UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD
SALT LAKE CITY, UTAH 84106

PHONE (801) 484-2262

February 13, 1985

State of Utah

Department of Natural Resources F%EE(;EEQ‘EEEE}

Division of 0il, Gas and Mining

355 West North Temple e ‘
3 Triad Center, Suite 350 FEB 19 1985
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

DIVISION CGF 0L
GAS & MINING

Gentlemen:
Enclosed please find the following:

1. Triplicate copies of Application for Permit to Drill
the Hanson Trust 2-5B3 well, located in the NE, SW of
Section 5, Township 2 South, Range 3 West, Duchesne
County, Utah.

Triplicate copies of survey plat.
Triplicate copies of well Tayout plat.
Triplicate copies of BOP drawing.

O BwWw N

Triplicate copies of 10 Point Well Prognosis.

We trust this application 1is complete and 1in proper form
for your rapid approval of our planned operations. If further
information 1is required, please contact us at the above address
or telephone number.

We hereby request that this APD and all other information
submitted relative to this well be held confidential for the
maximum allowable period of time.

If I may be of further assistance, please advise.

Sincerely,

D. T. Hansen

DTH/mm
Enclosures



N
‘ ®

Form OGC-1a SUBMIT IN &LICATE*
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on
: reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

. Lease Designation and Serial No.

=

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK

Fee
la. Type of Work »,44" R ] g ,u.m r ,,q Sl T Unit A N
DRILL m f g t : .\ {w '{%\ i léG*%A%K D nit Agreement Name
b. Type of Well LW A )6 oy N om
0il [X Gas et e E ? Mr“? '#'mSm rle‘a |:]'/Q T Mult“'fe D 8. Farm or Lease Name
Well Well Other Zone Zone
2. Name of Operator Han son TY‘USt
. 9. Well No.
Utex 011 Company ~ .
3. Address of Operator 2 583
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106  '[r's'®n Foob or Wide
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) . A] tamont
At surface J i1, Sec., T., R., M., or Bk
1482 FWL 1606 FSL ;@ and Survey or Area
. y W, .

Av proposed prod. zone e Section 5, T2S R3W USM
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State
2% miles Southeast of Altamont, Utah Duchesne, Utah

15. Distance from proposed* 16, No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned
Iocatlo? to r;eales% £t to this well
€ , ft.
?X(igsrtg :éarestsilrllg.eline, if any) 485' 28 ;4 640
18. Distance from proposed location® 19. Proposed depth\ _ //1/ 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed, s
or applied for, on this lease, ft. 14 000 //,//{:l ROtaY‘V
. L] s
21, Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) v 22 Approx. date work will start*
6106 GR March 1, 1985
2. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth ’ Quantity of Cement
12 1/4 9 5/8" 36# 5,000 circulate to surface
8 3/4 7" 26# 10,700 as _necessary
6 1/8 5" 184 14,000 as necessary
Utex Controls the land within 660' of the well location 5%§§(f§2ggfg:§§

DIVISICN OF oL
GAS & MINING

a/ -
dat{ on 'mesent ploductwe zone and proposed new pro-
and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PR()GRAM:\M# SSPSA@N\G’:

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, £ive pertinent data on subsurface locatio
preventer program, if any. ’

2. / B =
B . . . e o
L s /’34/%/%/ ..... Title(ﬁ%é( /4/d%’1;‘ A 1//7%;,, Date.. o / = "'4(/ 5/
(This space for Federal or State office use) )
Permit No 46'016 -l 3, o 7 9 ADDTOVAL DALE  ceioereecrnitenirietiiceeieinecene st ressiesease s comssbessba st ess s saa s m e et
ADDEOVEd DY et teccrsere s e et . Title, Date

Conditions of approval, 1f any:

*See Instructions On Reverse Side




LOCATED HE NE% OF THE SWk OF
UTEX O/L L.OMPA/V Y secrIon 5,I.Tgs, R3W

WELL LOCATION PLAT
HANSON-TRUST 2-583

, U.S.B.&M.

*—
©
L
©
N
N
©
N £,
5
SCALE:1"=1000'
HANSON-TRUST 2-5583
GROUND ELEV:6106"
1482’ PN
a4
T
~
o
Q
Q o
©
Q)
N
¢ 80.16 chs.
LEGEND & NOTES SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

& CORNERS FOUND AND USED BY THIS SURVEY. | hereby certify that this plat was prepared
from field notes of an actual survey

performed by me, during which the shown
THE GENERAI LAND OFFICE PLAT WAS USED monuments were found or established.

FOR REFERENCE AND CALCULATIONS.

o 0 2

Aﬁed Registered Land
veyorV/Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
x A Surveying & Enginesring Consultants

121 North Center Street
: P.O. Drawer C
DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021

29 Jan. '85 79-121-068 (601) 738-5352




10.

. February 11, 1985

UTEX OIL COMPANY
10 Point Well Prognosis
HANSON TRUST 2-5B3

Surface formation: Tertiary Uinta Formation
Estimated tops of geologic markers: Top Green River 5,600
Top Wasatch 10,930

Estimated depths to water, 0il and gas or mineral bearing formations:

0-5,600 Uinta - Water bearing
5,600-10,930 Green River - 0il, Gas and Water
10,930 to T.D. Wasatch - 0il, Gas and Water
Casing program: Size Weight Grade Depth
9 5/8" 36# J-55 5,000'
7" 26# N-80 & P110 10,700
5" 18# P-110 14,000

Pressure control equipment: See diagram attached to APD.

Blowout preventers: A series 1500, 5000 psi W.P.

hydraulically operated double ram type preventer, with pipe and blind
rams, and a 5000 psi, Hydril type preventer will be used.

A 5,000 psi W.P. hydraulic choke manifold, PVT, and flow sensors will

be used.

Testing Procedure: Before drilling out each casing string, blowout pre-
venters, casing head, and casing will be pressure tested, and blowout
preventers will be checked for proper operation each day.

Type and characteristics of proposed circulating medium:

0-5,000 Fresh water native mud with gel sweeps as necessary

5,000-10,700 Fresh gel mud 1ightly treated, water loss controlled
below 8,000'.

10,700-T.D. Fresh gel mud, weighted, treated and dispersed as

necessary.
Approximately 800 barrels of circulating fluid and
adequate bulk barite will be maintained on site.

Auxillary Equipment:

Upper and lower kelly cocks will be used, and a full opening valve will
be maintained on the rig floor. A mud logging unit is planned from
7,000"' to total depth with 24 hour supervision.

Testing and Coring:
No DST's are planned
DIL with S.P. and G.R., FD-CN

Anticipated Hazards:
No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen
sulfide is present in this area.

Anticipated starting date:
March 1, 1985 with duration of operations approximately 90 days.



RIGHT~OF—WAY AND USE BOUNDARY

HANSON-TRUST 2-583
UTEX OIL COMPANY

USE BOUNDARY DESCRIPTION

 AECENED
FLB 19 1985

. olL
DIViSION OF

Beginning at a point which is North 45°42'08" East 1833.02 feet from the Southwest Corner

of Section 5, Township 2 South, Range 3 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian:

_Thence
-Thence
Thence

Thence

N

4 50 feet wide

I'intah

North
North
South

South

Special

as follows:

Beginning at

as marked by

Thence

South

1°47'46" West 560 feet;
88°12'14" East 380 feet;

1°47'46" East 560 fedit;

88°12'14" West 380 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing 4.89 acres.

RIGHT-0OF=-WAY DESCRIPTION

(Gary Opecrating Company)

right-of-way over part of Section 5, Township 2 South,

[y

Range 3 West of the

Rase¢ and Meridian, the centerline of said right-of-way being further described

a point which is South 2419.11 feet from the Northwest Corner of said Section 5

a 5/8" rebar, said point being on the Last right-of-way line of a County Road;

89°11'45" East 734 fect to the East fence of the Gary Operating Company property,

.containing (.84 acres.

3

RIGHT~OF~WAY DESCRIPTION

(Hanson Property)

A 50 feet wide right-of-way over part of Section 5, Township 2 South, Range 3 West of the

Uintah Special Base and Meridian, the centerline of said right-of-way being further described

as follows:

Beginriing at a point which is South 16°48'37" East 2537.86 feet from the Northwest Corner of said

Section 5;

Thence
Thence
Thénce
Thence
Thence
Thence

Thence

oil well location, containing 1.89 acres.

South

“South

South
South

South

‘South

South

89°11'45" East 27 feet;
0°05'18" East 297.23 feet;
2°07'39" East 139.98 feet;
9°20'58" East 218.77 feet;
22°41'25" Fast 434.55 feet;
59° Fast 287.92 feet;

27°29'44"” East 241.80 feet to the West line of the Utex 0il Company HANSON-TRUST 2-5B3

SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

This is to certify that this plat has been prepared from the field notes of a survey

performed by me and that the monuments indicated were found during said survey and that

this plat accurately represents said survey to the best of my knowledg.

79 -'/2/—' CO:S

Surveyor, Cert. No.

ed, Registered Land

3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
-Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C

- DUGHESNE, UTAH B4021

(801) 755-8382
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SIWilr Aivi7

PLAT
2-583

£

XISTING
GROUND
\\N LOCATION SURFACE

/50" STA 4+30 | N\

WELL
HOLE

LOCATION SURFACE

4tsp— - - STA 2+30

£t/
6106 LOCATION SURFACE
°
/"= 50" STA. 0+00
QUANTIT/ES ' 75 e 3 e 5
APPROXIMATE CUT: 13,400 Cu. VYds. '
} KEYWAY A——A
APPROXIMATE FILL: 7,200 Cu. Yds.
JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants
121 North Center Street
N P.O. Drawer C
) . DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021
JANUARY 1985 79—12/1—068 v (801) 738-5352
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OPERATOR 7//542/ L7 G5 | L %""5;‘

WELL NAME %L@/ %W o - 35433

TE R - A0S

SEC NE- S/ 5 T X5 R e/ COUNTY /éw,@./
f3- 4/3-3/079 e
APT _NUMEER TYPE OF LEASE
CHECK OFF:
P 'BOND vs S
] PLAT 7 Bon ] NEAREST WELL
LEASE FIELD POTASH OR
Vv ‘ v v OIL SHALE
PROCE@NG COMMENTS:
Lr P nhLE

ey o~ F - Tens

APPROVAL LETTER:

| P |
SPACING: A-3 1 esa s~ 1= S 2y
ONIT CAUSE NO. & DATE

c-3-b c=3-C

STIPULATIONS:

_ /- \JZ%zfé el -

11/2/84
25020



| k‘ ‘smiz OF UTAH e 7" NomanH. Bangerler, Govemor
} v NATURAL RESOURCES R T e e ~ Dee C. Hansen, Executive Director

. .-;DnenneR Nlelson Ph. D Dlwsnon Dlector
355 W. North Temple - 3 Triad Cen’rer - Suite 350 - Salt Lcke Ch‘v maa1ao-1203 801-538-534' ' :

Oit, Gas & Mining A -} ;,'_" r

: ";;/JFebraury 21 1985

- Utex 0il Company
1245 E. Brickyard ‘Road, Su1te 600
Salt Lake Clty, Utah 84106 s

'Gentlemen~"

e,Re' Well No.- Hanson Trust #2-583 - NE SW Sec. 5, T. 25 R. 3W
- 18067 FSL, 14827 FWL ~ Duchesne County, Utah

Approval to drill the above referenced 0il well is hereby granted 1n L
- accordance with Order of Cause No. 140-12 dated August 27, 1981 subject to the
following stlpulatlons. " :

1. = Strict compllance with the conditions for drilllng and produclng test
wells as ordered in Cause No. 140-12, specifically, production-
testing time limitations, bottom hole pressure 1nformatlon submittal

and damage 11ab111ty assumption.,

In addltlon, the follow1ng actlons are necessary to fully comply with thls
approval: L e _

1.' Spudding notlflcatlon to the D1v1sion w1th1n 24 hours after dr1111ng :
: operatlons commence. :

2. Submittal to the Dlv1s10n of completed Form OGC—B-X Report of Water
Encountered During Drllllng. s

3. - Prompt notification -to the Division should you determlne that 1t is
necessary to plug and abandon this well. Notify John R. Baza,
Petroleum Engineer, (Office) (801) 538-5340, (Home) 298-7695 or
R, J. Flrth Associate Dlrector, (Home) 571-6068. ’

4, Compllance w1th the requ1rements and regulations of Rule c-27

Associated Gas Flarlng, General Rules ‘and Regulatlons, 011 and Gas
Conservatlon.v v S

-an equol opportunity ernployer



Page 2 SR, G G e T
Utex 0il COmpany ' > . {f “!k~" C | L L .. e

Well No. Hanson Trust #2—553
,vFEbruary 21 1985 : : ,

‘5. This approval shall expire one (1) year after date of issuance unless
substantial and continuous operatlon is underway or an application
for an exten51on 1s made prlor to the. approval explratlon date._

The API number a551gned to thls well is 43-013-31079

.'Sincerglyi‘“f@t::*ffi: e

, Assoc1ate Dlrector, Oil & Gas

- és
Enclosures '
-~ ce: Branch of Flu1d Minerals



NATURAL RESOURCES Temple A. Reynolds, Executive Director
Water Rights Dee C. Hansen, State Engineer

k‘ g‘ STATE OF UTAH Scott M. Matheson, Governor

23 East Main Street « P.O. Box 879 « Vernal, UT 84078 - 801-789-3714
April 4, 1985

e

Curry Leasing
- P. 0. Box 227
~ Altamont, Utah 84001

RE: Temporary Change 85-43-26

"Dear Mr. Curry:

The above numbered Temporary Change Application has been
approved, subject to prior rights.

A copy is herewith returned to you for your records and
future reference.

Very truly yours,

QB

G. Blake Wahlen
for Robert L. Morgan, P. E.
State Engineer
RLM:GBW/1n

Enclosure

an equal opportunity emplover « please recycle paper




® | [ 06(07(7

Fom e APPLICATION NO §. é}‘ R

DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM. ... i aean

Application For Temporary Change of Point of Diversion,
Place or Purpose of Use

STATE OF UTAH

(To Be Filed in Duplicate)

. For the purpose of obtaining permission to temporarily change the point of diversion, place or purpose of use
) . (Strike out writien matter not necded)

of water, the right to the use of which was acquired by..A7.8.5‘9.....C.er .12.._._].6.7‘8...(.43: 1957.) ........................... .
- {Give No. of application, title and date of Decree and Award No.)

to that hereinafter described, application is hereby made to the State Engineer, based upon the following showing of

facts. submitted in accordance with the requirements of the Laws of Utah.

1. The owner of right or application is_....... GOYrdon HAN SO e
2. The name of the person making this application is....Gurry leasing

3. The post office address of the applicant mPOBox227,A]tamont,Utah84001 .........................

PAST USE OF WATER

4. The flow of water which has been used in second feet is......._. Yl X i RS
5. The quantity of water which has been usegdh acry feet is.._ ... ... D e
6. The water has been used each year from..A.Pr.:...] ........................... 7. YRR, O Ct3] .................... . incl.
(Month) (Day) (Month} < (Day)
7. The water has been stored each year from_.._._.. e eeaas to ... e e . incl,
¢ {Month) (Day) (Month) (Day)
8. The direct source of supply is.......... 3lood. draw.. ... in e Duchesne.....ooooeeeeee. . County.
9. The water has been diverted into.....} iteh g:::l at a point located. S..2820. ft. E.1640..ft.
from the NW Cor. Sec. 32, T1S,R3W, USBaM e e A
10. The water involved has been used for the following purpose: ...Lrrigation & Stockwatering...........
................................................................................................ Total45°40 acres
NOTE: If for irrigation, give legal subdivisions of land and total acreage which has been irrigated. If for other purpses, give
piace and purpose of use.
THE FOLLOWING TEMPORARY CHANGES ARE PROPOSED
11. The flow of water to be changed in cubic feet per second’is ... e,
12. The quantity of water to be changed in acre-feet is 30 ................................................. P
. 1 ]
13. The water will be diverted into the...... 21K _Trucks ditch o o point located .N-2220. E.1640

NOTE: If for irrigation, give legal subdivisions of land to be irrigated. If for other purposes, give place and purpose of pro posed use.

. EXPLANATORY

........................................................................................................................................................

A filing fee in the gum of $5.00 is submitted herewith. I agree to pay an t_ldditional fee for either investigating or ad-
ertiging this chang¢, or both, upon the request of the State Engineer.

%’ZZ?N//%'ZJV;%[/ / [//\// | //

o

Signature of A'ppfieant




RULES AND REGULATIONS
(Read Carefully)

This application blank is to be used only for temporary change of point of diversion, place or nature of use for a
definitely fixed period not to exceed one year. If a permanent change is desired, request proper application blanks from
the State Engineer.

Application for temporary change must be filed in duplicate, accompanied by a filing fee of §7.50 Where the water
affected is under supervision of a Water Commissioner, appointed by the State Engineer, time will be saved if the
Application is filed with the Commissioner, who will promptly investigate the proposed change and forward both copies
with filing fee and his report to the State Engineer. Applications filed directly with the State Engineer will be mailed
to the Water Commissioner for investigation and report. If there be no Water Commissioner on the source, the Appli-
cation must be filed with the State Engineer.

When the State Engineer finds that the change will not impair the rights of others he will authorize the change
to be made. If he shall find, either by his own investigation or otherwise, that the change sought might impair existing
rights he shall give notice to persons whose rights might be affected and shall give them opportunity to be heard before
acting upon the Application. Such notice shall be given five days before the hearing either by regular mail or by one
publication in a newspaper. Before making an investigation or giving notice the State Engineer will require the appli-
cant to deposit & sum of money sufficient to pay the expenses thereof.

Address all communications to: "
State Engineer RECE#VED
State Capitol Building
Salt Lake City, Utah APR 08 1985

STATE ENGINEER'S ENDORSEMENTS - ,
DHVISIOn i Ol

(Not to be filled in by applicant) GAS & M’N!NG
Change Application No. .............oooii i
{River System)
b e Application received by Water Commissioner ... .............c......o........______

Recommendation of Commissioner ......__......................_____ P pyaneceneemmcnannanas
U ——
2. -.WZ&T.....,.Appumm received%m)in State Engineer's Office byf }7 .................

B e Fee for filing application, $7.50 received by _.......................: Rec. NOu oooroorommooo .
A s Application returned, with letter, to ........._. ... , for correction.
B e Coirected application resubmitied ovgl:;c;:?:ter to State Engiaeer's Ofica.
6. e Fee for investigationrequested $......_..... ...
e e eeceenaerennen————- Fee for investigation $._.........__... .received by ..._......._..._..... Rec. No. ................
- T Investigation made by ... ......_.... ... . ; Recommendations: ............................
L revearmernn Fee for giving notice requested $..._.._......._................
10 e, Fee for giving notice $........_..._... ,received by ... :Rec. Nowoo oo
) S Application approved for advertising by pub‘l';(;?ltlon BY e -
U Notice published in.......... .
| . U Notice of pending change application mailed to interested partieaby ....._...._. as follows:
........... T e — e st maem e e e e e n e e e e e e oo
) S Change application protested by ...
(Date Received and Name)
13, ey Hearingset for ... ... VB e
| L R Application recommended for ;‘g;f;i‘?;: DY e
. 7
17. 4 e 36 .............. Change Application appi roved and returned to ...OE, L

THIS APPLICATION IS APPROVED SUBJECT TO THE FOLLOWING CONDITIONS:

- Ny

Robert L l;'iorgan P.E. State !::nginoer



‘ ‘ w/ok

} DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION
G APT #43-013-3107q
|
| NAVE OF COMPANY: UTEX_OIL_COMPANY
! WELL NAVE: HANSON TRUST #2-5B3
SECTIONNE_SW 5 TownsHIP_ 28 RANGE 3W COUNTY Duchesne
DRILLING CONTRACTOR Utex Drilling

RIG #_48
SPUDDED: DaTE___ 4-6-85
TIME__ 6:00 PM

How Rotary

DRILLING WILL COMMENCE

REPORTED BY Dorothy Hansen

TELEPHONE # 484-2262

DATE, 4-9-85 SIGNED AS




N .
-~
s « R

Form 061D SEBNIT OIN PRy e v
STATE OF UTAH TOher snstr lluvlu~-vn N
Feserse sulv )
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES . .
DIV'S'ON OF OlL, GAS, AND M'NING [3‘ LEAZE DEBIGNATION VKD 888IAL MO,

Fee

SUNDRY NOT,CES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IF INDIAM, ALLOTTED 0% Tains “ama

{Do not use this form tor ;r&ouh 8o dril) or to deepen of plug back to a Aiffersat reservolr.
Use “AP CATION FOR FERMIT—" tor such proposais. )

1. T. UNMIT LOBEEMENT NamB
o 7Y ]
waLe waLL oTHER
2. waMm oF orsxazos 8. Fasu O L8a8% NaMB
Utex 0il Company HANSON TRUST
¥ iGousss OF QrasAION 8. waLL Mo,
Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-5B3
4. LOCATION OF wEL (Report location ¢lenrly and o accordance with say Stase requirements.* 10. FIRLD 4ND rOOL, O8 WiIlDCaT
See also space 17 betow.)
At aurface Altamont
' 11. a3C. T a1, &., O8 BLK, 4anD
1,482' FWL 1,606' FSL TUTE TN
Section 5, T25, R3W, USM
14, rzami? wo, 15, si3vamions (Show whether oF, AT, OR, eta. ) 12, COGNTY o8 PamiaN| 18. aTaza
43-013-31079 ] 6,106' GR Duchesne Utah
1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE AF INTBXTION TO: SUBSIQUANT RBPORT OF:;
TERT WATER AMUT-OFF _ PULL OB ALTER Casimg WiTER ANUT-OFP ALPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CasiING
SHOQT O ACILILIE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONWENT®
| KEPAIR WELL ‘ CHANGE PLANS tOther) __ DRILLING
Oth (NOTE . Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) Campletion ue Recompietian Report and Lug turm.)

17. DESCRIBE FROPNRED OR CUMILETED UPERATIONS (Clearly state nll pertinent detulls, und give pertinent dates. inciuding estimated date

proposed work. If well is dirsctionally drilled, giva subsurface locations and Mmessured and true vectical depths for all narkers
nant w this work.) ®

of atarting any
a8d rones pertl-

SPUDDED AT 6:00 P.M. ON APRIL 6, 1985

T ~April 7, 1985 through April 13, 1985
Drilled from O to 4,200' in the Uintah formation

April 14, 1985 through April 20, 1985
Drilled from 4,200' to 5,998' in the Green River formation
Ran 9 5/8" 40# casing, cemented. :

April 21, 1985 through April 27, 1985
‘ Drilled from 5,998' to 7,373' in the Green River formation

April 28, 1985 through Mav 4, 1985
Drilled from 7,373' to 8,624' in the Green River formation

May 5, 1985 through May 11, 1985 .
Drilled from 8,624' to 9,794' in the Green River formation

bace 1 CONFIDENTIAL

18. 1 hereby certify that the forego € 18 true, acd correct
BIGNED M@Q_ﬁmﬂ:@_* TirLg ____Secretary pate _May 14, 1985
arqo/HartTe _— .

‘ (This epace for Federal or State ofice uss)

J

APTTAVED BY TITLE DATE
Clliiwise. '3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:




Fonn OGC-1b : SUBMUET EN FRIFV LN
STATE OF UTAH tUthee instnin Lions on .
. reveese sule )
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
D‘V'S'ON OF O'L' GAS' AND M'N‘NG S Lzasas DRAIORATION \ND sERIAL LIN
Fee
8. 17 INDIAN, 4LLOTTES 0% TRiNG Nams
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
{Do not use this form for ;rl?ouln to deill or to deepen of plug back to a Aifersat reservoly,
Use “AP CATION FOR PEKMIT—" for such proposals.)
1. T. UMIT JGREZMANT NaMB
oI 7Y ]
waLL wBLL oTmER »
2. NAMS OF OPIRATOR 8. FABM 08 LBASE NiMB
Utex 0il Company HANSON TRUST
3. aDoaxss OF oramaion 8. waLL wo.
Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-5B3
4. LOCATION OF wiLL (Report location clearly and 1o accordance with say State requirements.® 10. FIBLD 4ND FOOL, O8 WILDCAT
Ses also space 17 delow.)
At surface Altamont
. . ) 11. ssc, 1.8, M., OB ALK, 4ND
1,482' FWL 1,606"' FSL A0RYRY 0% sdma
Section 5, T2S, R3W, USM
1¢. rzamiT »o. 18. aigvations (Show whetber oF, &7, an, eta) 12. COUNTY o8 Pantam] 18, sTaTa
43-013-31079 6,106' GR Duchesne Utah
1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICR OF INTRNTION TO: SUBSNQUSNT &8POST QF:
e
TEST WATIR SRUT-OFF i PULL OB ALTEXR CasiNgG WATER SHUT-OFP RETAIRING WBLL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE TRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CaBIMQ
3HOOT OR ACHIM2R ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
RCPAIR WELL | CHANGE PLANA (Other) DRILLING
o {NoTE; Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) Completlon or Recompietion Report and Log torm.)

17. DEATHIBE Phurnskpd R CUMPLETED UPKERATIONS (Cleurly stute all pertinent defalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
‘ pmpo"d&h"'“k.h}" well is dirsctionally drilled. give subsurfacs locations and messured and true vertical deptns foc sl qarkess sad tones perti-
hent O is wor

May 12, 1985 through May 18, 1985
Drilled from 9,794' to 10,700' in the Green River formation
l o Logged, ran 7" 26# casing, cemented.

: May 19, 1985 through May 25, 1985
[ Drilled from 10,700' to 11,066' in the Wasatch formation

May 26, 1985 through June 1,1985
Drilled from 11,066' to 11,433' in the Wasatch formation

June 2, 1985 through June 8, 1985
Drilled from 11,433' to 12,018' in the Wasatch formation

CONFIDENTIAL

18. 1 hereby certify that the foregolpg ia
8IGNED TITLE Secretary pare _June 14, 1985
(This apace for Federal or State oce use) = === .
L]

APRP™AVED BY . TITLE DATE
CUswia.. 'S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY;




Form OGC.1b SUBMET N riende o
STATE OF UTAM (Uther st llmu.- on D
Fevaerse spho )
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES . N
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING S G StaIGR TION N5 SEAIIL WG,

Fee
6. 1F INDIAN, ALLOTTES O TRING Nams

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

- {Do not use thie form for ;ro osals to drill or to deepen op plug back to & difterent reservoir.

Use “AP CATION FOR PERMIT—" for such Proposals.)

1. T. UNIT JGaEEMNBNT NaMa

oIt VAl

waLL, waLL oTHER
3. NAMB OF OPEAATOR . FasM OR LB4AK NiMB

Utex 0il Company HANSON TRUST
3. ADDBZSE OF OPARATOB 9. wiLL Nwo.

Suite 600, 1245 East Brickyard Road, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-5B3
4. tocaTION OF wELL (Hepoft location clearly and In accordaoce with any 3tace tequirements.® 10. #I8LD aND FOOL, OB WILOCAT

See 2is0 space 1T betow.)

At surface Altamont

11. sac. 7,8, M., OB BLE. aND
1,482' FWL 1,606' FSL AUAYAY 0R sa8a
Section 5, T2S, R3W, USM
14. reasar wo. 18. luiunoul (Show whather 07, 8T, A, eta. ) 12. COUNTY o8 rantau| 18, atazn
43-013-31079 6,106' GR Duchesne Utah
1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice. Raport ot Other Data
’ pon,
NOZTICR OF INTRNTION 70 SURSBQUENT &BPOAT OF:

TEST WATER SRUT-OFP POLL OB ALTXR CaSING WATER SHUT-OPP REFAIRING WRLL

FRACTURE TAEAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CaBiNG

JHOOT OR ACILiZR ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENTS®

ACPAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANG (Othery ___ DRILLING

(Other) {NOTE ; Repoct results of multiple compietion on Well

Csupletion oe Recompietion Repoet ang Lug turm.)

17. DESCRIBE PioipnskDd OR COUMPLETAD UPERATIONS (Cleurly stute ull pertinent detalls. and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting any
propoudmiwork.h;f. well ia directionally drilled, yive subsurface locations and measured and triie vurrical depths (ur all macrkers and rones perti-
nent w this waor

June 9, 1985 through June 15, 1985 .
Drilled from 12,018' through 12,621' in the Wasatch formation

June 16, 1985 through June 22, 1985
Drilled from 12,621' to 13,402' in the Wasatch formation

June 23, 1985 through June 29, 1985
Drilled from 13,402' to 13,9647 in the Wasatch formation

June 30, 1985 through July 2, 1985

Drilled from 13,964' to 14,000" in the Wasatch formation
TD 14,000' on July 2, 1985

Logged with Gearhart

Ran 91 joints 5" 18# casing, cemented.

RIG RELEASED AT 3: 59 P.M. ON JULY 3, 1985 CUNHDENTIAL

PAGED  FiNAL REPORT

TITLE Secretary pare _July 10, 1985

APPTAVED BY - TITLE DATE
Cudiiaa. 'S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY;

L_; *Coe lnstrisctimng mm Rovarce C:d.




1 Mev. b-£3) SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE®

SJATE OF UTAH (Sgamtber in-

B . OIL & GAS ISERVATION COW(ISSION :‘:\”:dg;] 5. LEASE DEBIGNATION AND BIRIAL 0.
’ FEE

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TEBIBL NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORIEAMNDYUREY N/A

F—Raws Tt

ls. TYPE OF WELL: S\.I;:‘LL ;“ESLL PRY D Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT KNAMEK
b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: N/A
NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF. ’ -
WELL OVER LN D DACE CESVR. Other SEP 1 0 1985 6. FARM OB LEASE NAME
2 NiME OF OFERATOR Hanson Trust
UTEX OIL COMPANY DIVISION OF Qi 9. WELL XNO.
3. ADDRLSS OF OPERATOR GAS & MINING 2~5B3
1245 E. Brickyard Road, Suite 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84107 10. FIELD AND POOL, OB WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Stiatle reguirements)® Altamont

At purtace 1,482" FWL, 1,606"' FSL ENT“.\\_ 1 R g M O BLOCK AXE BERYEY
At top prod. interval reported below ' C’Q\\XF\D

Sec. 5, T2S, R3W

At tota]l depth USM
14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY OR 13. BTATE
PARISH
43-013-31079 | 2/21/85 Duchesne Utah
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED | 17. DATE cOoMPL. (Ready to prod.) | 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, EEEB, ET, GE, gTc.)* | 19. ELEV. CASINGEEAD
4/6/85 6/30/85 8/8/85 6,106' GR 6,106"
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21, PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY®* DRILLED BY
14,000" 13,993" —_—> | 0-1 -
24, PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION——TOQP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)® 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE
11,674' - 13,962' Wasatch No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC ANp OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL COBED
¢k 0g Gl
DIL, $p-cN &C - No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
CASING SBI1ZE ' WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTE SET (MD) HOLE BIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
9-5/8" | 404 5,998 123" 1,470 sx None
" ' 26# 10,700 8-3/4" 875 sx
29. LINER RECORD 30. TTUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACEER SET (MD)
5" 10,511 13,999' 525 sx 2-7/8" 10,565 10,565
2-3/8" 5,033" Hegt String
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, #ize and number) 82. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
DEPTE INTEEVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND EIXD OF MATERIAL USED
See Attached List 11,674'-13,962" 18,000 gallons 15% HCL
3 shots/ft. 483 holes 13,500 gallons 2% KCL
-
33.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIEST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—esize and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producin;} or
. shut-in) .
8/8/85 Flowing Producing
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OIL—EBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD '
8/15/85 72 16/64 —_— | 1,158 ] 1,150 [ 160 99:1
YLOW. TCUEING PRESS. | CASING PRESSURE g;xg:tvm'r:n OIL—EBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—BBL. oIL cauxrz-im (CORR.)
-HOUR EATE
1,000 0 — 5 | 386 | 383 | 53 43° API
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY
Sold Don Baucum

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTSE

Perforation List
36. I hereby certify that/the foregoing and attachbed information 15%?\81](1 correct as deterfnined from all avallable records
> 7

;5 ’/‘ : —_ 4 P
SIGNED 7w4£;§;x4%%;722252{>/// TITL léé%fku/ébuﬁ(_;ZQﬁ/{/;AZZ?% DATE 9/6/85

*{See Instructions and Spaces fc;r Additional Data on Reverse S%e)
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PERFORATIONS

. HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
Depths from DIL-GR dated 6/30/85

11,674-76 12,425-27 13,055-57
11,684-85 12,461-63 13,087-89
11,695-97 12,475-77 13,091-93
11,711-13 12,489-90 13,105-06
11,788-90 12,505-06 13,122-23
11,808-10 12,515-16 13,158-59
11,820-21 ' 12,540-41 13,205-07
11,828-30 12,573-74 13,242-44
11,838~-40 12,583-85 13,301-03
11,849-51 12,592-94 13,324-26
11,878~-79 12,599-601 13,365-66
11,912-14 12,627-29 13,414-16
11,957-58 12,640-42 13,437-39
11,974-75 12,653-55 13,450-52
12,042-44 12,683-85 13,478-80
12,056-57 12,704-06 13,489-91
12,067-69 12,720-21 13,552-53
12,083-85 12,781-83 13,584-85
12,090-92 12,790-91 '13,593-95
12,120-22 12,803-04 13,628-30
12,138-40 12,813-15 13,667-68
12,151-53 12,826-27 13,676-78
12,162-64 12,841-43 13,715-16
12,173-75 12,851-53 13,770-72
12,240~42 12,866-67 13,781-82
12,265-67 12,929-30 13,831-33
12,272-74 12,936-37 13,861-63
12,293-95 12,956-59 13,868-69
12,317-19 12,979-81 13,880-81
12,330-32 12,995-99 13,906-07
12,352-53 13,017-18 13,916-18
12,416-17 13,023-24 13,960-62

96 =zones

161’ net



UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 600
1245 EAST BRICKYARD ROAD

SALT LAKE CITY, UTAH 84106 RECEIVED

PHONE (801) 484-2262

SEP 1 01985
SEP 00 1985

DATE D‘V‘SKJN Ui Ol
GAS & MINING

STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS & MINING
355 West North Temple

3 Triad Center, Suite 350 -

Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: WELL [hjnigys Truhi]— .2 -S03
BPI % 47-9)3 -3/p79

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the Completion Report and Perforation Record
for the above referenced well, in duplicate.

Please note that all information submitted to you is to be held
"CONFIDENTIAL" for the maximum allowable period of time, which is
seven (7) months from the date of submittal.

Thank you for your cooperation. If you have any questions, or if
you need any further information, please contact this office.

Sincerely,
UTEX OIL COMPANY .
(pog el Ll e e

Jennifer S. Winterroth

/Jsw

Enclosures

PLEASE SIGN THE COPY OF THIS LETTER IN THE SPACE PROVIDED BELOW AND
RETURN TO UTEX FOR OUR RECORDS.( tnt G—10-&S

[otH

Receipt of the above information is hereby acknowledged, this
day of , 198 §, by %&J‘fﬂu@ :




L eppiched
Budge: Buresu No. 1N104-01135

Tarm 1160-5 . 4
TED STATES ILBMIT IN ’.‘C‘"" Expires August 31, 1985

(Nover’ter 1983) (Other lnstryel _om re %

(Formerly 9-1331) DEPART - T OF THE lNTERIOR refse side) 3. LEASE OLRIONATION iND SRLLAL RO,
‘ BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Fb;>
. IF INDLAN, ALLOTT
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 033 1‘;"
dee ae . < €
(D vot e the (3 100, BORERON $OR FERMITIITS S g} 4T T ~ U
i T. UNIT sGEBZMENT Waus
ofL, [ 7Y ]
waLL @ wILL oruse
2 xaMB OF OPERATOR . PARX OR LRASS WNaME
PENNZOIL, COMPANY
$. 4ADDRZSS OF OPRAATOM §. wBLL 3:O.
P. Q. BOX 2967 HOUSTON TEXAS, 77252-2967 Hanson Trust 2-5B3
[ ;c;:.:':%x'g:e: tllin.’:ﬁe'pf;u location clearly and ia sccordance with any State requirements.® lO.unlu ARD POOL, OR WILDCAT
At surface . Altamont
T2S-R3W Section 5: B avar o s 4
T2S5-R3W
14. reanMer NoO. 18. 81xvATIONS (Show whether F. 2T, OB, ete ) 12. COONTY OR PsRISE| 13. 8TATR
,_{3 - 013- 310749 Duchesne uT
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICS OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WaTER SHOT-OFP PCLL OR ALTER CASING E WiTER SHOT-OPP REPAIRING ;lw
PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE — PRACTURE TREATMENT . ALTERING CABING
SROOT OR aACIDIZE ABANDON® _ SNOOTING O8 ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) _CHANGE QOF QOPERATOR |
(Other) (Nors: Report resuits of muitiple completion on Well
Completion or Recoripletion Report and Log form.)

17. DLSCRIBE I'ROTUSID OR COMPLEITED OPERATIONT (Clearly state ail pertinent details., sad zZive pertinent dates, inciudin
LETL! ) ] 3 g estimated date of starting an
,’.::f?:da;"::x.y- well is directionally drilled, give subsurface Iouuon.s and measnred and true vertical depths for all markers and sones perts-

DUE TO UTEX OIL COMPANY BANKRUPTCY AND THEIR SUBSEQUENT REJECTION
OF THE OPERATING AGREEMENT. GOVERNING OPERATIONS FOR THIS WELL,
PENNZOIL COMPANY BY MAJORITY VOTE OF THE NON_OPERATORS IN THIS
WELL HAS SUCCEEDED UTEX AS OPERATOR EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 1, 1986.

iy

MAR 25 igg7

s Q

- v .
18. [ beredy 3 tZ‘ lorlei trye aod correct .
SIGNED 4 W v TITLE DATR
ALPH WILLIAMS > SUPERVISING ENGINEER MARCH 1, 1987
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE : DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

$See Instructions on Reverse Side

Title 1S U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
Cntted S1a'es anv falce. “irtirinne me froadinlent €1atamanse me cameme monns oon ~o oo .



DOGM 56-64-.

- . . an equal opportunity employ
[ |
v NATURAL RESOURCE! C,Iw

QOif, Gos & Mining
1 of 12

355 West North Tempie, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut
Page

. 84180-1203.(801-538-5340) .
| ~ RECEIVE
MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT
AUG 41987

Operator name and address: DIVISION OFOIL
GAS & MINING
O PERNEOH—EXPEOR——PRODCO Feamzs!/ &M/‘AA/L] Utah Account No. —N2885
P O BOX 2967,25TH FL.
HOUSTON TX 4 712252 2967 Report Period (Month/Year) 6 /87
ATTN: WH-BURNLNA v, ’
ArTia k)'/"”‘/ Amended ReportD

Producing | Days | Production Volume
Zone Oper | Oil {BBL) Gas {MSCF) Water (BBL)

wsTC 3o | 1239 34\ 4400

| wsTC 130 | |b]7 __135% ¥Y950
v o - 5 -
T wsTC |30 1391 /274 3944
WsTC | 3o 714 77 YA/S
GR-WS | 3a 7323 b4 Yso
wsTC | 32 JOB 1698 /938
T6 | GRRV
""""" wsTe | 3o 40438 /28745 Y33
WsTC |29 1541 | 3ego | ®6K |

Location

L

T

o

1:2;301330809 02301 02§

 NL10L730751 02355 025 01W 23 | WSTC 3o | 7Y 40 - | - 52
wste | 7 24 € -

wste |30 | %) (290 Jol2
13638 298 32734

HRRU
1330753 02415

L 30

TOTAL

Comments lattach separate sheet if necessary

{ have reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete.  Date %/ 7 /.9?7

' ﬁ 4.)19“\— | | Telephone 7/%-5 ‘/é‘?/ oY

Authorized signature

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK INK |




ok flodeds e 0 0 e

=5
PENNZOIL COMPANY RE£ égég
y PENNZOIL PLACE ¢ P.0O.BOX 2967 » HOUSTON, TEXAS 77252-2967 * (713) 546-4000
AUG 4 1987
DIVISION OF Of
GAS & MININGL ’

July 30, 1987

Utah Natural Resources
Division of 0il, Gas, & Mining
Attn: Tammy Searing

355 Triad Center, Suite #350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Ms. Searing:

This letter is to confirm our telephone conversation of July 30, 1987,
regarding the name change from Pennzoil Exploration & Production Co. to
Pennzoil Company.

Please change your records to reflect this name change effective August
1, 1987.

Your contact for drilling operations will continue to be Will Luna at
our Neola office. The contact for the monthly production reports will
be myself at our Houston address. All affected properties, except the
drilling activity, are listed on the attached production report for
June, 1987. The bonding is in the name of Pennzoil Company.

This is a change in name only, the company and personnel have remained
the same. If you need additional information, please call me at
(713)-546-8104.

Sincerely,

A IO

Martin Wilson
Onshore Accounting

mh/dcw
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« 7 May 5, 1987 .
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING - Or- 5. LEAXE DESIGNATION AND SEBRIAL NO.
Liviniidp OF
Faty

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON. WELLS "~ o PPN &I Some Eiovsas o sins Naxs

{Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to s different reservoir,
Use “"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-E" for such proposais.) ¢

1. . 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAKS
: o1t GAS
WELL WwOLL OTHIR
2. NAME OF OPIRATOR A 8. FARM OR LEASE NAMB
Pennzoil Company Utah Acct. # N0O705 See Attached List
3. ADDEEES OF OFERATOR 9. WiLL NO.
P.0. Box 2967 Houston, TX 77252-2967
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location tleariy and in accordance with any State requirements.® 1716 F15Lp anp POOL, OR WILDCAT
ietolzl::‘ :ep‘" 17 delow.)
. : Alt t
See Attached List of Wells mebal LAl tanon

SURVRY OR AREA

14, AP1 NUMBER 15, BLavaTioNs {Show whether D7, XT, O, eto.) 1nz. COUNTY OR rnun 18, STATR
Duchesne & Utah
(TEATE NN
"R RLE"1 Y
16. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Dat
NOTICE OF INTENTIOX 10! SUBEBQUENT RAPORY OF:
TEST WATER BHUT-OFP PULL OR ALTER CASING ‘WATER IHUT-OFF REPAIRING WRLL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZR ABANDON?® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
{NoTk : Report resuits of multiple completion on Well
(Other) OperatOY‘ Name Change X 8 nmpletlnup:r Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED AR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clenrly state nil pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposedmwork. k.%t' well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all mackers and xones perti-
nent to this wor.

Change of operator name from Pennzoil Company to Pennzoil Exploration &
Production Company, effective June 1, 1988,

See Attached List of wells OIL AND GAS
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18. 1 hereby ce: that the foreg: {s e, and cotrrect
SIGNED /ww/)/“7 S:m é’—d’ rreziestern Div. Production Mgr.puam G ~7-88

{This space for E‘edan.l or State omce uu)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATR
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANX:

*Gee [nstructions on Reverse Side
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SUNDRY NOTICE OF NAP.-IANGE

Page 1 of 4

EXHIBIT A Z
ENTITY LEASE NAME LEGAL API REMARKS
NUMBER DESC. #
{::1636 HANSEN TRUST 2-5B3 2S W B 4301331079
QO 1641 HANSEN TRUST 2-32A3 1S 3K 32 4301331072 e
1775 MYRIN RANCH 1-13B4 2s 4N 13 4301330180 wsT L
1811 MEAGHER ESTATE 1-4B2 25 24 & 4301330313
N\1816 MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 25 2W 9 4301330325
\ 1871 GOODRICH 1-18B2 2s 2K 18 4301330397 v///’
2:11910 TIMOTHY 1-8B1E _ 2s 1E 8 43064730215 ()51
2301 LAMICQ 2-6B1 2S IW 6 4301330809 ,)5TC
N\ 2303 MARQUERITE 2-8B2 25 2W 8 4301330807
“\2355 JENKINS 1-23B1 2S 1M 23 4306730751 \/,/’
N 2608 WHITE 1-15C5 35 5W 15 4301330651 WSTC
2415 URRUTY 2-36A2 1S 2W 34 4301330753
2416 REESE 2-10B2 2S 2W 10 4301330837 v//’
26417 MCELPRANG 2-31A2 1S 2W 31 4301330836 ) )STC
5255 SPRING HOLLOW 2-3423 IN 3K 34 4201330234
5256 SPRING HOLLOW 4-36Z3 IN 3W 36 4301330398
§::527o OWEN ANDERSON 1-28A2 1S 2W 28 4301330150
5275 BLACK JACK UTE 1-14-2D  4S 6W 14 4301230480
5280 BLUEBENCH UTE 1-7C4 S 4 7 4301330116
~ 5285 UTE TRIBAL 1-16B2 4S 6W 16 4301330481
5295 CAMPBELL UTE 1-7B1 25 1M 7 4301330236
5300 DARWOOD CAMPBEL 1-12B2  2S 2W 12 4301330237
5305 CHENEY 1-33A2 1S 2W 33 4301330202
?;:5306 CHENEY 2-33A2 1S 2W 33 4201331042
N\ 5320 DUCHESNE COUNTY 1-9C4 3S 4.9 4301330318
5325 DUCHESENE COUNTY 1-17C4  3S GW 17 4301330410
5330 DUCH. COUNTY 1-3C4 35S GH 3 4301330065 S
{:75335 EVANS UTE 1-17B3 2S 3W 17 4301330276 13 STT
5336 EVANS UTE 2-17B3 2S 3W 17 4301331056 v
5340 FORTUNE UTE FED 1-11C5  3S 5W 11 4301330402 [05TC
:::5345 FRESTON 1-8B1 25 1N 8 4301330294
5350 GERITZ MURPHY 1-6C4 35S GH 6 4301330573
.::5360 HAMBLIN 1-26A2 1S 2W 26 4301330083
5361 HAMBLIN 2-26A2 1S 2W 26 4301330903
O 5370 JENKS ROBERTSON 1-1B1 2S 1W 1 4304730174 \//’
5375 RACHEL JENSEN 1-16C5 2S 5N 16 4301330376 4,1 STC
5385 JOHN 1-3B2 2s 2 3 4301330160
V5387 JOHN 2-2B2 2S 2W 3 4301330975
:::5390 V JOHNSON 1-27A2 1S 2W 27 4301330119
V5400 LAMICQ 1-20A2 1S 2W 20 4301330133
5405 JOHN LAMICQ 1-6B1 25 1M 6 4301330210
5410 LAMICQ ROBERTSON 1-1B2 25 2W 1 4301330200
5412 LAMICQ ROBERSTON 2-1B2  2S 2W 1 4301330995
e 5415 LAMICQ UTE 1-5B2 2S 2W B 4301330212
\:::5425 MCELPRANG 1-31A1 1S 1W 31 4301330190 »///
\\Vsqzo MARQUERITE UTE 1-8B2 2S 2W 8 4301330235 _,)5TC
\\Vsazs MAY UTE FED 1-12B1 2s IW 13 4304730176
N 5440 MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 2S GW 30 4301330576
N MORTENSEN 1-32A2 13 2W 32 4301330199
5652 MORTENSEN 2-32A2 1S 2W 32 4301330929
~J 5455 PHILLIPS UTE 1-3C5 35S BW 3 4301330333 —
\\\'5460 REESE ESTATE 1-10B2 2S 2W 10 4301330215 wsTC
5465 ROBERTSON 1-29A2 1S 2K 29 4301330189




Form OGC.tS,
- STASE OF UTAM
OEPARTMENY TURAL RESOURCES
DlVISlON OF OlIL, GAS, AND MINING

Uth

SUBMEL IV BRI AN

e 3gastrise froonns sy
"‘ i)
API 43-013-31079-00

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do sot pos s lor- u‘:»n

lnu%ﬂlrmuﬂuhuun.lmcm

T TSIIR. SLiOTTES 64 TRIRE NeBS

| - Y USIT 0B NDEY BaM0
BB %0 omm _
m T 7684 06 LBABE BANS

¢
Hanson Trust

Jur 11

[1 Vu;ax}‘l ¥ 3%

Pennzoil Exploration and.Production ComRany
T aeiies oF eratee )
P.0. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252

T el b
2-5B3

B e ey v ST ¥~y VS

10, 7ISLD AND FOOL, 08 WILBCAY

Altamont-Wasatch

. 8B, 7., &, K. 08 BLE. AFD
SUBYRY 08 404

Sec 5,;T25;R3W

23108 OF WLl (Bapert b

Y t%‘uu'. i . RANING
Boo sioe opase ) ; o MiNG
1¢. Psamey vo. TE Savarens (Bhov wbather o7, 57, . 000}

S5 0/3 - Gp07T

15 630537 oo pasies| 1L o rc
Duchesne

16 Check Appropnete Bex Te Indicate Nature of Noetice, Repert, or Other Dete
POTICE OV INTBETION 90 : SUBSQUBNT li’.lt w0

T85T WaTHR SRUTOFY POLL 08 ALTSS CaBive waTE SRUTOFY SSPAlRING WBLL

PRACTUAR TRBAT MCLTIPLS COMPLETE F3ACTUES TRBATHENT ALTERING CABING

SNO0T A1 ACIDISE X ‘ ABANDON® SEOUTING O8 ACIDISING ABANNORNBNT®

agPaik Wikt l CHAPES PLANS (Othor) —

(Noves : Report num d umm u-ﬂouu os Well
(Other) Lt Crmpletion ur Recompietion B torm.)
s 1 tinent dates, uelula ml-lul date of starting any

1T ezscaint Pu :::'l:n ne W"I.l'l-tf:‘l UPrRATIONS 1¢!¢aﬂ);. state ol ::tl»ln dn:i.lz m .:m :o.r‘ e erneal ."'”l“' e hers sad senes pert)-

pre
seat » this week.) *

Plan to acidize Wasatch perfs 11,674-13,962" with 10,000 gal 15% HCL.

APPTAVED | 24
Coarmia. ‘8 0OF APPROVAL IF ANT:




Form approved.
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

'Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN TRIBLICATE®

(November 1983) Oth 4 Expires August 31, 1985

(Fgrmrenrlyrg-.sll) DEPARTM OF THE |NTER‘OR ier'o::adiol;“m"‘” e 5. LEASE DEBIGNATION AND BSRRIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT APT 43-013-31079-00
8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBS NaXE
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
(Do not use this !o‘;n hxp;;r&pgxxg;otg %ul{ ;';:l'l%(g'?fnf:: .pul::pblck to l) different reservoir.
I T, UNIT 4GREEMEBNT NaME
ot cas )
wELL wELL 23113
2. NaME OF OPEBATOR 8. FARM OR LRASE NAME
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company Hangon Trust
3. ADDEEZa3 OF OPERATOR 9. wBLL NoO.
P.0. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252 2-5B3
4. LOCATION oF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.® 10. PISLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At surface Altamont-Wasatch
11 "56' T, : M., OR BLK. AMD
1482' FWL & 1606' FSL RYAT OR aknt
Sec 5, T2S, R3W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether OF, KT, OR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PaRiSH| 18, STATE
A 6/3— 3079 6106 GL Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
ROTICE OF INTENTION T0: SUBSBQUENT RBFORT OF ;
TEST WATES SEUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WiTER SHUT-OFP ___ REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT | | ALTERING CABING |
SHOOT OR ACIDIZB ABANDON® X XNE XX aciprzing [ X ABANDONMENT® -
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) i
{NoTe : Report results of multiple completion on Well
{Other) Completion or Recoiapletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIDE I'ROPUSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONE (Clearly state ail pertinent detatls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directiopally drilled, give subsurface locativns and meastired and true vertical depths for all markers and sones perti-
nent to this work.) ®

SUMMARY OF WORK PERFORMED FROM 9/29/88 to 10/12/88
MI and RI pulling unit. Installed BOP and POH with TBG, pump cavity and packer.
Tested all csg above 11,473" to 1500 psi. Held OK.
Acidized Wasatch perfs 11,674-13,962' with 15,000 gallons 15% HCL.
Swabbed back load and installed hydraulic pumping_equi @EEW
RD pulling unit. ED
pEC 191988 =’
J. Dullnig DIVISION OF
Neola, UT OiL, GAS & MINING
181 hereby thit the £ gegoln ae and correct
SIGNED @Zg&j A/ == _TmLE Supervising Engineer DATE /9/ 9/?@

Title 16 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it @ crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any faise, !

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

TITLE DATR

APPROVED BY
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

#See Instructions on Reverse Side

fietitious or fraudulent statements or representstions as to any matter within its jurisdiction.



DIVISION OF O'L, GAS, AND MINING S. LEAZK DEXZIONATION \NO BERIAL NO

SUNDRY NOWYES AND REPORTS ON wz-:u_s‘ €I R g R e

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir,
Use "APPLFCATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposais.)

1 T. UNIT 2GREENBNT NaNE

oI1L uAl
waLL woLy OTHER
3. NAME OF OFIiaTOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NaMB
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company -
3. iDoREas OF oPEZRaTOR - k 9. ""'-!-’.;—5"0-
P.0. Box 2967, Houston, Texas 77252-2967 Y A ‘2=583
N i NEANYi i e Tk TaY N
4. LOCATION or wELL (Report location clearly and In accordance with any State requirementd® © 7 'J /U /10, FIELD AND roOU, O WILDCAT
See aiso space 17 delow.)

At surface . Altamont

s 11. apc, 7., B, M., OB BLX, AND
e BURYSEY OR iR3A

1606' FLS and 1482' FWL - o

mson Trust

ip

Sec. 5, T2S-R3w

1¢. rersir xo, % 13, sLavations (Show whether o7, 1T, an, ote.) 12. coONTY Oa ranisH| 13, sTaTn
43-013-31979-01 { 6106' GR Duchesne Utah
1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Repont, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION T0: SUBSNQUINT REPORT OF:
TEST WATIR SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATEIR SHUT-OFP RETAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MCULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
XXO6XXK acinize X ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUONMENT®
REPAIR WELL X CHANGE PLANS (Other)
. (NoTe: Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) Reperf Wasatch ('mupletlonpur Recompletion Report and Log furm.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED nit CUMULETED OPKRATIONS (Clearly state nll pertinent detalls, und give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposedh.work.kjl‘ well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations snd measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zanes pertl-
nent to this wor

Plan to clean out to bottom, squeeze any casing leaks, reperforate Wasatch
and acidize.

Jess Dullnig
Neola, Utah
10/8/90

A 4, A 4 ﬂ

18. T hereby cortif

and correct

SIGNED rrrLe __Supervising Engineer parg L0 2550
{This epace tof Federal or State ofice use)
APPTAVED BY TITLE DATE

Cllwwis.. 7S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




Form 9 S’E OF UTAH ‘

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESCURCES 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

9. Well Name and Number

e [ Other (specify) Hanson Trust 2-5B3
2. Name of Operator 10. APl Well Number b/ 0757
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 43-013-3179=00 foud
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat
P.0. Box 2967, Houston, Texas 77252-2967 (713) 546-4000 Altamont
§. Location of Well
Footage : 1606'" FSL and 1482' FWL County : Duchesne

QQ, Sec, T.,R., M. : Section 5, T2S-R3W State : UTAH

NOTICE OF INTENT T REPORT

{Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
[] Abandonment [] WNew Construction [] Abandonment * ] New Construction
] Casing Repair [ Puil or Alter Casing [ Casing Repair [J Pullor Alter Casing
[7] Change of Plans [] Recompietion O Change ot Plans fx] Shoot or Acidize
[J Conversion to Injection [7] Shoot or Acidize [ Conversion to Injection [] Ventor Flare
] Fracture Treat [ Ventor Flare [l Fracture Treat [J Water Shut-Off
[] Muitiple Completion [] Water Shut-Off (] OCther
(] Other

Date of Work Completion 03/04/91

Approximate Date Work Will Start  02/11/91

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different resarvoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cleariy state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

1. Reperforated Wasatch 11,512-13,935' (131 intervals, 986", 1972 holes).
2. Acidized all Wasatch 11,512-~13,935' with 40,000 gallons 15% HC1.

3. Returned to pump.

G

'MAR 2 5 1991

DIVISION CF
OIL GAS & MINING

A A A

14. I hereby certify that theforpg n7 isgrue and/céfrgct
Name & Signature ///Aéjua —=———"—>R. A, Williams Tle Supervising Engineevate 3-20-9/
7

(State Use Only)

(8/90) Ses Instructions on Reverse Side



8. Lease designation and Seiiai Huinber

state @UTAH ‘
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES |
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number
EOH Well DGas well EIOther (specify) Hanson Trust 2-5B3
2. Name of Operator 10. APt Well Number
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 43-013-31079-00
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat
P.O. Box 290 Neola, Utah 84053 801-353-4397 Altamont
6. Location of Well -
Footage : 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL conty : Duchesne
QQ, Sec, T., R, M. Sec. 5, T2S, R3W State Utah
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Orginal Form QOnly)
[] Abandonment [] New Construction [] Abandonment* []  New Construction
[:] Casing Repair [] Pullor Alter Casing [[] Casing Repair [] PuliorAtter Casing
[] Change of Plans [] Recompletion [] Change of Plans [] shootor Acidize
[] Conversion to Injection [X] Shoot or Acidize [[] Conversion to Injection [] VentorFiare
[] Fracture Treat [] VentorFlare [[] Fracture Treat []  water shut-off
[] Multiple Completion [] Water Shut-Off [] Other
[X] Other Recomplete in U. Wasatch - L. Green River Date of Work Completion

Report results of Multiple Completion and Recompletion to different reservoirs .
Approximate Date Work Will Start on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
location and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Plan to set CIBP at 11,500’ to exclude existing perfs 11,512-13,962 and recomplete in the
Upper Wasatch - Lower Green River 'TU2' from 10,985' to 11,452 (overall). If results are

marginal, Pennzoil may elect to drill out CIBP and commingle production.

' BGEl

APR 2 6 1993

F UTAH DIVIGIOW € DIVISION OF
OiL, GAS, AND MIMING O GAS & FININEG

DATE:

BY:

14, | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct ~
Name & Signature Jess Dullnig (,,244,4 M e  Petroleum Engineer Date 13-Apr-93
[~ v

{State Use Only)




DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

Y7 .-

STATE OF UTAH N e o —
M}Wﬁgﬁw‘ B

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry to a dfferent feservoir. 6. If Indlan, Alottes or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposal

y | 2
% iua s€ Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS B JUL 311995 JF £
¥

DIV OE G oac g s |

Fesdbanit or CA, Ag Desi

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well

EOH Well DG&; weoll Doﬂwr 8. Well Name and No.

HANSON TRUST 2-5B3

2. Name of Operator

Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 9. APt Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. 43 013 31 079
P.0O. Box 290 Neola, Utah 84053 (8 0 1) 3563-4397 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

Altamont-Wasatch

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

11. County or Patish, State

NESW SEC. 5, T2S, R3W Duchesne, UT

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION ) TYPE OF ACTION

Abandonment Change of Plans

m Notice of Intent

Recompletion New Construction
Non-Routine Fracturing

Water Shut-off

r—_—] Subsequent Report Plugging Back

Casing repair
Conversion to Injection

D Final Abandonment Notice Attering Casing

HO00oo
Qaoooo

Dispose Water
Note: Report results of mutiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report end Log form.)

Other Change of operator

13. D ibe Prop d or C leted Op O (Cleaily state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work, i well is ditectioally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for alt markers and zones pertinent to this work}

Pennzoil plans to turn over operatorship of subject well to Coastal Qil and Gas Corp. effective August 1, 1995,

14. | hereby comfy that the foregoing is true coirect
Signed LW‘ZK"/ Titlo Operations Superintendent Date 7/28/1995

{This space of Federal or State office use.)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes i a crime for any peison knowingly to make to any department of the United States any falss, fictitious or fraud ot or repi as

to any mattes within its jurisdiotion,




‘ ~

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry to a different reservaoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

. Lease Dasignation and Serial No.

FEE

. 1f Indian, Allottee or Tribs Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well

Oil Well DGQ' well D Other

. If unit or CA, Agreement Designation

2. Nsme of Operator

Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company

. Well Name and No.

HANSON TRUST 2-6B3

3. Address and Telephone No.

P.O. Box 290 Neola, Utah 84053 (801)353-4397

. APl Welt No.

43 013 31079

4. Looation of Well {Footage, Sea., T., R., M., or Survey Desoription)

NESW SEC. B, T2S, R3W

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

Altamont-Wasatch

11. County or Parish, State

Duchesne, UT

12

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX({s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

E Notice of Intent Abandonment

Recompletion

D Subsequent Report Plugging Back

Casing repair
E:j Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing

Other Change of operator

cinnininin

nooood

Change of Plans

New Construction
Non-Routine Fracturing
Water Shut-off
Conversion to Injection
Dispose Water

Note: Peport results of multiple completion on Wel
Completion or Fleaormpletion Report and Log form.}

13. Desoribe Proposed or Completed Op
drifled, give subsurface looations and measured and trus vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work) _

Ammendment to Sundry dated 7/28/95

(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated dste of starting any proposed work. Hf wall is directioally

Pennzoil plans to turn over aperatorship of subject well to ANR Production Co. effective August 1, 19905.

14. | hersby certify that

Title Sr. Petroleum Engineer

pate 8/8/1995

Signed

‘Noel W, Putscher

(Thie space of Federal ar State affice use.)

Title

Approved by
Conditions of approval, i any:

Date

Title 18 U.S.C. Seotion 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly to make to any department of the United States any false, fi

to any matter within its jurisdiction.

or




QATE OF UTAH .

FORM 9
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING
5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee
| 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

! Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
| Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A

1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:

Hanson Trust #2—-5B3

oiL aAs | | oTHER
Name of Operator:

ANR Production Company

9. APt Well Number:

43-013-31079

Address and Telephone Number:

10. Fieid and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573—4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: couny:  Duchesne
| g, sec. T.R.M:  NESW Section 5-T2S—-R3W State: Utah
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Originat Form Only)

(] Abandon [T 1 New Construction [T} Abandon* [] New Construction

[ ] Repair Casing {7} Puli or Alter Casing [} Repair Casing ] Pull or Alter Casing
1 [_] Change of Plans [ 1 Recompletion [] Change of Plans [ 1 Perforate

[] Convertto Injection [ ] Perforate [ ] Convertto Injection [ ] Ventor Flare

[] Fracture Treat or Acidize [C] Ventor Flare [ ] Fracture Treat or Acidize [ Water Shut—-Off

[ ] Multiple Completion [} Water Shut-Off [X7] Other _ Change of Operator

[ Other

Date of work completion

Report resuits of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

Approximate date work will start
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report.

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. 1 well is directionally drilled, give subsuriace locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Pennzoil Exploration & Production Company sold all of their interest/turned over operatorship of the subject well to AN R

Production Company effective August 1, 1995.
i
E (E \ )
ND\I 6 1995 &

L GAS & MINING

DIV.OF Ol

13.

.
Name & Signature: RAMK%MW
Y

{This space for State use only)

Sheila Bremer

Tite: Environmental & Safety Analyst pate: 11/02/95

{See Instructions on Reverse Side)

(5/84) ’ .
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’ "ivision of 0i1, Gas and Mining R .
outi

OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET
1-LE@ 7—PL,,V/
| “tach 271 documentation roceived by the division regardinc this change. ZMWS_SJ
~itial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3))5?8@9—]?11-13
4NLC 7/
9 Change of Operator (well sold) J Designation of Agent S*RJF,"V(’
. Designation of Operator {J Operator Name Change Only O-EWE S
|
 The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: _8-1-95 )
7O (new operator) ANR PRODUCTION COMPANY INC  FROM (former operator) PENNZOIL COMPANY
| (address) PO BOX 749 (address) PO BOX 2967 28TH FL
DENVER CO 80201-0749 HQUSTON TX 77252-2967
phone (303 ) 572-1121 phone ( 713) 546-8104
account no. _NO675 account no. _N 0705
Hell<(s) (attach additional page if needed): *CA'S

< Name: B HARTMAN U 1-31A3- " API: 43-013-30093 Entity: 5725 .- Sec 31:TwplS_ Rng.3W.-Lease Type:FEE _

ame:’HANSON- TRUST 2-5B3 ~ - APT: 43-013-31079 Entity: 1636 - Sec_5Twp2S. Rng 3W -Lease Type:FEE
/Name DASTRUP. 2-30A3 _ API: 43-013-31320 Entity: 11253 .Sec.30 TwplS Rng 3W Lease Type:FEE
© Name :HARTMAN-2-31A3 - - .. API: 43-013-31243 Entity: 11026 .Sec31:TwplS -Rng 3W .Lease Type:FEE
. Nafe : HANSON. TRUST 2—-32A3 APL: 43-013-31072 fntity: 1641  Sec 32 TwplS Rng_3W 3W Lease Type :FEE

Name *UTE_TRIBAL ‘10-13A4/GR -API: 43-013-30301 Entity: 5925  Sec 13 TwplS Rng 4W Lease Type:

B Name *CR.AMES -1-23A4/GR-WS  ApI: 43-013-30375 Ent1t 5675 __ SeCT{TwDIS _Rn S AW Lease Type:FEE
" ¥FVANS_UTE 2-17-B3/GR ‘. %3-013-31056 V: Sazp— 200 qy g Mgy 90 WPCipgp—

OPiRATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

2 1. (Rule- R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation -has been received from former
- operator (Attach to this form).[/aé\/ }//457 - - ' :

,Z{g?_. (Rute -R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has: been recewed from new operatox
(Attach ‘to this form). /4. /io- 75) , _

N/ :;;-—*The Department.-of. .Commerce -has been:contacted if the new: operator above is not - curre‘nﬂf
-operating any wells in Utah. - Is company registered with the -state? (yes/no)- - If -

yes, show company file number:

ﬂﬁﬂ. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone- Documentation Form to this report). - Make note of BLM status in
.comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5. through 9 below.

7( 5. Changes have been entered in the Gil and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well -
listed above. /7 2.95)

, %6 Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. (//—;74457
~7. Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above. ///_;20,;57

2£ 8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (//4/?;7

£.9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

— OVER -




.
' . *
.

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH
¢1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity assignments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
entity changes made? (yeséééb _ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

A&éﬁ 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

LAk

BOND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) <ﬁm%;:ﬂ17@¢53§?7/é?ﬁ2z)bé@jﬂ,//fgg(é,jig;/?,“
,Lg»l. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operatdr of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
‘ proper bond.

426 2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

| é§£r3- The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no) .
Today's date Nov._ 2, 1995 . If yes, division response was made by letter
| dated 19 .

‘ LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

| _fgéﬂ. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 , of their responsibility to notify any

| -person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

‘ ””Azé. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State Teases.

FILMING

s/ 1. A1l attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: l&\nﬂmm_ao__ 1995 .

" FILING

- 1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The origipal of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file. ’

COMMENTS
95003 B4 Lprve- CA_ bpells 72295

WE71/34-35




FORIS TATE OF UTAH .
- DIVISIO OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:

See Attached
—
—HN 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells, 7. Unit Agreament Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals, See Attached
—
1. Type of Well: 8, Well Narme and Number:
olL Gas | | oTHEr See Attached
2. Name of Operator: 9. APl Well Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201—0749 (303) 573—4455 See Attached
4. Location of Well
Footages: See Attached County: See Attached
QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: See Attached State: Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
{Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
(] Abandon [7 New Construction [ Abandon * [T New Construction
[_] Repair Casing [ ] Pullor Alter Casing 1 Repair Casing [ ] Pull or Alter Casing
[T ] Change of Plans []) Recompletion [} Change of Plans [ ] Perforate
[C] Convertto Injection (7 Perforate [ ] Convertto injection [] Ventor Flare
[] Fracture Treat or Acidize [ Ventor Flare {1 Fracture Treat or Acidize [] Water Shut—0ff
] Multiple Completion [] Water Shut-0Off [(X7] Other _ Change of Operator
[] Other
Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Report resuilts of Multiple Completions and Recompletions fo different reservoirs on WELL
: COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report.

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, !f wellis directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for alf markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please be advised that effective December 27,1995, ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
assumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being
provided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond
#U605382~9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11—40—66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

Bannie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety Analyst
ANR Production Company

- i"i{ OF CiL, GAS & MIE!N‘.{} }
_ “Sheila Bremer o

) Environmental & Safety Analyst
Name & Signature: EAM @L/l’)’\fw Tive: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Date: 03/07/96

‘ (This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
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Pl
Oivision of 0i1, Gas and Mining Ny
OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET Rovtipe: 77
VLECA-BY
Attach 311 documentation received by the division regarding this change. ZJ)T'S/B'—FILE
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. Hﬂiﬁ)/
4¥H?Zﬂ/
é{Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5LREC
3 Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 6FILM
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95 )
TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) PO BOX 749 (address) PO BOX 749
DENVER CO _80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749
phone (303 )572-1121 phone (303 )572-1121
account no. _N_0230 (B) account no. _NO0675
Hel1(s) (attach additional page if needed):
Name : ¥%SEE_ATTACHED#** API: D)%~ 2079 Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec___Twp__ _Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec__ Twp_Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec__ Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: A Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : : API: Entity: Sec___Twp__Rng___ Lease Type:

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

. 1. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form. /2.l /294

¢ 2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). [[(/,73,8—747

AMé‘B. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. "Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number: . '

[%ﬁ 4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

Zé; 5. Changes Have been eptered in the Oil apd Gas_Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
lVisted above. /3/-% ) Y3/ anlien ) (4159 [ e, £i4.5 ) (§-20-9% /) woliry OA.5)

;Zé 6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.
5#57. Well file labels have been updated-for each well Tisted above.

5£,8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. [?¢LZ€7

- ¢ 9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

— OVER -




® | .

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH

entity changes made? (yes/ _ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of

£1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity asiégfments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

_b@é 2. State Lands and the Tax Commiséion have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

' 9. 0 e N Tns. &b
BOND VERTFICATION (Fee wells only) Sirchy Ao Ubo5382-1 (19100 ) lnited fecitic T76. &

V2211. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a

proper bond.
xﬁn7éw/ /ﬂw/z
2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

25@ 3. The former operator Xas requested a release of liability from their bond (yes(zg .
Today's date _ Mere If yes, division response was made by letter

dated . [5,“,; Bond 45 &4%/7

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

QZQ—]. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well Tisted above has been
notified by letter dated 19___ , of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING

MZQ 1. A1l attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: /"1’7 19 ﬁﬁz .

FILING
1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS

sl Tl f/ g nvolys Fze lees, /)m CA taells %ﬁ%ﬁ 5/24 /d&e puells -
L4 £Aﬁwu/}w frrse ﬁ}u/s toitit /44/;4/1/14 27 S2p

Woodla_fim [ Hpre. C.4.'s 4)L9.

Jloos2p  Lia derv. (A% 5"/4/%

W3] Bip Lpre. Tod'sr, [ease poetts 321 -
WET1/34-35 7(7[,//57 Lwcg 2«581/1/340 12-30 754 tnder revicws ad Yhis doae po ”(7 W’L'/
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CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 03/07/96 -- Page20f4
If Indian, LOCATION OF WELL
Lease Designation Allottee or -WWnship .
Well Name & No. AP/ No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages & Range Field County
Brotherson 1-33A4 43-013-30272 Patented 1le$0 N/A N/A 820' FNL & 660' FEL NENE, 33-18-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-10B4 43-013-30443 Patented 1615 N/A N/A 1241"FSL & 1364' FWL  |SESW, 10-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-14B4 43-013-30815 Fee  [olgp N/A N/A 2557' FSL & 1642' FWL.  [NESW, 14-254W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-15B4 43-013-31103 Fee 177] N/A N/A 996' FWL & 1069' FSL SWSW, 15-28-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-22B4 43-013-31086 Fee |79 N/A N/A 1616" FWL & 1533' FSL |NESW, 22-2SaW Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-2B5 43-013-31302 Fee  [[3472 N/A N/A 1034'FSL & 2464' FEL  |[SWSE, 2-25-5W/ Altamont | Duchesne
Christensen 2-29A4 43-013-31303 Fee  j[235 N/A N/A 1425' FSL & 2131' FEL NWSE, 29-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Crook 1-6B4 43-013-30213 Patented 825 N/A N/A 2485 FNL & 1203' FEL  |SENE, 6-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Dastrup 2-30A3 43-013-31320 Fee 1{253 N/A N/A 1250' FSL & 1229' FWL ~ |[SWSW, 30-1S3W Altamont | Duchesne
Doyle 1-10B3 43-013-30187 Patented (8]0 N/A N/A 2382' FNL & 2157 FWL.  [SENW, 10-283W Bluebell | Duchesne
Duncan 2-9B5 43-013-30719 Fee N/A N/A 1701' FWL & 1554' FSL ~ [NESW, 9-25-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Ehrich 3-11B5 43-013-31080 Fee 109 N/A N/A 1654' FSL & 1754 FWL  |[NESW, 11-2S-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Eider 1-13B2 43-013-30366 Patented [ 905 N/A N/A 1490' FNL & 1334' FEL  [SWNE, 13-25-2W Bluebell | Duchesne
Elisworth 1-17B4 43-013-30126 Patented 1l 15 N/A N/A 763' FNL & 1189' FEL NENE, 17-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Elisworth 1-19B4 43-013-30183 Patented [ 70 N/A N/A 2043 FNL & 1764' FEL SWNE, 19-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-20B4 43-013-30351 Patented 1900 N/A N/A 1744' FNL & 1342' FEL SWNE, 20-28-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-8B4 43-013-30112 Fee [ B5 N/A N/A 1765 FNL & 2377 FEL  [SWNE, 8-2S54W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-17B4 43-013-31089 Fee X/ N/A N/A 1355' FWL & 1362 FSL ~ [NESW, 17-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-19B4 43-013-31105 . Fee [76] N/A N/A 1402' FSL & 1810' FWL_ [NESW, 19 -254W | Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-20B4 43-013-31090 Fee 967 N/A N/A 677' FWL & 1611' FSL NWSW, 20-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Elisworth 3-20B4 43-013-31389 ) Fee 1143 N/A N/A 1500' FNL & 1203' FWL — [SWNW, 20-2S4W | Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-12B5 43-013-34024 [ 3ol Y Patented 144y N/A N/A 2479'FNL & 1503' FEL  [SWNE, 12-2S5-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-13B5 43-013-30092 Patented 1ar N/A N/A 670' FNL & 1520' FEL NWNE, 13-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-7B4 43-013-30097 Patented [{00 N/A N/A 1923 FNL & 1095' FEL  [SENE, 7-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 2-12B5 43-013-31115 Fee [, N/A N/A 993' FSL & 768' FWL SWSW, 12-2S5-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 2-7B4 43-013-30470 Patented 1735 N/A N/A 1292'FSL & 1500' FWL  |SESW, 7-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Fieldstead 2-28A4 43-013-31293. Fee 77 N/A N/A 2431' FSL & 2212' FWL  [NESW, 28-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Galloway 1-18B1 43-013-30575 Fee 2305 N/A N/A 1519'FNL & 1565' FEL  |[SWNE, 18-25-1W Bluebell | Duchesne
Hanskutt 2-23B5 43-013-30917 Fee Dl N/A N/A 951' FSL & 761' FWL SWSW, 23-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson 1-24B3 43-013-30629 Fee 239 N/A N/A 1354' FNL & 1540' FWL  [NENW, 24-2S3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Hanson 2-9B3 43-013-31136 Fee {0455 N/A NIA 1461 FWL & 1531' FSL  |NESW, 9-2S5-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 1-32A3 43-013-30141 Patented [{:9p N/A N/A 671 FNL & 1710' FEL NWNE, 32-1S-3w Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 1-5B3 43-013-30109 Patented 1635 N/A : N/A 1200' FNL & 1140' FWL  INENE, 5-2S5-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-29A3 43-013-31043 Fee [6 205 N/A N/A 1857 FWL & 1394' FSL  |NESW, 29-1S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-32A3 43-013-31072 Fee JIAC] N/A N/A 1141 FWL & 1602' FSL [NWSW, 32-1S-3W_ | Altamont | Duchesne
‘? Hanson Trust 2-5B3 43-013-31079 Fee 11530 N/A N/A 1606' FSL & 1482 FWL  |[NESW, 5-25-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hartman 1-31A3 43-013-30093 Fee 5725 N/A N/A 1019'FNL & 1024' FEL ~ |[NENE, 31-1S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hartman 2-31A3 43-013-31243 Fee 11024 N/A N/A 2437' FSL & 1505' FWL — |SWSW, 31-15-3W | Altamont | Duchesne
Hunt 1-21B4 43-013-30214 Patented 134D N/A N/A 1701' FNL & 782' FEL SENE, 21-28-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Hunt 2-21B4 43-013-31114 Fee /839 N/A N/A 1512' FWL & 664' FSL NESW, 21-28-4W Altamont | Duchesne
lorg 2-10B3 43-013-31388 Fee {987 N/A N/A 738' FNL & 660" FEL NENE, 10-2S-3wW Altamont | Duchesne
Lake Fork 3-15B4 43-013-31358 Fee [[37% N/A N/A 1300'FNL & 1450’ FWL  [NENW, 15-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lawrence 1-30B4 43-013-30220 Fee /895 N/A N/A 919' FNL & 1622' FEL NWNE, 30-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lawson 1-28A1 43-013-30358 Fee [90] N/A N/A 2275 FSL & 1802' FEL  [NWSE, 28-1S-1W Bluebell | Duchesne
Lazy K 2-14B3 ~ 43-013-31354. Fee  [/452 N/A N/A 1670' FSL & 1488' FEL  |NWSE, 14-25-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Lindsay 2-33A4 43-013-31141 Fee 10457 N/A N/A 1499' FWL & 663' FSL SESW, 33-18-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lotridge Gates 1-3B3 43-013-30117 Patented [T N/A N/A 965' FNL & 750' FEL NENE, 3-28-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Matthews 2-13B2 43-013-31357- Fee (374 N/A N/A 858' FNL & 1098' FWL NWNW, 13-2S-2W Bluebell | Duchesne

Meeks 3-8B3 43-013-31377 Fee J989 T N/A N/A 1065' FNL & 1124' FWL  [NWNW, 8-2S5-3W Altamont | Duchesne




FORM & ATE OF UTAH .
. DIVISION®F OIL, GAS AND MINING
—
o ’ 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells, 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A
1. Typeof Well: 8. Well Name and Number:
ol GAs | | OTHER: Hanson Trust #2—5B3
2. Name of Operator: 9. AP] Well Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31079
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573—4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: 1606’ FSL & 1482 FWL County: Duchesne
QqQ, sec, T, R,M:  NESW Section 5-T2S~R3W State: Utah
1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
[1 Abandon [ ] New Construction ' (] Abandon * [ ] New Construction
[ Repair Casing (] Pullor Alter Casing [ ] Repair Casing [ ] Pulior Alter Casing
[} Change of Plans [ 1 Recompletion [ ] Change of Plans {1 Perforate
[ Convertto Injection [X7] Perforate [ ] Convertto Injection {1 Ventor Flare
[X7] Fracture Treat or Acidize {— ] Ventor Fiare {1 Fracture Treat or Acidize [ ] Water Shut-Off
[ 7] Multiple Completion [ 1 Water Shut—-Off [ ] Ofher
[ Other
Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Upon Approval Repoart results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report. !

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED CR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please sce the attached workover procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

b

o/

V. OF Gt o

13,

Sheila Bremer

Tite:_Environmental & Safety Analyst 05/31/96

Date:

/

(This space for State use only) 2
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HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
Section 28 TIS R4W
Altamont Field
Duchesne Co. Utah

PROCEDURE:

1.

MIRU PU. NDWH NUBOP. POOH w/2-3/8" N-80 DSS-HT heatstring. Rlse
Uni-pkr set @ 10,334' ?, POOH w/2-3/8" DSS tbg.

MIRU Wireline Co. RIH and set CIBP @ 11,500'. PT csg to 1000 psi.

Perforate the following interval w/a 3-1/8" csg gun loaded w/3 JSPF , 120 phasing.
10,691-11,477' 56' 168 holes

Tie into Gearhard Dual Ind Laterolog dated 6/30/85 for depth control.

RIH wiretr pkr on 2-7/8" tbg. Hydrotest GIH to 8500 psi. Set pkr @ 8500'.
PT csg to 1000 psi. Iftime allows, swab test well.

MIRU Dowell to acidize interval from 10,691-11,477' w/5200 gals of 15% HCL
per attached treatment schedule. MTP 9000 psi. Swab back load and test.

Rlse pkr, POOH

RIH w/re-dressed Uni-pkr, cavity on 2-3/8" tbg. Set pkr @ 10,600'. NDBOP
NUWH. Drop SV, drop pump. Return well to production.




GREATER ALTAMONT FIELD
HANSON TRUST #2-5B3
Section 5-T2S - R3W
Duchesne County, Utah

Perforation Schedule

Gearhart Gearhart
Dual Ind Laterolog Dual Ind Laterolog
Run #2 (6/30/85) Run #2 (6/30/85)
10,691 11,117
10,700 11,127
10,708 11,138
10,723 11,146
10,776 11,163
10,786 11,179
10,809 11,195
10,871 11,226
10,879 11,232
10,891 11,246
10,902 11,255
10,921 11,283
10,930 11,296
10,945 11,305
10,958 11,319
10,966 11,335
10,971 11,363
10,986 11,384
10,997 11,393
11,005 11,400
11,016 11,410
11,034 11,417
11,038 11,420
11,046 11,438
11,051 11,444
11,064 11,449
11,073 11,463
11,098 11,477
56 ZONES

S. H. Laney 5/14/96

B3-5P2.WK4




Well Name: Hanson Tr. #2-5B3 Date: 5/20/96

Fluid Stage 3% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine 15 % Acid Vol. Ball Sealers
Description # (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#, Sq)

Pad 1 1,800
Acid 2 5,200 260
Flush 3 4,600

Totals (gals): 6,400 5,200 260, 1.1 S.G.

(bbls): 152 124
Gelled Saltwater to contain: _1/2_ppg BAF

_1/2_ppg Rock Salt
__ O ppg Wax Beads
__Y_ Crosslinked? YF140 Crosslinked gel
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’TE OF UTAH .

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee
) 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:
oiL GAS D OTHER: Hanson Trust #2-5B3
2. Name of Operator: 9. APl Well Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31079
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wiidcat:
P.0O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL County: Duchesne
QQ, Sec., T, R, M.: NESW Section 5-T2S-R3W State: Utah
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) {Submit Original Form Only)
[] Abandon [] New Construction [ ] Abandon* [ ] New Construction
[ ] Repair Casing [_] PultorAlter Casing [T7]" Repair Casing [] PullorAlter Casing
[] Change of Plans ] Recompletion ] Change of Plans [X7] Perforate
] Convertto Injection [] Perforate [_] Convertto Injection (] VentorFlare
[] Fracture Treat or Acidize [] VentorFiare [X7] Fracture Treat or Acidize [ ] Water Shut-Off
[C] Multiple Completion [ ] Water Shut-Off [] Other
[} Other
Date of work completion 7/16/96
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and R pletion to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. if well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.}

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

MINING

" v OF OIL, GAS &

\% . % ; Sheila B egl‘
Name & Signature: v Mcg/ e \/ Tite Environmental & Safety Analyst Date 08/22/96

(This space for State use only)

(6/94) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)




COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

HANSON TRUST #2-5B3 (PERF & ACIDIZE U WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 77.85424% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26325

TD: 13,999 PBTD: 13,955'

5" LINER @ 13,999'

PERFS: 11,512'-13,962'

CWC(M$): 74.8

6/18/96 ND WH.
MIRU rig & equip. RU Delsco, RIH to 12,000', didn’t have standing valve in cavity - POOH & RD
Delsco. Open well to frac tk. Bled off gas for 3 hrs, still had 125 psi on csg. Shut in csg, press built
to 350 psi in 10 min. Hooked up flowline & open tbg & csg to treater. CC: $3809.

6/19/96 Hot oil & rel pkr @ 10,334".
50# on tbg & csg. Pmpd 55 bbls treated prod wate down csg, pres sup to 10004. Pump 75 bbls
treated prod water down tbg, kill well. ND tree, NU BOP. POOH & LD 168 jts 2%” DSS tbg, heat
string, x-o, ck valve & 2" vollar. Try torel pkr @ 10,334, unable to turn tbg, csg waxed off. Pump
35 bbls treated prod water @ 250° down csg, pressup to 1000#. Will hot oil 6/20 a.m. CC: $7302.

6/20/96 Hot oil & POOH.
RU 2 hot oilers & pmpd 850 bbis treated prod water down tbg & csg @ 250°. Got wax in csg to
move, pump 15 glas DN-98 & flushed 125 bbls treated prod water, work & rotate tbg, unable to rel
pkr. PU power swivel, work & rotate tbg, rel pkr @ 10,334', RD power swivel. POOH w/199 jts
2%” DSS tbg w/pkr hanging up all the way. Pkr hung up in paraffin @ 4085', unable to pull up any
higher, EOT @ 4090'. CC: $12,533.

6/21/96 WO0O.
RU two hot oilers & pmp 200 bbls treated prod water @ 250° down csg. RU power swivel, work &
rotate through tight spot. Work pkr free & POOH, left 5" pkr in hole. RU WL, RIH w/2'4” CL, tag
pkr @ 4457'. Found 3%” OD pump cavity was twisted & had marks indicating possible csg damage
in7" csg @4457. CC: $17,145.

6/22-23/96 No activity.

6/24/96 PU 274" tbg.
Bled 950# off well. WOO. Order out fishing tools & tbg, change equip over to 27%” - BOPs failed -
replaced with new. Tally, PU & RIH w/3%” OS w/3-1/16" grapple, jars on 89 jts 27&” N-80 tbg to
3050'. CC: $22,128.

6/25/96 RIH w/27%4” thg.

PU & RIH w/27&” tbg, tag tight spot @ 4449, tried to work over pkr @ 4457'. POOH w/27&” tbg,
BHA & 3%”x3-1/16" OS, OS collapsed from 3%” to 3-1/16" w/1" mark 25" long. PU & RIH
w/3V’x1ve” swedge. Took 5000# to push 314" swedge through tight spot & 5000# over to pull back
through. Run down & tagged w/4%”, x-o, bumped 4% down 2', EO swedge @ 4482'. POOH w/274”
tbg, BHA & 3%”"x1s” swedge, had marks from swedge to 4%” x-0. RIH w/4-15/16"x3-15/16"
swedge, 1-4%” DC, BS, jars, 6-4%” DC, intensifier & 27" tbg to 3930'. Left well open to treater.
CC: $30,033.

6/26/96 Run swedge through tight spot.
RIH w/27&” tbg, tag tight spot @ 4449'. Bumb & jar 4-15/16" swedge through 4' (4449'-4453").
POOH w/27s” tbg, BHA & 4-15/16" swedge. RIH w/5%4"x4-15/16" swedge, 1-4% DC, BS, jars, 2-
454" Dcs, intensifier, 276" tbg - tag tight spot @ 4449'. Bump & jar 57%” swedge through 4' (4449'-
4453"). POOH w/2%” tbg, BHA & 57" swedge. RIH w/ 64" sprial swedge, hit tight spot @ 105',
unable to get through, POOH wi/tools. RIH wistraight 6%” swedge, bump & jar through tight spot
@ 4449'-4453'. POOH w/4 jts 276" tbg to 4831'. Well open to treater. CC: $36,548.

6/27/96 RIH w/tbg & 4”x3-1/16" OS,
Run 6" swedge through tight spot @ 4449'-4453', POOH w/tbg, BHA & 616" swedge. RU WL,
RIH & tag pkr @ 8064', POOH, RD WL. RIH w/4%"x3-1/16" OS, BS, jars, 1 - 3%” DC & 27" tbg -
did not tag anything @ 8350'. Order out more 27” tbg. POOH w/274” tbg to 4383'. Left weli open
to treater. CC: $43,533.



Page 2

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

HANSON TRUST #2-5B3 (PERF & ACIDIZE U WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 77.85424% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26325

6/28/96

6/29-30/96

7/1/96

7/2/96

7/3/96

7/4/96

7/5/96

7/6/96

/7196

7/8/96

7/9/96

7/10/96

7/11/96

7/12/96

7/13/96

WOO.
RIH w/4¥”x3~1/16" OS to 12,021'. Did not tag fish. POOH, LD fishing tools, RU Atlas, RIH
w/vertilog, log from 5805'-surface - indicated holes in 7" csg from 4446'-4450'. CC: $54,247.

No activity.

RIH w/CIBP.

Order out & RU OWP, RIH w/5" WL RBP & set @ 6900, POOH. Fill csg w/180 bbls treated prod
water, press test csg to 1000#, ok. RD WL. RIH w/ret head to RBP, latch onto & rel RBP. POOH
w/5" RBP. Break out BS, jars, intensifier. LD 6 4%” DCs. CC: $61,077.

Flowing well.

RU OWP. RIH & set 5" CIBP @ 11,500', perf Upper Wasatch from 11,477'-10,691' w/3&” csg guns,
3 SPF, 120° phasing.

Run #1: 11,477'-11,246', 19 ft, 57 holes, psi 0, FL 6000".

Run #2: 11,232"-10,997', 19 ft, 57 holes, psi 0, FFL 5400".

Run #3: 10,986"-10,691", 18 ft, 54 holes, psi 0, FL 5200".

RD OWP. RU to hydrotest, RIH w/5" HD pkr, SN & 274" tbg testing to 8500 psi, pkr @ 4125'. Weli
started flowing. Flow to frac tank. Hooked up line from tbg to treater, open tbg to treater. Flowed
411 BO, 64 BW, 215 MCF, 45 psi FTP, 39/64" ck, 10 hrs. CC: $75,971.

Fiwd 420 BO, 0 BW, 310 MCF, FTP 220#, 24/64" ck, 22 hrs.
Flwd 449 BO, 0 BW, 302 MCF, FTP 2004, 24/64" ck.
Fiwd 329 BO, 0 BW, 265 MCF, FTP 375#, 19/64" ck.
Fiwd 282 BO, 0 BW, 242 MCF, FTP 1504, 19/64" ck.
Fiwd 295 BO, 0 BW, 242 MCF, FTP 125#, 19/64" ck.
Flwd 277 BO, 0 BW, 221 MCF, FTP 1004, 19/64" ck.
Flwd 244 BO, 0 BW, 221 MCF, FTP 180#, 19/64" ck.
Flwd 165 BO, 0 BW, 236 MCF, FTP 130#, 19/64" ck.

Flowing well.

Flwd 142 BO, 128 BW, 119 MCF, FTP 150#, 24/64" ck, 17 hrs.

150# tbg press, 850# csg press, pmp 125 bbls treated prod water down csg w/tbg flowing back @
13/64" ck. SD pump dn tbg & circ well w/550 bbls treated prod water for 2% hrs. SWI 1 hr, opened
up well to frac tank & flwd back 25 bbls water in 15 min. Will bullhead tbg & csg to kill well &
place on pump. CC: $84,854.

Flowing well.

FTP 1504, SICP 600#. Pump 150 bbls treated prod water down tbg, holding 900# on csg w/choke
when water up csg SI Csg w/1000# on tbg & csg. Dropped to 700# in 30 min, stayed @ 700# for 1%
hrs. Pmpd 1 bbis in tbg & csg 1000 psi, open tbg to frac tank, flowed back 25 BW 12 min. Open tbg
to ttr @ 2:30 pm, flwg @ 330# on 24/64" ck. CC: $87,075.

Kill well, LD 274” tbg workstring.

Csg 7004, tbg 360#, MIRU Halliburton WLS. RIH w/2%” plug, set @ 500", RIH w/5" HD pkr, set
@ 5917. Pmp 10 bbls TFW down tbg, rls plug, POOH, RD Halliburton. Bullhead pmpd on tbg %
BPM @ 2700#, 140 BBLTFW. Well on small vacuum. Rel 5" pkr @ 5917'. RIH w/82 jts 274" tbg,
EOT @ 8600, circ down tbg, up csg w/175 bbls TFW, 4 BPM @ 450#. CC: $91,930.




Page 3

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

HANSON TRUST #2-5B3 (PERF & ACIDIZE U WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 77.85424% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26325

7/14/96

7/15/96

7/16/96

RIH w/2%” prod tbg.

SITP 504, SICP 50#. Flush tbg w/65 bbls TFW. EOT @ 6800". POOH, LD 270 jts 27" tbg
workstring. X-o0 equip to 2%” tbg, MIRU Four Star hydortest unit. RIH w/2%” prod tbg, hydrotest
to 8500# pulling long drift, EOT @ 5977'. CC: $95,807.

On production.

SITP 20#, STCP 150#, bled off. RIH w/2%” tbg testing to 8500#, RD hydrotest truck. Set 5" R-3
pkr @ 10,614, fand tbg w/16,000# comp. ND BOP, NU WH. Flush tbg w/60 bbls treated prod water
@ 255°. RU WL, RIH w/SV & seat @ 10,580". RD WL, test csg & pkr to 1000#, ok. Drop pump
& loadout pump lines, RD rig. CC: $107,474. '

Pmpd 191 BO, 83 BW, 240 MCF, PP 3500#, 15 hrs,

Pmpd 292 BO, 0 BW, 374 MCF, PP 3500#, 24 hrs.
Prior Prod: 0 BO, 0 BW, 0 MCF (uneconomic).
RD & stack outrig, SD. CC: $114,798.

Final Report.




FORM ¢ QTE OF UTAH ‘
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals.

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

N/A

7. Unit Agreement Name:

N/A

1. Type of Well:

8. Well Name and Number;
Hanson Trust #2-5B3

oLx] eas[ | orHer:
2. Name of Operator;

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. AP[ Well Number:

43-013-31079

3. Address and Telephone Number:

10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL county:  Duchesne
QQ, Sec., T, R., M.: NESW Section 5-T2S-R3W State: Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Onily)
[ 1 Abandon [ 1 New Construction [ Abandon* [T7] New Construction
[ ] Repair Casing [] Pullor Alter Casing [ ] Repair Casing [ ] Pullor Alter Casing
[] Change of Plans (1 Recompletion [1 Change of Plans {1 Perforate
[1 Convert to Injection [ Perforate [1 Convert to Injection [} VentorFlare
[X7] Fracture Treat or Acidize [1 VentorFlare "1 Fracture Treat or Acidize [ 1 Water Shut-Off
[ ] Multiple Completion [] Water Shut-Off [] Other
Other _ Convert to Rod Pump
Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Upon Approval Report results of Multiple Comg and R P to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached workover procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

ECEIVIE]

SEP 0 91996

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

13.

Sheila Bremer

Name & Signature: VJ‘,@ g),u//&u @/\///’W\/ Tile  Environmental & Safety Analyst  pate 09/05/96

{This space for State use only) Z /

‘ (5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
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HANSEN TRUST #2-5B3
Section 5 T2S R3W
Altamont Field
Duchesne Co. Utah

PROCEDURE:

1.

MIRU PU. Pump jet pump out of hole. Kill well if necessary. NDWH. Rlse R-3
pkr set @ 10617'. NUBOP. POOH w/pkr and cavity.

RIH wi/retr pkr on 2-7/8" tbg. Hydrotest tbg GIH to 8500 psi. Set pkr @ 10,600'.
PT csg to 500 psi.

MIRU Dowell to acidize interval from10,691-11,477' w/5500 gals 15% HCL per
attached treatment schedule. MTP 8500 psi. '

Swab back load and test.

Rlise pkr, POOH w/tbg.

RIH w/6' bullplugged perf’d sub, SN, approx 29 jts 2-3/8" tbg, TAC, 4900' of
2-3/8" tbg and 2-7/8" tbg to surf.. Tag CIBP @ 11,500". PU and set TAC @

10,591'. RIH w/1-1/2" pump. Call Denver for rod string design. Return well to
production.




Well Name: Hanson Tr. #2-5B3 Date:

8/15/95
Fluid Stage 3% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine| 15 % Acid Vol. | Ball Sealers
Description # (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#,Sg)
Pad 1 2,200
Acid 2 5,500 260
Flush 3 3,100
Totals (gals): 5,300 5,500 260, 1.1 S.G.
(bbls): 126 131

Gelled Saltwater to contain:  _1/2_ppg BAF
_1/2_ppg Rock Salt

-0_ppgWaxBeads
__Y__Crosslinked? YF140 Crosslinked gel
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WELL PROFILE
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FORM 9’ 2"

RE OF UTAH
el DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.

7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A

1. Type of Well:

OTHER:

8. Well Name and Number:
Hanson Trust #2-5B3

oL cas| |
2. Name of Operator:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. APl Well Number:

43-013-31079

3. Address and Telephone Number:

10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL county,  Duchesne
QQ, Sec., T, R, M.: NESW Section 5-T2S-R3W State: Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

{Submit In Duplicate)

Abandon

Repair Casing

Change of Plans
Convert to Injection
Fracture Treat or Acidize

Jogodo

Multiple Completion
Other

Lugoood

New Construction
Pull or Alter Casing
Recompletion
Perforate

Vent or Flare
Water Shut-Off

Approximate date work will start

{Submit Original Form Only)

[] Abandon* (1 New Construction

"1 Repair Casing [] Pullor Alter Casing

[ ] Change of Plans (] Perforate

[} Convert to Injection [] VentorFlare

[X] Fracture Treat or Acidize 1. Water Shut-Off
Other__Convert to Rod Pump

Date of work completion 10/13/96

Report results of Multiple C and R ions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

EIVER

v

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MIMING

13
Name & Signature: \%A m )/

Sheila Bremer

Tite_ Environmental & Safety Analyst  pate 10/23/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94)

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)
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Page 4
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY
HANSON TRUST #2-5B3 (ACIDIZE, CONVERT TO ROD PUMP)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT
WI: 77.9% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26530/26531
TD: 13,999' PBTD: 11,500
5" LINER @ 5780'-13,999'
PERFS: 10,691'-11,477'
CWC(MS$): 52.3
CWC(MS$): 1154
10/7/96 RIH w/5" pkr & 274" tbg.
MIRU. ND WH. NU BOP. Rel 5" pkr @ 10,617'. POOH w/2%” tbg, BHA & pkr. LD 150 jts, had
a problem w/hard wax. Change equip over to 27%. CC: $4278.
10/8/96 Acidize.
PU & RIH w/5" HD pkr & 274" tbg. Hydrotest to 8500#. Set pkr @ 10,604". Fili csg w/80 bbls
treated prod water, test annulus to 5004, ok. CC: $9562.
10/9/96 Well started flowing.

SITP 300#, bled off. RU Dowell & acidize perfs from 10,691'-11,477' w/5500 gals 15% HCL & 260
1.1 sg Bss. MTP 8600#, ATP 8400#, MTR 21.5 BPM, ATR 14 BPM. ISIP 4000#, S min 0#. Good
diversion, TLTR 288 bbls. RD Dowell, RU swab. Made 6 runs/3 hrs, IFL 5800, FFL sfc, swabbed
17 BW, 20 BO, PH 5. Well started flowing, flowed to frac tank for 2% hrs - flwd 110.6 BO, 27.7
BW, PH 5. Turned well to treater. Flwd 453 BO, 14 BW, 315 MCF, 30/64" ck, 220# FTP, 12 hrs.

CC: $33,718.
10/10/96 Flwd 643 BO, 7 BW, 294 MCF, 30/64" ck, FTP 210#.
10/11/96 Fiwd 633 BO, 0 BW, 474 MCF, FTP 190#, 30/64" ck.
10/12/96 Fiwg 665 BO, 0 BW, 435 MCF, FTP 1954, 30/64" ck.
10/13/96 Fiwg 663 BO, 2 BW, 448 MCF, FTP 2054, 30/64" ck.

Prior prod: Pmpg 110 BO, 0 BW, 121 MCF.
Final Report.




Pors

FORM © TE OF UTAH

DIVISION ! IL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals,

6. If Indian, Allottes or Tribe Name:

N/A

7. Unit Agreement Name:

N/A

1. Type of Well:
OTHER:

8. Well Name and Number:

Hanson Trust #2-5B3

oL GAS D
2. Name of Operator:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. APl Well Number:

43-013-31079

3. Address and Telephone Number:

10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL County: Duchesne
QQ, Sec., T., R, M: NESW Section 5-T2S-R3W State: Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) {Submit Original Form Only)
[ ] Abandon [ 1 New Construction {1 Abandon* [ 1 New Construction
{1 Repair Casing [ 1 Pullor Alter Casing [ 1 Repair Casing ("] Pultor Alter Casing
[} Change of Plans [} Recompletion [ ] Change of Plans [} Perforate
] Convert to Injection [] Perforate [ 1 Convert to Injection [ VentorFlare
[ ] Fracture Treat or Acidize 1 VentorFlare [ 1 Fracture Treat or Acidize [ 1 Water Shut-Off
{7 Multiple Completion [] Water Shut-Off Other_ SWD Flowline Installation
[ ] Other
Date of work completion 15’7/ 3/ 96
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and R pletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

A 2" steel SWD flowline has been installed on the subject well. All applicable damage settlements have been made.

ECEIVE

APR 28 1397

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & M1 116G

13

Name & Sigm\W@ M

Sheila Bremer

Tite_Environmental & Safety Analyst  pate 04/24/97

(This space for State use only)

‘ (5/94)

I

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

&

. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

]

. IFINDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

~

. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not usa this form for proposals lo drill new wells, significantly deepen exisling wells below currenl boltem-hole deplh, reenter plugged wells, of lo
drill horizontal falerals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oiL WeLL [] GASWELL []  OTHER

Exhibig "'A"
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
368 _South 1200 Easgt civ Vernal state Utahzr 84078 435-789-4433

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: g s Cl . : R COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: o : ' STATE:

' UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

71 worice oF mTent

{Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

[} suBsEQUENT REPORT
{Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dale of work completion:

HOOOOOood

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL.SITE

other:_Name Change

UoOoooooog
OOO0O00Oo0ood

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumaes, eic.
As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
has been changed to El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JU0708
Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

 MAME (PLEASE PRINT, ohn T Elzner TITLE Vice President
SIGHATURE 7 ’ onte L& =15 -0/
\\Tﬁ‘<iEl Paso Pedduction Oil & Gas Company
. HAME (PLEASE PRIV John T %lzper wme Vice President
SIGNATURE 7 1 e onte Db -15 -8/
[ / [ ]

U S .
{This space for S{ate usa only, R E C E EVE D

JUN % 2001

(5/2000) (See Instruclions on Reverse Side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING




‘ State of Delaware .

Office of the Secretary of State

PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF
DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT
COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN
THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O’CLOCK

A.M.

H

RECEIViED

i

FEREIE B0 SR 22 2 9
RS E N i

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MinING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE: 04-03-01



[

03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4088 CORP. LAY DEPT.

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF
CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the “Company™), a corporation
organized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State of
Delaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimous
written consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolution
proposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate of
Incorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate of
Incorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporation be so emended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
“FIRST.” so that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows;

“FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company.”

SECOND: That in leu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, the
stockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment in
accordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance with
the applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
has caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice President and attested by an
Assistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
W
- ‘David L. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE
DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS

E:é E {:‘ - ? v"““ §% FILED 11:00 AM 03/09,/2001
L #t t 010118394 — 0610204
HUR 132001

DIVISION OF
OlL, GAS AND MINING

do003/003 .



Division ot Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2.CDW “1— 5-Lp.”
3.JLT 6-FILE
Enter date after each listed item is completed
Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent
Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: ~ 3-09-2001

FROM: (O1d Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

TO: ( New Operator):

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account N0O230 Account NI845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

APl ENTITY |[SEC TWN [LEASE |[WELL (WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE | STATUS
MILES 2-3B3 43-013-31261 |[11102 03-02S-03W {FEE oW P
RUST 1-4B3 43-013-30063 |1575 04-02S-03W |FEE oW P
RUST 3-4B3 43-013-31070 |1576 04-02S-03W [FEE oW P
HANSON TRUST 1-5B3 43-013-30109 [1635 05-02S-03W |FEE oW P
HANSON TRUST 2-5B3 43-013-31079 1636 05-02S-03W [FEE ow P
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 43-013-30780 |9355 08-02S-03W |FEE oW P
MEEKS 3-8B3 43-013-31377 (11489 08-02S-03W |FEE oW P
HANSON 2-9B3 43-013-31136 [10455 09-02S-03W |FEE oW P
DOYLE 1-10B3 43-013-30187 |1810 10-02S-03W [FEE oW p
1IORG 2-10B3 43-013-31388 11482 10-02S-03W |FEE oW P
RUDY 1-11B3 43-013-30204 1820 11-02S-03W |FEE oW P
LAZY K 2-11B3 43-013-31352 11362 11-02S-03W |FEE oW P
JENKINS 2-12B3 (CA 96-79) 43-013-31121 [10459 12-02S8-03W |FEE oW P
FLYING DIAMOND ROPER 1-14B3 43-013-30217 11850 14-02S-03W |FEE oW P
LAZY K 2-14B3 43-013-31354 |11452 14-02S-03W |FEE OW P
BODRERO 1-15B3 43-013-30565 12360 15-02S-03W |FEE OW S
LINMAR HANSON 1-16B3 43-013-30617 |9124 16-02S-03W [FEE OW P
EVANS UTE 2-17B3 (CA 96-104) 43-013-31056 [5336 17-02S-03W |FEE OwW P
MYRIN 2-18B3 (CA 70814) 43-013-31297 [11475 18-02S-03W [FEE oW P
EVANS 1-19B3 (CA 96-78) 43-013-30265 |1776 19-02S-03W |FEE ow p
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerece, Division of Corporations Database on:

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

YES

O

06/21/2001

Business Number: 608186-0143




. ‘ g

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:

1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/03/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/03/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/03/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING: ) .
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: é {50l
FILING:

1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso

Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change File".




Sundry Number: 16740 APl Wl | Number: 43013310790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS e OTTEEO
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current -
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013310790000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1606 FSL 1482 FWL

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 05 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
!/ ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
VI NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [0 cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [0 cHanGE TUBING [0 cHANGE WELL NAME
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[ sueseQUENT REPORT (] peepen [] FRACTURE TREAT [] NEw consTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE / RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: !/ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [] wATER SHUTOFF [] sITa STATUS EXTENSION [] app ExTENSION
Report Date:
[] WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION O] ortHer OTHER: | Add Perfs and Acidize d

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Please see attached procedure.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: {"'\IO?{ 18/2011 :

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 7/14/2011

RECEIVED Jul. 14, 2011




Sundry Number: 16740 APl Wl | Number: 43013310790000

HANSON TRUST 2-5B3 RECOMPLETION SUMMARY

POOH with rods and tubing.
Set a CBP with wireline at approximately 11,490’.
Perforate the Wasatch and Lower Green River from approximately 9480’ — 11,449’.

Acidize new and old Wasatch and Lower Green River perforations above CBP in four stages
with approximately a total of 45,000 gal 15% HCI acid + additives.

Drill out CBP @ approximately 11,490’.

Run tubing and rods and produce the well commingled.

7/14/2011

RECEIVED Jul. 14, 2011




Sundry Number: 19035 APl Wl | Number: 43013310790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS e OTTEEO
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current -
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013310790000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1606 FSL 1482 FWL

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 05 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
!/ ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
J SUBSEQUENT REPORT P D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
9/1 3/20 1 1 D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
|:| SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
!/ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: [J wATER sHUTOFF [] sITA STATUS EXTENSION [] aPD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
El Paso perforated from 11445' - 9468'. Treat Stage 1 (11097'-11478")

pumped 10 bbls KCL, 2000 gal 15% HCL, flush 10000 gal 15% HCL with 225

bio-balls for diversion. Treat Stage 2 perfs(10689' - 11064') pumped 10 bbidccepted by the
KCL, 2000 gal 15% HCL, flush 10000 gal 15% with 225 bio-balls for diversiodtah Division of

Treat Stage 3 perfs (10199' - 10658') pumped 10 bbls KCL, 1000 gal 15@il, Gas and Mining

HCL, flush 9000 gal 15% HCL with 170 bio-balls for diversion. Treat
perfs (9480'-10122"') pumped 10 bbls KCL, 1000 gal 15% HCL, flush 1 Og%l RECORD ONLY
15% HCL with 200 bio-balls for diversion. See attached Operations Summary

for more detail of operations.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/3/2011

RECEIVED Cct. 03, 2011




Sundry Nunber: 19035 APl Well Number: 43013310790000

WESTERN

ALTAMONT FIELD

HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEIVED Cct. 03, 2011




Sundry Number: 19035 APl Wl | Number: 43013310790000
WESTERN
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company WESTERN
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
Rig Name/No. KEY ENERGY/5, PEAK/1100* Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start Date 8/10/2011 End Date
Spud Date 4/6/1985 uwi 005-002-S 003-W 30
Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @6,106.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 153987/36601 / HANSON TRUST 2-5 B3 (ORR
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub [ OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
8/11/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 28 P TGSM & JSA ( RIGGING DOWN )
7:30 10:00 2.50 RDMO 02 P RDMO DWR 3-28 B5
10:00 10:30 0.50 MIRU 28 P MOL TGSM & JSA ( RIGGING UP)
10:30 11:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P SPOT IN AND RIG UP
11:30 13:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 14 P WORK PUMP OFF SEAT WHILE PUMPING DOWN CSG. L/D
P-ROD, SUBS AND 3 RODS. PU P-ROD
13:30 14:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH TBG AND RODS W/ 65 BBLS.
14:30 16:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D P-ROD POOH W/ 120 1", 130 7/8", 158 3/4" L/D AND RETIRE
2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 36' WALS RHBC. ( FLUSHING AS NEEDED )
C/O TO TBG EQ.,
16:30 17:30 1.00 CTU 16 P TEMP LAND TBG W/ 6' PUP JT, NU BOPS, RU WORK FLOOR,
RELEASE TAC, RE LAND ON HANGER. BOPS HAD HYDRAULIC
LEAK. SWI CSDFN.
8/12/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POOH W/ MYT ELEVATORS )
7:30 12:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CSIP @ 250# PSIG TSIP @ 200# PSIG, BWD. POOH W/ 328 JTS
2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, +45 PSN, 6' PUP JT, C/O TO 2-3/8" EUE,
3-1/2" P.B.G.A, 1 JT 2-3/8", 5" W.C.S TAC, 2-3/8" SOLID PLUG.
12:30 14:30 2.00 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ 4" GR,JB & CCL TAG FILL @ 13,924' POOH W/ GR
14:30 20:30 6.00 CHLOG 18 P RIH W/ CCL GAMMA RAY LOG FROM 13,924' TO 7500' SWIFN
CSDFN CT.
8/13/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM ( HYDROTESTING)
7:30 16:00 8.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CSIP @ 250 PSIG, BWD, MU & RIH W/ 4-1/8" BIT, 5" CSG
SCRAPER, RU 4-STAR HYDROTESTOR, BEG TESTING 328 JTS
2-7/8" 8RD EUE PROD TBG ( 1 BAD ) PU AND TEST 38 JTS
2-7/8" 8RD N-80 EUE TBG TO 11,538'
16:00 18:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RDMOL W/ 4-STAR TESTING EQUIPTMENT, POOH W/ 240 JTS
2-7/8" 8RD N-80 EUE TBG.EOT @ 3960'.
8/14/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PERFORATING )
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P COO0H W/ 125 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD N-80 EUE TBG, L/D 5" SCRAPER &
4-1/8" BIT.

October 03, 2011 at 8:26 am

RECEIVED_Cct.

03, 2011 OpenWells




Sundry Nunber:

19035 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

WESTERN

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
9:00 18:00 9.00 WLWORK 21 P MOL W/ LONE WOLF WIRE LINE UNIT TGSM & JSA ( OVER HEAD
LOADS ) RIG UP RIH W/ 8 CONS 3-1/8" HSC GUN RUNS
PERFORATING 3 JSPF W/ 120* PHASING W/ 22.7 GM CHARGES,
PERFORATE FROM 11445' TO 9468'. 1969 GROSS FT., 111 NET
FT., 333 HOLES. RDMOL W/ WIRE LINE UNIT.
18:00 20:00 2.00 INSTUB 39 P MU & RIH W/ 5" WCS RBP, 6' 2-3/8" PUP JT., 5" WCS HD PKR, 1
JT, + 45 PSN, 100 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG. EOT 3125', SWI
CSDFWE.
8/15/2011 6:00 6:00 24.00 P NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
8/16/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 INSTUB 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIH W/ TBG )
7:30 13:30 6.00 INSTUB 39 P TSIP & CSIP @ 300# PSIG, BWD, CIH W/ 226 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE
TBG, L/D 69 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, RIH W/ 38 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD
EUE TBG, LAND TBG W/ HANGER, EOT @ 9377"
13:30 15:00 1.50 INSTUB 16 P RIG DOWN WORK FLOOR AND TBG EQ., NIPPLE DOWN BOPS,
C/O TOROD EQ.,
15:00 17:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ (USED) 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 36' RHBC, 130 7/8", 120 1", LAY
DOWN 85 1", PU P-RO SWIFN CSDFN CT.
8/17/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( LAYING DOWN RODS )
7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH LAYING DOWN P-ROD, 35 1", 130 7/8", RIH W/ 158 3/4",
LAY DOWN 158 3/4" 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 36' WALS RHBC, SWI.
11:00 12:00 1.00 RDMO 02 P RDMOL TO 3-8 B4
9/1/2011 10:00 11:30 1.50 MIRU 01 P ROAD RIG TO LOC RU
11:30 14:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 16 P SICP SITP 50 PSI BLOW DWN WELL NDWH NUBOP X OVER TO
TBG EQ RU WORK FLOOR
14:00 18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 27 P TALLY 2 7/8 TBG & PU 67 JTS SET RBP @11490 POOH W/ 14
JTS SET PKR @ 11072 SWI WAIT ON ACID CREW
9/2/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO1 28 P MOL W/ ACTION HOT OIL UNIT TGSM & JSA ( HEATING WTR))
7:30 11:00 3.50 STGO1 18 P HEAT WTR FOR ACID JOB ( PREP LOCATION FOR ACID EQ., )
9/3/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (ACADIZING)
7:30 9:00 1.50 MIRU 01 P TSIP 200 CSIP 100 BLOW DWN WELL RU HALLIBURTON
9:00 10:00 1.00 STGO1 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES & EQ., TO 9100# PSIG, TREAT STAGE 1
PERFS ( 11,097 TO 11,478' ) PUMP 10 BBLS KCL, 2000 GAL
15% HCL, FLUSH 10,000 GAL 15% HCL W/ 225 BIO-BALLS FOR
DIVERSION. FLUSH W/ 81.3 BBLS. ISDP VAC. AVE RATE 19
BPM MX RATE 23.5 AVE PRES @ 5018 MAX PSIG 7302 (
TRICKLE DOWN CSG @ 2 BPM DURING ACID JOB. )
10:00 11:30 1.50 STG02 27 P RELEASE PKR RIH & RET PLUG, POOH SET PLUG @ 11090' AND
PKR @ 10673'.
11:30 12:30 1.00 STG02 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES & EQ., TO 9100# PSIG, TREAT STAGE 2
PERFS ( 10,689 TO 11,064' ) PUMP 10 BBLS KCL, 2000 GAL
15% HCL, FLUSH 10,000 GAL 15% HCL W/ 225 BIO-BALLS FOR
DIVERSION. FLUSH W/ 78.9 BBLS. ISDP VAC. AVE RATE 19.1
BPM MAX RATE 21.9, AVE PSIG @ 1738 MAX PSIG 2639 (
TRICKLE DOWN CSG @ 2 BPM DURING ACID JOB. )
12:30 14:00 1.50 STGO03 27 P RELEASE PKR, RET PLUG POOH & SET PLG @ 10,670' & PKR @
10,165'
14:00 15:00 1.00 STGO03 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES & EQ., TO 9100# PSIG, TREAT STAGE 3
PERFS (10,199 TO 10,658' ) PUMP 10 BBLS KCL, 1000 GAL
15% HCL, FLUSH 9,000 GAL 15% HCL W/ 170 BIO-BALLS FOR
DIVERSION. FLUSH W/ 77.7 BBLS. ISDP VAC. AVE RATE @ 16
BPM MAX RATE 22.5 AVE PSIG @ 5042, MAX PSIG 7126 (
TRICKLE DOWN CSG @ 2 BPM DURING ACID JOB. )
15:00 16:30 1.50 STG04 27 P RELEASE PKR, RET PLUG, SET PLUG @ 10,150' & SET & TEST

PKR @ 9434' (200 BBLS TO FILL TESTED GOOD @ 1000 PSIG )

October 03, 2011 at 8:26 am

RECEIVED Cet. 031 2011 OpenWells




Sundry Number: 19035 APl Wl | Number: 43013310790000

WESTERN
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
16:30 17:30 1.00 STG04 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES & EQ., TO 9100# PSIG, TREAT STAGE 4

PERFS (9480 TO 10,122" ) PUMP 10 BBLS KCL, 1000 GAL 15%
HCL, FLUSH 10,000 GAL 15% HCL W/ 200 BIO-BALLS FOR
DIVERSION. FLUSH W/ 77.7 BBLS. ISDP 1625 5 MIN 1279 10 MIN
1139 15 MIN 1068. AVE RATE @ 17.4 BPM MAX RATE 18.7 AVE
PSIG @ 5917, MAX PSIG 7213 ( TRICKLE DOWN CSG @ 2 BPM
DURING ACID JOB. )

17:30 18:30 1.00 FB 19 P RDMOL W/ HALLIBURTON ACID EQ., RU FLOW BACK LINES
FLOW BACK TTL OF 15 BBLS

18:30 20:00 1.50 STG04 18 P RELEASE PKR RIH ATTEMPT TO RELEASE PLUG W/ NO
SUCCESS

20:00 21:00 1.00 STG04 18 P POOH W/ 16 JTS SWIFN CSDFN CT. EOT 9437' CSDFN CT.

9/4/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT & TGSM & JSA TRIPPING TBG

7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TSIP @ 50# CSIP @ 50#, BWD, RIH W/ 26 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE
TBG

11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P LATCH ON TO RBP, WORK PLUG FREE. L/D 38 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD
EUE TBG. POOH W/ 283 JTS PROD TBG. L/D PKR DID NOT HAVE
RBP.

14:00 15:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 42 P WAIT ON NEW RET. HEAD

15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CSG BLOWING, PUMP 50 BBLS 2% KCL, PUMU & RIH W/ 5" RET

HEAD, 133 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG. EOT @ 4158'. TURNED
CSG TO SALES, SI TBG FOR HOLIDAY WEEK END.

9/5/2011 NO ACTIVITY SDFHWE
9/6/2011 NO ACTIVITY SDFHWE
9/7/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT & TGSM: JSA (BLOWING DWN WELL)
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P SITP 300 PSI BLOW DWN WELL PUMP 60 BBLS DWN CSG OPEN
WELL TIH W/ 189 JTS 2-7/8 N80 EUE TBG WELL BLEW IN
12:00 16:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P NU WASHINGTON HEAD PUMP 60 BBLS DWN TBG PU 118 JTS
2-7/8 TBG N80 EUE TAG BTM @ 13930' SET & RELEASE PLUG
16:00 19:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 118 JTS 2-7/8 N80 EUE TBG CONT POOH W/ 80 JNTS 2-7/8
N80 EUE TBG EOT @ 7813' SIT TURN CSG DWN SALES CT
9/8/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (TRIPPING TBG)
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P SITP 350 PSIG PUMP 50 BBLS DWN TBG POOH W/ 249 JTS

2-7/8" EUE N80 TBG (HAD TO KILL TBG 2 TIMES ON WAY OUY
W/ TOTAL OF 80 BBLS) LD RBP

12:00 15:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PU MU BULL PLUG 5" TAC 1 JT 2-3/8" EUE N80 TBG 3-1/2 PBGA
2-7/8" X 2-3/8" X OVER 6' 2-7/8"EUE N80 TBG SUB 2-7/8" PSN
329 JTS 2-7/8" EUE N80 TBG KILLCSG W/ 80 BBLS

15:30 17:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P RU WORK FLOOR NDBOP SET 5" TAC @10473' NUWH
17:00 18:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P X OVER TO ROD EQUP SIT OPEN CSG TO SALES
9/9/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (PU RODS)
7:30 13:30 6.00 PRDHEQ 24 P SITP 50 PSI BLOW DWN TBG FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLSPU &
PRIME 2-1/2 X 1-3/4 X 36' RD PUMP PU 18 1" RECOND. W/G 2 1"
NEW W/G 3/4" 56 W/G 19 SLK 63 W/G 7/8" 120 SLK 10 W/G 1"
124 SLK
13:30 16:30 3.00 RDMO 02 P SPACE RODS OUT W/ 1-8' 1" 1- 2" 1" PONY SUBS PU 1-1/2 X 36'
POLISH ROD FILL & TEST TBG W/ 55 BBLS STROKE TEST TO
1000 PSI RD RIG SLIDE PUMPING UNIT PWOP PREP TO MOVE
OFF LOC IN AM.
9/13/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING
DOWN. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:00 3.50 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG TO LOCATION. SLIDE PUMPING UNIT & RIG UP.
11:00 14:30 3.50 INARTLT 18 P FILL TBG W/ 30 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. PRESSURE TEST TBG TO

1000 PSI. LONG STROKE PUMP DOUBLE TAGGING PUMP EACH
STROKE. UNABLE TO SEE PUMP ACTION

October 03, 2011 at 8:26 am RECEIVED Cct. 03, 2011 OpenWells




Sundry Nunber:

19035 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

WESTERN

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)

14:30 18:00 3.50 INARTLT 39 P TOOH W/ RODS & PUMP. STROKE PUMP ON SURFACE. PUMP
FILLED & STROKED OK. BREAK DOWN PUMP. ALL VALVES
LOOKED GOOD. SDFN

9/14/2011 6:00 7:30 1.50 INARTLT 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RUNNING

RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 11:30 4.00 INARTLT 39 P PU & PRIME 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" RHBC PUMP. RIH W/ ROD PUMP &
RODS. SEAT & SPACE OUT PUMP

11:30 14:00 2.50 INARTLT 18 P FILL TBG W/ 45 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. STROKE TEST PUMP TO
1000 PSI. DID NOT HAVE GOOD PUMP ACTION. LONG STROKE
PUMP W/ RIG WHILE PUMPING 25 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. SAW
FAIR PUMP ACTION WHILE PUMPING DOWN CSG. PUMP WOULD
SLOWLY LOOSE PUMP ACTION WHEN PUMPING DOWN CSG
WAS STOPPED. PUMPED 68 TTL BBLS DOWN CSG

14:00 15:30 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG. SLIDE UNIT. START WELL PUMPING

October 03, 2011 at 8:26 am
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Sundry Number: 19116 APl Well Number: 43013310790000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Oil Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013310790000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1606 FSL 1482 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 05 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
VI NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [0 cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [0 cHanGE TUBING [0 cHANGE WELL NAME
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[ sueseQUENT REPORT (] peepen [] FRACTURE TREAT [] NEw consTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [] wATER SHUTOFF [] sITa STATUS EXTENSION [] app ExTENSION
Report Date:
[ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v oTHER OTHER: | PU Optimization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: f"'\llo‘a/ 06/2011 :

By:
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Sr. Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/4/2011
RECEIVED Cct. 04, 2011




Sundry Number: 19116 APl Well Number: 43013310790000

Hanson Trust 2-5B3 Procedure Summary

POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing

Set RBP at 11,500°. Dump 10’ sand on plug.

RIH w/optimized BHA, tubing to optimized depth, and optimized rod string
Clean location and resume production

RECEIVED Cct. 04, 2011




Sundry Nunber: 27101 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013310790000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1606 FSL 1482 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 05 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
1/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: IPU Optimization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached for detail. Came back in June and removed plug. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
June 27, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 6/26/2012

RECEI VED: Jun. 26, 2012




Sundry Nunber: 27101 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000
CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
Rig Name/No. PEAK/700 * Event LOE LAND
Start Date 4/11/2012 End Date 4/20/2012
Spud Date 4/6/1985 uwi 005-002-S 003-W 30
Active Datum KB @6,128.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 158303/45114 / HANSON TRUST 2-5 B3 (ORR
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub [ OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
4/12/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY ON TRIPPING RODS. FILLED OUT
JSA
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 41 P TRIED TO WORK PUMP OFF SEAT WHILE PUMPING 20 BBLS
DOWN CSG.
10:30 11:30 1.00 PMPNG 24 P FLUSHED TBG W/65 BBLS
11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P STILL UNABLE TO UNSEAT PUMP BACKED OFF RODS TOOH W/
124-1" AND 71-7/8" @ 4875'.
12:30 14:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P ND WH, NU BOP, RU RIG FLOOR RELEASED TAC.
14:00 17:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 20-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @ 9848' TAC HUNG
UP UNABLE TO WORK FREE , PUMPED 385 GALSOF 15% HCL
ACID, DOWN TBG DISPLACED W/ 57 BBLS, DISPLACED DOWN
THE CSG W/ 150 BBLS, SECURED WELL SDFN.
4/13/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING,
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 17:00 9.50 PRDHEQ 42 P FINISHED STRIPPING OUT OF HOLE W/ 308 JTS 2 /78 N-80EUE
TBG AND BHA, 59-7/8", 138-3/4" LD 20-1". HAD TO BACK OFF
RODS 4 TIMES. FOUND HOLE IN JT # 311 @ 9810'. SECURED
WELL SDFN.
4/14/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/ TBG AND
HYDRO TESTING.
7:30 17:30 10.00 MNTSSO 34 P RU HYDRO TESTER RIH HYDRO TEST @ 8500 PSI W/ 4 1/8 BIT,
5" SCRAPPER, BIT SUB, SN AND 367-JTS 2 7/8 EOT @ 11601.
FOUND NO LEAKS.RD HYDRO TESTER.
17:30 19:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 140 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG EOT 7200'. SECURED
WELL SDFN .
4/15/2012 NOACTIVITY
4/16/2012 NO ACTIVITY
4/17/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING
AND PINCH PIONTS. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUED TOOH W/ 227-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SN AND BIT
SUB. LEFT SCRAPPER AND BIT IN WELL.
10:00 18:00 8.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ BIT SUB, SN AND 440-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. TAGGED

FISH @ 13904' WORKED TORQUE INTO SCRAPPER SEVERAL
TIMES SETTING 5000 DOWN. MADE 2'.

June 26, 2012 at 2:59 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Jun. 26, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 27101 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)

18:00 20:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TOOH W/ 140-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT @ 9450 SECURED

WELL SDFN.
4/18/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING

AND OVERHEAD HAZARDS FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CONTINUED TOOH W/ 300-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SN, BIT
SUB, SCRAPPER AND BIT.

10:30 13:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 80 JTS WORKSTRING, LD 80 JTS WORK STRING,

13:30 17:00 3.50 ELINE 27 P RU WIRELINE RIH SET CBP @ 11500', WIRELINE DUMPED BAILED
10' CEM ON TOP.RD WIRELINE

17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ 2 3/8 SOLID PLUG, 5" TAC, 1-JT 2 3/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 3

1/2 PBGA, 2 7/8 X 2 3/8 X-OVER, 6'-2 7/8 TBG SUB, 2 7/8 SN
AND 80-JTS 2 7/8 N80 EUE TBG EOT @ 2640' SECURED WELL

SDFN.
4/19/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON ND BOPE FILLED

OUT JSA.

7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 18 P FINISHED RIH W/ 280-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG.RD RIG FLOOR.
ND BOPE SET TAC @ 11456', EOT 11460, SN @ 11385". NU
WELLHEAD.

11:30 12:30 1.00 PMPNG 24 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 60 BBLS

12:30 18:30 6.00 PRDHEQ 42 P PU AND PRIMED 2 1/2" X 1 1/2"X 36' RHBC EAGLE OPTIMZER

PUMP. RIH W/ PUMP,10-1 1/2" K BARS, 221-3/4" (110-w/g,
19-SLK, 92-W/G ), 125-7/8" ( 10-W/G, 115-SLK), AND 98- 1"
CHECKING ALL BREAKS. SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-2'x 1" SUB..

18:30 19:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 42 P PU POLISH ROD PUMPED 10 BBLS DOWN TBG STUFFING BOX
LEAKING OUT OF BTM SEAL. SECURED WELL SDSFN.
4/20/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING( RIGGING DOWN SAFELY)
FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:00 8:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P CHANGE OUT STUFFING BOX FILL TUBING WITH 50 BBLS 2%
KCL AND PRESSURE TEST TO 1000 PSI TEST GOOD
8:00 9:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIG DOWN SLIDE UNIT AND MOVE OUT
6/20/2012 10:00 10:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 46 P HELD SAFETY MEETING ON MOVING RIG. FILLED OUT JSA.
10:30 13:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P MOVED RIG FROM THE 3-19C5 TO THE 2-5B3 MIRU. WHILE
PUMPING 60 BBLS DOWN CSG.
13:30 17:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 42 P TOOH W/ RODS. RODS PARTED @ 91 3/4 @ 7800' BODY
BREAK AT DOUBLE PLUS GUIDE.
17:00 18:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGED OVER TO PULL TBG ND WELLHEAD. SECURED WELL
SDFN.
6/21/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RELEASING TAC)
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 46 P N.U. BOP'S, R.U. FLOOR EQUIPMENT, RELEASE 5"TAC.
9:30 16:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P POOH W/ 246 JTS TO ROD PART ( HAD TO WORK TAC
THROUGH SEVERAL CSG COLLARS)
16:30 19:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P COOH W/ 130 3/4", L/D 10 WT BARS & ROD PUMP SWIFN
CSDFN CT
6/22/2012 6:00 8:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 46 P BASIC SAFETY MEETING CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM
WRITE AND REVIEW JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING IN HOLE WITH BIT
8:00 11:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 42 P TSIP 100 PSI CSIP 150 PSI BLED OFF WELL CONTINUE TOH w
114 JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG L/D BHA
11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P R/U PMP AND LINES
12:30 19:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 42 P TALLY WHILE TIH w 4 1/8" ROCK BIT 320 JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG
EOT 10103' SECURE WELL SDFN
6/23/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 46 P CT TGSM & JSA ( R.U. POWER SWIVEL )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHECK PRESSURES- 100 ON TBG & 150 ON CSG. BLEED

DOWN, TIE BACK SINGLE ON RIG, RIH FROM 10,103, TAG UP @
11,510". RU POWER SWIVEL

June 26, 2012 at 2:59 pm 2 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Jun. 26, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 27101 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
10:30  15:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 18 P START PUMPING AT 9 BPM PUMPED 1612 BBLS, RAN OUT OF
WATER,PREP LOCATION TO RIG UP PLATINUM PUMP TRUCKS
SDFTD.
6/24/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP OPERATIONS )
7:30 14:00 6.50 PUMPED 3500 BBLS DOWN CSG @ 17 BPM. (12:00-1:00)- R.U.
PLATINIUM TO PUMP DOWN TBG PUMPED 330 BBLS @ 7.5 BPM.
NO PRESSURE CHANGES. SD RDMO W/ PLATINUM
14:00  16:00 2.00 RACK SWIVEL TO DERRICK. POOH W/40 JTS @ 10,231.
SDFTW.
6/25/2012  6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
6/26/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 MNTSSO = 46 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (TRIPPING TUBING, BODY
POSITIONING) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:00 3.50 MNTSSO 18 P BLEED DOWN TBG AND CSG. POOH W /200JTS TBG, MYT
ELEVATORS BROKE,
11:00  12:00 1.00 MNTSSO 18 P GO TO 4-STAR, GET A NEW SET OF MYT ELEVATORS
12:00  14:00 2.00 MNTSSO 16 P FINISH POOH W/TBG
14:00  16:00 2.00 MNTSSO 18 P CHANGE OVER TO 2 3/8 TBG,P.U. 4 1/8 BIT,BIT SUB,FAPPER
VALVE,S.N.,FLAPPER VALVERIH W/20 JTS 2 3/8,P.U. QUICK
BREAK CONNECTION,BAILER,FLAPPER VALVE,6'FT TBG
SUB,DRAIN SUB, CHANGE OVER TO 2 7/8
16:00  19:00 3.00 MNTSSO 18 P RIH W/276 JTS 2 7/8. EOT @ 9415'-—- 65' ABOVE T.P.,
19:00  19:30 0.50 MNTSSO 18 P SECURE WELL, SHUT DOWN FOR EVENING

June 26, 2012 at 2:59 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Jun. 26, 2013
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 . Houston, TX. 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038
CA No. Unit: N/A
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNGJAPI NO ENTITY [LEASE TYPE|WELL [|WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
See Attached List |
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012

COMMENTS:

Disposal and Injections wells will be moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis 6/29/2012




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
Multiple Leases

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposgis.

7. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
7
OIL WELL GasWELL []  OTHER See Attached
Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana iy Houston srate VX 7 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [ oeeeen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/] NoTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) M) auTER CASING [C] FracTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wit start:. | [ ]  CASING REPAIR [] wnewconsTRuCTION [C] veEMPORARILY ABANDON

[T] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE "] vueinG REPAIR
[J cHance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [7] ventorFLARE

[0 sussequent RepoRT ] crance weLL NaME [J pLuceack [[] warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comMmINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [_] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: Change of
[ converT weLL TYPE [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JU0705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Falle Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME (pLasm. Gomez mme Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE 6 : M oave  0/22/2012

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED (» /29/30IQ JUN 25 2012
Roahed

(moobivis‘-on of 0“’ Gas and Mining - (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene-Russell, Engineering Techiiiclan: ...
Rachet Modirm




El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well [Well
Well Name ___ |Sec 'TWP RNG |API Number Entity Lease Type Type |Status Conf
DWR 3-17C6 747 030S [060W 4301350070 14204621118 |OW __ APD _ [C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S [060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD |C
YOUNG 3-15A3 15 |010S [030W 4301350122 FEE OW |APD [C
WHITING 4-1A2 01 |010S [020W |4301350424 Fee oW |APD [C |
EL PASO 4-34A4 34 010S [040W 4301350720 Fee OW APD [C
YOUNG 2-2B1 02 020S |010W (4304751180 FEE OW APD C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-10B4 10 |020S [040W 4301350712 |18221 [Fee OW [DRL C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-26B4 26 |020S [040W 4301350714 |18432 [Fee OW |DRL € |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 [020S |040W 4301350717 |18315 |Fee OW DRL C
Cook 4-14B3 - 14 [020S |030W 4301351162 |18449 |Fee OW [DRL [C
Peterson 4-22C6 22 |030S |060W 4301351163 18518 [Fee OW [DRL [C |
Lake Fork Ranch 4-14B4 14 020S [040W [4301351240 (99999 |Fee OW |DRL [C
Melesco 4-20C6 - 20 [030S |060W 4301351241 [99999 |Fee OW |DRL _C |
Peck 3-13B5 113 [020S |050W |4301351364 (99999 [Fee OW DRL [C |
Jensen 2-9C4 09 [030S [040W |4301351375 (99999 [Fee OW [DRL C |
El Paso 3-5C4 105 0305 [040W 4301351376 | 18563 |Fee OW DRL [C |
ULT 6-31 31 |030S |020E 4304740033 FEE oW LA ]
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 |010S |010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 |030S |060W 4301351433 [14-20-H62-4724 OW _ [NEW |C
Lake Fork Ranch 5-2384 23 [020S [040W 4301350739 Fee OW [NEW ]
Duchesne Land 4-10C5 10 |030S |050W [4301351262 Fee OW [NEW C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 |020S [030W 4301351374 _ |Fee oW INEW [C
Layton 4-2B3 - 02 |020S |030W 4301351389 Fee OW |NEW [C |
Golinski 4-24B5 ]24 |020S [050W [4301351404| Fee = [OW [NEW [C
Alba 1-21C4 21 |030S [040W 4301351460 Fee OW |NEW [C
Allison 4-19C5 19 |030S [050W 4301351466 Fee OW |NEW [C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 [020S [030W 4301351486 Fee OW |NEW C |
Allen 4-25B5 25 |020S |050W 4301351487 Fee OW NEW [C |
Hewett2-6C4 |06 |030S [040W 4301351489 Fee OW INEW [C |
Young 2-7C4 - 07 |030S [040W 4301351500 __ |Fee oW T INEW € ]
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 [010S |010E (4304752471 Fee oW INEw [C ]
Hamaker 3-25A1 |25 |010S [010W 4304752491 __ |Fee OW [NEW [C |
Boiton 3-29A1E B 29 [010S [010E |4304752871 Fee OW [NEW C
HORROCKS 5-20A1 ~ 120 |010S [010W [4301334280 |17378 FEE OW _OPS [C |
DWR 3-19C6 } 19 [030S [060W [4301334263 17440 |14-20-462-1120 OW [P
DWR 3-22C6 f‘* 22 |030S [060W |4301334106 |17298 |14-20-462-1131 [OW P ]
DWR 3-28C6 - 28 030S |060W 4301334264 | 17360 | 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 - - 07 |010S [020W 4301330025 5850 |14-20462-811 OW P ]
UTE 2-17C6 17 |030S [060W [4301331033 10115 |14-20-H62-1118 OW P
WLR TRIBAL 2-19C6 119 0305 |060W [4301331035 | 10250 |14-20-H62-1120 OW [P B
CEDARRIM 10-A-15C6 115 [030S |060W 4301330615 6420 |14-20-H62-1128[OW P | |
CEDAR RIM 12A ] 28 |030S |060W |4301331173 10672 [14-20-H62-1323 OW [P ]
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 B 33 [030S |060W [4301331123 |10365 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |P
TAYLOR3-34C6 ~ 134 030S [060W [4301350200 17572 1420H621329 |[OW [P -
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 134 |030S |060W 14301332634 | 14590 |14-20-H62-1329 |OW P T
UTE3-3522K 35 |010N |020W 4301331133 | 10483 |14-20-H62-1614 [OW P | |
UTE 1-3222 |32 |010N[020W 4301330379 1915 |14-20-H62-1702'OW P o
UTE TRIBAL 1-3322 B 133 010N 020W 4301330334 |1851 |14-20-H62-1703 OW [P ]
UTE 2-3322 - 133 010N |020W 4301331111 10451 |14-20-H62-1703/OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422 |34 [010N[020W (4301331167 10668 |14-20-H62-1704 OW [P j
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 [020S |040W |4301334262 17439 |14-20-H62-1743 OW [P ]
UTE 1-28B4 T 1287]020S|040W 4301330242 1796 |14-20-H62-1745OW P | |
UTE 1-34A4 3 /34 1010S [040W 4301330076 |1585 |14-20-H62-1774 OW [P i
UTE 1-36A4 ] |36 [010S [040W 4301330069 1580 |14-20-H62-1793[OW [P
UTE 1-1B4 - 101 |020S [040W |4301330129 |1700 |14-20-H62-1798 [OW [P ]
UTE 1-31A2 '31_1010S [020W [4301330401 1925 [14-20-H62-1801 OW P

1



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE 1-25A3 25 |010S [030W 4301330370 1920 |14-20-H62-1802 | OW [P

UTE 2-25A3 - |25 0105 |030W 4301331343 [11361 |14-20-H62-1802[OW [P
UTE1-26A3 ] 126 "|010S [030W [4301330348 |1890 |14-20-H62-1803[OW [P

UTE 2-26A3 26 |010S [030W (4301331340 |11349 [14-20-H62-1803 OW P ]
UTE TRIBAL 4-35A3 135 [010S |030W 4301350274 [18000 [1420H621804 OW P C |
[UTE 2-35A3 T |35 |010S|030W 4301331292 11222 |14-20-H62-1804 [OW [P |
UTE 3-35A3 _ 35 |010S [030W [4301331365 |11454 [1420-H62-1804 OW P |
UTE 1-6B2 o ~ 106 |020S [020W 4301330349 1895 |14-20-H62-1807 [OW [P

UTE 2-6B2 ~ 706 |020S [020W 4301331140 [11190 | 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-6B2 ) 06 |020S[020W |4301350273 | 18008 |14-20-H62-1807 OW P c
POWELL 4-19A1 - 19 |010S [010W 4301330071 8302 |14-20-H62-1847 [OW [P

COLTHARP 12721 i 27 010N |010W [4301330151 |4700 |14-20-H62-1933 |[OW P~ | |
UTE 1-8A1E T 08 |010S |010E 14304730173 [1846 |14-20-H62-2147 OW P T
UTE TRIBE 1-31 31 |010N |020W (4301330278 |4756 |14-20-H62-2421|[OW P T
UTE 1-28B6X i 28 |020S |060W |4301330510 |11165 |14-20-H62-2492 [OW P ]
RINKER 2-21B5 21 |020S |050W [4301334166 |17299 |14-20-H62-2508 OW [P | |
MURDOCK 2-34B5 |34 [020S [050W [4301331132 |10456 |14-20-H62-2511/OW P |
UTE 1-35B6 35 |020S [060W 4301330507 2335 |14-20-H622531 [OW P | |
'UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 |010S [010E |4304730829 (860 |14-20-H622658 OW P |
UTE 2-17A1E B 17 1010S [010E |4304737831 16709 |14-20-H622658 [OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-27AE 27 [010S |010E 4304730421800 |14-20-H62-2662 |OW P i
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E " I35 [010S|010E [4304730286 (795 |14-20-H62-2665OW P _
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E |15 |010S [010E [4304730820 850 |14-20-H622717 OW _ |P )
UTE TRIBALP-3B1E |03 |020S |010E |4304730190 4536 |14-20-H622873[OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E ) |22 ]010S [010E 4304730429810 |14-20-H62-3103/oW P |
B H UTE 1-35C6 I35 |030S|060W [4301330419 10705 [14-20-H62-3436 OW |P |
BH UTE 2-35C6 7|35 [030S [060W |4301332790 | 15802 | 14-20-H62-3436 [OW P |
MCFARLANE 14D6 ] " |04 |040S [060W [4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452[OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 i 11 /040S [060W 4301330482 (6415 |14-20-H62-3454 OW P |
CARSON 2-36A1 36 |010S |010W 4304731407 737 |14-20-H62-3806 OW P )
UTE 2-14C6 7714 [030S [060W 4301330775 |9133 |14-20-H62-3809 [OW [P B
DWR 3-14C6 114 [030S |060W |4301334003 [17092 |14-20-H62-3808 OW P |
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 [010S |010W 4301330935 [9461 |14-20-H62-3855 OW P ]
BADGER-SAM H UMONGUS 1-15A1 (15 _|010S |010W 4301330949 [9462 |14-20-H62-3860 OW P | |
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE 14-1 14 [010S [030W 4301330726 |8437 |14-20-H62-3868 [OW P |
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 122 p10S [010W 4301330781 [0460 [14-20-H62-3880 .OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 30 |010N |010W [4301330813[9405 |14-20-H62-3910 OW P =
UTELB1-13A3 13 |010S [030W [4301330894 9402 |14-20-H62-3980([OW P 1
UTE 2-22B6 B |22 [020S '060W 4301331444 11641 [14-20-H62-4614 OW P ]
UINTAOURAY 1-1A3 o1 [010S 030W 4301330132 5540 |14-20-H62-4664 OW P |
UTE 1-6D6 ] 06 |040S |060W [4301331696 |12058 |14-20-H62-4752 |OW  |P

UTE 2-11D6 111 |040S |060W (4301350179 |17667 |1420H624801 |OW P T
UTE 1-15D6 ) o 15 [040S |060W 4301330429 | 10958 [14-20-H62-4824 OW P | |
UTE 2-15D6 15 |040S [060W 4301334026 (17193 |14-20-H624824 OW P o
HILL 3-24C6 " |24 |030S |060W 4301350293 [18020 | 1420H624866 | OW  |P C
BARCLAY UTE 2-24C6R "~ 724 |030S |060W |4301333730 | 16385 [14-20-H62-4866 [ OW P o
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 "oz ]020S |040W |4301330062 |1570 |FEE ow P T ]
BOREN 1-24A2 |24 010S|020W [4301330084 |5740 |[FEE ow p I
FARNSWORTH1-1385 13 1020S [050W 4301330092 [1610 |FEE ow P I ]
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 121 |020S |060W 4301330100 1595 |FEE ow P ]
ASAY E J 1-20A1 20 [010S |010W 4301330102 [8304 |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-6B3 05 |020S [030W [4301330109 (16356 |[FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 B 08 |020S [040W 4301330112 16556 |FEE ow P |~
ELLSWORTH1-9B4 ~ ""109 [020S |040W 4301330118 1660 |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 ) 17 |[020S [040W [4301330126 1695 |FEE ow P | ]
CHANDLER 1-5B4 ~ o5 [020S [040W [4301330140 |1685 FEE ow P
[HANSON 1-32A3 32 [010S[030W 4301330141 |1640 |FEE oW P i
JESSEN 1-17A4 117 [070S [040W (4301330173 |4725 |FEE ow P
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El Paso E3 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

JENKINS 1-1B3

01 [020S [030W [4301330175[1790 |FEE ow P
GOODRICH1-2B3 |02 |020S |030W |4301330182 |1765 FEE ow [P ]
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 19 |020S [040W 4301330183 |1760 |[FEE ow [P )
DOYLE 1-10B3 10 [020S |030W [4301330187 (1810 [FEE |OW P B
JOS.SMITH1-17C5 |17 _|030S [050W |4301330188 |5510 |[FEE ow p |
RUDY 1-11B3 o 11 [020S [030W 4301330204 |1820 |FEE oW P
CROOK 1-6B4 - 06 |020S |040W (4301330213 1825 |FEE ow P B
HUNT 1-21B4 ) 121 |020S |040W (4301330214 [1840 |FEE ow P
LAWRENCE 1-30B4 30 [020S |040W 4301330220 (1845 |[FEE ow [P B
YOUNG 1-29B4 |29 ]020S |040W 4301330246 1791 FEE =~ OW P
GRIFFITHS 1-33B4 133 1020S |040W [4301330288(4760 [FEE ~ OW P ﬂ
POTTER 1-2B5 02 [020S |050W [4301330293 (1826 |FEE oW P B
BROTHERSON 1-26B4 |26 [020S [040W [4301330336/1856 [FEE oW P | |
SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 |010N |010W 4301330355(765 [FEE ~ OW P ]
[POTTER 1-24B5 24 |020S |050W 4301330356 |1730 |FEE oW P
WHITEHEAD 1-22A3 o 22 |010S |030W |4301330357 1885 FEE ow [P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 101 ]010S |020W [4301330360/5830 FEE =~ OW P B
ELDER 1-13B2 113 |020S |020W 4301330366 (1905 FEE ~~ OW P B
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 |10 |020S [040W [4301330443 |1615 |[FEE ow |p B
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330470(1935 [FEE oW P B
TEW 1-15A3 - 15 _|010S |030W 4301330529/1945 FEE __~ OW [P )
UTE FEE 2-20C5 - 20 [030S |050W [4301330550 4527 |[FEE low |
HOUSTON 1-34Z1 - 34 010N |010W [4301330566 (885 |FEE ow P
GALLOWAY 1-18B1 ) ~ 118 |020S |010W 4301330575 [2365 FEE ow P [ ]
SMITH 1-31B5 ] 31 1020S |050W [4301330577 [1955 |FEE oW P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 ] 134 1010S |010W [4301330590(1440 FEE =~ OW P |
LINMAR 1-19B2 ) 19 |020S |020W 14301330600 (9350 |FEE ow P ]
WISSE 1-28Z1 B |28 |010N [010W (4301330609 (905 |FEE ow p |
POWELL 1-21B1 ] 21 |020S [010W 4301330621 (910 |FEE ow |p |
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S |030W 4301330629 2390 [FEE ow P
OMAN 2-4B4 ] 04 [020S [040W |4301330645/9125 [FEE ~ |OW P )
DYE 1-2522 |25 010N |020W [4301330659/9111 [FEE ~~  OW P
H MARTIN 1-21Z1 21 |010N [010W 4301330707 |925 |FEE ow P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 i 29 |010N|010W [4301330725/9110 [FEE ~ |OW [P
CHASEL 2-17A1V |17 |o10S |010W 4301330732/9112 FEE OW P |
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 B 27 |010S |010W |4301330758/940 [FEE =~ |ow P |
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 08 [020S |030W [4301330780 |9355 |FEE ow p |
LAMICQ 2-5B2 05 [020S [020W [4301330784 [2302 |FEE ow P ]
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 |020S |[040W '4301330815 10450 FEE =~ Oow P = |
MURRAY 3-2A2 |02 Jo10S 020w [4301330816/9620 [FEE =~~~ Oow [P ' |
HORROCKS 2-20A1 V 20 |010S |010W 4301330833 |8301 |FEE ow P N
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 ] 02 020S [040W [4301330855 8420 |FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 |08 |020S [040W |4301330898 [2418 |FEE ow p | ]
OMAN 2-32A4 - 132 _|010S |040W [4301330904 (10045 |[FEE ow [, |
BELCHER 2-33B4 33 |020S |040W 4301330907 (9865 [FEE =~ OW P
BROTHERSON2-35B5 35 |020S 050W |4301330908/9404 FEE =~ oW P =
HORROCKS 24A1 T - |04 |010S |010W |4301330954 9855 [FEE ow P
JENSEN229A5 29 '010S [050W 4301330974 [10040FEE OW P ]
UTE 2-34A4 |34 |010S [040W [4301330978 [10070/FEE  |OW P )
CHANDLER 2-5B4 |05 _|020S [040W (4301331000 [10075]FEE ~ |OW P ]
BABCOCK 2-12B4 |12 020S [040W |4301331005/10215[FEE ~OW P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 |29 |010S [010W [4301331013/9463 FEE =~ |OW P |
BLEAZARD 2-18B4 |18 [020S ;040W 4301331025 |1566 |FEE __ow P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 |32 1020S |050W 4301331036 |10216 |FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 020S |040W 4301331046 (10217 [FEE  |OW [P |
RUST 3-4B3 ... |04 |020S 030W 4301331070 1576 |[FEE = |OW P _
HANSON TRUST 2-32A3 32 |010S |030W 4301331072 1641 |FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-11B4 '11_1020S [040W 4301331078 [1541 [FEE ow__ P
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HANSON TRUST 2-6B3 05 [020S [030W [4301331079]1636 [FEE _|OW P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 |020S 040W (4301331103 /1771 [FEE ~ ow P |
MONSEN 2-27A3 27 010S1030W (4301331104 1746 |FEE ow [P
ELLSWORTH2-19B4 19 1020S [040W |4301331105|1761 FEE _OW P |
[HUNT2:21B4 " "121 [020S |040W (4301331114 [1839 |FEE _ow P )
JENKINS2-1B3 01 |020S |030W 4301331117 [1792 [FEE low P |
POTTER2-24B5 - 24 |020S [050W 4301331118/1731 FEE  Jow P T N
POWELL2-13A2K - 13 |010S |020W |4301331120 |8306 |FEE ow P I
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 |020S |030W [4301331121 10459 [FEE ow |
MURDOCK 2-26B5 |26 |020S |050W [43013311241531 (FEE oW P | |
BIRCH3-2785 127 |020S |050W (4301331126 [1783 FEE Cjow P
ROBB 2-29B5 - ~ 129 1020S [050W |4301331130 |10454 [FEE ow P 1
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 [020S|040W 4301331134 [10452 [FEE T jow [P |
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K T 01 |010S |020W [4301331135 10484 |FEE ow P ]
[HANSON 2-9B3 T 09 |020S [030W [4301331136 |10455 [FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 |09 10208 [040W 4301331138 10460/ FEE OW P | |
UTE 2-31A2 o 31 |010S |020W |4301331139 | 10458 |FEE OW"WE“" o
POWELL 2-19A1 K 19 |010S |010W (4301331149 8303 |FEE low P T
CEDAR RIM 8-A - 22 7]030S |060W |4301331171|10666 [FEE Tow P ]
POTTER 2-6B4 - 06 |020S [040W [4301331249 11038 [FEE ow P | |
MILES 2-1B5 ~ o1 |020S |050W |4301331257 (11062 |FEE ~ low P ]
MILES 2-3B3 - 03 [020S |030W 4301331261 |11102)FEE OW [P

MONSEN 2-22A3 122 |010S |030W 4301331265 | 11098 |FEE _ ow P

WRIGHT 21385 ~ ]13 |020S |050W 4301331267 (11115 FEE  [OW [P | |
TODD2-21A3 21 |010S [030W [4301331296 | 11268 |FEE Clow P [
WEIKART 22084 |29 020S040W[4301331298[11332|FEE  |OW P ]
YOUNG 2-15A3 |15 |010S [030W |4301331301 |11344 [FEE low P B
CHRISTENSEN 2-29A4 B |29 1010S1040W 4301331303 [11235[FEE [oW P | B
BLEAZARD 2-28B4 - 28 |020S |040W [4301331304 |11433 [FEE ow P ]
REARY 2-17A3 ~ |17 |010S[030W 4301331318 [11251 |FEE ow P ]
LAZY K 2-11B3 |11 _|020S[030W |4301331352 11362 FEE oW P | |
[AZYK2-14B3 14 |020S030W 4301331354 [11452/FEE  |[OW IE‘: L
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 13 |020S |020W [4301331357 | 11374 |FEE Tow P T
LAKE FORK 3-15B4 |15 |020S |040W [4301331358 | 11378 [FEE ______|[OW P N
STEVENSON 3-20A3 T 129 |010S030W 4301331376 11442 FEE ___OW P I
MEEKS3-883 B ”498 020S 030W |4301331377 11489 FEE | ow P |
ELLSWORTH 3-20B4 120 1020S[040W 4301331389 (11488 FEE  |low P | ]
DUNCAN 5-13A2 - 13 |010S |020W 4301331516 |11776 [FEE ow P ]
OWL 3-17C5 17 _[030S |050W 4301332112 [12476 FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-24B4 ] 124 ]020S '040W |4301332695[14652|[FEE ~ |OW P :
BODRERO 2-15B3 |15 |020S |030W |4301332755|14750 FEE =~ oW P |
BROTHERSON 2-25B4 |25 ]020S |040W [4301332791 [15044 [FEE ow p T
CABINLAND 2-16B3 16 |020S [030W 4301332914 15236 [FEE = |OW [P 7
KATHERINE 3-29B4 ~ 129 [020S [040W 4301332923 [15331 [FEE ow |p |
SHRINERS 2-10C5 ~ /10 |030S |050W [4301333008 [15908 |FEE ~low P ﬂ ]
BROTHERSON 2-26B4 126 |020S [040W [4301333139/17047 FEE oW [P T ]
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 '32 |010S |020W |4301333211 15720 |FEE Clow
FERRARINI3-27B4 127 [020S 040W 4301333265 15883/FEE =~ |OW P | -
RHOADES 2-25B5 - 25 1020S |050W [4301333467 16046 [FEE ow P j
CASE 2-3184 - /31 |020S |040W 4301333548 | 16225 |FEE T low P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 Wi#zj 020S [030W 4301333616 (16284 FEE ow P | _
SPROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 |18 |020S |010W [4301333808 [16677 [FEE ow P L]
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 |11 jo20S |040W 4301333904 [16891]FEE = OW P |
KOFFORD 2-36B5 ) 136 |020S |050W |4301333988(17048 FEE = OW [P |
ALLEN3-7B4 ~lo7 |020S |040W |4301334027 |17166 |FEE low P
[BOURNAKIS 3-18B4 ~ 18 |020S [040W |4301334091 17264 [FEE = |OW P

MILES 3-12B5 112 ]020S|050W [4301334110[17316 FEE __ OW [P

OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 ' T31 020S [050W [4301334123 17388 |FEE low P
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OWL and HAWK 4-17C5 17 0305 |050W [4301334193 | 17387 |FEE ow P | ]
DWR 3-32B5 132 l020S |050W 4301334207 |17371 |FEE Tow P’
LAKE FORK RANCH 32284 22 |020S |040W |4301334261 17409 [FEE  |OW P |
HANSON 3-9B3 ) 109 [020S [030W |4301350065 |17570 |FEE ow [P ]
DYE 2-28A1 28 |010S [010W 4301350066 |17531 |FEE ow P |
MEEKS 3-32A4 " {32 [010S |040W |4301350069 17606 FEE Jow b
[HANSON 4-8B3 |08 |020S |030W 4301350088 17571 FEE =~ OW P  C
LAKE FORKRANCH3-14B4 |14 |020S |040W 4301350007 17484 [FEE ow p
ALLEN 3-9B4 |09 |020S |040W 4301350123 |17656 FEE ow P |
HORROCKS 4-20A1 20 |010S |010W 4301350155 |17916 | FEE ow P | ]
HURLEY 2-33A1 133 _|010S 010W |4301350166 17573 [FEE ow P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO 3-20C5 20 |030S [050W (4301350190 17541 |FEE ow P ]
ALLEN 3-8B4 08 |020S |040W 4301350192 17622 |[FEE_|ow [P |
OWL and HAWK 3-10C5 B (10 |030S |050W 4301350193 |17532 | FEE ow P ’
OWL and HAWK 3-19C5 - 19 |030S [050W (4301350201 |17508 [FEE ow P T
EL PASO 420B5 " " 129 |020S [050W 4301350208 |17934 |FEE ow P C_|
DONIHUE 3-20C6 20 |030S |060W 4301350270 |17762 [FEE ow P )
HANSON 3-5B3 " los 1020S [030W 4301350275 17725 [FEE ow P ¢
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 |020S |050W 4301350302 [17668 |FEE T low P ]
REBEL 3-35B5 ] ~ I35 |020S (050W 4301350388 [17911 |FEE ow P Cc
FREEMAN 4-16B4 T 16 |020S |040W 4301350438 |17935 |Fee low Pl ]
WILSON 3-36B5 T 77 7 6 |020S |050W [4301350439 (17936 Fee 2 oW P 'C
EL PASO 321B4 21 10205 |040W |4301350474 [18123 |Fee Jow P c |
IORG 4-12B3 7712 [020S [030W [4301350487 |17981 [Fee ow P [
CONOVER 3-383 o 03 |020S |030W 4301350526 [18122[Fee __1OW [P Ic |
ROWLEY 3-16B4 B 16 [020S |040W |4301350569 | 18151 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTS 3-14B3 ) 14 0205 |030W 4301350570 18366 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTER 4-27B5 27 020S |050W 4301350571 |99999 |Fee ow P c ]
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 |020S |040W 4301350572 | 18152 |Fee “low P c
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 |020S |040W 4301350707 | 18270 |Fee ow P ¢ |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-25B4 T |25 020S|040W [4301350711 | 18220 |Fee T Tlow P ¢
LAKE FORK RANCH 42384 23 (0205 |040W 4301350713 |18271 |Fee —ow h{d ic
LAKE FORK RANCH4-1584 1150208 |040W |4301350715 | 18314 Fee Jow E Cle ]
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-24B4 124 |020S [040W 4301350716 |18269 Fee CJow TP e
GOLINSKI 1-8C4 T |08 |030S |040W 4301350986 18301 [Fee 2 ___OW P C |
J ROBERTSON 1-1B1 ] /01 |020S |010W 4304730174 |5370 |FEE ow P o
TIMOTHY 1-8B1E 08 [020S [010E |4304730215 1910 FEE oW P j
MAGDALENE PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E (34 [010S |010E [4304730241 785 |FEE jow P T
NELSON 131A1E © 731 0105 [010E |4304730671 830 FEE ow [p 1]
[ROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E |24 |010S 010E 14304730707 840 |FEE TTow P ,,,
H D LANDY 1-30A1E o 30 |010S |[010E |4304730790 845 |FEE oW P 1
WALKER 1-14A1E 14 |010S |010E 4304730805(855 |FEE oW [P | |
BOLTON2-29A1E |29 |010S[010E [4304731112[900 |FEE ow [P
PRESCOTT1-3521  [35 [010N|010W 4304731173 (1425 [FEE oW P | |
BISELGURR 11-1 11 0105 |010W 4304731213 |8438 |FEE Tow P ]
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E =~ 122 ,010S 010E 4304731265915 |[FEE ~~ OW P N
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 7 T2 ]010S [010W 14304731295 (920 |FEE ow p

FOWLES 1-26A1 |26 1010S |010W |4304731296 |930 |FEE ow P
BRADLEY23-1 - 23 |010S |010W |4304731297 (8435 FEE = IOW P
BASTIAN1-2A1 02 [010S [010W 4304731373 |736 |FEE low [P T
DRLONG2-19AME 19 i010S |010E |4304731470 9505 FEE ow
DMOON 1-23Z1 |23 010N |010W 4304731479 |[10310[FEE ~~|OW P
O MOON 2-26Z1 |26 |010N |010W 14304731480 10135 FEE - ow P |
LLAD225A1  "]25 |010S|010W 4304731797 10790|/FEE _ OW P L
LANDY 2-30A1E 30 |010S |010E 4304731895 11127/FEE oW P
WINN P2-381E 103 [020S |010E 4304732321 | 11428 |FEE Clow P
BISEL.GURR2-11A1 711 [010S 010W 4304735410 |14428/FEE OW P
FLYING J FEE 2-12A1 12 10105 [010W 14304739467 | 16686 | FEE oW P
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HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 2-14B1_[14 1020S [010W (4304739591 [16546[FEE  OW [P j
OBERHANSLY3-11A1 111 ]010S |010W (4304739679 17937 |[FEE | ow P I
DUNCAN2-34A1 134 1010S 010W |4304739944 17043 |FEE - ow P

BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 |010S |010W (4304739961 16791/FEE low P |
KILLIAN 3-12A1 112 |010S |010W |4304740226 17761 /ML39760 @ [OW P I
WAINOCO ST 1-14B1 ~ 7144 1020 [010W 4304730818 (1420 |ML24306-A [OW P |
UTAHSTUTE1-35A1 135 ,010S 010W 4304730182 5520 |ML-25432 = OW P | |
STATE 1-19A4 |19 |010S |040W 4301330322 9118 ML-27912  |OW P | |
FEDERAL2-28E19E 128 |050S |190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 |OW P | |
[FEDERAL 1-28E19E - 28 |050S [190E |4304730175 5680 |UTU143512 |OW [P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 103 [010S |020W 4301320316 |5877 |FEE ow PA |
WH BLANCHARD2-3A2 |03 |010S |020W 4301330008 5775 |FEE ow PA
YACK U 1-7A1 - 07 |010S|010W |4301330018(5795 FEE ~ OW [PA '
JAMESPOWELL3 113 010S |020W 4301330024 {8305 |FEE WD PA ]
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 |010S |010W |4301330026 5800 [FEE =~ OW |PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY18A2 08 |010S |020W 4301330036 5975 [FEE _  [OW  [PA
BLEAZARD1-18B4 118 020S |040W [4301330059 |11262 FEE ow |PA

OLSEN 1-27A4 |27 |010S |040W /4301330064 1565 FEE =~ OW |PA | |
EVANS 1-31A4 - 31 010S 040W 4301330067 |6330 |FEE ow IPA | ]
HAMBLIN 1-26A2 26 |010S [020W [4301330083 2305 |FEE ow PA | |
HARTMAN1-31A3 131 |010S |030W 4301330093 |10700 |FEE ow PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330097 5725 |FEE ow @7 e W
POWELL 1-33A3 33 |010S |030W |4301330105/4526 FEE  IOW PA |
LOTRIDGE GATES1-383 03 |020S 030W 4301330117 1625 [FEE _  |OW PA | |
REMINGTON 1-34A3 134 |010S |030W 14301330139 |1670 |FEE . ow [PA |
ANDERSON1-28A2 28 1010S 020W 4301330150,5895 |FEE . |OW |PA | = |
RHOADES MOON 1-35B5 35 [020S [050W 14301330155 |5270 |FEE ow PA ]
JOHN 1-382 o 03 |020S |020W |4301330160(5765 FEE ~  |OW |PA |
SMITH 1-6C5 o6 [030S 050w [4301330163 |5385 |FEE _jow PA |
HORROCKS FEE 1-3A1 |03 [010S[010W[4301330171|5505 FEE ___ OW PA | |
WARREN1-32A4 32 1010S |040W 4301330174 9139 FEE  ~ |OW  PA
JENSENFENZEL 1-20C5 |20 [030S |050W 4301330177 4730 [FEE ~  [OW  |PA e
MYRINRANCH1-13B4 13 |020S |040W 4301330180 |[4524 |FEE _ow PA |
BROTHERSON 12784 7sz 020S |040W [4301330185 1775 |FEE ow PA | |
JENSEN 1-31A5 131 1010S [050W [4301330186 |4735 |FEE ow PA |
ROBERTSON1-28A2 129 010S [020W |4301330189 [4740 |[FEE @ﬂ,, PA ]
WINKLER1-2843 128 {010S |030W [4301330191 |5465 |FEE oW |PA | ,
CHENEY1-33A2 "33 |010S|020W 4301330202[1750 [FEE __ [OW _ [PA |
JLAMICQ STATE1-6B1 |06 [020S [010W |4301330210|5730 |FEE oW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 110 [020S |020W 4301330215 5700 |[FEE ow  [PA 1
REEDER 1-178B5 - 17 |020S |050W (4301330218 5460 |FEE - low PA ]
ROBERTSONUTE1-2B2 02 |020S [020W |4301330225/1710 FEE = 1OW IPA L; ]
HATCH 1-5B1 .~ |05 ]020S 010W 4301330226 5470 FEE =~ |OW |PA
BROTHERSON 1-22B4 - fﬂ 020S |040W 4301330227 (5935 FEE ~ low |PA I
ALLRED 1-16A3 - 16 |010S |030W [4301330232 |1780 |FEE oW  PA 1
BIRCH 1-35A5 35 |010S [050W 4301330233 9116 FEE | OW [PA [
MARQUERITEUTE1-882 /08 |020S [020W [4301330235(9122 FEE = |OW  |PA |
BUZZI1-11B2 11 [020S|020W 4301330248(6335 [FEE |OW |PA | |
SHISLER 1-3B1 77,77@ 1020 [010W 14301330249 (5960 FEE OW PA 1 B
TEW 1-1B5 o1 Jo20S 050w 4301330264 (5580 FEE |OW |PA | |
EVANSUTE1-19B3 |19 |020S |030W 4301330265 (1870 [FEE _‘PQV!_ PA
SHELL2-27A4 " " '27 1010S|040W 4301330266 1776 [FEE WD [PA [
DYE 1-29A1 ) B |29 |010S |010W |4301330271 /99990 FEE o ow PA
VODA UTE 1-4C5 S ‘¥04 030S |050W 14301330283 4530 FEE ow |pPA |
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 Tz_é 010S |040W [4301330292 9114 FEE |OW |PA | |
MEAGHER14B2 104 |020S |020W 4301330313 8402 FEE =~ |OW JPA
NORLING19B1 109 |020S 010W 4301330315 1811 |[FEE ) }9\{\( [PA

S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 '09 '030S |050W 14301330316 |5940 |FEE OW PA
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TIMOTHY 1-00A3 09 010S [030W 4301330321 10883 |FEE ow__ [PA__ |
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 |010S |050W 4301330323 9115 |FEE OW PA )
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 |020S |020W 4301330325 9121 |[FEE _|OW PA |
PHILLIPS UTE 1-3C5 03 |030S [050W (4301330333 1816 |FEE Jow |pA ]
[ELLSWORTH 1-2084 T |20 020S |040W |4301330351(6376 |[FEE _ |OW _ PA
LAWSON128A1 28" [010S [010W [4301330358 (5015 [FEE  |OW |PA B
AMES 1-23A4 723 |010S [040W (4301330375 1901 |FEE ow pa T
HORROCKS 1-6A1 06 |010S [010W 4301330390 5675 |FEE oW [PA |
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 [030S [050W |4301330393 [5565 [FEE oW |PA |
GOODRICH 1-18B2 18~ |020S |020W 4301330397 |5485 |FEE “jow PA i
SWD POWELL 3 7713 |010S|020W 4301330478 [10708/FEE WD _PA | |
BODRERO 1-1583 115 |020S |030W 4301330565 [4534 |FEE OW |PA B
MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 ~ 7 /30 |[030S |040W 4301330576 |2360 |FEE OW |PA 7
DUNCAN2:9B5 109 |020S|050W 4301330719 |5440 |FEE Tlow T PA T
FISHER 1-16A4 ~ 116 |010S [040W 4301330737 2410 [FEE ____OW PA |
URRUTY 2-34A2 34 |010S [020W [4301330753 9117 |FEE ow [PA | ]
GOODRICH 1-24A4 ) 24 |010S [040W [4301330760 2415 |FEE ow PA
CARL SMITH 2-25A4 25 |010S|040W 4301330776 9136 |FEE “low  PA |
ANDERSON 1-A30B1 ~ |30 020S [010W |4301330783 [9137 |FEE low A T
CADILLAC 3-6A1 06 |010S 010W 4301330834 6316 [FEE __ |OW  |PA )
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 131 |010S [010W (4301330836 [8439 |FEE ow [PA | ]
[REESE ESTATE 2-1082 10 |020S [020W 4301330837 [2417 FEE oW PA | ]
CLARK 2-9A3 T 09 [010S |030W 4301330876 [2416 |FEE ow [PA ]
JENKINS 3-16A3 16 |010S |030W 4301330877 |9790 |FEE ow PA |
CHRISTENSEN 2-26A5 26 |010S [050W (4301330905 10710 FEE ____|OW  PA |
FORD 2-36A5 T 7 36 |010S |050W [4301330911]9630 |[FEE ow [PA |
MORTENSEN2-32A2 /32 0105 [020W |4301330029 (9486 |FEE oW PA -
WILKERSON 1-20Z1 120 [010N|010W [4301330042 5452 [FEE __ |OW _PA |
UTE TRIBAL24A3S 04 [010S [030W (4301330950 |10230 [FEE ow A |
OBERHANSLY 2-31Z1 31 |010N |010W 4301330970 9262 [FEE oW PA_ |
MORRIS2-7A3 07 [010S [030W (4301330977 9725 [FEE  |OW PA |
POWELL2-08A3 o8 [010S|030W 4301330979 10175 FEE  |OW |PA |
[FISHER 2-6A3 7 oe 0105 [030W [4301330984 [10110 [FEE ow A ||
JACOBSEN2-12A4 " ""42 [010S 040W 4301330985 10480 [FEE  IOW [PA | |
CHENEY 2-33A2 33 |010S |020W 4301331042 10313 [FEE ow [PA
HANSON TRUST 2-20A3 29 [010S|030W [4301331043/5306 [FEE |OW _ PA |
BURTON 2-15B5 15 |020S |050W |4301331044 [10205 [FEE oW [PA
EVANS-UTE 2-17B3 17 |020S |030W [4301331056 (10210 FEE __ |OW _ IPA ]
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 20 020S [040W 4301331090(5336 FEE _ |OW  PA -
REMINGTON 2-34A3 7 134 |010S [030W |4301331091 1902 [FEE __[OW PA |
WINKLER 2-28A3 |28 |010S|030W |4301331108 [4519 |FEE ow PA | ]
TEW 2-10B5 10 0205 |050W |4301331125 1751 FEE _ |OW _ |PA )
LINDSAY 2-33A4 _ ,A, 33 |010S [040W [43013311411756 [FEE _OW |PA_ | ]
FIELDSTED 228A4 28 (0105 [040W [4301331293 (10665 FEE  |[OW |PA | |
POWELL 4-13A2_ 13 [010S [020W |4301331336 | 11177 |FEE GW PA |
DUMP 2-20A3 S 20 [010S [030W [4301331505 | 11691 |FEE oW  [PA
[SMITH 2X-23C7 __ 23 |030S |070W |4301331634 12382)FEE D  PA | |
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 |010S |020W 14301331872 11928 [FEE ow PA |
TODDUSAST12B1 02 |020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE ~~  |OW  [PA

STATE 1-7B1E o7 |020S|010E |4304730180|5566 [FEE _ |ow [PA |
BACON 1-10B1E 10 |020S [010E 14304730881 5550 [FEE  |OW PA | |
PARIETTE DRAW 2844 28 [040S [010E 14304731408 (4537 FEE ow  PA |
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 |020S 010E 4304731840 4960 |FEE ow ~PA | |
STATE 2-35A2 ] 135 010S |020W 4301330156 4715 |ML-22874 _ |OW _ @@M N
UTAH STATE L B 1-11B1 |11 [020S |010W 4304730715530 |ML23655  |OW  [PA B
STATE 1-8A3 |08 0105 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316  [OW  PA
UTAHFEDERAL 12481 124 |020S [010W 4304730220 590 |ML26079  [OW  PA |
CEDAR RIM 15 '34_|030S [0B0W 14301330383 |6395 [14-20-462-1329 [OW 'S
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El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL 2-24C7 — |24 [030S [070W [4301331028 | 10240 |14-20-H62-1135 OW __|S 7
CEDARRIM 12 28 |030S [060W 4301330344 6370 |14-20-H62-1323 [OW  [S
CEDAR RIM 16 " |33 |030S [060W [4301330363 6390 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |S

SPRING HOLLOW 2-3473 34 |010N |030W 4301330234 5255 |14-20-H62-1480 OW | )
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 17 |020S |[030W [4301330274 5335 |14-20-H62-1733[OW S | |
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4G_ o1 |020S [040W [4301331197 | 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW  |S
UTE 3-1283 ) 12 [020S [030W |4301331379 |11490 |14-20-H62-1810 [OW  [S ,
UTETRIBAL94B1 |04 |020S [010W (4301330194 5715 [14-20-H62-1969/OW S | |
UTETRIBAL221B6 |21 [020S [060W 4301331424 11615 |14-20-H62-2489 |OW  |S )
UTE 1-33B6 ) ] "33 |020S [060W [4301330441 1230 |14-20-H62-2493 |OW IS

UTE22285 22 1020S [050W [4301331122 (10453 [14-20-H62-2509 OW S | |
UTE 1-18B1E 118 ]020S |010E |4304730969 [9135 |14-20-H62-2864 OW _ |S ]
LAUREN UTE 123A3 |23 ]010S [030W 4301330895 [9403 |14-20-H62-3981 OW (S _

UTE 2-28B6 T |28 [020S [060W [4301331434 [11624 |14-20-H62-4622 [OW | o
UTE127B6X |27 1020S |060W 4301330517 [11166 |14-20-H62-4631 [OW 'S )
UTE 22786 | 127 [020S |060W 4301331449 11660 |14-20-H62-4631 OW S o
CEDAR RIM 10-15C6 - 15 |030S |060W 4301330328 6365 |14-20-H62-4724 OW  |S |
UTE 5-30A2 ~ |30 |010S 020W 4301330169 [5910 [14-20-H62-4863 [OW  |S B
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) , 24 |030S |060W |4301330298 [4533 |14-20-H624866 OW | | |
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 1307 ]030S |050W |4301330475 |665 | 14-20-H62-4876 [OW  |S

SMB 1-10A2 - 10 |010S |020W |4301330012 |5865 |FEE ow s | ]
KENDALL 1-12A2 - 12 |010S[020W [43013300135875 FEE ___ |OW S T
CEDARRIM 2 B 20 |030S |060W [4301330019 6315 |FEE ow | o
URRUTY29A2 ~ 109 [010S [020W |4301330046 [6856 |FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 14 |020S |040W |4301330051 [1535 |FEE ow s 7
RUST 14B3 ] 04 |020S |030W 4301330063 [1575 [FEE ow [s | ]
MONSEN 1-21A3 21 010S |030W [4301330082 [1590 |FEE oW s 1
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 ) 10 |020S [040W 4301330110 1614 (FEE oW |8 T
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 |020S [050W [4301330124 (1645 |FEE oW [s ]
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 "~ 116 020S [040W [4301330192[1735 [FEE ____ |[OW S

MARSHALL 1-20A3 20 |010S |030W |4301330193 9340 |FEE ow s )
[CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 317 [020S [040W |4301330198 [4745 |FEE ~low s
ROPER 1-14B3 ) 114 |020S[030W 4301330217 (1850 |FEE ow [s | ]
BROTHERSON 1-24B4 - 24 |020S |040W |4301330229 |1865 |[FEE oW S i
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 33 [010S[040W [4301330272([1680 [FEE __ |OW |S
BROTHERSON 1-2384 123 |020S |040W 4301330483 (8423 |FEE ow s~ | ]
SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 08 |030S [050W [4301330543 |5495 |FEE ow s T
VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 19 |030S |050W (4301330553 (5650 |FEE ~jow [s }
HANSEN 1-16B3 16 [020S |030W 4301330617 |9124 |FEE ow s
BROTHERSON 1-25B4 ) 25 |020S [040W 4301330668 9126 |FEE ow "is ]
POWELL2-33A3 - 33 |010S [030W [4301330704 [2400 |FEE ow s | ]
BROWN2-28B5 28 |020S [050W [4301330718 9131 |[FEE OW s ]
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 7716 |o10s1010W [4301330782[8443 FEE __|OW S )
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 |010S [040W |4301330817 [9345 |FEE oW s B
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 |010N [010W [4301330884 [936 |FEE ow s |
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 7127 |010S]040W [4301330915(9632 FEE  |OW S )
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 B |23 [020S |050W |4301330917 [9600 |FEE ow [ )
TIMOTHY 3-18A3 18 |010S [030W 4301330940 (9633 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 103 [020S |040W 4301331008 (10165 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 |020S [040W 4301331086(1782 FEE ___OW 8 |
MILES 2-35A4 135 |010S |040W |4301331087 |1966 |FEE ow 1§ T ]
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 ] |17 020S |040W 4301331089 [1696 |FEE ow s T
RUST 2-36A4 |36 |010S |040W 4301331092[1577 [FEE ____ ow s |
EVANS 2-19B3 19 10205 [030W 4301331113 1777 |FEE ow s N
FARNSWORTH 2-1285 " 112 [020S [050W 4301331115 [1646 |FEE oW [S N
CHRISTENSEN34B4 04 |020S|040W 4301331142 10481 FEE  |OW S
ROBERTSON 229A2 29 1010S [020W [4301331150 | 10679 |FEE low s |
[CEDAR RIM 2A 20 [030S [060W 14301331172 110671 |FEE oW s
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El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31_[010S |030W |4301331243 [ 11026 |FEE SEE —
GOODRICH2-2B3 ] 02 |020S |030W 4301331246 | 11037 |FEE ow s )
JESSEN 2-21A4 21 |010S |040W |4301331256 | 11061 |FEE ~ low s
BROTHERSON 3-23B4 23 |020S [040W |4301331289 [11141 [FEE ow s

MYRIN RANCH 2-18B3 18 |020S |030W |4301331297 [11475 |FEE T low s
BROTHERSON 2-2B5 02 |020S [050W (4301331302 [11342 [FEE ow S ]
DASTRUP 2-30A3 30 |010S [030W (4301331320 [11253 |FEE ow s

YOUNG 2-30B4 30 |020S [040W 4301331366 | 11453 |FEE ow s

IORG 2-10B3 10 |020S |030W [4301331388 [11482 [FEE oW |s

MONSEN 3-27A3 27 |010S [030W 4301331401 |11686 |FEE low s
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 05 |020S [010E 4304732409 11481 FEE T Tlow I8

LARSEN 1-25A1 25 |010S [010W |4304730552 815 | FEE ow [TA

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S |010W 4304730569 820 FEE ow__ [TA




Sundry Nunber: 34282 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
HANSON TRUST 2-5B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013310790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1606 FSL 1482 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 05 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE [ RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: [ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION ¥ omher OTHER: Irepair rod |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

See attached procedure for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: February 06, 2013

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Lisa Morales 713 997-3587 Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 2/1/2013

RECEI VED: Feb. 01, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 34282 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

Hanson Trust 2-5B3 Rod Part Procedure Summary

e POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing

e Acidize existing perfs w/ 5,000 gal 15% HCI.
e RIH w/ BHA, tubing and rod string

e C(Clean location and resume production

RECEI VED: Feb. 01, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 41764 APl Well Nunber: 43013310790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSON TRUST 2-5B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013310790000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1606 FSL 1482 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 05 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE [ RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: [ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION O orver OTHER: I |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EP plans to acidize with 7500 gals. Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: August 30, 2013

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ ‘LDM'A%

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/27/2013

RECEI VED: Aug. 27, 2013
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