Shell Oil Company @

P.O. Box 831
Houston, Texas 77001

November 11, 1983

Mr. Norm Stout

State of Utah

Natural Resources

Division of 0i1, Gas & Mining

4241 State Office Building .

Salt Lake City, Ut 84114 DIVISION OF
~ GAS R MM

Dear Mr. Stout:

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
SHELL BROTHERSON 2-2B4

NE/4 SW/4 SECTION 2, T2S5-R4W
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

Enclosed is an Application for Permit to Drill the subject proposed
test. The test will be drilled as a "test well" in the Altamont Field as
authorized by Order of Cause No. 140-12, effective August 27, 1981. The
proposed test is located in the SW/4 of an existing drilling unit developed
by the Shell Brotherson 1-2B4 (located in the NE/4 Section 2).

As required by Order of Cause No. 140-12, only one well within the 640-acre
drilling unit will be produced at any one time following the initial 60-day
test period for the subject test well.

A copy of approval from the Utah Division of Water Rights for use of water
for drilling operations will be submitted to your office subsequent to our
selection of a water hauler.

Please inform me at (713) 870-3216 if additional information is required to
support approval of the enclosed application.

Yours very truly,

(2

Administrator, Regulatory-Permits
Rocky Mountain Division

Western E&P Operations

RLT:beb

Enclosures



Fo

STATE OF UTAH . (Other instrup(i[ions on
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES reverse side)

rm 0GC-la

.- Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee

o

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK

la. Type of Work 7. Unit Agreement Name
DRILL k] DEEPEN [] PLUG BACK []
b. Type of Well
gvi}eu v U Other gl K] Youltiple [ ] 8 Farm ox Lease Name
2. Name of Operator Brotherson
9. Well No.

Shell 0i1 Company

8. Address of Operator 2—284
P. 0. Box 831, Houston, Tx 77001 Attn. G. M. Jobe Rm 6566 WCK 10 ¥icld and Fool, or Wildeat
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) A] tamont C/
At surface . . 11. Sec., T., R., M., or BIk.
1371" FSL & 1498' FWL Section 2 and Survey or Area
At proposed prod. zone NE/4 SW/4 Section 2
T2S-R4W
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish  13. State
Approximately 2+ miles southwest of Altamont, Utah Duchesne Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned
locatig? to riearesti,‘ £ . N to this well
r se line, ft.
PRy e o5t it any) 1336 640 Pooled ¥
18. Distance from proposed location® 35007+ Sou thwes‘t 18. Proposed depth /UY 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completgff], — Y
or applied for, on this lease, 0T Brotherson 1-2B4 14,500+ ¥~ Rotary
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) \;—\ ?2. Approx, date work will start®
6240' GR Upon permit approval
28. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

SEE ATTACHED DRILLING PROGNOSIS

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM:
ductive zone.

ATTACHMENTS : e
D ECEIVI)

1. Survey Plat HIRE

2. Drilling Prognosis SR

3. Topo Map NOV | 4 1983 At
3!

BiV. OF OIL, GAS & Mikiiid

preventer program, if‘any.

24.

Administrator

If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-
If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

Smnedzig/

........ dé/{’/}/%k moRegulatory-Permits L 11/11/83

f
(This space for Feder#r State office use) / ]/ 7 7'7/‘, =2, :‘j/ :’/* /
“ 7y Z

Permit No Approval “Dats

Date

ADDIOVEd DYoo Title,
Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
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THIS

FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF.

PROJECT
SHELL OIL COMPANY

Well location, BROTHERSON
#2-284, located as shown in
the NE |/4 SWI/4 Section 2, T2S,
R4W, US.B.&M. Duchesne C ounty,
Utah.

CERTIFICATE

IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
UNDER MY

REISTERE;‘ LAND SURVEYOR

REGISTRATION N2 2454
STATE OF UTAH

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

PO BOX Q ~ 85SOUTH - 200 EAST
VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SCALE , DATE

1" = 1000 11 /9/83
PARTY REFERENCES

6S JF sB GLO Plat
WEATHER FILE .

Fair . SHELL OIL




DRILLING PROGNOSIS
&
o !
weLL Brotherson 2-2 B4 b0 ] "o, No.
ocation. 1498 FWL, 1371 FSL 0 '
HOCATION: Sec. 2, T'2 S, R4W | rieco: Altamont
«  Duchesne County, Utah e
ossective: Wasatch, Flagstaff esT.eLevation: 6237 GL
EVALUATION GEOLOGY DRILLING
ORLG. TME ELEC. D SIGNIFICANT WELL HOLE CABING “1-10g
& SAMPLES SURVEYS LOGGER FORMATIONS DEPTH SIZE & CEMENT PROGRAM
50°' J 1715"20" Conductor
2 300" 13 3/8" casing &R
o T cmt. to sfc.  —==
& BOPE 5MR - RSRRA
o §; .
'é' < 12" 5
© . S
7] Q g
- |
s B §
~ 500" 6500' 4 L | 958" casing ©
T0C 4000
TGR 3 9,500
9,800 |
M1 10,700 8 3/4
BOPE: 5MR RSRRA
~Jlop Transition 10,950'
Red Beds 11,100°
Base Red Beds 11,250' E &
e o 115300 ____7" fu11 string
§ = S S ’ cmt to 6200'— _
B S.8 g ~ | BOPE: SMR -RSRRA ;Q
3} 885 & | - 2
“w& KK 6 ition 12:550° ) S
g %83 & X
L] ~ N hing
O F o 3 ~
ggs  E z
R = -
et . 6%" diamond -
828 W M 13,450 (mud motor)
[
n 14.4
TD " 1
’ i\ 5" Yiner Cmt. to 7

SFJP or FL&S
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OPERATOR =4/l 0/ Co - DATE //-/f - =
WELL NAME /3A0)/ KA 5nf) o~ 282 )
SEC V& i) 2 T %S R _Yu) COWNIY _ L9 Ci e S/
43+ 672 3¢ 855 EE
APT NOMBER TYPE OF LEASE
POSTING CHEX OQFF:
INDEX MAP HL
NID PI .
PROCESSING COMMENTS : )
= S RN T LrEd L TE [=TEY G v WE
R T T APPROVED B

BY-THE-STATE—
OF UTAH DIVISION OF

o6

QAS ANDMINING——
DATE: _# ints -?:’5 S
/ LEUM ENG BY: ~ - ‘
NFQZ?&—MJM {

-/

APPROVAL LETTER:
SPACING: A-3 \// c-3-a /90-12. Y- &y
UNIT \ T CASE NO. & DATE
c-3-b c-3-c

/T WATEA
D~ LACAAL SIS L QSR NTE TD LIS Cpsre LA )N
Wil fRe i B WELTR ] L DI AESTHICTEL AP L /DA A<
TRECJFIC A S SRR A ol MDD, P DS




,_| RECONCILE WELL NAME AND LOCATION ON APD AGAINST SAME DATA ON PLAT MAP.
1 AUTHENTICATE LEASE AND OPERATOR INFORMATION
~]_VERIFY ADEQUATE AND PROPER BONDING
1T
,_} AUTHENTICATE IF SITE IS IN A NAMED FIELD, EIC.
APPLY SPACING CONSIDERATION
RDRR /YD &
1
UNIT
c-3-b b
L i
O ORI A
e3mc G GAVH AR 3V Ok
Vel OALD BA AME QLVAE
— CHECK DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL.

//CHECK OUTSTANDING OR OVERDUE REPORTS FOR OPERATOR'S OTHER WELLS.

iF POTASH DESIGNATED AREFA, SPECTAL LANGUAGE ON APPROVAL LETTER

" IF IN-OIL SHALE DESIGNATED AREA, SPECIAL APPROVAL LANGUAGE.

VERIFY LEGAL AND SUFFICIENT DRILLING WATER

-

®



November 16, 1983

Shell 0il Company
P. 0. Box 831
Houston, Texas 77001

RE: W¥ell No. Brotherson 2-2B4
NESW Sec. 2, T. 28, R. 4W
1371 PFSL, 1498' FWL
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above referred to
0il well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued in Cause No. 140-12
dated August 27,1981. Prior to spuddiqg¢?§ copy of the Utah Division of Water
Rights (Phone No. 801-533-6071) approval for use or purchase of drilling water
must be submitted to this office, otherwise this approval is void. Special attention
is directed toward compliance with Eg;ssure Teports and restricted production as

spetitied in the order of Cause No. 140-12.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon this well,
you are hereby requested to immediately notify the following:

RONALD J. FIRTH - Chief Petroleum Engineer
Office: 533-5771 ,
Home: 571-6068

Enclosed please find Form OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether or not
water sands (acquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your cooperation in
completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24 hours after
drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor and rig number be
identified.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30855.

Sincgrely,

ER
. ;‘/f f-, Tt e it

Norman C. Stout
Adninistrative Assistant

NCS/as
Encl.




DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

B —

NAWE OF COMPANY: SHELL QIL COMPANY

WELL NAME: BROTHERSON 2-2B4

SECTIONNESW 2 TOwNSHIP___ 25  RANGE___4w

DRILLING CONTRACTOR___vawden

CounTY

Duchesne

RIG #_21
SPUDDED:  Date_ 12-17-83
TIME 12:01 AM

How Rotary

DRILLING WILL COMMENCE

REPORTED BY Barbara
TELEPHONE # 713-870-3218

DATE___ 12-19-83 | SIGNED

AS




DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
NNVE OF CO]VPANY: Shell 0il Company
WELL NAVE: Brotherson 2-2B4
SECTION___ 2 TOWNSHIP__2S RANGE__4W COUNTY__ Duchesne
DRILLING CONTRACTOR Bawden
RIG # 21
SPUDDED:  Date_ 12-17-83
TIME 12:01 AM
How Rotary tools
el
12-17-83 S Wy
DRILLING WILL COMMENCE N regnipey
REPORTB) BY Barbara Bernard C;‘QES!CM QF

TUrORAD T R
o E P S D 1

TELEPHONE # (713) 870-3218

DATE, 12198 - SIGNED_D- M . (Jsbe.




Form OGC-1b sU
: TATE OF UTAH '
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS, AND MINING

b N TRIPLICATE®
wtrurtions on
reverse side)

N

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.
Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

{Do not use this form for_proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir,
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such propossis.)

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMB

2. NAME OF OPLRATOR
Shell Western E&P Inc.

8. PARM OR LEASE NAME

Brotherson 2~-2B4

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P, 0. Box 831, Houston, TX 77001

9. WBLL NO.

2-2B4

4. LOCATION oF WELL (Report location clearly and la accordance with aay State requirements.®

i?.:ll::‘gface 17 below.) . D;V;SfON {)F
i, GAS & MINING

1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2

10. PFIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
Altamont

11. sEC,, T, &, M., OB BLK. AND
SURVEY OR ARBA

NE/4 SW/4 Section 2

T2S-R4W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. swevaTIONS (Show whather oF, AT, aR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. sTATE
6240' GR , Duchesne Utah
18. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data ‘

NOTICR OF INTENTION TO:

TEST WATER SRUT-OFP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFP
FRACTURE TRIAT
SHOOQT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON®

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING

SUBSBQUENT ALPORT OF:

REPAIRING WELL
ALTERING CAS8ING

ABANDONMENT®

(othery Monthly Well Status Report X

{NoTg : Report results of multipie compietion on Weli
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMILETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detalls. and give pertinent dates,
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertica

nent to this work.,) *

Spud at 12:01 AM, 12-17-83 with Bawden Rig #21.

Including estimated date of starting any
1 depths for all markers and zones perti-

‘Set 13-3/8" csg @ 298'. Set 9-5/8" csg @ 6294' which is present depth.

18. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED 5M%6—f@‘1

Administrator
riTLE __Regulatory-Permits

DATH 1"5-84

(This space for Federal or State ofilce use)

APPTNVED BY TITLE

DATE

CGxiasi. ¥3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




> > Form OGC-.1b St ICATE®
TATE OF UTAH Reatile. L Hons on

reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS, AND MINING ) 5. LEASE DESIONATION \NO SERIAL NO.
Fee
8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

{Do not use this form for prgfgnll to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposais.)
1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMSB
oL GAS e o cam e
WELL WELL OTHER B
‘2, NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LBASE NAMB
Shell Western E&P Inc. B Brotherson
3. ADDRESS OF OFRRATOR 9. WBLL NO.
P. 0. Box 831, Houston, TX 77001 Yoo e 2-2B4
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clesrly and In accordance with any State requtrement;." ‘ 10. FIBLD AND I'OOL, OR WILDCAT
See also apace 17 delow.)
At surface . Altamont
1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2 DlV'S'ON GF 11. asmc,, 7., B, M., OR BLE, AND
e 2 13 S ARBA . .
€. GAS & MINING NE /53 ¥ecion 2
T2S-R4W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether oF, rT, oR, ¢ts.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 18. sTATE
6240' GR Duchesne Utah
18 Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
' port,
NOTICS OF INTENTION TO: SUBSBQUENT XBPORT OF
TEST WATER SHUT-OFP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WELL
PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) {
NoTE : Report resuits of multiple completion on Weil
(Other) Monthl}’ well Status Report X }‘n:npletlnupur Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED O COMILETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state nll pertinent detalls, and give pertinent datey, Including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If weil is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true verttcal depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent w0 this work,) *

Set .7" casing at 11,256'. Present status: Running casing Caliper at 11,265'.

18. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Administrator
SIGNED .5 A AL ‘9_6-—6—f riLe _ Regulatory-Permits parm _2-2-84

(This space for Federal or State ofiice use)

APP™NVED BY TITLE DATE
Cnistra. 73 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



» * Form OGC-1b Q . ‘ Ul I PLIC ATER
- ! witions on
TATE OF UTAH N I

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING . 5. LEASE DESIGNATION \KO SERIAL NO.
Fee
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRINE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back t different reservolr.
Use “"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for luCh‘DNDO‘I?I.." ¢

L 7. UNIT AGAEENBNT NAMB
oIL Al
wILL WELL OTHER
2. NAMB OF OPIRATOR . PARM OR LEASE NAMB
Shell Western E&P Inc. Brotherson
3. ADDRESS OF OPIRATOR 7179, waLL No.
P. 0. Box 831, Houston, TX 77001 2-2B4
“~4. LOCATION or WELL (Report location clearly and In accordance with any State requirements.*® 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
i.t. llrlto space 17 below.) Alt at
surface
' ' - DiViSION OF
1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2 ivi 11. axc., ., &., M., OR BLK. 4XD
3 UN; s 4884 .
(b } ec n 2
G, GAS & MINING NE/HSW/ et tio
T2S-R4W
14, rramiIT NO. 15. siavaTioNs (Show whether oF, XT, GR, eta.) 12. COUNTY OR PARIBH| 18. 8TATSB
6240' GR Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION T0: SUBSBQUENT XBPORT OF :
TEST WATER SHUT-OFP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE YRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIMZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) {
oTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) Monthly Well Status Report X }'ﬁmpletlonpgr Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cleariy state ull pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If weil is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and trie vertical depths for ajl markers and zones perti-

nent w this work,) *

Present status: Drilling at 13,844'".

18. I heredy certify that the foregoing is true and correct Administrator
SIGNED . 9.‘4—@—9__ rirLE _ Regulatory-Permits patn _ 3-2-84

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APPTAVED BY TITLE DATE
Cuiiviis. *S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side



' . SERMITT IN TRIPLICATE®* .
.TATE OF UTAH bh('rinﬂru{‘tlinns on
VE ISt <) q"
DEPARTME® OF NATURAL RESOURCES reveee

+* Ferm OGC-1b

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING . S. LEASE DESIGNATION iAND SERIAL NO.
Fee
SUNDRY NOT'CES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRINE NaME
(Do not use this form for propossals to drill or to deepen or plug back ¢t dift .
Use "APQJSATION FOR PERMIT-—" for Sxeh‘przgul?ug ifferent reservolr )
1. 7. UNIT AGASEMBNT NAMB
oIL, gAS
wILL WBLL oTHER .
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LBASE NaMB
Shell Western E&P Inc. Brotherson
$. ADDRESS OF OPBRATOR ] 9. WBLL NO.
P. 0. Box 831, Houston, TX 77001 2-2B4
*~& LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and (o accordance with any State fequirements.® 10, PISLD AND POOL, OR \WILDCAT
See alsc space 17 below.) .
At surface Altamont
1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2 11 asc.. 7., L, M., OB BLX. AND
NE/&"ESW/F S&ttion 2
T2S-R4W
14. rERMIT NO. ‘ 15. BLavATIONS (Show whether DF, X7, OR, ets.) 12, COUNTY O PaRisM| 18, sTAIB
6240' GR Duchesne Utah
1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
} NOTICE OF INTBNTION T0: SUBSBQUINT suroar or:
TEST WATER SRUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CaSING WATER SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUVONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(other) Monthly Well Status Report X T Pt Recompietion Refort and Log form.) -

17. DESCRIBE FRUPNSED OR CUMILETED OPERATIONS (Clearly dtute ull pertinent detalls. und give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
propoudmvork. h" well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations snd measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Reached TD of 14,450' on 3-8-84. Ran 7" liner to TD. Top of liner at 11,029'.
Released drilling rig on 3-16-84. Present status: W.0. completion rig.

5 CEl

RPR 4 1934

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS & MINING

18. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Administrator
SIGNED 5 -n 9.0'81‘ rrree _ _Regulatory-Permits pate _4-2-84

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APP"AVED BY TITLE DATE
Cuivizias. 'S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



» * Form OGC-1b ‘ .
- TATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCE
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS, AND MINING

SUERIT IN TRIPLICATE®
er instructions on
reverse side)

S

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

{Do not use this form for p:i?oanll to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
CATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposais.)

Use “APP

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAME

.

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMB
- o1L (7Y ]
WBLL WwELL OTHER
‘2, NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LBASE NAMB
Shell Western E&P Inc. Brotherson
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. wWBLL NO.
P. 0. Box 831, Houston, TX 77001 2-2B4
“~4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location ciearly and In accordance with any State requirements.® 10. PIELD AND FOOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At surface Altamont

1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2

11. amec,, T, B., M., OR BLX, AND

NE/2EW/3 Y&t cion 2

T2S-R4W
14, PERMIT NO, 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether OF, &T, G, eta.) 12. COUNTY 08 PaXRisH| 13, sTATE
6240' GR Duchesne Utah
18. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
XOTICE OF INTENTION T0: SUBSBQUENT XBPORT OF :
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OB ALTER CASING WATEZE SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) —
(other) Monthly Well Status Report X O ineror Rocompiction Renoct and Log tarm.) -
17. DESCRIBE PROFOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cleurly state nll pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work.
nent to this work.) ®

If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

Moved in completion rig, WOW #17, on 4-4-84. Perforated from 14,393 to 12,796 feet.

Acidized well. Hooked well into flowline. Turned well over to

RECEIVED

MAY 0 3 1984

DIVISION OF O1L
GAS & MINING

pumper on 4-19-84.

18. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Administrator

SIGNED § il a}r@? rrrLe _ Regulatory-Permits pare _ D-1-84
(This space for Federal or State ofiice use)
APPPNVED BY TITLE DATE

Custisizs. 7S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



. > Form 0GC-1b . :
) STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

SU.I" IN TRIPLICATE®
.1 instructions on

reverse side)

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a diff t res ie.
Use “"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for weh‘propo‘ul.) erent reservo

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRINE NAME

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMB

1.
orL 7Y ]
WwELL wELL OTHER
‘2, MaMB OF OPIRATOR 8. FARM OR LBASE NAMB
Shell Westerm E&P Inc. Brotherson
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. wsLL NO.
P. 0. Box 831, Houston, TX 77001 2-2B4

" ~4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.®
ieto ul:to space 17 below.)
surface

1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2

10. PIZLD AND FOOL, OR WILDCAT
Al tamont

11. =sscC., 7., B, M., OR BLK, AND
NE/2W/R Y8t tion 2
T2S-R4W

14. PERMIT NO, 15, MLBYATIONS (Show whether or, RT, GR, eto.) 12. COUNTY Om PARISM| 13, 8TATS
6240' GR Duchesne Utah
18. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

i NOTICE OF INTENTION 70:

} TEST WATER SEUT-OF? PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFP

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS {Other)

SUBSSBQUBNT XBPORT OF:

RETAIRING WELL

ALTEIRING CABING

ABANUONMENT®

(orher) Monthly Well Status Report X

(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel
(‘ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PRNPOSED OR COMILETED OPERATIONS (Clearly stute ull pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for ail markers and zones perti-

nent to this work,) *

Waiting on stabilized test.

-RECEIVED

JUNS 1984

DIVISION OF OIL
GAS & MINING

18. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Administrator

SIGNED __jc2 = M. ./‘ rirLe __ Regulatory-Permits

DATE 6-1-84

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPTNAVED BY TITLE

DATE

CuZiwis.. *S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



.

Form 0GC.3 e ! : SU’BMIT IN DU ;'ATE* u 5564 0
STATZ UF UTAH (S ther intieons
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES -
DIVISION OF OlIL, GAS, AND MINING . 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERiaL ffo.
. ' Fee
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTED OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG*
Ta TYPE OF WELL: wELL X AL var L]  Other 7. UNIT AGBEEMENT NAME
b TYPE OF COMPLETION:
were K1 ovme (1 250 [0 fkek aesva. (] Other 5. FARM OF LEASE NAME
'T2. NAME OF OPERATOR ] Brotherson
Shell Western E&P Inc. ATTN: E. A. Vajnar 6486 WCK. 8. wiLL No. -
3. ADDRESS OF OPLRATOR 2_234
P. 0. Box 831 Houston, Tx. 77001 R ECE'VED 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in acoordance with any State requirementa)® Altamont
At surface ]37] ' FSL & ]498! FWL SEC . 2 JU N 2 9 1984 11. g:c.‘.l'll'i.‘l.. M., OR BLOCK AND S8URVEY
At top prod. interval reported below h A NE/4 SW/4 Sec. 2
At total depth DIVISION OF OIL T2S-R4W
14. PERMIT NO. GASEMINIRIG 12. counTY oR 13. sTATE
43-012-20855 Duchesne Utah

13. DATE SPUDDED | 16, DATE T.D. REACHED | 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready 0 prod.) | 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, BEB, BT, GE, ETC.)* | 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

12-17-83 3-16-84 5-29-—84 KB 6264' GL 6240' --
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY®* DRILLED BY
14,450" 12,668 - — 0-TD --
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION—TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND ‘I'VD)‘ 25. :BA:V‘D!!B;C"X;!;?NAL
| Wasatch (12,623'-11,713') -
28, TIPE ELECTRIC-AND 0T LOGS RUN P 27. WAS WELL CORED
_DIL/ S_ELI.SE/,QR?(%., LTD/CNL/GR/CAL; Sofiic /GR/CAL ™ : No
28 CASING RECORD (Réport oll strings set in well)
CASING SIZE WEIGRT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
13-3/8" 68# 298" 17-1/2 390 sx ’
9-5/8 36# 6495 12-1/4 1400 sx
7" 26%#, 29# 11,256' 8-3/4 945 sx
29. LINER RECORD - 30. TUBING RECORD
81z TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT® SCREEN (MD) sIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
5" 11,0297 14,450° 230 2-778 11,612 11,612°'
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number) | 2, ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
. ' ) N DEPTH INTERYAL (MD) AMQUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED
Wasatch (14,393'-12,796") | 14.393'-12,796" | 35,000 gals. 15% HC]

12,623"-11,713" {35,000 gals. 15% HCI

(12,623'-11,713")

33.¢ PRODUCTION )
DATS FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas iift, pumping-—size and type of pump) WELL 8TATUS (Producing or
. shut-in)

5-30-84 Flowing Producing

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE sIzZE PROD'N. FOR 0IL—BBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—BBL. GAS-0IL RATIO
TEST PERIOD
5/30-6/5/84 | 168 —> | 4836 | 5766 | 785 1192
FLOW, TUBING PRESS. | CASING PRESSURE | CALCULATED OIL—BBL. GAS—MCP. WATER—BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)
24-HOUR RATE .

657 0 — | 691 | 824 | 112 41.5
34. DISPOBITION OF GaAS (Sold, uaed for fuel, vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY

Sold K. C. LaRose

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Drilling and Completion History
36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all avallable records

SIGNED __ r Div. Oper. Engr. qga;45<f
%ﬁ?{_— e parm

*(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)
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ALTAMONT FIELD

Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test

$ M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" c¢sg @ 60

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test

$§ M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60"

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
She11-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test

$ M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$101M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298"

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
ShelT-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$116M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60"

13-3/8" csg @ 298"

12-14-83
Status: RURT.
90% moved to location.

12-15-83
Status: RURT.
25% rigged up.

12-16-83
Status: RURT.
75% rigged up.

12-17-83
100/40//0/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.468) 9 x 50

Spud at 12:01 AM, 12-17-83

Location: 1371"' FSL & 1498' FWL
NE/4 SW/4 Section 2, T2S-R4W
Duchesne County, Utah

12-18-83
298/198//1/85. Status: Circ. casing.
Dev: 0° at 142'; 1° at 298"

Mud: (.484) 9.3 x 45

Ran 7 jts of 13-3/8" c¢sg to 298°'.
12-19-83

298/0//2/85. Status: Nipple up.

Cmt csg w/390 sx Class "G" w/3% CaCi2,
4#/sx Flocele. Bumped plug at 7:15 AM,
float did not hold.

12-20-83
340/42//3/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (fresh water)



UTAH

-

ALTAMONT FIELD .
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$122M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shei1l-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$130M/81,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" c¢sg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$207M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'

ALTAMONT FIELD

Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$282M/%$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" ¢sg @ 298°

12-21-83

1124/784//4/85. Status: Trip in.
Dev: 4° at 787'; 3/4° at 1124'
Mud: (.433) 8.3 x 28

12-22-83 )
1945/821//5/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 4° at 1635'

Mud: (.433) 8.3 x 27

12-23-83

2395/450//6/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 1° at 2136

Mud: (.433) 8.3 x 27

12-24-83

3000/605//7/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 1° at 2752'

Mud: (.433) 8.3 x 27

12-25-83

3382/382//8/85. Status: Drilling.

Dev: 1° at 3306'.
of water per hour.

Losing approx. 70 bbls

Mud: (.447) 8.6 x 29

12-26-83

3830/448//9/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 1° at 3800'. Still losing water.
Mud: (.433) 8.3 x 27

12-27-83

4258/428//10/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.442) 8.5 x 29

12-28-83

4571/313//11/85. Status: Trip out.
Dev: 0° at 4376

Mud: (.436) 8.4 x 29



UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

P

ALTAMONT FIELD
ShelT-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500"' Wasatch Test
$303M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$311M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$367M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$381M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240"

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$486M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" ¢sg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

12-29-83

4836/265//12/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 3/4° at 4564

Mud: (.447) 8.6 x 30

12-30-83

5206/370//13/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 0° at 5044'

Mud: (.436) 8.4 x 28

12-31-83 L
5550/344//14/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.442) 8.5 x 28 .
1-1-84 .
5805/255//15/85. Status: Drilling.

Dev: 3/4° at 5507’
Mud: (.442) 8.5 x 28

1-2-84
6060/255//16/85. Status:
Mud: (.436) 8.4 x 27

Trip in hole.

1-3-84

6403/343//17/85. Status:
Dev: 3/4° at 5999'

Mud: (.436) 8.4 x 27

Drilling.

1-4-84

6496/93//18/85. Status:
Dev: 134° at 6496'

Mud: (.437) 8.4 x 27

Circulating.

1-5-84

6496/0//19/85. Status: W.0. cmt,

Ran 165 jts of 9-5/8" csg to 6495°'.
Cmt w/1150 sx Lite w/i#/sx Cello-seal.
Tail w/250 sx Class "H" w/i#/sx Cello-seal.
Bumped plug at 4:45 AM.
Mud: (.437) 8.4 x 27




UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500 Wasatch Test
$515M/$1,680M
Wl - 64.62%
GR 6240'
20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$548M/%1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240'
20" csg @ 60
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$563M/$1,680M
Wl - 64.62%
GR 6240'
20" c¢sg @ 60°
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495°

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$573M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" c¢sg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$580M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" c¢sg @ 6495'

1-6-84

6496/0//20/85. Status: Testing BOPE.

1-7-84
6831/335//21/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28

1-8-84
7384/553//22/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 2%° at 7021'

Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28

1-9-84
7864/480//23/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 1-3/4° at 7420'

Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28

1-10-84

8333/469//24/85. Status: Prep to trip.

Dev: 2° at 7881'
Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28

1-11-84

8571/238//25/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 14° at 8300'

Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28

1-12-84

9069/498//26/85. Status: Drilling.
Dev: 14° at 8795'

Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28



N

.

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

——

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$591M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" ¢sg @ 60'

13-3/8" c¢sg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$625M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’

ALTAMONT FIELD

SheTT-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$660M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$688M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298!
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

1-13-84

9645/576//27/85. Status: Drilling.

Dev: 1° at 9290’

Mud: (.433) 8.33 x 28

1-14-84

10,130/485//28/85. Status: Drilling.

Dev: 4° at 9813; 4° at 9875'; 4° at 10,010'

Mud: (.442) 8.5 x 29

1-15-84
10,220/90//29/85.
Dev: 3%° at 10,193'
Mud: (.452) 8.7 x 30

1-16-84
10,469/249//30/85.

Status:

Status:

Drilling.

Mix LCM pill.

Lost returns at 10,460' - approx. 300 bbis.

Dev: 2-3/4° at 10,303

Mud: (.510) 9.8 x 38 x 13.6

Drilling.

1-17-84

10,635/166//31/85. Status:
Dev: 2-3/4° at 10,593

Mud: (.552) 10.6 x 37 x 11.6
1-18-84

10,804/169//32/85. Status:

Lost returns at 10,784’
Mud:

1

Drilling.
spotted 2 LCM pills.

(.572) 11 x 45 x 12.2



a

\

C

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$722M/%1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240’

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$729M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

ALTAMONT FIELD

Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$768M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" c¢sg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298*
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

ALTAMONT FIELD

Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$782M/%1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240°

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg 0@ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495°

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shell-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$793M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298!
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’

Status:

1-19-84

10,853/49//33/85.
1-3/4° at 10,810
Mud: (.572) 11 x 44 x 17.2

1-20-84
10,948/95//34/85. Status: Pulling 5 stands.
Lost returns at 10,948' - approx. 250 bbls.
Mud: (.577) 11.1 x 45 x 14.2

1-21-84

10,997/49//35/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.582) 11.2 x 42 x 13.8

1-22-84

11,104/107//36/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.587) 11.3 x 43 x 13.6

1-23-84

11,167/63//37/85. Status: Testing BOPs.

Mud: (.587) 11.3 x 44 x 14.8

1-24-84

11,183/16//38/85. Status: Drilling.
Lost 300 bbls. mud.

Mud: (.592) 11.4 x 42 x 15

1-25-84

11 254/71//39/85 Status: Drilling.

Lost complete returns at 11,232'.
partial returns w/3rd pill.
total.

Mud: (.598) 11.5 x 44 x 13.6

Regained
Lost 500 bbls.

Circ & thaw out equip.



&

w

UTAH

————

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD ‘
Shel1-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$810M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" ¢sg @ 298!
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
Shel1-Brotherson 2-284
(D) Bawden #21

14,500 Wasatch Test
$840M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
§-5/8" csg @ 6495'

ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,070M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60°

13-3/8" c¢sg @ 298'
9-5/8" c¢sg @ 6495’

7" ¢sg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,099M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

7" csg @ 11,256

1-26-84

11,259/5//40/85. Status:
Dev: 1° at 11,259'

Logging.

Mud: (.598) 11.5 x 43 x 13

1-27-84

11,259/0//41/85. Status: Lay down DCs.
Mud: (.598) 11.5 x 48 x 13

1-28-84

11,259/0//42/85. Status: Build mud volume.

Ran 286 jts of 7" csg to 11,256'. Cmt Ist
stage w/200 sx Lite w/1% Halad 9, i#/sx Flocele.
Tail w/260 sx Class "H" w/1% Halad 9, .1% WR-4,
1#/sx Flocele.

Mud: (.598) 11.5 x 45 x 13
1-29-84
11,259/0//43/85. Status: Run temp. survey.

Cmt 2nd stage w/485 sx Lite w/.6% Halad 24,
3% CaCl2, i#/sx Flocele. Good returns.

1-30-84

11,259/0//44/85. Status: Picking up DP.
1-31-84 _ _
11,265/6//45/85. Status: Run casing Caliper.

Mud: (.603) 11.6 x 43 x 17.6



2-1-84 , o
11,266/1//46/85. Statusg Trip in hole.
Attempted to run csg Caliper - stopped at
5160'. Cleaned junk out of hole and ran

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test

$1,107M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,130M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240
20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" c¢sg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256"

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,137M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240
20" csg @ 60"
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256
UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500"' Wasatch Test
$1,188M/$1,680M
WI - 64.629
GR 6240'
20" csg @ 60"
13-3/8" ¢sg @ 298!
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256

Mud: (.681) 13.1 x 46 x 14

csg Caliper - OK.
Mud: (.603) 11.6 x 42 x 18

2-2-84
11,339/69//47/85. Status:
Mud: (.603) 11.6 x 42 x 18

Drilling.

2-3-84
11,416/77//48/85. Status:

Drilling.
Mud: (.608) 11.7 x 47 x 16

2-4-84

11,494/78//49/85. Status: Drillin
Mud: (.629) 12.1 x 46 x 18 ’
2-5-84

11,524/30//50/85. Status: Drilling.

Dev: 1° at 11,475
Mud: (.650) 12.5 x 55 x 16

2-6-84

11,619/95//51/85. Status: Drilling.



UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,200M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298

UTAH

UTAH

9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,219M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,239M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60"
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,266M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" c¢sg @ 60
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" c¢sg @ 11,256

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,308M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" ¢sg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

7" csg 0 11,256

2-7-84
11,685/66//52/85. Status:
Mud: (.712) 13.7 x 48 x 12

2-8-84

11,721/36//53/85. Status:
Mud: (.723) 13.9 x 52 x 11.2
2-9-84

11,780/59//54/85, Status:
Mud: (.7332) 14.2 x 62 x 11.2
2-10-84

11,836/56//55/85. Status:

Lost 166 bbls mud at 11,781"'

Mud: (.7332) 14.1 x 57 x 8
2-11-84

11,972/136//56/85. Status:
Mud: (.728) 14 x 58 x 8.8
2-12-84 :
12,101/129//57/85. Status:
Mud: (.728) 14 x 52 x 7
2-13-84

12,204/103//58/85. Status:
Mud: (.728) 14 x 47 x 8

Drilling.

Install Kelly wiper.

Drilling.

Drilling.

Drilling.

Drilling.

Drilling.



UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotnerson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,330M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240‘@ 50"

20" ¢s

13—3/8g csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

7" csg @ 11,256'

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,339M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256’

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500 Wasatch Test
$1,356M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60"
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256°

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,372M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256

2-14-84

12,285/81//59/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.728) 14 x 47 x 8

2-15-84

12,345/60//60/85. Status: Drilling.

Lost complete returns at 12,319' & Tost
250 bbls. Pumped 4 pilis.

Mud: (.728) 14 x 47 x 8.2

2-16-84

12,396/51//61/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.728) 14 x 52 x 8.4

2-17-84

12,475/79//62/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.733) 14.1 x 51 x 8.8 :



¢

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,422M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240°

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500 Wasatch Test
$1,436M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

7" csg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,451M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240°

20" c¢sg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,469M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256

2-18-84

12,526/51//63/85. Status: Drilling.

Lost complete returns at 12,500°'. Dropped
three LCM pills. Lost 300 bbls mud.

Mud: (.733) 14.1 x 55 x 8.8

2-19-84 .
12,623/97//64/85. Status: Drilling.

Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 53 x 8.8
2-20-84
12,713/90//65/85. Status: Drilling.

Lost partial returns at 12,692' & 12,698"'.
Lost total of 100 bbls mud.

Mud: (.748) 14.4 x 55 x 8.8
2-21-84 .
12,810/97//66/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.749) 14.4 x 61 x 9.6
2-22-84
12,903/93//67/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.7488) 14.4 x 56 x 8
2-23-84
12,941/48//68/85. Status: Magnaflux BHA.
Mud: (.747) 14.3 x 56 x 8



Y

v o

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,493M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4

(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,526M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240' ‘

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" ¢sg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256’

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,535M/$1,680M
Wl - 64.62%
GR 6240
20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,551M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240’
20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" csg @ 298"
9-5/8" ¢sg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,560M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

7" csg @ 11,256°

[
2-24-84

12,988/47//69/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.7436) 14.3 x 56 x 8

2-25-84

13,131/143//70/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.7384) 14.2 x 53 x 7.2

2-26-84

13,267/136//71/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 53 x 7.2

2-27-84

13,412/145//72/85. Status: Drilling.

Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 55 x 7.2

2-28-84
13,538/126//73/85. Status:

Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 55 x 6.4

2-29-84
13,651/113//74/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 58 x 6

3-1-84

13,728/77//75/85. Status: Drilling.

Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 61 x 5.2



UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,573M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" ¢sg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,616M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" c¢sg 0 60
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" ¢sg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,625M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg 0 60
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256'

ALTAMONT FIELD

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,634M/$1,680M

Wl - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'

7" csg @ 11,256'

SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,650M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" ¢sg @ 60°'

13-3/8" ¢sg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495

7" ¢csg @ 11,256

3-2-84
13,844/116//76/85. Status:
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 57 x 5.6

3-3-84

13,945/101//77/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 58 x 6

3-4-84

14,055/110//78/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 58 x 6.4

3-5-84

14,167/112//79/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 55 x 6.4

3-6-84 .
14,263/96//80/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 55 x 7.2

3-7-84

14,364/101//81/85. Status: Drilling.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 56 x 7.4

3-8-84

14,450/86//82/85. - Status: Cond. for logs.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 55 x 8

Drilling.



UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,657M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240'
20" csg @ 60
13-3/8" ¢csg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg.@ 11,256'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,802M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240’
20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" ¢csg @ 11,256
5" Tiner @ 14,450'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,816M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240
20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256'
5% 1iner @ 14,450'

UTAH
ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,823M/$1,680M
WI - 64.62%
GR 6240
20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495'
7" csg @ 11,256'
5" liner @ 14,450'TD
Top @ 11,029'

o
3-9-84

14,450/0//83/85. Status: Logging.
Ran DLL/BHC/Sonic. Running CDL/CNS.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 58 x 7.4

3-10-84
14,450/0//84/85. Status: Running in w/liner.
Mud: (.7436) 14.3 x 42 x 7.4

3-11-84

PBTD 14,365/0//85/85. Status: W.0. cmt.
Ran 5" Tiner to 14,450'. Cmt w/280 sx Class
"H" w/35% Silica, 1.5% CFR-2 (Blue), .3%
Halad 24, .1% HR-12.

Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 42 x 7.4

3-12-84

14,365/0//86/85. Status: PU RTTS tool.
PU RTTS tool to test Tiner lap & csg.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 59 x 6.8

3-13-84 '
14,365/0//87/85. Status: Trip out w/RTTS.
Pressure tested liner lap & csg.

Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 62 x 7.2

3-14-84 .
14,450/0//88/85. Status: TIH w/Mill to drill cmt.
Trip in to 9875'. Tagged top of cement to 10,624'.
Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 58



~~

UTAH

‘UTAH

——

UTAH

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,831M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240

20" csg @ 60°
13-3/8" csg @ 298"
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’
7" csg @ 11,256°

5" liner @ 14,450'TD
Top @ 11,029'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21

14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,841M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'

13-3/8" csg @ 298
9-5/8" csg @ 6495’

7" csg @ 11,256'

5" 1iner @ 14,450'TD
Top @ 11,029'

ALTAMONT FIELD
SWEPI-Brotherson 2-2B4
(D) Bawden #21
14,500' Wasatch Test
$1,834M/$1,680M

WI - 64.62%

GR 6240'

20" csg @ 60'
13-3/8" csg @ 298'
9-5/8" csg @ 6495
7" csg @ 11,256'

5" Tiner @ 14,450'
Top @ 11,029’

3-15-84

14,450/0//89/85. Status: Prep to rev. out water.
Trip in w/Mill. Pick up RTTS tool and TIH.
Testing liner lap - pressured up on lap to.

1500 PSI - OK. Displaceing w/water and checked
inflow - OK.

Mud: (.738) 14.2 x 68 x 8.0

3-16-84
14,450/0//90/85. Statusi
Lay down drill pipe - DC's.

Nippleing down BOP's.
Nipplte down B.0.P.'s.

3-17-84

TD 14,450//91/85. Status: Rig release.
Rig released at 8 PM, 3-16-84.

Corrected cost $1,834,506



¢

STATE:
FIELD:

WELL:®

lLLAEBEL:

L N, 8
FUOREMANS
RIG:

ALITH. AMNT:
DAILY COETs
LM, CsT:
TYFE OF J0RE:
ORJECTIVE:

DATE(S) @

FRESENT STATLIZ:

ACTIVITY:

TR

®OTH
0 4%
#O5%

ETATE:
FTIEL.I:

WELL#

LAREL. 2

W MO, s
FOREMAN
RIG:

AUTH. AMNT:
CATLY COET:s
CLIM. COsT:
TYFE OF J0g:
OBRUECTIVE:

DATE(S) ¢

FREZENT STATLS:

ACTIVITY:
#O 2%
# A
#0145
#O5#
HNA 4
#0O7 %
WO
FOV
# 1 0%
#1 1%
#12%
#1323
31 44
1 S
3] A

LTaH
ALTAMONT

BROTHERSON Z2-2R4

FIRST REFORT
Seniel

Folle LARISE
WOW 17
21A000
192,40
2122, 40

NEW WELL
COMPLETION

4~4-34
FREFARE TO START FICKING LFP TEG.

TRAVEL TO 1-3R4 LOCATION. FINISH RIGGING DOWN
LOAD OUT AND MOVE EQUIP., TO 2Z-2Z2R4. RIG UP EQUIF
LIMLOAD AND TALLY =2 773 IN TRG. INSTALL AND TEST
B.O.FLE. ACME TO S000 LBE. HELD. PREFPARE TO START
FICKING UP TBG. SDON.

LUTaH
ALTAMONT

BROTHERSON Z-2E4

Sesavl

.. LAROSE

WOW 17

21 AQOO

FOAS  FOAR  RARS
2957, 40

MEW WELL
COMPLET T O

=% 4-4& 0 4-7
MILLIMG O ML

4-5-84 SITART RIH W/ FPROD. TEG., PICEING P TN
SINGLE. DRIFTING TG, STOP AT S450 FT. AND CIRC.
MUDD OUT OF HOLE. CONT. RIH W/ & L/75 IN. MILL AND
SCRAFER. TO0 5 ING LINER TOF AT 11021 FT. FULL WP 2
ST, SDON.

4-4&0 RN 2 STDESE, RACK TOOS ING LINER TORF. TCIRC,
MUD GUT OF HOLE. POOH W/ TRG AND 7 IN. ™MILL AND
SLCRAFPER. BREAE DOWN TOOLES MADE L MILL AND SCRAFER
FOR S5 OIM. ORG. RIMH TO LINER, COMT. PICRIMNG UFP TEG
COULDNT GET INTO LIMNER. SDON

4-7  RIG P SWIVEL AND HYD. STRIFFER. MILL TWWN
INTO 5 IN. LIMNER AFPFROX. 10 FT. CONT. RIM W/ PROD
TRG AND WORKESTRIMNG TO 142735 FT. MUD THICK. FLOAT-
TRG. TO 20000 LRI, CTRC MUD OUT. MILL CUT MLUID AND
CMT. T 14420 FT. PL&,T. 0. COULONT GET BELOW
14240 FT. MILL FOR AFPPROX 3 HRES, HGME BACE SWIVEL
AN PUILL WP QU OF 5 TN, L ITMER.  S00aN.




STATE:
FIELD:

WELL.®

lLABEL:

Wi N, 2
FOREMARM:
RIG:

AUTH. AMNT:
OAaILY COST:
CUM. DOsT:
TYFE OF JI0g:
ORJECTIVE:

DATE(S) =
FRESENT STATUZ:

ACTIVITY:
#ODH
HOTE
Hi) G %
HOTH
O

STATE:
FIELD:

WELL 2

LAEBEL:

WO MO, e
FOREMANM:
RIG:

AUTH. AMNT:
DATLY COosT:
CUM, COsT:
TYFE OF JI0R:
OBIECTIVE:

DATE(S):
FREZENT 2TATLS:

ACTIVITY:
#OS
LT ICE-3
360143
#OE
IRV

LITAH
AL TAMONT

BROTHERZON 2-2ER4

Ll

F.C. LAROSE
WOl 17
21ADO0

SATT 20
11424, 40
NEW WELL
COMPLETION

4~5—324
DRILLING CN CMT.

CONT. POOH W/ 4 178 IN. MILL AND CESG. SCRAPER.
BREAK DOWN AND LAY DOWN MILL AND SCRAFPER. MADE UR
4 178 IN. ROCK RIT. RIM. RIG UP EQUIE. AND START
DRILLING ON CMT. AT 14340 FT. STILL COULDNT MAKE
ANY HOLE. DRILL FOR 3 HRE. CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP.
HANG BACK SWIVEL. PULL UP HOLE 1 STD.  S0ON

LITAH
AL TAMONT

BROTHERSON 2-2B4

SPER2Rl

k. C. LARDEE
WO 17
214000
2E020 40
14037, 20
NEBE WL
COMPLETION

4-10-524
DRILLING 0OM CMT.

RUN BACE DOWN T 14340 FT. CONT. DRILLING ON FLOAT
COLLAR. FELL THRU FLOAT COLLAR AT %230 AM. CONT.
DRILLLING ON CMT. DRILLED TO 14385 FT. COULDNT
MAKE ANY MORE HOLE. CIRC. HOLE CLEAN. FOOH LAYING
DUWN WORKETRING. FULL PROD. TEG. STANDTMG BACE,
CLOZE WELL IN FOR MIGHT.



STATE:
FIELD:

WELL:

LABEL:

W NG, 8
FUREMAN:
RIG

ALUTH., AMNT:
ODATILY COST:
CiM. COsT:
TYFE OF Jogs:
ORIECTIVE:

DATE (=)
FRESENT STATUS:

ACTIVITY:
CORO2H
#OT
#0144
# (5
FOQER
WOT R
#OER

STATE:
FIELD:

WELL:

L.AREL:

WO NG, 2
FOREMAN:
RIG:

ALITH, AMNT:
DATLY COsT:
UM, CosTe
TYFE OF JOR:
NRJIECTIVE:

DATE(S):
FRESENT STATLS:

ACTIVITY:
#O2H#
HOIH
IO baE
WO W
#0O7
3y o

LTAH
AL TAMONT

BROTHERSON 2-2E4

B, LAROEE
WiW 17
214000
24432, 40
14420, 40
NEW WELL
COMPLETION

4-11-24
FREFARE TO RLN LOG

CONT. POOH W/ PRODUCTION TERG. RIG UP N L MO/
CULLOUGH. PRESS TEST LUBRICATOR AND FLANGES TO
SO00 LBS. PRESS TEST O5G. TO 3500 LBS. HELD FOR
13 MIN. Ok, MO CLULLOIGH RIH AND LOG WELL AS PER
FROG. TOOLS WOULDNT WORK ON FIRST AND SECOND RUNS.
IN HOLE. BREAE DOWN TOOLS AND TAKE TO TOWN TO EBE
CHECEED OVER.  ALSD 2 CONES OFF 4 1/2 IN. BIT IN
HOLE.  SDOoN

LUTAH
ALTAMONT

BROTHERSON 2—2R4

WOl 17
21AQ00
EEAR, A0
12174, 00
NEW WELL
COMPLETTON

0412534
TEST EQUIPMENT

ACTIVITY: S-4£:00 A.M. TRAVEL TO LOCATION- RIG
MOCULLOUGH BACK UP ~ TRY TO LOG WELL AGATIN — ToOoL
BUIT WORKING ON BOTTOM — FOOH - RIG DN ML QUGH
WAIT ON DLW.F. - RIG UP OLW.P. — O.W.F, RIH AND LOG
WELL AZS FER FROG — RIG DOWN 0L W, P, — BREAE FILLANGE
UFF BOF -~ PREFARE TO TEST EQUIFMENT T0 SO0 LRBRE.
CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT - 10-11:00 FoM. TVL HOME,



u
-
a
u

LITAH '

AL TAMONT

STATE
FIELD

WL s BROTHERZON 2-2R4

LAkEL
WO MO, s

FoEMAaM: A I LHRH k=
RiGe WO 17

ALTH. AMNT: 216000

DALy CosT: BEGET & 2440
CUM. DT 43404, 47
TYPE OF J0i: NEW WELL
ORJECTIVE: COMPLETION

DATE(Z) 4-12 & 4-14
FRESENT STATLEZ: TESTING FOR TRG. LEAK

ACTIVITYR 4—1Z2-24  INETALL TRG. HANGER DONUT IN TRG. SPOOL.
HORH : RIG UP HNP. LUBRICATOR ETC. PRESZ. TEST EQUIFP. TO
#ONHE EO00 LES, PICEUR FIRST FERF GLIN AND PERFORATE AS
# Q4 FER FRUb" 14zes TO 12724 FT. 104 SELECTIONS

#O5 203 HOLES., MADE WP S IN. FERMANENT MT. STATES FER
#OE% AN SET AT 12710 FT. RIG DOWN OWR. MADE UFP SEAL
#OT % ARSEMBLY AT + 45 SEATING NIPFLE. BLEEDR PREZE OFF
# Oz WELL 1500 LEBE, START IN HOLE W/ FPRODL TEG. SDON.
HOWE . 4-14-24 CONT. RIH W/ PROD. TEG. LATCH INTO PER.
#10% AT 12710 FT. MARKE TRG. TO SPACE OUT. RELEAZE FROM
#1314 PRER.  SPACE OLT. WITH TRG JUST ARBOVE PER. CIRC,
#12E _ HOLE CLEAN. LATOH BACE INTD FER. PRESZS. TEST TRG
#1323 T AS00 LBZ. TRG GAVE WP AT SE500 LRBRE, DROP STDG.
w14 VAILVE IN TRG. RELEASE FROM PER. POOH AND TRY TO
#1550 FIMND BAD TRG, CAUGHT W W/ FLUID AT éoﬂﬁ FT FRESE
RCR LIF ON TRG. HMELD. CONT. RIH TESTING FOR LE . SN

STATE: UTAH
FIELD: AL TAMONT

WEILL & BROTHERSZON 2-2BE4

LAREL: e

W N, 57 TREEl
FOREMAN: ELC. LARDSE
RIG: WOW 17
ALTH. AMNT: 214000
DATLY TOsT: LW, A0
ClLiM, ST =057, 57
TYFE OF J0R: MNEW WELL
ORIECTIVE: COMPILLETION

i' |

DATE(Z) 4—-14-24
PRESENT STATLIS: REFLACE SEAL ASSEMRILY

ACTIVITY: CONT. RIMH W/ TRG. TESTING EVERY ROW TO &S00 LES.
HOTH ALL TRG, TESTED GOOD. RIG UP DELSCO. FISH STRG.
#OHH VALVE QUT OF TRG. RIG DOWN DELSCO, LATOH INTO
#O4 % FER. AT 12710 FT. TRY TESTING HhﬁTN :

w05 LEARING, RELEASE QUT 0OF PER. POOH WS 0
RARTCEY TRG. ETC. AlLL SEALS GONE OFF SEAL SSSEMEL
#0O7# LIF NER SEAL ASSEMBLY . START RIH. ’Hhhu




ETATE:
FIELD:

WELL:

l_LAREIL:

W MO, e
FIUOREMANM:
RIG:

AUTH. AMNT:
DATLY CosT:
CUM. CosTs
TYFE OF JowEs
ORJIECTIVE:

DATE (=) 2
FREZENT STATIIS:

ACTIVITY:
#O2
W#S%
#0g%
#OT4
0k
HO 7%
H NS
#0V3%
#1 0%

STAOTE:
FIELD:

WL

LAREL:
BN,
FOREMAM:
RiGs

AUTH. AMNT:
TATLY CO=Te
CLiM. CoST:
TYFE OF J0R:
ORIECTIVE:

TATE (=)
FRESENT =TATLE

ACTIVITY:
£
HO5
#04%
EINIE

e

UTAH
ALTAMONT

BROTHERSON 2~2R4

Wil 17

21 AQ00

212520

Bo - a e
nbal £l

NEW WELL
COMPLET ION

J=17-53
MADE SWHAR RUNS,

CONT. RIH W/ PROD. TEG, LATCH BACK INTO FER. aT
12710 FT. TRY TO FRESS UF ON TEG ETC. TO 4500 LBES
HELD. REMOVE BOP. INSTALL AND TEST 1OGOO LB, X-MAS
TREE. RIG UP DELSCO. RIH AND ENOCK FLUG OUT OF PER
RIG DOWN DELSCO, HOOE UF AND TRY To FLOW WELL.

NOT FLOWING. HOOE LUF AND TRY FLUMFING INTO WELL,
FREZSURE UF TO 4000 LES. RIG DELECO BACK UF. RIM
ANIN MADE SURE FPLUG GONE. RIG DOWN DELSCO, MOk
WELL UP TO PIT. RIG UF SWAR EQUTF, MADE 2 SWAR
RUNS, =00,

UTAH
AL TAMONT

BROTHERSON 2-2E4

Seaiel

Fale LAROSE
Wil 17
ALAQOD
ERT L 00
S4T7E0,07
NEW WELIL.
COMPLET TON

4-15-24
FREFARE TO DO ACID J0R

CHECE WELL FOR PRESS. 13200 LEBES. OPEN TO PIT.
DIED IN 20 MIN. RIG UP AND SWAR ON WELLL. SHAR
DOWN TO 2000 FT, CONT. TO SWAR WAITING 1 HR. BE-
TWEEN RLUNEZ. A% DRDERED BY SHELL. MADRE 15 RLUNS.
RETLURNE QIL AND GAS CUT. FLUID LEVEL aT 2000 FT.
CLOZE WELL IM. PREFARE FOR ACID 0B, SI0ON,




STATE:
FIELD:

WELL®

AL

WO MO, s
FOREMAN:
RIG:

AUTH. AMNT:
DATLY C0sT:
ClM, C0OsTs
TYFE OF J0E:
QEJECTIVE:

DATE(S) &
FRESENT STATUS:

ACTIVITY:
HOE %
O
#1438
#O5 R
O
#0735
#OE
O
31 0t
w11

18w

STATE:
FIELD:

WELL:

LLAREL ®

WO ML,
FOREMAN:
RIGe

ALITH., AMNT:
TATILY DOsT:
CiiM. COETe
TYRE OF JI0E:
QRJIECTIVE:

DATE(S)
FRESENT STATLES:

ACTIVITY:
0P
HOE

W R

UTAH
AL TAMONT

BROTHERSON Z-2E4

)

o, LAROSE
Wil 17
21LAOO0

BRTT77 & 128X
SE210

NEW WELL
COMPLETION

4=-19 & 4-30
FUT WELL ON PROCUCT TON

A-19-24  CHECK WELL FOR PRESS. O MADE 1 SWAR RUN

CHECKH FLUID LEVEL. 2000 FT. HANG BACK SWAER. HELE
NOWSCD RIG WP, ACIDIZE WELL A% PER PROG. RIS DOWN
NOWSCO. WELL HAD 5100 LBRS. RIG UF OWE., FUON R.A.
LOG. POB.TWDL 14397 FT. TO 12700 FT. RIG DOWN OWE
CLOSE WELL IN FOR NIGHT. PREPARE T FLOW WELL TO
FIT 4-20. SDON.

4-20-24 CHECK FRESS ON WELL. OFEN TO PIT TO CLEAN
LF. WELL HAD 2400 LES. CATCH SAMPLES. HOOE WELL
INTO FLOWLINE. OFEN TO TANKES. WATDH WELL. CLEAN ON
EQUIF. TURN WELL OVER TO FUMPEFR. SO0,

421 & A-22 NO O WORK,

LTAaH
AL TAMONT

BROTHERSON 2-2B4

POLLE, 40
MEW WELL
COMPLETION

4-—2n=-2

MOVE RIG T 1-2R4

WAIT ON OROERS FROM SHELL. CLEAN AND HEPQIR.EQQIP
LAY DUWN RIG. GET EQUIPMEMT LOADRED AND EE&DV_TQ
MOVE ., CLEAN UP LOCATION. CHECK WITH SHELL. MOVE

RIG T 1-384, LINE UP TRUCES TO MOVE. SDON




/
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e
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x
u

TELEL L HO
NEW WELL
COMPLET TON

COMPLETE REMATNDER 0F
TG DOWN gl

1-ER4g FeEEA. RIGOUR RIG AN
COULDNT GET DOWN HOLE W/ IN- TG,
L RIG DOWN OWE, OFER
R

SONT,
ANLH M

RIGUF QWP
BRIDGE FLLG
FINT

TO TANE BATTERY
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4247 State Otfice B

yilding:Salt Lake City, Ui. 84114.8 801-533-572% - .- -
T

MONTHLY_OIL_ AND GAS PRODUCTION REP

UTEX OIL CO.

Operator name and address

Yo SHECLWESTERN E&FORT.
PQ Box ~""" R B Wfﬂj@f m& 4 Utah Account No. e
HOUSTON TX 77001 4 /’ﬁ 7 Report Period Month/Year) 8 / 8b
ATTN: P.T. KENT, OIL ACCT. ; : I
Amended ReportD
Well Name _ / .. Producing | Days | Production Volume
AP! Number Entity Location { Zone Oper { Oil (BBL) Gas MSCHE Water (BBL)
MILES 1-35AkL / . I
4301330029 01965 018 oLw 35 WSTC 22 1 /é??
A o tad TRy
T .
><b301330038 01970 025 Olv\rl;_.jm e SR WL 1 | B — !__ S
013308 otho 028 ouwWw 2 | WSTC N LI

h301330128 osuzx
ST S0N 1-2 38! R /-
4301330483 08423 025 OkW 23 | WSTC
BLOrT 33-L y

303715866 08425 LOS *23E 4 PRDX

el 20 0) S DD K >

v th%m uu:—A«
}ﬁﬂv | AMx ﬂ(¥ PH%‘ C?y

|/ 15¢| ’

o e e o
“-‘/?"-"’fm{)‘ Pt it 4/7522//

TOTAL

Y I540 & /S160| 22507

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

| have reviewed this report and certify the information 10 be accuraie and complete. Date




Form OGC-1b

2k TE OF UTAH
DEPARTME F NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATL®

(Ot nstructions on
erse side)

0. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL XO.

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS

{Do not use this form for g’muh to drill or to deepen or plu

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

. Use “AP ATION FOR PERMIT—" for suc N/A
. ) QG0 e 7. UNIT AQREEMBNT NikS
?vx:x.x. wrLL oTHER MAY & & 15 N/A
2. NAME OF OFERATOR 8. FARM OR LBASE NAMB
UTEX OIL COMPANY s T Brotherson
3. ADDRESS OF OFERATOR R 9. 'WELL X0,
1245 E. Brickyard Rd., Ste. 600, Salt Lake City, Utah 84106 2-2B4
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location cleariy and in accordance with any State requirements.® 10. FIELD AND FOOL, OR WILDCAT
Bee also space 17 below.)
At surface . Altamont
1,371" FSL  1,498' FWL 11. auc, 1., B, ., Ok LK. AND
SURYRY OX ARBA
Sec. 2, T2S, R4W, USM
14, PERMIT NO. ] 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether b7, .,;m ote.) 12, COUNTY OR PaRISH| 18. sTaATE
43-013-30855 6,240' GL Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:

PULL OX ALTER CASING - WATER SHUT-OFF

MULTIPLE COMPLETE

TEST WATER BRUT-OFF

FRACTURE TREAT YRACTURE TREATMENT
S8HOUTING OR ACIDIZING

(Other)

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON?®

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS

SUBSBQUENT EEPORT OF:

KEFAIRING WELL
ALTERING CABING
ABANDONMENT®

(Other)

Install Hydraulic Pump

(Notz : Report results of multiple completion oo Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log farm.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detalls, snd glve pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true verticai depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) ¢

Utex plans to install a hydraulic pump in the above well.
This work will be performed pending partner approval.

(
74 // £ Vi
18. I hereby urWZg’W& azd correct
SIGNED ‘ . y o v = i TITLE Geol Ogi st DATE 5/2] /86

(This space for Federal or State office u‘e)

APPROVED BY
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

TTLE — —— APPROVED BYATHE-STATE——
OF UTAH DIVISION OF
L, GAS, AND MINING

*See Instructions on Rev

S S-22-8L

L e
S~



Form OGC.ib

STATE OF UTAH

MUT IN TRIPLICATE S % & A ON7 87
{Other instriclions on @ JN 9 Y

reverse sile)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DlVlSlON OF O'L, GAS, AND MlN'NG S. LEASE DERIONATION ANO SERIAL NO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS

(Do not use this form for %’{.’f&"“' to drill or to deepen or plug

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NaME

ON WELLS

back to a different reservolir.

Use “AP ATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposais.)
L 7. UNIT AGAEEMBNT NaME
oI uas
waLL wEBLL oTHER
3. NAME OF OPERLATOR §. PARM OR LBASE NAMS
ANR Limited Inc.
3. ADDARES OF OPIRATOR NNY s . .| 9. WBLL NO.
P. 0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201—% YR Z 7£¢
4. LocaTiON OF WELL (Report location ciearly and In accordance with ao 3 Guirementa.® 11 10, PIZLD AKD FOOL, OR WILDCaT

See also space 17 Delow.)
At surface

See attached list

11, asc., T, &, M., O% BLX. AXKD
SURVEY OR AR84

DEC 31 1986

14, rERMIT NO.

Y3-0/3 30855

15, BLEvATIONS (Show whether 07, 8T, OR, ots.)

DIVISION OF

1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION T0: ’ SUBSEQUENT i'”l‘l or:
TEST WATER SEUT-OYY PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OPP . REPAIRING WELL E
PRACTURE TREAT . MULTIPLE COMPLETE ' FRACTURE TREBATMENT ALTRRING CASING
S3HOOT AR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
AEPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANR (Other) {
(Other) —Change Operator E} }":'-::?ptl;t&flp::‘R?c'o‘:::leotfln:‘g:‘ppol:t?ﬁp&téog»r‘:.)w.u

17. DESCRIBE FRNENSKED AR CUMIPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly dtate nll pertinent detalis. snd give pertinent datey, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurfaee locations and measured and triue vertical depths for sil markers and zones perti-

nens w this work.) *

ANR Limited has been elected succes

sor Operator.to Utex 0il Company

on the o0il wells described on the attached Exhibit A",

18. 1 hereby/certify that the foregoing is true and correct -
* \

o K S —

\\
BIGNED —-

.~ - . ; ,
"-’1:’77 ")\/Zﬂ-/ //’I/M N DATE /-7/_? d/?&'

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APPTAVED BY . TITLE
Cllivias. '3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



Form OGC-1b sUBMURE TRIPLICATL-

STATE OF UTAH (00";‘-;};:':;":1""> on 032 118 PO l,b

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

D'V'S'ON oF O'L' GAs' AND M'N'NG S. LEASE DERIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
Fee
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTSS OR TRINE NaM8
Do SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
(Do not use this form fo } 111 to ¢
" S SXRBLRNION FOR Fem DIy s Mek i,y elerat reservete
i, . 7. UNIT sCAKEMSNT NaME
o, !3 oAl
L 2122 waLy OTEER
3. NiME OF OPBALTOR ) "8, FARM OR LBASE WAMS
ANR Limited Brotherson
3. ADDARES OF OPSALTOR §. WBLL NO.
P.0. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 2-2B4
4. gﬁtﬁigﬂ'::e::lib a:xlg?ﬁ" location clearly and io sccordance with aay Stats requiremests.® 10. PISLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
At surtace Al tamont
1371' FSL & 1498' FWL, Section 2 N avar o uasa 4
NE/4 SW/4 Sec. 2
T2S—-R4W
34, PERAMI? ¥O. 18, SLEVATIONS (Show whethet OF, &7, O, st} 12. COUNTY OB PakisM| 13, 8T4T3
Ll.s O |3 . 3085'5 6240' GR Duchesne Utah
is. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
XOTICH OF INTEXTION T0: SUBSEQUENT RBPOAT OF:
TEST WATEE SRUT-OF? PULL OR ALTER CASING : WATER BRUTOFP RBFAIRING WELL
PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE | | PRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING
SKHOOT Na ACIDIZE ABANDON® SROUTING OR ACIDISING ABANUONMENT®
RCTPAIR WBLL ] CHISANGE PLANA (Other) " ” Tor Tens o Weil
: completion o [ !
(Other) ' ! :"::::rr:v:(I’vfup‘on:tkm::u::leoﬂo:ukep%:t lndﬂbog form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROUNEED OK CUMILETED UPERATIONS (Cleariy state nil pertinent detalls. and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
prowud“\vwk. bll well is directionally drilied, give subsurface locations and meesured and true vertical depths for ail markers and zones perti-
nent o this work,) *

1. Perforated Wasatch 10,940'-11,697' w/3 SPF, total of 186 holes (4/7/87).

2, Acidized Wasatch 10,940'-12,623' w/24,000 gal 15% HCL w/additives and 822 ball
sealers (4/9/87).

G

IS T 44907

DIVISION OF OlL
GAS & MNING

18. 1 hereby certify t/ihe toregoing 18 and co ~
SIGNED errex __Sr. Production Engineer pary _ 8/11/87

e L. GUln
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPRAVED BY TITLE DATE
Cliwias. *8 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



. ’ DOGM 56-64-21
-~ H . an equal opportunity empioyer
fi ’ .
NATURAL RESOURCE!
O1l, Gos & Minng

gi?{;V::elsztogd'o.r}go:?g%lfssio}'nad Center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut Page 10 of 10
i
MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT
Operator name and address:
®ANR LIMITED INC./COASTAL Utah Account No. NO235
P 0 BOX 749
DENVER co 80201 0749 Report Period (Month/Year) 11 / 817
ATTN: RANDY WAHL
Amended ReportD
5;3‘;Well_:;jiuan§e Producing | Days | Production Volume
| AP} Number VEntlty Location | Zone Oper | Oil (BBL} Gas_(MSCF) Water (BBL!

BROTHERSOI

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

| wsTe

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

WSTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

..nmmﬁ" a-oa.. s

i | e reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

Q"W:"'

. S

Telephone

Authorized signature

-

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK INK



o o

ANR Production Company

a subsidiary of The Coastal Corporation

)
2!
(S

b

i}

R ROy ' | ¢12712

. Yt e . ql '
JAN 25 1988 by

' - DAV oON OF
f Gk, GAS & MINING January 19, 1988

Natural Resources

0il, Gas & Mining

3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Attention: Ms. Lisha Romero ' H0935

This letter includes the informatigp/igu requested on January 12,
1988 concerning the recent merger of ANR'Limited, Inc. into ANR

NolT75 «Production Company. Effective December 31, 1987 {December, 1987
Production), ANR Limited, Inc. merged into ANR Production Company; and
henceforth, will continue operations as ANR Production Company.

ANR Production Company will begin reporting and remitting the Utah
Conservation and Occupation Taxes effective December, 1987 production
for leases previously reported by ANR Limited, Inc. (Utah Account No.
N-7245). ANR Production Company will use the new Utah Account No.
N-0675, as assigned by the State of Utah.

Please contact me at (713) 877-6167 if I can answer any questions
on this matter.

o He Very tfu]y yours,
et ws L
mgw[:zl';:d wells l15/cA 5 f AJ
A:i wccovnt - 1./2_%2——
vader TS e Roder W. Sparks
/-2 Manager, Crude Revenue Accounting
cC:AwS
CTE:mmw ~——
Lisha peblesm w3

’
doa} s€€
’.::E o:,v-( o Ccffiﬂr/mé ;:(
J ceuld check o0 Hhe o./n“ .
5‘?:‘.4;}' he Adnd Sk fas
fadd“:‘fj«{- fhitr Ac/;( :;a/
) oa
pond 15 €t Lor
ond 115 Jub}/dmr;:l
[aY ’ . ‘
Ko 6,14.'1" Ao bor €N
ACLLsSaly s D'T5 /- 26- 4%
Coastal Tower! Nine Greenway Plaza, Houston, Texas 77046-0995 ¢ (713) 877-1400



Form 0GC-1b SUBMIT 1N TRIPLICATES

Oth, Ltriecdions on
s’?: OF UTAH ¢ et on
DEPARTMENT UF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING LEASE DERIORATION LMD SERIAL WO.
Patented
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OL TRINE NaMB
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPOR
(Do net use this form for propossis to drill or to deepen ort
Use "A’;JgATXON FOR PERMIT="
b 9y . “f. UNIT 40RESNMBNT NAME
o m [ 1]
ety waLL oTRSS
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ANR Production Company 0L, GAS & MINING protherson
T a0Riss oF OPBALTOR %. ¥8LL ¥O,
P.0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 2-2B4
'y T (K Tocation clearly and (8 r) ) ] 3 10, Fi8L0 aND POOL, O WILDCAT
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43-013-30855 6240' GL Duchesne Utah
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ANR Production Company proposes to convert the above-referenced
well from gas 1ift to hydraulic pump to reduce lifting costs & to
increase production.
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Form .5:62;5 UNITED STATES ‘ FORM APPROVED s
; 5 i
june 13 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR L e e 30
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT | 5. Lease Uesignanom ana Sersi No.
! TFee
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ~ T T Allotee or inbe Name
o not use this farm tor broposais to ariit or 1o cxeeoen Oor reentry 10 a aifferent reservolr.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for sucn proposais | N/A
%— — -
7. i Cant A, fetmeEt UCI1SDAtion
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE e
_'pcqul wew CA #9635
XNt w3 Other o ' 3. Weill Name ang No.
-- Name or Uoerator ‘ |___Brotherson {#2-2B4
ANR Production Company ['9.” API Well No. _
3. Aadress ang iciconone o, P | 43-013-30855
P. 0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 [10. Fieid ana Poot. or Explorascy Area
* Locauon o1 well IFoouge. sec.. T.. R.. M.. or Survey Uescnonont L Altamont
1371" FSL & 1498' FWL (NESW) 11. County or Parsh, Suza

Section 2, T2S-R4W
Duchesne County, Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE Z0X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE QF SUBMISSION . TYPE OF ACTION
l Nouce o1 Intenz l_: Abanaonment D Change o1 Plans
f— D Recomocenon D New Consoucnon
'— Subsequen: Repon D Plurgmg Back D Non-Routios Fracmney
Caung Repar . G Weter Shut-Off
DFinﬂAb&mNm UN'IB-CIHIB Dwntﬂ'-—
Ower Off~Site Storage [ Dispose water
(Note: Repon o wett
C LA a ans Log jerm.)
13. D Proposea or L Oma(:lummmmm.mmmmmmmmmmmmm-“Wim‘wu

give JUDSuUrace 10cauons ammlmmwﬂmdm for an MArKers ang Iones peranent ta QUS wWork. 1®

The above-referenced well was completed 5/29/84. All production from this well is measured,
stored and sold off the Brotherson #1-11B4 location in Section 11, T2S-R4W. These two
wells are not commingled at this time.

Signed 7 L mte __Regulatory Analyst oue 2/3/91
This 1or Federtl or dtate OIfice uses /—' == —— e
App ov - Tide Das
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FORM 9 TATE OF UTAH .
’ DIVISIO OIL, GAS AND MINING
Fs‘.@a Designation and Serial Number:
See Attached
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached
Do not use this form for proposals to drilt new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See Attached
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:
olL aas [ | oTHER: See Attached
2. Name of Operator: 9. API Well Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 5734455 See Attached
4. Location of Well
Footages: See Attached County: See Attached
QQ, Sec, T, R, M.: See Attached State: Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
[ ] Abandon ] New Construction [] Abandon * [T—] New Construction
[] Repair Casing ["] Puil or Alter Casing [] Repair Casing [1 Putt or Alter Casing
[] Change of Plans [ Recompletion "] Change of Plans ] Perforate
[] Convertto Injection [] Perforate [ ] Convertto Injection ] Ventor Flare
[] Fracture Treat or Acidize [] Ventor Flare [ ] Fracture Treat or Acidize [] Water Shut—-Off
[ Muiltiple Completion [] Water Shut-Off [XT] Other Change of Operator
[] Cther
Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, glve subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995, ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
assumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being
provided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond

- #U605382-9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11—40—66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

=

. '
Bonnie Carson, Sr. Environmental & Safety Analyst :

M

ANR Production Company .-V OF GiL, GAS & MINIIN‘:"S
13, Sheila Bremer =
Environmental & Safety Analyst
Name & Signature: \éﬁa’/&_}m Tite: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Date: 03/07/96
(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Co‘astal Oil & Gas Corp.

03/07/96 -- Page 1 of 4

, If Indian, LOCATION OF WELL __
Lease Designation Allottee or - Section, Township L
Well Name & No. AP No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages & Range Field County
Evans Ute 2-17B3 43-013-31056 Fee h2al, Ute 96104 1701'FSL & 1474' FWL  [NWSW, 17-2S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Miles 1-35A4 43-013-30029 Fee L5 N/A 9618 1980' FNL & 1980' FEL  |SWNE, 35-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Miles 2-35A4 43-013-31087 Fee yina N/A 9618 802' FWL & 1530 FSL NWSW, 35-18-4W | Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-11B4 43-013-31078 Fee 4] N/A 9623 944’ FSL & 1643' FWL SESW, 11-28-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-2B4 43-013-30062 Fee 570 N/A 9635 1478' FNL & 1459' FEL  |SWNE, 2-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-2B4 43-013-30855 Fee 39720 N/A 9635 1371' FSL & 1498 FWL  [NESW, 2-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Broadhead 1-21B6 43-013-30100 Patented 595 N/A 9639 540" FNL & 2610' FEL NWNE, 21-2S-6W Altamont | Duchesne
Ute Brotherson 2-34A4 43-013-30978 Fee 16D N/A 9640 663' FWL & 1626' FSL NWSW, 34-1S-4W | Altamont | Duchesne
Rust 2-36A4 43-013-31092 Fee 1977 N/A 9642 15616 FWL & 1955 FSL.  INESW, 36-15-4W Altamont | Duchesne
‘|Babcock 1-12B4 43-013-30104 Patented . [{,3p Ute 9643 2248 FNL & 1000' FEL  [SENE, 12-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Babcock 2-12B4 43-013-31005 Fee JOAI5 N/A 9643 502' FWL & 503' FSL SWSW, 12-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-9B4 43-013-30118 Patented " [lo/pn N/A 9645 1444' FNL & 700' FEL SENE, 9-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-9B4 43-013-31138 Fee TN/ N/A 9645 2976' FNL & 2543' FWL  [NESW, 9-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Burton 2-15B5 43-013-31044 Fee o210 N/A 9646 718' FWL & 1604' FSL NWSW, 15-2S-5W | Altamont | Duchesne
Tew 2-10B5 43-013-31125 Fee 75/ N/A 9654 851' FWL & 729' FSL SWSW, 10-2S-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Goodrich 1-2B3 43-013-30182 Patented 1945 N/A 9655 2347' FSL & 1514' FEL  |[NWSE, 2-2S5-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Goodrich 2-2B3 43-013-31246 Fee 1le37 N/A 9655 678 FNL & 2235' FWL NENW, 2-25-3w Bluebell | Duchesne
Robb 2-29B5 43-013-31130 Fee JoY 5t N/A 9656 2214' FWL & 1037' FSL  [SESW, 29-25-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-16B4 43-013-30192 Patented NREL Ute 9659 1301' FNL & 1101 FEL _ INENE, 16-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-16B4 43-013-31046 Fee o117 N/A 9659 1075' FWL & 1439' FSL  [NWSW, 16-254W | Altamont | Duchesne
Lake Fork 2-13B4 43-013-31134 Fee oY A N/A 9660 963' FWL & 819' FSL SWSW, 13-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Jessen 2-21A4 43-013-31256 Fee [IDA N/A 9661 702' FSL & 2182' FWL SESW, 21-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Jenkins 1-1B3 43-013-30175 Patented 179 N/A 9670 1807' FNL & 1888' FWL  [SENW, 1-2S-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Jenkins 2-1B3 43-013-31117 Fee 1792 N/A 9670 803' FWL & 662' FSL SWSW, 1-28-3wW Bluebell | Duchesne
Birch-3-27B5 43-013-31126 Fee I'7873 N/A 9671 979' FWL & 1151' FSL SWSWw, 27-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Lazy K 2-11B3 43-013-31352 Fes  []2h R N/A 9672 503' FNL & 2017' FEL NWNE, 11-28-3wW Bluebell | Duchesne
Rudy 1-11B3 43-013-30204 Patented /S A0 N/A 9672 2111' FSL & 2483' FEL NWSE, 11-28-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-24B4 43-013-30229 Fee [$65 N/A 9674 1445 FNL & 1894' FEL  |[SWNE, 24-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 3-23B4 43-013-31289 Fee 1114} N/A —20F—= 1177 FSL & 1112’ FWL  |[SWSW, 23-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne |
Evans 1-19B3 43-013-30265 Fee (770 N/A 9678 1256' FNL & 893' FEL NENE, 19-28-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Jenkins 2-12B3 43-013-31121 Fee 1459 N/A 9679 1623' FNL & 1047' FEL  [SENE, 12-25-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Bleazard 2-28B4 43-013-31304 Fee 11433 N/A 9681 1580' FSL & 2335' FWL  |[NESW, 28-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lamicg 2-56B2 43-013-30784 Fee AB0R N/A 9683 1963' FWL & 803' FSL SESW, 5-28-2wW Bluebell | Duchesne
C.R. Aimes 1-23A4 43-013-30375 Fee 5675 Ute 9C133 704' FEL & 1515' FNL SENE, 23-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Chandler 1-5B4 43-013-30140 [4,,v. 419, Patented [6%5 Ute NW580 2120' FNL & 1553' FEL  |[SWNE, 5-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Chandler 2-5B4 43-013-31000 [ © v Fee I1op75 Ute NW580 466' FSL & 1180' FWL SWSW, 5-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Monsen 2-27A3 43-013-31104- . Fee 1795 N/A NW581 1801' FWL & 2008' FSL  |NESW, 27-1S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Monsen 3-27A3 43-013-31401 . Fee 11,9/, N/A NW581 850' FNL & 1520' FWL NENW, 27-18-3wW Altamont | Duchesne
Ute Smith 1-30B5 43-013-30521 Fee [950 Ute UT08014987C696 |1890' FSL & 624' FEL NESE, 30-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Bleazard 1-18B4 43-013-30059 Patented  [5[,H N/A N/A 1923' FNL & 2314' FEL  [SWNE, 18-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Bleazard 2-18B4 43-013-31025 Fee 1504, N/A N/A 857' FWL & 861' FSL SWSW, 18-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Bodero 1-15B3 43-013-30565 Fee 230 N/A N/A 1370'FNL & 1679' FWL  |SENW, 15-2S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Broadhead 2-32B5 43-013-31036 Fee 1021 N/A N/A 1686' FWL & 1116' FSL  [SESW, 32-2S-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-10B4 43-013-30110 Patented [l]q N/A N/A 2037' FNL & 2052' FEL  [SWNE, 10-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-14B4 43-013-30051 Patented 1535 N/A N/A 2100' FNL & 750' FEL SENE, 14-2S-4W Altamont { Duchesne
Brotherson 1-22B4 43-013-30227 Fee 17780 N/A N/A 1642' FNL & 1297' FEL  |SENE, 22-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-23B4R 43-013-30483 Patented %425 N/A-. N/A 747' FNL & 2380' FEL NWNE, 23-28-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-26B4 43-013-30336 Patented 1956 N/A N/A 1272'FNL & 1408' FEL  INWNE, 26-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 1-28A4 43-013-30292 Patented [2Y) N/A N/A 751" FNL & 1130' FEL Altamont | Duchesne

R;’j'i'."}_?:ﬁ 2
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
uT-922

April 11, 1996
Memorandum
TO: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency, Ft. Duchesne, Utah
FROM: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals, BLM, Utah State Office, Salt Lake City, Utah

SUBJECT:  Successor of Operator, Communitization Agreement's (CA) 96-000018, 96-
000023, 96-000035, 96-000039, 96-000040, 96-000042, 96-000043, 96-000045,
96-000046, 96-000049, 96-000054, 96-000055, 96-000056, 96-000059, 96-
000060, 96-000061, 96-000070, 96-000071, 96-000072, 96-000074, 96-000078,
96-000079, 96-000081, 96-000085, 96-000104, 9C-000126, 9C-000133, 9C-
000138, 9C-000140, UT080149-87C696, UT70814, UTU73743 and UTU73964,
Duchesne and Uintah Countles Utah

The enclosed Designation of Successor of Operators for CA’s 96-000018, 96-000023,
96-000035, 96-000039, 96-000040, 96-000042, 96-000043, 96-000045, 96-000046,
96-000049, 96-000054, 96-000055, 96-000056, 96-000059, 96-000060, 96-000061,
96-000070, 96-000071, 96-000072, 96-000074, 96-000078, 96-000079, 96-000081,
96-000085, 96-000104, 9C-000126, 9C-000133, 9C-000138, 9C-000140, UT080149- 87C696,
UT70814, UTU73743 and UTU73964, Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, have been
reviewed by this office and found to be acceptable and we recommend approval. The new
- operator will be Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. Upon approval of these Successor of
Operators, please return one copy to this office.

If you have any questions, please contact Teresa Thompson at (801) 539-4047.

Enclosures

bce: GexeSSRS0
CA'’s (33)
DM - Vernal
{Division: Oil;;Gas & Mining
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid Chron




v * Sorm 3160-5
(June-1990)

UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS . :';?:-;m T T
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. '
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT ~-" for such proposals N/A
7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well CA #9635
Qil Gas 8. Wel a .

Vo L1885 [ow Brotherson  2-284

2. Name of Operator

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

3. Address and Telephone No.

P.0. box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749

(303) 573-4455

9. API Well No.

43-013-30855

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R.,, M.,

1371" FSL & 1498° FWL
NESW Section 2-T2S-R4W

or Survey Description)

10. Field and Pool, or exploratory Area

Altamont

11. County or Parish, State

Duchesne County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
m Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion New Construction
D Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

D Final Abandonment Notice

R

Altering Casing

X| omer Acdz & Install Elec. Pump D Dispose Water
(Note: Repott results of nmltiple completion an Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pettinent to this work.)*

Conversion to Injection

LI

Please see the attached workover procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

I%E ENVE

JUL 0 3 1996

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MiNING

oo J/1/96

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Sign a M Tite ENviropmental & Safety Analyst
7 2 Ly z

(This space for Federal of htats#

Approved by /
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements
or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

* See Instruction on Reverse Side




BROTHERSON #2-2B4 WORKOVER PROCEDURE’

(INSTALL ESP)

Section 2 T2S R4W
Altamont / Bluebeil Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Date: 5-14-96
- WELL DATA )
Location: 1,498' FWL & 1,371' FSL of Section 2
Elevation: 6,240' GL & 6,264' KB _ -
- Total Depth: 14,450 PBTD: 12,654’ —_
Casing: . 13-3/8" @ 298
_ 9-5/8" 36# K-55 ST&C @ 6,496'
— - © 7" 26# & 2%# S-95LT&C @ 11,256
- 5" 18# N-80 & S-95 SFJ-P LINER from 11,021 to 14,450’
Tubing: 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 1J-Nulock & 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 DSS-HT side string
Current Lift: Dual String Hydraulic Pump w/ TAC @ 10,783". Pump Cavity @ 10,459
CASING & TUBULAR DATA -
- Capacity Burst Collapse
N Description Interval D Drift (BIF) (PS) (PS})
= m————
9-5/8" 36# K-55 ST&C 0- 6,496° 8.921" 8.765" 0.0773 -3,520 2,020
_7"26#8-95LT&C 0- 7991 6.276" 6.151" 0.0382 8,600 7,800
7" 29# S-95 LT&C 7.991"- 8501 6.184" 6.059" 0.0371 9,690 9,200 _
7" DV-TOOL 7.991' - 8,504 )
7" 29# S-95 LT&C 8,504'- 11,256' 6.184" 6.059" 0.0371 9,690 9,200
- 5" 18# N-80 SFJP 11,021' - 13,911" 4.276" 4.151" 0.0177 10,140 10,500
5" 18# S-95 SFJP 13,911'- 14450° 4.276" 4.151"  0.0177 12,040 12,030
 3-1/2" 9.3 #P-110 EUE — 2.892" 2.867° 0.00870 13,970 13,530
2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 EUE 2.441"  2.347" 0.00579 10,570 11,170
PROCEDURE -

NOTE: USE ONLY CLEAN FRESH WATER. DO NOT USE PRODUCED WATER FROM ANY
SOURCE DURING THIS WORKOVER,

1. MIRU completion rig. MIRU slickline company. Punch standing valve and retrieve. ND wellhead &
NU BOPE. TOH & LD 2-3/8" tubing side string. TOH w/ 2-7/8" tubing, hydraulic BHA and TAC.

2. TIH w/ 6" drag bit and casing scraper (7" 29# casing) to clean out 7" casing down to 5" liner top @
11,021". TOH w/ BHA.



3. TIHw/4-1/8" drag bit, casing scraper (5" 18# casing), 2-3/8" and 2-7/8" tubing to clean out 5" casing
from 11,021' to PBTD @ 12,654'. TOH w/ BHA.

4.  TIH w/ 7" retrievable packer and 3-1/2" 9.3 # P-110 tubing. Set packer @ +/-10,760'. Nearest perf
@ 10,940

5. MIRU Doweli and acid stimulate Wasatch intervais (10,940' to 12,623") total of 411 holes as shown
- below. Heat ail fluids to 150 F except bleach. Apply 1,000 psig on annulus while pumping

down tubing.
— = = .—_——._
Fluid _ | Volume Volume Special Rate
Description (Gals) (Bbl’s) _ Additives Q_iverters (BPM)
Pad | 4200 100 Scale Inhibitor 20-30 | 9,000 psig
Scale inhibitor -
- & Micellar 600 BS
15% HCL Acid 4,000 a5 Solvent 1.1 8.G. 20-30 9,000 psig
Gelled Water 1,000 24 _ 20-30 | 9,000 psig
- Bleach 1,000 24 — 20-30 | 9,000 psig
_ Gelled Water | 1,000 24 20-30 | 9,000 psig
Scale Inhibitor _
- & Micellar 600 BS
| 15% HCL Acid 4,000 95 Solvent 1.1S.G. 20-30 9,000 psig
- — — 0.5ppg RS
Gelled Water 1,000 24 0.5 ppg BAF 20-30 9,000 psig
Bleach 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psig
Gelled Water 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psig
- Scale Inhibitor
& Micellar 600 BS .
15% HCL Acid -| 4,000 95 Solvent _ 1.18.G. 20-30 9,000 psig
Flush -
(Btm Perf) 5,700 136 20-30 | 9,000 psig
- - Totals 23,700 565

6. RU swab equipment and swab back acid job until pH is above 7. Do not place the ESP in hole with
a low pH. Monitor well flow back as required.

7. Release 7" packer and TOH w/ 3-1/2" tubing string.

8. RU spooler and TIH w/ ESP, 2-7/8" tubing and cable as follows: FBHP sensor, motor, seal section,
pump intake gas seperator, pump, cable and tubing. Set ESP @ 10,900’ and place well on production.



BROTHERSON #2-2B4
WELLBORE SCHEMATIC
- SECTION 2 T2S R4W
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
DATE: 5-15-96

9-5/8" 36# K-55 ST&C @ 6,496’ A ;

— - 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 IJ-NULOCK TUBING

2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 IJ-NULOCK TUBING
SIDE STRING.

DUAL HYDRAULIC PUMP CAVITY @
L., 10,459

><] 5<] 7 B-2TAC @ 10783

TOP OF 5" LINER @ 11,021 N B

WASATCH PRODUCING INTERVAL
(10,940°- 12,623') W/ 411 PERFS

7" 26# & 29# S-95 LT&C @ 11,256' A

MTS "B" RETRIEVABLE BP @ 12,668’
W/ SAND ON TOP AND JUNK

CONSISTING OF"FGS" BP & CUT OFF 2-7/8" TUBING @ 12,704' W/
REAMANENTS OF PACKER PICKER TWO CIBP'S @ 12,704" & 12,708’
SET MTS "DB" PKR @ 12,710’ ON 5/84
-EE WASATCH PERFS (12,796' - 14,393") W/
PBTD @ 12,654' 303 HOLES ABANDONED ON 5/84
BTM OF 5" 18# N-80 & S-95 SFJP LINER /]~ N\

14,450'
e TD - 14,450
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‘J ITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum

DATE: August 16, 1996

REPLY TO
ATTN OF:

Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency

SUBJECT:
Designation of Successor Operator

TO:

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

We are in receipt of the Designations of Successor Operator for our approval whereby Coastal
Oil & Gas Corporation was designated as the new Operator for the Communization Agreements
(CA) listed on the attached sheet, Exhibit “A”.

The enclosed instruments were approved on the date of this lettef. Coastal’s Nationwide Bond
will be used to cover all operations, and plugging and abandonment of wells.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

( Qo oliConon

Enclosures
cc:

Theresa Thompson BLM/

RE@EWE

’ AUG 2 0 1996

DIV. OF QIL, GAS & MINING

OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)

GSA FPMR {41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114

* U.8.GP0:1990-0-262-081/20165




DESIGNATION OF SUCCESSOR OPERATOR
Communitization Agreement Numbers are listed on attached Exhibit “A”

Designation of successor Operator for communitized area, Counties of Uintah an
Duchesne, State of Utah, being: ’

(See attached Exhibit “A” for description of Communitization Agreements)

THIS INDENTURE, dated as of the 9th day of April, 1996, by and between
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, hereinafter designated as “First Party”, and the owners
of communitized working interests, hereinafter designated as “Second Parties”,

WHEREAS, under the provisions of the Act of February 25, 1920, 41 Stat. 437,
30 U.S.C. Secs. 181, et seq., as amended by the Act of August 8, 1946, 60 Stat. 950, a
Communitization Agreement for the above Communitized Area, effective (see attached
Exhibit “A”) wherein ANR Production Company is designated as Operator of the
communitized area; and

WHEREAS said, ANR Production Company has resigned as Operator, and the
designation of successor operator is now required pursuant to the terms thereon; and

WHEREAS the First Party has been and hereby is designated by Second Parties as ,

- Operator of the communitized area, and said First Party desires to assume all the rights,

duties and obligations of Operator under the said Communitization Agreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises hereinbefore set forth and
the promises hereinafter stated, the First Party hereby covenants and agrees to fulfill the
duties and assume the obligations of Operator of the communitized area under and pursuant
to all the terms of said Communitization Agreement, and the Second Parties covenants and
agree that, effective upon approval of this indenture by the Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals,
Bureau of Land Management, First Party shall be granted the exclusive right and privilege
of exercising any and all rights and privileges as Operator, pursuant to the terms and
conditions of said Communitization Agreement; and said Agreement being hereby
incorporated herein by referenced and made a part hereof as fully and effectively as though
said Agreement were expressly set forth in this instrument. :

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument as of the
date hereinabove set forth.

FIRST PARTY
COAST/AL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
o ‘;’—*'/
Byf ( \ . VW(//:L\ = 47/
C. E. Lindberg / '

Vice President



STATE OF COLORADO
)

COUNTY OF \ g vuen
The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me on the 9th day of April, 1996
by C. E. Lindberg, known to me to be the vice President of Coastal Qil & Gas Corporation,
a Delaware corporation, on behalf of said corporation
Given under my hand and official seal of office on this 9th day of April, 1996
- e (o sw\?é;i&x

£

Notary Public in and for the State of Colorado

iy,

My Commission Expires:
MY com N \ 4,
lJ]MISSmN EXPIRES: May 14, 19 ' SGR ANA/(‘\ S,
4 She 97 o co¥ecas T 5%,
Li Pperd Ave, #203p & o® RSP RA
ittleton, Colorade 80129 N & n O -+ ’.-"/1.; 3
A !
= o LAV N "‘;\(D?;
= g N =
E AR, T fE
225 9810, §
‘2~_ ,)‘)"'o 1 ‘. .$
‘4\'\ 3,08 Trap08e" n -2‘

%, C,(‘
(/L ﬂcy\«\) \\
ARty

|
}

i

The Designation of Successor Operator is hereby approved this 16th day of August, 1996, for the
Communitization Agreements listed on the attached sheet as Exhibit “A”.

Actmg Supemntendent

BIA - Uintah & Ouray Agency
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EXHIBIT "A" Page 1
Communitization Agreement , i
Well Name Well Location County State Number Description Acres Date
Evans Ute 2-17B3 NWSW, 17-25-3W [ Duchesne | Utah 96104 All Sec. 17-T2S-R3W 640.00 10/01/73
Miles 1-35A4 SWNE, 35-1S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9618 All Sec. 35-T1S-R4W 640.00 07/01/70
Miles 2-35A4 NWSW, 35-1S-4W | Duchesne | Utah 9618 All Sec. 35-T1S-R4W 640.00 07/01/70
Brotherson 2-11B4 SESW, 11-2S-4W Duchesne Utah 9623 All Sec. 11-T2S-R4W 640.00 09/01/70
Brotherson 2-2B4 NESW, 2-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9635 All Sec. 2-T2S-R4W 684.24 03/29771|
Brotherson 1-2B4 SWNE, 2-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9635 All Sec. 2-T2S-R4W 1684.24 03/29/71
Broadhead 1-21B6 NWNE, 21-2S-6W Duchesne | Utah 9639 All Sec. 21-T2S-R6W 640.00 10/21/71
Ute Tribal 2-21B6 SESE, 21-2S6W Duchesne | Utah 9639 Sec. 21-T2S-R6W 640.00 10/21/71
Ute 1-34A4 SWNE, 34-1S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9640 All Sec. 34-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/03/71
Ute Brotherson 2-34A4  |NWSW, 34-15-4W | Duchesne | Utah 9640 All Sec. 34-T1S-R4W 640.00 09/03/71]
Rust 2-36A4 NESW, 36-1S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9642 All Sec. 36-T1S-R4W 640.00 12/08/71
Ute 1-36A4 NENE, 36-1S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9642 All Sec. 36-T1S-R4W 640.00 12/08/72
Babcock 1-12B4 SENE, 12-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9643 All Sec. 12-T2S-R4W 640.00 | 02/22/72
Babcock 2-12B4 SWSW, 12-2S-4W | Duchesne | Utah 9643 All Sec. 12-T2S-R4W 640.00 02/22/72
Ellsworth 2-9B4 NESW, 9-25-4W Duchesne | Utah 9645 All Sec. 9-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/27/72
Ellsworth 1-9B4 SENE, 9-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9645 All Sec. 9-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/27/72
Burton 2-15B5 =~ |[NWSW, 15-25-5W | Duchesne | Utah 9646 All Sec. 15-T2S-R5EW  1640.00 05/30/72
Ue1-1B4 |SENE, 1-254W Duchesne | Utah 9649 All Sec. 1-T2S-R4W 688.00 05/15/72
Ute Jenks 2-1 1B4  INENW, 1-25-4W Duchesne | Utah 9649 All Sec. 1-T2S-R4W 688.00 05/15/72
Tew 2-10B5 |SWSW, 10-2S-5W | Duchesne | Utah 9654 All Sec. 10-T2S-R5W 640.00 09/26/72
Goodrich 1-2B3 NWSE, 2-25-3W | Duchesne | Utah 9655 All Sec. 2-T2S-R3W 1645.84 09/15/72
Goodrich 2-2B3 NENW, 2-25-3W | Duchesne | Utah 9655 All Sec. 2-T2S-R3W 1645.84 09/15/72
Robb 2-29B5 SESW, 29-2S-5W | Duchesne | Utah 9656 All Sec. 29-T2S-R5W 640.00 10/01/72]
Ellsworth 1-16B4 NENE, 16-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9659 All Sec. 16-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/04/72
lisworth 2-16B4 NWSW, 16-2S-4W | Duchesne | Utah 9659 All Sec. 16-T2S-R4W 640.00 10/04/72
Lake Fork 2-13B4 SWSW, 13-2S-4W | Duchesne | Utah 9660 All Sec. 13-T2S-R4W 640.00 | 10/26/72
Jessen 2-21A4 SESW, 21-1S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9661 All Sec. 21-T1S-R4W  |640.00 09/01/72
Jenkins 2-1B3 SWSW, 1-2S-3W Duchesne | Utah 9670 All Sec. 1-T2S-R3W 644.92 11/30/72
Jenkins 1-1B3 SENW, 1-2S-3W Duchesne | Utah 9670 All Sec. 1-T2S-R3W 644.92 11/30/72
Birch 3-27B5 SWSW, 27-2S-5W | Duchesne | Utah 9671 All Sec. 27-T2S-R5W 640.00 01/30/73
Lazy K2-11B3 NWNE, 11-2S-3W Duchesne | Utah 9672 All Sec. 11-T2S-R3W 640.00 01/30/73
Rudy 1-11B3 NWSE, 11-2S-3W Duchesne |  Utah 9672 All Sec. 11-T2S-R3W 640.00 01/30/73
Brotherson 1-24B4 SWNE, 24-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9674 All Sec. 24-T2S-R4W  [640.00 03/13/73
Evans 2-19B3 NESW, 19-2S-3W Duchesne | Utah 9678 All Sec. 19-T2S-R3W 632.66 01/22/73
. [Evans 1-19B3 NENE, 19-2S-3W Duchesne | Utah 9678 All Sec. 19-T2S-R3W 632.66 01/22/73
Ute 3-12B3 SWNW, 12-28-3W | Duchesne | Utah 9679 All Sec. 12-T2S-R3W 640.00 04/16/73




EXHIBIT "A" Page 2
Communitization Agreement
Effective
Well Name Well Location County State Number Description Acres Date
Jenkins 2-12B3 ISENE, 12-2S-3W Duchesne |~ Utah 9679 All Sec. 12-T2S-R3W 640.00 04/16/73
Bleazard 2-28B4 INESW, 28-2S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9681 All Sec. 28-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/15/73
Ute 1-28B4 SWNE, 28-25-4W Duchesne | Utah 9681 All Sec. 28-T2S-R4W 640.00 03/15/73
Murdock 2-34B5  INESW, 34-2S-5W | Duchesne | Utah 9685 All Sec. 34-T2S-R5W 640.00 02/12/73
Ute Tribal 10-13A4 ~ |NWNE, 13-15-4W Duchesne | Utah 9C-126 All Sec. 13-T1S-R4W 640.00 03/10/74
C.R. Aimes 1-23A4 SENE, 23-1S-4W Duchesne | Utah 9C133 All Sec. 23-T1S-R4W 640.00 03/01/74
Ute 1-8A1E _ _|SWNE, 8-1S-1E Uintah Utah 9C138 All Sec. 8-T1S-R1E 640.00 10/21/74
Ute2-3322 7 SWSW, 33-1N-2W | Duchesne | Utah 9C140 All Sec. 33-T1N-R2W 640.00 08/01/75
te Tribal 1-3322 ~ SWNE, 33-1N-2W Duchesne | Utah 9C140 All Sec. 33-TIN-R2W 640.00 08/01/75
jte Smith 1-30B5 NESE, 30-2S-5W Duchesne | Utah |UT08014987C696 |Ail Sec. 30-T2S-R5W 609.24 06/18/81
Myrin Ranch 2-18B83 NWSW, 18-25-3W | Duchesne | Utah UTU70814  |All Sec. 18-T2S-R3W 629.70 11/05/92
Ute Tribal 2-22B6 SESE, 22-2S-6W Duchesne | Utah UTU73743: |Sec. 22-T2S-R6W 640.00 09/06/94
Ute 1-15B6 " INWSW, 15-256W | Duchesne | Utah UTU73964  |All Sec. 15-T2S-T6W 640.00 04/11/95




.‘Zﬁvésﬁion of’ 0i1, Gas and Mining 'y
OPERATOR' CHANGE HORKSHEET Routife: £
W LECAT-BY
Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. ZhTSA_FILE
nitial each Tisted item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. JW
iR
é((Mange of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent ngg
2 Designation of Operator Ol Operator Name Change Only 6-FILM |~
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: _ 12-27-95 )
TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) PO BOX 749 (address) PO BOX 749
DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749
phone (303 )572-1121 phone (303 )572-1121
account no. _N 0230 (B) account no. _N0675
Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed):
Name : **SEE_ATTACHED** API: (lA” PP Entity: Sec_ Twp___Rng___ lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: APL: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec__Twp__ Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec__ Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: _ Entity: Sec___Twp__ Rng Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec____Twp___Rng Lease Type:

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

1.

Lo
wh 3.

Wb a.

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form)./zwg/;4;z£7

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or qther legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). [&4473’2—%7

The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. ~Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number: . '

(For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

. Changes have been eptered in the Oil apd Gas nformat}pn System (Wang/IBM) for each well

Visted above. (G-t /( Y-2Hblrclien)( L1594 [, (4.5 ) (8-20-98 [ T3l far, OAE)

. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.
. HWell file labels have been updated-for each well Tisted above.

. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo

for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. K?%LZ;7

- A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been

placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

— OVER -
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OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH

entity changes made? (yes/ _ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of

¢ 1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity asz%ggments have been reviewed for all weils listed above. Were
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

NA 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

/(@G@J&E} A%}An//4u¢;€cilh§iég.

BOND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) 5“*‘17' No. Ul 05 382-

e 1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a

proper bond.
A Upen éWﬁ/b/thL‘/Z
A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operafors' bond files.

iﬁ£.3. The former operator ras requested a release of 11ab1llty from their bond (yes(jﬁ
Today's date _ Mmérc If yes, division response was made by letter

dated : {5,0,,,; Gond 45 Koés )

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

Qkéfl‘ (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 , of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such Tease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State Teases.

FILMING i

iﬁQ 1. A1l attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: / “'/7 19 47’7<

FILING
1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

___ 2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS

Wl Tles . wage Snvolies e Leese Losn O.d wretls a;m/é:% 544 Loese usells -
- 4 1 Nian on

Wolja_ fim [51 Hor C.d.5 49

9bo32n 14 lpre. (A's FlAL.

165320 _ Bl lpry. Tondier, Laese ppetls 3-2tl.
HET1/34-35 ,(74//07 Lomicy 2-582 (4301350754 unden revices ad ¥his done nody ot !

7 7
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Form 3166-5 kTED STATES ‘
(June 19903 DEPARTIMANT OF THE INTERIOR
K BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee

6. If indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

CA #9635

1. Type of Well

QOil Well D Gas Well D Other

8. Well Name and No.

Brotherson #2-2B4

2. Name of Operator

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. APIWell No.

43-013-30855

3. Address and Telephone No.

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455

10. Fieid and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

Altamont

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description)

1371' FSL & 1498' FWL

11. County or Parish, State

NESW Section 2-T2S-R4W Duchesne County, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent

Subsequent Report

D Abandonment
D Recompietion
D Plugging Back
D Casing Repair
D Altering Casing

other Install ESP

I:I Final Abandonment Notice

l:l Change of Plans

D New Construction
D Non-Routine Fracturing
[ ] water shut-off

D Conversion to {njection

@ Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report resuits of multiple completion on Well

C ion or R pletion Report and Log form.)

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state afl pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If weli is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

ECEIV Z1A)
|

<=
o

{

/
ey D0 anan <
bo o 28

o

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MIMING

14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Signed Tt Environmental & Safety Analyst

Dat 10/23/96

Sheila Bremer

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Til

Dat

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and wilifully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

WO 7%,)( C/ﬂ@ﬁ/«# /0/?7 '*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

BROTHERSON #2-2B4 (INSTALL ESP)
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 76.39% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26401
TD: 14,450' PBTD: 12,654'

5" LINER @ 11,021'-14,450'

PERFS: 10,940'-12,623'

CWC(MS): 203.0

8/9/96 POOH.
MIRU. ND WH, NU BOPs. POH & LD 2%” sidestring. EOT @ 2050'. CC: $4552.

8/10/96 PU 3'%” P-110 tbg, RIH.
POOH, LD 2%”, xo 2%”. POOH w/27%%” BHA. RIH w/gauge ring on WL to 12,668' PBTD. CC:
$9638.

8/11/96 Acidizing.
PU 3'%” P-110, RIH w/7" HD pkr, set pkr @ 10,747". Fill csg w/150 bbls treated fresh water, test to
1000#, ok. CC: $13,419.

8/12/96 Swab.
Acidize perfs @ 10,940°'-12,623' w/2000 gals bleach & 12,000 gals 15% HCL + diverter. MTP
9000#, ATP 8600#, MTR 31 BPM, ATR 19 BPM. ISIP 3180#, 15 min SIP 0#. Had good
diversion, 730 BLTR. Swab 16 BO, 160 BLW/7 hrs, FFL 7900', PH 4.0, entry 22 BPH, oil cut
10%. CC: $53,697.

8/13/96 POOH, LD 3%” P-110.
Swab, IFL 5500', FFL 6600, swab 59 BO, 134 BLW/10 hrs, oil cut 15%, PH 6.0, 22 BPH. Rel pkr @
10,747" & LD 3% workstring to 9330". CC: $58,195.

8/14/96 RIH w/ESP.
POOH, LD 3%” P-110 tbg. ND BOPs, NU Hydril. Change over to 274" tbg. CC; $62,730.

8/15/96 RDMO.
PU & RIH w/ESP on 274" tbg, land tbg on WH. CC: $74,933.
8/16/96 Pmpd 11 BO, 165 BW, 207 MCF, 8 hrs.
8/17/96 Pmpd 21 BO, 159 BW, 194 MCF, 5 hrs. Down 19 hrs - underload.
8/18/96 Pmpd 55 BO, 470 BW, 242 MCF, 12 hrs. Down 12 hrs - underload, gas interference.
8/19/96 Pmpd 75 BO, 831 BW, 589 MCF, 24 hrs.
8/20/96 RIH w/WL.

RU Delsco, RIH & ret collar stop. RIH, knock out drain plug, RD. MIRU, ND WH, NU hydril, RU
spooler, POOH w/ESP, LD pump. RIH w/40 jts to 1260'. CC: $186,233.

8/21/96 WO ESP.
POOH w/40 jts thg, RU OWP, RIH w/6" gauge ring, tag LT @ 11,021'. POOH, rec 1 frac ball, piece
rubber and band. PU 3.982 gauge ring/JD. RIH, tag fill @ 12,641'. No recovery, RD WL. CC;

$190,732.
8/22/96 WO ESP equipment.
8/23/96 WO ESP equipment.
8/24/96 Put well on production.

Wait on centra-lift pump. PU Centra-lift pump, had to overhaul pump. RIH wi/centra-lift pump putting
3 banks per jt. LD tbg, ND BOP. NU WH. Collar stop @ 10,427, drain valve @ 10,490, check valve
@ 10,553', EOT @ 10,891'. CC; $199,852.



Page 2

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

BROTHERSON #2-2B4 (INSTALL ESP)
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 76.39% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26401

8/25/96

8/26/96

8/27/96

8/28/96

8/29/96

8/31/96

9/1/96

9/2/96

9/3/96

9/4/96

9/5/96

9/7/196

9/8/96

9/9/96

9/10/96

9/11/96

9/12/96

Well turned to production.
RU WH. Plug in control unit. Pump ran 10 mun, gas locked. No mechanical down hole. Turn over
to production to hot csg. CC: $205,389.

Prep to pull ESP to check pump.
Pump would not pump. Pump 200 BW down annulus and fill tbg w/27 BW. PUMP would not PU

load. Reversed pump - still would not pump. Will not run higher than 63 amps (normal 130 amps @
60 HZ).

WO ESP pump.
ND WH, NU Hydril. RU cable spooier. POH w/ESP equip. Sent ESP equip into shop for inspection.

WO ESP equip.
Broke down ESP - found shaft split in 2 areas of tapered pump section. Evaluating failure now to
determine cause. Expect new pump in by 8/31.

WO ESP equip.
Expect to start running ESP on 8/31/96.

On production.

RU spoolers, PU ESP, RIH. ND BOPs, land on hanger, EOT @ 10,862', NU WH, turn to prod.
Pmpd 103 BO, 240 BW, 212 MCF, 10 hrs.

Pmpd 12 BO, 145 BW, 261 MCF, 4 hrs dn, 20 hrs overload.

Pmpd 12 BO, 95 BW, 75 MCF, 17 hrs dn, 7 hrs overload.

Pmpd 0 BO, 0 BW, 0 MCF, 24 hrs.

Pmpd 390 BW down annulus, pump 100 BW back in 3 hrs. Could not get pump to pump, continues
to go down on overload. Centrilift to check pump 9/4 a.m.

POOH w/ESP.

WOO. RU Delsco. Fish coller stop. Punch drain. ND WH, NU BOPs, prep to POOH. Cost to
centrilift.

WO new ESP equip.

Rig spoolers, POOH w/ESP equip. Send pump to shop. Will redesign pump & BHA (all cost on
Centrilift). Expect new equip on 9/7 a.m.

On production.

PU & RIH w/new ESP & 27" tbg. Land tbg, EOT @ 10,871". Collor stop @ 10,415'. Turn to pump.
Pmpd 125 BO, 412 BW, 245 MCF, 13 hrs.

Pmpd 22 BO, 171 BW, 237 MCF, 3 hrs. Down 21 hrs, underload.

Pmpd 37 BO, 443 BW, 207 MCF, 17 hrs. Down 7 hrs to hot oil.

Pmpd 82 BO, 881 BW, 72 MCF, 20.5 hrs. -
Flared 702 MCF off csg. Dn 4.5 hrs to RU gas flowline directly from csg to sales line.

Pmpd 81 BO, 986 BW, 31 MCF (to sales), 590 MCF flared.

Pmpd 33 BO, 522 BW, 0 MCF (sales), 479 MCF (flared).
Down 6 hrs - underload.



COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

BROTHERSON #2-2B4 (INSTALL ESP)
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 76.39% COGUSA/ANR  AFE: 26401

9/13/96

9/14/96

9/15/96

9/16/96

9/17/96

9/18/96

9/19/96

9/20/96

9/21/96

9/22/96

Pmpd 48 BO, 671 BW, 400 MCF (sales), 24 hrs, PIP 12704,

Pmpd 44 BO, 618 BW, 357 MCF (sales), 21 hrs, PIP 1445,
Down 3 hrs - underload.

Pmpd 1 BO, 4 BW, 227 MCF (flared), 15 hrs.

Down 9 hrs - unioaded fluid on csg - blew rupture disk on gas scrubber - bypassed scrubber.

Pmpd 37 BO, 119 BW, 307 MCF, 6 hrs, PIP 14404,

Page 3

Down 18 hrs - underload. Plan to set treater at location to allow producing oil & gas off annulus.

Installing heater treater & 3" gas line.

Installing heater treater & 3" gas line.

Set & hooked up treater & installed 1200' 3" gas line. Should be finished 9/19.

Pmpd 0 BO, 2 BW, 264 MCF (flared), 1 hr.
Finished hookup of heater treater & 3" gas line.

Pmpd 38 BO, 419 BW, 311 MCF, 15 hrs, TP 3104.
Down 9 hrs - underload.

Pmpd 135 BO, 940 BW, 751 MCF, 59 HZ, 24 hrs, TP 5204,

Pmpd 86 BO, 821 BW, 528 MCF, 59 HZ, 29 hrs, TP 550#.

Prior prod: Pmpd 38 BO, 228 BW, 234 MCF (hydraulic pump).

Final report.



FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

FEE
6. Indian, Allotiee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such purposes N/A

1. Type of Well: o D GAS OTHER:

8. Well Name and Number:

Brotherson #2284

2. Name of Operator

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

9. APl Well Number:
Gr3
43 -047 - 30855

3. Address and Telephone Number.

P.0. Box 1148, Vernal UT 84078

(435)-781-7023

10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat
Altamont Field

4. Location of Well

Footages: County: Duchesne
QQ,Sec., T.,R., M.: SeCZZ,TZS,R‘lW State: Utah
11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
{Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
D Abandon D New Construction D Abandon* D New Construction
I:l Repair Casing D Pull or Alter Casing |:| Repair Casing |:| Pul or Alter Casing
D Change of Plans D Recomplete D Change of Plans I:I Perforate
D Convert to Injection [:l Perforate D Convert to [njection D Vent or Flare
D Fracture Treat or Acidize [:I Vent or Flare I:] Fracture Treat or Acidize [:l Water Shut-Off
D Multiple Completion D Water Shut-Off [ ] other
Other Workover

Approximate date work will start

Upon Approval

Date of work completion

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12, DESCRIBEPROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for ail markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Coastal 0i1 & Gas Corporation requests authorization to do a Workover on the above referenced well.

Please refer to the attached Workover Procedure.

y
13. m 'f 7
Name & Signature M

i
L ad B4 At

(I

Sheila Upchego

Tite Environmental Secretary.

pate OCtober 18,1999

(This space for State use only)

(5/94)

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)




COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 |
Section 22-T2S-R4W
Duchesne County, Utah

Workover Procedure — Infill Perforate and Acidize

TD: 12,712° PBTD: 11,682
) ELEVATION: 6,100 GL 6,126 RKB
SURFACE CASING: 9-5/8”, 36/40#, J-55, LTC @ 5,000°, cmt w/ 2,050 sx.

INTERMEDIATE CASING: 77, 26#, N-80/P-110, LTC @ 10,338’, cmt w/ 840 sx.
i ID = 6.276, Drift = 6.151”, Pb (N) = 8,150 PSI, Pc (N) =
‘ 5,740 PSI, Pb (P) = 9,520 PSI, Pc (N) = 6,230 PSI

|
’
|
} WELL DATA
|
i
|
\
|

PRODUCTION LINER:I 5”, 18#, P-110, FL4S fm 10,112’ - 12,713, cmt w/ 300 sx.
ID =4.276”, Drift = 4.151”, Pb = 13,940 PSI, Pc = 13,470 PSI

PRODUCTION TUBING: 2 7/8”, 6.5#, L-80, DSSHT @ 10, 019’ (TAC), OD = 2.441”,
Cpl OD = 3.668”
23/8”, 4.74, N-80, DSSHT @ 9,995’ (Sidestring)
PERFORATIONS: UTT/Wasatch: 10,346’ — 12,682’ (Bxisting) .,

g I

WELLBORE FLUID: Produced Gas & Water

RECOMMENDED PROCEDURE: P
U bl & RENTG
1. MIRU completion unit ¢/w BOPE. ND well, NU BOPE. POOH with the 2 3/8” "

sidestring. Release 5” TAC and POOH with the 2 7/8” tubing assembly.

2. MIRU electric line unit ¢/w packoff type BOPE. TIH with a 3 %2 GRJB and check
TD. Run a GR/CCL correlation log over the 5 liner section. TIH with a 3 1/8”
casing gun loaded 3 JSPF, 120° phasing, centralized and perforate the following
interval:

Wasatch: 11,178 —12,651° (23°, 69 holes)
(see attached detail sheet)

Perforations are based on Schlumberger’s DIL/SFL/GR log run #2 dated May 23,
1985. Correlate guns using CCL tools. RDMO electric line unit.

(NOTE: Should the survey the gauge ring run indicate significant fill up of the
existing perforations, cease wireline operations and TIH with clean-out tools
pricr to performing the above perforating operatiens.)

3. TIH with a Baker Loc-Set retreivable packer on 2 7/8” tubing, setting same @
12,410° =. Hydrotest tubing in hole to 8,500 PSI.

4. MIRU well treaters and acidize the Lower Wasatch interval 12,424’ — 12,672 w/
6,000 gallons of 15% HCL plus additives according to the attached treating schedule.
Release packer and POOH to 12,220’ +. Acidize the Lower Wasatch interval 12,240’
— 12,402 w/4,000 gallons of 15% HCL plus additives according to the attached
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Brotherson 2-22B4 Infill Perforate and Acidize
October 7, 1999

treating schedule. Release the packer, re-set at 11,680’ and Acidize the Lower
Wasatch interval 11,696” — 12,209’ with 8,000 gallons of 15% HCL plus additives
according to the attached treating schedule. Release the packer, re-set at 11,071’ and
treat the lower Wasatch interval 11,089° — 11,628’ with 7,000 gallons of 15% HCL
plus additives according to the attached treating schedule. Release the packer and re-

set at 10,500” . (Note: Tag treating fluids with RA materials in preparation for post
treatment logging.) RDMO electric line unit.

3. Swab test well to recover load. Continue testing as directed by engineering.
6. MIRU electric line unit complete with packoff type lubrication equipment. TIH with
logging tools and perform a tracer survey to evaluate treatment performance. RDMO

electric line unit.

7. Release packer and POOH. TIH with the 2 7/8” tubing and TAC, setting the 5” TAC
@ 10,119’ +. TIH with the 2 3/8” sidestring and set at 9,995’ +.

8. Release well to production.

Approved:
Technical Manager

Recommended:
Production Superintendent

Recommended:
Project Engineer

DRA
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AHD SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

-

- UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME;
Do nol uss this form lor proposals lo drill new wells, significanily deepen exisling wells below current boltem-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or lo
diill hocizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO ORILL form for such proposals.

<]

TWELL NAME and NUMBER:
Exhibit "A"

1. TYPE OF WELL
' ol wert ] GASWELL [ ] OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 3. APl NUMBER:
El Paso Production O0il & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
368 _South 1200 East cnv Vernal state Utahzir 84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: s B P S COUNTY:
ATR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: : _Y s . - " STATE:
- UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE D DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[T wnoTice oF mTENT
(Submit in Duplicate} ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TQO REPAIR 'WELL
Approximale date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDONM
CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

] sussequenT REPORT PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL NAME

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dale of work conmpletion:

OO0 on

RECLAMATION OF WELL . SITE

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS OTHER: Name Chan ge

Uoobiooood
gooooooo

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, elc.
As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
has been changed to El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001L.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # %00JU0708

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
 NAME (PLEASE PRINT, ohn T ETzner TITLE Vice President

SIGHATURE 7 7‘%—— DATE ﬂ& ’/j”ﬂ/
/

T

El Paso Pydduction OIl & Gas Company
unve pLease PRy _N\John T Elzner e Vice President

SIGNATURE /t\‘ 7 /%\/ DATE Ct -15 -0/

e RECEIVED

JUN G 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

{5/2000) (Sea Instruclions on Reverse Side)}



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State

PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION

", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O’CLOCK

A M.

0610204

010162788

8100

_ DIVISION DF
Oli, GAS AND MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

DATE: 04-03-01



i ‘

' @003/003 ‘
03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT.

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF
CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company™), a corporation

organized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State of
Delaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY: .

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimous
written consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolution

proposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate of
Incorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate of
Incorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
“FIRST.” so that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

“FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Qi & Gas
Company.”

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, the
stockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment in

accordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware,

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance with

the applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
has caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice President and attested by an
Assistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
Méﬂ

David L. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE
 DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS

EﬁEi B §°Y FILED 11:00 aM 03,/09./2001
010118394 - 0610204
JUN 19 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING




4 N
Division ¢f Oil, Gas and Mining

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold)

Operator Name Change (Only)

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET

X

ROUTING .
I.GLH ) 4-KAS—
2.CDW¥ 5-Lpi”

3. JLT 6-FILE

Designation of Agent

Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective:

3-09-2001

FROM: (Old Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

TO: ( New Operator):

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address:

9 GREENWAY PLLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account N0230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY |SECTWN {LEASE |WELL |WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE | STATUS
EVANS 2-19B3 (CA 96-78) 43-013-31113 |1777 19-02S-03W |FEE ow P
HANSON 1-2B3 43-013-30629 2390 24-02S-03W |FEE ow p
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 (CA 96-35) 43-013-30062 11570 02-02S-04W [FEE ow p
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 (CA 96-35) 43-013-30855 18420 02-02S5-04W [FEE oW p
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 43-013-31008 [10165 03-02S-04W [FEE ow p
OMAN 2-4B4 43-013-30645 |9125 04-02S-04W |FEE oW P
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 43-013-31142 10481 04-02S-04W |FEE ow S
CHANDLER 1-5B4 (CANW-580) 43-013-30140 |1685 05-028-04W |FEE ow P
CHANDLER 2-5B4 (CA NW-580) 43-013-31000 }10075 05-028-04W |FEE Oow P
CROOK 1-6B4 43-013-30213 1825 06-02S-04W |FEE ow S
POTTER 2-6B4 43-013-31249 |11038 06-02S-04W |FEE oW P
FARNSWORTH 1-7B4 43-013-30097 1600 07-02S-04W |FEE ow S
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 43-013-30470 1935 07-02S-04W |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 43-013-30112 11655 08-02S-04W |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 43-013-30898 (2418 08-025-04W |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-9B4 (CA 96-45) 43-013-30118 1660 09-02S-04W |FEE oW p
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 (CA 96-45) 43-013-31138 10460 09-025-04W [FEE oW S
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 43-013-30110 [1614 10-025-04W [FEE oW P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 43-013-30443 11615 10-02S-04W |FEE oW p
BROTHERSON 2-11B4 43-013-31078 (1541 11-02S-04W |FEE oW P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corperations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

YES

Business Number:

608186-0143




‘ ‘ -

If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

W

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/03/2001
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/03/2001
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/03/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: 60 / 501

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso

Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change File".




API Well No: 43013308550000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
43013308550000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
11/2/2010
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: ( REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

El Paso E & P Company requests approval to perforate additional Wasatch

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

intervals per following summary: ¢ POOH with tubing and rods. e Clean out Approved by the
wellbore with bit and scraper. ¢ Plug back existing Wasatch production with a Utah Division of
CIBP @ approximately 10,935’. Dump Bail 10’ of cement on top. * Perforate  Qil, Gas and Mining
stage 1 of the Lower Green River from approximately 10,414’ - 10,910'. e RIH _

w/ 4 2" frac string and acidize interval with 20,000 g of cross-linked 15% Hzte: { “ Noyemper 02, 2010
e POOH with frac string. Set CBP at 10,400’. Perforate stage 2 of the Lower \ )f'/k {L ‘Q/_J,u,j
Green River from approximately 9,492’ - 10,378". « RIH w/ 4 '2" frac stringy: = A
and acidize interval with 25,000 g of cross-linked 15% HCI e Drill out CBP @
approximately 10,400’ and comingle the two LGR zones ¢ Run tubing and rods and produce the well (LGR

only).
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/29/2010

RECEIVED October 29, 2010




API Well No: 43013308550000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
43013308550000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
1 2/6/20 10 D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
/ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO E & P PERF'D AND FRAC'D SUBJECT WELL PER THE ATTACHMENT.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD@NLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 1/4/2011

RECEIVED January 04, 2011




~ Operations Summary Report -

 Page 10f3

Common Well Name:

BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

Spud Date: 12/17/1983

Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 11/1/2010 End:
Contractor Name: PEAK Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: PEAK Rig Number: 900
_ Date | From-To | Hours |
11/2/2010 07:00 - 08:30 150|C 06 ROAD RIG FROM 2-6B2 TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC: RIGGING UP
08:30 - 11:00 2.50|C 04 MIRU...RU HOT OIL TRUCK PMP HOT TPW DWN ANNULAS LD
POLISH TOH w RODS TO PART ROD #87 OF THE 7/8" TAPER 5100'
EL-06 BTM COULING
11:00 - 13:00 2.00|C 04 PU 2 1/2" OBANNON OS w 1 13/16 GRAPPLE TIH w RODS ENGAGE
FISH
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|C 08 UNSEAT PMP FLUSH 2 7/8" TBG w 60 BBLS OF HOT TPW
14:00 - 16:00 2.00|C 04 TOH w RODS LD FISH CONT TOH w RODS LD PMP
16:00 - 18:30 250(C 10 CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS ND WELL HEAD NU BOPE RELEASE
TAC SOH w 2 7/8" TBG SECURE WELL SDFN EOT 8593' TTL WTR
PMP TODAY 250 BBLS OF TPW
18:30 - 19:30 1.00(C 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/3/2010 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG
07:00 - 11:00 4.00|C 04 TSIP 100 PSI CSIP 50 PSI BLED OFF WELL CONT TOH w 267 OF JTS
27/8" TBG LD BHA
11:00 - 16:00 500|C 1 RU WIRELINE TIH w 5.710 GAUGE RING TO 11017 TOH LD GAUGE
RING...PU.7" CIBP TIH SET AT 10931' TOH w WIRELINE LD SETTING _|
TOOL...PU DUMP BAILER TIH DUMP BAIL 2 SX OF CMT ON TOP OF
CIBP (10 ft)...TOC 10921' TOH w LD BAILER
16:00 - 17:30 150|C 14 FILL 7" w 312 BBLS OF 2% KCL TEST 7" CSG TO 1000 PSI HELD 30
MIN BLED OFF PRESSURE SECURE WELL SDFN
17:30 - 18:30 1.00|C 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/4/2010 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; WORKING WITH
WIRELINE
07:00 - 09:30 250(C 1 CSIP 0 PSI TIHw 3 1/8" GUN PERFORATE STAGE #1 3SPF 120
PHASING (10909'-10416") RD WIRELINE...RU FLOW BACK FILL &
HEAT TANKS
09:30 - 10:00 0.50|C 06 RU RIG PMP PRESSURE UP TO 2500 PSI ATTEMPT TO BRAKE
DWN STAGE #1 FAILED BLED OFF PRESSURE
10:00 - 18:00 8.00|C 04 PU 7" PKR TALLY IN THE HOLE w 210 JTS OF 3 1/2" P-110 8RD TBG
EOT 6635'...TALLY LAST ROW OF 3 1/2" TBG SECURE WELL SDFN
18:00 - 19:00 c 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/5/2010 06:00 - 07:00 c 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; PICKING UP TBG ACID
JOB
07:00 - 10:30 350(C 04 TSIP 0 PSI CSIP 0 PSI FINISH TIH w 3 1/2" TBG TTL OF 323 JTS SET
7" PKR @ 10203' FILL ANNULAS w 3 BBL OF 2% KCL TEST
ANNULAS AND PKR TO 1000 PSI TEST GOOD
10:30 - 15:00 450|C 08 HSM JSA TOPIC: RIGGING UP...MIRU BJ PUMP SERVICES
15:00 - 17:00 2.00|C 08 TEST LINE TO 8000 PSI OPEN WELL 0 PSI PMP ACID AS PER -
PROPOSAL BROKE DWN @ 4326 PSI SHUT DWN ISIP 3461 PSI
START JOB...INJECTION RATE TREATING FLUID 25.7 FLUSH 23.5
AVE RATE 20.5 TREATING PRESSURE MINIMUM 4326 PS|
MAXIMUM 6614 PSI AVE PS| 5727 ISIP 2040 PSI 5 MIN 0 PSI SHUT
WELL IN RD BJ
17:00 - 18:30 150|C 04 RELEASE 7" PKR TBG SOH w 3 1/2" TBG EOT 9640'
18:30 - 19:30 1.00|C 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/6/2010 06:00 - 07:00 1.00(C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG WIRELINE
07:00 - 13:30 6.50|C 04 CSIP 200 PSI TSIP 100 PSI BLED OFF PRESSURE FINISH TOH w 3
1/2" TBG LD 7" PKR FLUSH TBG AS NEEDED
13:30 - 18:00 450(C 1 RU WIRELINE TIH w 7" CBP SET @ 10400 FILL ANNULAS w 327

BBLS OF 2% KCL WTR PRESSURE TEST PLUG TO 1000 PSI TEST
GOOD PERFORATE STAGE #2 10379'-9492' STARTING PRESSURE

Printed: 1/4/2011 2:02:19 PM

RECEIVED January 04, 2011




~ ELPASOPRODUCTION
~ Operations Summary Report

Page 2 of 3

Common Well Name:
Event Name:
Contractor Name:

Rig Name:

BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

Spud Date: 12/17/1983
Start: 11/1/2010 End:
Rig Release: Group:
Rig Number: 900

Date

Description ¢ f

11/6/12010 13:30 - 18:00
18:00 - 19:00
19:00 - 20:00
11/7/2010 06:00 - 07:00
07:00 - 12:00

12:00 - 14:30

14:30 - 15:30
11/8/2010 06:00 - 06:00
11/9/2010 06:00 - 07:00
07:00 - 17:00
17:00 - 18:00
11/10/2010  |06:00 - 07:00
07:00 - 08:30
08:30 - 13:30

13:30 - 15:30

15:30 - 17:30

17:30 - 18:30
11/11/2010  |06:00 - 07:00

07:00 - 10:30

10:30 - 16:00

16:00 - 17:30
17:30 - 18:30
11/12/2010  |06:00 - 07:00
07:00 - 08:00

08:00 - 13:30

RECOMPLETION

PEAK

PEAK
450(C 1"
1.00(C 04
1.00(C 06
1.00(C 06
5.00|C 04
250|C 21
1.00|C 06
1.00|C 06
10.00|C 04
1.00|C 06
1.00|C 06
150|C 04
5.00|C 04
2.00|C 13
2.00|C 04
1.00(C 06
1.00(C 06
350|C 04
550|C 04
150|C 10
1.00|C 06
1.00|C 06
1.00|C 06
5.50|C 04

1000 PSI BLED OFF 200 PSI RD WIRE LINE
PU 7" PKR SIH w 40 JTS 3 1/2" TBG EOT 1029' SECURE WELL SDFN
CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC

CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG PMPING
ACID

CSIP 0 PSITISP 0 PSI FINISH TIH w 3 1/2" TBG WHILE TIH MIRU BJ
PMP SERVICE

RU FRAC VALVE SET 7" PKR @ 9453 TEST PKR TO 1000 PSI TEST
GOOD...TEST LINES TO 8000 PSI PUMP DEEP SPOT ACID AS PER
PROPOSAL PMP 644 BBLS OF ACID 142 BBLS OF 10# BRINE w
ROCK SALT MAX PRESSURE 5862 PSI MIN 4413 PSI AVE 5623 PSI
AVR RATE 24.1 ISDP 1430 PSI 5 MIN 1307 PSI 10 MIN 1265 PSI 15
MIN 1234 PSI SHUT WELL IN RD BJ RU FLOW BACK LINE SECURE
LOC SDFW

CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC

TURN WELL OVER TO FLOW BACK

CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; LAYING DOWN 3 1/2" TBG _|

CSIP 50 PSI TSIP 0 PSI BLED OFF CSG RELEASE 7" PKR TOH
LAYING DOWN 270 JTS OF 3 1/2" TBG EOT 1004' SECURE WELL
SDFN

CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC

CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG
FINISH TOH w 30 JTS OF 3 1/2" TBG CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS
PU 6" MILL BIT SUB TIH w 337 JTS OF 27/8" TBG TAG PLUG @
10411

RU POWER SWIVEL ESTABLISH CIRC DRILL UP 7" CBP..WELL
WENT ON VACUME...SWIVEL DWN 1 JT RD POWER SWIVEL TIHw
13JTS OF 27/8" TBG TAG CMT TOP @ 10918’

SOH w54 JTS OF 27/8" TBG EOT 9315'...DRAIN PMP & LINES
SECURE WELL SDFN

CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC

CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING TBG PINCH
POINTS

CSIP 100 PSI TSIP 100 PSI CONT TOH w 300 JTS OF 27/8" TBG LD
BIT AND BIT SUB

PU BHA TALLY IN HOLE w 304 JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG...SOILD PLUG
NO-GO 2 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 8RD TBG 4 1/2" PBGA 2 7/8" X 6' N-80
8RD TBG SUB 27/8" +45 PSN 7 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 8RD TBG 7" TAC
w CARBIDE SLIPS 4 JTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 8RD TBG 2 7/8" EUE 8RD X 2
7/8" 1J NU-LOK XO 246 JTS OF 27/8" IJ NU-LOK TBG 2 7/8" |J
NU-LOK X 2 7/8" EUE 8RD XO 47 JTS OF 27/8" N-80 8RD TBG...SET
7" TAC @ 9164' w 25K TENTION PSN @ 9384 EOT 9489'

ND BOP'E NU WELL HEAD SECURE WELL SDFN

CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC

CREW TRAVEL TO LOC HSM JSA TOPIC; TRIPPING RODS

TSIP 100 PSI FLUSH TBG w 65 BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL WHILE
CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS

PU & PRIME 1 3/4" RHBC PMP TIH w 24-1" 118-3/4" 118-7/8" 113-1"
SPACE OUT PMP w 2' PONY ROD PU POLISH ROD FILL TBG w 10
BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL STROKE TEST PMP TO 1000 PSI TEST
GOOD...PMP 20 BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL ACROSS FLOW
LINE...RDMO...SLIDE ROTO FLEX ATTEMPT TO STRAT UNIT

Printed: 1/4/2011 2:02:19 PM

RECEIVED January 04, 2011




EL PASO PRODUCTION

Operations Summary Report

 Page3o0f3

Legal Well Name:
Common Well Name:

BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

Spud Date: 12/17/1983

Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 11/1/2010 End:
Contractor Name: PEAK Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: PEAK Rig Number: 900
Date From - To | Hours | Cod Description of Operations
11/12/2010  |08:00 - 13:30 550|C 04 FAILED WAIT ON ELECTRICIAN BLOWN FUSS REPLACE FUSS...
TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION
12/5/2010 07:00 - 07:30 050|C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING & START RIG
07:30 - 10:00 250|C 01 MOVE RIG TO LOCATION & RIG UP
10:00 - 11:30 150|C 08 WORK PUMP OFF SEAT & FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.
11:30 - 14:30 3.00(C 04 TOOH W/ RODS & PUMP. DISASSEMBLE PUMP. PUMP PLUNGER
WAS COVERED W/ SCALE
14:30 - 15:30 1.00|C 08 FLUSH TBG W/ 50 BBLS 2% KCL WTR
15:30 - 17:00 150|C 04 TIH W/ REBUILT PUMP, 24 1" RODS, 118 3/4" RODS, 118 7/8" RODS,
113 1" RODS & SPACE OUT W/ 2' X 1" PONY ROD & POLISH ROD.
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|C 08 FILL TBG W/ 30 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. STROKE TEST PUMP TO 1000
PSI.OK. SDFN
12/6/2010 07:00 - 07:30 050|C 18 HOLD SAFETY MEETING & FILL OUT JSA
07:30 - 09:30 2.00|C 01 RD RIG. SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. START WELL PUMPING. PUMP 10

GAL BJ TECHNIHIB DOWN CSG & CHASE W/ 200 BBLS 2% KCL
WTR. MOVE OFF LOCATION

Printed: 1/4/2011 2:02:19 PM

RECEIVED January 04, 2011




.

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 . Houston, TX. 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038
CA No. Unit: N/A
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNGJAPI NO ENTITY [LEASE TYPE|WELL [|WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
See Attached List |
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012

COMMENTS:

Disposal and Injections wells will be moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis 6/29/2012




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
Multiple Leases

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposgis.

7. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
7
OIL WELL GasWELL []  OTHER See Attached
Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana iy Houston srate VX 7 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [ oeeeen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/] NoTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) M) auTER CASING [C] FracTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wit start:. | [ ]  CASING REPAIR [] wnewconsTRuCTION [C] veEMPORARILY ABANDON

[T] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE "] vueinG REPAIR
[J cHance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [7] ventorFLARE

[0 sussequent RepoRT ] crance weLL NaME [J pLuceack [[] warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comMmINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [_] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: Change of
[ converT weLL TYPE [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JU0705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Falle Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME (pLasm. Gomez mme Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE 6 : M oave  0/22/2012

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED (» /29/30IQ JUN 25 2012
Roahed

(moobivis‘-on of 0“’ Gas and Mining - (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene-Russell, Engineering Techiiiclan: ...
Rachet Modirm




El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well [Well
Well Name ___ |Sec 'TWP RNG |API Number Entity Lease Type Type |Status Conf
DWR 3-17C6 747 030S [060W 4301350070 14204621118 |OW __ APD _ [C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S [060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD |C
YOUNG 3-15A3 15 |010S [030W 4301350122 FEE OW |APD [C
WHITING 4-1A2 01 |010S [020W |4301350424 Fee oW |APD [C |
EL PASO 4-34A4 34 010S [040W 4301350720 Fee OW APD [C
YOUNG 2-2B1 02 020S |010W (4304751180 FEE OW APD C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-10B4 10 |020S [040W 4301350712 |18221 [Fee OW [DRL C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-26B4 26 |020S [040W 4301350714 |18432 [Fee OW |DRL € |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 [020S |040W 4301350717 |18315 |Fee OW DRL C
Cook 4-14B3 - 14 [020S |030W 4301351162 |18449 |Fee OW [DRL [C
Peterson 4-22C6 22 |030S |060W 4301351163 18518 [Fee OW [DRL [C |
Lake Fork Ranch 4-14B4 14 020S [040W [4301351240 (99999 |Fee OW |DRL [C
Melesco 4-20C6 - 20 [030S |060W 4301351241 [99999 |Fee OW |DRL _C |
Peck 3-13B5 113 [020S |050W |4301351364 (99999 [Fee OW DRL [C |
Jensen 2-9C4 09 [030S [040W |4301351375 (99999 [Fee OW [DRL C |
El Paso 3-5C4 105 0305 [040W 4301351376 | 18563 |Fee OW DRL [C |
ULT 6-31 31 |030S |020E 4304740033 FEE oW LA ]
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 |010S |010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 |030S |060W 4301351433 [14-20-H62-4724 OW _ [NEW |C
Lake Fork Ranch 5-2384 23 [020S [040W 4301350739 Fee OW [NEW ]
Duchesne Land 4-10C5 10 |030S |050W [4301351262 Fee OW [NEW C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 |020S [030W 4301351374 _ |Fee oW INEW [C
Layton 4-2B3 - 02 |020S |030W 4301351389 Fee OW |NEW [C |
Golinski 4-24B5 ]24 |020S [050W [4301351404| Fee = [OW [NEW [C
Alba 1-21C4 21 |030S [040W 4301351460 Fee OW |NEW [C
Allison 4-19C5 19 |030S [050W 4301351466 Fee OW |NEW [C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 [020S [030W 4301351486 Fee OW |NEW C |
Allen 4-25B5 25 |020S |050W 4301351487 Fee OW NEW [C |
Hewett2-6C4 |06 |030S [040W 4301351489 Fee OW INEW [C |
Young 2-7C4 - 07 |030S [040W 4301351500 __ |Fee oW T INEW € ]
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 [010S |010E (4304752471 Fee oW INEw [C ]
Hamaker 3-25A1 |25 |010S [010W 4304752491 __ |Fee OW [NEW [C |
Boiton 3-29A1E B 29 [010S [010E |4304752871 Fee OW [NEW C
HORROCKS 5-20A1 ~ 120 |010S [010W [4301334280 |17378 FEE OW _OPS [C |
DWR 3-19C6 } 19 [030S [060W [4301334263 17440 |14-20-462-1120 OW [P
DWR 3-22C6 f‘* 22 |030S [060W |4301334106 |17298 |14-20-462-1131 [OW P ]
DWR 3-28C6 - 28 030S |060W 4301334264 | 17360 | 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 - - 07 |010S [020W 4301330025 5850 |14-20462-811 OW P ]
UTE 2-17C6 17 |030S [060W [4301331033 10115 |14-20-H62-1118 OW P
WLR TRIBAL 2-19C6 119 0305 |060W [4301331035 | 10250 |14-20-H62-1120 OW [P B
CEDARRIM 10-A-15C6 115 [030S |060W 4301330615 6420 |14-20-H62-1128[OW P | |
CEDAR RIM 12A ] 28 |030S |060W |4301331173 10672 [14-20-H62-1323 OW [P ]
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 B 33 [030S |060W [4301331123 |10365 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |P
TAYLOR3-34C6 ~ 134 030S [060W [4301350200 17572 1420H621329 |[OW [P -
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 134 |030S |060W 14301332634 | 14590 |14-20-H62-1329 |OW P T
UTE3-3522K 35 |010N |020W 4301331133 | 10483 |14-20-H62-1614 [OW P | |
UTE 1-3222 |32 |010N[020W 4301330379 1915 |14-20-H62-1702'OW P o
UTE TRIBAL 1-3322 B 133 010N 020W 4301330334 |1851 |14-20-H62-1703 OW [P ]
UTE 2-3322 - 133 010N |020W 4301331111 10451 |14-20-H62-1703/OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422 |34 [010N[020W (4301331167 10668 |14-20-H62-1704 OW [P j
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 [020S |040W |4301334262 17439 |14-20-H62-1743 OW [P ]
UTE 1-28B4 T 1287]020S|040W 4301330242 1796 |14-20-H62-1745OW P | |
UTE 1-34A4 3 /34 1010S [040W 4301330076 |1585 |14-20-H62-1774 OW [P i
UTE 1-36A4 ] |36 [010S [040W 4301330069 1580 |14-20-H62-1793[OW [P
UTE 1-1B4 - 101 |020S [040W |4301330129 |1700 |14-20-H62-1798 [OW [P ]
UTE 1-31A2 '31_1010S [020W [4301330401 1925 [14-20-H62-1801 OW P

1



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE 1-25A3 25 |010S [030W 4301330370 1920 |14-20-H62-1802 | OW [P

UTE 2-25A3 - |25 0105 |030W 4301331343 [11361 |14-20-H62-1802[OW [P
UTE1-26A3 ] 126 "|010S [030W [4301330348 |1890 |14-20-H62-1803[OW [P

UTE 2-26A3 26 |010S [030W (4301331340 |11349 [14-20-H62-1803 OW P ]
UTE TRIBAL 4-35A3 135 [010S |030W 4301350274 [18000 [1420H621804 OW P C |
[UTE 2-35A3 T |35 |010S|030W 4301331292 11222 |14-20-H62-1804 [OW [P |
UTE 3-35A3 _ 35 |010S [030W [4301331365 |11454 [1420-H62-1804 OW P |
UTE 1-6B2 o ~ 106 |020S [020W 4301330349 1895 |14-20-H62-1807 [OW [P

UTE 2-6B2 ~ 706 |020S [020W 4301331140 [11190 | 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-6B2 ) 06 |020S[020W |4301350273 | 18008 |14-20-H62-1807 OW P c
POWELL 4-19A1 - 19 |010S [010W 4301330071 8302 |14-20-H62-1847 [OW [P

COLTHARP 12721 i 27 010N |010W [4301330151 |4700 |14-20-H62-1933 |[OW P~ | |
UTE 1-8A1E T 08 |010S |010E 14304730173 [1846 |14-20-H62-2147 OW P T
UTE TRIBE 1-31 31 |010N |020W (4301330278 |4756 |14-20-H62-2421|[OW P T
UTE 1-28B6X i 28 |020S |060W |4301330510 |11165 |14-20-H62-2492 [OW P ]
RINKER 2-21B5 21 |020S |050W [4301334166 |17299 |14-20-H62-2508 OW [P | |
MURDOCK 2-34B5 |34 [020S [050W [4301331132 |10456 |14-20-H62-2511/OW P |
UTE 1-35B6 35 |020S [060W 4301330507 2335 |14-20-H622531 [OW P | |
'UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 |010S [010E |4304730829 (860 |14-20-H622658 OW P |
UTE 2-17A1E B 17 1010S [010E |4304737831 16709 |14-20-H622658 [OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-27AE 27 [010S |010E 4304730421800 |14-20-H62-2662 |OW P i
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E " I35 [010S|010E [4304730286 (795 |14-20-H62-2665OW P _
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E |15 |010S [010E [4304730820 850 |14-20-H622717 OW _ |P )
UTE TRIBALP-3B1E |03 |020S |010E |4304730190 4536 |14-20-H622873[OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E ) |22 ]010S [010E 4304730429810 |14-20-H62-3103/oW P |
B H UTE 1-35C6 I35 |030S|060W [4301330419 10705 [14-20-H62-3436 OW |P |
BH UTE 2-35C6 7|35 [030S [060W |4301332790 | 15802 | 14-20-H62-3436 [OW P |
MCFARLANE 14D6 ] " |04 |040S [060W [4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452[OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 i 11 /040S [060W 4301330482 (6415 |14-20-H62-3454 OW P |
CARSON 2-36A1 36 |010S |010W 4304731407 737 |14-20-H62-3806 OW P )
UTE 2-14C6 7714 [030S [060W 4301330775 |9133 |14-20-H62-3809 [OW [P B
DWR 3-14C6 114 [030S |060W |4301334003 [17092 |14-20-H62-3808 OW P |
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 [010S |010W 4301330935 [9461 |14-20-H62-3855 OW P ]
BADGER-SAM H UMONGUS 1-15A1 (15 _|010S |010W 4301330949 [9462 |14-20-H62-3860 OW P | |
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE 14-1 14 [010S [030W 4301330726 |8437 |14-20-H62-3868 [OW P |
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 122 p10S [010W 4301330781 [0460 [14-20-H62-3880 .OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 30 |010N |010W [4301330813[9405 |14-20-H62-3910 OW P =
UTELB1-13A3 13 |010S [030W [4301330894 9402 |14-20-H62-3980([OW P 1
UTE 2-22B6 B |22 [020S '060W 4301331444 11641 [14-20-H62-4614 OW P ]
UINTAOURAY 1-1A3 o1 [010S 030W 4301330132 5540 |14-20-H62-4664 OW P |
UTE 1-6D6 ] 06 |040S |060W [4301331696 |12058 |14-20-H62-4752 |OW  |P

UTE 2-11D6 111 |040S |060W (4301350179 |17667 |1420H624801 |OW P T
UTE 1-15D6 ) o 15 [040S |060W 4301330429 | 10958 [14-20-H62-4824 OW P | |
UTE 2-15D6 15 |040S [060W 4301334026 (17193 |14-20-H624824 OW P o
HILL 3-24C6 " |24 |030S |060W 4301350293 [18020 | 1420H624866 | OW  |P C
BARCLAY UTE 2-24C6R "~ 724 |030S |060W |4301333730 | 16385 [14-20-H62-4866 [ OW P o
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 "oz ]020S |040W |4301330062 |1570 |FEE ow P T ]
BOREN 1-24A2 |24 010S|020W [4301330084 |5740 |[FEE ow p I
FARNSWORTH1-1385 13 1020S [050W 4301330092 [1610 |FEE ow P I ]
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 121 |020S |060W 4301330100 1595 |FEE ow P ]
ASAY E J 1-20A1 20 [010S |010W 4301330102 [8304 |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-6B3 05 |020S [030W [4301330109 (16356 |[FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 B 08 |020S [040W 4301330112 16556 |FEE ow P |~
ELLSWORTH1-9B4 ~ ""109 [020S |040W 4301330118 1660 |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 ) 17 |[020S [040W [4301330126 1695 |FEE ow P | ]
CHANDLER 1-5B4 ~ o5 [020S [040W [4301330140 |1685 FEE ow P
[HANSON 1-32A3 32 [010S[030W 4301330141 |1640 |FEE oW P i
JESSEN 1-17A4 117 [070S [040W (4301330173 |4725 |FEE ow P
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El Paso E3 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

JENKINS 1-1B3

01 [020S [030W [4301330175[1790 |FEE ow P
GOODRICH1-2B3 |02 |020S |030W |4301330182 |1765 FEE ow [P ]
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 19 |020S [040W 4301330183 |1760 |[FEE ow [P )
DOYLE 1-10B3 10 [020S |030W [4301330187 (1810 [FEE |OW P B
JOS.SMITH1-17C5 |17 _|030S [050W |4301330188 |5510 |[FEE ow p |
RUDY 1-11B3 o 11 [020S [030W 4301330204 |1820 |FEE oW P
CROOK 1-6B4 - 06 |020S |040W (4301330213 1825 |FEE ow P B
HUNT 1-21B4 ) 121 |020S |040W (4301330214 [1840 |FEE ow P
LAWRENCE 1-30B4 30 [020S |040W 4301330220 (1845 |[FEE ow [P B
YOUNG 1-29B4 |29 ]020S |040W 4301330246 1791 FEE =~ OW P
GRIFFITHS 1-33B4 133 1020S |040W [4301330288(4760 [FEE ~ OW P ﬂ
POTTER 1-2B5 02 [020S |050W [4301330293 (1826 |FEE oW P B
BROTHERSON 1-26B4 |26 [020S [040W [4301330336/1856 [FEE oW P | |
SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 |010N |010W 4301330355(765 [FEE ~ OW P ]
[POTTER 1-24B5 24 |020S |050W 4301330356 |1730 |FEE oW P
WHITEHEAD 1-22A3 o 22 |010S |030W |4301330357 1885 FEE ow [P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 101 ]010S |020W [4301330360/5830 FEE =~ OW P B
ELDER 1-13B2 113 |020S |020W 4301330366 (1905 FEE ~~ OW P B
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 |10 |020S [040W [4301330443 |1615 |[FEE ow |p B
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330470(1935 [FEE oW P B
TEW 1-15A3 - 15 _|010S |030W 4301330529/1945 FEE __~ OW [P )
UTE FEE 2-20C5 - 20 [030S |050W [4301330550 4527 |[FEE low |
HOUSTON 1-34Z1 - 34 010N |010W [4301330566 (885 |FEE ow P
GALLOWAY 1-18B1 ) ~ 118 |020S |010W 4301330575 [2365 FEE ow P [ ]
SMITH 1-31B5 ] 31 1020S |050W [4301330577 [1955 |FEE oW P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 ] 134 1010S |010W [4301330590(1440 FEE =~ OW P |
LINMAR 1-19B2 ) 19 |020S |020W 14301330600 (9350 |FEE ow P ]
WISSE 1-28Z1 B |28 |010N [010W (4301330609 (905 |FEE ow p |
POWELL 1-21B1 ] 21 |020S [010W 4301330621 (910 |FEE ow |p |
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S |030W 4301330629 2390 [FEE ow P
OMAN 2-4B4 ] 04 [020S [040W |4301330645/9125 [FEE ~ |OW P )
DYE 1-2522 |25 010N |020W [4301330659/9111 [FEE ~~  OW P
H MARTIN 1-21Z1 21 |010N [010W 4301330707 |925 |FEE ow P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 i 29 |010N|010W [4301330725/9110 [FEE ~ |OW [P
CHASEL 2-17A1V |17 |o10S |010W 4301330732/9112 FEE OW P |
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 B 27 |010S |010W |4301330758/940 [FEE =~ |ow P |
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 08 [020S |030W [4301330780 |9355 |FEE ow p |
LAMICQ 2-5B2 05 [020S [020W [4301330784 [2302 |FEE ow P ]
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 |020S |[040W '4301330815 10450 FEE =~ Oow P = |
MURRAY 3-2A2 |02 Jo10S 020w [4301330816/9620 [FEE =~~~ Oow [P ' |
HORROCKS 2-20A1 V 20 |010S |010W 4301330833 |8301 |FEE ow P N
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 ] 02 020S [040W [4301330855 8420 |FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 |08 |020S [040W |4301330898 [2418 |FEE ow p | ]
OMAN 2-32A4 - 132 _|010S |040W [4301330904 (10045 |[FEE ow [, |
BELCHER 2-33B4 33 |020S |040W 4301330907 (9865 [FEE =~ OW P
BROTHERSON2-35B5 35 |020S 050W |4301330908/9404 FEE =~ oW P =
HORROCKS 24A1 T - |04 |010S |010W |4301330954 9855 [FEE ow P
JENSEN229A5 29 '010S [050W 4301330974 [10040FEE OW P ]
UTE 2-34A4 |34 |010S [040W [4301330978 [10070/FEE  |OW P )
CHANDLER 2-5B4 |05 _|020S [040W (4301331000 [10075]FEE ~ |OW P ]
BABCOCK 2-12B4 |12 020S [040W |4301331005/10215[FEE ~OW P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 |29 |010S [010W [4301331013/9463 FEE =~ |OW P |
BLEAZARD 2-18B4 |18 [020S ;040W 4301331025 |1566 |FEE __ow P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 |32 1020S |050W 4301331036 |10216 |FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 020S |040W 4301331046 (10217 [FEE  |OW [P |
RUST 3-4B3 ... |04 |020S 030W 4301331070 1576 |[FEE = |OW P _
HANSON TRUST 2-32A3 32 |010S |030W 4301331072 1641 |FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-11B4 '11_1020S [040W 4301331078 [1541 [FEE ow__ P
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El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSON TRUST 2-6B3 05 [020S [030W [4301331079]1636 [FEE _|OW P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 |020S 040W (4301331103 /1771 [FEE ~ ow P |
MONSEN 2-27A3 27 010S1030W (4301331104 1746 |FEE ow [P
ELLSWORTH2-19B4 19 1020S [040W |4301331105|1761 FEE _OW P |
[HUNT2:21B4 " "121 [020S |040W (4301331114 [1839 |FEE _ow P )
JENKINS2-1B3 01 |020S |030W 4301331117 [1792 [FEE low P |
POTTER2-24B5 - 24 |020S [050W 4301331118/1731 FEE  Jow P T N
POWELL2-13A2K - 13 |010S |020W |4301331120 |8306 |FEE ow P I
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 |020S |030W [4301331121 10459 [FEE ow |
MURDOCK 2-26B5 |26 |020S |050W [43013311241531 (FEE oW P | |
BIRCH3-2785 127 |020S |050W (4301331126 [1783 FEE Cjow P
ROBB 2-29B5 - ~ 129 1020S [050W |4301331130 |10454 [FEE ow P 1
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 [020S|040W 4301331134 [10452 [FEE T jow [P |
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K T 01 |010S |020W [4301331135 10484 |FEE ow P ]
[HANSON 2-9B3 T 09 |020S [030W [4301331136 |10455 [FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 |09 10208 [040W 4301331138 10460/ FEE OW P | |
UTE 2-31A2 o 31 |010S |020W |4301331139 | 10458 |FEE OW"WE“" o
POWELL 2-19A1 K 19 |010S |010W (4301331149 8303 |FEE low P T
CEDAR RIM 8-A - 22 7]030S |060W |4301331171|10666 [FEE Tow P ]
POTTER 2-6B4 - 06 |020S [040W [4301331249 11038 [FEE ow P | |
MILES 2-1B5 ~ o1 |020S |050W |4301331257 (11062 |FEE ~ low P ]
MILES 2-3B3 - 03 [020S |030W 4301331261 |11102)FEE OW [P

MONSEN 2-22A3 122 |010S |030W 4301331265 | 11098 |FEE _ ow P

WRIGHT 21385 ~ ]13 |020S |050W 4301331267 (11115 FEE  [OW [P | |
TODD2-21A3 21 |010S [030W [4301331296 | 11268 |FEE Clow P [
WEIKART 22084 |29 020S040W[4301331298[11332|FEE  |OW P ]
YOUNG 2-15A3 |15 |010S [030W |4301331301 |11344 [FEE low P B
CHRISTENSEN 2-29A4 B |29 1010S1040W 4301331303 [11235[FEE [oW P | B
BLEAZARD 2-28B4 - 28 |020S |040W [4301331304 |11433 [FEE ow P ]
REARY 2-17A3 ~ |17 |010S[030W 4301331318 [11251 |FEE ow P ]
LAZY K 2-11B3 |11 _|020S[030W |4301331352 11362 FEE oW P | |
[AZYK2-14B3 14 |020S030W 4301331354 [11452/FEE  |[OW IE‘: L
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 13 |020S |020W [4301331357 | 11374 |FEE Tow P T
LAKE FORK 3-15B4 |15 |020S |040W [4301331358 | 11378 [FEE ______|[OW P N
STEVENSON 3-20A3 T 129 |010S030W 4301331376 11442 FEE ___OW P I
MEEKS3-883 B ”498 020S 030W |4301331377 11489 FEE | ow P |
ELLSWORTH 3-20B4 120 1020S[040W 4301331389 (11488 FEE  |low P | ]
DUNCAN 5-13A2 - 13 |010S |020W 4301331516 |11776 [FEE ow P ]
OWL 3-17C5 17 _[030S |050W 4301332112 [12476 FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-24B4 ] 124 ]020S '040W |4301332695[14652|[FEE ~ |OW P :
BODRERO 2-15B3 |15 |020S |030W |4301332755|14750 FEE =~ oW P |
BROTHERSON 2-25B4 |25 ]020S |040W [4301332791 [15044 [FEE ow p T
CABINLAND 2-16B3 16 |020S [030W 4301332914 15236 [FEE = |OW [P 7
KATHERINE 3-29B4 ~ 129 [020S [040W 4301332923 [15331 [FEE ow |p |
SHRINERS 2-10C5 ~ /10 |030S |050W [4301333008 [15908 |FEE ~low P ﬂ ]
BROTHERSON 2-26B4 126 |020S [040W [4301333139/17047 FEE oW [P T ]
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 '32 |010S |020W |4301333211 15720 |FEE Clow
FERRARINI3-27B4 127 [020S 040W 4301333265 15883/FEE =~ |OW P | -
RHOADES 2-25B5 - 25 1020S |050W [4301333467 16046 [FEE ow P j
CASE 2-3184 - /31 |020S |040W 4301333548 | 16225 |FEE T low P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 Wi#zj 020S [030W 4301333616 (16284 FEE ow P | _
SPROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 |18 |020S |010W [4301333808 [16677 [FEE ow P L]
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 |11 jo20S |040W 4301333904 [16891]FEE = OW P |
KOFFORD 2-36B5 ) 136 |020S |050W |4301333988(17048 FEE = OW [P |
ALLEN3-7B4 ~lo7 |020S |040W |4301334027 |17166 |FEE low P
[BOURNAKIS 3-18B4 ~ 18 |020S [040W |4301334091 17264 [FEE = |OW P

MILES 3-12B5 112 ]020S|050W [4301334110[17316 FEE __ OW [P

OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 ' T31 020S [050W [4301334123 17388 |FEE low P
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El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

OWL and HAWK 4-17C5 17 0305 |050W [4301334193 | 17387 |FEE ow P | ]
DWR 3-32B5 132 l020S |050W 4301334207 |17371 |FEE Tow P’
LAKE FORK RANCH 32284 22 |020S |040W |4301334261 17409 [FEE  |OW P |
HANSON 3-9B3 ) 109 [020S [030W |4301350065 |17570 |FEE ow [P ]
DYE 2-28A1 28 |010S [010W 4301350066 |17531 |FEE ow P |
MEEKS 3-32A4 " {32 [010S |040W |4301350069 17606 FEE Jow b
[HANSON 4-8B3 |08 |020S |030W 4301350088 17571 FEE =~ OW P  C
LAKE FORKRANCH3-14B4 |14 |020S |040W 4301350007 17484 [FEE ow p
ALLEN 3-9B4 |09 |020S |040W 4301350123 |17656 FEE ow P |
HORROCKS 4-20A1 20 |010S |010W 4301350155 |17916 | FEE ow P | ]
HURLEY 2-33A1 133 _|010S 010W |4301350166 17573 [FEE ow P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO 3-20C5 20 |030S [050W (4301350190 17541 |FEE ow P ]
ALLEN 3-8B4 08 |020S |040W 4301350192 17622 |[FEE_|ow [P |
OWL and HAWK 3-10C5 B (10 |030S |050W 4301350193 |17532 | FEE ow P ’
OWL and HAWK 3-19C5 - 19 |030S [050W (4301350201 |17508 [FEE ow P T
EL PASO 420B5 " " 129 |020S [050W 4301350208 |17934 |FEE ow P C_|
DONIHUE 3-20C6 20 |030S |060W 4301350270 |17762 [FEE ow P )
HANSON 3-5B3 " los 1020S [030W 4301350275 17725 [FEE ow P ¢
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 |020S |050W 4301350302 [17668 |FEE T low P ]
REBEL 3-35B5 ] ~ I35 |020S (050W 4301350388 [17911 |FEE ow P Cc
FREEMAN 4-16B4 T 16 |020S |040W 4301350438 |17935 |Fee low Pl ]
WILSON 3-36B5 T 77 7 6 |020S |050W [4301350439 (17936 Fee 2 oW P 'C
EL PASO 321B4 21 10205 |040W |4301350474 [18123 |Fee Jow P c |
IORG 4-12B3 7712 [020S [030W [4301350487 |17981 [Fee ow P [
CONOVER 3-383 o 03 |020S |030W 4301350526 [18122[Fee __1OW [P Ic |
ROWLEY 3-16B4 B 16 [020S |040W |4301350569 | 18151 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTS 3-14B3 ) 14 0205 |030W 4301350570 18366 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTER 4-27B5 27 020S |050W 4301350571 |99999 |Fee ow P c ]
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 |020S |040W 4301350572 | 18152 |Fee “low P c
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 |020S |040W 4301350707 | 18270 |Fee ow P ¢ |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-25B4 T |25 020S|040W [4301350711 | 18220 |Fee T Tlow P ¢
LAKE FORK RANCH 42384 23 (0205 |040W 4301350713 |18271 |Fee —ow h{d ic
LAKE FORK RANCH4-1584 1150208 |040W |4301350715 | 18314 Fee Jow E Cle ]
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-24B4 124 |020S [040W 4301350716 |18269 Fee CJow TP e
GOLINSKI 1-8C4 T |08 |030S |040W 4301350986 18301 [Fee 2 ___OW P C |
J ROBERTSON 1-1B1 ] /01 |020S |010W 4304730174 |5370 |FEE ow P o
TIMOTHY 1-8B1E 08 [020S [010E |4304730215 1910 FEE oW P j
MAGDALENE PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E (34 [010S |010E [4304730241 785 |FEE jow P T
NELSON 131A1E © 731 0105 [010E |4304730671 830 FEE ow [p 1]
[ROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E |24 |010S 010E 14304730707 840 |FEE TTow P ,,,
H D LANDY 1-30A1E o 30 |010S |[010E |4304730790 845 |FEE oW P 1
WALKER 1-14A1E 14 |010S |010E 4304730805(855 |FEE oW [P | |
BOLTON2-29A1E |29 |010S[010E [4304731112[900 |FEE ow [P
PRESCOTT1-3521  [35 [010N|010W 4304731173 (1425 [FEE oW P | |
BISELGURR 11-1 11 0105 |010W 4304731213 |8438 |FEE Tow P ]
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E =~ 122 ,010S 010E 4304731265915 |[FEE ~~ OW P N
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 7 T2 ]010S [010W 14304731295 (920 |FEE ow p

FOWLES 1-26A1 |26 1010S |010W |4304731296 |930 |FEE ow P
BRADLEY23-1 - 23 |010S |010W |4304731297 (8435 FEE = IOW P
BASTIAN1-2A1 02 [010S [010W 4304731373 |736 |FEE low [P T
DRLONG2-19AME 19 i010S |010E |4304731470 9505 FEE ow
DMOON 1-23Z1 |23 010N |010W 4304731479 |[10310[FEE ~~|OW P
O MOON 2-26Z1 |26 |010N |010W 14304731480 10135 FEE - ow P |
LLAD225A1  "]25 |010S|010W 4304731797 10790|/FEE _ OW P L
LANDY 2-30A1E 30 |010S |010E 4304731895 11127/FEE oW P
WINN P2-381E 103 [020S |010E 4304732321 | 11428 |FEE Clow P
BISEL.GURR2-11A1 711 [010S 010W 4304735410 |14428/FEE OW P
FLYING J FEE 2-12A1 12 10105 [010W 14304739467 | 16686 | FEE oW P
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El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy £E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 2-14B1_[14 1020S [010W (4304739591 [16546[FEE  OW [P j
OBERHANSLY3-11A1 111 ]010S |010W (4304739679 17937 |[FEE | ow P I
DUNCAN2-34A1 134 1010S 010W |4304739944 17043 |FEE - ow P

BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 |010S |010W (4304739961 16791/FEE low P |
KILLIAN 3-12A1 112 |010S |010W |4304740226 17761 /ML39760 @ [OW P I
WAINOCO ST 1-14B1 ~ 7144 1020 [010W 4304730818 (1420 |ML24306-A [OW P |
UTAHSTUTE1-35A1 135 ,010S 010W 4304730182 5520 |ML-25432 = OW P | |
STATE 1-19A4 |19 |010S |040W 4301330322 9118 ML-27912  |OW P | |
FEDERAL2-28E19E 128 |050S |190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 |OW P | |
[FEDERAL 1-28E19E - 28 |050S [190E |4304730175 5680 |UTU143512 |OW [P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 103 [010S |020W 4301320316 |5877 |FEE ow PA |
WH BLANCHARD2-3A2 |03 |010S |020W 4301330008 5775 |FEE ow PA
YACK U 1-7A1 - 07 |010S|010W |4301330018(5795 FEE ~ OW [PA '
JAMESPOWELL3 113 010S |020W 4301330024 {8305 |FEE WD PA ]
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 |010S |010W |4301330026 5800 [FEE =~ OW |PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY18A2 08 |010S |020W 4301330036 5975 [FEE _  [OW  [PA
BLEAZARD1-18B4 118 020S |040W [4301330059 |11262 FEE ow |PA

OLSEN 1-27A4 |27 |010S |040W /4301330064 1565 FEE =~ OW |PA | |
EVANS 1-31A4 - 31 010S 040W 4301330067 |6330 |FEE ow IPA | ]
HAMBLIN 1-26A2 26 |010S [020W [4301330083 2305 |FEE ow PA | |
HARTMAN1-31A3 131 |010S |030W 4301330093 |10700 |FEE ow PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330097 5725 |FEE ow @7 e W
POWELL 1-33A3 33 |010S |030W |4301330105/4526 FEE  IOW PA |
LOTRIDGE GATES1-383 03 |020S 030W 4301330117 1625 [FEE _  |OW PA | |
REMINGTON 1-34A3 134 |010S |030W 14301330139 |1670 |FEE . ow [PA |
ANDERSON1-28A2 28 1010S 020W 4301330150,5895 |FEE . |OW |PA | = |
RHOADES MOON 1-35B5 35 [020S [050W 14301330155 |5270 |FEE ow PA ]
JOHN 1-382 o 03 |020S |020W |4301330160(5765 FEE ~  |OW |PA |
SMITH 1-6C5 o6 [030S 050w [4301330163 |5385 |FEE _jow PA |
HORROCKS FEE 1-3A1 |03 [010S[010W[4301330171|5505 FEE ___ OW PA | |
WARREN1-32A4 32 1010S |040W 4301330174 9139 FEE  ~ |OW  PA
JENSENFENZEL 1-20C5 |20 [030S |050W 4301330177 4730 [FEE ~  [OW  |PA e
MYRINRANCH1-13B4 13 |020S |040W 4301330180 |[4524 |FEE _ow PA |
BROTHERSON 12784 7sz 020S |040W [4301330185 1775 |FEE ow PA | |
JENSEN 1-31A5 131 1010S [050W [4301330186 |4735 |FEE ow PA |
ROBERTSON1-28A2 129 010S [020W |4301330189 [4740 |[FEE @ﬂ,, PA ]
WINKLER1-2843 128 {010S |030W [4301330191 |5465 |FEE oW |PA | ,
CHENEY1-33A2 "33 |010S|020W 4301330202[1750 [FEE __ [OW _ [PA |
JLAMICQ STATE1-6B1 |06 [020S [010W |4301330210|5730 |FEE oW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 110 [020S |020W 4301330215 5700 |[FEE ow  [PA 1
REEDER 1-178B5 - 17 |020S |050W (4301330218 5460 |FEE - low PA ]
ROBERTSONUTE1-2B2 02 |020S [020W |4301330225/1710 FEE = 1OW IPA L; ]
HATCH 1-5B1 .~ |05 ]020S 010W 4301330226 5470 FEE =~ |OW |PA
BROTHERSON 1-22B4 - fﬂ 020S |040W 4301330227 (5935 FEE ~ low |PA I
ALLRED 1-16A3 - 16 |010S |030W [4301330232 |1780 |FEE oW  PA 1
BIRCH 1-35A5 35 |010S [050W 4301330233 9116 FEE | OW [PA [
MARQUERITEUTE1-882 /08 |020S [020W [4301330235(9122 FEE = |OW  |PA |
BUZZI1-11B2 11 [020S|020W 4301330248(6335 [FEE |OW |PA | |
SHISLER 1-3B1 77,77@ 1020 [010W 14301330249 (5960 FEE OW PA 1 B
TEW 1-1B5 o1 Jo20S 050w 4301330264 (5580 FEE |OW |PA | |
EVANSUTE1-19B3 |19 |020S |030W 4301330265 (1870 [FEE _‘PQV!_ PA
SHELL2-27A4 " " '27 1010S|040W 4301330266 1776 [FEE WD [PA [
DYE 1-29A1 ) B |29 |010S |010W |4301330271 /99990 FEE o ow PA
VODA UTE 1-4C5 S ‘¥04 030S |050W 14301330283 4530 FEE ow |pPA |
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 Tz_é 010S |040W [4301330292 9114 FEE |OW |PA | |
MEAGHER14B2 104 |020S |020W 4301330313 8402 FEE =~ |OW JPA
NORLING19B1 109 |020S 010W 4301330315 1811 |[FEE ) }9\{\( [PA

S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 '09 '030S |050W 14301330316 |5940 |FEE OW PA



E! Paso E7 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIMOTHY 1-00A3 09 010S [030W 4301330321 10883 |FEE ow__ [PA__ |
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 |010S |050W 4301330323 9115 |FEE OW PA )
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 |020S |020W 4301330325 9121 |[FEE _|OW PA |
PHILLIPS UTE 1-3C5 03 |030S [050W (4301330333 1816 |FEE Jow |pA ]
[ELLSWORTH 1-2084 T |20 020S |040W |4301330351(6376 |[FEE _ |OW _ PA
LAWSON128A1 28" [010S [010W [4301330358 (5015 [FEE  |OW |PA B
AMES 1-23A4 723 |010S [040W (4301330375 1901 |FEE ow pa T
HORROCKS 1-6A1 06 |010S [010W 4301330390 5675 |FEE oW [PA |
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 [030S [050W |4301330393 [5565 [FEE oW |PA |
GOODRICH 1-18B2 18~ |020S |020W 4301330397 |5485 |FEE “jow PA i
SWD POWELL 3 7713 |010S|020W 4301330478 [10708/FEE WD _PA | |
BODRERO 1-1583 115 |020S |030W 4301330565 [4534 |FEE OW |PA B
MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 ~ 7 /30 |[030S |040W 4301330576 |2360 |FEE OW |PA 7
DUNCAN2:9B5 109 |020S|050W 4301330719 |5440 |FEE Tlow T PA T
FISHER 1-16A4 ~ 116 |010S [040W 4301330737 2410 [FEE ____OW PA |
URRUTY 2-34A2 34 |010S [020W [4301330753 9117 |FEE ow [PA | ]
GOODRICH 1-24A4 ) 24 |010S [040W [4301330760 2415 |FEE ow PA
CARL SMITH 2-25A4 25 |010S|040W 4301330776 9136 |FEE “low  PA |
ANDERSON 1-A30B1 ~ |30 020S [010W |4301330783 [9137 |FEE low A T
CADILLAC 3-6A1 06 |010S 010W 4301330834 6316 [FEE __ |OW  |PA )
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 131 |010S [010W (4301330836 [8439 |FEE ow [PA | ]
[REESE ESTATE 2-1082 10 |020S [020W 4301330837 [2417 FEE oW PA | ]
CLARK 2-9A3 T 09 [010S |030W 4301330876 [2416 |FEE ow [PA ]
JENKINS 3-16A3 16 |010S |030W 4301330877 |9790 |FEE ow PA |
CHRISTENSEN 2-26A5 26 |010S [050W (4301330905 10710 FEE ____|OW  PA |
FORD 2-36A5 T 7 36 |010S |050W [4301330911]9630 |[FEE ow [PA |
MORTENSEN2-32A2 /32 0105 [020W |4301330029 (9486 |FEE oW PA -
WILKERSON 1-20Z1 120 [010N|010W [4301330042 5452 [FEE __ |OW _PA |
UTE TRIBAL24A3S 04 [010S [030W (4301330950 |10230 [FEE ow A |
OBERHANSLY 2-31Z1 31 |010N |010W 4301330970 9262 [FEE oW PA_ |
MORRIS2-7A3 07 [010S [030W (4301330977 9725 [FEE  |OW PA |
POWELL2-08A3 o8 [010S|030W 4301330979 10175 FEE  |OW |PA |
[FISHER 2-6A3 7 oe 0105 [030W [4301330984 [10110 [FEE ow A ||
JACOBSEN2-12A4 " ""42 [010S 040W 4301330985 10480 [FEE  IOW [PA | |
CHENEY 2-33A2 33 |010S |020W 4301331042 10313 [FEE ow [PA
HANSON TRUST 2-20A3 29 [010S|030W [4301331043/5306 [FEE |OW _ PA |
BURTON 2-15B5 15 |020S |050W |4301331044 [10205 [FEE oW [PA
EVANS-UTE 2-17B3 17 |020S |030W [4301331056 (10210 FEE __ |OW _ IPA ]
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 20 020S [040W 4301331090(5336 FEE _ |OW  PA -
REMINGTON 2-34A3 7 134 |010S [030W |4301331091 1902 [FEE __[OW PA |
WINKLER 2-28A3 |28 |010S|030W |4301331108 [4519 |FEE ow PA | ]
TEW 2-10B5 10 0205 |050W |4301331125 1751 FEE _ |OW _ |PA )
LINDSAY 2-33A4 _ ,A, 33 |010S [040W [43013311411756 [FEE _OW |PA_ | ]
FIELDSTED 228A4 28 (0105 [040W [4301331293 (10665 FEE  |[OW |PA | |
POWELL 4-13A2_ 13 [010S [020W |4301331336 | 11177 |FEE GW PA |
DUMP 2-20A3 S 20 [010S [030W [4301331505 | 11691 |FEE oW  [PA
[SMITH 2X-23C7 __ 23 |030S |070W |4301331634 12382)FEE D  PA | |
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 |010S |020W 14301331872 11928 [FEE ow PA |
TODDUSAST12B1 02 |020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE ~~  |OW  [PA

STATE 1-7B1E o7 |020S|010E |4304730180|5566 [FEE _ |ow [PA |
BACON 1-10B1E 10 |020S [010E 14304730881 5550 [FEE  |OW PA | |
PARIETTE DRAW 2844 28 [040S [010E 14304731408 (4537 FEE ow  PA |
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 |020S 010E 4304731840 4960 |FEE ow ~PA | |
STATE 2-35A2 ] 135 010S |020W 4301330156 4715 |ML-22874 _ |OW _ @@M N
UTAH STATE L B 1-11B1 |11 [020S |010W 4304730715530 |ML23655  |OW  [PA B
STATE 1-8A3 |08 0105 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316  [OW  PA
UTAHFEDERAL 12481 124 |020S [010W 4304730220 590 |ML26079  [OW  PA |
CEDAR RIM 15 '34_|030S [0B0W 14301330383 |6395 [14-20-462-1329 [OW 'S

7



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL 2-24C7 — |24 [030S [070W [4301331028 | 10240 |14-20-H62-1135 OW __|S 7
CEDARRIM 12 28 |030S [060W 4301330344 6370 |14-20-H62-1323 [OW  [S
CEDAR RIM 16 " |33 |030S [060W [4301330363 6390 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |S

SPRING HOLLOW 2-3473 34 |010N |030W 4301330234 5255 |14-20-H62-1480 OW | )
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 17 |020S |[030W [4301330274 5335 |14-20-H62-1733[OW S | |
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4G_ o1 |020S [040W [4301331197 | 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW  |S
UTE 3-1283 ) 12 [020S [030W |4301331379 |11490 |14-20-H62-1810 [OW  [S ,
UTETRIBAL94B1 |04 |020S [010W (4301330194 5715 [14-20-H62-1969/OW S | |
UTETRIBAL221B6 |21 [020S [060W 4301331424 11615 |14-20-H62-2489 |OW  |S )
UTE 1-33B6 ) ] "33 |020S [060W [4301330441 1230 |14-20-H62-2493 |OW IS

UTE22285 22 1020S [050W [4301331122 (10453 [14-20-H62-2509 OW S | |
UTE 1-18B1E 118 ]020S |010E |4304730969 [9135 |14-20-H62-2864 OW _ |S ]
LAUREN UTE 123A3 |23 ]010S [030W 4301330895 [9403 |14-20-H62-3981 OW (S _

UTE 2-28B6 T |28 [020S [060W [4301331434 [11624 |14-20-H62-4622 [OW | o
UTE127B6X |27 1020S |060W 4301330517 [11166 |14-20-H62-4631 [OW 'S )
UTE 22786 | 127 [020S |060W 4301331449 11660 |14-20-H62-4631 OW S o
CEDAR RIM 10-15C6 - 15 |030S |060W 4301330328 6365 |14-20-H62-4724 OW  |S |
UTE 5-30A2 ~ |30 |010S 020W 4301330169 [5910 [14-20-H62-4863 [OW  |S B
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) , 24 |030S |060W |4301330298 [4533 |14-20-H624866 OW | | |
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 1307 ]030S |050W |4301330475 |665 | 14-20-H62-4876 [OW  |S

SMB 1-10A2 - 10 |010S |020W |4301330012 |5865 |FEE ow s | ]
KENDALL 1-12A2 - 12 |010S[020W [43013300135875 FEE ___ |OW S T
CEDARRIM 2 B 20 |030S |060W [4301330019 6315 |FEE ow | o
URRUTY29A2 ~ 109 [010S [020W |4301330046 [6856 |FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 14 |020S |040W |4301330051 [1535 |FEE ow s 7
RUST 14B3 ] 04 |020S |030W 4301330063 [1575 [FEE ow [s | ]
MONSEN 1-21A3 21 010S |030W [4301330082 [1590 |FEE oW s 1
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 ) 10 |020S [040W 4301330110 1614 (FEE oW |8 T
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 |020S [050W [4301330124 (1645 |FEE oW [s ]
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 "~ 116 020S [040W [4301330192[1735 [FEE ____ |[OW S

MARSHALL 1-20A3 20 |010S |030W |4301330193 9340 |FEE ow s )
[CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 317 [020S [040W |4301330198 [4745 |FEE ~low s
ROPER 1-14B3 ) 114 |020S[030W 4301330217 (1850 |FEE ow [s | ]
BROTHERSON 1-24B4 - 24 |020S |040W |4301330229 |1865 |[FEE oW S i
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 33 [010S[040W [4301330272([1680 [FEE __ |OW |S
BROTHERSON 1-2384 123 |020S |040W 4301330483 (8423 |FEE ow s~ | ]
SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 08 |030S [050W [4301330543 |5495 |FEE ow s T
VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 19 |030S |050W (4301330553 (5650 |FEE ~jow [s }
HANSEN 1-16B3 16 [020S |030W 4301330617 |9124 |FEE ow s
BROTHERSON 1-25B4 ) 25 |020S [040W 4301330668 9126 |FEE ow "is ]
POWELL2-33A3 - 33 |010S [030W [4301330704 [2400 |FEE ow s | ]
BROWN2-28B5 28 |020S [050W [4301330718 9131 |[FEE OW s ]
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 7716 |o10s1010W [4301330782[8443 FEE __|OW S )
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 |010S [040W |4301330817 [9345 |FEE oW s B
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 |010N [010W [4301330884 [936 |FEE ow s |
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 7127 |010S]040W [4301330915(9632 FEE  |OW S )
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 B |23 [020S |050W |4301330917 [9600 |FEE ow [ )
TIMOTHY 3-18A3 18 |010S [030W 4301330940 (9633 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 103 [020S |040W 4301331008 (10165 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 |020S [040W 4301331086(1782 FEE ___OW 8 |
MILES 2-35A4 135 |010S |040W |4301331087 |1966 |FEE ow 1§ T ]
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 ] |17 020S |040W 4301331089 [1696 |FEE ow s T
RUST 2-36A4 |36 |010S |040W 4301331092[1577 [FEE ____ ow s |
EVANS 2-19B3 19 10205 [030W 4301331113 1777 |FEE ow s N
FARNSWORTH 2-1285 " 112 [020S [050W 4301331115 [1646 |FEE oW [S N
CHRISTENSEN34B4 04 |020S|040W 4301331142 10481 FEE  |OW S
ROBERTSON 229A2 29 1010S [020W [4301331150 | 10679 |FEE low s |
[CEDAR RIM 2A 20 [030S [060W 14301331172 110671 |FEE oW s

8



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31_[010S |030W |4301331243 [ 11026 |FEE SEE —
GOODRICH2-2B3 ] 02 |020S |030W 4301331246 | 11037 |FEE ow s )
JESSEN 2-21A4 21 |010S |040W |4301331256 | 11061 |FEE ~ low s
BROTHERSON 3-23B4 23 |020S [040W |4301331289 [11141 [FEE ow s

MYRIN RANCH 2-18B3 18 |020S |030W |4301331297 [11475 |FEE T low s
BROTHERSON 2-2B5 02 |020S [050W (4301331302 [11342 [FEE ow S ]
DASTRUP 2-30A3 30 |010S [030W (4301331320 [11253 |FEE ow s

YOUNG 2-30B4 30 |020S [040W 4301331366 | 11453 |FEE ow s

IORG 2-10B3 10 |020S |030W [4301331388 [11482 [FEE oW |s

MONSEN 3-27A3 27 |010S [030W 4301331401 |11686 |FEE low s
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 05 |020S [010E 4304732409 11481 FEE T Tlow I8

LARSEN 1-25A1 25 |010S [010W |4304730552 815 | FEE ow [TA

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S |010W 4304730569 820 FEE ow__ [TA




Sundry Nunber: 31998 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013308550000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
v’ ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE / RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
EP plans to recomplete to the Upper Green River. Please see attached Approved by the

procedure for details. Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: November 15, 2012

By: (\;\b‘/\ (L DM*«??('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/12/2012

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 2012




Sundry Nunber: 31998 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013308550000

Permanent plugback of the Lower Green River and Wasatch formations will require 100’
minimum cement plug at approximately 9400'.

Commingling of Upper Green River with Lower Green River/Wasatch formations cannot take
place without first meeting the requirements of R649-3-22.

RECEI VED: Nov. 15, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 31998 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

Brotherson 2-2B4 UGR Recom Summary Procedure

e POOH w/Rods & pump, Release anchor, POOH w/tubing string

e Circulate & Clean wellbore

e RIH with 7”CIBP, set plug at ~8,100’, dump bail 10’ cement on top (No intention to
permanently abandon lower perfs)

e Perforate new UGR interval from ~6,900" — 7,900’

e Acidize perforations with 60,000 gals of 15% HCL

e Leave CIBP @ ~8,100’

e RIH w/tubing, pump & rods

e C(lean location and resume production

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 34932 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013308550000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

J SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/21/2012

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

ACIDIZE

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

CHANGE WELL STATUS

DEEPEN

OPERATOR CHANGE

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

TUBING REPAIR

I 0 O I N
Ooooogoggo

WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION l:‘

ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE / RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL

SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Please see attached for details.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
March 05, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Maria S. Gomez

PHONE NUMBER
713 997-5038

TITLE
Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
2/22/2013

RECEI VED: Feb. 22, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 34932 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

Brotherson 2-2B4 UGR Recom Summary Procedure

e POOH w/Rods & pump, Release anchor, POOH w/tubing string

e Set CIBP @ 8100’ & dumped 2 sx of cement on top. TOC @ 8090’.

e Pressure tested casing and CIBP to 500#. Bled to zero in 3 minutes. Several leaks on
casing valve flanges.

e Replaced ring gasket and installed valve. Tested to 500#. Zero loss in 15 minutes.

e Set CBP @ 7900’

e Perforated 7706’ to 7868’ (open hole) (7696’ — 7858’ cased-hole depth), 162" with 69
shots.

e Acidized with 15000 gallons of 15% HCL.

e Drilled out CBP @ 7900’.

e RIH with tubing, pump and rods.

e Resumed production.

RECEI VED: Feb. 22, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 36374 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013308550000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE [ RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: [ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION ¥ omher OTHER: IPump Change |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: April 04, 2013

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/4/2013

RECEI VED: Apr. 04, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 36374 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

Brotherson 2-2B4 Procedure Summary

e POOH w/rods & pump

e Acidize existing perfs w/ 7,500 gal 15% HCI.
e RIH w/ rod string & pump.

e C(Clean location and resume production

RECEI VED: Apr. 04, 2013



Sundry Nunber :

58497 APl \el |

Nunber :

43013308550000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013308550000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

PHONE NUMBER:

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/5/2014

l:‘ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS

l:‘ DEEPEN

l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE

l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME

'/ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
l:‘ TUBING REPAIR

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

l:‘ ALTER CASING

l:‘ CHANGE TUBING

l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:|

l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT

D PLUG AND ABANDON

l:‘ RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
D VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

CONVERT WELL TYPE

|:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

D PLUG BACK

|:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Add perforation to the upper green river. See attached for

details.

Date:

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

December 03, 2014

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Maria S. Gomez

PHON
713 997-5038

E NUMBER |TITLE

Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
12/3/2014

RECEI VED: Dec. 03, 2014




Sundry Nunber: 58497 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013308550000

Permanent plugback of the Lower Green River and Wasatch formations requires a 100" minimum
cement plug at approximately 9400' and on existing CIBP @ 10931".

Commingling of Upper Green River with Lower Green River/Wasatch formations cannot take
place without first meeting the requirements of R649-3-22.

RECEI VED: Dec. 03, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 58497 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

Brotherson 2-2B4 UGR Test Recom Summary

Procedure

1. POOH with rods, tubing string and pump, inspect/Repair/Re-furbish as needed and test
to bring in working condition and put back on Rack. Replace any bad tubing.
Circulate & Clean wellbore
RIH with 4 1/2”CBP, set plug at ~7,100’, set 2" plug at ~ 7,110’ dump bail 10’ cement on
top
4. Stage1:
0 Perforate new UGR interval from ~6,909’ — 6,920’
0 With work string Acidize perforations with 5,000 gal of 15% HCL
0 Swab test to test for oil.
0 If zone productive in commercial quantities go to step 6. If zone water wet go to
step 5
5. Stage 2:
0 Set plug at 6,890’ dump bail 10’ cement on top
0 Perforate new UGR interval from ~6,780" — 6,786’
0 With work string Acidize perforations with 5,000 gal of 15% HCL
6. RIH w AL equipment.
7. And put well on production.
8. Clean location and resume production.

RECEI VED: Dec. 03, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 58497 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

E P E N E RGYA. Brotherson 2-2B4

Altamont Field, Duchesne County, Utah
Latitude = 40° 19’ 59.448” Longitude = 110° 18’ 24.948”
API #: 43-013-30855
Spud: March 8, 1984
Sec. 2-T25—-R4AW

Proposed Pumping Schematic as of Dec 2014

2-7/8" 6.5# 1.-80 Tubing —
9-5/8" 36# K-55 @ 6,495'

UGR Recom Perfs TOC - 6,900' - CBL - Apr '84
Dec '14 (Contingent on Phz 1 if no oil)

6,780' - 6,786' - (6'/18 Holes)
5,000 Gals 15% HCL

Squeeze Perfs - Feb '13
6,860" - 6,863" w/150sx

UGR Recom Perfs - Dec '14 (Phz 1)
6,909' - 6,920' - (7'/21 Holes)—>"
5,000 Gals 15% HCL

e o v

7" 26# CBP's at 7,100' & 7.110' w/ 10' cement.

UGR Recom Perfs - Dec '12 {_
7,706 - 7,868' - (23'/69 Holes) =
15,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP @ 8.100' w/10' Cement - Dec '12

LGR Recom Perfs - Nov '10
9,492' - 10,379' (33'/99 holes)
27,000 Gals 15% HCL

10, 416' - 10,909' (24'/72 holes)
20,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP @ 10,931' w/10' Cement - Nov '10

Top of Liner @ 11,029
LGR Perfs - Apr '87

10,940' - 11,697' (62'/186 holes)
24,000 Gals 15% HCL

J\

oA B

7" 26# S-95 @ 7,991' - Drift 6.151"
7" 29#% S-95 @ 11,256' - Drift 6.059"

Acid Treatment - Aug '96 :
10,940' - 12,623' (137'/411 holes)
12,000 Gals 15% HCL

\ [

Additional Perfs - May '84
11,713 - 12,623' (75'/225 holes)
35,000 Gals 15% HCL

1
AN

f_/

PBTD @ 12,654
CIBP @ 12,668' w/15' Sand - May '84

CIBP's @ 12,694' & 12,708' - May '84

Original Completion Perfs - Apr '84 _<
12,796' - 14,393' (101'/303 holes)
35,000 Gals 15% HCL

5" 18# N-80 SFJP @ 13,911' - Drift 4.151"
5" 18# S-95 SFJP @ 14,450’ - Drift 4.151"

RECEI VED: Dec. 03, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 58497 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

RECEI VED: Dec. 03, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013308550000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v‘( SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
v‘( REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Fished. Milled at fish. Drilled out 4’ cmt & CIBP @ TBGM 8108’. Cleaned Accepted by the
out scale @ ~10931'. EOT @ 10924’ and pumped 30 sx class G & Utah Division of
displaced. Tagged cmt top @ 10795’. POOH & EOT @ 9499’. Pumped 30 Qil, Gas and Mining
sx class G & displaced. Well on vacuum. Tagged cement plug top #1 @ FOR RECORD ONLY
10795’ but did not tag cmt plug #2. RIH with CIBP & set @ 9485'. EOT April 30, 2015
@ 9469’ & pumped 30 sx Class G & displaced. Tagged plug #2 @ 9382’.
Set CIBP @ 7140'. Dumped 10’ cmt on top of plug. Tested casing to
2000 psi — good test. Logged from 7100°-2800’. Estimated top of cmt
@ 3100'. Perf'd 6920’-6909’. Acidized with 5000 gal 15% HCL. 37
swab runs. Initial fluid level surface 400’, final fluid 3700’. Perf'd 6780-6786 and pumped 5000 gals
15% HCL acid. Recompletion unsuccessful.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/29/2015

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site BROTHERSON 2-2B4
Rig Name/No. Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start date 12/9/2014 End date 1/8/2015
Spud Date/Time 12/17/1983 uwi 002-002-S 004-W 30
Active datum KB @6,264.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 164066/52904 / BROTHERSON 2-2B4
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
12/11/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON UNSEATING PUMP, WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S, WHILE PUMPING 40 BBLS DWN CSG @ 210 DEG
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 06 P LD POLISH ROD, WORK PUMP OFF SEAT, FLUSH RODS W/ 50
BBLS 2% KCL, RETURNING RETURNS UP CSG TO PROD
FACILITY
8:30 11:00 2.50 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 93-1", 112-7/8", 100 3/4" RODS, LAT DWN 6 1 1/2" WT
BARS, PUMP & DIP TUBE, FLUSHING RODS AS NEEDED
11:00 12:30 1.50 WOR 16 P X OVER TO TBG EQUIP, NDWH, STRIP ON & NU 5K BOP, RU
WORK FLOOR & TBG TONGS
12:30 17:00 4.50 WOR 39 P RELEASE 7" TAC @ 7766', RU SCANNING EQUIP, TOOH

SCANNING 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG W/ 15 JTS YELLOW BAND,
LAYING DWN 21 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 BLUE BAND & 102 JTS
2-7/8" NULOCK TBG, SLIP TYPE ELEVATORS BROKE DWN WILL
HAVE A NEW SET IN MORNING, SECURE WELL SDFN

12/12/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOC, HOLD SAFETY MTG ON LAYING DWN TBG,
WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 24 P 0 PSI ON WELL, RU SCANNERS CONT SCANNING TBG OUT OF

HOLE, LD PROD BHA, RIG DWN TBG SCANNERS
TOTAL TBG SCANNED255 JTS 2-7/8"

15 JTS 2-7/8" YELLOW BAND

123 JTS 2-7/8" BLUE BAND

116 JTS 2-7/8" RED BAND

11:00 13:30 2.50 WOR 18 P MIRU CAT WALK, PIPE RACKS & UNLOAD 350 JTS NEW 2-7/8"
EUE L-80 TBG
13:30 17:30 4.00 WOR 24 P TALLY MU & RIH W/ 6" SHOE, 8' SHOE EXT, 4-3/4" BUMPER SUB,

4 4-3/4" DRILL COLLARS, 2-7/8" EUE X 3-1/2" IF X OVER,
TALLY PU & RIH W/ 132 JTS NEW 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, SECURE

WELL SDFN
12/13/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOC HOLD SAFETY MTG ON P.U. TBG WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 24 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CONT PU 110 JTS NEW 2-7/8" TBG TAG FILL @
8005' ON JT # 242
11:00 13:00 2.00 WOR 06 P RU POWER SWIVEL, CIRC GAS & OIL TO TREATER UNTIL CLEAN

February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 1 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
13:00 16:30 3.50 WOR 10 P CLEAN OUT FILL FROM 8005' TO 8102' TO FISH TOP ON JT #

245, WASH OVER RBP FROM 8102' TO 8103' FISH BEGAN
SPINNING, CHANGING WT ON SHOE, SLOWING PUMP RATE &
SWIVEL RPM, NO CHANGE

16:30 17:30 1.00 WOR 39 P CIRC TBG CLEAN,LD 1 JT W/ SWIVEL, RD POWER SWIVEL,
TOOH W/ 14 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, EOT @ 7674', SECURE WELL SDFN
12/14/2014 6:00 6:30 0.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON POWER
SWIVEL SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
6:30 16:00 9.50 WOR 18 P TIH W/ 7 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. RU POWER SWIVEL & BREAK

REVERSE CIRCULATION. TAG FISH TOP ON JT # 245, WASH
OVER RBP FROM 8103' TO 8104' FISH BEGAN SPINNING,
CHANGING WT ON SHOE, SLOWING PUMP RATE & SWIVEL
RPM, NO CHANGE

16:00 17:00 1.00 WOR 18 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN. RD POWER SWIVEL.TOOH W/ 7 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN. EOT 7674’
12/15/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVETY. SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND
12/16/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON STANDING BACK DRILL COLLARS,
WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 10:30 3.00 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, TOOH W/ 230 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, 4 4-3/4"

DRILL COLLARS, BUMPER SUB, 8' X 6" OD WASH OVER EXT &
6" OD SHOE ( SHOE WAS BALD)

10:30 13:30 3.00 WOR 39 P MU & RIH W/ NEW 6" OD SHOE, 8' X 6" OD WASH OVER EXT.,
BUMPER SUB, 4 4-3/4" D.C'S & 244 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG

13:30 16:30 3.00 WOR 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL, MU JT # 245 W/ SWIVEL, BEGIN CIRC, TAG
@ 8104' & BEGIN MILLING OVER FISH, MADE 6" TODAY

16:30 17:30 1.00 WOR 39 P CIRC TBG CLEAN, LD JT # 245 W/ P.S., RIG DWN P.S., TOOH W/
14 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, SECURE WELL SDFN

12/17/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON RU POWER SWIVEL, WRITE &

REVIEW JSA'S

7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, TIH W/ 14 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, RU POWER SWIVEL
& BEGIN CIRCULATING

8:30 16:30 8.00 WOR 10 P BEGIN MILLING OVER FISH TOP 8104' TO 8105' TBGM, FISH

BEGIN SPINNING, SLOW PUMP RATE, SWIVEL RPM & WEIGHT
ON MILL STILL NO TORQUE

16:30 17:30 1.00 WOR 39 P LD 1 JT W/ P.S., RIG DWN POWER SWIVEL, TOOH W/ 14 JTS

2-7/8" TBG SECURE WELL SDFN
12/18/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON ICE PLUGS IN PUMP LINES WRITE &

REVIEW JSA'S

7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, TIH W/ 14 JTS OUT OF DERRICK, RU POWER
SWIVEL MU 1 JT W/ SWIVEL, BEGIN CIRCULATING

8:30 13:30 5.00 WOR 10 P CONT WASHING OVER FISH TOP

13:30 16:00 2.50 WOR 39 P LD 1 JT 2-7/8" W/ SWIVEL, RD P.S., TOOH W/ 244 JTS 2-7/8"

TBG, 4 4-3/4" DRILL COLLARS, LAY DWN BUMPER SUB, 6"
SHOE EXT & 6" SHOE W/ FISH IN IT

16:00 17:00 1.00 WOR 39 P MU & TIH W/ 6-1/8" BIT, 3-1/2" IF X 3-1/2" REG X OVER, 4 4-3/4"
DRILL COLLARS, 3-1/2" IF X 2-7/8" EUE X OVER & 60 JTS 2-7/8"
EUE L-80 TBG SECURE WELL SDFN

12/19/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON PROPER PPE FOR THE JOB, WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CONT TIH W/ 184 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, RU POWER
SWIVEL
10:00 14:00 4.00 WOR 10 P MU 1 JT W/ SWIVEL, START CIRC, DRILL OUT 4' CMT & CIBP @

TBGM 8108', CIRC TBG CLEAN, RIG DWN POWER SWIVEL, PU
43 JTS 2-7/8" TBG & CHASE REMAINS OFCIBP IN HOLE, TAG @
9513'

February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 2 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
14:00 17:30 3.50 WOR 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL, START CIRCULATING, BEGIN DRILLING UP

REMAINS OF CIBP 9513' TO 9519', CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN RIG
DWN POWER SWIVEL TOOH W/ 10 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG
SECURE WELL, DRAIN PUMP & HARD LINE, SDFN

12/20/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOC, HOLD SAFETY MTG ON LOCK OUT TAG OUT,
WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 13:30 6.00 WOR 10 P 0 PSI ON WELL, TIH W/ 10 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, TAG @ 9519', RU

POWER SWIVEL, START CIRCULATING, DRILLING UP REMAINS
OF CIBP & SWIVELING DWN TO 10931' CLEANING OUT SCALE

13:30 15:00 1.50 WOR 06 P CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN
15:00 17:30 2.50 WOR 39 P RIG DWN POWER SWIVEL, TOOH W/ 114 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80
TBG, DRAIN PUMP & HARD LINE, SECURE WELL SDFN
12/21/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON, TOOH W/ TBG, WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S
7:30 11:00 3.50 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, TOOH W/ 218 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, 2-7/8"
X 3-1/2" IF X OVER, 4, 4-3/4" DRILL COLLARS, BIT SUB & 6-1/8"
BIT
11:00 15:00 4.00 WOR 39 P TIH W/ 330 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, SECURE WELL SDFW
12/22/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW
12/23/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON PUMPING CMT, WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 24 P 0 PSI ON WELL, PU 5 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, EOT @ 10924',
MIRU BAKER CMT EQUIP
9:00 10:30 1.50 WOR 18 P PRESSURE TEST PUMP LINES TO 3500 PSI, FILL WELL W/ 61

BBLS 2% KCL, PUMP 30 SX CLASS G CMT 1.15 YIELD @ 15.8 #
PER BBL, DISPLACE W/ 62.3 BBLS KCL, TOOH W/ 18 JTS 2-7/8"
TBG & REVERSE OUT W/ 90 BBLS 2% KCL

10:30 14:30 4.00 WOR 18 P WAIT ON CMT TO HARDEN

14:30 16:00 1.50 WOR 39 P TIHW/ 13 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, TAG CMT TOP @ 10795', POOH &
LAY DWN 39 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, EOT @ 9499’

16:00 17:30 1.50 WOR 18 P RU PUMP LINES PRESSURE TEST TO 3500 PSlI, FILL WELL W/ 6

BBLS 2% KCL, PUMP 30 SX CLASS G CMT 1.15 YIELD @ 15.8
#S PER BBLS, DISPLACE W/ 54 BBLS 2% KCL, POOH W/ 18 JTS
2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, EOT @ 8909', REVERSE OUT TBG W/ 82
BBLS 2% KCL, WASH UP CMT EQUIP, SECURE WELL SDFN

12/24/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON PU TBG OFF OF CAT WALK, WRITE
& REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 24 P WELL ON VACUME, RIH OUT OF DERRICK W/ 10 JTS 2-7/8" TBG,

PU 47 JTS 2-7/8" TBG & TAG CMT PLUG TOP # 1 @ 10795' ( DID
NOT TAG CMT PLUG # 2)

9:00 12:00 3.00 WOR 39 P TOOH & LD 40 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, STAND BACK IN DERRICK W/
290 JTS 2-7/8" TBG

12:00 13:30 1.50 WLWORK 27 P MIRU W.L. RIH W/ 5.875 OD GR/JB TO 9500', POOH & RIH W/ 7"
CIBP & SET @ 9485', POOH RIG DWN & MOVE OFF LOC W/ WIRE
LINE

13:30 13:30 0.00 WOR 39 P RIH OUT OF DERRICK W/ 290 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, EOT @
9469', SECURE WELL SDFN

12/25/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL, HOLD SAFETY MTG ON ICE PLUGS IN PUMP

LINES, WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S

7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 18 P MIRU PRO PETRO CMT EQUIP, FILL WELL W/ 6 BBLS 2% KCL,

PUMP 30 SX CLASS G NEAT CMT, 1.15 YIELD @ 15.8#,
DISPLACE TBG W/ 54 BBLS WATER, LD 4 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, TOOH
& STAND BACK IN DERRICK W/ 14 JTS 2-7/8" TBG

9:30 13:30 4.00 WOR 18 P WAIT ON CMT TO DRY
13:30 15:00 1.50 WOR 24 P RIH & TAG TOP OF CMT PLUG # 2 @ 9382', POOH & LAY DWN
70 JTS 2-7/8" TBG ONTO PIPE RACKS
February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 3 OienWeIIs
RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
15:00 16:30 1.50 WOR 39 P TOOH & STAND BACK IN DERRICK W/ 180 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80
TBG, EOT @ 1240', SECURE WELL SDFH
12/26/2014  6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFH
12/27/2014  6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON SLIPPERY SURFACES, WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 39 P 0 PSI ON WELL, CIRC OIL OUT OF WELL BORE W/ 60 BBLS 2%
KCL, TOOH W/ 38 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG
9:00 13:30 4.50 WLWORK = 27 P RU WIRE LINE, RIH SET 7" CIBP @ 7140', DUMP BAIL 10' CMT ON

TOP OF PLUG, TEST CSG TO 2000 PSI GOOD TEST, RIH W/
CCL/CBL/GR TOOLS & LOG FROM 7100’ - 2800', EST TOP OF
CMT @ 3100, RIG DWN WIRE LINE, EMAIL LOGS OUT, SECURE

WELL SDFN
12/28/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON WIRE LINE WORK WRITE & REVIEW
JSA'S
7:30 10:30 3.00 WLWORK 21 P RU WIRE LINE LUBRICATOR, TEST TO 4500 PSI W/ HOT OIL

TRUCK GOOD TEST, RIH & PERF STG 1 PERFS FROM
6920'-6909' USING 3-1/8" TAG-RTG 22.7 GM CHARGES, 3 SPF
@ 120 DEG PHASING, STARTING PRESSURE 1000 PSI ENDING
PRESSURE 800 PSI, ALL PERFS WERE CORRELATED TO O.W.P.
4/12/1984 ACOUSTIC CEMENT BOND GAMMA RAY LOG, POOH
RIG DWN WIRE LINE EQUIP

10:30 10:30 0.00 WOR 24 P TALLY MU & RIH W/ 7" HD PKR, 2-7/8" +45 P.S.N., 3-1/2" EUE X
2-7/8" EUE X OVER, TALLY & PU 183 JTS 3-1/2" EUE P-110
WORK STRING TBG EOT @ 5878' , SECURE WELL & SDFW

12/29/2014 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY SDFW
12/30/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOC, HOLD SAFETY MTG ON ACIDIZING
OPERATIONS, WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 24 P THAW OUT WELL HEAD W/ HOT OILER STEAM HOSE, 0 PSI ON

WELL, PU 31 JTS 3-1/2" EUE P-110 WORK STRING TBG, PU 8' X
3-1/2" EUE P-110 TBG SUB, SET 7" HD PKR @ 6874' W/ 35K
COMPRESSION, MU 4" 10K FRAC VALVE, TEST CSG TO 2000
PSI FOR 15 MIN GOOD TEST

9:30 12:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P MIRU WEATHERFORD FRAC EQUIPMENT

12:00 14:00 2.00 STGO1 35 P BRK DWN STG 1 PERFS @ 3108 PSI @ 2BPM, ISIP 2471 PSI, FG .
79 TREAT PERFS W/ 5000 GALS 15% HCL ACID, FLUSH ACID 10
BBLS PAST BTM PERF W/ 72 BBLS 2% KCL, WHILE HOLDING
1500 PSI ON CSG, ISIP 2046 PSI, 5 MIN 1760 PSI, 10 MIN 1631
PSI, 15 MIN 1599 PSI, FG .73, AVG PSI 3514 PSI, MAX PSI 3837
PSI, AVG BPM 9 BPM, MAX BPM 11.8 BPM, 213 TOTAL BBLS TO
RECOVER, SHUT TBG IN W/ FRAC VALVE, BLEED OFF CSG &
SHUT CSG IN

14:00 16:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RIG DWN WEATHERFORD FRAC EQUIP & MOVE THEM OFF
LOCATION, INSTALL NIGHT CAPS IN TBG & CSG VALVES, RU
SWAB LUBRICATOR, SHUT DWN FOR NIGHT

12/31/2014 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON SWABBING OPERATIONS, WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 9:00 1.50 WOR 18 P THAW OUT 4" FRAC VALVE & CSG VALVES W/ HOT OILER

STEAM HOSE, 0 PSI ON SITBG & CSG

February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 4 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 62921 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
9:00 17:00 8.00 WOR 38 P RIG DWN 4" 10K FRAC VALVE, INSTALL 3-1/2" TIW VALVE &

SWAB TEE, PU SWAB LUBRICATOR & BEGIN SWABBING,
RECOVERED 194 BBLS FLUID W/ FINAL OIL CUT OF 5% IN 31
SWAB RUNS, INITIAL FLUID LEVEL SURFACE, FINAL FLUID
3000', FINAL PH 6 (NO COMMUNICATION DETECTED BETWEEN
CSG & TBG) LAY DWN SWAB LUBRICATOR, DOUBLE CHECK
PIPE RAMS WERE CLOSED, CLOSE TIW VAULVE, INSTALL
NIGHT CAPS ON TBG & CSG VALVES, DRAIN UP FLOW BACK

LINE, SDFN
1/1/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON SWABBING WELL.
OVERHEAD HAZARDS. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 17:00 9.50 WOR 38 P PU SWAB LUBRICATOR & BEGIN SWABBING, RECOVERED 213

BBLS FLUID W/ FINAL OIL CUT OF TRACE IN 37 SWAB RUNS,
INITIAL FLUID LEVEL SURFACE 400', FINAL FLUID 3700', FINAL
PH 7 (NO COMMUNICATION DETECTED BETWEEN CSG & TBG)
LAY DWN SWAB LUBRICATOR, DOUBLE CHECK PIPE RAMS
WERE CLOSED, CLOSE TIW VALVE, INSTALL NIGHT CAPS ON
TBG & CSG VALVES, DRAIN UP FLOW BACK LINE, SDFN

1/2/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY.
1/3/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION , HSM, TOOH W/ 3 1/2" TUBING
0 PSI SITP & SICP.
7:30 9:00 1.50 WBP 18 P HOT OILER UNTHAW WELL HEAD & TIW VALVE, RELEASE 7"
PACKER @ 6874'
9:00 11:30 2.50 WOR 39 P L/D 4 JTS 3 1/2" P-110 TBG, STAND BACK 210 JTS, L/D 3 1/2" X
2 7/8" EUE X/O SUB, 2 7/8" +45 SEAT NIPPLE, 7" HD PACKER
11:30 15:30 4.00 WLWORK 27 P MIRU THE PERFORATORS, RU WIRE LINE LUBRICATOR, RIH W/

7" 10 K CBP SET @ 6840', POOH, P/U BAILER RIH DUMP BAIL 10'
CMT ON CBP, POOH.
FILL CSG W/ 35 BBLS 2% KCL PSI TEST TO 2000#, NO LOSS IN
15 MIN.

15:30 17:00 1.50 WLWORK 21 P RU WIRE LINE LUBRICATOR, TEST TO 4500 PSI W/ HOT OIL
TRUCK GOOD TEST, RIH & PERF STG 2 PERFS FROM
6780'-6786" USING 3-1/8" TAG-RTG 22.7 GM CHARGES, 3 SPF
@ 120 DEG PHASING, STARTING PRESSURE 1000 PSI ENDING
PRESSURE 900 PSI, ALL PERFS WERE CORRELATED TO O.W.P.
4/12/1984 ACOUSTIC CEMENT BOND GAMMA RAY LOG, POOH
RIG DWN WIRE LINE EQUIP

17:00 18:00 1.00 WOR 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 7" 26# HD PACKER, 2 7/8" +45 SEAT NIPPLE, 2 7/8"
X 3 1/2" EUE X/O SUB 40 JTS 3 1/2" P-110 TBG, EOT @ 1300
SHUT & LOCK PIPE RAMS, CSG VALVES SHUT & NIGHT
CAPPED, TIW VALVE IN TBG, SHUT & CAPPED, SDFN.

( HOT OILER HEAT WORK TANK AND FRESH WATER FOR ACID)
2% KCL PUMPED = 100 BBLS

DIESEL USED = 88 GAL
PROPANE USED = 375 GAL

1/4/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, PUMPING ACID
SITP & SICP = SLIGHT BLOW
7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 39 P HOT OILER THAW OUT WELLHEAD & TIW.

EOT @ 1300', RIH W/ 170 JTS 23 1/2" P-110 TBG, P/U 8'-3 1/2"
P-110 TBG SUB, SET PACKER @ 6747', W/ 35K COMPRESSION,
INSTALL 4" 10K FRAC VALVE.

10:00 12:00 2.00 WOR 18 P MIRU WETHERFORD PUMPING EQUIPMENT
12:00 12:30 0.50 WOR 18 P FILL CSG W/ 5 BBLS, PSI TEST PACKER & CSG TO 1500#, 0
LOSS 15 MIN
SET CSG POP OFF FOR 1700#, HOLD 1500# ON CSG
February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 5 OienWeIIs
RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015
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CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
12:30 14:00 1.50 WBP 35 P HSM W/ WEATHERFORD, PSI TEST PUMP LINES TO 6000,

GOODTEST, BRK DOWN STAGE 2 PERFS 6780'-6786', .5 BPM @
3500 PSI, FG =.77, PUMP 5000 GAL ACID JOB, FLUSH 10 BBLS
INTO PERFS W/ 71 BBLS 2% KCL. 195 BBLS TO RECOVER, FG =
.78
ISIP = 2360 PSI
5 MIN = 2138 PSI
10 MIN = 2009 PSI
15 MIN = 1945 PSI
AVG RATE = 4.6 BPM
MAX RATE = 11.8 BPM
AVG PSI = 3500 PSI
MAX PSI = 4360 PSI
NO CHANGE IN CSG PSI DURING JOB.
14:00 15:00 1.00 WOR 18 P SHUT FRAC VALVE BLEED OFF PUMP LINES & CSG, R/D
WEATHERFORD.
TBG & CSG SHUT IN & NIGHT CAPPED.
PIPE RAMS SHUT & LOCKED, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 100 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 64 GAL
PROPANE USED = 150

1/6/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CT HOLD SAFETY MTG ON ICE PLUGS IN VALVES, WRITE &
REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 9:30 2.00 WOR 18 P THAW OUT TIW VALVE, CSG VALVE & BOP W/ HOT OILER

STEAM HOSE, SITP 1200 PSI & CSG 0 PSI, OPEN TBG TO FLOW
BACK TANK & BLEED OFF PRESSURE, RECOVERED 2 BBLS
WATER

9:30 11:00 1.50 WOR 18 P BREAK OUT 4" 10K FRAC VALVE & INSTALL TIW VALVE,WORK
PKR FREE & CIRCULATE 60 BBLS 2% KCL DWN TBG & UP THE
CSG TO FLOW BACK TANK

11:00 17:00 6.00 WOR 24 P TOOH LAYING DWN 210 JTS 3-1/2" P-110 WORK STRING TBG,
3-1/2" X 2-7/8" EUE X OVER, 2-7/8" +45 P.S.N. & 7" HD PACKER,
TIH & LAY DWN 4, 4-3/4" DRILL COLLARS, CLOSE & LOCK
BLIND RAMS, SHUT CSG VALVES & INSTALL NIGHT CAP, CREW
SHUT DWN FOR NIGHT

USED 100 GALS LPG TODAY
USED 70 GALS DIESEL TODAY
USED 85 BBLS 2% KCL TODAY

1/7/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL, HOLD SAFETY MTG ON RIH W/ TBG & CLEAN
WORK AREA, WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 11:30 4.00 WOR 39 P TALLY PU & RIH W/ PROD BHA, 5-3/4" NO-GO, 2-7/8" SOLID

PLUG, 2 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, 4-1/2" PBGA W/ DIP TUBE, 2'
X 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG SUB, 2-7/8" +45 P.S.N., 4' X 2-7/8" EUE
N-80 TBG SUB, 4 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG, 7" TRIPLE H TAC,
200 JTS 2-7/8" EUE L-80 TBG & MU 8' X 2-7/8" EUE N-80 TBG
SuB

11:30 13:30 2.00 WOR 16 P SET 7" TAC @ 6545', P.S.N. @ 6677' & EOT @ 6779', ND & STRIP
OFF 5K BOP, LD 2-7/8" X 8' TBG SUB, MU 5K B FLANGE & LAND
TBG IN 23K TENSION ON B FLANGE, NU WELL HEAD, MU 2-7/8"
PUMP T, RATIGANS & FLOW LINES, STEAM OFF WELL HEAD &
WORK EQUIP, X OVER TO ROD EQUIP

13:30 14:30 1.00 WOR 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL, RETURNING RETURNS UP
CSG TO FLOW BACK TANK

February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 6 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015
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21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
14:30 17:30 3.00 INARTLT 03 P PU PRIME & RIH W/ 2-1/2" X 1-3/4" X 38' RHBC WALS PUMP, PU

10, 1-1/2" WT BARS & RIH W/ 116-3/4" RODS & 89-7/8" RODS,
PICKING UP & LAYING DWN RODS AS NEEDED PER NEW ROD
STAR, PU POLISH ROD FOR NIGHT & SCREW IN STUFFING BOX,
SHUT 1" VALVE ON PUMP T & CSG VALVES INSTALLING NIGHT
CAPS FOR 2nd BARRIERS, SECURE WELL SDFN

75 BBLS 2% KCL
175 GALS OF LPG
75 GALS DIESEL USED TODAY

1/8/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HOLD SAFETY MTG ON RIH & LAYING DWN
RODS, WRITE & REVIEW JSA'S
7:30 11:00 3.50 INARTLT 03 P 0 PSI ON WELL, OPEN TBG, LAY DWN POLISH ROD, CONT RIH

W/ ATOTAL OF 93-1" RODS LAYING DWN 44-1" RODS,
THROUGH OUT THE 1" ROD TAPER AS PER NEW ROD STAR,
SPACE RODS OUT W/ 2-6', 1-4', 1-2' X 1" PONY RODS & NEW
1-1/2" X 40' POLISH ROD, SEAT PUMP, FILL TBG W/ 1 BBL,
STROKE TEST PUMP TO 1000 PSI, GOOD TEST

11:00 13:00 2.00 INARTLT 03 P RIG DWN RIG, SLIDE IN P.U. HANG OFF RODS, STROKE TEST
PUMPING UNIT, INSTALLALL BULL PLUGS IN VALVES ENDS,
TWOTP, RACK OUT PUMP & TANK, CLEAN UP TRASH OFF
LOCATION

13:00 15:30 2.50 MIRU 01 P ROAD RIG TO 4-32 B4, SPOT IN & RIG UP RIG, LEAVE WELL
FLOWING TO SALES FACILITY AS IT WAS, CREW SHUT DWN
FOR NIGHT

February 12, 2015 at 1:36 pm 7 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Apr. 29, 2015
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Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013308550000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002

PHONE NUMBER:
713 997-5038 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING
J NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: D CHANGE TUBING

5/1/2015
l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS
l:‘ SUBSEQUENT REPORT l:‘ DEEPEN l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT
Date of Work Completion:
l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE / PLUG AND ABANDON

0 [J probucTioN START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTION oF weLL siTE
SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: ]

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

Report Date:

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

|:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

D PLUG BACK

|:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached for details.

Approved by the

Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date:

June 11, 2015

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Maria S. Gomez

PHONE NUMBER
713 997-5038

TITLE

Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
4/9/2015

RECE| VED: Apr .

09, 2015
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UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013308550000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Amend Plug #2: Plug should be spotted a minimum of 200’ into stub (£3250’) to 2900’ to
isolate the Base of Moderately Saline Ground Water and the offset Salt Water Disposal zones as
required by R649-3-24-3.3. Approximately 93 sx of cement is required .

3. Amend Plug #3: A 300’ cement plug shall be balanced from 300’ to surface (124 sx) to isolate
the surface casing shoe and surface as required by R649-3-24-3.4 and 3.6.

4. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.
5. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface.
6. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 — Well Site Restoration.
7. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

8. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

9. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Wl |l Nunber: 43013308550000

V232015 Who3 045 S Wellbore Diagram 263
Location: Sec:2 T:2S R:4W Spot: NESW String Information
Coordinates: X: 558810 Y: 4464965 . Bottom Diameter Weight Length pue! Jrs‘
Field Name: ALTAMONT String  (tsub)  (nche) b/ ) Q‘/c )
HOL1 298 17.5
County Name: DUCHESNE COND 298 13.375 68
HOL2 6495 12.25
[ O\ X P(.,j B3 sure 6495 9.625 36 2.%Y
i
18 | Cement from 298 f. to surface BCO" ~+o SJ(L gsi ili(l)zf)l zz;:
Hole 175 in. @ 298 . 2o /(1039)(20)= '
f—_. (24 S’Q CIBP 7110 9.625
) mcmum from 6495 ft. to surface HOL3 11256 8.75
Conductor: 13.375 in. @ 298 ft. PROD 11256 7 26 4SS
L1 14450 5 18
\ CIBP 12708 5
" 4250  CIBP 12668, |
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Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

EP =
3/16/2015

Brotherson 2-2B4

API # 43-013-30855
Altamont Field — Duchesne County, Utah
SW/4 — NE/4
Section2, T2S,R4W
1371 FSL & 1498’ FWL
Lat. =40° 19’ 59.448” Long. =-110° 18’ 24.948"

Regulatory
Plug & Abandonment Procedure
AFE- Pending
Production Engineer:
Jacklyn Wilken — PDP Engineer Date
Approved By:
Sr. Production Engineer:
Iva Tomova — Western Division Date
Operations Supervisor:
Troy Anderton —Western Division Date
Engineering Manager:
Mitch Scarbrough —Westem Division Date

Distribution (Approved copies):

lva Tomova

Troy Anderton

Joe Sager

Mitch Scarbrough

Well File (Central Records) / Altamont Office (Well Files)

RECEI VED: Apr. 09, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
E P N
3/16/2015
PROJECT
SHELL OIL COMPANY
T2 S, R4 W, USBEM Well location, BROTHERSON
#2-284, located as shown in
the NE |/4 SWI/4 Section 2, T2S,
S 89%44'W R4W, US.B.&M. Duchesne County,
=73 Utah,
=
g8 P 2}2
a8 gl
(]
CERTIFICATE
BROTHERSON #2- 284 THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED ER0M .
. FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER My
- Elev. Ungraded Ground-6240' GEET oF Mt ampNLEIGE WD pELIER T B CREET TR THC
(Comp. W
REGISTER LAND SURVEYOR
- REGISTRATION N2 2454
- STATE OF UTAH
38 -
= Umntas ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
RO BOX Q ~ 85SOUTH -~ 200 EAST
8012 VErNAL, UTAH - 84078
589°48°W SCALE i DATE
1" = 1000 11 /9/83
PARTY REFEE_ENCES
X = Section Corners Locoted LI L S0 Plal
WEATHER FILE
Falr . SHELL OIL

CURRENT STATUS:

CBP was placed at 6,840’ above squeezed perfs and then perfs were added from 6,780’ to 6,786’ in
December 2014.

BHT: Unknown Casing Fluid: Produced Fluid
BHP: Unknown TD: 14,450’
SITP: Unknown PBTD: 6,830’
SICP: Unknown KB: 6,264’
GL: 6,240’
KB-GL: 24’
2

RECE| VED: Apr .

09, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

EP ENERGY#

Current WBD

EP E N E RGYA Brotherson 2-2B4

Altamont Field, Duchesne County, Utah
Latitude = 40° 19’ 59.448” Longitude = 110° 18’ 24.948”
API #: 43-013-30855
Spud: March 8, 1984
Sec. 2-T2S—-R4W

Current Pumping Schematic as of March 2014

TUBING DETAIL

~200 jts 2-7/8" 6.5# L-80 EUE Thg
Tubing Anchor/ Catcher @ 6,545’
4 jts 2-7/8" 6.5# L-80 tubing
Seating Nipple @ 6,677

2' Tubing Sub

4 1/2" x 30" PBGA

2 jt 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 Mud Anchor
Solid Plug

EOT @ 6,777

TOC - 3,100' - CBL - Dec '14

9-5/8" 36# K-55 @ 6,495

ROD DETAIL

1-1/2" x 40' Polished Rod
2',4'"& 2- 6' X 1" EL Pony Rod
49 (1,225') - 1" EL Rods

89 (2,225') - 7/8" EL Rods

116 (2,900") - 3/4" EL Rods

10 (150") - 1 1/2" Sinker "K" Bars
2 1/2" x 1-3/4" x 38' Insert Pump

UGR Recom Perfs Dec '14
6,780' - 6,786 - (6'/18 Holes)
5,000 Gals 15% HCL

Squeeze Perfs - Feb '13 ——> 7" 26# CBP at 6.840' w/ 10' cement. - Dec ‘14

6,860 - 6,863" w/150sx
UGR Recom Perfs - Dec '14
6,909 - 6,920" - (7'/21 Holes)

5,000 Gals 15% HCL

\7" 26# CBP's at 7,100' & 7,110" w/ 10' cement.

UGR Recom Perfs - Dec '12

7,706' - 7,868' - (23'/69 Holes)

15,000 Gals 15% HCL

Cement plugs @ 10.800-10.921'
& 9,380-9,500'

LGR Recom Perfs - Nov '10
9,492' - 10,379' (33'/99 holes)
27,000 Gals 15% HCL

10, 416' - 10,909' (24'/72 holes)
20,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP @ 10,931' w/10' Cement - Nov '10

Top of Liner @ 11,029’
LGR Perfs - Apr '87
10,940' - 11,697' (62'/186 holes) <
24,000 Gals 15% HCL

7" 26# S-95 @ 7,991' - Drift 6.151"
7" 29# S-95 @ 11,256' - Drift 6.059"

Acid Treatment - Aug '96 :
10,940 - 12,623' (137'/411 holes)
12,000 Gals 15% HCL

Additional Perfs - May '84
11,713 - 12,623' (75'/225 holes)
35,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP @ 12,668' w/15' Sand - May '84

Original Completion Perfs - Apr '84
12,796' - 14,393' (101'/303 holes)
35,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP's @ 12,694' & 12,708' - May '84

5" 18# N-80 SFJP @ 13,911" - Drift 4.151"
5" 18# S-95 SFIP @ 14,450' - Drift 4.151"

RECEI VED: Apr. 09, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

EP ENERGY#

Proposed P&A

EP E N E RG $. Brotherson 2-2B4

Altamont Field, Duchesne County, Utah
Latitude = 40° 19’ 59.448" Longitude = 110° 18’ 24.948"
APl #: 43-013-30855
Spud: March 8, 1984
Sec. 2-T25-R4W

Proposed P&A Wellbore chemaﬁc as of Mar 2015

N O e
[

JRAL S et Balanced Cement Plug from surface to 150°

*Cement to be used: 16.4ppg, 1.05 yield Class G cement

Plug Summary 3 Balanced Cement Plug from 2,900" to 3,050°
Bottom| Top Length |BBELs| SX — Cut Casing at 3,000

Plug# 3 150 0 150 12 62 TOC -3.100"- CBL - Dec '14

Plug#2 | 3050 | 2900 150 10 52

plugg1 | 6700 6300 400 15 32

#100% excess in OH Total: 37

Top of Green River @ 5,712

9-5/8" 36% K-55 @ 6,495"

Balanced Cement Plug from 6,300" to 6,700"
UGR Recom Perfs Dec '14 7" 26# CBP at 6,700'
6,780"- 6,786" - (6718 Holes)

5,000 Gals 15% HCL

Squeeze Perfs - Feb 13—

6,860 - 6,863 w/150sx

UGR Recom Perfs - Dec '14 (Phz 1
6,909"- 6,920 - (7¥21 Holes)

5,000 Gals 15% HCL

7" 26% CBP at 6.840"w/ 10" cement. - Dec '14

7" 26% CBP at 7,140 w/ 40" cement. - Dec '14

UGR Recom Perfs - Dec '12
7,706" - 7,868 - (23°/69 Holes)
15,000 Gals 15% HCL
Cement plu 9,382-9.485"- Dec '14

LGR Recom Perfs - Nov 10
9,492° - 10,379 (337799 holes)
27,000 Gals 15% HCL

10, 416° - 10,909' (24'/72 holes)
20,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP (@ 9.485° - Dec '14

Cement plu 10.795-10.921" - Dec 14

CIBP @ 10,931 - Nov '10
Top of Wasatch @ 10,926
LGR Perfs - Apr ‘87 Top of Liner @ 11.029°
10,940°- 11,697 (627186 holes)
24,000 Gals 15% HCL

Acid Treatment - Aug "96 _<
10,940~ 12,623" (1377411 holes)

12,000 Gals 15% HCL

7" 26% S-95 @ 7,991'- Drift 6.151
7" 291 S-95 @ 11,256" - Drift 6.059"

Additional Perfs - May '84
11,713 - 12,623 (757225 holes)
35,000 Gals 15% HCL

CIBP @ 12,668  w/15" Sand - May 84
Original Completion Perfs - Apr ‘84 CIBP's @ 12.694" & 12,708 - May 84
12,796 - 14,393 (1017303 holes)

35,000 Gals 15% HCL

5" 18# N-80 SFJP @ 13,911'- Drift 4.151"
57 18% 5-95 SFJP @ 14,450 - Drift 4.151"

RECEI VED: Apr. 09, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

EP =
3/16/2015

Tubular Data

Material Description Burst Col ID Drift Capacity TOC
(100%) | (100%) ID (bbl/ft)

Surface 9-5/8" 36# K-55 @ 6,495’ 3,520 2,020 | 8.921 | 8.765 0.0773 Surface
Casing
Intermediate | 7" 26# & 29# S-95 @ 11,256’ 8,600; 7,800; | 6.276; | 6.151; 0.0383; TOC @ 3,100’
Casing 9,690 9,200 | 6.184 0.0371 (CBL)
Production 5” 18# N-80 and S-95 @ 14,450’- | 10140 10490 | 4.276 | 4.151 0.0178 TOL
Liner 11,029’

Plug & Abandonment Procedure

e Testing tubing, use workstring and use CIBP/CICR as per Magna’s recommendation.

1. Notify Dan Jarvis w/ UDOGM @ 801-538-5338 and BLM of P&A operations at least 24 hours prior
to start of well work (See Contact List).

2. MIRU workover rig 2 3/8” workstring. Unseat pump and POOH with rods and pump. LD rods
and pump. ND tree and NU and test BOP’s to 5,000# for 10 minutes. Have test recorded and
charted to be signed and dated by well site supervisor. Record BOP serial number.

3. Release tubing anchor at 6,545’ and POOH with 2 7/8 tbg and lay down.

Plug #1

4. RU E-line and tag TD. Run gauge ring. RIH with a 7” CIBP and set at 6,700'.

5. Test Casing and CIBP to 1000 psi. Note test in daily report. Contact Houston office if
casing/CIBP falils to test.

6. Pick up workstring and run in hole open ended and tag CIBP.

7. Mix and circulate a +400’ balanced cement plug with £82 sacks (+15bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield

Class G cement. Lay in balanced cement plug from 6700’ to 6300’.

8. PU above cement and Reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

9. Run back in and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston.

10. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 3050’ and POOH.

RECEI VED: Apr. 09, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62484 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

EP =
3/16/2015

Cut Casing

11.MIRU E-line. PU & MU free point tool & check where csg is free. POOH. If csg free above
3,000’ continue with procedure otherwise contact Houston.

12.PU & MU 7” jet-cutter assembly; Test lubricator to 250psig/3000psig; RIH to +2,000; Pressure
up to 500psig on casing and jet cut 7” casing at +3,000’ (~100’ above TOC @ 3,100’ CBL);
POOH. RD ELU.

13. Establish circulation down the 7” and up the 7” by 9-5/8” annulus.

14.RU 7" casing handling equipment; PU & MU casing spear on tbg; Land and set the 7” csg
spear

15.POOH & LD 3,000’ of 7” csg.

16.Check for Norm.

Plug #2

17.TIH with 2 3/8” workstring.

18.RU pump and high pressure piping to 2 3/8” workstring

19.Mix and circulate a £150" balanced cement plug with £52 sacks (+10bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield
Class G cement. Lay in balanced cement plug from 3050’ to 2900’ over casing cut.

20.PU above cement and Reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

21.Run back in and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston.

22.Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 150'.

Plug #3

23.Mix and circulate a £150’ balanced cement plug from 150’ to surface with +62 sacks (£12bbls)
of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Pump cement from surface until cement returns up the
backside. POOH. With 1 jt left, circ around fresh water @ top 5. WOC; Monitor surface
samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

24.RU casing cutting equipment; Cut the remaining casing at 23’ below GL

25.Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the following:

1. Well Name: Brotherson 2-2B4

2. Operator Name : EP Energy

3. APl Number: 43-013-30855

4. Location: SW/4ANE/4-2, T2S,R4W

26.RD&MO rig & clean up location
27.Restore location as directed

RECEI VED: Apr. 09, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 63858 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013308550000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v" SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: ISqueeze

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Performed squeeze job. See attached. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
June 16, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 6/11/2015

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 63858 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 63858 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site BROTHERSON 2-2B4
Rig Name/No. MAGNA/026 Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start date 12/7/2012 End date 4/9/2013
Spud Date/Time 12/17/1983 uwi 002-002-S 004-W 30
Active datum KB @6,264.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 160126/47390 / BROTHERSON 2-2B4
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
12/8/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( MOVING EQUIPMENT )
7:30 9:30 2.00 MIRU 01 P MOL SLIDE UNIT RIG UP
9:30 12:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P WORK PUMP OFF SEAT
12:30 13:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 06 P L/D P-ROD AND SUBS, FLUSH TBG AND RODS W/ 65 BBLS
13:00 17:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 113 1", 118 7/8", 118 3/4", 24 1" (LAY DOWN 18 1", 2
7/8", 19 3/4", 24 1".
17:00 18:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P C/O TO TBG EQUIPMENT, N/D WELL HEAD, N/U TESTED BOPE
SWIFWE CSDFWE CT.
12/9/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
12/10/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
12/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SCANNING
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.
7:30 10:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU RIG FLOOR & RELEASE TAC. RU SCANNING EQUIPMENT.
SCAN OUT OF HOLE W/ 24 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. RIG MOTOR &
TRANSMISSION OVERHEATED. SDFN TO REPAIR RIG
12/12/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, R/U WIRELINE.
0 PSI TBG & CSG
7:30 12:30 5.00 WBP 39 P EOT @ 8750' CONTINUE SCANNING OOH. FLUSH AS NEEDED W/
HOT OILER.
TOTAL JTS SCANNED 303
TOTAL YELLOW BAND = 12
TOTAL BLUE BAND = 281
TOTAL RED BAND = 10
R/D PRS.
12:30 16:00 3.50 WBP 27 P MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE SERCICE.
P/U & RIH W/ 7" CIBP, SET @ 8100', POOH, P/U CMT BAILER, RIH
DUMP 2 SXS CMT ON CIBP @ 8100',
TOC @ 8090', POOH.
16:00 18:00 2.00 WBP 18 P FILL CSG W/ 310 BBLS 2%KCL, PRESSURE TEST CSG & CIBP

TO 500# W/ RIG PUMP, BLED TO 0 3 MIN, SEVERAL LEAKS ON
CASING VALVE FLANGES. REPAIR IN A.M, RETEST

June 11, 2015 at 10:46 am

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 201B




Sundry Nunber: 63858 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)

18:00 18:30 0.50 WBP 18 P SHUT WELL IN,DRAIN PUMP & LINES, SDFN
DIESEL USED = 106 GAL
PROPANE USED = 575 GAL
2% KCL PUMPED = 390 BBLS

12/13/2012 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, P/U PERFORATING GUN.

0 PSI ON WELL.

7:30 10:00 2.50 WHDTRE 59 N UNBOLT CASING VALVE, REPLACE RING GASKET, INSTALL

VALVE, FILL HOLE W/ 5 BBLS 2% KCL, PSI TEST TO 500# W/
RIG PUMP. 0 LOSS 15 MIN.
10:00 14:00 4.00 WBP 27 P R/U PIONEER WI/L SERV, P/U & RIH 7" CBP, SET @ 7900', POOH,
FILL CSG W/ 5 BBLS 2% KCL.
PSI TEST TO 2500# W/ RIG PUMP, 20 # LOSS 15 MIN.
HAD TO WORK THROUGH PARAFFIN FROM SURFACE TO 650"
14:00 16:00 2.00 WBP 21 P P/U & RIH W/ 3 1/8" HSC GUN LOADED 3SPF, W/ 120 DEG
PHASING & 22.7 GRAM CHARGES.
SHOOT PERFS FROM 7706' TO 7868' ( OPEN HOLE ) AS PER
DESIGN.W/ 69 TOTAL SHOTS.
HOLD 1000# ON CASING.CSG DROPPED TO 500 PSIAFTER
PERFORATING, POOH, R/D WIRELINE
16:00 17:30 1.50 WBP 39 P X-OVER TO 3 1/2" TBG EQUIP & PIPE RAMS, DRAIN PUMP &
LINES.
SWIFN.

DIESEL USED = 92 GAL
2% KCL PUMPED = 20 BBLS
PROPANE USED = 50 GAL

12/14/2012 6:00 9:30 3.50 WBP 28 P KEY HAD COMPANY SAFETY MEETING. TRAVEL TO LOCATION,

HSM, P/U 3 1/2" TBG .
0 PSI ON WELL

9:30 15:30 6.00 WBP 39 P P/U WEATHERFORD 7" HD PACKER, RIH & TALLY W/ 3 1/2"
P-110 TBG
SET PACKER @ 7667' W/ 241 JTS TBG. W/ 25000#
COMPRESION.
W/ RIG PUMP TEST PACKER TO 1000 PSI DOWN CSG.

15:30 18:00 2.50 WBP 35 P MIRU PLATINUM ENERGY SERVICES, HSM, PSI TEST SURFACE

LINES TO 9000 PSI.

BLED OFF, REPLACED WELLHEAD VALVE, & BLEED OFF VALVE
, RETEST STILL BLED OFF, BLEEDING OFF THROUGH VALVE IN
TRUCK, REPLACE & RETEST IN A.M.

SHUT WELL IN , DRAIN PUMP & LINES, SDFN.

DIESEL USED = 93 GAL
2% KCL PUMPED = 10 BBLS

12/15/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, PUMPING HIGH PSI ACID JOB
0 SICP & SITP
June 11, 2015 at 10:46 am 2 OienWeIIs
RECEI VED:. Jun. 11, 2015




Sundry Nunber :

63858 API

Vel |

Nunber :

43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date

Time
Start-End

Duratio
n
(hr)

Phase

Activit
y

Sub

OP
Code

MD from
(ft)

Operation

12/16/2012

12/17/2012
12/18/2012

12/19/2012

7:30 11:00

11:00 11:30
11:30 17:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 10:00

10:00 11:00

6:00 6:00

6:00 7:30

7:30 13:00

13:00 17:00

17:00 19:00

6:00 7:30

7:30 10:30

3.50

0.50
6.00

1.50

2.50

1.00

24.00

1.50

5.50

4.00

2.00

1.50

3.00

WBP

WBP
WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

WBP

35

18
39

28

18

39

28

39

18

39

28

39

MIRU PLATINUM ENERGY SERVICES, HSM, PSI TEST SURFACE
LINES TO 9000 PSI.

BLED OFF TO 4000 PSI, HEELD THERE NO VISIBLE LEAKS,
LEAKING THROUGH PUMP ON TRUCKS.

ACIDIZE PERFS FROM 7706' TO 7868' ( OPEN HOLE DEPTH )
7696' TO 7858' ( CASED HOLE DEPTH)

162' W /69 SHOTS

FILL TBG W/ 2 BBLS 2% KCL, BRK DOWN @ 4110 PSI @ 10.5
BBLS MIN.

PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL DROP BALLS PUMP 7500 GAL 15%
HCL

FLUSH W/ 84 BBLS 2% KCL.

ISIP =1232 PSI

5 MIN = 754PSI

10 MIN =472 PSI

15 MIN = 263PSI

AVG RATE = 17.6 BBLS MIN

MAX RATE = 20 BBLS MIN

AVG PSI = 5487 #

MAX PSI = 6011#

WATCH PSI 30 MIN, BLED TO 0

RELEASE PACKER POOH, L/D 242 JTS 3 1/2" TBG & PACKER.
SWIFN, DRAIN PUMP & LINES.

2% KCL USED =98 BBLS

DIESEL USED =92 BBLS

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, WINTER DRIVING CONDITIONS.
0 PSI ON WELL.

STEAM OFF RIG FLOOR & BOPS W/ HOT OILER, CHANGE PIPE
RAMS FROM 3 1/2" TO 2 7/8".

( RAM BLOCKS HARD TO GET IN ).

X-OVER TBG EQUIP.

HYDRAULIC PUMP ON TONGS BROKE DOWN. WILL HAVE FIXED
FOR MONDAY

SWIFN.

DIESEL USED = 30 GAL.
PROPANE USED = 175 GAL
NO RIG ACTIVITY

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, TIH W/ TBG.
0 PSI ON WELL

P/U & RIH W/ 68" ROCK BIT W/ 10 JTS 2 7/8" 8RD N-80 TBG, 218
JTS 2 7/8" NULOCK TBG, 28 JTS 2 7/8" 8RD N-80 TBG, TAG CBP
@ 7900’

RIG UP POWER SWIVEL, BRK CIRC REVERSE W/ 5 BBLS 2%
KCL, D/O CBP IN 25 MIN, CIRC CLEAN, W/ 200 BBLS 2 % KCL,
R/D PWR SWVL, RIH TO 8100’

POOH W/ 72 JTS, EOT @ 5925', SWIFN, DRAIN PUMP & LINES,
SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED = 250 BBLS

DIESEL USED = 88 GAL

TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, HYDROTESTING TBG.

0 PSI SITP & SICP.

R/U HOT OILER FLUSH TBG W/ 40 BBLS 2% KCL @ 200 DEG.
POOH W/ 192 JTS 2 7/8" TBG ( 182 NULOCK, 10- 8RD )

L/D BIT & BIT SUB.
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CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
10:30 17:00 6.50 WBP 39 P P/U & RIH W/ 5 3/4" NO-GO, 2 7/8" SOLID PLUG, 2- JTS 2 7/8"

8RD N-80 TBG ( MUD ANCHOR )

4 1/2" PBGA, 2'-2 7/8" N-80 TBG SUB, 2 7/8" SEAT NIPPLE, 4'-2
7/8" TBG SUB,

MIRU 4 STAR HYDOTESTER, HYDROTEST IN HOLE W/ 4- JTS 2
7/8" N-80 8RD,

7" WEATHERFORD TAC W/ CARBIDE SLIPS, 7 JTS 2 7/8" N-80
8RD, X-OVER SUB.

28 JTS 2 7/8" NULOCK, HYTDROTEST TOOLS GETTING STUCK
IN PARAFFIN. PULL HYDROTEST TOOLS OUY OF TBG, RIH W/
20 STANDS, FLUSH TBG W/ 20 BBLS 2% KCL @ 220 DEG,
POOH W/ 20 STANDS,HYDROTEST 12 STANDS, TOOLS
GETTING STUCK AGAIN.

EOT @ 3250',SWIFN, DRAIN PUMP & LINES

CIRC WELL W/ HOT OILER INA.M

2% KCL PUMPED = 60 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 82 GAL
PROPANE USED = 325 GAL

12/20/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, SLICK WORKING CONDITIONS.
0 PSI ON WELL. 5:30 AM HOT OILER CIRCULAING DOWN TBG
7:30 9:00 1.50 WBP 42 N COMPUTER ON RIG FROZE, WOULDNT LET BRAKES RELEASE.
BYPASSED COMPUTER SYSTEM.
9:00 15:00 6.00 WBP 39 P EOT @ 3200', CONTINUE HYDROTESTING IN HOLE W/ 128 JTS 2

7/8" NULOCK TBG, 36 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 8RD. R/D HYDROTESTER.
TOTAL JTS HYDROTESTED = 255. ALL PSI TESTED
FLUSHED TBG 2 TIMES W/ 80 BBLS 2% KCL @ 220 DEG.

TUBING DETAIL

KB = 20.00
STRETCH = 3.00'
36 JTS 2 7/8" 8RD N-80 TBG = 1131.21"
27/8" 8RD X 2 7/8" NULOCK X-OVER = 67"
208 JTS 27/8" NULOCK TBG = 6395.69'
2 7/8" NULOCK X 2 7/8" EUE X-OVER = .84'
7JTS27/8"EUE = 214.74
7" TAC W/ CARBIDE SLIPS = 2.35'
4 JTS27/8"EUE TBG = 125.05'

4'27/8"TBG SUB = 4.12'
2 7/8" SEAT NIPPLE = 1.10'
2'-27/8"TBG SUB = 211
41/2" PBGA = 32.69'
2JTS 2 7/8" EUE ( MUD ANCHOR ) = 62.53'

27/8" SOLID PLUG = 1.10'
5 3/4"NO-GO = 1.75'

EOT @ 8002.45'

7" TAC @ 7772.00'
SEAT NIPPLE @ 7901.17"
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21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
15:00 17:00 2.00 WBP 16 P

R/D FLOOR, N/D BOPS, SET TAC W/ 23000# TENSION, INSTALL
B- FLANGE, LAND TBG ON FLANGE, N/U WH.
SWIFN. DRAIN LINES, SDFN.

2% KCL PUMPED =280 BBLS
DIESEL USED = 83 GAL
PROPANE USED = 250 GAL
12/21/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HSM, ICE PLUGS
0 PSI ON WELL
HOT OILER FLUSHING TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL @ 220 DEG.
WELL CIRULATING TO FB TANK.

7:30 10:00 2.50 WBP 18 P WARM UP & JUMP RIG TO GET STARTED, X-OVER TO ROD
EQUIP.

10:00 14:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 03 P P/U & PRIME 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 36' RHBC PUMP, INSTALL
STINGER.

RIH W/ 6 - 1 1/2" K-SINKER BARS, 99-3/4" EL RODS, 115-7/8" EL
RODS, 93- 1" EL RODS
1" SUBS =

SPACE , HANG OFF, FILL TBG W/ 1 BBLS 2% KCL, PSI TEST TO
500# W/ HOT OILER

STROKE TEST TO 1000# ( GOOD )

PSI TEST CSG & CHECK VALVES TO 500#, PUMP 10 BBLS 2%
KCL THROUGH FLOW LINES.

ROD DETAIL.

11/2" X 38' POLISH ROD, 1-2' X 1" SUB

93- 1" EL RODS

115-7/8" EL RODS

99-3/4" EL RODS

6 -1 1/2" K-SINKER BARS

21/2" X1 1/2" X 36' RHBC PUMP & STINGER

14:00 16:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RACK OUT EQUIPMENT & PUMP LINES, RIG DOWN, SLIDE
ROTAFLEX.
PWOP.

16:00 17:00 1.00 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG TO BELCHER 2-33B4, SPOT RIG

DIESEL USED 80 GAL
2% KCL PUMPED 110 BBLS
PROPANE USED 100 GAL

2/13/2013 10:00 12:30 2.50 MIRU 01 P HELD SAFETY MEETING ON MOVING RIG FILLED OUT JSA.
MOVED RIG TO THE 2-2B4 MIRU WHILE PUMPING 60 BBLS
DOWN CSG MAX PRESSURE 450 PSI.

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P UNSEATED PUMP CIRCULATE WEL @ 600 PSI W/ 55 BBLS.
13:30 15:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 93-1", 115-7/8", 99-3/4", 6-KBARS AND PUMP.
15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD, NU BOP SECURED WELL SDFN.

2/14/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 39 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING

FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 11:00 3.50 WBP 39 P TOOH W/ 36-JTS 2 7/8 EUE TBG, X-OVER, 208-JTS 2 7/8
NU-LOCK, X-OVER, 7-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 7" TAC, 4-JTS 2
7/8 N-80,4'27/8 TBG SUB, 2 7/8 SN, 2'2 7/8 TBG SUB, 4 1/2
PBGA, SOLID PLUG AND 5 3/4 NO-GO

11:00 14:00 3.00 WBP 39 P TALLIED AND RIH W/ 6" BIT, SCRAPPER, BIT SUB, 6'2 7/8 TBG
SUB AND 250 JTS 2 7/8 TBG. EOT @ 7704'".

June 11, 2015 at 10:46 am 5 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 201B




Sundry Nunber: 63858 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
14:00 15:30 1.50 WBP 06 P PUMPED 20 BBLS DOWN TBG BROKE CIRCULATION. CIRULATED
70 BBLS 15 BBLS OIL @ 400 PSI. STOPPED PUMPING CSG DIED,
TBG HOLDING 400 PSI. BLED DOWN TBG.
15:30 17:00 1.50 WBP 39 P TOOH W/ 168-JTS 2 7/8 TBG. EOT @ 2525 SECURED WELL
SDFN.
2/15/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TBG
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 15 BBLS
8:00 9:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED TOOH W/ 82-JTS 2 7/8 TBG,BIT SUB, SCRAPPER
AND BIT.
9:00 14:30 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ PLUG, RET HEAD, 4'-2 7/8 TBG SUB, PKR, 2-JTS 2 7/8
TBG, SN AND 247-JTS 2 7/8 TBG. SET PLUG 10' IN ON JT # 249
@7658' SET PKR 6' OUT ON JT #248 @ 7628'. PRESSURE TEST
PLUG @ !500 PSI HELD. PRESSURE TEST CSG @ 1500 PSI FOR
15 MIN NO LOSS.
14:30 17:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 24- JTS SET PLUG 14' OUT ON JT # 224 @ 6880'.
PRESSURE TEST PLUG @ 1500 PSI. FINISHED TOOH W/ 224-JTS
2 7/8, PKR, 4' SUB AND RETRIEVING HEAD. SECURED WELL
SDFN.
2/16/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK = 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELDSAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE SAFETY.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 11:30 4.00 WLWORK = 21 P CSIP 0, TSIP 0, SURF CSG @ 200 PSI.RU WIRELINE RIH TAGGED
RETRIEVABLE BRIDGE PLUG @ 6885', DUMPED BAILED 10'
SAND. RIH PERFORATED CSG 6860'-6863' 4 SPF. 12 SHOTS.
11:30 12:30 1.00 WBP 06 P TRIED TO BREAK DOWN PERFS. 2000 PSI LOST 150 PSI IN 15
MIN. ATTEMPTED SEVERAL TIMES.
12:30 13:30 1.00 WLWORK = 04 P DUMPED BAILED 17 GALS OF ACID,
13:30 15:30 2.00 WBP 06 P TRIED BREAK DOWN PERFS. SEVERAL ATTEMPTS GOT IT TO
TAKE 8 BBLS @ 1/4 BPM @2000 PSI. ISIP 1800. LOST 150 PSI IN
15 MIN.
15:30 17:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIN W/ PKR, 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80,SN AND 176 JTS 2 7/8 EOT @
5468. SECURED WELL SDFN.
2/17/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING TRIPPING TBG FILLED
OUTJSA
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P FINISHED RIH W/ 44- JTS 2 7/8 TBG, CIRC 2 DRUMS OF ACID
DISPLACED TO EOT W/ 33 BBLS, SET PKR @ 6810". BREAK
DOWN PERFS. @ 2400 PSI @ 2 BPM ISIP 2050 LOST 150 PSI
BLED DOWN WELL.
12:00 14:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 178 JTS AND PKR SECURED WELL SDFN.
2/18/2013 | 8:00 17:00 9.00 PRDHEQ 39 P NO ACTIVITY
2/19/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING. ON TRIPPING CCR.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P MAKE UP CCR, RIH W/ 68- JTS 2 7/8 CCR SET @ 2091".
9:00 10:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P RU PUMP LINES REVERSE CIRC W/ 40 BBLS.
10:00 11:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PULLED 10,000 OVER STRING, TUBING COME UP BUT NOT
DOWN. TOOH W/ 68-JTS AND SETTING TOOL NO CCR,
APPEARS TO HAVE SHEARED.
11:00 12:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 42 P WAIT ON COLLARS.
12:30 15:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 6 1/8 SHOE, TOP SUB, 4-4 3/4" COLLARS,X-OVER, 6'-2
7/8 TBG SUB @ 64-JTS 2 7/8' TAGGED CCR 2091'.RU POWER
SWIVEL
15:00 17:00 2.00 WBP 10 P GOT REVERSE CIRC,WASHED OVER CCR. CIRCULATE TBG
CLEAN W/ 30 BBLS. RD POWER SWIVEL,
17:00 18:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH 45' CCR. HUNG UP UNABLE TO WORK FREE. TOOH W/
6-JTS SECURED WELL SDFN.
2/20/2013
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Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ @ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON DRILLING CCR
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL TAGGED CCR @ 2134', PUSHED AND
MILLED CCR TO @ 2295', CIRCULATED TBG CLEAN, RD POWER
SWIVEL.
11:30 13:00 1.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P FINISHED RIH W/ TBG TAGGED SAND @ 6870 TRIED TO WORK
REMINS OF CCR INTO SHOE.
13.00  15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 220-JTS 2 7/8, 6' SUB, X-OVER, 4-4 3/4 DRILL
COLLARS,TOP SUB AND SHOE.
15:00  17:30 2.50 WLWORK | 20 P RU WIRELINE RIH SET CCR @ 6810' RD WIRELINE SECURED
WELL SDFN.
2/21/2013  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ STINGER AND 220-JTS 2 7/8 TAGGTED CCR @ 6770’
SPACED OUT TBG . PRESSURE TEST TBG 4600 PS| HELD, EST
INJECTION RATE @ 2 BPM @ 2400 PSI.
10:30  12:00 1.50 WBP 42 P WAIT ON CEMENT
12:00  16:00 4.00 WBP 05 P RU BAKER HUGHES. PUMPED 150 SKS OF CLASS G CEM @
15.8%#. STAGED LAST 5 BBLS. LAST STAGE PUMPED 1BBL MAX
PRESSSURE 2442, BLED DOWN TO 2250 IN 5 MINS, STING OUT
REVERSED CICR W/ 60 BBLS.
16:00  17:30 1.50 WBP 05 P TOOH W 110-JTS 2 7/8 EOT @ 4100 SECURED WELL SDFN .
2/22/2013  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING. ON TRIPPING TBG.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED TOOH W 110-JTS 2 7/8 TBG AND STINGER
10:00  13:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 6 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB, 4-4 3/4" COLLARS,X-OVER, 6'-2 7/8
TBG SUB @ 216-JTS 2 7/8' TAGGED CEM @ 6768'.RU POWER
SWIVEL.
13:00  18:00 5.00 WBP 10 P DRILLED CEM FROM 6768 TO CCR @ 6770, DRILLED THRU CCR
AND 50" OF CEM. REVERSE CICR 2 BPM. CIRC TBG CLEAN W/
90BBLS
18:00  18:30 0.50 WBP 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL. TOOH W/ 6-JTS SECURED WELL SDFN.
2/23/2013  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ = 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RU POWER SWIVEL.
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 12:30 5.00 PRDHEQ @ 10 P RIH W/ 6- JTS 2 7/8 RU POWER SWIVEL. TAGGED CEM @ 6820'
REVERSED CIRC @ 2 BPM. FELL THRU CEM @ 6860, TAGGED
SAND @ REST OF PLUG @ 6870. FINISHED DRILLING CCR @
WASHED SAND DOWN TO RBP @ 6880'
12:30  14:00 1.50 PRDHEQ @ 06 P CIRCULATE TBG CLEAN W/ 90 BBLS, RD POWER SWIVEL
14:00  14:00 0.00 PRDHEQ @ 06 P TOOH W/ 220-JTS 2 7/8, 6' SUB, X-OVER, 4-4 3/4 DRILL
COLLARS,BIT SUB AND BIT. SECURED WELL SDFN.
2/24/2013  12:43  12:43 0.00 WBP 18 N NO ACTIVITY
2/25/2013  12:43  12:43 0.00 WBP 18 N NO ACTIVITY.
2/26/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CTTGSM & JSA (RIHW/ TBG )
7:30 17:00 9.50 PRDHEQ 18 P START RIG, TRANSMISSION WOULD NOT SHIFT RIG DOWN FOR
REPAIRS
2/27/2013  6:00 6:00 24.00 = PRDHEQ 18 P RIG DOWN FOR QUARTERLY SAFETY MEETING AND WAITING
ON PARTS
2/28/2013  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CTTGSM & JSA (LOTO)
7:30 16:00 8.50 PRDHEQ 18 P REPAIR TRANSMISSION
16:00  18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RIH W/ RET HEAD 1 JT, PSN, 160 JTS 2-7/8" EOT @ 5900' SWIFN
CSDFN CT
3/1/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CTTGSM & JSA (RIH W/ TBG )
7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P CIH W/ 89 JTS TAG RBP BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRC CLEAN

ATTEMPT TO CIRC ON PLUG W/ NO SUCCESS.
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Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
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13:00 16:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 249 JTS & RET HEAD SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/2/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (RIH W/ TBG )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 6 1/8" O.D, 4 1/4" 1.D SHOE, 249 JTS 2-7/8", RU POWER
SWIVEL, RU PUMP AND RETURN LINES.
10:30 16:30 6.00 PRDHEQ 06 P BREAK CIRCULATION, ATTEMPT TO DRILL UP CBP REMAINS ON
TOP OF RBP. MADE 6" NOT ABLE TO GET ANY TORQUE, R/D
POWER SWIVEL.
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 249 JTS, SHOE, CBP REMAINS WEDGED IN SHOE.
3/3/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POWER SWIVEL OPERATIONS )
7:30 12:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ RET HEAD, 249 JTS 2-7/8" TBG, RU PUMP AND RETURN

LINES BREAK CIRCULATION J ON PLUG CIRC CLEAN, ATTEMPT
TO RELEASE. PICK UP WOULD NOT PULL OVER. GO THROUGH
MOTIONS SEVERAL TIMES.

12:30 15:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ TBG AND 1/2 OF RBP.
3/4/2013 6:00 6:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 N NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
3/5/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CTTGSM & JSA (RIH W/ TBG )
7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PUMU & RIH W/ 5.5" 1.D, 6.125 O.D SHOE, X/O, 6' PUP JT, 224
JTS 2-7/8" TAG RBP RU POWER SWIVEL, RU PUMP AND RETURN
LINES, BREAK CIRCULATION.
11:30 18:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 06 P WASH OVER 21" OF RBP, CIRCULATE CLEAN,SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/6/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POWER SWIVEL OPERATIONS )
7:30 14:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU POWER SWIVEL, RU PUMP AND RETURN LINES, BREAK
CIRCULATION. WASH OVER 8" OF RBP (29" TTL ), CIRCULATE
CLEAN.
14:00 18:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIG DOWN SWIVEL, POOH W/ TBG & SHOE, PU NEW SHOE W/
EXTENSION, TOP SUB, X/O, PUP JT SIH W/ 115 JTS TBG SWIFN
CSDFN CT.
3/7/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POWER SWIVEL OPERATIONS )
7:30 10:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CIH W/ TBG TAG RBP RU POWER SWIVEL BREAK CIRCULATION.
10:00 18:30 8.50 PRDHEQ 06 P WASH OVER 3" RBP CIRCULATE CLEAN SWIFN CSDFN CT
3/8/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP OPERATIONS )
7:30 12:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 06 P BREAK CIRCULATION WASH OVER 2" STOPPED MAKING HOLE
PU CIRC CLEAN RD PWR SWVL.
12:00 18:00 6.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ TBG L/D SHOE, PU NEW 6 1/8" O.D 5.5 I.D SHOE RIH
W/ TBG RU PWR SWVL SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/9/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POWER SWIVEL OPERATIONS )
7:30 17:30 10.00 PRDHEQ 06 P BREAK CIRCULATION WASH OVER WASH OVER MOSTLY
SPINNING.
17:30 18:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PU CIRC CLEAN, WINTERIZE WELL HEAD, SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/10/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMP OPERATIONS )
7:30 17:30 10.00 PRDHEQ 06 P BREAK CIRCULATION WASH OVER WASH OVER MOSTLY
SPINNING. UNTIL 10 A.M START GETTING TOURQUE, END OF
DAY COULD ONLY SET 1K DOWN .
17:30 18:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PU CIRC CLEAN, WINTERIZE WELL HEAD, SWIFN CSDFN CT.
3/11/2013 6:00 6:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 06 P NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
3/12/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON USING
PWER SWIVEL. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 14:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU POWER SWIVEL & BREAK REVERSE CIRCULATION. ROTATE
ON RBP FOR 6-1/2 HRS. MADE 4" TODAY, 24" TTL. RD POWER
SWIVEL.
14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RD POWER SWIVEL. TOOH W/ TBG & WASHOVER ASSEMBLY.

SHOE SHOWED ORDINARY WEAR. REPLACE SHOE & RIH W/
SHOE ASSEMBLY & TBG. SDFN

3/13/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON POWER
SWIVEL SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
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7:30 18:30 11.00 PRDHEQ 18 P RU POWER SWIVEL. PU 1 JT TBG. TAG UP 1.5' HIGH. MILL ON

RBP FOR 10 HRS, CHANGING RPM, PUMP RATE & WEIGHT ON
SHOE. WAS NOT ABLE TO GET SHOE TO TORQUE OR MAKE
ANY HOLE. POOH W/ 1 JT TBG. CLOSE TBG VALVE. PRESSURE
UP ON CSG TO 1000 PSI. COULD NOT INJECT INTO PERFS @
1000 PSI. SDFN

3/14/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PINCH
POINTS & HAND PLACEMENT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 13:30 6.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ESTABLISH CIRCULATION. MILL ON RBP FOR 6 HRS, CHANGING

RPM, PUMP RATE & WEIGHT ON SHOE. WAS NOT ABLE TO GET
SHOE TO TORQUE OR MAKE ANY HOLE.

13:30 16:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ TBG & WASHOVER ASSEMBLY. SHOE SHOWED
VERY LITTLE WEAR
16:00 20:00 4.00 WLWORK 18 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. MADE 2 RUNS W/ 6" OD MAGNET.

RECOVERED SLIP CONE ON RUN #1. RECOVERED SMALL
METAL SHAVINGS ON RUN #2. RD WIRELINE TRUCK. SDFN

3/15/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP
DRILL COLLARS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PU OVERSHOT ASSEMBLY & TIH W/ 2-7/8" TBG
11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TAG RBP & ATTEMPT TO LATCH ON TO 5-1/2" FISHNECK.

UNABLE TO LATCH FISH. WHILE WORKING OVERSHOT FISH
STARTED MOVING DOWN HOLE. WORK IN HOLE TO 8078' TBG

MEASUREMENT.
14:00 17:30 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ TBG & LD FISHING TOOLS. SDFN
3/16/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ SOLID NO/GO, 2 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, PBGA, 2' X

2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, SEAT NIPPLE, 4' X 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, 4 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, TAC, 7 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 170 JTS
2-7/8"NU;LOC TBG, X-OVER & 44 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.

11:00 13:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P ND BOP. SET TAC @ 7781' IN 20K TENSION. SN @ 7811". EOT @
7965'. NU WELLHEAD

13:00 14:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.

14:00 16:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 2-1/2" X 1-1/2" ROD PUMP, 6 1-1/2" WEIGHT RODS & 39

3/4" RODS. STACK OUT ON TIGHT SPOT IN TBG @ 1435'. POOH
W/ RODS & PUMP. BOTTOM OF PUMP SHOWED IT HAD SET
DOWN ON TIGHT SPOT IN TBG.

16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD. RELEASE TAC NU BOP.
17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH & LD CRIMPED JT TBG. RIH & SET TAC @ 7777' IN 20K
TENSION. SN 7907'. EOT @ 7969'. SDFN
3/17/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SLICKLINE
SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 32 P Rig up. Scratch tight from 1400'-1600' 3000'-3300', 3400'-3600",

4900'-5050', 6350'- 6600',6900'-7000', 7700' - 7902'. POOH.
FLUSH TBG w/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. RIH W/2.36" OD TBG
BROACH. WORK THROUGH TIGHT TBG FROM 1493' - 1495', &
1554' - 1556'. STACKED OUT @ 1650". COULD NOT WORK
PAST 1650'. POOH. RIH W/ 2.35"0D BROACH. WORK THROUGH
TIGHT TBG @ 1493' - 1495'. RIH LOSING WEIGHT @ EACH TBG
CONNECTION. STACK OUT @ 7432'. WORK BROACH TO 7439'.
FELL FREE. RIH TO 7902'. POOH W/ TBG BROACH. RD
WIRELINE TRUCK.

11:30 13:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND BOP. LAND TBG. NU WELLHEAD.
13:00 14:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR
14:00 16:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ PUMP & RODS
June 11, 2015 at 10:46 am 9 OienWeIIs
RECEI VED:. Jun. 11, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 63858 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P STROKE TEST PUMP TO 1000 PSI. TESTED GOOD. SLIDE
PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP
3/18/2013 | 8:00 17:00 9.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY
3/19/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 18 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEEETING ON SLIDING PUMPING
UNIT. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 RDMO 02 P SLID PUMPING UNIT OUT, RD RIG, SLID PUMPING UNIT IN. PWOP.
CLEANED LOCATION AND GOT READY TO MOVE.
4/7/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON UNSEATING
PUMP. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 13:30 6.00 PRDHEQ 39 P UNSEAT PUMP & LD POLISH ROD. POOH W/ 93 1" RODS, 112
7/8" RODS, 100 3/4" RODS, 6 WEIGHT RODS & PUMP. PU &
PRIME REBUILT 2-1/2" X 1-1/2" RHBC ROD PUMP & TIH W/ SAME
ROD DESIGN. SEAT & SPACE OUT PUMP. STROKE TEST PUMP
TO 1000 PSI. TESTED GOOD
13:30 15:00 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG. SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP

June 11, 2015 at 10:46 am

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Jun. 11, 201B
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Sundry Nunber: 67884 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013308550000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acter casing [ casine repar
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
O CHANGE WELL STATUS O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS O CONVERT WELL TYPE
v SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
|:| SPUD REPORT O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME O RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
[ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
O DRILLING REPORT 0 0 0
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: IPump Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EP changed pump. See attached for details. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
November 24, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/24/2015

RECEI VED: Nov. 24, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 67884 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Nov. 24, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 67884 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P STROKE TEST PUMP TO 1000 PSI. TESTED GOOD. SLIDE
PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP
3/18/2013 | 8:00 17:00 9.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY
3/19/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 RDMO 18 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEEETING ON SLIDING PUMPING
UNIT. FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 RDMO 02 P SLID PUMPING UNIT OUT, RD RIG, SLID PUMPING UNIT IN. PWOP.
CLEANED LOCATION AND GOT READY TO MOVE.
4/7/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON UNSEATING
PUMP. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 13:30 6.00 PRDHEQ 39 P UNSEAT PUMP & LD POLISH ROD. POOH W/ 93 1" RODS, 112
7/8" RODS, 100 3/4" RODS, 6 WEIGHT RODS & PUMP. PU &
PRIME REBUILT 2-1/2" X 1-1/2" RHBC ROD PUMP & TIH W/ SAME
ROD DESIGN. SEAT & SPACE OUT PUMP. STROKE TEST PUMP
TO 1000 PSI. TESTED GOOD
13:30 15:00 1.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG. SLIDE PUMPING UNIT. HANG ROD STRING. PWOP

November 24, 2015 at 2:53 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 24, 201B




Sundry Nunber: 67752 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013308550000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002

PHONE NUMBER:
713 997-5038 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
1371 FSL 1498 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 02 Township: 02.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

l:‘ ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING

l:‘ NOTICE OF INTENT

- . I:‘ CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:

l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

l:‘ DEEPEN

l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE

J SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

9/16/2015

l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT
J PLUG AND ABANDON

l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME l:‘ RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:
l:‘ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT

Report Date: l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

|:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

D PLUG BACK

|:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
|:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

D WATER DISPOSAL

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

CIBP @ 6685’. 82 sx cmt. Tagged TOC @ 6344’ (341’ cmt plug). EOT @
5724’. Pumped 20 sx cmt. Cut 7” casing @ 1391'. EOT @ 3212'.
Pumped 40 sx cmt. Tagged cmt plug @ 2986'. EOT @ 1452'. Pumped

45 sx cmt. Tagged cmt plug @ 1440’. EOT @ 1440’. Pumped 55 sx cmt.
Tagged cmt plug @ 1294’. Pumped 130 sx cmt with returns to surface.
Topped off 9 5/8” x 13 3/8” with 40 sx cmt to surface. Cement fell. Top

off again with 40 sx cmt. Cmt @ 20’. Top off until cmt to surface.
Welded on P&A plate. SEE ATTACHED FOR DETAILS.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

November 24, 2015

PHONE NUMBER
713 997-5038

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE

Maria S. Gomez

Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
11/17/2015

RECEI VED: Nov.

17, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 67752 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
BROTHERSON 2-2B4
BROTHERSON 2-2B4

P&A LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 67752 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well BROTHERSON 2-2B4
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site BROTHERSON 2-2B4
Rig Name/No. PEAK/1100 Event P&A LAND
Start date 9/8/2015 End date
Spud Date/Time 12/17/1983 uwi 002-002-S 004-W 30
Active datum KB @6,264.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 164847/53859 / BROTHERSON 2-2B4
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
9/9/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 29 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; P&A OPERATIONS
7:00 9:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 42 P MIRU
9:00 11:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 42 P ATTEMPT TO PUMP DOWN ANNULUS FAILED WELL FULL WORK
PUMP OFF SEAT R/U LINE TO FLOW BACK TANK FLUSH RODS
TO FLOW BACK TANK
11:00 17:40 6.67 PRDHEQ 42 P TOH L/D RODS FLUSHING AS NEEDED ROD TONGS BROKE
DOWN CONTINUE TOH w RODS WRENCHES L/D WT BARS AND
PUMP
17:40 18:30 0.83 PRDHEQ 42 P CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS MAKE UP SPOOL ON BOPE
CHANGE RAM BLOCKS FOR 2 7/8" TBG SECURE WELL TIW
VALVE CLOSED w NIGHT CAP 7" CSG VALVES CLOSED w
NIGHT CAPS SDFN
9/10/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; N/D WELL HEAD N/U BOPE
7:00 8:30 1.50 WOR 16 P CSIP 0 PSI N/D WELL HEAD N/U BOPE
8:30 11:50 3.33 WOR 39 P RELEASE 7" TAC 6545' P/U 3-JTS TIH TAG AT 6849' L/D 3-JTS
TOH w 206-JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG L/D BHA
11:50 15:13 3.38 WOR 39 P P/U 7" CIBP TIH w 205-JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG ATTEMPT TO SET AT
6695' FAILED CIBP WOULD NOT SET R/U CIRC WELL w 50 BBLS
OF TREATED WATER P/U SET CIBP AT 6685'
15:13 156:35 0.37 WOR 06 P FILL WELL WITH 30 BBLS TEST CSG TO 1000 PSI TEST GOOD
15:35 18:00 2.42 WOR 06 P PUMP PLUG #1 82 SX OF 16.4# CEMENT TOH w 30-JTS OF 2
7/8" TBG TO 5700' REVERSE CIRC w 70 BBLS OF TREATED
WATER SECURE WELL TIW VALVE CLOSED w NIGHT CAP 7"
CSG VALVES CLOSED w NIGHT CAPS CLOSED 9 5/8" w BULL
PLUG SDFN
9/11/2015 6:30 7:30 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING
FILLED OUT AND REVIEWED JSA,
7:30 8:30 1.00 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 20-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 TBG TAGGED PLUG # 1 @ 6344' (341"

CEM PLUG). TOOH W/ 20-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, EOT @
5724'.

November 17, 2015 at 2:53 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 201B




Sundry Nunber: 67752 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
8:30 9:00 0.50 WOR 06 P EOT @ 5724'. PUMPED 20 SKS CLASS G CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD.

DISPLACED TO 5624' W/ 32 BBLS TREATED WATER. TOOH W/
20-JTS EOT @ 5100'. REVERSED TBG CLEAN W/ 50 BBLS.

9:00 14:00 5.00 WOR 39 P TOOH W/ 161-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE T BG, AND STINGER.
PPREPAREd TO CUT CSG.

14:00 16:30 2.50 WLWORK 18 P RU WIRELINE FREEPOINT CSG. 1300' 90% FREE, 1400' 70%
FREE, 1500' 30 % FREE, 1700 1% FREE., CUT CSG @ 1391'. RD
WIRELINE.

16:30 18:30 2.00 WOR 24 P RU RIG FLOOR . LD 5 JTS OF 7" CSG. SECURED WELL.

9/12/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN

CASING. FILLED OUT AND REVIEWED JSA.

7:30 12:00 4.50 WOR 24 P 0 WELL PRESS. OPENED WELL CONTINUED LAYING DOWN
30-JTS 7" 26# CSG. .

12:00 13:00 1.00 WOR 16 P RD CSG EQUIPMENT. NU BOPE.

13:00 14:00 1.00 WOR 39 P RIH W/ 98-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG EOT @ 3212".

14:00 16:00 2.00 WOR 06 P EOT @ 3212'. PUMPED 40 SKS CLASS G CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD.

DISPLACED TO 3012' W/ 17 BBLS. TOOH W/ 30-JTS EOT
@2235'. REVERSED TBG CLEAN W/ 20 BBLS.

9/13/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY
9/14/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 WOR 18 P NO ACTIVITY
9/15/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HSM, WRITE AND REVIEW JSA.
TOPIC - HAND PLACEMENT.
7:00 8:00 1.00 WOR 39 P TIH AND TAG CEMENT PLUG AT 2,986'. POOH W TBG TO 1,452'.
8:00 9:00 1.00 WOR 06 P EOT AT 1,452". PUMP 45 SX CLASS G CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD.

DISPLACED W 6 BBLS SCALE INHIBITOR WATER. TOOH W 24
JTS EOT @ 675'. REVERESED TBG CLEAN W 15 BBLS.

9:00 12:30 3.50 WOR 18 P WAIT FOR CEMENT TO SET UP.

12:30 13:30 1.00 WOR 39 P TIH AND TAG CEMENT PLUG AT 1,440' (NEEDED TO TAG AT
1,300').

13:30 14:00 0.50 WOR 06 P EOT AT 1,440'. PUMP 55 SX CLASS G CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD.

DISPLACED W 5.5 BBLS SCALE INHIBITOR WATER. TOOH W 24
JTS EOT @ 662". REVERSE TBG CLEAN W 15 BBLS. INSTALL

TIW.
14:00 16:00 2.00 WOR 18 P WAIT FOR CEMENT TO SET UP. CEMENT SAMPLE STILL GREEN.
SECURE WELL. SDFD.
9/16/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOC. HSM, WRITE AND REVIEW JSA.

TOPIC-OVERHEAD LOADS.

7:00 8:00 1.00 WOR 39 P TIHW TBG. TAG CEMT PLUG AT 1,294'. POOH W TBG.
8:00 8:30 0.50 WOR 16 P ND BOP.
8:30 9:00 0.50 WOR 39 P TIHW 9 JTS TBG.
9:00 10:00 1.00 WOR 06 P PUMP 130 SX CLASS G CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD. CEM RETURNS
TO SURFACE. POOH AND LAY DWN TBG.
10:00 11:00 1.00 WOR 18 P RIG DOWN WOR.
11:00 13:00 2.00 WOR 18 P DIG OUT CELLAR. CUT OFF WELLHEAD. TOP OFF 9 5/8" X 13
3/8" CSG ANNULUS W 40 SX CLASS G CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD
TO SURF. CEM FELL.
13:00 14:15 1.25 WOR 18 P WAIT ON CMT TO SET UP. CLEAN LOCATION
14:15 15:00 0.75 WOR 18 P TOP OFF 9 5/8" X 13 3/8" CSG ANNULUS W 40 SX CLASS G
CEM 16.4# 1.05 YIELD. CMT NEVER REACH SURF. CMT AT 20'.
LET CMT SIT OVERNIGHT.
15:00 16:30 1.50 WOR 18 P MOVE RIG TO BODERO 2-15 B3.
9/17/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 WOR 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HSM, WRITE AND REVIEW JSA.
TOPIC-PINCH POINTS.
November 17, 2015 at 2:53 pm 2 OpenWells
RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 2016




Sundry Nunber: 67752 APl Well Nunber: 43013308550000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:00 9:00 2.00 WOR 18 P TOP OFF CMT INTO 9 5/8" X 13 3/8" CSG ANNULUS. CMT FELL.
TOP OFF CMT INTO 9 5/8" X 13 3/8" CSG ANNULUS W LCM
MATERIAL. CMT TO SURFACE.
9:00 13:30 4.50 WOR 18 P WAIT ON CMT TO CONFIM CMT TOP.
13:30  14:00 0.50 WOR 18 P WELD ON P&A PLATE W FOLLOWING INFO: BROTHERSON 2-2
B4, EP ENERGY, 43-013-3-855, SW/4A NE/4 -2, T2 S, R4 W.
14:00  14:00 0.00 WOR 18 P BACKFILL CELLAR WITH DIRT. MOVE OFF LOCATION W ALL

EQUIPMENT.

November 17, 2015 at 2:53 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 201B
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