
Fonn OGC-la SUBMIT I IPLICATE*
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
reverse side)

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and serialNo.

Fee
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT pRILL, DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK

(2. [f Indînn, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work
. Unit Agreement NameDRILL DEEPEN PLUG BACK O

b. Type of Well
Oil Gas Single Multiple 8. Farm or Lease Name
Well Well Other Zone Zone

2. Name of Operator $†Own
Linmar Energy Corporation 9. Well No.

J. Address of Operator 2-28 B5
P.O. Box 1327, Roosevelt, UT 84066 10. Field and P'ool, or Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) Al SMOnt, WESatch
At surface

11. Sec.. T.. R., M., or BIk.
and Survey or Area

1, 413' FWL and 1,777' FSL (NE SW)At proposed prod, zone i

Sec 28-T2S-R5W, USM
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12, County or Parrish 13. State

7 Miles North and 4 Miles West of Duchesne, Utah Duchesne Utah
lö. Distance from proposed• 16, No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest to this well
property or lease line, ft. g
(Also to nearest drig. line, if any) 1, 413 640 640

161. Distance from proposed location* 19. Provosed depth gÛ 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft. 3345' 13,000' Rotary

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approx, date work will start*

5929 GR
23. 4°

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth

30" 20 " 40 ' 50
124" 9-5/8" 36# 2, 500' Soo DEC0 0 19028-3/4" 7" 26, 29, 32 19, 500' 700 CF
6" 5" 18 10400-TD 700 CF

DIVISIONOF
OILGAS&MININGThe proposed well is At Wasatch Test. Te effects of drainage will be analyzed.

Surface Damages will be settled with the appropriate landowners, prior to spudding.

The well is to be drilled, using fresh gel muds, weighted as required. Blowout prevention
equipment will be used per the attached drawing.

A certified location plat is attached.

APPROVEDBYTHESTATEThe anticipated spud date is December 15, 1982• OF UTAH DIVISIONOFOIL, GAS, AND MINING
IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal la to deepen or plug . ro-
ductive zone. If poposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsur (c blowout
preventer program, if any.

(This sonee for Federal or State office use)

Permit No. .... ................. . .. .
............. Approval Date .

Approved by.......................... ........
............... Title....................... .........

.. ............ Date...........
Conditions of approval, if any:

'See Instructions On Reverse
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L/NMAR EN GY CORR s oN
T2E E

Sw U
SE ¼M

WELL LOCAT/0N PLAT
BROWH 2-2ÐBS

BROWH2-2695
SCALE:l"=1000'¢HOUND ELEM 5929

S 89 50' W 2639.63'

LEGEND & NOTES SURVEYOR'S CERT/E/¢ATE

# FOUNDORIGINAL CORNERS USED I hereby certify that this plat was preparedFOR THIS SURVEY. from field notes of an actual survey
performed by me, during which the shownGENERAL LAND OFFICE PLAT USED monuments were found or established.FOR REFERENCE AND CALCULATIONS.

C7- O C/
Jepfy D. ed, Registered Land
S6rveyor, Cert. No. 3817 {UtahI

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
y P.O. Drawer C

DUCHESNE, UTAH 8402182-121-005 1 Dec 82 (sos)
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ILO'.4OUT PREVENTIONEQUIPHENT

BeTT Ripple

Flow Line
FilT Line

Annular
Preventer

- Pipe Rams

Blind Rams Adjustable Choke

----To Mud Tanks

Kill Line rilling . - , ----To FlareSpool Pit

To Gas
BusterCasin9 Hydraulic ChokeHead

I
Minimum 3,000 PSI BOPEis to be installed after setting surface pipe.

All preventers are to be tested to 1500 PSI prior to drilling out casing
shoe.

Minimum 5,000 PSI B0PE is to be installed after setting the long string.
The pipe rams and blind rams are to be tested to 5,000 PSI and the annular
preventer to 1,500 PSI prior to drilling out shoe.

All ai1xillary B0PE will be tested to appropriate pressures when B0P'S
are tested. (Manifold, upper and lower Kelly cocks, valves, and inside BOP).

After drilling the shoe, the casing seat will be pressure tested to
an equivalent mud weight of 13.5
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L.INMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
P. O. Box 1327

Roosevel t, Utah 84066
Phone (801) 722-4546

November 30,, 1982

Utah Division of Oil,, Bas, and Mining
4241 State Office Building
Balt Lake City,, Utah 84114
Attention:: Jack Feight

Brown 2-2885

Application For Permit to Drill

Dear Jac:k:

Linmar Energy Corporation plans to drill a 320 ac:re
of f set test wel l to the Shel l Ute 1-2885 (NW NE Sec
28-T28-R5W). The new well., The Brown 2-2825, is to be
located in the NE SW Sec 28-T2S-ROW.,

As this well is a test well, it is understood and
at.greed that after an initial test period of 60 days, only
one well will be produc:ed from the Wasatch Formation in ti,e
sub.ject section.

Please f:i.nd attac:hed, a Permit Application, along with
the BOP diagram and plats. Linmar plans to spud the
sub.ject wel1 on or bedc:are December 15, 1982.,

Your early ai::)proval of this applic:ation will !::>e
greatly apprec:iated.

Very Truly Yoi..tre,

E. B. Whicker
Manager of
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RECONCILEWELLNAMEANDIDCATIONONAPDAGAINST SAMEDATAON PLATMAP.
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Decomber 6, 1982

Linmar Energy Corporation
P. O. ßox 1326
Roosevelt, Utah 84066

RE: Well No. Brown 2-2885
NESWSec, 28, T.2S, R.5W
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above referred to
oil well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued in Cause No. 140-12
dated June 25, 1982. Testpperiod shall not exceed 60 days after which either the
test well, or the well being offset shall be shut in. All test information and
bottom hole pressure shall be submitted within 90 days of completion.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon this well,
you are hereby requested to immediately notify the following:

ROMALDJ. FIRTH - Engineer CLEON 5. FEIGHT - Director
Office: 533-5771 OR Office: 533-5771
Home: 571-6068 Home: 466-4455

Enclosed please find Porm OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether or not
water sands (acquifiers) are encountered during drilling. Your cooperation in
completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24 hours after
drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor and rig number be
identified.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30718.

Sincerely,

Norman C. Stout
Administrative Assistant

NCS/as
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FormúGE-lb M BWl lN TRll'LICUE* /, 7

.ATE OF UTAH i rin,tnanon.,an

DEPARTMElTP OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS. AND MINING 'sana oratosarios s.,o asaan. so.

AP1 NO, 43-013-30718 FEE
6. \r INDIA.N. ALLottaa on rants NAusSUNDRYNOTlGS AND REPORTSON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill of to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPL1CATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT IanzzumNT Naus

ELLL ISLL
UTHER

2. NA¼R OF OPISATOR S TARAt QA LIA4E .NAME

LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION BROWN
3, IDORI38 OF CPERATOS 9. WELL .WO.

7979 TUFTS AVENUE PARKWAY, STE 604, DENVER, COLORADO 2-28 85
4. Lot1T1oN or NELL \Report location ciestly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. rt:La A.so root, on witocaT

See also space 17 0410W,)
.a narrac• ALRAMONT, WASATCH

11. sac., T., I., M.. 38 3L-t- AND
\413' FWL AND 1777' FSL (NE SW) soavar on 22.4

SEC. 28, T2S, R5W, USM
14, PERMIT :to. I 15, at.tvATroNs (Show whether Dr. AT, GA, etc.) 12. CocNTY on fixian 13, STATE

5929 CR DUCHESNE J UTAH
- CheckAppropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or ÑerData

NotIcz or INTENTION TO: Stastqu NT azroar or:

215"¯ WITER 5HUT-OPY Pt.*LL OR 4LTlft CASING WATER SitUT-Orr REPAIAfNG WELL

PRACT"Itt TACAT MULTIPL COrfPU.TC FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHuuT ,R \LIDIZI 48.a'sDON' SilOUTING Oft ACIDITING ABA,NtmNMENT*
.J

.m er :9e<ot er ass oeneri MONTIlLY OR I l.f.]Na
"Gr; INoTE: Report resulta of alultiple rompletten on W.=il

('umpletion or flecompletion Report ind Lug form.)
17 .scniat .'

wo-ru ou in PLErro MPERArloNs fl9.irf) .alatr til pmfinent details, and give pe-t cent dates, including estimated date of starting 3,yproposes worK f well is frectionady drdled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and onrw prt!-
sern 'a ih a wor<.) *

4-1-83 TO 4-LO-83 PERFORATE, ETIMULATE AND PLACE ON FRODUCTION gASATCH FORMATJ_ON

FROM 10,796 - 12,842'

(SEE ATTACllED FOR DETATLS)

18. I hereb eer i 7 ht ne oreg gud ect

sicNons -t / pg VICE PRESIDFNT DATE i 2 7 2,
I mn IJ. C | yh .

(This space fr Federal or State odice use)

APPROVED BY _ _ TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY;

*See Instructionson Reverse
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WEJL: LINMAR-BROWN2-28B5
OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
LCCATION: SEC 28, T2S, R5W, DUCTIESNECOUNTY, UTTH
CONTRAC2DR: CHASE DRIILING, RIG #1
OEJECTIVE ZONE: WASATCH FORMATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12,500' PAGE 1

1-24-83 631' Day l; SPUD @ 5 p.m., 1/23/83. Drilling, made 561' in 13 hrs.
MW8.5, Vis 33 (spud mud) . Rig up rotary tools. Nipple up
conductor pipe. Tag cement @ 70'. Survey: 3/4 degrec @198';
1 degree @ 440'.
DC: $23,053 CUM: $23,053
DMC: $ 555 CMC: $ 555

1-25-83 1,286' Day 2; Drilling, made 655' in 22 hrs. MW9.1, Vis 31, Cake ],
PH 10. Remarks: Trip for bit #2. Wireline survey. Survey:
½ degree @ 714'; ½ degree @881'.
DC: $18,851 CUM: $41,904
DMC: $ 445 CMc: $ 1,000

1-26-83 1,683' Day 3; Drilling, mado 397' in 17 hrs. MW8.9, Vis 32, WL 28,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: Trip in hole for bit #3. Survey:
½ degree @1,380' & ¼ degrce @ 1,486'.
DC: $48,107 CUM: $90,011
DMC: $ 300 CMC: $ 1,300

1-27-83 2,078' Day 4; Drilling, made 395' in 20½ hrs. MW 9.3, Vis 35, Cake 2,
PH ll. Remarks: Drilling to 1,907'. Trip for bit #4. Raam 60'
to bottom. Survey: 1 degree @ 1,907'.
DC: $25,402 CUM: $115,413
DMC: $ 410 CMC: $ 1,710

1-28-83 2,310' Day 5; Drilling, Rede 232' in 12½ hrs. MW 8.9, Vis 31, WL 21,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: Drilling @4:30 p.m. Inst pump
pressure & weight. Check pumps. Pull out of hole. Cross-over
sub broken off. 3 - 8" drill collars & bit in hole. Wait on
fishing tools. Makeup overshot and jars. Go in hole and retrieve
fish. Change bits. Triµ in hole. Drilling 2 4 a.m.
DC: $7,592 COM: $123,005
DMC: $ 575 CMC: $ 2,285

1-29-83 2,492' Day 6; Drilling, Jede 182' in 10 hrs. MW 8.9, Vis 33, WL 22, Cake 2
PH 10.2. Remarks: Drilling to 2,492'. Ran 30 joints 9-5/8" 36#
K-55 LT & C (1,223.56') and 32 joints 9-5/8" 36# K-55 ST & C
(1,272.76') casing with Halliburton guido shoe @2,492' and differ-

ential fill float collar @2,450'. Cemented with 730 sacks BJ lite
with 2% CC, 10# Gilsonite, and k# Flocele per sack. Followed by
200 sacks Class H with 2% CC and ¼# Flocele per sack. Displaced
top rubber plug with 190 barrels water. Lost circulation after
displacing 130 barrels. Partial circulation returned after dis-
placing 145 barrels. Cement and contaminated mud to surface, no
pure cement visible in returns. Bumped plug with 190 barrels. Flui<
fell slowly out of sight behind 9-5/8" casing. Survey: 1 degree @
2,492'.
DC: $39,939 CUM: $162,944
DMC: $ 536 CMC: $ 2,821

l-30-83 2,492' Day 7; Tag cement outside 9-5/8" @ 180' with l" pipe. Cemented with
150 sacks Class H with 3% CC. Cement standing at surface. Cut off
conductor and surface pipe. Weld on and test head. Nipple up,
change pipe rams, BOP stack, blind rams and valves to 5000 psi. Test
Hydril to 1500 psi.
DC: $16,941 CUM: $179,885
DMC: $ 470 CMC: $ 3,291

1-31-83 2,985' Day 8; Drilling, made 493' in 16 hrs. MW water. Pemarks: Test
kelly and set wear bushing. Pick up bottom hole assembly and trip
in hole. Drill floats and shoe joint.
DC: $21,695 CUM: $201,580
DMC: $ 554 CMC: $ 3,845

2-1-83 3,395' Day 9; Drilling, Rade 410' in 194 hrs. FM wtr. Remarks: Trip for
bit #7. Wash 60' to bottam. Survey: l¼ degrees @2,953' and
1-3/4 degrees @ 3,182'.
DC: $14,290 CUM: $215,870
DMC: $ 1,950 CMC: $
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DC: $39,939 CUM: $162,944
DMC: $ 536 CMC: $ 2,821
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DMC: $ 470 CMC: $ 3,291

1-31-83 2,985' Day 8; Drilling, made 493' in 16 hrs. MW water. Pemarks: Test
kelly and set wear bushing. Pick up bottom hole assembly and trip
in hole. Drill floats and shoe joint.
DC: $21,695 CUM: $201,580
DMC: $ 554 CMC: $ 3,845

2-1-83 3,395' Day 9; Drilling, Rade 410' in 194 hrs. FM wtr. Remarks: Trip for
bit #7. Wash 60' to bottam. Survey: l¼ degrees @2,953' and
1-3/4 degrees @ 3,182'.
DC: $14,290 CUM: $215,870
DMC: $ 1,950 CMC: $
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2-2-83 4,085' Day 10; Drilling, made 690' in 23½ hrs. MWwater. Remarks:
Survey: 2¼ degrees @ 3,663'.
DC: $19,773 CUM: $235,643
DMC: $ 615 CMC: $ 6,375

2-3-83 4,665' Day 11; Drilling, ande 580' in 23½ hrs. FW water. Remarks:
Survey: 2 degrees @4,176'.
DC: $17,156 CUM: $252,799
DMC: $ 330 CMC: $ 6,705

2-4-83 5,270' Day 12; Drilling, made 605' in 22½ hrs. MWwater. Pecarks:
Survey: 2 degrees @4,664' & 2 degrees @ 5,190'.
DC: $17,743 CUM: $270,542
DMC: $ 415 CMC: $ 7,120

2-5-83 5,716' Day 13; Drilling, made 446' in 18-3/4 hrs. MWwater, PH 11.5.
Remarks: Dark brown oil on reserve pits. Survey: 2 degrees @
5,480'.
DC: $13,539 CUM: $284,081
DMC: $ 820 CMC: $ 7,940

2-6-83 6,225' Day 14; Drilling, made 509' in 23 hrs. MWwater, PH 11.
Remarks: Increase in dark brown oil. Drilling @5,980'.
Survey: 2½ degrees @5,994'.
DC: $15,297 CUM: $299,378
DMC: $ 940 CMC: $ 8,880

2-7-83 6,555' Day 15; Drilling, Rade 330' in 17 hrs. MWwater, PH 10.5.
Remarks: Trip for bit #9. Wash and ream 95' to bottom.
Survey: 2¼ degrees @6,531'.
DC: $10,323 CUM: $309,701
DMC: $ 620 CMC: $ 9,500

2-8-83 7,000' Day 16; Drilling, made 445' in 24 hrs. MWwater, PH 10.5.
Remarks: Drilling ahead, no problems.
DC: $17,331 CUM: $327,032
DMC: $ 346 CMC: $ 9,846

2-9-83 7,480' Day 17; Drilling, rede 480' in 23½ hrs. MWwater, PH 10.2.
Remarks: Slight amount of dark brown oil going over shaker.
Survey: 2-3/4 degrees @7,007'.
DC: $16,767 COM: $343,799
DMC: $ 335 CMC: $ 10,181

2-10-83 7,970' Day 18; Drilling, Rede 490' in 23½ hrs. FM water, PH 10.2.
Remarks: Dark brown oil going over shaker, no increase.
Survey: 24 degrees @ 7,520'.
DC: $15,218 CUM: $359,017
DMC: $ 559 CMC: $ 10,740

2-11-83 8,157' Day 19; Drilling, rade 187' in 14½ hrs. MW 8.6, Vis 34, WL 18,
Cake 2, PH 11.2. Remarks: Trip for bit #10. Wash and ream.
SHOW#l: 8,120-30'; Drilling Rate: Before 7.5 mins., During 4.5
mins., After 7 rins. Formation Gas: Before 25 units, During
185 units, After 20 units. No oil show, gas only. Survey:
3 degrees @ 8,157'. BGG: 25 units.
DC: $7,856 COM: $366,873
DMC: $ 660 CMC: $ 11,4002-12-83 8,411' Day 20; Drilling, Rade 254' in 17-3/4 hrs. 597 8.6, Vis 38, PL 22,
Cake 1, PH 11.0. Remarks: Mix and pump LCM pill on bottom @8,157'.
Pull 5 stands. Build volume and mix IEM to 10%. Trip in 5
stands. Resure drilling. SHOW#2: 8,377-82'; Drilling Rate:
Before 4 mins., During 3.5 mins., After 4 rins. Formation Gas:
Before 80 units, During 820 units, After 90 units. No fluoresence
or cut. BGG: 80 units; CG: 136 units.
DC: $10,902 COM: $377,775
DMC: $ 2,135 CMC: $
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2-13-8 3 8 , 737 ' Day 21; Drilling , made Ei' in MW 8 . 6 , Vis 38 , WL 16 ,

Cake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: SHOW #3: 8,646-64'; Drilling Rate:
Before 5 mins., During 2.5 mins., After 4 mins. Formation
Gas: Before 70 units, During 370 units, After 100 units. No
oil show. SHOW#4: 8,692-8,700'; Drilling Rate: Before 7 rins.,
During 5 mins. After 6 mins. Formation Gas: Before 100 units,
During 340 units, After 100 units. No oil show. BCE: 90 units;
CG: 100 units.
DC: $14,314 CUM: $ 392,089
DMC: $ 3,820 CMC: $ 17,355

2-14-83 8,933' Day 22; Drilling, made 196' in 16 hrs. MW 8.5+, Vis 37, WL 21.4,
Cake 2, PH ll. Remarks: Pump 400 barrels, mix I£M pill and
purrped to bottom. Pulled 5 stands. Build volume to 39 Vis, and
15% 101. Purp in slow, no returns. Build volume to 49 Vis, and
28% LCM. Start pamping in 100 barrels. No returns. SHOW#5:
8,850-54'; Drilling Rate: Before 4 mins., During 3 mins., After
4 wins. Formation Gas: Before 100 units, During 380 units, After
90 units. No oil show.
DC: $17,549 CUM: $409,638
DMC: $10,500 CMC: $ 27,855

2-15-83 9,140' Day 23; Drilling, made 207' in 15½ hrs. MW 8.4, Vis 45, WL 21,
Cake 2, PH 10. Remarks: Build volume to 40 Vis and 20% I.CM.
Circulate with approximately 80% returns. Run in hole with 5
stands. SHOW#6; 9,064-80'; Drilling Rate: Before 4 Rins., During
2.5 mins., After 4 Kins. Formation Gas: Before 120 units, During
450 units, After 100 units. Trace yellow oil, yellow fluoresence,
fair cut. BGG: 80 units; CG: 114 units.
DC: $8,509 CUM: $418,147
DMC: $ 984 000: $ 37,695

2-16-83 9,227' Day 24; Drilling, Rede 87' in 8½ hrs. MW8.4+, Vis 45, WL 17,
Cake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: Trip for bit #11 and look for hole in
pipe. Found hole in pipe, lay down 1 joint. Wash and ream.
BGG: 60 units; TRIP 350 units.
DC: $4,475 COM: $422,622
DMC: $ 260 CMC: $ 37,955

2-17-83 9,532' Day 25; Drilling, rede 305' in 20½ hrs. MW 8.6, Vis 42, WL 18,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: Ream and wrk tight hole. SHOW#7:
9,464-70'; Drilling Rate: Before 3 mins., During 2 mins., After
3 mins. Fonnation Gas: Before 450 units; During 2100 units;
After 1400 units. Show brown-green oil.
DC: $11,929 COM: $434,551
DMC: $ 135 CMC: $ 38,090

2-18-83 9,684' Day 26; Drilling, made 152' in 21½ hrs. MW 8.8, Vis 42, WL 17.6,
Cake 2, PH 9.8. Remarks: No shows. BGG: 260 units; CG: 400 units.
DC: $8,270 CUM: $442,821
DMO: $ 445 CMC: $ 38,535

2-19-83 9.840' Day 27; Drilling, made 156' in 24 hrs. MW8.9, Vis 42, WL 17.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.8. Remarks: No shows. BGG: 380 units; CG: 540 units.
DC: $18,360 CUM: $461,181
DMC: $ 5,100 CMC: $ 43,635

2-20-83 9,991' Day 28; Drilling, made 151' in 23½ hrs. ARI 9, Vis 43, WL 16.8,
Cake 2, PH 10. Remarks: Mix and pump IDI pill. Spot pill on
bottom. Regain circulation. Drilling ahead. No shows.
BGG: 350 units; CG: 590 units.
DC: $11,003 CUM: $472,184
DEC: $ 4,855 CMC: $ 48,490

2-21-83 10,016' Day 29; Drilling, made 25' in l½ hrs. MW 9.2, Vis 42, WL 16.4,
Cake 2, PH 10. Remarks: Rig up Dresser Atlas and run logs, tool
trouble. Pull out of hole. Rig up more tools. Continue to log.
Survey: 2-3/4 degrees @10,000'. BGG: 240 units; CG: 320 units;
Short Trip 2900 units.
DC; (8,868 CUM:
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2-22-83 10,016' Day 30; Made -0- footage. MW9.l+, Vis 55, WL 14.6, Cake 2,
PH 9.5. Remarks: Finish logs and rig down Dresser Atlas.
Trip in hole and break circulation @ 5,000'. Trip in hole and
attempt to break circulation @ 9,000'. No circulation. Pull
5 stands. Break circulation 15 stands off bottom. Trip in
hole 5 stands. Break circulation. Trip in hole l joint, hit
bridge @9,110'+. Wash and ream 60'. Trip in hole 2 stands.
Bridge @9,300'+. Wash and ream from 9,300-9,634'. Trip in
hole fram 9,634-9,845'. Wash and remn from 9,855-10,016'.
25' fill on bottom. Circulate bottoms up. BGG: 180 units;
CG: 240-260 units; TRIP 1900 units.
DC: $26,151 CUM: $507,203
DMC: $ 150 OMC: $ 49,250

2-23-83 10,016' Day 31; Made -0- footage. MW9.2, Vis 47, WL 13.4, Cake 2,
PH 9.2. Remarks: Circulate bottoms up. Short trip 20 stands.
Circulate and condition. Trip in hole hit bridge @ 9,323'.
Washed bridge out, did not rotate. Finish going to bottom.
Circulate bottoms up. Chain out 20 stands. Lay down drill
pipe, drill collars and bottom hole assembly. Rig up and run
7" casing. Break circulation @5,000'. Trip in hole with
casing. No returns.
DC: $147,314 CUM: $654,517
DMC: $ 1,265 CMC: $ 50,515

2-24-83 10,016' Day 32; Made -0- footage. MW9.1, Vis 54, WL 15.2, Cake 2,
PH 9. Remarks: Ran Halliburton guide shoc, differential fill
float collar, 86 joints 7" N-80 32# LT & C (3,485.99'), 83
joints 7" N-80 29# LT & C (3,463.70'), and 74 joints 7" N-80
26# LT & C (3,077.58') casing. Total pipe and float equipment
10,027.27'. Set shoe @10,016' with float collar @9,973'.
Cemented with Halliburton with 10 barrels water and 250 sacks
Halliburton Lite cement with 10% salt, 10# Gilsónite and k#
Flocele per sack. Followed by 200 sacks Class H with 10% salt,
and ¼# Flocele per sack. Released top rubber plug and displaced
with 337 barrels mud. Plugged down @ 9:05 a.m. Bumped plug @
1000/1250 psi. Checked flow, ok. Nipple down. Cut off casing.
Nipple up. Change kelly's. Pressure test Hydril, blind rams
and casing to 2000 psi. Test choke manifold, safety valve, BOP
stack and pipe rams to 5000 psi. String up on 8 lines. Cut
drilling line. Pick bottom hole assembly.
DC: $22,926 CUM: $677,443
DMC: $ 215 CMC: $ 50,730

2-25-83 10,026' Day 33; Drilling, Rade 10' in 2 hrs. .MW 8.6, Vis 46, WL 14.2,
Cake 1, PH 10.5. Remarks: Tag cement @9,962'. Drill cement,
rubber plug, float collar, shoe & 10' of new hole. Pressure
test formation to 1500 psi for 10 minutes, no leak off. Circulate.
Trip out of hole. Pick up bit #13 and jars. Trip in hole.
BGG: 20 units.
DC: $19,937 CUM: $697,380
DMC: $ 215 CMc: $ 49,315

2-26-83 10,115' Day 34; Drilling, ande 89' in 23 hrs. MW9.2, Vis 42, WL 16.4,
Cake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: Circulate and clean bottom of hole.
SHOW#8: 10,050-58'; Drilling Rate: Before 19 rins., During 7
mins., After 12 mins. Formation Gas: Before 10 mins., During
510 units; After 40 units. BGG: 20 units; CG: ,120 units.
DC: $17,586 CUM: $714,966
OMC: $ 300 CMC: $ 49,615

2-27-83 10,160' Day 35; Drilling, made 45' in 14 hrs. >¾v 9.2, Vis 47, WL ll,
Cake 2, PH 9.8. Remarks: Circulate bottoms up. Trip for bit
#14. Wash 50' to bottom. Ream and clean hole. No shows.
BGG: 20 units; CG: 120 unitS; TRIP 3150 units.
DC: $8,291 CUM: $723,257
OMC: $ 290 OMC: $
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Bridge @9,300'+. Wash and ream from 9,300-9,634'. Trip in
hole fram 9,634-9,845'. Wash and remn from 9,855-10,016'.
25' fill on bottom. Circulate bottoms up. BGG: 180 units;
CG: 240-260 units; TRIP 1900 units.
DC: $26,151 CUM: $507,203
DMC: $ 150 OMC: $ 49,250

2-23-83 10,016' Day 31; Made -0- footage. MW9.2, Vis 47, WL 13.4, Cake 2,
PH 9.2. Remarks: Circulate bottoms up. Short trip 20 stands.
Circulate and condition. Trip in hole hit bridge @ 9,323'.
Washed bridge out, did not rotate. Finish going to bottom.
Circulate bottoms up. Chain out 20 stands. Lay down drill
pipe, drill collars and bottom hole assembly. Rig up and run
7" casing. Break circulation @5,000'. Trip in hole with
casing. No returns.
DC: $147,314 CUM: $654,517
DMC: $ 1,265 CMC: $ 50,515

2-24-83 10,016' Day 32; Made -0- footage. MW9.1, Vis 54, WL 15.2, Cake 2,
PH 9. Remarks: Ran Halliburton guide shoc, differential fill
float collar, 86 joints 7" N-80 32# LT & C (3,485.99'), 83
joints 7" N-80 29# LT & C (3,463.70'), and 74 joints 7" N-80
26# LT & C (3,077.58') casing. Total pipe and float equipment
10,027.27'. Set shoe @10,016' with float collar @9,973'.
Cemented with Halliburton with 10 barrels water and 250 sacks
Halliburton Lite cement with 10% salt, 10# Gilsónite and k#
Flocele per sack. Followed by 200 sacks Class H with 10% salt,
and ¼# Flocele per sack. Released top rubber plug and displaced
with 337 barrels mud. Plugged down @ 9:05 a.m. Bumped plug @
1000/1250 psi. Checked flow, ok. Nipple down. Cut off casing.
Nipple up. Change kelly's. Pressure test Hydril, blind rams
and casing to 2000 psi. Test choke manifold, safety valve, BOP
stack and pipe rams to 5000 psi. String up on 8 lines. Cut
drilling line. Pick bottom hole assembly.
DC: $22,926 CUM: $677,443
DMC: $ 215 CMC: $ 50,730

2-25-83 10,026' Day 33; Drilling, Rade 10' in 2 hrs. .MW 8.6, Vis 46, WL 14.2,
Cake 1, PH 10.5. Remarks: Tag cement @9,962'. Drill cement,
rubber plug, float collar, shoe & 10' of new hole. Pressure
test formation to 1500 psi for 10 minutes, no leak off. Circulate.
Trip out of hole. Pick up bit #13 and jars. Trip in hole.
BGG: 20 units.
DC: $19,937 CUM: $697,380
DMC: $ 215 CMc: $ 49,315

2-26-83 10,115' Day 34; Drilling, ande 89' in 23 hrs. MW9.2, Vis 42, WL 16.4,
Cake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: Circulate and clean bottom of hole.
SHOW#8: 10,050-58'; Drilling Rate: Before 19 rins., During 7
mins., After 12 mins. Formation Gas: Before 10 mins., During
510 units; After 40 units. BGG: 20 units; CG: ,120 units.
DC: $17,586 CUM: $714,966
OMC: $ 300 CMC: $ 49,615

2-27-83 10,160' Day 35; Drilling, made 45' in 14 hrs. >¾v 9.2, Vis 47, WL ll,
Cake 2, PH 9.8. Remarks: Circulate bottoms up. Trip for bit
#14. Wash 50' to bottom. Ream and clean hole. No shows.
BGG: 20 units; CG: 120 unitS; TRIP 3150 units.
DC: $8,291 CUM: $723,257
OMC: $ 290 OMC: $



0 0
WELL: LINMAR-BROWN2-2885
OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGYCORPORATION
LOCATION: SEC 28, T25, R5W, DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAH
CONTRAC'IOR: CHASE DRILLING, RIG #1
OBJECTIVE ZONE: WASATCHFORMATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12,500' PAGE 5

2-28-83 10,270' Day 36; Drilling, made 110' in 24 hrs. MW9.3, Vis 46,
WL 11.4, Cake 2. Remarks: SHOW#9: 10,202-10'; Drilling
Rate: Before 16 mins., During 12.5 mins., After 17 mins.
Formation Gas: Defore 20 units; During 440 units; After 80
units. SHOW#10; 10,214-20'; Drilling Rato: Before 17 units,
During 12 units, After 17 units. Forration Gas: Before 80
units; During 480 units, After 70 units. No fluoresence or cut.
BGG: 10-80 units; CG: 320 units.
DC: $22,881 CUM: $746,138
DMC: $ 515 CMC: $ 50,420

3-1-83 10,414' Day 37; Drilling, rede 144' in 24 hrs. MW 9.4, Vis 47,
WL 12.2, Cake 2, PH 10. Pararks: SHOW#11: 10,252-54'; Drilling
Rate: Before 14 adns., During 15.5 Kins., After 12.5 ains.
Formation Gas: Before 40 units; During 200 units, After 50
units. No oil show, no cut or fluoresence. BGG: 120 units - avg;
CG: 1500 units - avg.
DC: $8,386 CUM: $754,524
DMC: $ 385 CMC: $ 51,655

3-2-83 10,555' Day 38; Drilling, Rede 141' in 24 hrs. MW9.5, Vis 40, WL 13.6,
Cake 2. Remarks: Drilling. No shows. PßG: 35 units; CG: 610
anits.
DC: $13,116 CUM: $767,640
DMC: $ 5,205 CMC: $ 56,860

3-3-83 10,693' Day 39; Drilling, vede 138' in 22 hrs. MW10.1+, Vis 40, PL 14.2,
Cake 2, PH 8.9. Remarks: Drilling @10,693'. Got 3000-3200+ units.
No gain in pit volume. Shut in for 20 wins. Shut in casing
pressure 340 psi. Shut in drill pipe pressure 0 psi. Circulate
through choke, 1200 units through gas buster. SHOW#12: 10,686-
possible fracture. Drilling Rate: Before 9 mins., During 13mins.,
After 7 mins. Formation Gas: Before 30 units,'During 3200 units,
After 1200 units. BGG: 1300 units through buster, CG: 60-480 units.
DC: $14,645 CUM: $782,285
DMO: $ 384 CMC: $ 57,244

3-4-83 10,820' Day 40; Drilling, made 127' in 234 hrs. MW10.3, vis 42, WL 13.4,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: No shows. BGG: 3200 units; CG: 3300 units.
DC: $9,366' CUM: $791,651
DMC: $ 585 CMC: $ 57,829

3-5-83 10,958' Day 41; Drilling, Rede 138' in 23½ hrs. MW10.8, Vis 39, WL 9.6,
Cake 2, PH 9.0. Remarks: Drilling. No shows. BCG: 2800 units;
CG: 2800-4000 units.
DC: $18,391 CUM: $810,042
DMC: $ 9,610 CMC: $ 67,439

3-6-83 11,092' Day 42; Drilling, made 134' in 24 hrs. 557 11.2+, Vis 44, WL 10.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.3. Remarks: Drilling. No shows. BGG: 600-1600
units; CG: 1080-2200 units.
DC: $8,981 CUM: $819,023
DMC: $ 200 CMC: .$ 67,639

3-7-83 11,262' Day 43; Drilling, made 170' in 24 hrs. >W 11.2, Vis 42, WL 9.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: SHOW#13: 11,102-06'; Drilling Rate:
Before 13 rins., During 7.5 núns., After 8.5 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 480 units, During 2000 units, After 800 units. Trace
black oil. BGG: 320-1600 units; CG: 1810-2100 Gnits.
DC: $14,161 CUM: $833,189
DMC: $ 5,315 CMC: $ 72,954

3-8-83 11,440' Day 44; Drilling, ande 178' in 23-3/4 hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 42,
WL 10.2, Cake 2, PH 9.1. Remarks: Drilling @11,440'. Pull off
bottom and mix Im while pumping. BGG: 450 units; CG: 1440 units.
DC: $9,221 COM: $842,410
DMC: $ 375 CMC: $

0 0
WELL: LINMAR-BROWN2-2885
OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGYCORPORATION
LOCATION: SEC 28, T25, R5W, DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAH
CONTRAC'IOR: CHASE DRILLING, RIG #1
OBJECTIVE ZONE: WASATCHFORMATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12,500' PAGE 5

2-28-83 10,270' Day 36; Drilling, made 110' in 24 hrs. MW9.3, Vis 46,
WL 11.4, Cake 2. Remarks: SHOW#9: 10,202-10'; Drilling
Rate: Before 16 mins., During 12.5 mins., After 17 mins.
Formation Gas: Defore 20 units; During 440 units; After 80
units. SHOW#10; 10,214-20'; Drilling Rato: Before 17 units,
During 12 units, After 17 units. Forration Gas: Before 80
units; During 480 units, After 70 units. No fluoresence or cut.
BGG: 10-80 units; CG: 320 units.
DC: $22,881 CUM: $746,138
DMC: $ 515 CMC: $ 50,420

3-1-83 10,414' Day 37; Drilling, rede 144' in 24 hrs. MW 9.4, Vis 47,
WL 12.2, Cake 2, PH 10. Pararks: SHOW#11: 10,252-54'; Drilling
Rate: Before 14 adns., During 15.5 Kins., After 12.5 ains.
Formation Gas: Before 40 units; During 200 units, After 50
units. No oil show, no cut or fluoresence. BGG: 120 units - avg;
CG: 1500 units - avg.
DC: $8,386 CUM: $754,524
DMC: $ 385 CMC: $ 51,655

3-2-83 10,555' Day 38; Drilling, Rede 141' in 24 hrs. MW9.5, Vis 40, WL 13.6,
Cake 2. Remarks: Drilling. No shows. PßG: 35 units; CG: 610
anits.
DC: $13,116 CUM: $767,640
DMC: $ 5,205 CMC: $ 56,860

3-3-83 10,693' Day 39; Drilling, vede 138' in 22 hrs. MW10.1+, Vis 40, PL 14.2,
Cake 2, PH 8.9. Remarks: Drilling @10,693'. Got 3000-3200+ units.
No gain in pit volume. Shut in for 20 wins. Shut in casing
pressure 340 psi. Shut in drill pipe pressure 0 psi. Circulate
through choke, 1200 units through gas buster. SHOW#12: 10,686-
possible fracture. Drilling Rate: Before 9 mins., During 13mins.,
After 7 mins. Formation Gas: Before 30 units,'During 3200 units,
After 1200 units. BGG: 1300 units through buster, CG: 60-480 units.
DC: $14,645 CUM: $782,285
DMO: $ 384 CMC: $ 57,244

3-4-83 10,820' Day 40; Drilling, made 127' in 234 hrs. MW10.3, vis 42, WL 13.4,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: No shows. BGG: 3200 units; CG: 3300 units.
DC: $9,366' CUM: $791,651
DMC: $ 585 CMC: $ 57,829

3-5-83 10,958' Day 41; Drilling, Rede 138' in 23½ hrs. MW10.8, Vis 39, WL 9.6,
Cake 2, PH 9.0. Remarks: Drilling. No shows. BCG: 2800 units;
CG: 2800-4000 units.
DC: $18,391 CUM: $810,042
DMC: $ 9,610 CMC: $ 67,439

3-6-83 11,092' Day 42; Drilling, made 134' in 24 hrs. 557 11.2+, Vis 44, WL 10.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.3. Remarks: Drilling. No shows. BGG: 600-1600
units; CG: 1080-2200 units.
DC: $8,981 CUM: $819,023
DMC: $ 200 CMC: .$ 67,639

3-7-83 11,262' Day 43; Drilling, made 170' in 24 hrs. >W 11.2, Vis 42, WL 9.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: SHOW#13: 11,102-06'; Drilling Rate:
Before 13 rins., During 7.5 núns., After 8.5 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 480 units, During 2000 units, After 800 units. Trace
black oil. BGG: 320-1600 units; CG: 1810-2100 Gnits.
DC: $14,161 CUM: $833,189
DMC: $ 5,315 CMC: $ 72,954

3-8-83 11,440' Day 44; Drilling, ande 178' in 23-3/4 hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 42,
WL 10.2, Cake 2, PH 9.1. Remarks: Drilling @11,440'. Pull off
bottom and mix Im while pumping. BGG: 450 units; CG: 1440 units.
DC: $9,221 COM: $842,410
DMC: $ 375 CMC: $
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3-9-83 11,560' Day 45; Drilling, rede 120' in 21½ hrs. MW 11.2+, Vis 41,
WL 9.0, Cake 2, PH 9.4. Remarks: Mix and pump LCM @ 11,440'.
SHDW #14: 11,440-46'; Drilling Rate: Before 9 mins., During 4-10
mins., After 10 mins. Formation Gas: Before 800 units, During 1000
units (through buster) , After 500 units (through buster) . Show of
green gray oil. BGG: 920 units; CG: 1600 units.
DC: $10,626 CUM: $853,036
DMC: $ 1,845 CMC: $ 75,714

3-10-83 11,690' Day 46; Drilling, made 130' in 234 hrs. MW11.2+, Vis 42, WL 9.6,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: No shows. BGG: 340 units; CG: 880 units
DC: $14,177 CUM: $867,213
DMC: $ 5,396 CMC: $ 80,570

3-11-83 11,692' Day 47; Drilling, made 2' in 2 hrs. 659 ll.l+, Vis 39, PL 9.8,
*SIN CORR. Cake 2, PH 8.6. Remarks: Trip for bit #15. Magnaflux bottom

hole assembly. Survey: 4 degrees @11,692'. BGG: 320 units;
TRIP 1150 units - through gas buster.
DC: $25,001 CUM: $892,214
DMC: $ 295 CMC: $ 80,865

3-12-83 11,842' Day 48; Drilling, made 150' in 21½ hrs. FW 11.2, Vis 40, WL 10.2,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: Drilling ahead. SHOW#15: 11,822-30';
Drilling Rate: Before 10 mins., During 7.3 rins., After 9.5. mins.
Formation Gas: Before 500 units, During 1890 units, After 400 units.
Trace oil. BGG: 250 units; CG: 1600 units.
DC: $17,016 CUM: $909,225
DMC: $ 8,170 CMC: $ 89,035

3-13-83 12,027' Day 49; Drilling, made 185' in 24 hrs. MW11.2+, Vis 44, WL 8.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.8. Remarks: SHOW#16: 11,862-64'; Drilling Rate:
Before 8.3 mins., During 7.3 mins., After 7.8 «dns. Formation
Gas: Before 320 units, During 875 units, After 300 units. No oil
increase. SHOW #17: 11,872-76'; Drilling Rate: Before 7 mins.,
During 4 mins., After 7.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 380 units,
During 840 units, After 300 units. No oil increase. Assumcd
fracture. BGG: 320 units; CG: 1800 units.
DC: $9,536 CUM: $918,761
DMC: $ 755 CMC: $ 89,790

3-14-83 12,217' Day 50; Drilling, Rede 190' in 24 hrs. MW11.2, Vis 46, WL 8.6,
Cake 2, PH 10.3. Remarks: SHOW#18: 12,060-62'; Drilling Rate:
Before 6 mins., During 5 mins., After 7 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 55 units, During 118 units, After 70 units. No oil show.
SHOW#19: 12,064-72'; Drilling Rate: Before 7 mins., During 6.7
mins., After 9.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 70 units, During 120
units, After 90 units. No oil show. SHOW#20: 12,160-80';
Drilling Rate: Before 11 mins., During 5.5-10 mins., After 7.5 Räns.
Formation Gas: Before 100 units, During 210 units, After 50 units.
No oil show. SHOW #21: 12,188-92'; Drilling Rate: Before 8 mins.,
During 7 mins., After 8 mins. Formation Gas: Before 50 units,
During 195 units, After 100 units. No oil show. SHOW#22: 12,200-
04'; Drilling Rate: Before 10 mins., During 5.5 Rins., After 8 mins.
Formation Gas: Before 100 units, During 672 units, After 80 units.
No oil show. BGG: 120 units; CG: 1720-372 units.
DC: $9,576 CUM: $928,342
DMC: $ 310 CMC: $ 90,100

3-15-83 12,428' Day 51; Drilling, made 211' in 23 hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 47, WL 8.4,
Dake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: SHOW#23: 12,228-34'; Drilling Rate:
Before 11 mins., During 4 mins., After 6 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 80 units, During 200 units, After 45 units. SHOW#24:
12,240-42'; Drilling Rate: Before 6.5 mins., Dering 6 Kins., After
8.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 45 units, During 180 units, After
60 units. SHOW #25: 12,266-68'; Drilling Rate: Before 8 mins.,
During 7 mins., After 8.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 90 units,
During 225 units, After 160 units. No oil show. BGG: 90 units;
CG: 1142 units.
DC: $9,201 CUM: $937,543
DMC: $ 420 M'• < QA
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3-9-83 11,560' Day 45; Drilling, rede 120' in 21½ hrs. MW 11.2+, Vis 41,
WL 9.0, Cake 2, PH 9.4. Remarks: Mix and pump LCM @ 11,440'.
SHDW #14: 11,440-46'; Drilling Rate: Before 9 mins., During 4-10
mins., After 10 mins. Formation Gas: Before 800 units, During 1000
units (through buster) , After 500 units (through buster) . Show of
green gray oil. BGG: 920 units; CG: 1600 units.
DC: $10,626 CUM: $853,036
DMC: $ 1,845 CMC: $ 75,714

3-10-83 11,690' Day 46; Drilling, made 130' in 234 hrs. MW11.2+, Vis 42, WL 9.6,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: No shows. BGG: 340 units; CG: 880 units
DC: $14,177 CUM: $867,213
DMC: $ 5,396 CMC: $ 80,570

3-11-83 11,692' Day 47; Drilling, made 2' in 2 hrs. 659 ll.l+, Vis 39, PL 9.8,
*SIN CORR. Cake 2, PH 8.6. Remarks: Trip for bit #15. Magnaflux bottom

hole assembly. Survey: 4 degrees @11,692'. BGG: 320 units;
TRIP 1150 units - through gas buster.
DC: $25,001 CUM: $892,214
DMC: $ 295 CMC: $ 80,865

3-12-83 11,842' Day 48; Drilling, made 150' in 21½ hrs. FW 11.2, Vis 40, WL 10.2,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: Drilling ahead. SHOW#15: 11,822-30';
Drilling Rate: Before 10 mins., During 7.3 rins., After 9.5. mins.
Formation Gas: Before 500 units, During 1890 units, After 400 units.
Trace oil. BGG: 250 units; CG: 1600 units.
DC: $17,016 CUM: $909,225
DMC: $ 8,170 CMC: $ 89,035

3-13-83 12,027' Day 49; Drilling, made 185' in 24 hrs. MW11.2+, Vis 44, WL 8.8,
Cake 2, PH 9.8. Remarks: SHOW#16: 11,862-64'; Drilling Rate:
Before 8.3 mins., During 7.3 mins., After 7.8 «dns. Formation
Gas: Before 320 units, During 875 units, After 300 units. No oil
increase. SHOW #17: 11,872-76'; Drilling Rate: Before 7 mins.,
During 4 mins., After 7.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 380 units,
During 840 units, After 300 units. No oil increase. Assumcd
fracture. BGG: 320 units; CG: 1800 units.
DC: $9,536 CUM: $918,761
DMC: $ 755 CMC: $ 89,790

3-14-83 12,217' Day 50; Drilling, Rede 190' in 24 hrs. MW11.2, Vis 46, WL 8.6,
Cake 2, PH 10.3. Remarks: SHOW#18: 12,060-62'; Drilling Rate:
Before 6 mins., During 5 mins., After 7 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 55 units, During 118 units, After 70 units. No oil show.
SHOW#19: 12,064-72'; Drilling Rate: Before 7 mins., During 6.7
mins., After 9.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 70 units, During 120
units, After 90 units. No oil show. SHOW#20: 12,160-80';
Drilling Rate: Before 11 mins., During 5.5-10 mins., After 7.5 Räns.
Formation Gas: Before 100 units, During 210 units, After 50 units.
No oil show. SHOW #21: 12,188-92'; Drilling Rate: Before 8 mins.,
During 7 mins., After 8 mins. Formation Gas: Before 50 units,
During 195 units, After 100 units. No oil show. SHOW#22: 12,200-
04'; Drilling Rate: Before 10 mins., During 5.5 Rins., After 8 mins.
Formation Gas: Before 100 units, During 672 units, After 80 units.
No oil show. BGG: 120 units; CG: 1720-372 units.
DC: $9,576 CUM: $928,342
DMC: $ 310 CMC: $ 90,100

3-15-83 12,428' Day 51; Drilling, made 211' in 23 hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 47, WL 8.4,
Dake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: SHOW#23: 12,228-34'; Drilling Rate:
Before 11 mins., During 4 mins., After 6 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 80 units, During 200 units, After 45 units. SHOW#24:
12,240-42'; Drilling Rate: Before 6.5 mins., Dering 6 Kins., After
8.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 45 units, During 180 units, After
60 units. SHOW #25: 12,266-68'; Drilling Rate: Before 8 mins.,
During 7 mins., After 8.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 90 units,
During 225 units, After 160 units. No oil show. BGG: 90 units;
CG: 1142 units.
DC: $9,201 CUM: $937,543
DMC: $ 420 M'• < QA
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3-16-83 12,638' Day 52; Drilling, made 210' in 23 hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 47, WL 8.5,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: SHOW#26: 12,422-34'; Drilling Rate:
Before 6 mins., During 4.5 mins., After 8.5 mins. Formation
Gas: Before 90 units, During 2200 units, After 150 units. 5%
green oil on pits. SHOW#27: 12,454-62'; Drilling Rate: Before
5.5 mins., During 3.5 mins., After 6 mins, Formation Gas:
Before 150 units, During 1600 units, After 400 units. Green oil
on pits. SHOW #28: 12,578-90'; Drilling Rate: Before 15 nins.,
During 5-6 mins., After 8 mins. Formation Gas: Before 400 units,
During 1320 units, After 400 units. No increase in oil. SHOW #29:
12,592-96'; Drilling Rate: Before 8 mins., During 6.5 mins.,
After 7.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 400 units, During 800 units,
After 650 units. SHOW #30: 12,598-600'; Drilling Rate: Before
7.5 mins., During 6.5 mins., After 9 mins. Fonnation Gas: Before
650 units, During 940 units, After 500 units. SHOW#31: 12,606-20':
Drilling Rate: Before 8.5 Kins., During 4 mins., After 6 mins.
Formation Gas: Before 400 units, During 600 units, After 160 units.
SHOW #32: 12,624-34'; Drilling Rate: Before 8.7 Kins,, During
4.5-5 rins., After 7 ains. Formation Gas: Before 160 units,
During 360 units, After 210 units. BGG: 220 units; CG: 2080 units.
DC: $9,806 CUM: $947,349
DMC: $ 620 CMC: $ 91,140

3-17-83 12,873' Day 53; Drilling, made 235' in 24 hrs. 597 11.2, Vis 41, WL 10.2,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: SHOW#33: 12,726-38'; Drilling Rate:
Before 6 mins., During 4.5-5 mins., After 9 mins. Fornation Gas:
Before 200 units, During 850 units, After 200 units. No oil show.
SHOW #34: 12,836-44'; Drilling Rate: Before 5 mins., During 2
mins., After 5 mins. Formation Gas:- Before 160 units, During 520
units, After 160 units. No oil show. BGG: 80-200 units;
CG: 2560 units.
DC: $9,466 CUM: $956,815
DMC: $ 750 CMS: $ 91,890

3-18-83 12,927' Day 54; Drilling, made 54' in 5½ hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 40, WL 9.6,
SLM Corrt. Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: Circulate and condition for logs.

Ran logs to bottom, no fill, no problems. Survey: 2 degrees @
12,927'. SHOW#35: 12,880-92'; Drilling Rate: Before 6 mins.,
During 4.7 mins., After 7 mins. Formation Gas: Before 200 units,
During 275 units, After 200 units. BGG: 160-200 units;
CG: 1920-2760 units.
DC: $35,655 CUS: $992,470
DEC: $ 545 CMC: $ 92,435

3-19-83 12,927' Day 55; MW11.2, Vis 42, WL 9.6, Cake 2, PH 9.5. Pararks:
Circulate and condition hole to run liner. Trip. Wash and
ream, no fill. BGG: 400-1000 units.
DC: $9,570 CUM: $1,002,035
DMC: $ 374 CMC: $ 92,809

3-20-83 12,927' Day 56; BW 11.2, Vis 49, PH 9.1. Remarks: Circulate. Trip with
drill pipe. Rig up and run 78 joints 5" 18# P-110 X-line Liner
with Halco Differential Fill Float Shoe and Float Collar, and
Rotating Liner Hanger . Total length 3, 118 . 32 '

. Circulate bottoms
up. Hang liner with shoe @ 12,926', float collar @12,883'.
Liner top @ 9,808'. Got loose from liner and rotated 3 mins.,
while circulating. Pumped 15 barrels CS-12 weighted spacer.
Cemented with 550 sacks 50-50 Pozmix with 10% salt, .5% CFR2'
and .4% Halad 9 per sack. BGG: 1200-1300 units; ITŒP 2200
units.
DC: $11,386 CUM: $1,013,421
DMC: $ 270 CMC: $ 93,079

3-21-83 12,927' Day 57; Cementing. Started rotating when cement started around
shoe. Could not rotate for last 50 barrels displacement. Dis-
placed with 127 barrels mud. Bumped plug @ 7:05 a.m. @ 1700/
2000 psi. Checked floats, ok. Set packer. Pull out of hole with
setting tool and retrievable pack off bushing. All looked OK.
Wait on cement.
DC: $29,846 CUM: $1,043,267
DMC: $ -0- CMC: $
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OBJECTIVE 'ZONE: WASATCHFORMATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12,500' PACE 7

3-16-83 12,638' Day 52; Drilling, made 210' in 23 hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 47, WL 8.5,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: SHOW#26: 12,422-34'; Drilling Rate:
Before 6 mins., During 4.5 mins., After 8.5 mins. Formation
Gas: Before 90 units, During 2200 units, After 150 units. 5%
green oil on pits. SHOW#27: 12,454-62'; Drilling Rate: Before
5.5 mins., During 3.5 mins., After 6 mins, Formation Gas:
Before 150 units, During 1600 units, After 400 units. Green oil
on pits. SHOW #28: 12,578-90'; Drilling Rate: Before 15 nins.,
During 5-6 mins., After 8 mins. Formation Gas: Before 400 units,
During 1320 units, After 400 units. No increase in oil. SHOW #29:
12,592-96'; Drilling Rate: Before 8 mins., During 6.5 mins.,
After 7.5 mins. Formation Gas: Before 400 units, During 800 units,
After 650 units. SHOW #30: 12,598-600'; Drilling Rate: Before
7.5 mins., During 6.5 mins., After 9 mins. Fonnation Gas: Before
650 units, During 940 units, After 500 units. SHOW#31: 12,606-20':
Drilling Rate: Before 8.5 Kins., During 4 mins., After 6 mins.
Formation Gas: Before 400 units, During 600 units, After 160 units.
SHOW #32: 12,624-34'; Drilling Rate: Before 8.7 Kins,, During
4.5-5 rins., After 7 ains. Formation Gas: Before 160 units,
During 360 units, After 210 units. BGG: 220 units; CG: 2080 units.
DC: $9,806 CUM: $947,349
DMC: $ 620 CMC: $ 91,140

3-17-83 12,873' Day 53; Drilling, made 235' in 24 hrs. 597 11.2, Vis 41, WL 10.2,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: SHOW#33: 12,726-38'; Drilling Rate:
Before 6 mins., During 4.5-5 mins., After 9 mins. Fornation Gas:
Before 200 units, During 850 units, After 200 units. No oil show.
SHOW #34: 12,836-44'; Drilling Rate: Before 5 mins., During 2
mins., After 5 mins. Formation Gas:- Before 160 units, During 520
units, After 160 units. No oil show. BGG: 80-200 units;
CG: 2560 units.
DC: $9,466 CUM: $956,815
DMC: $ 750 CMS: $ 91,890

3-18-83 12,927' Day 54; Drilling, made 54' in 5½ hrs. MW 11.2, Vis 40, WL 9.6,
SLM Corrt. Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: Circulate and condition for logs.

Ran logs to bottom, no fill, no problems. Survey: 2 degrees @
12,927'. SHOW#35: 12,880-92'; Drilling Rate: Before 6 mins.,
During 4.7 mins., After 7 mins. Formation Gas: Before 200 units,
During 275 units, After 200 units. BGG: 160-200 units;
CG: 1920-2760 units.
DC: $35,655 CUS: $992,470
DEC: $ 545 CMC: $ 92,435

3-19-83 12,927' Day 55; MW11.2, Vis 42, WL 9.6, Cake 2, PH 9.5. Pararks:
Circulate and condition hole to run liner. Trip. Wash and
ream, no fill. BGG: 400-1000 units.
DC: $9,570 CUM: $1,002,035
DMC: $ 374 CMC: $ 92,809

3-20-83 12,927' Day 56; BW 11.2, Vis 49, PH 9.1. Remarks: Circulate. Trip with
drill pipe. Rig up and run 78 joints 5" 18# P-110 X-line Liner
with Halco Differential Fill Float Shoe and Float Collar, and
Rotating Liner Hanger . Total length 3, 118 . 32 '

. Circulate bottoms
up. Hang liner with shoe @ 12,926', float collar @12,883'.
Liner top @ 9,808'. Got loose from liner and rotated 3 mins.,
while circulating. Pumped 15 barrels CS-12 weighted spacer.
Cemented with 550 sacks 50-50 Pozmix with 10% salt, .5% CFR2'
and .4% Halad 9 per sack. BGG: 1200-1300 units; ITŒP 2200
units.
DC: $11,386 CUM: $1,013,421
DMC: $ 270 CMC: $ 93,079

3-21-83 12,927' Day 57; Cementing. Started rotating when cement started around
shoe. Could not rotate for last 50 barrels displacement. Dis-
placed with 127 barrels mud. Bumped plug @ 7:05 a.m. @ 1700/
2000 psi. Checked floats, ok. Set packer. Pull out of hole with
setting tool and retrievable pack off bushing. All looked OK.
Wait on cement.
DC: $29,846 CUM: $1,043,267
DMC: $ -0- CMC: $



. O O
WIRL: LINMAR-BRCWN2-28B5

OPERMOR: LINMAR ENERGYCOIGORATION
IDCATION: SIE 28 , T2S, R5W, DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAH
CONTRACTUR: CHASE DRILLING, RIG #1
OBJECTIVE ZONE: WASASCHFOPMATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12,500' PAGE 9

4-6-83 (cont'd) Rig down move off Oil Well Perforators. Pick up 5" 18# redel
"R" packer. Run in hole with 318 joints to bottom. Set packer
@10,009' with 15,000# weight. Test packer, casing and BOP tC
3000 psi.

4-7-83 Day 5; 13 hr. shut in tubing pressure 600 psi. Bled small amount
of gas and oil to flat tank. Install back pressure valve in long
string. Land production tubing with 15,000# set down on packer.
Change elevators, rams and tongs to 2.9". Pick up and rtm in
hole with 167 jionbs 2.9" NDE heat string to 5,017'. Nipple
down BOP. Nipple up tree. Test tree to 5000 psi. Pull back
pressure valve. Shut in tubing pressure 400 psi. Flowed well to
tank. Tubing dead in 45 mins. Made 3 swab runs. Pulled fluid
level to 6600'. Recovered 53 barrels fluid total. Shut down for
night.
DC: $3,700 CUM: $86,800

4-8-83 Day 6; 12 hr shut in tubing pressure 1500 psi. Bled pressure to
tank. Rig up and swab as follows:
RUN FLUID LEVEL DEPTH BARRELS FLUID-tanks

1 2,400' 6,000' 7
2 3,600' 7,200' 12
3 4,200' 7,800' 8
4 4,800' 8,700' 12
5 6,000' 10,000' 8
6 6,000' 10,000' 10
7 6,300' 10,000' 13
8 6,900' 10,000' 13
9 6,900' 10,000' 10

10 6,900' 10,000' 13
11 3,000' 10,000' 26
Produced 148 barrels oil and 60 barrels water.
DC: $10,000 CUM: $96,800

4-9-83 Flowed 24 hrs. on 28/64" choke @ 150 psi tubing pressure, 316 BO,
25 BW, 368 MCFD.

4-10-83 Day 7; Move in rig up Dowell. Nipple up tree saver. Set casing
popoff to 3000 psi. Test lines to 8500 psi. Pressure casing bo
2500 psi. Acidize down tubing w/20,000 gals. 15% HCl (with
corrosion inhibitor and friction reducer) . Maximum treating
pressure 7000 psi, average 6700 psi. Maximum rite 10 bpm, average
9.5 bpm. Good ball action. Instant shut in pressure 3400 psi,
5 Rin. shut in tubing pressure 3100 psi, 10 adn, 2300 psi, 15
rin 800 psi. Open well for 3 mins to surge balls off perforations.
Shut in well. Rig down Rove off Dowell. 619 barrels load fluid
to be recovered. Opened well to tank #1 @1:00 p.m. Gas to sur-
face in 25 mins. Oil to surface in 40 Kins. At 2:00 p.m. Well
flowing to treater @1500 psi on 23/64" choke. Rig down move off
service unit. Flow 24 hrs. on 23/64" choke @1400 psi tubing
pressure 1360 BO, 123 BW, 1555 McFG. 467 barrels load water to be
recovered.
DC: $22,200 CUM: $119,000

4-11-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 17/64" choke @1650 psi tubing pressure, 729 BO,
15 BW, 1531 MCFD.

4-12-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 17/64" choke @ 1550 psi tubing pressure, 792 BO,
8 BW, 1317 MCFD.

4-13-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 17/64" choke @1400 psi tubing Šressure,712 BO,
6 BW, 1200 MCFD.

4-14-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 19/64" choke @ 1250 psi tubing pressure, 874 BO,
11 BW, 1226 MCFD.

4-15-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 19/64" choke @1200 psi tubing pressure, 858 BO,
1 BW, ll98

. O O
WIRL: LINMAR-BRCWN2-28B5

OPERMOR: LINMAR ENERGYCOIGORATION
IDCATION: SIE 28 , T2S, R5W, DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAH
CONTRACTUR: CHASE DRILLING, RIG #1
OBJECTIVE ZONE: WASASCHFOPMATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12,500' PAGE 9

4-6-83 (cont'd) Rig down move off Oil Well Perforators. Pick up 5" 18# redel
"R" packer. Run in hole with 318 joints to bottom. Set packer
@10,009' with 15,000# weight. Test packer, casing and BOP tC
3000 psi.

4-7-83 Day 5; 13 hr. shut in tubing pressure 600 psi. Bled small amount
of gas and oil to flat tank. Install back pressure valve in long
string. Land production tubing with 15,000# set down on packer.
Change elevators, rams and tongs to 2.9". Pick up and rtm in
hole with 167 jionbs 2.9" NDE heat string to 5,017'. Nipple
down BOP. Nipple up tree. Test tree to 5000 psi. Pull back
pressure valve. Shut in tubing pressure 400 psi. Flowed well to
tank. Tubing dead in 45 mins. Made 3 swab runs. Pulled fluid
level to 6600'. Recovered 53 barrels fluid total. Shut down for
night.
DC: $3,700 CUM: $86,800

4-8-83 Day 6; 12 hr shut in tubing pressure 1500 psi. Bled pressure to
tank. Rig up and swab as follows:
RUN FLUID LEVEL DEPTH BARRELS FLUID-tanks

1 2,400' 6,000' 7
2 3,600' 7,200' 12
3 4,200' 7,800' 8
4 4,800' 8,700' 12
5 6,000' 10,000' 8
6 6,000' 10,000' 10
7 6,300' 10,000' 13
8 6,900' 10,000' 13
9 6,900' 10,000' 10

10 6,900' 10,000' 13
11 3,000' 10,000' 26
Produced 148 barrels oil and 60 barrels water.
DC: $10,000 CUM: $96,800

4-9-83 Flowed 24 hrs. on 28/64" choke @ 150 psi tubing pressure, 316 BO,
25 BW, 368 MCFD.

4-10-83 Day 7; Move in rig up Dowell. Nipple up tree saver. Set casing
popoff to 3000 psi. Test lines to 8500 psi. Pressure casing bo
2500 psi. Acidize down tubing w/20,000 gals. 15% HCl (with
corrosion inhibitor and friction reducer) . Maximum treating
pressure 7000 psi, average 6700 psi. Maximum rite 10 bpm, average
9.5 bpm. Good ball action. Instant shut in pressure 3400 psi,
5 Rin. shut in tubing pressure 3100 psi, 10 adn, 2300 psi, 15
rin 800 psi. Open well for 3 mins to surge balls off perforations.
Shut in well. Rig down Rove off Dowell. 619 barrels load fluid
to be recovered. Opened well to tank #1 @1:00 p.m. Gas to sur-
face in 25 mins. Oil to surface in 40 Kins. At 2:00 p.m. Well
flowing to treater @1500 psi on 23/64" choke. Rig down move off
service unit. Flow 24 hrs. on 23/64" choke @1400 psi tubing
pressure 1360 BO, 123 BW, 1555 McFG. 467 barrels load water to be
recovered.
DC: $22,200 CUM: $119,000

4-11-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 17/64" choke @1650 psi tubing pressure, 729 BO,
15 BW, 1531 MCFD.

4-12-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 17/64" choke @ 1550 psi tubing pressure, 792 BO,
8 BW, 1317 MCFD.

4-13-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 17/64" choke @1400 psi tubing Šressure,712 BO,
6 BW, 1200 MCFD.

4-14-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 19/64" choke @ 1250 psi tubing pressure, 874 BO,
11 BW, 1226 MCFD.

4-15-83 Flow 24 hrs. on 19/64" choke @1200 psi tubing pressure, 858 BO,
1 BW, ll98



STATE OF UTAH
On TCVerse shÌe)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING $ LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO

EEE
WELLCOMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG *

6. IF INDIAN, AT.LOTTEE OR TRTHE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: I
LL 4 LL DRY Üthor

- ,
---.--

I. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NEwL wonit IFFP-

e in. Other_ ...__

8. FAust on LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR BROWN
LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION 0. IEELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERAToa 2-28 B5
7979 TUFTS PARKWAY, STE 604, DENVER, COLORADO 10. FIEI,D AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (R€port locaffDN Clearly and iN accorduhCe icith ang State requirements)' ALTAMONT, WASATCH
At surface 11. SEC., T., R., M., on BLOCK AND st'avEY

At top prod. interval reported below 1413' FWI AND 1777' FSL
SEL 28, T2S, R5W, USM

(NE SW)At total depth

4. PERAiIT NO. DATE 1881 En 12. COUNTY OR 13. BTATE

12-6-1982 DUCrlÊÊE
UTAll

15, DATE SPCDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED li. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, TT, GR, ETC.)* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

1-23-1983 3-21-1983 4-10-1983 59 29 GR 5931
20. TØrAL DEPTH, MD A TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MT LTIPLE COMPL., 28. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY* PRILLED BY

12,927' 12,881' X |
24. PILODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NANIE (MD AND TVD) 5. WAN DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE

WASATCH 1.0,796' - 12,842' NO
26. TTPE ELECTIIIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

FOC, CNL, GR, CAL, DTL, SP NO
28. CASING RECORD (Report all atr tigA ael

CASING RIZE WEIGHT, LBfrT. DEPTH SET (MD) IIOLE SIZE CEN ING AM UNT PULLED

9 5/8" 36 2' 2 la" TO SURFACE
2" 2 ,_ 32 10,016 e 3/4" 250 SX T ITE 200 SX "H"

29, LINER RECORD 30 TUBING RECORD
HIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SI2E DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD

6"
_

9808' 12,927' 550 2 7/8" 10,009' 10,009'

ST imaronArio ascoan (Interval, size and nutaber) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL (afD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED10,796' - 12,842' 10,796' -

12,¯Z2'
20,000 GAL 15% H C1 ACID

(SEE ATTACHED FOR DETAILS)

33.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRBT PRODUCTION PRODLOTION METHOD (Flotolfig, gaa left, puffsping-tigg GHd igpg of putsp) =VELL STATIJS (Producing or

4-10-33 i FLOWING DDCINC
DATE OF TEST HOLRS TESTED CIIOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR DIL-BBL, GAS- MOV. BATER-BEL GAS-OIL RATIO

4-10-83 24 23/64
TEST PERIOD

1360 1555 123 14143
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSL RE CALPLLATED IL-BRL. GAS- MCF. WATI R BEL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR,)

1400 PSI | ŸJ \ 360 1555 123 45.4
34. DisPoslTIoN or oAs (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TEsT WITNESSED BT

VENTED E. B. WHICKER
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

PERFO ATI
36. I hereby ee ify t t a foregoingnd

at¯
cH d infor tion mpÏeteand correct as determined from all available records

SIGNE
,_

- VICE PRESIDENT DATEohn W. Clark
*(See Instructionsand Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse
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WELL: LINMAR-BRCWN2-28B5

OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
LOCATION: SEC 28, T2S, R5W, DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAH
CONTRACTOR: CHASE DRILLING, RIG #1
ORTECTIVE ZONE: WASA'ICHFOIWATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12, 500 ' PAGE 8

3-22-83 12,927' Day 58; Wait on cement. Trip in hole. Displace hole with
water . Contaminated cement and stringers from 8 ,

425-8
, 575 '

.

Firm cement from 8,525-9,680'.
DC: $86,371 CUM: $1,129,638
DMC: $ -0- OMC: $ 93,079

3-23-83 12,927' Day 59; Drilling cement from 9,680-9,808'. ('Dop of liner.)
Circulate. Pressure test. Lay down 3½" drill pipe. Break
and lay down kelly. Rig down floor and stack, clean pits.
Nipple up wellhead. Pressure test liner top to 2300 psi for
20 mins., no bleed off.
DC: $45,568 COM: $1,175,206
DMC: $ -0- CMC: $ 87,430

3-24-83 12,927'TD Day 60; Nipple up tree, pressure test wellhead. RETEASED RIG
@8:00 a.m. 3/23/83.
DC: $5,050 CUM: $1,180,256
DMC: $ -0- CMC: $ 87,430

3-25-83 Rig down, rove off Rotary Tools. Waiting on Completion Unit.

3-26-83 Wait on campletion unit.

3-27-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-28-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-29-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-30-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-31-83 Day 1; Move.in rig up Prairie Gold Rig #6. Nipple down tree.
Nipple up BOP. Pick up and run in hole to 8,886' with 282 joints
2-7/8" 6½# N-80 EUE tubing. Shut down for night.
DC: $54,l00 CUM: $54,100

4-1-83 Day 2; Pick up and run in hole to 12,881' wit11 127 joints. Had
to mill 6' of cerent @ top of liner and 75' @TD. Reverse circulate
bottoms up. Pull out of hole and lay down 4 joints. Shut down
for night.
DC: $4,700 CÓM: $58,800

4-2-83 Day 3; Pull out of hole and lay down 81 joints. Pull out of hole.
Move in rig up Oil Well Perforators. Run CBL-GR log from TD to
7, 500 '

. Shut down for night.
DC: $3,200 CUM: $62,000

4-3-83 shut down for weekend.

4-4-83 Shut down for weekend.
4-5-83 Waiting on Perforators.
4-6-83 Day 4; Move in rig up Oil Well. Perforators. Nipple up 5000 psi

lubricator and test same to 2500 psi. Pick up and run in hole with
gun #1. Perforate the following DIL-GR depths with 3 jspf , using
a 3-1/8" casing gun:
RUN #1 - Tobing pressure before 250 psi, after 100 psi:
12,840-42'; 12,733-35'; 12,618-20'; 12,428-30'; 12,012-04';
11,746-48'; 11,706-08'; 11,682-84'; 11,670-72'; & 11,594-96'.
RUN #2 - Tubing pressure before 500 psi, after 500 psi:
12,718'; 12,642'; 12,570'; 12,538'; 12,534'; 122,520'; 12,483';
12,462'; 12,452'; 12,389'; 12,372'; 12,312'; 12,243'; 12,208';
12,146'; 11,967'; 11,924'; 11,916'; 11,879'; 11,866'; & 11,841'.
RUN #3 - Tubing pressure before and after 500 psi:
11,811'; 11,805'; 11,697'; 11,657'; 11,647'; 11,574'; 11,362';
11,319'; 11,315'; 11,300'; 11,252'; 11,249'; 11,240'; 11,157';
11,052'; 10,982'; 10,899'; 10,803'; 10,774'; &610,768'.
RUN #4 - Tubing pressure before 500 psi, after 350 psi:
11,452-54'; 11,218-20'; 11,203-05'; 11,110-14'; 10,796-98'.
Pull out of hole and lay down perforating tools.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT

WELL: LINMAR-BRCWN2-28B5

OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
LOCATION: SEC 28, T2S, R5W, DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAH
CONTRACTOR: CHASE DRILLING, RIG #1
ORTECTIVE ZONE: WASA'ICHFOIWATION
ESTIMATED TD: 12, 500 ' PAGE 8

3-22-83 12,927' Day 58; Wait on cement. Trip in hole. Displace hole with
water . Contaminated cement and stringers from 8 ,

425-8
, 575 '

.

Firm cement from 8,525-9,680'.
DC: $86,371 CUM: $1,129,638
DMC: $ -0- OMC: $ 93,079

3-23-83 12,927' Day 59; Drilling cement from 9,680-9,808'. ('Dop of liner.)
Circulate. Pressure test. Lay down 3½" drill pipe. Break
and lay down kelly. Rig down floor and stack, clean pits.
Nipple up wellhead. Pressure test liner top to 2300 psi for
20 mins., no bleed off.
DC: $45,568 COM: $1,175,206
DMC: $ -0- CMC: $ 87,430

3-24-83 12,927'TD Day 60; Nipple up tree, pressure test wellhead. RETEASED RIG
@8:00 a.m. 3/23/83.
DC: $5,050 CUM: $1,180,256
DMC: $ -0- CMC: $ 87,430

3-25-83 Rig down, rove off Rotary Tools. Waiting on Completion Unit.

3-26-83 Wait on campletion unit.

3-27-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-28-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-29-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-30-83 Wait on completion unit.

3-31-83 Day 1; Move.in rig up Prairie Gold Rig #6. Nipple down tree.
Nipple up BOP. Pick up and run in hole to 8,886' with 282 joints
2-7/8" 6½# N-80 EUE tubing. Shut down for night.
DC: $54,l00 CUM: $54,100

4-1-83 Day 2; Pick up and run in hole to 12,881' wit11 127 joints. Had
to mill 6' of cerent @ top of liner and 75' @TD. Reverse circulate
bottoms up. Pull out of hole and lay down 4 joints. Shut down
for night.
DC: $4,700 CÓM: $58,800

4-2-83 Day 3; Pull out of hole and lay down 81 joints. Pull out of hole.
Move in rig up Oil Well Perforators. Run CBL-GR log from TD to
7, 500 '

. Shut down for night.
DC: $3,200 CUM: $62,000

4-3-83 shut down for weekend.

4-4-83 Shut down for weekend.
4-5-83 Waiting on Perforators.
4-6-83 Day 4; Move in rig up Oil Well. Perforators. Nipple up 5000 psi

lubricator and test same to 2500 psi. Pick up and run in hole with
gun #1. Perforate the following DIL-GR depths with 3 jspf , using
a 3-1/8" casing gun:
RUN #1 - Tobing pressure before 250 psi, after 100 psi:
12,840-42'; 12,733-35'; 12,618-20'; 12,428-30'; 12,012-04';
11,746-48'; 11,706-08'; 11,682-84'; 11,670-72'; & 11,594-96'.
RUN #2 - Tubing pressure before 500 psi, after 500 psi:
12,718'; 12,642'; 12,570'; 12,538'; 12,534'; 122,520'; 12,483';
12,462'; 12,452'; 12,389'; 12,372'; 12,312'; 12,243'; 12,208';
12,146'; 11,967'; 11,924'; 11,916'; 11,879'; 11,866'; & 11,841'.
RUN #3 - Tubing pressure before and after 500 psi:
11,811'; 11,805'; 11,697'; 11,657'; 11,647'; 11,574'; 11,362';
11,319'; 11,315'; 11,300'; 11,252'; 11,249'; 11,240'; 11,157';
11,052'; 10,982'; 10,899'; 10,803'; 10,774'; &610,768'.
RUN #4 - Tubing pressure before 500 psi, after 350 psi:
11,452-54'; 11,218-20'; 11,203-05'; 11,110-14'; 10,796-98'.
Pull out of hole and lay down perforating tools.

(CONTINUED ON NEXT



LT NMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

November 6, 1987

State of Utah
Division of 011, Gas and Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
355 west North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

ATTN: Tami Searing

Re: Change of Operator 6
- '_314.

Dear Ms. Searing:

Enclosed is a Sundry Notice, in triplicate, evidencing Change of
Operator effective November 1, 1987, from Linmar Energy Corporation to
Linmar Petro3eum Company covering the wells listed on the Exhibit "A"
attached thereto. Such listing of wells should cover all the wells in
which you currently show Linmar Energy Corporation as Operator.

Ïf you have any questions whatsoever or if you need any additional
information, please do not hesitate to call me collect at (303) 773-8003.

Thank you so very much for all of your assistance and cooperation
in this matter.

Very truly yours,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

Susan L. Foster
Land Consultant

SLF:jgm

Enclosures

cc: Ed Whicker, Field Superintendent, Linmar Petroleum
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Form 0,GC-lb SLBMlT RIPLlu l E.'
(Othe nobons onS OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. i.rans oratomarros ano samt. 90.

SUNDRYNOTIGS AND REPORTSON WELLS
(DO not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPL1CATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposala.)

1. ' 7. unrx loassumut NAus

¯m
or ortaaToa 8. TAxu on t,sAst NAMM

See Below
s. Añoazza or onurox T Ei so. See Exhibit "A"

See Below Attached Hereto
4. LOCATION or WILL (Report locat100 clearl7 and la accordance with any 3tate requirementa.* 10. rtzLo AND root., on wit-DCAT

See also 1pace 17 below.)
At turfacs

11, 3DC., T., 1., M,, 01 3LX. 12tD

80173T 04 AAWA

See Exhibit "A"
Attached Hereto

14. PraWIT No, 15. ELxvArtoNa (Show whether er, RT, on, etc.) 12. CooNTT on FAximit 18, ITATE
Duchesne &

.. Uintah Countj.e - Utah

"· CheckAppropoote Box To ladicate Notoreof Notice, Repoa, or Other Data
NOT1CI 07 INT2NTION TO : SCESEQUINT IEFORT 07 |

TTST WATEE SHUT+Orr PUT.L OR ALTZit CISING I WATER SHUT.()ry REPAInfNO WELL

TRACTURE TAEAT 1 MULTIPLE COMPLET¾ YRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAstNO

3MOOT OR AC10IZZ ABANDON' 3MOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CitA.NGT PLANN (Q(lier)
(Other Change of Operat mort: Report resuus o< mattiple comptedoo on wen

('nopletion or Rrcompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCTLIGE PROPOSF1; na CUMPLETED OFYRATIONS (Claurly state all pertinent details. and give pertinent dates, including *stimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is dirtClionajly drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and trur Yurtlest dPpth1 for all markers and innel pfrtl-

nant to this work.) *

CHANGE OF OPERATOR
(Effective November 1, 1987)

FROM:

Company Name: Linmar Energy Corporation
Address: 7979 East Tuf ts Avenue Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, Colorado 80237
Telephone No.: (303) 773-8003

TO:

Company Name: Linmar Petroleum Company ÅA543
Address: 7979 East Tuf ts Avenue Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, Colorado 80237
Telephone No.: (303) 773-8003

18. I hereby certify that the fore ing is true and correct
LINMAR NER CORPORATION

SIGNJCD /* P/r NO TITLa Vice President DATy November 6, 1987
(This space for Ÿederalor 3tate omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

$tt ÍnsfivCtions on Revers,
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Page 4

EXllIB I.T "A" $ $ v $ L

AEtached to and made a part of that. certain Sundry Notice covering

Change of Operator from Linmar Energy Corporation to Linmar
Petroleum Company

WELL NAME SECTION, TOWNSHIP AND RANGE

Carmen 1 7B5
_gjg, go C; Section 7, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Priest 2-7B5 6-<>(3-SICO Section 7, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Sorenson 1-8B5 S-ol'5-So }O Section 8, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Miltz 2-8B5 ð_\_3-_3 e , Section 8, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Brotherson 1-2584 Section 25, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Erotherson 1-27B4 3-0 Section 27, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Wimmer 2-27B4, 6-013-3 __ Section 27, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Christman-Blann 1-3184 S-Ol3- O Section 31, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Lindsay Russell 1-32B4 S-OÍS-BOS 3 _ Section 32, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Lindsay Russell 2-32B4 37DÍS-En?4 LÍ Section 32, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Griffith 1-33B4._ - \'4-'S Section 33, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Belcher 2-3334, S-Oj3-301h Section 33, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Erwin 1-35B4 L S-QJ S-25ppd(, Section 35, Township 2 south, Range 4 West

Flanigan 2-14B5 S~ IS¯'it'TET Section 14, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Brown 2-28BSc L 5-Ol3-3e~7/2
Section 28, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Wildlife Resources 1-3335 45' $" Section 33, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Rhoades Moon 1-3585 S-Dji -Soy cá Section 35, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Brotherson 2-35B5 L y, c Section 35, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Rhoades 1-36B5, «b|3-Traî$2 Section 36, Township 2 South, Range 5 West

Ute Tribal 2-14C6-
4,013-3e¯7]!Ë

. Section 14, Township 3 South, Range 6 West

Ute Tribal 2-17C6 E-n(S-'5ÍOli?> Section 17, Township 3 South, Range 6 West

Wildlife Resources 2-19C6 S-<RS SIO~56
Section 19, Township 3 South, Range 6 West

Ute Fee 2-33C6 3 3 5-5 ))23> Section 33, Township 3 South, Range 6 West

Ford 2-13C7 ÑC -Oh 5/0211
_

Section 13, Township 3 South, Range 7
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. TE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENi JF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING '' '"" ° Y°
Foe

SUNDRY NOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
Do not use this form for r osals to drill or to deepen o Hoe

Use "AP CATION FOR PERMIT-" fo e roposals

1
OtLLL WAELL

OTHzz

2 NAME 07 opstaten 8. TAgu og LIAax NAME

Linmar Petroleum Companv Brown
,

9. WB L NO.

P.O. Box 1327 Roosevelt, UT 84066 -28B5

4. OCATION OF WE L e it 10Ct[100 Citarly 40$ 10 ACCor 5004 With 807 StAtt requlrtments.s 1Ò,r a ND r L

At surfact

1413' FWL and 1777' FSL (NE SW)
u.8 A .,0 1.E.1ND

Sec 28, T2S, R5W USM

14. FlaM¡T yo• 18. ItayATton (Show whether or. xT, ax, sta.) 12. coDNtt 04 PAntsu la. stats

AN# 43-013-30718 5229' GR, MSL

Geek Appropnet. BoxTo Indleet. Natureof Nede., Report,or OtherData
NOTICE F INTENTION ¶Q: BU383QUgWT REPORT o

TIET WATER BRUT-OFT FUI,I. OR A1.TEft CAalNO WITER 5NUT-Orr RETAinfWG WELL

FIACTillE TREAT MCI.TIPLE COMFLETE FRACTURE TREATidENT ALTEKING CASING

3HOOT na ACilillt AAANDON* ANOut!NG Ott ACIDitlNG ABAtrBONMENT*

ftEFAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANN (Other)
(NOTE Report results of multiple coulpletion on Well

(Other) tion or Recompletion Report and Log form,)

17. DKScillat ritavasto nit CUMt'LETr.D UPYRATIONS (Cle.irly 4tute all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If w•\\ is directionally drilled, give subsurines locations and measured and trite vertical depths for all markers and tones perti-
rierrt to LMs work.) •

L_inmar plans to pluu and abandon the sub.iect well as follows:

1. PU CIUP. RIH and seL CTEP 10,000'.

2. Fill hole with Gel Mud, min 8.6 ppg and FV = 35.

3. SpoL 100' eemenL plus on top of CIEP.

4 . ICOH and LD Tub ine to 2500 '
. POOH and S tand back remainder of tub ine .

5. MIRU WL and perforate four squeeze holes at 2475' (Surface Pipe shoe @ 2491').
Open Surface Pipe and aLLempt to circulate.

6. PU cmt Retainer and RIH. Set at 2460'. If possi_ble, circulate omt to surface.
If surface pipe will not circulate, Squeeze perfs with 150 sx Class O cement.

7. PCOH and LD tb to 100'. Spot Coment pl.ug to surface. Cut off Casine head a.nd
erect regulation dry hole marker, with boLtom in cement and marker welded to
casine.

18. hereby cert that the foretoing is true od correct

TITLE ManaŒer of Enstineerin DAn 1R Feb 198R

(Tbts space for Federal or State oŒce use)

AP"""VED BY TITLR
Cul.vu.. 5 OF APPROVAL, IF INI.

Saa Instructionson
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FOPM o , TE OF UTAH
DIVISION OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:

Foc
6. If Indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new welb, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned walls. 7. Unit Agreement Name

Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals.

Type of Well: 8 Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: Brown 2-2885

2. Name of Operator; 9. API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013--30718

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573--4476 Altamont
4 Location of Well

Footages: 1413' FWL & 1777' FSL County: Duchesne
QQ, See,T., R., M.: NE/SW Section 28,T2S-R5W, USM stato: Utah

u. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convertto injection Perforate Convertto Injection Ventor Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

MultipleCompletion Water Shut-Off Other
Other install Rotaflex equipment

Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start 10/10/94 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETIONORRECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwe1\ ts directionally dri!Ied, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

The operator proposes to retire the casing free hydraulic lift system on the subject well and replace it with a beam pump
(Rotoflex).

Procedurc: Release 5" packer @ 10,009'. POOH w/tbg. Clean out 7" cas top of 5" liner. POOH w/thg. Clean out 5" liner to
CIBP @ 10,750'. PU 5" PBGA and 7"TAC and TIH setting SN @9,500'. PU and RIH w/1-3/4" pump, 200' of 1"rods w/g, 2950'
3/4" slick, 225' 3/4"w/g, 75' 7/8"w/g, 3000' 7/8" rods, and 3050' of 1"rods. Return to production @4 spm.

Bonnio Johnston
Name & Signature Title: Environmental Analyst _ _Date: 10/03/94

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (Se in tructi e on Reverse
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0 O
BROWN 2-2885

Sec 28; 2S; 5W

9 5/8' Shoe: 2492'

Averago Production:
70 BOPD

260 BWPO
135 MCFD 2 7/9' Tubing EUE Brd NSO

I IDownhole Pump: |
Jet

Comments:
I

TOL: 9,808

Packer: 5" 18# R3 @ 10,009'

7"Shoe: 10,016'

Perfs 10,0056- 10,730' Aug '96
33 feet, 99 holes

5" CIBP: 10,750'

Perfs 10,796-12,842' Apr '83
73 feet, 219 holes

22-Aug-94 5N
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FORM ATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Loaso Designation and Seria! Number:

Fee
6. If Indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name;

Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals.

1. Type of Woll: 6. Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: Brown 2-28BS

2. Name of Operaton 9. API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30718

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4 Location of Well

ootaoss: 1413' FWL & 1777' FSL County: Duchesne

QQ. Soc., T., R., M.: NE/SW Section 28, T2S-R5W, USM stato: Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convert to Injection [ Perforate Convert to injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize [ Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion _ Water Shut-Off Other Rotaflex Conversion
Other

Date of work completion 12/11/94
Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSEiD OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsuriace locations and easured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

.IV OF OIL, GAS& MIN

13

N.O. Shiflett
Name& Signature; / .

A
Title: I>strict Drilling Manager oste: 01/24/95

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See instructions on Reverse

FORM ATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Loaso Designation and Seria! Number:

Fee
6. If Indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name;

Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals.

1. Type of Woll: 6. Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: Brown 2-28BS

2. Name of Operaton 9. API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30718

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4 Location of Well

ootaoss: 1413' FWL & 1777' FSL County: Duchesne

QQ. Soc., T., R., M.: NE/SW Section 28, T2S-R5W, USM stato: Utah

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convert to Injection [ Perforate Convert to injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize [ Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion _ Water Shut-Off Other Rotaflex Conversion
Other

Date of work completion 12/11/94
Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSEiD OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsuriace locations and easured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.
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COASTALOIL & GASCORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

BROWN#2-28B5 (INSTALLROTAFLEXPUMPINGUNIT) PAGE1
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 58 856% COGC AFE: 14839
TD: 12.926" PBTD- 10,750" (CIBP)
5" LINER @ 9,808'-ll.9?6'
PERFS. 10,U56'-10,730'
CWC(M$):143.1

31/28/94 PUCH w/b" pkr
MIRUPU #1465 RU Delsco & shear SV. RD Delsco. NDWH.NU ß0P.
Work W-3 pkr @ 10,009' for 1-hr to rls. POOHto 8644', tbg waved
off Heat tbg w/180 BW@250°. Hot oil csg w/l80 BW@ 250°. POOH
4/100 its 24" tbg to 5669'. CC: $6,424

11/29/94 'r"i 6" (0 assembly
PCCH w/177 its 2¼" tbg. pump cavity A 5" R-3 pkr. RIH w/7" csg¯ racer Ltuck out on wax plug @4603·. Hot oil esg to clear wax
plug PTH w/167 Jts 2¾" tbg. tag 5" liner 9814' (SLM). Hot oil
Lua .og w/250° fmn wtr to COwax. POOHw/csg scraper CC: $10.479

11/30/94 o!H e-production tbg.¯IH w;4½" mill & COassembly. Tag till in 5" liner @10.745'. CO to
10 750 (LIBP). POOHw/COassembly& 4½" mill (some scale in mill),
PÏH w,7" AL. BHA.SN& 80 Jts 2½" tbg to 2618'. CC: $16,633

12/1/94 Continue to PU rod string.
RIH w;2;ß its 2¼" tbg. NDBOP. set 7" AC @9776' w/18.000# tension.
UN@ 9697· NUWH. PU & RIH w/1¼" pump. 8 - 1". 132 - ¼" & 10 - ¼"
rods. CC. 128.264

12/2/94 Well on production.
RIH w/114 - ½" & 121 - 1" rods. Space out. Stroke pump - good pump
action RD. CC. $136,683

12/2/94 Pmpd 0 BO. 135 BW,45 MCF.

12/3/94 Pmpd 3 BO, 152 BW, 12 MCF, 14 hrs.

12/4/94 Pmpd D BO. O BW,0 MCF, pumpproblems, hot oiled. Will run dyno in
the a.m.

12/5/94 TIH w/rods.
Ran dyno - evidence of SV leaking. POOHw/rods & pump. Found hard
wax in SV ball & seat. RIH w/new Highland pump and rods to 6600 .

CC: $139,994

12/6/94 Well on production.
Continue TIH w/pump& rods. Seat pump. PT to 500#. RDrig, place
well on pump CC: $141.663

12/6/94 Pmpd 9 BO, 352 BW. 78 MCF, 3.5 SPM, 20 hrs.

12/7/94 Pmpd 0 BO. 342 BW,80 MCF, 3.5 SPM. Will run dyno tomorrow, 12/8/94,
12/8/94 Pmpd 0 B0, 335 BW. 86 MCF,3.5 SPM. Ran dyno, FL @ 5550° - will incr

SPM.

12/9/94 Pmpd 71 BO. 540 BW. 46 MCF.

12/10/94 Pmpd40 BO. 375 BW, 81 MCF.

12/11/94 Pmpd 54 BO, 338 BW, 86 MCF, 4.1 SPM.

Prior prod: 16 BO. 242 BW. 57 MCF. Final
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INMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
Suite 604, 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003

March 15, 1995 u)

STATE OF UTAH
L

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVlS10N OF OIL, GAS AND MlNINC
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: "MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT" (Form 10) "MONTHLY DIL AND CAS
DISPOSITION REPORT" (Form 11)

Gentlemen:

Please be advised that Linmar Petroleum Company has sold all of its oil and gas
interests to Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation effective July 1, 1994. We are,
therefore, returning the enclosed forms. Please change your records accordingly.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Very truly,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

Vice President of
Managing General Partner

LMR

O O

INMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
Suite 604, 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003

March 15, 1995 u)

STATE OF UTAH
L

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVlS10N OF OIL, GAS AND MlNINC
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: "MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT" (Form 10) "MONTHLY DIL AND CAS
DISPOSITION REPORT" (Form 11)

Gentlemen:

Please be advised that Linmar Petroleum Company has sold all of its oil and gas
interests to Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation effective July 1, 1994. We are,
therefore, returning the enclosed forms. Please change your records accordingly.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Very truly,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

Vice President of
Managing General Partner

LMR
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INMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
Suite 604, 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003

May 18, 1995 2nd NOTICE!

Mr. R. J. Firth
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES U ße
DÏVISION OF DIL, CAS AND MINING
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

GENTLEMEN:

Please be advised that LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY has sold all of its oil and gas
interests to Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation effective Ju.ly 1, 1994. Please
change your records accordingly.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Very truly,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

L. M. Rohleder
Vice President of Managing
General Partner

LMR

ENCLS.: MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT (Form 10) and
MONTHLY OIL AND GAS DISPOSITION REFORT (Form

O O

INMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
Suite 604, 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003

May 18, 1995 2nd NOTICE!

Mr. R. J. Firth
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES U ße
DÏVISION OF DIL, CAS AND MINING
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

GENTLEMEN:

Please be advised that LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY has sold all of its oil and gas
interests to Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation effective Ju.ly 1, 1994. Please
change your records accordingly.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Very truly,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

L. M. Rohleder
Vice President of Managing
General Partner

LMR

ENCLS.: MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT (Form 10) and
MONTHLY OIL AND GAS DISPOSITION REFORT (Form
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Division of Gil, Gas and Mining

PHONE CONVERSATION DOCUMENTATION FORM

Route original/topy to:

E] Well File E3 Suspense XXXl Other
(Return Date) (0 .)

(Location) See Twp_ _Rng (To - Initials) RJ_E/FY

(APINo.) _ _ __ __ _____

VLC/FY

1. Date of Phone Can: 5-22-95 __ __

Time: 4:30

2. DOGM Employee (name) L. CORDOVA _ (Initiated Call )
Talked to:

Name _B°E _DALE _ (Initiated Call E3) - Phone No. ( 303) 572 121

of (Company/Organization) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP.

3. Topic of Conversation: LINMAR WELLS SOLD TO COASTAL
(& INDIAN LEASES)

*LINMAR SOLD ALL OF THEIR WELLS TO COASTAL HOWEVER WELLS INVOLVED IN C.A.'S HAVE

NOT BEEN OFFICIALLY APPROVED BY BLM. CRANGE IS IN PROGRESS AT THlS TIME.

4. Highlights of Conversation: **MONTHLY OIL & GAS PRODUCTION & DISPOSITION REPORTS**

(& INDIAN LEASE)
THE DIV. WILL MAIL REMAIN_ING LINMAR WELLS (C.A WELLS) TO:

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
C/0 COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP.
P. 0. BOX 749
DENVER, CO 80201-0749

THE DIV. IS AWAITING BLM APPROVAL PRIOR TO CHANGING THE OPERATOR FROM LINMAR/N9523

TO COASTAL/NO230. DOCUMENTATION HAS ßEEN FILED BY COASTAL AND BLM APPROVAL SHOULD

BE FORTHCOMING SOON!

*LINMAR/L.M. ROHLEDER (303)773-8003

O O
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3. Topic of Conversation: LINMAR WELLS SOLD TO COASTAL
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*LINMAR SOLD ALL OF THEIR WELLS TO COASTAL HOWEVER WELLS INVOLVED IN C.A.'S HAVE

NOT BEEN OFFICIALLY APPROVED BY BLM. CRANGE IS IN PROGRESS AT THlS TIME.

4. Highlights of Conversation: **MONTHLY OIL & GAS PRODUCTION & DISPOSITION REPORTS**

(& INDIAN LEASE)
THE DIV. WILL MAIL REMAIN_ING LINMAR WELLS (C.A WELLS) TO:

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
C/0 COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP.
P. 0. BOX 749
DENVER, CO 80201-0749

THE DIV. IS AWAITING BLM APPROVAL PRIOR TO CHANGING THE OPERATOR FROM LINMAR/N9523

TO COASTAL/NO230. DOCUMENTATION HAS ßEEN FILED BY COASTAL AND BLM APPROVAL SHOULD

BE FORTHCOMING SOON!

*LINMAR/L.M. ROHLEDER (303)773-8003
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FORM 10 STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 2 4

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

oPURAroR NAME. AND ADDRESS:
I.TTAll ACCOUNT NUMBER:

N9523

C/0 COASTAL OIL & GAS 5 / 95REPORT PERIOD (MONTH/Yl.AR):
LINMAR PETROLEUMCOMPANY
PO BOX 749
DENVER CO 80201-0749

AMENDED REPORT (Highlight Changes)

Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes
API Number Entity Locanon Zone Status Oper OlL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)

TIMOTHY 1-9A3

4301330321 09115 015 03W 9 GR-WS
ÃTLRED 1-lbA3
4301330232 09116 015 03W 16 GR-WS fÚ640S/
FISHER 1-16A4 ¯

4301330737 09117 015 04W 16 GRRVL (gfý|9(ÚŸ9LL

OLSEN 1-27A4
4301330064 09119 015 04W 27 GR-WS Ÿ>dd0/02
BROWN2-2885
930133071809131 02S OSW 28 GR-WS ŸÓ0000
WILDLIFE RES. I-33BS

01330649 09132 025 05W 33 GR-WS mgayggggd EE FA/A
ufE TRIBAL 1-18BlE
4304730969 09135 025 01E 18 GR-WS †dúva2/p-
GOODRICH 1-24Ah ¯¯

930133076009136 ois 04w 24 GR-ws VAŸWFŸ?aSC
CARL SMITH 2-25AA ¯¯

4301330776 09137 015 04W 25 GR-WS @-60/1932 EG Vf§¾ÅÑ
JENKINS 3-16A3
4301330877 09335 015 03W 16 GR-WS ŸËœ0419
JESSEN 1-15A4
4301330817 09345 ois 04w 15 GR-WS
tHASEL-HACKFORD 2-lO-A1E'
4304731421 09400 ois oit 10 GR-ws kyrfo/Ÿ?9 73 FEE 08 as
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1
4301330813 09405 01N 01W 30 GR-ws VAyy/rf96d

TOTALS

MMENTS:

hereby certify that this report is truc and complete to tbc best of my knowledge. Date:

Jame and Signature: _ _ _. _ . . ..__ ___ Telephone

(Il (Il
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O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

June 20, 1995 JUN 211995

Memorandum OlV.O IL G S& MINING

TO: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency, Ft. Duchesne, Utah

FROM: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals, BLM, Utah State Office, Salt Lake City, Utah

SUBJECT: Successor of Operator, Communitization Agreement's (CA) 96-000058,
96-000065, 96-000068, 96-000087, 96-000108, 96-000118, 96-000119,
9C-000123, 9C-000132, 9C-000212, NRM-715, VR49I-84672C,
VR491-84680 C, VR49l-8468 1C, VR49I-84692C, VR49I-84694C,
VR491-84703C, VR491-84705C, UTOS0l49-85C701, UTO80\49-85C704,
UTO80\49-85C713, UTO80149-85C714, UTO80I49-86C680,
UTO80\49-86C685, UTO80\49-87C685, Duchesne and Uintah Counties,
Utah

The enclosed Designation of Successor of Operators for CA's 96-000058, 96-000065,
96-000068, 96-000087, 96-000108, 96-000118, 96-000119, 9C-000123, 9C-000132,
9C-000212, NRM-715, VR491-84672C, VR491-84680C, VR49I-84681C, VR49I-84692C,
VR491-84694C, VR49l-84703C, VR49l-84705C, UTO80\49-85C701, UTO80l49-85C704,
UTOSOl49-85C713, UTOS0l49-85C714, UTOSOl49-86C680, UT080149-86C685,
UTO80l49-87C685, Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, have been reviewed by this
office and found to be acceptable and we recommend approval. The new operator will be
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. Upon approval of these Successor of Operators, please
return one copy to this office.

If you have any questions, please contact Teresa Thompson at (801) 539-4047.

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Enclosures
cc: Marlene Boyle

Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.

bcc: 96-000058, 96-000065, 96-000068, 96-000087, 96-000108, 96-000118,
96-000119, 9C-000123, 9C-000132, 9C-000212, NRM-715, VR49I-84672C,
VR491-84680C, VR491-84681C, VR49l-84692C, VR49I-84694C, VR491-84703C,
VR491--84705C, UTOSOl49-85C701, UTO80149-85C704, UTO80\49-85C713,
UTO80149-85C714, UTOSOI49-86C680, UTOSOI49-86C685, UTOSOl49-87C685
District Manager - Vernal
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid
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Coastal
The fnergy People

May 9, 1995

Ms. Theresa Thompson
Bureau of Land Management
324 S. State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

Dear Ms. Thompson:

Enclosed is a list of the Communitization Agreements under which Coastal is currently
balloting the working interest owners to be appointed as successor Operator to Linmar Petroleum
Company. Letters were sent out May 3, 1995, to all working interest owners, and we expect
to have the self certification process completed by June 12, 1995. The Designation of Successor
Operator forms will be mailed to you at that time.

Coastal acquired Linmar's interest in and took over operations of the Chandler 2-5B4 and
the Ellsworth 2-9B4 wells last year. ANR operates the Chandler 1-5B4 and the Ëllsworth1-
9B4, and ANR is the designated operator under the Communitization Agreement for both these
sections. Coastal has elected to have ANR remain as operator under both of these
Communitization Agreements.

Thank you for answering my many questions. I have appreciated your help and patience
in getting this project completed.

Very truly yours,

Marlene Boyle
Land Consultant

MB:mh

Enclosure

cc: Bonnie Johnston

Coastal Dil&GasCorporation
- ;BSIDIARY OF 74ECOASTALCORPC:·
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Operator forms will be mailed to you at that time.

Coastal acquired Linmar's interest in and took over operations of the Chandler 2-5B4 and
the Ellsworth 2-9B4 wells last year. ANR operates the Chandler 1-5B4 and the Ëllsworth1-
9B4, and ANR is the designated operator under the Communitization Agreement for both these
sections. Coastal has elected to have ANR remain as operator under both of these
Communitization Agreements.

Thank you for answering my many questions. I have appreciated your help and patience
in getting this project completed.

Very truly yours,

Marlene Boyle
Land Consultant

MB:mh

Enclosure

cc: Bonnie Johnston

Coastal Dil&GasCorporation
- ;BSIDIARY OF 74ECOASTALCORPC:·
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COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS

CA No. UTO80I49-87C685
Section 1, TIS, R2W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C704
Section 3, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C701
Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C713
Section 4, T4S, R6W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C714
Section 5, T4S, R6W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000058
Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. NRM-715
Section 8, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 9C-000123
Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UT080I49-86C685
Section 12, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84692C
Section 15, TIS, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah
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COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS

CA No. 96-000087
Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84672C
Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84680C
Section 17, T1S, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 9C-000132
Section 18, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 9C-000212
Section 18, T2S, R1E, U.S.M.
Uintah County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-86C680
Section 20, T1N, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84703C
Section 24, TIS, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-400118
Section 24, T3S, R7W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO8049P-84C723
Section 25, TIN, R2W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000108
Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesue County, Utah
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COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS

CA No. 96-000065
Section 27, T1N, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah

CA No. 96-000068
Section 28, T2S, R5W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84681C
Section 29, T1N, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84705C
Section 30, TIN, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000119
Section 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84694C
Section 34, TIS, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. NW-613
Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah
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FosM e gSTATE OF LITAH
DIVISIOlumF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Senal Nurnber:

Fee
5. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for prtposals lo drill new wells, deepen existing wells. or to reeniet plugged and abandoned wolle. L Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPUCATlON FOR PERMFCTO DRILLOR DEEFEN form for such proposals.

1. Type of Well; 8. Well Name and Number

OIL GAS OTHER: Brown 2-28B5

2. Name c¢ Operator: 9. API Well Nurrter

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30718

3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Poi, or WBdcat

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Location of Well

root.o..: 1413' FWL & 1777' FSL County: Duchesne
oa.see,r..n..M.; NE/SW Section28,T2S-RSW,USM state: Utah

u. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Sthmit In Diplicate) (Submit Originni Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon * New Construction
Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Perforate
Convert to Injection Perforate Convert to Injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off [X] Other Rotaflex Conversion
Other

Date of work completion 12/11/94
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Coupletions and Recoupletions to different rese<voirs on \M LL

COMPLETJONOR RECOMPLE flON AEPOAT ANDLOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verifcation report.

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertment details, and give partnent dates, if well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to thiswork.)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

ame & Signature: _ Title _ ril ing Manager oat. 01/24/95

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse
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Illi IIII

CDASTALOIL & GASCORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

BROWN#2-28B5 (INSTALLROTAFLEXPUMPINGUNIT) PAGE1
ALTAMONTFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY.UT
WI: 58.856% COGC AFE: 14839
TD: 12.926 PBTO:10.750' (CIBP)
5" LINER@9.808 -12.926'
PERFS: 10.056'-10.730
CWC(MS): 143.1

11/28/94 POOH w/5" pkr.
MIRU PU #1455. RU Delsco & shear SV. RDDelsco. NOWH.NUBOP.
Work R-3 pkr @ 10.009' for 1-hr to rls. POOHto 8644°. tbg waved
off. Heat tbg w/180 BW@250°. Hot oil csg w/180 BW@250°. POOH
w/196 Jts 2½" tbg to 5669 . CC: $6.424

11/29/94 PU 5" COassembly.
PDCH w/l77 jts 2½" tbg, pump cavity & 5" R-3 pkr. RIH w/7" csg
scraper. Stuck out on wax plug @4603'. Hot oil csg to clear wax
plug. RIH w/167 jts 2½" tbg. tag 5" liner @9814' (SLM). Hot oil
tbg &csg w/250° fmn wtr to COwax. PD0Hw/csg scraper. CC: $10.479

11/30/94 RIH w/production tbg.
RIH wid½" mill &COassembly. Tag fill in 5" liner @10.745 . COto
10.750 (CIBP). PDOHw/COassembly&4½" mill (somescale in mill).
RIH w/7" AC. BHA.SN& 80 jts 2¾" tbg to 2618'. CC: $16.633

12/1/94 Continue to PU rod string.
RIH w/228 jts 2½" tbg. NOBOP. set 7" AC@9776° w/18.000# tension.
SN @9697 NUWH. PU & RIHw/1¾" pump. 8 - 1". 132 - ¾"& 10 - ½"
rods. CC: $28.264

12/2/94 Well on production.
RlH w/ll4 - ½" & 121 - 1" rods. Space out. Stroke pump - good pump
action. RD. CC: $136,683

12/2/94 Pmpd 0 BO. 135 BW,45 MCF.

12/3/94 Pmpd3 B0. 152 BW.12 MCF.14 hrs.

12/4/94 Pmpd0 BO. O BW.O MCF.pumpproblems. hot oiled. Will run dyno in
the a.m.

12/5/94 TIH w/rods.
Ran dyno - evidence of SV leaking. PDOHw/rods & pump. Found hard
wax in SV ball & seat. RTHw/new Highland pump and rods to 6600'.
CC: $139.994

12/6/94 Well on production.
Continue TIH w/pump& rods. Seat pump, PT to 500#. RDrig, place
well on pump. CC: $141.663

12/6/94 Pmpd9 80. 352 BW, 78 MCF.3.5 SPM.20 hrs.

12/7/94 Pmpd0 BO. 342 BW.80 HCF,3.5 SPM. Will run dyno tomorrow.12/8/94.

12/8/94 Pmpd0 BO. 335 BW.86 MCF.3.5 SPM. Ran dyno. FL @5550' - will incr
SPM.

12/9/94 Pmpd 71 BO, 540 BW,46 MCF.

12/10/94 Pmpd 40 BO. 375 BW.81 MCF.

12/11/94 Pmpd54 BO. 338 BW, 86 MCF,4.1 SPM.

Prior prod: 16 BO. 242 BW.57 MCF. Final
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O O
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
pone1990> DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR HodgetBureauNo.1004 -0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
. Lease ignati and ial Nr

¯

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS I ee
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6 H Indian. Alcuee or Iribe N

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT' - for such proposals

Ute
¯¯¯

7 If Unit or CA. Agreement Designat

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1 Type of Well 8 Well Narna and No.

¯

Oil Well Gas Well Other See attached list.
2 Name of Operator 9. AAPI Well No.

Linmar Petroleum Company See attached list.
3. Address and Telephone No. 10 Field and Pool, Or ExploratoryÄ

7979 East Tufts Ave. Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003 See attached list.
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T., R., M., Or Survey Descriptior1) 11. Countyor Parish. State

See attached list.
See attached list of wells.

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of intent Abandonment change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut- Ott

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Change of Operator Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well

Cornpletion or Recompletion Regit and Log forrn)
13, Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. 11well is directionally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

There will be a change of operator for all wells specified on the attached list.

OPERATOR - FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation

All operations will be covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40-66A and Bond No. U6053821, as required by the State of
Utah.

14. I hereby certify that the to oing is true a conopt
Vice President of

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Title __ Date
Conditions of approval, if any

Title 16 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department of agency of the United Stake any false, ficticious or fraudu ent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse
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01-Sep-94

LEASE
WELLNAME API # FOOTAGES LOCATION FIELO COUNTY DESIGNATION

Ällred2 --16A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Barrett 1-34A5 43-013-30323 713' FNL & 1387 FEL Secton 34, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Birch 1--35A5 43-013-30233 757' FNL& 1024' FEL Section 35, TíS, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Birch 2-35A5 43-013-30362 Section 35, T1S, A5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 1-25B4 43-013-30668 778' FNL& 1627' FEL Section 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 1-27B4 43-013-30185 1244' FNL& 1464' FEL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 2-35B5 43-013-30908 2432' FNL & 1648' FWL Section 35, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 2-3B4 43-013-31008 1226' FSL & 1933' FWL Section 3, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeÓhandler2-584 43-013-31000 466' FSL & 1180' FWL Section 5, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christensen 2-26A5 43-013-30905 776' FSL & 1467' FWL Section 26, TiS, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christensen 2-8B3 43-013-30780 1880' FSL & 1694' FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christensen 3-484 43-013-31142 804' FSL & 1948' FEL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christman Blann 1-31B4 43-013-30198 1257' FNL & 1552' FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
D. Moon 1-23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, T1N, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Uintah Fee
Ellsworth 2-884 43-013-30898 1580' FSL & 1580' FWL Secton 8, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Ellsworth 2-9B4 43-013-31138 2976' FNL& 2543' FWL Section 9, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeEvans1-31A4 43-013-30067 1987' FNL& 1973' FEL Section 31, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Fisher 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609' FNL & 1671' FEL Section 19, T1S, A3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Fisher 2-6A3 43-013-30984 404' FSL & 596' FEL Section 6, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Ford 2-36AS 43-013-30911 1113' FSL & 1659' FWL Section 36, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Hansen 1-16B3 43-013-30617 2088' FSL & 1760' FWL Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Horrocks 1-3A1 43-013-30171 2502' FNL& 2141' FWL Section 3, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne/Uintah Fee
Jensen 1-31A5 43-013-30186 1380' FNL& 1244' FEL Section 31, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jensen 2-29A5 43-013-30974 1085' FSL & 1528' FWL Section 29, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182' FNL & 1130' FEL Section 17, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jndsay Russell 2-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jnmar 1-1982 43-013-30600 2032' FNL& 2120' FWL Section 19, T2S, R2W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Marshall 1-20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL& 1821' FEL Section 20, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne Fee
Murray 3-2A2 43-013-30816 2211' FNL &2257' FWL Section 2, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Bluebe|| Duchesne Fee
3man 2-4B4 43-013-30645 1536' FSL & 1849' FWL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Rhoades Moon1-3585 43-013-30155 870' FNL& 960' FEL Section 35, T2S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Nimmer 2-27B4 43-013-30941 904' FNL& 886' FWL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne

01-Sep-94

LEASE
WELLNAME API # FOOTAGES LOCATION FIELO COUNTY DESIGNATION

Ällred2 --16A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Barrett 1-34A5 43-013-30323 713' FNL & 1387 FEL Secton 34, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Birch 1--35A5 43-013-30233 757' FNL& 1024' FEL Section 35, TíS, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Birch 2-35A5 43-013-30362 Section 35, T1S, A5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 1-25B4 43-013-30668 778' FNL& 1627' FEL Section 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 1-27B4 43-013-30185 1244' FNL& 1464' FEL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 2-35B5 43-013-30908 2432' FNL & 1648' FWL Section 35, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 2-3B4 43-013-31008 1226' FSL & 1933' FWL Section 3, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeÓhandler2-584 43-013-31000 466' FSL & 1180' FWL Section 5, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christensen 2-26A5 43-013-30905 776' FSL & 1467' FWL Section 26, TiS, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christensen 2-8B3 43-013-30780 1880' FSL & 1694' FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christensen 3-484 43-013-31142 804' FSL & 1948' FEL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christman Blann 1-31B4 43-013-30198 1257' FNL & 1552' FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
D. Moon 1-23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, T1N, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Uintah Fee
Ellsworth 2-884 43-013-30898 1580' FSL & 1580' FWL Secton 8, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Ellsworth 2-9B4 43-013-31138 2976' FNL& 2543' FWL Section 9, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeEvans1-31A4 43-013-30067 1987' FNL& 1973' FEL Section 31, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Fisher 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609' FNL & 1671' FEL Section 19, T1S, A3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Fisher 2-6A3 43-013-30984 404' FSL & 596' FEL Section 6, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Ford 2-36AS 43-013-30911 1113' FSL & 1659' FWL Section 36, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Hansen 1-16B3 43-013-30617 2088' FSL & 1760' FWL Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Horrocks 1-3A1 43-013-30171 2502' FNL& 2141' FWL Section 3, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne/Uintah Fee
Jensen 1-31A5 43-013-30186 1380' FNL& 1244' FEL Section 31, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jensen 2-29A5 43-013-30974 1085' FSL & 1528' FWL Section 29, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182' FNL & 1130' FEL Section 17, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jndsay Russell 2-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jnmar 1-1982 43-013-30600 2032' FNL& 2120' FWL Section 19, T2S, R2W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee
Marshall 1-20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL& 1821' FEL Section 20, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne Fee
Murray 3-2A2 43-013-30816 2211' FNL &2257' FWL Section 2, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Bluebe|| Duchesne Fee
3man 2-4B4 43-013-30645 1536' FSL & 1849' FWL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Rhoades Moon1-3585 43-013-30155 870' FNL& 960' FEL Section 35, T2S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Nimmer 2-27B4 43-013-30941 904' FNL& 886' FWL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne
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L e Designation and Ser | Number

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON W

Use APPI JUAllON FOR PERMITTO DHil L OH DI i PLN form for such pr pc . . -
as attached list.

1 Type of Well 8 Well Name and Number
OIL GAS OTHER: See attached list.

2 Name of Operatos 9 API Well Number

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See attached list.
3 Address and Ielephone Number 10 Field and Pool, or Wldcat

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont/Bluebell
4 i ocation of Well

Footages See attached list. County See attached list.
OQSec,T..R.,M: State Utah

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENTREPORT

(S±mit in Diplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * [ ] New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair [ ] Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection ¯¯

Shoot or Acidize Conversion to injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Ireat Ventor Flare Fracture Ireat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion _ Water Shut-Off Other
Other Change of operator.

Date of work completion

Approximate date work willstart 25294 __ __ Report results of Multiple Cornpletons and Recompletions to diilerent reservars on WElL
COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETIONAND LOG form

* Must be accornpanied by a cement venf cation report

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATlONS (Clearly state aff pertinent detat1s, and give pertinent dates ifwell is dirotionally dallai, give subsurface locations and measured and true
verheal depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

T11ere was a change of operator on the date above for all wells on the attahced list:

OPERATOR: -- FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

All operations are covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40-66A, Bond No. U6053821 and Nationwide Bond No.962270.

13

Narne & Signature
,.. Title Date 09/19/94

(Inis space for State use only)

(12/92) (See Instructions on Reverse
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21-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME API #

FOO~AGES LOCATlON COUNTY DESIGNAT1ON NAME CA & BOND #

Allrea 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700 FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U:e 96-000087 102102, 962270

Allred 2-16A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 95-000087 102102, 962270
Bar,'ett 1-34AS 43-013-30323 713' FNL & 1387' FEL Secton 34, T1S, RSW, U S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Belcher 2-3384 43-013-30907 2348' FNL& 1085' FWL Secton 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesrie Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Bi-ch 1-35A5 43-013-30233 75T FNL & 1024' FEL Secten 35, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Birch 2-35A5 43-013-30362 Secton 35, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Duchesrie Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotnerson 1-25B4 43-013-33668 778' FNL & 162T FEL Secton 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesr.e Fee Ute ' 102102, 962270
B'otherser 1-2764 43-013-30185 1244' FNL& 1484 FEL Section 27, T23, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 2-3585 43-0'3-3C906 2432' FNL& 1648' FWL Sectior 35, T2S, A5W, U.S.M. Ducnesne Fee Ute 102102, 952270
Brotherson 2-3B4 43-013-31008 '.226' FSl & '933' FWL Section 3. T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Browr 2-2685 43-013-30768 1777 FSL& 1413' FWL See:ion 28. T2S. RSW. U.S.M. Duchesne Pee U1e 96-000058 102·.02.962270

Carl Smt, 2-25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25. T1S.R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Pee Ule 95-000036 102:02 962270
Chandler 2-594 43-013-31000 466' FSL & 1180' FWL Section 5, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Chasel 2-17A1 43-0'.3-3D732 1379 FSL& 1360' FWL Section 17. TIS, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C 102102, 962270
Chasel Hacxio o 2-10A1E 43-047-31421 1120 FSL& 1320 FEL Sect;an 10. TíS, R1E, U.S.M. Cintah Fee U:e UTO6014985C693 102102, 962270

O C,asel Mil.er 2-1A2 43-013-30350 Secton 1, T1S, R2W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOBO14987C685 102102, 962270
Christensen 2-26A5 43-013-30905 776' FSL & 1467 FWL Section 26, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 102102, 962270
Ch.=,stensen 2-883 43-013-30780 1880 FSL& 1694' FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Die 102102, 962270
Christensen 3-4B4 43-013-33142 804' FSL & 1948 FEL Section 4, T2S, RAW, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270

Chrisiman Blarr. '-3184 43-013-30198 1257 FNL& 1552' FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Cla.'k 2-9A3 43-013-30676 Section 9. T1S. R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 90-000123 102102, 962270
Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 1097 FSL& 702' FWL Section 1. TIS, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOBO14987C685 102102, 962270
Oye 1-25Z2 43-013-30659 1520 FSL& 1520 PEL Section 25, T1N, B2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UToeo49PB4C723 102102, 962270
D. Moo, * -23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, T1N, BlW, U.S.M. Uinlah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
E .swor h 2-88< 43-013-30896 1580 FSL & 1580 FWL Section B. T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 102102, 962270
E swor1b 2-984 43-013-31138 2976 FNL & 2543 FWL Section 9. T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Evans 1-31A4 43-013-30057 198T FNL & 1973 FEL Sec1ion 31, T1S, A4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-30915 1496 FSL& 1718 FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102.962270
Fisher 1- 6A4 43-013-30737 1527 FSL & 834' FEL Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672O 102102, 962270
Fisner 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609 FNL& 1671 FËL Section 19, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980 FNL& 2060 FEL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000056 102102, 962270
Fisher 2-SA3 43-013-30984 404' FSL& 596 FEL Section 6, T18, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Ford 2-36A5 43-013-30911 1113 FSL & 1559 FWL Section 36, T1S, B5W, U.S.M. Duchesna Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1105 FNL& 1599 FËL Section 24, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184703C 102102, 962270
Gefiith 1-3384 43-013-30285 1307 FNL& 1512 FEL Section 33. T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Hansen ' -1583 43-013-30617 2088 FSL& 1750 FWL Section 16, T2S. R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 1-3A1 43-O'.3-30171 2502 FNL& 2141 FWL Section 3, T18, R1W, U.S.M. DuchesnejUiniah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 2-4A1 43-013-30954 1678 FNL& 1520 FEL Secton 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14985C701 102102, 962270
acobsor 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104 FSL& 2417 FWL Secton 12, TIS, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C685 102102, 962270

senkins3-16A3 43-013-30877 1065 FSL& 1905 FWL Secton 16.TIS.R3W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102,962270

O Jensen 1-29Z1 43-013-30725 1331 FSL& 2424 FEL Sect.on 29, T1N, T1W, ü.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 952270
Jensen 1-31AS 43-013-30·86 1380 FNL& 1244' FEL Secton 31, T1S. RSW. U.S.M Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jensen 2-29AS 43-053-30974 1085 FSL& 1528' FWL Sect:on 29, TIS, R5W. U.S.M Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jessen 5-15A4 43-033-30817 2417 FNL& 1514' FEL Section 15, T'.S, R4W. U.S.M Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182 FNL& 1130' FEL Section 17, TIS, R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1-34A1 43-0:3-30590 Section 34. Tis. R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uinian Fee Ute VR49164694C 102102, 962270
Lirdsay Russell 1-32B4 43-013-30308 1320 FNL & 1320' FEL Section 32, T2S. R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000115 102102. 962270
Lirdsay Russell 2-32B4 43-053-30371 Section 32, T2S. R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Lir,mar 1-19B2 43-013-30500 2032 FNL& 2120' FWL Section 19, T2S. R2W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Marsha 1-20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL & 1821' FEL Section 20, TIS, R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fue Ute 102102, 962270
Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473 FSL & 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 96-000058 102102, 962270
Murray 3-2A2 43-013-30816 2211 FNL & 225T BWL Section 2, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200 FNL & 1200 FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Gee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754 FSL& 114D' FWL See:ion 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e NW-613 102102, 962270
Oman 2-484 43-013-30645 1536 FSL& 3849' FWL Sec1ion 4. T2S.84W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Powell 2-8A3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Secilon 8. T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
R,ades Moon 1-3585 43-013-30155 870' FNL & 960' FEL Section 35, T25, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee
Rncades Moo, 1-3695 43-013-30289 Section 36, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy '-9A3 43-013-30321 1491 FNL& 1645 FEL Section 9, T:S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Feu Ute GC-DOO323 102102, 962270
Ti.nethy 3-18A3 43-013-30940 Section 18 T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000132 102102, 962270
Warre, 1-32AC 43-013-30174 1799 FNL& 1104 FEL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Wildliie Resources 1-33BS 43-O'.3-30649 1804 FNL& 1603 PEL Section 33, T2S.RSW, U.S.M. Ouchesr.e Fee Ute UTOSO49184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 1523 FSL& 1509 FEL Section 20, TIN, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014986C680 102102, 962270
Wimmer 2-27Bd 43-013-30941 904' FNL & 866' FWL Section 27, T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesr.e Fee Ute 102102,

21-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME API #

FOO~AGES LOCATlON COUNTY DESIGNAT1ON NAME CA & BOND #

Allrea 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700 FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U:e 96-000087 102102, 962270

Allred 2-16A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 95-000087 102102, 962270
Bar,'ett 1-34AS 43-013-30323 713' FNL & 1387' FEL Secton 34, T1S, RSW, U S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Belcher 2-3384 43-013-30907 2348' FNL& 1085' FWL Secton 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesrie Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Bi-ch 1-35A5 43-013-30233 75T FNL & 1024' FEL Secten 35, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Birch 2-35A5 43-013-30362 Secton 35, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Duchesrie Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotnerson 1-25B4 43-013-33668 778' FNL & 162T FEL Secton 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesr.e Fee Ute ' 102102, 962270
B'otherser 1-2764 43-013-30185 1244' FNL& 1484 FEL Section 27, T23, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 2-3585 43-0'3-3C906 2432' FNL& 1648' FWL Sectior 35, T2S, A5W, U.S.M. Ducnesne Fee Ute 102102, 952270
Brotherson 2-3B4 43-013-31008 '.226' FSl & '933' FWL Section 3. T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Browr 2-2685 43-013-30768 1777 FSL& 1413' FWL See:ion 28. T2S. RSW. U.S.M. Duchesne Pee U1e 96-000058 102·.02.962270

Carl Smt, 2-25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25. T1S.R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Pee Ule 95-000036 102:02 962270
Chandler 2-594 43-013-31000 466' FSL & 1180' FWL Section 5, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Chasel 2-17A1 43-0'.3-3D732 1379 FSL& 1360' FWL Section 17. TIS, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C 102102, 962270
Chasel Hacxio o 2-10A1E 43-047-31421 1120 FSL& 1320 FEL Sect;an 10. TíS, R1E, U.S.M. Cintah Fee U:e UTO6014985C693 102102, 962270

O C,asel Mil.er 2-1A2 43-013-30350 Secton 1, T1S, R2W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOBO14987C685 102102, 962270
Christensen 2-26A5 43-013-30905 776' FSL & 1467 FWL Section 26, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 102102, 962270
Ch.=,stensen 2-883 43-013-30780 1880 FSL& 1694' FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Die 102102, 962270
Christensen 3-4B4 43-013-33142 804' FSL & 1948 FEL Section 4, T2S, RAW, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270

Chrisiman Blarr. '-3184 43-013-30198 1257 FNL& 1552' FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Cla.'k 2-9A3 43-013-30676 Section 9. T1S. R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 90-000123 102102, 962270
Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 1097 FSL& 702' FWL Section 1. TIS, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOBO14987C685 102102, 962270
Oye 1-25Z2 43-013-30659 1520 FSL& 1520 PEL Section 25, T1N, B2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UToeo49PB4C723 102102, 962270
D. Moo, * -23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, T1N, BlW, U.S.M. Uinlah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
E .swor h 2-88< 43-013-30896 1580 FSL & 1580 FWL Section B. T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 102102, 962270
E swor1b 2-984 43-013-31138 2976 FNL & 2543 FWL Section 9. T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Evans 1-31A4 43-013-30057 198T FNL & 1973 FEL Sec1ion 31, T1S, A4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-30915 1496 FSL& 1718 FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102.962270
Fisher 1- 6A4 43-013-30737 1527 FSL & 834' FEL Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672O 102102, 962270
Fisner 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609 FNL& 1671 FËL Section 19, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980 FNL& 2060 FEL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000056 102102, 962270
Fisher 2-SA3 43-013-30984 404' FSL& 596 FEL Section 6, T18, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Ford 2-36A5 43-013-30911 1113 FSL & 1559 FWL Section 36, T1S, B5W, U.S.M. Duchesna Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1105 FNL& 1599 FËL Section 24, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184703C 102102, 962270
Gefiith 1-3384 43-013-30285 1307 FNL& 1512 FEL Section 33. T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Hansen ' -1583 43-013-30617 2088 FSL& 1750 FWL Section 16, T2S. R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 1-3A1 43-O'.3-30171 2502 FNL& 2141 FWL Section 3, T18, R1W, U.S.M. DuchesnejUiniah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 2-4A1 43-013-30954 1678 FNL& 1520 FEL Secton 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14985C701 102102, 962270
acobsor 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104 FSL& 2417 FWL Secton 12, TIS, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C685 102102, 962270

senkins3-16A3 43-013-30877 1065 FSL& 1905 FWL Secton 16.TIS.R3W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102,962270

O Jensen 1-29Z1 43-013-30725 1331 FSL& 2424 FEL Sect.on 29, T1N, T1W, ü.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 952270
Jensen 1-31AS 43-013-30·86 1380 FNL& 1244' FEL Secton 31, T1S. RSW. U.S.M Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jensen 2-29AS 43-053-30974 1085 FSL& 1528' FWL Sect:on 29, TIS, R5W. U.S.M Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jessen 5-15A4 43-033-30817 2417 FNL& 1514' FEL Section 15, T'.S, R4W. U.S.M Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182 FNL& 1130' FEL Section 17, TIS, R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1-34A1 43-0:3-30590 Section 34. Tis. R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uinian Fee Ute VR49164694C 102102, 962270
Lirdsay Russell 1-32B4 43-013-30308 1320 FNL & 1320' FEL Section 32, T2S. R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000115 102102. 962270
Lirdsay Russell 2-32B4 43-053-30371 Section 32, T2S. R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Lir,mar 1-19B2 43-013-30500 2032 FNL& 2120' FWL Section 19, T2S. R2W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ule 102102, 962270
Marsha 1-20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL & 1821' FEL Section 20, TIS, R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fue Ute 102102, 962270
Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473 FSL & 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 96-000058 102102, 962270
Murray 3-2A2 43-013-30816 2211 FNL & 225T BWL Section 2, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200 FNL & 1200 FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Gee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754 FSL& 114D' FWL See:ion 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee U1e NW-613 102102, 962270
Oman 2-484 43-013-30645 1536 FSL& 3849' FWL Sec1ion 4. T2S.84W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Powell 2-8A3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Secilon 8. T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
R,ades Moon 1-3585 43-013-30155 870' FNL & 960' FEL Section 35, T25, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee
Rncades Moo, 1-3695 43-013-30289 Section 36, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy '-9A3 43-013-30321 1491 FNL& 1645 FEL Section 9, T:S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Feu Ute GC-DOO323 102102, 962270
Ti.nethy 3-18A3 43-013-30940 Section 18 T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000132 102102, 962270
Warre, 1-32AC 43-013-30174 1799 FNL& 1104 FEL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Wildliie Resources 1-33BS 43-O'.3-30649 1804 FNL& 1603 PEL Section 33, T2S.RSW, U.S.M. Ouchesr.e Fee Ute UTOSO49184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 1523 FSL& 1509 FEL Section 20, TIN, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014986C680 102102, 962270
Wimmer 2-27Bd 43-013-30941 904' FNL & 866' FWL Section 27, T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesr.e Fee Ute 102102,



19-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME API # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

State 1-19A4 43-013-30322 985' FNL & 853 FEL Section 19,T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-27912 Ute 102102, 962270
State 1-8A3 43-013-30286 1545' FNL & 1489' FEL Section 8,T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-24316 Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Wainoco State 1 -1481 43-047-30818 Section 14. T2S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne,iUintah ML-2402 Ute - 102102, 962270
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LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME API # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

State 1-19A4 43-013-30322 985' FNL & 853 FEL Section 19,T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-27912 Ute 102102, 962270
State 1-8A3 43-013-30286 1545' FNL & 1489' FEL Section 8,T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-24316 Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Wainoco State 1 -1481 43-047-30818 Section 14. T2S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne,iUintah ML-2402 Ute - 102102, 962270

O



O O
FORA:o STATE OF UTAH

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS AND MINING
5 ase Designat and S a Ni berSEP2 6 ee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON
td n,Allotteeor TribeName

I)o not use this form for proposals to drill new wem, deepenexisting wells, or to reenter plugged and abend hettyntif LJnitAgreement Name:

LJse APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposais. See attached list.
1. Type of Well. I 8 Well Name and Number:

oil. X GAS OTHER: See attached list.
2. Name ot Operator: 9 API Wel Number:

Linmar Petroleum Company Soc attached list.
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10 Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

7979 East Tufts Ave. Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, CO 80237 (303)773-8003 Altamont/Bluebell
4. Location of Wel

Footages: See attached list. county: See attached list.
QQ Sec.. 1., R., M.: State: Utah

u. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(S±mit in Owlicate) (Samit Original Form Only)

Abandonment [¯
New Construction Abandonment * New Construction

¯¯
Casing Repair Pull or After Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to injection Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat ¯¯ ventor Flare [ Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off [ Other
[X ) Other Change of operator.

Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start _ 9/8/94_ Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions todifferentreservoirson WELL
COMPU TlON OR RECOMPLETlON AND LOG Iorm.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

12, DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Itwellis directionally driued, givesubsuríace locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinentto thiswork.)

There was a change of operator on the date abovc for all wells on the attahced list:

OPERATOR: - FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

All operations are covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40 66A, Bond No. U6053821 and Nationwide Bond No.962270.

13.

V.F. OF MANAGING
Name&Signature BY: L. FL ROHLEDER/_ 7 nue:GENERAL PARTNER Date. 9/20/94

(This space for State use only)

(12/92) (See Instructions on Reverse
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22-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME AP\ # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

A[lred 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700' FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102. 962270
Allred 2-16A3 43-013-SGGG1?cks/ Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102. 962270
Belcher 2-33B4 43-013-30907 2348' FNL & 1085' FWL Section 33,T2S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Brown 2-2BB5 43-013-30718 177T FSL & 1413' FWL Section 28, T2S, R5W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000068 102102, 962270
Carl Smith 2-25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000036 102102, 962270
Chasel 2-17A1 43-013-30732 1379' FSL & 1360' FWL Section 17, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C 102102, 962270
Chase[ Hackford 2-10A1E 43-047-31421 1120' FSL & 1120' FEL Section 10, TTS, R1E, U.S.M. Uintah Fee Ute UTOSO14986C693 102102. 962270
Chasel Miller 2-1A2 43-013-30360 Section 1.T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14987C685 102102, 962270Clark2-9A3 43-013-30876 Section9.TTS,R3W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102,962270
Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 TO97' FSL & 702' FWL Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14987C685 102102.962270
Dye i -2522 43-013-30659 1520' FSL & is20' FEL Section 25, T1N, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOBO49PS4C723 102102. 962270
Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-30915 1496' FSL & 1718' FEL Section 27, TTS, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102. 962270
Fisher 1-16A4 43-013-30737 1527' FSL & 834' FEL Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672C 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980' FNL & 2080' FEL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1106' FNL & 1599' FEL Section 24,T1S, R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR491847030 102102, 962270
Griffith 1-3384 43-013-30288 130T FNL & 1512' FEL Section 33,T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102.962270
Horrocks 2-4A1 43-013-30954 1678' FNL & 1520' FEL Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014985C701 102102, 962270
Jacobson 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104' FSL & 2417' FWL Section 12, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSOT4986C685 102102, 962270
Jenkins 3-16A3 43-013-30877 1085' FSL & 1905' FWL Section 16,T1S.R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270
Jensen 1-2921 43-013-30725 1331' FSL & 2424' FEL Sectlon 29,T1N, T1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-15A4 43-013-30817 241T FNL & 1514 FEL Section 15, T15, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1-34A1 43-013-30590 Section 34,T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne,tUintah Fee Ute VB49184694C 102102,962270
LindsayRusseF11-32B4 43-013-30308 1320'FNL&i320'FEL Section32,T2S,R4W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102,962270
LindsayRussell2-3284 43-013-30371 Section32,T2S,R4W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102,962270
Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473' FSL & 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200' FNL & 120Œ FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754' FSL & 1140' FWL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Powel 2-SA3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Section 8, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Rhoades Moon 1-36B5 43-013-30289 Section 36,T2S,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy 1-9A3 43-013-30321 1491' FNL & 1646' FEL Sectlon 9,TTS, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000123 102102, 962270
Timothy 3-18A3 43-013-30940 Section 18,T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000132 102102, 962270
Warren 1-32A4 43-013-30174 1799' FNL & 1104' FEL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Wildlife Resources 1-33BS 43-013-30649 1804' FNL & 1603' FEL Section 33, T2S,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO49184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 1523' FSL & 1509' FEL Section 20, T1N, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UToso14986C680 102102, 962270

O
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22-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME AP\ # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

A[lred 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700' FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102. 962270
Allred 2-16A3 43-013-SGGG1?cks/ Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102. 962270
Belcher 2-33B4 43-013-30907 2348' FNL & 1085' FWL Section 33,T2S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Brown 2-2BB5 43-013-30718 177T FSL & 1413' FWL Section 28, T2S, R5W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000068 102102, 962270
Carl Smith 2-25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000036 102102, 962270
Chasel 2-17A1 43-013-30732 1379' FSL & 1360' FWL Section 17, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C 102102, 962270
Chase[ Hackford 2-10A1E 43-047-31421 1120' FSL & 1120' FEL Section 10, TTS, R1E, U.S.M. Uintah Fee Ute UTOSO14986C693 102102. 962270
Chasel Miller 2-1A2 43-013-30360 Section 1.T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14987C685 102102, 962270Clark2-9A3 43-013-30876 Section9.TTS,R3W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102,962270
Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 TO97' FSL & 702' FWL Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14987C685 102102.962270
Dye i -2522 43-013-30659 1520' FSL & is20' FEL Section 25, T1N, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOBO49PS4C723 102102. 962270
Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-30915 1496' FSL & 1718' FEL Section 27, TTS, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102. 962270
Fisher 1-16A4 43-013-30737 1527' FSL & 834' FEL Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672C 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980' FNL & 2080' FEL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1106' FNL & 1599' FEL Section 24,T1S, R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR491847030 102102, 962270
Griffith 1-3384 43-013-30288 130T FNL & 1512' FEL Section 33,T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102.962270
Horrocks 2-4A1 43-013-30954 1678' FNL & 1520' FEL Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014985C701 102102, 962270
Jacobson 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104' FSL & 2417' FWL Section 12, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSOT4986C685 102102, 962270
Jenkins 3-16A3 43-013-30877 1085' FSL & 1905' FWL Section 16,T1S.R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270
Jensen 1-2921 43-013-30725 1331' FSL & 2424' FEL Sectlon 29,T1N, T1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-15A4 43-013-30817 241T FNL & 1514 FEL Section 15, T15, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1-34A1 43-013-30590 Section 34,T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne,tUintah Fee Ute VB49184694C 102102,962270
LindsayRusseF11-32B4 43-013-30308 1320'FNL&i320'FEL Section32,T2S,R4W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102,962270
LindsayRussell2-3284 43-013-30371 Section32,T2S,R4W,U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102,962270
Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473' FSL & 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200' FNL & 120Œ FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754' FSL & 1140' FWL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Powel 2-SA3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Section 8, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Rhoades Moon 1-36B5 43-013-30289 Section 36,T2S,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy 1-9A3 43-013-30321 1491' FNL & 1646' FEL Sectlon 9,TTS, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000123 102102, 962270
Timothy 3-18A3 43-013-30940 Section 18,T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000132 102102, 962270
Warren 1-32A4 43-013-30174 1799' FNL & 1104' FEL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Wildlife Resources 1-33BS 43-013-30649 1804' FNL & 1603' FEL Section 33, T2S,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO49184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 1523' FSL & 1509' FEL Section 20, T1N, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UToso14986C680 102102, 962270

O
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SEP? 69W \
Coastal
DreEnuglople

OlV.0FOILf"B &MINING

September 21, 1994

State of Utah
Division of Oil Gas, and Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake city, UT 84180-1203

ATTN: Leesha Cordoba

Leesha:

I have mailed off the revised list of all the FEE wells to you, as
well as the State wells.

The signed copies of the UIC Form 5's were mailed to the State
approximately 9/12/94. Copies of the sundries sent to the BLM for
all the Indian wells were mailed to the State also on 9/19/94.

I will address the Linmar FEE and CA wells ASAP, and will talk to
our land people on 9/19 to determine the disposition of those wells
temporarily abandoned.

Thanks again for you much appreciated help.

y,

Bonnie Johnston
Environmental Coordinator
(303)573-4476

Coastal Bil & Gas Corporation
A SUBS/0/4RY01 14( COAS7AL

(il (il
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Divir.ton of Gil, G<c, an<i Hinino

OPER/\lOR CHANGÍ HORKSHET \
1 -

Attei<h all do<umentation te<Pived by ths. divioon regarding this t.hange_
2-L P'7-PL

Initicil enh listed item when completed. Writo N/A 11 item 1. not appli<.able. /

IWi thduge of Upelator (well s lii) 11 Designatioil of Agent

the operaien nf the well' ted below ha thanged (EEllt.lIVf DAll- 9-8-94

I0 t oew opera lor ) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP ¡ R()M ormei epoi a Du ) LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
-e, ) PO BOX 749 taddress) 7979 E TUFTS AVE PKWY 604

DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER _C_O..80237
C/O COASTAL OIL & GAS

phone i 303 ) 572-1_12_1 phone (303 )773-8003

account no N
0230¯(B)

*6-30-95 account no. _N9523(A)

Hell(s) ttach additional page if needed):

Name: **SEE ATTACHED** API::"_O Entity: Sec Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name:

___

API: Entity: ___ _ Sec Iwp Rng_ Lease Type:
Name: API: Enti ty: Sec Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: __ __ __ API: Entity: 5ec Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Fnti ty: Sec Iwp Rng_ \ ease Type:
Name. APl:___ _ Fntity: __ _ Sec_ Twp Rng Lease lype:
Name: API:

__
_ Entity:_

______
Sec Twp Rng Lease Type:

OPERATORCHANGEDOCUMFNTATION

/ l. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundty or other egal documentation has been received from fcumer
operator (Attach to this form). q

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other le_gal documentation has been received from Gew operator
(Attach to this form). ( --;2/-f

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) ____ If
yes, show company file number:

1. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BI.M has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report>. Make note of BLM status in

comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 thr ough 9 berow.

5. Changes have been entered in the Oil and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above. g ggç

b Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above 7. /Jg

7. Well file labels have been updated foi each well listed above.o../

8 Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Addre55, dnd Account thanges" memo
for distribut ion to State Lands and the lax Commission- g-3A45)

9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change fi le, and a copy of this page has been

placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents-

- OVER
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g g .

ONR/\TOR CHANGE WORKSinfl (CONIINULD) Ïniti,H e<nh item when t..oniphten Writ. N/A il itorn 1, n.H policable,

i NTITY RFVII H

1. (Rule R6]S--8 /) intity ass' nments have been reviewed for ali wei 5 i ted above. Wege
entity Ehanges made? (yes (lf entity assitanments were changed, attach copigs of
form 6, Entity Mtion Earm .

?.State Lands and the Tax Commisiion have been notified through Darm procedures d
enti ty change

OND VFRIFICATION ( Fee we i I s on Iy) / go or

UCcygti (co,co /<¿Ä,deEs.C
1. (Rule R615 3 1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed a ve has furnished a

proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes(n

Today's ddÌB _ .

19 . If yPS, divi51On response was made by letter

dated 19

11ASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

l. (Rule R615--2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been

notified by letter dated
.

. ..

19 ,
of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such lease of the thange of operator. Documentation of such

not fica igon has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

L MA11

attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: at 19 .

FILING

1. Cop es of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well fi e.

2. The o _g nal of this form and the original attachments have been f led in the Operator

Change file.

COMHENI5

Wl ll/M

g g .
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L MA11
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COMHENI5

Wl ll/M



FORM lo STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 2 4355 West North lemple. 3 Triad, 5eue 360. Salt lake City. UT 84180 120

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

OPERATOR NAME AND ADDRESS:
UTAH ACCOUNT NUMßER:

N9523

C/O COASTAL OIL & GAS / 95REPORT PERK)D (MONTH/YEAR)
Y

PO BOX 749
DENVERCO 80201-0749

AMENDED REPORT (Highlight Changes)

Well Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes
API Number Entity incatam Zone Status Oper OIL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)

TIMOTHY l-9A3 ·

4301330321 09115 015 03W 9 GR-WS geoco/2 g
ALLRED 1-16A3
4301330232 09116 ois 03W 16 GR-WS †ÖÐ000FŸ
FISHER 1-16A4
4301330737 09117 ois 04W 16 GRRvt YA
OLSEN 1-27A4"
4301330064 09119 ois 04w 27 GR-ws Ÿá 60/0

301330718 09131 025 OSW 28 GR-WS $$0000 E
1 RES 1 38

25 OSW 33; GR-ws //74ayfrgfg.ÿÿ¿, FEE fia; A
ufE TRIBAL 1-1881E
4304730969 09135 o2s 01E 18 GR-ws †d¿co>/p-
GOODRICH 1-24A4'

301330760 09136 ois obw 24 GR-ws VAŸîlFffd32L
CARL SMITH 2-25AA'
4301330776 09137 ois 04w 25 GR-WS †¾œœ RE f5 N Ñ
JENKINS 3-16A3 ¯

4301330877 09|35 ois 03W 16 GR-ws îtrodod?7
JESSEN 1-15AA
4}Ol330817 09345 015 DAW 15 GR-ws VAfîlyVlied.

vtilASEIN1ACKBGÀDR2- lO-A lE
430A731421 09400 ois 01E 10 GR-WS

ËUTE TRIBAL 1-30Zl '
A30133_o813_ 09405 01N_01W 30

_

GR-ws VAýý/ ŸaGd

TOTALS

UMMENT3:

hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge. Daw

lame and Signature: ___ Telephone

FORM lo STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 2 4355 West North lemple. 3 Triad, 5eue 360. Salt lake City. UT 84180 120
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gg eeJNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
DATË: October 12, 1995

"áfo°
Acting Superintendent , Dintah and Ouray Agency

SUBJE:CT: DOSignâtiOn of Successor Operator

To: Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

We are in receipt of the Designation of successor Operator for
whereby Linmar Petroleum Company resigned as operator and Coastal AS MININGCorporation was designated as the new operator for cowmunizationAgree ents
(CA) listed below:

Sec./ Legal
CA Number Twnshp/Rng Descrip. Acres96-000118 24-38-7W All 640.09C-000212 18-25-1E Al l 639.18VR49I-84703C 24-lS-4W All 640.0
UTOSOI49-85C713 04-4S-6W ALL 641.11
UTOSOI49-85C714 05-4s-6W ALL 641.84996-000058 07 lS-3W l ALL 630 .1296-0000 65 27-lN-lW ALL 640 .096-000068 28-2S-5W ALL 640.096-000087 16-15-3W ALL 640.0
96-000108 -1s-4W |5-acg ' ALL 640.096-000119 33-2S-4W ALL 654.08
9C-000123 09-lS-3R ALL 640.090-000132 18-1S-3W ALL 630.72MRM-715 08-lS-3W ALL 640.0VR49I-84680C 17-lS-lW ALL 640.0
VR49I-84672C 16-lS-4W ALL 640.0VR49I-84681C 29-lN-1W ALL 640.0
VR49I-84692C 15-lS-4W ALL 640.0
VR49I-84694C 34-lS-1W ALL 640.0
VR49I-84705C 30-lN-lW ALL 638 .92 I- 0

AM
UTOSOI49-85C701 '04-lS-lW ALL 659.14
UTOSOI49-85C704 03-lS-3W ALL 688.68UTOSOI49-86C680 120-lN-lW ALL 640.0
UTO80I49-86C685 12-lS-4R ALL 640.0UTO80I49-87C685 ¡Ol-lS-2W ALL 664.25

The enclosed instruments were approved on October 10, 1995. Coastal Bond No.ll-40-66A will be used to cover all CA operations, plugging and abandonment of
wells.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext.
51/52/54.

Enclosures OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10

cc: Lisha Cordova, Utah State DOGM
Esifm°À«termios-si.•
5010-114

*U.S.GPO:199Œo
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FORM9

DIVISION
S FG SAHAND

MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

Fee
6. Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existingwells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such purposes

8. Well Name and Number:
1 Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER: Brown 2-28B5

2 Name of Operator 9. API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30718

3 Address and Telephone Number. 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

Altamont
P.O. Box 1148, Vernal UT 84078 (435) 781-7023

4 Location of Well

Footages: 1413' FWL& 1777' FSL County: Duchesne
QQ,Sec., T., R., M.: NE/SW Sec 3. T25, RSW state: Utah

1 .

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Dupilcate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon* New Construction

Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recomplete Change of Plans Perforate

Convert to Injection Perforate Conved to Injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

MultipleCompletion Water Shut-Off Other Completion Report
Other

Date ofworkcompletion ]] /30/00
Approximate date workwillstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSEDORCOMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones peninent to this work.)

Subject well placed back on production on 11/30/00. Please refer to the attached Chronological
Workover Report. Any water produced from the proposed well will be contained in a water tank and
will then be hauled by truck to one of the pre-approved disposal sites:

RNI, Sec.5, T9S, R22E
NBU#159. Sec.35, T9S, R21E
Ace Oilfield, Sec.2, T65, R20E
MC&MC,Sec.12, T65, R19E

ame & Signa (\A Met Title
cS qCu

y Anal yst Date 12/4/00

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
DEC1 12000

(5/94) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DIVISIONOF
OIL, GAS AND
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Approximate date workwillstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSEDORCOMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones peninent to this work.)

Subject well placed back on production on 11/30/00. Please refer to the attached Chronological
Workover Report. Any water produced from the proposed well will be contained in a water tank and
will then be hauled by truck to one of the pre-approved disposal sites:

RNI, Sec.5, T9S, R22E
NBU#159. Sec.35, T9S, R21E
Ace Oilfield, Sec.2, T65, R20E
MC&MC,Sec.12, T65, R19E

ame & Signa (\A Met Title
cS qCu

y Anal yst Date 12/4/00

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
DEC1 12000

(5/94) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DIVISIONOF
OIL, GAS AND



O O
THE COASTAL CORPORATION

PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

BROWN #2-28B5
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

11/05/00 11/05/00 PROG: OPEN WELL. FIN POOH W/2 7/8" TBG, X-O, RIH W/2 7/8"
TBG 59 STDS, TBG PARTED EOT @6,865.92'. POOH Wl2 7/8" TBG 33 STDS,
PULLED THREADS ON END OF TBG, SPLIT COLLAR. SWI. SDFWE.
CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL. FIN POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, PROD BHA, &
7" AC. PU 4 1/8" X 3 1/8" SHOE, CO TOOLS, 101 JTS
2 3/8" TBG, X-O, RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 59 STDS,
TBG PARTED EOT @6,865.92'. POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG
33STDS,PULLEDTHREADSONENDOFTBG,
SPLIT COLLAR.
SWI

LENGTHS
52 JTS 2 7/8" 1,636.61'
X-O

.44'

101 JTS 2 3/8" 3,124.74'
CLEAN OUT TOOLS 26.84'
TOTAL 4,788.63'

l1/06/00 WI:70.1% AFE:#90368
PERFS: 10,056'-12,842' PBTD: 10,750' (CIBP) CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: FISH
PROG: OPEN WELL, PU 5 ¾" OVERSHOT DRESSED W/ 3 21/32" GRAPPLE.
RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 190 JTS, LATCH FISH @5,993'. WORK TBG, FISH TOOL
TURNED LOOSE @ 10,000# OVER TOTAL STRING WEIGHT, CALL OUT
WIRELINE, PU 1 11/16" OD JET CUTTER, RIH, TAG TOP OF BAILER, PU MADE
CUT @10,090', +/- 14' ABOVE BAILER, POOH Wl 190 JTS, FISHINNG TOOL, &
1 JT 2 7/8" TBG. SWI.

CLEAN OUT, PERFORATE, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL, PU 5 3/4" OVERSHOT DRESSED W/
3 21/32 GRAPPLE. RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 190 JTS,
LATCH FISH @5,993'. WORK TBG, FISH TOOL TURNED
LOOSE @10,000# OVER TOTAL STRING WEIGHT.
LATCH FISH, PULL TO STRING WEIGHT, CALL OUT
WIRELINE, PD l 11/16" OD JET CUTTER, RIH,
TAG TOP OF BAILER, PU MADE CUT @10,090',
PLUS/MINUS 14' ABOVE BAILER, POOH W/ 190 JTS
FISHING TOOL & l JT 2 7/8" TBG
SWI

11/07/00 WI: 70.1% AFE# 90368
PERFS: 10,056-12,842' PBTD: 10,750' (CIBP) CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: FISH
PROG: CONT. POOH W/ 51 JTS 2 7/8" GRAPPLE. RIH W/ 12JTS 2 3/8", X-O,
& 2 7/8" TBG. EOT @9,700. SDFN

CLEAN OUT, PERFORATE, ACIDIZE
CONT. POOH W/ 51 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, X-O, 79 JTS
2 3/8" & CUT OFF JT, PU 3 7/8" OS W/ 2 3/8" GRAPPLE.
RIH W/ 12 JTS 2 3/8", X-O, & 2 7/8" TBG.
EOT@9,700'. RECEIVED

11/08/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE DEC1 12000OPEN WELL. FIN RIH. RU SWIVEL, DRESS OFF FISH,
DIVISIONOF

OIL,GAS AND

O O
THE COASTAL CORPORATION

PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

BROWN #2-28B5
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

11/05/00 11/05/00 PROG: OPEN WELL. FIN POOH W/2 7/8" TBG, X-O, RIH W/2 7/8"
TBG 59 STDS, TBG PARTED EOT @6,865.92'. POOH Wl2 7/8" TBG 33 STDS,
PULLED THREADS ON END OF TBG, SPLIT COLLAR. SWI. SDFWE.
CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL. FIN POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, PROD BHA, &
7" AC. PU 4 1/8" X 3 1/8" SHOE, CO TOOLS, 101 JTS
2 3/8" TBG, X-O, RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 59 STDS,
TBG PARTED EOT @6,865.92'. POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG
33STDS,PULLEDTHREADSONENDOFTBG,
SPLIT COLLAR.
SWI

LENGTHS
52 JTS 2 7/8" 1,636.61'
X-O

.44'

101 JTS 2 3/8" 3,124.74'
CLEAN OUT TOOLS 26.84'
TOTAL 4,788.63'

l1/06/00 WI:70.1% AFE:#90368
PERFS: 10,056'-12,842' PBTD: 10,750' (CIBP) CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: FISH
PROG: OPEN WELL, PU 5 ¾" OVERSHOT DRESSED W/ 3 21/32" GRAPPLE.
RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 190 JTS, LATCH FISH @5,993'. WORK TBG, FISH TOOL
TURNED LOOSE @ 10,000# OVER TOTAL STRING WEIGHT, CALL OUT
WIRELINE, PU 1 11/16" OD JET CUTTER, RIH, TAG TOP OF BAILER, PU MADE
CUT @10,090', +/- 14' ABOVE BAILER, POOH Wl 190 JTS, FISHINNG TOOL, &
1 JT 2 7/8" TBG. SWI.

CLEAN OUT, PERFORATE, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL, PU 5 3/4" OVERSHOT DRESSED W/
3 21/32 GRAPPLE. RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 190 JTS,
LATCH FISH @5,993'. WORK TBG, FISH TOOL TURNED
LOOSE @10,000# OVER TOTAL STRING WEIGHT.
LATCH FISH, PULL TO STRING WEIGHT, CALL OUT
WIRELINE, PD l 11/16" OD JET CUTTER, RIH,
TAG TOP OF BAILER, PU MADE CUT @10,090',
PLUS/MINUS 14' ABOVE BAILER, POOH W/ 190 JTS
FISHING TOOL & l JT 2 7/8" TBG
SWI

11/07/00 WI: 70.1% AFE# 90368
PERFS: 10,056-12,842' PBTD: 10,750' (CIBP) CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: FISH
PROG: CONT. POOH W/ 51 JTS 2 7/8" GRAPPLE. RIH W/ 12JTS 2 3/8", X-O,
& 2 7/8" TBG. EOT @9,700. SDFN

CLEAN OUT, PERFORATE, ACIDIZE
CONT. POOH W/ 51 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, X-O, 79 JTS
2 3/8" & CUT OFF JT, PU 3 7/8" OS W/ 2 3/8" GRAPPLE.
RIH W/ 12 JTS 2 3/8", X-O, & 2 7/8" TBG.
EOT@9,700'. RECEIVED

11/08/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE DEC1 12000OPEN WELL. FIN RIH. RU SWIVEL, DRESS OFF FISH,
DIVISIONOF

OIL,GAS AND



WORK TBG, GOT FISH, PREE, POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG,
X/O, 12 JTS 2 3/8", FISHING TOOL, CUT JT., 20 JTS
2 3/8", CO TOOLS, 4 1/8" SHOE,
SWI

11/09/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
PU 4 1/8" X 3 1/8" SHOE, 10' WASHPIPE CO TOOLS,
99 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG. TAG CIBP @
10,750'. RU SWIVEL, DRILL ON CIBP @10,750'.
MADE 8" HOLE. RD SWIVEL. POOH W/ 30 JTS.
EOT @10,000'.
SWI

l1/10/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL, RIH, RU SWIVEL, CONT. MILLING ON 5" CIBP @10,750'. GOT CIBP
MILLED LOOSE. RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG. TAG FILL @ 12,617', RU SWIVEL GOT TO
12,73T, QUIT MAKING HOLE & STICKY. RD SWIVEL, POOH W/ 2 7/8", 2 3/8", EOT
@1,200'. SWI

11/11/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
FIN POOH W/ 2 3/8" FULL FILL, REMINANTSOF 5" CIBP UP IN SHOE, P/U 4 1/8" BIT,
CLEAN OUT TOOLS, RIH W/ 99 JTS 2 3/8", X-O, & 2 7/8" TBG, TAG @12,737'. DRILL
& STROKE, GOT TO PBTD @12,881', R/D SWIVEL POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, 24STDS,
EOT @11,400'
SDFN

11/12/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL. FIN POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, CLEAN OUT TOOLS & 4 1/8" BIT. 15 JTS
2 3/8" TBG PLUGGED W/ MUD & SCALE. RU OWP, RIH, UNABLE TO GET PAST
12,828'. LOST 4 BOTTOM ZONES. SHOT 12,822, TO 10,049'. 174 HOLES. RD OWP.
SDFN

11/13/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL. PU 5" HD PKR, RIH W/ 4 JTS 2 7/8" P-105
5 3/4" NO-GO, 3 1/2" TBG 312 JTS. SET 5" HD PKR @
9,890', RU PUMP TO CSG, FILL W/ 235 BBLS TPW,
TEST TO 500#, HELD.
BLED PRESS OFF. SWI.

11/14/00 WI: 70.1 % AFE# 90368
PERFS: 10,056'- 12,842' PBTD: 12,881' CSG: 5" SET @12,926"

ACT: PREP TO ACIDIZE 11/16/00
PROG: OPEN WELL. PU 5" HD PRK, RIH W/ 4 JTS 2 7/8" P-1055 ¾" NO-GO,
3 ½" TBG 312 JTS. SET 5" HD PRK @9,890'. RU PMP TO CSG, FILL W/ 235 BBLS
TPW, TST TO 500#, HELD. BLED PRESS OFF. SWI.

1/15/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
200 PSI, RU DOWELL, ACIDIZE PERFS 10,056' TO 12,822'
PUMP 15,000 GALS 15% HCl, 15,000 GALS BRINE DIV,
1400 BS, MAX PSI 8688#, MAX RATE 34.7 BPM.
AVG PSI 7000#, AVG RATE 27 BPM.
ISIP/5/10/15 MIN 3220/1845/934/0#
TOTAL LOAD 1005 BBLS. DIV GOOD.
RD DOWELL. RU SWAB. IFL @7900'. MD 12 RUNS.
REC 4l BBLS WTR- NO OIL. FFL @7800'. pH 5. SWI.
SDFN.

11/17/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
425 PSI ON WELL R.U. WIRE LINE RIH W/ TRACER
SURVEY UNABLE TO GET PAST 12534' LOG WELL
R.D. WIRELINE BLEED WELL DWN, WORK TBG.
FOR 2 1/2" HRS TO GET PKR TO EQUALIZE & UNSEAT
POOHNW/3 1/2" TBG. EOT 8000' S.W.I. RECEIVED

11/18/00 WI: 70.1% AFE# 90368 DEC1 12000
DMSION OF

OIL,GAS AND

WORK TBG, GOT FISH, PREE, POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG,
X/O, 12 JTS 2 3/8", FISHING TOOL, CUT JT., 20 JTS
2 3/8", CO TOOLS, 4 1/8" SHOE,
SWI

11/09/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
PU 4 1/8" X 3 1/8" SHOE, 10' WASHPIPE CO TOOLS,
99 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG. TAG CIBP @
10,750'. RU SWIVEL, DRILL ON CIBP @10,750'.
MADE 8" HOLE. RD SWIVEL. POOH W/ 30 JTS.
EOT @10,000'.
SWI

l1/10/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL, RIH, RU SWIVEL, CONT. MILLING ON 5" CIBP @10,750'. GOT CIBP
MILLED LOOSE. RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG. TAG FILL @ 12,617', RU SWIVEL GOT TO
12,73T, QUIT MAKING HOLE & STICKY. RD SWIVEL, POOH W/ 2 7/8", 2 3/8", EOT
@1,200'. SWI

11/11/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
FIN POOH W/ 2 3/8" FULL FILL, REMINANTSOF 5" CIBP UP IN SHOE, P/U 4 1/8" BIT,
CLEAN OUT TOOLS, RIH W/ 99 JTS 2 3/8", X-O, & 2 7/8" TBG, TAG @12,737'. DRILL
& STROKE, GOT TO PBTD @12,881', R/D SWIVEL POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, 24STDS,
EOT @11,400'
SDFN

11/12/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL. FIN POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, CLEAN OUT TOOLS & 4 1/8" BIT. 15 JTS
2 3/8" TBG PLUGGED W/ MUD & SCALE. RU OWP, RIH, UNABLE TO GET PAST
12,828'. LOST 4 BOTTOM ZONES. SHOT 12,822, TO 10,049'. 174 HOLES. RD OWP.
SDFN

11/13/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
OPEN WELL. PU 5" HD PKR, RIH W/ 4 JTS 2 7/8" P-105
5 3/4" NO-GO, 3 1/2" TBG 312 JTS. SET 5" HD PKR @
9,890', RU PUMP TO CSG, FILL W/ 235 BBLS TPW,
TEST TO 500#, HELD.
BLED PRESS OFF. SWI.

11/14/00 WI: 70.1 % AFE# 90368
PERFS: 10,056'- 12,842' PBTD: 12,881' CSG: 5" SET @12,926"

ACT: PREP TO ACIDIZE 11/16/00
PROG: OPEN WELL. PU 5" HD PRK, RIH W/ 4 JTS 2 7/8" P-1055 ¾" NO-GO,
3 ½" TBG 312 JTS. SET 5" HD PRK @9,890'. RU PMP TO CSG, FILL W/ 235 BBLS
TPW, TST TO 500#, HELD. BLED PRESS OFF. SWI.

1/15/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
200 PSI, RU DOWELL, ACIDIZE PERFS 10,056' TO 12,822'
PUMP 15,000 GALS 15% HCl, 15,000 GALS BRINE DIV,
1400 BS, MAX PSI 8688#, MAX RATE 34.7 BPM.
AVG PSI 7000#, AVG RATE 27 BPM.
ISIP/5/10/15 MIN 3220/1845/934/0#
TOTAL LOAD 1005 BBLS. DIV GOOD.
RD DOWELL. RU SWAB. IFL @7900'. MD 12 RUNS.
REC 4l BBLS WTR- NO OIL. FFL @7800'. pH 5. SWI.
SDFN.

11/17/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
425 PSI ON WELL R.U. WIRE LINE RIH W/ TRACER
SURVEY UNABLE TO GET PAST 12534' LOG WELL
R.D. WIRELINE BLEED WELL DWN, WORK TBG.
FOR 2 1/2" HRS TO GET PKR TO EQUALIZE & UNSEAT
POOHNW/3 1/2" TBG. EOT 8000' S.W.I. RECEIVED

11/18/00 WI: 70.1% AFE# 90368 DEC1 12000
DMSION OF

OIL,GAS AND



O O
PERFS: 10,056 - 12,842' PBTD: 12,881' CSG 5" SET @12,926'

ACT:PBOP
11/1800 PROG: 425 PSI ON WELL RU WIRELINE RIH W/ TRACER
SURVEY UNABLE TO GET PAST 12534' LOG WELL RD WIRELINE BLEED
WELL DWN, WORK TBG. FOR 2 ½ HRS TO GET PKR TO EQUALIZE & UNSEAT
POOH W 3 ½" TBG. EOT 8000' SWI SDFN

CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
250 PSI ON WELL BLEED DWN FINISH POOH & LAYING
DWN 3 12/" TBG. LAY NO GO 4 JTS 2 7/8" 5" H.D. PACKER
P.U. 5 3/4" NO GO SOLID PLUG l JT 2 7/8" TBG. 4 1/2"
PBGA 2 7/8" S.N. RIH W/ 7 JTS 2 7/8" 7 " TAC CONT RIH
W/ 2 7/8" TBG. EOT @4000'
S.D.F.N.

11/19/00 PROG: 250 PSI ON WELL BLEED DWN FIN POOH & LD 3 ½" TBG. LD NO GO 4
JTS 2 7/8" 5" HD PKR PU 5 ¾" NO GO SOLID PLUG 1 JTS 2 7/8" TBG. 4 ½' PBGA
2 7/8" SN RIH W/ 7 JTS 2 7/8" 7" TAC CONT RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG. EOT @4000'
SDFWE

11/20/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
FIN RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, SET 7" A/C @9773' W/ 22,000# TENSION, S.N. @9701', EOT
@9773, N/D WELLHEAD, FLSH TBG W/ 50 BBLS, RIH W/ 1 ¾" PMP & RDS, SEAT
PMP @9701', FILL TBG W/ 40 BBLS. R/D, SLIDE ROLOFLEX.
SDFN

WI: 70.1% AFE# 90368
PERFS: 10,056'-12,842' PBTD: 12,881' CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: ON PROD
11/23/00 PROD: 0 BO 356 BW 87 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/24/00 PROD: 15 BO 348 BW 82 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/25/00 PROD: 8 BO 336 BW 73 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/26/00 PROD: 17 BO 341 BW 58 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/27/00 PROD: 32 BO 402 BW 65 MCF RAN 24 HRS.

11/30/00 Altamont Field Duchesne Co. UT WI: 70.1%: AFE #90368
PERFS: 10,056-12,842' PBTD: 12,881'
CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: WELL ON PRODUCTION
11/30/00 PROD: 15 BO 399 BW 79 MCF RAN 24 HRS

RECEIVED
DEC1 12000
DIVISIONOFOIL GASAND

O O
PERFS: 10,056 - 12,842' PBTD: 12,881' CSG 5" SET @12,926'

ACT:PBOP
11/1800 PROG: 425 PSI ON WELL RU WIRELINE RIH W/ TRACER
SURVEY UNABLE TO GET PAST 12534' LOG WELL RD WIRELINE BLEED
WELL DWN, WORK TBG. FOR 2 ½ HRS TO GET PKR TO EQUALIZE & UNSEAT
POOH W 3 ½" TBG. EOT 8000' SWI SDFN

CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
250 PSI ON WELL BLEED DWN FINISH POOH & LAYING
DWN 3 12/" TBG. LAY NO GO 4 JTS 2 7/8" 5" H.D. PACKER
P.U. 5 3/4" NO GO SOLID PLUG l JT 2 7/8" TBG. 4 1/2"
PBGA 2 7/8" S.N. RIH W/ 7 JTS 2 7/8" 7 " TAC CONT RIH
W/ 2 7/8" TBG. EOT @4000'
S.D.F.N.

11/19/00 PROG: 250 PSI ON WELL BLEED DWN FIN POOH & LD 3 ½" TBG. LD NO GO 4
JTS 2 7/8" 5" HD PKR PU 5 ¾" NO GO SOLID PLUG 1 JTS 2 7/8" TBG. 4 ½' PBGA
2 7/8" SN RIH W/ 7 JTS 2 7/8" 7" TAC CONT RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG. EOT @4000'
SDFWE

11/20/00 CLEAN OUT, PERF, ACIDIZE
FIN RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, SET 7" A/C @9773' W/ 22,000# TENSION, S.N. @9701', EOT
@9773, N/D WELLHEAD, FLSH TBG W/ 50 BBLS, RIH W/ 1 ¾" PMP & RDS, SEAT
PMP @9701', FILL TBG W/ 40 BBLS. R/D, SLIDE ROLOFLEX.
SDFN

WI: 70.1% AFE# 90368
PERFS: 10,056'-12,842' PBTD: 12,881' CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: ON PROD
11/23/00 PROD: 0 BO 356 BW 87 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/24/00 PROD: 15 BO 348 BW 82 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/25/00 PROD: 8 BO 336 BW 73 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/26/00 PROD: 17 BO 341 BW 58 MCF RAN 24 HRS.
11/27/00 PROD: 32 BO 402 BW 65 MCF RAN 24 HRS.

11/30/00 Altamont Field Duchesne Co. UT WI: 70.1%: AFE #90368
PERFS: 10,056-12,842' PBTD: 12,881'
CSG: 5" SET @12,926'

ACT: WELL ON PRODUCTION
11/30/00 PROD: 15 BO 399 BW 79 MCF RAN 24 HRS

RECEIVED
DEC1 12000
DIVISIONOFOIL GASAND



c FORM 8
STA OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
5. LEASEFDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNO.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

N/A
la. TYPE OF WELL:

LL DRY
7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NWEE

L VE E R. O cr 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
2. NAME OF OPERATOR

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Brown
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 1148, Vernal UT 84078 (435)-781-7023 2-28B5
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements) 10. FIELD AND E'OOL,ORWTEf£¾i

Atsurface

NE/SW 1413' FWL& 1777' FSL Altament
At top prod. interval reported beloW 11. SI C.,T., R., M., OR BLK.

ANDSURVEYORAREA

Altotaldepth Section 28, T2S, R5W
14. API NO. DATE ISSUED l 2. COUNTY 13. STATEsame

43-013-30718 Duchesne UT
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL, (Ready toprod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GH, ETC.) 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

<Pugiana.> 5929' GL 5943' KB
20. TOTAL DEFRI, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY DRILLED BY
12.926' 12,881' a X

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION -TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD) 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE

Wasatch 10,056' - 12,822'
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND O]EER LOGS RUN Was Well Cored YES O (Submít analysis)

CCL, CB, GR ormsystemTest YEs ao (Seereverseside)

28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

CASING SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9 5/8" K-55 36# 2492'
7" N-80 26, 29 & 32# 10.016'

29. LI NEl. RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

5" 12.926' 2 7/8" 9778'

31. PERFORATION RECORD(Interval, size and number) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
10,049' - 12,822' 174 holes DEPTHINTERVAL(MD) AMOUNTANDKINDOFMATERIALUSED

10,056'-12,822' Acidize w/15,000Gal 15% HCL,
15.000Gal Brine Div, 1400 BS

33. PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOlgFlowing,gas liff, pumping - size and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing or

shut-in)
11/29/00 Pumping Producing

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SlZE PROD'N. FOR OIL -BBL GAS-MCF. WATER - BBL. GAS -OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD

11/30/00 24 > 15 79 399
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASINC PRESSURE CAI CULATED OIL -BBL. GAS -MCF. WATER -BBL 011. GRAVITY -API (CORR.)

24-HOUR RATE
15 79 399 ggggy

34. DISPOSITION OF CAS(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.) TESTwlTË11ssmo(...
Sol d

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

36. I hereb that the foreg '
g and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records DIV SlON F

Cheryl Cameron OIL, C NGSIG . \/ DAnt.À Aas TITLE Senior Regul atorv Anal yst DATE

See Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse

c FORM 8
STA OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
5. LEASEFDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNO.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

N/A
la. TYPE OF WELL:

LL DRY
7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NWEE

L VE E R. O cr 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
2. NAME OF OPERATOR

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Brown
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 1148, Vernal UT 84078 (435)-781-7023 2-28B5
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements) 10. FIELD AND E'OOL,ORWTEf£¾i

Atsurface

NE/SW 1413' FWL& 1777' FSL Altament
At top prod. interval reported beloW 11. SI C.,T., R., M., OR BLK.

ANDSURVEYORAREA

Altotaldepth Section 28, T2S, R5W
14. API NO. DATE ISSUED l 2. COUNTY 13. STATEsame

43-013-30718 Duchesne UT
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL, (Ready toprod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GH, ETC.) 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

<Pugiana.> 5929' GL 5943' KB
20. TOTAL DEFRI, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY DRILLED BY
12.926' 12,881' a X

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION -TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD) 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE

Wasatch 10,056' - 12,822'
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND O]EER LOGS RUN Was Well Cored YES O (Submít analysis)

CCL, CB, GR ormsystemTest YEs ao (Seereverseside)

28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

CASING SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9 5/8" K-55 36# 2492'
7" N-80 26, 29 & 32# 10.016'

29. LI NEl. RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

5" 12.926' 2 7/8" 9778'

31. PERFORATION RECORD(Interval, size and number) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
10,049' - 12,822' 174 holes DEPTHINTERVAL(MD) AMOUNTANDKINDOFMATERIALUSED

10,056'-12,822' Acidize w/15,000Gal 15% HCL,
15.000Gal Brine Div, 1400 BS

33. PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOlgFlowing,gas liff, pumping - size and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing or

shut-in)
11/29/00 Pumping Producing

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SlZE PROD'N. FOR OIL -BBL GAS-MCF. WATER - BBL. GAS -OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD

11/30/00 24 > 15 79 399
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASINC PRESSURE CAI CULATED OIL -BBL. GAS -MCF. WATER -BBL 011. GRAVITY -API (CORR.)

24-HOUR RATE
15 79 399 ggggy

34. DISPOSITION OF CAS(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.) TESTwlTË11ssmo(...
Sol d

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

36. I hereb that the foreg '
g and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records DIV SlON F

Cheryl Cameron OIL, C NGSIG . \/ DAnt.À Aas TITLE Senior Regul atorv Anal yst DATE

See Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse
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O O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONAMOSERIALMUMBER

A If INillAN ALI nTTEE ON TRIBE NAMF
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

111or CA AGREl-MENT NAME:
Do not use this form for p<opos-ils to dall new wells signrficanily deepen extsirng wells below cur<ent ballom-hale depth, reenter plugged wells. or to

drrflhorizontal lateraN. Use APPLICAllON FOR PERMll TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WEL L NAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER

Exhibir "A"
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR' 9 API NUMBER

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.

8 South 1700 EAst ens Vernal SIATEUtahZIP84078 _1435-789-4433
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE' COUNTY

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE.
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUl3MISSION IYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORA16CURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submil in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACIURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will stad: CAslNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGGTO PREVIOUS LANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CMANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VEN I OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BAGK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work complehon:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF wELL LITE OTHER. Name Chance
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMÞLETE - OtPFERENT FORMATION

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

flAME(PLEASEPRINT ohn T ¯r
flILE ŸiCC PreSident

El Paso . duction Oil & Gas Coitipáñy - -

MAME(PLEASE PRIf ) John T ' z 1er Vice President

SIGNATURE -g

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See insituctions on Reverse side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND

O O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONAMOSERIALMUMBER

A If INillAN ALI nTTEE ON TRIBE NAMF
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

111or CA AGREl-MENT NAME:
Do not use this form for p<opos-ils to dall new wells signrficanily deepen extsirng wells below cur<ent ballom-hale depth, reenter plugged wells. or to

drrflhorizontal lateraN. Use APPLICAllON FOR PERMll TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WEL L NAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER

Exhibir "A"
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR' 9 API NUMBER

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.

8 South 1700 EAst ens Vernal SIATEUtahZIP84078 _1435-789-4433
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE' COUNTY

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE.
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUl3MISSION IYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORA16CURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submil in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACIURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will stad: CAslNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGGTO PREVIOUS LANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CMANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VEN I OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BAGK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work complehon:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF wELL LITE OTHER. Name Chance
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMÞLETE - OtPFERENT FORMATION

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

flAME(PLEASEPRINT ohn T ¯r
flILE ŸiCC PreSident

El Paso . duction Oil & Gas Coitipáñy - -

MAME(PLEASE PRIf ) John T ' z 1er Vice President

SIGNATURE -g

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See insituctions on Reverse side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF EMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON TEE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

DMSION OF
IL GAS AND M NG

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:

State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF EMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON TEE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

DMSION OF
IL GAS AND M NG

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:



. g e
03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. 003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware. DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Diæctors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporationof this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporationbe so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that,as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:
"FIRST, The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil& GasCompany."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote havegiven unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware,

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalfby a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th dayof March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L Siddall
Vice PresidentAttest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

M E. R ' - - -e

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet oark. Assistant Secret" A blVED FILED 11:00 AM 03/09/2001
010118394 - 0610204

JUN i 9 2001
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND

. g e
03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. 003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware. DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Diæctors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporationof this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporationbe so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that,as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:
"FIRST, The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil& GasCompany."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote havegiven unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware,

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalfby a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th dayof March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L Siddall
Vice PresidentAttest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

M E. R ' - - -e

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet oark. Assistant Secret" A blVED FILED 11:00 AM 03/09/2001
010118394 - 0610204

JUN i 9 2001
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND



Division oÎOil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2. CDW 5-LP /
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995
Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
2-9B5 43-013-30719 2410 09-02S-OSW FEE OW S
TEW 2-10B5 (CA 96-54) 43-013-31125 1756 10-02S-05W FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 1-12BS 43-013-30124 1645 12-02S-05W FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-12B5 43-013-31115 1646 12-02S-05W FEE OW S
FARNSWORTH 1-13B5 43-013-30092 1610 13-02S-05W FEE OW P
WRIGHT 2-13B5 43-013-31267 11115 13-02S-OSW FEE OW P
BURTON 2-15B5 43-013-31044 10210 15-02S-05W FEE OW S
REEDER 1-17B5 43-013-30218 1710 17-02S-05W FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 43-013-30917 9600 23-02S-05W FEE OW P
POTTER 1-24B5 43-013-30356 1730 24-02S-05W FEE OW P
POTTER 2-24B5 43-013-31118 1731 24-02S-05W FEE OW P
MURDOCK 2-2685 43-013-31124 1531 26-02S-05W FEE OW P
BIRCH 3-27B5 (CA 96-71) 43-013-31126 1783 27-02S-05W FEE OW P
BROWN 2-28B5 (CA 96-68) 43-013-30718 9131 28-02S-05W FEE OW P
ROBB 2-29BS (CA 96-56) 43-013-31130 10454 29-02S-05W FEE OW P
SMITH 1-31BS 43-013-30577 1955 31-02S-0SW FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 43-013-31036 10216 32-02S-05W FEE OW P
RHOADES MOON 1-3585 43-013-30155 4715 35-02S-05W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 43-013-30908 9404 35-02S-05W FEE OW P
RHOADES MOON 1-36B5 (CA 96-113) 43-013-30289 4765 36-02S-05W FEE OW S
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:

Division oÎOil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2. CDW 5-LP /
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger
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Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995
Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account NO230 Account N1845
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OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
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g e .

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/06/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/06/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/06/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS -- BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change

g e .
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

BROWN 2-28B5
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. 4301330718

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1099 18TH ST, SUITE 1900 ce DENVER STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 291-6417 ALTAMONT,WASATCH

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1413' FWL & 1777' FSL COUNTY: DUCHESNE

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 28 2S 5W STATE:
UTAH

9t CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

'Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

10/1/2008 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO RESPECTFULLY REQUESTS APPROVAL TO RECOMPLE SUBJECT WELL PER ATTACHED PROCEDURE.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

Date: IÓ' i i
Initials: MS

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) MARIEOKEEFE
TITLE SR REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 9/18/2008

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly)

O UTAH DV RECEIVED
O\L, GAS

SEP2 2 2008
DATE:

(5/2000) . nstructions on Reverse Side) Div.OFOIL,GAS&
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O S Production

RECOMPLETION PROGNOSIS

BROWN 2-28BS

API #: 4301330718
SEC 28-T2S-RSW
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WELL DATA:
ELEVATIONS: GL 5,929' KB 5,943'
FORMATION TOPS: GREEN RIVER TGR3 @ 7,940'; WASATCH @ 9,482'
BHT 171 DEG F @ 9,999' 2/83
TOTAL DEPTH: 12,927'
PBTD: 12,881'
HOLE/CASING SIZES:

12-1/4" hole 9-5/8" 36# K-55 @ 2,492'with 1080 SXS cement
8-3/4" hole 7" 26, 29, 32# N-80 @ 10,016' with 450 SXS cement

TOC @ 8430' CBL 4/83
6" hole 5" 18# P-110 @ 12,926' with 550 SX

5" 18# P-110 TOL @ 9,814'

PERFS: 10,049-12,842'

PACKERS & PLUGS:
NONE

WELL IS PRODUCING AT 9-12 BOPD, 55 MCFPD, AND 350 BWPD

RECOMPLETION PROGNOSIS:

1. MIRUPU. Blow well down to tank. Release pump and lay down rods and pump.
Remove wellhead equipment and NU 5000# BOPE. Flush TBG clean.

2. Release TAC @ 9,465' & tally out of hole w/ 2 7/8" 6.5# N80 TBG and BHA.
PU 5 7/8" bit with 7" scraper. TIH to TOL @ 9,814'. TOOH.

3. RIH w/ 7" CIBP to 9,670'. Dump 10' cement on top.

RECEIVED
SEP2 2 2008

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&
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4. Pressure test casing to 1,500 PSI. If casing does not test, isolate leak, squeeze and
drill out. Re-test to 1,500 PSI. ND 5,000 PSI BOPE. NU 10,000 PSI BOPE and
test to 9,975 PSI for 15 min.

5. RU WL and perforate Upper Wasatch and LGR stage 1 interval (9,293-9,628'
OWP 4/83) per attached perf sheet with 3 1/8" HSC guns loaded as noted on SPF,
120 degree phasing w/ 22.7 gram premium charges. Record any pressure
changes.

6. RIH w/ 7" treating PKR with circulating port and 4 ½" 12.75# N80 frac string.
Set PKR 150' above top perforation at approximately 9,143' and install frac
valve.

7. RDMOL.

STAGE 1 STIMULATION OF UPPER WASATCH & LGR 9,293-9,628'

8. MIRU Stimulation company.

Base fluid is fresh water w/ 2% KCL substitute, scale inhibitor, biocide, and
2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company and heated to 120 degrees F.
Estimated BHST is 163 degree F at 9,455' mid perfs. Maximum allowable
treating pressure is 8,500 PSI. Anticipated frac gradient is .75 psilft. Pressure
annulus to 1,000 PSI.

Break down perforations w/ 5,000 gallons 15% HCL at 20-30 BPM. Run 108
bio-ball sealers evenly spaced in acid (balls @ 75% # perfs). Overflush acid
w/ 10 bbls treated 2% KCL water to bottom perf. Shut down and monitor
ISIP, 5, 10, 15 min shut in pressures. Remove ball guns and re-test lines to
9,500 PSI.

Pump fracture treatment per attached treatment schedule & hold 1,000 PSI on
annulus. Flush to top perf marking flush @ 1 PPG @ wellhead densitometer.
Monitor ISIP, 5, 10, 15 minute shut-in and record. Tag job w/ RA#1 in 1.0
PPG, RA #2 in 2.0 PPG and RA #3 in 3&4 PPG stages.

9. Flow test well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

10. RU WL. RIH w/ sinker bar and determine PBTD. Run Pro Technics tracer and
production log over treated interval.

11. Flow test well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

12.
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13. Open by-pass on PRK and kill well. Release PKR and LD 4 ½" 12.75# N80 frac
string.

14. RIH w/ 7" 10K CBP to 9,250' and add 10' cement on top. Pressure test casing to
1,500 PSI.

15. RU WL and perforate LGR stage 2 interval 8,628-9,179' per attached perf sheet
with 3 1/8" HSC guns loaded SPF as noted on perforation chart, 120 degree
phasing w/ 22.7 gram premium charges. Record any pressure changes.

16. RIH w/ 7" treating PKR with circulating port w/ 4 ½" 12.75# N80 frac string. Set
PKR 150' above top perforation at approximately 8,478' and install frac valve.

STAGE 2 STIMULATION OF GREEN RIVER 8,628-9,179'

17. MIRU Stimulation company.

Base fluid is fresh water w/ 2% KCL substitute, scale inhibitor, biocide, and
2.0 gpt MA-844 provided by frac company and heated to 120 degrees F.
Estimated BHST is 157 degree F at 8,903' mid perfs. Maximum allowable
treating pressure is 8,500 PSI. Anticipated frac gradient is .75 psilft. Pressure
annulus to 1,000 PSI.

Break down perforations w/ 5,000 gallons 15% HCL at 20-30 BPM. Run 88
Bio-ball sealers evenly spaced in acid (balls @ 75% # perfs). Overflush acid
w/ 10 bbls treated 2% KCL water to bottom perf. Shut down and monitor
ISIP, 5, 10, 15 min shut in pressures. Remove ball guns and re-test lines to
9,500 PSI.

Pump fracture treatment per attached treatment schedule & hold 1,000 PSI on
annulus. Flush to top perf marking flush @ 1 PPG @ wellhead densitometer.
Monitor ISIP, 5, 10, 15 minute shut-in and record. Tag job w/ RA#1 in 1.0
PPG, RA #2 in 2.0 PPG and RA #3 in 3&4 PPG stages.

18. Flow test well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures.

19. RU WL. RIH w/ sinker bar and determine PBTD. Run Pro Technics tracer and
production log over treated interval.

20. Open by-pass on PRK and kill well. Release PKR and LD 4 ½" 12.75# N80 frac
string.

21. PU 2 7/8" TBG with 5 7/8" bit and 7" scraper and drill up CBP @ 9,250'. Clean
out well to PBTD @ 9,670'. TOOH.

22. PU production assembly and
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23. RDMOL and clean up location.

BROWN 2-28B5 DESIGN TREATMENT SCHEDULE STAGE 1
Stage Stage Type Elapsed Fluid Clean Prop Stage Slurry Proppant

# Time Type Volume Conc Prop. Rate Type
min:sec (gal) (ppg) (kibs) (bpm)

Wellbore Fluid 2% KCL 6483
1 Main frac 2:22 VIKING_3000 5000 0.00 0.0 50.00

pad
2 Prop slug 9:41 VIKING_3000 15000 0.50 7.5 50.00 100-Mesh
3 Main frac 12:03 VIKING_3000 5000 0.00 0.0 50.00

pad
4 Main frac 21:56 VIKING_3000 20000 1.00 20.0 50.00 SinterLite Bauxite

slurry 20/40
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slurry 20/40
8 Main frac 49:50 LINEAR 20_GW- 6533 0.00 0.0 50.00

flush 32
Design c ean volume (bbis) 2357.9 Design proppant pumped (klbs) 152.5
Design s urry volume (bbis)



BROWN 2-28B5
PFKJPOSED PERFS
Cased Hole Log OWP Run #1 4/1/1983

STAX3E1 9293-9628' SPF

9293 9295 6 7"PKR @ 9143'
9301 9302 3
9304 9305 3
9309 9310 3
9314 9315 3
9324 9325 3
9327 9328 3
9333 9334 3
9350 9351 3
9369 9370 3
9377 9378 3
9382 9383 3
9404 9405 3
9415 9416 3
9429 9430 3
9438 9439 3
9445 9446 3
9448 9449 3
9462 9464 6 MP9455'163DEG F
9468 9469 3
9473 9474 3
9483 9484 3
9490 9491 3
9495 9498 9
9509 9510 3
9514 9516 6
9518 9520 6
9540 9542 6
9551 9552 3
9563 9564 3
9574 9575 3
9579 9580 3
9582 9583 3
9588 9590 6
9599 9600 3
9606 9607 3
9612 9613 3
9621 9623 6
9627 9628 3 CBP @ 9670' W/ 10' CMT

TOTALSHOTS 144
TOTALBIOBALLS
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BROWN 2-28B5
PROPOSED PERFS
Cased Hole Log OWP Run #1 4/1/1983

STAGE 2 8628-9179 SPF

8628 8630 6 7"PKR @ 8478'
8640 8641 3
8661 8662 3
8668 8670 6
8681 8682 3
8750 8752 6
8765 8766 3
8768 8769 3
8771 8772 3
8774 8776 6
8835 8836 3
8839 8840 3
8842 8844 6
8860 8861 3
8865 8866 3
8986 8987 3 MP8903'157 DEX3F
8996 8998 6
9006 9007 3
9010 9011 3
9043 9044 3
9046 9047 3
9070 9071 3
9077 9079 6
9088 9090 6
9093 9095 6
9099 9101 6
9152 9153 3
9169 9170 3
9178 9179 3 CBP @ 9250' W/ 10' CMT

TOTAL SHOTS 117
TOTAL BIOBALLS
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WELL NAME: BROWN 2-2885

PROPOSED RECOMPLETION
SEC 28, T2S, R5 I
DUCHESNE COL 4Ti
API #4301330718 100:

GL 5929' /
KB 5943' /

/ HOLE SIZE PIPE SIZE WEIGHT GRADE SET DEPTÑ
/ 12 1/4" 9 5/8" 36# K55 1080 SX 2492'
/ 8 3/4" T' 26#, 29#, 32# N80 450 SX 10016
/ TOL 5" 18# P110 9814'
/ 6" 5" 18# P110 550 SX 12926'
/ SURFACE 9 5/8" 36# K55 1080 SX 2492'

PERFORATIONS
PERFS 10796'-12842' 4/83
ACID 20,000 GAL 15% 4/83
ACID 10,000 GAL 15% 10/83
CIBP 10750' REMOVED 11/00 8/85

PERFS 10056'-10730' 8/85
PERFS 10049'-12822' 11/00
ACID ALL 15,000 GAL 15% 11/00

OPENPERFS 10049-12842'
TGR3 @ 7940'

PROPOSED RECOMPLETION
PROPOSED CBP 9670' Wl10' CEMENT

PROP0SED PERFS 9293'-9628'
TOC @ 8430' CBL 4/83 PROPOSED CPB 9250' Wl10' CEMENT

/ \ GRTN1 @ PROPOSED PERFS 8628'-9179'

\ 4 1/2" 12.75 N80 FRAC STRING 9143'

PROPOSED PERFS 9293'-9628'

/ % WASATCH @ 9482'
/ % PROPOSED CBP © 9670'
/ % TOL 5" 18# P110 9814'

/ % INTERMEDIATE 7" . . 26#, 29#, 32# NBC 450 SX 10016

PERFS 10056'-10730' 8/85

PERFS 10796'-12842 5/83

PBTD 12881' 4/83, 11/00
LINER 5" 18# P110 550 SX 12926
TD 12927

BMSGW @ 2429'
BHT 171*F @ 9999' 2/83

NOTE: NOT TO SCALE TBG DETAIL

5 3/4" NOGO, 27/8" SOLID PLUG, 1 JOlNT 27/8" N80
4 1/2" PBGA, 6'2 7/8" N80 SUB, SN, 7 JOINTS N80
T' TAC @ 9465'
298 JOINTS 2 7/8" NBO
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API Well No: 43013307180000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROWN 2-28B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013307180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1777 FSL 1413 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 28 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

3/22/2009

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EL PASO RECOMPLETED SUBJECT WELL ACCORDING TO ATTACHED REPORT
COMPLETED JOB 3/22/09. PERFORATE UPPER WASATCH LGR: 9293-9628'

GREEN RIVER: 8628-9179' EOT 8753' POP.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Marie Okeefe

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6/16/2009

PHONE NUMBER:
303 291-6417  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 291-6417

June 16, 2009

June 17, 2009

iPI Well No: 43013307180000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EEEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROWN 2-28B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43013307180000
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QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NESW Section: 28 Township: 02.05 Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o
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WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO RECOMPLETED SUBJECT WELL ACCORDING TO ATTACHED REPORT
COMPLETED JOB 3/22/09. PERFORATE UPPER WASATCH LGR: 9293-9628'Accepted by the

GREEN RIVER: 8628-9179' EOT 8753' POP. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECQßg2gNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2009

RECEIVED June 16,
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June 16, 2009

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 1 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: IIROWN 2-2885
Common Well Name: [3ROWN 2-28B5 Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name: IRECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: IIASIC ENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: I)ASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Pl3ase Description of Operations

2/28/2009 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 C 18 CT & TGSM ( MOVING EQ,, )
07:00 -08:00 1.00 C 01 RDMO 2-5 B3
08:00 -10:00 2.00 C 01 MOL TO WINDY TO RIG UP. CSDFWE
10:00-11:00 1.00 C 18 CT

3/1/2009 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 C 18 NO ACTIVITY( SDFWE )
3/2/2009 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 C 18 NO ACTIVITYCSDFWE
3/3/2009 06:00-07:00 1.00 C 18 CT& TGSM ( RIGGINGDOWN ROTO-FLEX)

07:00 -09:00 2.00 C 01 R/D ROTO-FLEX UNIT, R/U RIG.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 C 08 WORK PUMP OFF SEAT, FLUSH TBG & RODS W/ 65 BBLS TPW
10:00 - 13:00 3.00 C 04 POOH WI PROD RODS, LAYINGDOWN 10 1", 10 7/8", 18 3/4" & 11 1"

ON BTM TAPOR, CIO TO TBG EQ., P/U ON HANGER, RIGHT ANGLE
DRIVE WENT OUT IN RIG.

13:00 -18:00 5.00 C 06 RIG DOWN FOR REPAIRS WILL BE WAITING ON PARTS THROUGH
OUT TOM.

3/4/2009 06:00 -18:00 12.00 C 06 REPAIR RIGHT ANGLEDRIVE
3/5/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT & TGSM ( NIU BOPS)

07:00 -09:00 2.00 C 15 N/D WELLHEAD RELEASE TAC N/U BOPS, R/U WORKFLOOR &
TBG EQ.,

09:00 -11:30 2.50 C 04 POOH W/298 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD, 7" TAC, +45 PSN, 6' PUP JT., 4-1/2"
PBGA, 1 JT., (FULL OF SOLIDS), SOLID PLUG, 5-3/4" NO-GO

11:30 -16:30 5.00 C 11 R/U WIRELINE TRUCK,RIH Wl5.875 GAUGE RING TO LNR TOP,
RIH Wl7" CIBP & SET @9670, RIH W/ DUMP BAILOR& SPOT 12'
CMT ON TOP OF CIBP, R/D WIRELINE CMT SAMPLE WET, SWIFD
CSDFD CT

3/6Ï2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT &TGSM ( PERFORATING)
07:00 -09:00 2.00 C 08 F &T CSG W/ 332 BBLS, TO 1500 # PSi MONITOR FOR 30 MIN.,

GOOD TEST
09:00 -12:30 3.50 C 11 R/U WIRELINE & MAKE3 CONS., GUN RUNS PERFORATING 9293'

TO 9628' 48 NET FT., W/ 144 TTL SHOTS. HOLDlNG 1000# PSI ON
CSG, FOR 3 TTL GUN RUNS, ENDING PSI 1000#. R/D WIRELINE
CRW.

12:30 - 14:00 1.50 C 18 ATTEMPT TO BLEED OF PSI WELL WINOT DIE., C/O 4-1/2" TBG
EQ., FLOWED 102 BBLS

14:00 - 19:30 5.50 C 04 MU 7 RlH WI2-7/8" PUMP OFF SUB, 7" WCS PKR, 2-7/8" 8RD X 4-1/2"
8RD X/O 75 JTS 4-1/2" TBG, EOT @2430. SWIFD CSDFD CT

3/7/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT & TGSM ( PICKING UP 4-1/2 TBG ) CSIP @100# PSI BWD

07:00 -17:00 10.00 C 04 CONT MU & RIH W/ 194 JTS 4-1/2" 8RD, 4-1/2" 8RD X 4-1/2" PH6 X/O,
22 JTS 4-1/2" PH6 (291 TTL JTS 4-1/2") INSTALLFRAC VALVE&
SET PKR @9160.

17:00 -19:30 2.50 C 08 FILLTBG & PUMP OFF PLUG, F&T CSG TO 1500 # PSI GOOD TEST,
SWIFD, R/U FLOWBACKLINES, PREPAIR LOC., FOR FRAC. CSDFD
CT.

3/8/2009 06:00 -09:30 3.50 C 01 MOLW/ WEATHERFORD FRAC EQ., RIU FRAC EQ,,

09:30-15:30 6.00 C 21 TEST LINES TO9000 PSI. BREAK DOWN STAGE 1 PERFORATIONS
@3404 PSI @5 BPM. TREAT STAGE 1 PERFORATIONS W/5000
GAL 15% HCL ACID USING 105 BIO BALLS FOR DIVERSION. AVG
RATE 24.9 BPM. MAXPSI 4889 AVE PSI 4084. MAXRATE 32.1 BPM..
FLUSH ACID 10 BBLS PAST BTM PERF. ISIP 2427 PSI. 5 MIN2152

RECEIVED June 16, 2009
Printed $11812009
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2/28/2009 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 C 18 CT & TGSM ( MOVING EQ,, )
07:00 -08:00 1.00 C 01 RDMO 2-5 B3
08:00 -10:00 2.00 C 01 MOL TO WINDY TO RIG UP. CSDFWE
10:00-11:00 1.00 C 18 CT

3/1/2009 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 C 18 NO ACTIVITY( SDFWE )
3/2/2009 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 C 18 NO ACTIVITYCSDFWE
3/3/2009 06:00-07:00 1.00 C 18 CT& TGSM ( RIGGINGDOWN ROTO-FLEX)

07:00 -09:00 2.00 C 01 R/D ROTO-FLEX UNIT, R/U RIG.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 C 08 WORK PUMP OFF SEAT, FLUSH TBG & RODS W/ 65 BBLS TPW
10:00 - 13:00 3.00 C 04 POOH WI PROD RODS, LAYINGDOWN 10 1", 10 7/8", 18 3/4" & 11 1"

ON BTM TAPOR, CIO TO TBG EQ., P/U ON HANGER, RIGHT ANGLE
DRIVE WENT OUT IN RIG.

13:00 -18:00 5.00 C 06 RIG DOWN FOR REPAIRS WILL BE WAITING ON PARTS THROUGH
OUT TOM.

3/4/2009 06:00 -18:00 12.00 C 06 REPAIR RIGHT ANGLEDRIVE
3/5/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT & TGSM ( NIU BOPS)

07:00 -09:00 2.00 C 15 N/D WELLHEAD RELEASE TAC N/U BOPS, R/U WORKFLOOR &
TBG EQ.,

09:00 -11:30 2.50 C 04 POOH W/298 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD, 7" TAC, +45 PSN, 6' PUP JT., 4-1/2"
PBGA, 1 JT., (FULL OF SOLIDS), SOLID PLUG, 5-3/4" NO-GO

11:30 -16:30 5.00 C 11 R/U WIRELINE TRUCK,RIH Wl5.875 GAUGE RING TO LNR TOP,
RIH Wl7" CIBP & SET @9670, RIH W/ DUMP BAILOR& SPOT 12'
CMT ON TOP OF CIBP, R/D WIRELINE CMT SAMPLE WET, SWIFD
CSDFD CT

3/6Ï2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT &TGSM ( PERFORATING)
07:00 -09:00 2.00 C 08 F &T CSG W/ 332 BBLS, TO 1500 # PSi MONITOR FOR 30 MIN.,

GOOD TEST
09:00 -12:30 3.50 C 11 R/U WIRELINE & MAKE3 CONS., GUN RUNS PERFORATING 9293'

TO 9628' 48 NET FT., W/ 144 TTL SHOTS. HOLDlNG 1000# PSI ON
CSG, FOR 3 TTL GUN RUNS, ENDING PSI 1000#. R/D WIRELINE
CRW.

12:30 - 14:00 1.50 C 18 ATTEMPT TO BLEED OF PSI WELL WINOT DIE., C/O 4-1/2" TBG
EQ., FLOWED 102 BBLS

14:00 - 19:30 5.50 C 04 MU 7 RlH WI2-7/8" PUMP OFF SUB, 7" WCS PKR, 2-7/8" 8RD X 4-1/2"
8RD X/O 75 JTS 4-1/2" TBG, EOT @2430. SWIFD CSDFD CT

3/7/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT & TGSM ( PICKING UP 4-1/2 TBG ) CSIP @100# PSI BWD

07:00 -17:00 10.00 C 04 CONT MU & RIH W/ 194 JTS 4-1/2" 8RD, 4-1/2" 8RD X 4-1/2" PH6 X/O,
22 JTS 4-1/2" PH6 (291 TTL JTS 4-1/2") INSTALLFRAC VALVE&
SET PKR @9160.

17:00 -19:30 2.50 C 08 FILLTBG & PUMP OFF PLUG, F&T CSG TO 1500 # PSI GOOD TEST,
SWIFD, R/U FLOWBACKLINES, PREPAIR LOC., FOR FRAC. CSDFD
CT.

3/8/2009 06:00 -09:30 3.50 C 01 MOLW/ WEATHERFORD FRAC EQ., RIU FRAC EQ,,

09:30-15:30 6.00 C 21 TEST LINES TO9000 PSI. BREAK DOWN STAGE 1 PERFORATIONS
@3404 PSI @5 BPM. TREAT STAGE 1 PERFORATIONS W/5000
GAL 15% HCL ACID USING 105 BIO BALLS FOR DIVERSION. AVG
RATE 24.9 BPM. MAXPSI 4889 AVE PSI 4084. MAXRATE 32.1 BPM..
FLUSH ACID 10 BBLS PAST BTM PERF. ISIP 2427 PSI. 5 MIN2152

RECEIVED June 16, 2009
Printed $11812009
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5
Common Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5 Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name; IRECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: 13ASICENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IIASIC Rig Number: 1584

SubDate I¯rom
- To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

3/8/2009 09:30 - 15:30 6.00 C 21 PSI. 10 MIN 2080 PSI. 15 MIN2019 PSI. SURGE BALLS OFF
PERFORATIONS. WAIT 1 HR FOR BALLSTO DISSOLVE. FRAC
WELL W/ 7552 # 100 MESH [N 1/2 PPG STAGE & 159,469 # 20/40
SINTERLITE BAUXITESAND IN i PPG, 2 PPG, 3 PPG &4 PPG
STAGES. FLUSH TO TOP PERF. ISIP 2916 PSI. 5 MIN2781 PSI. 10
MIN 2648 PSI. 15 MIN 2524 PSI. RD WEATHERFORD FRAC
EQUIPMENT. R/U FLOWLINES TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION.

3/9/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTION FLOWING WELL BACK
3/10/2009 06:00 -10:00

-4.00 C 08 CT & TGSM ( PUMP OPERATIONS) TSIP @50 # PSI, CSIP @0 #
PSL RELEASE PKR & CIRC., 208 BBLS DOWN CSG. MON., WELL
TBG FLOWING R/U & PUMP 25 BBLS DOWN TBG. L/D FRAC VALVE.

10:00 -17:30 7.50 C 04 R/U 4-1/2" TBG EQ., POOH WI22 JTS PH6, PH6 XBRD X/O, 291 JTS
4-1/2"8RD, RETIRE PKR.

17:30 -19:00 1.50 C 18 CLEAN UP TBG EQ., WORK AREA, CLEAN OUT CELLAR. SWIFD
CSDFD CT

3/11/2009 06:00 -08:00 2.00 C 01 CT & TGSM ( PERFORATING) CSIP @400# PSI R/U CASED HOLE
SOLUTIONS

08:00 - 10:00 2.00 C 11 RIH Wl5.785 GAUGE RING VERY WAXY (HAD TO ADDSINKER
BARS) TO 9350'

10:00 - 11:30 1.50 C 11 ATTEMPT TO RIH W/7" CBP WI NO SUCCESS ( DUE TO WAXY
CONDITIONS ) POOH.

11:30 - 12:30 1.00 C 08 PUMP 60 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN CASING @250 DEG.,

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 C 11 RIH W/ 7" CBP & SET @9250'.

14:30 -15:30 1.00 C 11 SPOT 10' CMT ON TOP OF CBP ( TOP CMT @9240°) TEST CSG TO
1500 # PS1 GOOD TEST.

15:30-17:30 2.00 C 11 RIHWI2CONS.,GUNRUNS&PERFORATE8628'TO9179'39NET
FT., 3 SHOTS PER FT., 117 TTL HLS. RUN #1 PRESSURED UP CSG
TO 915# BEFORE SHOOTING BLED OFF TO 830#2ND RUN LEFT
830# ON CSG BLED TO 800#WHILE SHOOTlNG. R/D CASED HL.
WIRELINE CRW. BWD.

17:30 - 21:30 4.00 C 04 MU&RIHW/ 7" WCS PKR, 2-7/8" 8RD X 4-1/2" 8RD X/O, 44 JTS 4-1/2"
P-110 8RD EUE TBG EOP @1390'. HAD TO STOP & CIRC., @750'
SWIFD CSDFD CT

3/12/2009 06:00 -09:00 3.00 C 08 CT &TGSM ( P/U 4-1/2" TBG )THAW OUT WELL HEAD. TSIP & CSIP
@200# PSI. BWD CIRC WELL CLEAN.

09:00 -20:00 11.00 C 04 CONT., M/U & RIH WI219 JTS 4-1/2" P-110 8RD EUE, 8RD X PH6
X/O, 6 JTS PH6, MU FRAC VALVESET & TEST PKR TO 1500# @
8472'. SWIFD CSDFD CT

3/13/2009 06:00 -08:00 2.00 C 18 WEATHERFORD FRAC CRW MOLRU TGSM ( FRAC )

08:00 - 13:00 5.00 C 21 TEST LINES TO 9000 PSI. BREAK DOWN STAGE 2 PERFORATIONS
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5
Common Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5 Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name; IRECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: 13ASICENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IIASIC Rig Number: 1584

SubDate I¯rom
- To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

3/8/2009 09:30 - 15:30 6.00 C 21 PSI. 10 MIN 2080 PSI. 15 MIN2019 PSI. SURGE BALLS OFF
PERFORATIONS. WAIT 1 HR FOR BALLSTO DISSOLVE. FRAC
WELL W/ 7552 # 100 MESH [N 1/2 PPG STAGE & 159,469 # 20/40
SINTERLITE BAUXITESAND IN i PPG, 2 PPG, 3 PPG &4 PPG
STAGES. FLUSH TO TOP PERF. ISIP 2916 PSI. 5 MIN2781 PSI. 10
MIN 2648 PSI. 15 MIN 2524 PSI. RD WEATHERFORD FRAC
EQUIPMENT. R/U FLOWLINES TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION.

3/9/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTION FLOWING WELL BACK
3/10/2009 06:00 -10:00

-4.00 C 08 CT & TGSM ( PUMP OPERATIONS) TSIP @50 # PSI, CSIP @0 #
PSL RELEASE PKR & CIRC., 208 BBLS DOWN CSG. MON., WELL
TBG FLOWING R/U & PUMP 25 BBLS DOWN TBG. L/D FRAC VALVE.

10:00 -17:30 7.50 C 04 R/U 4-1/2" TBG EQ., POOH WI22 JTS PH6, PH6 XBRD X/O, 291 JTS
4-1/2"8RD, RETIRE PKR.

17:30 -19:00 1.50 C 18 CLEAN UP TBG EQ., WORK AREA, CLEAN OUT CELLAR. SWIFD
CSDFD CT

3/11/2009 06:00 -08:00 2.00 C 01 CT & TGSM ( PERFORATING) CSIP @400# PSI R/U CASED HOLE
SOLUTIONS

08:00 - 10:00 2.00 C 11 RIH Wl5.785 GAUGE RING VERY WAXY (HAD TO ADDSINKER
BARS) TO 9350'

10:00 - 11:30 1.50 C 11 ATTEMPT TO RIH W/7" CBP WI NO SUCCESS ( DUE TO WAXY
CONDITIONS ) POOH.

11:30 - 12:30 1.00 C 08 PUMP 60 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN CASING @250 DEG.,

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 C 11 RIH W/ 7" CBP & SET @9250'.

14:30 -15:30 1.00 C 11 SPOT 10' CMT ON TOP OF CBP ( TOP CMT @9240°) TEST CSG TO
1500 # PS1 GOOD TEST.

15:30-17:30 2.00 C 11 RIHWI2CONS.,GUNRUNS&PERFORATE8628'TO9179'39NET
FT., 3 SHOTS PER FT., 117 TTL HLS. RUN #1 PRESSURED UP CSG
TO 915# BEFORE SHOOTING BLED OFF TO 830#2ND RUN LEFT
830# ON CSG BLED TO 800#WHILE SHOOTlNG. R/D CASED HL.
WIRELINE CRW. BWD.

17:30 - 21:30 4.00 C 04 MU&RIHW/ 7" WCS PKR, 2-7/8" 8RD X 4-1/2" 8RD X/O, 44 JTS 4-1/2"
P-110 8RD EUE TBG EOP @1390'. HAD TO STOP & CIRC., @750'
SWIFD CSDFD CT

3/12/2009 06:00 -09:00 3.00 C 08 CT &TGSM ( P/U 4-1/2" TBG )THAW OUT WELL HEAD. TSIP & CSIP
@200# PSI. BWD CIRC WELL CLEAN.

09:00 -20:00 11.00 C 04 CONT., M/U & RIH WI219 JTS 4-1/2" P-110 8RD EUE, 8RD X PH6
X/O, 6 JTS PH6, MU FRAC VALVESET & TEST PKR TO 1500# @
8472'. SWIFD CSDFD CT

3/13/2009 06:00 -08:00 2.00 C 18 WEATHERFORD FRAC CRW MOLRU TGSM ( FRAC )

08:00 - 13:00 5.00 C 21 TEST LINES TO 9000 PSI. BREAK DOWN STAGE 2 PERFORATIONS
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5
Common Well Name: lìROWN 2-28B5 Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: lšASIC ENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IlASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

3/13/2009 08:00 - 13:00 5.00 C 21 @2961 PS1 @4.7 BPM. TREAT STAGE 2 PERFORATIONS W/ 5000
GAL 15% HCL ACID USING 88 BIO BALLS FOR DIVERSION. AVG
RATE 23.2 BPM. MAXPSI 4760 AVE PS13650. MAXRATE 27.8 BPM..
FLUSH ACID 10 BBLS PAST BTM PERF. ISIP 1659 PSL 5 MIN 1170
PSL 10 MIN 887 PSI. 15 MIN720 PSI. SURGE BALLSOFF
PERFORATIONS. WAIT 1 HR FOR BALLSTO DISSOLVE. FRAC
WELL Wl6014#100 MESH IN 1/2 PPG STAGE & 47973#20/40
SINTERLITE BAUXITESAND IN 1 PPG, 2 PPG STAGES. FLUSH TO
TOP PERF. ISlP 2178 PSI. 5 MIN 1831 PSI. 10 MIN 1731 PSI. 15 MIN
1656 PS1 RD WEATHERFORD FRAC EQUlPMENT. R/U FLOWLINES
TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION. ( CUT SAND &WENT TO FLUSH @
5450 # PSI IN 2# STAGE PSI DUE TO INSTANT PRESSURE
INCREASE )

3/14/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTION FLOWING STAGE 2 FRAC
3/15/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTION FLOWING STAGE 2 FRAC
3/16/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTlON FLOWING STAGE 2 FRAC
3/17/2009 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 C 18 CT &TGSM ( L/D 4-1/2" TBG )

07:00 -10:00 3.00 C 08 TSIP SIP @ 50 # PSI. RELEASE PKR CIRC., WELL CLEANW/2%
KCL.

10:00 - 19:00 9.00 C 04 BREAK OUT FRAC VALVE POOH W/ 6 JTS 4-1/2" PH6, PH6 X 8RD
X/O, 198 JTS 4-1/2" 8RD. SWIFD CSDFD CT. EOP @2122'

3/18/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 08 CT &TGSM ( R/D 4-1/2" TBG EQ., USE SNUB LINE ) TSIP @20 # PSI
CSG SIP @20 # PSI. HOT OILER BEG., CIRCULATING WELL @
06:00 UNTIL07:00.

07:00 - 11:00 4.00 C 04 CONT., L/D 67 JTS 4-1/2 "8RD EUE TBG 4-1/2" X 2-7/8" X/O, T' WCS
PKR. C/O TO 2-7/8" TBG EQ.,

11:00 - 16:30 5.50 C 04 MU & RIH W/ 6" BIT, BIT SUB, 283 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, (
STOPPING TO CIRC., AS NEEDED TO KEEP WELL IN CONTROL)
TAG SAND @8973' P/U OFF SAND CSG BEG., TO FLOW L/D3 JTS
PULLING HARD, 110K

16:30-18:30 2.00 C 08 R/U PUMP LINES & CIRC., DOWN CSG UP TBG, CIRC UNTILSAND
CLEANED UP. SPOT 25 BBLS BRINE DOWNTBG. POOH W/13 JTS
2-7/8" TBG. EOT @8506'. SWIFD CSDFD CT.

3/19/2009 06:00 -08:30 2.50 C 04 CT &TGSM ( PWR SWVL OPERATIONS) TSIP @20 # PSI. CSIP @
400# PSI. RIU PUMP & RETURN LINES BD TBG. RlH Wl16 JTS
RETAG SAND @8973'. RIU PWR SWVL.

08:30 -12:30 4.00 C 13 SWVL DOWN Wl9 JTS CIRC OUT SAND TAG CMT TOP @9240'.

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 C 08 CIRC WELL CLEAN.

13:00-16:00 3.00 C 13 DRILLUPCMT&CBP,SWVLDOWN1JT.,RIHWl10JTS2-7/8"8RD
EUE TBG, RETAG SAND @9658'. L/D 1 JT., RIU PWR SWVL. C/O
W/ JT # 304 & 8' OUT OF #305 TO TOP OF CMT @9658'. P/U 2' OFF
BTM.

16:00- 17:00 1.00 C 08 CIRC., CLEAN FOR 1 HR. PUMP 30 BBLS 10# BRINE DOWN TBG.
17:00 - 19:00 2.00 C 04 RID PWR SWVL., POOH WI 37 JTS., 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG (268 JTS
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5
Common Well Name: lìROWN 2-28B5 Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name: RECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: lšASIC ENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IlASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

3/13/2009 08:00 - 13:00 5.00 C 21 @2961 PS1 @4.7 BPM. TREAT STAGE 2 PERFORATIONS W/ 5000
GAL 15% HCL ACID USING 88 BIO BALLS FOR DIVERSION. AVG
RATE 23.2 BPM. MAXPSI 4760 AVE PS13650. MAXRATE 27.8 BPM..
FLUSH ACID 10 BBLS PAST BTM PERF. ISIP 1659 PSL 5 MIN 1170
PSL 10 MIN 887 PSI. 15 MIN720 PSI. SURGE BALLSOFF
PERFORATIONS. WAIT 1 HR FOR BALLSTO DISSOLVE. FRAC
WELL Wl6014#100 MESH IN 1/2 PPG STAGE & 47973#20/40
SINTERLITE BAUXITESAND IN 1 PPG, 2 PPG STAGES. FLUSH TO
TOP PERF. ISlP 2178 PSI. 5 MIN 1831 PSI. 10 MIN 1731 PSI. 15 MIN
1656 PS1 RD WEATHERFORD FRAC EQUlPMENT. R/U FLOWLINES
TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION. ( CUT SAND &WENT TO FLUSH @
5450 # PSI IN 2# STAGE PSI DUE TO INSTANT PRESSURE
INCREASE )

3/14/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTION FLOWING STAGE 2 FRAC
3/15/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTION FLOWING STAGE 2 FRAC
3/16/2009 06:00 -06:00 24.00 C 18 PRODUCTlON FLOWING STAGE 2 FRAC
3/17/2009 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 C 18 CT &TGSM ( L/D 4-1/2" TBG )

07:00 -10:00 3.00 C 08 TSIP SIP @ 50 # PSI. RELEASE PKR CIRC., WELL CLEANW/2%
KCL.

10:00 - 19:00 9.00 C 04 BREAK OUT FRAC VALVE POOH W/ 6 JTS 4-1/2" PH6, PH6 X 8RD
X/O, 198 JTS 4-1/2" 8RD. SWIFD CSDFD CT. EOP @2122'

3/18/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 08 CT &TGSM ( R/D 4-1/2" TBG EQ., USE SNUB LINE ) TSIP @20 # PSI
CSG SIP @20 # PSI. HOT OILER BEG., CIRCULATING WELL @
06:00 UNTIL07:00.

07:00 - 11:00 4.00 C 04 CONT., L/D 67 JTS 4-1/2 "8RD EUE TBG 4-1/2" X 2-7/8" X/O, T' WCS
PKR. C/O TO 2-7/8" TBG EQ.,

11:00 - 16:30 5.50 C 04 MU & RIH W/ 6" BIT, BIT SUB, 283 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, (
STOPPING TO CIRC., AS NEEDED TO KEEP WELL IN CONTROL)
TAG SAND @8973' P/U OFF SAND CSG BEG., TO FLOW L/D3 JTS
PULLING HARD, 110K

16:30-18:30 2.00 C 08 R/U PUMP LINES & CIRC., DOWN CSG UP TBG, CIRC UNTILSAND
CLEANED UP. SPOT 25 BBLS BRINE DOWNTBG. POOH W/13 JTS
2-7/8" TBG. EOT @8506'. SWIFD CSDFD CT.

3/19/2009 06:00 -08:30 2.50 C 04 CT &TGSM ( PWR SWVL OPERATIONS) TSIP @20 # PSI. CSIP @
400# PSI. RIU PUMP & RETURN LINES BD TBG. RlH Wl16 JTS
RETAG SAND @8973'. RIU PWR SWVL.

08:30 -12:30 4.00 C 13 SWVL DOWN Wl9 JTS CIRC OUT SAND TAG CMT TOP @9240'.

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 C 08 CIRC WELL CLEAN.

13:00-16:00 3.00 C 13 DRILLUPCMT&CBP,SWVLDOWN1JT.,RIHWl10JTS2-7/8"8RD
EUE TBG, RETAG SAND @9658'. L/D 1 JT., RIU PWR SWVL. C/O
W/ JT # 304 & 8' OUT OF #305 TO TOP OF CMT @9658'. P/U 2' OFF
BTM.

16:00- 17:00 1.00 C 08 CIRC., CLEAN FOR 1 HR. PUMP 30 BBLS 10# BRINE DOWN TBG.
17:00 - 19:00 2.00 C 04 RID PWR SWVL., POOH WI 37 JTS., 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG (268 JTS

RECEIVED June 16, 2009 Púnted' 6/16/2009
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5
Common Well Name: lìROWN 2-28BS Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name: IRECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: IIASIC ENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IIASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

3/19/2009 17:00 -19:00 2.00 C 04 INHL., EOT @8506'. DRAIN UP PUMP & RETURN LINES, SWIFD
CSDFD CT

3/20/2009 06:00-08:00 2.00 C 18 BASICSAFETYMEETING.

08:00 -10:00 2.00 C 06 CT &TGSM. ( STRIPPING HEAD RUBBERS) CHANGE OIL IN RIG.
10:00 - 11:00 1,00 C 04 TSIP @200# CSIP @400# BD TBG PUMP 15 BBLS BRINE DOWN

TBG. MU & RJH W/ 37 JTS., TAG FILL@9656'. 2° FILL. L/D 1 JT 10'
ABOVE PBTD. SWI

11;00 -14:00 3.00 C 18 WAIT ON TRACER LOG.

14:00 -18:00 4.00 C 11 R/U DELSCO RIH W/ TRACER LOG & LOG PERFS. 1ST &2ND
STAGE. R/D DELSCO.

18:00 -19:30 1.50 C 04 PUMP 15 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, POOH W/ 40 JTS. EOT @8435°.

SWIFD CSDFD CT.

3/21/2009 06:00 -07:30 1.50 C 18 CT &TGSM ( MONITERING & BWD WATCH OUT FOR TRAPPED PSI
).TSlP @200# PSI CSlP @400# PSI. BD TBG PUMP 20 BBLS 10#
BRINE DOWN TBG

07:30 -09:00 1.50 C 04 POOH W/ 170 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. EOT @2970'

09:00 - 10:00 1.00 C 08 CIRCULATE 130 BBLS 10 # BRINE DOWN TBG. MONlTER WELL.

10:00-11:00 1.00 C 04 CONT POOH Wl94 JTS 2-7/8"8RD EUE TBG, ( L/D 30 JTS2-7/8" 8RD
EUETBG)

11:00 - 14:00 3.00 C 04 MU & RIH Wl2-7/8" SOLID PLUG. 2 JTS 2-7/8", 4-1/2" PBGA, 6' PUP
JT, +45 PSN, 7 JTS 2-7/8", 7" WCS TAC, 265 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE
N-80 EUE TBG. R/D WORKFLOOR &TBG EQ.

14:00 -18:00 4.00 C 15 NID BOPS, SET TAC Wl20K TENSION, N/U WELLHEAD, MlU PUMP
"T" & FLOWLINES. SWIFD, C/O TO ROD EQ., R/D PUMP & RETURN
LINES. CSDFD CT.
EOT @8753', PSN @8648', TAC @84246.

3/22/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT &TGSM, ( RIH W/ RODS)

07:00 -12:00 5.00 C 04 PUST, MU&RIHW/ 2-1/2 X 1-3/4X 36 CDI. MAG., PUMP, & PROD
ROD STRING ( SEE ROD DETAIL). F&TTBG W/5 BBLS L/S TO
1000# PSI.

12:00 -15:00 3.00 C 01 RD,SLIDE UN1TPWOP. CSDFD CT.
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: 13ROWN2-28B5
Common Well Name: lìROWN 2-28BS Spud Date: 1/23/1983
Event Name: IRECOMPLETION Start: 2/27/2009 End:
Contractor Name: IIASIC ENERGY Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IIASIC Rig Number: 1584

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

3/19/2009 17:00 -19:00 2.00 C 04 INHL., EOT @8506'. DRAIN UP PUMP & RETURN LINES, SWIFD
CSDFD CT

3/20/2009 06:00-08:00 2.00 C 18 BASICSAFETYMEETING.

08:00 -10:00 2.00 C 06 CT &TGSM. ( STRIPPING HEAD RUBBERS) CHANGE OIL IN RIG.
10:00 - 11:00 1,00 C 04 TSIP @200# CSIP @400# BD TBG PUMP 15 BBLS BRINE DOWN

TBG. MU & RJH W/ 37 JTS., TAG FILL@9656'. 2° FILL. L/D 1 JT 10'
ABOVE PBTD. SWI

11;00 -14:00 3.00 C 18 WAIT ON TRACER LOG.

14:00 -18:00 4.00 C 11 R/U DELSCO RIH W/ TRACER LOG & LOG PERFS. 1ST &2ND
STAGE. R/D DELSCO.

18:00 -19:30 1.50 C 04 PUMP 15 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, POOH W/ 40 JTS. EOT @8435°.

SWIFD CSDFD CT.

3/21/2009 06:00 -07:30 1.50 C 18 CT &TGSM ( MONITERING & BWD WATCH OUT FOR TRAPPED PSI
).TSlP @200# PSI CSlP @400# PSI. BD TBG PUMP 20 BBLS 10#
BRINE DOWN TBG

07:30 -09:00 1.50 C 04 POOH W/ 170 JTS 2-7/8" TBG. EOT @2970'

09:00 - 10:00 1.00 C 08 CIRCULATE 130 BBLS 10 # BRINE DOWN TBG. MONlTER WELL.

10:00-11:00 1.00 C 04 CONT POOH Wl94 JTS 2-7/8"8RD EUE TBG, ( L/D 30 JTS2-7/8" 8RD
EUETBG)

11:00 - 14:00 3.00 C 04 MU & RIH Wl2-7/8" SOLID PLUG. 2 JTS 2-7/8", 4-1/2" PBGA, 6' PUP
JT, +45 PSN, 7 JTS 2-7/8", 7" WCS TAC, 265 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE
N-80 EUE TBG. R/D WORKFLOOR &TBG EQ.

14:00 -18:00 4.00 C 15 NID BOPS, SET TAC Wl20K TENSION, N/U WELLHEAD, MlU PUMP
"T" & FLOWLINES. SWIFD, C/O TO ROD EQ., R/D PUMP & RETURN
LINES. CSDFD CT.
EOT @8753', PSN @8648', TAC @84246.

3/22/2009 06:00 -07:00 1.00 C 18 CT &TGSM, ( RIH W/ RODS)

07:00 -12:00 5.00 C 04 PUST, MU&RIHW/ 2-1/2 X 1-3/4X 36 CDI. MAG., PUMP, & PROD
ROD STRING ( SEE ROD DETAIL). F&TTBG W/5 BBLS L/S TO
1000# PSI.

12:00 -15:00 3.00 C 01 RD,SLIDE UN1TPWOP. CSDFD CT.

RECEIVED June 16, 2009
""" 6/10/2 09



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |

El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P

El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P

El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
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CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA
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RECEIVED: Jul. 17, 2013

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROWN 2-28B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013307180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1777 FSL 1413 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 28 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7 /22 /2013

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached for details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /17 /2013

September 24, 2013

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well BROWN 2-28B5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013307180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1777 FSL 1413 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESW Section: 28 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
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Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached for details. Approved by the
Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: September 24, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/17/2013

RECEIVED: Jul. 17,

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000
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Report Date:
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
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Utah Division of
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Date: September 24, 2013

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
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SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/17/2013

RECEIVED: Jul. 17,



RECEIVED: Sep. 24, 2013

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013307180000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure they are at the depths specified in the procedure. 

3. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

4. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 

5. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

6. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

7. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply. 

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BAS Pr N1NTMG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013307180000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure they are at the depths specified in the procedure.

3. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface.

4. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration.

5. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

6. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

7. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEIVED: Sep. 24,

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BAS Pr N1NTMG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013307180000
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Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.
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5. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

6. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

7. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEIVED: Sep. 24,



RECEIVED: Sep. 24, 2013

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

9/24/2013 Wellbore Diagram r263

API Well No: 43-013-30718-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: BROWN 2-28B5

Company Name: EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

Location: See: 28 T: 2S R: 5W Spot: NESW String Information
Coordinates: X: 545919 Y: 4458500 Bottom Diameter Weight Length

String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)
Field Name: ALTAMONT

HOLl 2492 12.25
County Name: DUCHESNE SURF 2492 9.625 36

HOL2 10016 8.75

Il 10016 7 26 ¿..pg 11
i

_
_ HOL3 12927 6.25

5 (LOy) 4 (50 Ll 12926 5 18 /0,o LÑ

Cement from 2492 ft to surface

Surface: 9.625 in. @2492 ft.

[ole: 12.25 in. @2492 ft

of9e Cement Information

BOC TOC
lo LosKlA 7'() String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks

or
? Los)( 2.304 Il 10016 8430 HC 250

de Il 10016 8430 H 200
Sm¾e LI 12926 9808 50 550

LURF 2492 0 H 350

cc 6400 SURF 2492 0 LT 730

Perforgtion formation

woo
(ft sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze

10796 12842

140 10049 10730
GMWL 8628 9628

Liner from 12926 ft to 9808 ft

Cement from 10016 ft to 8430 ft

Intermedíate 7 in 10016 a. Formation Information
Formation Depth

¯ ¯ ¯
gegg 62%foola i BMSW 2800 430t3303WO - (og E -

-look9
¯ /' GRRV 5478

GRRVL 7940
7to73 ', WSTC 9482

Hole: 6.25 in. @12927 ft

TD: 12927 TVD: PBTD:

Page
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RECEIVED: Jul. 17, 2013

  7/8/2013 
   

1 
 
 

 

Brown 2-28B5 
API # 43-013-30718 

Altamont Field – Duchesne County, Utah 
NE/4 – SW/4 

Section 28, T 2 S, R 5 W  
1413’ FWL & 1777’ FSL 

Lat. = 40° 16' 31.8354" Long. = -110° 27' 32.7954" 

Regulatory 

Plug & Abandonment Procedure 
CURRENT STATUS:
 

  

This well has been shut-in since October 2010 with +/- 265 jts 2-7/8" N-80  8rd tubing. 
 

BH  Unknown  Casing Flui  Produced Fluid 
BH  Unknown   TD: 13,875’ 
SI  Unknown  PBTD: 8,070’ 
SI  Unknown  KB: 6,121’ 
 

 
    

 
  

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

Brown 2-28B5
API #43-013-30718

Altamont Field - Duchesne County, Utah

NE/4 - SWl4
Section 28, T 2 S, R 5 W

1413' FWL & 1777' FSL
Lat. = 40° 16' 31.8354" Long. = -110° 27' 32.7954"

Regulatory

Plug &Abandonment Procedure
CURRENTSTATUS:

This well has been shut-in since October 2010 with +/- 265 jts 2-7/8" N-80 8rd tubing.

BI Unknown Casing Flu Produced Fluid
BI Unknown TD: 13,875'
SI Unknown PBTD: 8,070'
SI Unknown KB: 6,121'

1

RECEIVED: Jul. 17,

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

Brown 2-28B5
API #43-013-30718

Altamont Field - Duchesne County, Utah

NE/4 - SWl4
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1413' FWL & 1777' FSL
Lat. = 40° 16' 31.8354" Long. = -110° 27' 32.7954"
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1

RECEIVED: Jul. 17,



RECEIVED: Jul. 17, 2013

  7/8/2013 
   

2 
 
 

 

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

EP
SI Schematic as of July 2013

companyname:EP Energy Last Updated: July 8, 2013
Well Name: Brown 2-2885 By: 1.Tomova

Field, County, sole: Adament - Bluebed, Duchesne, Utah TD: 12,927'
Smface Location: Lat 40.27551 N Long -110.45911 Bli.:

Proclucing zagsþ: LGR RHB:
Notes: Spud: Janumy 24 m3

-265

./ts 2 777" 6.5# N·80 Brd Tubinq - - 4

Rod Detali Â 9-5/8", 36#, J·55, @2,492'

i 1/2" x 36' Polis hed Rod
2'x 1" EL Pony Rod Top of Grooft Rivar@ 5,4786

113 (2,8237 - 1" EL Rods
102 (2,550) - 7/8" EL Rods ,

Tubing Ancher @ ~8.424'

102 (2,550) - 3/4" EL Rods 7Ïrs 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 Tubing
24 {600) - 1-1/2" Sinker Bars Searing Nipple @ ~8,648'

3'x 1" EL Pony Rod 6'x 2 T/8" Tubing Sub
2-1/2" x 1-3/4" x 36' insert Pump ,4-1/2" x 32' PBG A Shell

2jr-2-L/8"6.5#N-80MudAnchor
Buli Plug
No·GoNippie?EOT@~8,753'

TOC@8,430'(CBL4/B3)
LGR Recom - Mar '09

8.628' - 9.179' (38';117 shots}
5.000 gals 15% HCL -

50,000# 20.740(cut sand due to high TP) Of.. Y 12 C/BP @9.670' wi 12' cmt on top· Mar 09
9.293' - 9.628" (48'?144 shots}

S.000gals15%HCL Topof5"linerg9,808'
160.000# 28740

7", 26#,29#, 32# N-80 @10,016'
Top of Wasarch @ 10,312'

Now Wasarch Peris - Ana ' RR
10.056'- 10.730' (33 99 holes)

20,000 ga 15% HCi -

- CTBP@10.750'-Aug'B5
CO ';BR Lã IC.¯50'- Nov 00

Orig trai Wasatell Cornpletion · April '83 -

10,790' - 12, 842' {73'!219 Iloles)
20,000 gai 15% HCI

10,990 gal 13% HC/ - Oct '83 -

PETD(:T 72.828'·No ' O
TD @12,927" 5", 18# P-110 @12,926'

RECEIVED: Jul. 17,

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013
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RECEIVED: Jul. 17,



RECEIVED: Jul. 17, 2013

  7/8/2013 
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Proposed P&A  

 

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

Proposed PRA
i a il ina iig

Pronosed P.4A Srhernmic

compmy manne:EP Energy Lut Upustad: July ( 2013
weli mana: Brown 2-2885 By: J. Tomova

rinKI, comty, stme: .4ttamont - StuebeãI, Dischesne. Utah TD: 12,927'
striacaLocahen: Lat40.2755f NLorg-170.459f? BHL:

ProdiscingZenm|a): LGR RKB:

Nelse: spua: January 22, 1983

Pfug #4: 62 sz hafarpeedpiug from 150' io surface

*Cement te be used:16.4gpg..1.05 pield Class G cmt
Plug summary

Bottom Top Length BBLs sx
Plug # 4 150 0 150 L2 b2
Plug # 3 1650 1250 400 45 241
Plug#2 5450 5250 200 LB SE

Plug#1 8500 84DO 200 E 41
*1.004 e:.:cessin 011 Total: 83 443 9-5/8" 36#, J-55. @ 2,492·

Pfug 43: 242 ex baianced plug from 2.650' - 2.250'
Caslag and cameriting Data 'puff easing from 2,800'

Hole Size 12-1/4" 8-3/4"

Casiri.q 00 9-5,i's" 7"
5°

Pfug #2: Perf @5.450'; CICR @ 5.400'; pump 68 sx befow &
£2sing 269, 29tt, spor 30 sx on top of CiCR
Weight 16s 320 IBG

Gr2de J-55 N-80 P-110

Depth 2.492' 10.016' 9,808' - 12,926' Top of Green River@ 5,478'
Critinfû 7305.< 4505< 5505.<

6.2 76
6.184

Cãisin.g ID 8.921 6.094 4.276
6.151
6.059

DrÍft ID 8.765 5.969 4.151
TOC@S,430' CBLd/83

Pfag #1: CfBP @ B,800'w/ 200'emt on top
LGR Recorn - Mar'DB

8,628' -9.17S'l38'l117 shotsþ
5.DOO gals 15% HCL

50.000#20.740(entsandduefoliighTP) P-7742.à CiBP@9.670'w/12'emtontop-Mart.79
3,293' - 9.828'l48'I144 shotsþ

5.DOO gals 15% HC L Top of 5" firier @S,809"
f 60,000# 20/40

7", 28#,29#, 32# N-80 @ id,018"
--- (26#: surf-·-3.078'; 29#: -3, 978'-

New Wasatch Perfs - .ALrg ' 85 --6 542'; 32# from --6.542'-10,016'l

10,056' - f0,730' (33'/99 hofea) - - Top of Wasatch iB (0,312'
20.000 gad f5% NCf - -

CIBP ::g: 10,750'- .Aug '86

[9.0519'- .li ?i2',58' 174 .bolesi

19 900'Ja.I r5 H.

Original Wasatch Completion - April W3
10,796' -12,842' 73't219 holes

20,000 gal 15% HCI -

10..000 gal 15% RCf - Oct W3 --

TD @f2,927" 5", 18# P-110 @ f2,828'
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Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013
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Caslag and cameriting Data 'puff easing from 2,800'

Hole Size 12-1/4" 8-3/4"
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5°
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£2sing 269, 29tt, spor 30 sx on top of CiCR
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Depth 2.492' 10.016' 9,808' - 12,926' Top of Green River@ 5,478'
Critinfû 7305.< 4505< 5505.<

6.2 76
6.184

Cãisin.g ID 8.921 6.094 4.276
6.151
6.059

DrÍft ID 8.765 5.969 4.151
TOC@S,430' CBLd/83

Pfag #1: CfBP @ B,800'w/ 200'emt on top
LGR Recorn - Mar'DB

8,628' -9.17S'l38'l117 shotsþ
5.DOO gals 15% HCL

50.000#20.740(entsandduefoliighTP) P-7742.à CiBP@9.670'w/12'emtontop-Mart.79
3,293' - 9.828'l48'I144 shotsþ

5.DOO gals 15% HC L Top of 5" firier @S,809"
f 60,000# 20/40

7", 28#,29#, 32# N-80 @ id,018"
--- (26#: surf-·-3.078'; 29#: -3, 978'-

New Wasatch Perfs - .ALrg ' 85 --6 542'; 32# from --6.542'-10,016'l

10,056' - f0,730' (33'/99 hofea) - - Top of Wasatch iB (0,312'
20.000 gad f5% NCf - -

CIBP ::g: 10,750'- .Aug '86

[9.0519'- .li ?i2',58' 174 .bolesi

19 900'Ja.I r5 H.

Original Wasatch Completion - April W3
10,796' -12,842' 73't219 holes

20,000 gal 15% HCI -
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TD @f2,927" 5", 18# P-110 @ f2,828'
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Tubular Data 

 

 
Plug & Abandonment Procedure 

• Testing tubing, use workstring and use CIBP/CICR as per Magna’s recommendation.  
 

1. Notify Dan Jarvis w/ UDOGM @ 801-538-5338 and BLM of P&A operations at least 24 hours 
prior to start of well work (See Contact List). 

2. MIRU workover rig.  RU Hot Oil Unit and pump hot water down 2-7/8” tbg to heat up tubing.  
Unseat pump and flush tubing & rods with hot water. POOH w/rods & pump.   

3. Send pump in for inspection & rebuild. ND tree and NU and test BOP’s to 5,000# for 10 
minutes. Have test recorded and charted to be signed and dated by well site supervisor. 
Record BOP serial number. 

4. Release tubing anchor at ~8,424’ and POOH w/ 265 jts 2-7/8” tbg, scanning for tubing for 
wear. Lay out all bad joints. Check for NORM (*If no NORM is found, note it in the daily report; 
If NORM is found in the tubing; Follow EP Energy procedures and chain of custody paperwork 
for handling, wrapping and transporting NORM tubing to a proper cleaning or disposal site). 

5. MIRU E-line, RIH w/ GR (check min setting OD on CICR/CIBP to be ran) to 8,630’, if tag reach 
8,630’ then processed to Step 7, otherwise continue with procedure. RD E-line 

6. PU 5-7/8” RB, 7” 32# casing scraper, 2 x 3 ½” drill collars on 2 7/8” tubing (or 2-3/8 
workstring). Work down to ~8,630 and attempt to establish circ with FSW, circ until returns 
clean.  POOH.  If perforations take fluid on way in, mix a 10 bbl HEC pill and circulate around 
or spot as needed.   

 

 
Plug #1  

7. PU & MU a 7”- (32#) mechanical set CIBP (or CICR) on tubing (or workstring) and TIH to 
±8,600’. Set CIBP @ ±8,600 (above top of perfs @ 8,628’). Get off of CIBP & establish 
circulation. 

8. Mix cement plug with ±48sacks (±9bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a ±200’ 
balanced cement plug from 7,650’ to 7,450’ on top of the CIBP

9. PU above cement and Reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to 
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.  

. 

10. Run back in and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston. 

Material Description Burst 
(100%) 

Col 
(100%) 

ID Drift 
ID 

Capacity 
(bbl/ft) 

TOC 

Surface  
Casing 

  9-5/8", 36#, J-55, @ 2,492' 3520 2020 8.921 8.765 0.0773 Surface 
 

Intermediate 
Casing 

  7", 26#,29#, 32# N-80 @ 10,016' 
(26#: surf- ~3,078'; 29#:~3,078'-

~6,542'; 32# from ~6,542'-10,016') 

7240 
8160 
8460 

5410 
7020 
8600 

6.276 
6.184 
6.094 

6.151 
6.059 
5.969 

0.0383 
0.0371 
0.0361 

TOC @ 8,430' 
(CBL 4/83) 

Production 
Liner 

5", 18# P-110 @  9,808'  - 12,926' 10140 10490 4.276 4.151 0.0177 TOL 
 

Production  
Tubing 

2-7/8” 6.5# N-80 8rd  10570 11160 2.441 2.347 0.0058 N/A 

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

Tubular Data
Material Description Burst Col ID Drift Capacity TOC

(100%) (100%) ID (bbl/ft)
Surface 9-5/8", 36#, J-55, @ 2,492' 3520 2020 8.921 8.765 0.0773 Surface
Casing
Intermediate 7", 26#,29#, 32# N-80 @ 10,016' 7240 5410 6.276 6.151 0.0383 TOC @ 8,430'
Casing (26#: surf- ~3,078'; 29#:~3,078'- 8160 7020 6.184 6.059 0.0371 (CBL 4/83)

~6,542'; 32# from ~6,542'-10,016') 8460 8600 6.094 5.969 0.0361
Production 5", 18# P-110 @ 9,808' - 12,926' 10140 10490 4.276 4.151 0.0177 TOL
Liner
Production 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 8rd 10570 11160 2.441 2.347 0.0058 N/A
Tubinq

Pluq & Abandonment Procedure

• Testing tubing, use workstring and use CIBP/CICR as per Magna's recommendation.

1. Notify Dan Jarvis w/ UDOGM @ 801-538-5338 and BLM of P&A operations at least 24 hours
prior to start of well work (See Contact List).

2. MIRU workover rig. RU Hot Oil Unit and pump hot water down 2-7/8" tbg to heat up tubing.
Unseat pump and flush tubing& rods with hot water. POOH w/rods & pump.

3. Send pump in for inspection & rebuild. ND tree and NU and test BOP's to 5,000# for 10
minutes. Have test recorded and charted to be signed and dated by well site supervisor.
Record BOP serial number.

4. Release tubing anchor at ~8,424' and POOH w/ 265 jts 2-7/8" tbg, scanning for tubing for
wear. Lay out all bad joints. Check for NORM (*lfno NORM is found, note it in the daily report;
If NORM is found in the tubing;Follow EP Energy procedures and chain of custody paperwork
for handling, wrapping and transportingNORM tubingto a proper cleaning or disposal site).

5. MIRU E-line, RIH w/ GR (check min setting OD on CICR/CIBP to be ran) to 8,630', if tag reach
8,630' then processed to Step 7, otherwise continue with procedure. RD E-line

6. PU 5-7/8" RB, 7" 32# casing scraper, 2 x 3 ½" drill collars on 2 7/8" tubing (or 2-3/8
workstring). Work down to ~8,630 and attempt to establish circ with FSW, circ until returns
clean. POOH. If perforations take fluid on way in, mix a 10 bbl HEC pill and circulate around
or spot as needed.

Pluq #1

7. PU & MU a 7"- (32#) mechanical set CIBP (or CICR) on tubing (or workstring) and TlH to
±8,600'. Set CIBP @ ±8,600 (above top of perfs @ 8,628'). Get off of CIBP & establish
circulation.

8. Mix cement plug with ±48sacks (±9bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a ±200'
balanced cement plug from 7,650' to 7,450' on top of the CIBP.

9. PU above cement and Reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

10.Run back in and tag plug. Iftag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston.
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Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

Tubular Data
Material Description Burst Col ID Drift Capacity TOC

(100%) (100%) ID (bbl/ft)
Surface 9-5/8", 36#, J-55, @ 2,492' 3520 2020 8.921 8.765 0.0773 Surface
Casing
Intermediate 7", 26#,29#, 32# N-80 @ 10,016' 7240 5410 6.276 6.151 0.0383 TOC @ 8,430'
Casing (26#: surf- ~3,078'; 29#:~3,078'- 8160 7020 6.184 6.059 0.0371 (CBL 4/83)

~6,542'; 32# from ~6,542'-10,016') 8460 8600 6.094 5.969 0.0361
Production 5", 18# P-110 @ 9,808' - 12,926' 10140 10490 4.276 4.151 0.0177 TOL
Liner
Production 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 8rd 10570 11160 2.441 2.347 0.0058 N/A
Tubinq

Pluq & Abandonment Procedure

• Testing tubing, use workstring and use CIBP/CICR as per Magna's recommendation.

1. Notify Dan Jarvis w/ UDOGM @ 801-538-5338 and BLM of P&A operations at least 24 hours
prior to start of well work (See Contact List).

2. MIRU workover rig. RU Hot Oil Unit and pump hot water down 2-7/8" tbg to heat up tubing.
Unseat pump and flush tubing& rods with hot water. POOH w/rods & pump.

3. Send pump in for inspection & rebuild. ND tree and NU and test BOP's to 5,000# for 10
minutes. Have test recorded and charted to be signed and dated by well site supervisor.
Record BOP serial number.

4. Release tubing anchor at ~8,424' and POOH w/ 265 jts 2-7/8" tbg, scanning for tubing for
wear. Lay out all bad joints. Check for NORM (*lfno NORM is found, note it in the daily report;
If NORM is found in the tubing;Follow EP Energy procedures and chain of custody paperwork
for handling, wrapping and transportingNORM tubingto a proper cleaning or disposal site).

5. MIRU E-line, RIH w/ GR (check min setting OD on CICR/CIBP to be ran) to 8,630', if tag reach
8,630' then processed to Step 7, otherwise continue with procedure. RD E-line

6. PU 5-7/8" RB, 7" 32# casing scraper, 2 x 3 ½" drill collars on 2 7/8" tubing (or 2-3/8
workstring). Work down to ~8,630 and attempt to establish circ with FSW, circ until returns
clean. POOH. If perforations take fluid on way in, mix a 10 bbl HEC pill and circulate around
or spot as needed.

Pluq #1

7. PU & MU a 7"- (32#) mechanical set CIBP (or CICR) on tubing (or workstring) and TlH to
±8,600'. Set CIBP @ ±8,600 (above top of perfs @ 8,628'). Get off of CIBP & establish
circulation.

8. Mix cement plug with ±48sacks (±9bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a ±200'
balanced cement plug from 7,650' to 7,450' on top of the CIBP.

9. PU above cement and Reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

10.Run back in and tag plug. Iftag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston.
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11. Test casing & plug to 1,000# watch for leak off for 15 min. Report to Houston if casing doesn’t 
test. 

12. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 5,450’. POOH 
 

 
Plug #2 

13. RU E-line; PU & MU a perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to ±5,450’; Pressure up to 
500psig on casing and perforate casing at ±5,450’ (above Top of Green River Formation @ 
5,478’); POOH. RD ELU. 

14. PU & MU a 7”- (29#) mechanical set cement retainer on tubing (or work-string); TIH to ±5,400’; 
Set cement retainer @ 5,400’ (Set 50’ above perfs); Establish circulation or injection into 
perforations. If sufficient injection rate can be established proceed with procedure, otherwise 
contact Houston office for instructions. 

15. Mix and circulate a ±200’ In-Out cement plug with ±98 sacks (±18bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield 
Class G cement. Pump (±12bbls)(50’+ 200’outside annulus) below the cement retainer. Sting 
out of the cement retainer; Lay in the remaining balanced cement plug, (±6bbls)(150’) on top of 
the cement retainer

16. Run back in and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston 

. TOOH with tubing until above cement and Circulate the hole clean; WOC; 
Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up. 

17. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 2,650’. POOH 
 
 

18. MIRU E-line. PU & MU 7” jet-cutter assembly; Test lubricator to 250psig/3000psig; RIH to 
±2,600’; Pressure up to 500psig on casing and jet cut 7” casing at ±2,600’(~108’ below surface 
casing shoe @ 2,492’); POOH. RD ELU. 

19. Establish circulation down the 7” and up the 7” by 9-5/8” annulus. 
20. RU 7” casing handling equipment; PU & MU casing spear on tbg; Land and set the 7” csg 

spear. 
21. POOH & LD 2,600’ of 7” csg. 
22. Check for Norm. 

 

 
Plug #3 

23. RIH open ended w/ workstring to 2,650’. 
24. Mix cement plug with ±242 sacks (±45bbls)

25. PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to 
determine when the cement has set up. WOC. 

 of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a 
±400’ balanced cement plug from 2,650’ to 2,250’ (across surface casing shoe @ 2,492’). 

26. Run back in and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston. 
27. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 150’. 

 

 
Plug #4 

28. RIH open ended to 150’. Mix and circulate a ±150’ balanced cement plug from 150’ to surface 
with ±62 sacks (±12bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Pump cement from surface 

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

11.Test casing & plug to 1,000# watch for leak off for 15 min. Report to Houston if casing doesn't
test.

12. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 5,450'. POOH

Pluq #2

13.RU E-line; PU & MU a perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to ±5,450'; Pressure up to
500psig on casing and perforate casing at ±5,450' (above Top of Green River Formation @
5,478'); POOH. RD ELU.

14.PU & MU a 7"- (29#) mechanical set cement retainer on tubing(or work-string); TlH to ±5,400';
Set cement retainer @ 5,400' (Set 50' above perfs); Establish circulation or injection into
perforations. If sufficient injection rate can be established proceed with procedure, otherwise
contact Houston office for instructions.

15. Mix and circulate a ±200' In-Out cement plug with ±98 sacks (±18bbls)of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield
Class G cement. Pump (±12bbls)(50'+ 200'outside annulus) below the cement retainer. Sting
out of the cement retainer; Lay in the remaining balanced cement plug, (±6bbls)(150') on top of
the cement retainer. TOOH with tubinguntil above cement and Circulate the hole clean; WOC;
Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

16.Run back in and tag plug. Iftag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston
17. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 2,650'. POOH

18.MIRU E-line. PU & MU 7" jet-cutter assembly; Test lubricator to 250psig/3000psig; RIH to
±2,600'; Pressure up to 500psig on casing and jet cut 7" casing at ±2,600'(~108' below surface
casing shoe @2,492'); POOH. RD ELU.

19.Establish circulation down the 7" and up the 7" by 9-5/8" annulus.
20.RU 7" casing handling equipment; PU & MU casing spear on tbg; Land and set the 7" csg

spear.
21.POOH & LD 2,600' of 7" csg.
22. Check for Norm.

Pluq #3

23.RIH open ended w/ workstring to 2,650'.
24. Mix cement plug with ±242 sacks (±45bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a

±400' balanced cement plug from 2,650' to 2,250' (across surface casing shoe @2,492').
25.PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to

determine when the cement has set up. WOC.
26.Run back in and tag plug. Iftag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston.
27. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 150'.

Pluq #4

28.RIH open ended to 150'. Mix and circulate a ±150' balanced cement plug from 150' to surface
with ±62 sacks (±12bbls)of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Pump cement from surface
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Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

11.Test casing & plug to 1,000# watch for leak off for 15 min. Report to Houston if casing doesn't
test.

12. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 5,450'. POOH

Pluq #2

13.RU E-line; PU & MU a perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to ±5,450'; Pressure up to
500psig on casing and perforate casing at ±5,450' (above Top of Green River Formation @
5,478'); POOH. RD ELU.

14.PU & MU a 7"- (29#) mechanical set cement retainer on tubing(or work-string); TlH to ±5,400';
Set cement retainer @ 5,400' (Set 50' above perfs); Establish circulation or injection into
perforations. If sufficient injection rate can be established proceed with procedure, otherwise
contact Houston office for instructions.

15. Mix and circulate a ±200' In-Out cement plug with ±98 sacks (±18bbls)of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield
Class G cement. Pump (±12bbls)(50'+ 200'outside annulus) below the cement retainer. Sting
out of the cement retainer; Lay in the remaining balanced cement plug, (±6bbls)(150') on top of
the cement retainer. TOOH with tubinguntil above cement and Circulate the hole clean; WOC;
Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

16.Run back in and tag plug. Iftag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston
17. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 2,650'. POOH

18.MIRU E-line. PU & MU 7" jet-cutter assembly; Test lubricator to 250psig/3000psig; RIH to
±2,600'; Pressure up to 500psig on casing and jet cut 7" casing at ±2,600'(~108' below surface
casing shoe @2,492'); POOH. RD ELU.

19.Establish circulation down the 7" and up the 7" by 9-5/8" annulus.
20.RU 7" casing handling equipment; PU & MU casing spear on tbg; Land and set the 7" csg

spear.
21.POOH & LD 2,600' of 7" csg.
22. Check for Norm.

Pluq #3

23.RIH open ended w/ workstring to 2,650'.
24. Mix cement plug with ±242 sacks (±45bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a

±400' balanced cement plug from 2,650' to 2,250' (across surface casing shoe @2,492').
25.PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to

determine when the cement has set up. WOC.
26.Run back in and tag plug. Iftag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston.
27. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to 150'.

Pluq #4

28.RIH open ended to 150'. Mix and circulate a ±150' balanced cement plug from 150' to surface
with ±62 sacks (±12bbls)of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Pump cement from surface
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until cement returns up the backside. POOH. With 1 jt left, circ around fresh water @ top 5’. 
WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up. 

29. RU casing cutting equipment;  Cut the remaining casing at ≥3’below GL  
30. Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the following

 

:  

31. RD&MO rig & clean up location 
32. Restore location as directed 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

1. Well Name:   Brown 2-28B5 
2. Operator Name :   EP Energy 
3. API Number:   43-013-30718    
4. Location:    NE/4 SW/4 – Sec 28, T 2 S, R 5 W  

 

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

until cement returns up the backside. POOH. With 1 jt left, circ around fresh water @ top 5'.
WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

29.RU casing cutting equipment; Cut the remaining casing at >3'below GL
30.Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the followinq:

1. Well Name: Brown 2-28B5

2. Operator Name : EP Energy

3. API Number: 43-013-30718

4. Location: NE/4 SWl4 - Sec 28, T 2 S, R 5 W

31.RD&MO rig & clean up location
32.Restore location as directed

6

RECEIVED: Jul. 17,

Sundry Number: 40167 API Well Number: 43013307180000

EP A
7/8/2013

until cement returns up the backside. POOH. With 1 jt left, circ around fresh water @ top 5'.
WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

29.RU casing cutting equipment; Cut the remaining casing at >3'below GL
30.Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the followinq:

1. Well Name: Brown 2-28B5

2. Operator Name : EP Energy

3. API Number: 43-013-30718

4. Location: NE/4 SWl4 - Sec 28, T 2 S, R 5 W

31.RD&MO rig & clean up location
32.Restore location as directed
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September 4, 2014 

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7011 29700001 8828 1627 

Ms. Maria Gomez 
EP Energy E&P Company, LP. 
1001 Louisiana 
Houston, TX 77002 

L-\ '3 c)r~ :-x5ll ~ 
'byuwn '2-26&5 
L~~ '2<' -j "\ ..J '::> f.A-.l 

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases 

Dear Ms. Gomez: 

As of April 2014, EP Energy E&P Company, LP (EP) has twenty-seven (27) Fee Lease 
Wells (see attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for 
extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SIITA) status. Two (2) wells in 2013 and four (4) 
wells in 2014 were added to EP's SIITA list. 

The Division has worked with EP for many years to reduce the immense number of wells 
that were in non-compliance status. The Division feels that EP's SIITA list is now at a 
manageable number; therefore all wells need to be addressed. 

EP has a number of wells that were proposed for plugging (attachment A) but have not 
been plugged. Additionally, four (4) wells were inspected and reported as plugged by Division 
inspectors, but EP has failed to file subsequent plugging sundries and consequently are still listed 
as SIITA (attachment A). 

It has also come to the Division's attention that there are unresolved complaints against 
EP from landowners concerning spills and site access. Specifically with reference to the 
Christensen 3-4B4, pictures showing the state of the well were sent to the Division; it appears 
that this well is nowhere near being capable of production. This is cause for concern which 
needs to be addressed. 

EP shall immediately submit plans and timeframes for each well stating which wells will 
be plugged, placed back on production, or requesting SIlT A extension with proof of well bore 
integrity and good cause for such request. All wells need an individual sundry filed and are 
required to meet the SIITA rules as listed below. 

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801 
telephone (801) 538-5340. facsimile (801) 359-3940. TTY (801) 538-7458. www.ogm.ulah.gov 

OIL, GAS & MINING 

, State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R.HERBERT .
ExecutiveDiœctor

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director
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CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7011 2970 0001 8828 1627

Ms. Maria Gomez og
EP Energy E&P Company, LP.
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Gomez:

As of April 2014, EP Energy E&P Company, LP (EP) has twenty-seven (27) Fee Lease
Wells (see attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for
extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. Two (2) wells in 2013 and four (4)
wells in 2014 were added to EP's SI/TA list.

The Division has worked with EP for many years to reduce the immense number of wells
that were in non-compliance status. The Division feels that EP's SI/TA list is now at a
manageable number; therefore all wells need to be addressed.

EP has a number of wells that were proposed for plugging (attachment A) but have not
been plugged. Additionally, four (4) wells were inspected and reported as plugged by Division
inspectors, but EP has failed to file subsequent plugging sundries and consequently are still listed
as SI/TA (attachment A).

It has also come to the Division's attention that there are unresolved complaints against
EP from landowners concerning spills and site access. Specifically with reference to the
Christensen 3-4B4, pictures showing the state of the well were sent to the Division; it appears
that this well is nowhere near being capable of production. This is cause for concern which
needs to be addressed.

EP shall immediately submit plans and timeframes for each well stating which wells will
be plugged, placed back on production, or requesting SI/TA extension with proof of wellbore
integrity and good cause for such request. All wells need an individual sundry filed and are
required to meet the SI/TA rules as listed below.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov
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EP Energy E&P Company, LP. 
September 4, 2014 

Wells SIITA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice 
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, 
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by 
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SIITA consideration the operator shall provide the 
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following: 

1. Reasons for SIITA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1) 
2. The length oftime the well is expected to be SIITA (R649-3-36-1.2), and 
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has 

integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level, 
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and 
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the 
environment (R649-3-36-1.3). 

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT 

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help 
qualify your well for extended SIITA. Note: As of July 1,2003, wells in violation ofthe SIffA 
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3). 

1. Wellbore diagram, and 
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and 
3. Current pressures on the well bore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and 

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and 
4. Fluid level in the well bore, and 
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity. 

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further 
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at 
(801) 538-5281. 

DKD/JP/js 

cc: Compliance File 
Well File 

Dustin K. Doucet 
Petroleum Engineer 

N :\O&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\SIT A 
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EP Energy E&P Company, LP.
September 4, 2014

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) Years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1)
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has

integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js

cc: Compliance File
Well File

N:\O&G Reviewed



ATTACHMENT A 

Well Name API Years Inactive 

1 43-013-30019 

2 43-013-31142 FEE 5/10/2010 

3 43-047-30569 FEE 

4 43-047-30552 FEE 

5 43-013-31115 FEE 5/18/2007 

6 43-013-30110 FEE 

7 ERSON 1-2484 43-013-30229 FEE 

8 ERSON 1-33A4 43-013-30272 FEE 

9 43-013-31087 FEE 12/31/2012 

43-013-30012 FEE 
Needs 

11 uent 9119/2013 
Needs 

15 43-013-30917 FEE 8 months 

16 43-013-31289 FEE 9 months 

17 11 months 

18 6 months 

19 6/1/2014 

20 43-013-31008 FEE 3 months 

21 43-013-31320 FEE 8 months 

22 43-013-30884 FEE 3 months 

23 43-013-34280 FEE 7 months 

24 43-013-30907 FEE r2 months 

25 43-013-31172 FEE 2 months 

26 43-013-30782 FEE r 11 months 

27 1-1683 3-30617 FEE r 8 months 

ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive Proposed PA Plugged
Needs

1 CEDAR RIM 2 43-013-30019 FEE 12 years 7 months subsequent 7/17/2013

2 CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 43-013-31142 FEE 5/10/2010

3 DRY GULCH 1-36A1 43-047-30569 FEE R
4 LARSEN 1-25A1 43-047-30552 FEE -
5 FARSWORTH 2-12B5 43-013-31115 FEE 10 ears 5 months 5/18/2007

6 BROTHERSON 1-10B4 43-013-30110 FEE R
7 BROTHERSON 1-24B4 43-013-30229 FEE M
8 BROTHERSON 1-33A4 43-013-30272 FEE M
9 MILES 2-35A4 43-013-31087 FEE M 12/31/2012

10 SMB 1-10A2 43-013-30012 FEE 4 years 8 months
Needs

11 RUST 1-4B3 43-013-30063 FEE 4 years 7 months subsequent 9/19/2013
Needs

12 SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 43-013-30543 FEE 4 years 9 months subsequent 12/4/2013
13 VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 43-013-30553 FEE 4 years 9 months

14 BROWN 2-28B5 43-013-30718 FEE 4 years 3 months
Needs

15 HANSUKUTT 2-23B5 43-013-30917 FEE 4 years 8 months subsequent 10/24/2013
16 BROTHERSON 3-23B4 43-013-31289 FEE 4 years 9 months
17 BROTHERSON 1-14B4 43-013-30051 FEE 3 years 11 months
18 BROTHERSON 2-3B4 43-013-31008 FEE 3 years 6 months
19 POWELL 2-33A3 43-013-30704 FEE 3 years 1 month 6/1/2014
20 BROTHERSON 2-3B4 43-013-31008 FEE 3 years 3 months
21 DASTRUP 2-30A3 43-013-31320 FEE 3 years 8 months
22 R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 43-013-30884 FEE 2 years 3 months

23 HORROCKS 5-20A1 43-013-34280 FEE 4 years 7 months
24 BELCHER 2-33B4 43-013-30907 FEE 1 year 2 months
25 CEDAR RIM 2A 43-013-31172 FEE 2 years 2 months
26 EULA-UTE 1-16A1 43-013-30782 FEE 1 year 11 months
27 HANSEN 1-16B3 43-013-30617 FEE 1 year 8



RECEIVED: Oct. 13, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BROWN 2-28B5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013307180000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1777 FSL 1413 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 28 Township: 02.0S Range: 05.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

11 /6 /2013

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

CIBP @ 8580'. Pumped 41sx TOC @ 8407'. Pressure tested casing 1000 psi for 15 min & held. Perf csg
@ 5450'. EIJ. CICR @ 5384' pumped 100sx (65 into & 35 on top). TOC 5220'. Cut window in 9 5/8. Cut
off 7" csg and weld window back on 9 5/8. Cut csg @ 2550'Pumped 200sx BP @ 2634' TOC @ 2569'.
Pumped 140 sx TOC @ 2639'. Pumped 60 sx TOC @ 2247'. TIH to 156' & pumped 84 sx BP & top off.

Cut off wellhead & welded marker plate.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/13/2014

Sundry Number: 56667 API Well Number: 43013307180000



RECEIVED: Oct. 13, 2014

Sundry Number: 56667 API Well Number: 43013307180000
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Sundry Number: 56667 API Well Number: 43013307180000
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Sundry Number: 56667 API Well Number: 43013307180000
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Sundry Number: 56667 API Well Number: 43013307180000



RECEIVED: Oct. 13, 2014

Sundry Number: 56667 API Well Number: 43013307180000
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