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FORM 0GC-la SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATES*
(Other instructions on

| THE STATE OF UTAH reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERV. ATTON $. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO,
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK | & ™ ™?ux 4uLorren on maise Naxs
la. TYPE OF WORK N/A
DRILL X DEEPEN [] PLUG BACK [] | * ©ri Acsmxumar Niaxs
b TYPE OF WELL
R Wity OTHER ZoNe rons o [X] 8. FABM OR L¥ASR NAME
2. NAME OF OPERATOR LIN:MAR"HANSEN
LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION . o 9. WELL No.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR : ) 1-16 B3
1670 BROADWAY, SUITE 3025, DENVER, COLORADO 80202 10. ';“ﬁ” AND w?'" OB WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location cleurly and in accordancé wlm an& State requirements.*) .
At surf'aae ' e\ WASATCH
1760" FWL, 2088' FSL, SECTION 16, T2S}’ RBW USM UL@ggg co. 11gg;;u"!ogggf
At proposed prod. zone £ g M/ ' {f\(\, ,
SAME /V SEC 16, T2S, R3W, USM
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICK® - TS 12, COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. B8TATE
4 MILES NORTHEAST OF BLUEBELL, UTAH R DUCHESNE | - uTAH
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED?® 16. NOo. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRKS ABSIGONED
LOCATION TO NEAREST - TO THIS WELL
s ot N T v anyy /A N/A . 640
18. g:}sga&(;sn sl'rx‘R(v)‘vaTv:ogg‘sLE;gsxc ?(.:é‘(;r.\‘ﬂ*’{;:nn, FIRST WELL. 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
OR APPLIED FOR, ON THIS LEASE, FT. 13,000 ROTARY
21. ELEVATiONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete,) 22, APPROX. DATE WORK WILL START®
5,975"' GL . NOVEMBER 1, 1981
28 PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING - |» WEIGHT PER ir(;o'r SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT .
30" 20" 52.73 80! 175 SACKS TO SURFACE
12-1/4" 9-5/8" : 36.00 2,500’ 500 SACKS TO SURFACE
8-3/4" 7" 26, 29, 32 10,100' 600 SACKS TO 7,500’
6" 5" 18 13,000’ 700 SACKS TO TOP LINER
TUBING 1 2-7/8" 6.5 10,150

LINMAR PLANS TO USE A DRY HOLE DIGGER AND DRTLI TO APPROXIMATELY 80' AND SET THE 20"
CONDUCTOR CASING. A ROTARY DRILLING RIG WILL THEN BE MOVED IN AND DRILLING WILL RESUME
WITH A 12-1/4" HOLE TO 2,500' WHERE THE 9-5/8" SURFACE CASING WILL BE SET. AN 8-3/4"
HOLE WILL THEN BE DRILLED TO 10,100' ‘AND THE 7" CASING WILL BE SET AND CEMENTED. DIAMOND
BITS WILL THEN BE USED TO DRILL TO 13,000' WHERE THE 5" LINER WILL BE SET AND CEMENTED.
THE ROTARY DRILLING RIG WILL BE MOVED OFF AND A COMPLETION RIG WILL BE MOVED ON. THE
WELL WILL BE SELECTIVELY PERFORATED AND ACIDIZED AND THEN PLACED ON PRODUCTION AS AN OTL
WELL. THE PRODUCTION FACILITIES WILL BE CONSTRUCTED DURING THE DRILLING OPERATIONS.

SAFETY EQUIPMENT PROGRAM IS SHOWN ON ATTACHED DIAGRAMS.

' IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive sone and proposed new productive
- zone, If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertlcal depths. Give blowout

preventer program, If any.

24.
SIGNED e LT TITLB PRESIDENT DATE 10-26-81 !
ATET rivd
" (This space for Feder or State office use)/
PERMIT NO. APPROVAL DATE
APPROVED BY TITLD

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY !

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
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T2S, R3W, U.SM.

801 .48

1760 "'

~®

WELL LOCATION
Elev. Ungraded Ground - 5975’

2088

80].36

PROJECT

_LINMAR ENERGY

Well location as shown in the
NE!/4 SW1/4, Section 16, T2 S,
R3 W, U.S.M. Duchesne County,
Utah.

CERTIFICATE

THIS 1S YO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD WOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY -ME OR  UNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF,/,//

-

REGISTRATION N2 3137
STATE OF UTAH

REGISTERED LAND SURVE¥OR._

e

~

X = Section Corners Located

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

PO BOX Q ~ 85 SOUTH - 200 EAST
VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SCALE 1. 000" DATE 10/16/81
PARTY DA, JK,KR JH REFERENCES GLO PLAT
WEATHER ‘ FILE

CLOUDY/ WARM LINMAR
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LINMAR ENERGY

LOCATION

PROPOSED |
VSEC. b, Tzs, B3W, USM

ROAD CLASSIFICATION

Light-duty........

Medium-duty .. ...

Unimproved dint

RBEEBDT I WS

O State Route

* QUADRANGLE LOCATION
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B30OPRP STACK

KELLY (with upper and lower kelly cock,
3000 psi)

[ ROTARY TABLE ]

/1
HYDRIL 3 s5/8" 5000 psi)
- TN
[ RLIND RAMS J
p— DOUBLE GATE (13 5/8" 5000 psi

( PIPE RAMS - '

D I CHOKEE LINE " 5000 psi

—_—
—_——

(L f =41
LINE 2" ! |

FUIPED WITE A KOOUEY 160 GALLON, 390 PSI, FIVE STATION ACCIMULATOR
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setting suriace pipe.

to 1500 psi prior to drilling out

shoe,

£11 =zusillary 20PE will be fested

X

are tested. (Ilanifold, ugper and

ICP's)
After

drilling the shee,

equivalent mud weizht of 14.0 £/Ga1,




** FILE NOTATIONS **

DATE: _enr. 2,/ g5/

OPERATOR: 5/ oman,  Convz gag. Cop.

WELL NO:_/yon motan - ﬁMA{(#/ /Ll 53
Location: Sec. [{p T. 25 R. 31/ County: Z) /Acﬁcang

File Prepared: E/ Entened on N.1.D: ZF/
Card Indexed: Completion Sheet: y

APT Number 43 -0/3-3 O ()7

CHECKED BY:

Petroleum Engineer:

Director: ﬂé( g 5}\'% m/z&q /3/"/7/

Administrative Aide LD"&&.Q.&ML:IJ-.

APPROVAL LETTER:
Bond Required: Su/wey PLat Required: _/_ /
Onden No. A3)-44, ¥-1{-7/ 0.K. Rule C-3

Rule C-3(c), Topogfcaph,ca Exceplion - company owns or contrhols acreage
within a 660" radius of proposed site

Lease Designation ﬁ‘eL7 Plotted on Mapf /

. Approval Letten Written i /
Hot Line i 7 ﬁ



November 12, 1981

Linmar Energy Corporation
1670 Broadway, STE. #3025
Denver, Colo. 80202

RE: Well No. Linmar-Hansen #1-16B3,
Sec. 16, T. 25, R. 3kp
Duchesne County, Utah

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to ofl well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued
in Cause No. 131-14, dated August 11, 1971.

Should you determine that 1t will be necessary to plug and abandon
this well, you are hereby requested to immediately notify the following:

MICHAEL T. MINDER - Petroleum Engineer
Office: 533-5771
Home: 876-3001
Enclosed please find Form 0GC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water sands (acquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation in completing this form will be appreciated.

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24 hours
after drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor and rig
number be identified.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30617.
Sincerely,
DIVISION OF_Q;;. GAS AND MINING

Py, ) / / /
yr ”. ?/i}’wz/
Cleon B. Feight
Director i

CBF/db
CC:QGM



, Form 0GC-3 T’ SUBMIT IN DQTTE*
. (See other ix o hs
o STA JTAH ON TEVEFSE: 51T )

R DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

56 64 01.

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND S8ERIAL NO,

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG*

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

N/A

7. UNIT ACREEMENT NAME

ia. TYPE OF WELL: o1, GAS D
WELL WELL DRY Other
b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NEW WORIK DEEP- PLOG DIFF.
WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR. Other

2. NAME OF QPERATOR

Linmar Energy Corporation Afiﬁ&ﬁm

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR /‘g \E‘
SN

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requireufgls) *5g>

Atsurface 1760' FWL, 2088' FSL, Section 16, T2S,

§. FARM OR LEASE NAMEK

Linmar-Hansen

9. WELL No,

1-16 B3

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

Al tanmont-Hasedsek

i1. sEC., T., R.,, M., OK BLOCK AND SURVEY
OR AREA

At top prod. interval reported below (/£ S w Duchesne Coun¥Fgif '93 &
Same . Y N <(€§§
At total depth Same Y3-0/3-30U/ “-'53 Q sxSec. 16, T25, R3W, USM
14. PERMIT NO. . S ~ eh-12. COUNTY OR 13. STATE
ﬁ ) PARISH
_ | '121§§l Duchesne Utah
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED | 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready to PC EL“ATXO@ B, RT, GR, ETC.)* | 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD
11-16-81 1-19-82 3-30-82 5,975 Same
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. 1¥ MULTIPLE COMPL,, 23. Q&gyfnvALs ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY* ngu,zn BY
13,141" 13,104" N/A =~ X I
24, PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION—TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)®* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADNM
Wasatch, 11,864' to 13,005' NO
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN Sl 27. WAS WELL CORED
_.FDC, CNLYDIL, GR, SP, CALIPER --> O
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./¥T. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
9-5/8" 364 2,484' 125" To sfc. w/800 sacks N/A
7" 26,29,324% 10,002 8-3/4" 500 sacks N/A
29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
81Z% TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT® SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
5" 9,774' ' 13,141" | 565 sxs. - 2-7/8" 10,100" 10,100
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number) 32, ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
See Attached DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED
11,864'-13,005"' | 30,000 gals. 15% HCl acid in
20 stages,
33.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—size and type of pump) WELL 8TATUS (Producing or
3_30_82 Fl . shut-in) ,
owlng Producing
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OIL—BBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD
3~-30-82 24 20/64" — ] 1563 ' 1500 , 399 960
FLOW, TUBING PRESS. | CASING PRESSURE g;_xggg:'r:gﬂ OIL—BBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)
1800 -0~ —> | e | | 42.3
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) K TEST WITNESSED BY
Sold Ed Whicker

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Perforhtion Record . /) )
ttac

36. I hereby frtityoye foregot aén/d d ihformation is complete and correct as determined from all avatlable records
SIGNED ‘= bt 4 8 DATE 4/23/82

John W. CIarK Vice President

*(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)
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LINMAR HANSEN 1-16 B3
LOWER INTERVAL PERFORATIONS

TWO JET SHOTS PER FOOT 2/22/82

11,864-66 2) 12,716 (1)

11,874~76 (2) 12,718 (1) '

11,946-48 (2) 12,720 (1)

11,918-26 (8) 12,761-66 (5)

11,963-65 (2) 12,824-26 (2)
. 11,985 (1) ’ 12,829-31 (2)

12,050-52 (2) 12,840 (1)

12,082 (1) 12,846 (1)

12,084 (1) 12,852 (1)

12,086 (1) 12,899-12,901  (2)

12,088 (1) 12,906-08 (2)

12,093-96 (3) 12,916 (1)

12,130 (1) 12,950-52 (2)

12,132 (1) 12,966~68 (2)

12,238 (1) 12,999 (1)

12,240 (1) 13,001 (1)

12,242 (1) 13,005 (1)

12,244 (1 49 Zones 83 Ft./166 Holes.

12,280~82 (2)

12,288-92 (4)

12,332-34 (2)

12,352 (1)

12,377 (1)

12,456-58 (2)

12,479-81 (2)

12,554~58 (2)

12,634 (1)

12,649-51 (2)

12,678-80 (2)

12,710 (L

12,712 (1)

12,714 (1)
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Form OGC.1b

’STATE OF UTAH

*HT IN TRIPLICATES
PO ther instructions on

- B ?
‘ everse sile
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES e
Dlvls‘ON OF OIL, GAS' AND M'NING 5. LRASE bdEBIGNATION AND 3ERIAL NO.
8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTZD OR TRINE MNAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
‘D
e e e SA PR CROA o Sl or 1o deepen or P oot 0,8 diftereat reservolr. N/A
L 7. UMIT AGREEMENT NaMB
ol UAS D
WELL WELL d OTHER

2. NAMB OPF OPIRATOR

Linmar Energy Corporation

8. FARM OR LEASL NAMX

Linmar~Hansen

3. ADDRESZ OF OPEBRATOR

9. waLL NO.

1670 Broadway, Suite 3025, Denver, Colorado 80202 1-16 B3

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Rep
See 2120 space 17 below.)

At surface

1760'FWL, 2088' FSL, Section 16, T2S, R3W, USM,

Duchesne County, Utah

ort location clearly and \n accordance with any State requirements.*

10. FI2LD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

Altamont-Wasatch

11, sxC., T., R, M., OB BLE, AND
BURYNY OR ARDA

Sec. 16, T2S, R3W, USM

14, PERMIT No.

131-14

5,975"' GL

15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether o7, AT, GR, s )

12. COUNTY O PaRISH| 13, g8Tazs

Duchesne Utah

16.

TIST WATER SEUT-OFY

FRACTUREZ TREAT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE

REPAIR WELL

(Other)

Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

YOTICD OF INTENTION YO:

-

=

CUANGE PLANS

PULL OR ALTER CaSiNGC
MCULTIPLE COMPLETE ,
ABANDON®

AUBSRQURNT RIPORT OF:

WATER SHUT-OFP RETAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUONMENT®

(othery _Monthly Drilling

{NoTe: Report results of multiple completion on Weil
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17, DESCRIBE FPROPOSED OR CuUMIL
If well |

proposed work.
nent o this work.) *

3-1-82 to
3-29-82
3-30-82

ETED OPERATIONS (Cleurly stuate all pertinent details, and give pertinent datey, Including estimated date of starting any

s directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and trite vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

Flow test.
Acidize w/30,000 gals. 15% HC1 and test.

/)

(See Attached for Details.)

i
] i

o

18. 1 herwrtuy thye t !or/y(
SIGNED

Zﬂ///
/]

pate ___4/23/82

/-John W.

ClErk

ﬂd cofrpét
TITLE

Vice President

(This space/for Federal or State office use)

AP NY

BY

TITLE

DATE

Ciiovis.l 'S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side
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WELL: LINMAR-HANSEN 1~16 B3

s OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
LOCATION: SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
CONTRACTOR: PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E

OBJECTIVE ZONE: WASATCH FORMATION
ESTIMATED T.D.: 13,000

PAGE 11
3-9-82 - 7 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 550 TP, 348.7 BO, 49 BW, 420 MCFD.
3-10-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 525 TP, 343.8 BO, 42 BW, 420 MCFD.
3~11-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 525 TP, 353.6 BO, 54 BW, 422 MCFD.
3-12-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 500 TP, 354.7 BO, 30 BW, 422 MCFD.
3-13-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 500 TP, 331.6 BO, 6 BW, 428 MCFD.
3-14-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 500 TP, 337 BO, 6 BW, 439 MCFD.
3-15-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 500 TP, 332 BO, 6 BW, 417 MCFD.
3-16-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 475 TP, 344 BO, 7 BW, 379 MCFD.
3-17-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 500 TP, 303 BO, 35 BW, 368 MCFD.
3-18-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 490 TP, 308 BO, 54 BW, 341 MCFD.
3-19-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 500 TP, 309 BO, 80 BW, 388 MCFD.
3-20-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 480 TP, 288 BO, 79 BW, 324 MCFD.
3-21-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 490 TP, 289 BO, 90 BW, 336 MCFD.
3-22-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 475 TP, 295 BO, 96 BW, 336 MCFD.
3-23-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 475 TP, 228 BO, 86 BW, 336 MCFD.
3-24-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 275 TP, 291 BO, 109 BW, 299 MCFD.
3~-25-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 250 TP, 257 BO, 92 BW, 250 MCFD.
3-26-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 250 TP, 228 BO, 98 BW, 320 MCED.
3-27-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 230 TP, 258 BO, 104 BW, 274 MCFD.
3-28-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 350 TP, 263 BO, 108 BW, 275 MCFD.
3-29-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 250 TP, 219 BO, 93 BW, 275 MCFD.
3-30-82 Move in rig up Dowell. Nipple up tree favor. Increase casing pressure to

2500 psi. Acidize down tubing w/30% HC1 and 20,000 gals. formation water i
15 stages. Used 225 ball sealers (132% coverage) for diversions. All fluic
heated to 100 degrees (F) prior to pumping. Acid contained corrosion in-
hibitor and friction reducer. Water contained friction reducer (slick water
Maximum treating pressure 7800 psi. Average treating pressure 7000 psi.
Maximum rate 10 bpm. Average rate 9.5 bpm. Had good ball action. ISIP 53¢
psi, after 5 mins., SITP 3800 psi, 10 mins., 3500 psi, 15 mins, 3150 psi.
Nipple down tree favor. Rig down move off Dowell. Flow well to pit on 12/6
choke for 5 mins. Dislodged ball sealers from perforations. Shut in for 3C
mins. to allow ball sealers to drop to bottom. Open well to pit on 18/64"
choke. Flowed approximately 200 BW to pit in 2 hrs. Turned well to treater
at 2:00 p.m. Flowed 17 hrs. on 18/64" choke @ 2000 TP, 1071 BO, 300 BW, 144
MCFD. IP START @ 4:00 p.m. 3/29/82 to 4:00 p.m. 3/30/82.

DC: $53,900 CUOM: $199,519 .

3-31-82 Initial Production for first 24 hrs. 1,563 BO, 399 BW, 1500 MCF, FTP 1800 ps:

on 20/64" choke. Production for next 24 hrs., flowing on 20/64" choke @
1650 psi FTP, 1479 BO, 378 BW, 1661 MCFG.

4-1-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 1475 TP, 1217 BO, 378 BW, 1368 MCFD.

4-2-82 Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 1350 TP, 1079 BO, 288 BW, 1201 MCFD.
(Sold 667 MCF.)
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WELL:

~ OPERATOR:

LOCATION:
CONTRACTOR:
OBJECTIVE ZONE:
ESTIMATED T.D.:

. ‘ ' .\
5 !

LINMAR-HANSEN 1-16 B3

LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION

SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
WASATCH FORMATION

13,000'

PAGE 10

2=-17-82

2-18-82
2-19-82
2-20-82
2-21-82
2-22-82

2-23-82

2-24-82

2-25-82

2-26-82
2-27-82
2;28—82
3-1-82
3-2-82
3-3-82
3-4-82
3-5-82
3-6-82
3-7-82

3-8-82

Pick up Baker model FAB 30 seal assembly and run in hole w/326 joints
2-7/8" 6%# N-80 EUE tubing. Pick up (2) 10' pup joints. Sting into
packer @ 10,100'. Land tubing w/5000# tension. Pick up and run in hole.
w/121 joints 1%" NUE 1l0-round tubing (4005'). Land heat string and
wellhead. Nipple down BOP. Nipple up tree. Test tree to 5000 psi. w/
WKM. Test casing to 3000 psi w/tubing pressure = to 0. Test tubing,
tree, packer, and liner w/4500 psi. w/casing pressure - to 0. All CK.
Rig down move off surface unit. Released all rental tools.

DC: $33,911 CuM: $161,950

Shut in waiting on perforators. Plan to perforate 2/22/82.
Shut in waiting on perforators.

Shut in waiting on perforators.

loading perforation gun.

Loading perforation gun.

Move in rig up Dresser Atlas. Perforate 30 dual induction-Wasatch interval:
from 12,288-13,005', using 2" premium charge hollow carrier gun w/2 jspf.
Choke open to 10/64" while perforating and flow line disconnected at well-
head. After perforating 12,852-53', well started flowing slowly. Perforat:
at 12,761-66' increased flow to an estimated 30 BOPD. Perforating at
12,288-92', increased flow to an estimated 75 BOPD. 19 intervals remain to
be perforated. Shut in for night.

DC: $600 CuM: $128,619

24 hrs. SITP 3700 psi. Open well to treater on 18/64" choke. Bled tubing
pressure to 1000 psi and ran in hole w/perforator run #4. Perforate 19
additional Wastach zones w/2 jspf from 12,280-11,866'. After perforating
12 zones from 12,280-12,082' the flowing tubing pressure increased from
800 to 1300 psi. After completing all perforations, well was flowing w/
flowing tubing pressure 1500 psi on 18/64" choke. Rig down Dresser Atlas.
Treater began dumping clean yellow oil @ 4:30 p.m. Flowed 12 hrs., 274 BO,
50 BW @ 6:30 a.m. Well produced at a rate of 20 BOPH, 468 MCFD, on 21/64"
choke w/flowing tubing pressure 850 psi.

DC: $17,000 CuM: $145,619

Flowed 279.9 BO, 51 BW in 15 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750 psi WHP. Flowed
391.5 BO, 127 BW, 339.6 MCF in 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke.

Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750 WHP, 404.3 BO, 94.3 BW, 494 MCF.
Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750 TP, 435 BO, 48 BW, 509 MCF,

Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750 TP, 420 BO, 57 BW, 509 MCF.

Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750

P

Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750 TP, 414 BO, 61 BW, 433 MCF.
TP, 40%9.9 BO, 52 BW, 433 MCF.
TP

Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 750 , 368 BO, 23 BW, 454 MCF.
Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 550 TP, 396 BO, 53 BW, 454 MCF.
Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 550 TP, 58 BW, 481 MCF, $29.9 BO.
Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" chcke @ 550 TP, 365 BO, 54 BW, 468 MCFD.
Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 525 TP, 376.6 BO, 55 BW, 494 MCFD.
TP

Flow 24 hrs. on 20/64" choke @ 550 , 347.9 BO, 50 BW, 454 MCFD.
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Form OGC-1b ’
' ~ DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

-

SQIT IN TRIPLICATE®
STATE OF UTAH ther instruchions on

teverse stide)

S. LEASE DEBIGNATION iNO OGERIAL NO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

‘Do not use this form for proposals to drtll or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr,
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

§. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTED OO TRINE NaM:

N/A

1. T. UNIT AGREEMENT MaM3
(134 uAs D
wELL WELL OTHES
2, NaAM3 OF OPLRATOR 8. FARM OR LBASE NAMD
Linmar Energy Corporation Linmar-Hansen
3. ADDRESS OF OPIRATOR 9. weLL xo.
1670 Broadway, Suite 3025, Denver, Colorado 80202 1-16 B3

4. LOCATION OF wrLL (Report location clearly and {n accordance with any State requirementas.®
See also space 17 below.) K
At wurface

1760'FWL, 2088' FSL, Section 16, T2S, R3W, USM,
Duchesne County, Utah

10, FIELD AND 1OOL, 08 WILDCAT

Altanmont-Wasatch

11, aRC., T., %, M, OB BLE. AXD
SUXYAY OR A884

Sec. 16, T25, R3W, USM

14. PERoIT NO. 15, sLzvaTionNs (Show whether or, rt, GR, .€2a.) 13. coUNTY or Paxiau} 13, sTaTZ
131-14 5,975" GL Duchesne Utah
18. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE NP INTINTION TO: SUBSBQUINT RBPORT OF:
TXAT WATEIR AHUT-OPY PULL OR ALTER CaASING WATER SHUT-OPF?P REFAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TRELAT l i MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURX TREATMENT ALTEZRING CASING

SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING

ABANUDONMENT®

(otmery _Monthly Drilling

S8HOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON®
REPAIR WELL | CUANGE PLANS

(Other)

(NOTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well
(‘nmpletinn or Recompleticn Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED DR CUMILETED OPHRATIONS (Clearly stute all pertinent detalls, und give pertinent dutes. including estimuted date of starting an:
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and trite vertical depths (oc all markers and zones perti.

nent to this work,) *

SPUD at 6:15 p.m. on 11-16-81.

11-16-81 to

11-23-81 Drill 12%" hole to 2,484', set 9-5/8" casing.
11-23-81 to

11-30-81 Drill to 5,237'.

(See Attached for Details.)

iNaY

18. 1 herebtnuj thajt the forpgg IWM;“:\
SIGNED e (S9N TITLE

pate ___4/23/82

—Joon W. Clark Vice President

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

DATE

APTTNAVED BY TITLE
Cisliwis.. 73 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



Form OGC-b ' ’HT IN TRIPLICATES
STATE OF UTAH Vther instrictions on

: everse <ilde)
o DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES e
. DIVISION OF olL, GAS' AND MINING 3. LEASE DEMIGNATION \NO GERIAL NO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U7 IOUN, ALLoTIER o8 TR a

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.) N/A
1. 7. UMIT AGREEMENT NaMmg
oL UAS
WILL WEILL OTHER
2. MNAME OF OPIRATOR 8. FARM OR LIASE NaM3
Linmar Enerqgy Corporation Linmar-Hansen
3. ADDRESS OF OPBRATOR 8. wxLL No.
1670 Broadway, Suite 3025, Denver, Colorado 80202 1-16 B3
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location cleariy and In sccordance with any 3tate requirementa.® 10. 712LD AND rOOL, OR WILDCAT
See aiso space 17 belaw.)
At surtace : Altamont-Wasatch
1760'FWL, 2088' FSL, Section 16, T2S, R3W, USM, 1i. asc., 7. R, M., OB 3LX, AND

SURYSY OR ARD4

Duchesne County, Utah
Sec. 16, T2S, R3wW, usM

14. PERMIT NoO. 15, 3zvaTiONS (Skow whether o7, AT, oR, ets,) 12. CoUNTY On PaRiSH]| 13, gTATZ
131-14 5,975"' GL Duchesne  Utah
16. Check Approprate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTIC® 0OF INTINTION TO: SUBSDQUENT RSPORT OF:
TZ3T WATER SHUT-OFY g PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUZT-OFP RETAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE ’ FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTIRING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE 5 ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANUDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL i CUANGE PLANS i (otery _Monthly Drilling |
{NOTE : Report results of multiple completion on Weil
i{Other) Cowpletion or Recompletioa Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE IROVOSED OR CuMILETED UPKRATIONS (Cleurty state all pertinent detulls, sad give pertinent datey, Including estimated date of starting an.:
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for 2il markers and rones perti.
nent to this work.) *

2-1-82 to

2-9-82 WOCU.

2-10-82 to

2-17-82 Run tubing and NU well.
2-23-82 to

2-24-82 Perforate lower Wasatch.
2~24-82 to

2-28-82 Flow test.

'(See Attached for Details.)

(Vo ). i'

18. I heredy certﬂyWe tzm}/ ruf an. ect
SIGNED TITLE pate ___4/23/82

i
Johnh~W. Clar Vice. President
(This space tz Federal or State office use) e

APT™AVED BY TITLE DATE

Cisssiszan.. 73 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:;

*See Instructions on Reverse Side
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W“WELL:
“ 'OPERATOR:
LOCATION:

CONTRACTOR:
OBJECTIVE ZONE:

LINMAR-HANSEN 1-16 B3

LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION

SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
WASATCH FORMATION

ESTIMATED T.D.: 13,000'
PAGE 9

1-25-82 13,141} Day 70' Remarks: Run in hole w/drill pipe and drill collars; lay down
drill pipe and drill collars; rig down lay down machine; rig down
tear out flare line, choke line, kill and flow lines; change out
2 sets pipe rams, nipple down BOP stack & nipple up tree.
RIG RELEASED @ 8:00 a.m. 1/25/82.
DC:  $15,694 CUM: §1,462,281
MC: $ ~0- MC:  $ 191,021

1-26-82 Day 71; Rig down rotary tools.

1-27-82 Rig down move off rotary ﬁools.

1-28-82 Rig down rotary tools.

1-29-82 Rig down rotary tools.

1=30-82 Waiting on completion unit.

1-31-82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-1-82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-2-82 Viaiting on completion unit.

2-3-82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-4-82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-5-82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-6-82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-7~82 Waiting on completion unit.

2-8-82 Walting on completion unit.

2-9--82 Rig up completion unit.

2-10~62 Move in rig up Prairie Gold Rig #1. Nipple down well head. Nipple
up BOP. Thawed well head w/hot oil truck. Pick up and run in hole
w/150 joints 2-7/8" 6%# EUE tubing, 4-1/8" mill and scraper.
DC: $71,939 CuM: $71,939

2-11-82 Pick up an additional 180 joints 2-7/8" tubing. Run in hole. Drill

- to top of baffle plate. Drilled for 2 hrs. Shut in for night.

DC: $19,867 CUM: $91,806

2-12-82 Run in hole w/5 stands. Rig up power swivel and drill out baffle
plate. Circulate and clean out tubing. Rig down power swivel and
stripper head. Strip out of hole w/158 stands. Pick up 103 joints
(3165') red band (bad) tubing from Ute Tribal 1-27D3. Run in hole
w/136 stands (to 11,775'). Pull out of hole w/5 stands. Shut in for
night.
DC: $4,163 CUM: $95,969

2-13-82 Run in hole w/5 stands to 11,775'. Reverse out mud. Run in hole to
12,775, reverse out mud. Run in hole and tag cement @ 13,000'. Rig
up power swivel and stripper head. Clean out @ 13,104'. Tag plug at
13,104' w/424 joints in hole. Rig down power swivel and stripper head.
Test shoe, liner, liner sub, casing and well head to 3000 psi. Held OK.
Circulate w/fresh water. Iost 60 bbls 2% KCl in liner. Pull out of
hole w/5 stands.
DC: $4,050 CUM: $100,019

2-14-82 Pull out of hole w/158 stands. Pull out of hole and lay down 3 joints
red band (bad) tubing, casing scraper and mill. Shut in for weekend.
DC: $2,262 coM: $102,281

2-15-82 Shut in for Sunday. N

2-16~-82 Rig up Dresser Atlas. Run CBL-GR-VDL-CCL from 13,100-7,500'. Poor

bond from 12,000' to liner top. Pick up Baker 32 FAB 30 packer,
6' mill out extension, X-over, 1 joints 2-7/8" tubing, 2.31 ID nipple,
and 2-7/8" tubing collar on wireline. Assembly hit derrick. Pull off
wireline and fell to ground, bending tools, and destroying packer.

Repair setting tool and pick up second packer. Run in hole on wireline

and set packer @ 10,100'. Pull out of hole. Rig down Dresser Atlas.
Shut in for night.
DC: $25,758 CuM: $128,039
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Form OGC-1b
TATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS, AND MINING

TN TRIPLICATES
her instrietions on
reverse side)

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

{Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for auch proposals.)

Plug back to a different reservolr.

8. 18 INDIAN, ALLOTTEDR OR TRIBE Nas -

N/A

orL
WILL

(:VA:LL D

OTHER

7. UNIT AGRXECMABXNT NaMa

2. NAME Or OPIRATOR

B. FARM OR LEASK NAMD

Linmar Energy Corporation Linmar-Hansen
3. iDDRX3S OF OPERATOR 9. waLL MO,
1670 Broadway, Suite 3025, Denver, Colorado 80202 1-16 B3

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clear}

See also space 17 below.)

At surface

7 and in accordance with any State requirements.*

1760'FWL, 2088' FSL, Section 16, T2S, R3W, UsM,
Duchesne County, Utah

10. FIZLD AND FOOL, OR WILDCAT

Altamont-Wasatch

11, axc,, 1., X, M., OR BLE., AND
SULYEY OR 4234

Sec. 16, T2S, R3W, USM

14, pERretiT NoO.

131-14

15. BLevaTioNs (Show whather o7, AT, aR, s, )

5,975' GL

12. COUNTY Ox PaxisSH| 13, oTazs

Duchesne Utah

16.

TEST WATLR 3RUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE

REPAIR WELL !

{Other)

Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

XOTICY OF INTENTION TO:

ABANDON®

CHANGE PLANS

PULL OR ALTER CASING
MULTIPLE COMPLETE '

(Other)

WATER SHUT-OFP
FRACTURK TREATMENT

SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING

Monthly Drilling

BURSDQUENT REPORT OF:

RETAIRING WELL
ALTIRING CABING

ABANDONMENT®

i
{NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompietion Report and Log form.)

17, DESCRIDE FPROPOSED OR CUMPLETED UPERATIONS {Clearely state
If well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations snd measured and true vertica

proposed

work.

nent to this work.) *

1-1-82

1-25-82

to
Drill to 13,141'

1-25-82 to

1-31-82

Aavs

WOCU.

and set 5" liner.

(See Attached for Details.)

all pertinent detulls, and give pertinent dates, including esttmuted date of starting any

1 depths for all markers and zones perti-

18. 1 hered

SIGNED

certity th et

4/23/82

DATH

G

- Vice President

(This space fo/r Federal or State office use)

APTTAVED BY

Ciravmna.

TITLE

DATE

“3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side
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« «WELL:
OPERATOR:
LOCATION:

CONTRACTOR:
OBJECTIVE ZONE:
ESTIMATED T.D.:

ot o

LINMAR-HANSEN 1-16 B3
LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
WASATCH FORMATION
13,000’

PAGE 8

1-16-82

1-17-82

1-18-82

1-19-82

1-20-82

1-21-82

1-22-82

1-23-82

1-24-82

12,769"

12,956

13,123

13,141

13,141

13,141

13,141

13,141'

13,141"

Day 61; MW 14.4, Vis 54, WL 10.4, Cake 2+, PH 10.2. Remarks:
Show #27: 12,694-12,720'; No drilling break; Formation gas:
-Before; 900 units, During 3900 units thru gas buster; After

1500 units. Fluoresence nill, cut nill, porosity fair.

Show #28: 12,744-48'; No drilling break; Formation Gas:

Before 900 units; During 2400 units; After 900 units. Fluoresence
nill, cut nill, porosity fair. Slight increase in yellow-green
0il over shaker and in samples with gas kick. BGG: 600~900 units;
CG: 1100-1600 units; TRIP: 4500 units.

DC:  $14,043 CUM: $1,241,373
DMC: § 0 715 cmc:  $ 187,794

Day 62; MW 14.4, Vis 55, WL 11.2, Cake 3, PH 10.6. Remarks:
Some yellow-green oil over shaker and in samples. Show #29:
12,810-30"; No drilling break; Formation Gas: Before 750 units;
During 2250 units; After 750 units. Fluoresence nill, cut nill,
frosty. Show #30: 12,858-94'; Drilling Rate: Before 7-10 mins.,
During 4-5 mins., After 7 mins.; Formation Gas: Before 550 units:
During 2250 units, After 750 units. Fluoresence nill, cut nill,
porosity fair. BGG: 300-750 units; CG: 2250~-2500 units.

DC:  $23,502 cuM: $1,264,875
DMC: $ 927 ac: § 188,721

Day 63; MW 14.5, Vis 61, VIL 12, Cake 3, PH 11. Remarks: Rig
service; Hit 80% pastel colors @ 12,990'. BGG: 300-600 units;
CG: 1200-2400 units.

DC: $13,736 coM: $1,278,611
DMC: S 744 MC:  $ 189,465

Day 64; MW 14.6, Vis 54, VL. 12.6, Cake 3, PH 10.5. Remarks:

Rig service, circulate for short trip, short trip 30 stands,

circulate and condition mud for logs, drop survey and rabbit,

pull out of hole and SIM, Rig up Schlumberger, log. BGG: 150-500 units:;
CG: 400 units; Short trip; 2650 units.

DC: $14,284 CuM: $1,292,895

DMC: $§ 622 CMC:  $ 190,087

Day 65; MW 14.6, Vis 51, WL 11.8, Cake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks:

Rig service, logging, running in hole, wash 90' to bottom,
circulate and condition mud, pull out of hole, cut drilling line,
rig up to run liner. Running liner. Trip gas: 2500 units.

DC:  $35,974 CuM: $1,328,869
DMC: $§ 934 aic:  $ 191,021

Day 66; MW 14.6, Vis 45, WL 12.2, Cake 3, PH 10.5. Remarks:
Run 5" liner, rig down and pick up machine and casing crews,
run 3-1/2" drill pipe. Circulate and reciprocate liner, hang
liner. Circulate. Cement liner. Pull out of hole w/drill pipe.
Wait on cement.

DC: $17,287 CuM: S$1,346,156
DMC: $ ~0- aMc:  $ 191,021

Day 67; Remarks: Rig service, wait on cement. Run in hole w/ drill
pipe, circulate out mud @ 3,000', 6,025'. Tag up @ 7,188'. _
DC: $42,812 CoM: $1,388,968
DMC: $ -0- cMC: $ 0 191,021

Day 68; Remarks: Drilling cement. Rig service; laydown drill
pipe; circulate hole w/water; run in hole; drill out cement.

DC: $45,467 CUM: $1,434,435
DMC: § -0~ CMC: $ 191,021

Day 69' Remarks: Drilling cement. Rig service; test liner lap
to 2000 psi, tested OK; circulate and clean hole @ 9,774'; break
kelly, rig up lay down machine and lay down 3-1/2 drill pipe.
DC: $12,512 CUM: $1,446,587
oMC: § -0- CcMC:  $ 191,021
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WELL:

OPERATOR:
LOCATION:
CONTRACTOR:
OBJECTIVE ZONE:
ESTIMATED T.D.:

e e

LINMAR-HANSEN 1-16 B3

LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION

SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
WASATCH FORMATION

13,000'

PAGE 7

1-8-82

1-9-82 11,670

1-10-82 11,873'

1-11-82 12,042"

1-12-82 12,247'

1-13-82 12,469'

1-14-82 12,582

1-15-82 12,582"

Day 53; Made 213' in 21-1/2 hrs. MW 13.3, Vis 54, WL 10, Cake 2+,

PH 10.9. Remarks: Rig service, circulate gas up. Some vellow-green
oil going over shaker and in samples. BGG: 1200~1500 units;

CG: 1400-1500 units.

DC:  $54,631 ' CUM: $1,054,853
DMC: $32,285 aCc: 116,711

Day 54; Made 207' in 20-3/4 hrs. MW 13.3+, Vis 56, WL 9.6, Cake 3,
PH 10.5. Remarks: Rig service, changing wash pipe & packing in
swivel. Increase in yellow oil with down time gas. BGG: 1300-1650
units; CG: 1500-2300 units; Down time gas: 2800 units.

DC:  $23,122 COM: $1,077,975
oDMC: $ 9,378 c™MC:  $ 126,089

Day 55; Made 203' in 22 hrs. MW 13.8, Vis 58, WL 11, Cake 3, PH 10.3.
Remarks: Rig service; circulate, mix & pump ILCM. Show #23 11,800-12':
Drlg. rate: Before 6, During 2-3, After 6; Formation gas: Before

600 units; During 900 units, After 700 units. Fluoresence N, cut N,
porosity fracture. Slight increase in oil. Iost 70 bbls. md.
Mixed mica & nut plug. BGG: 600~-800 units; CG: 850-1100 units.

DC: 515,105 cuM: $1,083,080
DMC: S 2,120 aMC: § 128,209

Day 56; Made 169' in 19 hrs. MW 14.0, Vis 49, WL 10.8, Cake 3,

PH 10.8. Remarks: Rig service; building MW & circulate out

kick to kill well. Slight increase in oil on shaker. Show #24:
11,896-910"'; Drlg. rate: Before 7, During 5, After 6. Formation
gas: Before 800 units, During 2000 units, After 1700 units.
Fluoresence N, Cut N, porosity fracture. Show #25; 11,970-76';
Drlg. rate: Before 7 mins., During 6 mins., After 6 mins.;
Formation gas: Before 1500 units, During 4600 units, After 1800
units. Fluoresence N, cut N, porosity fracture. BGG: 800-1600
units; CG: 1200-1400 units. At 11,986' took kick. Shut in
drilling pressure 300 psi. Circulate cut & raise mud to 14.0 ppg.
DC:  $20,402 CuM: $1,113,482
DMC:  § 7,330 MC:  $ 135,539

Day 57; Made 205' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW 14.0, Vis 49, VI 12.8, Cake 3+,
PH 11.3. Remarks: Some yellow green oil over shaker and in samples.
Show #26; 12,038-48'; Drlg. rate: Before 6 mins., During 6 mins.,
After 6 mins.; Fromation gas: Before 1200 units, During 2400 units;
After 1500 units. Fluoresence N, cut N, porosity fracture. BGG:
1000-1700 units, CG: 1800-2550 units.

DC: $38,807 CoM: $1,152,289
mMC:  $25,870 aC:  $ 161,409

Day 58; Made 222' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW 14.0, Vis 43, WL 11.8, Cake 3,
PH 11.0. Remarks: Drilling break @ 12,294'-12,308'. No significant
increase in gas or oil from break. Some yellow oil in shaker and in
samples. BGG: 1100-2100 units; CG: 2400-2750 units.

DC:  $35,940 cuM: $1,188,229
DMC:  $13,370 aMc:  § 174,779

Day 59; Made 113' in 12-1/4 hrs. MW 14.2, Vis 49, WL 11.8, Cake 2+,
PH 10.6. Remarks: Rig service; trip for hole; cut drilling line;
check surface equipment for pressure loss. BGG: 950-1700 units;

CG: 1800-3000 units.
DC: $13,662 , CM: $1,201,891
DMC: 725 MC:  $ 175,504

Day 60; MW 14.8, Vis 65, WL 11, Cake 3, PH 10. Remarks: Rig service;
inspecting drill collars; run in hole and pick up new jars; circulate
gas out, drop soft line to locate hole; trip; wash and ream to
bottom.

DC:  $25,439 ClM: $1,227,330
mMC:  $11,575 aMc:  $ 187,079
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-WELL:
OPERATOR:
LOCATION:

CONTRACTOR:
OBJECTIVE ZONE:
ESTIMATED T.D.:

LINMAR-HANSEN 1~16 B3
LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
WASATCH FORMATION
13,000’

PAGE 6

1-1-82

1-2-82

1-3-82

1-4-82

1-5-82

1-6-82

1-7-82

10,361"

10,498"

10,626"'

10,744"

10,776’

11,008

Day 46; M4 wtr 10.3, Vis 42, WL 16.8, Cake 4, PH 11.3. Made
119" in 23~1/2 hrs. Show #16: 10,250-56'; Drlg. rate: Before
12 mins., During 9 mins., After 17 mins. Formation gas: Before
100 units, During 900 units, After 150 units. Fluoresence N,
Cut N, Porosity fracture. Show #17: 10,318-24'; Drlg. rate:
Before 12 mins., During 10 mins., After 12 mins. Formation
gas: Before 70 units, During 650 units, After 200 units.
Fluoresence N, Cut N, Porosity fracture. BGG: 70-190 units;
CG: 200~-390 units.

DC:  $15,326 CuM: $880,858

MC: $ 1,269 MC:  $ 68,827

Day 47; Made 137' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 10.5+, Vis 39, WL 16.4,
Cake 4, PH 10. Remarks: Rig service; BGG: 140-300 units;

CG: 300-600 units.

DC: $13,461 CUM: $894,319

DMC: § 679 cMC: § 69,506

Day 48; Made 128' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 10.8, Vis 45, WL 18.5,
Cake 5, PH 10.1. Remarks: Show #18; 10,608'12'; Drlg. rate:
Before 10 mins., During 8 mins., After 11 mins. Formation gas:
Before 170 units, During 580 units, After 170 units. Fluoresence
N, Cut N, Porosity fracture. BGG: 140~370 units; CG: 400-780
units.

DC: $23,726 . CuM: $918,045

MC: $ 718 ‘ ' CMC:  $ 70,224

Day 49; Made 118' in 19-1/4 hrs. MW wtr 11.5, Vis 46,

WL 15.2, Cake 5, PH 9.6. Remarks: Show #19; 10,626-48";
Drlg. rate: Before 11 mins., During 8 mins., After 9 mins.
Formation gas: Before 160 units, During 1200 units, After
360 units. Fluoresence N, cut N, frosty fracture. Show #20;
10,668-90"'; Drlg. rate: Before 9 mins., During 8 mins.,
After 9 mins., Formation gas: Before 450 units, During 1600
units, After 520 units. Fluoresence N, cut N, Porosity fracture.
Show #21; 10,700~26'; Drlg. rate: Before 10 mins., During

9 mins., After 10 mins. Formation gas: Before 600 units,
During 1500 units, After 175 units. Fluoresence N, cut N,
Porosity fracture. BGG: 125-600 units; CG: 400-2520 units;
Short trip; 3500 units.

LC: $13,450 CUM: $931,495

MC: $ 558 ac: S 70,782

Day 50; Made 32' in 3-1/4 hrs. MW wtr 11.7, Vis 43, WL 16.6,
Cake 4, PH 10.3. Remarks: Rig service; build MW; circulate
and condition hole for trip; drop survey; pull out of hole;
change bit & gauge stabilizers; run in hole with bit #12;
wash & ream 100' to bottom. Survey 3 degrees @ 10,713'.

BGG: 320-360 units; Trip: 3600 units.

DC:  $28,995 CUM: $960,490

DMC: § 367 oc:  $ 71,149

Day 51; Made 232' in 23 hrs. MW wtr 11.8+, Vis 48, WL 13.8,
Cake 3, PH 10.8. Remarks: Rig service, change O-ring on
rotating head. BGG: 1800-2700 units; CG: 3100 units.

DC:  $25,035 ClM: $985,925

DMC:  $12,125 aC: S 83,274

Day 52; Made 242' in 23 hrs. MW wtr 12.8+, Vis 45, WL 13,
Cake 3, PH 10.9. Remarks: Rig service, repalr rotating
head. Slight increase in oil going over shaker. BGG:
1400-1800 units thru possom belly, 3300-3750 thru buster
line. CG: 1600-2200 units thru possom belly.

DC:  $14,697 CM: $1,000,222
MC: § 1,152 MC: $ 84,426
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« WELL:
OPERATOR:
LOCATION:
CONTRACTOR:
OBJECTIVE ZONE:
ESTIMATED T.D.:

4 &

LINMAR-HANSEN 1-16 B3

LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
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PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
WASATCH FORMATION
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12-23-81

12-24-81

Day 37; MW wtr 10.2, Vis 51, WL 14.2, Cake 2, PH 9.6. Remarks:

Rig service; short trip; circulate to build up MAW; pull out of hole;
Rig up Schlumberger and log. BGG: 800 down to 500 units; Short trip;
2400 units.

DC:  $23,066 ' CUM: $682,464
DMC:  §11,395 MMC:  $ 60,489

Day 38; MW wtr 10.2, Vis 51, WL 14.2, Cake 2, PH 9.6. Remarks:
Load out Schlumberger; run in hole; circulate; rig service; lay down
drill pipe, jars and collars; slip and cut drilling line; pull wear

- bushing; Rig up casing free. BGG: 600 units; CG: 2600-600 units.

12-25-81

12-26-81

12-27-61

12-28-81 10,016

12-29-81

12-30-81 10,137'

12-31-81 10,242°'

DC: $35,151 CUuM: $717,615
DMC: § 242 : eMC: $ 60,731

Day 39; MW wtxr 10.2, Vis 61, WL 14.2, Cake 2, PH 9.6. Remarks:
Out of hole; rig up and run 7" casing; rig service.

bC: $32,879 CUM: §$750,494
DMC: § -0- MC: S 60,731

Day 40; MW wtr 9.8, Vis 34. Remarks: Nipple up blow out preventer;
test choke lines, safety valves, kelly and BOP stack; caliber and
measure drill collars, and kelly drill pipe; rig up and pick up
machine; run in hole.

DC:  $12,143 , o ClM: $762,637
CMC: $ 1,067 aCc: $ 61,798

Day 41; MW wtr 10.1+, Vis 45, WL 18, Cake 2, PH 8.4. Remarks:

rig service; pull up bottom hole assembly, drill collars, heavy
welght drill pipe; thaw out stand pipe and kelly hose; drill rubber
plug and flow collar, circulate and condition mud.

DC:  $19,133 cM: $781,770
DMC:  $71,961 aMC: S 63,759

Day 42; Made 14' in 4-3/4 hrs. MW wtr 10, Vis 42, WL 17.8, Cake 3,
PH 9.8. Remarks: rig service; circulate and condition mud; test
casing to 1500 psi.; test formation to 1500 psi; pump mill and trip
out; trip in hole with bit, slip in, fell i hole; wait on tools.
EGG: 30-40 units; Trip gas: 80 units.

DC: $17,682 ClM: $799,452
DMC: $ 115 ' MC: S 63,874

Day 43; MW wtr 10.1, Vis 41, WL 17.4, Cake 5, PH 11. Remarks:
rig service; trip in hole with flat bottom mill; mill on jump;
trip out of hole; trip in hole with bit. BGG: 15-20 units;

TG: 40 units.

DC:  $34,863 CUM: $834,315
DMC:  $ 1,038 CMC:  $ 64,912

Day 44; Made 116' in 20-3/4 hrs. MW wtr 10.1, Vis 41, WL 15,

Cake 4, PH 10. Remarks: rig service; trip in hole. Show #14;
10,104-08"', Drlg. rate; Before 10 mins., during 10 mins., after 10
mins. Formation Gas: before 20 units, during 290 units, after

40 units. Top of transition @ 10,010'. BGG: 20~40 units;

CG: 40-120 units.

LC: $14,413 CUM: $848,728
MC: $ 1,611 MC: S 66,523

Day 45; Made 105' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 10.1, Vis 41, WL 15, Cake 3,
PH 11.4. Remarks: Rig service; Show #15: 10,180-98'; Drlg. rate:
Before 14 mins., during 10 mins., after 13 mins. Formation Gas:
Before 30 units; during 150 units, after 80 units. Flower N, cut N,
porosity trace. BGG: 30-80 units; CG: 100-250 units.

DC: $16,804 CUM: $865,532

DMC: § 1,035 aMC: S 67,558
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. WELL: LINMAR~HANSEN 1-16 B3
OPERATOR: LINMAR ENERGY CORPORATION
LOCATION: SEC 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M., DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
CONTRACTOR: PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E

OBJECTIVE ZONE: WASATCH FORMATION
ESTIMATED T.D.: 13,000"
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12-14-81 7,993" Day 28; Made 284' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 8.7, Vis 47, WL 17,
Cake 4, PH 11. Remarks: Dark brown oil & tar going over
shaker. BGG: 180-300 units - average; CG: 210-350 units -

average.
DC:  $16,411 CuM:  §$531,121
DMC: $ 190 aic:  $ 42,755

12-15-81 8,272' Day 29; Made 279' in 22-3/4 hrs. MW wtr 8.9, Vis 38, WL 16, Cake 2,
PH 10.5. Remarks: rig service; circulate for survey; Survey;
2-1/8 degrees @ 7,975'. Tar and dark brown oil going over
shaker. BGG: 220-350 units - average; CG: 320-450 units - average.
DC:  $21,155 CUM:  $552,274
DMC: § 436 aMC: § 43,191

12-16-81 8,615 Day 30; Made 343' in 22-3/4 hrs. MW wtr 8.9, Vis 39, WL 17.6,
Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: rig service, circulate for survey,
Survey - 1-3/4 degrees @ 8,475'. Dark brown oil over shaker
and in samples. BGG: 160-250 units - average; CG: 240-280 units-

average.
DC:  $11,762 CUM:  $564,036
omMC: § 881 CMC:  $ 44,072

12-17-81 8,891' Day 31; Made 276' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 8.9, Vis 40, WL 19.2,
Cake 2, PH 9.5. Remarks: Dark brown oil going over shaker and
in samples. BGG: 140-200 units - average; CG: 180-240 units -

average.

DC:  $21,926 CUM:  $585,962

DMC: S 1,025 aMC:  $ 45,097
12-18-81 Day 32; Made 202' in 18~1/4 hrs. MW wtr 9.0, Vis 40, WL 21,

Cake 2, PH 10. Remarks: Rig service, Survey -~ 3 degrees @ 8,990',
circulate hole, trip out of hole to change out tool. Dark brown
oil and tar going over shaker. BGG: 160-220 units - average;

CG: 220-280 units - average. :

LC: $11,613 CUM: $597,575
DMC: $ 515 MC: $ 45,612
12-19-81 Day 33; Made 144' in 14-1/4 hrs. MW wtr 8.9, Vis 39, WL 20.5,

Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: Trip to change out tools, cut drilling
line, rig service, and wash and ream to bottom. Dark brown oil
and tar over shaker. BGG: 80-100 units - average; CG: 110-140
units - average; Trip 3200 units.

DC: $16,113 CUM: $613,688
DMC: $ 538 aMC: § 46,150
12-20-81 Day 34; Made 234' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 9.0, Vis 39, WL 19.6,

Cake 2, PH 10.5. Remarks: Dark brown oil and tar over shaker.
BGG: 100-180 units - average; CG: 280-400 units - average.

DC: $12,122 CUM: $625,810
MC: $ 1,026 MC: S 47,176
12-21-81 Day 35; Made 264' in 22-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 9.0, Vis 39, WL 20.4,

Cake 2, PH 10.4. Remarks: Rig service, circulate for survey;
Survey: 2-3/4 degrees @ 9,475'. Show #13; Drlg. rate before

5 min., during 3-1/2 min., after 5 mins. Formation Gas: before
210 units, during 1600 units, after 1200 units. Fluoresence trace
cut G; porosity possible fracture. BGG: 180-1200 units; CG:
310-1960 units.

oC: $11,747 CUOM: $637,557
MC: S 651 cMC: S 47,827
12-22-81 Day 36; Made 268' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 9.7, Vis 47, WL 16.4,

Cake 2, PH 10.2. Remarks: Rig service. BGG: 600-1000 units;
CG: 900-1350 units.

DC:  $21,841 CuM:  $659,398
DMC: $ 1,267 MCe S 49,094
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PETER BAWDEN DRILLING, LTD., RIG NO. 21E
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12-5-81 5,515" Day 19; Made 93' in 11-1/4 hrs., MW wtr 8.6, Vis 41, WL 17.8,

: Cake 2, PH 10.4. Remarks: BGG 0; CG 0; TRIP 90 units. NOIE:
TOP OF GREEN RIVER @ 5510'. Wash and ream to bottom, clean
iron off bottom, cut and slip drilling line, tripping pipe.

DC: $11,656 ClM:  $373,234
DMC: $ 475 CMC: $ 15,983
12-6-81 5,900' Day 20; Made 385' in 23-1/2 hrs., MW wtr 8.9, Vis 35, WL 18,
Cake 1, PH 11.4. Remarks: Tar going over shaker. BGG 0 CG 0.
IC: $10,867 CUM:  $384,101
DMC: $ 128 ac:  $ 16,111
12-7-81 6,295’ Day 21; Made 395' in 22-1/2 hrs., MW wtr 9.1+, Vis 36, WL 17.8,
Cake 1+, PH 11. Remarks: Short trip to survey. Swurvey: 1-1/2
degrees @ 5,967'. Show No. 10: 5,918-5,938', Drlg. Rate:
Before 3 mins., During 2 mins., After 3 mins.; Form. Gas:
Before 70 units, During 150 units, After 100 units. Fluoresence
cut, frosty; cut, frosty; trace frosty. BGG 100 units, CG 150
units, Short trip 350 units.
DC: $11,212 : CuM:  $395,313
MC: S 226 aMC: $ 16,337
12-8-81 6,682' Day 22; Made 387' in 22-3/4 hrs.” MW wtr 9.1, Vis 35, WL 18, Cake 2,
PH 11.4. Remarks: Tar over shaker and in samples. Survey:
1-3/4 degrees @ 6463'. BGG 60-120 units; CG 90-170 units.
DC: $21,494 CUM:  $416,807
CMC: $ 529 cMC: § 16,866
12-9-81 7,018' Day 23; Made 336' in 22 hrs. MW wtr 9.1+, Vis 39, WL 15.6,
Cake 2, PH 11.4. Remarks: Abundant increase in tar @ 6,748-
6,790'. Show No. 1l: 6748-6790', Drlg. Rate: Before 3.5 mins.,
During 3 mins., After 4.5 mins.; Form. Gas: Before 110 units;
During 3,000 units; After 300 units. Sample had large amount
of tar to surface. Survey 2 + degrees @ 6,926'. BGG 150-280
units - average; CG 360-550 units -~ average.
DC: $10,596 CUM:  $427,403
DMC: $ 63 a™MC: $ 16,929
12-10-81 7,160" Day 24; Made 142' in 15-1/4 hrs. MW wtr. 9.1, Vis 36, WL 15,
Cake 2, PH 10.9. Remarks: Trip for bit. Show No. 12:
7,032-7,066', Drlg. Rate: Before 4 mins., During 3.5 mins.,
After 3.5 mins.; Form. Gas: Before 150 units, During 600
units, After 300 units. Surge of oil tar. Mud and oily tar
coming over shaker. BGG 200-300 units; CG 300-400 units;
Trip Gas 2500 units. )
DC: $24,572 CUM:  $451,975
DMC: $ 850 cMe: $ 17,779
12-11-81 7,369 Day 25; Made 209' in 23-1/2 hrs. MW wtr 9.0, Vis 40, WL 14,
Cake 2, PH 11.4. Remarks: No shows, heavy dark brown oil - .
& tar going over shaker & in samples. BGG: 180-300; CG: 300-540.
DC: $13,181 ClM:  $465,156
DMC:$ 1,910 aC: $ 19,689
12-12-81 7,590’ Day 26; Made 221' in 22-3/4 hrs. MW wtr 9.0, Vis 38, WL 13.6,
Cake 2, PH 10.8. Remarks: No shows; Survey 2 degrees @ 7,443"';
BGG: 150-300 units - average; CG: 280-360 units - average.
DC:  $32,421 cmM:  $497,577
DMC:  $16,624 aMc:  $ 36,313
2-13~-81 7,709' Day 27; Made 119' in 15-~1/2 hrs. MW wtr. 9.0, Vis 42, WL 12.6,

Cake 2, PH 10.3. Remarks: circulate hole, wash & ream to
bottom, trip. Dark brown oil & tar going over shaker. BGG:
160-180 units - average; CG: 210-220 units - average; Trip Gas:
2100 units.

DC: $17,133 CUM: $514,710
DMC:  § 6,252 cMC: $ 42,565
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11-28-81

11-29-81

11-30-81

12-1-81

12-2-81

12-3-81

12-4-81

4,110 Day 12; Made 564' in 23 hrs., MW wtr 8.8, PH 11.5. Remarks:
Circulate and condition hole for survey, Survey: =-0- degrees
at 3,865"'.
DC: $10,921 CUM: $270,335
DMC: $710 CMC: $8,446

4,666" Day 13; Made 556' in 23 hrs., MW wtr 8.4, PH 10.9. Remarks:
Survey 3/4 degree at 4,389', Show #1: 4558-4568', Drlg.
Rate: Before 2 mins., During .5 mins., After 2 mins., Form.
Gas: Before 5 units, During 20 units, After 5 units, No Flour..
No Cut, Porosity trace.
DC: $11,630 CuM: $281,965

DMC: 81,165 CMC: $9,611

5,237 Day 14; Made 571' in 22-1/2 hrs., MW wtr 8.4, PH 11. Remarks:
Survey 1/2 degree at 4,880'. Show No. 2: 4694-4710', Drlg.
Rate: Before 2 mins., During 1 mins., After 2 mins.; Form.
Gas: Before 5 units, During 15 units, After 5 units; No flour..
no cut, Porosity trace. Show No. 3: 4778-4786', Drlg. Rate:
Before 2.5 mins., During 1 min., After 2 mins.; Form. Gas:
Before 5 units, During 35 units, After 5 units; no flour., no
cut, porosity trace. Show No. 4: 4862~4868'; Drlg. Rate:
Before 2 mins., During 1 min., After 2 mins.; Form. Gas:
Before 5 units, During 45 units, After 5 units; NN-Trace.
Show No. 5: 4990-5004'; Drlg. Rate: Before 2 mins, During
1 min., After 2 mins.; Form. Gas: Before 7 units, During 30
units, After 10 units; NN-Trace. Show No. 6: 5022-5040';
Drlg. Rate: Before 2 mins., During 1.5 mins., After 2 mins.;
Form. Gas: Before 10 units, During 30 units, After 5 units;
NNTR. Show No. 7: 5126-5140'; Drlg. Rate: Before 2 mias.,
During 1-1}% mins., After 2 mins.; Form. Gas: Before 5 units,
During 50 units, After 15 units; NNTR. Show No. 8: 5156-
5170', Drlg. Rate: Before 2) mins., During 1} mins., After
2 mins.; Form. Gas: Before 10 units, During 40 units, After
15 units; NNTR. Show No. 9: 5186-5198', Drlg. Rate: Before
2 mins., During 1-1) mins., After 3 mins.; Form. Gas: Before
15 units, During 90 units, After 10 units; NNTR.

BGG 5-15 units - average; CG 20-40 units - average.
DC:  $11,522 CUM: $293,487
DMC: $930 CMC: 810,541

5,422° Day 15; Made 185' in 8-1/2 hrs., MW wtr 8.4, PH 11.4. Remarks:
Survey 1/4 degree at 5,380', Background gas 5-10 units,
connection 15-30 units.
DC: $21,452 CUM: $314,939
DMC: $850 CMC: $11,391

5,422 Day 16; M4 wtr 8.7, Vis 41, Cake 2, PH 11.2. Remarks: Rig servic
check BOP, work on wireline, freepoint stuck pipe, run string
shot & back off pipe, mix mud & circ hole w/mud, TOOH, LDDC, PU
tbg, TIH, circ to top of fish, screw into fish & work pipe loocse,
hoist fish OCH.

DC: $17,337 CUM: $332,276
DMC: $3500 MC: $14,891

5,422" Day 17; MW wtr 8.8, Vis 42, Cake 2, PH 11. Remarks: Rig service.
waiting on tools, run in hole, wash down to fish, jar on fish,
pull out of hole, Magnaflux bottom hole assembly, wait on short
short drill collar, made up bottom hole assembly.

DC: $14,063 CUM: $346,339
DMC: $384 ) oF: $15,275

5,422' Day 18; MW wtr. 8.6, Vis 42, WL 18, Cake 2, PH 11.4. Remarks:
Round trip bit #5, round trip load basket. Start in hole with
bit #6.
DC:  $15,239 CUM: $361,578
DMC: $233 QauC:  $15,508
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11-17-81 372! Day 1; MW 10.4, VIS 37, WL 16.6, Cake 2, PH 10.5. Made 372' in
13-3/4 hrs. Remarks: - SPUDDED WELL AT 6:15 P.M. ON 11-16-81.
Surveys: 1/2 degree at 94' and 3/4 degree at 321'.
DC: $31,413 CUM: $31,413
DMC: $1,085 CMC: $1,085
11-18-81 710’ Day 2; Made 710' in 23 hrs., MW 10.5, VIS 43, WL 15, Cake 2,
PH 9. Remarks: Surveys: 1/2 degree at 585' and 1/4 degree
at 900'.
DC: $44,781 CUM: $76,194
DMC: $526 cMC:  $1.611
11-19-81 1,479 Day 3; Made 329' in 21-1/2 hrs., MW 10.4, VIS 42, WL 12.8,
Cake 3, PH 9.6. Remarks: Survey 1/2 degree at 1200'.
DC: $38,461 CUM: $114,655
DMC: $88 CMC: $1,699
11-20-81 1,880"' Day 4; Made 401" in 20-1/4 hrs., MW 9.8+, VIS 37, WL 13.4,
Cake 3, PH 10.6. Remarks: Surveys: 1/4 degree at 1,479' and
3/4 degree at 1,828'.
DC: $21,073 CUM: $135,728
DMC: $426 CMC:  $2,125
11-21-81 2,150" Day 5; Made 270' in 23-1/4 hrs., MW 9.9, VIW 40, WL 13, Cake 3,
PH 10.5. Remarks: Survey-0 degrees at 2,106"'.
bC: $12,803 CUM: $148,531
bDMC: $1,135 CMC: 83,260
11-22-81 2,485 Day 6, Made 335' in 17 hrs., MW 10, VIS 39, WL 17.2, Cake 3,
PH 11.5. Remarks: Circulate and condition hole, ream out
tite spot at 1,599', trip for bit, short trip 19 stands.
DC: $11,572 CUM: $160,103
DMC: $155 tMC:  $3,415
11-23-81 2,485" Day 7; Made ~0-' in last 24 hrs. Remarks: Survey 7/8ths degree
at 2,482'. Ran 57 jts. of 9-5/8", 36#, J-55 casing, set at
2,484", cemented with 800 sx. Howcolite, 10# gilsonite, 1/4#
flocele, 27 CACL at 13.1# PPG, 300 sx. Class "H", 1/4# flocele,
2% CACL, wt. 15.8# PPG. Plug down at 12:20 AM on 11-23-81.
DC: 514,513 CUM: $174,616
DMC: $§55 CMC: $3,470
11-24-81 2,485" Day 8; Made -0-' in last 24 hrs., Remarks: Nippling up and
building lines.
DC: $26,765 CUM: $201,381
DMC: § -0- CMC: $3,470
11-25-81 2,485" Day 9; Made -0-' in 24 hrs., MW Wtr 8.5, PH 9.6. Remarks:
Nipple up, pressure test BOP stack, put in wear bushing, make
up bottom hole assembly, pick up 12 drill collars, going in
hole, drilling out cement.
DC: $19,497 CuM: $220,878
DMC: § -0- CMC: $3,470
11-26-81 2,983 Day 10, Made 498' in 18 hrs., MW wtr 8.4+, VIS 12.4. Remarks:
Drilled cement and float collar, work tite spot, condition
hole, survey 1/4 degree at 2,760'.
DC:  $27,164 CUM: $248,042
DMC: $2,766 MC:  $6,236
11-27-81 3,546" Day 11; Made 563' in 22 hrs., MW wtr 8.6, PH 11.6. Remarks:
Condition hole for survey, Surveys: -0- degree at 3,068' and
~-0- degree at 3,374'.
DC: $11,372 CUM: $259,414

DMC: $1,500 CMC: §7,736



i \ Form OGC-1b

STATE OF UTAH

:.”']‘ IN TRIPLICATE®
{Other instruetions on

. sveerses sidher )
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES e
D'VIS'ON OF O‘L' GAS' AND M'NING 5. LEASE DERIONATION AND BDERIAL NO:
8. IFf INDIAN, ALLOTTED 0O TRISE NAM :
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
{Do not use this form for propoeals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr,
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals,) N/A
1L T. UNIT AGREEMENT NaMn
o1t uAS D
wOLL WELL OTHIR

2, NAME OF OPIRATOR

Linmar Enerqgy Corporation

8. FARAM OR LBASE NaMB

Linmar-Hansen

3. ADDRZES OF OPERATOR

9. wsLL No.

1670 Broadway, Suite 3025, Denver, Colorado 80202 1-16 B3

4. LOCATION OF wWILL (Report location clearly and In accordance with any 3tate requirementa.® 10. r12LD AND roOt, OR WILDCAT
See ais0 space 17 below,
At wrface Altamont~Wasatch

1760'FWL, 2088' FSL, Section 16, T2S, R3W, UsM,

Duchesne County, Utah

SURYRY OR a484

11, azc,, 1., 2., M., OB BLI. AND

Sec. 16, T2S, R3W, USM
14, reERMIT No. 15, StzvATioNs (Show whether 07, 2T, R, ¢to.) 13. couNTY ox pamtad| 18, oTat:
131-14 5,975"'" GL Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE 0F INTENTION TO: ' AUSSIQUENT RBPORT OF
LL

TEST WATCK SHUT-OFY q
FRACTURE TREAT |
SHOOQT OR ACIDIZE

REPAIR WELL 1

{Other)

CUANGE PLANS

PULL OR ALTEIR CASING WATER SHUT-OFP REPAIRING WE

MULTIPLE COMPLETE , FRACTURE TREATMENT

ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT
H

ALTERING CaBINg

(othery _Monthly Drilling

{NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on
Cumpletion or Recompietion Report and Log form

Well
.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED UPKRATIONS (Claurly state al! pertinent detalls.

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and

nent to this work.) *

und give pertinent dates, Including estimated date of atarting an:
meassured and true vertical depths for all markers aud rzones perts

12-1-81 to

12-25-81 Drill to 10,016' and set 7" casing.
12-26-81 to

12-31-81 Drill to 10,242'.

(See Attached for Details.)

/]

certity

DATE 4/23/82

18. 1 bered /MNI.Z/ZW
SIGNE TITLE

onhn W. Clark

Vice

Preqi dent

{This space for Federal or State office use)

APTTAVED BY

TITLE

DATE

Ciiwise. 'S OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Gih VAT
NANE OF CGMPANY: Linmar Energy Corp.

i )

WELL NAME{ Linmar - Hansen #1-16B3

SECTION_NESW 16  TOWNSHIP___2S RANGE__3W

CounTy

Duchesne

DRILLING CONTRACTDR Peter Bawden Drilling. Ltd.

RIG #__21E
SPUDDED:  DaTE__11-16-81
TIME__6:15 PM

How Rotary

DRILLING WILL COMMENCE

REPORTED BY Lori Rohleder
TELEPHONE #  (303) 832-3800

AS

DAIE November 24, 1981 SIGNED
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STATE OF UTAH Scott M. Matheson, Governor
NATURAL RESOURCES & ENERGY Temple A. Reynolds, Executive Director
L Oil, Gas & Mining Cleon B. Feight, Division Director

4241 State Office Building - Sait Lake City, UT 84114 + 801-533-5771
April 2, 1982

Linmar Energy Corporation
1670 Broadway, Suite 3025
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Well No. Linmar-Hansen #1-16B3
Sec. 16, T. 2S, R. 3W.
Duchesne County, Utah
(December 1981- February 1982)

Gentlemen:

Our records indicate that you have not filed the monthly drilling
reports for the months indicated above on the subject well.

Rule C-22, General Rules and Regulations and Rules of Practice and
Procedure, requires that said reports be filed on or before the sixteenth
(16) day of the succeeding month. Thsi report may be filed on Form OGC-1B,
(U.S. Geological Survey Form 9-331) "Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells",
or on company forms containing substantially the same information. We are
enclosing forms for your convenience.

Your prompt attention to the above will be greatly appreciated.
Very truly yours,

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

7498

ari Furse
Clerk Typist

Board/Charles R. Henderson, Chaimnan « John L. Bell - E. Steele McInWre » Edward 1. Beck
Robert R. Noman « Margaret R. Bird - Herm Olsen

on equoi opportunity employer - please recycle paper
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LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
7679 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Suite 604

Denver, Colorado 80237 4 ifgg};g
(303) 773-8003 e
November 6, 1987
State of Utah
Division of 0il, Gas and Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
355 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203
ATTN: Tami Searing
.
Re: Change of Operator hrﬂ‘Jqozb

Dear Ms. Searing:

Enclosed is. a Sundry Notice, in triplicate, evidencing Change of
Operator effective November.l, 1987, from Linmar Energy Corporation to
Linmar Petroleum Company covering the wells listed on the Exhibit "A"
attached thereto. Such listing of wells should cover all the wells in
which you currently show Linmar Energy Corporation as Operator.

If you have any questions whatscever or if you need any‘additional-
information, please do not hesitate to call me collect at (303) 773-8003.

Thank you so very much for all of your assistance and cooperation
in this matter.

Very truly yours,
LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

Dol Frim)

Susan L. Foster
Land Consultant

SLF:jgm
Enclosures

cc: Ed Whicker, Field Superintendent, Linmar Petroleum Company
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Form 0GC.1b . SUBMIT FRIPLICATE®
e - S OF UTAH {Othe \u‘-l]iu)ns on
. Bred angse side
& DEPARTMENT NATURAL RESOURCES
- DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. LEASE DERIGNATION AND ARRIAL NO.

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEN OR TAIHE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

{Do not use this torm for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a differsnt reservolr.
Use “"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

1. T. UNIT AGREEMANT NAWS
oIt UAS D
WILL FILLL OTHIZ
2., XiM3 OF OPEBATOR 8. TARM OR LZASE NAMK
[ Sal 9 BonT
See Below ) Hnuv S
3. ADDRISS OF OPY1ATOR . 9. WILL O, a1 1t
' : : P See Exhibit "A
See Below': . ce Ty Attached Hereto
4. LOCATION OFr wrkLL (Report location cleariy aod {n accordance with any Jtate nqulremenu . 10. FIELD AND POOL, O% WILDCAT
See also space 17 delow.) .

At surfacs

11, ame¢,, T, 2., M., OR 3LX, AXD
SURYRY OB AREA -

See Exhibit "A"
Attached Hereto

13, PramiT Xo. 15, l‘uvu'xom {Show whethar or, 2T, 08, ¢ta.) 11, COUNTY ox Pax{fad}| 13, srTaTxz
Duchesne & .
Uintah Countie Utah
1s. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
[} [}
NOTICE NF INTENTION TO: SUBASQUENT XXPORT OF:
TI8T WATIR SHUT-OFF g : PULL OR ALTIR Ca3ING WATIZR SHUT-OTP ’::) RETAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TRILAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE YRACTURE TREATMEINT ALTZRING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ) ABANDON® SHOUTING Ol ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
; .
REPAIR WELL CHAMGE PLANS (Other) . -
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Weil
, (Other) . o Change of Operat rX” oo Cuwmpletion oe Recompletion Report and Log fnem.)

17, DESCRIBE PROPNRKD NI CUMULETED OPERATIONS (Clewrly stute nil purtinent detuils, und give pertinent dutes, Inciuding estlmated date of starting any
proposed work, [f well is directionally drilled, give subsurface- loatmns and meuured and true. vertlcnl depths (nr all markers and zones pertl-
nent to this work.) *

CHANGE OF OPERATOR
(Effective November 1, 1987) ' ’

FROM:

Company Name: Linmar Energy Corporatlon
Address: - 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, Colorado 80237 I
Telephone No.: (303) 773-8003 ' :

Company Name: Linmar. Petroleum Company - JQ5<D 3 .
Address: © - 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Suite 604 Denver, Colorado 80237

Telephone No.: (303) 773-8003

218, 1 he.r'et;y ceiu: that the tor;;lnA il t'riu and cor'rec't
St LII\fMAR NER| §ORPORATION .

: DATE Noverﬁber 6. 1987

TITLE Vice President

 816NED _BY
R L11 =
{(This space tor Federal or State office use) -
APPROYVED BY ' : . TITLE —_ : " DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL IF ANY

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



4

&i

¥

EXHIBIT "A"

Attached to and made a part of that certain Sundry Notice covering
Change of Operator from Linmar Energy Corporation to- Linmar

Petroleum Company

WELL NAME

Horrocks 1-3A1 L/g,o/?) '5017/

"SECTION, ! TOWNSUIP AND RANGE

Sectdion

Chasel Miller 2-1A2_ Y4%3-0(3-2%030:0

Duncan 3-1A2 . '/3-10/3’3//35

Murray 3-2A2 43«0/3*305 I

Chasel Hackford 2—10A1Eh_ﬁg,odjkf3/9ébl

Wilkerson 1-20Z1 Y2 _p/3-309Y>

Moon 1-23Z1 Y2 047-21479

Coltharp 1-2721  U3_p[3-20]5/

Section

Section

Section

Section

Section

Section

Section

Jensen 1-29Z1 L'/g,o/a- 30725

Ute 1-30Z1 Yz 013~ 30512

Dye 1-2522_ Ya,_p13-20L 59

Ute Tribal 3-3522 . Ya_p|3-3/|33

Section
Section
Section

Section

Horrocks 2-4Al L/ 3_0 /3-3095 L/ |

Helen Larsen 2-5Al 17/3,0/3_ zn 720

Section

Section

Chasel 2-17A1 * Y3.p/2_ 2,732

Section

LeBeau 1-34Al L/3-—O 13-305 9y

Timothy 3-18A3 l/ﬁ«o/%—%o‘? Yo .

Fisher 1-19A3 "-/340-/3—30535

_ Goodrich 1-24A4 Yo 01 3-357bo

Smlth 2-25A4 Ya-0/3_ 3,7 7[:: .

State l-l‘l‘;Blr 1{’3,0 Y7- 308 1(%
Linmar 1-1982  42_ 5)2— 300y

" Section
iSection
vSection
VSéétion
‘Secfion
‘VSecpion

Section

Christensen 2-8B3 9%-0/3—;35752>

Hansen 1-16B3 %3-0/3“'}3033 5
: ‘ 1/5‘0/‘3_'30 617

" Section

Section

3, Township 1 South, Range 1 West
1, Township 1l South, Range 2vWest-
1, Township ! South, Range 2 West
2, Township 1 South, Range 2 West
10; Township .1 South, Range 1 East
20, Township 1l North, Range 1 West

23, Township 1 North, Range 1 West

27, Township 1 North, Range 1 West

29, Township 1 North, Range 1 West
30, Townsh;p 1 North, Range 1 West
25, Township 1 North, Range 2 West
35, Township 1 North, Range 2 West
4, Township L Southy Range 1 West

5, Township 1l South, Range 1 West

17, Township 1 South, Range 1 West

34, Township 1 South, Rangé 1 West
18, Township 1 South, Range 3 West
19, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

24, Townshipvl South, Range 4 West
25} Township 1 Soufh, Range AVWest
14, Township 2 Sopth, Rénge 1 Wés;
19, Township 2 SoutH,ARéng§72'weéF 

8, Township 2 South,‘RahgeVS'Wés;ifrr_

16, Township 2 South, Range 3HW¢§t



EOF UTAH 4 e
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MiNiNG 1IN G [E[[\WV/[E[R
‘i ;‘-—_ ’g Lb4de Designation and Serial Number:
i :
it H
AW A oo :
4 —3 Falll ol ) 6} Ifjridian, Afiottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WH 4 LI
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing welis, or to reenter piugged ' v;; & mgﬁ“‘é ‘itg'\greement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such propol ’ , m——geé attached list.
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:
oL GAs [ | OTHER: See attached list.
2. Name of Operator: 9. AP| Well Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See attached list.
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573—-4476 Altamont/Bluebell
4.  location of Well
Footages: See attached list. county:  See attached list.
QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: . State: Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) {Submit Original Form Only)
[} Abandonment {1 New Construction [ 1 Abandonment * ] New Construction
(] Casing Repair [ 1 Pull or Alter Casing [} Casing Repair (] Pultor Alter Casing
(] Change of Plans (1 Recompletion [ ] Change of Plans [} Shoot or Acidize
[ Conversion to Injection [1 Shootor Acidize [ ] Conversion to Injection [} Ventor Flare
[ Fracture Treat [CJ Ventor Flare [ ] Fracture Treat [ water Shut—Off
[ ] Multiple Completion ] Water Shut-Off [ Other
[X] Other  Change of operator.
Date of work completion
_ Approximate date work will start 9/8/94 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form,
* Must be accompanied by a cement veriication report.

12, DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If wellis directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

There was a change of operator on the date above for all wells on the attahced list:

OPERATOR: — FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
All operations are covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40—66A, Bond No. U6053821 and Nationwide Bond No0.962270.

e M

Name & Signature: f _/{/M W Title: ( 2 Arg gﬂ ' ?/__t ™~ Date: 09/19/94

=
(This space for State use only)

(12/92) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME APl # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

Allred 1—16A3 43-013-30232 700" FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96000087 102102, 962270
Allred 2—-18A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270
Barrett 1—-34A5 43-013-30323 713 FNL & 1387' FEL Section 34, T18, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Belcher 2—-33B4 43-013-30907 2348' FNL & 1085' FWL Section 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Birch 1—-35A5 43-013-380233 757' FNL & 1024’ FEL Section 35, T1S, R5W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Birch 2-35A5 43-013-30362 Section 35, T18, R5W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 1-25B4 43-013-30668 778 FNL & 1627' FEL Section 25, T2S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 1-27B4 43-013-30185 1244' FNL & 1464' FEL Section 27, T2S, R4W, US.M., Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 2-35B5 43-013-30808 2432' FNL & 1648’ FWL Section 35, T28, R5W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 2~3B4 43-013-31008 1226' FSL & 1933' FWL Section 3, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brown 2-28B5 43-013-30718 1777' FSL & 1413 FWL Section 28, T2S, RSW, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96000068 102102, 962270
Carl Smith 2—25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25, T1S,R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96—-000036 102102, 962270
Chandier 2-5B84 43-013-31000 466' FSL & 1180° FWL Section 5, T28, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute Nwb4o 102102, 962270
Chasel 2—17A1 43-013-30732 1379 FSL & 1360 FWL Section 17, T18, R1W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C ° 102102, 962270
hasel Hackford 2—10A1E 43-047-31421 1120° FSL & 1120' FEL Section 10, T1S, R1E, U.S.M. Uintah Fee Ute UT08014886C693 102102, 962270
‘hasel Miiler 2—1A2 43-013-30360 Section 1, T18, R2W, U.S. M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014987C685 102102, 962270
Christensen 2—-26A5 43-013-30905 776' FSL & 1467 FWL Section 26, T18, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Christensen 2—883 43-013-30780 1880' FSL & 1694’ FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Christensen 3—-4B4 43-013-31142 804' FSL & 1948' FEL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Christman Blann 1-3184 43-013-30198 1257' FNL & 1552° FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Clark 2—-9A3 43-013-30876 Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102, 962270
Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 1097' FSL & 702' FWL Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014987C685 102102, 962270
Dye 1-25Z2 43-013-30659 1520' FSL & 1520' FEL Section 25, TIN, R2w, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08049P84C723 102102, 962270
D. Moon 1-23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, TIN, RIW, US.M. Uintah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Elisworth 2-8B4 43-013-30898 1580' FSL & 1580' FWL Section 8, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Elisworth 2-984 43-013-31138 2976' FNL & 2543' FWL Section 9, T28, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute ’v‘;l’,oop""g 102102, 962270
Evans 1-31A4 43-013--30067 1987' FNL & 1973' FEL Section 31, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-380915 1496' FSL & 1718 FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96000108 102102, 962270
Fisher 1—16A4 43-018-30737 1527' FSL & 834' FEL Section 16, T18, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672C 102102, 962270
Fisher 1—19A3 43-013-30535 1609’ FNL & 1671' FEL Section 19, T1S, R8W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980' FNL & 2080 FEL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.8.M, Duchesne Fee Ute 96-—-000058 102102, 962270
Fisher 2-6A3 43-013-~30984 404' FSL & 596' FEL Section 6, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Ford 2—36A5 43-013-30911 1118' FSL & 1659 FWL Section 36, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1106' FNL & 1599’ FEL Section 24, T1S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184703C 102102, 962270
Griffith 1—-33B4 43-013-30288 1307' FNL & 1512' FEL Section 33, T2S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Hansen 1-1683 43-013-30617 2088’ FSL & 1760 FWL Section 16, T28, R3W, U.8.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 1-3A1 43-013-30171 2502' FNL & 2141' FWL Section 3, T18, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uintah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 2—~4A1 43-013-30954 1678' FNL & 1520' FEL Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT080149885C701 102102, 962270
Jacobson 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104' FSL & 2417 FWL Section 12, T18, R4W, US .M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C685 102102, 962270
enkins 3—-16A3 43-013-30877 1085' FSL & 1905' FWL Section 16, T18, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96--000087 102102, 962270
.ensen 1-29Z1 43-013-30725 1331' FSL & 2424' FEL Section 29, TIN, T1W, US.M, Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 962270
Jensen 1-31AS 43-013-30186 1380 FNL & 1244' FEL Section 31, T1S, R5W, US .M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jensen 2—-29A5 43-013-30974 1085’ FSL & 1528' FWL Section 29, T18, RSW, US.M. Duchesne Fea Ute 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-15A4 43-013-30817 2417 FNL & 1514’ FEL Section 15, T18, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182' FNL & 1130' FEL Section 17, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1-34A1 43-013-30590 Section 34, T1S, R1W, US.M. Duchesne/Uintah Fee Ute VR49184694C 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 1-32B4 43-013-30308 1320' FNL & 1320° FEL Section 32, T2S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 2~-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 82, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96—-000116 102102, 962270
Linmar 1—-19B2 43-013-30600 2032' FNL & 2120' FWL Section 19, T2§, R2W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Marshall 1—20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL & 1821' FEL Section 20, T18, R3W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 862270
Morris 2—7A3 43-013-30977 2473 FSL & 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Murray 3—2A2 43-013-30816 2211' FNL & 2257’ FWL Section 2, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200' FNL & 1200' FEL Section 27, T18, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Oman 2—-32A4 43-013-30904 754' FSL & 1140 FWL Section 32, T1S, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Oman 2~4B4 43-013~30645 1536' FSL & 1849' FWL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Ouchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Powell 2-8A3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Section 8, T1S,R3W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM~715 102102, 962270

Rhodes Moon 1-35B5 43-013--30155 870" FNL & 960’ FEL Section 85, T28, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee
Rhoades Moon 1-3685 43-013-30289 Section 36, T28, R5W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy 1-9A3 43-013-30321 1491’ FNL & 1646' FEL Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102, 962270
Tiinothy 3—18A3 43-013-30840 Section 18, T18, R3W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000132 102102, 962270
Warren 1-32A4 43-013-30174 1799’ FNL & 1104’ FEL Section 82, T18, R4W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Wildlife Resources 1-33B5 43-013-30649 1804’ FNL & 1603’ FEL Section 33, T28,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08049184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson {-20Z1 43-013-30942 1623' FSL & 1509' FEL Section 20, TIN, R1W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C680 102102, 962270
Wimmer 2-2784 43~013-30941 904' FNL & 886' FWL Section 27, T28, R4W, US.M, Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270

21-Sep—94



19-Sep—-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME APl # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #
State 1-19A4 43-013-30322 985 FNL & 853 FEL Section 19, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-27912 Ute 102102, 962270
State 1 —8A3 43-013~-30286 1545’ FNL & 1489 FEL Section 8, T1IS,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-24316 Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Wainoco State 1 —14B1 43-047-30818 Section 14,T2S,R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uintah ML -2402 Ute 102102, 862270
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DIV, OF OIL, €5 & MiKING

September 21, 1994

State of Utah

Division of 0il Gas, and Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

ATTN: Leesha Cordoba

Leesha:

I have mailed off the revised list of all the FEE wells to you, as
well as the State wells.

The signed copies of the UIC Form 5’s were mailed to the State
approximately 9/12/94. Copies of the sundries sent to the BIM for
all the Indian wells were mailed to the State also on 9/19/94.

I will address the Linmar FEE and CA wells ASAP, and will talk to
our land people on 9/19 to determine the disposition of those wells
temporarily abandoned.

Thanks again for you much appreciated help.

Sincerely,

Bonnie Johnstjj2$bd{4-—‘\\\\

Environmental Coordinator
(303)573-4476

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
A SUBSIDIARY OF THE COASTAL CORPORATION
600 17THST+ STEBOOS « P O BOX 749 « DENVER £0 80201-0,49 ¢ 303 572-1121
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FORM 9 .TE OF UTAH CoE .

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING T

S@ 2 6 ’%A ’— 5‘ Lease Designation and Serial Number:
‘; \ ; &];“lee
5l e ) ‘é’/ﬁ Indian, Aliottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON EQ L. ﬁ' i Ute
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugwd andfabandméﬂwans‘ = Uit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See attached list.
1.  Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number;
OlL GAS D OTHER: See attached list.
2. Name of Operator: 9. AP! Well Number:
Linmar Petroleum Company See attached list.
3.  Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
7979 East Tufts Ave. Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, CO 80237 (303)773—8003 Altamont/Bluebell
4.  Location of Well
Footages: See attached list. County: See attached list.
QqQ, Sec., T, R, M.: State: Utah
11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
{Submit In Duplicate) {Submit Original Form Only)
[[] Abandonment [] New Construction [] Abandonment * [T] New Construction
[] Casing Repair [1 Pullor Alter Casing [] Casing Repair [] Pullor Alter Casing
[] Change of Plans [ ] Recompletion [] Change of Plans [ 7] Shoot or Acidize
[} Conversion to Injection [] Shoot or Acidize [] Conversion to Injection [T 7] Ventor Flare
[ Fracture Treat [] Ventor Flare [ ] Fracture Treat [ ] Water Shut-Off
[ ] Muitiple Completion [] Water Shut—Off [ ] Other '
[XT] Other Change of operator.
Date of work completion
- Approximate date work will start 9/8/94 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR-RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report.

c 12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detaiis, and give pertinent dates. if wellis directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

There was a change of operator on the date above for all wells on the attahced list:

OPERATOR: — FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
All operations are covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40—66A, Bond No. U6053821 and Nationwide Bond N0.962270.

13.

V.P. OF MANAGING
Name& Signatre: BY: L. M. ROHLEDER/ ;7, //7 / AZZ{QL Tite: GENERAL PARTNER pate: 9/20/94

{This space for State use only)

(12/92) {See Instructions on Reverse Side)



22-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME AP| # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

Allred 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700 FNL & 1280’ FEL Section 16, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270
Allred 2—16A3 43-013-30681 2036/ Section 16, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96000087 102102, 962270
Belcher 2-33B4 43-013-30907 2348 FNL & 1085 FWL Section 33,T2S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Brown 2-28B5 43-013-30718 1777 FSL & 1413’ FWL Section 28, T28,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96 -000068 102102, 962270
Carl Smith 2—25A4 43~013-30776 Section 25, T1ISR4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96000036 102102, 962270
Chasel 2-17A1 43~013-30732 1379’ FSL & 1360' FWL Section 17,T1S,R1W, US.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C 102102, 962270
Chasel Hackford 2 - 10A1E 43-~047-31421 1120’ FSL & 1120’ FEL Section 10,T1S,R1E, U.S.M. Uintah Fee Ute UT08014986C693 102102, 962270
Chasel Miller 2—-1A2 43~013-30360 Section 1,T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014987C685 102102, 962270
Clark 2~ 9A3 43-013-30876 Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 8C-000123 102102, 962270
Duncan 3—-1A2 43-013-31135 1097’ FSL & 702’ FWL Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S. M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014987C685 102102, 962270
Dye 1-25Z2 43-013-30659 1520’ FSL & 1520’ FEL Section 25, T1N,R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08049P84C723 102102, 962270
Fieldsted 2—-27A4 43~013-30915 1496’ FSL & 1718’ FEL Section 27, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96--000108 102102, 962270

er 1—16A4 43-013~30737 1527' FSL & 834 FEL Section 16, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672C 102102, 962270

er1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980’ FNL & 2080' FEL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96 -000058 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1—24A4 43—-013-30760 1106’ FNL & 1599 FEL Section 24, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184703C 102102, 962270
Griffith 1-33B4 43~013-30288 1307’ FNL & 1512 FEL Section 33, T2S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Horrocks 2 ~4A1 43-013~30954 1678' FNL & 1520 FEL Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014985C701 102102, 962270
Jacobson 2-12A4 43-013--30985 1104’ FSL & 2417’ FWL Section 12, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C685 102102, 962270
Jenkins 3—16A3 43-013-30877 1085 FSL & 1905’ FWL Section 16, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96—-000087 102102, 962270
Jensen 1-29Z1 43-013-30725 1331’ FSL & 2424’ FEL Section 29, TIN, T1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-15A4 43-013-30817 2417' FNL & 1514 FEL Section 15, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1—-34A1 43-013-30590 Section 34, T1S,R1W, U.S.M, Duchesne/Uintah Fee Ute VR49184694C 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 1--32B4 43-013-30308 1320’ FNL & 1320 FEL Section 32, T2S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 2—32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473’ FSL & 580 FWL Section 7, T1S, R8W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96 ~000058 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-~27A4 43-013-30064 1200’ FNL & 1200 FEL Section 27, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754 FSL & 1140 FWL Section 32, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute  NW-613 102102, 962270
Powell 2—-8A3 43-013-30979 661 FSL & 1114 FWL Section 8, T1S,R3W, U.SM. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Rhoades Moon 1-36B5 43-013-30289 Section 36,T2S,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy 1 —9A3 43-013~-30321 1491’ FNL & 1646 FEL Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102, 962270
Timothy 3~18A3 43-013~30940 Section 18, T1S8,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000132 102102, 962270
Warren 1 —32A4 43-013-30174 1799’ FNL & 1104 FEL Section 32, T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Wildlife Resources 1—33B5 43-013-30649 1804’ FNL & 1603 FEL Section 83, T2SR5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08049184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson 12021 43-013--30942 1523’ FSL & 1509’ FEL Section 20, TIN,R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C680 102102, 962270
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DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

(June 1990)

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" — for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-~0135

Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee

6. if Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. li Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

N/A

1. Type of Well

|
Oil Well Gas Well D Other

8. Well Name and No.

See attached list.

2. Name of Operator

Linmar Petroleum Company

9. AAPI Well No.

See attached list.

3. Address and Teiephone No.

7979 East Tufts Ave. Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773 -8003

0. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

See attached list.

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec.. T.. R., M., Or Survey Description)

See attached list of wells.

11. County or Parish, State

See attached list.

12, | CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

D Abandonment
!:] Recompletion
D Plugging Back
D Casing Repair
[___l Altering Casing

Other Change of Operator

Notice of Intent
D Subsequent Report

[:] Final Abandonment Notice

D Change of Plans
D New Construction

D Non—Routine Fracturing

D Water Shut—Off

I:I Conversion to Injection

D Dispose Water

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion _or Recompletion Report and Log form)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionaily

drilted, give subsurface iocations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

There will be a change of operator for all wells specified on the attached list.

OPERATOR — FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation

All operations will be covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40-66A and Bond No. U6053821, as required by the State of

Utah. S e

Vice President of

14, 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is truea/jcgl/f ~
~ 7 ;
Signed By: .%ﬂf /7/)‘ 2 ) W \ A
7

Title MBDEg]Dg General Ea]:t]E]:Date

9/1/94

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.8.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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LEASE
WELL NAME AP| # FOOTAGES LOCATION FIELD COUNTY DESIGNATION
“Alired 2—-16A3 43—-013—-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Barrett 1—-34A5 43-013-30323 713’ FNL & 1387’ FEL Section 34, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Birch 1—35A5 43-013-30233 757" FNL & 1024’ FEL Section 35, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Birch 2—35A5 43-013-30362 Section 35, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 1--25B4 43~013-30668 778 FNL & 1627’ FEL Section 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 1—27B4 43-013-30185 1244’ FNL & 1464’ FEL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 2—-35B5 43~013-30908 2432' FNL & 1648’ FWL Section 35, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Brotherson 2—3B4 43-013—-31008  1226" FSL & 1933’ FWL Section 3, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee .
~Chandler 2—5B4 43-013-31000 466’ FSL & 1180’ FWL Section 5, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee nwlig (£ ie]
Christensen 2—26A5 43-013—-30905 - 776' FSL & 1467’ FWL Section 26, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
ensen 2—8B3 43—-013-30780 1880° FSL & 1694’ FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
tensen 3—-4B4 43-013-31142 804’ FSL & 1948’ FEL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. . Altamont Duchesne Fee
Christman Blann 1-31B4 43-013-30198 1257 FNL & 1552’ FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
D. Moon 1-23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, TIN, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Uintah Fee
Ellsworth 2—8B4 43—-013-30898  1580' FSL & 1580' FWL Section 8, T2S, RAW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee -
.-Ellsworth 2984 43--013—-31138 2076’ FNL & 2543’ FWL Section 9, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Attamont Duchesne Fee ob-rois (4 u’@
Evans 1 —31A4 43-013-30067 1987' FNL & 1973' FEL Section 31, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Fisher 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609 FNL & 1671’ FEL Section 19, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Fisher 2—6A3 43—-013-30984 404’ FSL & 596' FEL Section 6, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Ford 2—36A5 43~013-30911 1113’ FSL & 1659’ FWL Section 36, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Hansen 1—-16B3 43—-013-30617  2088' FSL & 1760’ FWL Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Horrocks 1—3A1 43—-013-30171 2502' FNL & 2141’ FWL Section 3, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne/Uintah Fee
Jensen 1—31AS 43—-013-30186 1380" FNL & 1244’ FEL Section 31, T1S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jensen 2—29A5 43--013—30974 1085’ FSL & 1528' FWL Section 29, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013—-30173 1182 FNL & 1130' FEL Section 17, T1S, R4W, U.SM. Altamont Duchesne Fee ;
~Lindsay Russell 2—-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee 9L~ 0001G
Linmar 1 —1982 43-013-30600 2032’ FNL & 2120' FWL Section 19, T2S, R2W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Marshall 1 —20A3 43—-013-30193 565' FNL. & 1821' FEL Section 20, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne Fee
Murray 3—2A2 43—-013-30816 2211’ FNL & 2257' FWL Section 2, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Biuebell Duchesne Fee
2—-4B4 43—-013-30645 1536' FSL & 1849’ FWL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
des Moon 1-35B5 43—-013-30155 870" FNL & 960’ FEL Section 35, T2S, RSW, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
Wimmer 2-27B4 43—-013-30941 904’ FNL & 886’ FWL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee
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Division of 0il, Gas and Mining Routi
outi

OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET -
_ 1- =PL .1
Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. Z-LW’S‘SJ
Initia}l each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3 9-FILE
4-VLC
XXX Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent . 5-RIF V'~
O Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 6-LWP ¢~

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 9894
FROM (former operator) LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
(address) 7979 E TUFTS AVE PKWY 604

DENVER CO 80237

TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP
{(address) PO BOX 749
DENVER CO 80201-0749

phone (303 ) 572-1121 phone (303 )773-8003
account no. _NO0230 . account no. _N9523

HelT(s) (attach additional page if needed):

Name : _**SEE ATTACHED** APL:OIR-306G 13 Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
- Name: API: Entity: __Sec____Twp___Rng____ Lease Type:
Name : : API: Entity: Sec__ _Twp___Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp__ Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: : API: Entity: Sec__ _Twp__Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API:__ , Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec____Twp___Rng Lease Type:

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

‘ £ 1. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form). ,z,// y,/g,%a

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other_legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). /4. %/ 7./5,75/5

/4 3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
_ operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If

yes, show company file number:

N[/L 4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator

changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

jﬁ 5. Changes have been entered in the 0il and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
listed above. //(ﬁ;?;?

02’14496 Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. sz ./v. gy
DZ/V. Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above./p s« G

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. [/041/_@

4&&9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER -



OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

EqTITY REVIEH

Zéé,l. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity assigaments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. HWere
entity changes made? (yes/fi0) (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of
Form 6, Entity Action Form)~

AM& 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

' . 4, ¢ / { /./ 4 /- g X73 g
BOND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) /5% Sarsly “Trust Jerd s (lond Zace. b Frogress 7

o
‘g@ﬁl. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well Tisted above has furnished a
proper bond. #3@@3 Suuﬁy‘lMpZ@//i¢ﬁ¢JBs;&V’ L
¥ Upon Cerapl- o [ roading.
2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators’ bond files.

jié 3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes<§§> .
Today's date 5Zfl. ﬁ% 1994 . 1f yes, division response was made by letter
dated 19 .

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

1. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 , of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

thi 2. Cogies of do%gments have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.
70 -7 74;) S (55 near
FILMING
/1. A1l attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: \0-20 19. 9™,
FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS

?7/6’0'% Ec'//-/,hmZ Zﬂ/ /p/r/h //5721/1:1(7. h /{f/L?Ns’s?

4

' . : ) ; ./ v . /
ar uells & L(H//é /LthAMf//‘)v (// s {p,kl[i‘ﬁ'/Jﬂ c[.z,z/{

WE71/34-35



DATE: 05/06/94
ACCT COMPANY NAME
NUM

V/ﬁ§523 LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

65
55

65
55

65

55

65

55

65

55

65

55

65

55

WELLS

FIELD NAME

ALTAMONT

BLUEBELL
ALTAMONT

BLUEBELL
ALTAMONT
BLUEBELL
ALTAMONT
BLUEBELL

ALTAMONT

BLUEBELL

ALTAMONT

BLUEBELL

ALTAMONT

BLUEBELL

ALTAMONT

TOWN
SHIP

SO010
S010
SO10
S010
SO10
$020

-+ SO10

S010
5020
5020
$020
S020
NO10
S020
S020
NO10
S010
SO10
S010
S020
5010
S030
SO10
5020
NO10
SO10
S010
S010
5010
S010
SO010
SO10
S020
$020
SO10
SO10
S020
S020
S020
3010
SO10

B Y

RANGE

WO40
WOS0
w030
w020
WO50
WO40
WO30
WO 10
w020
WO30
w040
WOS50
w020
w040
w050
w010
WO10
w040
w040
[lel:le]
wo40
WO60
w040
w030
wo10
w020
w040
w030
WO30
WO30
WO30
WO30
w040
WO50
w040
w050
W0o50
w040
WOS0
w050
WO40
w040
WO30
w040
w010
w010
WOS50

OPERATOR

SEC QTR

QTR

NENE
NWNE
NWNE
SENW
NENE
SENE
SWNE
NESW
SENW

 NESW

NESW
SWNE
NWSE
NWNE
NESW
NWSE
NESW
NESE
NESE
NESW
NWNE
SWSW
NWsSw
NESW
NWSE
SENW
SWNE
NwWsw
SESW
NESW
SWNE
NESW
NESW
SESW
SWSW
SESW
NWSW
SWNW
SENW
SESW
NWSE
NESE
SENW
NWNW
NWSE
SWNE
SESW

API PROD
NUMBER  ZONE

4301330322 GR-WS
4301330323 GR-WS
4301330354 GR-WS
4301330360 GR-WS
4301330362 DUCH

4301330371 UNTA

4301330535 GR-W

4301330590 GR-WS
4301330600 GR-WS
u&§91§§9§i§>GR-ws
4301330645 GR-WS
4301330649 GR-WS
4301330659 GR-WS
4301330668 GR-WS
4301330718 GR-WS
4301330725 GR-WS
4301330732 GR-WS
4301330737 GR-WS
4301330737 GRRVL
4301330757 GR-WS
4301330760 GR-WS
4301330775 GR-WS
4301330776 GR-WS
4301330780 GR-WS
4301330813 GR-WS
4301330816 GR-WS
4301330817 GR-WS
4301330876 GR-WS
4301330877 GR-WS
4301330893 GR-WS
4301330894 GR-WS
4301330895 GR-WS
4301330898 GR-WS
4301330901 GR-WS
4301330804 GR-WS
4301330905 GR-WS
4301330906 GR-WS

4301330907 GR-WS.

4301330908 GR-WS
4301330911 GR-WS
4301330915 GR-WS
4301330936 GR-WS
4301330940 GR-WS
4301330941 GR-WS
4301330942 GR-WS
4301330954 GR-WS
4301330974 GR-WS

WELL
STATUS

ENTITY

9118
9121
5915
5830
99996
99996
1435
1440

112
9117
9117
9130
9136
9133
9137
9355
9405
9620
9345
9790
9335
9401
9402
9403
2418
9407
10045
9630
10712
9865
9404
9406
9632
10482
9633
9625
10230
9855
10040

PAGE: 209

WELL NAME

VSTATE 1-19A4 mL-277/2
ARRETT 1-34AS% fge
JTE ALLOTTED 2-18A3 yJY-20-Hl2-[S 29
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2%feg
~BIRCH WDW 2-3% FEE
RUSSELL SWD 2-32BAWFEE
FISHER 1-19AFELE
LE BEAU 1-34-A{7fFgg
» LINMAR 1-19B2, FEE"
ZCINMAR “HANSEN 1- 1688 FEE
MAN 2- ABAFEE
WILDLIFE RES. 1-33BY FEE
DYE 1-252Z2%FEE
~BROTHERSON '1-25B4 fgg
BROWN 2-28BSRFep
JENSEN 1-292% fpg
CHASEL 2-17A% peg
FISHER 1-16A4
FISHER 1~-16A4iFEE
FLANIGAN 2-14BS
GOODRICH 1-24A4. FEE
~AUTE TRIBAL 2-14C6. [4.20- }i,2-2909
CARL SMITH 2-25A& FEE
“CHRISTENSEN 2-8BIFEE
L MTE TRIBAL 1~ 30211](/,%,[./[,1 29
“MURRAY 3-2A2%fep
JESSEN 1-15A4 E
CLARK 2- 9A3ﬂFEF
JENKINS 3-16A3pFEE

-£ESLIE UTE 1-11A3v}'+20 Hb1-23979

CeB. UTE 1-13A3 1Y4- 20- Hlp2~39%0
LLAUREN UTE 1-23A3 [ 2, Hl2-39%]

ELLSWORTH 2-8Bargeg
EDWARDS 2-4B5
OMAN 2-32A4 FLE.-
“CHRISTENSEN 2-26ASvFEE
ILTZ 2-8B5:FEE
'BELCHER 2-33B4 FEEL.
“BROTHERSON 2-35B8 FEE
FORD 2-36ASY. FEL.
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 FEE
JESSEN 1-11A4
TIMOTHY 3-18A3:F5ﬁ5
VMIMMER 2-27B4 (FEE
WILKERSON 1-20Z1¢
HORROCKS 2-4At F
WIENSEN 2-29A5vpec

E



ATE OF UTAH ‘
DIVISION™S¥ OIL, GAS AND MINING
: 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new welis, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.

7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A

1. Type of Well:

oL{X] aas|[ | oTHER:

8. Well Name and Number:

Hansen #1—-16B3

2. Name of Operator:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9, API Well Number:

43-013-30617

3.  Address and Telephone Number:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201—0749

10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

Altamont

(303) 5734455

4. Location of Well

Feotages: 1760’ FWL & 2088’ FSL
Section 16—T2S—R3W

QQ, Sec,, T., R, M.:

county:  Duchesne
State: Utah

1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit in Duplicate)

[] Abandon [1 New Construction
[1 Repair Casing [C1 Pullor Alter Casing
[ 1 Change of Plans ] Recompletion
[ Convertto Injection [ Perforate

[ Fracture Treat or Acidize [ Ventor Flare
T3 Multiple Completion [] Water Shut—Off
[ ] Other

Approximate date work will start

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit Original Form Only)

[] Abandon* [] New Construction
[T} Repair Casing [] Pull or Alter Casing
[} Change of Plans [] Perforate
[] Convertto Injection [] Ventor Flare
[] Fracture Treat or Acidize [] Water Shut—Off
[X7] Other __Install Rotaflex
Date of work completion 3/15/95
Report results of Multiple Completions and R letions to different reservoirs on WELL

COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form

*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report.

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

give pertinent dates. If wellis directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

M e |

SEP 111995 r

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

T

13.

Name & Signature:

Sheila Bremer

1
Tire:_Environmental & Safety Analyst bate: 09/07/95

W@M

{This space for State use only)

/%m% y

(Glogy (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

HANSEN #1-16B3 (INSTALL ROTAFLEX) PAGE 1
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 50.872% COGC_ AFE: 14874

TD: 13,141  PBTD: 10,010°

5" LINER @ 9,774°-13,141"

PERFS: 10,320°-12,013"

CWC(M$): 158.2

3/1/95 POOH w/seal assembly & thg.
MIRU workover rig. ND WH, NU BOP. Rls 2%" seal assembly from Baker
5" pkr @ 10,150°". POOH w/160 jts 2%" thg. CC: $3,301

3/2/95 RIH w/plucker to recover pkr @ 10,150".
Finish POH w/2%" tbg & LD csg-free pump cavity. Make up Baker 44%"
pkr retrieving tool & RIH on 218 jts. Encounted heavy paraffin @
2282;6 SgiH w/mill to 5" LT @ 9774". Hot oil csg w/wlr & diesel.

3/3/95 Finish RIH w/wax knife to 5" LT @ 9774".
RIH w/pkr plucker & mill over pkr @ 10,150°. POH, rec all of pkr.
Make-up 6" wax knife. CC: $13,535

3/4/95 RIH w/mi1l & CO tools.
RIH w/6" wax knife to 5" LT @ 9774". Hot oil csg. POOH w/wax knife.
RIH w/4-Star 4%" mi1l & CO tools. CC: $18,160

3/5/95 RIH w/prod thg, hydrotest thg.
RIH w/4%" mill & CO tools to 10,010 PBTD. POH. RIH w/prod thg to
9296° . hydrotest tbg to 8500#. CC: $24,006

3/6/95 Prep to place on pump.
Finish RIH w/production thg. Set TAC @ 9483" w/SN @ 9701°. ND BOP.
Land tbg w/20,000# tension. NU WH. RIH w/1%" pump & 10 - 1", 129 -
%", 129 - %", 115 - 1" rods. Space out, seat pump. Test to 500#.
CC: $147,701

3/7/95 Well on pump, MO rig.
RD rig. Place well on pump. CC: $148,246

3/7/95 Pmpd 26 BQ, 351 BW, 10 MCF, 4.1 SPM, 21 hrs.
3/8/95 Pmpd 0 BO, 376 BW. 10 MCF. 4.1 SPM.

3/9/95 Pmpd 3 BO, 321 BW, 20 MCF, 4.1 SPM.
Ran dyno - FL @ 5417'. Will increase SPM.

3/10/95 Pmpd 54 BO, 359 BW, 43 MCF, 4.7 SPM.
3/11/95 Pmpd 56 BO, 375 BW, 38 MCF, 4.7 SPM.
3/12/95 Pmpd 52 BO, 371 BW, 62 MCF, 4.7 SPM. Will run dyno.
3/13/95 Pmpd 52 BO, 298 BW, 130 MCF, 4.7 SPM.

3/14/95 Pmpd 42 BO, 322 BW, 110 MCF, 4.7 SPM. Ran dyno - FL @ 6289, pump
efficiency 74%.

3/15/95 Pmpd 55 BO, 285 BW, 111 MCF, 4.7 SPM.
Prior prod: 15 BO, 110 BW, 15 MCF. Final report.



d LY
FQRM 9 QE OF UTAH .
DIVISION O IL, GAS AND MINING
*
' * 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number:
Fee
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drilt new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposals. N/A
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:

Hansen #1-16B3

OIL GASD OTHER:
2. Name of Operator:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. API Well Number:
43-013-30617

3. Address and Telephone Number:

P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749

10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
(303) 573-4455 Altamont

4.  Location of Well
Footages: : 1760' FWL & 2088' FSL
QQ, Sec., T, R, M.: Section 16-T2S-R3W

county:  Duchesne

State: Utah

1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit In Duplicate)

] Abandon [] New Construction
[ ] Repair Casing [] PultorAlter Casing
[ ] Change of Plans [] Recompletion

[ ] Convert to Injection [X] Perforate

E Fracture Treat or Acidize [:] Vent or Flare

{_] Multiple Completion [] Water Shut-Off
[ Other

Approximate gate work will start Upon approval

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon * New Construction

Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Perforate
Vent or Flare

Water Shut-Off

Convert to Injection

Fracture Treat or Acidize

Juodo

Other

ngouod

Date of work completion

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

ECEIVE

NOV 24 1997

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

13.
Name & Signéﬂ’?.\%&b&\/ M
4

Sheila Bremer
Tite; Environmental & Safety Analyst  Date 11/18/97

(This space for State use only})

A R




Hansen 1-16B3
Section 16 T2S R3W
Altamont Field
Duchesne County, Utah

PROCEDURE:

1. MIRU PU. POOH w/ rods and pump. ND WH. NU BOPE. Rlse TAC set @
9483'. POOH w/ tbg.

2. MIRU wireline. RIH w/ 4 1/8" GR/IB to PBTD @ 12,010". If bridges tagged
above PBTD clean out with 4 1/8" mill and C/O tools.

3. Perforate the following interval w/ 3-1/8" csg gun loaded w/ 3 JSPF, 120 degree
phasing (see attached perf detail).

10,506' - 11,987' (124, 372 holes)

Tie into Schlumberger Dual Induction Log, Run #2 dated 1/18/82.
Monitér all fluids and pressure changes.

4, RIH w/ 5" ret pkr, 2-7/8" HD workstring, 3-1/2" 9.3#, N-80 tbg. Set pkr @
about 10,100'. PT csg to 1000 psi.

5. Acidize perfs from 10,320 to 11,987 (630 holes) w/ 19,000 gals 15% HCL as per
attached treatment schedule. Hold 1000 psi on backside during job. MTP 9,000

psi.
6. Swab/flow back load and test. Rlse pkr. POOH.

7. RIH w/ pumping BHA. Call Denver for BHA design. Return well to production.



GREATER ALTAMONT FIELD
HANSON 1-16B3

Section 16; T2S; R3W

Duchesene County, Utah
UPPER WASATCH PERFORATION SCHEDULE

Schlumberger | O.W.P. Schiumberger | O.W.P. Schlumberger O.W.P.
Dual Induction| Bond Log Dual Induction| Bond Log -Dual Induction | Bond Log
SFL Log SFL Log _ SFL Log
Runs1 &2 Run #1 Runs 1 & 2 Run #1 Runs1 &2 Run #1
01/18/82 02/15/82 01/18/82 02/15/82 01/18/82 02/15/82
10,506 10,496 10,920 10,912 11,515 11,506
10,511 10,501 10,922 10,914 11,517 11,509
10,513 10,503 10,936 10,927 11,532 11,524
10,522 10,512 10,953 10,944 11,538 11,530
10,526 10,516 11,007 10,999 11,574 11,566
10,528 10,518 11,021 11,013 11,598 11,591
10,535 10,525 11,024 11,015 11,601 11,594
10,538 10,528 11,047 11,039 11,610 11,603
10,563 10,553 11,057 11,049 11,626 11,620
10,568 10,558 11,059 11,051 11,637 11,629
10,573 10,564 11,067 11,059 11,639 11,632
10,579 10,570 11,074 11,066 11,657 11,650
10,585 10,575 11,078 11,069 11,684 11,675
10,588 10,578 11,082 11,073 11,695 11,687
10,597 10,588 11,086 11,077 11,698 11,690
10,603 10,593 11,100 11,091 11,710 11,702
10,639 10,630 11,107 11,098 11,712 11,704
10,641 10,632 11,171 11,163 11,716 11,708
10,663 10,654 11,176 11,168 11,738 - 11,730
10,670 - 10,660 11,191 11,183 11,741 11,734
10,672 10,663 11,195 11,187 11,765 11,759
10,676 10,667 11,233 11,225 11,772 11,766
10,679 10,670 11,238 11,229 11,778 11,772
10,682 10,674 11,250 11,241 11,782 . 11,776
10,686 10,677 11,254 11,245 11,790 - 11,783
10,690 10,681 11,257 11,249 11,792 11,785
10,694 10,685 11,263 11,255 11,804 11,798
10,698 10,689 11,283 11,275 11,806 11,800
10,702 10,692 11,294 11,285 11,816 11,810
10,715 10,705 11,303 11,295 11,819 11,812
10,727 10,718 11,351 11,343 11,842 11,836
10,729 10,720 11,353 11,345 11,846 11,840
10,734 10,724 11,363 11,355 11,849 11,843
10,745 10,737 11,392 11,384 11,867 11,861
10,752 10,743 11,396 11,388 11,887 11,881
10,762 10,753 11,475 11,467 11,890 11,884
10,765 10,756 11,478 11,470 11,930 11,924
10,773 10,764 11,481 11,473 11,940 11,934
10,776 10,767 11,483 11,475 11,944 11,938
10,864 10,856 11,486 11,478 11,962 11,956
10,902 10,894 11,499 11,491 11,987 11,980
10,918 10,910
124 TOTAL INTERVALS

DAVID J. STEYAERT 11/7/97




Well Name: Hansen #1-16B3 . Date;: 11/12/97

Fluid Stage **% KCI Gelled 10 ppg Brine{ 15 % Acid Vol. | Ball Sealers
Description # (Gal) (Gal) (Gal) (#.Sq)

Pad 1 3,700

Acid 2 2,500 125
Divertor 3 2,000

Acid 4 , 3,500 175
Divertor 5 2,000

Acid 6 3,500 175
Divertor 7 1,500

Acid 8 4,500 225
Divertor 9 1,000

Acid 10 5,000 250

Flush 11 5,300

Totals (gals): 9,000 | 6,500 19,000 950, 1.3 S.G.
(bbls): 214 155 452

Gelled Saltwater to contain:.  _0_ppg BAF

ot e = e e - - . " o . = s - — M v T  — v w— —

_1_ppg Rock Salt

__N__Crosslinked? WF 140 gel

T mm AL e e e T e e e e e e e e o e e e A S e A e T G e e e e T e v e A e W = W e e e e . T = o m—

T e e mn e e s e e e T M e e e e e e e M s e e et T e e e e e e W o o e M e v e e e e v b o T o e . —r — — . = -

T T T T m e e h e e e e G e A e e s e et e e e e e A e e e e e = e e T e e e R e = At e S e o = - = - - -

T T T T T T T ATt e e e e e o e e e e e e e e e e e M e et et e G o = = A = e G - e o T = e = o —— = - — - -



o e
EORM sw& OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number
Fee
8. Indian, Allottee or Ttribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such purposes
N/A

8. Well Name and Number:

1. Typeof Well: GASI:‘ OTHER:
Hansen #1-16B3

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well Number:

Coastal 0i1 & Gas Cor‘dor‘ation 43-013-30617
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

3. Address and Telephone Number.

P.0. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4, |.ocation of Well
Footages: 1760° FWL & 2088° FSL County: Duchesne
aaSec. T. M- section 16-T2S-R3W Stele Utah
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
D Abandon D New Construction D Abandon* |:| New Construction
[ ] Repair Casing [ ] Pull or Alter Casing [ ] Repair Casing [ ] Pullor Alter Casing
D Change of Plans EI Recomplete D Change of Pians Perforate
[ ] convert to Injection [] Perforate [ ] convert to Injection [] ventorFiare
I:] Fracture Treat or Acidize I:I Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize |___] Water Shut-Off
[ ] Muitiple Completion [[] Water Shut-Off [] other
D Other
Date of work completion 1/30/98
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and R pletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed on the subject well.

ECEIVE

FEB 121998

ST
A
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING | { /%"/
g v

13. . Sheila Bremer

Name&SignaMK,%ﬁfw&j M\/ Tite Environmental & Safety Analyst Date 2/11/98

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

HANSEN #1-16B3 (PERF & ACIDIZE WASATCH)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 84.20%
TD: 13,141
5" @ 13,141

AFE: 27525
PBTD: 12,010'

PERFS: 10,320'-13,005'
CWC(MS): 126.7

1/6/98

1/7/98

1/8/98

1/9/98

1/10/98

1/11/98.

1/12/98

1/13/98

1/14/98

1/15/98

1/16/98

1/17/98

1/18/98

1/19/98

POOH w/27” workstring.
MIRU. Slide rotoflex back. Unseat pump. Flush tbg w/60 bbls TPW. Reseat pump, test tbg to 1000#,
ok. POOH w/rods & pump. ND WH. Rel TAC @ 9483'. NU BOP. CC: $3440.

Replace rig clutch.
SITP 75#. POOH w/2%&” prod tbg, 7" TAC & BHA. MIRU Delsco. RIH w/4%” GR, tag @ 12,150,
POOH. RD Delsco. Rig is down for clutch repair. CC: $7241. .

Replace rig clutch.

Rig repair. CC: $7885.
Replace clutch on rig. ) CC: $8580.
Replace sand line on rig. CC: $8580.

PU & RIH w/3':” N-80 thg.

MIRU Cutters. Perf interval from 11,980'-10,496' w/3%" csg gun, 3 SPF, 120° phasing.

Run #1: 11,980'-11,759', 21 shots, 0 psi, FL 7450

Run #2: 11,734'-11,491", 21 shots, 0 psi, FL 7450

Run #3: 11,478'-11,183', 21 shots, 0 psi, FL 7450

Run #4: 11,168'-10,894, 21 shots, 0 psi, FL 7400",

Run #5: 10,856'-10,660', 21 shots, 0 psi, FL 7350".

Run #6: 10,654'-10,496', 19 shots, 0 psi, FL 7300".

RD Cutters. PU & RIH w/5" HD pkr, 12 jts 274" P-110 tbg, 5% No-Go & 3'%” N-80 tbg, EOT W
3750". CC: $35,815.

MIRU Dowell.

SITP 50#. Cont to PU & RIH w/5" HD pkr, 12 jts 27%” P-110 tbg, 5%” No-Go, 319 jts 3%5” N-80. Set
5" pke @ 10,095 in 35,000# compr. Filled csg w/184 bbls TPW, test to 1000#, ok. Prep to acidize in
morning,. CC: $41,735.

Swhb.

SITP 200#, MIRU Dowell. Acdz perfs f/ 10,320 - 11,987' w/ 19,000 gals 15% HCI, 950 1.3 BS & 1
ppg RS. MIP 8460#, MIR 34 BPM; AIP 7500#, AIR 30 BPM. ISIP 3374#, 5-min 2403#, 10-min
11854, 15-min 485#. 834 BTLWR. Diversion poor. RD Dowell. RU SU. Swb 80 BLF /11 runs
(0 BO). RU rig pmp. Flush tbg w/88 BTPW. IFL 6900', FFL 5800'. SDFN. CC: $98,794

Ris pkr & POOH.
SITP 450#. RU SU, swb 85 BLF (5 BO). PH 6. IFL 6100, FFL 8100'. SDFN, CC: $103,611

L/D 3.5 thg.
500# SITP. Ris pkr. POOH w/ 3.5 tbg & L/D. SDFN. EOT @ 2799
CC: $108,968

POOH & L/D 3.5 P110 thg, XO to 2-7/8" tbg. L/D 2-7/8" P110 tbg. XO to 2-3/8" tbg. PU BHA &
RIH w/ 66 jts 2-3/8" tbg. XO to 2-7/8" tbg. RIH. SDFN. EOT @ 5215". CC: $120,398

SD Sunday.

RD slide unit.

Cont to RIH w/ 2-7/8" prod tbg & 7" TAC. ND BOP. Set 7" TAC in 22004 tension @ 9761'. Land
tbg. NU WH. Flush tbg w/ 60 bbls TPW. XO to rods service pmp. PU & RIH w/ 2" x 1-1/4" x 36'
Trico pmp & rods. Seat rod pmp @ 11,828'. Fill tbg w/ 34 bbls TPW. PT to 1000#. OK. Too windy
to RD safely. SDFN. CC: $130,691



1/20/98

1/21/98

1/22/98

1/23/98

1/24/98

1/25/98

1/26/98

1/27/98

1/28/98

1/29/98

1/30/98

RD slide rotoflex. Hang off well. Well to production. SDFN. Last report.

Pmpd 24 BO, 72 BW, 2.8 SPM, 19 hrs.

Pmpd 20 BO, 104 BW, 2.8 SPM, 24 hrs.

Pmpd 15 BO, 115 BW, 2.4 SPM, 24 hrs,

Pmpd 20 BO, 128 BW, 17 MCF, 2.7 SPM, 19 hrs.
Pmpd 20 BO, 251 BW, 17 MCF, 4.7 SPM, 24 hrs,
Pmpd 21 BO, 264 BW, 11 MCF, 4.7 SPM, 24 hrs.
Pmpd 26 BO, 266 BW, 13 MCF, 4.7 SPM, 24 hrs.
Pmpd 23 BO, 264 BW, 13 MCF, 4.7 SPM, 24 hrs,
Pmpd 20 BO, 260 BW, 16 MCF, 4.7 SPM, 24 hrs.

Pmpd 22 BO, 263 BW, 16 MCF, 4.7 SPM, 24 hrs.
Prior prod: 13 BO, 94 BW, 4 MCF. Final Report.

CC: 132,516
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AFD SERIAL NUMBER:

e e 6. IF INDIAN_ ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. URIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do nol usa this form [or proposals to drilt new wells, significanlly deepen exisling wells below current boltem-hole depth, reenter plugyed wells, or to
drilt horizontal faterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TVPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMIZ and NUMBER:
' oiLwell 1 easweiL ]  OTHER o
Exhibit "A"

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APUNUMBER:
El Paso Production 0Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OFERATOR: PHONE NUMGER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
368_South 1200 East cny Vernal state Utah zir 84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: . & L ST B T COUNTY:
QATRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: <. " - : S STATE:
’ UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

(] Acioize [ ] oeeren [ ] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

1 noTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) [] aurercasing [] FrACTURE TREAT [T] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximale dale work wil start: ] casinG rerair [] MEWCONSTRUCTION [] TEMPoRARILY ABANDON

] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operator criance [} vusinG RePAR
[] crance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [[] ventorFLARE

[] susseQuENT REPORT [[] cHance weLL name [] Pusback [] warer oisposaL

{Submit Original Form Only)
[] cHance weLL sTaTUs [T] PrODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] warersHut-oFF
Dale of work completion:

7] commmiaLe PropuUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE X] omer Name Change
[] convertweLL TveE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El1 Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
has been changed to El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JU0708

. Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
_ NAME (PLEASE PRINT, ohn T Elzner “TITLE Vice President

7'%_' onte D4 =15 -0/

/
El Paso Prdduction Oil & Gas Company '
 nave pLease PRI N\John T Blzner mme Vice President

; 7,
SIGNATURE )b—xxl 7 % — onie  Cb -/5-0/

SIGHATURE

R RECEIVED

JUN 19 200f

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

{5/2000) (See Instruclions on Reversa Side)



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State

PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTATL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

0610204

010162788

8100

DIVISION DF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

\:Lbenijb )JZWLLXQK/Q%AAAAiKMPN)
Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State
AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

DATE: 04-03-01



‘ @o003/003 .

03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4089 CORP. LAW DEPT.

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF¥
CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company™), a corporation
organized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State of
Delaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY: ,

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimous
written consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolution
proposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate of

Incorporaticn of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate of
Incorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporation be so emended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
“FIRST.” 50 that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows;

“FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company.”

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, the
stockholdets entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment in
accordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance with
the applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of the

State of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
has caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice President and attested by an
Assistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

&Vﬁ%éﬁ

i ‘David L. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE
 DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS

g-%’ ES E E VE §°% FILED 11:00 AM 03,09,/2001
010118394 ~ 0610204
HINT9 2000

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING




Division of Oil, Gas and Mining .

ROUTING ,
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4KAS”
2. CDW T 5-LPv”
3.JLT 6-FILE
Enter date after each listed item is completed
Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent
Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: ~ 3-09-2001

FROM: (O1d Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

TO: (New Operator):

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account N0230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY |SEC TWN |LEASE |WELL |WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE | STATUS
MILES 2-3B3 43-013-31261 {11102 03-02S-03W |FEE oW P
RUST 1-4B3 43-013-30063 |1575 04-02S-03W |FEE ow P
RUST 3-4B3 43-013-31070 |1576 04-02S-03W |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-5B3 43-013-30109 {1635 05-02S5-03W |FEE oW P
HANSON TRUST 2-5B3 43-013-31079 |1636 05-02S-03W |FEE oW P
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 43-013-30780 (9355 08-02S-03W |FEE OW P
MEEKS 3-8B3 43-013-31377 [11489 08-02S-03W |FEE ow P
HANSON 2-9B3 43-013-31136 [10455 09-02S-03W |FEE oW P
DOYLE 1-10B3 43-013-30187 ]1810 10-02S-03W |FEE OW P
IORG 2-10B3 43-013-31388 |11482 10-02S-03W |FEE oW P
RUDY 1-11B3 43-013-30204 1820 11-02S-03W |FEE oW P
LAZY K 2-11B3 43-013-31352 [11362 11-02S-03W |FEE ow P
JENKINS 2-12B3 (CA 96-79) 43-013-31121 |10459 12-02S-03W {FEE OwW P
FLYING DIAMOND ROPER 1-14B3 43-013-30217 [1850 14-02S8-03W |FEE ow P
LAZY K 2-14B3 43-013-31354 11452 14-02S-03W |FEE oW P
BODRERO 1-15B3 43-013-30565 ]2360 15-02S-03W |FEE oW S
LINMAR HANSON 1-16B3 43-013-30617 [9124 16-02S-03W |FEE oW P
EVANS UTE 2-17B3 (CA 96-104) 43-013-31056 |5336 17-02S-03W |FEE oW p
MYRIN 2-18B3 (CA 70814) 43-013-31297 |[11475 18-028-03W |FEE oW P
EVANS 1-19B3 (CA 96-78) 43-013-30265 |1776 19-02S-03W [FEE ow P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

YES

062112001

Business Number: 608186-0143




' . ’

If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

W

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for welis listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 07/03/2001
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 07/03/2001
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 07/03/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: Zi ! l \S 'O |
FILING:

1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso

Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change File".




STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL |:] OTHER HANSEN 1-16 B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: S. APl NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. 4301330617
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1099 18TH ST, STE 1900 .., DENVER grare GO 5, 80202 (303) 291-6400 ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FooTAGES AT sURFace: 2088’ FSLL AND 1760' FWL county: DUCHESNE
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 29 3w STATE:

UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE
NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

CHANGE TUBING

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL NAME

CHANGE WELL STATUS
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

oooogoodn

CONVERT WELL TYPE

ROOOUOOo4do

DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR
PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

oooooaonoo

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12,

DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATION TO RECOMPLETE THE WELL CAPTIONED ABOVE. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED

PROGNOSIS.

e wo ccé&e&?erh 934" 4o [o)t{’ﬂ'

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR

Date: [p * 2 (* 20X
Initials: ‘46

name (pLease PNy FAURA WILT

REGULATORY ANALYST

TITLE

SIGNATURE " 1 '(\’\}J“\Jl L{\ (\,Lw ( /Q_Q

6/13/2008

DATE

N

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED BY THE STATE
OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OlL, GAS, AND MINING

0%

(5/2000)

See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
JUN 15 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MiNING



A e Exploration
e' pasﬁ A Production

Recompletion Procedure

Hansen 1-16B3

To
Plugback and Propant Frac the Lower Green River

Section 16, T2S, R3W
Altamont-Blue Bell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Prepared by:

Doug Sprague date

Approved by:

David Jaksik date

Distribution (Approved copies):
Doug Sprague

David Jaksik

David Benton

Well File (Central Records)
Altamont Office (Well Files)




Recompletion Procedure
Hansen 1-16B3
Section 16, T2S, R3W
Altamont-Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

COMPANY PERSONNEL

Title

Name Office Mobile Home

Production Manager

David Jaksik

(713) 420-6133

(832) 444-8491

(281) 225-8065

Production Engineer

Doug Sprague

(303) 291-6433

(303) 957-6176

(303) 627-4970

Production Foreman

Gary Lamb

(435) 454-4224

(435) 823-1443

(435) 454-3537

TUBULAR DATA

Burst Col Body Jt Drift Cap
Material Description {100%) | (100%) | Yield | Yield ID ID CFILF TOC

Surface 9 5/8” 36# J-55 @ 2,484 3520 2020 564 453 9.921 | 8.765 4340 SURF
Casing
Intermediate 7" 29# N&L-80t0 6,413 & 8160 7020 676 587 | 6.184 | 6.059 .2085 8,450
Casing 32# N&L-80 to 10,002’ 9060 8610 745 | 661 | 6.094 | 5969 | .2025 (CBL)
Production 5" 18# P-110 @ 9,774 to 13940 13450 580 606 | 4.276 | 4.151 .0997 12,030
Liner 13,147 (CBL)
Production 2-7/8” 6.5# N-80 8rd 10570 11160 2.441 | 2.347 .0325
Tubing

1. MIRU workover rig. Load well with TPW. POOH and lay down rods and pump.
2. ND wellhead. NU and test BOP. POOH with tubing. Lay down BHA.

3. RIH with 6” bit, 7” casing scraper and DC’s and clean wellbore to top of liner
(9,774’). Circulate well clean. POOH.

4. RIH with 4 1/8” bit, 5" casing scraper and DC’s and clean liner to 10,550’
Circulate well clean. POOH.

5. RU EL. RIH and set 5” CIBP at 10,500’. Dump 10’ of cement on top. RD EL.

6. Pressure test casing to 1,500 psi. If leak is detected, isolate with packer.
Establish breakdown. Design squeeze job based on breakdown data and
squeeze leak. Dirill out and test squeeze. Circulate hole clean. POOH laying
down tubing.




10

11

12.

13.

14.

15.

Pick up treating packer with circulating port and RIH with 4 15" frac string. Set
packer at 9,575't. Test frac string to 8,500 psi.

RU EL w/ 5K lubricator and test to 5,000 psi with water. RIH and shoot the
intervals of Stage # 1 per the attached schedule with 3-1/8" HSC, 22.7 gm
charges, SPF as noted and 120° phasing. Perforate first interval under 500 psig
surface pressure. Record any changes in fluid level or wellhead pressure while
perforating. RD WL unit. Lay and stake hardline to pit, NU chokes on casing
valves.

Ml and RU stimulation company and wellhead isolation tool.

Break down perforations with 5 drums of Baker Petrolite WLC821 and 3 drums of
PAO108 mixed with 20 barrels of diesel followed by 5,000 gallons 15% HCI acid
at 20 to 30 bpm. Run 140 Bio-Balls (brown or green color) sealers evenly
dispersed in the acid. Maximum allowable surface pressure is 8,500 psi.
Anticipated frac gradient is 0.75 psi/ft. Acid to contain both corrosion and
scale inhibitor. Bottom hole static temperature is 171° F at 10,144’ (Mid perf).
Overflush acid 10 bbls to bottom perf with 2% KCIi water. Shut down. lIsolate
well head and continue to monitor well head pressure with stimulation company’s
data recorder for 15 minutes. Surge ball sealers. Leave well shut in for 60
minutes total to allow Bio-Balls to dissolve. Remove ball guns from treating line
and re-pressure test treating line to 9,500 psig during shut in period. Acid and
flush fluids are to contain 2.0 gpt MA-844.

Pump the Stage # 1 crossiinked gel frac treatment with 150,000 lbs 20/40
CarboProp per the attached schedule. Ali frac water to contain biocide, scale
inhibitor, and 2.0 gpt MA-844 furnished by the frac company. Heat the 2% KCI
water to achieve +/- 120°F the day of the frac. Tag job with three RA isotopes.
RA #1 in 100 mesh; RA #2 in 1.0 and 2.0 psa; RA #3 in 3.0 and 4.0 psa.
Designed pump rate is ramped up to 65 bpm; maximum surface pressure is to
be 8,500 psi. Mark flush at 1.0 psa on wellhead densiometer and flush to top
perf. Record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 minute pressures. Isolate pump trucks from
wellhead, rig down isolation tool.

Flow test well for 24 hours recording hourly rates and pressures. [f well flows,
run ProTechnics TRACER AND PRODUCTION LOG over frac stage.

Open circulating port and kill well. Release treating packer and POOH laying
down frac string.

Run production assembly based on well productivity.

Once production equipment has been run, release all rental equipment, RD &
MO WO rig and clean location. Turn well over to pumper and turn to sales



Design Treatment Schedule

Stage | Stage Type |Elapsed Fluid Clean | Prop | Prop | Stage | Slurry | Slurry | Proppant
# Time Type Volume [Conc 1|Conc 2| Prop. |Rate 1| Rate 2 Type
min:sec (gal) | (ppg) | (ppg) | (kibs) | (bpm) | (bpm)
Wellbore Fluid 2% KCL | 6831
1 Main frac 1:35 XL 2000 | 0.00 o0.00 0.0| 30.00| 30.00
pad
2 Main frac 7:59 XL 12500 | 0.50; 0.50 6.3| 30.00 65.00 100-Mesh
pad
3 Main frac 8:43 XL 2000 | 0.00 0.00 0.0| 65.00| 65.00
pad
4 Main frac 12:31 XL 10000 | 1.00 1.00 10.0| 65.00| 65.00CarboProp
slurry -20/40
5 Main frac 17:26 XL 12500 | 2.00 2.00] 25.0| 65.00 65.00/CarboPropl
slurry -20/40
6 Main frac | 23:32 XL 15000 | 3.00 3.00 45.0| 65.00| 65.00CarboProp
slurry -20/40
7 Main frac | 30:53 XL 17500 | 4.00 4.00 70.0| 65.00/ 65.00/CarboProp
slurry -20/40
8 Main frac | 33:15] LINEAR | 6435 | 0.00, 0.00 0.0| 65.00] 65.00
flush 20
Design clean volume (bbls) 1855.6 Design proppant pumped (kibs) 156.3
Design slurry volume (bbls) 1993.9
Casing Configuration
Length Segment Type Casing ID Casing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
6413 Cemented 6.184 7.000 29.000f N-80
Casing
3589 Cemented 6.094 7.000 32.000f N-80
Casing
3367 Cemented 4.276 5.000 18.000; P-110
Casing
Surface Line and Tubing Configuration
Length Segment Type Tubing ID Tubing OD Weight Grade
(ft) (in) (in) (Ib/ft)
9600 Tubing 3.958 4.500 12.750] N-80

Total frac string volume (bbis)

Pumping down

Tubing

162.6




Perforated Intervals

Interval #1 Interval #2 Interval #3 Interval #4

Top of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9818 9999 10126 10352

Bot of Perfs - TVD (ft) 9950 10017 10322 10471

Top of Perfs - MD (ft) 9818 9999 10126 10352

Bot of Perfs - MD (ft) 9950 10017 10322 10471

Perforation Diameter (in) 0.340 0.340 0.340 0.340

# of Perforations 27 18 24 24

Path Summary
Segment Length MD TVD Dev Ann OD AnnID Pipe ID

Type (ft) (ft) (ft) (deg) (in) (in) (in)

Tubing 9600 9600 9600 0.0 0.000 0.000 3.958
Casing 174 9774 9774 0.0 0.000 0.000 6.094
Casing 578 10352 10352 0.0 0.000 0.000 4.276




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
Fee
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS o I7 INDIAR, ALLOTTEE OR TRISE NAME:

. - 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
IL WELL AS W
° L G L Hansen 1-16B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, LP 4301330617
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1099 18th Street, Ste. 1900 .., Denver stare CO 5 80202 (303) 291-6400 Green River - Wasatch
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 2088' FSL & 1760' FEL county: Duchesne
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NESW 16 T2S R3wW STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] Acioize [] opeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[ nNoTicE oF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [ Atercasme [T] FrACTURE TREAT [] sioeTrRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: |:| CASING REPAIR |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION [:I TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[ cHanee To Previous PLANS [C] oreraTOR cHANGE [] tuemnererar
[ craneE TuBiNG [] PLue AND ABANDON [] ventorFLARE
[/l suBsEQUENT REPORT [0 cHance wew nave [ Prussack [] wareroisrosaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[[] chaneeweLL sTATUS [[] ProbUCTION (START/RESUME) [] water sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [0 RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ orher:
[T] convertweLL Tvpe [/] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Operator performed the following work on the subject well between 5/14/08 and 6/8/08:

TOOH W/ RODS, PUMP AND TBG. SET CIBP AT 10500' DUMP BAIL 10' CMT ON TOP OF PLUG. SET 5" CIBP AT 10485'
DUMP BAIL 10' CMT ON TOP OF CIBP. TOP OF CMT AT 10475'. REPLACE TBGHEAD. PRES TEST. PREFORATE 3
INTERVALS OF LOWER GREEN RIVER FORMATION 10461-10289', 10270-9994' and 9985-9807' - 654' TOTAL, 93
SHOTS. SET PKR AT 9368' PRES TEST TO 1000 PSI. PUMP 840 GAL DIESEL/CHEM FLUSH AHEAD OF 5586 GALS 15%
HCL W/ 50 BIO-BALLS. FLUSHED W/ 158 BBLS 25KCL. FRAC WELL - TOTAL OUT 1383804# (6280# 100 MESH 132 100#
PROPPANT 20/40 SINTERLITE) OPEN WELL FOR FLOWBACK. CIRC WELL CLEAN. RIH WITH 2-8/8" TBG. RIH W/ RODS.
SEAT PUMP. PRESSURE TEST WELL. HUNG WELL ON. POP 7/2//08.

e PRODUCTION TECHNICIAN

6/26/2008

DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
JUL 07 2008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS 2 INING

(5/2000) {See Instructions on Reverse Side)



.

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 . Houston, TX. 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038
CA No. Unit: N/A
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNGJAPI NO ENTITY [LEASE TYPE|WELL [|WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
See Attached List |
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012

COMMENTS:

Disposal and Injections wells will be moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis 6/29/2012




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
Multiple Leases

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposgis.

7. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
7
OIL WELL GasWELL []  OTHER See Attached
Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana iy Houston srate VX 7 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [ oeeeen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/] NoTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) M) auTER CASING [C] FracTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wit start:. | [ ]  CASING REPAIR [] wnewconsTRuCTION [C] veEMPORARILY ABANDON

[T] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE "] vueinG REPAIR
[J cHance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [7] ventorFLARE

[0 sussequent RepoRT ] crance weLL NaME [J pLuceack [[] warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comMmINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [_] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: Change of
[ converT weLL TYPE [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JU0705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Falle Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME (pLasm. Gomez mme Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE 6 : M oave  0/22/2012

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED (» /29/30IQ JUN 25 2012
Roahed

(moobivis‘-on of 0“’ Gas and Mining - (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene-Russell, Engineering Techiiiclan: ...
Rachet Modirm




El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well [Well
Well Name ___ |Sec 'TWP RNG |API Number Entity Lease Type Type |Status Conf
DWR 3-17C6 747 030S [060W 4301350070 14204621118 |OW __ APD _ [C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S [060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD |C
YOUNG 3-15A3 15 |010S [030W 4301350122 FEE OW |APD [C
WHITING 4-1A2 01 |010S [020W |4301350424 Fee oW |APD [C |
EL PASO 4-34A4 34 010S [040W 4301350720 Fee OW APD [C
YOUNG 2-2B1 02 020S |010W (4304751180 FEE OW APD C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-10B4 10 |020S [040W 4301350712 |18221 [Fee OW [DRL C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-26B4 26 |020S [040W 4301350714 |18432 [Fee OW |DRL € |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 [020S |040W 4301350717 |18315 |Fee OW DRL C
Cook 4-14B3 - 14 [020S |030W 4301351162 |18449 |Fee OW [DRL [C
Peterson 4-22C6 22 |030S |060W 4301351163 18518 [Fee OW [DRL [C |
Lake Fork Ranch 4-14B4 14 020S [040W [4301351240 (99999 |Fee OW |DRL [C
Melesco 4-20C6 - 20 [030S |060W 4301351241 [99999 |Fee OW |DRL _C |
Peck 3-13B5 113 [020S |050W |4301351364 (99999 [Fee OW DRL [C |
Jensen 2-9C4 09 [030S [040W |4301351375 (99999 [Fee OW [DRL C |
El Paso 3-5C4 105 0305 [040W 4301351376 | 18563 |Fee OW DRL [C |
ULT 6-31 31 |030S |020E 4304740033 FEE oW LA ]
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 |010S |010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 |030S |060W 4301351433 [14-20-H62-4724 OW _ [NEW |C
Lake Fork Ranch 5-2384 23 [020S [040W 4301350739 Fee OW [NEW ]
Duchesne Land 4-10C5 10 |030S |050W [4301351262 Fee OW [NEW C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 |020S [030W 4301351374 _ |Fee oW INEW [C
Layton 4-2B3 - 02 |020S |030W 4301351389 Fee OW |NEW [C |
Golinski 4-24B5 ]24 |020S [050W [4301351404| Fee = [OW [NEW [C
Alba 1-21C4 21 |030S [040W 4301351460 Fee OW |NEW [C
Allison 4-19C5 19 |030S [050W 4301351466 Fee OW |NEW [C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 [020S [030W 4301351486 Fee OW |NEW C |
Allen 4-25B5 25 |020S |050W 4301351487 Fee OW NEW [C |
Hewett2-6C4 |06 |030S [040W 4301351489 Fee OW INEW [C |
Young 2-7C4 - 07 |030S [040W 4301351500 __ |Fee oW T INEW € ]
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 [010S |010E (4304752471 Fee oW INEw [C ]
Hamaker 3-25A1 |25 |010S [010W 4304752491 __ |Fee OW [NEW [C |
Boiton 3-29A1E B 29 [010S [010E |4304752871 Fee OW [NEW C
HORROCKS 5-20A1 ~ 120 |010S [010W [4301334280 |17378 FEE OW _OPS [C |
DWR 3-19C6 } 19 [030S [060W [4301334263 17440 |14-20-462-1120 OW [P
DWR 3-22C6 f‘* 22 |030S [060W |4301334106 |17298 |14-20-462-1131 [OW P ]
DWR 3-28C6 - 28 030S |060W 4301334264 | 17360 | 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 - - 07 |010S [020W 4301330025 5850 |14-20462-811 OW P ]
UTE 2-17C6 17 |030S [060W [4301331033 10115 |14-20-H62-1118 OW P
WLR TRIBAL 2-19C6 119 0305 |060W [4301331035 | 10250 |14-20-H62-1120 OW [P B
CEDARRIM 10-A-15C6 115 [030S |060W 4301330615 6420 |14-20-H62-1128[OW P | |
CEDAR RIM 12A ] 28 |030S |060W |4301331173 10672 [14-20-H62-1323 OW [P ]
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 B 33 [030S |060W [4301331123 |10365 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |P
TAYLOR3-34C6 ~ 134 030S [060W [4301350200 17572 1420H621329 |[OW [P -
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 134 |030S |060W 14301332634 | 14590 |14-20-H62-1329 |OW P T
UTE3-3522K 35 |010N |020W 4301331133 | 10483 |14-20-H62-1614 [OW P | |
UTE 1-3222 |32 |010N[020W 4301330379 1915 |14-20-H62-1702'OW P o
UTE TRIBAL 1-3322 B 133 010N 020W 4301330334 |1851 |14-20-H62-1703 OW [P ]
UTE 2-3322 - 133 010N |020W 4301331111 10451 |14-20-H62-1703/OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422 |34 [010N[020W (4301331167 10668 |14-20-H62-1704 OW [P j
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 [020S |040W |4301334262 17439 |14-20-H62-1743 OW [P ]
UTE 1-28B4 T 1287]020S|040W 4301330242 1796 |14-20-H62-1745OW P | |
UTE 1-34A4 3 /34 1010S [040W 4301330076 |1585 |14-20-H62-1774 OW [P i
UTE 1-36A4 ] |36 [010S [040W 4301330069 1580 |14-20-H62-1793[OW [P
UTE 1-1B4 - 101 |020S [040W |4301330129 |1700 |14-20-H62-1798 [OW [P ]
UTE 1-31A2 '31_1010S [020W [4301330401 1925 [14-20-H62-1801 OW P
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El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE 1-25A3 25 |010S [030W 4301330370 1920 |14-20-H62-1802 | OW [P

UTE 2-25A3 - |25 0105 |030W 4301331343 [11361 |14-20-H62-1802[OW [P
UTE1-26A3 ] 126 "|010S [030W [4301330348 |1890 |14-20-H62-1803[OW [P

UTE 2-26A3 26 |010S [030W (4301331340 |11349 [14-20-H62-1803 OW P ]
UTE TRIBAL 4-35A3 135 [010S |030W 4301350274 [18000 [1420H621804 OW P C |
[UTE 2-35A3 T |35 |010S|030W 4301331292 11222 |14-20-H62-1804 [OW [P |
UTE 3-35A3 _ 35 |010S [030W [4301331365 |11454 [1420-H62-1804 OW P |
UTE 1-6B2 o ~ 106 |020S [020W 4301330349 1895 |14-20-H62-1807 [OW [P

UTE 2-6B2 ~ 706 |020S [020W 4301331140 [11190 | 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-6B2 ) 06 |020S[020W |4301350273 | 18008 |14-20-H62-1807 OW P c
POWELL 4-19A1 - 19 |010S [010W 4301330071 8302 |14-20-H62-1847 [OW [P

COLTHARP 12721 i 27 010N |010W [4301330151 |4700 |14-20-H62-1933 |[OW P~ | |
UTE 1-8A1E T 08 |010S |010E 14304730173 [1846 |14-20-H62-2147 OW P T
UTE TRIBE 1-31 31 |010N |020W (4301330278 |4756 |14-20-H62-2421|[OW P T
UTE 1-28B6X i 28 |020S |060W |4301330510 |11165 |14-20-H62-2492 [OW P ]
RINKER 2-21B5 21 |020S |050W [4301334166 |17299 |14-20-H62-2508 OW [P | |
MURDOCK 2-34B5 |34 [020S [050W [4301331132 |10456 |14-20-H62-2511/OW P |
UTE 1-35B6 35 |020S [060W 4301330507 2335 |14-20-H622531 [OW P | |
'UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 |010S [010E |4304730829 (860 |14-20-H622658 OW P |
UTE 2-17A1E B 17 1010S [010E |4304737831 16709 |14-20-H622658 [OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-27AE 27 [010S |010E 4304730421800 |14-20-H62-2662 |OW P i
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E " I35 [010S|010E [4304730286 (795 |14-20-H62-2665OW P _
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E |15 |010S [010E [4304730820 850 |14-20-H622717 OW _ |P )
UTE TRIBALP-3B1E |03 |020S |010E |4304730190 4536 |14-20-H622873[OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E ) |22 ]010S [010E 4304730429810 |14-20-H62-3103/oW P |
B H UTE 1-35C6 I35 |030S|060W [4301330419 10705 [14-20-H62-3436 OW |P |
BH UTE 2-35C6 7|35 [030S [060W |4301332790 | 15802 | 14-20-H62-3436 [OW P |
MCFARLANE 14D6 ] " |04 |040S [060W [4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452[OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 i 11 /040S [060W 4301330482 (6415 |14-20-H62-3454 OW P |
CARSON 2-36A1 36 |010S |010W 4304731407 737 |14-20-H62-3806 OW P )
UTE 2-14C6 7714 [030S [060W 4301330775 |9133 |14-20-H62-3809 [OW [P B
DWR 3-14C6 114 [030S |060W |4301334003 [17092 |14-20-H62-3808 OW P |
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 [010S |010W 4301330935 [9461 |14-20-H62-3855 OW P ]
BADGER-SAM H UMONGUS 1-15A1 (15 _|010S |010W 4301330949 [9462 |14-20-H62-3860 OW P | |
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE 14-1 14 [010S [030W 4301330726 |8437 |14-20-H62-3868 [OW P |
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 122 p10S [010W 4301330781 [0460 [14-20-H62-3880 .OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 30 |010N |010W [4301330813[9405 |14-20-H62-3910 OW P =
UTELB1-13A3 13 |010S [030W [4301330894 9402 |14-20-H62-3980([OW P 1
UTE 2-22B6 B |22 [020S '060W 4301331444 11641 [14-20-H62-4614 OW P ]
UINTAOURAY 1-1A3 o1 [010S 030W 4301330132 5540 |14-20-H62-4664 OW P |
UTE 1-6D6 ] 06 |040S |060W [4301331696 |12058 |14-20-H62-4752 |OW  |P

UTE 2-11D6 111 |040S |060W (4301350179 |17667 |1420H624801 |OW P T
UTE 1-15D6 ) o 15 [040S |060W 4301330429 | 10958 [14-20-H62-4824 OW P | |
UTE 2-15D6 15 |040S [060W 4301334026 (17193 |14-20-H624824 OW P o
HILL 3-24C6 " |24 |030S |060W 4301350293 [18020 | 1420H624866 | OW  |P C
BARCLAY UTE 2-24C6R "~ 724 |030S |060W |4301333730 | 16385 [14-20-H62-4866 [ OW P o
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 "oz ]020S |040W |4301330062 |1570 |FEE ow P T ]
BOREN 1-24A2 |24 010S|020W [4301330084 |5740 |[FEE ow p I
FARNSWORTH1-1385 13 1020S [050W 4301330092 [1610 |FEE ow P I ]
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 121 |020S |060W 4301330100 1595 |FEE ow P ]
ASAY E J 1-20A1 20 [010S |010W 4301330102 [8304 |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-6B3 05 |020S [030W [4301330109 (16356 |[FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 B 08 |020S [040W 4301330112 16556 |FEE ow P |~
ELLSWORTH1-9B4 ~ ""109 [020S |040W 4301330118 1660 |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 ) 17 |[020S [040W [4301330126 1695 |FEE ow P | ]
CHANDLER 1-5B4 ~ o5 [020S [040W [4301330140 |1685 FEE ow P
[HANSON 1-32A3 32 [010S[030W 4301330141 |1640 |FEE oW P i
JESSEN 1-17A4 117 [070S [040W (4301330173 |4725 |FEE ow P
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El Paso E3 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

JENKINS 1-1B3

01 [020S [030W [4301330175[1790 |FEE ow P
GOODRICH1-2B3 |02 |020S |030W |4301330182 |1765 FEE ow [P ]
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 19 |020S [040W 4301330183 |1760 |[FEE ow [P )
DOYLE 1-10B3 10 [020S |030W [4301330187 (1810 [FEE |OW P B
JOS.SMITH1-17C5 |17 _|030S [050W |4301330188 |5510 |[FEE ow p |
RUDY 1-11B3 o 11 [020S [030W 4301330204 |1820 |FEE oW P
CROOK 1-6B4 - 06 |020S |040W (4301330213 1825 |FEE ow P B
HUNT 1-21B4 ) 121 |020S |040W (4301330214 [1840 |FEE ow P
LAWRENCE 1-30B4 30 [020S |040W 4301330220 (1845 |[FEE ow [P B
YOUNG 1-29B4 |29 ]020S |040W 4301330246 1791 FEE =~ OW P
GRIFFITHS 1-33B4 133 1020S |040W [4301330288(4760 [FEE ~ OW P ﬂ
POTTER 1-2B5 02 [020S |050W [4301330293 (1826 |FEE oW P B
BROTHERSON 1-26B4 |26 [020S [040W [4301330336/1856 [FEE oW P | |
SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 |010N |010W 4301330355(765 [FEE ~ OW P ]
[POTTER 1-24B5 24 |020S |050W 4301330356 |1730 |FEE oW P
WHITEHEAD 1-22A3 o 22 |010S |030W |4301330357 1885 FEE ow [P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 101 ]010S |020W [4301330360/5830 FEE =~ OW P B
ELDER 1-13B2 113 |020S |020W 4301330366 (1905 FEE ~~ OW P B
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 |10 |020S [040W [4301330443 |1615 |[FEE ow |p B
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330470(1935 [FEE oW P B
TEW 1-15A3 - 15 _|010S |030W 4301330529/1945 FEE __~ OW [P )
UTE FEE 2-20C5 - 20 [030S |050W [4301330550 4527 |[FEE low |
HOUSTON 1-34Z1 - 34 010N |010W [4301330566 (885 |FEE ow P
GALLOWAY 1-18B1 ) ~ 118 |020S |010W 4301330575 [2365 FEE ow P [ ]
SMITH 1-31B5 ] 31 1020S |050W [4301330577 [1955 |FEE oW P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 ] 134 1010S |010W [4301330590(1440 FEE =~ OW P |
LINMAR 1-19B2 ) 19 |020S |020W 14301330600 (9350 |FEE ow P ]
WISSE 1-28Z1 B |28 |010N [010W (4301330609 (905 |FEE ow p |
POWELL 1-21B1 ] 21 |020S [010W 4301330621 (910 |FEE ow |p |
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S |030W 4301330629 2390 [FEE ow P
OMAN 2-4B4 ] 04 [020S [040W |4301330645/9125 [FEE ~ |OW P )
DYE 1-2522 |25 010N |020W [4301330659/9111 [FEE ~~  OW P
H MARTIN 1-21Z1 21 |010N [010W 4301330707 |925 |FEE ow P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 i 29 |010N|010W [4301330725/9110 [FEE ~ |OW [P
CHASEL 2-17A1V |17 |o10S |010W 4301330732/9112 FEE OW P |
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 B 27 |010S |010W |4301330758/940 [FEE =~ |ow P |
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 08 [020S |030W [4301330780 |9355 |FEE ow p |
LAMICQ 2-5B2 05 [020S [020W [4301330784 [2302 |FEE ow P ]
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 |020S |[040W '4301330815 10450 FEE =~ Oow P = |
MURRAY 3-2A2 |02 Jo10S 020w [4301330816/9620 [FEE =~~~ Oow [P ' |
HORROCKS 2-20A1 V 20 |010S |010W 4301330833 |8301 |FEE ow P N
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 ] 02 020S [040W [4301330855 8420 |FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 |08 |020S [040W |4301330898 [2418 |FEE ow p | ]
OMAN 2-32A4 - 132 _|010S |040W [4301330904 (10045 |[FEE ow [, |
BELCHER 2-33B4 33 |020S |040W 4301330907 (9865 [FEE =~ OW P
BROTHERSON2-35B5 35 |020S 050W |4301330908/9404 FEE =~ oW P =
HORROCKS 24A1 T - |04 |010S |010W |4301330954 9855 [FEE ow P
JENSEN229A5 29 '010S [050W 4301330974 [10040FEE OW P ]
UTE 2-34A4 |34 |010S [040W [4301330978 [10070/FEE  |OW P )
CHANDLER 2-5B4 |05 _|020S [040W (4301331000 [10075]FEE ~ |OW P ]
BABCOCK 2-12B4 |12 020S [040W |4301331005/10215[FEE ~OW P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 |29 |010S [010W [4301331013/9463 FEE =~ |OW P |
BLEAZARD 2-18B4 |18 [020S ;040W 4301331025 |1566 |FEE __ow P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 |32 1020S |050W 4301331036 |10216 |FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 020S |040W 4301331046 (10217 [FEE  |OW [P |
RUST 3-4B3 ... |04 |020S 030W 4301331070 1576 |[FEE = |OW P _
HANSON TRUST 2-32A3 32 |010S |030W 4301331072 1641 |FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-11B4 '11_1020S [040W 4301331078 [1541 [FEE ow__ P
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El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSON TRUST 2-6B3 05 [020S [030W [4301331079]1636 [FEE _|OW P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 |020S 040W (4301331103 /1771 [FEE ~ ow P |
MONSEN 2-27A3 27 010S1030W (4301331104 1746 |FEE ow [P
ELLSWORTH2-19B4 19 1020S [040W |4301331105|1761 FEE _OW P |
[HUNT2:21B4 " "121 [020S |040W (4301331114 [1839 |FEE _ow P )
JENKINS2-1B3 01 |020S |030W 4301331117 [1792 [FEE low P |
POTTER2-24B5 - 24 |020S [050W 4301331118/1731 FEE  Jow P T N
POWELL2-13A2K - 13 |010S |020W |4301331120 |8306 |FEE ow P I
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 |020S |030W [4301331121 10459 [FEE ow |
MURDOCK 2-26B5 |26 |020S |050W [43013311241531 (FEE oW P | |
BIRCH3-2785 127 |020S |050W (4301331126 [1783 FEE Cjow P
ROBB 2-29B5 - ~ 129 1020S [050W |4301331130 |10454 [FEE ow P 1
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 [020S|040W 4301331134 [10452 [FEE T jow [P |
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K T 01 |010S |020W [4301331135 10484 |FEE ow P ]
[HANSON 2-9B3 T 09 |020S [030W [4301331136 |10455 [FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 |09 10208 [040W 4301331138 10460/ FEE OW P | |
UTE 2-31A2 o 31 |010S |020W |4301331139 | 10458 |FEE OW"WE“" o
POWELL 2-19A1 K 19 |010S |010W (4301331149 8303 |FEE low P T
CEDAR RIM 8-A - 22 7]030S |060W |4301331171|10666 [FEE Tow P ]
POTTER 2-6B4 - 06 |020S [040W [4301331249 11038 [FEE ow P | |
MILES 2-1B5 ~ o1 |020S |050W |4301331257 (11062 |FEE ~ low P ]
MILES 2-3B3 - 03 [020S |030W 4301331261 |11102)FEE OW [P

MONSEN 2-22A3 122 |010S |030W 4301331265 | 11098 |FEE _ ow P

WRIGHT 21385 ~ ]13 |020S |050W 4301331267 (11115 FEE  [OW [P | |
TODD2-21A3 21 |010S [030W [4301331296 | 11268 |FEE Clow P [
WEIKART 22084 |29 020S040W[4301331298[11332|FEE  |OW P ]
YOUNG 2-15A3 |15 |010S [030W |4301331301 |11344 [FEE low P B
CHRISTENSEN 2-29A4 B |29 1010S1040W 4301331303 [11235[FEE [oW P | B
BLEAZARD 2-28B4 - 28 |020S |040W [4301331304 |11433 [FEE ow P ]
REARY 2-17A3 ~ |17 |010S[030W 4301331318 [11251 |FEE ow P ]
LAZY K 2-11B3 |11 _|020S[030W |4301331352 11362 FEE oW P | |
[AZYK2-14B3 14 |020S030W 4301331354 [11452/FEE  |[OW IE‘: L
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 13 |020S |020W [4301331357 | 11374 |FEE Tow P T
LAKE FORK 3-15B4 |15 |020S |040W [4301331358 | 11378 [FEE ______|[OW P N
STEVENSON 3-20A3 T 129 |010S030W 4301331376 11442 FEE ___OW P I
MEEKS3-883 B ”498 020S 030W |4301331377 11489 FEE | ow P |
ELLSWORTH 3-20B4 120 1020S[040W 4301331389 (11488 FEE  |low P | ]
DUNCAN 5-13A2 - 13 |010S |020W 4301331516 |11776 [FEE ow P ]
OWL 3-17C5 17 _[030S |050W 4301332112 [12476 FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-24B4 ] 124 ]020S '040W |4301332695[14652|[FEE ~ |OW P :
BODRERO 2-15B3 |15 |020S |030W |4301332755|14750 FEE =~ oW P |
BROTHERSON 2-25B4 |25 ]020S |040W [4301332791 [15044 [FEE ow p T
CABINLAND 2-16B3 16 |020S [030W 4301332914 15236 [FEE = |OW [P 7
KATHERINE 3-29B4 ~ 129 [020S [040W 4301332923 [15331 [FEE ow |p |
SHRINERS 2-10C5 ~ /10 |030S |050W [4301333008 [15908 |FEE ~low P ﬂ ]
BROTHERSON 2-26B4 126 |020S [040W [4301333139/17047 FEE oW [P T ]
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 '32 |010S |020W |4301333211 15720 |FEE Clow
FERRARINI3-27B4 127 [020S 040W 4301333265 15883/FEE =~ |OW P | -
RHOADES 2-25B5 - 25 1020S |050W [4301333467 16046 [FEE ow P j
CASE 2-3184 - /31 |020S |040W 4301333548 | 16225 |FEE T low P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 Wi#zj 020S [030W 4301333616 (16284 FEE ow P | _
SPROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 |18 |020S |010W [4301333808 [16677 [FEE ow P L]
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 |11 jo20S |040W 4301333904 [16891]FEE = OW P |
KOFFORD 2-36B5 ) 136 |020S |050W |4301333988(17048 FEE = OW [P |
ALLEN3-7B4 ~lo7 |020S |040W |4301334027 |17166 |FEE low P
[BOURNAKIS 3-18B4 ~ 18 |020S [040W |4301334091 17264 [FEE = |OW P

MILES 3-12B5 112 ]020S|050W [4301334110[17316 FEE __ OW [P

OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 ' T31 020S [050W [4301334123 17388 |FEE low P
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El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

OWL and HAWK 4-17C5 17 0305 |050W [4301334193 | 17387 |FEE ow P | ]
DWR 3-32B5 132 l020S |050W 4301334207 |17371 |FEE Tow P’
LAKE FORK RANCH 32284 22 |020S |040W |4301334261 17409 [FEE  |OW P |
HANSON 3-9B3 ) 109 [020S [030W |4301350065 |17570 |FEE ow [P ]
DYE 2-28A1 28 |010S [010W 4301350066 |17531 |FEE ow P |
MEEKS 3-32A4 " {32 [010S |040W |4301350069 17606 FEE Jow b
[HANSON 4-8B3 |08 |020S |030W 4301350088 17571 FEE =~ OW P  C
LAKE FORKRANCH3-14B4 |14 |020S |040W 4301350007 17484 [FEE ow p
ALLEN 3-9B4 |09 |020S |040W 4301350123 |17656 FEE ow P |
HORROCKS 4-20A1 20 |010S |010W 4301350155 |17916 | FEE ow P | ]
HURLEY 2-33A1 133 _|010S 010W |4301350166 17573 [FEE ow P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO 3-20C5 20 |030S [050W (4301350190 17541 |FEE ow P ]
ALLEN 3-8B4 08 |020S |040W 4301350192 17622 |[FEE_|ow [P |
OWL and HAWK 3-10C5 B (10 |030S |050W 4301350193 |17532 | FEE ow P ’
OWL and HAWK 3-19C5 - 19 |030S [050W (4301350201 |17508 [FEE ow P T
EL PASO 420B5 " " 129 |020S [050W 4301350208 |17934 |FEE ow P C_|
DONIHUE 3-20C6 20 |030S |060W 4301350270 |17762 [FEE ow P )
HANSON 3-5B3 " los 1020S [030W 4301350275 17725 [FEE ow P ¢
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 |020S |050W 4301350302 [17668 |FEE T low P ]
REBEL 3-35B5 ] ~ I35 |020S (050W 4301350388 [17911 |FEE ow P Cc
FREEMAN 4-16B4 T 16 |020S |040W 4301350438 |17935 |Fee low Pl ]
WILSON 3-36B5 T 77 7 6 |020S |050W [4301350439 (17936 Fee 2 oW P 'C
EL PASO 321B4 21 10205 |040W |4301350474 [18123 |Fee Jow P c |
IORG 4-12B3 7712 [020S [030W [4301350487 |17981 [Fee ow P [
CONOVER 3-383 o 03 |020S |030W 4301350526 [18122[Fee __1OW [P Ic |
ROWLEY 3-16B4 B 16 [020S |040W |4301350569 | 18151 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTS 3-14B3 ) 14 0205 |030W 4301350570 18366 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTER 4-27B5 27 020S |050W 4301350571 |99999 |Fee ow P c ]
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 |020S |040W 4301350572 | 18152 |Fee “low P c
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 |020S |040W 4301350707 | 18270 |Fee ow P ¢ |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-25B4 T |25 020S|040W [4301350711 | 18220 |Fee T Tlow P ¢
LAKE FORK RANCH 42384 23 (0205 |040W 4301350713 |18271 |Fee —ow h{d ic
LAKE FORK RANCH4-1584 1150208 |040W |4301350715 | 18314 Fee Jow E Cle ]
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-24B4 124 |020S [040W 4301350716 |18269 Fee CJow TP e
GOLINSKI 1-8C4 T |08 |030S |040W 4301350986 18301 [Fee 2 ___OW P C |
J ROBERTSON 1-1B1 ] /01 |020S |010W 4304730174 |5370 |FEE ow P o
TIMOTHY 1-8B1E 08 [020S [010E |4304730215 1910 FEE oW P j
MAGDALENE PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E (34 [010S |010E [4304730241 785 |FEE jow P T
NELSON 131A1E © 731 0105 [010E |4304730671 830 FEE ow [p 1]
[ROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E |24 |010S 010E 14304730707 840 |FEE TTow P ,,,
H D LANDY 1-30A1E o 30 |010S |[010E |4304730790 845 |FEE oW P 1
WALKER 1-14A1E 14 |010S |010E 4304730805(855 |FEE oW [P | |
BOLTON2-29A1E |29 |010S[010E [4304731112[900 |FEE ow [P
PRESCOTT1-3521  [35 [010N|010W 4304731173 (1425 [FEE oW P | |
BISELGURR 11-1 11 0105 |010W 4304731213 |8438 |FEE Tow P ]
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E =~ 122 ,010S 010E 4304731265915 |[FEE ~~ OW P N
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 7 T2 ]010S [010W 14304731295 (920 |FEE ow p

FOWLES 1-26A1 |26 1010S |010W |4304731296 |930 |FEE ow P
BRADLEY23-1 - 23 |010S |010W |4304731297 (8435 FEE = IOW P
BASTIAN1-2A1 02 [010S [010W 4304731373 |736 |FEE low [P T
DRLONG2-19AME 19 i010S |010E |4304731470 9505 FEE ow
DMOON 1-23Z1 |23 010N |010W 4304731479 |[10310[FEE ~~|OW P
O MOON 2-26Z1 |26 |010N |010W 14304731480 10135 FEE - ow P |
LLAD225A1  "]25 |010S|010W 4304731797 10790|/FEE _ OW P L
LANDY 2-30A1E 30 |010S |010E 4304731895 11127/FEE oW P
WINN P2-381E 103 [020S |010E 4304732321 | 11428 |FEE Clow P
BISEL.GURR2-11A1 711 [010S 010W 4304735410 |14428/FEE OW P
FLYING J FEE 2-12A1 12 10105 [010W 14304739467 | 16686 | FEE oW P
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El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy £E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 2-14B1_[14 1020S [010W (4304739591 [16546[FEE  OW [P j
OBERHANSLY3-11A1 111 ]010S |010W (4304739679 17937 |[FEE | ow P I
DUNCAN2-34A1 134 1010S 010W |4304739944 17043 |FEE - ow P

BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 |010S |010W (4304739961 16791/FEE low P |
KILLIAN 3-12A1 112 |010S |010W |4304740226 17761 /ML39760 @ [OW P I
WAINOCO ST 1-14B1 ~ 7144 1020 [010W 4304730818 (1420 |ML24306-A [OW P |
UTAHSTUTE1-35A1 135 ,010S 010W 4304730182 5520 |ML-25432 = OW P | |
STATE 1-19A4 |19 |010S |040W 4301330322 9118 ML-27912  |OW P | |
FEDERAL2-28E19E 128 |050S |190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 |OW P | |
[FEDERAL 1-28E19E - 28 |050S [190E |4304730175 5680 |UTU143512 |OW [P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 103 [010S |020W 4301320316 |5877 |FEE ow PA |
WH BLANCHARD2-3A2 |03 |010S |020W 4301330008 5775 |FEE ow PA
YACK U 1-7A1 - 07 |010S|010W |4301330018(5795 FEE ~ OW [PA '
JAMESPOWELL3 113 010S |020W 4301330024 {8305 |FEE WD PA ]
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 |010S |010W |4301330026 5800 [FEE =~ OW |PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY18A2 08 |010S |020W 4301330036 5975 [FEE _  [OW  [PA
BLEAZARD1-18B4 118 020S |040W [4301330059 |11262 FEE ow |PA

OLSEN 1-27A4 |27 |010S |040W /4301330064 1565 FEE =~ OW |PA | |
EVANS 1-31A4 - 31 010S 040W 4301330067 |6330 |FEE ow IPA | ]
HAMBLIN 1-26A2 26 |010S [020W [4301330083 2305 |FEE ow PA | |
HARTMAN1-31A3 131 |010S |030W 4301330093 |10700 |FEE ow PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330097 5725 |FEE ow @7 e W
POWELL 1-33A3 33 |010S |030W |4301330105/4526 FEE  IOW PA |
LOTRIDGE GATES1-383 03 |020S 030W 4301330117 1625 [FEE _  |OW PA | |
REMINGTON 1-34A3 134 |010S |030W 14301330139 |1670 |FEE . ow [PA |
ANDERSON1-28A2 28 1010S 020W 4301330150,5895 |FEE . |OW |PA | = |
RHOADES MOON 1-35B5 35 [020S [050W 14301330155 |5270 |FEE ow PA ]
JOHN 1-382 o 03 |020S |020W |4301330160(5765 FEE ~  |OW |PA |
SMITH 1-6C5 o6 [030S 050w [4301330163 |5385 |FEE _jow PA |
HORROCKS FEE 1-3A1 |03 [010S[010W[4301330171|5505 FEE ___ OW PA | |
WARREN1-32A4 32 1010S |040W 4301330174 9139 FEE  ~ |OW  PA
JENSENFENZEL 1-20C5 |20 [030S |050W 4301330177 4730 [FEE ~  [OW  |PA e
MYRINRANCH1-13B4 13 |020S |040W 4301330180 |[4524 |FEE _ow PA |
BROTHERSON 12784 7sz 020S |040W [4301330185 1775 |FEE ow PA | |
JENSEN 1-31A5 131 1010S [050W [4301330186 |4735 |FEE ow PA |
ROBERTSON1-28A2 129 010S [020W |4301330189 [4740 |[FEE @ﬂ,, PA ]
WINKLER1-2843 128 {010S |030W [4301330191 |5465 |FEE oW |PA | ,
CHENEY1-33A2 "33 |010S|020W 4301330202[1750 [FEE __ [OW _ [PA |
JLAMICQ STATE1-6B1 |06 [020S [010W |4301330210|5730 |FEE oW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 110 [020S |020W 4301330215 5700 |[FEE ow  [PA 1
REEDER 1-178B5 - 17 |020S |050W (4301330218 5460 |FEE - low PA ]
ROBERTSONUTE1-2B2 02 |020S [020W |4301330225/1710 FEE = 1OW IPA L; ]
HATCH 1-5B1 .~ |05 ]020S 010W 4301330226 5470 FEE =~ |OW |PA
BROTHERSON 1-22B4 - fﬂ 020S |040W 4301330227 (5935 FEE ~ low |PA I
ALLRED 1-16A3 - 16 |010S |030W [4301330232 |1780 |FEE oW  PA 1
BIRCH 1-35A5 35 |010S [050W 4301330233 9116 FEE | OW [PA [
MARQUERITEUTE1-882 /08 |020S [020W [4301330235(9122 FEE = |OW  |PA |
BUZZI1-11B2 11 [020S|020W 4301330248(6335 [FEE |OW |PA | |
SHISLER 1-3B1 77,77@ 1020 [010W 14301330249 (5960 FEE OW PA 1 B
TEW 1-1B5 o1 Jo20S 050w 4301330264 (5580 FEE |OW |PA | |
EVANSUTE1-19B3 |19 |020S |030W 4301330265 (1870 [FEE _‘PQV!_ PA
SHELL2-27A4 " " '27 1010S|040W 4301330266 1776 [FEE WD [PA [
DYE 1-29A1 ) B |29 |010S |010W |4301330271 /99990 FEE o ow PA
VODA UTE 1-4C5 S ‘¥04 030S |050W 14301330283 4530 FEE ow |pPA |
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 Tz_é 010S |040W [4301330292 9114 FEE |OW |PA | |
MEAGHER14B2 104 |020S |020W 4301330313 8402 FEE =~ |OW JPA
NORLING19B1 109 |020S 010W 4301330315 1811 |[FEE ) }9\{\( [PA

S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 '09 '030S |050W 14301330316 |5940 |FEE OW PA



E! Paso E7 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIMOTHY 1-00A3 09 010S [030W 4301330321 10883 |FEE ow__ [PA__ |
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 |010S |050W 4301330323 9115 |FEE OW PA )
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 |020S |020W 4301330325 9121 |[FEE _|OW PA |
PHILLIPS UTE 1-3C5 03 |030S [050W (4301330333 1816 |FEE Jow |pA ]
[ELLSWORTH 1-2084 T |20 020S |040W |4301330351(6376 |[FEE _ |OW _ PA
LAWSON128A1 28" [010S [010W [4301330358 (5015 [FEE  |OW |PA B
AMES 1-23A4 723 |010S [040W (4301330375 1901 |FEE ow pa T
HORROCKS 1-6A1 06 |010S [010W 4301330390 5675 |FEE oW [PA |
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 [030S [050W |4301330393 [5565 [FEE oW |PA |
GOODRICH 1-18B2 18~ |020S |020W 4301330397 |5485 |FEE “jow PA i
SWD POWELL 3 7713 |010S|020W 4301330478 [10708/FEE WD _PA | |
BODRERO 1-1583 115 |020S |030W 4301330565 [4534 |FEE OW |PA B
MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 ~ 7 /30 |[030S |040W 4301330576 |2360 |FEE OW |PA 7
DUNCAN2:9B5 109 |020S|050W 4301330719 |5440 |FEE Tlow T PA T
FISHER 1-16A4 ~ 116 |010S [040W 4301330737 2410 [FEE ____OW PA |
URRUTY 2-34A2 34 |010S [020W [4301330753 9117 |FEE ow [PA | ]
GOODRICH 1-24A4 ) 24 |010S [040W [4301330760 2415 |FEE ow PA
CARL SMITH 2-25A4 25 |010S|040W 4301330776 9136 |FEE “low  PA |
ANDERSON 1-A30B1 ~ |30 020S [010W |4301330783 [9137 |FEE low A T
CADILLAC 3-6A1 06 |010S 010W 4301330834 6316 [FEE __ |OW  |PA )
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 131 |010S [010W (4301330836 [8439 |FEE ow [PA | ]
[REESE ESTATE 2-1082 10 |020S [020W 4301330837 [2417 FEE oW PA | ]
CLARK 2-9A3 T 09 [010S |030W 4301330876 [2416 |FEE ow [PA ]
JENKINS 3-16A3 16 |010S |030W 4301330877 |9790 |FEE ow PA |
CHRISTENSEN 2-26A5 26 |010S [050W (4301330905 10710 FEE ____|OW  PA |
FORD 2-36A5 T 7 36 |010S |050W [4301330911]9630 |[FEE ow [PA |
MORTENSEN2-32A2 /32 0105 [020W |4301330029 (9486 |FEE oW PA -
WILKERSON 1-20Z1 120 [010N|010W [4301330042 5452 [FEE __ |OW _PA |
UTE TRIBAL24A3S 04 [010S [030W (4301330950 |10230 [FEE ow A |
OBERHANSLY 2-31Z1 31 |010N |010W 4301330970 9262 [FEE oW PA_ |
MORRIS2-7A3 07 [010S [030W (4301330977 9725 [FEE  |OW PA |
POWELL2-08A3 o8 [010S|030W 4301330979 10175 FEE  |OW |PA |
[FISHER 2-6A3 7 oe 0105 [030W [4301330984 [10110 [FEE ow A ||
JACOBSEN2-12A4 " ""42 [010S 040W 4301330985 10480 [FEE  IOW [PA | |
CHENEY 2-33A2 33 |010S |020W 4301331042 10313 [FEE ow [PA
HANSON TRUST 2-20A3 29 [010S|030W [4301331043/5306 [FEE |OW _ PA |
BURTON 2-15B5 15 |020S |050W |4301331044 [10205 [FEE oW [PA
EVANS-UTE 2-17B3 17 |020S |030W [4301331056 (10210 FEE __ |OW _ IPA ]
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 20 020S [040W 4301331090(5336 FEE _ |OW  PA -
REMINGTON 2-34A3 7 134 |010S [030W |4301331091 1902 [FEE __[OW PA |
WINKLER 2-28A3 |28 |010S|030W |4301331108 [4519 |FEE ow PA | ]
TEW 2-10B5 10 0205 |050W |4301331125 1751 FEE _ |OW _ |PA )
LINDSAY 2-33A4 _ ,A, 33 |010S [040W [43013311411756 [FEE _OW |PA_ | ]
FIELDSTED 228A4 28 (0105 [040W [4301331293 (10665 FEE  |[OW |PA | |
POWELL 4-13A2_ 13 [010S [020W |4301331336 | 11177 |FEE GW PA |
DUMP 2-20A3 S 20 [010S [030W [4301331505 | 11691 |FEE oW  [PA
[SMITH 2X-23C7 __ 23 |030S |070W |4301331634 12382)FEE D  PA | |
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 |010S |020W 14301331872 11928 [FEE ow PA |
TODDUSAST12B1 02 |020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE ~~  |OW  [PA

STATE 1-7B1E o7 |020S|010E |4304730180|5566 [FEE _ |ow [PA |
BACON 1-10B1E 10 |020S [010E 14304730881 5550 [FEE  |OW PA | |
PARIETTE DRAW 2844 28 [040S [010E 14304731408 (4537 FEE ow  PA |
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 |020S 010E 4304731840 4960 |FEE ow ~PA | |
STATE 2-35A2 ] 135 010S |020W 4301330156 4715 |ML-22874 _ |OW _ @@M N
UTAH STATE L B 1-11B1 |11 [020S |010W 4304730715530 |ML23655  |OW  [PA B
STATE 1-8A3 |08 0105 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316  [OW  PA
UTAHFEDERAL 12481 124 |020S [010W 4304730220 590 |ML26079  [OW  PA |
CEDAR RIM 15 '34_|030S [0B0W 14301330383 |6395 [14-20-462-1329 [OW 'S

7



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL 2-24C7 — |24 [030S [070W [4301331028 | 10240 |14-20-H62-1135 OW __|S 7
CEDARRIM 12 28 |030S [060W 4301330344 6370 |14-20-H62-1323 [OW  [S
CEDAR RIM 16 " |33 |030S [060W [4301330363 6390 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |S

SPRING HOLLOW 2-3473 34 |010N |030W 4301330234 5255 |14-20-H62-1480 OW | )
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 17 |020S |[030W [4301330274 5335 |14-20-H62-1733[OW S | |
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4G_ o1 |020S [040W [4301331197 | 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW  |S
UTE 3-1283 ) 12 [020S [030W |4301331379 |11490 |14-20-H62-1810 [OW  [S ,
UTETRIBAL94B1 |04 |020S [010W (4301330194 5715 [14-20-H62-1969/OW S | |
UTETRIBAL221B6 |21 [020S [060W 4301331424 11615 |14-20-H62-2489 |OW  |S )
UTE 1-33B6 ) ] "33 |020S [060W [4301330441 1230 |14-20-H62-2493 |OW IS

UTE22285 22 1020S [050W [4301331122 (10453 [14-20-H62-2509 OW S | |
UTE 1-18B1E 118 ]020S |010E |4304730969 [9135 |14-20-H62-2864 OW _ |S ]
LAUREN UTE 123A3 |23 ]010S [030W 4301330895 [9403 |14-20-H62-3981 OW (S _

UTE 2-28B6 T |28 [020S [060W [4301331434 [11624 |14-20-H62-4622 [OW | o
UTE127B6X |27 1020S |060W 4301330517 [11166 |14-20-H62-4631 [OW 'S )
UTE 22786 | 127 [020S |060W 4301331449 11660 |14-20-H62-4631 OW S o
CEDAR RIM 10-15C6 - 15 |030S |060W 4301330328 6365 |14-20-H62-4724 OW  |S |
UTE 5-30A2 ~ |30 |010S 020W 4301330169 [5910 [14-20-H62-4863 [OW  |S B
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) , 24 |030S |060W |4301330298 [4533 |14-20-H624866 OW | | |
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 1307 ]030S |050W |4301330475 |665 | 14-20-H62-4876 [OW  |S

SMB 1-10A2 - 10 |010S |020W |4301330012 |5865 |FEE ow s | ]
KENDALL 1-12A2 - 12 |010S[020W [43013300135875 FEE ___ |OW S T
CEDARRIM 2 B 20 |030S |060W [4301330019 6315 |FEE ow | o
URRUTY29A2 ~ 109 [010S [020W |4301330046 [6856 |FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 14 |020S |040W |4301330051 [1535 |FEE ow s 7
RUST 14B3 ] 04 |020S |030W 4301330063 [1575 [FEE ow [s | ]
MONSEN 1-21A3 21 010S |030W [4301330082 [1590 |FEE oW s 1
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 ) 10 |020S [040W 4301330110 1614 (FEE oW |8 T
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 |020S [050W [4301330124 (1645 |FEE oW [s ]
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 "~ 116 020S [040W [4301330192[1735 [FEE ____ |[OW S

MARSHALL 1-20A3 20 |010S |030W |4301330193 9340 |FEE ow s )
[CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 317 [020S [040W |4301330198 [4745 |FEE ~low s
ROPER 1-14B3 ) 114 |020S[030W 4301330217 (1850 |FEE ow [s | ]
BROTHERSON 1-24B4 - 24 |020S |040W |4301330229 |1865 |[FEE oW S i
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 33 [010S[040W [4301330272([1680 [FEE __ |OW |S
BROTHERSON 1-2384 123 |020S |040W 4301330483 (8423 |FEE ow s~ | ]
SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 08 |030S [050W [4301330543 |5495 |FEE ow s T
VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 19 |030S |050W (4301330553 (5650 |FEE ~jow [s }
HANSEN 1-16B3 16 [020S |030W 4301330617 |9124 |FEE ow s
BROTHERSON 1-25B4 ) 25 |020S [040W 4301330668 9126 |FEE ow "is ]
POWELL2-33A3 - 33 |010S [030W [4301330704 [2400 |FEE ow s | ]
BROWN2-28B5 28 |020S [050W [4301330718 9131 |[FEE OW s ]
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 7716 |o10s1010W [4301330782[8443 FEE __|OW S )
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 |010S [040W |4301330817 [9345 |FEE oW s B
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 |010N [010W [4301330884 [936 |FEE ow s |
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 7127 |010S]040W [4301330915(9632 FEE  |OW S )
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 B |23 [020S |050W |4301330917 [9600 |FEE ow [ )
TIMOTHY 3-18A3 18 |010S [030W 4301330940 (9633 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 103 [020S |040W 4301331008 (10165 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 |020S [040W 4301331086(1782 FEE ___OW 8 |
MILES 2-35A4 135 |010S |040W |4301331087 |1966 |FEE ow 1§ T ]
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 ] |17 020S |040W 4301331089 [1696 |FEE ow s T
RUST 2-36A4 |36 |010S |040W 4301331092[1577 [FEE ____ ow s |
EVANS 2-19B3 19 10205 [030W 4301331113 1777 |FEE ow s N
FARNSWORTH 2-1285 " 112 [020S [050W 4301331115 [1646 |FEE oW [S N
CHRISTENSEN34B4 04 |020S|040W 4301331142 10481 FEE  |OW S
ROBERTSON 229A2 29 1010S [020W [4301331150 | 10679 |FEE low s |
[CEDAR RIM 2A 20 [030S [060W 14301331172 110671 |FEE oW s
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El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31_[010S |030W |4301331243 [ 11026 |FEE SEE —
GOODRICH2-2B3 ] 02 |020S |030W 4301331246 | 11037 |FEE ow s )
JESSEN 2-21A4 21 |010S |040W |4301331256 | 11061 |FEE ~ low s
BROTHERSON 3-23B4 23 |020S [040W |4301331289 [11141 [FEE ow s

MYRIN RANCH 2-18B3 18 |020S |030W |4301331297 [11475 |FEE T low s
BROTHERSON 2-2B5 02 |020S [050W (4301331302 [11342 [FEE ow S ]
DASTRUP 2-30A3 30 |010S [030W (4301331320 [11253 |FEE ow s

YOUNG 2-30B4 30 |020S [040W 4301331366 | 11453 |FEE ow s

IORG 2-10B3 10 |020S |030W [4301331388 [11482 [FEE oW |s

MONSEN 3-27A3 27 |010S [030W 4301331401 |11686 |FEE low s
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 05 |020S [010E 4304732409 11481 FEE T Tlow I8

LARSEN 1-25A1 25 |010S [010W |4304730552 815 | FEE ow [TA

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S |010W 4304730569 820 FEE ow__ [TA




Sundry Number: 28239 APl Well Number: 43013306170000

STATE OF UTAH

FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
HANSEN 1-16B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013306170000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2088 FSL 1760 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE [ RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: ¥ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION O orver OTHER: I |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: August 06, 2012

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ ‘LDM'A%

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/1/2012

RECEIVED: Aug. 01, 2012




Sundry Number: 28239 API Well Number: 43013306170000

Hanson 1-16B3 Summary Procedure

e POOH w/Rods & pump, Release anchor, POOH w/tubing string
e Circulate & Clean wellbore

e RIH with 7”CIBP, set plug at ~9,765’, dump bail 10’ cement on top
e Perforate new LGR interval from ~9,488’ — 9,698’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 7” CBP and set plug at ~9,375’.

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~9,168’ — 9,368’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e Drill out CBP at 9,375’

e RIH w/tubing, pump & rods

e C(lean location and resume production

RECEIVED: Aug. 01, 2012



State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

GARY R. HERBERT

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director
September 4, 2014

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7011 2970 0001 8828 1627

Ms. Maria Gomez 43 O/ 27 75[)[?{ 7

EP Energy E&P Company, LP. HensSen |- B A
1001 Louisiana 1 29 210

Houston, TX 77002

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State [eases

Dear Ms. Gomez:

As of April 2014, EP Energy E&P Company, LP (EP) has twenty-seven (27) Fee Lease
Wells (see attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for
extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. Two (2) wells in 2013 and four (4)
wells in 2014 were added to EP’s SI/TA list.

The Division has worked with EP for many years to reduce the immense number of wells
that were in non-compliance status. The Division feels that EP’s SI/TA list is now at a
manageable number; therefore all wells need to be addressed.

EP has a number of wells that were proposed for plugging (attachment A) but have not
been plugged. Additionally, four (4) wells were inspected and reported as plugged by Division
inspectors, but EP has failed to file subsequent plugging sundries and consequently are still listed
as SI/TA (attachment A).

It has also come to the Division’s attention that there are unresolved complaints against
EP from landowners concerning spills and site access. Specifically with reference to the
Christensen 3-4B4, pictures showing the state of the well were sent to the Division; it appears
that this well is nowhere near being capable of production. This is cause for concern which
needs to be addressed.

EP shall immediately submit plans and timeframes for each well stating which wells will
be plugged, placed back on production, or requesting SI/TA extension with proof of wellbore
integrity and good cause for such request. All wells need an individual sundry filed and are
required to meet the SI/TA rules as listed below.

UTAH

DNR
A

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 s facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov
OIL, GAS & MINING



Page 2
EP Energy E&P Company, LP.
September 4, 2014

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1)

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/'TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and

4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at

(801) 538-5281.
m&w
Dustin K. Doucet

Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js

cc: Compliance File
Well File

N:AO&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\SITA



ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LLEASE| Years Inactive Proposed PA | Plugged
1 |CEDARRIM 2 43-013-30019 | FEE | 12 years 7 months suys?cﬁant 7/17/2013
2 |CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 43-013-31142 | FEE | IFEEY T 5/10/2010
3 |DRY GULCH 1-36A1 43-047-30569 | FEE
4 |LARSEN 1-25A1 43-047-30552 | FEE |(IFEE 0
5 FARSWORTH 2-12B5 43-013-31115| FEE 5/18/2007
6 |BROTHERSON 1-10B4 43-013-30110 | FEE | P CRITREEINIGE
7 [BROTHERSON 1-24B4 43-013-30229 | FEE
8 [BROTHERSON 1-33A4 43-013-30272 | FEE onth
9 |MILES 2-35A4 43-013-31087 | FEE 12/31/2012
10 [SMB 1-10A2 43-013-30012 | FEE | 4 years 8 months

Needs

11 |RUST 1-4B3 43-013-30063 | FEE | 4 years 7 months subsequent 9/19/2013
12 |SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 43-013-30543 | FEE | 4 years 9 months su;l:eeqdusent 12/4/2013
13 [VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 | 43-013-30553 | FEE | 4 years 9 months
14 [BROWN 2-28B5 43-013-30718 | FEE | 4 years 3 months
15 [HANSUKUTT 2-23B5 43-013-30917 | FEE | 4 years 8 months sug‘;ec:dusent 10/24/2013
16 [BROTHERSON 3-23B4 43-013-31289 | FEE | 4 years 9 months
17 BROTHERSON 1-14B4 43-013-30051 | FEE | 3 years 11 months
18 BROTHERSON 2-3B4 43-013-31008 | FEE | 3 years 6 months
19 |POWELL 2-33A3 43-013-30704 | FEE | 3years 1 month 6/1/2014
20 |BROTHERSON 2-3B4 43-013-31008 | FEE | 3 years 3 months
21 |DASTRUP 2-30A3 43-013-31320 | FEE | 3 years 8 months
22|R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 43-013-30884 | FEE | 2 years 3 months
23 [HORROCKS 5-20A1 43-013-34280 | FEE | 4 years 7 months
24 |BELCHER 2-33B4 43-013-30907 | FEE | 1 year 2 months
25|CEDAR RIM 2A 43-013-31172 | FEE | 2 years 2 months
26 [EULA-UTE 1-16A1 43-013-30782 | FEE | 1 year 11 months
27 |HANSEN 1-16B3 43-013-30617 | FEE | 1 year 8 months




Sundry Nunber :

56449 API

Vel | Nunber:

43013306170000

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
HANSEN 1-16B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013306170000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

PHONE NUMBER:

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2088 FSL 1760 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/7/2014

l:‘ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

l:‘ ACIDIZE l:‘
D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D
l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘
l:‘ DEEPEN l:‘
D OPERATOR CHANGE D
l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME l:‘
l:‘ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘
D TUBING REPAIR D
l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF J
l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION l:‘

ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE

FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON

VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL

SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well has casing leaks and need facilities, therefore is not
economically viable. We will plug this well in 2015.

REQUEST DENIED
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

October 23, 2014
Date:_

By: (\;\lﬁ'/& (L Dézwx?{'

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/7/2014

RECEI VED: Cct. 07, 2014




Sundry Nunber: 56449 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013306170000
Without further information showing the well is not a risk to public health, safety or the

environment and that the casing leaks do not permit movement of fluid from one horizon to
another, the casing should be repaired or the well plugged immediately, not 2015 as proposed.

RECEI VED: Cct. 23, 2014



Sundry Nunber :

57800 API

Vel | Nunber:

43013306170000

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
HANSEN 1-16B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013306170000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

PHONE NUMBER:

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2088 FSL 1760 FWL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/1/2014

l:‘ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

l:‘ SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

l:‘ ACIDIZE l:‘
D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D
l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘
l:‘ DEEPEN l:‘
D OPERATOR CHANGE J
l:‘ PRODUCTION START OR RESUME l:‘
l:‘ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘
D TUBING REPAIR D
l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF l:‘

O

ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS I:' CONVERT WELL TYPE

FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE I:' RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O

D WATER DISPOSAL

SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON
VENT OR FLARE

SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
See attached for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: December 17, 2014

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/13/2014

RECEI VED: Nov. 13, 2014




Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013306170000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Amend Plug # 3: Quantity pumped below CICR should be a minimum of 9 bbls. 7 bbls on top
of CICR is adequate.

3. Amend Plug #4: Plug should be spotted a minimum of 50’ into stub £2750’ to 2300’ as
proposed as required by R649-3-24-3.8. Quantity of cement may be adequate. Confirm with tag.

4. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.
5. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface.
6. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 — Well Site Restoration.
7. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

8. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

9. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEI VED: Dec. 17, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000
1271772014 Wellbore Diagram
API Well No: 43-013-30617-00-00  Permit No: Well Name/No: HANSEN 1-16B3

Company Name: EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.
Location: Sec: 16 T:2S R:3W Spot: NESW

String Information

1263

Coordinates: X: 565319 Y: 4462140 . Bottom Diameter Weight Length
. ALTAMONT String (ft sub) (inches) (1b/ft) (ft)
Field Name: HOL1 2484 1225
County Name: DUCHESNE SURF 2484 9.625 36
P‘ HOL2 10002 8.75
y ‘__‘ﬁ_%_‘ PROD 10002 7 29
| o Glorz M3 5p . L1 13141 5 (3
| s’ . CIBP 10500
Cum.ni from 2484 ft. to surface rPlQ s Rt
_ PKR 9368
Gbliulu. 1225in.@2484 1t (Gl9K] (?..
(4% nent from 10002 . to 5000 ft L S ol 7763
l..m:.n! rom to CIBP 12016
2S_urface 9.625 in. @ 2484 1t CIBP 12210
Stoy
Pl ;! Ci‘g > " ot (o) >
1 e . e __’______.____——-—-—'_’_'*
Fancerte] 55 € ‘/f:f:;é‘:-m‘r o % x 7 (103)
taso' 4 cor et 2o’ ou 7-{-’@,/ oo (234 %{Eement Informatlon
225! 99" 194'(
ol e oy 5 BOC  TOC
{35 . % &3 ( ‘1‘0\9\5 ‘P“‘, String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
= | ;2T
lA\ 0 fgb oo 2o o) - SEIBP 9765 9755
i) = el 2”“””“2%§§?$$ o
1 o2 | Gl
S — TS @
c-;:y i >4 - 6;?0 '\"‘j"\*SM/lquW 125/ IBP 12016 12006
P = CIBP 12210 12200
9?23;%; \ D\uj_'ﬁ’l- LI 13141 9774 UK 565
i ' PROD 10002 5000 UK 500
( 2¢ =OCosHh. —H\O feo SURF 2484 0 UK 800
TA2 200
_/{7 “. Perforation Information
Top Bottom
(ft sub) (£t sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze
11864 13005
qq@: ul 10496 11980
Good o> 9818 10471
!Iullc 8.75 in. @ 10002 fi. 9807 10461
Z\ Lmer fén‘]:'l314l ft. to 9774 ft.
X_X Packer @9368ﬁ ol
= Pro uctlon 7m @1 02ﬁ . .
790} Formation Information
Formation Depth
BMSW 2500
Ll gg‘,é loygs' w/io! GRRV 5409
{ o4 WSTC 10498
low4s — FF'crere wsew' ~/ro!
woTe- ' ?\u Jﬁ:(
>U9D { |.os 20 \
L7 b zorc g (o LoX( i)~ 1500 /ol
)
L cgpel2zn' Yp! T
| Hole: Unknown
Zloos
TD: 13141 TVD: PBTD: 13104

cwcﬁ
2.301{

Y. 394
0.-02%

Page 1



Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000

EP =
12/1/2014

Plug & Abandon
Hansen Trust 1-16B3

API #: 43-013-30617
Sec. 1-T2S-R3W
Altamont/Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Version #2c¢
Date: 12/1/14

Regulatory
Plug & Abandonment Procedure

RECEI VED: Dec. 15, 2014



Sundry Nunber :

EP

57800 APl \el |

N

Nunber :

43013306170000

12/1/2014

r2s, R3W, USM.

PROJECT
LINMAR ENERGY

Well location as shown in the
NEI/4 SW1/4, Section 16, T2S5,
R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne County,
Utah.

CERTIFICATE

TMIS 05 TD CERTIFY TWAT TWE ABOVE PLAT wAS PREBARED FROW
FUELD WOTES OF 2CTUsL SURVEYS WADE BY WE QR UNDER W

80| .48
/6
1760 -9
3| WELL LOCATION

80|.36

Elev. Ungradad Ground - 5975

SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CCRRECT TO THE

REGISTRATION N2 3137
STATE OF UTAM

BEST OF W® sWOWLEDGE #wC BDuIEF 7/ /

i
REGISTERED LAND SURTE¥GE

— —

UinTan ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

X * Section Corners Located

POBOX Q@ ~ 8530UTH - 200 EAST
VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SCALE "2 1000" DATE 10/16/81
PARTY D‘PJKIKR JH REFERENCES GLO PLAT
WEATHER FILE

CLOUDY / WARM LINMAR

CURRENT STATUS:

This well is currently shut-in with no rods and EOT at 9670’ and open perforations at 9807°-10461".

BHT:
BHP:
SITP:
SICP:

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Casing Fluid:
TD:13141
PBTD: 13104’
KB:

GL:5975’

Produced Fluid

RECEI VED:

Dec. 15, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000

| BN B 12/1/2014

- ENERGY™

PRESENT

Hansen Trust 1-16B3

Altamont / Blue Bell Field
Duchesne Co., Utah
API| —43-013-30617

9-5/8" 36# J-55 @ 2484’
Cemented w/800Sks to surfacein 12 %" hole

BMSW as per UGS Study 144 ~ 2500’

Top of Green River 5409’

\ Tight Spot in Casing Leaking off ~6280’

Top of cement ~ 8450’
Spotty Bond to 6500’

4'-2-7/8" Perforated Sub
w/ Bull Plug
EOT @ 9,670

CIBP @ 9730’ w/10'cmt on top

Perfs: 9807-10461

TOL @ 9774
7" - 26,29,32# N-80 @ 10002’
Top of Wasatch 10498’

CIBP @ 10485 &10500 w/ 10’cmt on top
Perfs: 10506-11988

CIBP @ 12016 &12210 w/ 10’cmt on top

Perfs: 11864-13006

5" 18# P-110 @ 13141’

PBTD - 13104’
TD - 13141 DSB 12/1/14

RECEI VED: Dec. 15, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000

EP ENI

12/1/2014

Hansen Trust1-16B3

Altamont / Blue Bell Field PROPOSED P&A

X

150’ Balanced Plug @ 10'-160’

AP| — 43-013-30617
-

Cement
Properties
PPG 16.44
Yield 1.05
Pl Bottom Top Length bbls Sacks
summary 150" Balanced Plug @ 1500'-1650'
6 160 10 150 11.4 61
5 1650 1500 150 11.4 61
4 2700 2300 400 30.4 162
3 5425 5225 200 15.5 83
2 6300 6200 100 3.75 20
1 9000 8800 200 7.5 40
Total 1200 80 427
400’ Balanced Plug @ 2300'-2700
9-5/8" 36# J-55 @ 2484’
Cementedw/ 800 Sks to surfacein12 %" hole
BMSW as per UGS Study 144 ~ 2500’
Casing and Cementing Data CICR @ 5400’ w/ 200’ CMT Plug
Hole | 121/4" [ 83/4 63/4” Top of Green River 5409’
Size
100’ Balanced Plug @ 6300- 6200
CcSG 95/8" 7 5" Tight Spot in Casing Leaking off ~6280’
oD
WET 264 26,29, 16 CIBP @ 9000’ w/200’ cement on top
32# Top of cement ~ 8450’
Spotty Bond to 6500’
Grade J55 N80 P110
CIBP @ 9730’ w/ 10’cmt on top
Depth 2484’ 10002’ 9774
_ Perfs: 9807-10461
13141’
TOL @ 9774’
Ccmt cmt Cmt cmt w/ 7" - 26,29,32# N-80 @ 10002’
Info. w/ 800 w/ 500 565 Top of Wasatch 10489’
SX SX SX
CIBP @ 10485 &10500 w/ 10'cmt on top
Perfs: 10506-11988

CIBP @ 12016 &12210 w/ 10’cmt on top
Perfs: 11864-13006

5" 18# P-110 @ 13141’

PBTD - 13104’

TD — 13141 DSB 12/1/14

RECEI VED: Dec. 15, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000

w N

EP =
12/1/2014

Tubular Data

Burst Col Body Jt Drift Cap
Material Description (100%) | (100%) | Yield | Yield ID ID CF/LF TOC

Surface 9 5/8” 36# J-55 @ 2,484’ 3520 2020 564 453 | 9.921 | 8.765 4340 SURF
Casing
Intermediate 7" 29# N&L-801t0 6,413’ & | 8160 7020 676 587 | 6.184 | 6.059 .2085 8,450’
Casing 32# N&L-80 to 10,002’ 9060 8610 745 661 | 6.094 | 5.969 .2025 (CBL)
Production 57 18# P-110 @ 9,774 to 13940 | 13450 | 580 606 | 4.276 | 4.151 .0997 12,030
Liner 13,141 (CBL)
Production 2-7/8” 6.5# N-80 8rd 10570 | 11160 2441 | 2.347 .0325
Tubing
NOTE:

Plug & Abandonment Procedure

. Notify Dan Jarvis w/ UDOGM @ 801-538-5338 of P&A operations at least 24 hours prior to start of

well work (See Contact List).

MIRU work-over rig. RU Hot Oil Unit and pump hot water down casing to heat up tubing.

ND tree and NU and test BOP’s to 5,000# for 10 minutes. Have test recorded and chart signed and
dated by well site supervisor. Record BOP serial number.

POOH w/ 2-7/8” tbg, scanning for tubing for wear. Lay out all bad joints. Check for NORM (*If no
NORM is found, note it in the daily report; If NORM is found in the tubing; Follow EP Energy
procedures and chain of custody paperwork for handling, wrapping and transporting NORM tubing
to a proper cleaning or disposal site).

Plug #1

PU and RIH with 77-26, 29, 32# CIBP and set at 9000'. Get off CIBP and establish circulation, Test
casing and CIBP to 500psi. ( may leak off above 500 psi due to small leak at tight spot in casing
around ~ 6280’)(may have trouble getting past tight spot ~ 6280")

Mix cement plug with 40 sacks (£7.5bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a £200’
balanced cement plug from 9000’ to 8800".

PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

RIH and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston. If not, circulate around
non-corrosive fluid and POOH w/ work-string to 6300’ laying down same.

Plug #2

Mix cement plug with +20 sacks (+£3.75bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a £100’
balanced cement plug from 6,300’ to 6,200'.

RECEI VED: Dec. 15, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 57800 API Well Nunber: 43013306170000

EP =
12/1/2014

10.PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

11.RIH and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston. If not, circulate around
non-corrosive fluid and POOH w/ work-string to 5425’ laying down same. Continue POOH racking
back the last 5425’

Plug #3

12.RU E-line; PU & MU a perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to £5,425’; Pressure up to 500
psig on casing and perforate casing at £5,425’; POOH. RD ELU.

13.PU & MU a 7"- 26,29# mechanical set cement retainer on the work-string; TIH to £5,400’; Set
cement retainer @ 5,400’ Establish circulation or injection into perforations

14.Mix and circulate a £200" In-Out cement plug with +£83 sacks (x15.5bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield
Class G cement. Pump (£7.5bbls)(25’+200’ outside annulus) below the cement retainer. Sting out of
the cement retainer; Lay in the remaining balanced cement plug, (£8bbls)(175") on top of the
cement retainer. TOOH with tubing until above cement and Circulate the hole clean; WOC; Monitor
surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

15.Run back in and tag plug. Circulate around non-corrosive fluid to surface’. POOH w/ work-string to
2700’ laying down same. Continue POOH racking back the last 2700'.

Pull Casing

16.MIRU E-line. PU & MU 7” jet-cutter assembly; Test lubricator to 250psig/3000psig; RIH to
+2700. Pressure up to 500psig on casing and cut 7” casing at +2700"; POOH.

17.Establish circulation down the 7” and up the 7” X 9 5/8” annulus if possible.

18.RU 7” casing handling equipment; PU & MU casing spear; Land and set the 7” csg spear

19.POOH & LD +£2700” of 7” csg.

20.Check for NORM.

Plug #4

21.RIH with work string to 2700'.

22.Mix cement plug with 162 sacks (+30.4bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a +400’
balanced cement plug from 2700’ to 2300".

23.PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.
RIH and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston. If not, circulate
around non-corrosive fluid. POOH to 1650’ laying down work string.

Plug #5

24.Mix cement plug with £61 sacks (x11.4bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Lay in a £150’
balanced cement plug from 1,650’ to 1,500'.

25.PU above cement and reverse circulate the hole clean; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up. WOC.

RECEI VED: Dec. 15, 2014
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EP =
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26.RIH and tag plug. If tag is lower than top of proposed plug, contact Houston. If not, circulate around
non-corrosive fluid and POOH w/ work-string to 160’ laying down same.

Plug #6

27.Mix and circulate a 150" balanced cement plug from 160’ to 10’ below surface with +61 sacks
(x11.4bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement. Pump cement from surface until cement returns
up the backside. POOH. With 1 jt left, circ around fresh water @ top 5. WOC; Monitor surface
samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up.

28.RU casing cutting equipment; Cut the remaining casing at =3’ below GL and fill all annuli with
cement.

29.Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the following:

1. Well Name: Hansen Trust 1-16B3

2. Operator Name : EP Energy

3. API Number: 43-013-30617

4. Location: NE/4-SW/4-16-T2S-R3W

30.RD&MO rig & clean up location
31.Restore location as directed

RECEI VED: Dec. 15, 2014



Sundry Nunber: 67754 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well HANSEN 1-16B3
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013306170000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2088 FSL 1760 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v‘( SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE !/ PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

POOH with tubing. EOT @ 8996’ and spotted 50 sx cmt for balanced Accepted by the
plug. Tagged plug @ 8740’ (256’ plug). POOH to 6310’ and pumped 35 Utah Division of
sx cmt for balanced plug. Tagged TOC @ 6180’ (130’ plug). Perf'd from Qil, Gas and Mining

5415'-5416’. Set CICR @ 5372’. Pumped 45 sx cmt under CICR & FOR RECORD ONLY

spotted 45 sx cmt on top of plug. Tagged cmt @ 5147’ (225’ plug). November 24, 2015
POOH with 7" casing. TIH to 2589" and pumped 135 sx cmt, displaced,

pumped 135 sx cmt (witnessed by Dave Hackford — UDOGM). TOC @
2233’ (356’ stump plug). POOH to 1650’ and pumped 70 sx cmt. TOC
@ 1500’ (150’). TIH to 160’ and pumped 75 sx cmt surface plug. Cut off

wellhead and welded on marker plate. SEE ATTACHED FOR DETAILS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/17/2015

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 67754 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
HANSEN 1-16B3
HANSEN 1-16B3

P&A LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 67754 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well HANSEN 1-16B3
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site HANSEN 1-16B3
Rig Name/No. MAGNA/026 Event P&A LAND
Start date 2/26/2015 End date 3/7/2015
Spud Date/Time 11/16/1981 uwi 016-002-S 003-W 30
Active datum KB @5,997.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 164007/52940 / HANSEN 1-16B3
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
2/27/2015 9:30 11:00 1.50 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG FORM FOWLES 1-26A1 TO LOCATION SPOT IN
11:00 13:30 2.50 MIRU 01 P RIG UP AND MOVE IN EQUIPMENT WHILE CIRCULATING WELL
BORE WITH 100 BBLS TPW
13:30 14:00 0.50 WOR 16 P NIPPPLE DOWN B- FLANGE AND NIPPLE UP BOP
14:00 17:30 3.50 WOR 24 P RIG UP RIG TO PULL TUBING. POOH LAYING DOWN 130 JTS
TUBING. SECURE WELL SHUT DOWN FR DAY
2/28/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 POST 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( PICKING UP AND LAYING

DOWN TUBING AND PUMPING CEMENT. HELP. OVERHEAD
LOADS, PINCH POINTS, EYES ON TARGET AND LINE OF FIRE)
FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30  10:30 3.00 POST 24 P FINISH LAYING DOWN 2 7/8" PRODUCTION TUBING

10:30  11:00 0.50 POST 18 P CHANGE OVER TUBING RUNNING EQUIPMENT TO 2 3/8"

11:00  14:30 3.50 POST 24 P PICK UP 278 JTA 2 7/8" TUBING WITH MULE SHOE ON END. EOT
@ 8996’

14:30  15:30 1.00 POST 05 P RIG UP CEMENT EQUIPMENT AND SPOT 50 SACK 16.2 PPG 1.05
YIELD CLASS G CEMENT BALANCED PLUG

15:30  17:00 1.50 POST 39 P POOH WITH 1000' OF TUBING AND REVERSE TUBING CLEAN.
SECURE WELL. SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND.

3/3/2015  6:00 7:30 1.50 POST 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( WORKING IN SLICK AND

MUDDY CONDITIONS. TRIPPING TUBING. HELP, BODY
POSITIONING AND EYES ON TARGET) FILL OUT AND REVIEW

JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 POST 18 P CLEAN SNOW OFF EQUIPMENT

8:00 8:30 0.50 POST 39 P TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG PLUG 1 CEMENT TOP @ 8740' FOR @
256' CEMENT PLUG

8:30 9:00 0.50 POST 39 P POOH WITH TUBING TO 6310'

9:00 10:00 1.00 POST 05 P PUMP A 35 SACK 16.4 PPG 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CEMENT
BALANCED PLUG. POOH WITH TUBING TO 5800

10:00 12:30 2.50 POST 06 P CIRCULATE WELL BORE CLEAN WITH PW TREATED WITH
CORROSION INHIBATOR. WAIT ON CEMENT

12:30 13:00 0.50 POST 39 P TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG CEMENT TOP @ 6180' FOR A 130’
CEMENT PLUG

November 17, 2015 at 3:12 pm 1 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 201B



Sundry Nunber: 67754 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
13:00 15:00 2.00 POST 39 P POOH WITH TUBING SAND PICK UP 6" BIT AND BIT SUB. TIH

WITH BIT TO 5450' AND POOH WITH BIT TO 1000'. SECURE
WELL SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

3/4/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 POST 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (RIGGING UP E/L TRUCK.
PUMPING CEMENT AND TIH WITH CICR. HELP OVERHEAD
LOADS) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA .CIRCULATE WELL WITH 70

BBLS TPW

7:30 8:30 1.00 POST 21 P RIG UP E/L TRUCK AND TIH TO 5415' AND SHOOT 4 CASING
PERF HOLES FROM 5415/5416'. POOH AND RIG DOWN E/L
TRUCK

8:15 9:30 1.25 POST 27 P TIH WITH 7" CICR ON 2 3/8" WORK STRING AND SET @ 5372'

8:30 8:15 POST 18 P PUMP INTO PERF HOLES WITH 1 BBLA MIN @ 1000 PSI.

9:30 10:30 1.00 POST 05 P PUMP 45 SACK 16.4 PPG, 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CEMENT UNDER

CICR AND STING OUT. SPOT 45 SACKS 16.4 PPG, 1.05 YIELD
CLASS G CEMENT ON TOP OF PLUG. POOH WITH 1000' TUBING

10:30 14:30 4.00 POST 41 P CIRCULATE WELL BORE CLEAQN WHILE WAIITING FOR CEMENT
TO SET
14:30 16:30 2.00 POST 39 P TIH AND TAG CEMENT @ 5147' FOR A 225' CEMENT PLUG. POOH

STANDING 2800' OF TUBING IN DERRICK AND LAY DOWN
REMAINING TUBING AND TOOLS. PREP TO PULL CSING. SECURE
WELL SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

3/6/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 WOR 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRE LINE

SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:00 2.50 WOR 18 P RU WIRELINE UNIT. RIH & FREE POINT 7" CSG. POOH W/ FREE
POINT TOOL. SET SPLIT SHOT OFF IN COLLAR @ 2532'. RD
WIRELINE UNIT

10:00 14:30 4.50 WOR 24 P TOOH LAYING DOWN 59 JTS 7" CSG

14:30 15:15 0.75 WOR 39 P TIH TO 2589'. PUMP 135 SX 16.4 PPG, 1.05 YIELD CLASS G
CEMENT. DISPLACE W/ 11 BBLS WTR

15:15 16:30 1.25 WOR 06 P PUMP 135 SX 16.4 PPG, 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CEMENT.

DISPLACE W/ 11 BBLS WTR APPROVED & WITNESSED BY DAVE
HACKFORD WITH STATE OF UTAH DOGM.
16:30 17:00 0.50 WOR 39 P TOOH TO 1620". SHUT WELL FOR NIGHT
3/7/2015 6:00 7:30 1.50 POST 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( TRIPPING TUBING, PUMPING
CEMENT, CUTTING WELLHEAD. HELP. HAND PLACEMENT AND
PROTECTION) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 POST 39 P TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG CEMENT @ 2233' FOR A 356' STUMP
PLUG. PLUG # 4. POOH TO 1650

8:00 8:30 0.50 POST 05 P PUMP A 70 SACK 16.4 PPG, 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CEMENT PLUG

8:30 12:00 3.50 POST 41 P POOH WITH 800" TUBING AND CIRCULATE CASING CLEAN. WAIT
ON CEMENT

12:00 13:00 1.00 POST 39 P TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG PLUG 4 @ 1500' FOR A 150' PLUG
POOH LAYING DOWN TUBING.

13:00 14:30 1.50 POST 16 P NIPPLE DOWN BOP AND CASING HEAD. TIH WITH 160" TUBING

14:30 15:00 0.50 POST 05 P PUMP 75 SACKS 16.4 PPG, 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CEMENT
SURFACE PLUG. LAY DOWN TUBING

15:00 17:00 2.00 POST 18 P RIG DOWN RIG, CUT WELLHEAD OFF 3' BELOW GROUND

LEVAL, WELD ON MARKER PLATE AND BACKFILL CELLAR.
RACK OUT ALL EQUIPMENT. SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

November 17, 2015 at 3:12 pm 2 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Nov. 17, 201B
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Sundry Nunber: 67885 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
HANSEN 1-16B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013306170000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext ALTAMONT
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
2088 FSL 1760 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 16 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: ICIBP

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

POOH with tubing. Worked through tight spots. Set CIBP @ 9730’ and
dumped 10’ cmt on top. Perforated sub and 312 jts tubing w/ EOT @
9670'. Did not reperf. See attached for details.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
November 24, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/24/2015

RECEI VED: Nov. 24, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 67885 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
HANSEN 1-16B3
HANSEN 1-16B3

RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Nov. 24, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 67885 APl Well Nunber: 43013306170000
CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well HANSEN 1-16B3
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site HANSEN 1-16B3
Rig Name/No. BASIC/1480 Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start date 8/6/2012 End date
Spud Date/Time 11/16/1981 uwi 016-002-S 003-W 30
Active datum KB @5,997.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 159575/46619 / HANSEN 1-16B3
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
8/7/2012 12:00 12:30 0.50 MIRU 28 P SAFETY METING( MOVING RIG AND RIGGING UP SAFELY) FILL
OUT AND REVIEW JSA
12:30 15:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P SPOT IN RIG UP CSIP @ 900 PSI. BLEED OFF CASING AND PUMP
50 BBLS 2% DOWN CASING. CASING FILLED AND PUMPED
UPTO 1000 PSI ON CASING WITH NO CIRCULATION
15:00 15:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LAY DOWN 36' POLISH ROD AND RIG UP FLOOR TO PULL RODS
15:30 18:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH WITH 91-1" RODS AND 7-7/8" RODS TO ABOX PART @
2450'. SECURE WELL
18:00 18:00 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/8/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (FISHING RODS) FILL OUT
AND REVIEW JSA. HOT OIL TRUCK STARTED PUMPING DOWN
CASING AND FILLED IT WITH 30 BBLS 2% KCL PRESSURED UP
TO 1000 PSI
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P TRIP IN HOLE WITH 2 1/2" OBANNON OVERSHOT DRESSED 1
13/16" TO FISH PARTED 7/8" ROD BOX @ 2450 LATCH ONTO
FISH @ 2450'.
8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ATTEMPT TO WORK PUMP OFF-SEAT, EITHER PULLED OFF OR
PARTED.
9:30 10:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 28-7/8--PARTED PIN @ 2975/,
10:30 12:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS FOR TBG, N.D. WELLHEAD,P.U. ON
C-FLANGE- 7"TAC IS SHEARED, N.U. BOPS, R.U. FLOOR,
12:00 20:00 8.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 14 JTS 2 7/8 @ 9331".... WELL TO FLOW UP TUBING.
HOOK UP TO FLOW BACK TANK AND FLOW WELL TO TANK.
HOOK UP 2 HOT OILERS CIRCULATE WELL DOWN CSG AND UP
TBG THROUGH A CHOKE, CIRCULATE 410BBL 2% KCL. THE
TUBING STARTED TO CIRCULATE WATER. SECURE WELL .
RECOVERED 395 BBLS OIL TO FLOWBACK TANK
8/9/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( BACKING OFF RODS
SAFELY) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P . POOH W /86 JTS-2 7/8 TO RODS, X-O TO HANDLE RODS.

(2:30- BACKED OFF RODS,

November 24, 2015 at 2:56 pm
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21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
11:30 19:30 8.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 101- 7/8-- TOTAL 129,136-3/4,24-1". CHANGE OVER

TO TBG, POOH W/220 JTS 2 7/8--- TOTAL ABOVE 7"TAC 306
JTS,L.D. 7" TAC,CONTINUE W/7JTS ,S.N.,6'TBG SUB,L.D. 4 1/2
PBGA,L.D. MUD JT,L.D. SOLID PLUG,L.D. 5 3/4 NO-GO. SECURE

WELL.
19:30 20:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P WASH UP EQUIPMENT.
20:00 20:00 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (ON R.U. WIRELINE) FILL
OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 11:00 3.50 WBP 18 P R.U. WIRELINE- RUN GAUGE RING, TROUBLE GETTING
THROUGH 6284'-6300'. R.D. WIRELINE.
11:00 15:00 4.00 WBP 39 P M.U. 5 7/8 BIT W/ SCRAPER, RIH AND TALLEY TBG, TAG @
6292' SPT
11:00 11:00 0.00 MOVE IN CATWALK AND 3 1/2" TUBING
15:00 17:00 2.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP W/230 BBLS @ 6254'-202 JTS IN.
SECURE WELL FOR DAY
17:00 17:00 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (RIGGING UP WIRE LINE
TRUCK) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 8:30 1.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL W/ 230 BBLS @ 6254'-202 JTS IN.
8:30 10:30 2.00 WBP 39 P POOH FROM 6254'. LAY DOWN 5 7/8" BIT AND SCRAPER
10:30 12:00 1.50 WLWORK 18 P RIG UP ELECTRIC LINE AND RUN IN HOLE WITH 1 1/2"

SINKERBARS AND 3 1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR THROUGH TIGHT
SPOT @ 6284". TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG FILL @ 9,848’

12:00 13:00 1.00 WLWORK 18 P RIG UP 56 ARM CALIPER LOGGING TOOL BUT COULD NOT GET
ODT TOOL TO REGISTER. SECURE WELL AND WAIT FOR NEW
TOOL
13:00 13:00 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/12/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WLWORK 28 P CREW TRAVEL SAFETY MEETING ( RUNNING WIRELINE
SAFELY) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 12:00 4.50 WLWORK 18 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND RUN 56 ARM CALIPER /ODT LOG FROM

LT @ 9774' TO 2000' FINDING CASING ANOMOLY @ 6284' AND
5863'. RIG DOWN WIRE LINE TRUCK SECURE WELL

12:00 12:00 0.00 SHUT WELL IN FOR WEEKEND
8/13/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 WBP 45 P DOWN FOR WEEKEND
8/14/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 N CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (PICKING UP COLLARS AND
BHA) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:00 2.50 WBP 44 N WAITING ON ORDERS FOR WELL.
10:00 12:00 2.00 WBP 42 N ORDER OUT COLLARS AND SWEDGING EQUIPMENT
12:00 17:00 5.00 WBP 45 N PICK UP 6" CASING SWEDGE, 1-4 3/4" DRILL COLLAR,

4 3/4" BOWEN LUBRICATED BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" BOWEN JAR,
4-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS. 4 3/4" BOWEN INTENSIFIER. CHANGE
OVER SUB RIH W/198 JTS 5' IN @ 6292', CANT GET 6" SWEDGE
THROUGH THE PART.

17:00 20:00 3.00 WBP 39 N PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH BOTTOM HOLE ASSEMBLY SECURE
WELL
20:00 20:00 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR QUARTLEY CONSULTANT MEETINGS
8/15/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 WBP 45 P DOWN FOR QUARTERLY CONSULTANT MEETING
8/16/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (RUNNING IN HOLE WITH
CASING SWEDGING EQUIPMENT) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:30 3.00 WBP 39 N CASING WAS STATIC. PICK UP 5 3/4" IMPRESSION BLOCK AND

TRIP INTO WELL SETTING 4000 PSI ON BLOCK @ 6,284".
IMPRESSION BLOCK FELL THROUGH TIGHT SPOT. PULL
THROUGH TIGHT SPOT WITH IMPRESSION BLOCK
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CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
10:30 13:00 2.50 WBP 39 N PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH 204 JOINTS TUBING AND EXAMINE

IMPRESSION BLOCK. THERE WERE SOME SMALL
DISTORTATIONS ON BOTTOM SIDES OF BLOCK AND TOP OF
BLOCK WHERE CASING HAD ENGAGED BLOCK WHIKE
TRAVELING THROUGH CASING ANOMIALLY

*** HEAT WORK TANK TO 140 DEGREES AND CIRCULATE WELL
CLEAN FROM 3000' TO SURFACE WITH 100 BBLS***

13:00 16:00 3.00 WBP 39 P PICK UP 5 3/4" CASING SWEDGE, 1-4 3/4" DRILL COLLAR,
BOWEN 4 3/4" LUBRICATED BUMPER SUB, 4 3/4" JAR, 4-4 3/4"
DRILL COLLARS, BOWEN 4 3/4" INTENSIFIER, CHANGE OVER
SUB AND 6' X 2 7/8" TUBING SUB. TRIP INTO WELL WITH 198
JOINTS TUBING AND ENGAGE TIGHT SPOT @ 6,284' SETTING
DOWN 4,000 PSI AND WORKING THROUGH TIGHT SPOT IN
CASING. WORK THROUGH TIGHT SPOT 10 TIMES UNTIL STRING
WEIGHT WAS OBSERVED THROUGH FULL TRAVEL OF STAND

DOWN TO 6,320
16:00 19:30 3.50 PULL TUBING, COLLARS AND SWEDGING EQUIPMENT OUT OF
HOLE. SECURE WELL
19:30 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/17/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (RUNNING COLLARS AND
SWEDGING) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:00 2.50 WBP 39 N CASING PRESSURE WAS STATIC. PICK UP 5 7/8" CASING

SWEDGE, 1 4 3/4" DRILL COLLAR, 4 3/4" BOWEN LBS, 4 3/4
BOWEN JARS, 4-4 3/4" DRILL COLLARS, BOWEN 4 3/4"
INTENSIFER, CHANGE OVER, 6'- 2 7/8" TUBING SUB AND 198
JOINTS OF 2 7/8" N-80 EUE TUBING. ENGAGE CASING PROBLEM

@ 6,284'
10:00  10:30 0.50 WBP 45 N ENGAGE CASING PROBLEM WITH CASING SWEDGE AND WORK

THROUGH TIGHT SPOT FOR FIRST TIME WITH 5 7/8" SWEDGE
10:30  11:30 1.00 WBP 45 N WORK SWEDGE THROUGH TIGHT SPOT TAKING 10,000 LBS

WIEGHT APPLIED TO MOVE THROUGH TIGHT SPOT AND 12,000
LBS PULLING THROUGH TIGHT SPOT. WORKED LAST 30
MINUTES @ THOSE WIEGHTS.

11:30 16:30 5.00 WBP 39 N PULL TUBING, COLLARS AND CASING SWEDGING EQUIPMENT
OUT OF HOLE AND CHANGE 5 7/8" SWEDGE OUT FOR 6"
CASING SWEDGE AND TRIP INTO WELL TO ENGAGE CASING

ANOMALY

16:30 19:30 3.00 WBP 45 N SWEDGE ON CASING ANOMALY @ 6,284'

19:30 20:30 1.00 WBP 45 N WORKED SWEDGE THROUGH TIGHT SPOT. LAY DOWN 2
JOINTS TUBING SECURE WELL

20:30 20:30 0.00 WBP P SECURE WELL

8/18/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 TIEB3 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( RIGGING DOWN SWEDGING

EQUIPMENT. LAYING DOWN COLLARS) FILL OUT AND REVIEW
SA

7:30 10:00 2.50 WBP 45 N CONTINUE TO SWEDGE THROUGH TIGHT SPOT IN CASING WITH

6" CASINF SWEDGE UNTIL SET DOWN WEIGHT WAS 22,000 PSI
AND 25,000 PSI PICK UP WEIGHT TO GET SWEDGE OUT OF

HOLE
10:00 12:30 2.50 WBP 39 N PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TUBING TO COLLARS AND TOOLS
12:30 13:30 1.00 WBP 24 N LAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS AND COLLARS. SWEDGE WAS IN
GOOD CONDITION
13:30 16:00 2.50 WBP 39 N PICK UP 7" 32# WEATHERFORD PACKER AND TRIP INTO HOLE

THROUGH TIGHT SPOT @ 6,284' AND SET HD PACKER @ 6450
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21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
16:00 17:00 1.00 WBP 18 N PRESSURE TEST BAD SPOT IN CASING TO SURFACE TO 1400

PSIINJECTING @ 1.5 BBL MINUTE . ISIP @ 1400
1 MINUTE @ 850 PSI. 2 MINUTE @ 800 PSI. 3 MINUTE @ 800. 4
MINUTE @ 800 PSI. 5 MINUTE @ 775 PSI. 6 MINUTE @ 775 PSI. 7
MINUTE @ 750 PSI. 8 MINUTE @ 750. 9 MINUTE @ 750 PSI. 10
MINUTE @ 750 PSI.

17:00 18:30 1.50 WBP 39 N BLEED WELL OFF AND RELEASE HD PACKER PULL UP
THROUGHT TIGHT SPOT. PULL 3250' TUBING OUT OF WELL.
EOT @ 3000' SECURE WELL

18:30 18:30 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/19/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (RIGGING UP AND WORKING
AROUND WIRLINE) FILL OUT AND REVIEW SA
7:30 8:00 0.50 WBP 06 N CIRCULATE 100 BBLS 2% KCL TO CLEAN OUT WELLBORE
8:00 9:00 1.00 WBP 39 N FINISH PULLING TUBING OUT OF WELL FROM 3000' AND LAY
DOWN HD PACKER
9:00 13:00 4.00 WLWORK 27 N RIG UP ELECTRIC LINE TRUCK AND RIH WITH 5.78" GAUGE RING

TO 9771. TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND PICK UP 7" 32 LB CAST IRON
BRIDGE PLUG AND TRIP INTO WELL WITH PLUG SAT DOWN @
9750' WITH PLUG. SET CIBP @ 9730'. DUMP BAIL 10' CEMENT
ON TOP OF CIPB. RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK.

13:00 14:00 1.00 WBP 18 N INJECT INTO CASING @ 1.5 BBLS AMINUTE @ 1500 PSI.
PUMPED 10 BBLS. ISIP @ 1400. 1 MINUTE @ 800 PSI. 2 MINUTE
@ 725 PSI. 3 MINUTE @ 700. 4 MINUTE @ 700 PSI. 5 MINUTE @
690 PSI. 6 MINUTE @ 690 PSI. 7 MINUTE @ 690 PSI. 8 MINUTE @
690. 9 MINUTE @ 690 PSI. 10 MINUTE @ 690 PSI. BLEED OFF
WELL BORE

14:00 19:00 5.00 WBP 39 N TRIP INTO WELL WITH 2 7/8" TAPPED BULL PLUG, 4' X 2 7/8"
PERFORATED SUB AND 312 JOINTS TUBING W/ EOT @ 9670’
RIG DOWN FLOOR NIPPLE DOWN BOP NIPPLE UP WELLHEAD.

SECURE WELL
19:00 19:00 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY
8/20/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 TIEB3 18 P DOWN FOR WEEKEND
8/21/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL SAFETY MEETING (LAYING DOWN RODS) FILL
OUT AND REVIEW JSA
7:30 7:30 0.00 CLEANED FLOW BACK TANK AND RIG TANK
7:30 9:00 1.50 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE TUBING CLEAN WHILE CHANGING OVER TO RUN
RODS
9:00 12:00 3.00 WBREMD 18 P RUN IN HOLE WITH RODS
12:00 13:00 1.00 WBREMD 06 P FLUSH RODS W/60 BBLS 2% KCL
13:00 18:00 5.00 WBREMD 24 P LAY DOWN 93-1" RODS, 93-7/8" RODS AND97-3/4" RODS AND
LEFT ON LOCATION
18:00 19:00 1.00 RDMO 54 P CHANGE OUT DRILL LINE
8/22/2012 6:00 17:00 11.00 RDMO 54 P WORK ON RIG
17:00 19:00 2.00 RDMO 02 P RIG DOWN RIG AND GET READY TO MOVE OUT
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Date: 31-JUL-2015 1:01:34PM

Fees $12.00 Check Filed By: DifM
SHELLEY BRENNAM, Recorder

DUCHESNE COUNTY CORPORATION

For: EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY LP

SURFACE DAMAGE RELEASE

This Surface Damage Release is made and entered into as of this 13th day of May, 2015, by and
between ROGER A. BENNETT AND ANDREA F. BENNETT, husband and wife, as joint
tenants, whose mailing address is HC 65 Box 41, Altamont, Utah 84001-0000, hereinafter
referred to as “Surface Owner” and EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY L.P. (formerly El Paso
E&P Company, L.P.), whose address is 1001 Louisiana Street, Houston, TX 77002 hereinafter
referred to as “EP Energy.”

WITNESSETH

WHEREAS, EP ENERGY is the operator of record of the following well, to wit:

WellName :  Hansen 1-16B3 A% 0O1% 2D
Location : T2S, R3W, Sec. 16: NESW
County/State : Duchesne County, Utah

(the “Well”) and;

WHEREAS, on or about November 13, 2014, the Well was plugged and abandoned in
accordance with the rules and regulations of the State of Utah, Oil, Gas, & Mining Division; and
surface equipment belonging to EP Energy has been removed from the Well location, and;

WHEREAS, the surface has been restored as near as practicable to its original condition and in
accordance with the rules and regulations of the State of Utah.

NOW THEREFORE, the consideration of Ten Dollars ($10.00) and other valuable consideration
paid by EP Energy to the Surface Owner is accepted by Surface Owner as full and final
settlement. Surface Owner does hereby release and forever discharge EP Energy, its agents,
contractors, officers and employees, from any and all claims, demands and causes of action of
whatsoever kind or nature.

Executed as of the date first written above.

SURFACE OWNER:

By:.swuﬂ’w

Name: Andrea F. Bennett

Contract Number: 1545



Ent 486784 Page 2 of 2

ACKNOWLEDGEMEI}II ...... detnesisvaconssnnnan sesanscesces .

1 FEN RYANBROCK

. -f— : ' ntary Public ;

STATE OF | A H vateolUtah !
3 : Comr: 1. Expires December 27, 2016 ¢

§ S8 : Cormistion Mooer 000883

COUNTY OF A § R SR L TTT TR PP “"'O....‘....l.‘

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me thisé day of 1 «© Ié , 2045

by Roger A. Bennett.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT §=oceretsneenncoeceeannanneaneonns

{ R RYAN BROCK i

7[’ H: Notary Public H

: State of :

STATE OF ZA § 1\ uyco«--mmmn,mi
3 - vmission Nunber 600853 3

§ S8 LSBTy
county orfllecrz -
The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this Zd( day of T %4 % , 20/ ;

by Andrea F. Bennett.
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
STATE OF TEXAS §
§SS
COUNTY OF HARRIS §
The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this day of ,20

by Thomas L. Muchard, as Agent and Attorney-in-Fact of EP Energy, a Delaware limited
partnership.

Notary Public
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