State of Utah

UTEX OIL COMPANY

SUITE 41B
4700 SOUTH 9TH EAST
SALT LAKE CITY, UTAH 84117
PHONE 801 - 262-6869

April 21, 1981

Division of 0il1 & Gas Conservation
1588 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the following:

1.

4.
5.

Triplicate copies of Application for Permit to Drill

the Galloway 1-18B1 well, Tocated in the SWiNE} Section 18,
T2S, R1W, Duchesne County, Utah. -

Triplicate copies of survey plat.

Triplicate copies of Right-of-Way and Use Boundary map.
Triplicate copies of well Tayout plat.

Triplicate copies of BOP drawing.

We trust this application is complete and in proper form for your rapid
approval of our planned operations. If further information is required,
please contact us at the above address or telephone number.

Thank you.

Sincerely,

D.T. Hansen




Form OGC-1a ’ SUBMIT IN ’J’LICATE*
STATE OF UTAH (Other instructions on
} reverse side)
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS, AND MINING

o

.- Lease Designation and Serial No.
FEE

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK

la. Type of Work 7. Unit Agreement Name
DRILL X] : "DEEPEN [] PLUG BACK []
b. Type of Well ~
0Oil Gas o . . Single D Multiple D 8. Farm or Lease Name
W W Oth
T Tame of Operator e Zone Zone GALLOWAY
UTEX OIL COMPANY 9. Well No.
3. Address of Operator 1-18B1
Suite 41-B, 4700 South 9th East, Salt Lake City, Utah 84117 10- Field and Fool, or Wildeat =~
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) %BEH—W“G é(ﬁ(‘{
At surface ' ' 11. Sec., T., R.. M., or Bk,
1519 BE(, 1565 %L and Sur.vey or Area
At proposed prod. zoneFNL FEI—'
SW/ANE/4 Sec. 18, T2S, R1W, USB&M
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12, County or Parrish 13, State
Approximately 2.5 miles West-Northwest of Roosevelt, Utah Duchesne Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease - 17. No. of acres assigned
locatl(;:x to t;ea:sii.in £t . - to this well
(Also to nearest drlg. line, if any) 1519 80 640
18. tDistance t{ro'n';l p(xiop]nl)sed ]ocati(l)n';d : 19. Pronosed depth . Rotary or cable tools
or applied for, ‘on this Jease, ft. : 12,350" “/ﬂ m Rotary
21. Elevations (Show whether DF,.R_T, GR, ete.) 22 Approx, date work will start®
1
5150" GR May 15, 1981
. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGBAM
Size of Hole Size of Casing ‘Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement
14 3/4" 10 3/4" 40.5# 2500 As necessary
9 7/8" 7:5/8" , 26.4 & 29.7# 9500 As necessary
6 3/4" 51/2" 20.0# 12,350 As necessary

Utex controls the lands within a 660 ft. radius of this location

APPROVED BY THE STATE
OF UTAH DIVISION OF 80P
OIL, GAS, AND MINING

. =2 -5/
DATE: DIViSION OF

BY: ’ OIL, GAS & MINING

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true verucal depths. Give blowout

preventer program, if any.

21, )
Sismned //Z/@””ﬂ/’ﬂ’ / Title..., | /fﬂé/x/ ........ Date April 21, 19..81

(This space for Federal or State office use) 7U_r
s 2 71
Permit No 3@Q £ N Arpproval Date
Approved by...ooeiveeeeeeeee e Title. ) 12 USSR

Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse Side



Instructions

General: This form is designed for submitting proposals to perform certain well operations, as indicated, on all types of lands and leases for appropriate action by either
a Federal or a State agency, or both, pursuant to applicable Federal and/or State laws and regulations. Any necessary special instructions concerning the use of this form
and the number of copies to be submitted, particularly with regard to local, area, or regional procedures and practices, either are shown below or will be issued by, or may
be obtained from, the local Federal and/or State office.

Iem 1: If the proposal is to redrill to the same reservoir at a different subsurface location or to a new reservoir, use this form with appropriate notations. Consult
applicable State or Federal regulations concerning subsequent work proposals or reports on the well.

Item 4: If there are no applicable State requirements, locations on Federal or Indian land should be described in accordance with Federal requirements. Consult local
State or Federal office for specific instructions. .

Ttem 14: Needed only when location of well cannot readily be found by road from the land or lease description. A plat, or plats, separate or on this reverse side, show-
ing the roads to, and the surveyed location of, the well, and any other required information, should be furnished when required by Federal or State agency offices.

Items 15 and 18: If well is to be, or has been directionally drilled, give distances for subsurface location of hole in any present or objective production zone.
Item 22: Consult applicable Federal or State regulations, or appropriate officials, concerning approval of the proposal before operations are started.

Formation Tops: = Uintah  ~ 0'-5500"
Green River 5500'
Wasatch 10,100'
W i




UTEX O/ coMeany
WELL LOCATION PLAT
GALLOWAY |-/8B1

L(I’ATE!N THE SW% OF THE NEY% OF
SECTI(N 18, T25, RIW, U.S.B.&M.

N 89°56' E 2631.09'
o
o
~
1565"
-
GALLOWAY |,
/-188/ T NORTH
GROUND ELEV: 550" o
/8 . OOA

SCALE:1"=1000"'

NORTH

LEGEND & NOTES

@ CORNERS FOUND AND USED BY THIS -
SURVEY. 7
GENERAL LAND OFFICE PLAT WAS USED
FOR REFERENCE AND CALCULATIONS.

13 Apr *81 79-121-023

- SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

N hereby certify that this plat was prepared

from field notes of an actual survey

- performed by me, during which the shown

monuments were found or established.

O D 2000

Jérry DJAlired, Registered Land
urveyor, Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES

Surveying & Engineering Consuitants

J 121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C
DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021

' ‘ (801) 738-5352




Fill fine
X
4 H

/0 "= 5000 PS5l Wp

DOUA/C‘.‘ 9Q-/e

Blowout preventer

<o Kill  1ine L{ P | Choke /ine
XX =Y <

g c

= | | X 7o sump
\.\, . < T

"\ 0% 5000 psi wp - {_
© L\ So.w €os/ng Aead Choke




‘R/GH T-OF-WAY AND USE BOUNDARY
GALLOWAY /-/186/
UTEX OIL COMPANY

*‘T EX IS T IN G COLA7T Y ol I ‘k

A col. \A/E cor.
SEC. '8 NW Y oF NE %
728, £l u’ '
LS5 B EM.

W

\\}

LS

N

o

2

. N NORTH
NV E NE 4

R i

Y

~

\ = 2007

375 °

Y SE
EBOLNLAR Y /

N

W ~#7 e~szq.

SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

. . Co
This is to certify that under my personal supervision
a survey was made of the parcels shown on this plat
and that said plat was prepared from the field notes

of said survey and is true and correct to the best of

t— ),

" of sald NW%, containing 0.89 acres.

Jerpﬁ;D. é%ﬁred, Registered Land
0’1

Surveyor, Cert. No. 3817 (Utah)

USE BOUNDARY DESCRIPTION

Beginning at a point which is west 14.27 feet and South 1329.37 feet
from the Northeast Corner of the NW4 OF THE NE% of Section 18,

Township 2 South, Range 1 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian,
with a bearing of South 89°56' West along the Nortb line of said NE%
used as the basis of bearings;

Thence South 375 feet;

Thence West 500 feet;

Thence North 375 feet; , ‘

Thence East 500 feet to the Point of Beginning, containing 4.30 acres.
ALSQO:

A 30 feet wide right-of-way from the above described parcel to the
South line of said NW¥% of said NE%, the centerline of said right-of-way
being further described as follows:

Beginning 26.38 feet West of the Northeast Corner of the above described

'parcel;

Thence North 0°11°'15" West 9 feet, more or less to said South line,

containing 0.01 acres.
DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY

A thirty feet (30') wide right-of-way over part of Section 18,

Township 2 South, Range 1 West of the Uintah Special Base and Meridian,

the centerline of said fight—of—wag being described as follows, with

a bearing of South 89°56' West along the North line of the NE% of

said Section being used as the basis of beafings-

Beginning at a point which is South 89°56' wWest 45 feet and South 0°11'15" East
33 feet from the Northeast Corner 'of the Niy of said NE%, said point being in the
South right-of-way line of a county road;

Thence South 0°11'15" East 1287 feet more or less, to the South line

* oA
KR I

eSS

- DLAN Y
?, Qs

....--o..

JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES

Surveying & Engineering Consultants

121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C
DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021

/3 APr &/ -/2/-
s AP & 79-r2/- 023 (801) 738-5352

)




UTEX O/L

WELL LAY
GALLOW,

cl/€ _Fo<
@ce2 | 3c244) —
_.+ T T ||| 1 1 ) 70 ™, STA 4‘+05
STRAH TGP -
ACCESS . ] =
ROAD g = =
o == -
5 =
LT TR L i |
DIKE 8 — =14
ST AL = .
= ) =
': WATER - ? —?
r_— WATER I — : —]
HOLE LOCAT/ON warer ] E: RESERVE i—;
C 1R FROM GROUND — | 3
ELEV. OF 5/50 I MUD TANK — PIT =
TO FINISHED LOCATION - / { — R
ELEV. OF 5/49 e 1= g DELP A § A
NN = BOTTOM ELEV. R
el N
A S o o=
NN =[x
B = =|°
3 @ F— —
C4-<8 : ) /180’ 5 a| <0’ BOLHL T RTINS STA. 1480
| Sk 3 / |
] L2 co+= Fl=
1§ |
PIPE PIPE
RacKs RACKS EXCAVATION
MATERIAL
STOCKPILE
o
N
ropPsoisL
STOCKPILE
ki T et by 2 _3_7_ 4 , STA. 0+00
@c+= NGz - @coZ Eco
= 100 =
= TANK GRADE |=
=R ELEV: 5163 =
ZATTTT I IiIHIIHHHHII'I'III\\%

NOTES

OVERHEAD FLAGGING TO BE INSTALLED OVER

RESERVE PIT.

SOIL IS COMPOSED OF SILTY-SAND AND

SCALE:1"-50' SANDY LOAM.

WIND DIRECT/ION
EASTERLY

|
|



LOCATED IN THE NW% OF THE NEY% OF 1
SECTION 18, T25, RIW, U'.S.B.&M.

COMPANY
T PLAT F
/—/88/

5149~ LOCAT/ION SURFACE \ j\‘\
\ /
= RESERVE PIT N
S \ \/
M \__._ ______ —
1"=50" STA. 4+05
51494 LOCATION SURFACE l\m;\; \=
Jl - /
\l'g \L RESERVE PIT ~
. g3 \ 7
s ‘ \ _ |
1= 50 STA. /+80
£
XISTING sroun,
h8 4
5149 LOCAT/ION SURFACE
N
:“
1"=50' STA. 0+00
- L e Sy LA——

al
QUANTITIES 75 v fe- 3"
APPROXIMATE CUT: [7,490 CU. YDS.

,

3
4

__KEYwAY A—24

APPROXIMATE FILL: /150 CU YDS.
JERRY D. ALLRED & ASSOCIATES
Surveying & Engineering Consultants
121 North Center Street
P.O. Drawer C
DUCHESNE, UTAH 84021
(3 _APKIL_198] 79-12/1-023 (801) 738-5352




*% FILE NOTATIONS **

onte:__ MNay 1) 198/
0,, . '

OPERATOR:

WELL NO:

Location: S’ec. I?{ T. A5 =&. )U) Countwm

Fite Prepaned: /__/ Entered on N.I.D:E
Card Indexed: E ~ Completion Sheet: D
w1 Nunbor 43D 3- 30575

CHECKED BY:

Petroleum Engmeer/yw S /R —-2’/

Director:

APPROVAL LETTER:

Bond Required:
Ornden No.

Rule C-3(c), Topographic Excepition - company owns or controls acreage
within a 660' radiws o4 proposed site

Lease Designation @ Plotted on Mapf /
Approval Letten Wrnitten U

Hot Line _/‘ZZ'_/ P.I.Q?



May 18, 1981

Utex 0il Comppny

Suite 41-B,

4700 South 9th Bast

Salt Lake City, Utah 84117

Re: Well Nol.Galloway 1-18B1
S°CI 18, T. zs' R. 1", s' NB
Duchesne County, Utah

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to 0il well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued
in Cause No. 131-14, dated August 11, 1971.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon
this well, you are hereby requested to immediately notify the following:

MICHAEL T. MINDER - Petroleum Engineer
Office: 533-5771
Home: 876-3001

Enclosed please find Form 0GC~8-X, which is to he completed whether
or not water sands (acquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation in completing this form will be appreciated. '

Further, it is requested that this Division be notified within 24 hours
after drilling operations commence, and that the drilling contractor and rig .
number be identified.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30575.
Sincerely,
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

Michael T. Minder
Petro_leum Engineer

MIM/ko

cCi




0 Qﬁi/fqi( |
JIM UTEX OlIL COMPANY

SUITE 41B
4700 SOUTH 9TH EAST
SALT LAKE CITY, UTAH 84117
PHONE 801 - 262-6869

August 27, 1981

Department of Natural Resources
Division of 011, Gas and Mining
1588 West North Temple

Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Galloway 1-18B1
Sec. 18, T2S-R1W
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find the well report, in triplicate, for
the above captioned well.

Sincerely,

2

. nsen

Enclosure



l‘:otm 0GC-1b

’ATE OF UTAH
DEPARTME OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS, AND MINING

SU IN TRIPLICATE*
instructions on
heverse side)

5. LEASE DESIONATION AND BERIAL NO.

Fee:

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRINE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS '
{Do not use this fotr’a f'%r%%ifnuog ‘d_gg ;rz ltlou g_ie_pe"n':: &l&:pt;;;m‘a) different reservolir.

1. A 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMS

or oAl .

WELL WELL oTHER
2. XAMB OF OPXRATOR . 8. FARM OR LBASE NAME

Utex 0i1 Company Galloway
3. 4ADDREZSS OF OPERATOR _:' - - 9. WaLL xo.
Suite 41-B, 4700 South 9th East, Salt Lake City, Utah 84117 1-18B1

4. ?;‘5‘-%'-3:::?&" bgﬁ;pf;rt location clearly ungl in accordance with any State requirements.® 10. ngl:lnuAelboer;?ln, OR WILDCAT

Atserfa¥ SW/4 NE/4 -1519' FEL 1565' FSL

11, asc, 7., R, M., OR BLX, AND
SURVAY OR ARBA

Sec. 18, T2S, RIW

14. rERMIT MO,

43-013-30575

5150 GR

18. lx.‘;':vrnoxs (Show whether b7, AT, OR, ¢to.)

12. COUNTY O& PaRISH

Duchesne

13. sTATE

Utah

16.

NOTICE OF INTENTION T0:

TEST WATEIR BHUT-OFP
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL

{Other)

Check Appro'pncjfc Box To Indicate Nature

; I
PULL OR ALTER CaASING

MCLTIPLE COMPLETE
ABANDON®

CHANGE PLANS

of Notice,r"chon, or Other Data

AUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

WATER SHUTOFP RETAIRING WELL

PlAﬁUlt TQ‘IATHIHT ALTERING CABING

SHOUTING OR ACID .
(Other) __ LIRNR

b3
NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
}’nmpletlonpgr Recompletion Report and Log form.)

ABANUONMENT®

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMILETED OPERATION
proposed work. If well .is directionally

nent to this work.) ®

. Spdded well.at 11:45 PM 6-2-

- 6-3-81 thru 6-9-81
Drilling, Uintah
Drilled 0 - 2,414"

s?(Cleurly stute all pertinent detalls, und give pertinent dutes, including estimated date of atarting any
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured-and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
¢ .

81

Ran- 10 3/4" - 40.5# casing

6-10-81 thru 6-16-81
Drilling, Uintah

Drf]]ed from 2,414 -~ 4,

6-17-81 thru 6-23-81
Drilling, Green River

685'

Drilled from 4,685'-6,312"

6-24-81 thru 6-30-81
Drilling, Green River
Drilled 6,312' - 7,760'

ing {s true :gnd correct

7
rxrmd&&“ =

18. 1 hereby certif, th :
' BIGNED f@ Wavar/ s b= Zaa DATE
{This space for Federal or State office use)
APPROVED BY TITLE | DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



e . -

QATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

Form OGC-1b

SUL IN TRIPLICATE*
instructions on
feverse side)

5. LXASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

{Do not use this fotr’m for pro

sals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr.

se “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

6. 17 INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRINE NAME

i . T. UNIT AGAXEMBNT NAMB
OIL CAS
WELL WELL OTHER
2. -Aﬂl OF OPERATOR 8. FaRM OR I;IAII NAMB
Utex 0i1 Company Galloway
3. ipoxzsa oF orswiToR g 9. WBLL WO,
Suite 41-B, 4700 South 9th East, Salt Lake City, Utah 84117 1-18B1

4.

LOCATION OF WELL (Repo
delow.)

See also space 17

rt location clearly nxéd in accordance with any State requirements.?

Atwrtict SW/4 NE/4 1519' FEL 1565' FSL

10. PIELD AXD POOL, OR WILDCAT

Bluebell

11. asC., T, R, M., OR BLX, AND
SURYAY OR ARBA

Sec. 18, T2S, RIW

14,

PERMIT XO.

43-013-30575

5150 GR

18. xi;uﬂous {Show whether prF, &Y, OX, oto.)

12. COUNTY OR PARISH

Duchesne

13, sTATR

Utah

16.

Check Appro}mi:u Box To Indicate Nature of Noﬁcé; chod, ot Other Data

b
NOTICE OF INTBNTION T0: )

TEIST WATER 8HUT-OFF

PULL OK ALTER CASING

SUBSBEQURNT REPORT OF:

WATER SHUT-OFP

RETAIRING WERLL
ALTERING CASING
ABANUONMENT®

FRACTURE TREAT MTLTIPLT COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OR ﬁmu.lur.
s 1

REPAIR WELL CHANGE -PLANS (Other) m

(Oth

or)

(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE FRNPOSED OR CUMILETED OPERATIONS (Clearly stute il pertinent detalls, und glve pertinent dates, Including estimated date of starting any

proposed work., If well is di
nent to this work.) *

7-1-81 thry 7-7-81

Dril
Dril

1ing, ‘Green River
led from 7,760'~ 9,500'

7-8-81 thru 7-14-81

Dril
Dril

T1ing, Wasatch
led from 9,500'- 9,751

7-8-81 Logging with Sch]umbergér
7-9-81 Running 7 5/8" casing
7510-81 Cementing

7-15-81 thru 7-21-81

Dril
Dril

T1ing, Wasatch
led from 9,571' - 10,566'

7-22-81 thru 7-28-81

Dril

Ting, Wasatch

prilled from 10,566" - 11,190'

vl

rectionally d{illtd. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

18. I beredy urmmmnm
' BIGNED Z 2 // , TITLE

DATEB

(This

APPROVED BY

COND

space for Federal or State office use)

TITLE

" DATE

ITIONS OF APPROVAL, IV ANY: .

*See Instructions on Revense Sidc



. FormOGCIb | © " SUBMdR IN TRIPLICATE®
. R QATE OF UTAH _ (‘inslru%ions on
" DEPARTMEN , verse side)

OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5. LEARE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

{Do not use this fo&m for proposals to drfll or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

se “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT~" for such proposals.)

6. 1Ir INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRINE NAME

1

OIL GAS .
WILL WELL OTHER

7. UNIT AGAEEMENT NaMB

2. XAME OF OPERATOR

8. FARAL OR LIASE NAMB

Utex 0i1 Company Galloway
8. ADDREES OF OPBRATOR 5 : 9. wWaLL XO.
Suite 41-B, 4700 South 9th East, Salt Lake City, Utah 84117 1-18B1
4. xs.gecaﬁx.%u.g: e:vixil. biﬁ?f;n location clearly néd in accordance with any State uqulremenu.;f 10. l’lgl:lnuaelbb eI‘_T?Il-: OR wWiLDCAT

Aterts /4 NE/4 -1519' FEL 1565' FSL

11. asC., T, R, M,, OR BLX, AND
SUAVET OR ARBA

Sec. 18, T2S, R1W

14. reaMIT XNO. 15. BLXIVATIONS (Show whether D7, AT, OX, oto.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH]| 18, aTATS
43-013-30575 . 5150 GR v Duchesne Utah
16. ~ Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICS OF INTENTION xo: . C : B SUBSBQUENT XEPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF rULL o:;:nﬂn CASING ' WATER SHUT-OFP RETAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT um.-uni‘;‘ COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIMZE ABANDON® SHOUTING OF ACID . ABANUONMENT®
: ﬁrﬁ"ﬁ g
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) 3
(NoTE} Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) ('nmplétlonp:r Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE 'ROPOSED OR COMILETED OPERATIONS -(Clearly state all pertinent detatls, and give pertinent dates, Including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is - directionally drjlled. give subsurface locations and mgaugred ':g::d true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) ¢

7-29-81 thry 8-4-81
Drilling, Wasatch .
Drilled 11,190 - 12,238"

8-5-81 thru 8-7-81 TD
Drilling, Wasatch

Drilled 12,238' - 12,750' TD .
Ran 5" 18# N-80 casing, 3,515.61'.

Total Tap 249", top of hanger 89,250,48".
Wait on completion. (Rig Released @4:00 p.m. 8-10-81).

i

DATB

' Vi
18. I heredy certu///g;nt regoing is true and correct
' BIGNED / V M adedt © TITLE <2%
- o .

(This space for Federal or State office use) :

APPROVED BY ; TITLE

" DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



UTEX OlL COMPANY
SUITE 41B
4700 SOUTH 9TH EAST

SALT LAKE CITY, UTAH 84117
PHONE 801 - 262.6869

September 19, 198%}: e T33X

@

State of Utah Dy
Division of oil & Gas Conservation oL,
1588 West North Temple

Salt Lake City, Utah

84116

Gentlemen:

Enc]osed please find duplicate copies of completion report for the Galloway
1-18B1 well, Tocated in Section 18, T2S-R1W, Duchesne County, Utah.

Copies of all Togs run have been ordered sent directly to your office from
the logging company.

We hereby request that all information submitted relative to this well be
held confidential for the maximum allowable period of time.

If I may be of further assistance, please advise.

Sincerely,

/2fzgz%;%;%;é%f;an;aéz»a//’

D. T. Hansen



il GCC-3 ' ' q
R SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE®

STATE OF UTAH

(Sce otherin.

3. LEASE DESIGNATIUN AND EBERIAL NO.

FEE

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE QR TRIBL NAME

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION. REEQRT_’

YPE OF WE ol GAS
e T LL: WELL “‘AL'LL DRY D 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: : } -
NEW WORIC DEEF- PLTG PIFF. 3 VRS _
WELL BX OVER EN DACK RESVR. Other S. FARM OR LEASE NAMEK

, N OF GALLOWAY
UTEX OIL COMPANY oW w;‘;@qim\mw@ B wELL RO,
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR b, W 1-18B1

SUITE 41-B, 4700 South 9th East, Salt Lake C1ty, Utah 84117 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in acch WILDCAT

Atsudface  1019' FNL 1565° FEL 11. 8EC.. T, K., M., OH BLOCK 4NL BCOVEY

OR AREA
At top prod. ioterval reported below

2. NAME OF OPERATOR

Section 18, T2S, RIW
SW/4NE/4

At total depth

14. FERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY oOR 13. STaTE
PARISH
- 43-013-30575 |May 18, 1981 |pycheene Utah
15. paTE sPUDDED | 16. DATE T.D. REACHED | 11. DATE COMPL. (Ready fo prod.) | 18, ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, BT, GR, ETC.)* | 19- ELEV. CASINGHEAD
6/2/81 8/7/81 8/28/81 5150 GR
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., ¥D & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL.,, 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TQOLS
: HOW MANY® * DRILLED BY
12,773 12,735 >} 0-TD |
25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMFLETION-—-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)®

Wasatch 12,684-11,078

SCBVEY MADE

No

26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND oruu.._wcs RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

(@I CNRD, BHC-Sonic> | No

28.- CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
c:«sx.\'c SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

10 3/4 _40.5 2414 14 3/4 1500 sx Class G w/additiyes = None
7.5/8 26.4 & 29.7 | 9503 9 7/8 1050 sx Class H w/additiyes None

29. LINER RECQRD - ’ 30. TUBING RECORD

j:354 4 TOP (MD)} BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT® SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

5" 9240 | | 12,773 612 Class H |~ 2 778 9800 9600
' 2 3/8 6000

31. PERFORATION RECORD (Infercval, size ond numbﬁr) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
See attachment : ) DEPTE INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL CSED
Natural None
33.¢ " PRODUCTION
DATE FIRBT PRODUCTION PRODUCTION m:rnoo (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—size and type o[ pump) %ELL STATUS (Producing or
8/28/81 FTOW1 ng ) , shut: m)S :
DATE OF TEST HOURS TLSTED CHOKE §IZE PROD'N. FOR OIL—BBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—BBL. "GAS-OIL RATIO
b >
8/29/81 24 26/64 | IR | 954 | 1000 |
"YLow. TUBING PrEss. | CASING PRESSURE | CALCT Lutu OIL—BBL. GAS—MCF. : WATER—BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)
24-ROURIRATE ’
600 0 —— | 954 | | o

TEST WITNESSED BY

D. Baucum

34. DISPOSITION OF Gas (Sold, uzed for fuel, vented, etc.)

Flared pending gas line hookup

335. LiST OF ATTACHMENTS

38. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as detetmiued from all avallable records
. S s 2
sioxen AL /- /\,cif T A miree __EXc. Secretary pate _ 3/16/81

*(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)
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12,672-84
12,602-10
12,569-72
12,542-46
12,484-98
12,440-44
12,370-84
12,344-46
12,338-4C
12,222-30

33 zones

205 feet

PERFORATED INTERVALS

GALLOWAY 1-<18B1

12,204-14
12,182-88
12,124-35
12,102-108
12,048-52
11,898-902
11,876-80
11,828-32
11,798-802
11,784-92

615 holes

11,738-43
11,677-79
11,668-70
11,612-18
11,560-70
11,480-84
11,460-65
11,358-61
11,326-36
11,284-92

11,256-60
11,156-64
11,078-84
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Form OGCC-1 be
STATE OF UTAH SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE®

(Other instructions on re-
OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

verse side) 6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Fee
AT INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
| {Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--"

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMB
oIL GAS
WDLL WELL OTHER
2, NAME OF OPERATOR P 8. FARM OR LEASE NAMD
| ANR Production Company . Galloway
8. ADDEESS OF OPDRATOR D|V|§]UN"0‘F 9. WELL N0,
P.0. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 OiL, GAS & MINING 1-18B1
4, E%Aﬁls%usg:c;vg?bél%?g" location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10, PIBLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
| At surface ) Altamont
1519'" FNL & 1565' FEL 11. sEC., 1., &., M., OR BLK. AND

SURVEY OR ARKA

Section 18, T2S-RIW

14, PERMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.) 12, COUNTY OR PARISH| 18. 8TATE
43-013-30575 5150' GR Duchesne Utah
1e. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) Change ° Operator {
{Other) (NOTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well

(ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMILETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proi)ot:)e%h_w%k.kgf. well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nen! 1S WOrkK.

Effective April 1, 1988 ANR Production Company took over operations on
the above-referenced well from Utex 0il Company.

OIL AND GAS
DRN RJF
JRB GLH

DTS ™\ SLS

ITas_ | >

&— MICROFILM l/

L:); FILE )

)

18. T hereby ce: %}@/ﬂue and Tect
SIGNED = (St / wrop Regulatory Analyst papp _June 24, 1988

1I1TTI UdllILl "UTy

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

S. LEASE DESICNATION & SERIAL NO.
Fee

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS

(Do not use this [orm for preposais to drill or to deepan or nlu‘{i}é; r

e ——————————
A 1 6e IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" forisaéh pighe: 1 N /A
b - T. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
Gas
veLL WELL oTHER LAY JuL 30 1990 N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR

8, FARM OR LEASE NAME

ANR Production Company o BW}S!GN OF Galloway
3. ADDRESS OF OPLRATOR Vi, I3, WELL NO.
P. 0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 1-18B1
1. LOCATION OF WELL (Zeport localion cleatiy ang i ACCOTIINCE WItN ANY Jiate requirements. 0. FIELD AND PQOL. QR wu.na‘r
See aiso soace A7 below.) Altamont
Avestses 1519' FNL & 1565' FEL T T ORI AN
Atpropossdpred.zone Same as above SURVEY OR AREKA.-

Section 18, T25-RIW

13, art %o, 15. ELZVATIONS (Show waetner OF, AT, GR. siees 12, COUNTY 13. STATE
43-013-30575 5150' GR Duchesne Utah-

13.

NOTICZ OF INTENTION TO:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING
FRACTURE TREAT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE

MULTIPLL COMPLETE
ABANDON

‘ REPAIR WELL,
(Other)

CHANGE PLANS
—
X

Request to Flare Gas

APPROX. DATE WORK WILL START

Check Appropriate 8ox To Indicate Nature of Natice, Report or Other Data

SUBSEQUENT REFORT OF:

WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDOXMENTY
(Other)

(Note: Repors resuits oc nuitipie compistion oa Well
Compietion or Recompietion Report and Log form.)

CATE OF COMPLETION

starting any progosed work. 1 weil i directionally drilled. dve

. " DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Cleariv state all pertinent details. and give pertinens dates, inciuding astimated date of

riace |

pertinant tu this work.)

ANR Production Company hereby requests

and sured and true vertical depths for all meskers and zones

* Must be accompanied by a cemeant verification report.

permission to flare gas from the above-referenced

well under R615-3-21, Utah 0il & Gas Conservation General Rules.

ANR sells the gas produced from this well to Gary-Williams Energy Corporation.

the fire at the Gary-Williams plant in
service for 3 to 4 weeks for repairs.

Due to
the Bluebell Field, the plant will be out of

Since there is no other market for the gas during

this time period, ANR requests permission to flare the gas.

The above-referenced well produces approximately14( MCFPD.

SIGNED

s
&hlleon 13

(This soacs (or Federal or Stats oftice use)

APPROVED BY
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL. IF ANY:

TITLE

(3/39)

Regulatory Analyst DATE 7-26-90

APPROVED BY THE STATE

ECRTCTSTIGIIT Y TavY el - —

&AL, GAS, AND FIINING
=y 2./3.%
L




corm s STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL, ARESOURCES il 6. Lease Designation ana Seriai NUmbDer g
, :

DIVISION OF CIL, GAS AND MINING

L Fee

L 7. indian AHSUQe Of Tribe Aamn

- v
it ¥/a
SUNDRY NOTICES. AND REFORT AR i
Ca not use this form tor proposais to:dn‘l!‘new-wegfs,: doepen existing: weils; or ta | v 3. Uit or Communitizauon Agreement '
? S : Use--ARPuCATION?FQR*PEBMIT-—'- !omwch.propowiss.ﬂ_uts ! ?
i TrCe ot Vien _ , . DlVlSlON OF 3. 'Well Name ana Numboer
&R C G [ Other (specify) _OIL, GAS & MINING_| Gallovay #1-18B1
2. Name of Qperator 10. APl Well Number
ANR Production Company i 43-013-30575. ...
TTid AdgressotOperator - - - —— 4. Telepnone Number 11. Field and Poot, or Wildeat
P. 0. Box 749. Denver., Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
&. Location of Well
,  Footage ~1519" FNL & 1565' FEL - County : Dychesne i
! QQ. Sec. T. 2. M. : SWNE Section 18, T2S-R1W State : UTAH J
2. CHECK APPHQPRIAT £ BOXES TO INDICATENATUREQE NQTICE; REPORT.. OR.OTHER DATA ! -
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REFQRT
(gubmiﬁno Duplicate) ! . (Submit Qriginal Form Only) .
" Abandonment T New Canstruction l : Abanconment * f:. New Construction
i Casing Repair D Pull or Aiter Casing (] Casing Repair D Pull or Alter Casing
[ Change of Plans D Recompletion D Changs of Plans D Shoot or Acidiza
[J Conversion to Iinjection [J Shoot or Acidize (J Conversion to Injection (J Ventor Flare
[ Fracture Treat D Vent or Flare D Fracture Treat (] Water Shut-Off
D Muitipte Compietion D Water Shut-Off D Other
X COther Emergency Pit

Date of Work Completion

Approximate Date Work Will Start

Report resuits of Muitipie Compiations and RAecompletions to ditferent ressrvoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.

° Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.
——-—%___—_;

e — ——— ——
13. CESCRIBE PROPOSED QR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Claaniy state all pertinent details, and give pertinent datas. If weil is directionatly drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true verticai depths for ail markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

above-referenced location using microbial remediation and install a lined pit. The liner
will be seamless, 30 MIL, and 20 year warranted. Any emergency use of this pit will be
reported to your office as soon as possible and the pit will be emptied and the liquids
disposed of in an approved manner within 48 hours following its use, unless otherwise

instructed by your office.

(Please see the attached letter submitted to your office 5/7/91 further describing thig
project.)

‘4. i heredy cerufy tha

Name & Signature

s —
iNg 15 rue ant R
%ﬂ W(@ Title Regulatory Analygt Jate _6/27/91
/

APPROVED BY THE STATE
OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OlL, G ‘ INING

(State Usa Only)

(8s80Y Sese instructions on Reverss Side



1

Coastal

The Energy People

MICHAEL E. MCALLISTER. Ph. D

DIRECTOR May —7 , 19 91

ENVIRONMENTAL & SAFETY AFFAIRS
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORFORATION

State of Utah

Department of Natural Resources
Division of 0il, Gas and Mining EHW
355 West North Temple

3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203 Jut 01 1991
Attention: Dianne R. Nielson, Ph.D.
Division Director o Division OF
IL, GAS & MINING

Dear Ms. Nielson:

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation and ANR Production Co., Inc.,
known hereafter as COG welcomes the opportunity to provide the
State of Utah with information regarding our emergency pits in the
Altamont/Bluebell producing areas.

COG shares your concern for protecting ground water and other
natural resources. We recognize our responsibility to conduct our
operations lawfully, ethically and in an environmentally
responsible manner.

CNOG acknowledges the potential environmental liabilities with
emergencv pits. Therefore, we are currently conducting a pilot
program using bioremediation technology as the closure technique.
It is anticipated that the microbial treatment process will achieve
a cost effective closure while eliminating long term waste disposal
liabilities associated with conventional closure technologies.

COG is currently 90 days into the pilot program. The selected
pits have been inoculated and filled to the desired liquid level.
The pit walls and bottoms have been manually turned to achieve
maximum microbial contact. To date, we are able to
photographically document the success of our efforts. If the
program continues to progress as expected, we will use this
technology as our plan of action for the remaining pits.

Utilizing microbes or any other type of closure technique will
necessitate the need for emergency containment in the event of an
operating system upset and/or failure. COG respectfully requests,
as part of our plan of action, the State of Utah's approval to
utilize lined emergency pits to meet this need.

Loastal élfif & sas quparatisn

TTeE e T 00008 ¢ FAN T13-877- 700



pesTVgg

State of Utah JU[ 0 "99'
Page ~ 2 o DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS & MINING

our intent is simple. COG will construct an emergency pit
immediately adjacent to the existing pits. The new pit's size will
be held to a minimum, yet large enough to provide adequate
protection. The new pit will be lined using a 30 mil, 20 year
warranty, seamless liner. All emergency piping will be removed
from the pit to be closed and diverted to the new lined excavation.
The old pit will be closed by microbe or other closure technology.

COG feels we are eliminating the potential environmental
liability exposure of the past practice of  unlined pits.
Additionally, the now lined pits afford COG, as a prudent operator,
the opportunity to keep the pits clean, remove any liquids as a
result of upset conditions within 48 hours and most importantly the
pit liner will be inspected on a documented scheduled basis for
maximum efficiency. If a problem is noted, corrections will
receive priority attention.

The pits 1listed in your letters to Coastal 0il & Gas
Corporation and ANR Production Company Co., Inc. will be the first
pits on our state leases to be closed.

To re-confirm our position, COG conducts it's operations in an
environmentally sound manner. With the State of Utah's approval
for the installation of "lined emergency pits", we will continue
with our planned pit closure program. At the same time this
program offers future protection to the groundwater and other
natural resources in Utah.

Your approval of COG's request to install "lined emergency
pits" would be appreciated. Additionally, at your request COG will
provide the State of Utah with a copy of our Waste Management

Program.

If there are any questions or if additional information is
needed, please do not hesitate to call.

Very truly yours,

&0,
ichael E. McAllister, Ph.D.

MEM: scC

bcc: R.L. Bartley
E. Dey
W.L. Donnelly
L.P. Streeb
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STATE OF UTAH
QJEPARTMENT OF NATURAL, RESOURCES l 6. Lease Deaignauon ang Serial Numper
DIVISION OF QIL, GAS AND MINING [ Fee
s 7.Indian Allottes of Tribe Nama
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS: | y/a |

; * Use APPLIGATION FOR PERMIT- (ar such proposals:

Oa not use mis-fotm-tor-proposals—xq:dﬁl!‘now-ml{g;»deepen exi_stin_g;.yeﬂa:or toreenter; ugged-and.abandoned weits:| 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

N/A
i. Type ot ‘f""""' ' 9. Well Name ana Numoer
X QL O g [J Other (specify) Galloway #1-18B1
2 Name of Operator 10. APl Well Number
ANR Production Company 43-013-305 5 L
i Adcressof Operator - - - "4, Telephone Number 11, Field and Pool, or Wildcat
P. 0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 30201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
& Locadon of Weil
Footage : 1519" FNL & 1565' FEL County : Duchesne
i QQ.Sec.T.A.M. : SWNE Section 18 , T2S~-R1W State  : UTAH
i1 CH ECK.APPROPHIAIE’IBOXES?T O INDICATENATURE OENOT ICE; REPORT, OR.OTHER DATA:. .. ..
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Dupticate) . (Submit Originat Form Only) .
_ Abandonment : New Construciion G Abandonment * (J New Canstruction
1 Casing Repair (J Pull or Alter Casing (J Casing Repair [J Puilor Alter Casing
(J Change of Plans (J Recompletion (J Change of Plans [J Shoot or Acidize
[J Conversion to injection ] Shoot or Acidize [J Conversion to Injection (J Ventor Flare
[J Fracture Treat (J Ventor Flare (] Fracture Treat [J Water Shut-Ott
Q Muitipte Compietion D Water Shut-Off E] Other
[J Other
Date of Work Completion
Approximate Date Work Wiil Start 3/15/92 )
Report resuits of Muitiple Compistions and Recompletions to different ressrvoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION ANDQ LOG form.
“ Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state ail pertinent details. and give pertinent dates. |f well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true verticai depths for ail markers and Zones pertnent to this work.)

Ll T el o\ Sl N A
vy ;s TS Sy

BT EROA
£y H

1revd

4. | hereby cerfy thagtf
Name & Signature AT Tile Regulatory Analyst oawe 2/18/92 |

=== —— e e el
v

(State Usa Qnly)

(8/90) See instructions on Aeverss Side



b ‘

Hme 7 STAYE OF UTAH ,
v L DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL,RESOURCES 8. Lease Designauon ana Seriai Numoer
DIVISION OF QIL, GAS AND MINING Fee
+ 7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Nama
: SUNDRY: NOTICES.AND REPORTS ON.WELLS: . 4 N/A 5
Oanot use mis'fM'tor'proposals»tg:dﬁii'nm‘mqfs;»_t;eepeq existing.weils; or mreen(erf;plqued-w abgndongd'wed(s_;: 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement |
R = * Uss APPLICATION.FOR PERMIT== (or such.proposais:. e T
o T N/A
b Trpe ot el v 9. Well Name ana Numoer
& Rl C an O Otner (specity) Galloway #1-18B1
2. Name ot Cperator 10. APt Well Number
ANR Production Company 43-013-30575 _
T|&-Addressot Operator - - - - - —— ‘4. Telephone Number 11. Fieid and Pool, or Wildeat
P. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
8. Locanan of Weil
Footage : 1519' FNL & 1565' FEL County : Duchesne
i Qa.Sec.T.3.M. : SW/NE Section 18 , T2S-R1W State  : UTAH |
2. CHECKAPPRGPR%A:-TE’BOXEST O INDICATENATURE.OENOT ICE; . REPORT,.OR.OTHER DATA:- . .. ]
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Dupiicate) . (Submit Qriginal Form Only) .
—_ Abangonment ] New Censtruction L. Abandonment * (J New Canstruction
1 Casing Repair (J Puitor Alter Casing [J Casing Repair (] Puil or Alter Casing
(] Change of Plans (] Recomptetion (J Change of Plans £} Shoot or Acidize
(J Conversion to injection (J Shoot or Acidize {J Conversion to Injection D Vent or Flare
(] Fracture Treat (J Ventor Flare (J Fracture Treat [J Water Shut-Ott
[I Muttipte Completion D Water Shut-Off G Cther
(] Other
Date of Work Completion 4/24/92
Appraximate Date Work Wil Start
Report resuits of Muitipie Complaedons and Recompietions 1 different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form,
Rt be accomoanied by a cement verification e ——

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED CPERATIONS (Clearly state ail pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. if weil is directionaily driled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths for ail markers ang Zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached chronological history for the cleanout and acid job performed
on the above referenced well.

‘4. | hareby cerufy that

Name & Signature

(State Usa Oniy)

Tiile Regulatory Analyst pae 5/6/92

(8/90y See instructions on Reverss Side



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (CLEANOUT & ACIDIZE)
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 26.184592% ANR AFE: 63915

T0: 12,773° - PBTD: 12,729’

5" LINER @ 9,251°-12,773°

PERFS: 9,942°-12,684’

CWC(M$): 124.1

PAGE 1

4/9/92 POOH w/hyd pump BHA. MIRU. ND WH, NU BOP. POOH w/2-3/8" stinger.

Rel 7-5/8" TAC.
DC: $3,729 TC: $3,729

4/10/92 Finish POOH w/7-5/8" csg scraper. POOH w/2-7/8" tbg. RIH w/7-5/8"

csg scraper. CO 7-5/8" csg to liner top @ 9251°. SOH.
DC: $2,828 TC: $6,557

4/13/92 Prep to CO liner. PU & RIH w/4-1/8" mill & CO tools to liner top.

DC: $1,980 TC: $8,537

4/14/92 Finish CO 5" liner. Tag fill @ 12,130°. Soft to 12,281°, medium

hard to 12,610°, hard @ 12,610°. Start to rotate tbg.
12,616°, tbg parted. Fish tbg. Unable to make more hole.

plugged. SOH.
DC: $7,074 TC: $15,611

€0 to
Tools

4/15/92 POOH w/CO tools. Tag fill @ 12,610°. CO 5" liner to 12,648’.
Torque up. Lost hole to 12,638°. Apparently bad csg @ 12,638°.

DC: $4,667 TC: $20,278

4/16/92 Attempt to isolate hole in c¢sg. RIH w/5" CIBP. Tag fill @ 12,539°.
Set CIBP @ 12,535°. Spot 2 sxs cmt on top of CIBP. RIH w/5" RBP &

7-5/8" pkr. Unable to get RBP in liner. Set packer @ 9165’.

7-5/8" csg. Inject 3.5 BPM @ 500 psi.
DC: $10,489 TC: $30,767

4/20/92

Attempt%to sfs, 7-5/8" x 10-3/4" annulus. I

énhu]us‘
DC: $4,155 TC: $34,922

Test

CO cellar. Prep to circ up 7- 5/8" X:IO 3/4"

4/21/92 LD prod string. Change plans. No attempt made to circ to surface.

Set RBP @ 9012°. Spot 2 sxs sand on BP. Top of sand @ 9005°.

to lay down prod siring.
DC: $8,186 TC: $43,108

Start

4/22/92  Finish LD 2-7/8" tbg. Finish LD 2-3/8" tbg, start LD 2-7/8" tbg.

Prepare revised AFE.
DC: $2,945 TC: $46,053

4/23-24/92 Prepare revised AFE to squeeze csg. Finish LD 2-7/8" tbg, Teave

2000° in well. RDMO. Final report.
DC: $4,213 TC: $50,266



STIMULATION PROCEDURE

Galloway #1-18Bl1
Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

WELL DATA
Location: 1565° FSL & 1519° FEL
Elevation: 5150° GL, 5167’ KB
Total Depth: 12,773° PBTD: 12,729’
Casing: 10-3/4", 40.5, N-80 set 0@ 2414°.
7-5/8", 26.4# & 29.7#, N-80 set @ 9504°.
5", 18#, N-80 set 9251-12,773°.
Tubing: 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80 set @ 9649’ w/B-2 anchor catcher
TUBULAR DATA
B/F psi psi
Description 1D Drift Capacity Burst Collapse
7-5/8", 26.4#, N-80 6.276" 6.151 .0471 6020 3400
7-5/8", 29.7#, N-80 6.875" 6.750" .0459 6890 4790
5", 18#, N-80 4.276" 4.151 .0177 10140 10490
2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80 2.441" 2.347 .00579 - 10570 11160

Present Status: Producing on hydraulic pump.

1.

PROCEDURE

MIRU service rig. Kill well. ND wellhead and NU BOP. POOH with tubing and pump
cavity.

Clean out 7-5/8" casing and 5" liner to 12,729°.

PU 5" x 2-7/8" packer on 2-7/8" x 3-1/2" tubing and TIH. Set packer @ 9350°.

Acidize Wasatch perfs 9,942-12,684° with 32,000 gals 15% HC1 with additives and 1500
1.1 s.g. ball sealers.

A.

B.
C.
D

Precede acid w/250 bbls water w/10 gal per 1000 scale inhibitor and 500 gals
Xylene.

A1l water to contain 3% KCI.

Acidize in 8 stages of 4000 gals each with diverter stages of 1000 gals gelled
saltwater with 1/2#/gal each of Benzoic acid flakes and rock salt.

Acid to be pumped at maximum rate possible at 8500 psi.

Flow back acid load. Unseat pkr and POOH, laying down packer and 3-1/2" tubing.

Rerun production equipment and return well to production.



- STAVE OF UTAH
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X QL O gas (O Other (specity) Galloway #1-18B1
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ANR Production Company o 43+013=30575
T Adcressof Operator e 4. Telephone Number 11, Field and Poct, of Wildeat
P.0. Box 749 Denver, CO  80201-0749 " (303) 573-4476 Altamont
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SW NE Section 18, T25, RIW
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ENT REPORT
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(Submit in Dupticate) (Submit Originat Form Qniy)
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1 Casing Repair (J Pulior Alter Casing (] Casing Repair D Pull or Alter Casing
(] Change of Plans (J Recomptetion (J Change of Plans X] Shoot or Acidize
D Conversion to injection D Shoot or Acidize (J Cenversion to Injection D Vent or Flare
D Fracture Treat D Vent or Flare (J Fracture Treat J Water Shut-Oft
D‘_ Muitipte Completion D Water Shut-Off D Other
(J Other

Approximate Date Work Will Start

vze of Work Completion 6/15/92

Report resuits of Muitiple Completions and Aecompletions 1o different reservoirs

on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION ANDO LOG form,
° Must be accompanied by a cament verification repor,
13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Claanty state ail pertinent details. and give pertinent dates. |f weil is directionaity drilled, give subsuriace
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Please see the attached c
to repair the casing leak

work.)

hronological history for the work performed
> cleanout and acidize the above-referenced well.

]
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{ame & Signature 7 7 /Z/é// ﬁ/ Tle Regulatory Analyst oOate 6/30/92

State Use Oniy)

icgulatory Analyst ows _6/30/92

See instructions on Reverss Side



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (CLEANOUT & ACIDIZE) PAGE 1
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 26.184592% ANR AFE: 63915

TD: 12,773°

5" LINER @

PBTD: 12,729’
9,261°-12,773’

PERFS: 9,942°-12,684°
CWC(M$): 124.1

4/9/92

4/10/92

4/13/92

4/14/92

4/15/92

4/16/92

4/20/92

4/21/92

4/22/92

4/23-24/92

POOH w/hyd pump BHA. MIRU. ND WH, NU BOP. POOH w/2-3/8" stinger.
Rel 7-5/8" TAC.
DC: $3,729 TC: $3,729

Finish POOH w/7-5/8" csg scraper. POOH w/2-7/8" tbg. RIH w/7-5/8"
csg scraper. CO 7-5/8" csg to liner top @ 9251°. SOH.
DC: $2,828 TC: $6,557

Prep to CO Tiner. PU & RIH w/4-1/8" mi1l & CO tools to liner top.
DC: $1,980 TC: $8,537

Finish CO 5" liner. Tag fill @ 12,130°. Soft to 12,281, medium
hard to 12,610°, hard @ 12,610°. Start to rotate tbg. CO to
12,616°, tbg parted. Fish tbg. Unable to make more hole. Tools
piugged. SOH.

DC: $7,074 TC: $15,611

POOH w/CO tools. Tag fill € 12,610°., CO 5" Tiner to 12,648°.
Torque up. Lost hoie to 12,638°. Apparently bad csqg @ 12,638’.
DC: $4,667 TC: $20,278

Attempt to isolate hole in csg. RIH w/5" CIBP. Tag fill @ 12,539°,
Set CIBP @ 12,535°. Spot 2 sxs cmt on top of CIBP. RIH w/5" RBP &
7-5/8" pkr. Unablie to get RBP in liner. Set packer @ 9165°. Test
7-5/8" csg. Inject 3.5 BPM @ 500 psi.

DC: $10,489 TC: $30,767

Attempt to circ to sfc 7-5/8" x 10-3/4" annulus. Isolate hole in csg
between 2840° & 2902°. CO cellar. Prep to circ up 7-5/8" x 10-3/4"
annulus.

DC: $4,155 TC: $34,922

LD prod string. Change plans. No attempt made to circ to surface.
Set RBP @ 9012°. Spot 2 sxs sand on BP. Top of sand @ 9005°. Start
to lay down prod string.

DC: $8,186 TC: $43,108

Finish LD 2-7/8" tbg. Finish LD 2-3/8" tbg, start LD 2-7/8" tbg.
Prepare revised AFE.
DC: $2,945 TC: $46,053

Prepare revised AFE to squeeze csg. Finish LD 2-7/8" tbg, leave
2000’ in well. RDMO. Final report.
DC: $4,213 TC: $50,266



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (REPAIR CSG LEAK, CLEANOUT & ACIDIZE) PAGE 2
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 26.184592% ANR AFE: 63915 R1

1D: 12,773° PBTD: 12,729’

5" LINER @ 9,251°-12,773°

PERFS: 9,942°-12,684°

CWC(M$): 202.3

5/26/92 POOH w/kill string. MIRU, spot equip. Hammer off WH. Install
spool, BOP’s, RU floor. Change equip to 2-7/8". LD hanger. POOH
w/66 jts 2-7/8", hydril crossover sawtooth collar. Close well in
SDFN @ 2:30 p.m.
DC: $2,386 TC: $52,652

5/27/92 Evaluating logs. Hot oiler tried to flush 7-5/8" csg. Pmpd 15 bbls
@ 250°, pressure up. Pressured to 500 psi, held. Bleed off. RU
Schlumberger to Tog well. RIH w/Digital CET log. Log from 8200° to
1200°. TOC @ 7400°. POOH. RIH w/Pipe Analysis Tog (PAL), log from
7000° to 2000°. POOH. RD Schlumberger. Close well in, SDFN @ 8:00

p.m.
DC: $11,259 TC: $63,911

5/28/92 Cement hole in csg. WO orders. Decide to find hole, get injection
rate. RIH with Mtn States 7-5/8" 32-A tension pkr, crossover, 65 jts
2-7/8" NuLok. PU 31 jts 2-7/8" NuLok. Set pkr @ 2950°. Pump down
ibg, PT to 2000 psi, good. Release pkr, pull to 2800°, set pkr.
fump down 7-5/8" csg, circ up 10-3/4", no test. Pull to 2736°, set
pkr, pump down 7-5/8" csg, circ up 10-3/4", no test. Pull to 2521°,
set pkr, PT csg to 2000 psi, held. RIH to 2551°, set pkr, pump down
7-5/8" csg, circ up 10-3/4", no test. Pump down 2-7/8", PT to 2000
psi, held. Hole is between 2521°-2551°., Pull to 2521°, set pkr, PT
7-5/8" csg to 2000 psi, held. Pump down 2-7/8" out 10-3/4", get
injection rate 3 BPM @ 500 psi. Pmp 30 bbls prod wtr. Close 10-3/4"
valve, get injection rate down hole, 1-1/2 BPM @ 1000 psi. Bleed
off, release pkr. POOH w/82 jts 2-7/8", crossover, 7-5/8" pkr. RD
floor, clean out cellar. ND BOP’s. Install 6" x 7-5/8" screw on
flange. Install Halliburton head. Close well in. SDFN @ 7:30 p.m.
DC: $4,075 TC: $67,986

5/29/92 Bleed off pressure, install BOP’s. RU Halliburton to cement hole in
7-5/8" csg. Pump 10 BFW, 500 gal mud flush, 500 gal xylene, 10 BW.
Pump 800 sx (161 bbls) 15.6 ppg Type 5 cement followed by 200 sx (42
bbls) 15.6 ppg Type 5 cement w/2% CaCl,. Drop 7-5/8" plug. Displace
w/113 bbl prod wtr. Squeeze 20 bbls (95 sx) cement along 7-5/8" csg
below 10-3/4". Pressure to 2400 psi. Circ 60 bbls (285 sx) cement
to pit. Close well in w/1200 psi. AIR 6 BPM @ 300 psi. MIP 2400
psi. Est TOC @ £2379°. RD Halliburton. Cleanout flat tank, cement.
Unload & tally 2-7/8" tbhg, drill collars. SDFN @ 2:00 p.m.
DC: $14,484 TC: $82,470

6/1/92 Drill cmt. Check pressure on 7-5/8" csg - 300 psi. Bleed off
pressure on 7-5/8" csg squeeze to 2000 psi, held. Hammer off flange,
Halliburton pmpg head. Install BOP’s. RU floor. RIH w/6-3/4" drag
bit, crossover, 6 - 4-3/4" drill collars, crossover, 4 sub, 70 joints
2-7/8" 8rd, tag TOC @ 2346°. RU swivel, strip head. Drill cmt,
plug. Keeps plugging up w/parts of wiper plug. Cmt hard. Drill to
2537°. Blow strip rubber. Circ well. Close well in, SDFN @ 7:00

p.m.
DC: $4,071 TC: $86,541



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (REPAIR CSG LEAK, CLEANOUT & ACIDIZE) PAGE 3
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 26.184592% ANR AFE: 63915 R1

6/2/92

6/3/92

6/4/92

6/5/92

6/6/92

6/8/92

Prep to retrieve RBP, POOH w/tbg. Open well up - no pressure. Mill
cmt to 2566°. Started getting hard stringers to 2627°, fell thru.
Circ btms up. PT 7-5/8" squeeze to 2000 psi. Hold 15 min. RD drlg
equip. RIH w/82 jts 2-7/8" hydril. PU 116 jts 2-7/8" hydril. Tag
sand @ 9003’. Circ down to top of bridge plug @ 9012°. Circ btms
up. POOH w/60 jts 2-7/8". Close well in. SDFN @ 6:00 p.m.

DC: $3,617 TC: $90,158

POOH w/RBP. Continue to POOH w/2-7/8" hydril 8rd. LD 60 jts 2-7/8"
8rd, 4’ crossover, 6 - 4-3/4" DC’s, crossover, 6-3/4" drag bit. Bit
looks OK. Load out collars. RIH w/7-5/8" SE retr head. PU 78 jts
2-7/8" hydril. RIH w/198 jts 2-7/8" hydril, crossover, 30 jts 2-7/8"
8rd. Latch onto bridge plug, let equalize. LD 30 jts 2-7/8" 8rd.
Unload 3-1/2" tbg, clean out flat tank - cement. Close well in.
SDFN.

DC: $5,256 TC: $95,414

Prep to acidize. Hot oiler bled off csg, tbg. Pmpd 60 bbls prod wtr
down tbg @ 250° to flush tbg. POOH w/276 jts 2-7/8" hydril. (Had to
flush tbg several times to keep tbg clean.) LD 7-5/8" SE bridge
plug. RIH w/Mtn States 5" HD pkr, 4 jts 2-7/8" 8rd, 5-3/4" No-Go.
Change equip to 3-1/2". Tally and PU 308 jts 3-1/2" thg. Set 5% #D
pkr @ 9355° w/25,000# compression. Fi1l 7-5/8" csg w/20 bbls prad
wtr. PT csg to 2000 psi. Hold 15 min, good. Bleed off. Close well
in. SDFN.

DC: $4,018 TC: $99,432

Check pressure, FL. Check pressure on tbg - 250 psi. Bleed off. RU
Smith to acdz well. Treat perfs 9,936°-12,506° w/32,000# gal 15% HC1
w/additives. Drop 1504 - 1.1 gravity BS’s. Acdz well w/4000 gal
acid in 8 stages, 7 diverter stages w/saltwtr, RS, BAF. Flush w/148
bbls 3% KC1. Total lToad 1406 bbls. MIR 33 BPM @ 8900 psi, AIR 28
BPM @ 8300 psi. ISIP 3870 psi, 5 min 3300 psi, 10 min 2990 psi, 15
min 2900 psi. Good diversion. RD Smith, RU to swab well. Make §
swab runs. IFL @ 950°, FFL @ 3100°, pH 1. Total fluid swabbed - 40
BW. Pump 60 bbls prod wtr down tbg to push acid wtr past pkr. Close
well in. SDFN.

DC: $57,362 TC: $156,794

RIH hydrotesting. Check tbg pressure - 100 psi. Bleed off. RU to
swab. Run 1 - FL 3300-4400°, 8 BW, run 2 - FL 3400°-4500°, 8 BW. RD
swab equip. Release pkr, Tet equalize. LD 307 jts 3-1/2" tbg, No-
Go, 4 jts 2-7/8" N-80, 5" HD pkr. Change equip BOP’s to 2-7/8". RIH
w/Mtn States 7-5/8" B-2 anchor catcher, 50,000# shear, 4° sub, 2-7/8"
perf jt, 2-7/8" plug, 2-7/8" plain jt, 5" PBGA, 6’ 2-7/8" sub, 7 jts
2-7/8" 8rd, crossover, 22 jts 2-7/8" hydril kil string. SDFN.

DC: $4,432 TC: $161,226

Fish tbg stub. Check pressure - 300 psi. Bleed off csg, tbg. POOH
w/22 jts 2-7/8" hydril. PU National Dual "V" cavity. RU 4-Star to
hydrotest. RIH w/288 jts 2-7/8" CS hydril hydrotesting to 8500 psi
(2-7/8" tbg rough, hard to pull through). No leaks. RD 4-Star, add
crossover, 4° sub, set Mtn States 7-5/8" anchor @ 9232° w/i8,000#
tension. PU to install thg hanger. Thg parted @ 24,000# over string
weight. Pull 19 jts 2-7/8" hydril. Tbg either parted by backing off
or threads pulled through. SDFN, close well in @ 5:30 p.m.

DC: $14,283 TC: $175,509



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT .

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (REPAIR CSG LEAK, CLEANOUT & ACIDIZE) PAGE 4
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 26.184592% ANR AFE: 63915 Rl

6/9/92

6/10/92

6/11/92

6/12/92

6/13/92
6/14/92
6/15/92

RIH w/overshot, jars, etc. Check pressure - 200 psi, bleed off. RIH
w/overshot, 3.22" ID grapple, bumper sub, 4° 2-7/8" sub, crossover,
19 jts 2-7/8" hydril. PU 1 jt 2-7/8" 8rd, latch onto fish. Try to
release 7-5/8" anchor w/rig tongs, get only 4 turns to right. RU
swivel. Try turning to right to release anchor, get tbg to turn to
right - acts 1ike carbide slips are just turning in csg. Try to
shear anchor. Pull 55,000# over string, jarring, no good. RU
Cutters to cut tbg. RIH, can’t get chemical cutter past 9088°, cut
tbg @ 9073°. POOH, RD Cutters. Fish left in hole: 7-5/8" anchor,
4’ sub, 2-7/8" perf jt, 2-7/8" plug, 1 jt 2-7/8", 5" PBGA, 6’ sub, 3
Jts 2-7/8", £10° cut-off stub (202°). POOH w/19 jts. LD overshot.
When started pulling, dragging 10-20,000#. POOH w/269 jts 2-7/8" (LD
11 bad jts, stand back 42 jts questionable corkscrewed, rest should
be OK). LD cavity (twisted bad), 3 jts 2-7/8" (twisted), and 20’
piece. Good clean cut. Close well in, SDFN @ 7:00 p.m.

DC: $8,715 TC: $184,224

POOH w/BHA. Bleed off pressure. PU overshot, extension w/2-7/8"
grapple, Tubricated bumper sub, jars, crossover, 4 - 4-3/4" DC’s,
crossover, accelerator, crossover, 2-7/8" sub 4’ crossover, 254 jts
2-7/8" hydril. PU 35 jts 2-7/8" 8rd, work over fish, start Jarring
1/2-hr, jar anchor free. POOH w/35 jis 8rd, dragging 10-20,000# over
weight. LD 43 jts 2-7/8" hydrii (beni}. Flush tbg w/30 bbis prod
wtr. POOH w/110 jts 2-7/8". (lose well in. SDFN @ 7:00 p.m.

DC: $8,352 TC: $192,576

Change equip to 2-3/8", PU tbg. Bleed off pressure - 200 psi. LD 1
jt, 1 - 4’ sub crossover, accelerator, crossover, 4 - 4-3/4" DC's,
crossover, jars, bumper sub, 0S. LD 10’ 2-7/8" stub, 3 jts 2-7/8"
8rd (bent) 6’ sub, 5" PBGA, plain jt, plug, perf jt, 4° sub, 7-5/8"
anchor. Anchor was sheared & beat up. RIH w/prod, Mtn States 7-5/8"
anchor catcher, carbide slips, 50,000# shear 4° 2-7/8" sub, 2-7/8"
perf jt, 2-7/8" plug, 2-7/8" plain jt, 5" PBGA, 6’ sub, 7 jts 2-7/8"
8rd, National Dual "V" pump cavity, crossover. RU 4-Star to
hydrotest. Hydrotest 211 jts 2-7/8" hydril, crossover, 76 jts 2-7/8"
8rd (keep having to change rubbers - rough tbg). RD 4-Star. RD
floor, remove BOP’s. Set 7-5/8" anchor @ 9223’ w/18,000# tension.
Top of cavity @ 8881°. 1Install hanger, BPV. Install BOP’s. Close
well in. SDFN @ 7:30 p.m.

DC: $7,497 TC: $200,073

Well on hyd pmpd prod. Bleed pressure off csg - 200 psi. Change
equip, BOP’s to 2-3/8". RU floor. RIH w/National stinger, 221 jts
2-3/8" hydril, crossover, 64 jts DSS-HT. Flush tbg w/35 bbls prod
wir, add 8’ sub 2-3/8" DSS-HT, crossover, hanger. Sting into cavity.
Land tbg w/8000# compression. RD floor, remove BOP’s. Pump 10 bbls
down tbg. Remove BP valve. Flush 2-7/8" tbg w/50 bbls. RU Delso.
RIH w/standing valve to cavity (FL @ 3100°). POOH. RD Delso. Pump
35 bbls to get circ. PT tbg to 4000 psi. Hold 15 min. Good. Bleed
off. 1Install WH. Drift WH. PT void to 5000 psi. Hook up pump
lines. Let circ overnight. Load out equip, pump lines. SDFN @
6:30.

DC: $2,334 TC: $202,407

Pmpd 109 BO, 93 BW, 0 MCF, 1400#, 64 SPM.
Pmpd 37 BO, 77 BW, 52 MCF, 1450#, 64 SPM.
Well on production. RD, clean location. Put up stinger pole. Pmpd

36 BO, 107 BW, 52 MCF, 1450#, 64 SPM,
DC: $400 TC: $202,807



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
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GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (REPAIR CSG LEAK, CLEANOUT & ACIDIZE) PAGE 5
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 26.184592% ANR AFE: 63915 R1

6/16/92
6/17/92
6/18/92
6/19/92
6/20/92

6/21/92
6/22/92
6/23/92

Pmpd 24 BO, 110 BW, 69 MCF, 1500#, 64 SPM.
Pmpd 20 BO, 103 BW, 82 MCF, 1500#, 64 SPM.
Pmpd 23 B0, 119 BW, 87 MCF, 1500#, 64 SPM.
Pmpd 20 BO, 111 BW, 30 MCF, 1500#, 64 SPM.

Pmpd 23 BO, 83 BW, 31 MCF/22 hrs, 1550#, 64 SPM. Down 2 hrs -
tripiex vibration.

Pmpd 8 BO, 89 BW, 31 MCF, 1600#, 64 SPM.
Pmpd 25 BO, 110 BW, 49 MCF, 1650#, 64 SPM.
Pmpd 29 BO, 120 BW, 62 MCF.

Prior prod: 19 BO, 63 BW, 43 MCF. Final report.
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TOTAL COSTS
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L Ie.'md V‘l? f:»-o g - I3RZ 1 :
[0 Rl _Spot Rz in  Rigup R 110 | ROADS & LOCATIONS | Y
' ! f AL ' 120125 | CONTRACTOR CHARGES
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DRILLING STRING:
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EFF.WT.OFDC BHA
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OIVISION OF CIL. GAS AND MINING | Fee '

- T.inagan Allottee ar THoa Namn

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON.WELLS'

Ca nor use My form tar Procosais to:driif new-

i f
[_N/A j
wetis: desaen existing wetis: or toreenter-piucgea-and abandoned wesla: i 3.Unitor Coemmunitizauen Agresment !
Use - APPLICATION FOR PESMIT— for sucn.proposaies: T ‘

N/A
T .".'eu _ - © 3, Well Name ang Numbder
: X %L“ : \,Gv:ﬁ C Ciner (soecitv) Galloway #1-18B 1
| % Name ar Operator 10. AP Wail Numper
l ANR Production Company 43-013-30575
[WNODW 4. Telspnone Number 11. Fieid ana Poot, or Wildegs
! P. 0.Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
: 5. Locagon of Weil "
Footage © 1519' FNL & 1565' FEL County : Duchesne |
QQ. Swc. 7. 5. M. SW/NE Section 18, T2S-R1W State : UTAH I
CHECK APP SAPRIATE SOXES [0 INDICATENATUREQE. NQTICE: REPQRT..OR.Q1H ER DATA:-
. NQTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Quplicate) ’ (Submt Qrigmnat Form Qnty)

— Abancorment ™ New Construcucn [ _ Abangonment (J New Canstrucuon

. Casing Repair (g Puitor Alter Casing ] (J Casing Repair (J Pultor Alter Casing

I~ Change of Plans (J Recomotetion (J Change ot Plans (J Shoot or Acigize

] Conversion to Injection (J Shoc or Acidize (O Conversion to Injection [ Ventor flare

(] Fracture Treat {J VentorFlare (] Fracture Treat {OJ Water shut-ott .

(J Muttipte Comptetion J Water shut-oft f] Other conversion from Hydraulic Lift to

J OCtrer Beam Pump s

Date of Work Comptetion 1/6/93
Approximate Date Work Wil Start
of Muitiole and Mm»mw
mt‘c?hmon WMPLEUON AND LOG lorm,
e . "“""""'

13. OESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Claany state aul perunent ie, and give pertinent dates. if wed hwmmm
lcmm.mwnmqmuuowmmmmucmmmmnm

Please see the attached chronological history for the conversion from hydraulic

lift to beam pump on the above referenced well.
RECEIVE],

LAY 10 1993
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ame & Signaturs g

plate Usa Qniy)

Tille Regulaty Analyst Oate 28/93 -
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THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

GALLOWAY #1-18B1 (CONVERT FROM HYDRAULIC TO BPU, INSTALL COROD) PAGE 6
BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 39.79976% ANR  AFE: 64272

TD: 12,773’ PBTD: 12,515’

5" LINER @ 9,251'-12,773"

PERFS: 9,936°-12,506° (LGR & WASATCH)

CWC(MS$): 143.7 .

12/18/92 LD 2-3/8". RU rig. Hammer off WH. Hard time removing WH. Broke &
Teft both hanger necks in WH. Install BPU. RU spool BOP’s. PU on
2-3/8", sting out of cavity. Pump 20 bbls prod wtr down csg. Pump
30 bbls prod wtr down tbg. Press to 2500 psi, won’t pump past.
DC: $3,285 TC: $3,285

12/21/92  POOH w/2-7/8". Thaw out WH, 400 psi on csg. Pump 40 bbls prod wtr
down csg @ 280 degrees. Try to swab 2-3/8" - cannot. Try to flush
2-3/8", press to 3500 psi, won't blow out. LD 82 Jts 2-3/8" wet,
plugged. Pump 50 bbls prod wtr down csg. Pump down 2-3/8". Press
to 500 psi, broke. Flush w/15 bbls prod wtr. LD rest of 2-3/8",
stinger. Pump 20 bbls prod wtr down tbg. Remove BPU, hanger. Ris
7-5/8" -anchor. POOH w/60 jts 2-7/8". SDFN.
DC: $3,426 TC: $6,711 :

12/22/92 Cleanout 5". Bled well off 150 psi. Pmpd 40 bbls down csg, tbg.
POOH w/76 jts 2-7/8", X0, 211 jts 2-7/8" hydril, X0, LD Nat'l cavity,
7 jts 2-7/8" 8rd, 6’ sub, 5" PBGA, 1 jt 2-7/8", 2-7/8" plug, 1 joint
2-7/8", 4’ sub, 7-5/8" anchor. RIH w/4-1/8" mill, check, 10’ sub,
check, 40 jts 2-3/8" 8rd, safety jt, bailer, 4’ sub, 5 jts 2-3/8",
X0. RIH w/211 jts 2-7/8" hydril. RIH w/56 Jjts 2-7/8" 8rd, EQT @
9700°. SDFN.
DC: $3,523 TC: $10,234

12/23/92 LD 2-7/8" hydril. Continue to RIH w/2-7/8". Tag scale @ 12,260’ and
from 12,475°-12,505°. Work thru. Tag PBTD @ 12,515°. Stroke tool,
no headway. POOH w/146 jts 2-7/8" 8rd. LD 130 Jjts 2-7/8" hydritl.
Hookup flowline. Leave csg open to treater.

DC: $4,506 TC: $14,740

12/28/92 RIH w/prod. LD rest of 2-7/8" hydril (81 jts). LD § jts 2-3/8",
bailer, 40 jts 2-3/8" 8rd, check, 10’ sub, check 4-1/8" mill (12 jts
2-3/8" plugged w/drlg mud). Remove BOP’s. Remove tbg spool.
Install 11" 3000# x 7-1/16" 5000 tbg spool. PT to 2000 psi, hold.
Install BOP’s. RIH w/3-1/2" PBGA, XO, 2-3/8" 4’ sub, 7 jts 2-3/8"
Mtn States 5’ anchor catcher, 50,000 shear, 4’ 2-7/8" sub, 2-7/8" SN,
X0, 25 jts 2-7/8" locket, X0. CWI & SDFN.
DC: $12,560 TC: $27,300

12/29/92  Well closed in, WO Corod. Set 5" anchor @ 9898’ w/18,000# tension,
SN @ 9893°, top of 3-1/2" PBGA @ 10,118”. RDMO. WO Corod. Drop

from report_until further activity.
DC: $17,692 TC: $44,992

1/6/93 Prep to place well on production. RU Corod rig. PU 1-3/4" pump,
on/off tool and RIH w/Corods. Seat pump @ 9893°, TAC @ 9898’. Test
to 700 psi. Hang on pmpg unit. RD Corod rig. Place well on pump @
4:30 p.m., 1/6/93. Blew rupture disk in heater treater. No
production. Will repair this a.m.

DC: $90,639 TC: $135,631

1/7/93 Pmpd 122 BO, 284 BW, 15 MCF/20 hr, 10 SPM.

1/8/93 Pmpd 92 BO, 284 8W, 17 MCF, 10 SPM.

1/9/93 Pmpd 63 BO, 190 BW, no gas, 10 SPM.

1/10/93 Pmpd 75 BO, 207 BW, 85 MCF, 10 SPM.

Prior prod: 19 BO, 24 BW, 32 MCF. Final report.
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5. Loase Designation and Serial Number:
Fee

8. ¥ indlan, Allottes or Tribe Name:
N/A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new weiis, deepen existing weils, or to reenter piugged and abandoned weils, 7. Unkt Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for such proposais. N/A

8. Well Name and Number:
Galloway #1-18B1

1. Type of Well: QL GAS[]] OTHER:

2. Name of Operator: 9. AP| Well Number:
ANR Production Company 43-013-30575
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Fiekd and Pool, or Wildcat:
P. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont
4. Location of Well
Footages: 1519' FNL & 1565' FEL County: Duchesne
QQ, Sec..T.,ALM.: SW/NE Section 18, T2S-R1W State: Utah

i CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
| [ Abandonment J New Construction [J Abandonment " 7 New Construction
[ Casing Repair (37 Pull or Alter Casing [] Casing Repair O Pull or Alter Casing
[0 Change of Plans [0 Recompletion [ Change of Plans [ Shoot or Acidize
O Conversion to Injection [ Shoot or Acidize [J Conversion to Injection [ Vent or Flare
{0 Fracture Treat {1 Vent or Flare [ Fracture Treat [ Water Shut-Off
[ Multiple Completion 3 Water Shut-Off X Other _Change Gas Anchor Configuration in Well
[ Other . ; :
. Date of work completion 2/15/93
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompistions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must be panied by a t verification report
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Glearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. H weliis directionally drilied, give rface locations and d and true

vertical depths for ail markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Please see the attached morning reports for the prccedure performed to change the

gas anchor configuration in the above referenced well.
AW Y
ECEIVET

JUN 2D 1993
MVISION Of-

CUAS SN

7 Eileen D&nni Dey

(This space for State use only)

(1282 {See instructions on Reverse Side)



Heorme® TATE OF UTAH
DIVISIO OIL, GAS AND MINING

FLease Designation and Serial Number:
See Attached
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See Attached
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new welks, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN form for suich proposals. See Attached
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:
olL GAs [ | oTHER: See Attached
2. Name of Operator: 9. APl Welt Number:
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See Attached
3. Address and Telephone Number; 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:
P.O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201—0749 (303) 5734455 See Attached
4. Location of Welt
Footages: See Attached county:  See Attached
QQ, Sec,, T, R., M.: See Attached State: Utah
11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit In Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
[] Abandon [ New Construction [[™] Abandon * [ 1 New Construction
] Repair Casing [1 Pull or Alter Casing [] Repair Casing [1 Pullor Alter Casing
[] Change of Plans [ ] Recompletion [ ] Change of Pians [ Perforate
1 Convertto Injection [} Perforate [ ] Convertto Injection [] Ventor Flare
[] Fracture Treat or Acidize [ 1 Ventor Flare [ Fracture Treat or Acidize ] Water Shut—Off
[—] Multiple Completion [[] Water Shut—Off [X7] Other _Change of Operator
[] Other
Date of work completion
Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
: COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.
*  Mustbe accompanied by a cement verification report.

12, DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If wellis directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work,)

Please be advised that effective December 27, 1995, ANR Production Company relinquished and Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation
assumed operations for the subject wells (see attached). Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being
provided by Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation under the following bonds: State of Utah #102103, BLM Nationwide Bond
#U605382—9, and BIA Nationwide Bond #11—40—66A. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation, as operator, agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the leases for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

5] N

Bannie Carson, St. Environmental & Safety Analyst .’ ]

ANR Production Company ; OF CiL, GAS & MININ% -

1a. Sheila Bremer :

Environmental & Safety Analyst

Neme & Signatures Lo L Dy Te: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation  ome:  03/07/96

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)



CHANGE OF OPERATOR - From ANR Production Co. To Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.

03/07/96 - Page20of4  {

NWNW, 8-28-3W

If Indian, LOCATION OF WELL
Lease Designation Allottee or Section, Township :

Well Name & No. API No. & Serial Number Tribe Name CA No. Footages & Range Field County
Brotherson 1-33A4 43-013-30272 Patented  ][o%0 N/A N/A 820' FNL & 660" FEL NENE, 33-15-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-10B4 43-013-30443 Patented 1|5 N/A N/A 1241' FSL & 1364' FWL  |SESW, 10-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-14B4 43-013-30815 Fee {oY5p N/A N/A 2557 FSL &' 1642' FWL  |NESW, 14-2S5-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-15B4 43-013-31103 Fee [77{ N/A N/A 996' FWL & 1069 FSL SWSW, 15-28-4w Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-22B4 43-013-31086 Fee [792 N/A N/A 1616' FWL & 1533' FSL  [NESW, 22-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Brotherson 2-2B5 43-013-31302 Fee HEY A N/A N/A 1034' FSL & 2464' FEL  [SWSE, 2-2S-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Christensen 2-20A4 43-013-31303 Fee {235 N/A N/A 1425' FSL & 2131' FEL NWSE, 29-15-4W Aitamont | Duchesne
Crook 1-6B4 43-013-30213 Patented 825 N/A N/A 2485' FNL & 1203' FEL  ISENE, 6-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Dastrup 2-30A3 43-013-31320 Fee 11253 N/A N/A 1250' FSL & 1229' FWL  |SWSW, 30-1S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Doyle 1-10B3 43-013-30187 Patented [4]b N/A N/A 2382' FNL & 2157' FWL  [SENW, 10-2S3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Duncan 2-9B5 43-013-30719 Fee %'ﬂo N/A N/A 1701' FWL & 1554' FSL  [NESW, 9-2S-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Ehrich 3-11B5 43-013-31080 Fee 11,91 N/A N/A 1654' FSL & 1754' FWL  INESW, 11-2S-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Elder 1-13B2 43-013-30366 Patented [ 905 N/A N/A _11490' FNL & 1334' FEL  [SWNE, 13-2S-2W Bluebell | Duchesne
Elisworth 1-17B4 43-013-30126 Patented [l 95 N/A N/A 763' FNL & 1189' FEL NENE, 17-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Elisworth 1-19B4 43-013-30183 Patented [Tl N/A N/A 2043' FNL & 1764' FEL  |SWNE, 19-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-20B4 43-013-30351 Patented 1900 N/A N/A 1744' FNL & 1342' FEL  |SWNE, 20-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 1-8B4 43-013-30112 Fee [,55 N/A N/A 1755' FNL & 2377 FEL  |SWNE, 8-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-17B4 43-013-31089 Fee X/ N/A N/A 1355' FWL & 1362' FSL  INESW, 17-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Elisworth 2-19B4 43-013-31105 Fee (7] N/A N/A 1402' FSL & 1810' FWL  INESW, 19 -2S-4W | Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 2-20B4 43-013-31090 Fee NAZES N/A N/A 677' FWL & 1611' FSL NWSW, 20-25-4W | Altamont | Duchesne
Ellsworth 3-20B4 43-013-31389 Fee 114%% N/A N/A 1500' FNL & 1203' FWL  |[SWNW, 20-2S-4W | Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-12B5 43-013-34624 |3ol2Y Patented Y5 N/A N/A 2479' FNL & 1503' FEL SWNE, 12-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-13B5 43-013-30092 Patented 10]0 N/A N/A 670' FNL & 1520' FEL NWNE, 13-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 1-7B4 43-013-30097 Patented [{o00 N/A N/A 1923' FNL & 1095' FEL SENE, 7-25-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 2-12B5 43-013-31115 Fee [27A N/A N/A 993' FSL & 768' FWL SWSW, 12-28-5W Altamont | Duchesne
Farnsworth 2-7B4 43-013-30470 Patented /935 N/A N/A 1292' FSL & 1500' FWL  [SESW, 7-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Fieldstead 2-28A4 43-013-31293. Fee /77 N/A N/A 2431' FSL & 2212' FWL  |[NESW, 28-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Galloway 1-18B1 43-013-30575 Fee 23[:5 N/A N/A 1519' FNL & 1565' FEL ~ |SWNE, 18-2S-1W Bluebell | Duchesne
Hanskutt 2-23B5 43-013-30917 Fee “lecr N/A N/A 951' FSL & 761' FWL SWSW, 23-28-5W | Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson 1-24B3 43-013-30629 Fee 23% N/A N/A 1354' FNL & 1540' FWL  [NENW, 24-28-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Hanson 2-9B3 43-013-31136 Fee [o455 N/A N/A 1461' FWL & 1531' FSL  [NESW, 9-2S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 1-32A3 43-013-30141 Patented [ LY N/A N/A 671' FNL & 1710' FEL NWNE, 32-1S8-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 1-5B3 43-013-30109 Patented 163% N/A N/A 1200' FNL & 1140' FWL  |[NENE, 5-25-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-29A3 43-013-31043 Fee [6 205 N/A N/A 1857' FWL & 1394’ FSL  |[NESW, 29-1S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-32A3 43-013-31072 Fee J1A N/A N/A 1141' FWL & 1602' FSL  |[NWSW, 32-1S-3W | Altamont | Duchesne
Hanson Trust 2-5B3 43-013-31079 Fee 11,30 N/A N/A 1606' FSL & 1482' FWL  |NESW, 5-2S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hartman 1-31A3 43-013-30093 Fee 5725 N/A N/A 1019' FNL & 1024' FEL  [NENE, 31-1S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Hartman 2-31A3 43-013-31243 Fee 11024 N/A N/A 2437 FSL & 1505' FWL  |[SWSW, 31-1S-3W | Altamont | Duchesne
Hunt 1-21B4 43-013-30214 Patented 1350 N/A N/A 1701' FNL & 782' FEL SENE, 21-2S8-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Hunt 2-21B4 43-013-31114 Fee /839 N/A N/A 1512' FWL & 664' FSL-  [NESW, 21-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
lorg 2-10B3 43-013-31388 Fee {481 N/A N/A 738’ FNL & 660" FEL NENE, 10-2S-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Lake Fork 3-15B4 43-013-31358 Fee /13798 N/A N/A 1300' FNL & 1450' FWL  [NENW, 15-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lawrence 1-30B4 43-013-30220 Fee /895 N/A N/A 919' FNL & 1622' FEL NWNE, 30-2S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lawson 1-28A1 43-013-30358 Fee [70] N/A N/A 2275' FSL & 1802' FEL  [INWSE, 28-1S-1W Bluebell | Duchesne
Lazy K 2-14B3 43-013-31354. Fee /1952 N/A N/A 1670' FSL & 1488' FEL  [NWSE, 14-2S8-3W Bluebell | Duchesne
Lindsay 2-33A4 43-013-31141 Fee . JpY57 N/A N/A 1499' FWL & 663' FSL SESW, 33-1S-4W Altamont | Duchesne
Lotridge Gates 1-3B3 43-013-30117 Patented 170 N/A N/A 965' FNL & 750" FEL NENE, 3-28-3W Altamont | Duchesne
Matthews 2-13B2 43-013-31357 Fee /{374 N/A N/A 858' FNL & 1098' FWL NWNW, 13-28-2wW Bluebell | Duchesne
Meeks 3-8B3. 43-013-31377 Fee ILER N/A N/A 1065' FNL & 1124' FWL Altamont | Duchesne



N N
B

Division of 0i1, Gas and Mining N
OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET Routipe: 7
' - \JECAT-BY
Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2'D"-ITS/BLFILE
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3
¥ 4.R
XChange of Operator (well sold) 3 Designation of Agent 54
J Desigration of Operator O QOperator Name Change Only 6FTIM .~
'he operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE:  12-27-95 )
TO (new operator) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM (former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO INC
(address) PO BOX 749 , (address) PO BOX 749
DENVER CO _80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749
phone (303 )572-1121 phone (303 )572-1121
account no. _N 0230 (B) account no. _N0675
Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed):
Name : **SEE ATTACHED*#* API:LW?b"*EMy%755Entity: Sec__ _Twp__ Rng___ lease Type:
Name : API:__ Entity: Sec__Twp__ _Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp__ Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: : Entity: Sec__Twp__Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec____Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: _ Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name : API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:

CIPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

L

1.

h

Wh a.

V/

el 5,

;(/U
2 8.

/7
9.

6.

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form). /4. l/ 209

(Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or qgther legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). [[“/,7;9'717

The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. ~Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number: ; '

(For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

Changes héve been eptered in the Oil apd Gas_Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well
Visted above. /344 ) Y79b/audie )( 44590 ) Fr LA ) ( §-20-9 [Trolrs OAS

Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.
Well file labels have been updated-for each well listed above.

Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo
for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. ﬁ?ﬁLﬂ;7
A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER -



OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.
t

ENTITY REVIEH .

entity changes made? (yes/ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of

¢ 1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity asz%g?ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. HWere
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

_ﬁ%é 2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

g _ ‘ ; , nS. (o .
BOND VERIFICATION (Fee wells only) Serchy No- Ub05382-1 (18000 ) hn ded Pecrbic Tos. &

¢ 1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a

proper bond.
,{///m Zé‘m /o//‘bu/

A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operagérs bond files.

242.3. The former operator [as requested a release of liability from their bond (yes(ZD .
Today's date __Mmaére If yes, division response was made by letter

dated . [5“,; Bond #5 [Nis/a/7

LEASE INTEREST ORNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

QZéfl. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/lessee of any fee lease well listed above has been
notified by letter dated 19 , of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING "x
¥%§ 1. A1l attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: : 2“'/7 196?7 .

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

__ 2. The original of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS

%ﬁg// 7'[,‘5 r[m/ix byvoA;{S /Z:a /fé& /)m Lol tisells -‘.;:w/é——*ﬁ 53/&4 Zeéig //u-c//s :

an

Volla_ fim [51 Mprv. 0.5 419,
Gbogdo  b1a berv. (A% _F-WAL.

1060329 fin _lprv. Todler Loese ppetls 3-20-. |
WET1/34-35 ,(74//,,7 Lem eg 2-567 [ 430 13-30 784 under revicis ad Vhis Lone; no oy ywé,/




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESQURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

@

. LEASE DEESIGNATION AD SERIAL NUMBER:

[=:]

. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME;

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

-~

. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do nol usa this form lor proposals lo drill new wells, significanlly deepen exisling wells below cucrent baltem-hale depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal lalerals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

ol weLt [] GASWELL [[]  OTHER

-3

T WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Exbibit "A"

1. TYPE OF WELL

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. AP NUMBER:
El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMDER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
368 South 1200 East cnr Vernal state Utah zin 84078 435-789-4433

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: . © - .0 .- S SR W Se COUNTY:

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: = R S STATE:

’ UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE [] oseren REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[T wotice oF INTENT

{Submil in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR ‘WELL

Approximale date work will stari: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR
CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VEMT OR FLARE
[:] SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

{Submit Original Form Only)

WATER SHUT-OFF

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)

Dale of work comipletion:

HOOO0ooon

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS otHerR: Name Change

OUoooooog
obooOoooono

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all periinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corpoeration and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal 01l & Gas Corporation
has been changed to El Paso Production 0il & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 4%00JU0708
Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

 MAME (PLEASE PRINT, ohn T Elzner -mirte Vice President
SIGNATURE > %—' onte L4 -15 -0/

El Paso Pxdduction 011 & Gas Company
e pLease PRI \John TH#lzner e Vice President

— onte L6 <15 -8/

SIGNATURE KM 7

) .
R RECEIVED

JUN 15 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

{5/2000} {See instruclions on Reversa Side)



‘ State of Delaware .

Office of the 'Secretary of State

PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF
DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT
COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN
THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O’CLOCK

A.M.

RECEIVED
HUN 8 Jom

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE: 04-03-01



03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. @oo3/003
CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company™), a corporation
organized and existing under and by virtue of the General Co

rporation Law of the State of
Delaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY: .

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimous
written consent of its members, fi

led with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolution

B advisable the following amendment to the Certificate of
Incorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate of
Incorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
“FIRST.” 50 that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

“FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oi! & Gas
Company.”

SECOND: That in lieu of z meeti
stockholders entitled to vote have
accordance with the

State of Delaware.

ng and vote of stockholders, the
given unanimous written consent to said amendment in
provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of the

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance with

the applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware,

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

has caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice President and attested by an
Assistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
W

David L. Siddall
Vice President

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

P b DIVISION OF CORPORATIONS
ECEi Ko ¥ FILED 11:00 am 03,/09/2001
010118394 ~ 0610204
TN 19 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.GLH 4-KAS »«f’/
2. CDW/ 5-LP e
3.JLT 6-FILE
Enter date after each listed item is completed
Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent
Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: ~ 3-09-2001

FROM: (01d Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

TO: ( New Operator):

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address:

9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account N0230 Account NI1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY |SEC TWN |LEASE |WELL |WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE | STATUS
CBHATCH 1-5B1 43-013-30226 [5935 05-02S-01W |FEE ow S
JLAMICQ ST 1-6B1 43-013-30210 ]5405 06-02S-01W |FEE ow S
NORLING ST U 1-9B1 43-013-30315 {5940 09-02S-01W {FEE ow S
GALLOWAY 1-18B1 43-013-30575 2365 18-02S-01W |FEE oW p
ANDERSON 1A-30B1 43-013-30783 1292 30-028-01W |FEE oW P
JOHN 1-3B2 43-013-30160 |5385 03-028-02W |FEE oW S
MEAGHER ESTATE 1-4B2 43-013-30313 [1811 04-02S-02W |FEE ow S
LAMICQ 2-5B2 (CA 96-83) 43-013-30784 2302 05-02S-02W |FEE ow P
REESE ESTATE 1-10B2 43-013-30215 5460 10-02S-02W |FEE ow S
REESE 2-10B2 43-013-30837 |2416 10-025-02W |FEE ow p
EHBUZZIU 1-11B2 43-013-30248 [5960 11-02S-02W |FEE oW S
ELDER 1-13B2 43-013-30366 {1905 13-02S-02W {FEE ow P
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 43-013-31357 11374 13-02S-02W |FEE ow P
GOODRICH 1-18B2 43-013-30397 ]1871 18-02S-02W |FEE oW S
LINMAR 1-19B2 43-013-30600 }9350 19-02S-02W |FEE OwW P
JENKINS 1-1B3 (CA 96-70) 43-013-30175 1790 01-02S-03W [FEE ow p
JENKINS 2-1B3 43-013-31117 [1792 01-028-03W |FEE ow p
GOODRICH 1-2B3 43-013-30182 1765 02-02S-03W |FEE oW p
GOODRICH 2-2B3 43-013-31246 11037 02-025-03W |FEE ow P
LOTRIDGE GATES FEE 1-3B3 43-013-30117 1670 03-02S-03W [FEE ow S
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

YES

Business Number:

608186-0143




5. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA'"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:

1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 06/28/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 06/28/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 06/28/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: g i l§ ID,

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change File".




.

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 . Houston, TX. 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038
CA No. Unit: N/A
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNGJAPI NO ENTITY [LEASE TYPE|WELL [|WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
See Attached List |
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012

COMMENTS:

Disposal and Injections wells will be moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis 6/29/2012




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
Multiple Leases

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposgis.

7. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
7
OIL WELL GasWELL []  OTHER See Attached
Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana iy Houston srate VX 7 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [ oeeeen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/] NoTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) M) auTER CASING [C] FracTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wit start:. | [ ]  CASING REPAIR [] wnewconsTRuCTION [C] veEMPORARILY ABANDON

[T] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE "] vueinG REPAIR
[J cHance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [7] ventorFLARE

[0 sussequent RepoRT ] crance weLL NaME [J pLuceack [[] warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comMmINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [_] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: Change of
[ converT weLL TYPE [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JU0705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Falle Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME (pLasm. Gomez mme Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE 6 : M oave  0/22/2012

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED (» /29/30IQ JUN 25 2012
Roahed

(moobivis‘-on of 0“’ Gas and Mining - (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene-Russell, Engineering Techiiiclan: ...
Rachet Modirm




El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well [Well
Well Name ___ |Sec 'TWP RNG |API Number Entity Lease Type Type |Status Conf
DWR 3-17C6 747 030S [060W 4301350070 14204621118 |OW __ APD _ [C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S [060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD |C
YOUNG 3-15A3 15 |010S [030W 4301350122 FEE OW |APD [C
WHITING 4-1A2 01 |010S [020W |4301350424 Fee oW |APD [C |
EL PASO 4-34A4 34 010S [040W 4301350720 Fee OW APD [C
YOUNG 2-2B1 02 020S |010W (4304751180 FEE OW APD C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-10B4 10 |020S [040W 4301350712 |18221 [Fee OW [DRL C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-26B4 26 |020S [040W 4301350714 |18432 [Fee OW |DRL € |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 [020S |040W 4301350717 |18315 |Fee OW DRL C
Cook 4-14B3 - 14 [020S |030W 4301351162 |18449 |Fee OW [DRL [C
Peterson 4-22C6 22 |030S |060W 4301351163 18518 [Fee OW [DRL [C |
Lake Fork Ranch 4-14B4 14 020S [040W [4301351240 (99999 |Fee OW |DRL [C
Melesco 4-20C6 - 20 [030S |060W 4301351241 [99999 |Fee OW |DRL _C |
Peck 3-13B5 113 [020S |050W |4301351364 (99999 [Fee OW DRL [C |
Jensen 2-9C4 09 [030S [040W |4301351375 (99999 [Fee OW [DRL C |
El Paso 3-5C4 105 0305 [040W 4301351376 | 18563 |Fee OW DRL [C |
ULT 6-31 31 |030S |020E 4304740033 FEE oW LA ]
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 |010S |010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 |030S |060W 4301351433 [14-20-H62-4724 OW _ [NEW |C
Lake Fork Ranch 5-2384 23 [020S [040W 4301350739 Fee OW [NEW ]
Duchesne Land 4-10C5 10 |030S |050W [4301351262 Fee OW [NEW C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 |020S [030W 4301351374 _ |Fee oW INEW [C
Layton 4-2B3 - 02 |020S |030W 4301351389 Fee OW |NEW [C |
Golinski 4-24B5 ]24 |020S [050W [4301351404| Fee = [OW [NEW [C
Alba 1-21C4 21 |030S [040W 4301351460 Fee OW |NEW [C
Allison 4-19C5 19 |030S [050W 4301351466 Fee OW |NEW [C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 [020S [030W 4301351486 Fee OW |NEW C |
Allen 4-25B5 25 |020S |050W 4301351487 Fee OW NEW [C |
Hewett2-6C4 |06 |030S [040W 4301351489 Fee OW INEW [C |
Young 2-7C4 - 07 |030S [040W 4301351500 __ |Fee oW T INEW € ]
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 [010S |010E (4304752471 Fee oW INEw [C ]
Hamaker 3-25A1 |25 |010S [010W 4304752491 __ |Fee OW [NEW [C |
Boiton 3-29A1E B 29 [010S [010E |4304752871 Fee OW [NEW C
HORROCKS 5-20A1 ~ 120 |010S [010W [4301334280 |17378 FEE OW _OPS [C |
DWR 3-19C6 } 19 [030S [060W [4301334263 17440 |14-20-462-1120 OW [P
DWR 3-22C6 f‘* 22 |030S [060W |4301334106 |17298 |14-20-462-1131 [OW P ]
DWR 3-28C6 - 28 030S |060W 4301334264 | 17360 | 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 - - 07 |010S [020W 4301330025 5850 |14-20462-811 OW P ]
UTE 2-17C6 17 |030S [060W [4301331033 10115 |14-20-H62-1118 OW P
WLR TRIBAL 2-19C6 119 0305 |060W [4301331035 | 10250 |14-20-H62-1120 OW [P B
CEDARRIM 10-A-15C6 115 [030S |060W 4301330615 6420 |14-20-H62-1128[OW P | |
CEDAR RIM 12A ] 28 |030S |060W |4301331173 10672 [14-20-H62-1323 OW [P ]
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 B 33 [030S |060W [4301331123 |10365 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |P
TAYLOR3-34C6 ~ 134 030S [060W [4301350200 17572 1420H621329 |[OW [P -
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 134 |030S |060W 14301332634 | 14590 |14-20-H62-1329 |OW P T
UTE3-3522K 35 |010N |020W 4301331133 | 10483 |14-20-H62-1614 [OW P | |
UTE 1-3222 |32 |010N[020W 4301330379 1915 |14-20-H62-1702'OW P o
UTE TRIBAL 1-3322 B 133 010N 020W 4301330334 |1851 |14-20-H62-1703 OW [P ]
UTE 2-3322 - 133 010N |020W 4301331111 10451 |14-20-H62-1703/OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422 |34 [010N[020W (4301331167 10668 |14-20-H62-1704 OW [P j
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 [020S |040W |4301334262 17439 |14-20-H62-1743 OW [P ]
UTE 1-28B4 T 1287]020S|040W 4301330242 1796 |14-20-H62-1745OW P | |
UTE 1-34A4 3 /34 1010S [040W 4301330076 |1585 |14-20-H62-1774 OW [P i
UTE 1-36A4 ] |36 [010S [040W 4301330069 1580 |14-20-H62-1793[OW [P
UTE 1-1B4 - 101 |020S [040W |4301330129 |1700 |14-20-H62-1798 [OW [P ]
UTE 1-31A2 '31_1010S [020W [4301330401 1925 [14-20-H62-1801 OW P

1



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE 1-25A3 25 |010S [030W 4301330370 1920 |14-20-H62-1802 | OW [P

UTE 2-25A3 - |25 0105 |030W 4301331343 [11361 |14-20-H62-1802[OW [P
UTE1-26A3 ] 126 "|010S [030W [4301330348 |1890 |14-20-H62-1803[OW [P

UTE 2-26A3 26 |010S [030W (4301331340 |11349 [14-20-H62-1803 OW P ]
UTE TRIBAL 4-35A3 135 [010S |030W 4301350274 [18000 [1420H621804 OW P C |
[UTE 2-35A3 T |35 |010S|030W 4301331292 11222 |14-20-H62-1804 [OW [P |
UTE 3-35A3 _ 35 |010S [030W [4301331365 |11454 [1420-H62-1804 OW P |
UTE 1-6B2 o ~ 106 |020S [020W 4301330349 1895 |14-20-H62-1807 [OW [P

UTE 2-6B2 ~ 706 |020S [020W 4301331140 [11190 | 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-6B2 ) 06 |020S[020W |4301350273 | 18008 |14-20-H62-1807 OW P c
POWELL 4-19A1 - 19 |010S [010W 4301330071 8302 |14-20-H62-1847 [OW [P

COLTHARP 12721 i 27 010N |010W [4301330151 |4700 |14-20-H62-1933 |[OW P~ | |
UTE 1-8A1E T 08 |010S |010E 14304730173 [1846 |14-20-H62-2147 OW P T
UTE TRIBE 1-31 31 |010N |020W (4301330278 |4756 |14-20-H62-2421|[OW P T
UTE 1-28B6X i 28 |020S |060W |4301330510 |11165 |14-20-H62-2492 [OW P ]
RINKER 2-21B5 21 |020S |050W [4301334166 |17299 |14-20-H62-2508 OW [P | |
MURDOCK 2-34B5 |34 [020S [050W [4301331132 |10456 |14-20-H62-2511/OW P |
UTE 1-35B6 35 |020S [060W 4301330507 2335 |14-20-H622531 [OW P | |
'UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 |010S [010E |4304730829 (860 |14-20-H622658 OW P |
UTE 2-17A1E B 17 1010S [010E |4304737831 16709 |14-20-H622658 [OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-27AE 27 [010S |010E 4304730421800 |14-20-H62-2662 |OW P i
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E " I35 [010S|010E [4304730286 (795 |14-20-H62-2665OW P _
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E |15 |010S [010E [4304730820 850 |14-20-H622717 OW _ |P )
UTE TRIBALP-3B1E |03 |020S |010E |4304730190 4536 |14-20-H622873[OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E ) |22 ]010S [010E 4304730429810 |14-20-H62-3103/oW P |
B H UTE 1-35C6 I35 |030S|060W [4301330419 10705 [14-20-H62-3436 OW |P |
BH UTE 2-35C6 7|35 [030S [060W |4301332790 | 15802 | 14-20-H62-3436 [OW P |
MCFARLANE 14D6 ] " |04 |040S [060W [4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452[OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 i 11 /040S [060W 4301330482 (6415 |14-20-H62-3454 OW P |
CARSON 2-36A1 36 |010S |010W 4304731407 737 |14-20-H62-3806 OW P )
UTE 2-14C6 7714 [030S [060W 4301330775 |9133 |14-20-H62-3809 [OW [P B
DWR 3-14C6 114 [030S |060W |4301334003 [17092 |14-20-H62-3808 OW P |
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 [010S |010W 4301330935 [9461 |14-20-H62-3855 OW P ]
BADGER-SAM H UMONGUS 1-15A1 (15 _|010S |010W 4301330949 [9462 |14-20-H62-3860 OW P | |
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE 14-1 14 [010S [030W 4301330726 |8437 |14-20-H62-3868 [OW P |
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 122 p10S [010W 4301330781 [0460 [14-20-H62-3880 .OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 30 |010N |010W [4301330813[9405 |14-20-H62-3910 OW P =
UTELB1-13A3 13 |010S [030W [4301330894 9402 |14-20-H62-3980([OW P 1
UTE 2-22B6 B |22 [020S '060W 4301331444 11641 [14-20-H62-4614 OW P ]
UINTAOURAY 1-1A3 o1 [010S 030W 4301330132 5540 |14-20-H62-4664 OW P |
UTE 1-6D6 ] 06 |040S |060W [4301331696 |12058 |14-20-H62-4752 |OW  |P

UTE 2-11D6 111 |040S |060W (4301350179 |17667 |1420H624801 |OW P T
UTE 1-15D6 ) o 15 [040S |060W 4301330429 | 10958 [14-20-H62-4824 OW P | |
UTE 2-15D6 15 |040S [060W 4301334026 (17193 |14-20-H624824 OW P o
HILL 3-24C6 " |24 |030S |060W 4301350293 [18020 | 1420H624866 | OW  |P C
BARCLAY UTE 2-24C6R "~ 724 |030S |060W |4301333730 | 16385 [14-20-H62-4866 [ OW P o
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 "oz ]020S |040W |4301330062 |1570 |FEE ow P T ]
BOREN 1-24A2 |24 010S|020W [4301330084 |5740 |[FEE ow p I
FARNSWORTH1-1385 13 1020S [050W 4301330092 [1610 |FEE ow P I ]
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 121 |020S |060W 4301330100 1595 |FEE ow P ]
ASAY E J 1-20A1 20 [010S |010W 4301330102 [8304 |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-6B3 05 |020S [030W [4301330109 (16356 |[FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 B 08 |020S [040W 4301330112 16556 |FEE ow P |~
ELLSWORTH1-9B4 ~ ""109 [020S |040W 4301330118 1660 |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 ) 17 |[020S [040W [4301330126 1695 |FEE ow P | ]
CHANDLER 1-5B4 ~ o5 [020S [040W [4301330140 |1685 FEE ow P
[HANSON 1-32A3 32 [010S[030W 4301330141 |1640 |FEE oW P i
JESSEN 1-17A4 117 [070S [040W (4301330173 |4725 |FEE ow P

2



El Paso E3 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

JENKINS 1-1B3

01 [020S [030W [4301330175[1790 |FEE ow P
GOODRICH1-2B3 |02 |020S |030W |4301330182 |1765 FEE ow [P ]
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 19 |020S [040W 4301330183 |1760 |[FEE ow [P )
DOYLE 1-10B3 10 [020S |030W [4301330187 (1810 [FEE |OW P B
JOS.SMITH1-17C5 |17 _|030S [050W |4301330188 |5510 |[FEE ow p |
RUDY 1-11B3 o 11 [020S [030W 4301330204 |1820 |FEE oW P
CROOK 1-6B4 - 06 |020S |040W (4301330213 1825 |FEE ow P B
HUNT 1-21B4 ) 121 |020S |040W (4301330214 [1840 |FEE ow P
LAWRENCE 1-30B4 30 [020S |040W 4301330220 (1845 |[FEE ow [P B
YOUNG 1-29B4 |29 ]020S |040W 4301330246 1791 FEE =~ OW P
GRIFFITHS 1-33B4 133 1020S |040W [4301330288(4760 [FEE ~ OW P ﬂ
POTTER 1-2B5 02 [020S |050W [4301330293 (1826 |FEE oW P B
BROTHERSON 1-26B4 |26 [020S [040W [4301330336/1856 [FEE oW P | |
SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 |010N |010W 4301330355(765 [FEE ~ OW P ]
[POTTER 1-24B5 24 |020S |050W 4301330356 |1730 |FEE oW P
WHITEHEAD 1-22A3 o 22 |010S |030W |4301330357 1885 FEE ow [P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 101 ]010S |020W [4301330360/5830 FEE =~ OW P B
ELDER 1-13B2 113 |020S |020W 4301330366 (1905 FEE ~~ OW P B
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 |10 |020S [040W [4301330443 |1615 |[FEE ow |p B
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330470(1935 [FEE oW P B
TEW 1-15A3 - 15 _|010S |030W 4301330529/1945 FEE __~ OW [P )
UTE FEE 2-20C5 - 20 [030S |050W [4301330550 4527 |[FEE low |
HOUSTON 1-34Z1 - 34 010N |010W [4301330566 (885 |FEE ow P
GALLOWAY 1-18B1 ) ~ 118 |020S |010W 4301330575 [2365 FEE ow P [ ]
SMITH 1-31B5 ] 31 1020S |050W [4301330577 [1955 |FEE oW P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 ] 134 1010S |010W [4301330590(1440 FEE =~ OW P |
LINMAR 1-19B2 ) 19 |020S |020W 14301330600 (9350 |FEE ow P ]
WISSE 1-28Z1 B |28 |010N [010W (4301330609 (905 |FEE ow p |
POWELL 1-21B1 ] 21 |020S [010W 4301330621 (910 |FEE ow |p |
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S |030W 4301330629 2390 [FEE ow P
OMAN 2-4B4 ] 04 [020S [040W |4301330645/9125 [FEE ~ |OW P )
DYE 1-2522 |25 010N |020W [4301330659/9111 [FEE ~~  OW P
H MARTIN 1-21Z1 21 |010N [010W 4301330707 |925 |FEE ow P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 i 29 |010N|010W [4301330725/9110 [FEE ~ |OW [P
CHASEL 2-17A1V |17 |o10S |010W 4301330732/9112 FEE OW P |
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 B 27 |010S |010W |4301330758/940 [FEE =~ |ow P |
CHRISTENSEN 2-8B3 08 [020S |030W [4301330780 |9355 |FEE ow p |
LAMICQ 2-5B2 05 [020S [020W [4301330784 [2302 |FEE ow P ]
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 |020S |[040W '4301330815 10450 FEE =~ Oow P = |
MURRAY 3-2A2 |02 Jo10S 020w [4301330816/9620 [FEE =~~~ Oow [P ' |
HORROCKS 2-20A1 V 20 |010S |010W 4301330833 |8301 |FEE ow P N
BROTHERSON 2-2B4 ] 02 020S [040W [4301330855 8420 |FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 |08 |020S [040W |4301330898 [2418 |FEE ow p | ]
OMAN 2-32A4 - 132 _|010S |040W [4301330904 (10045 |[FEE ow [, |
BELCHER 2-33B4 33 |020S |040W 4301330907 (9865 [FEE =~ OW P
BROTHERSON2-35B5 35 |020S 050W |4301330908/9404 FEE =~ oW P =
HORROCKS 24A1 T - |04 |010S |010W |4301330954 9855 [FEE ow P
JENSEN229A5 29 '010S [050W 4301330974 [10040FEE OW P ]
UTE 2-34A4 |34 |010S [040W [4301330978 [10070/FEE  |OW P )
CHANDLER 2-5B4 |05 _|020S [040W (4301331000 [10075]FEE ~ |OW P ]
BABCOCK 2-12B4 |12 020S [040W |4301331005/10215[FEE ~OW P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 |29 |010S [010W [4301331013/9463 FEE =~ |OW P |
BLEAZARD 2-18B4 |18 [020S ;040W 4301331025 |1566 |FEE __ow P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 |32 1020S |050W 4301331036 |10216 |FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 020S |040W 4301331046 (10217 [FEE  |OW [P |
RUST 3-4B3 ... |04 |020S 030W 4301331070 1576 |[FEE = |OW P _
HANSON TRUST 2-32A3 32 |010S |030W 4301331072 1641 |FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-11B4 '11_1020S [040W 4301331078 [1541 [FEE ow__ P
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HANSON TRUST 2-6B3 05 [020S [030W [4301331079]1636 [FEE _|OW P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 |020S 040W (4301331103 /1771 [FEE ~ ow P |
MONSEN 2-27A3 27 010S1030W (4301331104 1746 |FEE ow [P
ELLSWORTH2-19B4 19 1020S [040W |4301331105|1761 FEE _OW P |
[HUNT2:21B4 " "121 [020S |040W (4301331114 [1839 |FEE _ow P )
JENKINS2-1B3 01 |020S |030W 4301331117 [1792 [FEE low P |
POTTER2-24B5 - 24 |020S [050W 4301331118/1731 FEE  Jow P T N
POWELL2-13A2K - 13 |010S |020W |4301331120 |8306 |FEE ow P I
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 |020S |030W [4301331121 10459 [FEE ow |
MURDOCK 2-26B5 |26 |020S |050W [43013311241531 (FEE oW P | |
BIRCH3-2785 127 |020S |050W (4301331126 [1783 FEE Cjow P
ROBB 2-29B5 - ~ 129 1020S [050W |4301331130 |10454 [FEE ow P 1
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 [020S|040W 4301331134 [10452 [FEE T jow [P |
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K T 01 |010S |020W [4301331135 10484 |FEE ow P ]
[HANSON 2-9B3 T 09 |020S [030W [4301331136 |10455 [FEE ow p |
ELLSWORTH 2-9B4 |09 10208 [040W 4301331138 10460/ FEE OW P | |
UTE 2-31A2 o 31 |010S |020W |4301331139 | 10458 |FEE OW"WE“" o
POWELL 2-19A1 K 19 |010S |010W (4301331149 8303 |FEE low P T
CEDAR RIM 8-A - 22 7]030S |060W |4301331171|10666 [FEE Tow P ]
POTTER 2-6B4 - 06 |020S [040W [4301331249 11038 [FEE ow P | |
MILES 2-1B5 ~ o1 |020S |050W |4301331257 (11062 |FEE ~ low P ]
MILES 2-3B3 - 03 [020S |030W 4301331261 |11102)FEE OW [P

MONSEN 2-22A3 122 |010S |030W 4301331265 | 11098 |FEE _ ow P

WRIGHT 21385 ~ ]13 |020S |050W 4301331267 (11115 FEE  [OW [P | |
TODD2-21A3 21 |010S [030W [4301331296 | 11268 |FEE Clow P [
WEIKART 22084 |29 020S040W[4301331298[11332|FEE  |OW P ]
YOUNG 2-15A3 |15 |010S [030W |4301331301 |11344 [FEE low P B
CHRISTENSEN 2-29A4 B |29 1010S1040W 4301331303 [11235[FEE [oW P | B
BLEAZARD 2-28B4 - 28 |020S |040W [4301331304 |11433 [FEE ow P ]
REARY 2-17A3 ~ |17 |010S[030W 4301331318 [11251 |FEE ow P ]
LAZY K 2-11B3 |11 _|020S[030W |4301331352 11362 FEE oW P | |
[AZYK2-14B3 14 |020S030W 4301331354 [11452/FEE  |[OW IE‘: L
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 13 |020S |020W [4301331357 | 11374 |FEE Tow P T
LAKE FORK 3-15B4 |15 |020S |040W [4301331358 | 11378 [FEE ______|[OW P N
STEVENSON 3-20A3 T 129 |010S030W 4301331376 11442 FEE ___OW P I
MEEKS3-883 B ”498 020S 030W |4301331377 11489 FEE | ow P |
ELLSWORTH 3-20B4 120 1020S[040W 4301331389 (11488 FEE  |low P | ]
DUNCAN 5-13A2 - 13 |010S |020W 4301331516 |11776 [FEE ow P ]
OWL 3-17C5 17 _[030S |050W 4301332112 [12476 FEE ow P
BROTHERSON 2-24B4 ] 124 ]020S '040W |4301332695[14652|[FEE ~ |OW P :
BODRERO 2-15B3 |15 |020S |030W |4301332755|14750 FEE =~ oW P |
BROTHERSON 2-25B4 |25 ]020S |040W [4301332791 [15044 [FEE ow p T
CABINLAND 2-16B3 16 |020S [030W 4301332914 15236 [FEE = |OW [P 7
KATHERINE 3-29B4 ~ 129 [020S [040W 4301332923 [15331 [FEE ow |p |
SHRINERS 2-10C5 ~ /10 |030S |050W [4301333008 [15908 |FEE ~low P ﬂ ]
BROTHERSON 2-26B4 126 |020S [040W [4301333139/17047 FEE oW [P T ]
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 '32 |010S |020W |4301333211 15720 |FEE Clow
FERRARINI3-27B4 127 [020S 040W 4301333265 15883/FEE =~ |OW P | -
RHOADES 2-25B5 - 25 1020S |050W [4301333467 16046 [FEE ow P j
CASE 2-3184 - /31 |020S |040W 4301333548 | 16225 |FEE T low P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 Wi#zj 020S [030W 4301333616 (16284 FEE ow P | _
SPROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 |18 |020S |010W [4301333808 [16677 [FEE ow P L]
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 |11 jo20S |040W 4301333904 [16891]FEE = OW P |
KOFFORD 2-36B5 ) 136 |020S |050W |4301333988(17048 FEE = OW [P |
ALLEN3-7B4 ~lo7 |020S |040W |4301334027 |17166 |FEE low P
[BOURNAKIS 3-18B4 ~ 18 |020S [040W |4301334091 17264 [FEE = |OW P

MILES 3-12B5 112 ]020S|050W [4301334110[17316 FEE __ OW [P

OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 ' T31 020S [050W [4301334123 17388 |FEE low P
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OWL and HAWK 4-17C5 17 0305 |050W [4301334193 | 17387 |FEE ow P | ]
DWR 3-32B5 132 l020S |050W 4301334207 |17371 |FEE Tow P’
LAKE FORK RANCH 32284 22 |020S |040W |4301334261 17409 [FEE  |OW P |
HANSON 3-9B3 ) 109 [020S [030W |4301350065 |17570 |FEE ow [P ]
DYE 2-28A1 28 |010S [010W 4301350066 |17531 |FEE ow P |
MEEKS 3-32A4 " {32 [010S |040W |4301350069 17606 FEE Jow b
[HANSON 4-8B3 |08 |020S |030W 4301350088 17571 FEE =~ OW P  C
LAKE FORKRANCH3-14B4 |14 |020S |040W 4301350007 17484 [FEE ow p
ALLEN 3-9B4 |09 |020S |040W 4301350123 |17656 FEE ow P |
HORROCKS 4-20A1 20 |010S |010W 4301350155 |17916 | FEE ow P | ]
HURLEY 2-33A1 133 _|010S 010W |4301350166 17573 [FEE ow P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO 3-20C5 20 |030S [050W (4301350190 17541 |FEE ow P ]
ALLEN 3-8B4 08 |020S |040W 4301350192 17622 |[FEE_|ow [P |
OWL and HAWK 3-10C5 B (10 |030S |050W 4301350193 |17532 | FEE ow P ’
OWL and HAWK 3-19C5 - 19 |030S [050W (4301350201 |17508 [FEE ow P T
EL PASO 420B5 " " 129 |020S [050W 4301350208 |17934 |FEE ow P C_|
DONIHUE 3-20C6 20 |030S |060W 4301350270 |17762 [FEE ow P )
HANSON 3-5B3 " los 1020S [030W 4301350275 17725 [FEE ow P ¢
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 |020S |050W 4301350302 [17668 |FEE T low P ]
REBEL 3-35B5 ] ~ I35 |020S (050W 4301350388 [17911 |FEE ow P Cc
FREEMAN 4-16B4 T 16 |020S |040W 4301350438 |17935 |Fee low Pl ]
WILSON 3-36B5 T 77 7 6 |020S |050W [4301350439 (17936 Fee 2 oW P 'C
EL PASO 321B4 21 10205 |040W |4301350474 [18123 |Fee Jow P c |
IORG 4-12B3 7712 [020S [030W [4301350487 |17981 [Fee ow P [
CONOVER 3-383 o 03 |020S |030W 4301350526 [18122[Fee __1OW [P Ic |
ROWLEY 3-16B4 B 16 [020S |040W |4301350569 | 18151 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTS 3-14B3 ) 14 0205 |030W 4301350570 18366 [Fee ow P ¢
POTTER 4-27B5 27 020S |050W 4301350571 |99999 |Fee ow P c ]
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 |020S |040W 4301350572 | 18152 |Fee “low P c
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 |020S |040W 4301350707 | 18270 |Fee ow P ¢ |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-25B4 T |25 020S|040W [4301350711 | 18220 |Fee T Tlow P ¢
LAKE FORK RANCH 42384 23 (0205 |040W 4301350713 |18271 |Fee —ow h{d ic
LAKE FORK RANCH4-1584 1150208 |040W |4301350715 | 18314 Fee Jow E Cle ]
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-24B4 124 |020S [040W 4301350716 |18269 Fee CJow TP e
GOLINSKI 1-8C4 T |08 |030S |040W 4301350986 18301 [Fee 2 ___OW P C |
J ROBERTSON 1-1B1 ] /01 |020S |010W 4304730174 |5370 |FEE ow P o
TIMOTHY 1-8B1E 08 [020S [010E |4304730215 1910 FEE oW P j
MAGDALENE PAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E (34 [010S |010E [4304730241 785 |FEE jow P T
NELSON 131A1E © 731 0105 [010E |4304730671 830 FEE ow [p 1]
[ROSEMARY LLOYD 1-24A1E |24 |010S 010E 14304730707 840 |FEE TTow P ,,,
H D LANDY 1-30A1E o 30 |010S |[010E |4304730790 845 |FEE oW P 1
WALKER 1-14A1E 14 |010S |010E 4304730805(855 |FEE oW [P | |
BOLTON2-29A1E |29 |010S[010E [4304731112[900 |FEE ow [P
PRESCOTT1-3521  [35 [010N|010W 4304731173 (1425 [FEE oW P | |
BISELGURR 11-1 11 0105 |010W 4304731213 |8438 |FEE Tow P ]
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E =~ 122 ,010S 010E 4304731265915 |[FEE ~~ OW P N
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 7 T2 ]010S [010W 14304731295 (920 |FEE ow p

FOWLES 1-26A1 |26 1010S |010W |4304731296 |930 |FEE ow P
BRADLEY23-1 - 23 |010S |010W |4304731297 (8435 FEE = IOW P
BASTIAN1-2A1 02 [010S [010W 4304731373 |736 |FEE low [P T
DRLONG2-19AME 19 i010S |010E |4304731470 9505 FEE ow
DMOON 1-23Z1 |23 010N |010W 4304731479 |[10310[FEE ~~|OW P
O MOON 2-26Z1 |26 |010N |010W 14304731480 10135 FEE - ow P |
LLAD225A1  "]25 |010S|010W 4304731797 10790|/FEE _ OW P L
LANDY 2-30A1E 30 |010S |010E 4304731895 11127/FEE oW P
WINN P2-381E 103 [020S |010E 4304732321 | 11428 |FEE Clow P
BISEL.GURR2-11A1 711 [010S 010W 4304735410 |14428/FEE OW P
FLYING J FEE 2-12A1 12 10105 [010W 14304739467 | 16686 | FEE oW P
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HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 2-14B1_[14 1020S [010W (4304739591 [16546[FEE  OW [P j
OBERHANSLY3-11A1 111 ]010S |010W (4304739679 17937 |[FEE | ow P I
DUNCAN2-34A1 134 1010S 010W |4304739944 17043 |FEE - ow P

BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 |010S |010W (4304739961 16791/FEE low P |
KILLIAN 3-12A1 112 |010S |010W |4304740226 17761 /ML39760 @ [OW P I
WAINOCO ST 1-14B1 ~ 7144 1020 [010W 4304730818 (1420 |ML24306-A [OW P |
UTAHSTUTE1-35A1 135 ,010S 010W 4304730182 5520 |ML-25432 = OW P | |
STATE 1-19A4 |19 |010S |040W 4301330322 9118 ML-27912  |OW P | |
FEDERAL2-28E19E 128 |050S |190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 |OW P | |
[FEDERAL 1-28E19E - 28 |050S [190E |4304730175 5680 |UTU143512 |OW [P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 103 [010S |020W 4301320316 |5877 |FEE ow PA |
WH BLANCHARD2-3A2 |03 |010S |020W 4301330008 5775 |FEE ow PA
YACK U 1-7A1 - 07 |010S|010W |4301330018(5795 FEE ~ OW [PA '
JAMESPOWELL3 113 010S |020W 4301330024 {8305 |FEE WD PA ]
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 |010S |010W |4301330026 5800 [FEE =~ OW |PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY18A2 08 |010S |020W 4301330036 5975 [FEE _  [OW  [PA
BLEAZARD1-18B4 118 020S |040W [4301330059 |11262 FEE ow |PA

OLSEN 1-27A4 |27 |010S |040W /4301330064 1565 FEE =~ OW |PA | |
EVANS 1-31A4 - 31 010S 040W 4301330067 |6330 |FEE ow IPA | ]
HAMBLIN 1-26A2 26 |010S [020W [4301330083 2305 |FEE ow PA | |
HARTMAN1-31A3 131 |010S |030W 4301330093 |10700 |FEE ow PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330097 5725 |FEE ow @7 e W
POWELL 1-33A3 33 |010S |030W |4301330105/4526 FEE  IOW PA |
LOTRIDGE GATES1-383 03 |020S 030W 4301330117 1625 [FEE _  |OW PA | |
REMINGTON 1-34A3 134 |010S |030W 14301330139 |1670 |FEE . ow [PA |
ANDERSON1-28A2 28 1010S 020W 4301330150,5895 |FEE . |OW |PA | = |
RHOADES MOON 1-35B5 35 [020S [050W 14301330155 |5270 |FEE ow PA ]
JOHN 1-382 o 03 |020S |020W |4301330160(5765 FEE ~  |OW |PA |
SMITH 1-6C5 o6 [030S 050w [4301330163 |5385 |FEE _jow PA |
HORROCKS FEE 1-3A1 |03 [010S[010W[4301330171|5505 FEE ___ OW PA | |
WARREN1-32A4 32 1010S |040W 4301330174 9139 FEE  ~ |OW  PA
JENSENFENZEL 1-20C5 |20 [030S |050W 4301330177 4730 [FEE ~  [OW  |PA e
MYRINRANCH1-13B4 13 |020S |040W 4301330180 |[4524 |FEE _ow PA |
BROTHERSON 12784 7sz 020S |040W [4301330185 1775 |FEE ow PA | |
JENSEN 1-31A5 131 1010S [050W [4301330186 |4735 |FEE ow PA |
ROBERTSON1-28A2 129 010S [020W |4301330189 [4740 |[FEE @ﬂ,, PA ]
WINKLER1-2843 128 {010S |030W [4301330191 |5465 |FEE oW |PA | ,
CHENEY1-33A2 "33 |010S|020W 4301330202[1750 [FEE __ [OW _ [PA |
JLAMICQ STATE1-6B1 |06 [020S [010W |4301330210|5730 |FEE oW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 110 [020S |020W 4301330215 5700 |[FEE ow  [PA 1
REEDER 1-178B5 - 17 |020S |050W (4301330218 5460 |FEE - low PA ]
ROBERTSONUTE1-2B2 02 |020S [020W |4301330225/1710 FEE = 1OW IPA L; ]
HATCH 1-5B1 .~ |05 ]020S 010W 4301330226 5470 FEE =~ |OW |PA
BROTHERSON 1-22B4 - fﬂ 020S |040W 4301330227 (5935 FEE ~ low |PA I
ALLRED 1-16A3 - 16 |010S |030W [4301330232 |1780 |FEE oW  PA 1
BIRCH 1-35A5 35 |010S [050W 4301330233 9116 FEE | OW [PA [
MARQUERITEUTE1-882 /08 |020S [020W [4301330235(9122 FEE = |OW  |PA |
BUZZI1-11B2 11 [020S|020W 4301330248(6335 [FEE |OW |PA | |
SHISLER 1-3B1 77,77@ 1020 [010W 14301330249 (5960 FEE OW PA 1 B
TEW 1-1B5 o1 Jo20S 050w 4301330264 (5580 FEE |OW |PA | |
EVANSUTE1-19B3 |19 |020S |030W 4301330265 (1870 [FEE _‘PQV!_ PA
SHELL2-27A4 " " '27 1010S|040W 4301330266 1776 [FEE WD [PA [
DYE 1-29A1 ) B |29 |010S |010W |4301330271 /99990 FEE o ow PA
VODA UTE 1-4C5 S ‘¥04 030S |050W 14301330283 4530 FEE ow |pPA |
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 Tz_é 010S |040W [4301330292 9114 FEE |OW |PA | |
MEAGHER14B2 104 |020S |020W 4301330313 8402 FEE =~ |OW JPA
NORLING19B1 109 |020S 010W 4301330315 1811 |[FEE ) }9\{\( [PA

S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 '09 '030S |050W 14301330316 |5940 |FEE OW PA
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TIMOTHY 1-00A3 09 010S [030W 4301330321 10883 |FEE ow__ [PA__ |
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 |010S |050W 4301330323 9115 |FEE OW PA )
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 |020S |020W 4301330325 9121 |[FEE _|OW PA |
PHILLIPS UTE 1-3C5 03 |030S [050W (4301330333 1816 |FEE Jow |pA ]
[ELLSWORTH 1-2084 T |20 020S |040W |4301330351(6376 |[FEE _ |OW _ PA
LAWSON128A1 28" [010S [010W [4301330358 (5015 [FEE  |OW |PA B
AMES 1-23A4 723 |010S [040W (4301330375 1901 |FEE ow pa T
HORROCKS 1-6A1 06 |010S [010W 4301330390 5675 |FEE oW [PA |
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 [030S [050W |4301330393 [5565 [FEE oW |PA |
GOODRICH 1-18B2 18~ |020S |020W 4301330397 |5485 |FEE “jow PA i
SWD POWELL 3 7713 |010S|020W 4301330478 [10708/FEE WD _PA | |
BODRERO 1-1583 115 |020S |030W 4301330565 [4534 |FEE OW |PA B
MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 ~ 7 /30 |[030S |040W 4301330576 |2360 |FEE OW |PA 7
DUNCAN2:9B5 109 |020S|050W 4301330719 |5440 |FEE Tlow T PA T
FISHER 1-16A4 ~ 116 |010S [040W 4301330737 2410 [FEE ____OW PA |
URRUTY 2-34A2 34 |010S [020W [4301330753 9117 |FEE ow [PA | ]
GOODRICH 1-24A4 ) 24 |010S [040W [4301330760 2415 |FEE ow PA
CARL SMITH 2-25A4 25 |010S|040W 4301330776 9136 |FEE “low  PA |
ANDERSON 1-A30B1 ~ |30 020S [010W |4301330783 [9137 |FEE low A T
CADILLAC 3-6A1 06 |010S 010W 4301330834 6316 [FEE __ |OW  |PA )
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 131 |010S [010W (4301330836 [8439 |FEE ow [PA | ]
[REESE ESTATE 2-1082 10 |020S [020W 4301330837 [2417 FEE oW PA | ]
CLARK 2-9A3 T 09 [010S |030W 4301330876 [2416 |FEE ow [PA ]
JENKINS 3-16A3 16 |010S |030W 4301330877 |9790 |FEE ow PA |
CHRISTENSEN 2-26A5 26 |010S [050W (4301330905 10710 FEE ____|OW  PA |
FORD 2-36A5 T 7 36 |010S |050W [4301330911]9630 |[FEE ow [PA |
MORTENSEN2-32A2 /32 0105 [020W |4301330029 (9486 |FEE oW PA -
WILKERSON 1-20Z1 120 [010N|010W [4301330042 5452 [FEE __ |OW _PA |
UTE TRIBAL24A3S 04 [010S [030W (4301330950 |10230 [FEE ow A |
OBERHANSLY 2-31Z1 31 |010N |010W 4301330970 9262 [FEE oW PA_ |
MORRIS2-7A3 07 [010S [030W (4301330977 9725 [FEE  |OW PA |
POWELL2-08A3 o8 [010S|030W 4301330979 10175 FEE  |OW |PA |
[FISHER 2-6A3 7 oe 0105 [030W [4301330984 [10110 [FEE ow A ||
JACOBSEN2-12A4 " ""42 [010S 040W 4301330985 10480 [FEE  IOW [PA | |
CHENEY 2-33A2 33 |010S |020W 4301331042 10313 [FEE ow [PA
HANSON TRUST 2-20A3 29 [010S|030W [4301331043/5306 [FEE |OW _ PA |
BURTON 2-15B5 15 |020S |050W |4301331044 [10205 [FEE oW [PA
EVANS-UTE 2-17B3 17 |020S |030W [4301331056 (10210 FEE __ |OW _ IPA ]
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 20 020S [040W 4301331090(5336 FEE _ |OW  PA -
REMINGTON 2-34A3 7 134 |010S [030W |4301331091 1902 [FEE __[OW PA |
WINKLER 2-28A3 |28 |010S|030W |4301331108 [4519 |FEE ow PA | ]
TEW 2-10B5 10 0205 |050W |4301331125 1751 FEE _ |OW _ |PA )
LINDSAY 2-33A4 _ ,A, 33 |010S [040W [43013311411756 [FEE _OW |PA_ | ]
FIELDSTED 228A4 28 (0105 [040W [4301331293 (10665 FEE  |[OW |PA | |
POWELL 4-13A2_ 13 [010S [020W |4301331336 | 11177 |FEE GW PA |
DUMP 2-20A3 S 20 [010S [030W [4301331505 | 11691 |FEE oW  [PA
[SMITH 2X-23C7 __ 23 |030S |070W |4301331634 12382)FEE D  PA | |
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 |010S |020W 14301331872 11928 [FEE ow PA |
TODDUSAST12B1 02 |020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE ~~  |OW  [PA

STATE 1-7B1E o7 |020S|010E |4304730180|5566 [FEE _ |ow [PA |
BACON 1-10B1E 10 |020S [010E 14304730881 5550 [FEE  |OW PA | |
PARIETTE DRAW 2844 28 [040S [010E 14304731408 (4537 FEE ow  PA |
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 |020S 010E 4304731840 4960 |FEE ow ~PA | |
STATE 2-35A2 ] 135 010S |020W 4301330156 4715 |ML-22874 _ |OW _ @@M N
UTAH STATE L B 1-11B1 |11 [020S |010W 4304730715530 |ML23655  |OW  [PA B
STATE 1-8A3 |08 0105 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316  [OW  PA
UTAHFEDERAL 12481 124 |020S [010W 4304730220 590 |ML26079  [OW  PA |
CEDAR RIM 15 '34_|030S [0B0W 14301330383 |6395 [14-20-462-1329 [OW 'S

7



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL 2-24C7 — |24 [030S [070W [4301331028 | 10240 |14-20-H62-1135 OW __|S 7
CEDARRIM 12 28 |030S [060W 4301330344 6370 |14-20-H62-1323 [OW  [S
CEDAR RIM 16 " |33 |030S [060W [4301330363 6390 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |S

SPRING HOLLOW 2-3473 34 |010N |030W 4301330234 5255 |14-20-H62-1480 OW | )
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 17 |020S |[030W [4301330274 5335 |14-20-H62-1733[OW S | |
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4G_ o1 |020S [040W [4301331197 | 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW  |S
UTE 3-1283 ) 12 [020S [030W |4301331379 |11490 |14-20-H62-1810 [OW  [S ,
UTETRIBAL94B1 |04 |020S [010W (4301330194 5715 [14-20-H62-1969/OW S | |
UTETRIBAL221B6 |21 [020S [060W 4301331424 11615 |14-20-H62-2489 |OW  |S )
UTE 1-33B6 ) ] "33 |020S [060W [4301330441 1230 |14-20-H62-2493 |OW IS

UTE22285 22 1020S [050W [4301331122 (10453 [14-20-H62-2509 OW S | |
UTE 1-18B1E 118 ]020S |010E |4304730969 [9135 |14-20-H62-2864 OW _ |S ]
LAUREN UTE 123A3 |23 ]010S [030W 4301330895 [9403 |14-20-H62-3981 OW (S _

UTE 2-28B6 T |28 [020S [060W [4301331434 [11624 |14-20-H62-4622 [OW | o
UTE127B6X |27 1020S |060W 4301330517 [11166 |14-20-H62-4631 [OW 'S )
UTE 22786 | 127 [020S |060W 4301331449 11660 |14-20-H62-4631 OW S o
CEDAR RIM 10-15C6 - 15 |030S |060W 4301330328 6365 |14-20-H62-4724 OW  |S |
UTE 5-30A2 ~ |30 |010S 020W 4301330169 [5910 [14-20-H62-4863 [OW  |S B
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) , 24 |030S |060W |4301330298 [4533 |14-20-H624866 OW | | |
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 1307 ]030S |050W |4301330475 |665 | 14-20-H62-4876 [OW  |S

SMB 1-10A2 - 10 |010S |020W |4301330012 |5865 |FEE ow s | ]
KENDALL 1-12A2 - 12 |010S[020W [43013300135875 FEE ___ |OW S T
CEDARRIM 2 B 20 |030S |060W [4301330019 6315 |FEE ow | o
URRUTY29A2 ~ 109 [010S [020W |4301330046 [6856 |FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 14 |020S |040W |4301330051 [1535 |FEE ow s 7
RUST 14B3 ] 04 |020S |030W 4301330063 [1575 [FEE ow [s | ]
MONSEN 1-21A3 21 010S |030W [4301330082 [1590 |FEE oW s 1
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 ) 10 |020S [040W 4301330110 1614 (FEE oW |8 T
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 |020S [050W [4301330124 (1645 |FEE oW [s ]
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 "~ 116 020S [040W [4301330192[1735 [FEE ____ |[OW S

MARSHALL 1-20A3 20 |010S |030W |4301330193 9340 |FEE ow s )
[CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 317 [020S [040W |4301330198 [4745 |FEE ~low s
ROPER 1-14B3 ) 114 |020S[030W 4301330217 (1850 |FEE ow [s | ]
BROTHERSON 1-24B4 - 24 |020S |040W |4301330229 |1865 |[FEE oW S i
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 33 [010S[040W [4301330272([1680 [FEE __ |OW |S
BROTHERSON 1-2384 123 |020S |040W 4301330483 (8423 |FEE ow s~ | ]
SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 08 |030S [050W [4301330543 |5495 |FEE ow s T
VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 19 |030S |050W (4301330553 (5650 |FEE ~jow [s }
HANSEN 1-16B3 16 [020S |030W 4301330617 |9124 |FEE ow s
BROTHERSON 1-25B4 ) 25 |020S [040W 4301330668 9126 |FEE ow "is ]
POWELL2-33A3 - 33 |010S [030W [4301330704 [2400 |FEE ow s | ]
BROWN2-28B5 28 |020S [050W [4301330718 9131 |[FEE OW s ]
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 7716 |o10s1010W [4301330782[8443 FEE __|OW S )
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 |010S [040W |4301330817 [9345 |FEE oW s B
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 |010N [010W [4301330884 [936 |FEE ow s |
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 7127 |010S]040W [4301330915(9632 FEE  |OW S )
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 B |23 [020S |050W |4301330917 [9600 |FEE ow [ )
TIMOTHY 3-18A3 18 |010S [030W 4301330940 (9633 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 103 [020S |040W 4301331008 (10165 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 |020S [040W 4301331086(1782 FEE ___OW 8 |
MILES 2-35A4 135 |010S |040W |4301331087 |1966 |FEE ow 1§ T ]
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 ] |17 020S |040W 4301331089 [1696 |FEE ow s T
RUST 2-36A4 |36 |010S |040W 4301331092[1577 [FEE ____ ow s |
EVANS 2-19B3 19 10205 [030W 4301331113 1777 |FEE ow s N
FARNSWORTH 2-1285 " 112 [020S [050W 4301331115 [1646 |FEE oW [S N
CHRISTENSEN34B4 04 |020S|040W 4301331142 10481 FEE  |OW S
ROBERTSON 229A2 29 1010S [020W [4301331150 | 10679 |FEE low s |
[CEDAR RIM 2A 20 [030S [060W 14301331172 110671 |FEE oW s

8



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31_[010S |030W |4301331243 [ 11026 |FEE SEE —
GOODRICH2-2B3 ] 02 |020S |030W 4301331246 | 11037 |FEE ow s )
JESSEN 2-21A4 21 |010S |040W |4301331256 | 11061 |FEE ~ low s
BROTHERSON 3-23B4 23 |020S [040W |4301331289 [11141 [FEE ow s

MYRIN RANCH 2-18B3 18 |020S |030W |4301331297 [11475 |FEE T low s
BROTHERSON 2-2B5 02 |020S [050W (4301331302 [11342 [FEE ow S ]
DASTRUP 2-30A3 30 |010S [030W (4301331320 [11253 |FEE ow s

YOUNG 2-30B4 30 |020S [040W 4301331366 | 11453 |FEE ow s

IORG 2-10B3 10 |020S |030W [4301331388 [11482 [FEE oW |s

MONSEN 3-27A3 27 |010S [030W 4301331401 |11686 |FEE low s
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 05 |020S [010E 4304732409 11481 FEE T Tlow I8

LARSEN 1-25A1 25 |010S [010W |4304730552 815 | FEE ow [TA

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S |010W 4304730569 820 FEE ow__ [TA




Sundry Number: 28733 APl Well Number: 43013305750000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well GALLOWAY 1-18B1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013305750000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1519 FNL 1565 FEL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 18 Township: 02.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE [ RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: ¥ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION ¥ omher OTHER: IcIBP |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EP plans to set CIBP ~9800' with 10' of cement on top, perforate LGR Approved by the
and acidize. Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: August 08, 2012

By: (\;\b’/\ ‘L D&w&ﬁ('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/8/2012

RECEIVED: Aug. 08, 2012




Sundry Number: 28733 APl Well Number: 43013305750000

Galloway 1-18B1 Summary Procedure

e POOH w/Rods & pump, Release anchor, POOH w/tubing string

e Circulate & Clean wellbore

e RIH with 5”CIBP, set plug at ~9,800’, dump bail 10’ cement on top
e Perforate new LGR interval from ~8,602’ — 9,760’

e Acidize perforations with 60,000 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH w/tubing, pump & rods

e (Clean location and resume production

RECEIVED: Aug. 08, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 40013 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

FORM 9

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
GALLOWAY 1-18B1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013305750000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1519 FNL 1565 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 18 Township: 02.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
v’ ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

While performing routine ops, decided to drill out plugs and acidize
perfs. Please see attached for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

By: (\;\b‘/\ (L DM*«??('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 7/15/2013

RECEI VED: Jul . 15, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 40013 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

Galloway 1-18B1 Plug Drill-Out Procedure Summary

e POOH w/rods and pump

e Release TAC @ 8,779’ & POOH w/ tbg.

e RIH w/ bit & drill on CBP & 9,210’ & CIBP @ 9,900’ w/ 18’ cmt on top.
e Push CBP & CIBP to bottom.

e Acidize existing Wasatch perfs w/ 7,500 gal 15% HCI.

e RIH w/ BHA, tubing, rod string & pump.

e C(Clean location and resume production

RECEI VED: Jul . 15, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
GALLOWAY 1-18B1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013305750000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002

PHONE NUMBER:
713 997-5038 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
BLUEBELL

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

1519 FNL 1565 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 18 Township: 02.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
DUCHESNE

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

'U‘( ACIDIZE

l:‘ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

l:‘ ALTER CASING

l:‘ NOTICE OF INTENT

- . I:‘ CHANGE TUBING
Approximate date work will start:

l:‘ CHANGE WELL STATUS l:‘ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

J SUBSEQUENT REPORT

Date of Work Completion: l:‘ DEEPEN l:‘ FRACTURE TREAT

l:‘ OPERATOR CHANGE l:‘ PLUG AND ABANDON

1 spub rerorT [ propucTion START OR RESUME L recLamaTiON OF WELL SITE

Date of Spud:

J REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION l:‘ SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
l:‘ TUBING REPAIR l:‘ VENT OR FLARE

l:‘ DRILLING REPORT

Report Date: l:‘ SI TA STATUS EXTENSION

l:‘ OTHER

l:‘ WATER SHUTOFF

l:‘ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION

|:| CASING REPAIR

D CHANGE WELL NAME

(]
(]
O
(]
(]

D WATER DISPOSAL

CONVERT WELL TYPE

NEW CONSTRUCTION

PLUG BACK

RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

TEMPORARY ABANDON

|:| APD EXTENSION

OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EP recompleted and acidized well. This work was permitted with two

sundry notices. 25,000 gals of acid on 9,296’ — 9,760’ and left it under

a plug at 9,210’ and not produced. We came up hole and put 15,000
gals of acid on 8,953’ — 9,190’ and tried to produce. It wasn’'t good so
we came back out, took the plug out at 9,210’ and also the plug at
9,900'. Acidized entire wellbore again with 15500 gals of acid.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

August 30, 2013

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)
Maria S. Gomez

PHONE NUMBER
713 997-5038

TITLE

Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
N/A

DATE
8/1/2013

RECEI VED: Aug. 01, 2013




Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
GALLOWAY 1-18B1
GALLOWAY 1-18B1

RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Aug. 01, 2013



Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000
CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
11 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well GALLOWAY 1-18B1
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site GALLOWAY 1-18B1
Rig Name/No. PEAK/700 Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start Date 4/16/2013 End Date 7/127/2013
Spud Date/Time 6/2/1981 uwi 018-002-S 001-W 30
Active Datum KB @5,167.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 160924/48171 / GALLOWAY 1-18 B1
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
4/17/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON ROADING
RIG IN SLICK CONDITIONS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.
7:30 10:30 3.00 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG FROM EL PASO 3-21B4 TO LOCATION. PULL TEST
DEAD MEN. RU RIG. REMOVE HORSE HEAD.
10:30 15:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 18 P WORK PUMP OFF SEAT WHILE PUMPING 2% KCL WTR DOWN
CSG
15:30 16:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSH RODS W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR
16:30 16:09 PRDHEQ 06 P TOOH W/ 106 1" RODS & 114 7/8" RODS. SDFN
4/18/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PULLING
RODS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ REMAINING 7/8", 3/4" & 1" RODS. LD PUMP.
9:00 10:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 16 P ND WELLHEAD. PU ON TBG TO 110,000K. COULD NOT PULL
TBG HANGER FROM TBG HEAD.
10:00 10:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 42 P CALL FOR & WAIT ON JARS
10:30 12:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P MU JAR & INTENSIFIER. JAR TBG HANGER FREE. NU BOP
12:00 19:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE TAC. RU SCANNING EQUIPMENT. TOOH W/ 159 JTS
2-7/8"EUE TBG, 102 GOOD & 57 BAD ( MOSTLY DUE TO
CORROSION). SDFN
4/19/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SCANNING
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CALIBRATE SCANNING EQUIPMENT. CONTINUE SCANNING TBG
OUT OF HOLE, FLUSHING & LAYING DOWN TBG AS NEEDED
10:30 15:00 4.50 WLWORK = 27 P RU PIONEER WIRELINE UNIT. RIH W/ GUAGE RING TO 9950'.
POOH. RIH W/ CIBP & SET @ 9900' WLM.POOH. DUMP BAIL 10'
CMT ON CIBP. POOH & RD WIRELINE UNIT.
15:00 19:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ PKR FOR 5"18# CSG, X-OVER, 5 JTS IJ NULOC TBG,
X-OVER, 138 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG FROM DERRICK & PU 148 JTS
OFF CAT WALK (138 FROM WELL & 146 NEW). SET PKR @
9269'. SDFN
4/20/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PRESSURE
TESTING CSG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

August 01, 2013 at 3:59 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Aug. 01, 2013




Sundry Nunber :

40679 API

Vel |

Nunber :

43013305750000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date

Time
Start-End

Duratio
n
(hr)

Phase

Activit
y

Sub

OP
Code

MD From
(ft)

Operation

4/21/2013

4/22/2013
4/23/2013

4/24/2013

4/25/2013

7:30 14:30

14:30 19:00

6:00 7:30

7:30 19:00

6:00 6:00
6:00 7:30

7:30 11:00

11:00 14:00

14:00 17:00
17:00 20:00

11:00 12:30

12:30 14:00

14:00 19:30

19:30 21:00

6:00 7:30

7:30 13:30

13:30 17:30

7.00

4.50

1.50

11.50

24.00
1.50

3.50

3.00

3.00
3.00

1.50

1.50

5.50

1.50

1.50

6.00

4.00

WBP

PRDHEQ

WBP

WBP

WBP
STGO1

STGO1

STGO1

STGO1
STGO1

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

STGO1

STGO1

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

18

24

28

18

18
28

21

24

54
24

28

24

42

35

28

18

39

FILL TBG W/ 50 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. PRESSURE TEST LINER TO
1000 PSI. LOST ALL PRESSURE IN 5 MINUTES.PRESSURE UP ON
TBG 5 TIMES. UNABLE TO GET A GOOD TEST. FILL CSG W/ 285
BBLS 2% KCL WTR. PRESSURE TEST CSG TO 1000 PSI. LOST
100 PSI IN 5 MINUTES. RELEASE PKR & LD 4 JTS TBG.
CIRCULATE GAS & OIL FROM WELL BORE. PRESSURE TEST
7-5/8" CSG & LINER TO 1000 PSI. TESTED GOOD.

POOH W/ 285 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 5 JTS 2-7/8" NU

LOC TBG, X-OVER & PKR. SDFN

TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WIRELINE
SAFETY. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.

RU WIRELINE UNIT. RIH W/ CBL TOOL TO 265'. SET DOWN ON
OIL. POOH W/ CBL TOOL. RIH W/ 30 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG.
CIRCULATE OIL FROM WELLBORE W/ 85 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.
POOH W/ 30 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. RIH W/ CBL TOOL & TAG CMT
@ 9882". RUN CBL/CCL/GR LOG FROM 9882' TO 7400'. POOH

W/ CBL TOOL. RIH W/ 56 ARM CALIPER TOOL. RUN CALIPER
LOG FRON 9882' TO SURFACE. RD WIRELINE TRUCK. SDFN
SHUT DOWN FOR SUNDAY

TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOILD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP
PERFORATING GUNS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.

RU WIRELINE TRUCK. MADE 2 PERFORATING RUNS,
PERFORATING FROM 9296' TO 9760'. RD WIRELINE TRUCK.
TALLY & TIH W/ PKR FOR 5" 18# CSG, X-OVER, 3 JTS 2-7/8" NU
LOC TBG, X-OVER & 90 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG.

REPAIR DRIVE LINE & HYDROMATIC TANK

CONTINUE PICKING UP TBG. PICKED UP 139 MORE JTS, 229 TTL.
SDFN

TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

PU 63 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG. SET PKR @ 9270'. PRESSURE TEST
ANNULUS TO 1000 PSI FOR 10 MINUTES. TESTED GOOD.

RU PLATINUM PUMP EQUIPMENT & WAIT ON BALL DROPPER &
RESPERATER

PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 9000 PSI. BREAK DOWN STAGE 1
PERFORATIONS 9296' TO 9760' @ 4500 PSI. START PUMPING
ACID. STARTED SEEING COMMUNICATION BETWEEN TBG &
CSG. PUMPED 94 BBLS THEN FLUSHED TO BOTTOM PERF.
BLEED PRESSURE OFF WELL SDFN

TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PRESSURE
TESTING. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

SICP 1200 PSI. SITP 1100 PSI. BLEED PRESSURE OFF WELL.
RELEASE PKR @ 9270'. UNABLE TO MOVE PRK DOWN HOLE.
PULL PKR UPHOLE TO 9245'. ATTEMPT TO MOVE PKR DOWN
HOLE TO 9291'. TAG LINER TOP @ 9262' SLM. UNABLE TO
WORK PKR THROUGH LINER. REVERSE CIRCULATE WELL W/
150 BBLS 2% KCL WTR. WORK PKR THROUGH LINER TOP TO
9291' & SET PKR. PRESSURE TEST ANNULUS TO 1000 PSI. SAW
COMUNICATION BETWEEN ANNULUS & TBG. RELEASE PKR.
POOH ABOVE LINER TOP. ATTEMPT TO RIH & SET PKER @ 9259'
SLM. UNABLE TO GET IN LINER TOP.

TOOH W/ 295 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG, X-OVER, 3 JTS 2-7/8" NU

LOC TBG, X-OVER & PKR. PU PKR FOR 7-5/8" 29.4# CSG.
UNABLE TO GET PKR THROUGH TBG HEAD.
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Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
17:30  20:00 2.50 PRDHEQ @ 47 P ND BOP & SPOOL. DRAG BLOCKS ON PKR WERE HITTING
6-13/16" OD HANGER PROFILE. NU BOP & SPOOL. BREAK OUT
PKR. SDFN
4/27/2013  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 80 BBLS
8:30 13:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TOOH W/ 264-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. TBG PARTED LEFT
21-JTS AND PKR DOWN HOLE
13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 42 N WAIT ON OVERSHOT AND GRAPPLE
15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 N RIH W/ 5 3/4 OVERSHOT W/ 4 1/8 GRPPLE AND 200-JTS 3 1/2
TBG EOT @6364' SECURED WELL SDFN.
4/28/2013 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 N CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING
FILLED OUT JSA.
7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 N CONTINUE RIH W/ 73-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. LATCHED ONTO
FISH TOP PULLED OVER 10 K. TOOH W/ 273-JTS 3 1/2
OVERSHOT, 21-JTS 3 1/2, X-OVER AND PKR
13:00 14:30 1.50 STG02 42 P WAIT ON WIRELINE
14:30 19:00 4.50 STG02 21 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. MADE 3 PERFORATING RUNS HAD 1
MISFIRE,SET CBP @ 921 PERFORATING FROM 9190' TO 8953'.
STARTING PRESSUE 1000 PSI ENDING PRESSURE 850. RD
WIRELINE TRUCK. SDFN
4/29/2013  6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY
4/30/2013  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
HYDROTESTING TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW
7:30 10:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RU HYDROTEST UNIT
10:00  20:00 10.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH W/ 7-5/8" PKR, X-OVER & 268 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG, TESTING
ALL TBG TO 8500 PSI. SDFN
5/1/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SETTING
PKR. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUE
5/2/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RELEASING
PKR. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 18 P RELEASE PKR. REVERSE CIRCULATE WELL W/ 100 BBLS 2%
KCL WTR. RD FRAC EQUIPMENT & MOVE PIPE RACKS INTO
POSITION. FLUSH TBG W/ 75 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.
13:00 19:00 6.00 PRDHEQ 24 P POOH LAYING DOWN 86 JTS 3-1/2"EUE TBG, FLUSHING 30 JTS
TO KEEP TBG CLEAN. SDFN
5/3/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 POST 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING
DOWN TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P PUMP 60 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN TBG
9:00 13:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 24 P LD 199 JTS 3-1/2" EUE TBG, FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED
13:00 14:00 1.00 INARTLT 18 P CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER TO RIH W/ 2-7/8"EUE TBG.
14:00  21:00 7.00 INARTLT 39 P TIH W/ NO/GO, SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, 4-1/2"0D
PBGA, 2' X 2-7/8"EUE PUP JT, SEAT NIPPLE, 6' X 2-7/8"EUE TBG
& 30 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG. FLUSH TBG W/ 10 BBLS 2% KCL.
POOH W/ 30 JTS 2-7/8" EUE TBG. RU HYDRO TESTER. TIH W/
PROD BHA, 4 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG, TAC & 133 JTS 2-7/8"EUE
TBG, HYDROTESTING ALL TBG ABOVE SEAT NIPPLE TO 8500
PSI. RD HYDROTESTER. SDFN
5/4/2013 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PICKING UP
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 13:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 24 P CONTINUE TIH, PICKING UP 189 JTS 2-7/8"EUE TBG
13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P SETTAC @ 10312', SN @ 10451' & EOT @ 10555'. ND BOP. NU
WELLHEAD.
15:00 16:00 1.00 INARTLT 06 P FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL WTR.
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Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
16:00  19:30 3.50 INARTLT 39 P LD 24 1" RODS FROM DERRICK. TIH W/ 2-1/2" X 1-1/2" RHBC
ROD PUMP, 6 WEIGHT RODS, 131 (11 new) 3/4" RODS, 115 (1
new) 7/8" RODS & 102 1" RODS. SPACE OUT W/ 2" X 1" [PONY
ROD & POLISH ROD.
19:30 12:27 INARTLT 18 P STROKE TEST PUMP TO 1000 PSI. TESTED GOOD. RU PUMPING
UNIT. HANG HORSE HEAD & ROD STRING. PWOP
7/16/2013 | 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA TOPIC (MOVING RIG)
7:00 8:00 1.00 MIRU 01 P ROAD RIG FROM 1-1B4 TO 1-18B1
8:00 10:30 2.50 MIRU 01 P MIRU, PUMP 60 BBLS HOT 2% DOWN CSG, L/D HORSE HEAD,
FLOW DOWN TBG
10:30  12:00 1.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P ATTEMPT TO UNSEAT PUMP, FAILED, RODS PARTED, HOT OILER
WAS PUMPING DWN CSG.
12:00  15:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 101-1", 115- 7/8", 131- 3/4", L/D 6- 1 1/2" K-BARS &
TOP OF PULL ROD, R/D PUMPING UNIT, X O TO TBG EQUIP
15:00  16:00 1.00 WLWORK = 21 P R/U PERFORATORS, RIH PERFORATE TBG @ 8840’ - 8841, TBG
WENT ON VACUUM, POOH R/D PERFORATORS
16:00  18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P N/D B-FLANGE, N/U 3' 5 K SPOOL & BOP, R/U FLOOR & TONGS,
RELEASE 7 5/8" TAC @ 8779', SECURE WELL, SDFD
7/17/2013 | 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA (TOPIC) TRIPPING
PIPE.
7:00 12:30 5.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P POOH W/ 275 JTS 2 7/8", 7 5/8" TAC, 2 JTS, L/D JT W/ PERF
HOLES, L/D BHA, PUMP WAS STUCK IN BOTTOM JT, MUD JTS
FULL OF MUD
12:30  18:00 5.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P P/U 6 3/4" BIT, BIT SUB, 4-3/8" COLLAR, X O SUB, TO 2 7/8", RIH
TALLEY TBG W/285- JTS 2 7/8", TAG FILL @ 9185', L/D 1 JT,
R/U POWER SWIVEL, SECURE WELL SDFD
7/18/2013  6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC POWER
SWIVEL)
7:00 12:00 5.00 PRDHEQ = 39 P R/U PUMP, BREAK CIRCULATION W/ 287 BBLS, PUMPING DOWN
CSG UP TBG, TAG FILL @ 9184', CLEAN OUT TO 7 5/8" CBP,
DRILL UP PLUG, CHASE REMAINS OF CBP TO LINER TOP @
9262, DRILL ON PLUG, CIRC CLEAN
12:00  16:30 4.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P R/D POWER SWIVEL, L/D 10 WORK JTS, 2 7/8", POOH W/ 376
JTS 27/8" X O SUB, 4-3 1/8" DRILL COLLARS, BIT SUB & 6 3/4"
BIT, CHANGE OUT BIT TO 4 1/8"
16:30  19:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 4 1/8" BIT, BIT SUB, 4- 3 1/8" COLLARS, X O SUB TO 2
3/8", P/U 102 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS, X O
TO 2 3/8" X 2 7/8", RIH W/ 2 JTS 2 7/8", SECURE WELL, SDFD,
EOT 3431’
7/19/2013 | 6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL, HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA (TOPIC) TRAP
PRESSURE
7:00 9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P WELL ON VACUUM, RIH W/ 184 JTS 2 7/8', TAG PLUG @ LINER
TOP 9262', RIU POWER SWIVEL,
9:30 13:00 3.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P BREAK CIRC W/ 123 BBLS OF 2%, FINISH DRILLING UP REMAINS
OF 7 5/8" CBP, FALL THROUGH LINER TOP, CIRC CLEAN, R/D
SWIVEL,
13:00  19:00 6.00 PRDHEQ = 39 P RIH W/ 12 JTS 2 7/8", TAG SCALE & REMAINS OF CBP @ 9660/,
R/U SWIVEL, BREAK CIRC, CLEAN OUT SCALE TO 9773', CIRC
CLEAN, POOH W/ 17 JTS 2 7/8", SECURE WELL, EOT 9220'
SDFD
7/20/2013 | 6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC) SLIPS,TRIPS
& FALLS
7:00 9:00 2.00 PRDHEQ @ 39 P RIH W/ 17 JTS 2 7/8" TAG SCALE @ 9773 R/U POWER SWIVEL
BREAK CIRC. W/ 71BBLS
9:00 13:00 4.00 POST 18 N AIR COMPRESSOR WENT OUT ON RIG, CHANGE OUT

COMPRESSOR
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Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OoP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
13:00 18:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FINISH CLEAN OUT SCALE FROM 9773' TO 5" CIBP @ 9900,

DRILL UP PLUG LOST CIRC 1/2 WAY THROUGH PLUG,
CANNOT GET CIRC BACK, PUMP 2 BPM DOWN CSG, FINISH
DRILLING UP PLUG, SWIVEL DOWN 3 MORE JTS, L/D WORK
JTS, POOH 16 JTS 2 7/8", SECURE WELL, EOT; 9290' SDFD.

7/21/2013 6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC ) OVER
HEAD LOADS
7:00 8:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TBG & CSG ON VACUUM RIH W/ 90 JTS 2 7/8" TBG TAG FILL @
12265' P/U SWIVEL WILL NOT CIRCULATE, RACK OUT SWIVEL
8:30 15:00 6.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 278 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, 2 7/8" X 2 3/8" X-O 24 JTS 2 3/8"
TBG L/D 78 JTS 2 3/8" X-O SUB, 4-3 1/8"COLLARS, BIT SUB, 4
1/8" BIT
15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 5" PACKER, RIH W/ 24 JTS 2 3/8",2 3/8" X 2 7/8" X O, 194
JTS 2 7/8" TBG, SECURE WELL, EOT 6862', SDFW
7/22/2013 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P SHUT DOWN FOR SUNDAY
7/23/2013 6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC ) PUMPING
ACID
7:00 9:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TBG & CSG ON VACUUM FINISH RIH W/ 94 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, SET
5" PKR @ 9907'
9:00 9:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P R/U HOTOILER MIXED 25 GALS SCALE INHIBITER W/ 35 BBLS 2
% KCL PUMP DOWN TBG R/D HOTOILER
9:30 11:30 2.00 STGO1 35 P MIRU PLATINUM PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 9000 PSI MIXED

ADDITIVES TO ACID PUMP 3500 GALS ACID DROP 500
BIO-BALLS PUMP 3500 GALS ACID FLUSH 108 BBLS 2% ISIP
2150 PSI 5 MINS 652 PSI 10 MINS 0 PSI R/D PLATINUM

11:30 16:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RELEASE 5" PKR @ 9907' POOH W/ 287 JTS 2 7/8" XO TO 2 3/8"
24 JTS 2 3/8" & 5" PKR

16:00 18:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 5" RBP RIH W/ 24 JTS 2 3/8" TBG XO TO 2 7/8" 202 JTS 2
7/8" TBG SECURE WELL, EOT @ 7124', SDFD

7/24/2013 6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ( TOPIC ) GAS

VAPORS

7:00 8:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P FINISH RIH W/ 92 JTS 2 7/8" TBG SET 5" PLUG @ 9800’

8:30 12:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 288 JTS 2 7/8" TBG X-O TO 2 3/8" 24 JTS 2 3/8" TBG
& L/D ON/OFF TOOL

12:00 15:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 7 5/8" PKR RIH W/ 284 JTS 2 7/8" TBG SET 7 5/8" PKR @
8926'

15:00 16:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FILL CSG W/ 263 BBLS , PRESS TEST TO 1000 PSI FOR 5 MIN,
GOOD TEST

16:00 16:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P R/U HOTOILER PUMP 25 GAL. SCALE INHIBITOR, MIXED W/ 40
BBLS 2% KCL.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P R/U PLATINUM, REVIEW JSA, PRESSURE TEST TO 9000 PSI,

PUMP STAGE 2 OF ACID, 7500 GALS OF ACID, 2ND 1/2 OF JOB
DROP 100 BIO-BALLS, SHUT IN TBG, R/D PLATINUM, ISIP WAS
2497 PSI, 5 MIN. 2275 PSI, 10 MIN 2107 PSI, 15 MIN. 1921 PS]I,

18:00 19:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P R/U LINE TO FLOW BACK TANK, OPENING PRESSURE 1350 PSI,
OPEN ON 18 CHOKE, MADE 15 BBLS & STOPPED FLOWING.,
SECURE WELL, SDFD.

7/25/2013 6:00 7:00 1.00 POST 18 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA (TOPIC) CONFINED
SPACE
7:00 11:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P SITP 0, RELEASE 7 5/8" PKR, POOH W/ 286 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, L/D
PKR, CHANGE OVER HANDLING TOOLS
11:00 14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U ON/ OFF TOOL RIH W/ 24 JTS 2 3/8" TBG XO TO 2 7/8" 288
JTS 2 7/8" TBG LATCH ON RELEASE 5" PLUG
14:00 14:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS HOT 2%
14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 288 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, X O TO 2 3/8", 24 JTS 2 3/8", L/D
ON/OFF TOOL & 5" PLUG, SECURE WELL, SDFD
August 01, 2013 at 3:59 pm 5 OpenWells
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Sundry Nunber: 40679 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7/26/2013 | 6:00 7:00 1.00 INSTUB 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( NIPPLING DOWN BOP AND

RIGGING UP PUMPING UNIT) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:00 11:30 4.50 INSTUB 39 P PICK UP 2 3/8" BULL PLUG, 2 JOINTS 2 3/8" TUBING, 2
3/8 X 2 7/8" EUE XOVER, 3 1/2" PBGA, 2 3/8" X 2' EUE SUB, 2
3/8" PLUS 45 SEAT NIPPLE, 2 3/8" X 6' TUBING SUB, 4 JOINTS 2
3/8" TUBING, 5" TAC, 16 JOINTS 2 3/8" TUBING, 2 3/8" X 2 7/8"
XOVER, CHANGE OVER TO RUN 2 7/8" TUBING AND TIH WITH
289 JOINTS 2 7.8" TUBING. ATTEMPT TO SET TAC @ 9727' WITH
NO SUCCESS. LAY DOWN 1 JOINT AND SET TAC @ 9695' WITH
S/N @ 9831' AND EOT @ 9926' ANCHOR SET IN 25 K TENSION

11:30 13:00 1.50 INSTUB 16 P RIG DOWN FLOOR, N/D BOP AND NIPPLE UP B FLANGE. AND
FLOWLINE

13:00 14:00 1.00 INARTLT 18 P FLUSH TUBING WITH 60 BBLS 2% KCL WHILE CHANGING OVER
TO RUN RODS

14:00 17:30 3.50 INARTLT 03 P PICK UP 21' DIPTUBE AND 2" X 1 1/2" X 28' RHBC ROD PUMP
AND TIH WITH 10- 1 1/2" KBARS, 20 3/4' RODS WITH S/H
GUIDES, 9 3/4' W/G, 131-3/4" RODS, 117-7/8" SLK RODS, 101-1"
RODS, SPACE OUT PUMP WITH 1-4' AND 1-2' X 1" ROD SUB.
PICK UP ROD PUMP AND SEAT PUMP @ 9381'

17:30 18:00 0.50 INARTLT 18 P FILL TUBING WITH 25 BBLS 2% KCL AND TEST TO 1000 PSI.
TEST GOOD. PUMP 20 BBLS 2% U FLOW LINE

18:00  20:00 2.00 INARTLT 18 P RIG UP PUMPING UNIT AND HANG RODS OFF. PUT WELL ON

PRODUCTION

August 01, 2013 at 3:59 pm
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Sundry Nunber: 65416 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well GALLOWAY 1-18B1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013305750000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1519 FNL 1565 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 18 Township: 02.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v" SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: IDownsize & Deepen

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Downsized & deepened. See attached for details. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
August 26, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE
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Sundry Nunber: 65416 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
GALLOWAY 1-18B1
GALLOWAY 1-18B1

WORKOVER LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Aug. 12, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 65416 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

CENTRAL DIVISION
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company CENTRAL DIVISION
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well GALLOWAY 1-18B1
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site GALLOWAY 1-18B1
Rig Name/No. NABORS DRILLING/1446 Event WORKOVER LAND
Start date 6/25/2015 End date 7/3/2015
Spud Date/Time 6/2/1981 uwi 018-002-S 001-W 30
Active datum KB @5,167.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe PENDING 6/25/15 /
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
6/26/2015 11:30 13:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ROAD RIG 2-15B2 TO 1-18B1, TEST ANCHORS, LOCK & CHAIN
OFF PUMPING UNIT, MIRU
13:30 14:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 42 P P/U RODS, DID NOT SEE PUMP UNSEAT, TRY FLUSH RODS,
PRESSURE UP, BLED OFF PRESSURE
14:30 17:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 42 P POOH W/ 104-1", 117-7/8", 160-3/4", L/D 10 K-BARS & PUMP
PULL ROD, SECURE WELL, SDFD.
6/27/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 46 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ON PERFORATING
7:00 11:30 4.50 ELINE 21 P R/U THE PERFORATORS, RIH TO PERF TBG, STACK OUT IN WAX

@ 3618, GOT TWO HOTOILERS PUMPING HOT 2% DOWN 7"
CSG W/ 365 BLS , FELL THROUGH WAX @ 6579, CONTINUE IN
HOLE TO 9775', PERF TBG W/ 4 SHOTS, FLUSH TBG W/ 40
BBLS WHILE POOH, R/D WIRE LINERS

11:30 13:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P X-O TO TBG EQUIPMENT, R/D PUMPING UNIT, N/D 5K B-FLANGE,
N/U 5K BOPS, R/U WORK FLOOR & TBG TONGS RELEASE 5"
TAC @ 9714'

13:00 16:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 18 P POOH W/ 288 JTS 2 7/8",27/8" X 2 3/8" X-0,16 JTS 2 3/8", 5"
TAC, 4 JTS 2 3/8", L/D & CLEAN BHA

16:00 18:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 18 P M/U BHA, INSTALL 21' DIP TUBE IN PBGA, P/U 2 3/8" BULL PLUG,

2JTS23/8",23/8"X27/8" X-0, 3 1/2" PBGA, 2' X 2 3/8" SUB, 2
3/8" PSN, 4' X 2 3/8" SUB, RIH W/ BHA & 4 JTS 2 3/8", 5" WTRD
TAC, 16 JTS, P/U 53 NEW JTS 2 3/8", X-O TO 2 7/8", RUN 6 JTS 2
7/8', EOT @ 2487', SECURE WELL, SDFW

6/28/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY, SDFW
6/29/2015 6:00 6:00 24.00 PRDHEQ 18 P NO ACTIVITY, SDFW
6/30/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ON TRIPPING TUBING
7:00 10:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P BLED OFF WELL, CONTINUE RIH TALLEY TBG W/ 160 JTS 2 7/8"
TO 8903' 50' ABOVE TOP PERF.
July 14, 2015 at 1:51 pm 1 OpenWells
RECEI VED: Aug. 12, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 65416 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000

CENTRAL DIVISION

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
10:00 18:00 8.00 PRDHEQ 18 P R/U HOT OILERS TO TBG, UNLOAD & MIX CHEMICALS, PUMP

PRE FLUSH, 660 GALS WLC603, 5 GALS SCW2600 W/ 52 BBLS
2% KCL, PUMP MAIN PILL 110 GALS SCW2600 W/ 52 BBLS 2%
KCL, OVER FLUSH W/ 250 BBLS 2%, PUMP 2nd INHIBITOR PILL
55 GALS OF SCW 2600 W/ 25 BBLS 2%, OVER FLUSH W/ 237
BBLS 2%, PUMP 3rd INHIBITOR PILL 55 GALS SCW2600 W/ 25
BBLS 2%, OVER FLUSH W/ 255 BBLS 2% KCL, R/D HOT
OILERS, PUMPED SQUEEZE @ 2 BPM @ O PSI, SECURE WELL,

SDFD.
7/1/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ON BOP EQUIPMENT

7:00 8:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P WELL ON VACUUM, RIH W/ 80 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, SET 5" TAC IN
22K TENSION @ 11,343

8:00 9:15 1.25 PRDHEQ 16 P R/D WORK FLOOR, N/D 5K BOPS, N/U 5K B-FLANGE & FLOW
LINES, X-O TO ROD EQUIPMENT

9:15 10:00 0.75 PRDHEQ 05 P R/U HOT OILER, FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL & 10 GALS
CORR CHEM

10:00 14:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U & PRIME 2" X 1 1/2" X 28' PUMP, RIH W/ PUMP, 12 WEIGHT

BARS, 20-3/4" SHG, P/U 56 NEW 3/4" SHG, RUN OUT DERRICK
W/ 140-3/4" RODS, 117-7/8", P/U 9 NEW 7/8", RUN 104-1" RODS,
SPACE OUT W/ 2-2', 1-8' SUBS, P/U NEW 1 1/2" X 30" POL. ROD
W/ 1 3/4" X 20' LINER SEAT PUMP @ 11,473'

14:00 16:45 2.75 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL TBG W/ 35 BBLS 2% KCL, PRESSURE TEST TO 500 PSI,
TRY STROKE TEST PUMP IT WOULD PULL OFF SEAT, GOT PUMP
TO SEAT TRY TO STROKE TEST , THE PLUNGER STUCK WAS
UNABLE TO UNSEAT PUMP.

16:45 18:00 1.25 PRDHEQ 39 P R/U TBG TONGS, BACK OFF RODS, STRING WEIGHT IS 18,000

LBS, SOOH W/ 99-1", SECURE WELL, SDFD
7/2/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ON STAIRWAYS,

LADDERS & PLATFORMS

7:00 8:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUE POOH W/ 51-1', 129-7/8" & 132-3/4" RODS, X-O TO
TBG EQUIPMENT

8:30 9:45 1.25 PRDHEQ 16 P N/D 5K B-FLANGE, N/U 5K BOPS, R/U WORK FLOOR & TONGS

9:45 17:00 7.25 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH STRIPPING TBG W/ 288 JTS 2 7/8" TO RODS, BACK OFF

RODS AT PUMP, CONTINUE POOH STRIP RODS & TBG, W/
88-3/4" & 10 K-BARS, 67 JTS 2 3/8", 5" TAC, 4 JTS 2 3/8", LID
BHA, 4' SUB, PSN, 2' SUB, 3 1/2" PBGA, 2 JTS 2 3/8" & BULL
PLUG, THE PBGA & BOTTOM 2 JTS WERE FULL OF MUD,
SECURE WELL, SDFD.

7/3/2015 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HSM WRITE & REVIEW JSA ON HAND
PLACEMENT
7:00 8:45 1.75 WLWORK 32 P R/U DELSCO, RIH TAGGED FILL @ 12,152', POOH, R/D DELSCO,

CLEAN OUT TO 12,265 ON ( 7-13 ), THERE ISA CIBP @ 12,525
W/ 10' CEMENT.

8:45 11:00 2.25 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U BHA, RIH W/ 2 3/8" BULL PLUG, 2 JTS 2 7/8", 3 1/2" PBGA, 2'
X 23/8"SUB, 2 3/8" PSN, 4' X 2 3/8" SUB, 4 JTS 2 3/8", 5" WTRD
TAC, 61 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, 2 3/8" X 2 7/8" X-O, 288 JTS 2 7/8"
TBG, SET 5" TAC IN 24,000 LBS TENSION.

11:00 12:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P R/D WORK FLOOR, N/D 5K BOPS, N/U 5K B-FLANGE & FLOW
LINES, X-O TO ROD EQUIPMENT

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 05 P R/U HOT OILER, FLUSH TBG W/ 60 BBLS 2% KCL & 10 GALS
CORROSION CHEM.

13:30 17:15 3.75 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U & PRIME 2" X 1 1/2" X 28' PUMP W/ 60 RING PA & TOP

SLIDING BRASS VALVE, RIH W/ PUMP & CHECKING ALL
BREAKS, 12 - 1 1/2" K-BARS, 209-3/4", 126-7/8" & 101-1" EL
RODS, SPACE OUT W/ 2-2', 1-8' X 1" SUBS, P/U POLISH ROD
SEAT PUMP @ 11,283'

July 14, 2015 at 1:51 pm 2 ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Aug. 12, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 65416 APl Well Nunber: 43013305750000
CENTRAL DIVISION
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
17:15  20:00 2.75 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL TBG W/ 35 BBLS 2% KCL, P.T. TO 400 PSI, STROKE TEST

PUMP WITH RIG TO 1000 PSI, GOOD TEST, R/U PUMPING UNIT,
HANG OFF HORSE HEAD & RODS, START UNIT, TWOTO, SDFW.

July 14, 2015 at 1:51 pm

ienWeIIs

RECEI VED: Aug. 12, 2015
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CENTRAL DIVISION
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