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Re KB CH
September 5 , 1974 UdBR EXPLORAft0N COMPANY

ONE PARK CENTRAL
SUITE 530
1515 ARAPAHOE STREET
DENVER, COLORADO80202

U.S. Geological Survey
8416 Federal Building
125 South State Street
Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

Attn: Gerald Daniels

Re: Koch's Cedar Rim #12 Well
Section 28-T3S-R6W
Duchesne County, Utah
Ute Tribal Lease
14-20-462-1323

Dear Mr. Daniels:

Attached, in triplicate,is U.S.G.S. Form 9-331C, Application for
Permit to Drill, for a proposed development well in the captioned
section. There is also attached, in triplicate, a location plat
prepared by Uintah Engineering and Land Surveying.

The surface has been patented and is owned by The State of Utah,
Department of Natural Resourcesr Division of Fish and Game. In
the near futute, and prior to drilling activity, we will make
arrangements with the surface owner for entry and use of the
surface. We will also obtain necessary rights-of way for a road
through Section 21.

Koch is operating under a $25,000.00 statewide bond and, also,
under a nationwide Indian Lease Bond on file with the Bureau of
Indian Affairs, Fort Duchesne, Utah.

Attached you will also find our plan of development for'surface
use and the appropriate exhibits pertaining thereto.

Your early attention and approval of our application is appreciated.

Yours very truly,

Robert D. Romek
District Landman

RDR/mwc
Enc1
cc: Bureau of Indian Affairs

Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026

J. A. Ziser

DIVISION OF KOCH INDUSTRIES INC / BOX 2256, WICHITA, KANSAS. 67201 /TELEPHONE



Form 9-331C SUBNIT IN CATE* Form approva
(May 1%3) '

(Other instructions on Budget Bureau No. 42-R.1425.
UNITED STATES re-swe>

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR s. =sa ossssmos 2.2 La o.
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14-20-462- 1323

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK "'" ""'suorn.oa

la. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL il DEEPENO PLUG BACK O """ AGRERMENT NAME

b. TTem oF wsLL
OTT, GAS SINGLE , MULTIPLE 8. FARM OR LEASS NAMEWEI,L WELL OTHER ZONE ZONEi¯¯Nin

or o¥zalion

Koch Exploration Co., a div. of Koch Industries, Inc. "">°

a. «ooarsa orona^2°" 80202 12
1 Park Central, Suite 530, 1515 Arapahoe, Denver Co io. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. C TI OF WELL (Report location clearly and la accordance with any State requirements *}

SW¾ NE¼ Sec. 28-3S-6W 11.s eD., , ORB K.

At proposed prod. zone
Sec - 28 T3S-R6WSame

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICz* 12, COUNTT OR PARISH 13. STATE

9 miles northwest of Duchesn kah nnch one Utah10. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSER* I 16 O. OF ACRES IN LEASE l'i. NO. OF ACRS3 ASSIGNED1.ocarros to sas2,2, 198 0 FNL and to -rars war.t.
PROPERTY OR LEASE I.INE, FT.taiao to nearest arig. ogit uve, u any; 197 3 FEL 64 0 . 0 0 6 4 0 . 0 0

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED OCATION* lik PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTAKY OR CAßLE TOOLS
TO NEtnEST WEf,L, DRILLING C biPLÈT
onorumrox.ontmar.exas.rr· 10,000 |

_ at ru21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. arruom. úWe wdam2witu sr.at•

6,194 GR ¡ February 1, 1975
23.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLS SIZB OF CASING WEIGHT PERFOOT SETTING DEPTil QUANTITTOFCF3fENT

13-3/4 10-3/4 40.5 _ 600 300
8-3/4 7-5/8 26 .4 7, 500 300
6-3/4 5·-1/2 17.0 10,000 220

1. Set new 10-3/4" 40.5# K-55 ST & C csg at 600-800'. Press test csqto 1000 PSI for 30 min. Cement with enough cement to circulate itto surface. WOC 24 hrs.
2. Drill w/water & native mud to approx. 5300'. Mud up w/Gel-Benex type

mud w/enough wt. to control press. thereafter. Set 7-5/8" 26.4# N-80
LT&C & used 7-5/8 J-55 26.4# LT & C 'B' condition (tested to 5500#
before running) csg in 8-3/4" hole at approx. 7500'. Cement csg w/
enough cement to cover the Green River formation. WOC.24 hrs. Press.test csg & BOP's to 3000# before drilling out.

3. 10" 900 series double pipe & blind rams & 10" 900 series Hydril BOP's
will be used . Check BOP ' s each tour & blind rams each trip.

4. Drill 6-3/4" hole to TD, set & cement 5½" 17# N-80 Hydril Flush :

jt new or used 'A' condition csg. WOC 24 hrs. & drill..out.
(SEE REVERSE SIDE)

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new prodtretive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout

revent

Exploration Manager ,, 7/
(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMIT No APPROVAT. DATM

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See InstructionsOn Reverse



5. Well head equipment will consist of 10" 3000# & .
6" 5000# Rector or Shaffer equipment.

6. Mud Program will be as follows:
0-800' Fresh water spud mud 8.8-to 9.5#.
800-5,3-00' Fresh water native mud 8.8 to 9.5#.
5,300'-TD Gel-Benex mud 9.5 to 12.6#.

7. Anticipated BHP at TD, max. of 6600 PSI. No.
abnormal pressures anticipated.

8. Auxillary & BOP equipment on rig as followsi
A. Hydril BOP 10" 900 series.
B. Double Ram BOP.
C. Kill & choke manifold- remote controlled.
D. PVT Mud Sensory equipment.& rate indicator
E. Degasser
F. Rotating drilling head
G. Inside drill pipe BOP
H. Upper & lower Kelly Cocks
I. Well mud logging unit
J. Gas buster
K. Kill valve on rig floor - for stab-in
L. Bulk Barite storage

9. Complete well by displacing mud w/produced water;
run tbg & pkr; press test above liner to 4000#;
perforate pay zones thru tbg; swab test & acidize
necessary.

o



KEY TO SYMBOLS & ABBREVIATIONS

TANKS:
FWT - Fresh Water Tank (Boiler Feed)

WT - Produced Water Tank
PWT - Power Water Tank (Hydraulic Pumps)

TANK ID # - Oil Stock Tank
TANK SYMBOL

"a Type
Size (42 gl bbl)

PUMPS:
PUG - Pumping Unit w/ Gas Engine
PUE - Pumping Unit w/ Electric Motor
TPG - Hydraulic Triplex w/ Gas Engine
TPE - Hydraulic Triplex w/ Electric Motor
ESP - Electric Submersible Pump

PROCESS EQUIPMENT:
VT - Vertical Treater
HT - Horizontal Treater
HS - Horizontal Separator
GB - Gun Barrel Separator
LH - Line Heater
SG - Steam Generator
DP - Drip Pot (Scrubber)
GP - Glycol Pot
VB - Valve Box
LL - Load Line

LINES & METERS:
GSL - Gas Sales Line
GSM - Gas Sales Meter
RGL - Residue Return Gas Line
GRM - Residue Gas Meter

PL - Power Line
CP - Electric Control Panel
DL - Drain Line
EL - Equalizing Line
SL - Steam Line

WDL - Produced Water Disposal Line
PB - Pipeline Bundle (Insulated)

MISCELLANEOUS:
WH - Wellhead
EP - Emergency Pit
FE - Fire Extinguisher
UB - Unused Building
SS - Storage Shed
PP - Power Pole
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Production Tanks
Power Oil Tank
Kobe Triplex Pump
Heater Treater
Line Heater Well Head

Steam Generator



1
4

Location Approx. 150' x 350' Toile Traile

Pipe
Racks

Rig Engines

e - rPumps

Logging Trailer Steel Mud Tanks 2 g

Approx. 150' x



Form 9-3310 SUBMIT LICATE* Form approved.
(May 1%3) (Other instructions ou Budget Bureau No. 42-R1-125.

UNITED STATES reve-s16e>

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND S RI NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14-20-462-- 132-3

APPLKATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUG BAG< .IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEBÔRTalBEN.4MM

la. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL
k¯Ì

DEEPEN O PLUG BAG< O """ ^°""""2 " ""
b. Tyra or «sLL

OTT, , GAS SINGLE , MULTIPLE
. FAKM Og LZASS NAMSWELL 't WELL OTHER 2ONE ZONE

2. NAME OF OPEP.ATOR

Koch Exploration Co., a div. of Koch Industries, Inc. """' "°

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 8 0 2 0 2 12
1 Park Centpal, Suite 530, 1515 Arapahoe, Denver Co io. v2rco as root., om wn.ocar

4. LocATroN or wz ( eport location clearly and in accordance with any State requlrements.*}

pr

puo

ed pr z

neNEk Sec . 28 -3S-6W
s a r

a°ai

Same
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR FO3T OFFICE* 12. COUNTT OR PARISH 13. STAT1:

9 miles northwest-o-f-t>ucTi It h nnchesn I___11tah
10. DisTANew FROM PaoPosso*

g No, or ACRzs IN LEAsa 17. No. OF .tcass assicNeor.oemo.s ro us.,2ss, 198 0 FNL and to oms war.x,
PROPERTY Oil LEASE LTNW, FT.
(Alsotonearestdrlg unitline.ifany) 1973 FEL _ 640.00 640.00

18. DISTANCE PROM PRO ED LOCATION* 19 PROPOSED DEPTH ' 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
To Ngsnest war.L, na No, Co.sbyv-evn
OR Am.IED FOR, ON TES 10 , 0 0 0 Rotarw

1. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Arraot, D.ara wondwtt.t. sr.anT•

6,194 GR February 1, 1975
PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM y

SIZE 07 HOLE SIZB OF CASING WEIGHT PERFOOT SETTING DEPTII QUANTITTOPCEMENT

13-3/4 10-3/4 40.5 600 300
8-3/4 7-5/8 26 .4 7, 500 300
6-3/4 5-1/2 17.0 10,000 220

1. Set new 10-3/4 " 40 . 5# K-55 ST & C csg at 600-800 '
. Press test csgto 1000 PSI for 30 min. Cement with enough cement to circulate it

to surface. WOC 24 hrs.
2. Drill w/water & native mud to approx. 5300 '

. Mud up w/Gel-Benex type
mud w/enough wt. to control press. thereafter. Set 7-5/8" 26.4# N-80
LT&C & used 7-5/8 J-55 26.4# LT & C 'B' condition (tested to.5500#
before running) csg in 8-3/4 " hole at approx. 7500 '

. Cement csg w/
enough cement to cover the Green River formation. WOC 24 hrs. Press.test csg & BOP's to 3000# before drilling out.

3. 10" 900 series double pipe & blind rams & 10" 900 series Hydril' BOP's
will be used. Check BOP's each tour & blind rams each trip.

4. Drill 6-3/4" hole to TD, set & cement 5½" 17# N-80 Hydril Flush
jt new or used 'A' condition csg. WOC 24 hrs. & drill.out.

(SEE REVERSE SIDE)
IN AcovE sPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGR.ut : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present prodûctive zone and propoe•d new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Glye blowout

aras Tr= Exploration Manager

(This space for ederal or State office use

APPROVED By TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPP.OVAL, IF ANY:

*See InstrucionsOn Reverse
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5. Well head equipment will consist of 10" 3000 &
6" 5000# Rector or Shaffer equipment.

6. Mud Program will be as follows:
0-800' Fresh water spud mud 8.8 to 9.5#.
800-5,300' Fresh water native mud 8.8 to 9.5#.
5,300'-TD Gel-Benex mud 9.5 to 12.6#.

7. Anticipated BHP at TD, max. of 6600 PSI. No.
abnormal pressures anticipated.

8. Auxillary & BOP equipment on rig as follows:
A. Hydril BOP 10".900 series. .

B. Double Ram BOP.
C. Kill & choke manifold- remote controlled.
D. PVT Mud Sensory equipment.& rate indicato
E. Degasser
F. Rotating drilling head
G. Inside drill pipe BOP
H. Upper & lower Kelly Cocks
I. Well mud logging unit

c J. Gas buster
.2 K. Kill valve on rig floor - for stab-in

L. Bulk Barite storage
9. Complete well by displacing mud w/produced water;

run tbg & pkr; press test above liner to 4000#;
perforate pay zones thru tbg; swab test & acidize



PROJECT

KOCH EXPLORATIONCQMPANY
Well location,

T3S R6W U.S.B.8 M Located as shown in the SW I/4
* *

, NE 1/4 , Section 28 , T3S, R6W,660
U.S.B.8 M.

79 80 DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

O

1973' Co uted

GEDAR R/M * /2
ELEV. UNGRADED GROUND

CERTIFtcATE

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM

FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY

SUPERVISt0N AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO THË
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF

REGISTERED LAND SÜRVEYÒ¾
REGISTRATION N© 3|37
STATE OF UTAH

WEST
79.8o UINTAH ENGINEERIMG 8t LAND SURVEYING

R 0. BOX Q 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTH
X = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED (STONE) VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SC A LE n i D A TE
AUG. 21, 1974

PARTY
DA DG REFERENCES

GLO Plot
WEATHER

COOL FILE
KOCH
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October 2, 1974
EXPLORATIONCOMPANY

ONE PARK CENTRAL
SUITE 530
1515 ARAPAHOESTREET
DENVER,COLORADO80202

Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil and Gas Conservation
1599 West, North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Koch's Cedar Rim #12 Well
Section 28-T3S-R6W
Duchesne County, Utah
Ute Tribal Lease
14-20-462-1323

Gentlemen:

Attached is a copy of our letter dated September 5, 1974
to the U.S. Geological Survey, together with two copies
of our Application for Permit to Drill, location plat and
Development Plan for Surface use on the abovereferenced well.
Also attached is an amended Exhibt A to our Development Plan
for Surface Use.

Your early approval authorizing us to drill will be
appreciated.

Very truly yours,

Robert D. Romek
District Landman

mwc
Encl

DIVISION OF KOCH INDUSTRIES INC / BOX 2256, WICHITA, KANSAS 67201 /TELEPHONE



RM KBCH
October 2 , 1974 MIIR ¾Ð EXPLORATION COMPANY

ONE PARK CENTRAL
SUITE 530
1515 ARAPAHOESTREET
DENVER. COLORADO 80202

U. S. Geological Survey
8416 Federal Building
125 South State Street
Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

Re: Koch's Cedar Rim #12 Well
Section 28-T3S-R6W
Duchesne County, Utah
Ute Tribal Lease
14-20-462-1323

Gentlemen:

On September 5, 1974, we forwarded to you our Application
for Permit to Drill and our Development Plan for Surface Use for
the abovereferenced proposed well.

As a result of a surface inspection by the State Division of
Wildlife Resources, we have changed the location of the
proposed roads and attached is an amended Exhibit A to our
Development plan.for Surface Use.

Yours very truly,

Ro ert D. Romek
District Landman

mwc
Encl

cc: Bureau of Indian Affairs
Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026

J. A. Ziser

DIVISION OF KOCH INDUSTRIES INC / BOX 2256, WICHITA, KANSAS 67201 /TELEPHONE
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5. Adverse Environze 91 Effects which Cannot La Avai d

1

.ó. Datermination

(This requested action (4ew) (doc.: not) constitute
a :najor Federal action significantly affecting the
environnent in the sense of NE2A, Section 102(2) (c)).
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October 7, 1974

Koch Exploration Company
Suite 530
1515 Arapahoe Street
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Well No. Cedar Rim #12
SEc. 28, T. 3 S, R. 6 W,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order issued
in CaS oe bl yl40d

termine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon
this well, you are horeby requested to immediately notify the following:

PAUL W. BURCHELL - Chief Petroleum Engineer
HOME: 277-2890
OFFICE: 328-5771

Enclosed please find Form OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water sands (aquifers) are encountered during drilling.

Please advise this office as to your drilling contractor, rig number,
and toolpusher, immediately upon spudding-in.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30344.

Very truly yours,

DIVISION OF OIL ô GAS CONSERVATION

CLEON B. FEIGHT
DIRECTOR

CBF:sw
cc: U.S. Geological



O · · e
DEVELOPMENT PLAN FOR SURFACE USE-CEDAR RIM #12

1. Existing Roads: (Exhibit 'A')
Equipment and personnel will use U.S. Highway 40 west

from Duchesne, Utah, approximately 4½ miles. This is a
paved, all-weather highway. The exit from this highway
will be north at approximately the center of the NW¼ Sec.
31-T3S-R5W, where an existing road runs northwest through
sections 25, 24, 23, 22 and to the SW¼NEk Sec. 21 T3S-R6W to
Koch's Gas Plant.

2. Planned Access Roads: (Exhibit 'A')
From the existing road that runs through the S½N½ Sec.

21-T3S-R6W and just east of Koch's Gas Plant, a road will
need to be constructed in a southerly direction following
an existing jeep trail running to the south line of Section 21.
A new road will then be built almost directly south in to the
location.

The road will be in the open and the vegetation is sparce.

3. Location of Existing Wells: (Exhibit 'A')
The proposed well is one mile south of our Cedar Rim # 6

well which is producing.

4. Lateral Roads to Well Location:
There are no lateral roads in to the proposed well location.

See Exhibit 'A'.

5. Location of Tank Battery and Flow Lines: (Exhibit 'B')
It is anticipated that if the well is productive it

will produce oil with a high pour point. The tank battery
will be built as near the well as possible and will
consist of two 500-bbl. power oil tanks and two production
tanks of either 300 or 400 bbl. capacity. There will also
be a steam generator, heater treater, line heater and a Kobe
or National Triplex pump and engine. All flow lines and
lines connected to the vessels will be tested before
insulation. All pits will be fenced immediately. Because

.of the high pour point of the oil there is little danger of
any oil spills getting into drainage systems; however, embankments
will be erected where necessary.

6. Location and Type of Water Supply:
The source of water to be used in the drilling operations

will be from Starvation Reservoir, east of the location
approximately 4 miles by road. Water trucks will be used to
haul the



O · O

7. Waste Disposal:
The Drilling Contractor will furnish a chemical toilet.

Cuttings, metal, wire line, etc. that will not burn will be
either buried or hauled off the location.

8. Location of Camps:
No camps are anticipated.

9. Location of Airstrips:
No airstrips are required.

10. Location Layout: (Exhibit 'C')
We plan to have the rig facing east with the reserve

and burn pits on the north side. The terrain is relatively
flat, with a downward slope to the north, and there does not
appear to be any drainage problem.

11. Plans for Restoration of the Surface:
A minimum amount of the area will be disturbed to build

the location. Upon completion of drilling, the area will be
leveled and the pits either filled or fenced as soon as the
rig is moved. All areas not needed in producing operations
will be seeded with a grass mixture of five pounds crested
wheat grass, five pounds intermediate wheat grass and three
pounds nomad alfalfa to each acre. The planting will be
done in the fall or early winter, when conditions are favorable.

12. General Description of Topography, Vegetation and Other
Aspects of Area:

The area of the location has a gentle downward slope to the
north with Sink Draw to the south. The vegetation is sparce in
an area that has been cleared of all the trees by the Division of
Fish and Game.



i°ã T=L°:.*No.
42-R356.5.

UNITEDSTATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR ^ °""-------- --------

GEOLOGICALSURVEY -- - -·--

LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

ßtate Utah Duchesne Cedar Rim

The followingis a correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producing

wells) for the Treonth of .....Oc e.f...............
.._....., 19 .$..., ........... ..

...---.............-...-..

.dgent's address ..l...f.9.F.6...9.9.9.t.F.9.1.t...9.9.i.t.9...2.4.9...............Cornpany ..

Koch__Ex21ora
_

on o_.
1515 Arapahoe St., Dever, Colo. 80202 ad ÑAAÑ .

Ph 303-623-5266
.4 ent's title Operations Managerone ...................................................- - ..............- - - - - - - - - - - ..... g

Twr. Raxes BAnaEIß OF OII. GRAVITY
CV

W a

SW NE 28 3S 6W 12 Drlg. @481'

Nors.-There were ...................................... runs or sales of oil; .......-.......-...............-............. M. cu. ft. of gas sold;
....................................., runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)

NOTE.-Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in
duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.

Porm 9-329A
(December1WS) U.S. GOVERNMENT PRINTING OFFICE: 1960 0-288.424



Form apyvg.

UNITEDSTATES
Edsedurmu No. 42-R356.5.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR -9-----

GE01.OGicAI.. suRVEY 14-20-462-1323

LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS
ßtate Utah Cong Duchesne A Cedar Rim

The following is a corteet report of operations and production (including drilling and producingwella) for the month of . Noy.emb.e.t...__-., 19..71, Cedar Rim #121 Park Central Suite 530 och Exploration,dgent's address
.-....-..............-........-------------.----------------- Company

Phone .....-.9.03....§9..._Ë.M.$_-.____.......
.._....- .dgent's title --..D tr En neer

SWNE
28 35 6W 12

Clean up and
repair rig after
fire. 7-5/8
set @ 7110.
Depth of hole
7151. Well is
shut in.

Noxx.---There were
........._........_..-..........., runs or sales of oil;

---......-....-....-...-.....-- . M. cu. ft. of gas M•
....................................., runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)Nora.--Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed fa

duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.Form 9-GSGA
(December 19es)

U.S. GOVERNMENT PRINTING OFPTCEt 1986 O-208•424



UNITED STATES
DEPMTTENT OF THE IN Ute

GEot omru saava 14-20-462- 13'

Y, VES MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS
I
V S cha Utah Com Duchesne Fú¾ Cedar Rim

T7va foltouring is a correct report o operadona crà prodadon (ir-cZudica dr3End and nrarwing
December 74 Cedar Rim "12toeMa) for the moth of , 19-,

.dger,t's cidreas .1 Park Central, Suite 530 Company Eyologaþign Co,
1515 Arapahoe St., Denver, Co 80202 cifra
Phor (303) 623-5266

.dgenes d la District Facin er

Gm>a or B cm BLLGE

SíñíE
28 35 6W 12 · 12/31/74

Drlg @ 8561

Nov.-Thers runs or a of oß; ---... M. cm. It, cf
----------

.....-.. runs or saks of gaaoline duTicy the month. (Writo "no" wh --e spoliesb½.)Norz.---Psepo-t on thi., fo is required for esch calendar comth, of the akstos of op-stioma, and muA be filed iduplesta with the superiser by the ôth of the afeceedieg month, u o*M directed by the



g;, gg UNITED STATES sgegxx y Tayagos- Og.,•¶••g fá,DEPART T OF THE INTERIOR· vm. so.> 6- -= a-•====•= -ma a••w. ».

GacLOGICAL. SURVEY 14-20-462- 1323
6. IF INDI.tx, ALLoTrza on TRIan NA.MESUNDRYNOTlŒS AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for pro la to drill or to deep•n or plug baclc to a diferent reservoir. Ute TribeU.se ''APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such propenaLa)
1. 7. UNIT Acassata.yt .Naataort. XX cas

WEr.g, DJ «st.g. OTasa

2. yrsta or oeza.azoa S. r.aan om I.mAsa NausKoch Exploration Company
Cedar Rima. zooassa or omastoa Co 80202 o. war.s so.l Park Central Suite 530 1515 Arapahoe St, Denver, 12

4. r.GC.4TION OF «ELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* IG. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILOCATSee niso spaer 1. belo.)
Cedar RimAt surface

11. sec., T., a., II., om ELK. Axo1980 ' FNL and 1973 ' FEL SWNE noavr.x om mana

28 -3S-7W
14. Pzrtatir No. 15. EtsvATroNs (Show whether or, BT. ca. eta.) 12. cOUNTT OR PARL%¾ 13. STATS .43-013-303 44 GR 6194 Duchesne Utah
16- Check Appoweet. BoxTo indical. Netwo of Notiew,Ry, or Other Dese .

NoTres or r.Non:eTroN To: sensaquays anseer om•

TEST WATER SEGT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHOT-OPP REFAILI.NG WELI.
FRACTCRE TRE.tT 3lCLTIPLE COMPf.ETE FRACTURE TEMATMGMT ALTERING CASEX4
SHoor oa .tCIDIZE ABANDON*

SBOOTING OR ACinismo ABANDOX3tBWT*

Intermediate Casing CREPAIR WELC. CH.tNGE PLANS (Oth r)
(Notz: Report resnits of Inultiple compietion on We11(Other)

-- Completion or Recompletion Report and Lag forts.)
17. DiscRisE raorOSED OR COMPI.ETED OPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertinent detalla, and give pertinent dates, i¤cluding estimated date of startfug anyproposed woric. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locatinas and measured and true vertical deptba for all markers and zones pert1•nent to this work.) *

Drilled 8-3/4 hole to 7151. Ran 7-5/8 casing, 40 jts 29.70#/ft NSO,
1613' and 133 jts 26.40#/ft J55, 5497', to 7110 and cemented with 200
sacks lite and 100 sacks Class "G" cement. Tested BOP to 3000 psi and
Hydril to 1400 psi.OK. Drilled out with 6-3/4 bit.

18. I hereby certit that ' and correct

District Engineer 12/6/74SIGNED - TITLE DATE

(Thia space for Federal or State ottlee use)

APPROVED BY . . .. . TITLE DATECONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson RO¥ern



'11& IITED STATES - sygIT IN IJCE:*
aiNo. 42-R1424.DEPAR , .eNT OF THE INTERIOR Øseilde)str a on re-

5. LEasa DaaleNATION AND saalAL No.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14-20-462. 1323
. IF INDI.tN. ALLOTTER Og TRIBM NAMESUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS

.(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a dlŒerent reservoir. Ute TribeUse "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals.)
1. 7. GNIT AGREE3tSNT NAME

ELY,L
PLL OMR

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S.FARM OR LEASE NAMEKoch Exploration CompanY
Cedar Rima. sooassa or onaaroa Co 8 0 20 2 o. ws,.x. so.1 Park Central Suite 530 1515 Arapahoe St, Denver, 12

4. I.oc,tTroN oF wEt.L (Report location clearly and la accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOK., OR WILDCATa o pace 17 below.)
Cedar Rim

11. szc., T., a., M., on ar.x, ANs19 8 0 ' FNL and 19 7 3 ' FEL SWNE suavar om anna

28 -3S-7W
14. PER>tIT NO. 1õ. ELEVATIONS (Show wltether Dr. RT. ca, eta.) 12. CouNTT om Psalsa 13. STATE43-013-303 44 GR 6194 Duchesne Utah
16· Check Appropriate BoxTo indiegte Notere of Neue., Report, or Other Date

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQURNT RSPORT OP:

TEST W.4TER SECT-OFF PULL OR ALTER C.tSING WATER SHUT-OPP REPAIRING WILL
FRACTCES TREAT ItCLTIPLE CO31Pr.VTE rnACTURE TasATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

[tEPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) Set.ting il TieT .<X
Com lete xx (some: Report results or maiuma commetton on wei(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO3tPLETED OPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give ÑÃnentdates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-nent to this work.) *

Drilled 6-3/4" hole to 9500' 1/10/75. Ran DILL, FDC-CNL, GR-Sonic
and GR Microseismogram logs. Ran 91 jts 5", 18#/ft, N80 Lt&C linerto 9498 with top of liner @ 6879. Cemented with 187 sacks of
BJ lite cement PD 8:30 A.M. 1/14/75. WOC 24 hours and cleaned out
45' of cmt to 6879.

Plan to complete according to attached prognosis. Completion
operations to begin approximately 2/3/75.

18. I hereby certify t th ing e and correct

District Engineer 1/22/75SIGNED TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State olEte use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATECONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse



O O
CEDAR RIM NO. 12
Completion Prognosis

Well Data

TD 9500', 7-5/8 csg @ 7110 (1613', 29.7#/ft, N80 and 5497',
26.4#/ft, J55 on top) 5" 18#/ft, Lt&C, N80 liner, 6879-9498 w/FC @
9471, cmt'd w/187 sx BJ lite circ over top of liner.

Recommended Procedure

1. RUPU and install BOP

2. Close blank rams and test casing to 3000 psi.

3. If casing will not test 3000 psì, PU squeeze packer and isolate
leak and squeeze cmt.

4. If casing test is OK, pu 4-1/8 bit (or next smaller size available)
3-1/8 DC's, and.2-7/8 tbg and clean and drill out to 9471+, top of
F.C.

5. Displace hole with FM. wtr.

6. POH & LD bit & DC's.

7. Run dual string hydraulic pump cavity on 2-7/8 tbg to 7100+ and
drift tbg for hydraulic pump and run 2-3/8 tbg into cavity.

8. RDPU.

9. Run CCL and perf via tbg selected Wasatch intervals.

10. Prod, test and acidize if



um-rmsum
DEPARTMENT GF THE IN Ute

GEO'nmot StlA¥EY 14-20--462- 1,323

LERSR3 MONTHLY REPORT OF DPERATIONS

E a Utah . County Duchesne____ Fidd Cedar Rim

The foEowing is a correc report o opercifona an¿ vrod.ation (ir-cZudin.s drißind on.d nrnr'ming

toe a) for the ruonth of JanuarY
, 19_ 7.5 Cedar Rim y 12

1 Park Central, Suite 530
.

Company K n. E ... r gon Co.

1515 Arapahoe St., Denver, Co 80202 ßigr'A

Pnova (303) 623-5266
.dgent's y a District Fnaipeer

SWNE 1/31/75
28 35 6W 12 -

Waiting on

completion .

Nom.-There were runs or saka of oß; 11. ca. ft.

..
runs or s»Wo of g>oolies duñe3 the recati. (Writa "no" whe-o apollable.)

Non.-P.eport on this fora is ruiuired for esch caleedx comth, egardle-o of the status of operatio--s, acd muu be filed la
dupUcste with the sop-rvisor by the 6th of the weceedia3 month, u-1.ese o•½ directed by the



Budget Bureau No. 42· R7HA.
Approvai expires 12-31-

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR

GEOLOGlCALSURVEY

SSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

State Utah County Duchesne Field Cedar Rim

The following is a correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producing

wella) for the month of FebruaTY 1p_7_5, Cedar Rim #12

.fgent's
addresa....l.-EãLyg._.Cgggg;Q. Sigigg._SES..Company ch, plp ation Co.

1515 Aracahoe St- « Denver Co 80202 g¿aged

Phone (303) 623-5266
.ggent's title

Disbtrict
Engineer

SWNE
28 3S 6W 12 2/28/75

Conducting Compl-
etion Operations

Non.--There were .._...
.................._...... runs or sales of oil; ------------......----.........--.............. M. ca. ft. of gas sold;

,......................-.........-, runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)
Non.-Report on this forna is reqtiired for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in,

duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unlese otherwise directed by the superiisor.

Form s-a29A
Igbeg 1948) tô--2623L- u. s. r.ovranntaf ¥mmttwo ow#ict



Budget Bartsu No. O-R7N.4
Approvel expires 12-31-60-

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR

GEOLOGlCALSURVEY mae iIf a
traseNo. 14-70-467-1373

LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

ßbate Utah County Duchesne Cedar Rim
'

The following is a correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producing

wella) for the month of March
.

1p_75 Cedar Rim #12

.fgents addreas 1 Park Central, Suite 530 Company ch Explora);.ion Co.

15]5 Aracahoe St., Denver Co 80202 ßigned

Phon.e (303) 623-5266
.ggenya title District Engineer

SWNE On prod 3/9/75.
28 3S 6W 12 Completion report

file 3/19/ 75. Will
report prod volumes <

a later report.

Nors.-There were ..........-.._.--._._ runs or sales of oil; ------------..-..-----....---... M. cu. ft. of gar sold;

... ...
. runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)

No-rm.-Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed iä
duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.

(Decernbar 1948) a 33.35



U ITED STATES SUBMIT IN DU
herin-

rr
No.4

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR y o=Zd 5. LEASE DESIGÑATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14-20-462-1323
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBM NA¼BELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONREPORTAND LOG *

.

1a. TYPE OF WELL: o
L L Y Other 7. U T GRE >

ENTbp

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:

EL
OTORK EP-

ogger S. - on mm
2. NAME OF OPERATon Cedar Rim

Koch Exploration Company, a Div of Koch Industries , Ir d. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 8 0 2 0 2 12
1 Park Central, Suite 530 , 1515 Arapahoe , Denver , CO io, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (ECDOff 10CG (On CI€Œrly and in GCC0TdGRCS 10$$¾ Guy S GÉS T€gulfêm6nf8)* Cedar Rim
at sortae* 19 8 0 ' FNL & 197 3 ' FEL (SWNE) 11. c., 2. a., z., on asoca año scavar

At top prod. interval reported below
28-3S-6W

At total depth

14. PERMIT ND. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY OR 13. STATE

43-013-303-·44Í10/21/74 Du Esne Utah
16 DATE SPUDDED 1Û. DA 'E T.D. 10ACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (ËÐGdy ‡O prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB, RT, GR, ETC.)* 1Û. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

10/28/74 i 1/10/75 3/9/75 6194 GR GR
2Û. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T,D., MD & TVD' 22. IF 41ULTIPLE COMPL., 23, INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

9500 9467 | > \
4. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* SÖ. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE

Wasatch Selected Intervals 7128-8780
No

26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27, WAS WELL CORED

.DILLr FDC-CNLr Sonicr Micro Seismogram No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in toen)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

10-3/4 40.5 570 13-3/4 100 sx Lte 190 Sx C ass "G"
7-5/8 26.4&29.7 7110 _ 8-3/4 200 sx Lte 100 Sx C ass "G"

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
$IZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCRËEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (3tD) PACKER SET (MD)

5" 6879 9498 187 2-7/8 6838
2-3/8 6838

31. PERFORATION RECORD (IN#879GE, Bifo GRd HumŠ©f) 82. . ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
DEFTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

See attached list. Not acidized

33.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (FIOtoing, gg8 lift, puinping-Bi e 07&& $‡/po Of FNmp) WELL STATUS (PÑd cinØ or

shut-in}
3/9/75 Flowing Producing

DATE OF TE3T HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N, FOR OIL--BBL. GAS-MCF. WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD

3/9/75 16 30/64 a 420 655 - 1560
FLOW. TUSING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL---BBL. GAS->ICF. WATER-BBL. OIL GRAVITT-API (CORR.)24-ROUR RATE

--. 650 > 630 980 - 41
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, ¾884 for fu€l, UBnfed, €ÚC.) TEST WITNESSED BT

Sold E. Matteson
SÖ. LIST OF ATTACEMENTS

List of pe_rforations.
A hereby cert at th tached information is complete and correc as determine frome all available records3/19/75

*(SeeInstructionsand Spaces for AdditionalData on Reverse



1NSTRUCTIONS
General: This forin is designed for subruitting a colnplete and correct well cornpletion report and log on all types of lands and leases to either a Federal agency or a State agencyor both, pursuant to applicable Federal and/or State laws and regulations. Any necessary special Instructions concerning the use of this form and the nuniber of copies to besubruitted, particularly wit11 regard to local, nrea, or regional procedures and practices, eitller are sliown below or wlli be issued by, or niay be obtained froni, tlie local Fetleraland/or State office. See instructions on itenis 22 and 24, and 33, below regarding separate reports for separate completions.iIf not filed prior to the tlule tllis sununary record is submitted, copies of all currently available logs (drillers, geologists, sample and core analysis, all types electrie, etc.),.forma-tion ant1 pressure tests, and directional surveys, 8110uld be attaelled hereto, to the extent required by applicable Federal and/or State laws and regulations. All attachmentsshould be listed on tliis forin, see item 35.
Item 4: If tliere are no applicable State requirements, locations on Federal or Indian land should be described in accordance with Federal requirernent Consult local Stateor Federal ofDee for specific instructiorts.
Item 18: Indicate which elevation is used as reference (where not otherwise sliown) for depth measurements given in other spaces on this form and in any attachments.Items 22 and 24: If this well is completed for separate production from more than one interval zone (multiple completion), go state in item 22, and in item 24 show the prodúcinginterval, or intervals, top(s), bottont(s) and naine(s) (if any) for only the interval reported in item 33. Submit a separate report (page) on this form, adequately identifiedfor each additional interval to be separately produced, showing the additional data portinent to such interval,item 29: "Sacks Cement": Attached supplemental records for this well should sliow the details of any multiple stage cernefiting and the location of the cetuenting toolItem 33: Submit a separate completion report on this form for each interval to be separately produced. (See instruction for items 22 and 24 above.)

37. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES:
SIIOW ALL IMPORTANT ZONES OF POROSITY AND CONTENTS THEREOF; CORED INTERVALS) AND ALL DRILL-STEM TESTS, INCLUDING 38. GEOLOGIC MARKERSDEPTH INTERVAL TESTED, CUSHION USED, TIME TOOL OPEN, FLOWING AND SIIUT-IN PRESSURES, AND RECOVERIES

FORh!ATION TOP BOTTOM - DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, ETC. TOP
NAME

MEAS. DEPTH TRUE VERT.DEPTH

Evacuation Ck
Mbr 2575 +3629

Parachute Ck
Mbr 3943 +2261

Douglas Ck
Mbr 5223 + 981

Lower Green
River Mkr 6 8 2 6 - 6 2 2

Wasatch 7150 - 946

U S. GOVËRNMENTPRONTINGOFFICE195FŒ683836

887



CEDAR RIM NO. 12

Perforations

Feet Holes .7128-40 12 137194-96 2 37201-03 2 37223-26 3 47289-95 6 77307-10 3 47334-37 3 47363-66 3 47373-76 3 47446-52 6 77484-88 4 57498-7504 6 77534-40 6 77578-80 2 3- 7647-52 5 67660-62 2 37692-94 2 37702-08 6 77716-18 2 37742-46 4 57962-70 8 97997-99
- 2 38054-60 6 78130-38 8 98 2 0 9-19 10 118375-80 5 68391-95 4 58446-52 6 78458-62 4 58472-80 8 98494-8504 10 118777-80 3 4

32 Intervals 156



O O
0RM OGC-8-X
ILE IN QUADRUPLICATE

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION
1588 west North Temple

Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

PsEPORTOF WATER ENCOUNTEREDDURING DPs1LLING

Well Name and Number Cedar Rila #12

Operator Koch Exploration Company

Address 1 Park Central, Suite 530, Denver Co 00202

Contractor Loffland Brothers

Address Box 3000, Casper, Wyoming 82601

LocationSW 1/4, NE 1/4, Sec.28 ; T.3S 4; R,6W E; Duchesne County

Water Sands:

Depth: Volume: Quality:
From- To- Flow Rate or Head - Fresh or Salty -

' None

2.

3,

5.
(Continue on Reverse Side if Necessary)

Formation Tops:

NOTE: (a) Upon diminishing supply of forms, please inform this office.
(b) Report on this form as provided for in Rule C-20, General Rules

And Regulations and Rules of Practice and Procedure.
(c) If a water quality analysis has beer made of the above reported

zone, please forward a copy along wifh this



O O
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
Qune 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

No 110 135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

14204621323
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals U&O Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE
7. If unitor cA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well

EL O °w"n O o.., 8. Weu Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Cedar Rim 12

Held By Production, InC. 9. APIWellNo.

3. Address and Telephone No. 4 3-013-30344
P . O , Box 306, Roosevelt, UT 84066 801-722-2546 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Cedar Rim
I l. County or Parish, State

1980' FNL & 1973' FEL Sec . 28-T3S-R6W, USB&M Duchesne, UT

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Nonce of Inmut Abandonment Change of Plans

O acco.pi.so. O New Construction

U Subsequent Repon Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O Cming Repair Waer Shut-Of

O Final Abandonment Notice Alerin Cning Conversion to Injecdon

Ë Other hange of Operator Dispose Water
(Note:ReportresultsofmultiplecompletiononWell
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log forrn.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state a l pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective January 31, 1996, Held By Production, Inc., has sold all of its
interest in the well and the underlying lease to North Plains Corp., 6638
West Ottava Avenue, Suite 100, Littleton, CO 80123. North Plains Corp. is
now the operator of this well.

14. I hereby ce fy t the foregoi is correct

Signed Title
Operations Manager Date January 31, 199E

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval. if any:

Tide 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulen statements
or represcumions as to any mancr within its jurisdiction.

'See Instruction on Reverse



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
Uune 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR x ire Ma c

311
m

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
14204621323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottce or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals U&O Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE
7. « unitor cA. Agreement Designaton

1. Type of Well

8 f.a O °w¾u O 8. Weu Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Cedar Rim 12
North Plains Corporation 9. AN Weu No.

3. Address and Telephone No- BU3-932-1851 43-013-30344

6638 West Ottawa Avenue, Suite 100, Littleton, CO 80123 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. I.acation of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Cedar Rim

/
11. County or Parish, State

1980 FNL & 1973' FEL Sec .
28- T3S-R6W, USB&M Duchesne, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O soti= o<i.e., O Abandonment Change of hans

O Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Repon Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O casi., a.p.i, O w.2, sa.-orr
O Final Abandonment Notice Alaring Cnin, O co,-,sica .. wecaos

other Change of Operator Dispose water
(Note Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state a 1pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective January 31, 1996, North Plains Corp. has purchased this well
and the underlying lease from Held By Production, Inc. North Plains Corp.
will now be the operator of this well.

FEB-6l996

14. I hereby certify that the f ng is true and correct

Signed Tide PreSident a,, January 31, 199

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Tide Date
Conditions of approval. if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any deparanent or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements
or stpresessations as to any maner within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse
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MARC T. ECKELS
HELD BY PRODUCTION, INC. / QUINTANA MINERALS CORP.

P. O. BOX 306
ROOSEVELT, UTAH 84066

801-722-2546 (Office)
801-722-4791 (Fax)

January 31, 1996

R. J. Firth, Associate Director for Oil & Gas
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: Sale of Held By Production, Inc. oil and gas properties in Duchesne County to North
Plains Corp.

Dear Mr. Firth:

QuintanaMinerals Corporation, dba Held By Production, Inc., has sold its oil and gas
properties in Duchesne County to North Plains Corp. Enclosed are Designation of Agent
or Operator forms (Form 5) and Sundry Notices associated with this transaction. There
are triplicate Forms 5 for each lease and a Sundry Notice from each company for every
well.

Ute Tribe leases covering sections 10 and 15-T3S-R6W were not included in the sale.
These leases, which include the Cedar Rim 14, 21, 10 and 10A wells have been
terminated and the Tribe is in the process of granting new leases to other operators. It
appears that we will shortly conclude arrangements for these new operators to take over
all obligations relative to these wells.

Please contact me if you have any questions or need additional information. I have
entered into a contract to operate these properties for North Plains Corp. through Applied
Drilling Services, Inc. There will be no change in the local phone or P. O. Box numbers.

Since ely yours,

Marc T.



am s STATE OF UTAH
¯DIVISION OF Olb GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME: Ute Indian Tribe and the Ute Distribution Corp.

LEASE NUMBER:
14-20-462-1323

and hereby designates

NAME: NORTH PLAINS CORP.

ADDRESS: 6638 W. Ottawa Ave., Suite 100 Littleton CO 80123

as his agent O/operator QQ,with full authority to act in his behalf in complyíng with the terms of the lease and regulations

applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in securing

compliance with the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the

State of Utah with respect to:

eacdbo acreage to which this designadan is appucabie, and Idendfy each applicable on and gas well by name and API numbat. Anach pagesŠneeded)

T3S, R6W, USM
Section 28: All

Well: €edar Rim #12
API#: 43-013-30344

Well: Cedar Rim #12A
API#: 43-013-31173

it is understood that this designation of agent/operator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance with the terms

of the lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the

State of Utah. It is also understood that this designation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest

in the lease.

In case of default on the part of the designated agent/operator, the lessee will make full and prompt compliance with all rules.

lease terms or orders of the 6oard of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to promptly notify the Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Designation: 02/01/96

(Phone)



(il (il
UNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
DATE: February 13, 1996

NCF: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency

susaect: Change of Operator

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office
To: Attention: Sally Gardiner, Division of Minerals and Mining

We have received copies of Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells (Form 3160-5),
requiring BIA Action, informing this office of a change of operator for the
following wells:

OPERATOR - FROM: Held By Production, Inc.
(now, Quintana Minerals Corp.)

TO: North Plains Corporation

TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 6 WEST, USB&M
Sec Well Name/No. Lease No.
16 Cedar Rim 5 14-20-H62-4653

16 Cedar Rim 5A 14-20-H62-4653

21 Cedar Rim 6 14-20-462-1130

21 Cedar Rim 6A 14-20-462-1130

22 Cedar Rim 8 14-20-462-1131

27 Cedar Rim 11 14-20-462-1322

27 Cedar Rim 11A 14-20-462-1322

28 Cedar Rim 12 14-20-462-1323

28 Cedar Rim 12A 14-20-462-1323

29 Cedar Rim 13 14-20-462-1324

29 Cedar Rim 13A 14-20-462-1324

32 Cedar Rim 17 14-20-462-1327

33 Cedar Rim 16 14-20-462-1328

34 Cedar Rim 15 14-20-462-1329

This office recommends a approval for the Changes of Operator for the wells
listed above.

All operations will be covered under a $75,000 Collective Bond filed with this
office for Barrett Resources Corporation.

Lease No. 14-20-462-1328 expired on its own terms. No replacement lease was
issued. According to the Sundry Notice for the Cedar Rim BA well, it is under
a Fee status. Therefore, we do not recommend approval for these two wells.

OPTIONALFORMNO.10
(REV.1-80)
GSA FPMR (4t CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114



Page 2

Change of Operator

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext.
51/52/54.

cc: Jerry Kenczka, BLM/Vernal
Energy & Minerals, Ute Tribe
Ute Distribution Corporation, Roosevelt, UT
Lisha €ordov ,

wwofaUtah

Theresa Thompson, BLM/State Office

O



701vision of Gil, Gas and Mining
OPERATORCHANGEHORKSHEET "° 9:

1 7-FILKy

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 58-FILg

lnitial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3-VLD
4

000 Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent SQL

Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only 6,SJ )

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE:
1-31-96

)

TO (new operator) NORTH PLAINS CORPORATION FROM (former operator) HELD BY PRODUCTION INC
(address) P_O_BOX 306 (address) Po Box 306

ROOSEVELT UT 84066 ROOSEVELT UT 84066
MARC T ECKELS, AGENT MARC T ECKELS
phone (801 )722-2546 phone ( 801 ) 722-2546
account no. N3435(A) 2-6-96 account no. N 7280

Hell(s) (attach additional page if needed):

Name: **SEE ATTACHKD** API: Entity: Sec Twp___Rng __ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp Rng_ _ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec _ Twp___Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp __Rng _ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec___Twp___Rng Lease Type:

O RATORRteANGRE61 lEONTA

u ry or other legal documentation has been received from former
operator (Attach to this form). ) gfýQ

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from newoperator
(Attach to this form). / g ý

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) If
yes, show company file number:

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in
comments section of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been entered in the Öil and Gas Information System (Hang/IBM) for each well
listed above. (2-/ dÈ

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above.

7. Hell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.(2-204ËQ
8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo

for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (pyg,ý )

9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been
placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

... inni

- OVER



(Iþ (Iþ
OPERATOR CHANGEWORKSHEET (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEH

1. (Rule R615-8-7) Entity
ass° ments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Here

entity changes made? (yes/ __ _ (If entity assignments were changed, attach copiel of
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

2. State Lands and the Tax Commission have been notified through normal procedures of
entity changes.

BONDVERIFICATION (Fee wells only)

. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond.

C

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no) ___.

Today's date 19 . If yes, division response was made by letter
dated 19___.

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

e/_A 1. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/1essee of any fee lease well listed above has been

ud' notified by letter dated 19__ , of their responsibility to notify any
person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such
notification has been requested.

2. Copies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMING

. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: ,
Lr 19 .

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The ociginal of this form and the original attachments have been filed in the Operator
Change file.

COMMENTS



e g
United States Department of the Interior

o

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Vernal District Office

3162.ER
170 South 500 East Phone: (801) 781-4400

N R8938° Vernal, Utah 84078-2799 Fax: (801) 78£-4410

March 4, 1996

North Plains Corporation
6638 West Ottawa Avenue Suite 100
Littleton CO 80123

Re: Well No. Cedar Rim12
Sec. 28, T3S, R6W
Lease 14-20-H62-1323
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This correspondence is in regard to the Sundry Notice submitted requesting a change in
operator for the referenced well. After a review by this office, the change in operator request
is approved. Effective immediately, North Plains Corporation is responsible for all operations
performed on the referenced well. Allliabilitywillnow fall under your bond, a $75,000BIA
Collective Bond, for all operations conductedon the referenced well on the leased land.

Ifyou have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Margie Herrmann or
Pat Sutton of this office at (801) 789-1362.

Sincerely,

o ard B. Cleavinger II
Assistant District Manager for
Minerals Resources

cc: Held By Production, Inc.
BIA

ggaOhmOasr& Mining
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

J 1990 Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
( une ) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: March 31, 1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. lasse Designation and Serial No.
14204621323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOA PERMIT-" for such proposals U&O Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE
7. is unitor cA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well

8 f.n O °w"u O om., 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Cedar Rim 12
North Plains Corporation 9. API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No. 303-932-161 43-013-30344

6638 West Ottawa Avenue, Suite 100, Littleton, CO 80123 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Lacation of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Cedar Rim
I l. County or Parish, State

1980; FNL & 1973' FEL Sec.28- T3S-R6W, USB&M Duchesne, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Nonce onn ent Abandonment Chnge of Plam

O Re ompledon New Construction

Subsequent Report O el.,,s., s.ca O Non-Routine Fracturing

O c..., a...i, O Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Ahering Cuing Convmion to Injecdon
Change of Operator O oisposewater

(Note: Reportresultsof multiplecompletiononWell

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state a l pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective January 31, 1996, North Plains Corp. has purchased this well
and the underlying lease from Held By Production, Inc. North Plains Corp.
will now be the operator of this well.

14. I hereby certify that the f ng is true and correct

p gg Tide PreSident oate January 31, 199

his space for Federal or State of5ce use)

b Tide """ Date

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements
or representations as to any maner within its jurisdiction.

'See instruction on Reverse



· O O
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
""

p'ire :

aNo 1100-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

14204621323
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals U&O Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE
7. It unitor cA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well

11 11 Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator
¯ " ¯¯¯¯ Cedeu. Rim 12

Held By Production, Inc. 9. APIWel1No.

3. Address and Telephone No. 4 3-0 1 3-30 34 4
P. O, Box 306, Roosevelt, UT 84066 801-722-2546 10.FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Cedar Rim
11. County or Parish, State

1980' FNL & 1973' FEL Sec. 28-T3S-R6W, USB&M Duchesne, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Nodce onntent Abandonment Ch nge of Plam

O a....wieso. O New Contrucdon

2 Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Alterin Casing Convmion o Ingon

Ë oher hange of Operator DisposeWater
(Note: Reportresultsof multiplecompletiononWell

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state a l pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estirnated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all rnarkers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective January 31, 1996, Held By Production, Inc., has sold all of its
interest in the well and the underlying lease to North Plains Öorp. , 6638
West Ottava Avenue, Suite 100, Littleton, CO 80123. North Plains Corp. is
now the operator of this well.

VERNALDIST.

GEOL

E.8.

PET.

A.M.

14. I hereby ce fy t the foregoi is e correct

. Operations Manager Date January 31, 1996
(This space for Federal or State office use)

pp ed b
n

Title Date ÛÑÑ

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements
or representations as to any maner within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse



O O
FORM la STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
355 West North Temple, 3 Triad. Suite 350. Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203 Of

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

OPERATOR NAME AND ADDRESS:
UTAH ACCOUNT NUMBER

C/0 MARC T ECKELS 3 | 96REPORT PERIOD (MONTH/YEAR):
NORTH PLAINS CORPORATION
PO BOX 306
ROOSEVELT UT 84066 AMENDED REPORT (Highlight Changes)

Nell Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes
WI Number Entity Incation Zone Status Oper OIL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)

BROTHERSON2-3484
4301330857 00289 025 04W 34 GR-WS
ANDERSON lA-30Bl
4301330783 00292 025 01W 30 GR-ws
CEDAR RIM #2 --pp, gg,
4301330019 06315 035 06W 20 GR-WS
CEDAR RIM l1-A ./Ÿ20//$Ñ782,2
4301330797 o6316 03s 06W 27 GR-ws
CEDAR RIM #5 --/VacabR//p¶
4301330240 06335 035 06W 16 GR-ws
CEDAR RIM #6

- //ge//b;2//30 TC-ace//o
''01330243 06340 035 06W 21 GR-WS
--DAR RIM #8 - /¾2 2 //3/ †¿.-occaff
4301330257 06350 03s 06w 22 GR-ws

EDAR Rin #12 - /V2e//b2/32'i
4301330344 06370 035 06W 28 GR-ws
CEDAR RIM #ll

--/ 2 |:Z2
4301330352 06380 03s 06W 27 GR-ws
CEDAR RIM #l3 <

- (ý2eVåg 732¶
4301330353 06385 035 06w 29 GR-WS
CEDAR RIM #l6

- Sigg§2/326
4301330363 06390 035 06W 33 GR-WSCEÕ¯ÁÑ

RIN 15 --ÑaŸë27901
4301330383 06395 035 06W 34 GR-WS
CEDAR ÑIM 17

,7

4301330385 06400 035 06W 32 GR-WS

TOTALS

hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge. Date:

me and Signature: Telephone



O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS
UINTAH AND OURAY AGENCY
FORT DUCHESNE, UTAH 84026

(801) 722-2406
IN REPLY REFER m Ext. 51/52/54

Minerals and Mining
Change of Operator

June 14, 1996

Barrett Resources Corp. North Plains Corp.
Attn: Brian Kuhn Attn: Marc Ekels
1515 Araphahoe St., #1000 P. O. Box 306
Denver, CO 80202 Roosevelt, UT 84066

Dear Mr. Kuhn and Mr. Ekels:

We have received copies of Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells (Form 3160-5), requiring BIA Action,
informing this office of a change of operator for the following wells:

OPERATOR - FROM: North Plains Corp.
TO: Barrett Resources Corp.

TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 6 WEST, USB&M
Sec Well Name/No. Well Location Lease No.
27 Cedar Rim 11 NW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1322

27 Cedar Rim 1lA NE/4SW/4 14-20-H62-1322

28 Cedar Rim 12 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1323

28 Cedar Rim 12A SE/4SE/4 14-20-H62-1323

29 Cedar Rim 13 SE/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1324

29 Cedar Rim 13A SW/4SE/4 14-20-H62-1324

32 Cedar Rim 17 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1327

33 Cedar Rim 16 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1328

34 Cedar Rim 15 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1329

This office recommended approval to BLM for the Changes of Operator for the wells listed above.

All operations will be covered under a $75,000 Collective bond filed with this office for Barrett
Resources Corp.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

Sincerely,

Superintendent

cc: Ed Forseman. BLM/Vernal
Energy & Minerals, Ute Tribe L-

Ute Distribution Corporation, Roosevelt.



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS

UINTAH AND OURAY AGENCY
FORT DUCHESNE. UTAH 84026

(800 722-2406
IN REPLY REFER TO: Ext. 51/52/54

Minerals and Mining
Change of Operator

June 14, 1996

Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Ute Distribution Corporation
Attn: Ferron Secakuku Attn: Lois LaRose
P. O. Box 70 P. O. Box 696
Ft. Duchesne, Ut 84026 Roosevelt, Ut 84066

Dear Joint Managers:

We have received copies of Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells (Form 3160-5), requiring BIA Action,
informing this office of a change of operator for the following wells:

OPERATOR - FROM: North Plains Corp.
TO: Barrett Resources Corp.

TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 6 WEST, USB&M
Sec Well Name/No. Well Location Lease No.
27 Cedar Rim ll NW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1322

27 Cedar Rim 1lA NE/4SW/4 14-20-H62-1322

28 Cedar Rim 12 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1323

28 Cedar Rim 12A SE/4SE/4 14-20-H62-1323

29 Cedar Rim 13 SE/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1324

29 Cedar Rim 13A SW/4SE/4 14-20-H62-1324

32 Cedar Rim 17 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1327

33 Cedar Rim 16 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-l328

34 Cedar Rim 15 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1329

This office recommended to the BLM approval for the Changes of Operator for the wells listed above.

All operations will be covered under a $75,000 Collective bond filed with this office for Barrett
Resources Corp.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

Sincerely,

Superintendent

cc: Theresa Thompson, BLM/SLC
Lisha Cordova, DOGM/State of



· ' e OUNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
DATE: June 14, 1996

REPLY TO
ATTN OF:

Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
SUBJECT:

Concurrance for Approval for Change of Operator

TO:

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District

We have received copies of Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells (Form 3160-5), requiring BIA Action,
informing this office of a change of operator for the following wells:

OPERATOR - FROM: North Plains Corp.
TO: Barrett Resources Corp.

TOWNSHIP 3 SOUTH, RANGE 6 WEST, USB&M
Sec Well Name/No. Well Location Lease No.
27 Cedar Rim 11 NW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1322
27 Cedar Rim 1lA NE/4SW/4 14-20-H62-1322
28 Cedar Rim 12 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1323
28 Cedar Rim 12A SE/4SE/4 14-20-H62-1323
29 Cedar Rim 13 SE/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1324
29 Cedar Rim 13A SW/4SE/4 14-20-H62-1324
32 Cedar Rim 17 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1327
33 Cedar Rim 16 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1328
34 Cedar Rim 15 SW/4NE/4 14-20-H62-1329

This office recommends approval for the Changes of Operator for the wells listed above.

All operations will be covered under a $75,000Collective bond filed with this office for Barrett
Resources Corp.

If you have any questions, please contact the Minerals and Mining Office at (801) 722-2406, Ext.
51/52/54.

OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114



· - • •
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
'

"M 3

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. ase Designation and Serial No.

14204621323
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian. Anottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals U&OUte

SUBMIT IN TRIPL/CA TE
7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designati

1. Type of Well
~¯¯

Ë win
GWa

H Mer
8. Wen Name and No.

2. Name of Operator | Cedar Rim 12
North Plains Corporation i API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No (303) 932-1851 43-013-30344
6638 W. Ottawa Ave. , Ste. 100, Littleton, CO 80123 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Cedar Rim
I 1. County or Parish, State

1980' FNL & 1973' FEL Sec. 28-T35-R6W, USB&M
Duchesne, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTlCE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Ab ndonment Change of Plans

O acco.,,coo. O New Constnietion

Subsequent Repon Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O casi., a.p.2, O w.2, ss...ors

O Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

'Ë Other Change of Operator Dispose water
(Note: Report results of multipic completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log formi

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and tnie vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective March 1, 1996, North Plains Corporation, has sold all of its interest in

the well and the underlying lease to Barrett Resources Corporation, a Delaware

corporation, 1515 Arapahoe Street, Suite 1000, Denver, Colorado 80202. Barrett

Resources Corporation is now the operator of this well, effective May 15, 1996.

DIV.OFOtL,GAS& MINING
14. I hereby c the f true and co

Title ASl dAD Date

Gliis space for r State g*g28tB.f¾ I

,r a U fl fal 86SCUfC 6 VUi.. Ü u di
Appmved by Title Date
Conditions Šf a'pp oval, if any: i -

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or frauduleÑstatements

or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

'See Instruction on Reverse



Form 3f60-5 UNITED STATES
\ FORM APPROVED

Uune 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
suagersureauNo loo4-oi3;

Expires: March 31, 1993

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. txase oesignationand serialNo.

14204621323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATlON FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals O & O Ute

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
7. it unit or cA. Agreement Designauon

1. Type of Well

11
Gae

1 Oder

.
8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator
Cedar Rim 12

Barrett Resources CorporatiCD
9. API Well No.

3. Address anÄTelephone No,
(303) 572-3900 43-013-30344

1515 Arapahoe Street, Ste. 1000, Denver, CO 80202 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4- Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M,, or Survey Description)
Cedar Rim

I1. County or Parish, State

1980' FNL & 1973' FEL Sec. 28-T35-R6W, USB&M
Duchesne, UT

12- CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION
TYPE OF ACTION

O sose, oc inten, O Abandonment
Change of Plans

O Recompletion
New Construcúon

B Subsequent Repon
Plugging Back

Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair
Water Shut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing
Convmion to in on

other Change of Operator Dispose water
(Note: Reportresultsof muitpiccompictionon Well

Complenon or Recompletron Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled.

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Effective March 1, 1996, Barrett Resources Corporation has purchased this well and

the underlying lease from North Plains Corporation. Barrett Resources Corporation

will now be the operator of this well, effect ive May 15, 1996.

JUL101996

PRT

DIV.OFOIL,GAS& MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoin rue and cogect

Signed
Title

DBy D SC Date

(Thism eo c

Title
Date

Conditions of ap df a

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to ny department or agency of the Unite States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements

or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
* a nstruction on Reverse



O e
United States Department of the Interior

%2./ BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT
Vernal District Office
170 South 500 East Phone: (801) 781-4400

1N REPLY REFER TO: Vernal, Utah 84078-2799 Fax: (801) 781-4410

3162.3
UTO8300

July 2, 1996

Barrett Resources Corporation
1515 Arapahoe Street Suite 1000
Denver CO 80202

Re: Well No. Cedar Rim 12
SWNE, Sec. 28, T3S, R6W
Lease 14-20-H62-1323
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This correspondence is in regard to the Sundry Notice submitted requesting a change in
operator for the referenced well. After a review by this office, the change in operator request
is approved. Effective immediately, Barrett Resources Corporation is responsible for all
operations performed on the referenced well. All liability willnow fall under your bond, a
$75,000BlA Collective Bond, for all operations conducted on the referenced well on the
leased land.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Margie Herrmann or
Pat Sutton of this office at (801) 789-1362.

Howard B. Cleavinger II
Assistant District Manager for
Minerals Resources

cc: North Plains Corporation
BIA

JUL 1 0 596

DN OFOILGAS&



·bivla n 1, Gas and Mining b n .

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1- 6-

7-KD
Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 3- ß-SJ
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 4-VLD / 9-FILE

5-RJF

IU Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent
O Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-1-96

TO: (new operator) BARRETT RESOURCES CORP FROM: (old operator) NORTH PLAINS CORP

(address) 1515 ARAPAHOE ST T3 #1000 (address) 6638 W OTTAWA AVE STE 100
DENVER CO 80202 LITTLETON CO 80123

Phone: (303) 606-4259 Phone: (303) 932-1851
Account no. N9305 Account no. N3435

WELL(S) attach additional page if needed: C.A. 96-000110 & 96-000089

Name: **SEE ATTACHED** API· Zy )6~
Entity: S T R Lease:

Name: API: Entity: S
_

T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S

_

T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

1. r649-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from the FORMER operator
attach to this form). 26

2. (r649-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from the NEW operator (Attach
to this form). (jd/ 6 244

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently operating
any wells in Utah. Is the company registered with the state? (yes/no) If yes, show company
file number:

4. FOR INDIAN AND FEDERAL WELLS ONLY. The BLM has been contacted regarding this change.
Make note of BLM status in comments section of this form. BLM approval of Federal and Indian well
operator changes should ordinarily take place prior to the division's approval, and before the
completion of steps 5 through 9 below.

5. Changes have been entered in the Oil and Gas Information System (3270) for each well listed above.

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. My

7. Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above. /g

8. Changes have been included on the monthly "O erator, Address, and Account Changes" memo for
distribution to Trust Lands, Sovereign Lands, UËS, Tax Commission, etc. /pg

9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been placed there
for reference during routing and processingof the original documents.

e\dous\wpdocs\iorms\operchng
- OVER



O O *
,

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (continued) - Initial each item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEW

l. (r649-8-7) Entity assignments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were entity changes

made? (yes/ 9) If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of Form 6, Entity Action
Form.

2. Trust Lands, Sovereign Lands, Tax Commission, etc., have been notified through normal procedures

of entity changes.

BOND VERIFICATION - (FEE WELLS ONLY)

1. (r649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a proper bond.

. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operator's bond files.

3. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/no) , as of
today's date . If yes, division response was made to this request by letter
dated

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION OF RESPONSIBILITY

^t 1. Copies of documents have been sent on to at Trust
Lands for changes involving State leases, in order to remind that agency of their responsibility to
review for proper bonding.

.NGAll

attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Today's date:

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form, and the original attachments are now being filed in the Operator Change
file.



e TATE OF UTAH

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING
5. taase Mnabon and Serial Numbec

6. WIndian, Albattee or Tdbo Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this fonn for proposals to drill newwells, deepen existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells.
7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPUCATION FOR PEAMfr TO DAll.LOR DEEPEN form for such proposals.

8. Well Name and Number
1. Type of Well: OtL GAs O OTHER:

Ba t Resources Corporation

3. Address and Telephone Number (303) 572-3900 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

1515 Arapahoe St., Tower 3, Ste #1000 Denver, CO 80202
4. Locanon of Well

Footages: County:

co, sec..T.,R.,M.: state:

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TQ INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Subout in Dupl6eete) (Submit Original Form Only)

O Abandon O New Construction O Abandon O New Construction

O Repair casing O Pull or Alter casing O Repair casing O Pull or Atter casing

O Change of Plans O Recomplete Change of Plans O Repedorate

O convertto injection O RePerforate O convertto injection O Vent or Flare

O Fracture Treat or Acidize O Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize O Water Shut-Off

O Multiple Completion O Water Shut-Off g)Other Annual Stggne Report

O other of Shut-In Wells.
Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Fleoort results of Multiole Comosetionnand P--pa-•to different meervotra on WELL
COMPl.EDON OR RECOMPLEDON REPORT AND LOG fonn.

• Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCAIBE PAOPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearty state all pertinent oetaits, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measbred and true

vertical depths for all markom and zones pertinent to this work.)

See Attached List

APR2 1 1997

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&M

signature: Greg DSViS n6e:

Vd

e upvr, oate

(This space for State noe only)

(4\G4) (See Instructions on Reverse



BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION
UTAHANNUALSTATUS REPORT OF SHUT-IN WELLS 1996

LAST I REASON FOR
WELLNAME OTR QTR SEC-T-R AP1 NUMBER PRODUCED SHUT-IN OR TA'D WELL FUTUREPLANS FOR WELL

BROTHERSON2-23B4 NWNE 34-2S-4W 43-013-30857 Oct-93 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.
UTETRIBAL2-21G NWNE21-5S-4W 43-013-31313 Never Uneconomic to produce. Currently performingproductiontest.

CEDARRIM 2 SWNE 20-3S-6W 43-013-30019 Aug-92 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
-- CEDARRIM12 SWNE28-3S4W 48*01340344 Oct-89 Uneconomictoproduce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential

CEDARRIM 14 SWNE10-3S-6W 43-013-30345 Sep-86 Uneconomicto produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.
CEDARRIM 21 SESE 10-3S-6W 43-013-31169 Oct-91 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.

O
2X-25C7 NESW 25-3S-7W 43-013-31083 Oct-92 Uneconomic to produce. P&A
2X-23C7 NENE23-3S-7W 43-013-31073 Sep-88 Uneconomic to produce. P&A

YACK1-7A1 NESW 7-1S-1W 43-013-30018 Nov-95 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
DYE1-29A1 NWSE 29-1S-1W 43-013-30271 Apr-85 Uneconomic toproduce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

SUMMERALEST. 1-30A1 NWSE 30-1S-1W 43-013-30250 Sep-91 Uneconomicto produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
HARMSTON1-32A1 NESW 32-1S-1W 43-013-30224 Mar-92 Uneconomic to produce. PßA
BLANCHARD1-3A2 NWSE 3-1S-2W 43-013-20316 Feb-93 Uneconomicto produce. Rhoentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
BLANCHARD 2-3A2 SESW 3-1S-2W 43-013-30008 Feb-93 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

L URRUTY1-8A2 NWSW 8-1S-2W 43-013-30036 Jul-91 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
HAMBLIN1-26A2 NESW 26-1S-2W 43-013-30083 Dec-87 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

ANDERSON1-28A2 NWSE 28-1S-2W 43-013-30150 Priorto Jan-84 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.
URRUTY1-34A2 SWNE 34-1S-2W 43-013-30149 Prior to Jan-84 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluating recompletion potential.

UTE 1-10A3 SENW 10-1S-3W 43-013-30319 Aug-92 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.
BECKSTEAD 1-30A3 SWNE 30-1S-3W 43-013-30070 Feb-93 Uneconomic to produce. Recently acquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

STATE1-6B1E NWSE 6-28-1E 43-047-30169 Dec-94 Casing problems. P&A
UTE9-4B1 SENW 4-2S-1W 43-013-30194 Apr-91 Uneconomic to produce. Recompletedin 4/97.

ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 NESW 2-2S-RW 43-013-30225 Jul-88 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyac(uired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.
MARGUERITE1-8B2 NWSE 8-2S-2W 43-013-30235 Jul-87 Uneconomic to produce. Ñecentlyacquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.

REESE 1-10B2 SENW 10-2S-2W 43-013-30215 Aug-92 Uneconomic to produce. Ñecentlyacquired. Evaluating recompletionpotential.
BUZZI 1-11B2 SENW11-2S-2W 43-013-30248 Oct-92 Uneconomic to produce. P&A

MYRIN RANCH1-13B4 NENE13-2S-4W 43-013-30180 May-92 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
UTETRIBAL1-5C4 SENE 5-38-4W 43-013-30532 Aug-94 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

UTE 1-20C4 NWNE20-3S-4W 43-013-30170 Priorto Jan-84 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
UTE 1-2C5 NWNW2-3S-5W 43-013-30392 Sep-92 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
UTE 1-5C5 NWNE5-3S-5W 43-013-30260 Priorto Jan-84 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

SMITH1-6C5 NWNE6-3S-5W 43-013-30163 Apr-92 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
UTETRIBAL1-3C6 SWSE 3-3S-6W 43-013-30415 Sep-93 Uneconomicto produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

UTETRIBAL E-2 SWSW 12-3S-6W 43-013-30500 Mar-95 Uneconomic to produce. Recompletedin 4/97.
UTE TRIBAL 1-25C6 SWNE 25-3S-6W 43-013-30417 Sep-94 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.

FEE 1-10B1E SENW 10-2S-1E 43-047-30881 May-89 Uneconomic to produce. Recentlyacquired. Evaluatingrecompletionpotential.
SPRING HOLLOW 4-36Z3 NESW 36-1N-3W 43-013-30398 Feb-84 Uneconomic to produce. P&A
SPRING HOLLOW2-34Z3 NESW 34-1N-3W 43-013-30234 Feb-92 Uneconomic to produce. P&A

UTETRIBALK-1 NWSE 1-3S-6W 43-013-30280 Jul-88 Uneconomic to produce. Recompleted in



STATE: OF UTAM

DMS OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
s. te... o..ign.nonand senesnune.e

6. E indsen, Allonne er Tdbe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen exisdag wells, or to twentar plugged and abandoned wells.
7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPUCANN FCA PERMir TODAlu.OR DEEPEN form for such procosais.

1.Tro•ofW•ll: OILO GAsO OTHER:

2. Name of Operator 9. API Weil Numbec

Barrett Resources Corporation
6° Û

3. Address and Temphone Numbec ( 3 0 3 ) 5 7 2 - 3 9 0 0 to- F••ld ••d P==l.•r

1515 Arapahne St
.

Tower 3, #1000 Denver, CO 80207 I
4. M of Weil

Footages: County:

QQ. Soc..T.,R..M.: Sista:

" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(submit in Dupoleet.) (Submit Original Form Onhy)

O Abandon O New Construction O Abandon O New Construction

O Repair casing O Puti or Alter casing O Repair Casing O Pull or Alter Casing

O changeof Plans O RecomPl•te O Change of Plans O Raoerforate

O convertto injection O Reperforate O Convert to Injection O Vent or Flare

O Fracture Treat or Acidize a ventor Flar• O Fracture Treat or Acidize O Water Shut-Off

O Multiple Completion O Water Shut-C Other Annu a 1 Stutus Report
otner of shut-in Wells

Date of womc completion

Aporoximate date work will stan Reoort r..uns et numos•ca..o..cio...ang P---··· to danorum r...rvous on wm
COMPLEDON OR RËCOMPtiñQN RË ORT AND LO3 man.

' Must De accomoansed Dy a cement vertfacanon reoort,

12. DESCAIBE PACPCSED CA C MPLETED O ERATTONS(C.eany stam all peronent oetans, ana give peronen: cases. It won ts careenonallv artibed, grve suosucace locanons and measurec ana eue

verocal GeoŒts IDF all marxert ana zones perDnent to this worx.)

See Attached List ECEEWE

ason.rue.: Greg payis .

Seror
upervisor o.

(This opeoe for State use only)

(4\94) (See instmctions on Aeverse



Sheet1

BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION
UTAH ANNUALSTATUS REPORT OF SHUT-IN WELLS 1997

LAST REASON FOR
WELL NAME QTR QTR SEC-T-R API NUMBER PRODUCED SHUT-IN OR TA'D WELL FUTURE PLANS FOR WELL
FEE 1-10B1E SENW 10-2S-1E 43-047-30881 May-89 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST

2X-25C7 NESW25-3S-7W 43-013-31083 ? UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST
MONADAGOV'T 3 NWNE 35-5S-19E 43-047-30095 ? UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST

ANDERSON 1-28A2 NWSE 28-1S-2W 43-013-30150 ? UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION CANDIDATEFOR P&A LIST
AD 1-30A3 SWNE 30-1S-3W 43-013-30070 Feb-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST

BLANCHARD1-3A2 NWSE 3-1S-2W 43-013-20316 Feb-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION CANDIDATEFOR P&A LIST
BLANCHARD2-3A2 SESW 3-1S-2W 43-013-30008 Feb-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION CANDIDATEFOR DEEPENING IN WASATCH

BROADHEAD1-24B6 SWNE 24-2S-6W 43-013-30518 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION CANDIDATEFOR DEEPENING INWASATCH
BROTHERSON i-34B4 NWNE 34-2S-4W 43-013-30857 Oct-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION CANDIDATE FOR P&A LIST

CEDAR RIM 11 NWNE 27-3S-6W 43-013-30352 Apr-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION I POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETIM
CEDAR RIM 12 SWNE 28-3S-6W 43-013-30344 ' Oct-89 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
CEDAR RfM 14 SWNE 10-3S-6W 43-013-30345 Sep-86 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
CEDAR RIM 16 SWNE 33-3S-6W 43-013-30363 Nov-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
CEDAR RIM2 SWNE 20-3S-6W 43-013-30019 Aug-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETlON

CEDAR RIM21 SESE 10-3S-6W 43-013-31169 Oct-95 UNECÒNOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
CEDAR RIM5A SESW 16-3S-6W 43-013-31170 Feb-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVERRECOMPLETION
CEDAR RIM 8 SWNE 22-3S-6W 43-013-30257 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION

CHENEY 1-33A2 SWNE 33-1S-2W 43-013-30202 May-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIALWASATCH / L GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
CHENEY 2-33A2 NESE 33-1S-2W 43-013-31042 Dec-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST

CAMPBELL 1-12B2 SWNE 12-2S-2W 43-013-30237 Dec-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIALWASATCH/ L GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
SMITH 1-6C5 NWNE 6-3S-SW 43-013-30163 Äpr92 UNECÒNOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIAL U GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION

DUCHESNE COUNTY 1-3C4 SENW 3-3S-4W 43-013-30065 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIALWASATCH / L GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
DUCHESNE 1-17C4 NWNE 17-3S-4W 43-013-30410 ? UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST

JENSEN FENZEL 1-20CS SWNE 20-3S-5W 43-013-30177 Feb-86 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIALWASATCH / L GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
HARMSTON 1-32A1 NESW 32-1S-1W 43-013-30224 Mar-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST
HORROCKS 1-6A1 SENW 6-1S-1W 43-013-30390 May-84 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION ON 98 P&A LIST

VODA 1-19C5 SWNE 19-3S-5W 43-013-30382 ? UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIALWASATCH / L GREEN RIVER RECOMPLETION
UTE TRIBAL2-21G NWNE 21-SS-4W 43-013-31313 ? UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION POTENTIALSERVICE WELL FOR WATERFLOOD

Page



(JUNE 1990\ - UNITED STATES I Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
* '

DEPUAREAMUENFTOF THE INNAEGRI

14204621323
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals

_ __

UTE TRIBE
7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. of Well

Oil Gas 8. Well Name and No.
Well Well Other CEDAR RIM 12

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION 43-013-30344

3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
1515 ARAPAHOE ST, TOWER 3, #1000, DENVER, CO 80202 (303) 572-3900 CEDAR RIM

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State
1980' FNL 1973' FEL
SWNE SECTION 28-T3S-R6W DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of intent Abandonment Change of plans

Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

X Other CHANGE OF OPERATOR Dispose Water

(Note: Report results of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed OperationsÎÇlearlystate all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, inclucing estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,

give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 1, 2000, BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION WILL RELINQUISH THE
OPERATORSHIP OF THE REFERENCED WELL TO COASTAL OIL AND GAS CORPORATION.

O

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Signed ITLE Sr. Vice-President, Land Date

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title
__

Da
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulen statements

o ntations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
*See Instruction on Reverse Side

DMSION0FOILBAS&



g gForin'3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ',°'
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELL.S
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, AUouee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBM/T IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

O w°"a U wG
her

8. Well Name and No.

Codar Rim #12
2. Name of Operator

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Attn: Cheryl Cameron (L API Wel No
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (includeareacode) 43-013-30344-00

P. 0. Box 1148 Vernal . Utah 84078 35-781-7023 io na a pool or explors,arya ,

4. I.ocation of Well (Footage, Sec., T., A'.,M., or Survey Description)

S28-T3S-R6W SWNE
11. County or Parish. State

Duchesne, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acia Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WM Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Enogrity

O suuss-acrart
Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete X other Change of

O Final Abandonment Notice Change Plans Plug and Mandon Temporarily Abandon Operator
Convert to Injection Plug Back Wo Disposal

1 Describe Proposed or Coommpleted Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation. have been completed. and the operator has
determined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

Please be advised Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation at P. 0. Box 1148 Vernal, Utah 84078 is considered to be
the operator of the above referenced well and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease
for the operations conducted upon the leased lands.

Effective date of change is January 1, 2000

BLMbond coverage is provided by 0605382-9.

Utah state bond coverage is U2644534. State operator number is 17102.

RECENED
JANI O2000

Please contact Cheryl Cameronat 435-781-7023 if you have any questions.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Title
Name (Printed/Typed)

hn T. Elzn Vice President

Date

r
IS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE -

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its



FORM 9

TE OF UTAH
DIVISION IL, GAS, AND MINING

5. Lease Designation and Serial NumÄ:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REFORTS ON WELLS 6.Ifindian, AllotteeorTribeName:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wells, or to re-enter plugged and abandoned wells- 7. Unit Agreement Name:
Use APPUCATION FOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals.

I. Type of well: OIL GAS OTHER:
8. Well Name and Number:

2. Name of Operator: 9. API Well Number:

BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

1515ARAPAHOE ST., TOWER 3, #1000, DENVER, CO 80202 (303) 572-3900

4. Location of Well:

Footages: County:

QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: State: UTAH

t. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon New Construction

Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recomplete Change of Plans Reperforate

Convert to Injection a Reperforate Convert to Injection Vent or Flare -
Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other ANNUAL STATUS REPORT OF SHUT=lN WELLS
Other

Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start Report results of Multiple Completionsand Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMLEPTION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true

vertical depths for all markers and 2ones pertinent to this work.)

SEE ATTACHED LIST

r
,_ m

13

Name & Signature: Title: PRODUCTION SERVICES SUPVR Date: 01/19/00

(ThÍsspace for Federal or State officeuse)

a

(4/94) (See instructions on reverse



1999

UTAH ANNUAL STATUS REPORT OF SHUT-IN WELLS 1999

LAST REASON FOR

WELL NAME QTR QTR SEC-T-R API NUMBER PRODUCED SHUT-IN OR TA'D WELL FUTURE PLANS FOR WELL

FEE 1-10B1E SENW 10-2S-1E 43-047-30881 May-89 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

BLEY2X-25C7 NESW25-3S-7W 43-013-31083 na NEVER PROD; NO ECONOMIC RESERVES Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SMITH2X-23C7 NENE 23-3S-7W 43-013-31634 na NEVER PROD; NO ECONOMIC RESERVES Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

ANDERSON 1-28A2 NWSE 28-1S-2W 43-013-30150 Jul-83
__

UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

BLANCHARD 1-3A2 NWSE 3-1S-2W 43-013-20316 Feb-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil& Gas Corp. 12/99

Bl.ANCHARD 2-3A2 SESW 3-1S-2W 43-013-30008 Feb-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SMITH 1-17C5 CNE 17-3S-5W 43-013-30188 Nov-98 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 11 NWNE 27-3S-6W 43-013-30352 Apr-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 12 SWNE 28-3S-6W 43-013-30344 Oct-89 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 14 SWNE 10-3S-6W 43-013-3ÕŠ45 Sep-86 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 16 SWNE 33-3S-6W 43-013-30363 Nov-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 2 SWNE 20-3S-6W 43-013-3Õ039 Aug-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 21 SESE 10-3S-6W 43-013-31169 Oct-91 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 5A SESW 16-3S-6W 43-013-31170 Feb-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 8 SWNE 22-3S-6W 43-013-3Õž57 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

CHENEY 1-33A2 SWNE 33-1S-2W 43-013-30202 May-94 UNECONOMIC PRODÒCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CHENEY 2-33A2 NESE 33-1S-2W 43-013-31042 Dec-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CAMPBELL 1-12B2 SWNE 12-2S-2W 43-013-30237 Dec-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil &Gas Corp. 12/99

SMITH 1-6CS NWNE 6-3S-$W 43-013-30163 Apr-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

DUCHESNE COUNTY 1-3C4 SENW 3-3S-4W 43-013-30065 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

DUCHESNE 1-17C4 NWNE 17-3S-4W 43-013-30410 Mar-82 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

JENSEN FENZEL 1-20C5 SWNE 20-3S-5W 43-013-30177 Feb-86 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

ESTHER ARHI 1-5B1E NWSW 5-2S-1E 43-047-30205 Mar-98 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

O HORROCKS 1-6A1 SENW 6-1S-1W 43-013-30390 May-84 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

VODA 1-19C5 SWNE 19-3S-5W 43-013-30382 Dec-81 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-21G BC NWNE 21-5S-4W 43-013-31313 na NEVER PROD; NO ECONOMIC RESERVES Lease HBP; reviewing utility of wellborein pending waterflood operation

RECEIVED
JAN24 2000
DIVISION OF

OIL,GAS AND MINING
Page



1999

LAST REASON FOR
WELL NAME QTR QTR_SEC-T-R API NUMBER PRODUCED

_

SHUT-IN OR TA'D WELL FUTURE PLANS FOR WE L

JOHN 1-3B2 NESW 3-2S-2W 43-013-30160 Sep-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

KENDALL1-12A2 . SWSW 12-1S-2W 43-013-30013 Dec-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

LAMICQURRUTY 1-8A2 NWSW 8-1S-5W 43-013-30036 Dec-91 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTlON Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

MEAGHER EST. 1-4B2 NWSE 4-2S-2W 43-013-30313 . Feb-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil& Gas Corp. 12/99

MOON TRIBAL 1-30C4 SESE 30-3S-4W 43-013-30576 - Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

MORTENSEN 2-32A2 NWSE 32-1S-2W 43-013-30929 -
Mar-91 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

MYRIN RANCH 1-13B4 NENE 13-2S-4W 43-013-30180
.

May-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

NORLING 1-9B1 NESE 33-1S-2W 43-013-30315 . May-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

O PHILLIPS FEDERAL 1-3C5 NENW 3-3S-5W 43-013-30333 Sep-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

REESE 1-10B2 SENW 10-2S-2W 43-013-30215
.

Aug-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oli & Gas Corp. 12/99

ROBERTSON 1-29A2 SENW 29-1S-2W 43-013-30189 Jun-95 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE 1-282 NESW 2-2S-2W 43-013-30225
.

Jul-88 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SALERATUS WASH 1-7CS SWNE 7-3S-5W 43-013-30098 Sep-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil &Gas Corp. 12/99

SHISLER 1-381 NWSE 3-2S-1W 43-013-30249 May-90 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SPRING HOLLOW 4-36Z3 NESW 36-1N-3W 43-013-30398 Feb-84 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

STATE 1-681E | NWSE 6-2S-1E 43-047-30169 Dec-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

STATE 1-7B1E NWSE 7-2S-1E 43-047-30180 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

STATE 2 35A2 SENW 35-1S-2W 43-013-30156 Sep-91 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SUMMERELL EST. 1-30A1 NWSE 30-1S-1W 43-013-30250 Sep-91 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oli & Gas Corp. 12/99

TODD 1-2B1 NWSE 2-2S-1W 43-047-30167 Dec-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION d Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-26 BC NENE 26-5S-5W 43-013-31912 N/A ease HBP; reviewing utility ofwellbore in pending waterflood operation

URRUTY 2-9A2 NESW 9-1S-2W \43-013-30046 Apr-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE 1-2A3 NWSE 2-1S-3W 43-013-30409 Jun-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION oÏdto Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE 1-2C5 NWNW 2-3S-5W 43-013-30392 Sep-92 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Id to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 15-16 BC SWSE 16-5S-4W 43-013-31648 Nov-98 am HBP; reviewing utility ofwellbore in pending waterflood operation

UTE 1-SC5 NWNE 5-3S-5W 43-013-20260 Jan-79 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE 6-783 SWNE 7-2S-3W 43-013-30211 Sep-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION œsta10il & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-25C6 _ SWNE 25-3S-6W 43-013-30417 Sep-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION old to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-3C6 SWSE 3-3S-6W 43-013-30415 Sep-93 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-3486 SWSE 34-2S-6W 43-013-30431 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-36C6 NENE 36-3S-6W 43-013-30422 Oct-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-5C4 SENE 5-3S-4W 43-013-30532 Aug-94 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-13C6 NESW 13-3S-6W 43-013-30530 Sep-96 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION old to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

YACK 1-7A1 NESW 7-1S-1W 43-013-30018 Nov-95 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION dd to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

RECEIVED
JAN24 2000

Page 1 DIVISIONOF
OIL,GAS AND



1999

LAST REASON FOR
WELL NAME QTR QTR SEC-T-R API NUMBER PRODUCED SHUT-IN OR TA'D WELL FUTURE PLANS FOR WELL

UTE 1-10A3 ) SENE 10-1S-3W )43-013-30319 Feb-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

BUZZl 1-11B2 SENW 11-2S-2W 43-013-30248 May-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SHRINE1-10C5 NWNE 10-3S-5W 43-013-30393 Jul-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

MORTENSEN 3-32A2 SWSW 32-1S-2W 43-013-31872 Dec-98 coLLAPSED CASING Sold to Coastal Oil &Gas Corp. 12/99

GOODRICH 1-18B2 SENW 18-2S-2W 43-013-30397 Jul-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

BOREN 1-24A2 NESW 24-1S-2W 43-013-30084 Sep-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil &Gas Corp. 12/99

UTAH STATE FED 1-24B1 NWSE 24-2S-1W 43-047-30220 May-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

HAMBLIN1-26A2 NESW 26-1S-2W 43-013-30083 Jun-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

- UTE TRIBAL 1-26C6 SWNE 26-3S-6W 43-013-30412 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

BASTIAN 3-7A1 NESE 7-1S-1W 43-013-30026 Jun-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

DYE 1-29A1 NWSE 29-1S-1W 43-013-30271 Jul-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

MCELPRANG1-31A1 NWSE 31-1S-1W 43-013-30190
.

Jan-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

VODA UTE 1-4C5 NWNE 4-3S-5W 43-013-30283 Jul-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-4C6 NWNE 4-3S-6W 43-013-30416 Jan-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

MARGUERITE1-8B2 NWSE 8-2S-2W 43-013-30235 Jun-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-9C6 i SWNE 9-3S-6W 43-013-30487 Jan-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL10-1 SENW 10-4S-5W 43-013-30088 Jul-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-11C6 NESW 11-3S-6W 43-013-30534 May-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-12C6 SWSW 12-3S-6W 43-013-30500 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODÙCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-23C6 NENW 23-3S-6W 43-013-30537 May-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-2C6 SWSW 2-3S-6W 43-013-30531 May-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

MCELPRANG 2-31A1 NWSW 31-1S-1W 43-013-30836 Jul-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUÓTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

URRUTY 2-34A2 SWSW 34-1S-2W 43-013-30753 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 NESW 34-1N-3W 43-013-30234 Apr-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-3C6 NENW 3-3S-6W 43-013-30902 Jul-97 - UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

REYNOLD 2-7B1E SENE 7-2S-1E 43-047-31840 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

UTE TRIBAL 2-9C6 SESE 9-3S-6W 43-013-31096 Ñ\ay-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99O CADILLAC3-6A1 SWSE 6-1S-1W 43-013-30834 Apr-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold toCoastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

BASTIAN 3-7A1 NESE 7-1S-1W 43-013-30026 Apr-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

UTE TRIBAL 3-9D5 SENW 9-4S-5W 43-013-20179 Jul-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

ANDERSON 1-A-3081 i i SWNE 30-2S-1W 43-013-30783 Jul-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION |Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.12/99

RECElVED
JAN24 2000
DIVISIONOF

Page i OIL,GAS AND
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LAST
WELL NAME QTR QTR SEC-T-R API NUMBER PRODUCED FUTUREPLANS FOR WELL

CEDAR RIM 5 SWNE 16-3S-3W 43-013-30240 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR R1M6 SWNE 21-3S-6W 43-013-30243 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

CEDAR RIM 6A CSW 21-3S-6W 43-013-31162 May-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 10-21 BC NWSE 21-SS-4W 43-013-31283 Jun-97 UNECONOMICPRODUCTION Lease HBP; reviewing utilityof welfbore in pending waterflood operation

UTE TRIBAL 13-22 BC SWSW 22-5S-4W 43-013-31548 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Lease HBP; reviewing utilityof wellbore in pending waterflood operation

UTE TRIBAL4-22 BC NWNW 22-5S-4W 43-013-30755 Jun-97 UNEcoNOMIC PRODUCTION Lease HBP; reviewingutilityof wellbore in pending waterflood operation

UTE TRIBAL9-23X BC NESE 23-SS-5W \ 43-013-30999 Nov-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Lease HBP; reviewing utilityof wellbore in pending waterflood operation

UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 SENW 4-2S-1W 43-013-30194 Jul-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold toCoastal Oil& Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 1-30CS SWNE 30-3S-5W 43-013-30475 Jul-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

UTE TRIBAL 5-1D5 SENW 5-4 43-013-30081 Jun-97 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold to Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

J. LAMICQST. 1-6B1 SENW 6-2S-1W 43-013-30210 Sep-87 UNECONOMIC PRODUCTION Sold toCoastal Oil & Gas Corp. 12/99

RECEIVED
JAN24 2000
DIVISIONOF

Page i OIL,GAS AND
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nited States Department of the a rior
BUREAU OF INDIANAFFAIRS

Utatah and Onray Agency
P. O. Box 130

988 South1500 East
Fort Duchesne,Utah 84026-0130

Phone: (435) 722-4300 Fax: (435)122-2323

IN REPLYREFERTO: FILENO,
Mineralsand Mining FileUnder
Phone: (435) 722-4310 October29,2000
Far (435)722-2809 O input Sheets

O Division Orders i
CoastalOil & Gas Corporation Q Title And Curative
Attn: CarrollWilson

.
.O1.ea.se
i

O CorrespondenceVernal,UT 84078
O Other

DearMr.Wilson: 10Analyst

Transmittedherewithforyour recordsareAssignment(s)of MiningLease for Oiland GasLease
No.(s) listedbelow. These assignment(s) were approvedon February24, 2000, for record title
onlyas indicatedin ourfiles.

LEASES NO.(S) 14-20-H62-1822,1823,1824,1825, 2881,2882, 2913, 2914, 2921, 2928,
2955, 2956, 2957 (Allotted Leases)
14-20·462-1130,1131, 1322, 1323,1329, 14-20-H62-1723,1724, 1801, 1802, 1803,18û4,
1806, 1807, 1809, 1810g 2463, 2873,2814,2894,2895,2907,3436, 4531, 4653,4664,
4672,4780 (JM leases)

ASSIGNOR: Barrett ResourcesCorp.

ASSIGNEE: Coastal Oil& GasCorporation

We have enclosed a listing of the RecordTitleInterest- By Lease, accordingto ourrecords.
This shows the companies who own an interestin theseleases,and their percentageof interest.
If ourrecordsdiffer fromyours, pleasenotifythisofficeimmediately,so that we can make any
necessary corrections.

As a reminder,we would liketo informyou ofParagraph(h) in all Oil and Gas Leases:

"Assignment. No to assign,sublet,or transferthisleaseor anyinteresthereinby
an operatingagreementor otherwisebeforerestrictionsare removed, exceptwith
the written approval of theSuperintendent...".

and,25 Code of FederalRegulations,Part 211 26, and Part212.22,Assignmentsand Overriding
Royalties.
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Page2
Assignments of
MiningLeases

(a) Approved leasesoranyinterestthereinmaybeassignedor transferredonly
with the approvalof the Secretaryof theInterior,andtoprocure such
approval the assigneemustbe quatHied toholdsuch lease under existing rules
and regulations and shallfurnisha satisfactory bondconditionedfor the
faithfulperformanceof thecovenants and conditionsthereof:

Provided, That in order for suchassignmentto receive favorableconsiderationthe
lesseeshall assigneither his whole interestor an undivided interestin thewhole
lease.

(b) NoLeaseor interesttherein or the useof suchleaseshall be assigned, sublet,or
transferred,directlyor indirectlybyworkingor drillingcontract,or otherwise,
without the consent of the SecretaryoftheInterior.

We apologizefor the long process of theseassignments.If you haveanyquestions,please
contact the Mineralsand Mining Office.

Sincerely,

e
Minerals andMining
for Superintendent

Enclosures

O
TOTEL



~ O O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING S LEASE DESIGNATION ANO SERIAL N

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNiT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use tilis fo<m for proposals to drili new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below cu<rerit bottom-hole deptli. reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposats.

L TYPE OF WELL
OfL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Exhibit "A"
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.AP1NUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILOCAT:

A South 12.00 East cny Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE. MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMAT10
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPA1R WELL

Approximale date work will start CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

Dale of work completion:
CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL.SITE OTHER: Name Chanee
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T - r _ TITLE Ÿice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE S '
¯

El Paso duction Oil & Gas Conigãñ
NAME(PLEASEPRI JOhn T er TITLE

Vice President

S1GNATURE DATE '

This space for te use only e -- . =RE EIVED
JUN : 9 2001

5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATT.ACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON TEE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECEivEO

DIVISION OF
DíL GAS AND MININ

t Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary ofState

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:
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03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. @003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOESHEREBYCERTTFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the foHowing amendmert to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that,as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:
"FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & GasCompany."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of DeJaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certincate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L. Siddaß
Vice PresidentAttest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
y , SECRETARY OF STATE

t E. Ro Assi tS
,

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSecretary FILED 11 : 00 AN 03/09/2001
w 010118394 - 0610204

UN ! 9 2001
DIVISIONOF

JL GAS AND
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't United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

CH Utah State Office RECEIVED
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 JUL12 200i
DIVISIONOF

In Reply Refer To: OIL, GAS AND MINING
3106
UTSL-065841
(UT-924)

JUL 1 0 2000

NOTICE

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company : Oil and Gas
Nine Greenway Plaza
Houston TX 77046-0095

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been received in this office concerning the name change of Coastal Oil &
Gas Corporation into El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company with El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company being the surviving entity.

For our purposes, the name change is recognized effective March 9, 2001.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the enclosed exhibit have been noted as to the name change.
The exhibit was compiled from a list of leases obtained from our computer program. We have not
abstracted the lease files to determine if the entities affected by this name change hold an interest in
the leases identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entitities are the operator on
the ground maintaining no vested recorded title or operating rights interests. We will be notifying
the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of the
change by a copy of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of operator are required by
our Field Offices, you will be contacted by them.

If you identify additional leases in which the entities maintain an interest, please contact this office
and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this



O

Due to the name change, the name of the principal/obligor on the bond is required to be changed
from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company. You may
accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.
The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

Opoloma L. Abeyta
Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Exhibit of Leases (1 pp)

cc: Moab Field Office
Vernal Field Office
MMS, Reference Data Branch, MS3130, PO Box 5860, Denver CO 80217
State of Utah, DOGM Attn: Jim Thompson (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine



Form3160-5 UN D STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMBNo. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-462-1323
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. UTE TRIBE
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well

Oil Well O Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator CEDAR RIM 12
BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION , KNA
WILLIAMSPRODUCTION RMT COMPANY, INC. 9. APIWellNo.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-013-30344

1515 ARAPAHOE ST. TOWER 3, SUITE #1000
DENVER, CO 80202 (303) 572-3900 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) CEDAR RIM
l l. County or Parish, State

1980' FNL & 1973' FEL DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT
SWNE SEC. 28, T3S, R6W

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Q Acidize Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Wel Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon SUCCESSOR OF

O Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Plug Back Q Water Disposal OPERATOR

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinentdetails, includingestimated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site isready for finalinspection.

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 1, 2000, BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION (KNAWILLIAMS PRODUCTION RMT COMPANY, INC)

WILL RELINQUISH THE OPERATORSHIP OF THE REFERENCED WELL TO COASTAL OIL AND GAS CORPORATION.

Name(Printed/Typed) Title Attorney-in-Fact

JOSEPH P. BARRETT
signatur ADP

IL 15,2002
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached. Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001, make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to maketo any departmentor agency ofthe UnitedStatesany

false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to anymatter within its



Forn*13160-5 D STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMBNo. 1004-0135

DEPARTM OF THE INTERIOR Expires .Inovember30, 2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-462-1323

O Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned we/I. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. UTE TRIBE

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE-- Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator CEDAR RIM 12
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-013-30344
P.O. BOX 1148 VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-7023 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) CEDAR RIM
11. County or Parish, State

1980' FNL & 1973' FEL DUCHESNE COUNTY,UT
SWNE SEC. 28, T3S, R6W

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, R SPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation WeUIntegnty

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon SUCCESSOR OF

O Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Plug Back Q Water Disposal OPERATOR

13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated startingdate of anyproposedwork and approximatedurationthereof
If the proposalis to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measuredand true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkersand zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or providethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedopemtions. If the opemtion resultsin a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Forn 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingteclamation, have been completed,and the operatorhas
determinedthat the site isready for finalinspection.

COASTAL OlL & GAS CORPORATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE THE OPERATOR ON THE ABOVE DESCRIBED LANDS
AND IS RESPONSlBLE UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE LEASE FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED
ON THE LEASED LANDS OR PORTIONS THEREOF, BOND COVERAGE FOR THIS WELL IS PROVIDED BY BIA
NATIONWIDE BOND NO. 114066-A, EFFECTIVE JANUARY 1, 2000.

COASTAL OlL & GAS CORPORATION WILL RELINQUISH THE OPERATORSHIP OF THE REFERENCED WELL TO
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY ON THE ABOVEDESCRIBED LANDS AND IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE LEASE FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED ON THE LEASED LANDS OR
PORTIONS THEREOF, BOND COVERAGE FOR THIS WELL IS PROVIDED BY BIA NATIONWIDE BOND NO.
103601473, EFFECTIVE MAY7, 2001.
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title
CHERYL CAMERON OPERATIONS

ignature Date

3Ñ 9 t i mN1-NN APRIL15,2002
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those lights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001,make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency ofthe UnitedStates any
false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to anymatterwithin itsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on
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United States Department of Interior
BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS

Uintah and Ouray Agency
P. O. Box 130

988 South 7500 East
Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026-0130

Phone: (435) 722-4300 Fax: (435) 722-2323

IN REPLY REFER TO:
Real Estate Services
Phone: (435) 722-4310
Fax: (435) 722-2809 JUN () 5 00

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
Attn: Cheryl Cameron
PO Box 1148
Vernal, UT 84078

Dear Ms. Cameron:

We have received copies of Sundry Notices, dated April 15, 2001, informing this office

of a change of operator for the following wells:

OPERATOR-FROM: Barrett Resources Corp. (Now known as Williams
Production RMT Corporation)

TO: Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation (Now known as El Paso
Production Oil & Gas Company)

LegalDescription Lease No. WeltNo. Location
SEC.27-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-1322 Cedar Rim11 NENE
SEC.27-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-1322 Cedar Rim11A NESW
SEC.28-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-1323 Cedar Rim12 SWNE
SEC.28-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-1323 Cedar Rim12A SESE
SEC.33-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-1328 Cedar Rim16 SWNE
SEC.34-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-1329 Cedar Rim15 SWNE
SEC.19-T1S-R2W 14-20-H62-1751 ute-4-19A2 NWSE
SEC.24-T1S-R3W 14-20-H62-1761 Ute-7-24A3 NWSE
SEC.7-T3S-R5W 14-20-H62-2389 Salaratus Wash 1-7CS SWNE
SEC.12-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-2463 UteTribalE 1-12C6 SWNE
SEG.12-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-2463 UteTribalE2-12C6
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SEC.7-T1S-R2W 14-20-H62-2811 Ute1-7A2 NESW
SEC.35-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-3436 BHUte1-35C6 SWNE
SEC.12-T4S-R5W 14-20-H62-4531 UteTribal16-12 SESE
SEC.1-T1S-R3W 14-20-H62-4664 UnityOuray1-iA3 NWSE
SEC.10-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-4707 Cedar Rim14 SWNE
SEC.10-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-4707 Cedar Rim21 SESE
SEC.25-T3S-R7W 14-20-H62-4707 BLEY2X-25C7 NESW
SEC.1-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-4780 UteTribal1-1C6 NWSE
SEC.3-T3S-R4W 14-20-H62-4869 Duchesne County UTE-1-3-C4 SENW
SEC.5-T4S-R5W 14-20-H62-4869 UteTribal5-1 S/2 SENW
SEC.25-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-4875 UteTribe1-25C6 SWNE
SEC.25-T3S-R6W 14-20-H62-4875 UteTribal2-25C6 NESW

This office concurs with the change of operator. All operations will be covered under El

Paso's Bond filed with this office, for those wells on trust property.

Please be advised that approval of this Change of Operator does not replace the Lessee(s)
of Record, nor does it relieve the Lessee(s) of Record of their responsibilities according to
lease terms and conditions.

If you have any questions regarding the above, please contact the Real Estate Office at
(435) 722-4310.

Sincerely,

Acting Superintendent

DMITCHELL/pcblack:060402
Agency Chrono
Real Estate Chrono
File Copy
Jerry Kenczka, BLM/Vernal
Energy & Minerals, Ute Tribe
Ute Distribution Corporation, Roosevelt, UT
Lisha Cordova, State of Utah ,

Theresa Thornpson, BLM/State
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. CDWe/

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 01-01-2000

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: (New Operator) TO: ( New Operator):
BARRETT RESOURCES CORP COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 1515 ARAPAHOE ST Address: PO BOX 1148 Address: PO BOX 1148
TOWER 3 STE 1000
DENVER, CO 80202 VERNAL, UT 84078 VERNAL, UT 84078
Phone: 1-(303)-572-3900 Phone: 1-(435-781-7023 Phone: 1-(435)-781-7023
Account No. N9305 Account No. (NO230) Account No. N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

SEC TWN API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL
NAME RNG NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
UTE 1-7A2 07-01S-02W 43-013-30025 5850 INDIAN OW P
UTE 4-19A2 19-01S-02W 43-013-30147 5895 INDIAN OW P
UNITA OURAY 1-1A3 01-01S-03W 43-013-30132 5540 INDIAN OW P
UTE 7-24A3 24-01S-03W 43-013-30203 5730 INDIAN OW P
SALARATUS WASH 1-7C5 07-03S-05W 43-013-30098 5480 INDIAN OW TA
UTE TRIBAL K-1 01-03S-06W 43-013-30280 4530 INDIAN OW P
CEDAR RIM 14 10-03S-06W 43-013-30345 6375 INDIAN OW S
CEDAR RIM 21 10-03S-06W 43-013-31169 10663 INDIAN OW S
UTE TRIBAL E 1-12C6 12-03S-06W 43-013-30068 8400 INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL E 2-12C6 12-03S-06W 43-013-30500 4531 INDIAN OW S
HB TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-25 25-03S-06W 43-013-30417 10704 INDIAN OW S
UTE FEDERAL 2-25 25-03S-06W 43-013-31093 10711 INDIAN OW S
CEDAR RIM 11 27-03S-06W 43-013-30352 6380 INDIAN GW S
CEDAR RIM 11A 27-03S-06W 43-013-30797 6316 INDIAN OW P
CEDARRIM 12 28-03S-06W 43-013-30344 6370 INDIAN OW S
CEDAR RIM 12A 28-03S-06W 43-013-31173 10672 INDIAN OW P
BLEY 2X-25C7 25-03S-07W 43-013-31636 11928 INDIAN OW TA
CEDAR RIM 16 33-03S-06W 43-013-30363 6390 INDIAN OW S
CEDAR RIM 15 34-03S-06W 43-013-30383 6395 INDIAN OW P
BH UTE 1-35C6 35-03S-06W 43-013-30419 10705 INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIB BRINK 5-1 (1-5D5) 05-04S-05W 43-013-30081 2305 INDIAN OW S

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCOMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 12/12/1999

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 01/10/2000

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 05/01/2002

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 05/01/2002

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/20/2002

4. Is the new operator registered in the S YES Business Number: 608186-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted coi
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6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: PLAN IN PLACE

7. Federal Wells: The BLM has approved the merger, name change, or operator change for all wells listed on
listed on Federal leases on: 06/10/2001

8. Indian Lease Wells: The BIA has approved the merger, name change, or operator change for all wells
listed on Indian leases on: 06/05/2002

9. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A

10. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

11. Underground Injection Cont The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas l 06/20/2002

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 06/20/2002

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Numbc N/A

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter or N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:



Form 3160-5
(August 1999) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14204621323
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian lottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. WellName and No.

Oil Well O Gas Well O Other CEDAR RIM 12

2. NameofOperator Contact: MARGIEHERRMANN 9. APIWellNo.
EL PASO O&G COMPANY E-Mail: Margaret.Herrmann@ElPaso.com 43-013-30344

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
PO BOX 120 Ph: 435.454.3394 CEDAR RIM
ALTAMONT, UT 84001 Fx: 435.454.3970

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
S Notice of Intent

O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
O Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete O Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANYREQUESTS THAT THE SUBJECT WELLBE PLACED ON TEMPORARILY
ABANDONSTATUS. THE WELL IS UNECONOMIC TO PRODUCE AND IS CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATION FOR ANY FUTURE
POTENTIAL.

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING RETURNED; INSUFFICIE DATA WAS SUB ITTED TO APPROVE
THE REQUESTED ACTION (see attached sheet).

June l, 2004
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #29816 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For EL PASO O&G COM =ANY,sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) MARGIE HERRMANN Title REGULATORY

Signature lectronicSubmission) Date 04/20/2004

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved By
_ _ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any depart ntwag ted
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. -J

** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMIT ÛÛ
p OlL, GAS&



INFORMATION REQUIRED
TO EXTEND SI/TA OF WELL

Well Name and Number: Cedar Rim 12
API Number: 43-013-30344
Operator: El Paso Oil and Gas Company
Reference Document: Original Sundry dated April 20, 2004, received by

DOGM on April 23, 2004

The well has been Shut-in/Temporarily Abandoned for 16 years 0 months. Insufficient
information was submitted to the Division to approve the referenced well for continued Shut-in
or Temporary Abandonment (SI/TA). The following requirements of R649-3-36 have not been
met with this request for SI/TA approval.

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1)
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has integrity,

meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level, pressure,
existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and other factors do
not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the environment. (R649-3-36-
1.3)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help qualify
your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA rule
R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram and;
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test and/or;
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and casing/casing

annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity and;
4. Fluid level in the wellbore and;
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
( 38-5

June 1, 2004
Dustin K. Doucet Date
Petroleum



FORM APPROVEDForm3160-5 UN 'ED STATES
OMBNo, 1004-0135August 1999)

DEPARTM OF THE INTERIOR : ExpiresJnovember30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Seria1No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-462-1323

Do not use thisform for proposals to dri/I or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals· UINTAHAND OURAY
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator CEDAR RIM 12
El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-013-30344
P. O. Box 120, Altamont, UT 84001 (435) 454-3394 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Wel I (Footage, Sec., T , R., M, or Survey Description) CE DAR RIM
SWNE, 1980' FNL & 197Š' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SEC. 28, T3S, R6W Î
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction O Recomplete Other

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon Revised

O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperations (clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated statting date of any proposed v«rk and approximate dumtion thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determinedthat the site is ready for final inspection

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL& GAS COMPANY IS REQUESTING AN EXTENSIONOF THE TA STATUS FOR THE SUBJECT
WELL. THE VyELLIS UNECONOMICTO PRODUCE AND IS CURRENTLY UNDER EVALUATIONFOR ANY FUTURE
POTENTIAL.
Expected length of TA status -- 5 years
Current pressures on the well bore: Casing pressure -- 7" csg 750#, 9-5/8" csg 150#; Tubing pressure -- 2-7/8" tbg 630#,
2-3/8" tbg 630#.
Fluid level shot @ 5119' in the 7" csg.
Fluid level in the 9-5/8" csg would drop down and fill the 7" csg if there were a leak in the 9-5/8" csg.

14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Margie Herrmann Regulatory
Sig Date

June 29, 2004

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

onditions of approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certiiÿ that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001,make it a crime for any person knowinglyand will nake to any department orggency ofthe United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on revers)

THIS SUNDRY IS BEING RETURNED: INSUFFICIENT DATA WAS,SUBMIT D TO A PROVE
HEE

D
ACTION (see attached sheet).

/ | s i Utah Division of Oil, Gas ahd



O O
OLENE S. WALKER

Governor

GAYLEE McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah INFORMATION REQUIRED
Department of TO EXTEND SI/TA OF WELL

Natural Resources
Well Name and Number: Cedar Rim 12

ROBERT L. MORGAN
Executive Director API Number: 43-013-30344

Operator: El Paso Production Oil and Gas Company
Division of Reference Document: Original Sundry dated June 29, 2004,

Oil, Gas & Mining received by DOGM on June 30, 2004
LOWELL R BRAXTON

Division Director

The well has been Shut-in/Temporarily Abandoned for 15 vears 2 months. Insufficient
information was submitted to the Division to approve the referenced well for continued Shut-in
or Temporary Abandonment (SI/TA). The following requirements of R649-3-36 have not been
met with this request for SI/TA approval.

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1), (this should also define why 5 years
is necessary) and

2. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has integrity,
· meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level, pressure,

existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and other factors do
not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the environment. (R649-3-36-

1.3) (how does the information provided prove integrity, what is the explanation for
the 150 psi csg pressure on the back side?)

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help qualify
your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA rule
R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram and;
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test and/or;
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and casing/casing

annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity and; (supplied but insufficient to
show integrity)

4. Fluid level in the wellbore and; (supplied but with pressures did not prove integrity)
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity. (a better

explanation of the differing pressures and how this proves integrity)

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at

October 18, 2004
ITI tin K. Doucet Date
Petroleum Engineer

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov Where ideas



Foun 316 5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED
(February2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR $Ê1, 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. InseSuialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1323

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals' UINTAHANDOURAY

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7 IfUnit or CA/Agreement,Nameand/or No.

l. Type o
1Well GasWell O OA« 8. WellNameandNa

2. Nameof EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P.
CEDAR RIM 12

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (includearea code) 43-013-30344

1099 18TH ST, STE 1900, DENVER, CO 80202 303-291-6400 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea
4 LocationofWell (Footage,Sec.,I, R.,M, orSurveyDescnpuon) CEDAR RIM

SEC. 28, T3S-R6W, SWNE, 1980' FNL, 1973' FEL H. CM or MA SW

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATURE OFNGIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Produenon (Sart/Remme) Waar Shut-OK
Noticeof Intent AlterCasmg FractureTreat Reclamation WellIntegrity

SubsequentRy Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomple Oher
ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon

O FinalAbandonmentNotice Convertto Injection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertmentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedwork andapproximate durationthereof
If theproposalis todeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurface locationsandmeasured and truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkersandzones.
AttachtheBondunderwhich thework will be performedorprovidetheBondNo. onfilewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreports must befiledwithin 30days
followingcompletion oftheinvolvedoperations.If theoperationresultsin a multiplecompletionor recompletion ina newinterval,a Fonn 316tMmustbefiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesmust befiledonlyatter allrequirements, includmgreclamation, havebeencompleted, andtheoperator has
determinedthatthesite is ready forfmalinspection.)

OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATION TO PLUG AgXBANDOWPHE SUBJECT WELI PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHED
PROCEDURES.

RECElVED
Accelytzd by th OCT2O2006
Utah Division o

-- he
Oil, Gas and Mining Federal

Ne ssaw DN.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I herebycertify thattheforegoingis trueand correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

R T. BECHTEL Title ASSOCIATE ANALYST

Signature 10/16/2006

/ THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title Date
Conditionsof approval,if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrantor
certifythatthe applicantholdslegalor equitable titleto thoserights in thesubjectleas© Office
which wouldentitlethe applicantto conduct operations thereon.
Title 18US.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crimefor anypenon loowmgly and willfullytomaketo any departmentor agency of the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentations as toanymatterwithin its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page



SO Production

PLUG AND ABANDONMENT PROGNOSIS

CEDAR RIM 12
API #: 4301330344
SW NE SEC 28-T3S-R6W
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WELL DATA:
ELEVATIONS: GL 6194' KB 6204'
FORMATION TOPS: GREEN RIVER TGR3 @5244', WASATCH @6978'
TD: 9500'
PBTD: 9467'
HOLE/CASING SIZES:

13.75" hole 10 .75" 40.5# N-80 @570'with 290 sxs cement
UNK hole 7 5/8" 26.4, 29.7 N-80 @7110' with 300 sxs cement

TOC UNKNOWN
6.75" hole 5" 18# N-80 @9498' with 187 sxs cement

5" 18# TOL @6879'

PERFS: 6978-7970 OPEN
6978-8830' PARTIALLY COVERED
7128-8780 PARTIALLY COVERED
9100-9146' SQ30 SX 3/75

PACKERS & PLUGS:

CIBP @7990' 10/86

WELL HAS BEEN REPORTED AS SHUT IN SINCE 3/1989

CEMENT DESIGN: Class G Cement, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 FT3/SX. Displace with corrosion inhibited
produced water.

ABANDONMENT PROGNOSIS:

1. Notify BLM and DOGM of P&A operations at least 24 hrs prior to starting abandonment
operations.

2. MIRUPU. Blow well down to tank and remove wellhead equipment. NU BOPE.
TOOH w/ 2 3/8" SEAL LOCK TBG. Use slip type



3. Release TAC set at 6856' and TOOH. Note: it is not clear if TAC is in the well.
4. TIH w/ 7 5/8" CICR and set at 6800'. Mix and pump 35 sx class G. Pump 30 sx through

CICR and spot 5 sx on top. Fill and roll hole with corrosion inhibited produced water.

5. Shoot squeeze holes at 5300'. TIH w/ CICR to 5250' and pump 50 SX class G w/ 2%
CaCl2, 45 sx into CICR and spot 5 SX on top.

6. Free point 7"at approximately 620' and lay down. TIH w/ TBG to 50' inside 7" stub and
spot 100'-150' plug: 50' across stub, (across open hole if any) and 50' into 10.75"
surface casing with 60 sx Class G w/ 2% CC. WOC and tag plug. TOOH.

7. TIH w/ 10.75" CICR to 10' above Stub Plug and set 10 sx ClassG w/ 2% on top.

8. TOOH to 100'. Mix and spot 50 sxs Class G w/ 2% CC in mix water. Cement surface
annulus via 1" tubing if necessary.

9. Cut off casing 3' below ground level and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate to include
CEDAR RIM 12A, SWSE Sec 3 T3S R6W, Lease # 1420H621323, and El Paso as
operator. RDMOL.

10. Restore



O
nn 31600- UNITED STATES OOM 10RO 13D7

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
14-20-H62-1323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an UINTAH & OURAY

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE -- Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well Gas Well O Other CEDAR RIM 12
2. Name of Overator 9. API Well No.
EL PASO E&P COMAPNY, L.P. 4301330344

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
1099 18TH ST., STE. 1900, DENVER, CO 80202 303-291-6400 CEDAR RIM

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M.,or Survey Description) 11. Country or Parish, State
SEC.28, T3S, R6W
SWNE, 1980' FNL, 1973' FEL DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent
Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrhy

Subsequent Report
Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other CANCEL NOI

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Ternporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

OPERATOR REQUESTS TO CANCEL NOI APPROVED 10/24/2006 TO P&A SUBJECT WELL.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

OiL Gas and Mining

For Record Only
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)
SHANELLE DEATER

Title ENGINEERING TECH

Signature Date 12/04/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by

fitle Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached, Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any depart d States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) DECO9 2 08
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&





API Well No: 43013303440000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1323 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CEDAR RIM 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 CEDAR RIM 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1980 FNL 1973 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EL PASO E & P COMPANY WISHES TO CANCEL THE NOTICE OF INTENT TO
PLUG AND ABANDON THE SUBJECT WELL, SUBMITTED IN jULY, 2009. EL

PASO IS PREPARING TO STUDY AND EVALUATE THE POSSIBILITY OF
CONVERTING THE WELL TO A SALT WATER DISPOSAL WELL. WHEN THE

DETERMINATION HAS BEEN FINALIZED, WE WILL SUBMIT THE APPROPRIATE
PAPERWORK TO APPLY FOR THE SWD PERMIT, WHICH MAY BE THROUGH THE

EPA.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 11/14/2010

November 14, 2010

November 15, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013303440000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DE2-13N2A3TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well CEDAR RIM 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext CEDAR RIM

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1980 FNL 1973 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.05 Range: 06.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO E & P COMPANY WISHES TO CANCEL THE NOTICE OF INTENT TO
PLUG AND ABANDON THE SUB1ECT WELL, SUBMITTED IN jULY, 2009. EL Accepted by the

PASO IS PREPARING TO STUDY AND EVALUATE THE POSSIBILITY OF Utah Division of
CONVERTING THE WELL TO A SALT WATER DISPOSAL WELL. WHEN THÕil,Gas and Mining

DETERMINATION HAS BEEN FINALIZED, WE WILL SUBMIT THE APPRO R RE OPAPERWORK TO APPLY FOR THE SWD PERMIT, WHICH MAY BE THROU er n
EPA.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 11/14/2010

RECEIVED November 14,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012
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El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1323 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CEDAR RIM 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 CEDAR RIM 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1980 FNL 1973 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10 /1 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 November 2010, EP requested that the NOI to P&A be cancelled to
review for injection. BLM rejected EP's proposal and therefore the well

needs to be P&A'd. EP requests approval to P&A well as previously
approved.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8 /22 /2012

August 27, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14-20-H62-1323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well CEDAR RIM 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EPENERGYE&PCOMPANY,L.P. 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext CEDAR RIM

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1980 FNL 1973 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/1/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

November 2010, EP requested that the NOI to P&A be cancelled to Accepted by the
review for injection. BLM rejected EP's proposal and therefore the well utah Division of

needs to be P&A'd. EP requests approval to P&A well as previously oil, Gas and Mining

approved. Date: August 27, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/22/2012

RECEIVED: Aug. 22,



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

Fa 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED
(Febmary2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E OQg

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS * 20 "' 1323

Do not use thIs form for proposals to drIll or to re-enteran 6. lf Indian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals· UINTAH ANDOURAY

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

1. Type o
ilWellr E GmWel 8. Wel NameandNa

2. NameofOperatorEL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P.
CEDAR IUM 12

31 Address 3b. PhoneNo. (includearea code) 43-013-30344

1099 18TH ST, STE 1900, DENVER, CO 80202 303-291-6417 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea
4. Locationof Well (Footage,Sec.,T, R.,M. or SroveyDescription) CE DAR RIM

SEC. 28, T3S-R6W, SWNE, 1980' FNL, 1973' FEL 11, Countyor Parish, State

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGIICE, REPORT, OR OTTIERDATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acida Deepen Proddon (Surt/Reume) WaterShut-Off
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTreat Reclamation WenIntegay

O sumuentRepon O c.ins Reper O NesvConstmodon Recomplete Other
O ChangeMans PlugandAbandon TemporarilyAbandonO FinalAbandonmentNäe Convento Iniection PlugBack WaterEsposal

13. DesciibeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartíngdateofanyproposedwork andapproximatedurationthereof
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyorrecomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtruevertical depthsof allpertinentmarkersandzones.
AttachtheBondunderwhichtheworkwill beperformedorprovidetheBondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreports must befiledwithin30days
followmgcompletionof the involvedoperations.[ftheoperationresultsina multiplecompletionor recompletionina newintelval,a Form3160-4must be filedonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesmustbefiledonlyafterallrequirements,includingreclamation,havebeencompleted,andtheoperatorhas
determinedthatthesiteismadyforfinalinspection.)

EL PASO REQUESTS APPROVAL TO PLUG AND ABANDON THE SUBJECT WELL PER THE ATTACHED PROCEDURE.
THIS NOI SUPERSEDES ANY OTHER NOI FOR P&A AS THE PROCEDURE HAS CHANGED.

14. I herebycertify that the foregoingis true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

MARIE OKEEFE Title SR REGULATORY ANALYST

Si Date 07/02/2009

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Appnwed tg pgg( DateJUL1 0 2009
Conditionso val, hed Approvalof thisnotLce doesnotwanant or
certifythat thefpplicant legalor equitabletitleto thoserightsin the subjectlease Office
which would entitJethe applicanttoconductoperationsthereon.
Title 18U.SC. Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Secdon1212,makeit a crimefor anypersonknowinglyand willfullyto maketo any departmentor agencyof the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulent statementsor representationsasto anymatterwithin its junsdiction.
(Instructions on page 2)



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

eÝpasoerosseron

PLUG AND ABANDONMENT PROGNOSIS

CEDAR RIM 12
API #: 4301330344
LAT 11:32.9 LONG l10:33:54.61
SW NE SEC 28-T3S-R6W
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WELL DATA:
ELEVATIONS: GL 6194' KB 6204'
FORMATION TOPS: GREEN RIVER RV 2402', TN1 3140', TGR3 @5244',
WASATCH @6978'
TD: 9500'
PBTD: 9467'
HOLE/CASING SIZES:

13.75" hole 10 3/4" 40.5# N-80 @570'with 290 SXS cement
9.875 hole 7 5/8" 26.4, 29.7 J-55, N-80 @7110' with 300 SXS cement

TOC UNKNOWN
6.75" hole 5" 18# N-80 @9498' with 187 SXS cement

5" 18# TOL @6879'

PERFS: 6372-6950' 1/09
6978-7970'
6978-8830'
7128-8780'
9100-9146' SQ30 SX 3/75

PACKERS & PLUGS:
CICR @6970' w/ 10' CMT 1/09
CIBP @7990' 10/86

WELL HAS BEEN REPORTED AS SHUT IN SINCE 1/2009

CEMENT DESIGN: Class G Cement, 15.8 PPG, 1.15 FT3/SX. Displace with corrosion
inhibited produced water.

ABANDONMENT



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

1. Notify BLM and DOGM of P&A operations at least 24 hrs prior to starting abandonment
operations.

2. MIRUPU. Blow well down to tank and remove wellhead equipment. Release pump and
lay down rods. NU BOPE. Fill and roll hole with corrosion inhibited produced water.

3. Release TAC set at 6100' and TOOH w/ 2 7/8" N80 EUE TBG.

4. Plug #1. Establish injection rate. Set 7 5/8" CICR @6320'. Squeeze perforations w/ 75
SXS Class G cement. Pump 60 SXS through CICR and spot 15 SXS on top. If unable to
establish injection rate, spot plug #1 6422-6222' w/ 50 SXS Class G cement (2% CC
optional). WOC and tag w/ tubing.

5. Plug #2. Shoot squeeze holes at 5700'. Establish injection rate. Set 7 5/8" CICR @
5650'. Pump 75 SXS Class G cement. Squeeze 60 SXS into CICR and spot 15 SXS on
top. If unable_to establish injection rate, spot plug #2 5750-5550' w/ 50 SXS Class G
cement (2% CC optional). WOC and tag w/ tubing.

6. Plug #3. Spot 100' stabilizer plug 2750-2650' w/ 25 SXS Class G cement (2% CC
optional). WOC and tag w/ tubing.

7. Plug #4. Shoot squeeze holes @1220'. Establish injection rate. TIH w/ CICR to l170'
and pump 75 SXS Class G cement, 60 SXS into CICR and spot 15 SXS on top.

8. Free point, cut 7 5/8"at 620' and lay down. TIH w/ TBG to 670'.

9. Plug #5. Spot 100'-150' plug 50' inside stub, (50' across open hole if any) and 50' into
surface casing with 60 SXS Class G w/ 2% CC. WOC and tag plug w/ tubing. TOOH.

10. RIH w/ 9 7/8" bit to TOC.

11. Plug #6. Set 10 3/4" CICR above Stub Plug and set 10 SXS Class G cement on top.

12. TOOH to 100'. Mix and spot 50 SXS Class G w/ 2% CC. Cement surface annulus via
1" tubing if necessary.

13. Cut off casing 3' below ground level and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate to include
CEDAR RIM 12, SWSE Sec 28 T3S R6W, Lease # 1420H621323, and El Paso as
operator. RDMOL.

14. Restore



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

WELL NAME:CEDARRIM 12
AS IS

SEC 28 T3S RGW
LAT it:32.9 LONG110:33:54.61
DUCHESNECOUNTY, UT
API# 4301330344

GL6194
KBS204 HOLESIZE PIPESIZE WEIGHT TYPE SETDEPTH

13 314" 10 314" 40.58 N 80 57&
9 7/8" 7 518" 29.7#,26.48 N.80,J.S$ 711¥
6 3/4" 5" 18# N.80 9498'
TOL 8" 185 N·80 8877

SURFACE 10 3/4 40.55 NJ0 570

PERFORATIONS
TN1 @ 3140 ÞERFB 9100-9146 SO 2/75

PERFS 7128°-8780 3/75
TGR3@$244 PERFS 6978'4830 10/78

COP 799W 10188
CISP 6970 1/09

TOC UNKNOWN PERFS $3724950 lies
OPEN PERFS 63724950

7 Sto" TAC 6100 EOT © 6425

PERFS 6372.6980

TOL 5" 188 NJ0 6879'
5" CICR W11W CEMENT 6970 1/09
WASATCH 6978
PERFS 6978'-7970

INTERMEDIATE 7 5/8" 2910,2845 N40,J-SS 7110'

CEP 7990 10/86

PERF$ 7128'-8780 3/75

PERFS SO 30 SX 9100 -9148 3/15

PSTD $447

UNER 5" 18# 1440 9495'
TO 9500

BMSGW
BNT148 Fg7102'11174

NOTE: NOT TO SCALE
TBG DETAE..2109

2 TW SOLID PLUG g 6426
E 3/4" MOGO
2 JTS 2 7tS" N80 EUE
4112"PBGA
6'TBGSUB,SN@S322'
7JTS2718"TBG
7 Sli" TAC & E100'
198 JTS 2 718" NBO



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

WELL NAME: CEDAR RIM 12
PROPOSED PSA

SEC 28 T38 R6W
LAT 11:32.9 LONG 110:33:54 61
DUCHESNECOUNTY.I.fT
Arts asotasaare

GL $194 / PLUG $7 100°-SURFACE Wt 50 SXS CLASS G
KB 6204 / HOLEstLE PIPE SEE WEIGHT TYPE SET DEPT14

13 3/4* 10 3/4" 40.88 N-80 $10
9718" 753" 29.7#,26.48 N-80,J-55 7110
6 3/4* 5" 18# N40 9498
TOL S 188 NJO 8879

PLUG 88 10 314" CICR @520' Wi 10 SXS ON TOP

SURFACE 10 3/4 40M N-80 670'

PLUG #5 $70'.620 Wl 60 SXS CLASS G

PLUG 84 7 US" CICR @1170' WI 60SXS CLASS G WTO AND 15 SXS ON TOP
SQHOLESg1220'
ÞLUG 53 2750-2650 WI 25 sxs CLASS G PERFORATIONS
TN1@3140' PERFS 9100-9146 80 2/75

PERFS 7128 4780 3/75
TGR3 g 5244' PERFS 6978 -8830 10/78
PLUG #2 7 Sit' CICR @ 5650 Wi 50 SXS CLASS G WTO AND 15 SXS ON TOP CIBP 7990 10/86
SO HOLES @ 5700' CIBP 8970 1/09
TOC UNKNOWN PERFS 63724950 1/09

OPEN PERFS 83724950

PLUG #1 7 6/8" CICR @ 4320' WI 60 SXS CLASS G INTO AND 15 SXS ON TOP

PERFS 6372-6950'

TOL 5" 18# F&40 6879'
5"CFCRWl10'CEMENT 6970' 1/09
WASATCH 6978'
PERFS 6978'-7970

INTERMEOlATE 7 W8" 29.7#.26M N,80,J-SS 7110"

C18P 7990 1&85

PERFS 7128'4780 3175

PERFS SQ 30 SX 9100'-9148 3175

PSTO 9487

LINER 5 185 N40 94986

TD 9600

BMsGW
EHT148'FQ7102'11174

NOTE: NOTTO SCALË
TEG DETAIL 2109

2 7/8" SOLID PLUG g t42S
5 3/4" NO GO
2 JTS 2 718" NOGEUE
41/2"PBGA
6' TBG BUB, SN © 6327
7 JTS 2 718" TUG
7 WS"TAC @6100'
195 JTS 2 7/B" NBO



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR WELL ABANDONMENT

Company El Paso E & P Company Location: SWNE, See. 28 T3S R6W
Well No. Cedar Rim 12 Lease No. 14-20-H62-1323

GOVERNMENT CONTACTS
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT - VERNAL FIELD OFFICE

170 South 500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078 (435) 781-4400

Petroleum Engineer: Ryan Angus Cell: 828-7368 Office: 781-4430
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Cell: 828-7875 Office: 781-4432
Suprv. I&E Inspector: Bill Owens Cell: 828-7630 Office: 781-4498
Suprv. I&E Inspector: Jamie Sparger Cell: 828-3913 Office: 781-4502

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE GIVEN TO
YOUR FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO ENSURE COMPLIANCE

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

1. Spot 30 sx of cement on all CICR's set to cover formation tops.

SITE SPECIFIC SURFACE CONDITION OF APPROVAL

1. Restore location as per the surface management agency's requirements

2. Contact Bureau of Indian Affairs (BIA) if this is Indian Trust Surface for reclamation
requirements at 435-722-4312, Johnna Blackhair, Realty Officer.

3. Operator and subcontractors will need Ute Indian Tribe business license and/or access pennits.

STANDARD CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

l. This office shall be notified sufficiently in advance of actual plugging work so that a representative
may have an opportunity to witness the operation. If time permits, please try to notify this office at
least 24 hours in advance of rigging up. Notify Jamie Sparger or Bill Owens

2. You shall notify the Fort Duchesne Office of the BIA, 435-722-4320, at least 48 hours prior to
initiating the plugging procedure.

3. You shall notify the Ute Indian Tribe Energy & Minerals Office, Kermit Wopsock, 435-725-4999 or
435-725-4950, at least 48 hours prior to initiating the plugging procedure.

4. Prior to perforating any casing string, adequate BOPs, lubricators, and controls shall be



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

5. If paraffin or scale deposits are detected while pulling the tubing or anyother production equipment
out of the wellbore, hot water treatments and/or scraper runs shall be conducted before placing any
cement plugs.

6. All cement used for plugging shall be Class "G".

7. It will be left to the discretion of the BLM representative on location while plugging as to
whether or not any of the plugs shall need to be tagged.

8. A GPS re-verification and certification of the abandoned well location shall be made for the
Latitude and Longitude coordinates with accuracy to the sixth decimal place. This well location
re-verification shall be noted on the Subsequent Sundry Notice of Abandonment.

9. Upon completion of the approved plugging program, a dry hole marker shall be installed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6(b) and clean up the site. The marker shall be a flat plate (with a
weep hole) not less than 1/4 inch in thickness and large enough to contain all of the information
identified below and shall be buried a minimum of three (3) foot below re-contoured surface level.
Pits must be fenced unless approved otherwise by the authorized officer.

10. The following minimum information will be permanently and legibly placed on the marker with a
plate, cap or welded bead:

A. Name of the operator.
B. Lease serial number.
C. Well number.
D. Surveyed description of the well; section, township and range and either footages or quarter-

quarter section.

11. Within 30 days after well bore plugging operations have been completed, Form 3160-5 (formerly
Form 9-331), Subsequent Report of Abandonment, shall be submitted to this office.The report must
show the location of all plugs or any mechanical setting device, quantity and type of cement and
additives in each plug, amount of casing or any tubulars left in the hole, methods used to test plugs
and test results, and the status of the surface restoration. If a temporary delay in the removal of
equipment or surface cleanup is deemed necessary, so justifyin your report. This abandonment
report will be approved by this office with surface stipulations. Liability for the well shall not be
released until the surface management agency approves the actual site rehabilitation.

12. If not previously filed, submit in duplicate, Form 3160-4 (formerlyForm 9-330),Well completion or
Recompletion Report and Log, well history, electric logs, any other surveys, and, if taken, core
analysis. This completion report must be filed within 30 days after the culmination of downhole
plugging



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Form 3160-5
(August 2007) UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well.  Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0135
Expires: July 31, 2010

5.  Lease Serial No.
14204621323

6.  If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
UINTAH AND OURAY

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7.  If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1.  Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other

8. Well Name and No.
CEDAR RIM 12

2.  Name of Operator
EL PASO E&P COMPANY LP

Contact: MARIE  OKEEFE
E-Mail: MARIE.OKEEFE@ELPASO.COM

9.  API Well No.
43-013-30344-00-S1

3a.  Address
1099 18TH STREET, ST. 1900
DENVER, CO  80202

3b.  Phone No. (include area code)
Ph:  303.291.6417

10.  Field and Pool, or Exploratory
CEDAR RIM

4.  Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL

11.  County or Parish, and State

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

12.  CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent

Subsequent Report

Final Abandonment Notice

Acidize

Alter Casing

Casing Repair

Change Plans

Convert to Injection

Deepen

Fracture Treat

New Construction

Plug and Abandon

Plug Back

Production (Start/Resume)

Reclamation

Recomplete

Temporarily Abandon

Water Disposal

Water Shut-Off

Well Integrity

Other

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations.  If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed.  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

EL PASO E & P WISHES TO CANCEL THE NOTICE OF INTENT TO PLUG AND ABANDON THE SUBJECT WELL, SUBMITTED
7/2/09.  EL PASO IS PREPARING TO STUDY AND EVALUATE THE POSSIBILITY OF CONVERTING THE WELL TO A
SALT WATER DISPOSAL WELL.  WHEN THE DETERMINATION HAS BEEN FINALIZED, WE WILL SUBMIT THE
APPROPRIATE PAPERWORK TO APPLY FOR THE SWD PERMIT, WHICH MAY BE THROUGH THE EPA.

14.  I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #97418 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For EL PASO E&P COMPANY LP,  sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by ROBIN R. HANSEN on 11/16/2010 (11RRH0458SE)

Name (Printed/Typed) MARIE  OKEEFE Title SR REGULATORY ANALYST

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 11/14/2010

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved By TitleDENIED DENIED
DENIED Date 01/20/2011

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.  Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office Vernal

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED **

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000
3st16200057) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT .

Expires: July 31, 2010
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14204621323
Do not use this form for poposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Ind an AnoNueeor TribeYName

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well O Gas Well O Other CEDAR RIM 12

2. NameofOperator Contact: MARIE OKEEFE 9. APIWellNo.
EL PASO E&P COMPANY LP E-Mail: MARIE.OKEEFE@ELPASO.COM 43-013-30344-00-S1

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
1099 18TH STREET, ST. 1900 Ph: 303.291.6417 CEDAR RIM
DENVER, CO 80202

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

. O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
Notice of Intent

O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
O Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

EL PASO E & P WISHES TO CANCEL THE NOTICE OF INTENT TO PLUG AND ABANDON THE SUBJECT WELL, SUBMITTED
7/2/09. EL PASO IS PREPARING TO STUDY AND EVALUATETHE POSSIBILITY OF CONVERTING THE WELL TO A
SALT WATER DISPOSAL WELL. WHEN THE DETERMINATION HAS BEEN FINALIZED, WE WILL SUBMIT THE
APPROPRIATE PAPERWORK TO APPLY FOR THE SWD PERMIT, WHICH MAYBE THROUGH THE EPA.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #97418 verifie.! by the BLM Well Information System

For EL PASO E&P COMPI NY LP, sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by ROEIN R. HANSEN on 11/16/2010 (11RRHO458SE)

Name(Printed/Typed) MARIE OKEEFE Title SR REGULATORY ANALYST

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 11/14/2010

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved By_ D_E_NIE_D_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

TitieDE ED Date 01/20/2011
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office Vernal
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED **

RECEIVED: Aug. 22,



RECEIVED: Aug. 22, 2012

Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for Sundry Notice #97418

Operator Submitted BLM Revised (AFMSS)

Sundry Type: OTHER OTHER
NOI NOI

Lease: 14204621323 14204621323

Agreement:

Operator: EL PASO E & P COMPANY EL PASO E&P COMPANY LP
1099 18TH ST STE 1900 1099 18TH STREET, ST. 1900
DENVER, CO  80202 DENVER, CO  80202
Ph:  303-291-6417 Ph:  303-291-6417

Admin Contact: MARIE  OKEEFE MARIE  OKEEFE
SR REGULATORY ANALYST SR REGULATORY ANALYST
E-Mail: marie.okeefe@elpaso.com E-Mail: MARIE.OKEEFE@ELPASO.COM

Ph:  303-291-6417 Ph:  303.291.6417

Tech Contact: MARIE  OKEEFE MARIE  OKEEFE
SR REGULATORY ANALYST SR REGULATORY ANALYST
E-Mail: marie.okeefe@elpaso.com E-Mail: MARIE.OKEEFE@ELPASO.COM

Ph:  303-291-6417 Ph:  303.291.6417

Location:
State: UT UT
County: DUCHESNE DUCHESNE

Field/Pool: BLUE BELL/ALTAMONT CEDAR RIM

Well/Facility: CEDAR RIM 12 CEDAR RIM 12
Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL

Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 29131 API Well Number: 43013303440000

Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for Sundry Notice #97418

Operator Submitted BLM Revised (AFMSS)

Sundry Type: OTHER OTHER
NOI NOI

Lease: 14204621323 14204621323

Agreement:

Operator: EL PASO E & P COMPANY EL PASO E&P COMPANY LP
109918THSTSTE 1900 109918THSTREET,ST.1900
DENVER, CO 80202 DENVER, CO 80202
Ph: 303-291-6417 Ph: 303-291-6417

Admin Contact: MARIE OKEEFE MARIE OKEEFE
SR REGULATORY ANALYST SR REGULATORY ANALYST
E-Mail: marie.okeefe@elpaso.com E-Mail: MARIE.OKEEFE@ELPASO.COM

Ph: 303-291-6417 Ph: 303.291.6417

Tech Contact: MARIE OKEEFE MARIE OKEEFE
SR REGULATORY ANALYST SR REGULATORY ANALYST
E-Mail: marie.okeefe@elpaso.com E-Mail: MARIE.OKEEFE@ELPASO.COM

Ph: 303-291-6417 Ph: 303.291.6417

Location:
State: UT UT
County: DUCHESNE DUCHESNE

Field/Pool: BLUE BELLIALTAMONT CEDAR RIM

Well/Facility: CEDAR RIM 12 CEDAR RIM 12
Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL Sec 28 T3S R6W SWNE 1980FNL 1973FEL

RECEIVED: Aug. 22,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1323 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CEDAR RIM 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 CEDAR RIM 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1980 FNL 1973 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

10/11 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8 /17 /2014

August 18, 2014

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14-20-H62-1323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well CEDAR RIM 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext CEDAR RIM

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1980 FNL 1973 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

10/11/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
August 18, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/17/2014

RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

Cedar Rim 12 
43013303440000 
 
 

 POOH with 2 7/8”.  RIH with CICR and set @ 6320’.  Established injection rate.  Mixed and 
pumped 90 sx class G 1.05 yield cement.  20 sx below & 70 sx above retainer.  Reversed clean.  
Tagged cement @ 6246’.  Pressure tested plug to 1000 psi – good test. 

 Shot 4 holes in casing @ 5699’.  Could not establish injection.  Glade Rich with BLM approved to 
pump 50 sx of cement from 5750’-cement top. 

 Shot 4 holes I casing @ 1220’.  Pumped 50 sx of class G 1.05 yield spotting balanced plug with 
bottom @ 5750’.  Tagged plug @ 5530’ (220’ plug).  POOH to 2754’ and pumped 30 sx class G 
cement and taged plug @ 2652’. 

 Set CICR @ 1174’ and pumped 90 sx class G cement.. 
 Cut 7 5/8” casing @ 620’.  TIH to 669’ and pumped 60 sx class G cement.  Tagged cement @ 

620’.  Pumped 55 more sx class G cement.  Tagged cement @ 314’ (355’ plug).  Tested plug to 
400 psi. 

 TIH to 165’ and pumped surface plug with 80 sx of class G cement.  Installed dry hole plate 
below surface. 

 

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

Cedar Rim 12
43013303440000

> POOH with 2 7/8". RIH with CICR and set @ 6320'. Established injection rate. Mixed and
pumped 90 sx class G 1.05 yield cement. 20 sx below & 70 sx above retainer. Reversed clean.
Tagged cement @ 6246'. Pressure tested plug to 1000 psi-good test.

> Shot 4 holes in casing @ 5699'. Could not establish injection. Glade Rich with BLM approved to
pump 50 sx of cement from 5750'-cement top.

> Shot 4 holes I casing @ 1220'. Pumped 50 sx of class G 1.05 yield spotting balanced plug with
bottom @ 5750'. Tagged plug @ 5530' (220' plug). POOH to 2754' and pumped 30 sx class G
cement and taged plug @ 2652'.

> Set CICR @ 1174' and pumped 90 sx class G cement..
> Cut 7 5/8" casing @ 620'. TlH to 669' and pumped 60 sx class G cement. Tagged cement @

620'. Pumped 55 more sx class G cement. Tagged cement @ 314' (355' plug). Tested plug to
400 psi.

> TlH to 165' and pumped surface plug with 80 sx of class G cement. Installed dry hole plate
below surface.

RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) 

does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the 

possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this 

report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD

 CEDAR RIM 12

  CEDAR RIM 12

   P&A LAND

Operation Summary Report

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
CEDAR RIM 12
CEDAR RIM 12
P&A LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user's own risk.

RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

CENTRAL DIVISIONCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

CEDAR RIM 12Well

CEDAR RIM 12SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event P&A LANDMAGNA/026Rig Name/No.

Start date 10/4/2012 End date 10/12/1970

10/28/1974Spud Date/Time UWI 028-003-S 006-W 30

Active datum KB @6,204.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

142999/34566 / CEDAR RIM #12

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(ft)

Operation

10/5/2012 10:00  6:00 20.00 FB 19 P RU FLOW BACK IRON TO FLOW BACK TANK SIP @ 3400 PSIG 

FLOW BACK TTL OF 493 BBLS WELL CURRENTLY DEAD. ( RIG 

MOVED & SPOTTED IN EQUIPMENT )

10/6/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIGGING UP )

 7:30  8:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P RIG UP

 8:30  9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 16 P NU TESTED BOPE

 9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PUMU & RIH 6 5/8" BIT, BIT SUB  199 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG

14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 199 JTS 2-7/8" BIT SUB, BIT, PUMU & RIH W/ 7 5/8" 

CICR, 198 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG SET @ 6320'. STING OUT, 

BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE CLEAN, STING INTO, PUMP 

DOWN TBG TO ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE, RETURN UP 

CASING. (TALKED TO MICHEAL LEE W/ BLM & RYAN KRUG W/ 

EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP 90 SX CEMENT 20 BELOW 

& 70 ABOVE RETAINER. TAG CEMENT MONDAY )

18:30 19:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MIX AND PUMP 90 SX CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD, 

SPOT 20 BELOW AND 70 ABOVE RETAINER, POOH W/ 40 JTS, 

REVERSE CLEAN.

10/7/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/8/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/9/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (RIGGING UP WIRELINE AND 

PERFORATING) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP IN TO TAG CEMRNT. TAGGED CEMENT @ OF PLUG 1 @ 

6246'.  PRESURE TEST PLUG TO 1000 PSI. TEST GOOD

 8:00  9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TUBING

 9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCK AND SHOOT 4 HOLES IN CASING @ 

5699". POOH WITH WIRELINE TRUCK.

11:00 11:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL CASING WITH 8 BBLS TPW AND PUMP UPTO 1500 PSI 

ATTEMPTING ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE. NO RATE COULD BE 

ESTABLISHED.  (TALKED TO GLADE RICH  W/ BLM & RYAN 

KRUG W/ EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP 50 SX CEMENT 

FROM 5750'TO CEMENT TOP.)

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND SHOOT 4 HOLES IN CASING @ 1220' AND 

RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK

 1August 12, 2014 at  2:22 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv CENTRAL DIVISION

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well CEDAR RIM 12
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site CEDAR RIM 12
Rig Name/No. MAGNA/026 Event P&A LAND

Start date 10/4/2012 End date 10/12/1970

Spud Date/Time 10/28/1974 UWI 028-OO3-S OO6-W30

Active datum KB @6,204.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 142999/34566 / CEDAR RIM #12
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
10/5/2012 10:00 6:00 20.00 FB 19 P RU FLOW BACK IRON TO FLOW BACK TANK SIP @ 3400 PSIG

FLOW BACK TTL OF 493 BBLS WELL CURRENTLY DEAD. ( RIG
MOVED & SPOTTED IN EQUIPMENT)

10/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CTTGSM&JSA(RIGGINGUP)
7:30 8:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P RIG UP
8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 16 P NU TESTED BOPE
9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PUMU & RIH 6 5/8" BIT, BIT SUB 199 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG
14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl199 JTS 2-7/8" BIT SUB, BIT, PUMU & RIH Wl7 5/8"

CICR, 198 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG SET @6320'. STING OUT,
BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE CLEAN, STING INTO, PUMP
DOWN TBG TO ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE, RETURN UP
CASING. (TALKED TO MICHEAL LEE W/ BLM & RYAN KRUG W/
EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP90 SX CEMENT 20 BELOW
& 70 ABOVE RETAINER. TAG CEMENT MONDAY)

18:30 19:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MIXAND PUMP90 SX CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD,
SPOT 20 BELOWAND 70 ABOVE RETAINER, POOH Wl40 JTS,
REVERSE CLEAN.

10/7/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/8/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/9/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREWTRAVEL,SAFETYMEETING(RIGGINGUPWIRELINEAND
PERFORATING) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP IN TO TAG CEMRNT. TAGGED CEMENT @ OF PLUG 1 @
6246'. PRESURE TEST PLUG TO 1000 PSI. TEST GOOD

8:00 9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TUBING
9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCKAND SHOOT4 HOLES IN CASING @

5699". POOH WITH WIRELINE TRUCK.
11:00 11:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL CASING WITH 8 BBLS TPWAND PUMP UPTO 1500 PSI

ATTEMPTING ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE. NO RATE COULD BE
ESTABLISHED. (TALKED TO GLADE RICH W/ BLM & RYAN
KRUG W/ EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP 50 SX CEMENT
FROM 5750'TO CEMENT TOP.)

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND SHOOT 4 HOLES IN CASING @ 1220' AND
RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK

August 12, 2014 at 2:22 pm 1
RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(ft)

Operation

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP INTO WELL WITH TUBING TO 5,750'.  MIX AND PUMP 50 SX 

CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD,. SPOTTING BALANCED 

PLUG WITH BOTTOM @ 5,750'.

13:30 16:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH WIT 30 JOINTS TUBING AND REVERSE CIRCULATE 

TUBING CLEAN

10/10/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (TRIPPING PIPE AND RIGGING 

DOWN FLOOR SAFELY) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG #2 @ 5530' FOR @ 220' PLUG

 8:00 12:30 4.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH TO  2754' AND PUMP 30 SX CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% 

CC. PULL OUT OF PLUG  WITH TUBING AND LET PLUG SET FOR 

3 1/2 HOURS.

12:30 13:30 1.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG @ 2652'

13:30 14:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH WITH TUBING AND PICK UP 7 5/8" CICR.

14:00 16:00 2.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO WELL AND SET 7 5/8" CICR @ 1174' AND PUMP 90 SX 

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC (60 SX INTO RETAINER AND 

SPOTTED 30 SX ON CICR. POOH WITH TUBING AND CICR 

SETTING TOOL

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBREMD 30 P WORK ON WELL HEAD TO PREPARE TO PULL CASING AND 

CONTINUE PLUGGING OPERATIONS

10/11/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (REMOVING WELLHEAD) 

FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P REMOVE WELLHEAD

 8:00  9:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND CUT 7 5/8" CASING @ 620'. RIG DOWN 

WIRELINE TRUCK

 9:00 10:00 1.00 WBREMD 24 P LAY DOWN 620' OF CASING.

10:00 11:00 1.00 WBREMD 05 P TRIP INTO WELL TO 669' AND PUMP 60 SX CLASS G CEMENT 

WITH 2% CC

11:00 14:00 3.00 WBREMD 18 P PULL OUT OF CEMENT AND WAIT FOR CEMENT TO HARDEN

14:00 15:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG CEMENT @ 620'. PUMP 55 MORE SX  

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC. PULL OUT OF HOLE TO WAIT 

ON CEMENT

15:00 17:30 2.50 WBREMD 18 P WAIT ON CEMENT. TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG CEMENT @ 314'.  

FOR @ CEMENT PLUG OF 355'

17:30 17:30 0.00 CEMENT IS TO HIGH TO SET 10 3/4" CICR AFTER CONFERING 

WITH RYAN KRUG OF EP ENERGY AND GLADE RICH WITH BLM 

THIS STEP WAS ELEMINATED. BLM THEN DECIDED THAT WE 

NEEDED TO TEST CEMENT PLUG TO 400 PSI.

17:30 18:30 1.00 WBREMD 18 P NIPPLE UP WELLHEAD AND TEST PLUG TO 400 PSI. TEST GOOD

18:30 18:30 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

10/12/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( RIGGING DOWN SAFELY) 

FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P N/D WELL HEAD

 8:00 12:00 4.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP IN TO WELL WITH 165' OF TUBING AND PUMP 165' 

SURFACE PLUG WITH 80 SX OF CLASS G CEMENT  W/ 2% CC. 

CEMENT SURFACE ANULUS AND INSTALL DRY HOLE PLATE 3' 

BELOW SURFACE ON WELL BORE. RIG DOWN RIG AND COVER 

CELLAR

 2August 12, 2014 at  2:22 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP INTO WELL WITH TUBING TO 5,750'. MIXAND PUMP 50 SX

CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD,. SPOTTING BALANCED
PLUG WITH BOTTOM @ 5,750'.

13:30 16:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH WIT30 JOINTSTUBINGAND REVERSE CIRCULATE
TUBING CLEAN

10/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (TRIPPING PIPE AND RIGGING
DOWN FLOOR SAFELY) FILL OUTAND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG #2 @ 5530' FOR @ 220' PLUG
8:00 12:30 4.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH TO 2754' AND PUMP 30 SX CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2%

CC. PULL OUT OF PLUG WITH TUBING AND LET PLUG SET FOR
31/2 HOURS.

12:30 13:30 1.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG @ 2652'
13:30 14:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH WITH TUBING AND PICK UP 7 5/8" CICR.
14:00 16:00 2.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO WELLAND SET 7 5/8" CICR @ 1174' AND PUMP90 SX

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC (60 SX INTO RETAINER AND
SPOTTED 30 SX ON CICR. POOH WITH TUBING AND CICR
SETTING TOOL

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBREMD 30 P WORK ON WELL HEAD TO PREPARE TO PULL CASING AND
CONTINUE PLUGGING OPERATIONS

10/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (REMOVING WELLHEAD)
FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P REMOVE WELLHEAD
8:00 9:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P RIG UP WIRELINEAND CUT 7 5/8" CASING @620'. RIG DOWN

WIRELINE TRUCK
9:00 10:00 1.00 WBREMD 24 P LAYDOWN 620' OF CASING.
10:00 11:00 1.00 WBREMD 05 P TRIP INTO WELL TO 669' AND PUMP60 SX CLASS G CEMENT

WITH 2% CC
11:00 14:00 3.00 WBREMD 18 P PULL OUT OF CEMENT AND WAIT FOR CEMENT TO HARDEN
14:00 15:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP INTO WELLAND TAG CEMENT @ 620'. PUMP 55 MORE SX

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC. PULL OUT OF HOLE TO WAIT
ON CEMENT

15:00 17:30 2.50 WBREMD 18 P WAIT ON CEMENT. TRIP INTO WELLAND TAG CEMENT @ 314'.
FOR @ CEMENT PLUG OF 355'

17:30 17:30 0.00 CEMENT IS TO HIGH TO SET 10 3/4" CICRAFTER CONFERING
WITH RYAN KRUG OF EP ENERGY AND GLADE RICH WITH BLM
THIS STEP WAS ELEMINATED. BLM THEN DECIDED THAT WE
NEEDED TO TEST CEMENT PLUG TO 400 PSI.

17:30 18:30 1.00 WBREMD 18 P NIPPLE UP WELLHEAD AND TEST PLUG TO 400 PSI. TEST GOOD
18:30 18:30 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

10/12/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( RIGGING DOWN SAFELY)
FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P N/D WELL HEAD
8:00 12:00 4.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP IN TO WELL WITH 165' OF TUBING AND PUMP 165'

SURFACE PLUG WITH 80 SX OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl2% CC.
CEMENT SURFACEANULUSAND INSTALL DRY HOLE PLATE 3'
BELOW SURFACE ON WELL BORE. RIG DOWN RIG AND COVER
CELLAR

August 12, 2014 at 2:22 pm 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION
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RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1323 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CEDAR RIM 12 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 CEDAR RIM 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1980 FNL 1973 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

10/11 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8 /17 /2014

August 18, 2014

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14-20-H62-1323

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well CEDAR RIM 12

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013303440000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext CEDAR RIM

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1980 FNL 1973 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNE Section: 28 Township: 03.0S Range: 06.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

10/11/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
August 18, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/17/2014

RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

Cedar Rim 12 
43013303440000 
 
 

 POOH with 2 7/8”.  RIH with CICR and set @ 6320’.  Established injection rate.  Mixed and 
pumped 90 sx class G 1.05 yield cement.  20 sx below & 70 sx above retainer.  Reversed clean.  
Tagged cement @ 6246’.  Pressure tested plug to 1000 psi – good test. 

 Shot 4 holes in casing @ 5699’.  Could not establish injection.  Glade Rich with BLM approved to 
pump 50 sx of cement from 5750’-cement top. 

 Shot 4 holes I casing @ 1220’.  Pumped 50 sx of class G 1.05 yield spotting balanced plug with 
bottom @ 5750’.  Tagged plug @ 5530’ (220’ plug).  POOH to 2754’ and pumped 30 sx class G 
cement and taged plug @ 2652’. 

 Set CICR @ 1174’ and pumped 90 sx class G cement.. 
 Cut 7 5/8” casing @ 620’.  TIH to 669’ and pumped 60 sx class G cement.  Tagged cement @ 

620’.  Pumped 55 more sx class G cement.  Tagged cement @ 314’ (355’ plug).  Tested plug to 
400 psi. 

 TIH to 165’ and pumped surface plug with 80 sx of class G cement.  Installed dry hole plate 
below surface. 

 

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

Cedar Rim 12
43013303440000

> POOH with 2 7/8". RIH with CICR and set @ 6320'. Established injection rate. Mixed and
pumped 90 sx class G 1.05 yield cement. 20 sx below & 70 sx above retainer. Reversed clean.
Tagged cement @ 6246'. Pressure tested plug to 1000 psi-good test.

> Shot 4 holes in casing @ 5699'. Could not establish injection. Glade Rich with BLM approved to
pump 50 sx of cement from 5750'-cement top.

> Shot 4 holes I casing @ 1220'. Pumped 50 sx of class G 1.05 yield spotting balanced plug with
bottom @ 5750'. Tagged plug @ 5530' (220' plug). POOH to 2754' and pumped 30 sx class G
cement and taged plug @ 2652'.

> Set CICR @ 1174' and pumped 90 sx class G cement..
> Cut 7 5/8" casing @ 620'. TlH to 669' and pumped 60 sx class G cement. Tagged cement @

620'. Pumped 55 more sx class G cement. Tagged cement @ 314' (355' plug). Tested plug to
400 psi.

> TlH to 165' and pumped surface plug with 80 sx of class G cement. Installed dry hole plate
below surface.
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Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s) 

does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the 

possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this 

report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD

 CEDAR RIM 12

  CEDAR RIM 12

   P&A LAND

Operation Summary Report

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CENTRAL DIVISION

ALTAMONT FIELD
CEDAR RIM 12
CEDAR RIM 12
P&A LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user's own risk.
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RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

CENTRAL DIVISIONCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

CEDAR RIM 12Well

CEDAR RIM 12SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event P&A LANDMAGNA/026Rig Name/No.

Start date 10/4/2012 End date 10/12/1970

10/28/1974Spud Date/Time UWI 028-003-S 006-W 30

Active datum KB @6,204.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

142999/34566 / CEDAR RIM #12

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(ft)

Operation

10/5/2012 10:00  6:00 20.00 FB 19 P RU FLOW BACK IRON TO FLOW BACK TANK SIP @ 3400 PSIG 

FLOW BACK TTL OF 493 BBLS WELL CURRENTLY DEAD. ( RIG 

MOVED & SPOTTED IN EQUIPMENT )

10/6/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIGGING UP )

 7:30  8:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P RIG UP

 8:30  9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 16 P NU TESTED BOPE

 9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PUMU & RIH 6 5/8" BIT, BIT SUB  199 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG

14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 199 JTS 2-7/8" BIT SUB, BIT, PUMU & RIH W/ 7 5/8" 

CICR, 198 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG SET @ 6320'. STING OUT, 

BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE CLEAN, STING INTO, PUMP 

DOWN TBG TO ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE, RETURN UP 

CASING. (TALKED TO MICHEAL LEE W/ BLM & RYAN KRUG W/ 

EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP 90 SX CEMENT 20 BELOW 

& 70 ABOVE RETAINER. TAG CEMENT MONDAY )

18:30 19:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MIX AND PUMP 90 SX CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD, 

SPOT 20 BELOW AND 70 ABOVE RETAINER, POOH W/ 40 JTS, 

REVERSE CLEAN.

10/7/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/8/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/9/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING (RIGGING UP WIRELINE AND 

PERFORATING) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP IN TO TAG CEMRNT. TAGGED CEMENT @ OF PLUG 1 @ 

6246'.  PRESURE TEST PLUG TO 1000 PSI. TEST GOOD

 8:00  9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TUBING

 9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCK AND SHOOT 4 HOLES IN CASING @ 

5699". POOH WITH WIRELINE TRUCK.

11:00 11:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL CASING WITH 8 BBLS TPW AND PUMP UPTO 1500 PSI 

ATTEMPTING ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE. NO RATE COULD BE 

ESTABLISHED.  (TALKED TO GLADE RICH  W/ BLM & RYAN 

KRUG W/ EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP 50 SX CEMENT 

FROM 5750'TO CEMENT TOP.)

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND SHOOT 4 HOLES IN CASING @ 1220' AND 

RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK

 1August 12, 2014 at  2:22 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv CENTRAL DIVISION

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well CEDAR RIM 12
Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site CEDAR RIM 12
Rig Name/No. MAGNA/026 Event P&A LAND

Start date 10/4/2012 End date 10/12/1970

Spud Date/Time 10/28/1974 UWI 028-OO3-S OO6-W30

Active datum KB @6,204.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 142999/34566 / CEDAR RIM #12
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
10/5/2012 10:00 6:00 20.00 FB 19 P RU FLOW BACK IRON TO FLOW BACK TANK SIP @ 3400 PSIG

FLOW BACK TTL OF 493 BBLS WELL CURRENTLY DEAD. ( RIG
MOVED & SPOTTED IN EQUIPMENT)

10/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P CTTGSM&JSA(RIGGINGUP)
7:30 8:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P RIG UP
8:30 9:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 16 P NU TESTED BOPE
9:30 14:30 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PUMU & RIH 6 5/8" BIT, BIT SUB 199 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG
14:30 18:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH Wl199 JTS 2-7/8" BIT SUB, BIT, PUMU & RIH Wl7 5/8"

CICR, 198 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG SET @6320'. STING OUT,
BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE CLEAN, STING INTO, PUMP
DOWN TBG TO ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE, RETURN UP
CASING. (TALKED TO MICHEAL LEE W/ BLM & RYAN KRUG W/
EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP90 SX CEMENT 20 BELOW
& 70 ABOVE RETAINER. TAG CEMENT MONDAY)

18:30 19:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P MIXAND PUMP90 SX CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD,
SPOT 20 BELOWAND 70 ABOVE RETAINER, POOH Wl40 JTS,
REVERSE CLEAN.

10/7/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/8/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

10/9/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREWTRAVEL,SAFETYMEETING(RIGGINGUPWIRELINEAND
PERFORATING) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP IN TO TAG CEMRNT. TAGGED CEMENT @ OF PLUG 1 @
6246'. PRESURE TEST PLUG TO 1000 PSI. TEST GOOD

8:00 9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH TUBING
9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCKAND SHOOT4 HOLES IN CASING @

5699". POOH WITH WIRELINE TRUCK.
11:00 11:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL CASING WITH 8 BBLS TPWAND PUMP UPTO 1500 PSI

ATTEMPTING ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE. NO RATE COULD BE
ESTABLISHED. (TALKED TO GLADE RICH W/ BLM & RYAN
KRUG W/ EP ENERGY. THEY DECIDED TO PUMP 50 SX CEMENT
FROM 5750'TO CEMENT TOP.)

11:30 12:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 21 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND SHOOT 4 HOLES IN CASING @ 1220' AND
RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK

August 12, 2014 at 2:22 pm 1
RECEIVED: Aug. 17,



RECEIVED: Aug. 17, 2014

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD from

(ft)

Operation

12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP INTO WELL WITH TUBING TO 5,750'.  MIX AND PUMP 50 SX 

CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD,. SPOTTING BALANCED 

PLUG WITH BOTTOM @ 5,750'.

13:30 16:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH WIT 30 JOINTS TUBING AND REVERSE CIRCULATE 

TUBING CLEAN

10/10/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (TRIPPING PIPE AND RIGGING 

DOWN FLOOR SAFELY) FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG #2 @ 5530' FOR @ 220' PLUG

 8:00 12:30 4.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH TO  2754' AND PUMP 30 SX CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% 

CC. PULL OUT OF PLUG  WITH TUBING AND LET PLUG SET FOR 

3 1/2 HOURS.

12:30 13:30 1.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG @ 2652'

13:30 14:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH WITH TUBING AND PICK UP 7 5/8" CICR.

14:00 16:00 2.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO WELL AND SET 7 5/8" CICR @ 1174' AND PUMP 90 SX 

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC (60 SX INTO RETAINER AND 

SPOTTED 30 SX ON CICR. POOH WITH TUBING AND CICR 

SETTING TOOL

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBREMD 30 P WORK ON WELL HEAD TO PREPARE TO PULL CASING AND 

CONTINUE PLUGGING OPERATIONS

10/11/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (REMOVING WELLHEAD) 

FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P REMOVE WELLHEAD

 8:00  9:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P RIG UP WIRELINE AND CUT 7 5/8" CASING @ 620'. RIG DOWN 

WIRELINE TRUCK

 9:00 10:00 1.00 WBREMD 24 P LAY DOWN 620' OF CASING.

10:00 11:00 1.00 WBREMD 05 P TRIP INTO WELL TO 669' AND PUMP 60 SX CLASS G CEMENT 

WITH 2% CC

11:00 14:00 3.00 WBREMD 18 P PULL OUT OF CEMENT AND WAIT FOR CEMENT TO HARDEN

14:00 15:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG CEMENT @ 620'. PUMP 55 MORE SX  

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC. PULL OUT OF HOLE TO WAIT 

ON CEMENT

15:00 17:30 2.50 WBREMD 18 P WAIT ON CEMENT. TRIP INTO WELL AND TAG CEMENT @ 314'.  

FOR @ CEMENT PLUG OF 355'

17:30 17:30 0.00 CEMENT IS TO HIGH TO SET 10 3/4" CICR AFTER CONFERING 

WITH RYAN KRUG OF EP ENERGY AND GLADE RICH WITH BLM 

THIS STEP WAS ELEMINATED. BLM THEN DECIDED THAT WE 

NEEDED TO TEST CEMENT PLUG TO 400 PSI.

17:30 18:30 1.00 WBREMD 18 P NIPPLE UP WELLHEAD AND TEST PLUG TO 400 PSI. TEST GOOD

18:30 18:30 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

10/12/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( RIGGING DOWN SAFELY) 

FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

 7:30  8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P N/D WELL HEAD

 8:00 12:00 4.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP IN TO WELL WITH 165' OF TUBING AND PUMP 165' 

SURFACE PLUG WITH 80 SX OF CLASS G CEMENT  W/ 2% CC. 

CEMENT SURFACE ANULUS AND INSTALL DRY HOLE PLATE 3' 

BELOW SURFACE ON WELL BORE. RIG DOWN RIG AND COVER 

CELLAR

 2August 12, 2014 at  2:22 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000Sundry Number: 54554 API Well Number: 43013303440000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD from Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:30 13:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TRIP INTO WELL WITH TUBING TO 5,750'. MIXAND PUMP 50 SX

CLASS G CMT 16.5 PPG, 1.05 YIELD,. SPOTTING BALANCED
PLUG WITH BOTTOM @ 5,750'.

13:30 16:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH WIT30 JOINTSTUBINGAND REVERSE CIRCULATE
TUBING CLEAN

10/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (TRIPPING PIPE AND RIGGING
DOWN FLOOR SAFELY) FILL OUTAND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG #2 @ 5530' FOR @ 220' PLUG
8:00 12:30 4.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH TO 2754' AND PUMP 30 SX CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2%

CC. PULL OUT OF PLUG WITH TUBING AND LET PLUG SET FOR
31/2 HOURS.

12:30 13:30 1.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO HOLE AND TAG PLUG @ 2652'
13:30 14:00 0.50 WBREMD 39 P POOH WITH TUBING AND PICK UP 7 5/8" CICR.
14:00 16:00 2.00 WBREMD 39 P TRIP INTO WELLAND SET 7 5/8" CICR @ 1174' AND PUMP90 SX

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC (60 SX INTO RETAINER AND
SPOTTED 30 SX ON CICR. POOH WITH TUBING AND CICR
SETTING TOOL

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBREMD 30 P WORK ON WELL HEAD TO PREPARE TO PULL CASING AND
CONTINUE PLUGGING OPERATIONS

10/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING. (REMOVING WELLHEAD)
FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P REMOVE WELLHEAD
8:00 9:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P RIG UP WIRELINEAND CUT 7 5/8" CASING @620'. RIG DOWN

WIRELINE TRUCK
9:00 10:00 1.00 WBREMD 24 P LAYDOWN 620' OF CASING.
10:00 11:00 1.00 WBREMD 05 P TRIP INTO WELL TO 669' AND PUMP60 SX CLASS G CEMENT

WITH 2% CC
11:00 14:00 3.00 WBREMD 18 P PULL OUT OF CEMENT AND WAIT FOR CEMENT TO HARDEN
14:00 15:00 1.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP INTO WELLAND TAG CEMENT @ 620'. PUMP 55 MORE SX

CLASS G CEMENT WITH 2% CC. PULL OUT OF HOLE TO WAIT
ON CEMENT

15:00 17:30 2.50 WBREMD 18 P WAIT ON CEMENT. TRIP INTO WELLAND TAG CEMENT @ 314'.
FOR @ CEMENT PLUG OF 355'

17:30 17:30 0.00 CEMENT IS TO HIGH TO SET 10 3/4" CICRAFTER CONFERING
WITH RYAN KRUG OF EP ENERGY AND GLADE RICH WITH BLM
THIS STEP WAS ELEMINATED. BLM THEN DECIDED THAT WE
NEEDED TO TEST CEMENT PLUG TO 400 PSI.

17:30 18:30 1.00 WBREMD 18 P NIPPLE UP WELLHEAD AND TEST PLUG TO 400 PSI. TEST GOOD
18:30 18:30 0.00 SHUT DOWN FOR DAY

10/12/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBREMD 28 P CREW TRAVEL, SAFETY MEETING ( RIGGING DOWN SAFELY)
FILL OUT AND REVIEW JSA

7:30 8:00 0.50 WBREMD 18 P N/D WELL HEAD
8:00 12:00 4.00 WBREMD 18 P TRIP IN TO WELL WITH 165' OF TUBING AND PUMP 165'

SURFACE PLUG WITH 80 SX OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl2% CC.
CEMENT SURFACEANULUSAND INSTALL DRY HOLE PLATE 3'
BELOW SURFACE ON WELL BORE. RIG DOWN RIG AND COVER
CELLAR

August 12, 2014 at 2:22 pm 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Aug. 17,
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