
Entered in NID File ... . Checked by Chief .

Location Map Pinned .... Approval Le
Card Indexed ... Disapproval La

COMPLETIONDATA:
Date Well CompÌeted........ Location Inspected

OW,.... WW..... TA..... Bond released
GW..... OS..... EA..... State or Fee La

LOGS FILED
Drilléita Log..........
Electric Logs (No.) ........

E........ I........ Dual I Lat........ GR-N........ Mace

BHC Sonic GR........ Lat........ Mi-L.....
.

CBLog........ GGLog........



rorfn 9-8810 SUBMIT IN TR JCATE* Form approved.
(May 1963) (Other instructions on Budget Bureau No. 42-R1425

UNITED STATES reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SEHIAL NO

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14-20-H62-1732
APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUG.BACK 6. M INDUN, AROTTER Oi ÑTE

Ute18. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL G DEEPENO PLUG BACK O 7, UNIT AGEEEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WEI.L

wrrr,1, casLL
OTHER

NNELE TRI;E 8. OR R

2. was.or or=a roa Ute Tribal
Gulf Oil Corporation 9. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. 0. Box 2619; Casper, Wyomin 82601 io. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and'in ac r ce with any State requirements.*) BluebellAt surface
1349' EWL& 1645 NSL (N SW) .

11. eD
SB

YM ORAR

At proposed prod. zone
Same 13-2S-3W

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR_POST OFFICE* 12, COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

Bluebell Utah 2.5 mi S, .5 mi SE, 1.4 mi E, .4 mi NE, 1 mi SE o Duchesne Utah
10. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. ACllES ASSIGNE.D

LOCATION TO NEAREST 1349'EWL Section 13 ro 2ms w=u.
PROPERTY OB LEASE LINE, FT. can PAn
(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any} U4U 04U

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION* 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, COMPLETED, No other

OR APPUED FOR, ON THIS LEASE "·
ye i e see 9 12,700 ' Rotary

21. ELEVATIONs (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROX. DATE WORK WILL START*

Will submit a revised plaishowing elevations when rec'd, Immediately upon approval
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGILAM

SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT

?4" 16" 00 - 65# H-40 60' Cmt to surface12-1/4" 9-5/8" OD 36# K 2,900' Cmt to surface
8-3/4" 7" 0D 26&29# P-110 10,900' Cmt lower 4000'
6" 5" 0D 18# P-110 10,400' to TD Cmt all of liner

Propose to drill a 12,700' test of the Green River and Wasatch.

BOP - Hydraulically actuated Series 900 double gate and bag type preventers in
conjunction w/ rotating head from 2,900' to 10,900'. Hydraulically actuated
Series 1500 single gate, double gate, and bag type preventers in conjunction
w/ rotating head from 10,900' to TD.

Mud - Fresh water, low solids, non-dispersed from surface to TD.
Flow sensors, PVT equipment, pump stroke counters, degasser, mud separator,
hydraulic choke, and gas detector will be utilized.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal 18 to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, glve pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.
24.

SIGNED TITIÆ Area Production Manager var.¾ 18

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROYAL, IF ANY :

cc: (See backside) *SeeInstwetionsOn Reverse



Instructions
General: This form is designed for submitting proposals to perform certain well operations, as indicated, on all types of lands and lenses for appropriate action by either

a Federal or a State agency, or both, pursunut to applicable Federal and/or State laws and regulations. Any necessary special lustructions concerning the use of this formand the number of copies to be submitted, particularly with regard to local, area, or regional procedures and practices, either are shown below or will be issued by, or maybe obtained from, the local Federal and/or State office.
Item 1: If the proposal is to redrill to the same reservoir at a different subsurface location or to a new reservoir, use this form with appropriate notations. Consultapplicable State or Federal regulations concerning subsequent work proposals or reports on the well.Item 4: If there are no applicable State requirements, locations on Federal or Indian land should be described in accordance with Federal requirerients. Consult local. State or Federal ofilee for specific instructions.
Item 14: Needed only when location of well cannot readily be found by road from the land or lease description. A plat, or plats, separate or on this reverse side, show-ing the roads to, and the surveyed location of, the well, and any other required information, should be furnished when required by Federal or State agency offlees.Items 15 and 18: If well is to be, or has been directionally drilled, give distances for subsurface location of hole in any present or objective production zone.Item 22: Consult applicable Federal or State regulations, or appropriate officials, concerning approval of the proposal before operations are started,

u.s.sovsamaNTrammsomCE:1953-O-7p½96

cc: Shell Oil Company
1700 Broadway
Denver, CO 80202
Attn: R. L. Freeman

.Utah 0ii and Gas Commision (2)
1588 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, UT 84116
Attn: Mr. Cleon Feight

Ute Distribution Corporation
P. 0. Box 696
Roosevelt, UT. 84066

O Bureau of Indian Affairs
Uintah & Ouray Agency
Ft. Duchesne, UT



SQLF OIL CORPOR47t
7 2 S, R3W, U. S.B.BM won to.otion, err rare

/-/3 83, located as shown the
NE 1/4 SW 1/4 Section 13, T2S R3
U.S.B.SM. Duchesne County, Uton.

fg i

1349' U TE THIBAL # I - /383

CER TIFICAT E

THIS IS TO CtitTIFY THAT TME ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELO NÔTES OF ACTUAL SURvgYS MADE SY ME OR UNDER MY

·•

SUPERVISION AND TWaT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO TNE
BEST OF MY KNOWLt06E A¾D

R€GISTERED LAND SURVEYOR
REsisTRATioN Ne 3 I$4
STATE OF UTAH

UmTAH ENGINEERES & LAND $URVEYING
R 0. BOX Q - 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTHX = Section Corners Used.

VERNAL, UTAN - 84078
SCAL E OATE

I "
= 1000 '

August 22, 1973
PARTY REFERENCES

G.S. S.S. R.R. GLO Plot
W€ATHER FILE

Het GULF OIL



Form 9-8810 * SUBEKIT IN CATE* Form approved.
(Máy 1963) (Other instructions on Budget Rúreau No. 42-R1425.

UNITED STATES r•v•r se)
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR U. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 4.gg.jjg2. 32
APPLICATIONTOR PERMITTO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUGBACK G.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEMORTRIBENAME

Ute18. TYPE OF WORK

DRILLE§ DEEPEN PLUGBACK UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TTrm or wmLL ••a

ELL ELL OTHER
MUNLTIPLE

. MiOR LEAsm NA3(B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Ute Tribal
Gulf ûlf Corporation ELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPEEATOR 1-1383
P. û. Rox 2614,• Camper, Nyntning RPßnl io. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCArroN OF WELL (Report location clearly and"in accoraanee with any State requirements.*)
At surface

1349' ENL& 1645'NSL(NESW) 11. .

At proposed prod. zone
Same 13-25-3W

14. DISTANCE IN MELES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST T WN OR POST OFFICE* 12.5 COUNTŸ OR PARISH 13. STATE

Bluebell Utah L5 mi S, .5 mi SE 1.4 mi E, .4 mi NE, 1 mi SE Duchesne Utah
10. DISTANCE PROM PROPOSED* 16, NO. OF ACRES IN LEAiÏB 17. 9 ACßES ASSIGNED

LOCATION TO NEABEST M9'ENL Section 13 66
PROPERTY OR LEABE LINE, FT.
(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any) y U U U

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION* 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. HO ARY OR CABLE TOOLS
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, COMPLETED, NO OthtP"'"" "" " """ L''"" " wel s in Set 11 12.700' Rotary

21, stavATrous (Show whether DF, RT, Ex, ) 22. APPROÈ. DATE WORK WILL START*

Mill submit a revised plat shaising elevations when rec'À. In-ediately aþon approval
28. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIEE OF H SIER OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF OEMËÑT

--24" --- 65NI-40--
17-•1/4" 9-5/8" 0 26f K 2,900 cut to surfaca
8-3/4" 7" OD 26&29f P-110 10,900' Cat lower 4000'
6" 5" 00 18# P-110 10,400' to TO Cat Atl of liner

Propose to drill a 12,700' test of the Green River and Masatch.

80P .- Hydraulically actuated Sgries 900 double gate and bag type preventers in
conjunction w/ rotating head from 2,900' to 10,900'. 1(ydraulita11y actúated
Series 1500 single gate, double gate, and bag type preventers in conjunction
w/ rotating head from 10,900' to TO2

Mud - Fresh water, low solids, non-diepersedfrom surface to TD.
Flow sensors PTOequipm t, opdap igroke counters, degasser, muá separator,
hydraulic chake,°86d gas letecto Â11be utilized.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PÈOGRA prOD0sal iOo deÒpeo p10g bael y dat on present prkuetive zone and p posed new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen diréctionally, give pertinent data on subsurface lamati ne and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.
24.

SIGNED L.M. WILSON a P on Manager DL.August 24, 1972
L M. Uilson

(This space for ederal or State oilice se

PERMIT NO APPyny4T p4TP

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE I

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

cc: (See backside) *SeeInstructionsOn Reverse



Instructions
Generali This form is designed for submitt proposa1Ëoerform certain well operations, as dicated, on all tyÒesof lahds and leases for appropriate actioñ Ñeithera Federal oli a State gency, or both, pursuant të applicable LFeëëral and/or State laws and regula ons. Any necessary special instructions concerning the useof tg formand the number of es to be submitted, partithlarly withie rg. to local, area, or regional pro dures and practices, either are shown below or. Will be issued by, pr maybe obtained from, th cal Federal and/or State ofBee.
Item 1:. If the proposal is to ï•edrill to the s e reservoËat a diferent subsurface location or to a new eservoir, use is form with appropi*iate notations onsultapplicable State or Federal regulations concern y subsequent Wogk proposalg Dr eo s on the 1.
Item 4: If there are no applicable State re¶uirements, locationa on Federgoi I n land sh d be described in eco ce with Federal re niremputs. ons t localState or Federal office for specine instructions. x, -, a
Item 14: Needed only when location of welf cannot read eiound by roãÊtrerite lánd or Base éseript n. platBr plats, separit'e or on thiire ehÏësideTshow-

ing the roads to, and the surveyed location of, tlie.well, and-ang o‡her required iker.mation, shonia be furnished w en.required by Federal or State agency ofBees.
Items 15 and 18:.aIf well is to be, or hakbe &rectionaÀyr ed, e dÑncesfor subsurface locÃonof hole in näy present or objective production zone.
Item 22: Consul applicable Federal or State regulations, or appropriate ofBe Is oncerning approval of the I before operations are started.

U.S. ÀÔVERNMgiT ERNT FFICE: 196Mgt1-396

63 171

ces she116011Company
1700greakay
Denygg, CO 80202
Attati R. L. Freeman

Utah $11 and Gas Co- on 2)
1588Mest North TempÍp
Salt Lake City, UT 86 8
Attar Mr. Cleon Feight

Ute Distribution Cor n
P. 0. Box 696
Roosevelt, UT 84066

Bureau of Indian Aff i
Uintah &Ouray Ageng
Ft Duchesne4.UT 84



PROJECT

GULF OIL CORPORATION
TËS, R3W, U.S.B.8M ' weit location, are raisar 4

/-/3 Ð3, located as shown in the
NE I/4 SW 1/4 Section 13, T2S, R3W
U.S.B.8 M. Duchesne County, Utah.

/3

I3 4 9 | | |" fg þ £ g / ... fjpg
Elev. Ungraded Ground 5897

CERTIFICATE

THIS IS TO C£RTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PL AT WAS PREPARED FROM

FIELO NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME On UNDER MY

SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO INE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIEF.

REGISTEREO LAND SURVEYOR
REGlŠTRATION No 3|g4

Revised: Sept. 17, 1973 STATE OF UTAH

UINTAH ENGINEERING Gr LAND SURVEYING
R O. BOX Q - 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTHX = Section Corners Used.

VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SCALE DATE
I "

= 1000 '
August 22, 1973

PARTY REFERENCES
G.S. S.S. R.R. GLO Plot

WEATHER FILE
Hot GULF DIL CORPORATI



August 28, 1973

Gulf Oli Corporation
Box 2619
Casper, Wyoming 82601

Re: Well No. U†e Tribal 1-1383
Sec. 13, T. 2 S, R. 3 W,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to well is hereby granted in accordance with the Order
issued in Cause No. 131-!4.

Should you determine that †† will be necessary to plug and
abandon this well, you are hereby requested to immediately notify
the following:

PAULW. BURCHELL- Chief Petroleum Engineer
HOME: 277-2890
OFFICE: 328-5771

Enclosed please find Form OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water sands (aquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation relative to the above will be greatly appreciated.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30251.

Very truly yours,

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERVATION

CLEON B. FEIGHT
DIRECTOR

CBF:sd
cc: U.S. Geological



Form approved,

. UNITEDSTATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOr. ^ °=--

----

GEOLOGICALSURVEY ------

Luse No..li-.20- Há2••.11
m

LESSEE'S MONTHLY RËPORT OF OPERATIONS

ßtate --.Utah County -------Duchesne...--..... Field Bluebell
The following is a correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producing

wells) for the month of ........._..9.919.Ë.9.E......_..--., 19..7_3
.egent's add res s ..P.s...9. _A .x__ 2.§13.........

......................... Company . _cal£...0.L1...cor-p o.ra.ti .

Phone .................30.Z-235 5283..................-.......... .. ..... .dgent's title ..Arm..S.erv es Supervisor.
E a Twr. RLNGE •E

B1RREIB or Or, GuVnY
r

no e ta46)
(u ræiWms we;

N/2 SW/4
13 28 3W 1-1383 - - - - TD 8,525' Drlg 11/1

16" esg set 40' below
GL cmtd w/readymix
Spudded 12t" hole 6 P.M10/9/¯/3

3 - J.S.S.S. SLC
2 - Jtah Oil & Gas Cons. Comm., JLC
1 - Sheli Oi Cox, Denter
1 - DeGo tyer and MacNa .ighton

1 - f. F, Betrly
1 - F.S. 1,
2 - File
1 - 3.C.

Ste Trib 11 1-13B3

NOTE.-ÎhOTO WOTO --..-------------ËÛ--------------..,TUDS Or 88Î68Of OiÎJ--------..----Ë-Û.----------------------.....M. CU. ÎŠ. of gas sold;
............. ....F9,.........., runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" mihere applicable.)Norm.-Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the sRatus of operations, and must be filed induplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directhed by the supervisor.

Form-9-3 9A
(Deterilbst 1WS) 18-2ß231-7 ya coytauttwy eascia orrrer



Form approsed. | xB Budget Bureau No. 42-R71 .L
UNITEDSTATES

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR °""-----·-------

GEOLOGICALSURVEY ------

I.rm NO. .lÚ.- Û.-Há2-1132..-..

LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

ß ate Utah County ---..Jlucheane............ Field --__Tilu.ebe11 ......

The following is a correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producin
wells) for the month of .......---.N.D.y her

..__.., 19.1Â_,......
.... ....

..

.igent's address ..._..Ë.•...O.._.BRE.2.§1.9...
_.._....._......... Compa 1.. p.aratiCasper, WY 82601

ed
Phone ......................3

7-135 5Z8.3 ......_........_... .... .igent's title ......Are.a.. c.es--supervisor
omons or naasm or REMARKS

N/2 SW/4
13 2S 3W 33 - - ' - TD 12,700' Trip 12/1

7" csg set at 10,425'
cmtd w/575 sx

3 - U S.G. S., SLC
2 - Ut ah 0 il & Gas Cons. Cotmn., SI C
1 - Shell Oil 'o., Denvt r
1 - DeGol> er a nd MicNaughton
1 - M F. B.
1 - F S.G
2-F:le
1-00:

Ute Tribal 1-1333

Nota.-There were .... ---No.......................... runs or sales of oil; --...------..--Alo..........-............... M. cu. ft. of gas sold;
-......,......NR................... runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write "no" where applicable.)NoTE.--Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed induplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.
Form 9•329A
(Decembdr 19.8)

10-26231-7 u.s sovramarmy enwtmo



Form 9--330
(Rev. 5-68)

I ED STATES SUBMIT IN DT.7
r'in- aÃget No. 4 355.5.

DEPARTM OF THE 'INTERIOR yd 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 14.gg.ggg.pygg
COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETIOWREPORTAND LOG* 6. DIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

1a. PE WELL:
V LL

ESLL
DRY Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION: ....

WEE
L

OWORRK EEP- FFÀ.
Other 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR T bal
Gulf Oil Corgration 9. WELL NO.

8. ADDRESS OF OPERAT R

P. O. Box 2619, Casper Idyoming 82601 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (BBp0TÉ8008$40% C'6Gily Snd in GCCOfdGECO 10 $67 TBSONÈ8) BlUebellAt Burface 1349' EWL& 1645' NSL(NE SM) 11. C T R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

At top prod. interval reported below $6-0
At total depth .gog

14. PERMÍT N DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY OR 18. STATE
PARISH

Duchesne Utah
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (RBÎ&dy0 þf04.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB, RT, GR, ETC.}* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

10-9-73 11-29-73 12-21-73 5887' ungraded GL5906' I(8 -

20. TOTAL DEPTH, xD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 28. INTERVALS ROTA Y TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANT* DRILLED BÝ ggg12,700' 12,656' ---

--+ TO 1 None24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE

10,525'-12,596' Masatch
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN Dual Induction Laterlog; Borehole com tiic Log- 27. was wars coa.»

faapataRay; ÇomFmDensity Loq - No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all stringe set in toell)

CASINO SIEE WEIGHT, LE./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMEN NG RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

16" OD 65¢ 40' 24" Cmt to sur ace None
9.5/8" OD 364 2,867' 12-1/4" 1100 sx None
7" 00 29# A 28# 10,425' 8-3/4" 575 sx None

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (3£D) PACKER SET

5" 00 9,906' 12,698• 275 2-7/8" 9,970' 9,856'
2-1/16 4,038' lot 011 String

31. PaaronATION ascono (Interval, afze and number) 82. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEEE, ETC.
DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AbiBNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

See Attached 10,525'-12,596' 40,000gal 15%HCl

33.* PRGDUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (FlOtOing, gGB liff, p¾¾ÿ$Ng-8458 GRÅ ÉgpB Of p¾WLp) WELL STATUS (Prod¾Cing Of

shut-in)12-20-73 flowing Producitg
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIzE PROD'N. FOR OIL-BBL, GAS-AICF. WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO

12-21-73 I 24 . 26/64"
N D

FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF. WATER -BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)24-noon sammsoo o - I 994 | 721 | 0 43.8'
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (ÑOld, ¾806 for f¾¢I, USuted, €$0.) TEST WITNESSED BT

Laase fuel and to be connected to Gary Gas Plant
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Loos per item 26
36. I hireby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined fÄotgp11available records

ORIGINALSIGNED BY
SIGNED M N TITLE Area Production Manager vara January 21. 1974

*(SeeInstructionsand SpacesforAdditional Data on Reverse
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UTE TRIBAL NO. 1-13B3

Perforation Record: 10,525'-527', 10,539'-541', 10,567'-569', 10,602'-604', 10,614'-617',

10,656'-658', 10,735'-737', 10,748'-754', 10,779'-781', 10,837'-839', 10,857'-859',

10,894'-896', 10,906'-909', 10,936'-938', 10,964'-967', 10,984'-987', 11,015'-017',

11,024'-026', 11,061'-063', 11,077'-079', 11,081'-083', 11,088'-092', 11,116'-118',

11,121'-124', 11,144'-147', 11,156'-158', 11,174'-177', 11,195'-198', 11,216'-218',

11,279'-282', 11,286'-289', 11,298'-301', 11,331'-335', 11,340'-343', 11,370'-372',

11,380'-382', 11,384'-386', 11,390'-394', 11,417'-420', 11,423'-425', 11,432'-436',

11,449'-451', 11,472'-476', 11,482'-486', 11,496'-500', 11,539'-541', 11,564'-566',

11,623'-625', 11,630'-632', 11,649'-65T', 11,682'-686', 11,704'-706', 11,760'-762',

11,778'-780', 11,786'-788', 11,822'-824', 11,844'-846', 11,894'-898', 11,926'-928',

11,948'-950', 11,962'-964', 12,008'-01Ö',12,037'-039', 12,086'-088', 12,093'-095',

12,150'-153', 12,288'-2901, 12,305'-307', 12,348'-350', 12,407'-409', 12,442'-444',

12,470'-474', 12,524'-526', 12,532'-534', 12,576'-578', 12,594'-596' w/ 2



amy
1 3) ED STATES o,agIT IN T AT e No 42 R 4

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY $"NIÛ
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTRE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plu'g back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.) $$$

1. 7. UNIT AGBEEMENT NAME
OWELLL WASLL

OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Suli 01i Corporation ute fri bei
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. G. Box 2619, Casper, wyoming82601 1-1383
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements? 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

imi in 6 i WSL(R SW) 11. s. a...., OR BLK. AND

13-25•3W
14. PÌDRMIT No. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, Ga, etc.) 12. CovNTY OR PARISH 18. STATE

5906' Ka Guehesse utah
16. teck Appropriate Box To IndicateNature of Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEIQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SKUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMlINT ALTERING CASING

OR ACIDÍZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZENG ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NOTE: REPOrt TOSults of multiple completion on Well(Other) Colupletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CORIPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Propose to treat well as out li ned on at tached procedum.

APPROVEDBY DIVISIONOF

18. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TITLE DATEL. N. Wilse
(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInsuuctionson ReverseSide

ses Utah 0; 1 4 Gas
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uitdamca1.AAmms
PO Box 119 Fort Duchesne. Utah 64026 (801) 722-2254

e

.
LAgoRATORY NUMBER W-663
SAMPLE TAYFN 3-29-74
SAMPLE RFCFivFD 4-8-74
RESULTS REPORTED 4-79-74

SAMPLE DESCRIPTION FIELD NO.
COMPANY Gulf Oil U.S, LEA$E Ute Tribal 1-13B3 WELL NO.
FIELD Altamont COUNTY Duchesne STATE Utah

SAMPLE TAKEN FROM Well bore @12,500
PRODUCING FORMATioN Wasatch yop 10525 - 12596
REMARKs Water bailed by Otis

P.O. 1-44221
SAMPLE TAKEN BY

CHEMICALAND PHYSICAL PROPERTIES
SPECIF1C GRAVITY 860/60° F. pH S,4 RES. 850 OHM METERS e 77°F

TOTALHÁRDN¶SS Mg/L as CaCO) $ÛÛ4 TOTAL ALKALINITYl36Mg/L as CaCO3

MILLIGRAMS MILLEQUlVALENTS
CONSTlTUENT PER LITER PER LITER REMARKS

Mg/L, MEQ/L
CALcluM - co + + 2400 120
MAGNESIUM - Mg + + 48ß (Q
SODIUM.No+ 2500.0 108.7

Out of Water
BARIUM (INCL. STRONTIUM) - Bo + + 5, 5 (),
TOTAL IRON . Fe+ + AND Fo + + +

...

BICARBONATE - HCO3 |,
CARBONATE -

CO3^^
12 0,4

SLILFATE -504

¯¯ If7 C.56 «de
CHLORIDE.CL- Û µQQ ) ,þ

11 fyl.'msiC

TOTAL DISSOLVED SOLlos . 6760

MILLEQUIVALENTSPER LITER .

LOGARITHMIC n. STANDARD

10 0 CO3

i

* 25 ml sample diluted to 50 cil

ANALYST

- CHECKED



23TAMME LÐÊÐTEXllS
PO Box 119 Fort Duchesne. Utah 84026 (801) 722·2254

LAsoRATORY NUMBER W-621

SAMPLE TA¥FN
SAMPLE PFCFtYFO

3-29-74 •·

RESULTS REPORTED 4-9-74 *

SAMPLEDESCRIPTION FIELD NO.
COMPANY Gulf Oil Co• LEASE Ute Tribal 1-1383 WELL HO.

FIELD Altamont COUNTY Duchesne STATE Utah

SAMPLE TAKEH FROM Treater

PRODUCiHO FORMATtoN wasatch ypp Perfs = 10,525 - 12,596

REMARKS

P.O. # 1-43569 SAMPLE TAKEN BY . .

Wittman

CHEMICALAND PHYSICALPROPERTIES
SPECtFIC GRAYlTY 960/60° F. 1.003646 pH 7.89 nes. 100 OHMMETERS e T/ F

TOT/ptMARDÑ$$ Mg/L es CaCOs úl,¶,Q TOTAL ALKALINITY Mg/L es CoCO3

MILLIGRAMS WALLEQUIVALE'HTS
CONSTITUENT PER LITER PER LITER REMARKS

sq/L. MEQ/L

CALctuM - ce+ + 140.0 7
MAGNESIUM . pp + + 140.0 11.5
50DIUM.Na+ ·

-3310.0 144

BARIUM (tNCL. STRONTIUM) - Bo + + B,4 0.12
TOTAL IRON. Fe+ + AND F.+ ++

. ,3,3 0,Q7 162.7
BICARBONATE .

HCO3^
,547 11, 4

CARBONATE - CO) "~ Q --

SULFATE -504~¯ 3,50 0,07
CHLORIDE.CL-

- 3546 )QQ,Q 111,5
TOTAL OlšSOLYED SOLlos 9 180 C 6400

.

MILLEQUIVALENTSPER LITER

LOûARITRMIC y, STANDARD

C

ANALYST
e
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FORMOGC-8-X

v FILE IN QUADRUPLICATE

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISiON OF OiL AND GAS CONSERVATION
1588 Wes† North Temple

Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

E OgT Og gAgEg (NÇ0pNIEgEg gUgigG Dgl LINg

Well Name and Number Ute Tribal 1-13B3

Operator Gulf Oil Corporation

Address P. 0. Box 2619; Casper, WY 82601

Contractor Noble Drilling Corporation

Address 2522 Lincoln Center Bldg.; Denver, CO 80203

Location NE I/4, SW !/4, Sec. 13 , T. 2 R., R. 3 g., Duchesne County.
S W

Water Sands:

Depth: Volume: Quality:
From - To - Flow Rate or Head - Fresh or Salty -

i. None

2.

3.

4.

5.

(Continue on Reverse Side if Necessary)

Formation Tops:

NOTE: (a) Upon diminishing supply of forms, please inform this office.
(b) Report on this form as provided for in Rule C-20, General Rules and

Regulations and Rules of Practice and Procedure, (see back of this
form)

(c) If a water qual iby analy_s_is has been made of the above reported zone,
please forward a copy along with this



a"y91 ) TED STATES SUBMIT IN T CATE* d B N 1424.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR fr'Asidinstructio on re-
5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND RELL NO.

GEoLOGICAL SURVEY 14• •ÛÊ
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR •Ï¾IBM NAME

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen of plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. PARK OR LEASE NAME

talf oft Corporetten Ute Tribet
8. ADpEESS OF OPERATOR Û. WELL NO.

P. 0, Gen 26191Casper, llpestag 88f61 1•188
4. LOCÃTION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

11. SEC., T., R. M., OR BLE. ANIf

1349*BL &1646*ML (M m) """ °"

13•t$•¾
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether DF, RT, OR, €tc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 184 STATE

906* O Duchesne Utah
16. CheckAppropriate BoxTo indicate Ñafure of Ñotice,Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ¾ SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUŒ-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING W&TEE SHUT-Orr BEPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIEE ABANDON* R ACIDIZING ABANDONMIONT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(Nors: Report results of multiple completion on Well

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (€learly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including èstimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) *

Treated with the follanagt
A. 500 get 25 Igl utr containing20 gal L-31 scale prevestitive, 1 gal

F-18 surfestaat
5. 3000gal 25 WCLwir cootainias6 gal W-27demulsiffer
C. 1000gal 155BC1m/3 gal L-•37.2 gal W-87,10 gal A-170 labibiter.

15 lbs L•41 Iroa Obel agent
0. Slag W 300 lbs J•227 bessets acid flakes
t. Repeated the abovesix moretimes
F. Flashed to perfbrations W 75 bb1s 25 WC1utr

Productienbeforet 40 bapd
after: 917 bapd

Mark started 6 7.74 andsempleted6•11-74.

18. I hereby cert rue and correct

SIGNED TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

cet Utah 011 &Sas Comisstaa
*See Instructionson Reverse



F¾m OGCC-1 be
i ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5, LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir. ""
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER ...-

2. NAME OF OPERATOR S.FARM OR LEASE NAME

Gulf Oil Corporation Ute
8. A0DRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. 0. Box 2619 Casper, Wyominq 82601 1-13B3
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirementa.• 10. TIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)at .urra** Bl ue bel l
11. emc.,T., a., x., os ar,x. AND

BURVBY OR ARRA

1349' FWL& 1645' FSL 13-2S-3W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. BLavATroNa (Show whether or, nT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTT OR PARISH lŠ. STATE

KB 5907' Duchesne Utah
1e CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : BUBBBQUENT REPORT OF :

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REFAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

KWWXRIXacrozzo L ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(Other (NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

Propose to remove scale deposition and stimulate to increase production
as outlined on attached procedure.

Request permission to flare acid gas for a maximumof 48 hours after treatment.

APPROVEDBY DIViSIONOF
OiL & GAS 60

18. I hpreby certify th t the reg ng is tr and correct

SIGNED TITLE Project Engineer slanuarv 14, 1975
(This space for Êderaor t o ce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse



Instructions
General: This form is designed for submitting proposals to perform certain well operations, and reports of such operations when completed, as indicated, on Fed-

. eral and Indian lands pursuant to applicable Federal law and regulations, and, if approved or accepted by any State, on all lands in such State, pursuant to applicable
State law and regulations. Any necessary special instructions concerning the use of this form and the number of copies to be submitted, particularly with regard to
local, area, or regional procedures and practices, either are shown below or will be issued by, or may be obtained from, the local Federal and/or State office.

Item 4: If there are no applicable State requirements, locations on Federal or Indian land should be described in accordance with Federal requirements. Consult local
State or Federal office for specific instructions.

Item 17: Proposals to abandon a well and subsequent reports of abandonment should include such special information as is required by local Federal and/or State offices.
In addition, such proposals and reports should include reasons for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significant
fluid contents not sealed off by cement or otherwise; depths (top and bottom) and method of placement of cement plugs; mud or other material placed below, between and
above plugs; amount, size, method of parting of any casing, liner or tubing pulled and the depth to top of any left in the hole; method of closing top of well; and date well site
conditioned for fmal inspection looking to approval of the abandonment.

O -

Shell Oil Company
P. 0. Box 831
Houston, Texas
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Form OGCC-1 be
S TA TE OF UT A H scaxIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

IL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(no not use this form for pro osals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir,
Use "APPL CATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

¯¯¯

1• 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OILLL WABLL

OTHER ---

2. NAME 07 OPEBATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Gulf Oil Corp. Ute
8. A0DRESS OF OPBBATOR 9. WELL NO.

Box 2619, Casper, Wyoming 82601 1-1383
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface Bluebell

11. sac., E., a., x., os aLE. AND
BURVET OR ARRA

13 49' FWL& 1645' FSL 13-2S-3W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether or, NT, on, eto.) 12. COUNTT OR PARISH 18. STATE

.. KR5907 Duchesne Utah
1e' ChecicAppropnote BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBagQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT4FF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIzE ABANDON' MXWWWX ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE : Report results of multiple completion on Wel

¯

(Other)
- _ Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DEsentBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subaurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this míork.) *

Remove scale and stimulate well per attached.

18. I hpreb certify that e reg is r correct

TITLE Project Engineer oss. 3-14-75

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Instructions
General: This form is designed for submitting proposals to perform certain well operations, and reports of such operations when completed, as indicated, on Fed-

eral and Indian lands pursuant to applicable Federal law and regulations, and, if approved or accepted by any State, on all lands in such State, pursuant to applicable
State law and regulations. Any necessary special instructions concerning the use of this form and the number of copies to be submitted, particularly with regard to
local, area, or regional procedures and practices, either are shown below or will be issued by, or may be obtained from, the local Federal and/or State office.

Item 4: If there are no applicable State requirements, locations on Federal or Indian land should be described in accordance with Federal requirements. Consult local
State or Federal office for specific instructions.

Item 17: Proposals to abandon a well and subsequent reports of abandonment should include such special information as is required by local Federal and/or State offices.
In addition, such proposals and reports should include reasons for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significant
fluid contents not sealed off by cement or otherwise; depths (top and bottom) and method of placement of cement plugs; mud or other material placed below, between and
above plugs; amount, size, method of parting of any casing,1iner or tubing pulled and the depth to top of any left in the hole; method of closing top of well; and date well site
conditioned for final inspection looking to approval of the abandonment.

Utah Oil & Gas Commission

Shell Oil Co.
P. O. Box 831
Houston Texas 77001



WELLPROGRESS REPORT--Field
GUS 95368

Moke reports complete, such ar; description of cosing . . . Show, as soon as known, name of contractor, type of rig, and kind
in guide margin show casing (as, 7"), 'Contractor,"Shot,"Acidized,' etc.

GUIDE MARGIN DATE YEAR 1975 A F. E. LEASE AND WELL Ute 1-13B3

Ute 1-1383
13-2S-3W, Duchesne Co., Utah
12,596' - Wasatch
.937500

3/12/75 REMOVESCALEANDSTIMULATEELL. AFE 89357. On 1/16/75, RU
Howco. Press test lines to 6000#. Press ann to 1500#. Acidizedw/ 12,000 gals 15% HCTas follows: 500 gals 15% HC1w/ 20 gaisLP-55 scale inhibitor, 1.5 gals 3N non-emulsifier, and 5 galsHAI-50 inhibitor; 3000 gals formation wtr w/ 9 gals LP-55, 9 gals3N; 1000 gals 15% HC1w/ 3 gals LP-55, 3 gaTs 3N, and 10 gals HAI-50;siugged for diversion w/ TLC-80 (Benzoic Acid Flakes). Stage 1 w/250# TLC-80, stage 2 w/ 350# TLC-80, stage 3-6 w/ 500# TLC-80, andstage T w/ 400# TLC-80. Moderate diversion on stages 3-7. Flushed w3100 gals formation wtr w/ 9 gals 3N. After stage 4, injected 300SCF N2/bbl, thru flush. AIR = 5 B/M. Max press 5800#, avg press
5200#. ISIP 4600#, 5 min 4300#, 10 min 4200#, and 15 min 4100#. On2jl6/75, well tested at rate of 175 80PD, 160 BWPD,on 24/64" ck, w/75# FTP. Production prior to job was 300 80PD, 250 BWPD, on 21/64"ck, w/ 400# FTP.



F

.STEESEMULA MT 2028
PO Box 119 Fort Duchesne. Utah 84026 (801) 722-2254

e

LAsoRATORY NUMBER W-1966

SAMPLE TAVFN
SAMPLE RFrFivFO 3-11-75

. .

RESULTS REPORTEo 3-17-75

SAMPLE DESCRIPTION FIELD NO.

CoxPANY Gulf On LEASE Ute Tribal WELL No.
1-13B3

FIELD CouNTY STATE ,

SAMPLE TAKEN FROM

PRODUCING FORMATION TOP -

REMARKS
'

$AMPLE TAKEN SY

CHEMICALAND PHYSICALPROPERTIES

SPECIFIC GRAVITY @60/60° P. I 57 pH 7 , 4Û RES. Û.80 OHMMETERS q F

TOTAL HARDNESS 782.30 mg/L es coCO) TOTAL ALKALINITY 1404 mg/L as CaCO3

MILLIGRAMS MILLEQUIVALENTS
CONSTITUENT PER LITER PER LITER REMARKS

mg/L. MEQ/L

CALC10M.co++ 279.0 13.95

MAGNEsiUM . Me + + 20.80 1.70
· SODIUM-Na+ 2812.50 122.28

BARIUM (1NCL. 5TRONTIUM) · Ba + + 12, 0 0.17
TOTAL IRON.Fe++ AND Fo+++ .. Q,,5g Ç,Q2
BICARBONATE - HCO3 1404.0 23.Û2
CARBONATE . CO3 Q Q
SULFATE.SO4"~ 71,0 1,40
CHLORIDE -

CL- 4033,4 U3,ß2 138.12

TOTAL DISSOLVED SOLIDS 8080.

MILLEQUIVALENTSPER LITER a

LOCARITwic s. RA ARD
Ci

...-.
.

.-....,. CI

Co
.

. . 10
--------

-------------------------- --- --- --- HC

ANALYST



(WH) A (tluyt's

Uticip t lhare:sti No. 12 Hili.4,

UNITEDSTATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ^¤°i

··---·----·---------------------------

GEOLOGICALSURVEY I""- ·---------- -

LESSEE'S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

ßtate a County ...._.Duche.sne._ _.._. Pield
_

__.81uebe11

The follozcingis a correc report of operations and production. (including drilling and producing

wclls) for the month of ....p.<' i .., 19.. .............. ..--.--. .... ....-.. ..-...

.fgent's address .........2..--û,...3ex..2.El __....- ............... Company .

,

,ulf.. LL.Co-rgo.rgion...

... -..............

......C.css_G.2..Ex.9."d-.rtg32 601 ßigned ...._.._.... w -X
-

Phone ---------...--,..........3û2x235.25.723................,................
.fgent's title .. Senior Cler L /

N/2 SU/4
13 2S 3W 1-1333

28 2,995 42.9 5,071 3,733 Oump

9/15 113 10 145 Ef 1::0 SPF 2,000 PF

WATER OIL

On band at begi ining of mont 1,664Disposition 3 733 Produced during month 2,995
3old à rin elon:h 3,767Injected e-
Unavoidab1v los: 0*** 100 3WD # -28A2 "

Inason800 3WD # -26A2
On haal at end >f month 892

GAS

Sold 3, 692
3- J.S.G.S. SLC Flared/7ented 0
2 - Jtah Oil de Gas Cons.Comm., SC Used Or/Off Lease * 19
1 - 3eGo yer and MacNaighton *Residue Retd from plant
2 - 3hel . Oi Co. , Hou r ton Used On Lease C'roduced) 1, 379
9 - NUBDLPÈC ..

CUMULATIVE PROD JCTION
1 - KK
1 - lous on 126,706 8056,463 BW 179,754 HCF
1 - 3C
2 - Tile
1 - .ßH :

Ute Tri al 01-13 3

Nors.---There wero .......?.>..7. .4.•.

............... runs or salen of oil; ...........-3ÁN-.....-....-............M. cu. It. of gas vold;

...................................... runs er sales of gasolitie during the roonth. (Writo "no" where applicable.)
NoT::.--Heport on this foun is required for each calendar Inonth, regardiera of the status of operations, and Inust be filed in

duplicate with the supervicor by-the Oth of the succeeding luonth, unkaa otherwise directed by the rupervisor.

Forn19-309A
(Utt't'Tilber 192) so-262ag-y v.s covenement ,«rsino errace



Form npproved.
Uudget flureau No. 42 14714.4.

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE 1NTERIOR Aue

.. .

GEOLOGICALSURVEY - -·-•

R P, pa ŒÐ tan No....14:2.9. 1.62 .3.2
.....

S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

8ta n Cou,nty nurbonne Flegg ßluebell
..

' correc report of operatiores ared prodrection. (irecluding drillirty and producing

toella) for the month of - ? ÂØR(i A 19

.fgent's addresa ........22.0....Box-.2.619 ...1/................. Comparty /D'nl f ni i onepora t i on ---

Ca,soer, Hyoming 82601 ßigned (cÃ..y.y/ r

Phoree ----....-......-..302-235.·=.1313 .4gent's title .. Senior Clerk .

Exc. Do Tyr. Raoz ' ^* En.aru or On. GavitT Co. 77. or Gas Ns or
G!drcir.g. d pt b down, e use;

K or x .co. raos,<= (In thousaada) Ercove:1xo acoe, sa r·at6) '-"" " n°a'ä "

1/2 SW/4
13 2S 3W 1-1233 0 0 - None SI UO Pulling Unit

WATER

Disposition Jom On hand at begiming of month 1,569

Pit ope
Produced during nonth 0

Injected Sold decir.; .,an:h 0
Unavoidably los : 0

Baason
On hand at end >f month 1,569

GAS

Sold 0
3--- J.S.G.S. SLC Flared/ilented 0

- 2 - Jtah Oil & Ges Cons.Corma., S,C Used Or/Off Lease * 50/
1 - JeGo .yer and MacNa ishton *Resi due Retd from plant
2 - shel . Oi Co. , Hoe ston

9 - NUBDxPÈC .
CUMULATDIS PROD JCTION

1 - « ..

1 - lous on 133,5M 3066,27 J BW 186,037 MCF
1 - 3C

, 2 2 - File
1 - BH ·

Ute Tri mal 41-1333

Non.--There wero No runs or sales of oll;.................$................... . M. cu. ft. of gaa sold;
...l...........,.................... runs or saks of gasolino during the month. (Writo "no" where applicable.)

Non.-Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and inust be fited in
duplicate with tho supervisor by tho Oth of the .succeeding month, unless otherwiso directed by the supervhor.

.
Form9•K'9A
(Otomhw 19¼) 10-t623t-i s.g sovtasiassistraiuttus



Porm 331 UNI STATES SURMIT IN TRIPL . Form approved.
(May 1963§

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR friehdistructions . re-
5. LEASE

DUEd o

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY ----

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. 1F INDIAN, ALLOTTEE On TRIBE NAME

(Do not ase this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER -.-..--

2. Hans or orzastoa 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Gulf Oil Corporation Ute
S. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 2619, Casper, Wyoming 82602 1-1383
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)at sana Altamont-Bluebell
11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND

1349' FNL& 1645' FSL sown on na

13-2S-3W
14. Panx12 No. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether or, RT, ca, etc.) 12. couNTY og raarsa 13. st1TE

5907' KB Juchesne-Uinta i Utah
1e· CheckAppropriate BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SECT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTUEE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

ACIDIZE X ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Well(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) * *

Refer to attachment. APPROVEDBY THE DIVIStONOF

OiL, GAS, MINING

DATE• N°--

BY.

No additional surface disturbance required.
18. I hereby certif at the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED \ TITLE Petroleum Engineer vars Oct 31, 1977
J. . Lrgtt //

(This space i FederaVor State otade use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIOXS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

See Instructionson Reverse
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UP D STATES MMIT W TM TE* ta o
42-R1424.

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR eia
'" '° " "

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BaalAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY --

A. IP INDIAN, ALLOTTËE OR RI ARE

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug boek to a ditierent reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT N£ME

IL CAS
wgtL WELL OTHEIL

. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. RARM OE LEASE NAME

GulF Oil Corporation Ute
3. AnoaEss OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 2619, Casper, 14Y 82602 1-1383
4. LOCATION OF WELL (R€OOftlOCatiGa clearly and in.accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, ÐR WILDC T

See also space 17 below.)at.arrace Bluebell
11. BEC., T., R;, Ë., OR BLE. 4ND

BURVEY R ÆREA

1349' FWL& 1645' FSL (N/2 $W/4)
13 2S-3R

14..rzastit-No, . 15. EIÆVATIONS (Show whether DE, et, on, etc.) 12. co NTY on raalga 13. sTATE

KB 590T' Dácheifie utah
16. eCk Appropriate BoxTo indicate Netwoof NoticerRepo e,o OtherDato

NOTICE F INTENTIÓN TO: SUBBEQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL Oil ATaTER CASING · WATER SIEUT-OFF BEPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TEEAT HULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TEEATHENT ALTERING CASING

sgOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* ACIDIžING XX ABAKDONMENT*

REPAIE WELL CHANGS PLars (Other)
(NOTE : RepOrt re58Ïts Of multiple 40mþ1etion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. O SCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. ILwell is directionany drined, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers nad zones perti•
nent to this work.) *

See Attachment

18. I hereby cer the for ing is ue and correct

SIGNED ,
ITLE ŸetrOleum Engineer April 5, 1978

S Smith
(This space for Federal or State otüte use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



WEit. PPSGRESSREPORT-Field
GUS 95368

Make reports complete, such as description of casing . . . Show, as soon as known, name of contractor, type of rig, and kind of fuel . . .

In guide morgin show casing (as, 7"), 'Contractor," 'Shot,"At;idized," etc.

GUIDEMARGIN DATE AR A. F. E. LEASEAND WELL g ) ..

Ute 1-1383
13-25-3'd, Duchesne Co., UT
.93750

3/2/78 Remove scale acid stimulate. Gulf AFE #82120. On 12/6/77, MI & RU Howco test
lines to 8500 psi & press annulus to 3000 psi . Treated Wasatch perfs TO,525 to
12,596' w/ 10,000 gal 7-1/2% HCLcontatning the following/1000 gaf. 3 ga 3NJ10 gal Fe-1A, T gal Pen-5, 3 gal HAI-50, 3 gaT LP-55 5# FR-20. Pmpd in 5
stages separated w/ 1000 gal form wtr containing the fo110wing/1000 gal: 3 gal 3
3 gal LP-55, 5# FR-20, flushed w/ 5000 gal form wtr containing same additives
all acid & flush treated to 140°F Max press 7000#, Avg press 69504, ATR 10 BP
ISIP 4600, 5 min SIP 4150, 15 min SIP 3690. Prod before trtmt, 70 80PD, 95AIP
100 SPM,2500 psi hyd pmp press. Prod after trtmt 2/22/78· 83 80PD, 234 BWPD,
120 SRM, 2800 psi hyd. pmp press.



c 9-331 Form Approved.
1973 .a e Budget Bureau Norg-RI424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE e i à
DEPARTMENT OF THE 1NTERIOR 14-20-H62 17

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMEN AME -

(Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different --- 15

reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) g
¯ËARM

OR LEAS NAME
1. oil gas Ute Tribal

well Å well other 9. WELL NO.
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 1-13B3

Gul f Oil Corporation 10. FIELD OR WILD AT AME 5
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR Bl uebel l o

P. 0. Box 2619; Casper, WY 82602 11. SEC., T., R., M. CÏR LK. AND SU VEY OR
4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA

below.) 13-ŸS-3
AT SURFACE: 1349' EWL& 1645' NSL (NE SW) 12. COUNTY OR PARIS 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Salile Duchesne Utal
AT TOTAL DEPTH: Salile 14. API NO. 2.

16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, 43-013-30253 2 i
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (ÊHOW DF, KDB AN WÑ

5887' ungrádoa GL 5906 BREQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report res ItËo ultipi com I i n r zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9 330.)
MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent deta s and give pertinent ates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, givè subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)* a 5

See attached.

Subsurface Safety ValvenManu. and Type e Ft.

18. I he by certify that the foregoing is true and corr
UCt100

SIGNED TITLE Fogineer DATE
nn

(This space for Federal on State off ce use)

APPROVED E TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL F Y:

*See Instructions on Reverse



WELL PROGREE REPORT-Field
GUS 95368

Make reports complete, such as description of casing . . . Show, as soon as known, name of contractor, type of rig, and kind of fuel . . .

In guide margin show casing (as, 7'), 'Contractor,"Shot,"Acidized,' etc.

GUIDE MARGIN DATE YEAR A. F. E. LEASEAND WELL

$31,641

5-19-82 PBTD 12,656'. Perfs/fmt 10,525'-12,596'/wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'. EOT @
9504'. SITP=0#. Dewax 2-1/16" tbg w/50 bb1s hot wtr. POH w/50 stads 2-1/16" tbg.
RU Cable Inc & tstd 7 stads tbg to 3000PSIG. Trouble w/parafin & crimped tbg pins.
LD bad tbg. RIH w/43 stnds 2-1/16" tbg & dewax w/50 bble hot wtr. Cable slips brk
in crimped pin. RD Cable. POH with & LD 130 jts 2-1/16" tbg. POH w/35 stnds 2-7/8"
N-80 Nu-loc. SDFN.

$34,072

5-20-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'. EOT @9504'. SITP=0. Dn 6 hrs for repairs. Dewaxed w/100 bb1s hot wtr & POH w/121 stds2-7/8" Nu-Loc tbg. Parallel free BHA & Baker catcher. RIH w/Baker "R-3" pkr,
National csg tree, BHA & 132 stds 2-7/8" Nu-Loc tbg. Broached every 20 stds. SION.

¥43,126
5-21-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9465'. SN @ 9465'. EOT @

9495'. SITP=0. Fin RIH w/31 jts 2-7/8" Nu-Loc tbg. Set Baker "R-3" pkr @ 9465' w/
15,000# compression. Flushed 2-7/8" tbg w/30 bb1s hot wtr. Dropped stdg valve.&
press tstd csg, 2-7/8" tbg & pkr to 1500PSI, OK. RIH w/83 stds 2-1/16", 10rd tbg
to 4980'. ND BOP & NU WH. Circ well bore w/National triplex pump.

5-22-82 Cire 16 hrs w/triplex pump. Dropped National .035 hydraulic pump. Will report
pump performance & prod 1 day late.

5-23-82 Pumped 31 BO & 125 BW in 18 hrs on 108 SPM pump. PP=2400PSI.

$43,766

5-24-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9465'. SN @ 9465'. EOT @
9495'. SITP=0. Pmpd 10.3 BO & 125 BW in 24 hrs on 108 SPM pump. PP=2500PSI.

$43,766* (5-24-82)

5-25-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9465'. SN @ 9465'. EOT @
9495'. Pumped 20 BO & 150 BW in 24 hrs on 108 SPM pump. PP=2500PSI.

$44,080

5-26-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'. EOT @
9504'. Pumped 20.6 BO & 150 BW in 24 hrs on 100 SPM pump. PP=2500PSI. Starter
pump out of cavity.

$45,020

5-27-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'. EOT @
9504'. Cire well 24 hrs w/National Triplex pump. Dropped National .050 hydraulic
pump. Will report prod 1 day late.

$45,029
5-28-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9465'. SN @ 9465'. EOT @

9495'. Pmpd 40 BO & 150 BW in 24 hrs on 120" SPM pmp. PP=1700PSI.

5-29-82 Pmpd 31 BO & 150 BW in 24 hrs on 100" SPM pmp, 1900PSI.

5-30-82 Pmpd 31 BO & 150 BW in 24 hrs on 120" SPM pmp, 1700PSI.

I



WELL PROGRESS REPORT-Field
GÖS 95368

Make reports complete, such as description of casing . . . Show, as soon as known, nome of contractor, type of rig, and kind of fuel . . .

In guide margin show casing (as, 7'), 'Contractor,' 'Shot,"Acidized,' etc.

GUIDE MARGIN DATE YEAR A. F. E. LEASEAND WELL

Ute 1-13B3
13-2S-3W, Duchesne Co., UT
Ref No.
API No.

.9375

AFE #
$15,000
$20,182

5-10-82 WORKOVER. 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'.
EDT @ 9504'. SITP=0. MIRU Gamache. ND WH & NU BOP. Pumped 1.250D ball dn 2-1/16"
side string, press tst to 2000PSI, OK. POH w/80 stds. SIFN.

5-11-82 Fin POH w/68 stds 2-1/16" tbg. Dropped dummy pump dn 2-7/8", press tstd to 2000PSI,
OK. Bad BRA. POH w/136 stds 2-7/8" Nu-loc tbg. SDFN.

5-12-82 Fin POH w/20 stds 2-7/8" Nu-loc, National parallel free BRA & Baker anchor catcher.

RIH w/new BRA, anchor catcher & 156 stds 2-7/8" tbg. Broached every 40 stds. Set
anchor 19,000# tension. RIH w/seal assy & stinger & 148 stds 2-1/16", 10rd tbg. SDFN.

$20,182

5-13-82 Spaced out 2-1/16" tbg & hung off w/5000# compression on stinger. Pumped 30 bbls hot
fmt wtr dn 2-7/8" & dropped stdg valve to press tst. Bled off 100#/min. RIH to tap
stdg valve, OK. Re-press & bled off 100#/min. Stung in & out of BHA, would still
bleed off. Dropped 1.25" ball dn.2-l/16" tbg & press tstd, still bled off. POH w/2-1/16" tbg, press tstg every 40 stds. SDFN.

5-14-82 Bullplugged 2-1/16", 10rd tbg. -RIH, press tstg 1 std @ a time to 3000PSI. Tstd 66
stds. LD 18 bad jts. SDFN.

,

5-15-82 Press tstd 82 stds 2-1/16" tbg to 2500PSI. LD 4 bad jts. POH w/148 stds 2-1/16"
tbg. SDFN.

5-16-82 SIFS.

$23,133

5-17-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'. EOT
@ 9504'. SITP=0. RIH w/148 stds, 2-1/16", 10rd tbg & National stinger sub.
Flushed 2-7/8" tbg w/50 bbls hot wtr & stung into National BHA. Attempted to press
tst, would not. POH w/148 stds 2-1/16" tbg. SION.

$26,842

5-18-82 12,656'PBTD. Perfs/fmt=10,525'-12,596' Wasatch. Pkr @ 9495'. SN @ 9495'. EOT @9504'. SITP=0. RU Cable Inc to hydrotst 2-1/16", 10rd tbg. Could not get in hole
w/tools. RIH w/50 stds 2-1/16" tbg, dewaxed w/75 bb1s hot wtr. POH w/2-1/16" tbg.
Tstd 50 stds tbg to 3000PSI, LD 22 jts. RIH w/50 stds tbg.



Lease Name Field Section Township Range County State

Tomlinson/Federal 1-25A2 Bluebell 25 1S 2W Duchesne UT
Uintah-Ouray/Tribal 1-1A3 Bluebell 1 1S 3W Duchesne UT
Urruty 1-34A2 Bluebell 34 1S 2W Duchesne UT
Utah S/F 1-24B1 Bluebell 24 2S 1W Uintah UT
Utah State Lnd. Bd. 1-11B1 Bluebell 11 2S 1W Duchesne UT

g Ute County 1-2004 Altamont 20 3S 4W Duchesne UT
't Ute Tribal 1-1C4 Altamont 1 3S 4W Duchesne UT\ Ute Tribal 1-1383 Bluebell 13 2S 3W Duchesne UT

Ute Tribal 1-1504 Undesignated 15 4S 4W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-20 Altamont 20 4S 6W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-20Z3 Bluebell 20 1N 2W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-21D3 Bridgeland 21 4S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-21Z2 Bluebell 21 1S 2W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-27D3 Bridgeland 27 4S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-28 Altamont 28 4S 6W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-28D3 Bridgeland 28 4S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 1-904 Duchesne 9 4S 4W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 3-5E3 Antelope Creek 5 SS 3W Duchesne UT
Ute Tribal 5-29E3 Antelope Creek 29 5S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-10A3 Altamont 10 1S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-13B3 Bluebell 13 2S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-2A3 Bluebell 2 1S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-2C5 Altamont 2 3S SW Duchesne UT
Ute 1-20Z2 Bluebell 20 1N 2W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-2281 Altamont 22 4S 6W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-3A3 Altamont 3 1S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-4A3 Altamont 4 1S 3W Duchesne UT
Ute 1-5CS Altamont 5 3S 5W Duchesne UT
Voda Ute 1-4C5 Altamont 4 3S 5W Duchesne UT
Voda, Josephine 2-19-C5 Altamont 19 3S 5W Duchesne UT
Voda,Josephine 1-19-C5 Altamont 19 3S 5W Duchesne UT
Whiton Federal 1-19-3C Gypsum Hills 19 8S 21E Uintah UT
Wonsits Unit #10 Wonsits WV 5 8S 22E Uintah UT
Wonsits Unit #11 Wonsits WV 5 8S 22E Uintah UT
Wonsits Unit #13 Wonsits WV 6 8S 22E Uintah UT
Wonsits Unit #14 Wonsits WV 6 8S 22E Uintah UT
Wonsits Unit #15 Wonsits WV 6 8S 22E Uintah UT
Wonsits Unit #2 ; Wonsits WV 29 7S 22E , Uintah UT

06/27/85
leases gulf operated/file2
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L. 6. Rader P. O. Box 2619
PRODUCTIONMANAGER-CASPER NEA July 2, 1985 camer.wvs2eo2

State of Utah
Division of Oi , Gas and Mining RECENED
355 West North Temple
3Sa riLaadkeCeCn Suahte 38

80-1203 JUL 05 1985

Gentlemen: DIVibus
GAS & W

Effective July 1, 1985, the corporate name of Gulf Oil Corporation was
changed to Chevron U.S.A. Inc. This will be applicable to all operations,
agreements, contracts, documents, and permits of Culf Oil Corporation in
the area of and/or under your jurisdiction.

The attached information is being furnished to facilitate the name change of
appropriate records under your authority, and submitted as our under-
standing of the procedure required to accomplish the change.

Please advise this office or the office listed on the attachments should
additional information be needed.

S

L. G. Rader

KWR/mdb

Attachments

A DIVISION OF GULF OIL CORPORATION TELEPHONE: (307)



Proven Properties Inc.
P.O. BOX2049 • HOUSTON, TEXAS77252-2049 • (713) 546-8780

eÌsinH R. HUDDLESTON

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
State of Utah
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
355 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Re: Change of Operator Bluebell-Altamont Fields,

Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah

Gentlemen:

Heretofore on December 26, 1985, Chevron U.S.A. Inc. advised you concern-

ing properties sold by Chevron U.S.A. to Proven Properties, Inc. and informed

you by telephone of change of operator with respect thereto.

This will confirm the advice given to you by Chevron U.S.A. Inc. Attached

hereto is the same list of wells furnished to you by Chevron U.S.A. which is

marked Exhibit "A" and by this reference made a part hereof. Proven Properties,

Inc. is now the operator of the wells described in the attached schedule,

however, Pennzoil Company will be operating said properties as agent for

Proven Properties, Inc.

We will promptly report to you in writing any change of address and any

termination of our operator's authority including any designation of a new '

operator. However, the designation of Proven Properties, Inc. as operator

shall remain in full force and effect until and unless a new designation of

operator is filed in accordance with the Utah statutes and the rules and

regulations and rules of practice and procedure of the Division of Oil, Gas

and Mining of the State of.Utah.

If there are any additional reports or any additional information which

you would wish to have, kindly call Kevin Cunningham at 713-546-8768.

Yours very truly,

HE 40NÐ ] 5 tg/DER THE / ENNzo/L

NomEj om inEREFone payszag. is PROVENPROPERTIES, INC.

Kenneth R.Muddieston,
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Chevron U.S.A. Wells Sold to Proven Properties Inc.,
P.O. Box 2049, Houston, Texas 77252-2049, Effective

December 1, 1985

Entity No. Well Name

05255 SP-H-U Tribal 2-24Z3

05256 SP-H-U Tribal 4-36Z3

05270 Owen Anderson 1-28A2

05275 Black Jack Ute 1-14-2D

05280 Blue Bench Ute 1

05285 Ute Tribal 1-6B2

05295 Campbell Ute St. 1-7B1

05300 Campbell Ute 1-12B2

05305 Cheney 1-33A2

05306 Cheney #2-33-A2

05320 Duchesne County Snider 1-9C4

05325 Duch Co 1-17C4

05330 Duch Co Tribal U 1

05335 Evans Ute 1-17B3

05336 Evans Ute #2-17-B3

05340 Fortune Ute Fed1-11C5

05345 Freston St 1-8B1

05350 Geritz Mur 1-6C4

05360 Hamblin 1-26A2

05361 Hamblin 2-26-A2

05370 J Robertsn Ute



O O
Entity Nö. Well Rame

05500 Smith Broadhead 1-9C5

05505 Smith David Ute 1-6C5

05510 Smith Joseph 1-17C5

05515 Smith Ute 1-18C5

05520 St Lnd Brd Ute 1-35A1

05525 Taylor Maurel l

05530 ToddUSASt 1-2B1

05535 Tomlinson Fed 1

05540 Unta Ouray Trbl 1-1A3

05545 Urrutz 1-34A2

05550 Ut St Fed 1-24B1

05555 Ut St L/B 1-11B1

05560 Ute 1-2A3

05565 Ute 1-2C5

05575 Ute 1-4A3

05580 Ute 1-5C5

05585 Ute 1-10A3

05590 Ute 1-20Z2

05605 .24 3 AT' Ute Tribal 1 13¾3/ VJo /33

05610 Ute Tribal 1-21Z2

05620 Ute County 1-20C4

05645 - Voda Jsphine 1-19C5

05650 Voda Jsphine 2-19C5

05655 Voda Ute 1-4C5

05665 Woodward Fed



O O
Entity No. Well Name

05375 Rachel Jensen 1-16C5

05385 John1-3B2

05387 John 2-3-B2

05390 Verl Johnson 1

05400 Lamicq 1-20A2

05405 J Lamicq St. 1-6B-1

05410 L Rbrtsn St 1-1B2

05412 Lamicq-Robertson State #2-1-B2

05415 Lamicq Ute 1-5B2

05425 McElprang 1-31A1

05430 Marguerite Ute 1-8B2

05435 May Ute Fed 1-13B1

05440 Moon Tribal 1-30 C4

05450 Mortensen 1-32A2

05452 Mortensen 2-32-A2

05455 Phillips Ute 1-3C5

05460 Reese Estate 1-10B2

05465 Robertson 1-29A2

05470 Robertson Ute 1-2-B2

05472 Robertson Ute 2-2-B2

05475 Rbrtsn Ute St 1-12B1

05480 - Saleratus W/U 1-7C5

05485 Shrine Hsptl 1-10 C5

05490 Smith Albert 1-8C5

05495 Smith Albert



Entity No. Well Name

05666 Dillman 2-28A2

05675 CR Ames 1-23A4

05695 StU 1-7B1E

05700 Ute Tribal U 6-7B3

05705 Ute Tribal 1-6B3

05710 Lyn Timothy U 1-10B1

05715 Ute Tribal 9-4B1

05720 E Bennion U 1-25A4

05725 B Hartman U 1-31A3

05730 Ute Tribal 7-24A3

05735 Ute Tribal U 2-12A3

05740 L Boren U 1-24A2

05745 Lamicq-Urty U 3-17A2

05750 L Boren U-6-16A2

05755 L Boren U 3-15A2

05760 Virgil B Mecham U 1

05765 St Unit 2-35A2

05770 Harmston U 1-32A1

05775 WH Blanchard 2-3A2

05780 Walker V. Brown #1

05785 Ute Allotted U 1-36Z2

05790 · T Horrocks 1-6A1

05795 Joseph Yack U 1-7A1

05800 Curtis Bastian 1-7A1

05805 Chsl-Fly-Dia



Entity No. Well Name

05810 State 3-18A1

05815 RG Dye U-1-29A1

05820 Summerell EU 1-30A1

05825 LL Pack 1-33A1

05835 Mobilute Trbl 11-6A2

05836 Ute Tribal #2-7A2

05840 Doug Brown 1-4A2

05845 Lamicq-Urty U 4-5A2

05850 Mobil-Ute Trl 1-7A2

05855 Lamicq-Urty 2-A2

05860 Ut St U 1-10A2

05865 Sprgfld M/B/U 1-10A2

05870 L Boren U 2-11A2

05875 Norman Knd/ U 1-12A2

05876 Clyde Murray 1 (2-2C)

05877 Blanchard Fee 1-3A2

05878 Utah State 1

05880 Olsen U 1-12A2

05885 Fly/Dia 1 Boren 1 (2-14C)

05890 Ute Tribal 3-18A2

05895 Ute Tribal 4-19A2

05900 L Boren U 5-22A2

05905 L Boren U 4-23A2

05910 Ute Tribal 5-30A2

05915 Ute Allotted



Entity Nö. Well Name

05920 P. Bckstd U 1-30A3

05925 Ute Tribal 10-13A4

05930 Karl Shisler U 1-3B1

05935 C. B. Hatch 1-5B1

05940 Norling St. U 1-9B1

05945 H.G. Coltharp 1-15B1

05950 George Murray 1-16B1

05960 E.H. Buzz U 1-11B2

05965 D.L. Galloway 1-14B2

05970 State Pickup 1-6B1E

05975 Mobil-Lami. Ur 1-8A2

09895
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Pennzoil Ex lorgion and Production Company Ute
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**• 16. StaTATiews tiw w of, aT. en, ete,) if& R os tantam là, eTata

3-OrS - So 5/ 5887' (GL); 5906' (KB) Duchesne Utah
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neat to this work.) •

Propose to acidize existing Wasatch perfs with 28,000 gals HCL. If casing damage is
encountered while working on well, propose to cement squeeze according to the extent
of damage.

(Die span for Federal or State oSce use) ACCEPTED BY THE STATE
a-'t et TITLE F UTAH DIVISI g OF
esa s or arsova, rr wr: OIL AS, AND MINING

r
care

'See lustructionson Reva



ÏNorra 16e0-
83) UNITE ' TATES gay,it onu gre .'3",'geau N31, 11 08

(Formerly 9-331) DEPARTMENT .
THE INTERIOR verse.lae> fa. LEASE DESIONATION AND SEEIAL WO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
0. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OB TRINE NAME

SUNDRYNOTIŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS a ,
(Do not time this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir. U g

Use ''APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch propo

1. .4 I AOBEEMENT NAME

OIL GAB
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAME or OPERATom 8 Om LEABE NAME

Pennzoil Exploration and Production Co. UTE TRIBAL
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

DIVISIOIMOF
P.O. Box 2967, Houston, Texas 77252 e gggy 1-1383

4. LOCATION OF M ELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State require è . 10. FIELD AND POO OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
at .urface Bluebe11-Altamont

1349' EWL & 1645' NSL (NE 1/4 SW 1/4) 11. amee.,a"n""°°iant,r.AND

Sec. 13, T.2S. ,R.3W.
14. PER T NO. 15. ELEVATIO5Ns (Show w ether or, RT, ca. et<.) 12 COUNTY OBePARISH 18 STATE

16 CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indica:e Nature of Notice, Report, or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : BUBBEQUSNT REPORT OF *

TEST WATER SBUT-Orr . PULL OR ALTER CtslNG • WATER SHUT4)FP BEPAIBING WELL X
FRACTUBE TREAT 3ICLTIPLE ContPIÆTE FRACTURE TREATMKNT ALTERING CASING

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SUGOTING OR ACIDITING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CIIANGE I'LANS (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

¯

(Other) ('ompletion or R colapletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COblPLETED OI'ERATIon (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subaurface locations and ruensured and trur vertical depths for all markers and gonee perti-
nent to this work.) *

. WORK PERFORMED FROM 11- 7-86 TO 12- 8-86

1. R.U. PULLING UNIT. POOH PRODUCTION TUBING & EQUIP. PRESSURE TEST CSG
FIND LEAK AT 2838'- 2868'.

2. RU DOWELL. SQUEEZE CSG LEAK (2838-2868) WITH 100 SX CLASS "G" CMT. DRILL
OUT CMT , PRESSURE TEST CSG .

3. RU SMITH TO ACIDIZE WASATCH PERFS (10,525-12,596) WITH 28,000 GALS OF
15% AND 7 1/2% HCL AT 12 BPMN & 8400 PSI.

4. SWAB-TESTED WELL. PUT ON PRODUCTION WITH HYDRAULIC PUMP.

18. I hereby at e forego s true and correct

SIGNE Ñ (A .2 TITLE Supervisitig Engitteer DATE 6/24/87

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPILOVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL. IF ANY :

*See Instructionson ReverseSide

Title 18 U.S C Se, non 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinely and willfulls to make to any department o. no
United S'a:r'. any f ise. ::connue er fraudulent statements or repr- otations as to any matter within its iurisdicti



Ute #1-1383
Duchesne County, Utah
Section 13 - T2S - R3W
AFE Cost $114,500.00.

11-7-86: MIRUpulling unit - Pumped out pump - NDwe11head - NUBOP -

POHw/ 124 jts 2 1/16" 10rd sidestring when well kicked -

Flowed to tank until died - POHw/ remaining 2 1/16" tbg -

Change for 2 7/8" equip - Held tension on 2 7/8" 0N - SDFN -

ECTD$2,411.00.

11-8-86: Worked pkr 1 hr - Released pkr - POHw/ 312 jts 2 7/8" N-80
Nulock tbg, BHA, and Baker R-3 pkr - RIH w/ 4 1/8" bit, 5" csg
scraper and 272 jts 2 7/8" N-80 tbg - SDFN- ECTD$4,406.00.

11-9-86: SDF Sunday

11-10-86: Finish RIH w/ bit and scraper on 2 7/8N tbg - Tagged fill at
12,592' (PBTD 12,656', btm perf 12,596') - Attempt to circ
clean - Would not circ - POH w/ tbg, bit and scraper - SDFN
ECTD$6,154.00.

11-11-86: Hydrotest to 9000 PSI w/ Mtn States 5" ND pkr on 2 7/8 N-80

tbg - Set pkr at 10,200' in 25,000f compression - Filled
annulus with 180 bbis fmt wtr - Press csg to 1500 PSI - Bled

to O PSI in 1 minute - Estab injt rate down csg at 1.5 BPMat
1200 PSI - Rel pkr - SDFN - Suspect csg leak 9800'-10,200' -

ECTD$10,657.00.

11-12-86: Suspect csg leak - PU 2 jts - Reset pkr - Load csg and test
to 1500 PSI - Bled to O PSI in 1 min - Rel pkr - POHw/ tbg
and pkr - RIH w/ 5" RBP on 5" pkr and 2 7/8" tbg - Set and
test RBP at 10,199' - PU and set pkr 20' below TOL at 9927' -

Test annulus - Confirm csg leak above 9927' - POHw/ 111 jts
2 7/8" tbg - SDFN - ECTD$14,175.00.

11-13-86: POHw/ remaining 215 Jts tbg and 5" Mtn States HD pkr without
retrieving head - Retrieving head apparently still on RBP at
10,199' - RIH w/ 7" Mtn States HDpkr - Isolate csg leak
2832'-2892' - Estab injec rate 1.5 BPM© 800 PSI - Rel pkr
POH - RIH to screw into retrieving head with 2 3/8" pin x
2 7/8" box XOon 2 7/8" N-80 tbg - Stop with E0T at 4962' -

RU hot oiler - Pump 40 bb1s hot diesel and 40 bb1 hot wtr
down tbg - RD hot oiler - Continue RIH - Screwed on to retr
head - Rel RBP - POH with 12 jts tbg - E0T 9 9837' - SDFN -

ECTD



Ute #1-1383
Duchesne County,
Section 13 - T2S - R3W
AFECost $114,500.00.
11-14-86: RIH w/ Baker 7" RBP and Retrievamatic on 2 7/8" tbg - Set and

test RBP & 9000 PSI - Spot 5 sks sand on RBP - PU and set pkr
at 2504' - Press annulus to 1500 PSI - OK - RU Dowell-Schlum
Establish inject rate 3 BPMat 1250 PSI w/ 20 bbl fresh wtr -

Mix and pump 100 sks class G neat cmt to squeeze csg leak
2838'-2868' - Displace cmt with 9 bb1 fresh wtr with 25 sks
cut behind csg - Release pkr - Rev circ clean 20 sks cmt to
pit - Hold 1200 PSI on csg and tbg - SDFN- ECTD$23,685.00.

11-15-86: POHw/ 2 7/8" tbg and pkr - RIH w/ 6 1/8" bit, 7" csg
scraper, 6-3 1/2" drill collars on 2 7/8" tbg - Drilled
solid cmt 2518'-2809' - Circ clean - SDFN- ECTD$25,690.00.

11-16-86: SOF Sunday

11-17-86: Finished drilling out squeeze - Orilled from 2806'-2830' -

Fell through - RIH to 3000' - POH w/ drill string - RIH w/
Baker 7" retrievamatic pkr - Set pkr at 2892' - Press test
annulus to 1500 PSI - RU and set pkr at 2502' - SDFN -

ECTD$28,028.00.

11-18-86: Rel pkr - RIH and reset pkr at 2587' - Press test annulus to
2000 PSI - Held OK - RU Halliburton - Estab inject rate with
fresh wtr § 2 BPM & 1800 PSI - Mixed and pumped 50 sks class
H neat cmt - Opened surf pipe estab circ - Displaced cmt out
of pkr - Closed surf pipe - Hesitate squeezed 8 times to
final squeeze press 2000 PSI - Release pkr - Rev circ clean -

Re-set pkr - SI with 1000 PSI on squeeze - 31,526.00.

11-19-86: Rel pkr - POHw/ 2 7/8" tbg and pkr - RIH w/ 6 1/8" bit,
7" csg scraper, 6-3 1/8" drill collars and 85 jts 2 7/8" tbg
Tagged cmt at 2768' - Drilled hard cmt 2768'-2895' and fell
through - Test squeeze to 1500 PSI - Bled to 1400 PSI
in 15 min and 1350 PSI in 30 min - POHw/ drill string - RIH
with retrieving head on 175 Jts 2 7/8" tbg - E0T 5425' -

ECTD$33,150.00.

11-20-86: RIH with remaining 119 Jts on retrieving head. Circ. sand off
RBP. Catch and release RBP. POOH. Found bottom cone and
drag springs gone off bottom of RBP. Apparently on T.0.L. at
9906'. RIH with 4 1/8" flat bottom mill, 3 3/4" bumper sub,
and 295 Jts 2 7/8N tbg. SIFN. ECTD$35,635.

11-21-86: RIH w/ remaining tbg on flat btm mill - Tagged fish at 9916'
- Milled and spudded on fish 20 min - Fell 3' - Cont milling
Chase fish to 12,500' - PU to 10,000' - Circ clean - POHw/tbg, bumper sub and 4 1/8" mill - SDFN - ECTD$37,445.00.

11-22-86: Hydrotest in hole to 9000 PSI w/ 5" Baker Retrievamatic pkr
and 335 jts 2 7/8" N-80 tbg - Set pkr at 10,197' in 32,000#
compression - Press test annulus to 1500 PSI - Bled to 1400PSI in 15 min - NDBOP - NUwellhead - SDFN-

ECTD$41,618.00.
11-23-86: SDF



Ute #1-1383
Duchesne County, U
Section 13 - T2S - BW
AFE Cost $114,500.00.

11-25-86: Flowing/Swabbing back acid job - Opened well to pit - Blew
down in 10 min - Ran swab - IFL 1600' - Swbd well in w/ 2
runs - Flowed 17 bb1 oil and 4 BWthen died - Made 20 swab
runs from stable fluid level of 4500' - Recvd 82 BO & 73 BW
in 10 hrs - 698 bbl load to recover - ECTD$65,258.00.

11-26-86: Cont swabbing back acid job - IFL 4900' - Made 30 swab runs
from stable fluid level of 4900' - Recvd 72 BO & 149 BWin 10
hrs - 549 BLWto recover - SDFN - ECTD$67,080.00.

11-27-86: SDF Thanksgiving

11-28-86: Cont swabbing - IFL 2900' - Made 30 swab runs from stable
fluid level of 4400'-6000' - Recvd 62 80 & 167 BWin 10 hrs -

382 bbl load wtr to recover - ECTD $68,593.00.
11-29-86: Cont swabbing - IFL 3200' - Made 28 runs form stagle fluid

level of 4800'-5500' - Recv 49 80 & 142 BWin 10 hrs -

240 BLTR - SDFN- ECTD$70,316.00.
11-30-86: SDF Sunday

12-1-86: Blew down well - NDwell head - NU80P - Rel pkr - POHw/
2 7/8N tbg and pkr - RIH w/ gas anchor, tbg anchor, 1 jt
2 7/8" Brd tbg, ARMCOparallel free 220 series BHAand 201 jts
2 7/8" tbg - Stopped to broach tbg every 40 jts - SDFN -

Hauled from yard 4400' 2 1/16N N-80 Atlas Bradford class 8 tbg
for sidestring - ECTD$102,317.00.

12-2-86: RIH w/ remaining 120 Jts 2 7/8" tbg - Set tbg anchor at 9844'
in 20,000 lb tension - RIH w/ parallel free stinger on 164 jts
2 1/16" J-55 10rd tbg and 80 jts 2 1/16" N-80 Atl Brad. tbg -

SOFN- ECTD$103,924.00.
12-3-86: RIH w/ remaining 66 Jts2 1/16" tbg sidestring - Stung into BHA

and land sidestring in 8000 lb compression - NDBOP - NU
we11head - Pumped standing valve to seat - Pressure tested
system to 2500 PSI - Held 15 min OK - Convert wellhead to
parallel free - RD pulling unit - Circ well - Will drop pump
ECTO$106,234.00.

12-4-86: Dropped ARMCO1.75" 220 series hydraulic pump 9 9 am -

ECTD$106,534.00.
12-5-86: Pumped 16 80 & 125 BW in 16 hrs

12-6-86: Found down on high discharge - Change pump

-12-7-86: Found down on high discharge - Change pump
12-8-86: Down for pump



Ute #1-1383
Duchesne County, Utah
Section 13 - T2S - R3W
AFE Cost $114,500.00.
12-9-86: No report

12-10-86: No



DOGM 56-64-2
an equal opportunity employe

UTAH
NATURALRESOURCE:
Oii. Gas & Mimng

355 West North Temple, 3 Triad Center, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, Ut 7 Î Ž
84180-1203.0 (801-538-5340)

Ÿage--- Of

MONTHLY OlL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

Operator name and address:

'd-V Utah Account No. N2886

P 0 BOX 2967,25TH FL.
HOUSTON TX 77252 2967 Report Period (Month/Year)

ATTN: Amended Report

Well Name Producing Days Production Volume

API Number Entity Location Zone Oper Oil (BBL) Gas (MSCF) Water (BBL)

UTE TRI BAL 1-2112
4301330148 05610 01N 02W 21 WSTC

UTE couNTY 1-20c4
4301330170 05620 035 04W 20 GR-ws

VODA JSPHINE I-19c5
4301330382 05645 035 05W 19 WSTC

voDA JSPRINE 2-1905
4301330553 05650 035 05W 19 GR-ws

VODA UTE 1-4CS
4301330283 05655 035 05W 4 GRRV

WOOOWAROFED 1-21A2

4301330130 05665 ois o2w 23 WSTc

Ol LLMAN 2-28A2
4301330821 .05666

015 02w 28 wsTC
CR AMES 1-23A4
4301330375 05675 015 04W 23 WSTC
FEDERAL 1-28
4304730175 05680 055 19E 28 GRRV

FEDERAL 1-27
4304730181 05685 OSS 19E 27 GRRV

ST U 1-781E
4304730180 05695 025 01E 7 GRRV /D

UTE TRI BAL U 6-783
4301330211 05700 025 03W 7 wsTC

TOTAL

Comments (attach separate sheet if necessary)

I have reviewed this report and certify the information to be accurate and complete. Date

Telephone
Authorized signature

PLEASE COMPLETE FORMS IN BLACK INK



PENNZOIL COMPANY RE
PENNZOIL PLACE • P. O. BOX2967 • HOUSTON, TEXAS77252-2967 • (713) 546-4000

AUG 4 1987
DIVISIONOF OIL
GAS& MINING

July 30, 1987

Utah Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
Attn: Tammy Searing
355 Triad Center, Suite #350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

Ms. Searing:

This letter is to confirm our telephone conversation of July 30, 1987,

regarding the name change from Pennzoil Exploration & Production Co. to
Pennzoil Company.

Please change your records to reflect this name change effective August

1, 1987.

Your contact for drilling operations will continue to be Will Luna at
our Neola office. The contact for the monthly production reports will

be myself at our Houston address. All affected properties, except the
drilling activity, are listed on the attached production report for

June, 1987. The bonding is in the name of Pennzoil Company.

This is a change in name only, the company and personnel have remained
the same. If you need additional information, please call me at
(713)-546-8104.

Martin Wilson
Onshore Accounting



STATE OF UTAH gl/
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s. samaa DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.

13.. 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES On TRIE WANS

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON. WELLŠ
(Do not use this form for pronosals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT---" for such proposals.)

1, 7. UNDRAGREB¼BNT NAMS
orr, oss
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAxa or orsaarom 8. ramat on LaAsa NAxx

Pennzoil Company Utah Acct. # NO705 See Attached List
8. ADDRESEOf ÄÕÙÄR 9. WELL NO.

P.O. Box 2967 Houston, TX 77252-2967
4. LOCATIox or war.L (Report location élearly and i¤ accordance with any State requirementa.• 10. TIBLD AND POOr., OR WILDCÁ

See also space 11 below.)
At surface

. R1aphall /al tamnntSee Attached List of Wells u...c.a.....x..oaar.x.ann
80BVET OR ASSA

. AP 1 NUMBER 18. aLaTArtoNs (Show whether er, RT. on, eta,) 12. Couxor om raalax 18. swara
Duchesne & Utah
Uintah

te· CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Aeport,or OtherData
NOTIC3 07 INTENTION TO: SO388QUENT REPORT 07:

TERT WATER SEUT•OFF PULL OR ALTER .CASING WATER SHUT•Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPt.ETE PRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SBOUTING OR ACIDIzlNG ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL Ct!ANGE PLANS (Oth‡r)
(Norm: Report resulta of multiple completion on Weltother, Operator Name Change

.1. Unmpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. ogscains Pnnvosso on court.sTao oPERATroNs (Cleuriy state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

Change of operator name from Pennzoil Company to Pennzoil Exploration &
Production Company, effective June 1, 1988.

See Attached List of wells
OILANDGAS

DRN RJF

JRS GLH

DTS SLS

3.y-FILE

18. I hpreby cor that the f eg g is e and correct

samm. - <- exotaWestern Div. Production Mqr.,,,,,, G -†-Fg

(This space är Federal or State ogee use)

APPROVED BT TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, 17 ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Page 2 of 4

SUNDRY NOTICE OF NA ANGE
EXHIBIT A

ENTITY LEASE NAME LEGAL API REMARKS
NUMBER DESC. E

5470 ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 2S 2N 2 4301330225 WWT Agl/
5472 ROBERTSONUTE 2-2B2 2S 2N 2 4301330921
5475 ROBERTSON UTE ST 1-1281 2S 1N 12 4304730164

e5480 SALERATUS NASH 1-7C5 3S 5N 7 4301330098
5485 SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 3S EN 10 4301330393 |ayy(6
5490 ALBERT SMITH 1-8C5 3S 5N 8 4301330245
5495 ALBERT SMITH 2-8C5 3S EN 8 4301330543
5500 SMITH BROADHEAD 1-9C5 3S EN 9 4301330316
5505 DAVID SMITH UTE 1-6C5 3S 5N 6 4301330163
5510 JOSEPH SMITH 1-17C5 3S EN 17 4301330188 0976
5515 SMITH UTE 1-18C5 3S EN 18 4301330142 pfrrŒ \
5520 ST LANDBOARD 1-35A1 1S 1N 35 4304730182
5525 MAUREL TAYLOR 1-36A2 1S 2N 36 4301330143
5530 TODD USA ST 1-2B1 2S 1N 2 4304730167
5535 TOMLINSON 1-25A2 2S 2N 25 4301330120
5540 UINTAH OURAY1-1A3 1S 3N 1 4301330132
5545 URRUTY 1-34A2 1S 2N 34 4301330149
5550 UTAH ST FEDERAL 1-24B1 2S 1N 24 4304730220
5555 UT ST LANDBOARD 1-1181 2S 1N 11 4304750171
5560 UTE 1-2A3 1S 3N 2 4301330409
5565 UTE 1-2C5 3S 5N 2 4301330392
5575 UTE 1-4A3 1S 3N 4 4301330306
5580 UTE 1-5C5 3S EN 5 43013302GO
5585 UTE 1-10A3 1S 3N 10 4301330319
5590 UTE 1-20Z2 1N 2N-20 4301330378
5605 UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3 2S 3W 13 430133025142
5610 UTE 1-21Z2 1N 2N 21 4301330148
5620 UTE COUNTY1-20C4 3S 4N 20 4301330170
5645 JOSEPHINE VODA 1-19C5 3S 5N 19 4301330382
5650 JOSEPHINE VODA 2-19C5 3S EN 19 4501550555 h3°FTf-

5655 VODAUTE 1-4C5 3S EN 4 4301330283
5665 NOODNARDFED 1-21A2 1S 2N 21 4301330130
566G DILLMAN 2-28A2 1S 2N 28 4301330821
5675 CR AMES 1-23A4 1S 4N 23 4301330375
5680 FEDERAL 1-28 ES 19E 28 4304730175
5685 FEDERAL 1-27 5S 19E 27 4304730181 06'"(,
5695 STATE 1-7B1E 2S 1E 7 4304730180
5700 UTE TRIBAL 6-7B3 2S 3N 7 4301330211
5705 UTE 1-683 2S 3N 6 4301330136
5710 L. TIMOTHY 1-10B1 2S 1N 10 4301330287 US'ri v
5715 UTE TRIBAL 9-4B1 2S 1N 4 4301330194 L19fŒ \,
5720 BENNION 1-25A4 1S 4N 25 4301330060
5725 HARTMAN1-31A3 1S 3N 31 4301330093
5730 UTE TRIBAL 7-24A3 1S 3N 24 4301330203
5735 UTE 2-12A3 1S 3N 12 4301330042 $$$Ü
5740 L. BOREN 1-24A2 1S 2N 24 4301330084
5745 LAMICO URRUTY3-17A2 1S 2N 17 4301330099
5750 L. BOREN 6-16A2 1S 2N 16 4301330123
E755 L. BOREN 3-15A2 1S 2N 15 430133008G
5760 VIRGIL MECHAM1-11A2 1S 2N 11 4301330009
5765 STATE 2-35A2 1S 2N 35 4301330156
5770 HARMSTON1-32A1 1S 1N 32 4301330224 pyy11
5775 BLANCHARD2-3A2 1S 2N 3



YestnOOC•th SLBitil 1%litil'île til

DEPARTMENT
AALNNESOUWCES

DIVl$lON OF OIL, QAS.ANDMINING L saas. es...••rsen •••••.,a ..

$UNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTSON WELLS
tDe set see this to to a a steseasgenervest.

Pennzoil Exploration and Prodt tion Company ÛÛI 1Î 1988 Ute

P.O. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252 DMSONOF 1-1383

4. gaga se rt leenties eiessir sad la asserisses withser Essas ØÛ*û 10. 950LB 658 9005. 08 WILSCAT

at eastus Bluebell/Wasatch
11.asc.. s.. s., s. es as.a. aus

1349' EWL and 1645' NSL (NE 1 4 S 1 4) *** T om** *

Sec 13,T2S,R3W

16. Psaanse se. A travassens IIbew ebether er. er, sa assi
· 85. esener se passes as. esass

3- O - A.25/ 5 ' GL/ 8906' KB pqchesne UT

at CheckAppropeseteBenToIndiese.Netureof Notica,Repen,er OtherDefe
sessca er ausssssesse: seassesamt massas er:

raer massa easteur won en utsa cassee massa snowere serasasse wou

raaetwas rasat ucceses.a centrasrs raaesens tasatssue avsaine enesse

SMoot na acsÞtBE AsaWOOM* SB0eTime om afi ISINS
asemmessamT•

859484 WELL tilAWOB PLAira (Ogger)
spints: Report teenits et settiple semplettes es Wel

tOtheri i «•,.magessen ur Recomplettes Report sad I.eg tere.)

IT saarmies ranensaa na tuasrs.stan opr.aaTeens (Clearir state nti pertinent details. and giro pertisent dates. teeledtag eettested date of starting ear

preseest mera. It well is diressionaar drinet gree subsortase inestions and measured and true vertical depths for all markers eed semes perti-

east as this werk) •

Plan to reperforate and acidize additional Wasatch pay zones. Also will repair any

casing damage found during well work with squeeze ñementing.

(Thte apaae ter Feistal er State eSee



Form0GC·1b SUBi Titirl.lt \\T

E OF UTAH (o astrurimus on
wrw shir)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES -

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING , LEASE OggggNATION aWD ammiaL WO.

14-20-H62-1732

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WEL15
Do not use this toUra to r als e ro dee a r i back o diRerent reservoir.

OIL GAS
W3LL WELL 0TRES

Pennzoil Exploration and Production Compan T
e. wBLL NO.

P.O. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252 1-13B3
4. LOCATION OF WBl.L ( 090ft 008 St 047 7 As B 8000& B $

See also space 17 below.
At sortaee Bluebell/Wasatch

11. BBC., T., 8., M., 08 BLE. AND
00BTET 08 ASSA

Sec. 13, T2S, R3W

1e CheckAppropnete BoxToIndicateNatureof Notice,Repon,or OtherData
NOTIC3 GP INTENTION TO• 50BasqUSNT REPORT OF:

TEST WATES BROT<bt? PULL 08 ALTER CasfNO wATat SNUT•Ogg REFAlstNO WELL

FRACTUBS TREAT MULTIPLE ¢0MPLETE FRACTUsa TSEATMENT ALTsalN6 CAstNO

SHOOT na ACIDIZE I ABANDON• BROUTING 08 ACIDESING X ^•^""*""="T*
-

REFAta WELL ct!ANos PLAus (Other)
If¢nTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) .....J Completion or Recompletton Report and Log form.)

l'i. DEacatas rnnynsgn nu tuMi•LETED OPERATroNa (Clearly state n11 pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface loestions and measured and trtte vertteal depths for all markers and nones pertt•

nont to this work.) •

1. Perforated 10510-11440' (5 int, 495', 1000 holes)
2. Acidized 10510-12', w/20,000 gallons 7-1/2% HCL.
3. Placed well back on hydraulic pukp

(This space for raderalor State ogee use)

AP"" VED ST TITLE DATE

Cu;wne 25 07 APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



FortnOCC·1b SUBMIT fitli'lli ill

8 OF UTAH (Oth tru.s e sm

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS, AND MINING """ ***'*""'*" '"* ""

14-20-H62-1732
. 17 $WDIAW. ALI.0TTBS OB Tales NAMS

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
tDe met see tate toUm 'SÊÊË00'ro¾isiner-'ri,'L'pre a Refeat t000FTot

1. . UNIT AOBERMENT WAMS

t.L
waSLL

OTRH

Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company Ute

P.O. Box 2967, Houston, TX 77252 1-13B3

: sortsee Bluebell/Wasatch
11. ase., t., a., n. os as.s. a

80895T 08 ASSA

ecit AppropriateBoxToladicate Natureof Notica, Report,or OtiserDato

nossca or surmassex to: sessaousus aross or:

TEST WATSB SECT'07 POLL 08 ALTER cas!NO WATSB BNUT4FP REFAltiMO WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MCLTIPLS COMPLKTE FRACTttag TSBATMENT ALTERIW6 CAgime

3NOOT om ACIÞtBE AB&NDON* SMOUTIMO Og aflDISING
ABANDOMMENT*

REPAIR WELL cifAses PLAWa (Other)
(Nota: Report results of auttiple completion on Wei

IOther) ('ompletion or Recomµletion Report and 1,og form.)

17. osatalet rnnvass:n na cuarLETF.0 09WRATIONa (Clearly state nil pertinent detalis. and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. It well is direetionally drilled, give ambourtsee toestions and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and senes perti-

next to this work.) *

Worked performed from 4/6/89 to 5/27/89

1. Perforated 10,510-11,440' (5 int, 495', 1000 holes). OiL AN
2. Acidized 10,510-11,440' w/20,000 gals 7-1/2% Hel. DAN
3. Placed well back on hydraulic pump.

JRB

DTS SLS

MICROFILM

FILE

16.
a Supervising Engineer vara

(Tbte space for ederal or State ofice ase)

AP""^VED ST TITLE DATE

Co..ana.. 5 07 APPROVAL. 17 ANT:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form 3160-3 UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA i L

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR'
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICE AND RE PORT ON WELLS 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL N

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.
14-20-H62-1732

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TR18AL NAME

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. IF UNIT OR CA, AGREEMENT DESIGNATION

1. TYPEOF WELL OIL GAS 8. WELL NAMEAND NO.

WELL WELL OTHER Ute 1-13B3

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API WELLNO.

PENNZOIL EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY 43-013-30251-00

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR - 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

P.O. BOX 290 NEOLA, UTAH 84053 PHONE: (801) 353-4397 Bluebell / Wasatch

4. LOCATION OF WELL AT SURFACE(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. COUNTY OR PARISH STATE

1,349' EWL and 1,645' NSL (NE 1/4, SW 1/4) ‡gg// ffg Duchesne Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICE OF INTENT ABANDONMENT O CHANGE OF PLANS
RECOMPLETION [¯¯]NEW CONSTRUCTION

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT PLUGGING BACK NON-ROUNTINE FRACTURING
CASING REPAIR WATER SHUT-OFF

FINALABANDONMENT NOTICE ALTERING CASING CONVERSION TO INJECTION
OTHER DISPOSE WATER

(Note: Report results of multiplecompletion on Well Completionor Recompletion Report and Log Form)

13. Describe Proposed or Completion Operation (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give

subsurface locations and measured and vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

Pennzoil plans to plug back existing perforation with a plug at 10, 400 '

and recomplete Lower Green River. Any casing damage found during well
work will be repaired with remedial cementing.

,saa TITLE Petroleum Engineer DATE:April 29, 1993

(Thisspace for Federal or State office use)
PERMIT NO: APPROVED DATE:

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE:
CONDITIONOF APPROVAL, IF



# e
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

5 Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1732
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6 If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals Ute Tribal

7 If unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well 9692

Oil Well Gas well Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Ute 1-1383
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 9 APlWellNo.

3. Address and Telephone No. 43-013-30251-00
P.O. Box 290 Neola, Utah 8 4 0 5 3 (8 0 1) 3 5 3 - 4 3 9 7 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) BÍUebell-Wasatch
11. County or Parish, State

1349' FWL and 1645' FSL of Section 13, T2S, R3W Duchesne, Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing repair Water Shut-off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Dispose Water
letion on Well

form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyg
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinentto this work)

Summary of workover from 6-24-93 to 7-20-93 AUGj | 19ÿ)
June 24, 1993: MI & RU pullingunit· DIVISIONOF

L GAS &MININJuly 4, 1993: Finished fishing tbg, pump cavity and anchor catcher.

July 7, 1993: Set 5" CIBP at 10,450' and capped with 35' of cement. Tested casing to 1000 psi, held OK.

July 8, 1993: Ran cement bond log from 10,413' to 2500'.

July 13, 1993: Perforated Lower Green River from 9418' to 10,233' (25 intervals, 101', 202 holes).

July 20, 1993: Rigged down pullingunit. Left well flowing.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is t nd correct

Signed JOSS DUllAÍQ Title Petroleum Engineer Date 16-Aug-93

(This space of Federal or State e use.)

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly to make to any department of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as
to any matter within its



UNITE TATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1732
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, AllotteeorTribeName

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals Ute Tribal

7. If unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well 9692

Oil Well Gas well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Ute 1-13B3
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 9. APIWelINo.

3. Address and Telephone No 43-013-30251-00
P.O. Box 290 Neola, Utah 8 4 0 5 3 (8 0 1) 3 5 3 - 4 3 9 7 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Bluebell-Wasatch
11. County or Parish, State

1349' FWL and 1645' FSL of Section 13, T2S, R3W Duchesne, Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing repair Water Shut-off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other Dispose Water
(Note: Report resuis of muRiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompleilon Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. Ifwell is directioally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true verticaldepths for all markers and zones pertinentto this work)

Summary of workover from 6-24-93 to 11-23-93

June 24, 1993: MI & RU pullingunit.
July 4, 1993: Finished fishing tbg, pump cavity and anchor catcher.
July 7, 1993: Set 5" CIBP at 10,450' and capped with 35' of cement. Tested casing to 1000 psi, held OK.
July 8, 1993: Ran cement bond log from 10,413' to 2500'.
July 13, 1993: Perforated Lower Green River from 9418' to 10,233' (25 intervals, 101', 202 holes).
July 20, 1993: Rigged down pulling unit. Left well flowing.
Oct 29, 1993: RU pullingunit.
Nov 4, 1993: Cleaned out fill from 9418' to 10,415'
Nov 6, 1993: RD pullingunit.
Nov 16, 1993: RU pulling unit.
Nov 18, 1993: Acidized perfs 9418-10,233' with 15,000 gallons 15% HCL. NL Û/ 199j
Nov 23, 1993: RD pulling unit, left well flowing.

14. Iberebycert thattheforegnongist rre

Title POÍf0Ieum Engineer Date 6-Dec-93

A(Thisspace of Federal or State ce use.)

Title D te

Conditions ofapproval,if any:

Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly to make to any department of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent sta ments or repre tatio as
to any matterwithinits



UNITI- STATES d DECDEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR I 5 0
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

DIVOF 5. L se Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLs OIL,GAS&MINWA 14 20 H62 1732
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. Indian,AllottesorTribeName

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals Ute Tribal

7. If unit or CA, Agrooment Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPL/CATE
1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof Operator UTE 1-13B3
Pennzoil Exploration and Production Company 9. APIWelINo.

3. Address and Telephone No. 43-013-30251
P.O. Box 290 Neola, Utah 8 4 O 5 3 (8 O 1) 3 5 3 - 4 3 9 7 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sea., T., R., M., or Survey Descriptioni Bluebell-Wasatch
11. County or Parish, State

NESW SEC. 13, , , R3W Duchesne, Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing repair Water Shut-off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Dispose Water
(Note: Report resulte of smitiple onnpletion on Well

Completioner Honompistion Report and Log formd

13, Desoribe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directioally

drilled, give subsurfaou locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

PENNZOILPERFORMED THE FOLLOWING WELLWORK FROM NOV. 1, THROUGH DEC. 9, 1994:

- CEMENT SQUEEZED CASING LEAK2892' - 4350' WITH 450 SX.
- FISHED STUCK PACKER AT 9222'
- PLACED WELL ON PRODUCTION

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is tiue and costeot

Signed Tide PETROLEUMENGINEER oat. DEC. 12, 1994

(This spacebyof Federal or State office use.)

Title

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly to make to any department of the United States any false, fiotitious or fraudulent statements or representations as

to any matter within its



UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENT

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1732
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals Ute Tribal

7. If unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well 9692

OilWell Gas well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof0perator Ute 1-13B3
Pennzoil Company 9. API Well No.

3. Address and Telephone No 43-013-30251-00
P.O. Box 10 Roosevelt, UT 84066 (8 0 1) 722-5128 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec, T., R., M., or Survey Description) BlUebell
11. County or Parish, State

1349' FWL and 1645' FSL of Section 13, T2S, R3W Duchesne, Utah

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing repair Water Shut-off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Install pump, clean out, lower pump. Dispose Water
(Note: Report results of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directioally

drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinentto this work)

3-8-94 to 3-10-94 Converted well from flowing to csg return hydraulic pump. Estimated cost - $8400.

5-31-94 to 6-27-94 Fished pump cavity and pkr (fillfrom csg leaks caused fishing job). Converted well to parallel return
hydraulic pump. Estimated cost - $58,100.

10-24-94 to 12-5-94 Repaired csg leaks at 2892-4350' with 450 sxs cmt. Fished stuck pkr at 9222' and lowered rod
pump 850'. Estimated cost - $180,000.

Estimated total cost of all three stages shown above (100% basis) - $246,000.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Signed JOSs Dullnig Title Petroleum Engineer Date 3-Oct-95

(This space of Federal or State office use.)

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly to make to any department of the United States any false, fictitious orfraudulent statements or representations as
to any matter withinits



(Ib (IlFORM 10
, STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
Page 3 of1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210. PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

OPERATOR NAME AND ADDRESS:
UTAH ACŒUNT NUMBER

No705

DEBORAH THOMAS 6 | 97REPORT PERIOD (MONTH/YEAR):PENNZOIL COMPANY
PO BOX 2967 28TH FL
HOUSTONTX 77252-2967

AMENDED REPORT (Highlight Changes)

Well Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes
API Number Entity location Zone Status Oper OIL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)

o 30 8 5
35

5 01W 35 GR-ws /
MAUREL TAYLORFEE l-36A2
4301330143 05525 015 02W 36 GR-ws

DILLMAN 2-28A2
4301330821 05666 015 02W 28 GR-ws
UTE TRIBAL l-6B3
4301330136 05705 025 03w 6 GR-ws
LAMICQ-URTY U 3-17A2
'^11330099 05745 ois o2w 17 GR-ws

OREN U 6-l6A2
4301330123 05750 ois 02w 16 GR-ws
L BOREN U 3-15A2
4301330086 ,05755

-ols 02W is GR-ws
VIRGIL MECHAM l-llA2
4301330009 05760 015 02W 11 GRRVU
VICTOR C BROWN 1-4A2
4301330011 05780 015 02W 4 GR-WS
UTE ALOTTED U 1-36Z2
4301330307 05785 01N 02W 36 GR-ws
CHASEL l-18Al
4301330030 05805 015 oiw 18 GR-ws
STATE 3-18Al

4301330369 05810 015 oiw 18 GR-WS

TOTALS

)MMENTS·

1ereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge. Date

me and Signature: Telephone Number





plTED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
DATE:

July 30, 1997

Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
SUBJECT

Designation of Successor Operator
'° DIV.OFOIL,GAS&WIINING

Bureau of Land Management, Venal District Office

Transmitted herewith for your records is anapproved Designation of Successor Operator for a
Communitization Agreement, and Barrettillbsources will the be operator, for the following
location:

OPERATOR - FRCE: Pennzoil Company
TDF:Barrett Resources Corp.

CA Number Sec/TwnshpRng Legal Acres |-/303
96-000092 13-T2S-R3W All 640.0 Ÿ8el3-3b>51

The enclosed instruments are approved asaf the date of this letter. Barrett's Bond will be used
to cover all CA operations, plugging and dinadonment of wells. All wells within the CA area
are responsibility of the new CA Operator.

If you have any questions, please contact flis office at (801) 722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

Enclosures
cc: Lisha Cordova, Utah State DOGM

Theresa Thompson, BLM/SLC

OPTIONAL FORM NO. Bil

(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101.!LS
soto-tta

» U.S. GPO:



. . DESI ATION OF SUCCESSOR OP MTOR

Communitization Agreement Number: 96-000092

Designation of Successor Operator for communitized area, County of Duchesme,State of Utah, being::

TOWNSHIP 2 SOUTH, RANGE 3 WEST, USB&M/SLB&M
SECTION: 13: ALL
Containing _640 acres, snore or less

This indenture, dated as of the Ig day of January, 49W by and between Barrett Resources Corporation, thereinafter designated as "First party", and the ownersofcommunitized working interests, hereinafter designated as "Second Parties".

WHEREAS, under the provisions of the Act of February 25, 1920, 41 Stat. 437, 30 U.S.C., Secs. 181, et seg., as amended by the Act of August 8, 1946,60 Stat.950, aCommunitization Agreement for the Above Communitized Area, effective Ammust2. 1973, wherein Pennzoil Company is designated as Operator of the communitized areaand

WHEREAS, said Pennzoil Companv has resignedas Operator, and the designation of a successor Operator is now required pursuant to the terms thereon; and

WHEREAS, the First Party has been and hereby isdesignated by Second Parties as Operator of the communitized Area, and said First Party desires to assume all therights, duties, and obligations of Operator under the said Communitization Agreement.

WHEREAS, the First Party has, prior to approval cif this indenture, filed aapproved Bond with the Bureau of Indian Affairs, Uintah and Ouray Agency, in the amount of$150.000.00, Bond No. 6101757342 (NM2545), approved on November 24, 1995.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises hereinbefore set fod and the promises hereinafter states, the First Party hereby covenants and agrees to fulfill theduties and assume the obligations of Operator of the communitized area under and pursuant to all the terms of the said Communitization Agreement, and the Second Partiescovenant and agree that, effective upon approval of this indenture by the Supesintendent, Bureau of Indian Affairs, Uintah and Ouray Agency, Fort Duchesne, Utah,FirstParty shall be granted the exclusive right and privilegeef exercising any and aR rights and privileges as Operator, pursuant to the terms and conditions of saidCommunitization Agreement; said Agreement being hereby incorporated herein by reference and made a part hereof as fully and effectively as though said Agreementwereexpressly set forth in this instrument.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto haveæxecuted this instrument as of the date hereinabove set froth.

(FEST P^RTY)

(sEcoND PARTY)

PENNZO MPA Y

B. E. Ball, Agent and Attomey-in-Fact

By

By:

I hereby approve the foregoing indenture designating RARRRTT REnniTRCER coup as Operator under the Communitization Agreement forthe above
ocation, this iday of ,Tyly , 19L.

Supointendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency
Bueau of Indian Affairs
Fort Duchesne,



EXHIBIT "A"

CA NO. 96-000092

(SECOND PARTIES CONTINUED)

Forcenergy Inc.
2730 SW 3rd Avenue, Suite 800
Miami, FL



UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR J AN 1 /
BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT

L asse Designation and Serial No.SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLs Div.OF0\L, GAS& M! 14 20 H62 1732Do not use this form for proposals to drill or deepen or reentry toiñÍÏfšrent reservoir. 6 ff Indian, AllotteeorTribeNameUse "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

7 ffunitor CA, Agreement DesignationSUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well

9692
Oil Well Gas well Other

8 Well Name and No.
2. NameofOperator

Ute Tribal 1-13B3Pennzoi! Company
9 APIWelINo.

3. Address and Telephone No. 43-013-30251P.O. Drawer 10 Roosevelt, UT 84066 (801) 722-5128 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
BlUebell

11. County or Parish, StateNESW of Section 13, T2S, R3W Duchesne
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATATYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion NewConstruction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing repair Water Shut-off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
Other Change of Operator Dispose Water

(Note: Report resuis of muRiple completion on Wel
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work ifwell is directicallydrilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths forall markers and zones pettinent to this work)

Pennzoil relinquished operatorship of the subject well to Barrett Resources Corporation as of January 1, 1997.

I
14. I hereby certifythat the foregoin rue and corr

Signed JOSS DUllnig
.g Title Senior Petroleum Engineer Date 8-Jan-97

(This space of Federal or State officeuse.)

Approved by Title
Date

Conditions of approval,if any:

fitle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyto make to any department ofthe United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations aso any matter withinits



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Routip /

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET U %d
7-K A

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. R-9i
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 4-Vin / q.pyy p

WO Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent
O Designation of Operator O Operator Name Change Only

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 11-1-96 & 1-1-97 (SEE INDIVIDUAL SUNDRIES)

TO: (new operator) BARRETT RESOURCES CORP FROM: (old operator) PENNZOIL COMPANY
(address) 1515 ARAPAHOE ST T3 #1000 (address) Po Box 2967 28TH FL

DENVER CO 80202 HOUSTON TX 77252-2967

Phone: (303)606-4259 Phone: (713)546-8104
Account no. N9305 Account no. NO705

WELL(S) attach additional page if needed:

Name: **SEE ATTACHED** APf:4¾Û Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name: API: Entity: S T R Lease:
Name:

_ _
API:

_ _ _
Entity: S T R Lease:

OPERATOR CHANGE DOCUMENTATION

& l. (r649-8-10) Sundryor other legaldocumentation has been received from the FORMER operator (attach to this
form). (e çaf,

e 2. (r649-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from the NEW operator (Attach to this
form). ( çu ja

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above is not currently operating any
wells in Utah. Is the company registered with the state? (yes/no) If yes, show company file number:

4. FOR INDIAN AND FEDERAL WELLS ONLY. The BLM has been contacted regarding this change. Make
note of BLM status in comments section of this form. BLM approval of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should ordinarily take place prior to the division's approval, and before the completion of steps 5
through 9 below.

5. C es have been entered in the Oil and Gas Information System (3270) for each well listed above.han

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. Q-'/-ýy)
6 7. Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above. Á-7-
' 8. Changes have beenincludedon the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo for distribution

to Trust Lands, SovereignLands, UGS, TaxCommission, etc. (ggg
9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been placed there for

referenceduring routing and proce,ssingof the original documents.
cMons\wpdocs\forms\operchng

- OVER



OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (co ed) - Initial each item when completed. Write if item is not applicable.

ENTITY REVIEW

I. (r649- 7) Entity assignments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were entity changes made?(yes/ If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of Form 6, Entity Action Form.

N _A 2. Trust Lands, Sovereign Lands, Tax Commission, etc., have been notified through normal procedures of entitychanges.

BOND VERIFICATION - (FEE WELLS ONLY) Sidy /½'9& s f// Afo,cco) * S4ßeors, del //s.

1. (<649-3-1)The NEW operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operator's bond files.

3. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes/ , as of today's date
á '7,/ff7 . If yes, division response was made to this request by letter dated

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION OF RESPONSIBILITY

1. Copies of documents have been sent on u |G to Q ; net at Trust Lands for changesinvolving State leases, in order to remind that agency of their responsibility to review for proper bonding.

2. (r649-2- The former operator of any fee lease wells listed above has been contacted and informed by letter
dated nd 19 21, of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change.

FILMING

l. All attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Today'sdate:
.

FILING

1. Copies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form, and the original attachments are now being filed in the Operator Change file.



Ron 3.1 U D STATES FORM APPROVED
ember 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ""ex

reureau No. 1 -oias

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. I.ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLs 0·-38560 -SG-SÔ
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-entÐf an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned we/I. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPL/CATE- Other instructions on reverse side 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

O w°",, U w°:,",
OO her 8. Well Name and No.

Utc #1 13032. Name of Operator

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation Attn: Cheryl Cameron
9. APIWellNo.3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (includeareacode} 43-013-30251-00

P. 0. Box 1148 Vernal , Utah 84078 35-781-7023 m Fiel<i and Pool of FYplor9tory Ar-a
4. Lacation of Wen (Footage, Sec., T , R., Af., or Swvey Description)

S13-T2S-R3W NESE
I l. County or Parish. State

Duchesne, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize D epen Production (Start/Restune) Ww Shut Off

Alter Casing FM Treat Rec antation Weß InkgrhyO suus--«-ean
Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete X other Change of

O Final Abandonment Notice Change Plans Plug and Abandon Tensporarily Abandon Operator
O ca...«,«,.>,,.. ,,,,.... Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Coommpleted Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowing completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed. Final Abandomnent Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the final site is ready for final inspection.)

Please be advised Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation at P. O. Box 1148 Vernal, Utah 84078 is considered to be
the operator of the above referenced well and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease
for the operations conducted upon the leased lands.

Effective date of change is January 1, 2000

BLMbond coverage is provided by U605382-9.

Utah state bond coverage is U2644534. State operator number is 17102 RECEIVED
JAN1O2000

Please contact Cheryl Cameronat 435-781-7023 if you have any questions. DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Title
Name (Printed/Typed)

J hn . Elz Vice President

Date

THI ACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Titic Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or egy¡,,cortify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would ontitlo the applicant to conduct operations thoroon.

Titio 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crimo for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious orfraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on



Form O(if lb SUSMIT 1N TRIPUCATE
"' STATE OF UTAII comer.nst oson

DEPA ENT OF NATI R.tL RESOt RCES reve

DIVIS N OF OlL, GAS, AND MINlNG
5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

9692

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.lFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENÁME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a dillerent reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals.)

I 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
Oil Gas
Well Well Other

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION
3.ADDRESSOFOPERATOR 9.WELLNO.

1815 ARAPAHOE STREET, TOWER 3, #1000, DENVER, CO 80202 (303)572-39co UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface BLUEBELL

1645' FSL 1349' FWL si.ssc., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND

NESW 13-2S-3W SURVEY OR AREA
APl#43-013-30251 NESW13-2S-3W I

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ETC.) II. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

5906' KB DUCHESNE UTAH

is Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO : SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATERSHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) PROGRESS REPORT

(Other) CHANGE OF OPERATOR (Note: Report results or multiple completion on weil
Completionor recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, inclucing estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally

ally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 1, 2000, BARRETT RESOURCES CORPORATION WILL RELINQUISH THE
OPERATORSHIP OF THE REFERENCED WELL TO COASTAL OIL AND GAS CORPORATION.

18. I hecreby certify that

TITLE Sr. Vice-President, Land DATE

(This space for ederal or State oltice use)

APPRO D BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instruction on Reverse



NITED STATES GOVERNMENT

DATE: February 22, 2000 memorandum
UNg. Superintendent, Uintah & Ouray Agency, Ft. Duchesne, UT

SUBJECT: Approved Communitization Agreements

to, Bureau of Land Management, Utah State Office
Attn: Theresa Thompson

Transmitted herewith for your records is an approved Designation of Successor for
Communitization Agreements for the following locations:

CA No. Sec-T-R Legalg? i igerësi i
9C-000145 03-2S-lE All 652.98
9C-000129 05-2S-lE All 648.10
9C-000141 08-2S-lE All 640.0
96-000063 31-lS-lW All 642.16
9C-000136 35-lS-lW All 640.00
9C-000130 01-2S-lW All 640.38
9C-000125 09-2S-2W All 640.0
9C-000131 18-2S-2W All 627.44
96-000092 13-2S-3W All 640.00

VR49I-84678C 30-3S-4W All 648.95
UTU76235 04-3S-5W All 636.32
9C-000156 l l-3S-5W All 640.0
UTU75538 16-3S-6W All 640.0
96-000110 21-3S-6W All 640.0
96-000089 22-3S-6W All 640.0

The enclosed instruments are approved on February 9, 2000.

Copies of the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with
one copy retained at this office.

If you have any questions,please contact this office.

cc: BLM, Vernal, UT

OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REV. 1-80)
GSA FPMR (41 CFR) 101-11.6
5010-114





4. Is the new operator registered in the State Utah: YES Business Number: 049324

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 03/26/2000

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: 02/22/2000

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") I The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 08/14/2000

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/14/2000

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond on: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: APR2 4 2001

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:



STATE UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

OlVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEOESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6 IFINDIAN.^LLOTTEEORTRIGENAL

T or CA AGREEA4ENT NAME:
Do nol use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells belowcur<ent boltom-hole depth. reenter plugged wells, or to

d<ill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO OR1LL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER _

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Exhibit "A"
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

A South 1200 East env Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 435-789-4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIOlZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date wo<k will stad: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of wode completion:

COMMINGLE PROOUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Name Chance
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dales, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001..

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE ViC€ PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE

El Paso duction OiÍ & Gas päny
NAME(PLEASEPRif ) JOhn T z er _ TITLE

Vice PTOSident

SIGNATURE DATE '

(This space for ate use only RECEIVED
JUN 19 2001

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse side)
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

DMSION OF

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary ofState

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:



03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4 CORP. LAW DEPT. 003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the fonowing amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorpomtion be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

"FIRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Co2poration Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

1N WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretaty, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L. Siddal
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

E '
-

.

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet . Roark, Assistant Secretwy FILZD 11: 00 AN 03/09/2001
010118394 - 0610204

lüN 19 2001
DIVISION OF

DIL GAS AND



O O
United States Department of the Interior

os a

BUREAU OF LhAS
e

MANAGEMENT

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 JUL1 2 2001

DIVISION OF

In Reply Refer To:
OIL, GAS AND MINING

3106
UTSL-065841
(UT-924)

JUL 1 0 2006

NOTICE

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company : Oil and Gas
Nine Greenway Plaza
Houston TX 77046-0095

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been received in this office concerning the name change of Coastal Oil &
Gas Corporation into El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company with El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company being the surviving entity.

For our purposes, the name change is recognized effective March 9, 2001.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the enclosed exhibit have been noted as to the name change.
The exhibit was compiled from a list of leases obtained from our computer program. We have not
abstracted the lease files to determine if the entities affected by this name change hold an interest in
the leases identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entitities are the operator on
the ground maintaining no vested recorded title or operating rights interests. We will be notifying
the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of the
change by a copy of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of operator are required by
our Field Offices, you will be contacted by them.

If you identify additional leases in which the entities maintain an interest, please contact this office
and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this



Due to the name change, the name of the principal/obligor on the bond is required to be changed
from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company. You may
accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.
The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

Opoloma L. Abeyta
Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Exhibit of Leases (1 pp)

cc: Moab Field Office
Vernal Field Office
MMS, Reference Data Branch, MS3130, PO Box 5860, Denver CO 80217

(gitggfgitg¶ØGÑ[,\Attn: Jim Thompson (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine



States Department of the I r
BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS

«
"

.;

Uintah and Ouray Agency
6 ° P. O. Box 130

988 South 7500 East
a ** Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026-0130

Phone: (435) 722-4300 Fax: (435) 722-2323

IN REPLY REFER TO:
Minerals and Mining
Phone: (435) 722-4310

August 16, 2001

Fax: (435) 722-2809

El Paso Production Company
Attn: Elizabeth R. Williams
Nine Greenway Plaza
Houston, TX 77046-0995

DearMrs. Williams:

We are in receipt of the corporate documentation for the name change from Coastal Oil & Gas

Corporation to El Paso Production Oil and Gas Company.

All documents appear to be in order, and the approval is hereby authorized to change all records,

including change of operator of certain oil and gas wells, Rights-of-Way, Communitization

Agreements, Oil and Gas Leases, Exploration and Development Agreements, etc. from Coastal

Oil & Gas Corporation to "El Paso Production Oil and Gas Company".

Approval of this name change is August 16, 2001, but effective on March 9, 2001. If you have

any questions, please do not hesitate to contact this office.

Respectfully,

Acting Superintendent

RECEIVED
AUG22 2001
DIVISIONOF

OtL, GAS AND



I ivision of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS
2. CDW/ 5-LP
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995
Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
UTE UNIT 1-36A4 (CA 96-42) 43-013-30069 1580 36-01S-04W INDIAN OW P
UTE 1-06B2 43-013-30349 1895 06-02S-02W INDIAN OW P
UTE 2-6B2 43-013-31140 11190 06-02S-02W INDIAN OW P
MARQUERITE UTE 1-8B2 43-013-30235 5430 08-02S-02W INDIAN OW S
CAMPBELL UTE 1-12B2 (CA 96-90) 43-013-30237 5300 12-02S-02W INDIAN OW S
UTE TRIBALU 6-7B3 (CA 96-75) 43-013-30211 5700 07-02S-03W INDIAN OW S
UTE 3-1 ß3 (CA 96-79) 43-013-31379 11490 12-02S-03W INDIAN OW P

(CA 96-92) 43-013-30251 5605 13-02S-03W INDIAN OW P
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 (CA 96-104) 43-013-30274 5335 17-02S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE UNIT 1-01B4 (CA 96-49) 43-013-30129 1700 01-02S-04W INDIAN OW P
UTE-JENKS 2-1-B4 (CA 96-49) 43-013-31197 10844 01-02S-04W INDIAN OW P
UTE 1-28B4 (CA 96-81) 43-013-30242 1796 28-02S-04W INDIAN OW S
UTE 2-22B5 43-013-31122 10453 22-02S-05W INDIAN OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 (CA 96-85) 43-013-31132 10456 34-02S-05W INDIAN OW P
UTE 2-21B6 (CA 96-39) 43-013-31424 11615 21-02S-06W INDIAN OW S
UTE 2-22B6 (CA 73743) 43-013-31444 11641 22-02S-06W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-27B6 43-013-30517 11166 27-02S-06W INDIAN OW S
UTE 2-27B6 43-013-31449 11660 27-02S-06W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-28B6 43-013-30510 11165 28-02S-06W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-28B6 43-013-31434 11624 28-02S-06W INDIAN OW S
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:



O O
5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 08/16/2001

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 07/10/2001

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: 08/16/2001

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 08/29/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/29/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

INDIAN BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond No.: 103601473

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond No: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change



Form 31 ITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(Augus ) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMs NNo

m r 3
,325000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-4864

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an
abandoned well Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. I InEdi lottee or Tribe Name

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agoement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
UTE 1-1383

g oilwell O Gaswell 0 Other
2. Name of Operator Contact: MARGIEHERRMANN 9. API Well No.

EL PASO O&G COMPANY E-Mail:Margaret.Herrmann@EtPaso.com 43-013-30251

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
PO BOX 120 Ph: 435.454.4236 BLUEBELL-WASATCH
ALTAMONT,UT 84001 Fx: 435.454.3970

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or SurveyDescnption) 11. Countyor Parish, and State

Sec 13 T2S R3W NESW 1645FSL 1349FWL DUCHESNE COUNTY,UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize . O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
g Notice of Intent

0 Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
O Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete Other

0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon rSuccessor of Operato

O Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testinghas beencompleted. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filedonly after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

EL PASO PRODUCTION O&G COMPANYIS THE OPERATOR OF THE REFERENCED WELLON THE ABOVE DESCRIBED LANDS,
AND IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONSOF THE LEASE FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTEDON THE
LEASED LANDSOR PORTIONS THEREOF. BOND COVERAGE FOR THIS WELL IS PROVIDEDBYBIANATIONWIDEBOND
NO. 103601473, EFFECTIVE MAY 7, 2001.

RECElVED

MAR12 2003
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #19276 verlfle the BLMWell Information System

For EL PASO O&G COM 'A sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) ,MAgGIE HERRMANN Title PREPARER

S (Electronic Submission) Date 03/06/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnotice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operationsthereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section1001 and Title 43 U.S.C.Section1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

" ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET L DJJ
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X Operator Name Change

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 7/1/2006

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1845-El Paso Production O&G Company N3065-El Paso E&P Company, LP

1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX 77002 Houston, TX 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 420-2300 Phone: 1 (713) 420-2131

CA No. Unit:

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 7/5/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 7/5/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/30/2006

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 2114377-0181

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: requested 7/18/06

6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: ok

6c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on:

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the rnerger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA not yet

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 7/14/2006

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 7/19/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 7/19/2006

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 7/5/2006

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473

3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO708

a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a applicable wells moved

The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/20/2006

COMMENTS:

El Paso 1 FORM 4A.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

MULTIPLELEASES
6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRlBENAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7 UNITar CA AGREEMENT MAME

Do not use thisform for proposals to dril newwells,significandydeepen emisingwallsbelow currentbosom-hole depih, menterplugged walls,or to
drBIhorizonial Islatals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLlann for such pmpoenlit

1 1YPE OF MELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER.
OIL WELL GASWELL OTHER SEE ATTACHED

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR 9 API NUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY N'7Ú
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PMONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL OR WILOCAY:

1339 EL SEGUNDO AVE NE ALBUQUERQUE , NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 SEE ATTACHED
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: SEE ATTACHED COUNTY: UINTAH& DUCHESNE

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ac.= DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
2 NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicale) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appraximate dels work willstart CASNG RM NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR C-E TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Data af workcomplodon:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE O OTHER: CHANGE OF
O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAFlom OPERATOR

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent delmils includinGdates, depths, volurnes, eic.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY (CURRENT OPERATOR) HAS
TRANSFERRED ITS OPERATORSHIP TO EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. (NEW OPERATOR) EFFECTIVE JUNE ,du

2006 AND THAT EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS CONSIDEREDTO BE THE NEW OPERATOR OF THE
ATTACHEDWELL LOCATIONS.

EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE LEASE(S)
FOR THE OPERATIONSCONDUCTED UPON LEASED LANDS. BOND COVERAGE IS PROVIDED BY THE STATE
OF UTAHSTATEWIDE BLANKETBOND NO. 400JUO705, BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENTNATIONWIDEBOND
NO. 103601420, AND BUREAU OF INDIANAFFAIRSNATIONWIDEBOND NO. 103601473.

El Paso E & P Company, L. P. gggg §
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

William M. Griffin, Sr. Vi President

NAME(P ASEPRINT) CHERYL CAMERON y,,, AUTHORIZED REGULATORY



Foun 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORI APIROVED
ME) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E 1,

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSuialNo
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-4864

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter en 6. If Indian,AlloucecrTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD}for such proposals• UTE TRIBE

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo

Ï. Typeof
ilWellO O QGæWeHOO OOder 8 WellNameandNa

2. Nameof EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P.

3a Address 3b Phone No tmcina area cod ; 4301330251
1099 18TH ST, SUITE 1900, DENVER, CO 80202 303-291-fi444 10.FieldandPool,or ExplataloryArea

4. LocationofWell (Footqge,Sec.,I, R.,M, or Stewy BLUEBELL

SEC 13, T25-R3W 11.CountyorParish, State
NESW, 1645' FSL, 1349' FWL DUCHESNE,UT

11 CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OFNDIIŒ, REPORT,OR OTHERDATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepm Pmducdon (Slart/Resmne) WaW Slun-Off
Noliceof Intent AlterCanng FractureTreat Rechuudo WeHIldeghy

OSubsmiumtRepmt Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomple Odsr AMEND SUNDRY

Oci....ri.. PlugandAlmudon TemporarilyAbandon DATED 6/06/2007
O FinalAbandonmentNolice Conut toInjection PlugBack WaW Duposai

13 DescribeProposedorCompleledOperation(clearlyslaleallpertinentdelails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedworkandappmxiumledurationthereof
Ifthe proposalis todeependirectionallyorrecompleinhorizonially,givesubsurfacelocatiansandmeasuredandtrueverticaldepthsof allpertinentmarkersandzones.
AttachtheBondunderwhichtheworkwillbeperformedorprovidetheBondNo. onfdewithBLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreportsmust befiledwithin30days
followingcompletionof theinvolvedoperations.If theoperationresultsina multiplecomplelianorrecompletionina newinterval,a Form31644 mustbefiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbendonmentNoticesmust befdedonly after aRrequirements,includingreclamalian,havebeencompleted, andtheoperalorhas
detenninedthatthesi1eis ready forfinalinspection.)

OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATION TO CHANGE THE P&A PROCEDURES PREVIOUSLY SUBMFITED. REVISIONS WERE
MADE TO ACCOUNT FOR RETRIEVING CASING. PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PROCEDURES.

ederalApproval0fThis
Actionis Necessary

14. Ihereby certify thattheforegoingistrueandcorrect
Name (Printed/Typed)

Signature

Title SR. REGULATORYO

O /

00S7T

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title Dûle
Conditionsof approval,if any,areattached.Approvalof thisnoticedoesnotwarrantor
certifythattheapplicantholdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserightsinthe subjectleas© Oífice
whichwouldentitletheapplicanttoconductopemtionsthereon.
Title18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Seclian1212,make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfullytomaketo any departmentor agency ofthe United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations asto anymatterwithinitsjurisdiction. en
(Instructions on page 2)

ggy 0 62007

OROFOL GAS



P&A Procedure
Ute Tribal 1-13B3

Section 13, T2S, R3W
Altamont-Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

COMPANY PERSONNEL
Title Name Office Mobile Home

Production Engineer Doug Sprague (303) 291-6433 (303) 957-6176 (303) 627-4970

Production Engineer Devin Brown (303) 291-6432 (303) 775-2130 (720) 344-6020

Production Foreman Gary Lamb (435) 454-4224 (435) 823-1443 (435) 454-3537

TUBULAR DATA
Burst Col Body Jt Drift CapMaterial Description ID TOC(100%) (100%) Yield Yield ID CF/LF

Surface 9 5/8" 36# K-55 @ 2,876' 3520 2020 564 489 8.921 8.765 .1168 SURFCasing
Intermediate 7" 26 # P-110 to 7,965' & 7240 5410 604 519 5300'6.276 6.151 2148Casing 29# P-110 to 10,425' 9960 6210 830 693 (CBL)
Production 5" 18# P-110 @ 9.906' --

, 13940 13450 580 495 4.276 4.151 .0997 TOLLiner 12,698
Production 2-7/8" 6.5# N-80 Nulock 10570 11160 145 2.441 2.347 .0325Tubmg
Sidestring 2 1/16"

Notes: Casing leak - 2,832' - 2,892' - Squeezed with 50 sacks cement.
Slurry mix - 1.15 CF/sack.

Procedure:

1. MIRU workover rig. Load well with corrosion inhibited produced water (CIPW).
ND wellhead. NU and test BOP's.

2. POOH and LD 2 1/16" side



3. PU 2 7/8" main string and unset Baker Model "R" packer @ 10,110'. Circulate
hole with (CIPW). POOH with tubingand lay down packer and BHA.

4. RU EL. RIH and set CIBP at 9,400'. Dump 7 sacks of cement on top.

5. RIH and perf at 6,200' (Green River isolation). RD EL. RIH with CICR and set at
6,150'. Establish breakdown. Mixand pump 70 sacks of Class G + 2% CaCL.
Squeeze 40 sacks of cement below CICR, unsting and equalize remaining 30
sacks on top of CICR. PU 8 jts and reverse tubingclean with CIPW. WOC. Tag
top of plug. POOH.

6. Cut 7" casing at 2,925'. This is 50' below 9-5/8" surface casing. Retrieve
7" casing.

7. TIH with tubing to 2,975'. This is 50' into 7" casing.

8. RU cementers. Mix and spot balanced plug of 50 sks Class G cement.
Pull 10 jts of tubing and reverse tubing clean with CIPW. WOC. TlH and
tag top of plug. PUH to 2,550'.

9. Mix and pump 60 sacks of Class G + 2% CaCI. Spot 150' balanced plug across
Base of Fresh Water Zone at 2,550' . PU 10 jts and reverse tubingclean with
CIPW. WOC. Tag top of plug. TOOH.

10. RU EL. RIH and set CIBP at 100'.

11. Cement from CIBP to surface.

12. Set surface plugs in all casing strings, cut casing off3' below ground level and
weld on surface plate and name plate with the following information:

Ute Tribal 1-13B3
El Paso E & P
Lease # 1420H624864
NE4/SW4 -- Sec 13, T2S, R3W.

13. RD&MO plugging unit. Remove surface equipment and junk.

14. Restore and reseed location as per BLM and BIA



Production Wellbore Diagram - As Is

UTE 1-13B3
Duchesne Co, Utah
Altamont / Blue Bell Field
API - 43-013-30251
El Paso Lease # - 10003390 GL - 5,887' KB - 19'

2-1/16" Sidestring 2-7/8" Production Tubing

Base of fresh water - 2,550' (Est)

9-5/8" 36# K-55 @ 2,876'
Cemented w/ 1,100 sks to surface

, Casinq Leak @ 2,832'-2,892' -

(Sqz'd 11/86 w/ 50 sks)

TOC - 5,300' (CBL)

National 220 Pump Cavity @ 9374

Top of Green River - 6,057'
Perfs: 9418'-10,233' (202 holes)

Baker pkr @ 10,110'

End of tubing @ 10,110'
'FOL @ 9906'

7" 26 & 29# P-110 @ 10,425'
CIBP @ 10,450' w/ 35' cement Cemented w/ 575 sks

Top of Wasatch - 10,402'

Perfs 10,510'-12,596'

5" 18# P-110 @ 12,698'
Cemented w/275 sks

PBTD @ 12,656'
TD @ 12,700'

RDS



S Production Wellbore Diagram - Proposed

UTE 1-1383
Surface plugs

Duchesne Co, Utah
Altamont / Blue Bell Field
API - 43-013-30251
El Paso Lease # - 10003390 GL -5,887 KB - 19'

CIBP @ 100' with cement to surface

150' balanced plug across fresh Base of fresh water -2,550' (Est)
water zone: 60 sks cement

9-5/8" 36# K-55 @ 2,876'
Cemented w/ 1,100 sks to surface

150' balanced plug across 7
casing stub: 50 sks cement Casinq Leak @ 2,832'-2,892' -

(Sqz'd 11/86 w/ 50 sks)

TOC -- 5,300' (Poor - CBL)
CICR @ 6,057 w/ 20 sks cement
below & 10 sks on top

Top of Green River - 6,05T

CIBP @ 9,400' w/ 20' cement

Perfs: 9418'-10,233' (202 holes)

TOL @ 9906'

7 26 & 29# P-110 @ 10,425'
CIBP @ 10,450' w/ 35' cement Cemented w/ 575 sks

Top of Wasatch - 10,402'

Perfs 1 ),510'-12,596'

5" 18# P-110 @ 12,698'
Cemented w/ 275 sks

PBTD @ 12,656
TD @ 12,700'

DLB



API Well No: 43013302510000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1732 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTE 1-13B3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013302510000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1645 FSL 1349 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 13 Township: 02.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

6/10/2009

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EL PASO PLUGGED AND ABANDONED SUBJECT WELL ACCORDING TO
ATTACHED REPORT 6.10.09

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Marie Okeefe

TITLE
 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6/16/2009

PHONE NUMBER:
303 291-6417  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 291-6417

June 16, 2009

June 16, 2009

iPI Well No: 43013302510000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI1G7NA2TIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well UTE 1-13B3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ELPASOE&PCOMPANY,LP 43013302510000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1099 18th ST, STE 1900 , Denver, CO, 80202 303 291-6417 Ext BLUEBELL

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1645 FSL 1349 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NESW Section: 13 Township: 02.05 Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/10/2009 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EL PASO PLUGGED AND ABANDONED SUBJECT WELL ACCORDING TO
ATTACHED REPORT 6.10.09 Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REÇQßggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Marie Okeefe 303 291-6417 Sr Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2009

RECEIVED June 16,



June 16, 2009

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 1 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3
Common Well Name: UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3 Spud Date: 10/9/1973
Event Name: ABANDONMENT Start: 5/26/2009 End:
Contractor Name: WESTERN WELLSITE SVCS Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: WESTERN WEL LSITE SVCS Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

5/28/2009 05:30 -07:00 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC
07:00-08:30 1.50 C 06 MIRU
08:30 -18:00 9.50 C 08 BLED DWN WELL... ATTEMPT TO KILLWELL... CIRC WELL w 350

BBL HOT TPW WELL STILL FLOWING...SECURE WELL SDFN
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL

5/29/2009 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC
07:00 -12:00 5.00 C 08 BLED DWN WELL...ATTEMPT TO KILLCICR WELL w HOT TPW

FAILED...PMP 130 BBLBRINE...ND WELL NU BOP'S
12:00 -15:00 3.00 C 17 PICKUP ON 2 1/16" SIDESTRING TO ATTEMPT TO WORK

FREE...PARTED SIDESTRlNG ATTHREAD IN HANGER...PClKUP ON
27/8" IN ATTEMPT TO RETRIEVE SIDESTRING PULL 100K FAILED...
LAND27/8" SECURE WELL ORDER FISH TOOLS & EQUIP FOR THE
AM.

15;OO- 16:30 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC
5/30/2009 05:30 -07:00 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC

07:00 -09:30 2.50 C 13 RU WIR ELINE RIH w STRING SHOT TO 300'... FlRE STRING SHOT...
BACK OFF 9 JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG... TOH wWL RD WL... TOH w 9 JTS
OF27/8"TBG

09:30 -11:00 1.50 C 13 TIH w 4 1/16" OS w 25/16" GRAPLE 1 JTS OF 2 3/8" N-80 TBG...TAG
FISH TOP @ 14°...TOH LD 1 JTS OF 2 3/8" TBG... PU 2 7/8" TBG
SUBS TlH ENGAGE FISH @14' ATTEMPT TO CATCH FISH FAILED...
TOH w OS CHANGE GRAPLE TO 2 3/8" TlHENGAGE FISH @ 14'...
ATTEMPT TO STINGOUT220 CAVITYFAILED

11:00 -13:30 2.50 C 13 RU WIRELINE RIH w FREE POINT TOOLS STACKOUT AT 434' RU
HOT OIL TRUCK PMP HOT TPW DWN ANNULAS CONT TO WORK
WIRELINE TO 1542' COULD NOT GET DEEPER...TlH w FREE POlNT
TOOLS

13:30 -20:00 6.50 C 13 RU 1.5" TBG CUTTER w 1 3/8" SINKER BARS RIH STACK OUT AT
1542' CONT PMP HOT TPW DWN ANNULAS CONT WORKING
CUTTER DWN TO 6240'.... A STRAND OF WIRELINE PARTED ON
WIRELINE ABOVE LUBACATOR UNABLETO CONT INTHE HOLE...
POH w WIRELINE...LD TBG CUTTER AND SINKER BARS SECURE
WELL SDFN

20:00 -21:30 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC
5/31/2009 05:30 -07:00 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL TO LOC

07:00 - 10:00 3.00 C 13 PMP HOT TPW DWN ANNULAS RU WIRELINE RIH w 1 1/2" CHEM
CUTTER 1 3/8" SINKER BARS STACKOUT @3269' CONT PMP HOT
TPW DWN ANNULAS AND WORKING WIRELINE

10:00 -11:30 1.50 C 13 POH wWIRELlNE LD CUTTER & SINKER BARS BLEED OFF WELL
11:30 - 13:00 1.50 C 13 PU ON 2 1/16" TBG SET IN SLIPES... LD OS & PARTED X-OVER...MU

X-OVER 2 1/16" 8RD X 2 3/8" EUE...FLUSH 2 1/16" TBG w 45 BBLS
HOT TPW

13:00 -15:30 2.50 C 13 RU WIRELINE RIH w 1.5 CHEM CUTTER 1 3/8" SINKER BARS TO
9372'.... CUT TBG @9260' TOH w WIRELINE LDWIRELINE TOOLS

15:30 - 17:00 1.50 C 04 SOH w 2 1/16" TBG LD TLL OF 86 JTS
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 C 06 CREW TRAVEL FROM LOC

6/1/2009 - NO ACTIVITY
6/2/2009 07:00 - 08:00 1.00 C 04 HSM 0 TSlP, O CSIP. LD30-JTS 2 1/16 TBG

08:00-09:00 1.00 C 08 CIRCWELLWl60TPW
09:00 - 12:00 3.00 C 04 FINISHED LAYlNGDOWN SIDE STRING. TOTAL OF -JTS
12:00 - 12:30 0.50 C 15 CHANGED OVER TO PULL 2 7/8 TBG
12:30-13:00 0.50 C 04 RIHWl1-JT27/8NU-LOC,X-OVER,9-JTS27/8N-80EUE.

SCREWED INTO TBG UNABLETO RELEASE PKR.

RECEIVED June 16, 2009 Printed 6/16/2009



June 16, 2009

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 2 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3
Common Well Name: UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3 Spud Date: 10/9/1973
Event Name: ABANDONMENT Start: 5/26/2009 End:
Contractor Name: VVESTERN WELLSITE SVCS Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: VVESTERN WELLSITE SVCS Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

6/2/2009 13:00 -14:00 1.00 C 08 CIRC 80 BTPW DOWN TBG, WHILE WAITING FOR WIRELINE
14:00 - 16:00 2.00 C 11 RU WIRELINE TO FISH STANDING VALVE.UNABLETO RETRIEVE

STANDING VALVE
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 C 18 TRIED TO WORK PKR FREE. PKR WOULON'T RELEASE SECURED

WELL SDFN
6/3/2009 07:00-07:30 0.50 C 18 HSM 0 WELL PRESS. TRIED TO RELEASE PKR . WOULDN'T

RELEASE.

07:30 -09:00

-1.50 C 11 RU WIRELINE RIH CUT 27/8 TBG @9353' RD WIRELINE
09:00 -12:00 3,00 C 04 TOOH Wl304-JTS27/8 NU.LOC FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/

80 BTPW.
12:00 -17:30 5.50 C 04 RIH WI6 1/8 BIT BIT SUBTAGGED POSSIBLE CSG PART W/ 15' IN

ON JT #121 @3710' CONTINUED IN TAGGED FISH TOP @9353' W/
10' IN ON JT#305 LD 1-JT SECURED WELL SDFN.

6/4/2009 07:00 - 08:00 1.00 C 08 HSM 0 WELL PRESS. CIRC WELL W/ 120 BBLS.
08:00 -09:00 1.00 C 14 EOT @9335' PUMPED 40 SKS OF CLASS G CEM W/CC. DISPLACED

TO EOT W/ 54.5 BTPW.TOOH W/ 32 JTS 2 7/8.
09:00 -12:30 3.50 C 08 WOC WHILE CIRC WELL W/ 180 BTPW
12:30-14:00 1.50 C 04 RIHWl22-JTSTAGGEDCEMTOP@9015'.LD94-JTS27/8TBG

TOTAL OF 200 JTS 27/8 TBG INWELL EOT @6149'.
14:00-14:30 0.50 C 14 PUMPED45SKSCLASSGCEMWICC.TOOHW/28-JTS27/8TBG.
14:30 - 17:30 3.00 C 18 WOC WHILE ClRC TBG W/ 180 BPTW
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 C 04 RIH TAGGED CEM TOP @5939, TOOH EOT @5505'
18:00 -19:00 1.00 C 14 PUMPED 50 SKS CLASS G CEM WICC. TOOH W/ 30 JTS 2 7/8 TBG

SECURED WELL SDFN.
6/5/2009 07:00 -10:30 3.50 C 04 HSM RIH WI23 JTS 2 7/8 TBG TAGGED CEM @5305'. TOOH WI

TBG
10:30-12:00 1.50 C 18 CHANGED P&A PROCEDURE. VARIANCES APPROVED BY BRAIN

ANGUS AND RAYARNOLD
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 C 04 RIH W/ 122-JTS 2 7/8 EOT @3739'.
13:00 -14:30 1.50 C 14 PUMPED 45 SKS CLASS G CEM NO CaCI. TOOH Wl30 JTS 27/8

SECURED WELL SDFN
6/6/2009 07:00 -09:30 2.50 C 04 HSM RIH WI TBG TAGGED CEM TOP @3495°.TOOH W/ TBG

09:30 -10:00 0.50 C 09 PRESSURE TEST CSG TO @ 1000 PSI LOST 200 PSI IN 15 MIN
10:00 -11:30 1.50 C 11 RU WIRELINE RIH SHOT 4 HOLES @2920' RD WIRELINE
11:30 -12:00 0.50 C 09 TRIED TO GET INJECTION RATE. NO INJECTION SAME BLED OFF
12:00 -14:00 2.00 C 14 RIH EOT @2961' SPOTTED 40 SKS CLASS G CEM WICa CI, TOOH

W/ 30 JTS OF TBG
14:00 - 16:00 2.00 C 18 WOC
16:00 - 17:30 1.50 C 04 RlH WI24 JTS 2 7/8 TBG TAGGED TOP OF CEM @2776'.TOOH WI

TBG SECURED WELL SDFN.
6/7/2009 - NO ACTIVlTY
6/8/2009 - NO ACTIVlTY
6/9/2009 07:00 -08:30 1.50 C 10 HSM ND BOPS ND WELLHEAD. CUT WINDOW. CUT 7"CASING.

PULLED SLIPS OUT
08:30 -10:00 1.50 C 11 RU WIRELINE R1HFREE POINT CASING 100% FREE @2600'. CUT

CSG @2593'.RD WIREL1NE.
10:00 - 14:30 4.50 C 04 LD 62-JTS OF 7" CSG
14:30 -15:00 0.50 C 10 NU WELLHEAD. NU BOPS
15:00 -16:00 1.00 C 04 RLHWl86-JTS 27/8 TBG EOT @2655'
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 C 14 SPOTTED 70 SKS CLASS G CEM. TOOH WI30-JTS 27/8 EOT 1655'

SECURED WELL SDFN.
6/10/2009 07:00 - 10;00 3.00 C 04 HSM RIH W/ TBG TAGGED CEM TOP @2471'. TOOH RlH W/8 3/4

RECEIVED June 16, 2009 Printed- 6/10/2009



June 16, 2009

EL PASO PRODUCTION Page 3 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3
Common Well Name: UTE TRIBAL 1-13B3 Spud Date: 10/9/1973
Event Name: ABANDONMENT Start: 5/26/2009 End:
Contractor Name: WESTERN WELLSITE SVCS Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: WESTERN WELLSITE SVCS Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Pliase Description of Operations

6/10/2009 07:00 -10:00 3.00 C 04 BIT. TO @1025' TOOH WI TBG AND BIT
10:00 -13:30 3.50 C 14 RIH W/ 9 5/8 CIBP SET @995'. CIRC WELL WI 50 BTPW. SPOTTED

10 SKS CLASS G CEM ON TOP OF CIBP.
13:30 -15:00 1.50 C 04 LDTBG. EOT @ 100' CIRC WELL CLEAN. PUMP CEM TO SURF,
15:00 -16:00 1.00 C 01 RD RIG CUT OFF WELLHEAD OIL MIGRATED TO SURFACE SDFN

woc.
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