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Form 9-331C SUBMIT IN TRi 'CATE®* If‘()(;mt aﬂDmVCd-N 42-T1425
(May 1963) Other instructt udge ureau No, 42- .
UNITED STATES O everse siaey™ .
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR . Lman SE DRSTGNATION ;\u‘ SERIAL WO,
s < [a -
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY o F © o

-

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK | ¢ & s it e
la. TYPE OF WORK DRILL & DEEPEN [ PLUG BACK [ ¥

i

2. NAME OF OPERATOR

b. TYPE OF WELL :
o, IE GAS [j SINGLE MULTIPLE [ —_] e}
WELY, WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE u

g

Gas Producing Enterprises, Iunc.

ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P, 0. Box 628, Vernal, Utah 84078

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) _r

v

L

B A
E3als

oL

05 ©

At surface
1650' FSL 1650' FEL SE% XW% SE% Sec. 20 T-1S R-1W USB&M
= ;, -AljD SURVEY OB AREA:; .
At proposed prod. zone v B t o — M‘J' <
Lower Green River - Wasatch '~ 2:/(/5“ = ol Sec 20 T IS R IW USB&M
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE® o 1" COUNTY on PABXSH 13 ‘STATE
4 miles N of Roosevelt, Utah "f % =:Duchesne | "iUtah
10. DISTANCE FROM PROPUSED*® 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO.-OF ACRES ASSIGNED 7 k
PROPEETY OR LEASE LINE, F ' o
PR : - o
(Also to nearest drig. unlt Hne, if any) 1650 640 o DY 640
18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION® 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR:CABLE 'roons
TO NEAREST WELL, DRILLING, COMPLETED,
OR APPLIED FOR, ON THIS LEASE, FT. NA - o oo 16000!
21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) -
5405' ungraded ground D
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM“ C,
SIZE OF IOLE BIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT S8ETTING DEPTH
15" 10 3/4" 40.5% 1500'
9 7/8" 7.5/8" 29.7¢ + 11500°
6 1/2" 5" 18 # 16000°' 00
[
I - BOP Program: g ; s
[ S S :{‘:
2 ram type and 1 bag type 12" Ser. 900 to 11500 v 5
=N
- =
2 ram type and 1 bag type 6" Ser. 1500 11500' to TD § & ¥
N s " RS
I ; *L/ @ o E
J Fogoen
Copies: 3 - U,.S.G.S ’ & A j1
3 - Utah Gas & Oil Division 3 - 2,
B
ol

LA H

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone nnd proposed new productive
zope. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and menwured and true 4vett1cnl depths GiAve blowout
preventer program, if any. : " R : ST

ET ‘
SIGNED //L /////’/ ﬂ/w“ L7 TriLe Division Manager

(This spap(tor Fe ernl or State office use)

o

; S
e - L P B

PERMIT NO. 'ﬁ/ 3 ’;/;O/AZ APPROVAL DATE L
/ ’ { T

“ & &

APPROYED BY TITLE - S

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY : R
[

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
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ELEV. UNGRADED GROUND 5405
_ %é
g
w
2
R
©
0&0
337
g leg
79.88

O=SECTION CORNERS RE-ESTABLISHED

PROJECT

GAS PRODUCING ENTERPRISES

Well location located as shown
in the SEI/4 NWI|/4 SE |/4 Section
20, TIS, RIW, U.S.B&M. Duchesne
County, Utah.

CERTFICATE

T S TLOCERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARE & FRUM
FE O ONOTES UF AT DAL TURVEYS MATGE BY ME DR ONDER MY
SUPERVISION ANG THAT TYHE  SAME AgE TRUE  ANT TURRECT 1O THE

BEST 2F My wNOWLEDGE and BF_ g4

REGISTERED L Al
REGISTRATION NO 337
STATE OF UTAH

UiNTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

P O BOX Q ~— {10 EAST - FIRST SOUTH
VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SCALE DATE

" = 1000" 22 JAN., 1972
PARTY REFERENCES

LD.T B.R MT. GLO PLAT
WEATHER FILE

600D GAS PROD.




January 26, 1972

GAs Producing Entenprises
Box 628
Vernal, Utah 84075

Re: Well No. E.J., Asay Fee #1
Sec. 20, T. 1S, R, 1 W,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office L8 concerned, approval to drnill the
above neferred to well 4s hereby granted in accondance with the
Onden issued in Cause No. 131-14. PlLease be advised that the
following mud system monitorning equipment must be installed (with
deiick fLoon dndicatons) and used throughout the period of drnilling
aften setting and cementing the swiface casing:

(1) Reconding mud pit Level indicator Lo determine
mud pit volume gains and Losses. This indicaton
shatl include a visual or audio warning device.

(2) Mud volume mwwz,éhg device forn accurately
deteuninéig mud volumes nequired Lo AL Zthe
hole on trhips.

(3) Mud return indicagon to detenmine that neturns
essentially equal the pump discharge nate.

Should you determine that it will be necessarny to plug and
abandon this well, you are hereby requested to irmediately notify
the following:

PAUL W, BURCHELL - Chief Petrnofeum Engineen
HOME: 277-2890
OFFICE: 328-5771 (801)



Gas Producing Enter-nises
Januany 26, 1972
Page Two

Enclosed please find Form 0GC-8-X, which is to be completed whethexr
on not water sands (aquifens) are encountered during drnifling. VYour
cooperation with negard to completing this form will be greatly appreciated.

The APT numben assdigned to this well is 43-013-30102,

Very twly youns,
DIVISION OF OTL AND GAS CONSERVATION

CLEON B. FEIGHT
DIRECTOR

CBF:5d



N ,’l i . Form approved. ) //}?7
) Budget Bureau No. 4% i£356.5. {1t
\

UNITED STATES © . Lawp OFFice
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR LeAse NUMBER
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY Uit

LESSEE’S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

State Utah County Duchesne Field Bluebell

The following is & correct report of operations and production (including drilling and producing
wells) for the month of February ,h 1972,
Agent’s address P..0. Box 774 Company .Gas~Px
' Vernal, Utah 84078 Signed ....~><
Phone . 789-4433 Agent’s titlé Division Managét

REMARKS
8}?61“}? Twe. |Banor| ol | Dav | Bamasisoron |Geavirr %‘L‘ 5,3;‘;;;,,%;,' ga‘zég%:l: n]:f:f%?ﬁ) s 'ﬁﬁ.‘?ﬁ?’.‘.’.‘&?‘ ?
. Sec. 20
NWSE Is{lw!| 1 Moving in rig
\
Nore.—There were runs or sales of oil; M ou. ft. of gas sold;

runs or sales of gasoline during the month., (Write “no’’ where applicable.)
Nors.—Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in
duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.

Cium:.‘ m 16—25766—0  U. . SOVIRNNEINT PRINTING SPVICE
GPO 837-082



0%

- Form approved., o
Budget Bureau No. 42-R356.5. // A
UNITED STATES LAND OFFICE neneemmecmacemmaemaes cemm o )
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR LEASE NUMBER we-eeeooememeceamacannre eme
. GEOLOGICAL SURVEY Uit

LESSEE’S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS .

. State Utah - County' Duchesne Feeld Bluebell

The following is a correot report of operations and production (including drilling and producing

wells) for the month of March ;9 72
Agent’s address p. 0. Box 628 Company Gas _Producing

Vernal, Utah 84078 Signed ... 1K (la A .. jo,‘_/
Phone 789-4433 Agent’s title Division Manage

REMARKS -

8zc. AND ; WELL | Dars on |G Cuv. F1. or Gas 06“‘0“’ OF | BARRELAOY | drilling, depth: If shut down, oa:
1 or i TwP. | RANGE No. | Pobyomn BARRELS OF OIL RAYITY (in thousands) Blgos‘v”it::‘n no?e:::l: t(nll{e ) A rilline ';:;“::::f';’.s' p -;u" use;

Sec. 20 i
NWSE |18 {1w | 1 ! TD 4945' Drlg.
Nore.—There were runs or sales of oil; M ou. ft. of gas sold;

runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write ‘“no’” where applicable.)
NoTs.—Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in
duplicate with the supervisor by whe 6th of the susceeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor,

mg]ﬁg ' 10—28700-9 V. 5. SOVERMMENT PRINTING OFPICE
GPO 837-082




e

UNiTEL STAVES
DEZPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Auorres

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY TRisz
LEASE No.

LESSEE'S NONTHLY REPCORT OF OPERATIONS

Utah Duchesne Field Bluebell

State County
The following is a correct report of operations and pi:oduction (Gncluding drilling and producing

April 79 12,

wells) for the month of

dgent’s address P, 0, Box 628 Company _.Gas /Prodg/c/i/ng l%ltg_xﬁ'prisc’as , Inc,
Vernal, ltah. 84078 Signed {/44_ ///L"%’lw&_,\_/

Phore 789-4433 Adent’s title vision Manager

8xc. . W R ) . Fr. or G GALLONS oF | BARRELS OF i ]%EMA?&(B .

}gcwu;';) Twr. |RaNGE| ok hfm::w BARRELS OF O1L | GraviTY C(‘Ijn this‘)u(s):ndngs B(;;g;x;«:p mvg:'zzzz tgt!e) (1t dritting, %o HEE:“{ :?*;:::;;’::‘;0 peuse;

Sec., 20
NWSE |1S | 1w | 1 TD 10,385"' Drig,
Norz.—~There were «.............___ il;
runs or sales of oil; .. M. cu. ft. of gas sold;

................................. -=--« TUNS OF sales of gasoline during the month, (Write “no” where applicable.)
I_\IOTE.—TReport on this form is required for each calender month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in
duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisér

(Decumbar 1943, ‘
) : 16--26231-6 U 8. GOVERNMENT PRINTING OFFICE
833-351



~.

- toEa
Budget i - 1dp, »

: UNITED STATES " Lawoommcs S
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR L PR
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY Unir

LESSEE’S MONTHLY REPORT OF OPERATIONS

State Utah . County Duchesne Field Bluebell
The following is a correot report of operations and production (including drilling and producing
wells) for the month of June 1.9.-?.2., .........
P. 0. Box 628 Company . Gas Producing };ﬂterppj_.;g_gg_,____l_pc.

N

Agdent’s address
Vernal, Utah 84078 Signed ........._..
789-4433 Agent’s title {ision_ Manager <

Phone
GALLONS OF | BARRELS OF REMARKS
8EC. AND WELL | Davs | g, peEisorOm |Geaviry| COU- FT.orGas G ASOLINE WatER (If | (M drilling, depth; if sbut down, cause;
Kor¥ Twe. | RaNeE No. |Pzobvesn (In thousands) RECOVERED | nome, 80 atate) | date and ,;:l:n?oﬁ.:g, aaacline
Sec. 20

NWSE |18 (1w |1 TD 15,231°' Drlg.

M ou. ft. of gas sold;

runs or sales of oil;
runs or sales of gasoline during the month. (Write “no” where applicable.)

Note.—Report on this form is required for each calendar month, regardless of the status of operations, and must be filed in
duplicate with the supervisor by the 6th of the succeeding month, unless otherwise directed by the supervisor.

mr? '12?0% 10—35700~9 U. 5. SOVERNRENT FRINTING OPPICR
GPO 837-082 . .

Norr.—There were
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/ /*"‘
Form OGCC 4 STATE OF UTAH
OlL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Salt Lake City 14, Utah

REPORT OF OPERATIONS AND WELL STATUS REPORT

Agent’s title

Phone ..o WIOITRRAD
43-013-30102
State Lease No. ..o Federal Lease No. .....ccocooooiies Indian Lease No. ..ocueceicceececnn Fee & Pat. (]
Sec. & Well g Qil Water Gas' REMARKS
Va of Ya Twp. Range No. taeus Bbis. Bbls. MCF’s (If drilling, Depth; if shut down, Cause;
Date & Results of Water Shut-Off Test;
Contents of Gas; and Gas-Oil Ratio Test)
No, of
Days
Produced
Sec.20
NWSE | 1S | 1W 1 r~ TD 16,025' - 7-8-72
Completing
I
» Note: There were runs or sales of oil; M cu. ft. of
gas sold; runs or sales of gasoline during the month.
NOTE: Report on this form as provided *STATUS: F-Flowing P-Pumping GL-Gas Lift
for in Rule C-22. (See back of form.) SI-Shut In D-Dead

GlL-Gas Injection ~ TA-Temp. Aban.
FILE IN DUPLICATE WI-Water Injection



L : SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE®
5 / STATE OF UTAH (See other in-

Form OGCC- 3

structions on
reverse side) 5. LEABE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TlillBB NAME

wiLL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG*

Ta TYPE OF WeLL: WELL E WhiL DRY D Other ‘ 7. UNIT AOREEMENT NAME
b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
NEW wonK DEED- rLOG DIFF,
WELL OVER EN DACK RESYR. Other 5. FARM OB LEASK NAMR

2. NAME OF OPERATOR E. J. Asay

Gas Producing Emterprises, Inc. 9. WELL NO.
3, ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 1

?. 0. Box 1138, Vernal, Utah 84078 {0, FiELO AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordanoe with any State requirements)® Bluebell .

At surface 1650' FSL, 1650' FEL, Section 20 ) 1. ggc.,:;, B 3., OR BLOCK AND SBURBVEY

. R AREA
At top prod. interval reported below Same ' '
C Sec. 20, T1s, RLW USB&M
At total depth Same ‘
14, PERMIT NO. DATE IBSUED 12, COUNYY OR 18, araxm
PARISH
NA l NA Duchesne UT
i5 Dazc SPUDDED | 16. DATE T.D. REACHED | 17. DATE COMPL, (Ready to prod;) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, REB, BT, GR, KTC.)* 10, ELEY. CABINGHEAD
|

3-19-72 7-9-72 9=8=72 ‘ 5424 KB

20, TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22, IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY® . PR!LLED BY
16025" 15970" \ M Surf to TD |
25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

. NG IN — NAMBE (MD AND TVD)®
24. PRODUCING 1 TERVAL(8), OF THIS COMFLETION—TOF, BOTTOM, NA (XD ) SURVEY MADE

Yes

Lower Green River-Wasatch Transition

26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. Wa8 wr.lx;ILocouD

BHC Sonic, Gamma Ray, wph . DIL

23. CASING RECORD (Report all sirings set in well)
CASING SIZE WEIGRT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) | HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
10 3/4» 40,50 K-55 1546 15" 950 sx Cl G, 16% Gel, 5% salt
75/8" 26.4 to 29,7 11489 9 7/8" | 1165 sx Cl G, 2% D=13-R
29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
BIZE . TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT® SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
5k:4 11270 16022 625 2 7/8" 11260 11260
3 - 15" 3780
N 1. PERNFORATION EECORD (Intervai, aize and number) | 82. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
15900’751’701’604’568’562’509’495’438’434’392’32 % pEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

120,516 ,220,098,14973,960,930,877 873,700,449 ,41
267, 13964,é75,705,565,379,374,303,289,060,017, 14267-15900" | 2500 gal HF acid

612, 12958,947,914,896,852,809,792,708,672,655,6 9, 4690 1950 sx cem

12574,508,434,374,363,256,220,198,183,172,150, 13563-15900' | 10000 gal HF acid

138,100,027, 11992,814. - 63 shots 11814-15900' | 15000 gal HF acid
33.* : PRODUCTION ’

WELL STATUS (Producing or

PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas Uift, pumping—aize and type of pump) L ST
. shut-in

DATE FIRST PRODUCTION

8-18-72 Flowing Producing
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESBTED CHOKE 8IZE PROD'N. FOR 0IL—BBL. GAS—MCF. WATER—BBL, GAB-OIL BATIO
- TE8T PERIOD '
9-10-72 5 12/64 s 340 | 284 | -~ 836
FiLow. TUDING PRESS. | CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED 0iL—BBL. GAS—MCF, : WATER—BBL, OIL GBAVITY-API (CORB.)
24-HOUR RATE
3300 - - FORMT | ye32 | 1364 | - - 42

34, DIGPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, uaed for fuel, vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY

Vented 3} W. L. Gibbens

35. LIaT OF ATTACHEMENTS . TV \¢§' . 7 ..
Al &’vaj n«/ zZy -~ @/ ¢é{ /Z?é «f/ st L Z/(,_Mc,
36. 1 hereby certily that the foregoing and nttacheg@rmagbn is compiete and correct %4 determined from all available records
N

J. R. Curtsinger &) _ Division Manager 9-23-72
o TITLE DATE

k
=, @ i

“*(See lnstruct‘itm and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)

SiGNED




ATTACHMENT #1

Well Completion or Recompletion Report & Log
E. J. Asay #l - Section 20, 1S, 1W
September 23, 1972

Additional Perforations:

13,505" 13,880" 14,365" 14,869 "
530 892 392 878
540 897 299 888
550 908 419 909
557 930 422 917
563 966 433 932
566 970 438 939
571 997 451 944
587 14,018 463 979
633 043 540 15,032
635 057 555 076
651 096 576 100
660 119 589 174
663 129 608 184
683 182 667 204
690 197 678 221
700 223 702 265
708 241 712 335
721 269 741 344
729 288 760 361
746 296 776 396
805 307 793 414
821 316 810 442

840 331 845 462
870 _ 358 :



March 13, 1974

Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc.
Box 1138
Vernal, Utah 84078

Re: Well No. E.J. Asay #!
Sec. 20, T. 1 S, R. I W,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to advise you that the following electric and/or
radioactivity logs are due and have not as yet been filed with this
offlice:

Borehole Compensated - Sonic - Gamma Ray
Dual Induction Laterolog
Compensated Formatlion Density

Please forward said logs, together with any additional which may
have been run, at your earlliest convenlence.

Very truly yours,

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERVATION

SCHEREE DeROSE
EXECUTIVE SECRETARY

:sd



Gas Froalcing Enterprises. inc.
COLORADO OIL COMPANY

Subsidiaries of Coastal States Gas Corporation
2100 PRUDENTIAL PLAZA o P.O. BOX 749 o DENVER, COLORADO 80201 e (303) 572-1121

April 2, 1974

Ms. Scheree DeRose, Executive Secretary
State of Utah

Department of Natural Resources
Division of 0il & Gas Conservation

1588 West North Temple

Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Well No. E. J. Asay #1
Sec. 20, Tls, RlW,
Duchesne County, Utah

Dear Ms. DeRose:

Attached are copies of the well logs on the subject well which
you requested in your letter dated March 13, 1974.

Sincerely yours,

J. A. shor
District Production Manager

JAS :mjr
Attachments

cc: Mr. W. E. Spencer
Mr. Karl Oden



Form OGCC-1 be
v N TRIPLICATE®*
; STATE OF UTAH ?Otth:rlTlnlltmctlfml gn re-
verse side)

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

1. 7. UNIT AGREENENT NAMB
o1L GAS
WELL WELL OTHER
2., NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LFASE NAMR
Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc. E. J. Asay
8. ADDRESS OF OPDRATOR 9. WBLL NO.
P. O. Box 1138, Vernal, UT 84078 1

&. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.®
See also space 17 below.)

10. FITLD AND FOOL, OR WILDCAT

Bluebell Field

At surface
' ! i 11, a%c,, T, &., M., OR BLK. AND
1650' FSL, 1650' FEL, Section 20 CaT B, X, 081
Sec 20, T1S, R1W, USB&M
14, PERMIT NO. 15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, OR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 18, STATE
NA 5424 KB Duchesne 148
16. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE 0F INTDNTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :
TEST WATER SHUT-OFP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other) {

(NoTE : Report results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) __J (Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an,
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) *

11-7-74: RU Schlumberger and perforate to following intervals,

1 SPF:

11992-98', 12029-35', 12142-58', 12224-34', 12244-50', 12256-64', 12328-34',
12366-78", 12434-44", 12462-68', 12562-68', 12576-82', 12626-32', 12640-46"',
12654-60", 12672-78', 12707-15"', 12792-98', 12808-16", 12898-906', 12912-20'.
Set a "through tubing" bridge plug in 5%" liner in the collar @ 13612°';

plug back w/cem to 12592'; then perforate.

1-18-75: RU BJ. Acidize w/10,000 gal 15% HCl w/admixes. Return well to production.

In 24 hr test, flowed 366 BO, no Hy0, 326 MCF gas.

DATE

TN /
18. I hereby certif tiac'éhe foregolpg 1y true and correct
SIGNED / € S rirLe __Area Superintendent
7 &

3-4-75

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




torm $--331 U
(May 1963)

LD SIAIES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse side)

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

SUBMIT IN 1K1 A'lli*
(Other instruction. on re-

Form app.. e
Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424,
LEASE DESIGNATION AND SBRIAL NO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

7. UNIT AGREEMBENT NAMB

2., NAME OF OPERATOR
Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc.

8. FARM OR LEASE NAMB

E. J. Asay

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P. O. Box 1138, Vernal, UT 84078

9. WELL NO.

#1

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.®
See also space 17 below.)

At surface
1650' FSL, 1650' FEL, Section 20

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

Bluebell Field

11. sEc,, T, R., M., OR BLK. AND
SURVEY OR ARBA

Sec. 20, T1S, RIW, USB&M

16. BLEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.)

NA 5424' KB

14, PERMIT NO.

12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. BTATD

Duchesne UT

16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZB ABANDON®* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF

REPAIRING WELL
ALTERING CASING
ABANDONMENT*

CHANGE PLANS

Place on Pump

REPAIR WELL (Other)

(Other)

&No'm: Report_results of multiple completion on Well
ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical

nent to this work.) *

Place flowing well on hydraulic pump.

including estimated date of starting any

depths for all markers and zones perti-

18. I hereby certify that the foregoing Krue a :fl\c:/\v{
sionep _ Ko E. Oden | Z?éj %Le _ Area Superintendent

pats __ 1=-8-175

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side



Torm 9-331
(May 1283)

SUBMIT IN TRIPL
(Other instructions
verse side)

UN D STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY

_TE*

.o re-

Form approved.
Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424.

5. LEASE DESICNATION AND SERIAL NO.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolir.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

1.
OIL

WELL E

GAS

WELL OTHER

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR

8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc. E. J. Asay
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR ] 9. WELL NO.
P. 0. Box 749 - Denver, Colorado 80201 1

3. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.®
See also space 17 below.)
At surface

1650' FSL, 1650' FEL, Section 20, T1S, RIW

10. FIELD AND POOL, OE WILDCAT

Bluebell Field

11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. ANL
SURVEY OR AREA

Sec. 20, T1s, RIW

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
NA 5424 KB Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF :

REPAIRING WELL
ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*
REPAIR WELL _CHANGE PLANS (Other)

B NOTE : Report results of muitiple completion on Well
(Oth")and place on pump i é?ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
nent to this work.) *

. Pull tubing, or back off at freepoint, if stuck.
Run washpipe and washover tubing, down to packer.
Pull all of tubing and packer.

. Re-run tubing and pump cavity.

v W N

. Drop pump and standing valve, and place well on production.

locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

Note: Surface facilities for operating and producing with a hydraulic pump will be

installed in conjunction with the above operatioms.

18. I hereby certify the foregoing is true and correct

SIGNED TiTLE ___Area Engineer pare October 22, 1975
(This space for Federal or State office use)
APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




g

Form 9-331 ) | Form approved.
(giray 1963) _ UN‘ »-D STATES %gﬁfrl'ru}gr\a%ﬂig Pge‘_ Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424.
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse stde) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS B O
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMB

oIL E GAS

WELL WELL OTHER
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc. E. J. Asay
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

P. O. Box 749 - Denver, Colorado 80201 1
4. LocaTIoN oF wELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 310. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)

At surface Bluebell Field

11. sEC., T., B, M., OR BLE. AND
. SURVEY OR ARBA
1650' FSL, 1650' FEL, Section 20, T1S, RIW
Sec. 20, T1lS, RIW

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 12. COUNTY OB PARISH| 13. STATE

NA 5424 KB Duchesne Utah
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SEUT-OFF

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON®*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Qther)

FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING
and placing on pump

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

REPAIRING WELL | X |
ALTERING CASING

ABANDONMENT*

<

(Other)

(NoTE ;: Report results of muliiple completion on Weil
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,

proposed work.
nent to this work.) *

If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vert

ica

including estimated date of starting any
1 depths for all markers and zones perti-

Tubing was pulled and repaired in workover from 8-25-75 to 10-4-75. Well was

put on hydraulic pump and placed on production 10-8-75.

18. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

S, Fe

SIGNED rrree _ Area Engineer parg October 29, 1975
(This space for Federal or State office use)
APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




Form 9-331 - Form approved,
May 1983) UNITI _ STATES %(t)g:irl Tinls“fnalt{iﬁﬁ‘lgﬁ . Budget Bureau No. 42-R142+.
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse sige) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY FEE - N/A
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS B I DA, ALioTIRR oF TR AR
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir. N/A
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)
1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
o1L GAS
WELL WELL OTHER N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
_GAS PRODUCING ENTERPRISES, INC. ‘ E. J. ASAY
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.
P. O. BOX 749, DENVER, CO 80201 1
1. tocatiox oF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At surface BLUEBELL FIELD
11. skC., T., B., M., OR BLK, AND
. . SURVEY OR ARKA
1650' FSL 7 1650' FEL, SECTION 20-T1S-RIW
SECTION 20-T1S-R1W
14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ete.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
'
5424' KB DUCHESNE UTAH
16. Check Appropriate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Repott, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF 3
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PUCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF ] REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRAC'TURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZB ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(NOTE : Report_results of multiple completion on Well
(Other) PLUG & ABANDON Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this work.) *

VERBAL FROM PAT "DRISCOLL (STATE OF UTAH) TO DAN HALL (GAS PRODUCING ENTERPRISES, INC.)
ON April 20, 1978.

' The well's production equipment was destroyed by a fire on January 3, 1978. The well

was operating at a loss before the fire and cannot be returned to economical production.

1) Load hole with water and NU BOP's.

2) Pull 1-1/2" heat string @ 3975' and 2-7/8" production tubing @ 11,200'. Release
tubing from Otis Permalatch packer @ 11,200' or Guiberson Safety jt @ 11,1957,

3) Spot 265" cement plug (50sx Class "G") on top of Otis packer @ 11,200'. Cement
plug 10,935" - 11,200'. POOH with tubing.

4) Set 265' cement plug (50 sx Class "G") inside 7" casing at surface.

5) Displace 200' cement plug (50 sx Class "G'") down 7" x 10-3/4" annulus at surface.

6) Cut off casing head below ground level and install marker.

7) Fill in all holes and rehabilitate location.

APPROVED BY THE DIVISION OF

)

-

qw\’*; | OIL, GAS, AND MINING
K /?H,‘é?[/[.‘i /

DATE: i) AL Ll
g /,} :é\"L‘L! ' (,(

P

rroLe _ District Superintendent DATE April 24, 1978

APPROVED BY ____ ’ TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Soe Instructions on Reverse Side



’Y) Y aind 0t o

- . i E J. ASAY NO. 1
- SECTION 20-T1S-RIW
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
| i
\""T\\\\i
; - : 26" Conductor & 'IO’ ,
| , 2 7/8" 8 Rd EUE Tbg. =
1’ » on 10 zd 1.J. Heat String @ 3975' :
-1 ‘10 3/4" 4£0.5% 8 Rd K~55 ST&C -
. A . | set @ 1546° w/900 sx. :
. 6% sub @ 11,175 — . S
- o ’ ' } _ National "V Pump cavity @ 11,181
g 7" ¢sg. split - squeezed @ 4690' ¢ ' ' TP :
- &
gy E ‘ Cuiberson Safety ite. f\: hand rel
' ail, 105 _
' 2 7/8" tbg sub & 11,196
¥ e

Otis pemmalatch phy set @ 11, ?_.GO
w/l jt 2 7/8% tbg as tail pip

iTop Brown "CRL" liner hgr @ 11,27

s

Z Perfs. 11,992° - 13,567°
- ._.,..3 po cexm. piug @ 13,600 i
| Schlumberger thru tbg b/plug set @
T~ /i 13,512° o
1
!
! §
'%
. ' §
: ! Original P,B.T.D. 15,970°




Form OGCC-1 be

STATE UF UTAH SUBMIT IN TRIPL _TE°®

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION 'COMMISSION

(Other instructions oa re-
verse side)

5. LEASE DESIONATION AND BERIAL NO.

FEE - NA

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolr.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTESB OR TRIBE

NAME

NA
1. 7. UNIT AGREEMBNT NAMD
o GAS
WELL WELL OTHIR CA 96-0000-80
2. NaMB OF OPERATOR 8. TARM OR LEASE NAME

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP. (FORMERLY GAS PRODUCING ENTERP.) E. J. ESAY
8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WBLL NO.
P. 0. BOX 749, DENVER, CO 80201 1

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location ciearly and in accordance with any State requirements.® 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.)
At surface . BLUEBELL FIELD
! ' 11, axc., 7., k., K., OR BLK, AND
1650" FSL & 1650' FEL C. T 1. i, Gk 3
SECTION 20-T1S-R1W
.14, PERMIT NO. 15, BLEVATIONS (Show whether D7, RT, OR, ¢ts.) 13. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. 8TATE
NA 5424' KB DUCHESNE UTAH
18. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF
TEST WATER SHUT-OF? ruu: OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE ’ FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ) ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (other) DID NOT P&A AS PER 4-24-78 SINPRY| NOTICE
(NOTE : Report _results of multiple completion on Well
(Qther) (‘ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMILETED OPERATIONS (Cleurly stute ull pertinent detalls, and giv

proposed work. I1f well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measure

nent to this work.) *

THIS WELL WAS DOWN FROM JANUARY 1978 THRU MAY 1979.

WELL WAS RETURNED TO

PRODUCTION ON May 23,. 1979 AND AT PRESENT IS STILL PRODUCING.
PLANS TO P&A THIS WELL HAVE BEEN ABORTED.

e pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
d and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

18. I hereby certify thnt'the oregoing is true and correct

rirLe _ PRODUCTION ENGINEER

. /s P /
NE Lt i A
816 I%\l. :l . UDEN

pars JANUARY 22,

1982

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APPROVED BY

TITLE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

DATE

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




NN

Form OGC-1b
oI'ATE OF UTAH

SUBMI " TRIPLICATE*
(Oth. 1structions on
reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5. LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

FEE - NA

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

{Do not use this fot}m for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservolir. NA

se “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals.)

OIL GAS
WELL WBLL OTHER

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMB

CA 96-0000-80

2., NAME OF OPERATOR

8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

COASTAI, OI1. & GAS CORPORATION E. J. ASAY
8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. WBLL NO.
P. 0. BOX 749, DENVER, CO 80201 1

4. LOCATION OF WILL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.®

See also space 17 below.)

At surface 1650" FSL & 1650' FEL

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

BLUEBELL FIELD

11. sEC,, T., R, M., OR BLK, AND
SURVBEY OR ARBA

SECTION 20-T1S-RIW

14. PERMIT NO,

NA

15. BLEVATIONS (Show whether DrF, RT, OR, oto.)

5424' KB

12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 18. sTATE

DUCHESNE UTAH

16. Check Appropnate Box To Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO:

TEST WATER SEUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE
8HOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON®*
REPAIR WELL

(Other)

CHANGE PLANS

! SUBSRQUENT EEPORT OF :

WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WBLL

FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CABING

SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT®

(otner) _ OPERATOR NAME CHANGE

(NOTE : Report results of multiple completion on Weli
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, Including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-

nent to this work,) *

NAME OF OPERATOR WAS CHANGED FORM GAS PRODUCING ENTERPRISES, INC. TO COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION EFFECTIVE MARCH 7, 1980 AS PER ATTACHED.

18. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

sioNep | TrTLE _PRODUCTION ENGINEER APRIL 18, 1983
W, V. GCOQDEN paTE

(Thie space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side




N

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION
OF

GAS PRODUCING ENTERPRISES, INC.

‘- ,-’;

Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc., a corporation organized and’

existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of
the State cf Delaware, '

DOES HEREBY CERTIFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of said Corporation, at
a meeting duly held, adopted a resolution proposing and
declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate
of Incorporation of said corporation:

RESOLVED, that the Certificate of Incorporation

of Gas Producing Enterprises, Inc. be amended by
changing the first Article thereof so that, as
amended, said Article shall .be and read as follows:

"FIRST. The name of the Corporation is

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders,
the sole stockholder has given its written consent to said
amendment in accordance with the provisions of section 228 of
the General Corporation Law of the State of Delaware.

TIIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in
sccordance with the applicable provisions of sections 242 and
228 of the General Corporation Law oI the State of Delaware.

_ Qﬁg/t. 3-7—%D

-44.



L4

S .

FOURTH: That the capital of the corporation will not be
changed under or by reason of said amendment.

IN WITNESS WHEEREOF, said Gas Producing Enterprlses, Inc. has
caused this certificate to be signed by Austin M. O'Toole, its
Vice President and attested by John C. Simons, its Assistant
Secretary this et - day of 7¢/,o1<>427 , 1980.

GAS PRODUCTNG ENTERPRISES, INC.

- > .
—

&:}'f"‘? N

273 sggn_ . Austin M. O'Toocle, Vice P‘e51aent

&czﬁ '7/1/ / W

Gcnn C. Simons, Assistant Secretary




<o
Office of SECRETARY OF STATE

£ Glenn C.Kenton Fecxelany of Sate of the Slate of Doloiwarne,
. Certificate of Amendment of the ''GAS fRODUCING ENTERPRISES, INC.", as received and

filed in this office the seventh day of March, A.D. 1980, at 10 o'clock A.M.

In Testimony Whereof, I have Fexewrnlo el mye Aa/zd
and c}%aa/iea/ai gaaw 97 twenty-eighth cﬁ#

Y/ v

Glenn C. Kenton, Secretary of State

T
!

i
1

:nm;;n:mnumumu:mul;sm:hhmllnlllmlim!il!i‘.HHlHiil’:iH|!i|§§!li}!li\il'iillhi i

s taripaiaread 1 S1M REASEEEAS CNARALS MARRALMEH ML B

1S A 411




Form 9-331 o Form Approved.

Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424
UNITED STATES 5 LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FEE~NA: .
o GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
- : NA = -
‘ SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT “%'RE%"":_’.‘JO'(‘)%”%O
(Do not use this form for proposais to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different Al - !
reservoir, Use Form 9—-331-C for Si¢H Padpolals:) 8. FARM OR LEASENAME ; P e
i E. J. ASAY s
1. oil gas . - -
o well Sﬂ well O other 9. WELL NO. : :
. 2. NAME OF OPERATOR 1 -
L COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR BLUEBELL FIELD
tg% P. 0. BOX 749, DENVER, CO 80201 11. SEC, T., R, M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR
£ 4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA SECTION 20-T1S-R1W
b below.) )
b AT SURFACE: 1650' FSL & 1650' FEL 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE
: _ AT TOP PROD. INTERVALKAME DUCHESNE UTAH
b - AT TOTAL DEPTH: SAME 14. APl NO. ' ” A
- 16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, 43-013-30102
- ) REPORT, OR OTHER DATA _ 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)
AR | 5424' KB
- REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF [] il
;, FRACTURE TREAT [l O
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE [l 5 .
REPAIR WELL O ™ (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
= PULL OR ALTER CASING [ O change on Form 9-330.)
MULTIPLE COMPLETE D N : '
- CHANGE ZONES O
othery ST TEMPORAIQLY ABANDONED?
: 17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, ‘and give pertinent dates,
i including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface Iocatlons and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*
3; : THE E. J. ASAY #1 WAS SHUT IN MAY 16, 1984 AS PER 640 ACRE SPACING - -
- . REQUIREMENTS FOLLOWING THE 60 DAY TEST PERIOD. THE HORROCKS #2V WILL

BE THE PRODUCER FOR SECTION 2G-T1S-KlW. THE E. J. ASAY #1 WILL BE
MAINTAINED IN A TEMPORARILY ABANDONED STATUS.

L
b
:
b

RECEIVED -

MAY 2 4 1934:*;

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type —'___DL\LLS.LON_QF_G,.L__ Set @ R

18. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and cofrect e GAS & M"\“NG ‘: wE f ]
SoNED 4; égy&___. nic PRODUCTION ENGINEER,. MAY 22,1984

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: '

*See Instructions on Reverse Side



Form 9-331 Form Approved.
Dec. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424
UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Fee-NA
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
NA

SUNDRY NOTICES AND RE%E

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepel

. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

CA 96-0000-80

reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for 9MéN pAsposels: g 8

. FARM OR LEASE NAME

i E. J. Asay
1. oil gas
weil i well U other JUL 2 2 1985 9. WELL NO.
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 1
Coastal 0il & Gas Corpor@t¥lHON OF g\ 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR GAS g M"\HNG Bluebell Field
P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201 11. SEC., T., R, M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR
4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA 20-T1S-R1W
beiow.)
AT SURFACE: 1650' FSL & 1650' FEL 12. COUNTY OR PARISH!| 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Same Duchesne Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH: Same 14 API NO.

16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,

43-013-30101

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15

. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)

5424' KB

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF [ O
FRACTURE TREAT 0 O
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE O O
REPAIR WELL O O
PULL OR ALTER CASING [ O
MULTIPLE COMPLETE J [
CHANGE ZONES | O
ABANDON* O O

(other) Return to production

(NOTE: Report resuits of multiple completion or zone

change on Form 9-330.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Returned to production on July 10, 1985 as allowed by change in spacing
requirements to allow 2 producing wells per 640 acre spacing unit.

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type

Set @ Ft.

July 10, 1985

1 hereby ce ’W the feregoing is true and correct
SIGNED __ nimiebroduction Engineery, .

andpn

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, If ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side

W T AR VE (SYeeERe a



(> Coastal Oil & Gas : .orporation 600 1 7ih Street—Suite 800 S 303/572-1121

a subsidiary of The Coastal Corporation P. O Box 749
Denver, Colorado 80201-0748

June 13, 1984

State of Utah

Utah 0il, Gas & Mining Division
4241 State Office Building , GAS& MIN) O1
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114 NG

Attention: Mr. Ron Eufse
ﬁer/ RE: Bluebell Field
Designation of Producing Well
Section 20-T1S-R1W
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is sent to your attention to designate the
Horrocks #2V well located in the SW/4 SW/4 of Section 20-T1S-R1W
as the producing well for Section 20-1S-1W. The E. J. Asay #1 well,
also located in this section, will be maintained in a temporarily
abandoned status.

I am enclosing a copy of the Completion Report on the
Horrocks well and Sundry Notice dated May 22, 1984.

Very truly yours,

AUt

David M. Laramie
Senior Landman

DML:kj

Enclosure

cc: Mr. Hugh Garner
Mr. Bill Gooden



EXPRESS MAIL ROUTING £' TP
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Form 9-331
Dec. 1973

UNITED STATES

Form Approved.
Budget Bureau No. 42~-R1424

5. LEASE
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FEE-NA
GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
NA

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPQRTS ON WELLS 7. ugg ’;%""_EOE(;“OESIS%AME
(Do not use this form for proposals to driil or to det FE@Ef\mBrent
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for sN¢N Dixposets:) L . 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

. E. J. Asay

1. oil 19 gas 0

well well other AUG 24 108‘; 9. WELL NO.
2. NAME OF OPERATOR hid 1

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation 10. FIELD OR WILDCAT NAME
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR UIVISTUNY e gy Bluebell Field

P. 0. Box 749, Denver, CO &B81& Mining 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR
4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA Sec. 20-T1S-RIW

below.)

AT SURFACE: 1650' FSL & 1650' FEL 12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 13. STATE

AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Same Duchesne Utah

AT TOTAL DEPTH:  gome 14. API NO.
16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, 43-013-30102

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB, AND WD)

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF [
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL

PULL OR ALTER CASING
MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*

(other)

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

OOC0000
I s

5424' KB

(NOTE: Report results of multipie completion or zone

change on Form 9-330.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. {f well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type

18. | hereby certi

SIGNED W

The E. J. Asay #1 was worked over as per the attached chronological

report of operationms.
August 6, 1985.

The well was retruned to flowing production on

Set@ .. Ft

that the foregoing is true and correct

TITLE

Production Engineer
DATE

August 19, 1985

W. . Gooden

APPROVED BY

(This space for Federal or State office use)

TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructions on Reverse Side

WD o mp—— e ——

W ———
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Form 3160-5
(Noveunbar 1983)
(Fomerly 9-331)

SUBMIT IN TRIPLI]

UN, ') STATES - (Other instructions
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse side)
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Form approved.
Budget Bureau No. 1004—0135
Expires August 31, 1985

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SELRIAL NO.

Fee - N/A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON_WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug bac )
¢ not W Use “AP%LIDCATION FOR PERMIT—" for such prop Wi

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

N/A

WELL WELL

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

CA 96-0000-80

(1244 GAS
orar: JAN29-1986
vy e

2. NaME OF OFERATOR

8. PARM OR LEASE NAME

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation E. J. Asay
3. ADDRESS OF OPEBATOR j Dlﬂg{@N OF %tf 9. WELL NO.
P.0. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 GAS & MN!& 1
&. LOCATION oF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance witb any State requirements.® . 10. FISLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
See also space 17 below.) .,
At surface Bluebell

1650' FSL & 1650' FEL

11. s»C., T, B, M., OR BLK. AND
SURVBY OR AREA

Sec 20, T1S, RIW

14. PERMIT NO.

43-013-30102

15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, BT, GR, ete.)

5424' KB

12. COUNTY OR PARISH| 18. STATE

Utah

Duchesne

18. Check Appropriate Box fo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION T0:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PCLL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFP

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON® SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING

CHANGE PLANS

(otber) _Put well op pump

SUBBEQUBNT REFORT OF :

REPAIRING WBLL
ALTERING CASING
ABANDONMBNT®

/

REPAIE WELL _
o NoTE : Report resuits of multiple completion on Well
(Otber) ompletion or Recoupletion Report and Log form.)

17. DLSCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, lncluding estimated date of starting an

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and sones pertl-
nent to this work.) ®

The E. J. Asay was converted to a pumping Wasatch oil well on 10/2/85.

Attached is a copy of the chonological report for installation of pump.

18. I hereby certify ?\tﬂt/h:;omoi;; 1s true and correct
SIGNED 1 R a1

miTLE __Produc tion Engineer

pars 1/24/86

Vince F . Cuinnp

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE

DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Gee Instructions on Reverse Side

Title }8 U.S.C. Section 1901., 4makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United Staies any f{alse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations 8s to any matter within its jurisdiction.



8/4/85

8/5/85

8/6/85

8/7/85

8/8/85

9/28/85

9/30/85

10/1/85

10/2/85

10/3/85

10/4/85

A, J. ASAy #1

Section 20-T1S-R1W
Bluebell Field
Duchesne County, Utah

Flowed 56 BO - 156 BW 20/64 ck FTP 475 psi O0il cut 26% PH - 5 LTR 755 BW
Cost $1631/55,587.

Flowed 75 BO - 173 BW 20/64" ck FTP 450 psi O0il cut 30% PH - 6 LTR 582 BW
Cost $1590/$57,177.

LD 2-7/8" Hydril. Flowed 25 BO & 59 BW in 5 hrs on 20/64" ck w/FTP - 475 psi.

RU Sun Oilfield Service and cut paraffin to 9000' - had paraffin 600'-6500".

Blow well down to 100 psi. Release Baker Rétrievematic packer - kill well w/50

bbl 10 ppg brine. ND BOP's, land tbg with packer set at 11,498' in 15,000

1b compression. NU tree. RU to swab - make 1 run from 1800' - well started
flowing. FTP = 110 psi  20/64" chk. Rec 42 BO and 170 BW in 12 hrs - avg oil cut
= 20% Final oil cut = 40%. pH = 6 LTR = 403 BW. Note: 2-7/8" N-80 EUE tbg
at P.R.S. inspected - 97 jts rejected w/15% + wall loss, cannot run pump cavity

due to lack of 2-7/8" tbg. Will pull well & run later.

Flowed 198 BO & 310 BW/24 hrs. Gas vented - 20/64" ck. FTP = 200 psi pH = 6.0 - 6.5,
LTR = 93 BW. RD and release SU. Cut paraffin from 2500' to 9000' - soft w/bridges.

20/64" FTP = 60 psi. Rec 110 BO & 174 BW, Gas vented. Turned to heater treater
@ 1:45 PM - Contact Gary for gas measurement and request gas connection. Move to
production report.

MIRU service unit. Road Western #12 from yard to location. MIRUSU. Set up pmp,
tanks & pipe rack.

DC: $1,350 TC: $105,784

Prep to TOH w/2-3/8" tbg w/retrievamatic pkr & TIH w/Lok-Set BHA 2-7/8". Road to loc.
RU pmp & lines. Kill well w/35 bbls, 1309F, 5% KCL wtr. ND tree. NU BOPS. Dress for
2-7/8" tbg. TOH w/20 jts 2-7/8" PH-6 hydric tbg. Dress for 2-3/8" tbg. RU & TOH 343
jts 2-3/8" tbg w/retrievamatic pkr. PU 1 jt 2-7/8" bullplug, 6' perf sub, Baker B-2
anchor, 2 jts 2-7/8" tbg, Armco V series dual string, pmp cavity, 4' 2-7/8" pup. TIH
w/2-7/8" tbg, tallied & drifted, 100 jts total. SDFN. Shut in well.

DC: $5,740 TC: §111,524

RD & rel Western #12. SITP 200#. Blow dn & kill well w/60 bbls, 150° fmn wtr. Fin
TIH w/2-7/8" tgb, tallied & drifted (307 jts). Set anchor @ 9618' w/18,000# tension.
‘Pmp cavity @ 9532'. ND BOP. Land 2-7/8" tbg in split hanger. NU BOP. Dress BOP
for 2-3/8" tbg. TIH w/2-3/8" tbg w/seal divider. Set 2/4000# compression. ND BOP.
NU hydraulic tree. Fabrication in flowline. RU pmp 30 bbl 150°F fmn wtr. Dropped
standing valve. Brk circ w/70 bbl, 1509F fmn wtr. Dropped standing valve. Brk circ
w/70 bbl, 150°F fmn wtr. Press tst standing valve to 2500 psi. Held OK. RR. Pmpg
thru treater w/triplex @ 10:30 am. 200 BLWTR. 8 hr prod: 25 BO, 0 BW, gas TSTM.

Fin installing Murphy equip. Tighten seals & weld on pipe collars for sensing equip.
WO Giberson hand to assem pmp. Dropped pmp @ 11 am. Pmp on btm & pmpd up @ 2 pm,
21 SPM. 1900 psi pmp press.

Pmpd 12 BO, 120 BW, 36 MCF/17 hrs, 24 SPM, 2200 psi. 80 BLWIR.

Pmpd 24 hrs. Prod 54 BO, 242 BW, 70 MCFG, 26 SPM & 144" stroke. PP 2200#. Rec'd
162 BW overload.



Form 3160-5
1 December 19RY)Y

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reantry 1o M&ﬂﬁ 1e53
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such prd 54

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: September 30. 1990

S. Lease Designanon and Serial No.
Fee

6. If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Designation

CA-9680

l l Q O 1 (]I\J
T. Type of Well JU LY
Qil Gas
Well D Well D Other ns% zmnm Fated
2. Name of Operator ’ VTN w
Oh.? hAS & PHHING

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

8. Weil Name and No.
Assay #1-20Al1

3. Address and Telephone No.

P. 0. Box 749, Denver, Colorado 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476

9. API Well No.
43-013-30102

4. Locauon of Well (Foouge. Sec.. T., R.. M., or Survey Descripuon)

1650' FSL & 1650' FEL
Section 20, TI1S-RI1W

10. Field and Pool. or Expioratory Area
Bluebell

i1. County or Parish, State

Duchesne, Utah

t2.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
Recompietion New Construcuion
D Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
Other Request to Flare Gas
(Note: Report resuits of muitipie compicuon on Well Compieton or
Recompietion Report and Log form.)

13. Descnibe Proposed or Compieted Op

(Clearly state ail pertinent details. and give perunent dates. including estumated date of starung any proposed work. If well is direcuonally drilled.

give subsurface focations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)®

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation hereby requests permission to flare gas from the above-
referenced well under NTL-4A, Paragraph III, Section A, Emergencies.

Coastal sells the gas produced from this well to Gary-Williams Energy Corporation. Due to

the fire at the Gary-Williams plant in the Bluebell Field,

for 3 to 4 weeks for

period, Coastal requests permission to flare the gas.
1 MCFPD.

approximately

the plant will be out of service
Since there is no other market for the gas during this time
The above-referenced well produces

repairs.

14. 1 hereby/cemfy /ue foregon As true and correg( VY
7 B
ISy Zr AP
Sig "°“’ —— ngrr/r(g"l{p( -fm,{ - (-”'// Tide Regulatory Apalyst - Date 1=26-90Q
(This space for Federal or State offict ~ ’%\ ,’3;— ﬁ(“»'___‘ S‘.’ E‘: : T;\T_‘:—
[ANZRal ) o

Approved by OS" Ufl'\.l;-)“ék} ~3u.
Conditions of al, if any: e

° R FAINING

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes i a

Of representations as (o any marier Within 1oy suruun.

*See Instruction on Raverse Side



Form 3160-5
(June 1990)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservair.
Use “APPLICATION FOR PERMIT—" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
Fee

6. If Indian, Aliottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well
Oil Gas
Well D Well D Other

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

CA-9680

(8]

. Name of Operator @GS# : aoy %]

8. Well Name and No.
E J Asay #1-20al

3. Address and Telephone No. 7

P. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476

9. API Well No.
43-013-30102

4. Locanon of Well (Footage, Sec.. T., R., M., or Survey Description)
1650' FSL & 1650' FEL

Section 20, TlS—Rﬁ
1
/

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Bluebell

11, County or Parish, State

Duchesne County, Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION | TYPE OF ACTION

i D Abandonment

Recompietion

[:] Notice of Intent

@ Subsequent Report | Plugging Back

Casing Repair

D Final Abandonment Notice | Altering Casing

D Change of Plans
New Construction
Non-Routine Fracturing
Water Shut-Off

Conversion to Injection

omer_Cleanout, Perf & Acidiz@] pispose Water

i
|

(Note: Report results of multiple completion on Weil
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

i
13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations {Clearly state all perunent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

give subsurface iocations and measured and true vertical depths for ali markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological report for the cleanout, perf and acid job

performed on the above referenced well.

Regulatory Analyst

12/23/91

Date

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,

(This space Yef Feder

Approved by

Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements

or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

E J ASAY #1-20A1 (CO, ADD PERFS & ACDZ) PAGE 3
BLUEBELL FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

WI: 100% COGC  AFE: 13344

TD: 16,025’  PBTD: 13,612°

5-1/2" LINER @ 11,270°-16,022°

PERFS: 11,992°-13,600° (WASATCH)

CWC(MS): $122.0

12/2/91 POCH w/hyd pmp equip. MIRU. Kill well. ND WH, NU BOP’s. Unsting
2-3/8" from cavity.
DC: $3,559 TC: $3,559

12/3/91 €O liner. POOH w/2-3/8" tbg and stinger. POOH w/hyd pump equip on
2-7/8" tbg. SIH w/4-1/2" mill & CO tools.
DC: $3,636 TC: $7,195

12/4/91 POH w/CO tools. RIH w/4-1/8" mill & CO tools to 11,310°. CO 5-1/2"
liner to 13,575°. Unable to make any further hole.
DC: $5,002 TC: $12,197

12/5/91 RIH w/pkr. POOH w/CO tools. Perf Wasatch from 11,819°-13,522°
(81°). SIH w/5-1/2" pkr on 3-1/2" tbg.
DC: $20,379 TC: $32,576

12/6-7/91 Prep to run w/2-7/8" tbg. Set pkr @ 11,288'. Acidize perfs from
11,992° to 13,600’ w/16,000 gals 15% HC1 w/add, BAF, RS & 800 - 1.1
BS's. MTP 8000 psi, ATP 8000 psi, MTR 20 BPM, ATR 17 BPM. Pkr
sheared 49 bbls into 160-bbl flush. Communication betw tbg &
annulus. POOH w/3-1/2" tbg.

DC: $60,697 TC: $93,273

12/9/91 Set cavity. RIH w/hyd pmp BHA hydrotesting to 8000#. Well gassing
heavily.
DC: $8,313 TC: $101,586

12/10/91 Circ well. Well kicking hard. Kill well. Set TAC @ 9886°. RIH
w/2-3/8" side string and land in WH. ND BOP’s.
DC: $3,347 TC: $104,933
12/11/91  Place well on hyd pmp prod. NU WH. Set SV @ 9536’. PT tbg to
4000#. RDSU. Circ well.
DC: $10,179 TC: $115,112
12/11/91  Pmpd 67 BO, 105 BW, 36 MCF/12 hrs.
12/12/91  Pmpd 51 BO, 132 BW, 79 MCF/24 hrs.
12/13/91  Pmpd 137 BO, 124 BW, 112 MCF/16 hrs. Down 8 hrs - pmp change.
12/14/91 Pmpd 111 BO, 140 BW, 122 MCF/22 hrs. Down 2 hrs - high discharge.
12/15/91  Pmpd 85 BO, 142 BW, 111 MCF/24 hrs, 3000 psi, 10 SPM.
12/16/91  Pmpd 111 BO, 182 BW, 122 MCF.
12/17/91  Pmpd 76 BO, 16 BW, 109 MCF.

12/18/91  Pmpd 108 BO, 147 BW, 122 MCF, 3500 psi, 14 SPM/15 hrs. Down 9 hrs,
pump change.

Prior production: 12 BO, 20 BW, 13 MCF. Final report.



Form 3160-5 . UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

' u ur . -0135
June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR e e aren 311093
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT ‘ 5. Lease Designauon and Seral No.
Fee
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS T

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use “"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT~" for such proposals | N/A

7. If Umt or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well CA #9680
3,':” D (“;',a:” : Other 8. Well Name and No.
. Name of Operator 'E. J. Asay #1-20Al
Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation | 9. API Well No.
3 Address and Teiephone No. . 43-013-30102
P. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 | 10. Field and Pooi. or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T.. R.. M.. or Survey Description) | Bluebell
1650' FSL & 1650' FEL i 11. County or Parish. State

Section 20, T1S-R2W |

| Duchesne County, Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TC INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION : TYPE OF ACTION
G Notice ot intent ! D Abandonment LJ Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction
T .
2! Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracwuring
l Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice j Altering Casing Conversion to injection
omer ReVised Site Security Dispose Water
Diagram {Note: Report resuits of multipic completion on Weli
Compietion or Recompiction Report and Log lorm )

13. Describe Proposed or Compieted Operations (Clearly state all perunent detaiis. and give pertinent dates. including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well 1s directionaiiv drilled.
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for ali markers and zones pertinent 1o this work.)*

Please see the attached revised site security diagram for the above referenced well.

MAR 19 =92

2 )
14. 1 hereby mw: corr&ﬂf@
Signed // { M €22 Title Regulatory Analyst Dae  3/17/92
Lt e Dae e —De 4

4

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title

Date
Conditions of approvai, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any deparmment or agency of the United States any false. fictitious or frauduient statements
Or representations as to any matter within s junsdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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Form 3160—5 Ul
WU e 1990)

ED STATES
DEPARTME.+T OF THE INTERIOR

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a diffetent reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" —

for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004—0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

§. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Fee

6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

7. If Unitor CA, Agreement Designation

CA #9680

1. Type of Well

Qil Well |:| Gas Well D Other

8. Well Name and No.

E.J. Asay #1-20A1

2. Name of Operator

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

9. APl Well No.

43-013-30102

3. Address and Telephone No.

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749

(303) 573—4476

10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

Bluebell

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description)
1650’ FSL & 1650’ FEL
Section 20— T1S—R2W /()

11. County or Parish, State

Duchesen County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intert

D Subsequent Report

Final Abandonment Notice

[:] Abandonmert

D Recompletion

D Plugging Back
Casing Repair
Altering Casing

other Perf & Acidize

D Change of Plans
l:] New Construction

D Non-Routine Fracturing

[ ] water shut-ofr

I:] Conversion to Injection

I:] Dispose Water

{NOTE: Report resuls of muiiple completion on Well
Completi or R Report and Log form)

b4

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached workover procedure to perf and acidize in the subject well.

14. | hereby eemfy that the fo

TR,

Signed tite _District Drilling Manager Date 06/28/94
N o Shifletf / ab

(This space for Federal or State office use) /

APPROVED BY Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and williully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statemerts or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



WORKOVER PR - E

E. J. ASAY #1-20A1
Section 20-T1S-R1W
Altamont Field
Duchesne County, Utah

LOCATION: 1.650" FSL and 1.650° FEL

ELEVATION: 5.405" GL: 5.424° KB

TOTAL DEPTH: 16.025° PBTD: 13.612° (Junk in hole)

CASING: 10-3/4", 40.5#, K-55 ST&C @ 1,546" cmt'd w/ 950 sxs

7-5/8", 26.4#, N-80 LT&C from 0" - 7,835 and

29.7#. CF-95 from 7,835 - 11.489" cmt w/1165 sxs
NOTE: 7-5/8" casing was split and cmt sqzd at 4690°.
5-1/2", 23#, N-80 LT&C from 11.270° - 16,022" cmt w/ 625

SXS
TUBING: 2-7/8" N-80 @ 9,887".
Capacity Burst Collapse
Description 1D Drift B/F Psi Psi
10-3/4" 40.5# K-55  10.050" 9.894" .0981 3130 1580
7-5/8" 26.4# N-80 6.969"  6.844" .0472 6020 3400
7-5/8" 29.7# CF-95 6.875" 6.750" .0459 8180 5120
5-1/2" 23# N-80 4.670"  4.545" .0212 9880 11160
09/72 Initial Completion. Perforate from 11.814° to 15.900° in three

stages. 3 SPF, 157 holes. Acidized with 27.500 gals 15% HF using
ball sealers. Flowed 1632 BOPD, 1364 MCFPD. 0 BWPD w/ FTP @ 3300 psi
on 12/64" choke.

11/74 Add Wasatch perforations 11,992°-12.920°. 181 holes. Plug back with—
BP at 13.612° covered with cmt.

Prior Production: 27 BOPD, 1 MCFPD. 0 BWPD
Post Production: 29 BOPD. 1 MCFPD, 4 BWPD

01/75 Acidize entire well bore with 10,000 gals 15% acid and ball sealers:. ,

Prior-Production: 29 BOPD. 1.MCFPD. 4 BWPD
Post Production: 366 BOPD, 326 MCFPD. 0 BWPD )

08/85 Ac;dgig entire well bore with 27,900 gals 15% acid w/ ball sealré;’
an .

Prior Production: BOPD. MCFPD. BWPD
Post Production; BOPD, MCFPD, BWPD i
10/85 Install hydraulic pump. S
Prior Prod : 0 BOPD, 0 MCFPD, 0 BWPD
Post Production: 54 BOPD, 70 MCFPD. 242 BWPD
12/91 Add Wasatch perforations 11,819°-13,522°, 243 holes. Acidize entire

well bore with 16,000 gals 15% acid w/ ball sealers and BAF.
Prior Production: 12 BOPD. 13 MCFPD. 20 BWPD
P ro ion: 85 BOPD, 111 MCFPD, 142 BWPD

Producing 30 BOPD 26 MCFD and 35 BWPD on hydraulic pump.




WORKOVER PROCEDURE - E. J. ASAY #1-20A1 Page 2

.o

1) MIRU service rig. POOH with production equipment. ND wellhead and NU
BOPE. Release TAC at +/- 9,887". Circulate condensate. POOH w/ tubing.

2) RIH w/ mi1l and scraper for 7-5/8" csg. (O 7-5/8" casing to Tiner top @
11,270°. TOOH. RIH w/ clean out tool for 5-1/2" casing. CO 5-1/2" csg
to PBTD +/- 13.600".

3) RU wireline company. RIH w/ 5-1/2" CIBP. Set BP at 11.840°.  (Note
perforations at 11.814°. 11,815", and 11.829".) RIH w/ 5-1/2" Halliburton
RTTS packer on 2-7/8" tubing. Set packer at 11.550°. Fill backside. Pump
into perforations 11,814'-11.829" to establish rate. Open RTTS valve. Mix
and spot 50 sx cement piug above packer. Close RTTS valve. Cement squeeze
perforations 11.819°-11.829". If squeeze is obtained reverse out excess
cement. WOC. If no squeeze is obtained. clear perforations. WOC, and
resqueeze.

4)  POCH with 5-1/2" Halliburton packer. Drill out cement to 11.810".

5) RU wireline company. RIH w/ 4" casing gun, 120° phasing. 3 SPF and
perforate Upper Wasatch Formation per the attached progosis from 10,254’ -
11,800°. (122", 366 total holes).

6) RIH w/ 7-5/8" Mountain State Arrowset I. 10k, packer with on/off tool and
profile nipple on 3-1/2" N-80 9.3# tubing. Set packer at +/- 10.200°.
éNgte top perforation at 10.254"). Fill backside. Pressure backside to

000 psi.

7)  Acidize perforations 10,254 to 11,800" using 22,000 gals 7-1/2% HCL BAF,
rock salt, and ball sealers as shown on attached schedule. Run RA tracer
to delineate stimulated zones.

8) Flow and swab back acid load.

9) If well flows back strongly, drop plug and release from on/off tool. - POOH— ____
and LD 3-1/2" tubing. RIH with 2-7/8" tubing. Latch into packer:
Retrieve plug and return well to production

10) If requested by Denver Office. RU Western Atlas and run Prism log  over
stimulated intervail.

11) When pressure drops and the well quits flowing, RIH w/ production B
equipment . _ -y

OKD: dkd e




GREATER ALTAMONT FIELD

CO&GC - ASAY #1-20A1
SE/4 SECTION 20, T1S-R1W
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

PERFORATION SCHEDULE

DEPTH REFERENCE:  Schiumberger BHC Sonic, Run #1 (5/21/72) and Run #2 (7/09/72)

11,800° 11,464 11,160’ 10,904’ 10,664’ 10,421°
11,767’ 11,441 11,138’ 10,897’ 10,653’ 10,410°

11,753 11,424’ 11,129° 10,866" 10,642’ 10,400°

11,742 11,404' 1,119’ 10,861’ 10,631’ 10,388’

11,730’ 11,390’ 11,112 10,840’ 10,624’ 10,378’

11,716' 11,377 11,000’ 10,832’ 10,604’ 10,370

11,703 11,364’ 11,077 10,828’ 10,597’ 10,361°

11,688’ 11,355' 11,070° 10,817’ 10,590" 10,357

11,678’ 11,342 11,065’ 10,810’ 10,576’ 10,353’

11,662 11,330’ 11,052 10,786’ 10,560" 10,339°

11,655' 11,312 11,040’ 10,782" 10,553’ 10,332

11,634’ 11,303 11,034’ 10,769’ 10,543 10,313’

11,614 11,291’ 11,020' 10,752’ 10,539" 10,296'

11,603' 11,286' 11,015’ 10,742’ 10,526’ 10,278’

11,588° 11,260’ 10,993’ 10,732 10,506" 10,272

11,581° 11,233 10,982’ 10,719° 10,487’ 10,262 ————
11,553 11,222 10,960’ 10,717 10,484’ 10,254 B
11,539" 11,206’ 10,952' 10,702 10,478’
11,521’ 11,199’ 10,842’ 10,696’ 10,456' L
11,513’ 11,171 10,934’ 10,688’ 10,445’

11,503’ 11,166’ 10,815’ 10,672’ 10,432

Gross Upper Wasatch Interval: 10,254-11,800°, 122 feet, 103 zones

—

J_
. J. La Rocque
pril 18, 1994

=

>
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Form 3160-5 U TED STATES FORM APPROVED
{June 1990) DEPARTM. _.T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004—0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT SEP ? 3 ey Expires: March 31, 1993
. L. e 5. Lease Designation and Seriai No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Fee
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. It indian, Alottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" — for such proposals
N/A
7. ¥ Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE CA #9680
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
Oil Well D Gas Well D Other E.J. Asay #1-20A1
2. Name of Operator 9. AP| Well No.
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30102
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area
P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201—-0749 (303) 573—-4476 Bluebell
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State
1650’ FSL & 1650’ FEL
Section 20—-T1S—R2W~ / ék/ Duchesen County, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intert D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion ‘ l:l New Construction
Subsequent Report I:] Plugging Back D Non—Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair D Water Shut- Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection
otmer Perf & Acidize D Dispose Water
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state alf pertinent details, and give pertinert dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionalty
drilied, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for ali markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed in the subject well.

14. | hereby certify that the/f_ore ing is tru %md correct

Signed LL,:U { /‘/ / tive District Drilling Manager Date 09/20/94
O Shlﬂett ‘

(This space for Federal or State office use) /

APPROVED BY Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

HRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

E.J. ASAY #1-20A1 (CO. PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE 4
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 100% COGC  AFE: 14629

TD: 16.025°

5% " LINER

PBTD: 13,612°
@ 11,270'-16,022°

PERFS: 10,254'-13,522°
CWCTMS$): 131.0

7/21/94

7/22/94

7/23-24/94
7/25/94

7/26/94

7127794

7/28/94

7/29/94

7/30-31/94
8/1/94

8/2/94

POOH w/2%4" .

MIRU. RU Delsco. Fished pump & RIH to knock ball out of standing
valve. ND WH, NU BOP's. Unstung 2%". Flushed 2%" w/70 bbls. POOH
w/150 jts 2%" tbg to 4650°. CC: $5.461

RIH w/7%" scraper.
POOH w/151 jts 2%" tbg & stinger. POOH w/304 jts 274" tbg. LD BHA.
PU 786" scraper. RIH w/40 jts 2%" tbg to 1225°. CC: $9.218

SD for weekend.

RIH w/scraper on 274" tbg.
Blew well down. Rig broke down - repair rig. CC: $10.993

RIH w/7%" scraper.
Repair rig. Blew well down. RIH w/174 jts 2%" tbg to 6556° CC:
$11.959

RIH w/CO tools.

RIH w/90 jts 27" tbg. PU & RIH w/57 jts 2%" tbg to LT @ 11.270".
POOH w/361 jts 2%" tbg. Changed over trip equip. PU & RIH w/mill,
check sub, 10" pup, check sub, 40 jts 23" tbg, safety jt. bailer.
C?gngeg over trip equip. RIH w/X0. 1-jt 2%" tbg to 1292°. CC:
$15.22

RIH & CO to PBTD.
RIH w/393 jts 27" tbg to fi11 @ 13,550 (62" of fill). RU. drld 6',

RO drlg equip. POOH w/80 jts 2%" tbg to above LT @ 11.270°. CC:
$19,878

Prep to perf.

RIH w/80 jts 27%". DO to PBTD @ 13.612°. POOH w/2%" tbg. LD bailer,
4%" mill. CC: $24,065

SD for weekend.

RIH w/7%" pkr on 3%" tbg.

RU Cutters. Ran GR Log. Perf'd Upper Wasatch @ 10,2547 -11,800° (366
holes) w/3%" & 4" guns, 120° phasing, 3 SPF: :

Run # Interval Shots FL PSI

11,800°-11.503° 63 5900
11.464°-11,166° 63 5900
11,160°-10,915° 63  5880°
10.904"-10.672° 63  5850°
10,664 -10,445° 60 5700
10,432°-10,254° 54 5700

Total 366

RD Cutters. RIH w/7%" HD pkr, X0, 40 jts 3%" tbg to 1225°. (C:
$49,813

YO A WN
OO ODOO

Prep to acidize.

RIH w/295 jts 3%" tbg to 10.213". set pkr. Filled csg w/200 bbls.
Tested csg to 2000# - held for 15 min. CC: $56,844



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONGLOGICAL HISTORY

E.J. ASAY #1-20A1 (CO, PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE 5
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 100% COGC  AFE: 14629

8/3/94

8/4/94

8/5/94

8/6/94

8/7/94

8/8/94

8/8/94
8/9/94
8/10/94
8/11/94

8/12/94
8/13/94
8/14/94
8/15/94
8/16/94
8/17/94

Swab testing.

RU Dowell. Blender broke down. Acidized perfs @ 10,254'-13.522°
w/22,000 gal 7%% HC1 + additives. MIP 8800#. AIP 8500#. MIR 38 BPM.
AIR 26.5 BPM. SITP 4133#, 15 min 3712#. Fair diversion. 1014 BLTR.
RD Dowell. Flwd & swbd back 239 bbls (76 BO. 163 BLW)/S hrs. FFL
150", present 011 cut 95%, 48 BPH. (C: $97.185

Prep to run Prism Log.

RU swab. IFL 2000°. Swabbed 120 bbls (54 BO. 66 BW)/16 runs. flwd
90 bbls, FFL 4000°. oil cut 45%, 20 BPH. pH 4. CC: $102.753

LD 3%" tbg.

RU Atlas. Run Prism log on well @ 13,552°-10,100°. RD Atlas. unset
pkr. LD 102 jts 3%" tbg. CC: $109.647

Hydrotesting in hole w/production tbg.

POOH LD 233 jts 3%" tbg & pkr. PU & RIH w/BHA & 80 jts 27" tbg to
2573" hydrotesting to 8500#. CC: $122.230

ND BOP's, test thg.

Hydrotested in hole w/225 jts 27" tbg. ND BOP's. set anchor @ 9699°
RIH w/stinger & 300 jts 2%" tbg to 9525°. CC: $126.362

Well on pump.

Stung in & landed 2%" tbg. ND BOP's. RU Delsco. Run SV. RD
Detsco. Circ well clean. Test 274" & 2%" tbg to 4000#. NU WH,
tested to 5000#. RU flowlines. Dropped pump. cleaned out flat tank.
Cleaned up location, RD. CC: $140.660

Pmpd 154 BO. 47 BW, 39 MCF, 17 hr, PP 1800#.

Pmpd 151 BO, 127 BW, 76 MCF, PP 23004#.

Pmpd 53 BO. 145 BW, 61 MCF. PP 3000#. Will check FL & CO pump .

Pmpd 100 BO, 114 BW, 65 MCF, 20 hrs. Ran FL - 4684°. Down 4 hrs -
CO pump from jet to recip.

Pmpd 83 BO, 153 BW. 54 MCF, 21 hr. Down 3 hr - power failure.
Pmpd 95 BO. 209 BW, 65 MCF.

Pmpd 20 BO, 96 BW, 63 MCF, 17 hr. Down 7 hr - pump failure.
Pmpd 92 BO. 99 BW, 62 MCF, 19 hrs. Down 5 hrs to change pump.
Pmpd 82 BO, 174 BW, 58 MCF.

Pmpd 86 BOPD., 185 BWPD. 64 MCFPD.

Prior rate: 27 BOPD, 41 BWPD, 22 MCFPD. Final report .



Form 3160-5 U "TED STATES E @ F oo FORM APPROVED
{June 1990) DEPARTM .TOF THE INTERIOR prem—— Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT : Expires: March 31, 1993
coo - E JONE| 5. Lease Designation and Seriai No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Fee
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. 1f Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT' — for such proposals
N/A
7. # Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE CA #9680
1. Type of Well 8. Weil Name and No.
oil Well D Gas Well D Other E.J. Asay #1-20A1
2. Name of Operator 9. APl Well No.
Coastal Qil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30102
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area
P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573—-4476 Bluebell
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State
1650’ FSL & 1650’ FEL
Section 20—-TiS—-R2W Duchesen County, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion l:] New Construction
Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non—Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair D Water Shut—Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection
other Perf & Acidize D Dispose Water
{NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on We!
Completion or Recompleton Report and Log form)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinert details, and give pertinert dates, inciuding estimated date of starting any proposed work. If weli is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work performed in the subject well.

14. | hereby certify that the/torefgo\ng is tru énd correct
Signed hﬂ(_ /‘/ / Tite _District Drilling Manager Dete 09/20/94
O Shiflett ‘ [ el
(This space for Federal or State office use) 7 ,f
APPROVED BY Title Date /{'M 0]7 L)( \v

Conditions of approval, if any: ; >
1< gs.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any faise, ficticious or fraudulent staternerts or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPQORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

E.J. ASAY #1-20A1 (CO, PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE 4
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 100% COGC  AFE: 14629

TD: 16,025"  PBTD: 13,612

5%" LINER @ 11,270°-16.022°

PERFS: 10,254'-13,522

CWCTM$): 131.0

7/21/94 POOH w/2%"
MIRU. RU Delsco. Fished pump & RIH to knock ball out of standing
valve. ND WH, NU BOP's. Unstung 23". Flushed 2%" w/70 bbls. POOH
w/150 jts 29" tbg to 4650°. CC: $5.461

7/22/94 RIH w/7%" scraper.
POOH w/151 jts 2%" tbg & stinger. POOH w/304 jts 27" tbg, LD BHA.
PU 79" scraper. RIH w/40 jts 2%" tbg to 1225 . CC: $9.218

7/23-24/94 SD for weekend.

7/25/94 RIH w/scraper on 274" tbg.
Blew well down. Rig broke down - repair rig. CC: $10.993

7/26/94 RIH w/7%" scraper.
Repair rig. Blew well down. RIH w/174 jts 23" tbg to 6556° CC:
$11.959

7/27/94 RIH w/C0 tools.
RIH w/90 jts 2%" tbg. PU & RIH w/57 jts 27" tbg to LT @ 11,270 .
POOH w/361 jts 27" tbg. Changed over trip equip. PU & RIH w/mill,
check sub. 10" pup. check sub, 40 jts 2%" tbg, safety Jjt. bailer.
Chgnggg over trip equip. RIH w/X0, 1-jt 2%" tbg to 1292°. (C:
$15,

7/28/94 RIH & CO to PBTD.
RIH w/393 jts 2%" tbg to fill @ 13.550" (62° of fi1l). RU. drld 6°.
Eggdg;g equip. POOH w/80 jts 2%" tbg to above LT @ 11.270°. CC:

7/29/94 Prep to perf.
RIH w/80 jts 2%". DO to PBTD @ 13.612°. POOH w/2%" tbg. LD baiter,
4%" mi1l. CC: $24.065

7/30-31/94 SD for weekend.

8/1/94 RIH w/7%" pkr on 3%" tbg.
RU Cutters. Ran GR Log. Perf'd Upper Wasatch @ 10.254°-11.800° (366
holes) w/3%" & 4" guns, 120° phasing, 3 SPF:

Run # Interval Shots FL PSI

=

1 11.800°-11,503° 63 5900 0

2 11,464°-11,166° 63 5900° 0

3 11,160°-10,915° 63 5880 0

4 10,904 -10,672° 63  5850° 0

5 10,6647 -10,445° 60 5700 0

6 10.432°-10,254° 54 5700° 0

Total 366

RD Cutters. RIH w/7%" HD pkr. X0, 40 Jts 3%" tbg to 1225°. CC:
$49,813

8/2/94 Prep to acidize.

RIH w/295 jts 3%" tbg to 10,213". set pkr. Filled csg w/200 bbls.
Tested csg to 2000# - held for 15 min. CC: $56,844



THE COASTAL CORPORATION
PRODUCTION REPORT

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

E.J. ASAY #1-20A1 (CO. PERF & ACIDIZE) PAGE 5
ALTAMONT FIELD

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UT

WI: 100% COGC  AFE: 14629

8/3/94

8/4/94

8/5/94

8/6/94

8/7/94

8/8/94

8/8/94
8/9/94
8/10/94
8/11/94

8/12/94
8/13/94
8/14/94
8/15/94
8/16/94
8/17/94

Swab testing.

RU Dowell. Blender broke down. Acidized perfs @ 10,254 -13,522°
w/22,000 gal 7%% HC1 + additives. MIP 8800#. AIP 8500#. MIR 38 BPM,
AIR 26.5 BPM. SITP 4133#, 15 min 3712#. Fair diversion, 1014 BLTR.
RD Dowell. Fiwd & swbd back 239 bbls (76 BO. 163 BLW)/5 hrs, FFL
150", present 011 cut 95%, 48 BPH. CC: $97,185

Prep to run Prism Log.

RU swab. IFL 2000°. Swabbed 120 bbls (54 BO, 66 BW)/16 runs, flwd
90 bbls, FFL 4000°, oil cut 45%, 20 BPH, pH 4. CC: $102,753

LD 3%" thg.

RU Atlas. Run Prism Tog on well @ 13,552°-10,100°. RD Atlas. unset
pkr. LD 102 jts 3%" tbg. CC: $109.647

Hydrotesting in hole w/production tbg.

POOH LD 233 jts 3% " tbg & pkr. PU & RIH w/BHA & 80 jts 27" tbg to
2573 hydrotesting to 8500#. CC: $122.230

ND BOP's, test tbg.

Hydrotested in hole w/225 jts 27" tbg. ND BOP's, set anchor @ 9699 .
RIH w/stinger & 300 jts 2%" tbg to 9525°. CC: $126.362

Well on pump.

Stung in & landed 2%" tbg. ND BOP's. RU Delsco. Run SV. RD
Delsco. Circ well clean. Test 27" & 2%" tbg to 4000#. NU WH.
tested to 5000#. RU flowlines. Dropped pump. cleaned out flat tank.
Cleaned up location, RD. CC: $140,660

Pmpd 154 BO, 47 BW. 39 MCF. 17 hr. PP 18004#.

Pmpd 151 BO, 127 BW, 76 MCF, PP 23004#.

Pmpd 53 BO. 145 BW, 61 MCF. PP 3000#. Will check FL & CO pump.

Pmpd 100 BO, 114 BW, 65 MCF, 20 hrs. Ran FL - 4684°. Down 4 hrs -
CO pump from jet to recip.

Pmpd 83 BO, 153 BW, 54 MCF, 21 hr. Down 3 hr - power failure.
Pmpd 95 BO, 209 BW, 65 MCF.

Pmpd 20 BO, 96 BW, 63 MCF, 17 hr. Down 7 hr - pump failure.
Pmpd 92 BO. 99 BW. 62 MCF. 19 hrs. Down 5 hrs to change pump.
Pmpd 82 BO. 174 BW. 58 MCF.

Pmpd 86 BOPD. 185 BWPD, 64 MCFPD.

Prior rate: 27 BOPD, 41 BWPD, 22 MCFPD. Final report.



Fe'm 3160-5 U "TED STATES FORM APPROVED

{June 1990) DEPARTM T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
‘ BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Fee
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals
N/A
7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE CA #9680

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

Oil Well D Gas Well D Other E.J. Asay #1-20A1
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30102
3. Address and Teiephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Bluebell
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, State

1650' FSL & 1650' FEL

Section 20-T18S- Duchesne County
12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction
Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing [:] Conversion to Injection
other SWD Flowline installation [;;l Dispose Water

(

E: Report results of muiltipie completion on Well

Completion or R pletion Report and Log form.)
13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Operator has installed a SWD flowline from the Bluebell Pump Station to the Asay #1-20A1. See attached map
showing flowline highlighted in yellow.

14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Signed (A, Tt Environmental & Safety Analyst Dat 04/24/97
Sheila Bremer
(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Titl

Dat
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse Side
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PRODUCTION FLOW LINE
INTO BATTERY

SWD WELLS

COASTAL OPERATED WRLLS

Coastal O & Gas Corporation

A SUBSIDIARY OF THE COASTAL CORPORATION
The £eergy People

ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHENSE COUNTY UTAH

SWD FLOW LINE
BLUEBELL EXTENSION

M.D. ERNEST SCALE: 17=4000' SEPTEMBER, 10086




Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold)

Operator Name Change (Only)

ROUTING
I.GLH 4-KAS ]
2.CDW/ 5-LPy”

3 JLT 6-FILE

Designation of Agent

X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective:

3-09-2001

FROM: (Old Operator):

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

TO: ( New Operator):

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY

Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995

Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account N0230 Account NI1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY |[SEC TWN |LEASE |WELL |WELL

NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE |STATUS
WILKERSON 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 110230 20-0IN-01W |FEE oW S
JENSEN 1-2971 43-013-30725 {9110 29-0IN-01W [FEE oW P
OBERHANSLY 2-3171 43-013-30970 9725 31-0IN-01W |FEE oW P
DYE 1-2572 43-013-30659 [9111 25-01IN-02W |FEE ow P
HORROCKS FEE 1-3A1 43-013-30171 [9139 03-01S-01W {FEE OwW S
HORROCKS 2-4A1 43-013-30954 9855 04-01S-01W |FEE oW p
T HORROCKS 1-6A1 43-013-30390 [5790 06-01S-01W |FEE ow S
CADILLAC 3-6A1 43-013-30834 8439 06-01S-01W |FEE ow S
JOSEPH YACK U 1-7A1 43-013-30018 5795 07-01S-01W |FEE oW S
CURTIS BASTIAN 1 (3-7D) 43-013-30026 5800 07-01S-01W |FEE ow S
CHASEL 2-17A1 43-013-30732 9112 17-01S-01W |FEE ow P
POWELL FEE 2-19K 43-013-31149 |8303 19-01S-01W [FEE ow p
E J ASAY FEE 1 43-013-30102 {8304 20-01S-01W |FEE ow P
HORROCKS 2-V 43-013-30833 {8301 20-01S-01W |FEE ow P
LAWSON 1-28A1 43-013-30358 {1901 28-01S-01W |FEE OW P
RGDYE U 1-29A1 (CA 96-109) 43-013-30271 {5815 29-01S-01W |FEE oW S
SUMMARELL E U 1-30A1 (CA NW-625) 43-013-30250 |5820 30-01S-01W {FEE OW S
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 43-013-30836 2417 31-01S-01W |FEE oW S
LEBEAU 1-34A1 43-013-30590 [1440 34-01S-01W |FEE OwW P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 43-013-30360 |5830 01-015-02W |FEE ow P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001

3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on:

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah:

YES

06/21/2001

Business Number: 608186-0143




w

If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator

for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 06/25/2001
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 06/25/2001
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001
4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 06/25/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: ?' / . S 'O [

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso

Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change File".




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AHD SERIAL NUMBER:

8. IF INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE MAME;

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do nol usa this form or proposals to drill new wells, significanlly deepen exisling wells below current bottem-hote deplh, reenter plugijed welis. or lo
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMI: and NUMBER:

ol weLt [ GASWELL [ ] OTHER

Exhibhit "A"
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
E1 Paso Production 0il & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OFERATOR: PHONE NUMOER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
368 South 1200 East cnv Vernal state Utah 2r 84078 435-789-4433

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: . COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: ' STATE:

UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE [j DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
] wmoTice oF iNTeNT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR 'WELL

Approximale date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

[] susseauenTt ReporT
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

CHAMGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Dale of work complelion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

omver:_Name Change

HMOOOOOoo

Oooooood

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

Ldooooon

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent delails including dales, depths, volumes, etc.
As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation
has been changed to El1 Paso Production 0il & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708

Coastal 0il & Gas Corporation

MAME (PLEASE PRINT, ohn T Elzner TITLE Vice President
SIGHATURE — >'%_‘ onte L4 15 -0/

V4 / ] : __

E1l Paso Pydduction Oil & Gas Company T T
nawe (pLease PRI _\John T #lzner wne Vice President
’ ; 7,

SIGNATURE 7 onte Ll 15 -0/

{ ] { ]

el RECEIVED

JUN %3 2001

DIVISION OF
OiL, GAS AND MINING

(3/2000) {Seq Instructiona on Reverso Sirde)



| State of Delaware
Office of the Secretary of State

PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF
DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT
COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS
CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN
THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O’CLOCK

A.M.

DIVISION 0F
OIL, GAS AND MINING

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State
AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

0610204 8100

010162788 DATE: 04-03-01



@003/003 ,

03-09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4098 CORP. LAY DEPT.

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT
OF
CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the “Company™), a corporation
organized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State of
Delaware, DOES HEREBY CERTIFY: .

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimous
written consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolution
proposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate of

Incorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate of
Incorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate of
Incorporetion be so emended, by changing the Article thereof numbered
“FIRST.” so that, as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows;

“FIRST. The name of the corporation 1s El Paso Production Qil & Gas
Company.”

SECOND: That in lieu of g meeting and vote of stockholders, the
stockholderts entitled to vote have glven unanimous written consent to said amendment in
accordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance with
the applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General Corporation Law of the
State of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
has caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice President and attested by an
Assistant Secretary, this 9th day of March 2001.

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION
W
0 David L. Siddall
Vice President

Attest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE
. DIVISTON OF CORPORATIONS

E C E i VE D FILED 11:00 AM 03/09/2001
010118394 — 0610204
1UN 19 2001

DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING




STA(E OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new welis, significantly deepen existing weiis below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal taterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GASWELL [[] OTHER ASAY E.J 1-20A1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER.
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY 4301330102
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1339 EL SEGUNDO NE (505) 344-9380 ALTAMONT

oy ALBUQUERQUE .. NM 87113

4. LOCATION OF WELL

rooTAGes AT surrFace: 1650° FSL, 1650" FEL

county: DUCHESNE

QTRATR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDAN: NWSE 20 1S 1W STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [J acozE ﬁ DEEPEN [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [] auercasing [ ] FRACTURETREAT [[] sioEmACKTOREPAIRWELL
Approximate date work will start [7] casinererar [[] n~ewconstrRucTion [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] crancE TOPREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraTorCHANGE ] tueinG RePair
[] cranceTUBING [[] PLuGANDABANDON [J ventorfLARe
4| SU(IguSEnQIL(J)En;J'T‘a'RFEOm) [] cHanGEWELL NAME [] pesack ] water oisPosaL
] [[] crance wewL sTaTUS [[] PropucTION (START/IRESUME) [ watersnut-oFF
Date of work compietion:
[C] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: ROD PUMP
6/3/2004 [ converTweLL TyPE [T] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION CONVERSION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

5/19/04 - 6/3/04

RIH W/ 2 3/8" SOLID PLUG, 1 JT 2 3/8" TBG, 3 1/2" PBGA, 2 3/8" SUB, 4' + 45 SN, 25 JTS 2 3/8" 8RD X-0 TO 2 7/8", 7 5/8"
TAC, 303 JTS OUT OF DERRICK. PU 53 JTS 2 7/8" N-80 8RD. SET TAC @ 11,212'. LAND TBG W/ 25,000# TENSION.
RIH W/ NEW 2" X 1 1/4" PUMP. RIH W/ 15 3/4" W/G SH, 165 - 3/4" SLICK, 20 - 3/4" W/G, 10 7/8" WIG, 132 SLICK 7/8" , 134
- 1" SLICK. PU NEW POLISH ROD. SEAT & SPACE PUMP @ 12,031. FILL TBG W/ 40 BBLS TPW. PRESS TEST TO

1000 PSI.

PLACE WELL ON PRODUCTION.

NAME (PLEASE FRINT) CHERYL CAMERON me ©- REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE ___ :) JUA O (lwu\u\ oare _8/25/2004

17 A
(This space for State use only)
RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
AUG 2 / 2004

TSI I NAS O g
DIV OF G CGAS A MINING



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.DJJ
2. CDW
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 7/1/2006
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1845-El Paso Production O&G Company N3065-El Paso E&P Company, LP
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX 77002 Houston, TX 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 420-2300 Phone: 1 (713) 420-2131
CA No. Unit:

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed
(R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 7/5/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 7/5/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/30/2006
4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 2114377-0181

5. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: requested 7/18/06

6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: ok

6¢. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on:
7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM  not yet BIA not yet
8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet
9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a
10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 7/14/2006
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 7/19/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 7/19/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
4. TFee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 7/5/2006
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0708
a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a  applicable wells moved
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/20/2006

COMMENTS:

El Paso 1 FORM 4A.xls 10/2/2006



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

MULTIPLE LEASES

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new weils, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

B, IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME.

B oL WELL ] GASWELL [] OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

SEE ATTACHED
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: - 9. APl NUMBER:
EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY N / g /7/5
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1339 EL SEGUNDO AVE NE  ALBUQUERQUE NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 SEE ATTACHED
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FooTAGES AT surFace: SEE ATTACHED county: UINTAH & DUCHESNE
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[Z] NOTICE OF INTENT [] acioize [] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicate) [C] AtercasiNg [T] FRACTURE TREAT [[] sIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: [] casinG rerar NEW CONSTRUCTION

[] crance To PREVIOUS PLANS

Ml
¥4
[[] cHanceTueING O
Ll
Ll
]

OPERATOR CHANGE

PLUG AND ABANDON

[ suBsEQUENT REPORT

[[] crance weLL Name
(Submit Original Form Only)

PLUG BACK

D CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)
Date of work completion:
D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

- DIFFERENT FORMATION

[] converT wewL TYPe O] recomrLete

[[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[[] TusinG REPAIR

[J ventorFLaARE

[[] water DisposaL

[[] WATER SHUT-OFF

[J orher: CHANGE OF
OPERATOR

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY (CURRENT OPERATOR) HAS
TRANSFERRED ITS OPERATORSHIP TO EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. (NEW OPERATOR) EFFECTIVE JUNE-36,J « / )/
2006 AND THAT EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS CONSIDERED TO BE THE NEW OPERATOR OF THE

ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS.

EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE LEASE(S)

FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED UPON LEASED LANDS. BOND COVERAGE IS PROVIDED BY THE STATE
OF UTAH STATEWIDE BLANKET BOND NO. 400JU0705, BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT NATIONWIDE BOND
NO. 103601420, AND BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS NATIONWIDE BOND NO. 103601473.

E1 Paso E & P Company, L. P. N 30(9
1001 Louisiana

Houston, TX 77002

LI 0a. ™o G
William M. Griffin, Sr. Viédd President

name pLease prnry CHERYL CAMERON mme AUTHORIZED REGULATORY AGENT
sxfsmruc Jbul L.\(g’ QCD/W\U«M e 6/20/2006
i
(This space for State use only)
APPROVED _7//7/0¢ RECEIVED
é‘ﬂ ’me @LW,U JUL 05 2006

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining oo o
Earlene Russell, Enginoering Technfclan®> "=

(5/2000)

MVOFWLGAS&MWMW



.

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 . Houston, TX. 77002
Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038
CA No. Unit: N/A
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNGJAPI NO ENTITY [LEASE TYPE|WELL [|WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
See Attached List |
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Qil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JU0705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4, (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012

COMMENTS:

Disposal and Injections wells will be moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis 6/29/2012




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER'
Multiple Leases

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposgis.

7. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
7
OIL WELL GasWELL []  OTHER See Attached
Z. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana iy Houston srate VX 7 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [ oeeeen [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/] NoTICE OF INTENT

{Submit in Duplicate) M) auTER CASING [C] FracTURE TREAT [C] sipETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wit start:. | [ ]  CASING REPAIR [] wnewconsTRuCTION [C] veEMPORARILY ABANDON

[T] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE "] vueinG REPAIR
[J cHance TuBING [] PLuG AND ABANDON [7] ventorFLARE

[0 sussequent RepoRT ] crance weLL NaME [J pLuceack [[] warer DisposaL

(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] waTER sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comMmINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [_] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE /] orver: Change of
[ converT weLL TYPE [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JU0705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Falle Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME (pLasm. Gomez mme Principal Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE 6 : M oave  0/22/2012

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED (» /29/30IQ JUN 25 2012
Roahed

(moobivis‘-on of 0“’ Gas and Mining - (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Earlene-Russell, Engineering Techiiiclan: ...
Rachet Modirm




El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well [Well
Well Name ___ |Sec 'TWP RNG |API Number Entity Lease Type Type |Status Conf
DWR 3-17C6 747 030S [060W 4301350070 14204621118 |OW __ APD _ [C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S [060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD |C
YOUNG 3-15A3 15 |010S [030W 4301350122 FEE OW |APD [C
WHITING 4-1A2 01 |010S [020W |4301350424 Fee oW |APD [C |
EL PASO 4-34A4 34 010S [040W 4301350720 Fee OW APD [C
YOUNG 2-2B1 02 020S |010W (4304751180 FEE OW APD C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-10B4 10 |020S [040W 4301350712 |18221 [Fee OW [DRL C |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-26B4 26 |020S [040W 4301350714 |18432 [Fee OW |DRL € |
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 [020S |040W 4301350717 |18315 |Fee OW DRL C
Cook 4-14B3 - 14 [020S |030W 4301351162 |18449 |Fee OW [DRL [C
Peterson 4-22C6 22 |030S |060W 4301351163 18518 [Fee OW [DRL [C |
Lake Fork Ranch 4-14B4 14 020S [040W [4301351240 (99999 |Fee OW |DRL [C
Melesco 4-20C6 - 20 [030S |060W 4301351241 [99999 |Fee OW |DRL _C |
Peck 3-13B5 113 [020S |050W |4301351364 (99999 [Fee OW DRL [C |
Jensen 2-9C4 09 [030S [040W |4301351375 (99999 [Fee OW [DRL C |
El Paso 3-5C4 105 0305 [040W 4301351376 | 18563 |Fee OW DRL [C |
ULT 6-31 31 |030S |020E 4304740033 FEE oW LA ]
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 |010S |010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 |030S |060W 4301351433 [14-20-H62-4724 OW _ [NEW |C
Lake Fork Ranch 5-2384 23 [020S [040W 4301350739 Fee OW [NEW ]
Duchesne Land 4-10C5 10 |030S |050W [4301351262 Fee OW [NEW C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 |020S [030W 4301351374 _ |Fee oW INEW [C
Layton 4-2B3 - 02 |020S |030W 4301351389 Fee OW |NEW [C |
Golinski 4-24B5 ]24 |020S [050W [4301351404| Fee = [OW [NEW [C
Alba 1-21C4 21 |030S [040W 4301351460 Fee OW |NEW [C
Allison 4-19C5 19 |030S [050W 4301351466 Fee OW |NEW [C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 [020S [030W 4301351486 Fee OW |NEW C |
Allen 4-25B5 25 |020S |050W 4301351487 Fee OW NEW [C |
Hewett2-6C4 |06 |030S [040W 4301351489 Fee OW INEW [C |
Young 2-7C4 - 07 |030S [040W 4301351500 __ |Fee oW T INEW € ]
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 [010S |010E (4304752471 Fee oW INEw [C ]
Hamaker 3-25A1 |25 |010S [010W 4304752491 __ |Fee OW [NEW [C |
Boiton 3-29A1E B 29 [010S [010E |4304752871 Fee OW [NEW C
HORROCKS 5-20A1 ~ 120 |010S [010W [4301334280 |17378 FEE OW _OPS [C |
DWR 3-19C6 } 19 [030S [060W [4301334263 17440 |14-20-462-1120 OW [P
DWR 3-22C6 f‘* 22 |030S [060W |4301334106 |17298 |14-20-462-1131 [OW P ]
DWR 3-28C6 - 28 030S |060W 4301334264 | 17360 | 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 - - 07 |010S [020W 4301330025 5850 |14-20462-811 OW P ]
UTE 2-17C6 17 |030S [060W [4301331033 10115 |14-20-H62-1118 OW P
WLR TRIBAL 2-19C6 119 0305 |060W [4301331035 | 10250 |14-20-H62-1120 OW [P B
CEDARRIM 10-A-15C6 115 [030S |060W 4301330615 6420 |14-20-H62-1128[OW P | |
CEDAR RIM 12A ] 28 |030S |060W |4301331173 10672 [14-20-H62-1323 OW [P ]
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 B 33 [030S |060W [4301331123 |10365 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |P
TAYLOR3-34C6 ~ 134 030S [060W [4301350200 17572 1420H621329 |[OW [P -
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 134 |030S |060W 14301332634 | 14590 |14-20-H62-1329 |OW P T
UTE3-3522K 35 |010N |020W 4301331133 | 10483 |14-20-H62-1614 [OW P | |
UTE 1-3222 |32 |010N[020W 4301330379 1915 |14-20-H62-1702'OW P o
UTE TRIBAL 1-3322 B 133 010N 020W 4301330334 |1851 |14-20-H62-1703 OW [P ]
UTE 2-3322 - 133 010N |020W 4301331111 10451 |14-20-H62-1703/OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 2-3422 |34 [010N[020W (4301331167 10668 |14-20-H62-1704 OW [P j
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 [020S |040W |4301334262 17439 |14-20-H62-1743 OW [P ]
UTE 1-28B4 T 1287]020S|040W 4301330242 1796 |14-20-H62-1745OW P | |
UTE 1-34A4 3 /34 1010S [040W 4301330076 |1585 |14-20-H62-1774 OW [P i
UTE 1-36A4 ] |36 [010S [040W 4301330069 1580 |14-20-H62-1793[OW [P
UTE 1-1B4 - 101 |020S [040W |4301330129 |1700 |14-20-H62-1798 [OW [P ]
UTE 1-31A2 '31_1010S [020W [4301330401 1925 [14-20-H62-1801 OW P

1



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE 1-25A3 25 |010S [030W 4301330370 1920 |14-20-H62-1802 | OW [P

UTE 2-25A3 - |25 0105 |030W 4301331343 [11361 |14-20-H62-1802[OW [P
UTE1-26A3 ] 126 "|010S [030W [4301330348 |1890 |14-20-H62-1803[OW [P

UTE 2-26A3 26 |010S [030W (4301331340 |11349 [14-20-H62-1803 OW P ]
UTE TRIBAL 4-35A3 135 [010S |030W 4301350274 [18000 [1420H621804 OW P C |
[UTE 2-35A3 T |35 |010S|030W 4301331292 11222 |14-20-H62-1804 [OW [P |
UTE 3-35A3 _ 35 |010S [030W [4301331365 |11454 [1420-H62-1804 OW P |
UTE 1-6B2 o ~ 106 |020S [020W 4301330349 1895 |14-20-H62-1807 [OW [P

UTE 2-6B2 ~ 706 |020S [020W 4301331140 [11190 | 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-6B2 ) 06 |020S[020W |4301350273 | 18008 |14-20-H62-1807 OW P c
POWELL 4-19A1 - 19 |010S [010W 4301330071 8302 |14-20-H62-1847 [OW [P

COLTHARP 12721 i 27 010N |010W [4301330151 |4700 |14-20-H62-1933 |[OW P~ | |
UTE 1-8A1E T 08 |010S |010E 14304730173 [1846 |14-20-H62-2147 OW P T
UTE TRIBE 1-31 31 |010N |020W (4301330278 |4756 |14-20-H62-2421|[OW P T
UTE 1-28B6X i 28 |020S |060W |4301330510 |11165 |14-20-H62-2492 [OW P ]
RINKER 2-21B5 21 |020S |050W [4301334166 |17299 |14-20-H62-2508 OW [P | |
MURDOCK 2-34B5 |34 [020S [050W [4301331132 |10456 |14-20-H62-2511/OW P |
UTE 1-35B6 35 |020S [060W 4301330507 2335 |14-20-H622531 [OW P | |
'UTE TRIBAL 1-17A1E 17 |010S [010E |4304730829 (860 |14-20-H622658 OW P |
UTE 2-17A1E B 17 1010S [010E |4304737831 16709 |14-20-H622658 [OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-27AE 27 [010S |010E 4304730421800 |14-20-H62-2662 |OW P i
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E " I35 [010S|010E [4304730286 (795 |14-20-H62-2665OW P _
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E |15 |010S [010E [4304730820 850 |14-20-H622717 OW _ |P )
UTE TRIBALP-3B1E |03 |020S |010E |4304730190 4536 |14-20-H622873[OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-22A1E ) |22 ]010S [010E 4304730429810 |14-20-H62-3103/oW P |
B H UTE 1-35C6 I35 |030S|060W [4301330419 10705 [14-20-H62-3436 OW |P |
BH UTE 2-35C6 7|35 [030S [060W |4301332790 | 15802 | 14-20-H62-3436 [OW P |
MCFARLANE 14D6 ] " |04 |040S [060W [4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452[OW [P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 i 11 /040S [060W 4301330482 (6415 |14-20-H62-3454 OW P |
CARSON 2-36A1 36 |010S |010W 4304731407 737 |14-20-H62-3806 OW P )
UTE 2-14C6 7714 [030S [060W 4301330775 |9133 |14-20-H62-3809 [OW [P B
DWR 3-14C6 114 [030S |060W |4301334003 [17092 |14-20-H62-3808 OW P |
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 [010S |010W 4301330935 [9461 |14-20-H62-3855 OW P ]
BADGER-SAM H UMONGUS 1-15A1 (15 _|010S |010W 4301330949 [9462 |14-20-H62-3860 OW P | |
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE 14-1 14 [010S [030W 4301330726 |8437 |14-20-H62-3868 [OW P |
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 122 p10S [010W 4301330781 [0460 [14-20-H62-3880 .OW P |
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 30 |010N |010W [4301330813[9405 |14-20-H62-3910 OW P =
UTELB1-13A3 13 |010S [030W [4301330894 9402 |14-20-H62-3980([OW P 1
UTE 2-22B6 B |22 [020S '060W 4301331444 11641 [14-20-H62-4614 OW P ]
UINTAOURAY 1-1A3 o1 [010S 030W 4301330132 5540 |14-20-H62-4664 OW P |
UTE 1-6D6 ] 06 |040S |060W [4301331696 |12058 |14-20-H62-4752 |OW  |P

UTE 2-11D6 111 |040S |060W (4301350179 |17667 |1420H624801 |OW P T
UTE 1-15D6 ) o 15 [040S |060W 4301330429 | 10958 [14-20-H62-4824 OW P | |
UTE 2-15D6 15 |040S [060W 4301334026 (17193 |14-20-H624824 OW P o
HILL 3-24C6 " |24 |030S |060W 4301350293 [18020 | 1420H624866 | OW  |P C
BARCLAY UTE 2-24C6R "~ 724 |030S |060W |4301333730 | 16385 [14-20-H62-4866 [ OW P o
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 "oz ]020S |040W |4301330062 |1570 |FEE ow P T ]
BOREN 1-24A2 |24 010S|020W [4301330084 |5740 |[FEE ow p I
FARNSWORTH1-1385 13 1020S [050W 4301330092 [1610 |FEE ow P I ]
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 121 |020S |060W 4301330100 1595 |FEE ow P ]
ASAY E J 1-20A1 20 [010S |010W 4301330102 [8304 |FEE ow P
HANSON TRUST 1-6B3 05 |020S [030W [4301330109 (16356 |[FEE ow P |
ELLSWORTH 1-8B4 B 08 |020S [040W 4301330112 16556 |FEE ow P |~
ELLSWORTH1-9B4 ~ ""109 [020S |040W 4301330118 1660 |FEE ow P
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 ) 17 |[020S [040W [4301330126 1695 |FEE ow P | ]
CHANDLER 1-5B4 ~ o5 [020S [040W [4301330140 |1685 FEE ow P
[HANSON 1-32A3 32 [010S[030W 4301330141 |1640 |FEE oW P i
JESSEN 1-17A4 117 [070S [040W (4301330173 |4725 |FEE ow P

2



El Paso E3 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

JENKINS 1-1B3

01 [020S [030W [4301330175[1790 |FEE ow P
GOODRICH1-2B3 |02 |020S |030W |4301330182 |1765 FEE ow [P ]
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 19 |020S [040W 4301330183 |1760 |[FEE ow [P )
DOYLE 1-10B3 10 [020S |030W [4301330187 (1810 [FEE |OW P B
JOS.SMITH1-17C5 |17 _|030S [050W |4301330188 |5510 |[FEE ow p |
RUDY 1-11B3 o 11 [020S [030W 4301330204 |1820 |FEE oW P
CROOK 1-6B4 - 06 |020S |040W (4301330213 1825 |FEE ow P B
HUNT 1-21B4 ) 121 |020S |040W (4301330214 [1840 |FEE ow P
LAWRENCE 1-30B4 30 [020S |040W 4301330220 (1845 |[FEE ow [P B
YOUNG 1-29B4 |29 ]020S |040W 4301330246 1791 FEE =~ OW P
GRIFFITHS 1-33B4 133 1020S |040W [4301330288(4760 [FEE ~ OW P ﬂ
POTTER 1-2B5 02 [020S |050W [4301330293 (1826 |FEE oW P B
BROTHERSON 1-26B4 |26 [020S [040W [4301330336/1856 [FEE oW P | |
SADIE BLANK 1-33Z1 33 |010N |010W 4301330355(765 [FEE ~ OW P ]
[POTTER 1-24B5 24 |020S |050W 4301330356 |1730 |FEE oW P
WHITEHEAD 1-22A3 o 22 |010S |030W |4301330357 1885 FEE ow [P
CHASEL MILLER 2-1A2 101 ]010S |020W [4301330360/5830 FEE =~ OW P B
ELDER 1-13B2 113 |020S |020W 4301330366 (1905 FEE ~~ OW P B
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 |10 |020S [040W [4301330443 |1615 |[FEE ow |p B
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 |020S |040W [4301330470(1935 [FEE oW P B
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MORRIS2-7A3 07 [010S [030W (4301330977 9725 [FEE  |OW PA |
POWELL2-08A3 o8 [010S|030W 4301330979 10175 FEE  |OW |PA |
[FISHER 2-6A3 7 oe 0105 [030W [4301330984 [10110 [FEE ow A ||
JACOBSEN2-12A4 " ""42 [010S 040W 4301330985 10480 [FEE  IOW [PA | |
CHENEY 2-33A2 33 |010S |020W 4301331042 10313 [FEE ow [PA
HANSON TRUST 2-20A3 29 [010S|030W [4301331043/5306 [FEE |OW _ PA |
BURTON 2-15B5 15 |020S |050W |4301331044 [10205 [FEE oW [PA
EVANS-UTE 2-17B3 17 |020S |030W [4301331056 (10210 FEE __ |OW _ IPA ]
ELLSWORTH 2-20B4 20 020S [040W 4301331090(5336 FEE _ |OW  PA -
REMINGTON 2-34A3 7 134 |010S [030W |4301331091 1902 [FEE __[OW PA |
WINKLER 2-28A3 |28 |010S|030W |4301331108 [4519 |FEE ow PA | ]
TEW 2-10B5 10 0205 |050W |4301331125 1751 FEE _ |OW _ |PA )
LINDSAY 2-33A4 _ ,A, 33 |010S [040W [43013311411756 [FEE _OW |PA_ | ]
FIELDSTED 228A4 28 (0105 [040W [4301331293 (10665 FEE  |[OW |PA | |
POWELL 4-13A2_ 13 [010S [020W |4301331336 | 11177 |FEE GW PA |
DUMP 2-20A3 S 20 [010S [030W [4301331505 | 11691 |FEE oW  [PA
[SMITH 2X-23C7 __ 23 |030S |070W |4301331634 12382)FEE D  PA | |
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 |010S |020W 14301331872 11928 [FEE ow PA |
TODDUSAST12B1 02 |020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE ~~  |OW  [PA

STATE 1-7B1E o7 |020S|010E |4304730180|5566 [FEE _ |ow [PA |
BACON 1-10B1E 10 |020S [010E 14304730881 5550 [FEE  |OW PA | |
PARIETTE DRAW 2844 28 [040S [010E 14304731408 (4537 FEE ow  PA |
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 |020S 010E 4304731840 4960 |FEE ow ~PA | |
STATE 2-35A2 ] 135 010S |020W 4301330156 4715 |ML-22874 _ |OW _ @@M N
UTAH STATE L B 1-11B1 |11 [020S |010W 4304730715530 |ML23655  |OW  [PA B
STATE 1-8A3 |08 0105 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316  [OW  PA
UTAHFEDERAL 12481 124 |020S [010W 4304730220 590 |ML26079  [OW  PA |
CEDAR RIM 15 '34_|030S [0B0W 14301330383 |6395 [14-20-462-1329 [OW 'S

7



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL 2-24C7 — |24 [030S [070W [4301331028 | 10240 |14-20-H62-1135 OW __|S 7
CEDARRIM 12 28 |030S [060W 4301330344 6370 |14-20-H62-1323 [OW  [S
CEDAR RIM 16 " |33 |030S [060W [4301330363 6390 | 14-20-H62-1328 OW  |S

SPRING HOLLOW 2-3473 34 |010N |030W 4301330234 5255 |14-20-H62-1480 OW | )
EVANS UTE 1-17B3 17 |020S |[030W [4301330274 5335 |14-20-H62-1733[OW S | |
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4G_ o1 |020S [040W [4301331197 | 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW  |S
UTE 3-1283 ) 12 [020S [030W |4301331379 |11490 |14-20-H62-1810 [OW  [S ,
UTETRIBAL94B1 |04 |020S [010W (4301330194 5715 [14-20-H62-1969/OW S | |
UTETRIBAL221B6 |21 [020S [060W 4301331424 11615 |14-20-H62-2489 |OW  |S )
UTE 1-33B6 ) ] "33 |020S [060W [4301330441 1230 |14-20-H62-2493 |OW IS

UTE22285 22 1020S [050W [4301331122 (10453 [14-20-H62-2509 OW S | |
UTE 1-18B1E 118 ]020S |010E |4304730969 [9135 |14-20-H62-2864 OW _ |S ]
LAUREN UTE 123A3 |23 ]010S [030W 4301330895 [9403 |14-20-H62-3981 OW (S _

UTE 2-28B6 T |28 [020S [060W [4301331434 [11624 |14-20-H62-4622 [OW | o
UTE127B6X |27 1020S |060W 4301330517 [11166 |14-20-H62-4631 [OW 'S )
UTE 22786 | 127 [020S |060W 4301331449 11660 |14-20-H62-4631 OW S o
CEDAR RIM 10-15C6 - 15 |030S |060W 4301330328 6365 |14-20-H62-4724 OW  |S |
UTE 5-30A2 ~ |30 |010S 020W 4301330169 [5910 [14-20-H62-4863 [OW  |S B
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) , 24 |030S |060W |4301330298 [4533 |14-20-H624866 OW | | |
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 1307 ]030S |050W |4301330475 |665 | 14-20-H62-4876 [OW  |S

SMB 1-10A2 - 10 |010S |020W |4301330012 |5865 |FEE ow s | ]
KENDALL 1-12A2 - 12 |010S[020W [43013300135875 FEE ___ |OW S T
CEDARRIM 2 B 20 |030S |060W [4301330019 6315 |FEE ow | o
URRUTY29A2 ~ 109 [010S [020W |4301330046 [6856 |FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 1-14B4 14 |020S |040W |4301330051 [1535 |FEE ow s 7
RUST 14B3 ] 04 |020S |030W 4301330063 [1575 [FEE ow [s | ]
MONSEN 1-21A3 21 010S |030W [4301330082 [1590 |FEE oW s 1
BROTHERSON 1-10B4 ) 10 |020S [040W 4301330110 1614 (FEE oW |8 T
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 |020S [050W [4301330124 (1645 |FEE oW [s ]
ELLSWORTH 1-16B4 "~ 116 020S [040W [4301330192[1735 [FEE ____ |[OW S

MARSHALL 1-20A3 20 |010S |030W |4301330193 9340 |FEE ow s )
[CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 317 [020S [040W |4301330198 [4745 |FEE ~low s
ROPER 1-14B3 ) 114 |020S[030W 4301330217 (1850 |FEE ow [s | ]
BROTHERSON 1-24B4 - 24 |020S |040W |4301330229 |1865 |[FEE oW S i
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 33 [010S[040W [4301330272([1680 [FEE __ |OW |S
BROTHERSON 1-2384 123 |020S |040W 4301330483 (8423 |FEE ow s~ | ]
SMITH ALBERT 2-8C5 08 |030S [050W [4301330543 |5495 |FEE ow s T
VODA JOSEPHINE 2-19C5 19 |030S |050W (4301330553 (5650 |FEE ~jow [s }
HANSEN 1-16B3 16 [020S |030W 4301330617 |9124 |FEE ow s
BROTHERSON 1-25B4 ) 25 |020S [040W 4301330668 9126 |FEE ow "is ]
POWELL2-33A3 - 33 |010S [030W [4301330704 [2400 |FEE ow s | ]
BROWN2-28B5 28 |020S [050W [4301330718 9131 |[FEE OW s ]
EULA-UTE 1-16A1 7716 |o10s1010W [4301330782[8443 FEE __|OW S )
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 |010S [040W |4301330817 [9345 |FEE oW s B
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 22 |010N [010W [4301330884 [936 |FEE ow s |
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 7127 |010S]040W [4301330915(9632 FEE  |OW S )
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 B |23 [020S |050W |4301330917 [9600 |FEE ow [ )
TIMOTHY 3-18A3 18 |010S [030W 4301330940 (9633 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-3B4 103 [020S |040W 4301331008 (10165 [FEE ow s |
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 |020S [040W 4301331086(1782 FEE ___OW 8 |
MILES 2-35A4 135 |010S |040W |4301331087 |1966 |FEE ow 1§ T ]
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 ] |17 020S |040W 4301331089 [1696 |FEE ow s T
RUST 2-36A4 |36 |010S |040W 4301331092[1577 [FEE ____ ow s |
EVANS 2-19B3 19 10205 [030W 4301331113 1777 |FEE ow s N
FARNSWORTH 2-1285 " 112 [020S [050W 4301331115 [1646 |FEE oW [S N
CHRISTENSEN34B4 04 |020S|040W 4301331142 10481 FEE  |OW S
ROBERTSON 229A2 29 1010S [020W [4301331150 | 10679 |FEE low s |
[CEDAR RIM 2A 20 [030S [060W 14301331172 110671 |FEE oW s

8



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31_[010S |030W |4301331243 [ 11026 |FEE SEE —
GOODRICH2-2B3 ] 02 |020S |030W 4301331246 | 11037 |FEE ow s )
JESSEN 2-21A4 21 |010S |040W |4301331256 | 11061 |FEE ~ low s
BROTHERSON 3-23B4 23 |020S [040W |4301331289 [11141 [FEE ow s

MYRIN RANCH 2-18B3 18 |020S |030W |4301331297 [11475 |FEE T low s
BROTHERSON 2-2B5 02 |020S [050W (4301331302 [11342 [FEE ow S ]
DASTRUP 2-30A3 30 |010S [030W (4301331320 [11253 |FEE ow s

YOUNG 2-30B4 30 |020S [040W 4301331366 | 11453 |FEE ow s

IORG 2-10B3 10 |020S |030W [4301331388 [11482 [FEE oW |s

MONSEN 3-27A3 27 |010S [030W 4301331401 |11686 |FEE low s
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 05 |020S [010E 4304732409 11481 FEE T Tlow I8

LARSEN 1-25A1 25 |010S [010W |4304730552 815 | FEE ow [TA

DRY GULCH 1-36A1 36 010S |010W 4304730569 820 FEE ow__ [TA




Sundry Nunmber: 27111 APl Well Nunber: 43013301020000

STATE OF UTAH

FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
ASAY E J 1-20A1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
43013301020000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1650 FSL 1650 FEL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 20 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus ¥ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE ¥’ RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: ¥ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION O orver OTHER: I |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: July 12, 2012

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 6/26/2012

RECEI VED: Jun. 26, 2012




Sundry Nunmber: 27111 APl Well Nunber: 43013301020000

Asay 1-20 Al Procedure Summary

e POOH w/Rods & pump, Release anchor, POOH w/tubing string
e Circulate & Clean wellbore

e RIH with 5-1/2”CIBP, set plug at ~10,240’, dump bail 10’ cement on top
e Perforate new LGR interval from ~10,200’ — 10,045’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 5-1/2” CBP and set plug at ~10,040’".

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~10,030’ — 9,975’

e Acidize perforations with 12,500 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 5-1/2” CBP and set plug at ~9,950’.

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~9,930’ — 9,800’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 5-1/2” CBP and set plug at ~9,785’.

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~9,770’ — 9,560’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e Drill out CBPs at 9,785, 9,950’ and 10,040’

e RIH w/tubing, pump & rods

e C(Clean location and resume production

RECEI VED: Jun. 26, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 27727 APl Well Nunber: 43013301020000

STATE OF UTAH

FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
ASAY E J 1-20A1

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
43013301020000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1650 FSL 1650 FEL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 20 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
¥ acoize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus ¥ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance [ pLuc anp AsanDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE ¥’ RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: ¥ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION ¥ omher OTHER: ISet Plug |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure for details.

Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: July 12, 2012

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 7/12/2012

RECEI VED: Jul . 12, 2012




Sundry Nunber: 27727 APl Well Nunber: 43013301020000

Asay 1-20 Al Procedure Summary

e POOH w/Rods & pump, Release anchor, POOH w/tubing string
e Circulate & Clean wellbore

e RIH with 5-1/2”CIBP, set plug at ~10,240’, dump bail 10’ cement on top
e Perforate new LGR interval from ~10,200’ — 10,045’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 5-1/2” CBP and set plug at ~10,040’".

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~10,030’ — 9,975’

e Acidize perforations with 12,500 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 5-1/2” CBP and set plug at ~9,950’.

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~9,930’ — 9,800’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e RIH with 5-1/2” CBP and set plug at ~9,785’.

e Perforate new LGR interval from ~9,770’ — 9,560’

e Acidize perforations with 15,000 gals of 15% HCL

e Drill out CBPs at 9,785, 9,950’ and 10,040’

e RIH w/tubing, pump & rods

e C(Clean location and resume production

RECEI VED: Jul . 12, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 30993 API Well Nunber: 43013301020000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well ASAY E J 1-20A1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013301020000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1650 FSL 1650 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 20 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
v‘( ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS v" COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v‘( SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE / RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
v‘( REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

July 9, 2012 - Set CIBP @ 10,220' and dump 10' cement on top. Add Accepted by the

perfs (10,128' - 10,047")w/3-1/8" HSC gun, 3 spf, 120 degree phase. Utah Division of
July 10, 2012 - Acidize same perfs with 14,952 gals of 15% HCL acid. Qil, Gas and Mining

July 12, 2012 - Set CIBP @ 10,040' (no cmt). Add perfs (10,028" - FOR RECORD ONLY
9977') w/3-1/8" HSC gun, 3 spf, 120 degree phase. July 13, 2012 - October 16, 2012

Acidize same perfs with 15,000 gals 15% HCL acid. July 16, 2012 - Set
CIBP @ 9950' (no cmt). Add perfs (9936' - 9800') w/3-1/8" HSC gun, 3
spf, 120 degree phase. July 17, 2012 - Acidize same perfs with 15,000
gals 15% HCL acid. July 18, 2012 - Set CIBP @ 9780' (no cmt) and add
perfs (9770' - 9568'") with 3-1/8" HSC gun, 3 spf, 120 degree phase. July 19, 2012 - Acidize same
perfs with 15,000 gals 15% HCL acid. July 21, 2012 - Drill out all plugs and clean out. July 10, 2012 -
Install 2-7/8" production tubing. Return well to production.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Linda Renken 713 997-5138 Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/11/2012

RECEI VED: Cct. 11, 2012




Sundry Nunber: 30993 API Wl | Nunber: 43013301020000

WESTERN

ORG HIERARCHY

E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEI VED: Cct. 11, 2012



Sundry Nunber: 30993 API Well Nunber: 43013301020000
WESTERN
1 General
1.1 Customer Information
Company WESTERN
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
Project ORG HIERARCHY Site E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
Rig Name/No. NABORS DRILLING/0561 Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start Date 7/3/2012 End Date 7/25/2012
Spud Date 3/19/1972 uwi 020-001-S 001-W 30
Active Datum KB @5,405.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 159391/46315 / ASAY E J 1-20A1
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7/4/2012 11:00 13:00 2.00 MIRU 01 P MOL SLIDE UNIT, RIG UP
13:00 15:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PUMP 60 BBLS DOWN CASING, WORK PUMP OFF SEAT FLUSH
W/ 65 BBLS, RESEAT AND TEST TO 1000 PSIG GOOD TEST.
15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D P-ROD AND SUBS, L/D 15 1", COOH W/ 120 1", L/D 35 7/8",
COOH W/ 134, L/D 54 3/4" SWIFN CSDFN CT.
7/5/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY
7/6/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( TALKED ABOUT WHERE THE BEST HAND
PLACEMENT WAS WHILE N/U BOPS )
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH 89 3/4 RODS L/D PUMP
8:30 12:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 16 P C/O TO TBG EQ., PU ON TBG, RIG BEGIN TO SINK, REBUILD
BASE BEAM, PU TO 130K WAIT ON DEAD LINE INDICATOR,
ORDER SURFACE JARS.
12:30 14:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P R/U DEAD LINE INDICATOR, RELEASE TAC NU BOPE, RU WORK
FLOOR & TBG EQUIPMENT. RU PRS SCANNERS.
14:30 20:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/353 JTS OF 2 7/8 TBG L/D 48 JTS OF TBG,144 JTS
BLUE,161 JTS YELLOW R/D PRS,SCANNERS. SWIFN CSDFN CT.
7/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( SCANNING TBG )
7:30 8:30 1.00 POOH SCANNING 25 JTS OF 2
3/8,11RED,10BLUE,4YELLOW,R/D SCANNERS
8:30 9:30 1.00 R/U WIRE LINE TRUCK TO SET A 7 5/8 COMPOSET PLUG @
10,520'".
9:30 12:30 3.00 FILL TBG WITH 480 BBLS OF WATER,PRESER TEST CSG TO
1000 PSI CSG HELD GOOD
12:30 15:30 3.00 GR,CCL,CBL LOG FROM 10,250 TO 1,500 E-MAIL TO HOUSTAN
15:30 21:00 5.50 RUN 56 ARM 3-D CALIPER LOG WITH PIPE WALL INTEGRITY
TOOL LOG FROM 10,200' TO SURFACE. E-MAIL TO HOUSTAN.
7/8/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY SDFWE
7/9/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
7/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( WIRELINE OPERATIONS )
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 26 P RIH W/ CMT DUMP BAILER TAG @ 500' C/NOT WORK THROUGH
PARAFFIN PLUG. POOH W/ DUMP BAILER.
8:30 11:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 60 JTS 2-7/8" CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN, POOH W/ 60

JTS. RU WIRE LINE.

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm
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Sundry Nunber :

30993 AP

Vel |

Nunber :

43013301020000

WESTERN

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date

Time
Start-End

Duratio
n
(hr)

Phase

Activit
y

Sub

OP
Code

MD From
(ft)

Operation

7/11/2012

7/12/2012

7/13/2012

7/14/2012

11:30 15:30

15:30 19:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 9:30

9:30 17:00

17:00 19:00

19:00 6:00

6:00 7:30
7:30 12:00

12:00 18:30

6:00 7:30
7:30 8:30

8:30 12:00

12:00 17:00

6:00 7:30
7:30 11:00

4.00

4.00

1.50

2.00

7.50

2.00

11.00

1.50
4.50

6.50

1.50
1.00

3.50

5.00

1.50
3.50

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

26

39

28

39

35

18

19

RIH W/ DUMP BAILER DUMP BAIL 10' CMT ON TOP OF CBP @
10,220'. RIH W/ 3-1/8" HSC LOADED 3 JSPF,120 deg PHASING,
W/ 22.7 GM CHARGES, PERFORATE 10128' TO 10047' W/ 1000
PSIG SURFACE PRESSURE, NO CHANGES RDMOL TO PIONEER
WIRE LINE UNIT.

PUMU & RIH W/ 7-5/8" PKR, X/O TO 3-1/2" TBG, 159 JTS 3-1/2"
TBG, EOT @ 5300'. SWIFN CSDFN CT.

CREW TRAVEL & JSA SAFETY MEETING (Body Placement and
Position for Tasks )

START RIG, BLEED WELL DOWN, PUMP 60 BBLS DOWN TBG,
GET READY TO P/U 3 1/2" TBG, P/U & TALLY 157 -JTS 3 1/2"
TBG, 6'- 3 1/2" TBG SUB W/ FRAC VALVE, SET PKR @ 10027
W/ 30,000 LBS COMP., PRES TEST CSG 500 LBS, OK.

R/U PLATIMUM PRESSURE PUMPING, PRES TEST LINES 7000%#,
HELD, HOLD 800# ON CSG, GET INJECTION RATE 5241#, 3.9
BPM, PUMP 178 BBLS ACID @ 5657#, 11.7 BPM, DROP 100 - BIO
BALLS, PUMP 178 BBLS ACID @ 5685#, 11.7 BPM, PUMP 140
BBLS FLUSH @ 6002# @ 11.7 BPM, ISIP - 4175#, 5 - MIN -

4135#, 10 - MIN - 4114#, 15 - MIN - 4107#

R/D PUMP LINES, RIG UP FLOW BACK LINE, TURN OVER TO
FLOW BACK CREW, ATTEMPT TO BLEED DOWN CASING W/NOT
BLEED DOWN.

TSIP @ 3900 PSIG OPEN ON 12/64 CHOKE

OPEN ON 12/64 FLOW BACK 183 WTR

CT TGSM & JSA ( Lifting/Body Mechanics )

START RIG, SITP - 0, SICP - 0, RELEASE 7 5/8" PKR @ 10,027',
CIRC. DOWN CSG W/ 156 BBLS 2% KCL, FLUSH TBG W/ 60
BBLS HOT, CHACE W/ 30 BBLS, DROP 2 7/8" BALL PUMPTO
BTM W/ 87 BBLS, PRES TEST 4000#, HELD, REVERSE PUMP
BALL TO SURF W/ 87 BBLS, L/D FRAC VALVE & 6' 3 1/2" TBG
SuUB

L/D 3-JTS 3 1/2" TBG, STAND BACK 248 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG IN
DERRICK, L/D 65 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, X -OVER, & 7 5/8" H -D PKR (
ELEMENTS WASHED ), CLEAN EQUIPMENT, RIH W/ 61 - JTS 3
1/2" TBG, EOT @ 1940', SWIFN, R/U TO CIRC IN A.M., SDFD.

CT TGSM & JSA ( PERFORATING )

START RIG, WELL WAS CIRC., W/ 100 BBLS HOT 2% KCL,
POOH W/ 61 JTS 3 1/2" TBG

R/U PIONEER WIRELINE SERVICE, RIH W/ 7 5/8" CBP & SET IT @
10,040', PRES TEST CSG 1000#,HELD, RIH & PERF 10028' TO
9977' RDMOL W/ PIONEER

P/U & RIHW/ 7 5/8" H -D PKR, 2 7/8" SEAT NIPPLE, X -OVER, 65 -
JTS 3 1/2" TBG, RIH W/ 248 - JTS OUT OF DERRICK,SET PKR @
9931' W/ 30,000# COMPRESSION, PRES TEST CSGG & PKR
1000#, HELD, SDFD

CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMPING ACID )

RU PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT

TSIP @ 2256 PSIG

ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE & BREAK DOWN STAGE 2 PERFS
@ 5 BPM @ 5800 PSIG. PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 50
BIO-BALLS PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL FLUSH 20 OVER BTM
PERF AVE RATE 11.2 BPM, MAX RATE 12 BPM, AVE PRESSURE
5816 PSIG @ 5400, MAX 6031 PSIG, FLUSH 20 OVER BTM
PERF. ISDP @ 4182 PSIG, 5 MIN 4147 10 MIN 4141 15 MIN 4127

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm
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Sundry Nunber: 30993 API Well Nunber: 43013301020000
WESTERN
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
11:00  6:00 19.00 RIG DOWN PLATINUM, RU FLOW BACK LINES
OPEN @ 1200 @ 4200 PSIG
FLOW BACK 393 BBLS WATER
CURRENTLY FLOWING OIL & GAS 5 BPH RATE W/ CHOKE
FULLY OPEN AND 50 PSIG
7/15/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( HOUSE CLEANING, PU WORK AREA
BETWEEN JOB STEPS )
730 11:00 3.50 START RIG, WELL FLOWING @ 50 LBS, SWI RELEASE PKR @
9,931' CIRC OUT OIL & GAS W/ 2% KCL, PUMP 85 BBLS DOWN
TBG, L/D FRAC VALVE & 6' 3 1/2" TBG SUB
11:00  13:00 2.00 L/D 6 JTS POOH W/ 120 JTS TUBING TONGS BROKE DOWN.
13:00  15:00 2.00 REPAIR TONGS
15:00  18:30 3.50 COOH W/ 96 JTS TONGS BROKE DOWN, PU NEW TONGS,
CSDFWE EOT @ 2895'
7/116/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDWE
717/2012 600  7:30 150  PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (L/D 3-1/2")
7:30  9:00 150  PRDHEQ 06 P CIRC WELL CLEAN CIRC 210 BBLS BRINE, TO KILL WELL
9:00  10:30 150  PRDHEQ = 39 P POOH W/ 90 JTS 3 1/2" TBG, L/D 1 - JT 3 1/2" TBG & 7 5/8" PKR
10:30  15:00 4.50 STGO3 21 P RIG UP, PIONEER WIRELINE SERVICE, RIH W/ 7 5/8" CBP SET IT
@ 9,950', PRES TEST CSG 1000 LBS, MAKE 2 CONS 3-1/8"
GUNS LOADED 22.7 GM CHARGES W/ 120 deg PHASING.
PREFORATE 9936' TO 9800' HOLDING 500 PSIG NO PRESSURE
CHANGES.RDMO W/ WIRELINE UNIT.
15:00  19:30 450 | PRDHEQ & 39 P P/U 7 5/8" H -D PKR, X -OVER, 1 JT 3 1/2" TBG, RIH W/ 28 - JTS
31/2" TBG, PUMP BRINE DOWN TBG, INSTALL WASHINTON
HEAD RUBBER, RIH W/ 278 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, P/U 6 - 3 1/2" TBG
SUB & FRAC VALVE, SET 7 5/8" PKR @ 9741', W/ 30,000 LBS
COMPRESSION, PRES TEST CSG 1000 LBS, HELD, SDFD
7/18/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 STGO3 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( Overhead Hazards )
730 9:30 2.00 STGO3 18 P RIG UP PLATINUM PRESSURE PUMPING SERVICE, HAVE
SAFETY MEETING, PRES TEST LINES 7,000 LBS, GET READY TO
PUMP.
9:30  13:00 3.50 STGO3 35 P EST. INJECTION RATE, 5 BPM @ 5362 LBS, PUMP 7500 GAL
15% HCL @ 10 BPM @ 6021 LBS, DROP 100 BIO BALLS, PUMP
7500 GAL 15% HCL @ 11.5 BPM @ 5855 LBS, FLUSH 20 OVER
BOTTEM PERF @ 11.5 BPM @ 6130 LBS, ISIP - 4225 LBS, 5 MIN
- 4138 LBS, 10 MIN - 4108 LBS, 15 MIN - 4083 LBS, SITP @ 4080
LBS, R/D PLATINUM, R/U FLOW BACK LINES, LEAVE WELL
SHUT IN FOR 2 - HOURS
13:00  6:00 17.00 | STGO3 19 P OPEN WELL UP, ON A 13/64" CHOKE, 4050 LBS
FLOW BACK 282 BBLS
CURRENTLY FLOWING @ 50 PSIG ON 46 CHOKE
7119/2012 600  7:30 150  PRDHEQ 28 P TGSM & JSA ( HAND PLACEMENT )
7:30  9:30 200 PRDHEQ 06 P TSIP @ 50 PSIG, CSIP @ 0 PSIG, START RIG, 0 LBS ON CSG &
TBG, RELEASE 7 5/8" PKR @ 9741', CIRC CLEAN W/ 2%,WELL,
PUMP 55 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG.
9:30  14:00 450 | PRDHEQ | 39 P L/D FRAC VALVE & 6'3 1/2" TBG SUB, L/D 6 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG,
POOH W/ 301 JTS 3 1/2" TBG, X -OVER & 7 5/8" H -D PKR
14:00  17:30 3.50 STGO4 21 P R/U PIONEER WIRELINE SERVICE, RIH & SET 7 5/8" CBP @
9,780', PRES TEST 1000 LBS, HELD, RIH & 3-1/8" HSC GUNS
LOADED 3 JSFP W/ 22.7 GM CHARGES W/ 120 deg PHASING
AND PERFORATE 9770’ TO 9568', R/D WIRELINE, GET READY
TO RIH W/ PKR
17:30  19:00 150  PRDHEQ = 39 P RIH W/ 7 5/8" H -D PKR, X -OVER, 101 JTS 3 1/2" TBG, EOT @
3,215', SWIFD, CSDFD
7/20/2012  6:00  7:30 150  PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (RIH W/ 3-1/2 TBG )

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm
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Sundry Nunber: 30993 API Well Nunber: 43013301020000
WESTERN
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P 50 LBS, SICP - 50 LBS, BLEED WELL DOWN, PUMP 30 BBLS
BRINE DOWN CSG
8:00 9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P RIH W/ 200 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, SET 7 5/8" H -D PKR @ 9550' W/
45,000 LBS COMPRESSION, PRES TEST PKR 1000 LBS,HELD.
9:30 12:30 3.00 STG04 42 P WAIT ON PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT
12:30  16:30 4.00 STG04 35 P R/U PLATINUM PRESSURE PUMPING, HAVE SAFETY MEETING,
PRES TEST LINES 7500 LBS, EST. INJECTION RATE 6.4 BPM @
5310 LBS, PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, 11.5 BPM @ 5,865 LBS,
DROP 80 BIO-BALLS PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL @ 13 BPM @
6,080 LBS, PUMP 235 BBLS 2 % KCL 12.5 BPM @ 6215 LBS,
ISIP @ 4225 LBS, 5 - MIN 3,914 LBS, 10 MIN 3,876 LBS, 15 MIN
3,868 LBS, SHUT IN PRES @ 3,861 LBS
16:30  18:00 1.50 STG04 18 P RDMOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT, RU FLOWBACK LINES.
LET ACID SIT.
18:00 6:00 12.00 STG04 19 P OPEN UP AT 3650 PSIG AT 18:00 HOURS ON 12/64 CHOKE
FLOW BACK 99 BBLS, CURRENTLY 0 PSIG
7/21/2012 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ = 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( HAND PLACEMENT L/D TBG )
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ = 06 P SITP & SICP 0 LBS, RELEASE 7 5/8" H -D PKR @ 9550, CIRC
WELL W/ 385 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN CSG, PUMP 50 BBLS BRINE
DOWN TBG.
9:30 16:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D 301 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, X -OVER, & 7 5/8" H -D PKR, CLEAN
UP EQUIPMENT, X -OVER FOR 2 7/8" TBG, CHANGE PIPE RAMS,
SLIP DIES, TONG HEADS, & ELEVATORS
16:30  18:30 200  PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 6 3/4" BIT, & BIT SUB, TALLY & RIH W/ 122 - JTS 2 7/8" TBG,
EOT@ 3825', SDFD
7122/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( Working at Heights/Fall Protection )
7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ = 39 P SITP - 1500 LBS, SICP - 1500 LBS, BLEED WELL DOWN PUMP 15
BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, TALLY & RIH W/ 180 JTS 2 7/8" TBG,
TALLY & P/U 3 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, R/D TONGS, R/U POWER
SWIVEL.
11:00  18:00 7.00 PRDHEQ 18 P P/U 6 - JTS, TAG @ 9780', BRAKE CIRC, START DRILLING ON
PLUG, DRILL UP PLUG #1, SWIVEL DOWN 5 JTS TAG PLUG @
9950', DRILL UP PLUG #2, SWIVEL DOWN 3 JTS TAG PLUG @
10040', DRILL UP PLUG #3, EOT @ 10060', CIRC CLEAN FOR 45
MIN, PUMP 10 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, RIG DOWN POWER
SWIVEL & SET IT BACK, POOH W/ 16 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, EOT @
9,550" SDFD.
7/23/2012 | 6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
7/24/2012 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ = 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POWER SWIVEL OPERATIONS )
7:30 11:00 3.50 PRDHEQ = 06 P TSIP & CSIP @ 1650# PSIG. RIH W/ TBG TO 10,490' TM PU PWR
SWIVEL DRILL UP PLUG REMAINS. CIRCULATE CLEAN. RD PWR
SWVL.
11:00  14:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D 19 JTS 2-7/8", COOH W/ 306 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG.
14:00  18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P PUMU & RIH W/ 2-7/8" SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS, 4-1/2" PBGA SHELL,
2' PUP, +45 PSN, 2' PUP JT, 4 JTS, 7-5/8" TAC, 300 JTS 2-7/8"
8RD EUE TBG. SET TAC. RD WORK FLOOR & TBG EQUIPMENT.
18:00  19:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P ND BOPE, LAND TBG W/ 25K TENSION. NU B FLANGE. SWIFN
CSDFN CT.
7/25/2012 | 6:00 7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( RIH W/ RODS )
7:30 11:00 3.50 START RIG, SITP 1850 LBS, SICP 1850 LBS, BLEED WELL

DOWN, CLEAN UP EQUIPMENT & WORK AREA, FLUSH

TBG W/ 60 BBLS, PUMP 50 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, X -OVER
FOR RODS, RACK OUT BOP'S, GET READY TO RUN RODS,
RACK OUT PUMP & LINES

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm
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Sundry Nunber: 30993 API Well Nunber: 43013301020000

WESTERN
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase Activit | Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
11:00 16:30 5.50 P/U & RIH W/ 2 1/2" X 1 3/4" X 36' WTRF PUMP W/ DIP TUBE, 10 -

11/2" K-BARS, RIH W/ 143 - 3/4", 107 - 7/8", & - 1" RODS,
SPACE OUT PUMP, P/U POLISH ROD, FILL TBG W/ 3 - BBLS,
PRES TEST 1000 LBS, HELD, STROKE TEST PUMP, OK, RIG
DOWN GET READY TO ROAD RIG, SLIDE ROTA - FLEXIN
PLACE, HANG WELL ON, PUT WELL ON PRODUCTION

16:30 19:30 3.00 ROAD RIG FROM THE 1 -20 A1 TO THE 3 -22 B4, SPOT RIG,
GET READY TO RIG UP RIG UP, UNLOAD EQUIPMENT, X -OVER
FOR TBG, GET READY TO NIPPLE DOWN IN A.M. SDFD

8/10/2012 13:00 14:00 1.00 MIRU 01 P ROAD RIG FROM SROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 HSM WRITE AND
REVIEW JSA TOPIC; RIGGING UP
14:00 15:30 1.50 MIRU 01 P ATTEMPT TO SLIDE ROTO FLEX FAILED WAIT ON
BACKHOE...PMP 70 BBLS OFF HOT 2% KCL DOWN ANNULUS
15:30 16:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P MIRU
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D POLISH ROD SIH w 117-1" 75-7/8 RODS P/U POLISH
SECURE WELL SDFN
8/11/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING RODS
7:00 9:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FINISH TOH w RODS L/D PMP
9:00 11:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P N/D WELL HEAD N/U BOPE RELEASE 7 5/8" TAC AT 9377
11:00 13:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TALLY AND TIHw 18 JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG ( TTL OF 315 JTS IN

WELL) RE-SET 7 5/8" TAC AT 9977' w 25K TENTION PSN AT
10106' N/D BOP NU WELL HEAD

13:00 18:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FLUSH TBG w 60 BBL OF HOT 2% KCL P/U AND PRIME 2 1/2" X
11/2" X 36' 10-WB 142-3/4" OUT OF DERRICK P/U 73-3/4" wig
107-7/8" OUT OF DERRICK P/U 13-7/8" SLK SECURE WELL SDFN

8/12/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING RODS
7:00 9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH w 54-1" RODS TOH AND L/D TIH w 53-1" RODS SPACE OUT

PMP w 1-2', 3-6', 1-4' x 1" PONY RODS P/U POILISH RODS FILL
TBG w 15 BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL WTR TEST AND STROKE TEST
TO 1000 PSI PMP 20 BBLS DOWN FLOW LINE

9:30 11:30 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO SLIDE ROTOFLEX TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION
August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm 5 OienWeIIs
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Sundry Number: 30993 API Well Number: 43013301020000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: '
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING s '
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 8. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below -
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION |7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well ASAY E J 1-20A1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013301020000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1650 FSL 1650 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 20 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH
11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
J ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:] CASING REPAIR
DA::I)‘(‘:::: L’:{f?’:rk will start: ] chance To PRevious PLANS [ cHanee Tusme [ crance we name
D CHANGE WELL STATUS J COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
J SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN I:I FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
8/ 1 1 /2 0 1 2 D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE J RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
J REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
EI DRILLINC:?EE:g%:te: D WATER SHUTOFF D S1 TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: | |

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

July 9, 2012 - Set CIBP @ 10,220" and dump 10' cement on top. Add perfs (10,128' -
10,047')w/3-1/8" HSC gun, 3 spf, 120 degree phase. July 10, 2012 - Acidize same perfs with 14,952
gals of 15% HCL acid. July 12, 2012 - Set CIBP @ 10,040’ (no cmt). Add perfs (10,028' - 9977')
w/3-1/8" HSC gun, 3 spf, 120 degree phase. July 13, 2012 - Acidize same perfs with 15,000 gals 15%
HCL acid. July 16, 2012 - Set CIBP @ 9950' (no cmt). Add perfs (9936' - 9800') w/3-1/8" HSC gun, 3
spf, 120 degree phase. July 17, 2012 - Acidize same perfs with 15,000 gals 15% HCL acid. July 18,
2012 - Set CIBP @ 9780’ (no cmt) and add perfs (9770' - 9568') with 3-1/8" HSC gun, 3 spf, 120
degree phase. July 19, 2012 - Acidize same perfs with 15,000 gals 15% HCL acid. July 21, 2012 - Drill
out all plugs and clean out. July 10, 2012 - Install 2-7/8" production tubing. Return well to production

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER |TITLE

Linda Renken 713 997-5138 Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/11/2012

RECEIVED: Oct. 11, 2012




Sundry Number: 30993 API Well Number: 43013301020000

WESTERN

ORG HIERARCHY

E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
RECOMPLETE LAND

Operation Summary Report

Disclaimer: Although the information contained in this report is based on sound engineering practices, the copyright owner (s)
does (do) not accept any responsibility whatsoever, in negligence or otherwise, for any loss or damage arising from the
possession or use of the report whether in terms of correctness or otherwise. The application, therefore, by the user of this
report or any part thereof, is solely at the user’s own risk.

RECEIVED: Oct. 11, 2012



Sundry Number: 30993 API Well Number: 43013301020000
WESTERN
1 General
11 Customer Information
Company WESTERN
Representative
Address
1.2 Well Information
Well E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
Project ORG HIERARCHY Site E J ASAY-FEE 1-20A1
Rig Name/No. NABORS DRILLING/0561 Event RECOMPLETE LAND
Start Date 7/3/2012 End Date 7/25/2012
Spud Date 3/19/1972 uwi 020-001-S 001-W 30
Active Datum KB @5,405.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)
Afe 159391/46315 / ASAY E J 1-20A1
No./Description
2 Summary
21 Operation Summary
Date Time Duratio Phase | Activit| Sub | op MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code ()
(hr}
7/412012 11:00 13:00 2.00 MIRU 01 P MOL SLIDE UNIT, RIG UP
13:00 15.00 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P PUMP 60 BBLS DOWN CASING, WORK PUMP OFF SEAT FLUSH
W/ 65 BBLS, RESEAT AND TEST TO 1000 PSIG GOOD TEST.
15:00 18:00 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D P-ROD AND SUBS, L/D 15 1", COOH W/ 120 1", L/D 35 7/8",
COOH W/ 134, L/D 54 3/4" SWIFN CSDFN CT
7/5/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY
716/12012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( TALKED ABOUT WHERE THE BEST HAND
PLACEMENT WAS WHILE N/U BOPS )
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH 89 3/4 RODS L/D PUMP
8:30 12:30 4.00 PRDHEQ 16 P C/O TO TBG EQ., PU ON TBG, RIG BEGIN TO SINK, REBUILD
BASE BEAM, PU TO 130K WAIT ON DEAD LINE INDICATOR,
ORDER SURFACE JARS.
12:30 14:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 16 P R/U DEAD LINE INDICATOR, RELEASE TAC NU BOPE, RU WORK
FLOOR & TBG EQUIPMENT. RU PRS SCANNERS.
14:30 20:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/353 JTS OF 2 7/8 TBG L/D 48 JTS OF TBG,144 JTS
BLUE,161 JTS YELLOW R/D PRS,SCANNERS. SWIFN CSDFN CT.
7/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( SCANNING TBG )
7:30 8:30 1.00 POOH SCANNING 25 JTS OF 2
3/8,11RED,10BLUE 4YELLOW,R/D SCANNERS
8:30 9:30 1.00 R/U WIRE LINE TRUCK TO SET A 7 5/8 COMPOSET PLUG @
10,520'.
9:30 12:30 3.00 FILL TBG WITH 480 BBLS OF WATER,PRESER TEST CSG TO
1000 PSI CSG HELD GOOD
12:30 15:30 3.00 GR,CCL,CBL LOG FROM 10,250 TO 1,500 E-MAIL TO HOUSTAN
15:30 21:00 5.50 RUN 56 ARM 3-D CALIPER LOG WITH PIPE WALL INTEGRITY
TOOL LOG FROM 10,200' TO SURFACE. E-MAIL TO HOUSTAN.
7/8/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY SDFWE
7/9/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
7/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( WIRELINE OPERATIONS )
7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 26 P RIH W/ CMT DUMP BAILER TAG @ 500' C/NOT WORK THROUGH
PARAFFIN PLUG. POOH W/ DUMP BAILER.
8:30 11:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P

RIH W/ 60 JTS 2-7/8" CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN, POOH W/ 60
JTS. RU WIRE LINE.

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm

OpenWells
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Sundry Number:

30993 API Well Number:

43013301020000

WESTERN

21 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date

Time
Start-End

Duratio
n
(hr)

Phase

Activit
y

Sub

OP
Code

MD From
L]

Operation

7/11/2012

7/12/2012

7/13/2012

7/14/2012

11:30 15:30

15:30 19:30

6:00 7:30

7:30 9:30

9:30 17:00

17:00 19:00

19:00 6:00

6:00 7:30
7:30 12:00

12:00 18:30

6:00 7:30
7:30 8:30

8:30 12:00

12:00 17:00

6:00 7:30
7:30 11:00

4.00

4.00

1.50

2.00

7.50

2.00

11.00

1.50
4.50

6.50

1.50
1.00

3.50

5.00

1.50
3.50

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

PRDHEQ

26

39

28

39

35

18

19

RIH W/ DUMP BAILER DUMP BAIL 10' CMT ON TOP OF CBP @
10,220". RIH W/ 3-1/8" HSC LOADED 3 JSPF,120 deg PHASING,
W/ 22.7 GM CHARGES, PERFORATE 10128' TO 10047' W/ 1000
PSIG SURFACE PRESSURE, NO CHANGES RDMOL TO PIONEER
WIRE LINE UNIT.

PUMU & RIH W/ 7-5/8" PKR, X/O TO 3-1/2" TBG, 159 JTS 3-1/2"
TBG, EOT @ §300". SWIFN CSDFN CT.

CREW TRAVEL & JSA SAFETY MEETING (Body Placement and
Position for Tasks )

START RIG, BLEED WELL DOWN, PUMP 60 BBLS DOWN TBG,
GET READY TO P/U 3 1/2" TBG, P/U & TALLY 157 - JTS 3 172"

TBG, 6'- 3 1/2" TBG SUB W/ FRAC VALVE, SET PKR @ 10027

W/ 30,000 LBS COMP., PRES TEST CSG 500 LBS, OK.

R/U PLATIMUM PRESSURE PUMPING, PRES TEST LINES 7000#,
HELD, HOLD 800# ON CSG, GET INJECTION RATE 5241#, 3.9
BPM, PUMP 178 BBLS ACID @ 5657#, 11.7 BPM, DROP 100 - BIO
BALLS, PUMP 178 BBLS ACID @ 5685#, 11.7 BPM, PUMP 140
BBLS FLUSH @ 6002# @ 11.7 BPM, ISIP - 4175#, 5 - MIN -

4135#, 10 - MIN - 4114#, 15 - MIN - 4107#

R/D PUMP LINES, RIG UP FLOW BACK LINE, TURN OVER TO
FLOW BACK CREW, ATTEMPT TO BLEED DOWN CASING W/NOT
BLEED DOWN.

TSIP @ 3900 PSIG OPEN ON 12/64 CHOKE
OPEN ON 12/64 FLOW BACK 183 WTR
CT TGSM & JSA ( Lifting/Body Mechanics )

START RIG, SITP - 0, SICP - 0, RELEASE 7 5/8" PKR @ 10,027',
CIRC. DOWN CSG W/ 156 BBLS 2% KCL, FLUSH TBG W/ 60
BBLS HOT, CHACE W/ 30 BBLS, DROP 2 7/8" BALL PUMPTO
BTM W/ 87 BBLS, PRES TEST 4000#, HELD, REVERSE PUMP
BALL TO SURF W/ 87 BBLS, L/D FRAC VALVE & 6' 3 1/2" TBG
SuB

LD 3-JTS 3 1/2" TBG, STAND BACK 248 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG IN
DERRICK, L/D 65 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, X -OVER, &7 5/8" H -D PKR (
ELEMENTS WASHED ) , CLEAN EQUIPMENT, RIH W/ 61 - JTS 3
1/2" TBG, EOT @ 1940', SWIFN, R/U TO CIRC IN AM., SDFD.
CT TGSM & JSA ( PERFORATING )

START RIG, WELL WAS CIRC., W/ 100 BBLS HOT 2% KCL,

POOH W/ 61 JTS 3 1/2" TBG

R/U PIONEER WIRELINE SERVICE, RIH W/ 7 5/8" CBP & SET IT @
10,040", PRES TEST CSG 1000#,HELD, RIH & PERF 10028' TO
9977' RDMOL W/ PIONEER

P/U & RIH W/ 7 5/8" H -D PKR, 2 7/8" SEAT NIPPLE, X -OVER, 65 -
JTS 3 1/2" TBG, RIH W/ 248 - JTS OUT OF DERRICK,SET PKR @
9931' W/ 30,000# COMPRESSION, PRES TEST CSGG & PKR
1000#, HELD, SDFD

CT TGSM & JSA ( PUMPING ACID )

RU PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT

TSIP @ 2256 PSIG

ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE & BREAK DOWN STAGE 2 PERFS
@ 5 BPM @ 5800 PSIG. PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, DROP 50
BIO-BALLS PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL FLUSH 20 OVER BTM
PERF AVE RATE 11.2 BPM, MAX RATE 12 BPM, AVE PRESSURE
5816 PSIG @ 5400, MAX 6031 PSIG, FLUSH 20 OVER BTM

PERF. ISDP @ 4182 PSIG, 5 MIN 4147 10 MIN 4141 15 MIN 4127

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm

OpenWells
RECEIVED: Oct. 11, 2




Sundry Number: 30993 API Well Number: 43013301020000
WESTERN
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code {ft)
(hr)
11:00 6:00 19.00 RIG DOWN PLATINUM, RU FLOW BACK LINES
OPEN @ 1200 @ 4200 PSIG
FLOW BACK 393 BBLS WATER
CURRENTLY FLOWING OIL & GAS 5 BPH RATE W/ CHOKE
FULLY OPEN AND 50 PSIG
7/15/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( HOUSE CLEANING, PU WORK AREA
BETWEEN JOB STEPS)
7:30 11:00 3.50 START RIG, WELL FLOWING @ 50 LBS, SWI RELEASE PKR @
9,931' CIRC OUT OIL & GAS W/ 2% KCL, PUMP 85 BBLS DOWN
TBG, L/D FRAC VALVE & 6' 3 1/2" TBG SUB
11:00 13:00 2.00 L/D 6 JTS POOH W/ 120 JTS TUBING TONGS BROKE DOWN.
13:00 15:00 2.00 REPAIR TONGS
15:00 18:30 3.50 COOH W/ 96 JTS TONGS BROKE DOWN, PU NEW TONGS,
CSDFWE EOT @ 2895
7116/2012  6:00 7:00 1.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDWE
7M17/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( L/D 3-1/2")
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRC WELL CLEAN CIRC 210 BBLS BRINE, TO KILL WELL
9:00 10:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P POOH W/ 90 JTS 3 1/2" TBG, /D 1 - JT 3 1/2" TBG & 7 5/8" PKR
10:30 15:00 4.50 STGO03 21 P RIG UP, PIONEER WIRELINE SERVICE, RIH W/ 7 5/8" CBP SETIT
@ 9,950', PRES TEST CSG 1000 LBS, MAKE 2 CONS 3-1/8"
GUNS LOADED 22.7 GM CHARGES W/ 120 deg PHASING.
PREFORATE 9936' TO 9800' HOLDING 500 PSIG NO PRESSURE
CHANGES.RDMO W/ WIRELINE UNIT.
15:00 19:30 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 7 5/8" H -D PKR, X -OVER, 1 JT 3 1/2" TBG, RIH W/ 28 - JTS
3 1/2" TBG, PUMP BRINE DOWN TBG, INSTALL WASHINTON
HEAD RUBBER, RIH W/ 278 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, P/U 6 - 3 1/2" TBG
SUB & FRAC VALVE, SET 7 5/8" PKR @ 9741', W/ 30,000 LBS
COMPRESSION, PRES TEST CSG 1000 LBS, HELD, SDFD
7/18/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO3 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( Overhead Hazards )
7:30 9:30 2.00 STGO3 18 P RIG UP PLATINUM PRESSURE PUMPING SERVICE, HAVE
SAFETY MEETING, PRES TEST LINES 7,000 LBS, GET READY TO
PUMP.
9:30 13:00 3.50 STGO3 35 P EST. INJECTION RATE, 5 BPM @ 5362 LBS, PUMP 7500 GAL
15% HCL @ 10 BPM @ 6021 LBS, DROP 100 BIO BALLS, PUMP
7500 GAL 15% HCL @ 11.5 BPM @ 5855 LBS, FLUSH 20 OVER
BOTTEM PERF @ 11.5 BPM @ 6130 LBS, ISIP - 4225 LBS, 5 MIN
- 4138 LBS, 10 MIN - 4108 LBS, 15 MIN - 4083 LBS, SITP @ 4080
LBS, R/D PLATINUM, R/U FLOW BACK LINES, LEAVE WELL
SHUT IN FOR 2 - HOURS
13:00 6:00 17.00 STG03 19 P OPEN WELL UP, ON A 13/64" CHOKE, 4050 LBS
FLOW BACK 282 BBLS
CURRENTLY FLOWING @ 50 PSIG ON 46 CHOKE
7/19/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P TGSM & JSA ( HAND PLACEMENT )
7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P TSIP @ 50 PSIG, CSIP @ 0 PSIG, START RIG, 0 LBS ON CSG &
TBG, RELEASE 7 5/8" PKR @ 9741', CIRC CLEAN W/ 2% WELL,
PUMP 55 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG.
9:30 14:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D FRAC VALVE & 6' 3 1/2" TBG SUB, L/D 6 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG,
POOH W/ 301 JTS 3 1/2" TBG, X -OVER & 7 5/8" H -D PKR
14:00 17:30 3.50 STG04 21 P R/U PIONEER WIRELINE SERVICE, RIH & SET 7 5/8" CBP @
9,780, PRES TEST 1000 LBS, HELD, RIH & 3-1/8" HSC GUNS
LOADED 3 JSFP W/ 22.7 GM CHARGES W/ 120 deg PHASING
AND PERFORATE 9770' TO 9568', R/D WIRELINE, GET READY
TO RIH W/ PKR
17:30 19:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 7 5/8" H -D PKR, X -OVER, 101 JTS 3 1/2" TBG, EOT @
3,215, SWIFD, CSDFD
7/20/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (RIH W/ 3-1/2 TBG )

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm

OpenWells
RECEIVED: Oct. 11, 012




Sundry Number: 30993 API Well Number: 43013301020000
WESTERN
241 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | oOP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)
(hr)
7:30 8:00 050 PRDHEQ 39 P 50 LBS, SICP - 50 LBS, BLEED WELL DOWN, PUMP 30 BBLS
BRINE DOWN CSG
8:00 9:30 150  PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 200 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, SET 7 6/8" H -D PKR @ 9550' W/
45,000 LBS COMPRESSION, PRES TEST PKR 1000 LBS,HELD.
9:30  12:30 3.00 STG04 42 P WAIT ON PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT
12:30  16:30 4.00 STGOo4 35 P R/U PLATINUM PRESSURE PUMPING, HAVE SAFETY MEETING,
PRES TEST LINES 7500 LBS, EST. INJECTION RATE 6.4 BPM @
5310 LBS, PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL, 11.5 BPM @ 5,865 LBS,
DROP 80 BIO-BALLS PUMP 7500 GAL 15% HCL @ 13 BPM @
6,080 LBS, PUMP 235 BBLS 2 % KCL 12.5 BPM @ 6215 LBS,
ISIP @ 4225 LBS, 5 - MIN 3,914 LBS, 10 MIN 3,876 LBS, 15 MIN
3,868 LBS, SHUT IN PRES @ 3,861 LBS
16:30  18:00 1.50 STG04 18 P RDMOL W/ PLATINUM ACID EQUIPMENT, RU FLOWBACK LINES.
LET ACID SIT.
18:.00  6:00 12.00 STG04 19 P OPEN UP AT 3650 PSIG AT 18:00 HOURS ON 12/64 CHOKE
FLOW BACK 99 BBLS, CURRENTLY 0 PSIG
712112012 6:00 7:30 150  PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( HAND PLACEMENT L/D TBG )
7:30 9:30 200 PRDHEQ 06 P SITP & SICP 0 LBS, RELEASE 7 5/8" H -D PKR @ 9550', CIRC
WELL W/ 385 BBLS 2% KCL DOWN CSG, PUMP 50 BBLS BRINE
DOWN TBG.
9:30  16:30 7.00 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D 301 - JTS 3 1/2" TBG, X -OVER, & 7 5/8" H -D PKR, CLEAN
UP EQUIPMENT, X -OVER FOR 2 7/8" TBG, CHANGE PIPE RAMS,
SLIP DIES, TONG HEADS, & ELEVATORS
16:30  18:30 2.00  PRDHEQ 39 P P/U 6 3/4" BIT, & BIT SUB, TALLY & RIH W/ 122 - JTS 2 7/8" TBG,
EOT@ 3825, SDFD
7/22/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( Working at Heights/Fall Protection )
7:30 11:00 350  PRDHEQ 39 P SITP - 1500 LBS, SICP - 1500 LBS, BLEED WELL DOWN PUMP 15
BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, TALLY & RIH W/ 180 JTS 2 7/8" TBG,
TALLY & P/U 3 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, R/D TONGS, R/U POWER
SWIVEL.
11:00  18:00 700 PRDHEQ 18 P P/U 6 - JTS, TAG @ 9780', BRAKE CIRC, START DRILLING ON
PLUG, DRILL UP PLUG #1, SWIVEL DOWN 5 JTS TAG PLUG @
9950', DRILL UP PLUG #2, SWIVEL DOWN 3 JTS TAG PLUG @
10040, DRILL UP PLUG #3, EOT @ 10060, CIRC CLEAN FOR 45
MIN, PUMP 10 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, RIG DOWN POWER
SWIVEL & SET IT BACK, POOH W/ 16 JTS 2 7/8" TBG, EOT @
9,550' SDFD.
7/23/2012  6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE
7/24/2012  6:00 7:30 150  PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POWER SWIVEL OPERATIONS )
7:30 11:00 350 PRDHEQ 06 P TSIP & CSIP @ 1650# PSIG. RIH W/ TBG TO 10,490’ TM PU PWR
SWIVEL DRILL UP PLUG REMAINS. CIRCULATE CLEAN. RD PWR
SWVL.
11:00  14:00 300 PRDHEQ 39 P /D 19 JTS 2-7/8", COOH W/ 306 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG.
14:00  18:00 400 PRDHEQ 3¢ P PUMU & RIH W/ 2-7/8" SOLID PLUG, 2 JTS, 4-1/2" PBGA SHELL,
2' PUP, +45 PSN, 2' PUP JT, 4 JTS, 7-6/8" TAC, 300 JTS 2-7/8"
8RD EUE TBG. SET TAC. RD WORK FLOOR & TBG EQUIPMENT.
18:00  19:30 150  PRDHEQ 16 P ND BOPE, LAND TBG W/ 25K TENSION. NU B FLANGE. SWIFN
CSDFN CT.
7/25/2012  6:00 7:30 1.50 CT TGSM & JSA ( RIH W/ RODS )
7:30  11:00 3.50

START RIG, SITP 1850 LBS, SICP 1850 LBS, BLEED WELL
DOWN, CLEAN UP EQUIPMENT & WORK AREA, FLUSH

TBG W/ 60 BBLS, PUMP 50 BBLS BRINE DOWN TBG, X -OVER
FOR RODS, RACK OUT BOP'S, GET READY TO RUN RODS,
RACK OUT PUMP & LINES

August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm

OpenWelis
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Sundry Number: 30993 API Well Number: 43013301020000

WESTERN
21 Operation Summary (Continued)
Date Time Duratio Phase |Activit| Sub | oOP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (1]
(hr)
11:00  16:30 5.50 P/U & RIH W/ 2 1/2" X 1 3/4" X 36' WTRF PUMP W/ DIP TUBE, 10 -

11/2" K-BARS, RIH W/ 143 - 3/4", 107 - 7/8", & - 1" RODS,
SPACE OUT PUMP, P/U POLISH ROD, FILL TBG W/ 3 - BBLS,
PRES TEST 1000 LBS, HELD, STROKE TEST PUMP, OK, RIG
DOWN GET READY TO ROAD RIG, SLIDE ROTA - FLEX IN
PLACE, HANG WELL ON, PUT WELL ON PRODUCTION

16:30 19:30 3.00 ROAD RIG FROM THE 1 -20 A1 TO THE 3 -22 B4, SPOT RIG,
GET READY TO RIG UP RIG UP, UNLOAD EQUIPMENT, X -OVER
FOR TBG, GET READY TO NIPPLE DOWN IN A.M. SDFD

8/10/2012  13:00 14:00 1.00 MIRU 01 P ROAD RIG FROM SROUSE BOWDEN 2-18B1 HSM WRITE AND
REVIEW JSA TOPIC; RIGGING UP
14:00 15:30 1.50 MIRU 01 P ATTEMPT TO SLIDE ROTO FLEX FAILED WAIT ON
BACKHOE...PMP 70 BBLS OFF HOT 2% KCL DOWN ANNULUS
15:30 16:30 1.00 MIRU 01 P MIRU
16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P L/D POLISH ROD SIH w 117-1" 75-7/8 RODS P/U POLISH
SECURE WELL SDFN
8/11/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING RODS
7:00 9:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FINISH TOH w RODS L/D PMP
9:00 11:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P N/D WELL HEAD N/U BOPE RELEASE 7 5/8" TAC AT 9377'
1100 13:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P TALLY AND TIHw 18 JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG ( TTL OF 315 JTS IN

WELL) RE-SET 7 5/8" TAC AT 9977' w 25K TENTION PSN AT
10106' N/D BOP NU WELL HEAD

13:00 18:00 5.00 PRDHEQ 39 P FLUSH TBG w 60 BBL OF HOT 2% KCL P/U AND PRIME 2 1/2" X
11/2" X 36' 10-WB 142-3/4" OUT OF DERRICK P/U 73-3/4" wig
107-7/8" OUT OF DERRICK P/U 13-7/8" SLK SECURE WELL SDFN

8/12/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING RODS
7:00 9:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TIH w 54-1" RODS TOH AND L/D TIH w 53-1" RODS SPACE OUT

PMP w 1-2', 3-6', 1-4' x 1" PONY RODS P/U POILISH RODS FILL
TBG w 15 BBLS OF HOT 2% KCL WTR TEST AND STROKE TEST
TO 1000 PSI PMP 20 BBLS DOWN FLOW LINE

9:30 11:30 2.00 RDMO 02 P RDMO SLIDE ROTOFLEX TURN WELL OVER TO PRODUCTION
August 22, 2012 at 6:03 pm 5 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Oct. 11, 12
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State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

GARY R. HERBERT

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director
March 21, 2016

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7015 0640 0003 5275 9918

45 013 20102

Ms. Linda Renken A‘Sﬁdj Ed { ~ZOH |

EP Energy 20 IS P W
1001 Louisiana Street, Suite 2628D

Houston, TX 77002

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Renken:

As of January 2016, EP Energy has thirty-six (36) Fee Lease Wells (see attachment A)
that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or temporarily
abandoned (SI/TA) status. The first eight wells listed on attachment A have been previously
noticed and will most likely be addressed further in a later correspondence.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

I. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT.

UTAH
. S G
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Salt Lake City, UT 84116

PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

tetephone (801) 538-5340 » facsimile (801) 359-3940 ¢ TTY (801) 538-7458  wiww.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



Page 2
EP Energy

March 21, 2016

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/'TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1.

Wellbore diagram, and

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and

3.

4.
5.

Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
Fluid level in the wellbore, and

An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

All Submittals should be sent via ePermit

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice,
further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact
me at (801) 538-5281.

DKD/DD/js
Enclosure

Sincerely,

IS

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

cc:  Compliance File

Well File

NAO&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\PetroleumEngineer\SITA



ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years Inactive

1 [Farnsworth 2-12B5 43-013-311156 Fee 12 year(s) 4 month(s)
2 |Brotherson 1-10B4 43-013-30110 Fee 11 year(s) 10 month(s)
3 |Miles 2-35A4 43-013-31087 Fee 8 year(s) 10 month(s)
4 |Fly/Dia L Boren 1-14A2 43-013-30035 Fee 6 year(s) 11 month(s)
5 |Brotherson 2-3B4 43-013-31008 Fee 5 year(s) 5 month(s)
6 [R Houston 1-2221 43-013-30884 Fee 4 year(s) 2 month(s)
7 |Horrocks 5-20A1 43-013-34280 Fee 6 year(s) 6 month(s)
8 |Eula-Ute 1-16A1 43-013-30782 Fee 3 year(s) 10 month(s)
9 JASAY E J 1-20A1 43-013-30102 Fee 2 year(s) 6 month(s)
10|{ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 43-013-30126 Fee 2 year(s) 5 month(s)
11|ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 43-013-30183 Fee 2 year(s) 2 month(s)
12|[ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 43-013-30898 Fee 2 year(s) 2 month(s)
13|BROADHEAD 2-32B5 43-013-31036 Fee 2 year(s) 4 month(s)
14|ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 43-013-31089 Fee 2 year(s) 6 month(s)
15|HUNT 2-21B4 43-013-31114 Fee 2 year(s) 2 month(s)
16|CEDAR RIM 8-A 43-013-31171 Fee 2 year(s) 4 month(s)
17|MILES 2-3B3 43-013-31261 Fee 2 year(s) 4 month(s)
18|MATTHEWS 2-13B2 43-013-31357 Fee 12 year(s) 4 month(s)
19\HORROCKS 2-5B1E 43-047-32409 Fee 2 year(s) 9 month(s)
20|FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 43-013-30124 Fee 1 year(s) 11 month(s)
21|ELDER 1-13B2 43-013-30366 Fee 1 year(s) 8 month(s)
22])YOUNG 2-30B4 43-013-31366 Fee 1 year(s) 7 month(s)
23|POTTER 1-24B5 43-013-30356 Fee 1 year(s) 5 month(s)
24|PETERSON 4-22C6 43-013-51163 Fee 1 year(s) 5 month(s)
25[FARNSWORTH 1-13B5 43-013-30092 Fee 2 year(s) 0 month(s)
26|BROTHERSON 2-35B5 43-013-30908 Fee 2 year(s) 0 month(s)
27WRIGHT 2-13B5 43-013-31267 Fee 2 year(s) 0 month(s)
28|CHANDLER 1-5B4 43-013-30140 Fee 1 year(s) 3 month{s)
29|ROBB 2-29B5 43-013-31130 Fee 1 year(s) 2 month(s)
30]YOUNG 3-36A1 43-047-54734 Fee 1 year(s) 2 month(s)
31|JERCANBRACK 3-14B1 43-047-54203 Fee 2 year(s) 2 month(s)
32|0STLER 7-20C4 43-013-53137 Fee 1 year(s) 2 month(s)
33[MYRIN LIVESTOCK 3-20B3 43-013-53133 Fee 1 year(s) 3 month(s)
34{HILL 4-28A1 43-013-53111 Fee 1 year(s) 2 month(s)
35|BULLOCK 4-17C4 43-013-52900 Fee 1 year(s) 3 month(s)
36/LINDSAY TRUST 4-18B4 43-013-52766 Fee 1 year(s) 5 month(s)




Sundry Nunber: 75097 APl Well Nunber: 43013301020000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well ASAY E J 1-20A1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P. 43013301020000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5138 Ext BLUEBELL
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE
1650 FSL 1650 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWSE Section: 20 Township: 01.0S Range: 01.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF J SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was shut-in July of 2013 due to poor facility REQUEST DENIED
conditions and a hole in the heater treater. The economics do Utah Division of
not support a repair at this time. The plan is to TA the well 0il, Gas and Mining

and perform an MIT on the 7” casing in 2017. We will repair October 25, 2016

. . N Date:
the surface facility when the economics are justified. ‘

By: (\;\lﬁ/& ‘L Oéxwx?{'

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Linda Renken 713 997-5138 Sr. Regulatory Analyst
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 10/6/2016

RECEI VED: Cct. 06, 2016




Sundry Nunber: 75097 APl Well Nunber: 43013301020000

UTAH

DNR

.-A‘....('

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013301020000

Showing of integrity required for extension of Shut-in period. No integrity information provided.
Plan to MIT by end of next year not sufficient.

RECEI VED: Cct. 25, 2016



State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director
Governor Division of Qil, Gas and Mining -
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R. BAZA 4?) O k 2 *% LO 2'
Lieutenant Governor Division Director
E) —2DR\
NOTICE OF VIOLATION 70 s W

OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION ACT

TO THE FOLLOWING OPERATOR:

EP Energy Date of Maiting: 10/31/2016

Linda Renken Certified Mail No.: 7015 0640 0003 5276 0396
1001 Louisiana Street, Suite 2628D

Houston, TX 77002 Compliance Deadline:  12/1/2016

Under the authority of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act, Section 40-6 et. Seq., Utah Code Annotated, 1953, as
amended, the undersigned authorized representative of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) has
conducted an inspection of the described site and/or records on the date listed below and has found alleged
violation(s) of the act, rules or permit conditions as described below.

Description of Violation(s):

On March 21, 2016, the Division sent a letter to EP Energy outlining that 36 wells were in non-compliance with the
requirements for extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned status and what actions were required for these wells. EP
Energy was given 30 days to supply the requested information. In an email correspondence with the Division, EP Energy
requested and was granted a two month extension to have this information submitted. It is well past the June 21, 2016
extended deadline and the majority of the wells listed on the following page have not had sundries filed with the required
information. Seven of the wells on the list have had a sundry submitted that was denied because of a lack of information
showing weilbore integrity and sufficient justification for continued shut-in status. Four of the wells from the original list
included with the March 21, 2016 letter have approved plugging plans but have not yet been plugged and abandoned.

See list of wells / sites on next page

Rule Reference(s):
Rule R649-3-36. Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells

Rule R649-3-4.3. Bonding
Rule R649-3-4.41. Bonding

UTAH

!
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov

OIL, GAS & MINING

Page 1 0f3



Required Actions:

For the well(s) subject to this notice, you shall fulfill full cost bonding requirements for each well. You shall also submit ail
information as required by R649-3-36, plug and abandon the well(s), or place the weli(s) on production.

+ Eines may be levied up to $10.000.00 per day for every well in violation given the
authority provided under U.C.A 40-6-11, part 4

This notice shall remain in effect until it is modified, terminated, or vacated by a written notice of an authorized
representative of the director of the Division of Qil, Gas and Mining. Failure to comply with this notice will result in the
Division pursuing further actions against said operator. Further actions may include initiation of agency actions to order full
cost bonding and plugging and abandonment of wells and requests for bond forfeiture and civil penalties.

Compliance Deadline: 12/1/2016 3‘3.“3"1 Signed % Dayn:a K Doucet
D ayn e K D 0 U Ce em.aitl:gdayanyer::)uce?éﬁa'h?égy,‘ c=US

Date: 2016.10.28 14:32:44 -06'00'

Petroleum Engineer (801) 538-5303

cc: Compliance File

Well File

Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer

Josh Payne, Compliance Manager
List of Wells or Sites:
‘Well or Site APl # Date of Inspection/Violation
MILES 2-35A4 43-013-31087 10/28/2016
FLY/DIA L BOREN 1-14A2 43-013-30035 10/28/2016
R HOUSTON 1-22Z1 43-013-30884 10/28/2016
HORROCKS 5-20A1 43-013-34280 10/28/2016
ASAY E J 1-20A1 43-013-30102 10/28/2016
ELLSWORTH 1-17B4 43-013-30126 10/28/2016
ELLSWORTH 1-19B4 43-013-30183 10/28/2016
ELLSWORTH 2-8B4 43-013-30898 10/28/2016
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 43-013-31036 10/28/2016
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 43-013-31089 10/28/2016
HUNT 2-21B4 43-013-31114 10/28/2016
CEDAR RIM 8-A 43-013-31171 10/28/2016
MILES 2-3B3 43-013-31261 10/28/2016
MATTHEWS 2-13B2 43-013-31357 10/28/2016
HORROCKS 2-5B1E 43-047-32409 10/28/2016
FARNSWORTH 1-12B5 43-013-30124 10/28/2016
ELDER 1-13B2 43-013-30366 10/28/2016
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List of Wells or Sites (cont.):

Well or Site

POTTER 1-2485
PETERSON 4-22C6
FARNSWORTH 1-13B5
BROTHERSON 2-35B5
WRIGHT 2-13B5
CHANDLER 1-5B4
ROBB 2-29B5
ERCANBRACK 3-14B1
OSTLER 7-20C4

HILL 4-28A1

BULLOCK 4-17C4
LINDSAY TRUST 4-18B4

APl #

43-013-30356
43-013-51163
43-013-30092
43-013-30908
43-013-31267
43-013-30140
43-013-31130
43-047-54203
43-013-53137
43-013-53111
43-013-52900
43-013-52766

Date ()f Inspection/Violation
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
10/28/2016
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