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Form DOGC-la SUBMIT IN 2 . ICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Other nstmctions on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL & GAS 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Patented
APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work 7. Unit Agreement Name
DRILL DEEPEN[¯]

PLUG BACK
b. Type of Well

Oil Gas Single Multiple 8. Farm. or Lease Name

2. N 1

el
of Operator Ô

e Z e
ÛÙ$ $ À

King Silver Corporation 9. Well No.

3. Address of Operator
10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

i. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) ÄiŠŠ
At surface m' FR d û * R Sec 21 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk.

At proposed prod. zone

a ve i e

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

2 miles W of Altament Duchesne Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest to this well
property or lease line, ft.
(Also to nearest drlg. line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* ggSg 19. Proposed depth Ž0. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft.

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GIT, etc.) 22. Approx. date work will start*

65co at (engrades) -71

23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

As per attached drilling prognosis and certified survey plat.

Kind of 807's: Set %000 pai 13 5/8 stack on 13 3/8" esg and later
on 9 5/8" casing - 300 * to TD

Operationally Teated a Operationally tested daily and press tested after
nippling up on all tasing strings and as deemed
necessary for dr*Plag conditione. All press testa
will be recorded on Tour Sheeta.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or vlug back, give data on present productive zone and provosed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give vertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.

24.

Signed............................ ..g... WiedM.. .... Title .. Af.. Date. ..

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Permit No........................ ............... Approval Date ....

Approved by......................... ........ ............. Title... .............. ... ........... Date.
Gonditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse



. DRILLINGWELLPROGNOSIS
WELL Ols_en Unit 1 27A4
TYPE WELL Development
FIELD ARRA Altamont

APPROX.LOCATION (SUBJECT TO SURVEY) 1200' FNL & 1200 FEL Sec. 27-T1S-R4R, Duchesne County, Utah

EST.G.L.ELEVATION _6

_

PROJECTED TD 15,500 OBJECTIVE Wasatch

DEPTHS AND
HOLE CASING LOGGING MAX
SIZE PROGRAM PROGRAMS DEV.

FORMATION SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS
TOPS

Dry hole '

30" 24" digger 40' + SAMPLES:

30' from 300' to 5500'
10' from 5500' to 15,500'

17 1/2" 13 3/8' 'Áro ßgÑa 300' (esÝ CORES:

- 0 -

DST'S:
TGR 1 Three in the 12,000' to 15,000'

12 1/3" 9 5/8' 6330 (+160) interval.

7000'
DEVIATION CONTROL

Dogleg severity to be less than 1 1/2°

per any 100' interval.

TGR 3
10,290 (-3800) CEMENT

8 d 'g" 5/8" , Transition Zone See Casing Programs
(hung) · 1000' 11,100'

10,000' Wasatch "N" marke:
MUD

/V / 11,780 (-5290) General Program

Water - 300' to 10,000'

13,000 Gel/Chemical/Weighted

so 10,000' to T.D.
ooSFJ o Miles Zone

6 1/t" 5 1/2" 13,221 (-8921) ;S_egmud program for details.
(hung)

TD 15,500

ORIGINATOR DATE



Form 1)O C-la SUBMIT IN LICATE*

STATE OF UTAH (Other ienstru i ns on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL & GAS 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

Patented

APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

la. Type of Work
7. Unit Agreement Name

DRILL [ DEEPEN
[¯]

PLUG BACK
b. Type of Well

ell E su O Other
Siniele Munltiple 8. Farm. or Lease Name

2. NameofOperator Shell Gil Company (Rocky Mountain Division Production) Olsen et al

King Silver Corporation 9. Well No.

3. Address of Overator

1700 Broadway, Denver, Colorado 80202 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any 5tate requÏrements.6 Al Ont
At surface

1200 ' FNL and 1200 ' FEL Sec 27 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk.

At proposed prod. zone

a S vey or/AreaSection
27-

T 15-R L¡W
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or vost office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

2 miles NW of Altamont Duchesne Utah
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. No. of acres assigned

location to nearest . to this well
property or lease line, It· 120 '
(Also to nearest drlg. line, if any) 200 6/40

18. Distance from proposed location* No other wells 19. Proposed depth 20. Rotary or cable tools
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft. On leaSe 15, 500 ' Rotary

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Avorox. date work will start*

6500 GL (Ungraded) 5-2/r71
23.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

Size of Hole Size of Casing Weight per Foot Setting Depth Quantity of Cement

As per attached drilling prognosis and certified survey plat.

Kind of BOP's: Set 5,000 psi 13 5/8 stack on 13 3/8" esg and later
on 9 5/8" casing - 300 ' to TD

Operationally Tested: Operationally tested daily and press tested after
nippling up on all casing strings and as deemed
necessary for drilling conditions. All press tests
will be recorded on Tour Sheets.

IN ABOVE SPACE .DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or vlug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new pro-

ductive zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical deaths. Give blowout

Approved by......................... .....-. .............. Title....................... .... ....,....... Date......
Conditions of approval, if any:

*See Instructions On Reverse



DRILLINGWELL PROGNOSIS
WELL E Olsen Unit 1-27A4
TYPE WELL Development
F IELD ARRA amog

APPROX.LOCATION (SUBJECT TOSURVFY) 1200' FNL & 1200 FEL Sec. 27-T1S-R4W, Duchesne County, Utah

EST. G.L. ELEVATION 6490 PROJECTED TD lŠ,500 OBJECTIVE asatch

I DEPTHS ANDHOLE CASING LOGGING MAX
SIZE PROGRAM PROGRAMS DEV.

FORMATION SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS
TOPS

Dry hole '

30" 24" digger 40' + SAMPLES:

30' from 300' to 5500'
10' from 5500' to 15,500'

17 1/2" 13 3/8 /n-o, e 300' (esÍ cORES:

- 0 -

DSTS:
TGR 1 Three in the 12,000' to 15,000'

12 1/3" 9 5/8" 6330 (+160) interval.

7000'
DEVIATION CONTROL

Ai Dogleg severity to be less than 1 1/2°

per any 100' interval.

TGR 3

8 g" 5/8"

T1 0 -38

oe

CSEMeENcTasing

Programs
(hung) 1000' 11,100'

10,000' Wasatch "N" marke
MUD

g /V 11,780 (-5290) General Program

Water - 300' to 10,000'

13,000 Gel/Chemical/Weighted

10,000' to T.D.ooSFJ o Miles Zone
6 1/t" 5 1/2" 13,221 (-8921) Sgg.mud program for details.

(hung)

/ / A/w/N' s, TD 15,500

ORIGINATOR AP DATE 5/11/71

GINEERING APPROVAL: OPERATIONS APPROVAL:

EXPLOITATION

MECH. // 2 -- | DIV. DRILLING



PROJECT

T/S, R4W, U.S.B.BA/. SHELL OIL COMPANY
Well location, SHELL-K/NG S/LVER

OLSEH e/o/ I-27A4, located as
West 5297.78° West Shown in the NE I/4 NE \/4|

o Section 27, TIS, R4W, U.S.B.8M.
qP Duchesne County, Utah.

oI o

SI ELL-If/HGSILVER OLSEN tio/ /-27A 4
'2°°°

w
o

Elev. ungroded ground 6500 ° °

No
o

27 -

CERTIFICATE

TAS S (ERTirv Isai THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED CROM

rE D Nous ¥ AtiuAL sua E'S MADE BY ME OR UNOFR MY

somenvsos ase Tsa- Tse sa e use aos av consecv to Tse

BEST M MY F.NOWLFDGt AN

REGISTERED LAND SURVEYOR
REGISTRATION N9 3154
STATE OF UTAH

UINTAH ENßlNEERING a LAND SURVEYING
P 0. BOX Q - 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTH

X = Corners Re-established VERNAL, ÜTAH - 84078

SCALE DATE
I" =

1000°
8 March, 1971

PARTY REFERENCES
G.S. L.D.T. H.M4 G LO Plats

WEATHER FILE
fair S†lELL OIL



FORM OGC-la susurr W TRIPÈCATE*

THE STATE OF UTAH '°© L'""stroons on

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERVATION

5. 1.EASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAI, NO.

APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL,DEEPEN,OR PLUG BACK 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEBOBTRIBENAME

18. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL U DEEPENO PLUGBACK O 7. UNIT AGBEEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WELL

VELLL VAFI,L
OTHER

ELE MUNLTIPLE

2. NA3IE OF OPERATOR 0 i sen
MAPCO I nc. , et a l . west, so.

3. ADDRESSOFOPERATOR Suite 320 Plaza West 1 - 27 .

153T Avenue D, Bi11ings, Montana 59102 1Û. FIELD AND POOL, 08 WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) A1tamontat sona" NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Section 27, T. 1 S.,R.4 W. 11. SEC., T., B., M., OR BLK.

U.S.M., Duchesne County, Utah AND SURVEY OR AREA-

At proposed prod. zone Section 27,
Same T. 1 S., R. 4 W., U.S.M.

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. SkATE

1-1/2 miles N.W. of Altamont Duchesne Utah
. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACBES ASSIGNED

LOCATION TO NEAREST TO THIS WELL
PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE· " 1200 ' 40 640
(Also to nearest drIg. line, if any)

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED IOCATION* 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTART OR CABLE TOOLSo'a°521"Zion'nD U GE,COiiPLETED'
--- 15,850' Rotary

21. ELEVATIONs (Show wÏœtherDF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROT. DATE WOEK WILL START*

6499' Graded Ground January 6, 1974

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTII QUANTITT OF CEMENT

2-1/4" 9-98" 36# 3500' As required
8-3/4" 7-5/8" Mi×ed 13500' As required
6-1/2" 5-1/2" 23# 15500' As required

This well will be drilled from surface to total depth with rotary drilling equipment,
including B.O.P. assemblies: Hydril 12" 3000 psi, Shaffer single gate 12" 3000 psi,
Shaffer double gate 12" 3000 psi, and additional as required to 13,500' and Hydril
10" 5000 psi, Shaffer single gate 10" 5000 psi, Shaffer double gate 10" 5000 psi, and
additional as required from 13,500' to total depth. Other equipment will include
(1) a recording pit level indicator with warning device, (2) mud volume measuring
device, and (3) a mud return indicator.

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBS PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive
zone. If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout
preventer program, if any.
24 Manager of Operations

SIGNED - TITLE
Northern District

DATE
December 19, 1973

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMIT NO APPROVAI. DATE

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE .

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*SeeinstructionsOn Reverse



. T / S, R4f, kB.B Af MAPCO 01
JEccfDMPANY

Well location, MARCO -

OLSEN eta/ /-27, locoted os
West 5297 78' West Shown in the NE I/4 NE I/4

Section 27, TIS, R4W, U.S.B.SM..
Duchesne County, Utah.

MA O - OLSEN tio/ /-27 '2°° w

Elev. graded ground 64_9_9
o

-.-. -.--.- --..- -

CEROF : C A TE

ÍNIS S T3 CERTiFY T.MAT THE ABOvé PecT WAb PNP:RED ©ROM

VIEs] NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE e ME UNDF Mr

SURERV'SION AND THAT THE SAMÈ ARF TRuE A ORREC 'C THE
BEST OF MY «NowtEDGE AND

REGISTERED LAND SURVEY
REGISTPATION No 3154^

Revised: 12-11-73 sTATE oF uTAM

UINTAH ENGINEERING a LAND SURYEVING
R 0. BOX Q - 110 EAST - FIRST SOUTH

X Corners Re-estoblished VERNAL, UTAH - 84078

SCALE DATE
I" = 1000' 8 March, 1971

PARTY REFERENCES
G.S LD.T. H.41. G LO



PRO

T / S, R4 M. MAPCO OIL COMPANY
Weli location, MARCO -

OLSEN eta/ /-27 locofed os
est 5297 78 West Shown in the NE I/4 NE 1/4

Section 27, TIS, R4W, U.S.B.SM.o°
Duchesne County, Utoh.

MA - OLSEN d tal /-27
- --- -- ---- --- - -- ---- - --- - - "o

Elev. graded yround MS
ooe
ca

27

CERTIFICAT£
..--- -..--. -....-- -..-- -..-.. -----

I H i 5 S TO CER 1 tF Y T MA T T ME A BOY E PL A 1

FtELD NOT $ OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MAgg gY U¾Ô$
SUPERV.SiON AWO THAT TM•E samt AWË T Coast
eEst or uv «nowetose ano eetier

REGISTE DS
REGISTAAT

Reviset 12-11- 73 9747

INTAH ENGINEERIN6 D RygYlNG
o: BOX Q - 110 EAST FIR SQOTI

Cor e-estúblished VERNAL, UTän - e4era
SCAL E QA E

ooo' e u.«
PARTY ~ g€FEREVCES

6.1 L.0 T. )(M. ' G00 Plais

. -

- etwixt



May 14, 1971

Shell 011 Company
1700 Broadway
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Olsen et al 1-27A4
Sec. 27, T. 1 8, R. 4 W, USM
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the
above referred to well is hereby granted in accordance with the
Order issued in Cause No. 139-1, dated June 17, 1970,

Should you determine that a vill be necessary to plug and
abandon this well, you are hereby requested to immèdiately
notify the following:

PAUL w. BURCHELL-Chief Petroleum Engineer
HOME: 277-2890
OFFICE: 328-5771

This approval terminates within 90 days if the well has not
been spudded-in within said period.

Enclosed please find Form OGC-8-X, which is to be completed
whether or nót water sande #aquifers) are encountered during drilling.

The API number assigned to this well is 43-013-30064.

Very truly yours,

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERVATION

CLEON B. FEIGKT
DIRECTOR

CBF:sd
cc: U.S. Geological



December 19, 1973

State Of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil and Gas Commission
1588 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

ATTENTION: Mr. Paul Burcheli

Re: MAPCO, Olsen No. i-27
NE NE Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W.,
and
MAPCO, Birch No. :-25
SW NE Section 25, T. I S., R. 5 W.,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Enclosed are three (3) copies each of our Application for Permit

to Drill and Survey Plat for the above captioned MAPCO, Olsen No. !=27

well. We are also enclosing three (3) copies of Application for Permit

to Drill for MAPCO, Birch No. 1-25. Uintah Engineering & Land

Surveying, Vernal, has been instructed to mail you three (3) copies of the

Survey Plat for the MAPCO, Birch No. 1-25 directly from their office to

facilitate processing this application.

Our $25,000 blanket bond No. 8055-97-09, dated october 11, 1972,

with certified copy of Power of Attorney attached, is on file with your

office. We trust that everything is in order, and if it is not, please

let us know.

Very truly yours,

MAPCO INC.

L. B. McDade, Geologist

LBM:awm

Enclosures

SUITE 32O PLAZA WEST 1537 AVENUE D BILLINGS, MONTANA 59102 A/C 400



December 2!, 1973

Mapco Inc. et al
Sul†e 320 Plaza West
1537 Avenue D
Billings, Montana 59102

Re: Well No's:
Birch #!-25
Sec. 25, T. I S, R. 5 W,
Olsen #1-27
Formerly Shell Oli #I-27A4
Sec. 27, T. I S, R. 4 W,
Duchesne County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Insofar as this office is concerned, approval to drill the above
referred to wells is hereby granted in accordance with the order
issued in Cause No. 139-3/139-4.

Should you determine that it will be necessary to plug and abandon
these wells, you are hereby requested to Immediately notify the following:

RRULW. BURCHELL- Chief Petroleum Engineer
HOME: 277-2890
OFFICE: 328-5771

Enclosed please find Form OGC-8-X, which is to be completed whether
or not water sands (aquifers) are encountered during drilling. Your
cooperation with respect to the above will be greatly appreciated.

The API numbers assigned to these wells are:

#1-25: 43-013-30265 #1-27: 43-013-30064

Very truly yours,

DIVISION OF OIL & GAS CONSERVATION

CLEONB. FEIGHT
DI



Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE•

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) fa. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SSKIAL NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-' for auch proposala.)

1. . UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTRER

2. NAxa or orzaAtoa 8. FAMM OR LEASE NAMS

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. Annaan. or oramazon Su i te 320 Pl a za Wes t 9. WRI,I. NO.

1537 Aveinue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION Or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)at.urrae" NE NE (1200' .FNL,& 1200' FEL) Altamont
Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11..me.'a'Ñ'Ë°'SBLE.AND

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S. , R. 4 W. , USM

14. PaxxzT NO. 15. stavArroNa (Show whether or, RT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 18. BTATA
43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.8. Duchesne Utah

CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicateNature of Notice,Report,or ther Dato
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER BRUT•Orr PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATHENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Ot11PT)
(NOTE: R€pOrt re8tlltS 0Ê multiplO C0mpletion on Wel(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUM1'LETED OPERATIONS (Clearly State all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting nny
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zonea perti-
nent to this Work.) *

JANUARY REPORT:

SPUDDED @ 5:30 AM, 1-24-74

1-24 thru
1-26-74: T.D. 302'; drilled 12-1/4" hole to 302'. Tripped out and picked up

17-1/2" holeopener. Reamed 12-1/4" hole to 17" to 302'. Ran 10
joints of 13-3/8", 68#, Buttress casing and set at 302' K.B. Halliburton
cemented with 400 sacks class "G" containing 2% CaC12. Completed cement
job at 4:00 PM, 1-26-74. Good returns throughout job. No cement to
surface. Tagged top of cement with 1" pipe at 58' K.B. after 8 hrs. WOC.

1-27-74 T.D. 490'; drilled cement and shoe. Cement top at 262'. Began drilling
new formation at 302'.

1-28 thru
1-31-74: T.D. 2416'; drilling Duchesne River formation.

18. I hpreby certify oregol e and correct Manager of Operations
SIGNED TITLE OR €m MStÑCt DATE February 13, 1974

(Thia space foi FederaÌor State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



STATE OF UTAH SCBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*
{Other Instructions on re-
verse Side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for pro osals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPL CATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposals.)

1. Ì. LÑIT Aaamm ir ÑAus
OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOB 8. ÑARat OR LEÄifÑA3ta

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
a. ADDREBB OF OPERATOs Su i te 320 Pl aza Wes t 9. WRI.T. NO.

1537 Avenue D, Bi11ings, Montana 59102 1-27
4. LOCATION Or wELL (Report location clearl.y and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WII,DCAT

See also space 17 below.)
It aurface NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27 T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11. ano.,2.,a.,x.,oansa.xxo
SURVEY OR ABRA

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S., Pr. 4 W., USM

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONs (Show whether Dr. xT, on, etc.) 12. COUNor om PARISH 18. aT&Ta

43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

GiackAppropnote BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO: SUBazQUNNT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT-OFF PUI.L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELI.

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CITANGE PLANs (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of mtiltiple completion on WeL(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBË PROPOSED OR COM1'LETED OPERATTONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and rneasured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

FEBRUARY REPORT:

2-1 & 2-74: T.D. 3500'; drilling Duchesne River formation.
2-3 thru 6-74: T.D. 3500'; ran 87 jts. of 9-5/8", 40#, K-55, STC casing and landed at

3457'. Ran Hallibruton guide shoe and float collar on bottom jt. Ran
9-5/8" centralizers at 3437, 3397, and 3356'. cementedwith 1600 sacks
of 65-35 Pozmix with 1/4# Flocele/sack followed by 250 sacks 50-50 Pozmix
with 1/4# Flocele/sack and tailed in with 50 sacks class "G" with l/4#
Flocele/sack. Pumped cement at 500 psi and bumped plug at 8:00 PM,
2-3-74 with 1000 psi. Checked float held OK. Cemented outside 9-5/8"
with 2 acks 25% cal Seal and 200 sacks class "G" with 3% cacl2. No
cement returns to surface. Cemented outside 9-5/8" casing with 2ûD
sacks class "G" containing 25% cal seal and 2gsacks of class "G"
containing 3% CaC12. Good returns to surface. WOC. Tested wellhead
to 2500 psi; held OK. Nippled up and tested BOP and manifold to 3000
psi and hydril to 2000 psi; held OK. Drilled cement top at 3417 and
shoe at 3457; began dri11ing new formation at 3500'.

2-7 thru 28-74: T.D. 7705·; drilling Green River formation.

ta. I pr tru

ITLE

Ort9hern M() ations
March 13, 1974

( space for Federal or State omee'use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TEOF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other Instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERIAL NO.OIL GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for auch proposala.)

1• 3. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
WELLL GABLL

OTHER

2. NAME OF OPEBATOR 8.FARM OR LEAsz NAMM

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. Annamaa or ormaaron Suite 320 Plaza West """ "°·

l537 Avenue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION or WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. risto AND Poot, on wlLDCATSee also space 17 below.)at surrace NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. l S., R. A W., USM 11.amse e .,u.,onnar.x.xxo

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

14. PERMIT NO. 16. BI.EVATroNa (Show whether or, nT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 18. STATE43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

"· CheckAppropnate BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or ther Data
NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO* SUBSEQUENT REPORT 09:

TEST WATER BRUT•ONT PUIL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

BHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)

- ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PnnPosEn OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertt-

nent to this Work.) *

MARCHREPORT:

3-1 thru 31-74: T.D. 11,096'; drilling Green Riyer formation.

18. I hpreby certif t to o a true and correct Manager of Operations
SIG TITLE Northern District osos April ll, 1974

(This space for Federal or State ofBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See Instructionson ReverseSide



For OG C-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE•

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5, LEASE DESIONATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRISE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for auch proposals.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAME 07 OPEBATOR 8. FARhl OR LEASE NAME

MAPCO I nc. Ol sen
a. Annamssorormaaron Suite 320 Plaza West o.w.z.r.no.

l537 Avenue D, Bi11ings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCArroN or w:LL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND TOOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
Atsurface NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11. ame z.,..,x.,oaanx.xxo

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USN

14. Paam:2 No. 15. mLsvATroNs (Show whether or, RT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY 02 PARISH 18. STATE43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

10. ÛIecit Appropnote BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or OtiserData
NOTICE 07 INTENTION 20: BUSSEQUENT REPORT 09:

TasT WATER amuz•OPP PULL OR ALTEft CAslNG WATER SHUW•OFF REPAIRINO WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

ŠHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SEIOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)
(Nomm: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)

-- ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clently state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

APRIL REPORT;

4-1 thru
4-8-74: T.D. ll .935'; dri ll ing Green River formation.

4-9 & 10-74: T.D. 11,935'; spotted 74 barrels 10.0 ppg mud on bottom at 11,935'.
Tripped out. Stuck DP at 3481'. Jarred DP loose and completed trip out.
Picked up mill and junk basket and tripped in. Washed and reamed
tight hole from 6895 to 7380.

4-11 & 12-74: T.D. 11,935'; tripped out and worked pipe in tight hole at 4066'. Could
not move drill string up. Picked up string reamer and tripped in
to tight spot with reamer. Reamed tight hole for 4 hours unt¡l
hole freed up. Tripped out. Cleaning junk basket full of junk. Tripped
in to 10,000' and attempted to circulate; could not. Lost 800 barrels
mud. Attempted to unplug bit without success. Tripping out.

4-13-74: T.D. 11,935'; unplugged bit and drill collars. Tripped in to 3560'.
Conditioned mud and drilled bridge at 3560·. Tripped in to 10,000'.
Conditioned mud, built mud volume and pumped 2 Pal Mix pills (35 bbls.
and 50 bb1s.) at 10,000'.

4-14-74: T.D. 11,935·; Built mod volume and pumped 40 barrel Pal M¡x pill at
10,005·. Lost 700 bbls mud. Reamed and washed through bridge. Tripped
in and reamed 30' to bottom. Drilled from 11,935 to 11,938'. Lost

-4-7 CONTINUTED ON PAGE 2 ---

18. I hpreby certif a for true and correct Manager of Operat ions
SIGNED TITLE Northern District May 10, 1974

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPit0VAL, IF ANY:

*See inskuenonson Reverse



n°
= - AGE 2 --

Form OGCC-1 be
STATE OF UTAH SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE•

(Other Instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEAsa DzstoNATIoN ANo ama:AL No.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF MDUN, MOTTES OR Tm3 NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drtil or to deepen or plug back to a different reservotr.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for sueb proposala.)

1. 7. UNtraoammunNT NAM:
OIT. GAB
WELL WELL OTHzx

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. Vanal og LEASE NAMN

MAPCOInc. Olsen
s. Annamme or oramazon Suite 320 Plaza West o. wiin no.

1537 Avenue D, Bi ll ings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND TOOL, OR WII,DCATSee also space 17 below.)staurface NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. A W., USM 11. ascGarfai°'oh°iÌI.E.AND

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. l .S., R. 4 W., USM

14. Psax12 No. - 15. ar.svAtroNs (Show whether er, RT. on, etc.) 12. COUNTY 02 PARIEN 18. BTATS43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

"· CheckAppropnete BoxTo Indicate Natwoof Notice,Report,or OtherData
WOTICli of INTENTIOW 20: BUssaqumNT asPORT 09:

TEST WATER BRO OPP PUI.L OR ALTER .CASING wATER SHUW•OFT REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TERAT AICLTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDISB ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CEIANGE PLANs (Other)
Othe (Notz: Report results of multiple conspletion on Wel( r) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

$Î. ÐESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting aproposed work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perŸiment to this Work.) *

APRIL REPORT: Continued from Page 1 --

circulation and build mud volume. Lost 700 barrels mud at 11,938'.
Began pulling drill pipe; hole was tight.

4-15 s 16-74: T.D. 11,9381; worked pipe out of tight hole from bottom to 11,500';
tripping out. Picked up taper tap, bumper sub, jars and tripped in.
Washed 60' to top of fish. Circulated above fish. Pulled out in
tight hole from 11,938 to 11,750; tripped out.

4-17-74: T.D. 11, 938'; did not recover fish. Tripped in with taper tap, bumper
sub and jars to top of fish and circulated. Tripped out; did not
recover fish. Tripping in with taper tap, 6 point reamer, bumper sub
and jars.

4-1.8 & 19-74: T.D. 11,938'; washed and circulated to top of fish. Fished and tripped
out of hole. Did not recover°fish. Changed out taper tap and tripped
in to top of fish. Circulated and fished for bit and junk sub.
Milled over fish and tripped out.

4-20 & 21-74: T.D. 11,938'; completed trip out; did not recover fish. Fish in hole --

junk sub and bit. Picked up overshot and tripped in hole. Circulated
and washed to top of fish. Milled on fish. Tripped out. Recovered
approximately 2/3 of junk sub skirt. Picked up overshot and tripped in.

--- CONTINUTED ON PAGE 3 ---

18. I bpreby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Manager of 0perations
szowso E. J. 1111L TITLE Northern District

hia space for Federal or State odice use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



..
. a. - PAGE 3 --

Forra OGCC-1 be
STATE OF UTAH SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse alde) 5. LEAss azaioNATloN .aND amatAL No.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

. ir INDIAN. ALLOTTES OR TREBË NAMESUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--•" for auch proposala.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT WAM3
OILLL OABLL O 42-

2. NAME 07 OrzmATOR 8. TARM on LEASE NAME

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. Annaass or oransson Suite 320 Plaza West """">°·

l537 Avenue D, Bi11ings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION or wzt,L (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirementa.* 10. PIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)at surrac' NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. A W., USM 11. axe.,2.,...x.,oaar.x.axo

Duchesne County, Utah Sect ion 27
T. l S., R. A W., USM14. PERMIT Ito. 15. BLaTATIONS (Show whether or, RT, ox, etc.) 12. CouWTY os PARIan 18. a:Ars43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

to· CheckAppropnateBoxTo Indicate Netwoof Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICS 47 INTENTION 20: BUSSEQUNNT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BEUT477 PUI.L on ALTER CASING WATER SHUT•OTP REPAIRING WELL
PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAstNG
SHOOT OR ACIDIES ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANS (Other)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)

_- ('ompletton or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CUMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clettrly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-nent to this Work.) *

APRIL REPORT: Continued from Page 2 --

4-22 & 23-74: T.D. 11,938'; circulated and washed over fish. Tripped out of hole. .

Found overshot skirt split. Picked up new overshot. Ran in to 3400 .

Stopped to build 500 barrel mud volume. Shut down 15 hours to repair
tail shaft sprocket on No. 1 engine.

4-24 thru
4-27-74: T.D. 11,938'; continued fishing and milling on junk; continued mud loss -

4-25, 220 bbls; 4-26, 250 bbls; 4-27, 400 bbls.
4-28-74: T.D. 11,938'; lost 420 bbls. mud; built 600 bbis. volume. Washed past

junk at 11,938' and resumed drilling.
4-29 & 30-74: T.D. 12,1701; drilling Wasatch Red Beds.

18. I hproby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Manager of Operations
BIGNED TIT E Northern District

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Torm OGCC I be
ST A TE OF UT A H SCB'd1T IN TRIPLICMI'E•

(Other Instructions on re•
verse alde) 5. LEASE DESIONATIOÑAND 3ERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. 17 INDuN, NOTTER OR Tm3 NAM3

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug bac1c to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposals.)

1• 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

Om CAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. Naxx or orzaatoa 8. rAnu om I.zAsa NAMS

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s, snaamanorormaston Suite 320 Plaza West s.w.or.no.

1537 Avenue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27.
4. I.oCATIoN or wELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requiremente.• 10. raato AND root, on witocar

Smalsospace17below.)at.uwace NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont
Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11. a=c., ,a., ., ar.x.a.

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S., R. 4 V., USM

14. Psaut? No. 1ð. ar.avATroNs (Show whether er, NT, ca. etc.) 12. couNTY on PAaras! 18. BTats
43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

ze· CheckAppropnoteBoxToIndicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
WOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUB3mqUNNT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER BRUT4)?? TUI.L OR ALTER _CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MUL1'IPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OA ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (ÛtÎlPT)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17• DESCRtBE PROPOSED OR CUM1'LETF.D OPERATioNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, itseluding estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all mariers and nones perti-
nent to daiaWorlm)*

MAYREPORT:
5-1 thru 4-74:T.D. 12,503'; drilling wasatch Red Beds formation.
5-5 a 6: T.D. 12,503'; rigged up schlumberger. Tr,ipped in with DILL-8 and BHC Sonic

GR logging tool. Tool failed on bottom. .Pulled out of hole. Changed
logging tool and ran the following logs: Dual Induction Laterolog 8
from 12,492-3437'; BHC Sonic Gamma Ray from 12,484-6000'; FDC-CNL from
12,494-6000'. Circulating and conditioning hole for casing.

5-7 s 8: T.D. 12,503'; ran 300 jts. of 7-5/8", 26.40, 29.70, 33.70, 39#, 95 grade,
Buttress and LTC casing with Halliburton guide shoe and differential fillup
float collar on bottom jt. Landed casing at 12,503'. Hall¡burton cemented
with 175 sacks 65-35 Pozmix containing 10% salt, 0.5% CFR-2, 0.2% HRA, k#
Flocele per sack followed by 200 sacks 50-50 Pozmix containing 2% gel,
10% salt, 0.5% CFR-2, 0.2% HR4, à# Flocele per sack, and t:ailed in with
100 sacks Class "G" containing.lo% salt, 0.5% CFR-2, 0.2% HR4, &# Flocele
per sack. Circulated with 80 to 90% returns at 1800 psi. Bumped plug at
12:30 PM, 5-8-74 with 3300 psi. Float holding. WOC.

5-9 thru 12: T.D. 12,503·; completed nippling up and tested BOP stack and manifold to
5000 psi, Hydril to 3000 psi; all held OK. Drilled float collar and cement.
Cement top at 12,408 and float collar at 12,416'.

5-13 thru 31: T.D. 14,364'; drilling Wasatch Red Beds formation.

18. I hpreby certify a e r,egoln e and correct ÑBnag€r OŸ Ûp€ratlODS

SIGNED thern DÎStrÎCt e Ì), Î¶|Ñ
(Thla apace for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OFAPPROVAL,IFANY:

*See Instructionson Reverse



Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERig NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTRE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRYNOTIŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposala.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NA¼E
011. GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8.FARM OB LEASE NAMS

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. Ananans or orasaxon Suite 320 Plaza West ã. war.r. úö.

1537 Avenue D, Bi ll ings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION or wzz.I. (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD ÀD POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
at surrace NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11. auch""oÏ"°"maSI.R.AND

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. I S., .R._ 4 W., .USM

14. PERMzz NO• 15. ELEVATroNa (Show whether or, RT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARIER 18. STATE43-013-30064 64992 G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

to CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBSEQURNT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT-Orr PULL OR ALTER .CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPL10 COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CIIANGE PLANS (Other)

(Other) (NoTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel
(knipletion or Recornpletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED Oli COMI'LETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting an,y
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertt-
nent to this Work.) •

JUNE REPORT:

6-1 thru 6: Drilled to 14,787'; lost complete returns. Built volume and attempted to
circulate, no returns. Built volume, filled annulus. Lost 1000 barrels mud.

6-7 thur 13: T.D. 14,787'; attempted to circulate and fill annulus with bit at 12,325'.
Build mud volume; could not circulate. Lost total 6600 barrels mud.
Rigged up Schlumberger and ran tracer log on 6-13-74. Losing mud below
7-5/8" casing.

6-14 & 15: T.D. 14,787'; tripped in hole with open ended DP. Halliburton cemented
at 14,753' with 100 sacks Class "G" and 1/8# tuff-fibre per sack. Pulled
26 stands to 12,270'. WOCand built volume. Tripped in to 14,0411. Attempted
to circulate, 80% returns, decreased to zero. Cemented at 14,043' with
100 sacks Class "G" and 1/8# tuff-fibre per sack. Pulled 18 stands to
12,270'. WOCand keeping annulus full.

6-16 thru 22: T.D. 14,787'; ran temperature survey. Survey indicated losing below 13,700'.
WOC. Ran 14 stands to 13,700' and attempted to wash b ridges. Cemented with
50 sacks Class "G" and 1/8# tuff-fibre per sack. Pulled 14 stands to
12,270', WOC. Ran in 11 stands, tagged soft cement at 13,323'. Circulated
with returns, returns dropped off to zero. Cemented with 150 sacks 50-50
Pozmix with 1/8# tuff-fibre per sack. Tagged soft cement at 13,020'. WOC.
Circulating with 50% returns at 13,020'. Cemented with 150 sacks 50-50

- CONTI,NUEDON PAGE 2 ---

18. I apretry cerar te true and correct Manager of Operations
mieny

. ¡ L
Northern District July 10, 1974

(This space for Federal or State otBee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



ForinOGCC-1be
S TA TE OF U TA H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEAsa DEstoNATrox AND amatAt. NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1. 7. tÌNIT AGREEMENT NAMS
WraL

LL w
eeLLO ox...

2. NAME OF OPEBATOR 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. Annanas or ormaaron Su i te 320 Pl a za Wes t o. waar, no.

1537 Avenue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATroN or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WII.DCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At.neace NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11..se ., o mar.xxo

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

14. PERMIT NO. 15. BI.svArroNs (Show whether or, ar, en, etc.) 12. COUNTY 05 PARISH 18. STATE43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne utah
ze· Geek Appropnote BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBBBQUNNT REPOAT OF•

TEST WATER BRUT•0FF PULL OR ALTER CASINO WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTORW TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

BHOOT OR ACIDDE15 ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZTNG ABANDON&iENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NoTE: Report reattlts of multiple completion on. Wel(Other)

- . Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17, OSSCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and trtte vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

JUNE REPORT: - Continued --

Pozmix containing .03% HR4 and 1/8# tuff-fibre per sack. WOC. Tagged
green cement at 11,439'. WOC. Tripped in to 3373' with bit. Worked by
bridge. Tripped out. Tripped and set impression Block. Set Retrievable
Bridge Plug at 2046'. Nippled down 6" BOP, nippled up 10" BOP.

6-23: Moved bridge plug from 2046 to 5580'. Laid down 7-5/8" casing, 3373'.
Set spear at 3460' and pulled 20,000#; held OK. Pulled up to 34001 and reset
spear. Pulled 20,000# above neutral point.

6-24: Picked up 2 new joints 39 70# and ran back in hole with total 80 joints
of 7-5/8" casing. Screwed into 7-5/8" casing. Attempted to pressure up on
casing, no pressure; hole in casing. Set OCT slips, landed casing with
20,000# on slips. Cut off 7-5/8" casing and nippling down 100 BOP stack.

6-25 & 30: Chnaged out BOP stack. Tested Yellow Jacket, BOP manifold to 5000 spi and
hydril to 03000 psi. Ran in 38 stands to 35801 to locate hole in casing.
Isolated hole in casing.between 337l' and 3382'. Ran in 5 stands and spotted
2 sacks sand on retrievable bridge plug. Pulled back to 3255'. Squeezed
with 150 sacks class "G" cement with 1% CaCl . Did not get a squeeze.
Squeezed with 100 sacks class "G" cement wit 2% CaCl2. Staged cement to
1500 psi. WOC. Ran RTTS tool to 3255·. Halliburton squeezed 100 sacks
class "G" cement and 2% CaCl2, Max. standing pressure 2000 psi. Chained out
with RTTS tool, WOC,

18. I hpreby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Manager of Operations
SIGNED TITLE Northern District

(This apace for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVEDBY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONSOFAPPROVAL,IFANY:

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



Form OGCC-1 be
ST A TE OF UT A H x x scaxxx IN TRIPLICATE•

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) 5. i.cAsa oza10NATION AND SERIAI. NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
IF INNN, AI.I.OTTER 08 TERE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposala.)

1. 7. L'NIT 102xxMSNT NAM3
OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAxa or ormastos 8. rann on I.zABE NAxa
MAPCO I nc. O1sen

a. Anossas or oramazon Su i te 320 Pl aza Wes t a. war.z. no.

1537 Avenue D, Bi ll ings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION or wrLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIEE.D AND POOL, 05 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)st aurrae. NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11.soc.,2.,s.,s., ar.x.ann

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. l S., R. 4 W., USM

14. PaaMIT,No. 16. aLEVATroNa (Show whether or, RT. on, etc.) 12. CooNTY os PARIsu 18. s:Ata43-013-30064 6499' G.L- - 6520' K.B. Duchesne utah
1e· CheckAppropnote BoxToIndicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData

NOTICE OP IWTENTION TO: SUBERQUENT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT-OPP PULL OR ALTER C.tSING WATER SHUT•Orr REFAIRIMO WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATHENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON SHOOTING OR ACIDIZINO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
Other (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel

completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DgsCRIBE PitnPOSED OR COM1*LETED OPERATro.ms (Clearly stat.•all pertinent derails, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) •

JULY REPORT:
7-1-74: T.D. 14,787'; drilled 60' solid cement from 3350 to 3410'. Tripped to

bridge plug at 5585'. Washed top of plug and circulated water out with
14.6 ppg mud. Tripped in to 5585' with retriever; retrieved plug and
chained out.

7-2 thru 7-5: Drilled hard cement from 11,346 to 14,787'. Circulating hole with full
returns prior to trip.

7-6-74: T.D. 14,758'; made a 29' uphole SLM correction from 14,787 to 14,7581.
Reaming to bottom at 14,136'.

7-7 thru 7-9: Resumed drilling and drilled to 14,965'.
7-10 thru 7-14: Isolated leak in 7-5/8" casing at approximately 3371'. Spotted sand on

bridge plug at 5613'. Pulled 10 stands to 3255' and set Hall iburton
RTTS tool at 3255·. Hal1iburton pumped 100 sacks of Class "G" and
displaced out of DP. Staged 1 barrel every 30 minutes. Halliburton
spotted 100 sacks of Class "G". Closed Hydril. WOC. Drilled green
cement from 3350 to 3380; lost returns. Halliburton squeezed 200
sacks of Class "G". WOC.

7-15 thru 7-17: T. D. 14.;965'; fishing for and reaming on bridge plug.
7-18 thru 7-27: Laid down mill and picked up bit. Circulated and washed past junk.

Resumed drilling and drilled to 15,667'. Lost circulation.
7-28 thru 7-31: T.D. 15,66T'; attempting to regain circulation; well kicked. Pumped

14.0 q mud down DP to kill well.
18. I hpreby certify e and correct Manager Of ÛpeTéltlODS

sicNao Trr Northern District ,1'E August 15, 1974

TÑsapace for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seeinnructionson Reverse



FormOGCC-Ib.
ST A TE OF UT A H SCBMIT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other Instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DzataNATION AND RERIAL NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTKES AND REPORTSON WELLS
0. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTRE OR TRIBE lia3tm

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposala.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAS
waCE, wmLt. OTHzz

2. Nams or orzaatoa 8. rian OR LEAS3 NAMS

MAPC0 Inc. Olsen
8. ADDRE38 07 OPS2ATOR

SUi te 320 Plaza West a. war.r. no.

1537 Avenue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION or wELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. rtBLD AND POOL OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)atsunace NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont
Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM . 11. ascilli'a!"oÏ'°iÎa.ann
Duchesne County, Utah Section 27

T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USN
14. PERailT NO. 18. ELEVATroNa (Show whether er, NT, an, etc.) 12. COUNTY Os PAmtsN 18. stàTa43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

ze· CheckAppropnoteBoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBSEQUNNT REPORT OT:

TEST WATER BRUT4FP PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRINO WELL .
PRACTURE TREAT Mt'LTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATHENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIzB ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL C11ANCE PLANs (Other)

(Other) (NOTE: Report results Of multiple COxupletion on Wel
-- (kmpletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. or:SCRIBE Pit0POSED 14 COMPLETED OPERATioNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed _work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vettical depths for all markers and zones perti-nant¾thiswork)*

AUGUST REPORT:

8-1-74: T.D. 15,667'; pumped 14.5 ppg mud through choke killing well. Started to
trip to bottom. Could not move DP. Stuck with bit at 12,648'.

8-2 thru 8-3: Working stuck DP with bit at 12,648'.
8-4-74: T.D. 15,667'; tripped in with Halliburton RTTS and set retrievable bridge

plug at 78121. Halliburton squeeze cemented with 100 sacks Class G".
8-5-74: Drilled hard cement from 3215· to 3390'.
8-6-74: Tripped in to retrieve Halliburton bridge plug at 7812'. Released plug

and circulated bottoms up.
8-7 thru 10: Circulated above fish and screwed into same. Chained out of hole.

Recovered all of fish. Washing to bottom at 12,8591. Hit bridge and
washed to 13,211'. Washing and reaming to 13,517, 13,813, 14,515 and
15,667' (0.T.D.).

8-11-74: T.D. 15,672'; drilled to 15,672' when standpipe developed a leak. Repaired
same and resumed operations. Drilling string would not move.

8-12 thru 17: T.D. 15,672'; working tight pipe; unable to rotate. Jarred on fish at
15,610. Spotted 50 barrels diesel (10 bbls. into annulus every 20 mins.).
Jarred fish out; circulating bottoms up, at 12,079'. Waiting on motors,
2 out.

8-18 thru 23: Circulating open ended at 12,079'; waiting on motors.
--- CONTINUED ON PAGE 2 ---

18. I hpreby y b to g is true an corre Manager of Operations

SIGNEDy
. L

Northern District 9-14-74

APPROVEDBY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL,1F ANY:

*Seelnstructionson



PAGE 2
orm OGCC-I be my ' i

ST A TE OF A H sta IT m TMPucA -

(Othgr Jnstructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEAaa DzatoNArtoN .aNo saatAL No,

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRY NOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drtil or to deepen or plug back to a dlfterent reserrotr.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposaJa.)

1. 7. UNIT A0xxzMENT NAM3
OTL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NA3Im 07 OFZaATOR 8, PARat 08 L3ASE NAME

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. sooa==a er or=nzon Suite 320 Plaza West ©· """•"°·

1537 Avenue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. I.ocation or wrLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.' 10. FIELO AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See alao space 17 below.)
at .unac' NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Al tamont

Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., usM 11..=«. 2.g., .. ar...ana

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. 1 S., R. 4 V., USM

14. Panutz No. 15. aLsvAtroNe (Show whether or, xT, an. etc.) 12. COUNTY om FAmtam 18. stAta43-013-30064 6499' G.L- - 6520' K.B. Duchesne utah
ze· CheckAppropnate BoxToindicateNatureof Notice,Report,or OtherData

NOTICE 07 INTENTION TO: BURS3QURNT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT•OPP PUI.L OR ALTzn CASING wATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MCLTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAstNG

BMOOT OR ACIDI25 ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ActDI2ING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL Ct!ANCE PLANS (Other)

(Other)
(NOTE: Report results of tuultiple completion on Wel
('ompletton or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIDE PunPOSED R CUM1'LETED OPERATioNs (Clearly state all pertinent d••tails, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for att markers and zones perti.
hent to this Work.) *

AUGUST REPORT: Continued --

8-24 thru 27: T.D. 15684'; motors installed and checked. Tripped in to shoe at 12,503'
and strapped in. Tagged bridge at 15,3026. Washed and reamed to 16,489;
hole sticky. Washed and reamed 15,300-15,672', 15,644-15,684. Resumed
drilling.

8-28 thru 31: T.D. 15,805'; reached total depth of 15,805', 8-29-74. circulating and
conditioning hole for logging.

FORMATIONTOPS:

Lower Green River Marker I 10,421' (-3901) (log top)
Top Wasatch Red Beds 12,040' (-5520) (sample top)
Base Wasatch Red Beds . 13,864' (-7344) (sample top)

18. I hpreby certify that the foregolog is true and correct gangggy g† Opera pg

Northern DistrictsicNao E. J. fli lL TITLE
. DATE

(This space for Federal or State ofice use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See instructionson ReverseSide



Forrn OÒCC-I be
ST A TE OF UT A H SCBL(IT IN TRIPLICATE*

(Other instructions on re-
verse side) . LEASE DESIGNATION AND BERRAL NO.

011,, & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

SUNDRYNOTIGS AND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use thia form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-' for such proposala.)

1. 7. UNIT 10xžžMSNT NAME

OTL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2. Waxa OF OrmaATOS 8. FARM 02 LEAax NAMA

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. ADDRESS OF OPUSAzoa Sui te 320 Plaza West a. war.r. no.

1537 Avenue D, Bi ll ings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LocattoN or wmLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)m andae. NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont
$ection 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11.ase z.,s.,x., ar.x.ano

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
T. I S., R. 4 W., USM

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVArrows (Show whether er, xT, on, etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARIBlij 18. STATE
43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. - Duchesne Utah

te· CheckAppropnete BoxTo Indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 60BliBQURNT REPORT 07:

TEST WATER BRUT477 PUI.L OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr RETAININO WELL

TRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE T3EAT3tENT ALTERING CABING

NOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONNENT*

REPAIR WELL C1tANGE PLANS (Other)
(NOTE: Report resttits of multiple completion on Wel

(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)
17. DESCRIBB Pit0POSED OR COM1'LETED OPERATIONs (Clearly staite all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any

proposed work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

SEPTEMBER REPORT:

9-1-74: T.D. 15,805'; schlumberger ran the following logs: BHC Sonic-GR 12,522-

15,792'; Dual Induction Laterolog 12,524-15,804'; FDC-CNL-GR 12,522-
15,7761.

9-2 & 3: Halliburton pumped mud flush and invert (265.5 barrels). Flowed back
10 barrels. Ran 97 joints 51" liner, 3326.50', including shoe and hanger.
Liner set at 15,556', top at 12,2001. Set TIN liner hanger. Rigged up GO
and ran Otis type "WB" 7-5/8" packer. Set at 12,189', tail assembly at
12,2241. Tripped in to displace mud with water.

9-4 & 5: Laid down drill pipe, drill collars and kelly. Cleaning pits. .Removed
BOP stack. Installed xmas tree. RELEASED RlG 4 PM, 9-5-74.

9-6 thru 30: T.D. 15,805'; rigging down rotary tools and waiting on completion rig.

18. I hpreby certify e re o true and correct Manager OÌ ÛperatlODS

sicaan TITLE Northern District DATE October 10, 1974

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE Dygg
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

Seeinstructionson Reverse



For OGCC 1 Be
S TA TE OF UT A H SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE•

(Other Instructions on re-
verse side) 5. LEASE DzatŠNATION .4ND BExtAL NO.OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

0. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTES OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRYNOTKESAND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reserrotr.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for auch proposala.)

1. 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
OIL GAN
WELL WELL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR 8. FIRM OA LEASE NANS

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
s. Annassa or oramazon Su i te 320 Pl a za Wes t e. w.z.r. no.

1537 Avenue D, Billings, Montana 59102 1 - 27
4. LOCATioN or wzLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. rrato AND room, on witocar

See also space 17 below.)at.unac' NE NE (1200' FNL & 1200' FEL) Altamont
Section 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM 11. ame 2"a'"J"Zaar.x.ana
Duchesne County, Utah Section 27

T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM
14. PERMIT No. 15. at.svATroNs (Show whethär or, xT, on, sto.) 12. COUNTY 02 PARIEN 18. STATE43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

le• CheckAppropnote BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice,Report,or OtherData
NOTICS 07 INTENTION TO: BURSEQUENT REPOET 07:

TEST WATER BRUT·Orr PULL OR ALTER CASING -WATER SHUT-Orr REFAIRING WELL

PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATRENT ALTERING CAstNO

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* BHOOTING OR ACIDIZINO ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANs (Other)
(NoTE: Report results of multiple completica on Wel(Other) ('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Cleurly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertteal depths for all markers and zones perti-
nent to this Work.) *

OCTOBER REPORT:

See attached daily report sheets for monthly report.

18. I hpreby certify tt and correct ana gy gg Opeçag
Northern District Nov. 15, 1974

SIGNED TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State omce use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seeinstructionson Reverse



DAILY DRILLING REPORT PAGE 47

MAPCO INC., OLSEN NO. l-27

NE/4 NE/4 SEC. 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

9-26-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

9-27-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

9-28-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

9-29-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

9-30-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

10-1-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

10-2-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on completion rig.

10-3-74 T.D. 15,805'; picked up Otis Seal Assembly, "J" Latch and mule
shoe guide. Ran 202 joints 2-7/8", 6.5#, N-80 Armco Nu-lock
tubing, 1 X-over joint, 10 joints 2-7/8" 6.50#, N-80 CS Hydril
tubing. Hydrotested all tubing to 10,000 psi. SDON.

10-4-74 T.D. 15,805'; ran 191 joints CS Hydril, 2-7/8", 6.5#/ft., 1-10'
CS Hydril sub, 1 double pin CS Hydril change over, 1 Joint CS
Hydril 6.5#/ft. and OCT tubing hanger, spaced out, stung into
packer. Set 20,000# on packer, pulled 20,000# over tubing weight.
Stung out of packer and hydrotested hanger. All tubing hydrotested
to 10,000 psi. Tagged packer top @ 12,160' KB. Total tuhing run:
202 joints Armco Nu-lock, l joint x-over, 201 Joints CS Hydril,
1-10' sub Hydril, 1 joint CS Hydril.

10-5-74 T.D. 15,805'; circulated hole with 500 barrels fresh water.
Returns were clean. Spotted CaCl2 (10#/gal) treated with KW-12
Inhibitor, K-4-70 Oxygen Scavenger from 5000' to 12,166' in
annulus. Stung into Otis packer with 6000# set down on packer.
Checked J latch assembly by pulling 20,000# over tubing weight.
Ran 159 joints 2-3/8" 0.D., EUE, 8 rd, 4.70# tubing. Landed in
hanger @5,012 KB. Removed 80P. Installed tree. Pressure tested
to 10,000 psi with OCT test



DAILY DR1LLING REPORT PAGE 48

MAPC0 INC., OLSEN NO. 1-27

NE/4 NE/4 SEC. 27, T. 1 s., R. 4 W., USM

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10-6-74 T.D. 15,805'; pressure tested tubing, tree leaking @7000 psi.
Removed and redressed sleeves and reinstalled. Pressured up to
7000 psi, tree leaking. Removed tree, reset production tubing
hanger and heat string tubing hanger and installed tree. Pressured
up to 5000 psi with ocT hand pump. Pressured tree and production
string to 10,000 psi. Held pressure for 15 minutes; no leaks.
Pressure tested casing to 2350 psi. Pressure broke to 600 psi,
bled to zero in 10 minutes. Leak in 7-5/8" casing. Established
injection rate of .30 BPM @ 525 psi. Shut down pump. Annulus
bled to zero. Removed tree. Rigged up BOP's. Pulled 159 joints
2-3/8" 0.D., EUE, 8 rd tubing. Stung out of packer. Let CaCl2
equalize in tubing (tubing full of fresh water). Pulled 6 stands
2-7/8" CS Hydril. Shut down for weekend.

10-7-74 T.D. 15,805'; shut down for weekend.

10-8-74 T.D. 15,805'; pulled 196 stands and 1 single x-over joint.
Waited on Howco tools 3/4 hour. Picked up Howco bridge and
RTTS packer, tripped in hole to 3,634'. Set Howco BP. Pulled 7
joints. Set packer @3,412'. Pressured up tubing. Pumped into -

leak 2 BPM and 500 psi. Hooked to annulus. Pressured to 2000
psi; held OK. Released packer. Ran 2 joints in hole to 3,474'.
Pressured tubing to 3500 psi; held OK. Pressured casing; not
holding. Pumped 3 BPM @ 1200 psi. Ran 5 joints, picked up BP. Ran

5 more joints to 3,788', set BP. Pulled 2 joints.. Pressure tested
BP to 3500 psi; held OK. Spotted 3 sacks sand on BP. Pulled 20
joints to 3,097'. set packer. Pressured annulus to 1000 psi.
Pumped 5 barrels water @ 21 BPM and 1200 psi. Mixed 200 sacks Class
"C" Neat cement (42 barrel slurry), Displaced cement into leak.
Clearing packer by 2 barrels @750 psi. Shut down for 10 minutes,
500 psi standing pressure. Left 14 barrel slurry in 7-5/8" casing.
Pumped i barrel. Pressured up to 3000 psi; let set 10 minutes.
Bled back. Squeeze holding. Repressured to 3000 psi. Bled back;
cement holding. Released pressure on annulus. _Unset packer.
Reverse out to pit with 36 barrels fresh water. Squeeze formation
with 140 sacks Class "G" regular; left 60 sacks inside casing.

10-9-74 T.D. 15,805'; pulled 92 joints and RTTS packer. Rigged up swivel,
picked up 61" RR DTJ Bit, bit sub. Ran 101 joints. Tagged hard
cement @3,122'. Drilled cement to 3,322'. Circulated hole
clean. SDON. Approximately 120' of cement left to



DAILY DRILLING REPORT PAGE 49

MAPCO INC., OLSEN NO. 1-27

NE/4 NE/4 SEC. 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10-10-74 T.D. 15*,805'; drilled 77' of cement. Bottom of cement @ 3461'.
Circulated hole clean. Closed 80P's. Pressure tested to 2500
psi; held for 15 minutes, did not bleed off. Ran in hole to
3757'. Hit sand and cement bridge. Circulated and rotated through
bridge. Ran 1 joint, tagged bridge plug, cleaned sand off plug.
Tripped out with 122 joints. Picked up retrieving head. Tripped
in to get bridge plug. Retrieved plug. Tripped out of hole. SDON.

10-11-74 T.D. 15,805'; rigged down drilling equipment. Picked up seal
assembly. Pressure tested to 10,000 psi; held OK. Ran 202 joints
Nu-lock, 1 x-over joint, 80 joints CS Hydril. Closed pipe rams.
Pressure tested casing to 2350 psi; held for I minute. Pressure
was not bleeding, then broke down and bled to 400 psi in 1 minute,
then bled to zero. Rigged down hydrotesters. Started pulling
tubing and seal assembly for squeeze job. SDON. Rate was 1 BPM
@ 400 psi into casing hole.

10-12-74 T.D. 15,805'; completed trip out with seal assembly. Picked up
Howco BP and RTTS and tripped in hole. Set packer @ 3407'.
Pressurea annuius to 2000 psT; heta Raieased þressure: RŒset
packer Liiñóf. Pfesisurect anriulus, leaRing. EstabTithed" rajection
rate of 2 BPM @900 psi. Shut down, bled back pressure. Released
packer. Set BP @3780'. Pressure tested BP to 3500 psi; luald.
Spotted 300 pounds sand on BP. Pulled up and reset packer @ 30942.
Mixed and pumped 200 sacks Class "G" Neat Cement. _Displaced all
cement 8 barrels below packer. Shut down 950 psi. Staged in
160 sacks until standing pressure reached 2700 psi. Maximum squeeze
pressure 2900 psi. Left 40 sacks cement in casing. Released
pressure. No flow back. Unseated RTTS packer. Reverse with 30
barrels water with rua cement returns. Pulled and laid down RTTS.
Started rigging up to trip back in hole. Tripped in with bit to
drill cement.

10-13-74 T.D. 15,805'; tripped in hole with 61" bit. Tagged cement. Cement
soft from 3301-3311', hard from 3311-3400', soft from 3400-3461'.
(cement bottom). Ran tubing and bit to 3553'. Circulated hole
clean. Pressure tested squeeze to 2000 psi; held for 15 minutes.
Tripped to 3764'. Tagged sand, circulated out cement chunks
plugging bit during drilling and circulating sand. Circulated hole
clean on top of BP. Hung back drilling equipment. Pulled 4 stands.
Shut down for weekend.

10-14-74 T.D. 15,805'; shut down for



' DAILY DRILLING REPORT PAGE 50

MAPCO INC., OLSEN NO. 1-27

NE/4 NE/4 SEC. 27, T. 1 S., R. A W., USM

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10-15-74 T.D. 15,805'; tripped out with bit. Picked up Rowco bridge plug
retrieving tool and tripped in. Washed down. Tripped out with Howco
bridge plug. Picked up Otis seal assembly, mule guide shoe and "J"
Latch assembly. Pressure tested to 10,000 psi. Tripped in hole
with 163 joints 2-7/8" Nu-lock, 6.50#, N-80 tubing. SDON.

10-16-74 T.D. 15,805'; tripping in hole with 39 joints 2-7/8" Nu-10k, 6.5#
tubing, 1 joint x-over to CS Hydril, 202 joints CS Hydril 2-7/8"
tubing. Landed in production hanger. Latched into "J" Latch
assembly with 6000# set down weight. Ran 159 joints 2-3/8", 4.70#,
Brd EUE tubing for heat string. Landed in hanger § 5012 KB. Set
tree on after removing BOP's. SDON. All 2-7/8" tubing was hydro-
tested to 10,000 psi with no leaks.

10-17-74 T.D. 15,805'; removed BOP's. Installed tree. Pressure tested ring
gasket and tubing sleeves; held OK. Rigged up pump to tubing to
test to 10,000 psi. Pressure up, would not hold. Communication
through sleeves into annulus. Closed valves on tree. Pressure tested
7-5/8" casing. Pressured to 1500 psi. Started taking fluid @ i BPM
@ 1500 psi. Removed tree. Installed 80P's. Seal blew out in 80P's.
Pulled 159 joints 2-3/8" 0D EUE Brd tubing. Latched onto 2-7/8"
production string. Unable to pull out of packer; seems to be un-

jayed. Worked string up to a maximum of 20,000# over weight of string.
SDON.

10-18-74 T.D. 15,805'; worked "J" Latch assembly free. Circulated up fine
cement cuttings and some sand. Circulated hole clean. Tripped out
with 202 joints CS Hydril, 1 x-over joint, 202 Joints Nu-lok, "J"
Latch, seal assembly and mule shoe guide. Removed BOP's and
inspected tubing hanger head; checked OK. Installed change-over

spool and 10" 1500 Series 80P's. Made up Howco BP and RTTS and
tripped in on 78 joints 2-7/8" Nu-lok. SDON.

10-19-74 T.D. 15,805'; picked up Halliburton Retrievable BP and RTTS tool.
Tripped in. Isolated leak in 7-5/8" casing between 3407-3468'. Could
not set BP. Tripped out. Changed out BP. Tripped in. Set BP
at 3780' with 3 sacks sand on top BP. Pulled up, set packer at 2968'.
Established injection rate of 3 BPM @800 psi. Halliburton mixed
150 sacks class "G" with .5%

CFR-2. Begin pump cement initial
pressure 2500 psi. After pumping 150 sacks, pressure increased to
3900 psi. Released packer. Reversed cement out of tubing. Gement
not setting up in tubing. 8 barrels cement remained in casing after
reversing out. Reset packer at 2968'. Pressured up to 3000 psi.
Bled to 2500 psi in 5 minutes. Released packer. Pulled 4 stands,
reset packer at 2720'. Pressured annulus to 1000 psi and tubing to
3000 psi. Released tubing pressure. Repressured tubing and pumped
into formation at 2 BPM and 800 psi. Displaced 4 barrels cement into
leak in 7-5/8" casing at 400 psi. Shut down 10 minutes. Staged

CONTINUED TO PAGE



DAILY DRILLING REPORT PAGE 51

MAPCO INC., OLSEN NO. 1-27

NE/4 NE/4 SEC. 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

REPORT OF 10-19-74 CONTINUED FROM PAGE 50

i barrel. Pressure increased from 400 psi to 750 psi; decreased -to
425 psi in 10 minutes. Pumped i barrel, pressure increased to 750 psi;
decreased to 450 psi in 10 minutes. Pumped i barrel, pressure increased
to 1500; held for 10 minutes. Pressured to 2000; held for 10 minutes.
Pressure to 2500 psi; held for 15 minutes. SDON.

10-20-74 T.D. 15,805'; SITP 2500 psi. Open tubing valve and disassembled
line to tubing valve. Pressured to 1600 psi. Released pressure.
Unseated packer at 2720'. Tripped out with RTTS tool. Picked up
bit. Tripped in hole. Drilled cement from 3419' to 3451'. Cir-

culated hole clean. Pressure tested to 2000 psi; held for 15 minutes.
Released pressure. Tripped in to 3766'. Circulated sand off top BP.
Tripped out. Tripped in with BP Retrieving tool to 3780'. Tagged
plug. Circulated sand and cement returns. Circulated until clean.
Released BP. Pulled 3 stands. SOON.

10-21-74 T.D. 15,805'; shut down on Sunday.

10-22-74 T.D. 15,805'; completed trip out of hole with Howco BP. Rigged
down swivel and related drilling equipment. Rigged up Cable Hydro-
testers. Pressure tested Otis seal assembly, "J" Latch. Tripped
in hole with 2-7/8" production string. Hydro-tester was
down for 31 hours. Repaired and tripped in hole. Ran 202 joints
2-7/8", 6.50#,_N-80 Nu-lok. Pressured casing to 2000 psi; held
for 10 minutes. Ran 57 joints 2-7/8", 6.50#, N-80 CS Hydril. SDON.

10-23-74 T.D. 15,805'; ran 145 joints 2-7/8", 6.50#, N-80 CS Hydril, 10'
sub, 1 joint Hydril tubing. Total tubing run 202 joints 2-7/8"
6.50#, N-80, Nu-lok, 1 x-over, 201 joints, 2-7/8" Hydril, 6.50#,
N-80, Nu-lok, 10' pup joint, 1 joint Hydril. Circulated hole
clean. Tagged packer with "J" Latch seal assembly. Spotted 10#
CaCl2 from 12,166.12 KB up to 50' KB. Recovered sand, cement
cuttings and shale. Pressure tested casing to 2000 psi; held
for 15 minutes. Released pressure, stung into Otis packer with
6,000# set down weight. Ran 159 joints 2-3/8", 4.7#, EUE Brd J-55
tubing. Removed 80P's. Installed OCT 10,000#xmas tree. Attempted
to pressure test xmas tree; tubing hanger leaking. Pressure
tested cas,.ing to 2000 psi; held. Pressure tested tree. Pressured
2-7/8" tubing to 10,000 psi; held for l minute; leaking through tubing
hanger.
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MAPCO INC., OLSEN NO. 1-27

NE/4 NE/4 SEC. 27, T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

10-24-74 T.D. 15,805'; removed OCT christmas tree. Replaced tubing hanger
"0" rings. Installed tree. Pressured to 7500 psi. OCT tree still
leaking. Removed tree. Replaced "0" rings. Tree still leaking. SDON.

10-25-74 T.D. 15,805'; rigged down Western Oil Well Service companyRig #16.
Removed OCT tree; transported tree to Fisher 1-12. Removed OCT tree
from Fisher 1-12; installed Olsen 1-27 tree on Fisher 1-12. Trans-
ported OCT tree from Fisher 1-12 to Olsen 1-27; installed tree on
Olsen 1-27. Pressured to 8400 psi; tree leaked. Shut down operations.

10-26-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on ocT.

10-27-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on ocT.

10-28-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on OCT.

10-29-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on ocT.

10-30-74 T.D. 15,805'; installed new sleeve assembly for tubing hanger whîch
extended further into base of tree. Pressured tubing to 10,000 psi.
Pressure bled from 10,000 psi to 9,000 psi in 8 minutes. Discussing
problem with OCT attempting to remedy.

10-31-74 T.D. 15,805'; shut in. Waiting on workover unit.

11-1-74 T.D. 15,805'; waiting on workover unit.

11-2-74 T.D. 15,805'; rigged up Western 011 Well service Rig #16., Removed
OCT tree. Inspected hanger, sleeves and tubing head. Pulled 156 joints
2-3/8"EUE Brd, J-55, 4.9# tubing. Picked up 2-7/8" tubing and stripped
over adapter spool. Removed and replaced tubing hangers. Landed 2-7/8"
tubing in natural weight. Ran 156 joints 2-3/8" EUE Brd, J-55, 4.9#
heat string. Landed with new hanger. Installed and nippled up tree.
Pressure tested to 5000 psi; held OK. SDON.

11-3-74 T.D. 15,805'; riggedup pump truck. Pressure tested tree to 10,000 psi.
Bled to 9,000 psi in 10 minutes. Tree holding. Removed tree, hooked up
to 2-7/8" tubing hanger. Pressure tested to 10,000 psi, tubing leaking.
Bled pressure off. Picked up 2-7/8" hanger out of tubing head. Pulled
12,000# over weight of string. Pressured to 8400 psi. Tubing came
unlatched from packer, seal assembly came unseated. Pressure bled off.
Set back down. Attempted to sting into "J" latch; unable to do so.
Tubing is stung into packer. Seal assembly holding. Closed well in
for night. Preparing to pull tubing and check "J" latch.

11-¾-74 T.D. 15,805'; no work today. Checked for pressure on casing-0.
Seal assembly holding and Otis plug not



rrff GCC-3
SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE *

STATE OP UTAH (Seeotherin-
structions on 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
reverseside)

WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETIONREPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALL0TTEE OR TRIBE NAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: O
LL

WALLL
DRY Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
VEE

L
TERRK EP- U D

n. Other S. FARM OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Ol sen
MAPCO I nc. Û. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR SU i te AU Ÿl BZa WOSt Ì - Ž7
1537 Avenue D, Bi11ings, Montana 59102 io. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance soith any ßtate requirements)• Al tamont
at surface NE NE (1200 ' FNL 6 1200 I FEL) 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

OR AREA

Section 27, T. l S., R. 4 W., USM
At top prod. interval reported below

Duchesne County, Utah Section 27
At total depth T. 1 S., R. 4 W., USM

14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED Ì2. COUNTY OR 13. STATE

43-013-30064 12-21-73 Du'ÉWsne Utah
15. DATE sPUDDED I 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (RBŒdy $0 prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GE, ETC.)e 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

1-24-74 8-29-74 11-13-74 6499' GL - 6520' KB
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANT* DRILLED BY

l 5, 805' l 5, 556' surf .-l 5,805\'
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE

Wasatch - 12,503'-15,805' No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN BHL-bonic-bk, Dual Induction Laterolog 8, 27. WAS WELL COBED

FDC-CNL-GR-Cal iper No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in toell)

CASINO SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" 40# 3457' 12-1/4" 2700 sacks
|-b/8" 2b.4,29.),

33./,39¥ 12,503' ô-3/4" 4/5 sacks

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIEE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

5-1/2" 12,200' 15,556' None None 2-3/8" 5012'
2-7/8" 12,163' 12,160

31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, eige and n¾NLber) 82. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

None

33-* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (FIOlding, 988 liff, PUfnping-BißÐGNŠ fgpg Of p¾1Ap) WELL STATUs (Prodtscing or

11-14-74 Fl owi ng "Nð"cÌucing
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIEE PROD'N. FOR OIL-BÉL. GAS-MCF. WATER-BEL. GAS-OIL RATIO

l 1-16-74 24 12/64" " 799 439 0 550
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL, GAS-MCF. WATER-BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (COBR.)

3400-4200 799 439 0 45.4
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (80ld, Maed for /¾61,tented, €‡c.) TEST WITNESSED BT

Selling as of 12-4-74 Rhuben Col1ins
35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

None
36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records

Manager of Operations,
SIGNED TITLE Northern District DATE December 17, 1974

1 D Hol 1(
e nstructions and Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse
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EXXON CHEMICAL COMPANY U.S.A. ---

CHEMICALS
.coes.

Houston Chemical Plant

WATERANALYSIS 8230 Stedman, Houston, Texas 77029

SAf\$PLE DESCRIPTION: Water from Olsen No. 1-27, Altamont Field, Utah

COMPANY: Mapco Production Companý, Roosevelt, Utah
STSR NUMBER: 75-6041-31 DATE RECEIVED: April 1, 1975
REQUESTED BY: F. H. Collett ANALYZED BY: C. S. Lieberman

Mg/L . Meq/L

sodium 1,440 63 pH 6.2
Calcium 30 1.5 Specific Gravity at 60 F- 1.000

Magnesium 12 1

Chloride 1,400 40
- Mgg

sulfate 200 4 Oil content 965

Bicarbonate , 1, 318 22 Organic Matter

Carbonate 12 0.4 Hydrogen Sulfide

Hydroxide Nil - Barium Nil

TOTAL 4,412

Dissolved Iron

Total Iron 20 ppm

WATER PATTERN (Stiff Method)

N †f CL

Meq/LITER





Form 9--331 U ED STATES SUBMIT IN TRI ATE. Form approved.
Diay iŠ63) (Other instructions on re- _ Budget Bureau No, 42--R1424.

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR verse side) 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY C.A. 96-108
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NA3IE

SUNDRYNOTlŒS AND REPORTSON WELLS
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for sue roposals.)

1.
OIL GAS

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

WEraL WELL OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR - i 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

MAPCO Inc. Olsen
3. Annamss or oPERATOR $U i te JAG ŸÌ BZa OS t 9. WELL NO.

1537 Avenue D, Bi ll ings, Montana 9102 1 - 27
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in secordarice with any State fegitirements.* 10. ElluLD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface Al tamont

NENE 11. sec., T., E., M., OR BLK. AND

(1200' FNL & 1200'- FEL) """"'°"

Sect ion 27
T. 1 S., R, 4 W,., USM

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT. GR. etc.) 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

43-013-30064 6499' G.L. - 6520' K.B. Duchesne Utah

1e· CheckAppropriateBoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CASING

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING X ABANDONMENT*

Perforate
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS (Other)

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel
(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CO3fPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state aH pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any
proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertl-
nent to this work.) *

5-15-75: Perforated 15,205-210'; 15,140-145'; 15,000-005'; 14,856-861'; 14,525-530'
14,222-227'; 14,218-220'; 14,215-217'; 13,964-969'; 13-862-864' with 2 SPF
using a 1-9/16" gun. Production increased from 63 to 138 80PD.

8-1-75: Treated with 44,600 gals. diesel containing benzoic acid flakes in 11 stages,
increasing production to 190 BOPD.

9-25-75: Acidized with 41,000 gals. 71% HCl in 10 stages separated by benzoic acid flakes.
Production to 250 BOPD.

1-10 thru
4-1-76: Attempted to perforate; could not get gun below 12,150'. Pulled tubing; bottom

6 joints were bent. Pull packer and clean out liner from 15,200' to 15,497'.
Cement squeeze liner lap. Left 2 cones from bit while drilling cement. Ran
packer with 3086' of tailpipe and set at 4036'. Perforated 29 intervals with
200 shots from 13,861 to 15,334'. RiH with packer and set at 12,190'.

5-17-76: Pulled tubing and ran Reda pump and cable. Landed with motor at 12,139'.
Production increased from 20 to 370 BOPD.

18. I hereby cer hat the fore g is e and correct

SIGNE TITLEGeological Clerk & Secretary ,
AUS1 7 1976

(This space for Federal or State ofnee use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

I

*SeeInstructionson Reverse



9-331 Form Approved.
1973 Budget Bureau No.42-R1424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE d
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR CA 96-000108

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

1. oli gas Olsen
well Û well other 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR MAPC0PRODUCTIONCOMPANY 1--27
Alpine Executive Center 10. FIELDORWILDCATNAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 1643 Lewi s Ave. , Sui te 202 Al tamont
Billings, MT 59102 11. SEC., T., R., M. OR BLK.ANDSURVEYOR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA Section 27 e y
below.) T 1 S " R 4 V NUSM
AT SURFACE: NE/4 NE/4 1200 ' FNL & 1200 ' FEL 12. COUNTY OR RISH 13. SŸATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Duchesne Utah'AT TOTAL DEPTH:

14. API NO. 2.
16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, 43-013-30064 11

REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB AND WD)
6499' GL 6520' KB SE

REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report resultà multiple comp t on r zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9 330.)
MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES '2
ABANDON*
(other) Abandon Wasatch Red Beds

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details arid give pertinent dates
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

PLEASE SEE ATTACHEDPROCEDURE

Received verba'I permission from Mike Minder on 8-7-80.

APPROVEDBYTHE DIVISIONOF
OIL, GAS, AND INING

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. and Type Ft.

S18GNED Td correEengineering
Tech DATE

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See instructions on Reverse



Olsen 1-27 AFE No.
Workover Procedure Sundry Appl. 8-7-80 (verbal)
Green River Completion

Current Condition
7-5/8" casing to 12,503'
5-1/2" liner from 12,200' - 15,556' uncemented
Perforations: 13,603' - 15,334'
Baker Loc-set packer at 12,062', with 2-7/8" tailpipe to 15,243'
98 jts 2-3/8" Brd EUE J-55
NOTE: Packer and tailpipe are stuck in hole. Appears tailpipe has fill inside

and outside of it. All attempts to recover it have failed.
NOTE: 7-5/8" casing has a split @ 3392' - 3412'. All attempts to squeeze hole

have failed.

Procedure
1. MlRU workover rig. Remove tree and NU BOP.

2. Pull 2-/38" tubing.

3. PU 2-7/8" production tubing and 7-5/8" permanent bridge plug. Tag
packer with BP PU 10' and set. Release from BP and spot cement from
12,000' to top of BP. POOH with tubing to 6000' and swab FL down to
4000'. POOH with 2-7/8" tubing.

4. RU perforators. Run Gamma Ray correlation log from PBTD to 10,000'.

5. Perforate 37' in the Green River formation using a 4" casing gun loaded
2 spf. Use full lubricator and decentralized gun.

Proposed Perfs (BHC Sonic GR Depths)
11,912 - 920 8'
11,896 - 906 10'
11,870 - 876 6'
11,859 - 864 5'
11,820 - 824 4'
11,780 - 784 Al

37'

6. If necessary, kill well. PU 7-5/8" production packer, OTIS seal divider
dual string cavity, and RIH on 2-7/8" production tubing. Drift all
tubing going in hole. Set packer @ 11,650'. Make necessary changes to
wellhead to accommodate dual tubing production system.

7. PU and run 2-3/8" side string. String into dual string cavity.

8. ND BOP and NU wellhead. Release rig'. Run and pressure test standing
valve.

9. Circulate tubing to clean it up and then drop pump and put on production.

10. Produce well to clean up prior to



Olsen 1-27
Workover Procedure
Page 2

11. When well has cleaned up, surface pump. Pull stdg. valve and run
acidizing sleeve.

12. Acidize well with 11,000 gal. 15% HCl using balls and benzoic acid flakesfor diversion. Use 750 SCF N2/bbl. of acid. Acid to contain demulsi-
fier, surfactant, corrosion inhibitor and iron sequestering agent. Flushacid to top perf. with formation water containing foamer and 500 scF N2/bbl.

13. Flow well back immediately after job.

14. When well quits flowing, pull acidizing sleeve and run standing valve.
Pressure test standing valve. Drop pump and put well on



UI ED STATES SUBMIT IN DU
rin-

eta
u No. 42-R355.5.

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR tytonsÎd 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

GEOLOGICAL SURVEY CA 96-000108

WELLCOMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETIONREPORTAND LOG *
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR THIBE NAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL:
V LL

WAESLL
DET Other 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF COMPLETION:
VEE

L
OWORRK EP-

Other 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME

2. NAME OF OPERATon MAPCOProduction Company Olsen
1643 Lewis Ave, Suite 202 9. WELL NO.

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR BÎ Ï l ÎD9S, MT 59102 1-27
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (28þ0TÉ IOCŒfiOn Clearly gud in GCC0TdŒ¾Ø6wit15 Guy Ñ‡af6 76guiren&6¾Š8)* Al tamont
At surface NE NE (1200 i FNL & 1200 I FEL) 11. SERC T R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

At top prod. interval reported below Sec 27, Tl5, R4W, USM Sect ion 27
At total depth Same TlS, R4W, USM

14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY OR 13. STATE

43-013-30064 \ 12-21-73 Duc esne Utah
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (R6Gdy ŠG pf04.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GR, ETC.) * 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

1-24-74 8-29-74 9-10-80 6499 ' GL - 6520 ' KB
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

15,805' 12,000 ' Burf-15,805'
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE

Green River 11,920' - 11,780' No
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

GR-CCL 10,000 I - 12,000 i No
28. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

c¯ASiNG
SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTII SET (MD) . HOLE SIEE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" 40# 3457 12-1/4" 2700 sacks
7-5/8" 26.4, 29.7,

33.7, 39# 12,503· 8-3/4" 475 sacks

29. BINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (M

S-l/2" 12,200' 15,5561 None None 2-7/8" 11,600'
Pkr 11,6001

31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, Bize GNd nuWib6f) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

SEE ATTACHMENT

83.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Fl0ming, gas lif‡, pHMping---8436 GWd Égp6 Of p¾mp) WELL STATUS {Producing Or

shut-in)10-23-80 - Flowing Producing
DATE OF TEST ÃOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF. WATER-BEL. GAS-OIL RATIO

10-23-80 23 16/640 " ""'°
1006 322 0 320

FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF, WATER-BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)
24-HOUR RATE i

1000 0 a 1050 336 0
84. DISPOSITION OF GA (Š0Ñ,¾864 JOT fußl, 96%$6d, 6tc.) TEST WITNESSED BY

Used on lease and sold
35. List or ATTACHMENTS

36. I hÑ y cátify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records

SIGNED Af (A TITLE Engineerinq Technician DATE
10-27-80

*(See Instructionsand Spacesfor Additional Data on Reverse
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. MAPC0Production Company
Olsen 1-27
Recompletion Report
Attachment

PERFORATIONRECORD

9-2-80 Set BP @12,052', Cemented on top to 12,000'

9-4-80 Perforated 2 spf:
11,912-920 (8)
11,896-906 (10)
11,870-876 (6)
11,859-864 (5)
11,820-824 (4)
11,780-784 (4)

9-4-80 Ran GR-CCL from 10,000'-12,000'.

9-9-80 Set OTIS Permalatch Packer @11,650'
2-7/8" tubing § 11,650'
2-3/8" tubing @11,650'

10-21-80 Pulled 2-3/8" tubing
Pulled production pkr and ran treating pkr and set at 11,6001.
Acidized well with 7400 gal. 15% Hel, ave. rate 3 BPM and ave.
pressure 4500





9-331 Form Approved.

y -.. 1973 Budget Bureau No. 42-R1424

UNITED STATES 5. LEASE
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR CA96-000108

GEOLOGICALSURVEY 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different
reservoir. Use Form 9-331-C for such proposals.) 8. FARM OR LEASENAME

Olsen1. o ae
other 9. WELL NO.

2. NAME OF OPERATOR MAPCOPRODUCTIONCOMPANY 1-·27
Alpi ne Executi ve Center 10. FIELDOR WILDCAT NAME

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 1643 Lewis Ave. , Sui te 202 Altamont
Bil1ings, MT 59102 11. SEC., T., R., M., OR BLK. AND SURVEY OR

4. LOCATION OF WELL (REPORT LOCATION CLEARLY. See space 17 AREA Section 27
below.) T 1 3 R 4 W USM
AT SURFACE: NE/4 NE/4 1200 ' FNL & 1200 ' FEL 12. COUNTY OR PARISHi 13. STATE
AT TOP PROD. INTERVAL: Duchesne i Utah
AT TOTAL DEPTH: 14. API NO.

16. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. 43-013-30064
REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 15. ELEVATIONS (SHOW DF, KDB. AND WD)

6499' GL, 6520 ' KB
REQUEST FOR APPROVAL TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF
FRACTURE TREAT
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE
REPAIR WELL (NOTE: Report results of multiple completion or zone
PULL OR ALTER CASING change on Form 9-330]

MULTIPLE COMPLETE
CHANGE ZONES
ABANDON*
(other)

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates,
including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and
measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

MAPC0intends to acidize the Green River E zone perfs to stimulate production.
Please see attached for details.

APPROVED BYTHE STATE <. Î
OF UTAH DIVISION OF
OIL, GAS, AND, MINING

DATE:
MAR12 1982

BY: US DIVISIONOF
OIL.GAS&MINING

Subsurface Safety Valve: Manu. d Type Set @ Ft.

S

GNI here e yt t o oing is true and correcEngr
. Tech• DATE 3-9-82

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY TITLE DATE
CONDIT10NS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*See instructions on Reverse



OLSEN1-27
Altamont Field

Acid Stimulation

Present Condition

7-5/8" to 12,503'. BP @12,052' with cement on top to 12,000'.
7-5/8" OTIS Permalatch packer @ 11,530'.
Perforations: Green River "E" from 11,780 - 11,920' - 37', 2 spf.
374 jts 2-7/8" Sealock production tbg, 369 jts 2-3/8" parallel string.
Note: 7-5/8" casing has split at 3392-3412'.

Proposed Procedure

1. Surface pump. Shear standing valve and pull same. Check PBTD.

2. RIH with acidizing sleeve and set in cavity. Pressure test sleeve by pressuring
up 2-3/8" to 2000 psi.

3. RUpump trucks. Acidize well with 7500 gal 15% HC1 with corrosion inhibitor,
surfactant, demulsifier and Tretolite scale inhibitor. Drop 120 1.1 sp gr balls
throughout acid. Pump 1000 gal gelled salt water containing 1000# BAFand 1000#
rock salt, after 1500 gal acid is pumped as follows:

1500 gal 15% HC1with 30 balls
1000 gal gelled salt water with BAF and rock salt
5000 gal 15% HC1 with 90 balls
1000 gal 15% HCl with no balls
Flush to top perf

-Pump acid as fast as possible until well pressuresup. then pump at 6 BPMas long
as well is not on a vaccum. Max Pressure - 7000 psi. SI well overnight.

4. Flow well back. When well quits flowing, pull acidizing sleeve, run standing
valve and test to 2000 psi. Drop pump and put on production.

GLE/jlu



Form OGC-lb SUInll TRll'LICATE*

TE OF UTAH (Otl tructions on
reverse side)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

Fee

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plug back to a different reservoir.
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals.)

1• 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

OIL GAS
WELL WELL OTHER

2, NAME OF OPERATOR
8. FARM 04 LBASE NAME

MAPCO PRODUCTION COMPANY Olsen
8. ADDREBB OF OPERATOR

9. wmLL NO.

c/o Linmar Energy Corp, P.O. Box 132'(,
' Roosevelt, UT 84066

4, LOCATION OF WELL (Rep0rt location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND POOL, Om WILDCAT

See also space 17 below.)
At surface

Wasatch

1200 ' FNL 1200 ' FEL (NENE)
11. amŠ'a'Aa.,u., OR BLE. AND

Sec 27-T1S-R4Ñ,USM

14. PERMIT NO. 15. ELEVATIONE (Show whether DF, NT, on, etc.) 12. coCÈTY Os PARIan iŠ. -TATE

API#43-013--30064 6499' GR 6520' KB 91;nhenne iltah

1e· CheckAppropnote BoxTo Indicate Nature of Notice,Report, or OtherData
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUBBEQUENT REPORT OF.

TEST WATER SECT-OFF PULL OR ALTER _CASING WATER SHUT-OFF REPAIRING WELL

FRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPLETE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAstNO

SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON* SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING
ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS ,
(Other)

X

(NOTE : Report results of mu pe completion on Wel
(Other) Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.}

17. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONs (Clearly statÃnllpertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting nny

proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give bsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for aH markers and zones perti-

nent to this work.) *

Linmar Energy Corporation has purchased Mapco's

interest in the Altamont Field, effective October 1, 1983.

Linmar Energy is now, therefor 4 Operator of this

wel l .

18. I hpreby cert that the foregoing is true an reet

SIGNED ,

TITLE Superintendant pay, Nov 30, 19 g

(This space for Fed/ral or State oflice use)

APPROVED BY ..
TITLE DATE

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson Reverse



ESIRABLEEVENTREPORT

Olse I-MA 4 070710 2 5 m
DIVISIONOFSubject: Report of Undesirable Event CilLGAS&MINING

Date Of Occurrence: 6/24/86 . Time of Occurrence: 8:00 a.m.,8X.yRI

Date Reported to USGS: 6/24/86 Time Reported to USGS: a.m., p.m.

Location: State Utah ; County Duchesne

NE 1/4 NE 1/4 Section 27 T. 1 S., R, 4 W ., UBS Meridian

Operator: _Linmar Energy Corporation

Surface Ownership: FEDERAL,INDIAN,( ), STATE API # 43-013-30064

Lease Number: Fee ; Unit Name or C.A. Number__9_6-000108

Type of Event: BLOWOUT,FIRE, FATALITY, INJURY, PROPERTYDAMAGE,
SALTWATERSPILL, TOXIC FLUID SPILL, OIL AND SALTWATERSPILL,
OIL AND TOXIC FLUID SPILL, SALTWATERAND TOXIC FLUID SPILL,
GASVENTING,or OTHER(Specify)

Cause of Event: Failure of value sealing gasket on #3 production tank

i

Volumes of Pollutants I. Discharged or Consumed: 60 bb1s
II. Recovered: 60 bb1s

Time Required to Control Event (in hours): 4

Action Taken to Control the Event, Description of Resultant Damage,
Clean-up Procedures, and Dates: Move remaining gil from tank #3 into tank #l,

all spilled oil was contained in cat'dh basin and recovered. Tank #3 will be
repaired.

Cause and Extent of Personnel Injury: None

Other Federal, State, and Local Governmental Agencies Notified: state of
Utah, Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Action Taken to Prevent Recurrence: Tank #3 will be repaired before
being used again.

n

turReema

e Date 6/24/86

Title Division



LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
1979 East Tuf te Avenue Parkway, Suite 604

Denver, Colorado 80237
(303) 773-8003

November 6, 1987

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
355 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

ATTN: Tami Searing

Re: Change of Operator

Dear Ms. Searing:

Enclosed is.a Sundry Notice, in triplicate, evidencing Change of -

Operator effective November.1, 1987, from Linmar Energy Corporation to
Linmar Petroleum Company covering the wells listed.on the Exhibit "A"
attached thereto. Such listing of wells should cover all the wells in
which you currently show Linmar Energy Corporation as Operator.

If you have any questions whatsoever or if you need any .additional
information, please do not hesitate to call me collect at (303) 773-8003.

Thank you so very much for all of your assistance and cooperation
in this matter.

Very truly_yours,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

Susan L. Foster
Land Consultant

SLF:jgm

Enclosures

cc: Ed Whicker, Field Superintendent, Linmar Petroleum Company

NOVA 9





Page 2 .

EXHIBIT "A"

Attached to and made a part of that certain Sundry Notice covering
Change of Operator from Linmar Energy Corporation to Linmar
Petroleum Company

WELL NAME
' SECTION,:TOWNSHIP AND RANGE

Ute Tribal 1-18B1E L LÉÎ>01 Section 18, Township 2 South, Range 1 East

Jessen 1-11A4 3 )\3-30 [3 p Section 11, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Jacobson 2-12A4 L
-30 SS Section 12, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Jessen 1-15A4
,

'b-O 13-30 19 Section 15, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Olson 1-27A4, 913--30 Section 27, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Fieldsted 2-27A4 -013-6 Section 27, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Warren 1-32A4 -016-30 Section 32, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Oman 2-32A4 ÑS-DIS--ík3 O Section 32, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Oman 2-434 - 3- (3--306 6 Section 4, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Christensen 3-4B4, 3--O(3-3 Section 4, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Chandler 2-5B4 ß-Ol3-Sicr> Section 5, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Ellsworth 2-8B4 SR)(3-SOŸc Section 8, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Evans Ute 1-31A4 3-ðlS-3.00 Section 31, Township 1 South, Range 4 West

Brotherson 2-384, S-CIS--3/cc Section 3, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Ellsworth 2-934 g.g|3-3 []3 Section 9, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

Ute Tribal 2-3A3 S-Dj¶b- Slo3 Section 3, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

Ute Tribal 2-5A3 3-013-3 o L Section 5, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

Fisher 2-6A3 -3 S-3D Section 6, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

Fisher 1-7A3 -016-30 Section 7, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

Morris 2-7A3
.

3-Ol3-3o Section 7, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

State 1-8A3 Ljp j3-3 Section 8, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

Powell 2-8A3, 'â-OI3-3b Section 8, Township 1 South, Range 3 West

Timothy 1-9A3 3-ð13.- Section 9, Township 1 South, Range 3



FormOGC4b SUBX1IT IN TllIPLIC\TE*
ATE OF UTAH er instru uns on

reverse «lde)DEPARTM OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 6· =^aa DialGNATION tND stRIAL NO.

Fee
SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or plUse "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for su

1.
7. UNIT AGREEMENT N&MBOILLI,

WELL OTHEE
2. NAME OF OPSBATOR

8. TARM 08 LMSN NAMELinmar Petroleum Company Olsen
3. ADDRESS 07 OPEEATOR

9. WELL NO.P. O. Box 1327, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 Q 1-27A4
4. I.oCATION or wtLL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND root, 08 WILDCATSee also space 17 below.)

ÑÏ ÈamOntAt surface

1200' FNL, 1200' FEL (NENE) 11. .. o a. ano

Sec. 27, T1S, RAW
14. 7 MI 0. 15. stavAtror<a (Sh w ryor, ox, ste.)

2'.
co NTY oserAaras 18 sta a

"· CheckAppropnote BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice,Report, or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: BUSSEQUNNT REFORT 07:

TIET WATER BRUT•Orr PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-OPP REPAIRING WELL
PRACTURE TREAT MULTIPLE COMPt,STE FRACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAstNG
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE X ABANDON*

5HOUTING On ACIDiz!NO ABANDONMENT*
ItBPAIR WELL CtfANCE PLANS (Other)

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)
('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)17. DEsenlac ritoi>ns):n oft coM1'LETED UPERATroNs (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pert1-nens to this work.) *

L.inmar is requesting that this proposal be approved as are a x kover as per HB110.¿ gnmar intends to increase product ion 0;the i Green River Format ion. The intervals OILANDGASorn 11 821' tc 11. 373' (31 feet. 93 perforat ions) are to be
DON RAFoerforated with 4" casina guns shooting 3 spf. The additionalintervals wi ll be comming led with the current perforat ions. The gJRB GLHopen perforations will be stimulated with HCL when necessary.
DTS SLS

TvW - ÑA g g de
MICROFILM

Ï h¯eieby
certify that the fore is true and correct Product ion Engineer 28-Mar-90

SIGNED k TITLE DATE

(This space for Federal oAState omee use) i di 6
OF UTAH DIVISION OFAP"ovED BY TITLE

Co.,vu.. 3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANT:

*See Instructionson Rave



Pt Stateof Utah 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

Norman H. Bangerter
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Governor

Dee C. Hansen
355 West North Temple

Executive Director 3 Triad Center, Suite 350

Dianne R Nielson, Ph.D. Salt Lake City,Utah 84180-1203

Division Director 801-538-5340

April 18, 1990

Mr. Michael Guinn
Linmar Petroleum Company
P.O. Box 1327
Roosevelt, Utah 84066

Dear Mr. Guinn:

Re: Proposals for Workovers

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining has recently received and reviewed your
notices of intent to perform work on the following wells in Duchesne County:

Murray #3-2A2, Section 2, Township 1 South, Range 2 West
Olsen #1-27A4, Section 27, Township 1 South, Range 4 West
Ute Tribal #2-5A3, Section 5, Township 1 South, Range 3 West
Oman #2-4B4, Section 4, Township 2 South, Range 4 West

All of the submitted proposals have been approved or accepted; however, the
designation of the proposed operations as workovers under HB110 (modifications to
U.C.A. 59-5-102) cannot be made at this time because the Division has not yet
finalized the rulemaking and procedures for implementing HB110. As soon as
rules and procedures have been established, it is anticipated that operators and
working interest owners will be able to apply for workover designation for any
appropriate activity performed since January 1, 1990.

In order to get the word out to the public and industry, the Division intends to
publicize both the rulemaking and the final establishment of the aforementioned
procedures. At that time, the Division will be able to properly act upon your
request. Please let me know if you have any further questions or concerns about
this matter.

Sincerely,

J, nR Baza
etroleum Engineer

cc: D. R. Nielson
R. J. Firth
Well files

OI2/285

an equal opportunity



, Form OGCJb SUBMIT IN TlilPLII:ATlú*
ATE OF UTAH ier in.stna tions on

revetw sulr)DEPARTM OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL GAS AND MINING 6. LEASE DEslONATION .tND SERIAI. NO.

WTUR Fee
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER 05 TRIBE NAMESUNDRYNOTIGS AN TS R

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill o µ a Ã reservoir.Use "APPLICATION FOR P
1.

7. UNIT AcazEMENT NAMEELLL WABLL
OTHE= DIVISIONOF

2. NAME OF OPERATOR
8. TAAM 08 L3ASE NAMELinmar Petroleum CompanY Olsen

3. ADDRE38 OF OPSEATOR
0. WELI. NO.P.O. Bo× 1327, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 i-27A4

4. LocaTION or wct.L (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.* 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCATacepace 17 below.)
.. .g

1200' FNL, 1200' FEL (NENE) Î"IPs "oÏ~ . AND

Sec. 2Ÿ, TiS, RAW
14• 15. BL3VATIONS (Sh ww DF, OR• etc.) 12. COUNTY OR FARIEN 18. STATE

Duchesne Utah
16 CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Natureof Notice, Report,or Other Data

NOTICS OF INTENTION TO: SUmsaqURNT ÁNPORT 07:

Tž5T WATER BRUT•OFF PUl.L OR ALTER CASING wATER SHUT-Ory REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT Mt*LTIPLE COMPt.ETE fxACTURE TREAT¼ENT ALTERING C18tNG
SROOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON*

SHOUTING OR ACIDIZING ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CtfANGE PLANN (Other)
(NOTE: Report results of multiple completion on Wel(Other)
('ompletion or Recompletion Report and Lot form.)

17. OEscalaE rBAP SED OR COMPl.ETED OPERATIONS (Clearly itate all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of startínr anyproposed work. It well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pert1-nent to this work.) *

OILANDGASAdditional Green River intervals were oerforated on the
DRN AJFsubject well on March 28, 1990. The interals from 11,373' to11,, 821" were perforated using 4" casing guns shoot ing 3 spf at JRB GLH120 degree phasing. A total of 32 intervals., 32 feet were
DTS SLSDerforated with 96 holes,

I-TA
- MICRORLM

- RLE

18. I he b c

TITLE

Product ion Engineer -Mar-90

(This spaUfor Federal or State odice use)

APP"OVED BY TITLE DATE
Cu2.vu.. 5 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

*Seeinstructionson Reverse



,
FormOGC-lb SUB,illT IN TitlPLIC\TE*

TATE OF UTAH her instro tions onOR reverse wÌr)DEPARTM .. OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5. trans oratomation suo amasse so.

Fee
6. Ir ruotan, ALLortza os Tatus nausSUNDRYNOTICESAND REPOR

(Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or rUse "APPLICATION FOR PERhilT-" for a et
1•

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAMEOlL , .. GAS
WELL - WELL OTHER

2. Naus or oPraatoa 8. raan on LsAas Naxa
i...inmar Petroleum Company idinitin Olsen

s. onzas or orsaal
27, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 1-E A

4. LOCATION OF WELL (ReP0rt location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.• 10. FIELD AND Poor., OR Wil.DCAT
A

sul o space 17 below.)
....ng

11, SEC., T., E.. M., OR BI.E. AND.t2OO' FNL, 1200' FEL (NENE) • mvar on auss

Sec. 27, T i S, R4W
14. PraxtT No. 15. at.svAT!oNa (Show whether or, at, on, eta.) 12. cooNTY os raatsu 18. stata43-013-30064 6, 499' GR Duchesne Utah
16· CheckAppropnate BoxTo indicate Nature of Notice, Report,or Other Data

NOTICE OF INT1\NTION TO : BURSEQUENT ÁNFORT 07 :

TzsT WATER BRUT-Orr PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT-Orr REPAIRING WELL
FRACTURE TREAT Mt'LTIPLE COMPLETE fxACTURE TREATMENT ALTERING CAalNG
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE ABANDON*

SHOUTING OR ACIDI2tNG ABANDONMENT*

REPAIR WELL CffANGE PLANS (Other)
(Nots: Report results of multiple completion on Well(Other)
('..nipirtlan or Recompletton Report and Log form.)

1Î. DESCRIDE PROPOSED OIt COMI'LETFD OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting anyproposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertt-nent to this work.) *

Aciditional Green River perforations were shot in the
subject well from 11.373' to 11,821' on 3/29/90. A total of 32
feet., 32 intervals were perforated with 96 holes. ---

OlLAND
DRN

D SLS

MICROF LM

18. I hereby c

ITLE DATE

(This space for Federal or State oface use)

APPNVED BY TITLE DATE
Cuaan. 3 OF APPROVAL, IF ANY :

*See Instructionson Reverse



Form e STATE TAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES La es rÃo an S a umber

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING Fee
7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPOATS ON WELLS
DO L 00 3e Und few or pfDDo6eHO driM B09 WOUS, dee¢40 ex¾ 4 Wak of to to atu DMged 80 d 1bandorsed wm 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

Lbe APPLi CATIONFOR PËPMIT for such proposals

1. Type of Well i WellName and Number
g Oil Gas O Other (specify)

weil weli Olsen 1-27A4
2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

Linmar Petroleum Company 43-013-30064
3. Address of Well 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

P.O. Box 1327, Roosevelt, Utah 84066 722-4546 Altamont
5 Location of Well

Fcotage : 1200' FNL, 1200' FEL (NENE) County : ÛUchesne
QQ. Seo, T., R., M. : Sec. 27, T1S, R4W USM State : Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATLRE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Origiral Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing

_

Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans X Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Inlection

_

Vent of Flare
Fracture Treat Ventor Flere Fra:ture Treat Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other
Other

Date of Work Completion
Approximate Date Work WillStart

Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different resertoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONANDLOG iorm,
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface
locations and measured and true vertical depths tor all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

The production assembly was pulled and a 7 5/8" full bore
packer was set at 10,880' in preparation for an acid job. The
well was acidized with 5,000 gallons 15% HCL acid on 1/29/93.
The acid contained MSR additives and 300 RCNB's were dropped for
diversiac

d
dpur unci

on
fpooentngas ru n the hole and the

FEB031993

DMSIONOF
OILGAS&MNNG

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and et

Name & Signature. Title Petroleum Engineer Date 01- Feb-93

(State Use Only

(9/90) See Instructiors on Reverse



(Iþ (Iþ
Division of Gil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR CHANGE HORKSHEET
"°"I

Attach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2-L 7 y
Initial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable.

4-VLOY9 E

XXXChange of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 5-RJF

] Designation of Operator __O Operator Name Change Only 6-LwP

The operator of the wel1(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 9-8-94

TO ( newoper a tor ) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP FROM ( for mer oper a tor ) LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
(address) PO BOX 749 (address) 731'LE THETS AVE PKWY 604

DENVER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80237
C/O COASTAL

OÌÏ.¯&¾¾

phone (303 )572-if f phone (303 )773-8003

account
¯30 BF 30-95 account no- BÁA)

He11(s) (attach additional page if needed)

Name: **SEE ATTACHED** API:f)t3 Cry Entity: Sec_ Twp_ Rng Lease Type:
Name: API:_ Entity: Sec__ Twp_ Rng___ Lease Type:
Name: API: Enti ty: Sec_ Twp Rng__ Lease Type:
Name: __ API: Entity: Sec Twp Rng__ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity:__ Sec Twp Rng__ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp Rng__ Lease Type:
Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp Rng_ Lease Type:

OPERATORCHANGEDOCUMENTATION

/ 1. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other egal documentation has been received from far er
operator (Attach to this form). >

2. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other legal documentation has been received from new operator
(Attach to this form). (g// f,2/f

3. The Department of Commerce has been contacted if the new operator above .is not currently
operating any wells in Utah. Is company registered with the state? (yes/no) _____

If

yes, show company file number:

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONLY) The BLM has been contacted regarding this change
(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status in

comments section of this form, Management review of Federal and Indian well operator
changes should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 beYow.

5. Changes have been entered in the Oil and Gas Information System (Wang/IBM) for each well

listed above. ¿y y,

6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed above. 7.-/J-g

7. Well file labels have been updated for each well listed above.97../g.

8. Changes have beek included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" memo

for distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission. (g,ÿÿ.
9. A folder has b en set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has been

placed there for reference during routing and processing of the original documents.

- OVER



(Iþ (Iþ
'

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEEI (CONTINUED) Initial each item when completed. LIrite N/A if item not applicable.

ITY RREVIeEHR615-8-7)

Entity ass nments have been reviewed for all wells listed above. Were
entity changes made? (yes/no (If entity assignments were changed, attach copies of
Form 6, Entity Action Form).

2. State Lands and the Tax Commiss ion have been not i f ied through norma l procedures of
entity changes.

BONDVERIFICATION (Fee wel ls onl y) / Re GM
" re/La-. A fr

1. (Rule R615-3-1) The new operator of any fee lease well listed above has furnished a
proper bond.

2. A copy of this form has been placed in the new and former operators' bond files.

¿C 3. The former operator has requested a release of liability from their bond (yes no

Today's date 19 îf_. If yes, division response was made by le er

dated 19

LEASE INTEREST OHNER NOTIFICATION RESPONSIBILITY

1. (Rule R615-2-10) The former operator/1essee of any fee lease well listed above has been

notified by letter dated __ 19___ ,
of their responsibility to notify any

person with an interest in such lease of the change of operator. Documentation of such

not cat n has4been egu ted.

2. C,opies of documents have been sent to State Lands for changes involving State leases.

FILMINGAll

attachments to this form have been microfilmed. Date: 28_ 191 .

FILING

1. C_ogies of all attachments to this form have been filed in each well file.

2. The original of this form and the o_riginal attachments have been filed in the Operator

Change file.

COMMENTS



(Iþ (Iþ
FORM 10 STATE OF UTAH

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 2 4
355 West North Temple, 3 Triad, Suite 350, Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203 Of

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

OPERATOR NAME AND ADDRESS:
UTAH ACCOUNT NUMBER:

NS523

C/0 COASTAL OlL & GAS /REPORT PERIOD (MONTH/YEAR): 5 95
LINMAR PETROLEUMCOMPANY
PO BOX 749
DENVER CO 80201-0749 AMENDED REPORT (Highlight Changes)

Well Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes
API Number Entity Location Zone Status Oper OIL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)

TIMOTHY 1-9A3
4301330321 09115 015 03W 9 GR-WS godoo/29
ALLRED 1-lbA3
4301330232 09116 ois 03W 16 GR-ws † GAktFT
FISHER 1-lbAh
4301330737 09117 015 04W 16 GRRVL '

ROLSfN 1-27Ah
4301330064 09119 ois 04W 27 GR-ws Ÿ 000/
BROWN 2-28B5

301330718 09131 025 oSW 28 GR-ws Ÿ/>0000
MWI RES 33B

25 oSW 33 GR-WS kroga¥fr 72¿, FEE / A
ufE TRIBAL l-l8BlE
4304730969 09135 025 01E 18 GR-WS
GOODRICH l-24AA

301330760 09136 OlS 04W 24 GR-WS

0 3
H 2-2

OlS 04W 25 GR-WS
JENKINS 3-16A3
4301330877 09335 015 03W 16 GR-WS />04
JESSEN 1-15AA
4301330817 09345 015 DAW 15 GR-ws WŸU2

VtBASEL--HACKFORD,2-*lO-AlEl

4304731421 09400 ois 01E 10 GR-ws gibso/f ýß [9EE OR3
UTE TRIBAL l-30Z1
4301330813 09405 01N 01W 30 GR-WS VAŸÝÊY

TOTALS

X)MMENTS

hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge. Date

Jame and Signature: Telephone



O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office <-

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

June 20, 199e JUN 211995

Memorandum DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

TO: Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency, Ft. Duchesne, Utah

FROM: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals, BLM, Utah State Office, Salt Lake City, Utah

SUBJECT: Successor of Operator, Communitization Agreement's (CA) 96-000058,
96-000065, 96-000068, 96-000087, 96-000108, 96-000118, 96-000119,
9C-000123, 9C-000132, 9C-000212, NRM-715, VR491-84672C,
VR491-84680C, VR491-84681C, VR491-84692C, VR491-84694C,
VR491-84703C, VR491-84705C, UTO80149-85C701, UTO80149-85C704,
UTO80l49-85C713, UTO80149-85C714, UTO80\49-86C680,
UTO80149-86C685, UTO80149-87C685, Duchesne and Uintah Counties,
Utah

The enclosed Designation of Successor of Operators for CA's 96-000058, 96-000065,
96-000068, 96-000087, 96-000108, 96-000118, 96-000119, 9C-000123, 9C-000132,
9C-000212, NRM-715, VR491-84672C, VR491-84680C, VR491-84681C, VR491-84692C,
VR491-84694C, VR49l-84703C, VR49l-84705C, UTO80l49-85C701, UTO80\49-85C704,
UTO80149-85C713, UTOSOl49-85C714, UTOSOI49-86C680, UTO80l49-86C685,
UTOS0l49-87C685, Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah, have been reviewed by this
office and found to be acceptable and we recommend approval. The new operator will be
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation. Upon approval of these Successor of Operators, please
return one copy to this office.

If you have any questions, please contact Teresa Thompson at (801) 539-4047.

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Enclosures -

cc: Marlene Boyle
Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.

bec: 96-000058, 96-000065, 96-000068, 96-000087, 96-000108, 96-000118,
96-000119, 9C-000123, 9C-000132, 9C-000212, NRM-715, VR491-84672C,
VR491-84680C, VR491-84681C, VR491-84692C, VR49l-84694C, VR491-84703C,
VR491-84705C, UTO80149-85C701, UTO80149-85C704, UTO80149-85C713,
UTO80149-85C714, UTO80149-86C680, UTO80149-86C685, UTO80l49-87C685
District Manager - Vernal
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid



Coastal
The Enen]y People

May 9, 1995

Ms. Theresa Thompson
Bureau of Land Management
324 S. State, Suite 301
Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

Dear Ms. Thompson:

Enclosed is a list of the Communitization Agreements under which Coastal is currently
balloting the working interest owners to be appointed as successor Operator to Linmar Petroleum
Company. Letters were sent out May 3, 1995, to all working interest owners, and we expect
to have the self certification process completed by June 12, 1995. The Designation of Successor
Operator forms will be mailed to you at that time.

Coastal acquired Linmar's interest in and took over operations of the Chandler 2-5B4 and
the Ellsworth 2-9B4 wells last year. ANR operates the/Chandler 1-5B4 and the/Éllsworth1-
9B4, and ANR is the designated operator under the Communitization Agreement for both these
sections. Coastal has elected to have ANR remain as operator under both of these
Communitization Agreements.

Thank you for answering my many questions. I have appreciated your help and patience
in getting this project completed.

Very truly yours,

Marlene Boyle
Land Consultant

MB:mh

Enclosure

cc: Bonnie Johnston

Coastal Dil& GasCorporation
UBSIDIARY OFTHECOASTA¿

CORPCL¯
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COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS

CA No. UTO80I49-87C685
Section 1, TIS, R2W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C704
Section 3, TIS, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C701
Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C713
Section 4, T4S, R6W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-85C714
Section 5, T4S, R6W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000058
Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. NRM-715
Section 8, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 9C-000123
Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-86C685
Section 12, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah .

CA No. VR49I-84692C
Section 15, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah
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COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS

CA No. 96-000087
Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84672C
Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84680C
Section 17, T1S, RIW, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 9C-000132
Section 18, T1S, R3W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 9C-000212
Section 18, T2S, R1E, U.S.M.
Uintah County, Utah

CA No. UTO80I49-86C680
Section 20, T1N, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84703C
Section 24, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000118
Section 24, T3S, R7W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. UTO8049P-84C723
Section 25, T1N, R2W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000108
Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah
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COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENTS

CA No. 96-000065
Section 27, TIN, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne and Uintah Counties, Utah

CA No. 96-000068
Section 28, T2S, R5W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84681C
Section 29, T1N, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84705C
Section 30, T1N, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. 96-000119
Section 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. VR49I-84694C
Section 34, T1S, R1W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah

CA No. NW-613
Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M.
Duchesne County, Utah
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DIVISIONO'FO , A

AHNDMINING E©ElWÐ
L e Designation and Serial Number:

If r lan, Allottee or Tribe Name:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON W

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepen existing wetts, or to reenter plugget a n 6092& HHNgitigreement Name:
Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such , -

=e attached list.
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: See attached list.
2. Name of Operator: 9. APIWell Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation See attached list.
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

P.O. Box749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altamont/Bluebell
4. Location of Well

Footages: See attached list. County: See attached list.
QQ. Sec., T., R., M.: State: Utah

u. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Sti>mit in Diplicate) (Stà>mit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction
Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing
Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans (_ Shoot or Acidize
Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection [ Vent or Flare
Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off
Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other

[X ] Other Change of operator.

Date of work completion

Approximate date work will start 9/8/94 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONAND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markersand zones pertinentto thiswork.)

There was a change of operator on the date above for all wells on the attahced list:

OPERATOR: - FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: CoastalOil & Gas Corporation

All operations are covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40-66A, Bond No. U6053821 and Nationwide Bond No.962270.

ame & Signat Title: Date: 09/19/94

(mis space for State use only)

(12/92) (See instructions on Reverse



21-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME API # FOOTAGES LOCAT10N COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA# BOND #

Allred 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700' FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16. T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270
Allred 2-16A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T18, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000067 102102, 962270
Barrett 1-34A5 43-013-30323 713' FNL & 1387 FEL Section 34, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Belcher2-33B4 43-013-30907 2346' FNL& 1085' FWL Section 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Birch 1-35A5 43-013-30233 757 FNL & 1024' FEL Section 35, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Birch 2-35A5 43-013-30362 Section 35, TiS, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute - 102102, 962270
Brotherson 1-2584 43-013-30668 778' FNL& 162T FEL Section 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute ' 102102, 962270
Brotherson 1-27B4 43-013-30185 1244' FNL & 1464' FEL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 2-3585 43-013-30908 2432' FNL & 1648' FWL Section 35, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brotherson 2- 3B4 43-013-31008 1226' FSL & 1933' FWL Section 3, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Brown 2-28B5 43-013-30718 177T FSL& 1413' FWL Section 28, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000066 102102, 962270
Carl Smith 2-25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25, T1S.R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000036 102102, 962270
Chandler 2-5B4 43-013-31000 466' FSL & 1180' FWL Section 5. T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Chasel 2-17A1 43-013-30732 1379' FSL& 1360' FWL Section 17, TiS, RiW, U.S,M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49164660C 102102, 962270
Chasel Hackford 2-10A1E 43-047-31421 1120' FSL& 1120' FEL Section 10. T1S, RTE, U.S.M. Uintah Fee Ute UToao14986C693 102102, 962270O Chasel Miller 2-1A2 43-013-30360 Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014987C685 102102, 962270
Christensen 2-26AS 43-013-30905 776' FSL & 1467' FWL Section 26, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Christensen 2-8B3 43-013-30780 1880' FSL& 1694' FWL Section 8. T2S, R3W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Christensen 3-4B4 43-013-31142 804' FSL & 1948' FEL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Christman Blann 1-31B4 43-013-30198 125T FNL& 1552' FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Clark 2-9A3 43-013-30876 Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102, 962270
Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 1097' FSL & 702' FWL Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014987C685 102102, 962270
Dye 1-25Z2 43-013-30659 1520' FSL& 1520' FEL Section 25, T1N, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8049PS4C723 102102, 962270
D. Moon 1-23Zi 43-047-31479 Section 23, T1N, RIW, U.S.M. Ulntah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Ellsworth 2-8B4 43-013-30898 1580' FSL& 1580' FWL Section 8, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Ellsworth 2-9B4 43-013-31138 2976' FNL & 2543' FWL Section 9. T2S. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Evans 1-31A4 43-013-30067 1987' FNL & 1973' FEL Section 31, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-30915 1496° FSL & 1718' FEL Section 27. T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-16A4 43-013-30737 1527' FSL& 834' FEL Section 16, T18, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672C 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609' FNL& 1671' FEL Section 19, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980' FNL& 2080' FEL Section 7. T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Fisher 2-6A3 43-013-30984 404' FSL & 596' FEL Section 6, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Ford 2-36A5 43-013-30911 1113' FSL& 1659' FWL Section 36, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1106' FNL & 1599' FEL Section 24, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184703C 102102, 962270
Griffith 1-33B4 43-013-30288 1307' FNL& 1512' FEL Section 33, T28, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270
Hansen 1-16B3 43-013- 30617 2088' FSL& 1760° FWL Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 1-3A1 43-013-30171 2502' FNL & 2141° FWL Section 3, T18. R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uintah Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Horrocks 2-4A1 43-013-30954 1678' FNL& 1520' FEL Section 4. T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO6014985C701 102102, 962270
Jacobson 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104' FSL & 2417' FWL Section 12. T18. R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014986C685 102102, 962270
Jenkins 3-16A3 43-013-30877 1085' FSL& 1905' FWL Section 16. T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270

O Jensen 1-29Z1 43-013-30725 1331' FSL& 2424' FEL Section 29, T1N, T1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 962270
Jensen 1-31AS 43-013-30186 1380' FNL& 1244' FEL Section 31, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jensen 2-29AS 43-013-30974 1065' FSL & 1528' FWL Section 29, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-15A4 43-013-30817 241T FNL& 1514' FEL Section 15, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270
Jessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182' FNL& 1130' FEL Section 17, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
LeBeau 1-34A1 43-013-30590 Section 34. T1S, R1W. U.S.M. Duchesne/UIntah Fee Ute VR49184694C 102102, 962270
Undsay Russell 1-3284 43-013-30308 1320' FNL& 1320' FEL Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 2-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Linmar 1-1982 43-013-30600 2032' FNL& 2120' FWL Section 19, T2S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Marshall 1-20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL & 1821' FEL Section 20. T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473' FSL& 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270
Murray 3-2A2 43-013-30816 2211' FNL& 2257' FWL Section 2. TiS, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200' FNL& 1200' FEL Section 27, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102302, 962270
Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754' FSL & 1140' FWL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Oman 2-484 43-013-30645 1536' FSL& 1849' FWL Section 4. T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102, 962270
Powell 2-8A3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Section 8. T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270
Rhodes Moon 1-35B5 43-013-30155 870' FNL& 960' FEL Section 35. T2S, R5W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee
Rhoades Moon 1-36B5 43-013-30289 Section 36, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy 1-9A3 43-013-30321 1491' FNL & 1646' FEL Section 9, T18, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000123 102102, 962270
Ti.nothy 3-18A3 43-013-30940 Section 1ô, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 90-000132 102102, 962270
Warren 1-32A4 43-013-30174 1799' FNL& 1104' FEL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 1021.02, 962270
Wildlife Resources 1-33B5 43-013-30649 1804' FNL& 1603' FEL Section 33. T2S.R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8049184C726 102102, 962270
W1\kerson 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 1523° FSL& 1509' FEL Section 20, T1N, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C680 102102, 962270
Wimmer 2-27B4 43-013-30941 904' FNL & 886' FWL Section 27, T2S, R4W. U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 102102,



19-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBEWELL NAME API # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

State 1 -19A4 43-013-30322 985' FNL & 853' FEL Section 19,T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-27912 Ute 102102, 962270State 1-8A3 43-013-30286 1545' FNL & 1489' FEL Section 8, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne ML-24316 Ute NRM-715 102102, 962270Wainoco State i-1481 43-047-30818 Section 14,T2S,R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uintah ML-2402 Ute - 102102,962270

O



SEP261994
Coastal
The EnergyPeople

September 21, 1994

State of Utah
Division of Oil Gas, and Mining
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, UT 84180-1203

ATTN: Leesha Cordoba

Leesha:

I have mailed off the revised list of all the FEE wells to you, as
well as the State wells.

The signed copies of the UIC Form 5's were mailed to the State
approximately 9/12/94. Copies of the sundries sent to the BLM for
all the Indian wells were mailed to the State also on 9/19/94.

I will address the Linmar FEE and CA wells ASAP, and will talk to
our land people on 9/19 to determine the disposition of those wells
temporarily abandoned.

Thanks again for you much appreciated help.

y,

Bonnie Johnston
Environmental Coordinator
(303)573-4476

Coastal Oil&Gas Corporation
A SUBSIDIARY OFTHECOASTAL CORPORATION
60017THST•STE800S
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

PHONE CONVERSATION DOCUMENTATION FORM

Route original/copy to:
E] Well File E] Suspense XVJ Other

(Return Date) (OPER. CHG

(Location) Sec Twp Rng (To - Initials) RJF/FYI

(AÃ?IIIO.) VLC/FYI

1. Date of Phone Call: 5-22-95 Time: 4:30

2. DOGM Employee (name) L. CORDOVA _ (Initiated CallXLXJ9
Talked to:

Name BOB DALE (Initiated Call t 3) - Phone No. ( 303) 572-1121

of (Company/Organization) COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP.

3. Topic of Conversation. LINMAR WELLS SOLD TO COASTAL
(& INDIAN LEASES)

*LINMAR SOLD ALL OF THEIR WELLS TO COASTAL HOWEVER WELLS INVOLVED IN C.A.'S RAVE

NOT BEEN OFFICIALLY APPROVED BY BLM. CHANGE IS IN PROGRESS AT THIS TIME.

4. Highlights of Conversation: **MONTHLY OIL & GAS PRODUCTION & DISPOSITION REPORTS**
(& INDIAN LEASE)

THE DIV. WILL MAIL REMAINING LINMAR WELLS (C.A WELLS) TO:

LINMAR PETROIÆUMCOMPANY
C/O COASTAL OIL & GAS CORP.
P. O. BOX 749DENVEi,¯CO 80Ž01-0749

THE DIV1 IS AWAITING BLM APPROVAL PRIOR TO CHANGING THE OPERATOR FROM LINMAR/N9523

TO COASTAL/NO230. DOCUMENTATION HAS BEEN FILED BY COASTAL AND BLK APPROVAL SHOULD

BE FORTHCOMING SOON!

*LINMAR/L.M. ROHLEDER (303)773-8003
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INMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
Suite 604, 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003

May 18, 1995 2nd NOTICE!

Mr. R. J. Firth
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

GENTLEMEN:

Please be advised that LINMKR PETROLEUM COMPANY has sold all of its oil and gas
interests to Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation effective July 1, 1994. Please
change your records accordingly.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Very truly,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

BY: .h

Vice President of Managing
General Partner

LMR

ENCLS.: MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT (Form 10) and
MONTHLY OIL AND GAS DISPOSITION REPORT (Form
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INMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY
Suite 604, 7979 East Tufts Avenue Parkway, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003

March 15, 1995

STATE OF UTAH L M NM
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
3 Triad Center, Suite 350
Salt Lake City, Utah 84180-1203

RE: "MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT" (Form 10) & "MONTHLY OIL AND GAS
DISPOSITION REPORT" (Form 11)

Gentlemen:

Please be advised that Linmar Petroleum Company has sold all of its oil and gas
interests to Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation effective July 1, 1994. We are,
therefore, returning the enclosed forms. Please change your records accordingly.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Very truly,

LINMAR PETROLEUM COMPANY

Vice President of
Managing General Partner

LMR



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

5 Lease Designation and Serial Number:

SEP2 6 199A ee
f indian,Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON te
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepenexisting wells, or to reenter plugged and e ÙnitAgreement Name:

Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such proposals. See attached list.
1. Type of Well: 8. Well Name and Number:

OIL GAS OTHER: See attached list.
2. Name of Operator: 9. APIWell Number:

Linmar Petroleum Company See attached list.
3. Address and Telephone Number: 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat:

7979 East Tufts Ave. Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, CO 80237 (303)773-8003 Altamont/Bluebell
4. Location of Well

Footages: See attached list. county: See attached list.
QQ, Sec., T., R., M.: State: Utah

u. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)

[¯ Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction

Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize

Conversion to injection Shoot or Acidize Conversion to Injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other

Other Change of operator.

Date of work completion

Approximate date work willstart 9/8/94 Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETIONAND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)

There was a change of operator on the date above for all wells on the attahced list:

OPERATOR: - FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

All operations are covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40-66A, Bond No. U6053821 and Nationwide Bond No.962270.

13.

Name&Signature: BY: L. M. ROHLEDER/ 7, Title:

P OLFMAN INRG
oate: 9/20/94

(This space for State use only)

(12/92) (See Instructions on Reverse



22-Sep-94

LEASE TRIBE
WELL NAME API # FOOTAGES LOCATION COUNTY DESIGNATION NAME CA # BOND #

AIIred 1-16A3 43-013-30232 700' FNL & 1280' FEL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270AIIred 2-16A3 43-013-8GSG17036/
.

Section 16,T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270Belcher 2-33B4 43-013-30907 2348' FNL & 1085' FWL Section 33, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102, 962270Brown 2-28B5 43-013-30718 1777' FSL & 1413' FWL Section 28, T2S, RSW, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000068 102102, 962270Carl Smith 2-25A4 43-013-30776 Section 25,T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000036 102102, 962270Chasel 2-17A1 43-013-30732 1379' FSL & 1360' FWL Section 17, T1S, Ri W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184680C 102102, 962270Chasel Hackford 2-10A1E 43-047-31421 1120' FSL & 1120' FEL Section 10, T1S, R1E, U.S.M. Uintah Fee Ute UT08014986C693 102102, 962270Chasel Miller 2-1A2 43-013-30360 Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTO8014987C685 102102, 962270Clark 2-9A3 43-013-30876 Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102, 962270Duncan 3-1A2 43-013-31135 1097' FSL & 702' FWL Section 1, T1S, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UTOSO14987C685 102102, 962270Dye 1 -2522 43-013-30659 1620' FSL & 1520' FEL Section 25, T1N, R2W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08049P84C723 102102, 962270Fieldsted 2-27A4 43-013-30915 1496' FSL & 1718' FEL Section 27,T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270Fisher 1-16A4 43-013-30737 1527' FSL & 834' FEL Section 16, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184672C 102102, 962270Fisher 1-7A3 43-013-30131 1980' FNL & 2080' FEL Section 7,T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270Goodrich 1-24A4 43-013-30760 1106' FNL & 1599' FEL Section 24,T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184703C 102102, 962270Griffith 1-33B4 43-013-30288 1307' FNL & 1512' FEL Section 33,T2S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000119 102102,962270
Horrocks 2-4A1 43-013-30954 1678' FNL & 1520' FEL Section 4, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014985C701 102102, 962270Jacobson 2-12A4 43-013-30985 1104' FSL & 2417' FWL Section 12, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C685 102102, 962270Jenkins 3-16A3 43-013-30877 1085' FSL & 1905' FWL Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000087 102102, 962270Jensen 1-29Z1 43-013-30725 1331' FSL & 2424' FEL Section 29, T1N, T1W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184681C 102102, 962270Jessen 1-15A4 43-013-30817 241T FNL & 1514' FEL Section 15,T1S,R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute VR49184692C 102102, 962270LeBeau 1-34A1 43-013-30590 Section 34,T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Duchesne/Uintah Fee Ute VR49184694C 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 1-32B4 43-013-30308 1320' FNL & 1320' FEL Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270
Lindsay Russell 2-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000116 102102, 962270Morris 2-7A3 43-013-30977 2473' FSL & 580' FWL Section 7, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000058 102102, 962270Olsen 1-27A4 43-013-30064 1200' FNL & 1200' FEL Section 27,T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000108 102102, 962270Oman 2-32A4 43-013-30904 754' FSL & 1140' FWL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270
Powell 2-8A3 43-013-30979 661' FSL & 1114' FWL Section 8, T1S,R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NRM-715 102102,962270Rhoades Moon 1-36B5 43-013-30289 Section 36,T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 96-000113 102102, 962270
Timothy 1-9A3 43-013-30321 1491' FNL & 1646' FEL Section 9, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute 9C-000123 102102, 962270
Timothy 3-18A3 43-013-30940 Section 18, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute GC-000132 102102, 962270
Warren 1-32A4 43-013-30174 1799' FNL & 1104' FEL Section 32, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute NW-613 102102, 962270Wildlife Resources 1-3385 43-013-30649 1804' FNL & 1603' FEL Section 33,T2S,R5W, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08049184C726 102102, 962270
Wilkerson 1-20Z1 43-013-30942 1523' FSL & 1509' FEL Section 20,T1N,RTW, U.S.M. Duchesne Fee Ute UT08014986C680 102102, 962270
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT | Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation a

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Fee
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian. Alottee or T

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT' - for such proposals
Ute

7. If Unitor CA, Agree

SUBMIT IN TR/PLICATE N/A
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No

Oil Well Gas Well Other See attached list.
2. Name of Operator 9. AAPIWell No.

Linmar Petroleum Company See attached list.
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

7979 East Tufts Ave. Parkway, Suite 604, Denver, CO 80237 (303) 773-8003 See attached list.
Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. Countyor Parish, State

See attached list.
See attached list of wells.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to injection

Other Cliange of Operator oisposewater
(NOTE: Report results of muttple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

There will be a change of operator for all wells specified on the attached list.

OPERATOR - FROM: Linmar Petroleum Company
TO: Coastal Oil and Gas Corporation

All operations will be covered by Nationwide Bond No. 11-40-66A and Bond No. U6053821, as required by the State of
Utah.

SEP

14. I hereby certify that the to oing is true a t
- Vice President of

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Title Date |
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 16 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraud ent statements or

representations as to any matter within its judsdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



01-Sep-94

LEASEWELLNAME API# FOOTAGES LOCATION FIELD COUNTY DESIGNATION
Ällred2-16A3 43-013-30361 Section 16, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee 9/rc x37Barrett 1-34A5 43-013-30323 713' FNL& 1387' FEL Section 34, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeBirch 1-35AS 43-013-30233 757' FNL& 1024' FEL Section 35, TiS, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeBirch2-35A5 43-013-30362 Section 35, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeBrotherson 1-25B4 43-013-30668 778' FNL& 1627' FEL Section 25, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeBrotherson 1-27B4 43-013-30185 1244' FNL & 1464' FEL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeBrotherson 2-3585 43-013-30908 2432' FNL& 1648' FWL Section 35, T2S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeBrotherson 2-3B4 43-013-31008 1226' FSL & 1933' FWL Section 3, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeÓhandler2-5B4 43-013-31000 466' FSL& 1180' FWL Section 5, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee 90Christensen 2-26A5 43-013-30905 776' FSL& 1467' FWL Section 26, T18, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeChristensen 2-883 43-013-30780 1880' FSL & 1694' FWL Section 8, T2S, R3W,U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeChristensen 3-4B4 43-013-31142 804' FSL &1948' FEL Section 4, T2S, R4W, U,S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeChristman Blann 1-31B4 43-013-30198 1257' FNL& 1552' FEL Section 31, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeD. Moon1-23Z1 43-047-31479 Section 23, T1N, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Uintah FeeEllsworth 2-8B4 43-013-30898 1580' FSL &1580' FWL Section 8, T2S, R4W,U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeEllsworth2-984 43-013-31138 2976' FNL &2543' FWL Section 9, T2S, R4W,U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeEvans1-31A4 43-013-30067 1987' FNL& 1973' FEL Section 31, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeFisher 1-19A3 43-013-30535 1609' FNL & 1671' FEL Section 19, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeFisher 2-6A3 43-013-30984 404' FSL & 596' FEL Section 6, TiS, R3W,U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeFord 2-36AS 43-013-30911 1113' FSL &1659' FWL Section 36, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeHansen 1-1683 43-013-30617 2088' FSL & 1760' FWL Section 16, T2S, R3W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeHorrocks 1-SA1 43-013-30171 2502' FNL & 2141' FWL Section 3, T1S, R1W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne/Uintah FeeJensen 1-31AS 43-013-30186 1380' FNL & 1244' FEL Section 31, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeJensen 2-29AS 43-013-30974 1085' FSL & 1528' FWL Section 29, T1S, R5W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeJessen 1-17A4 43-013-30173 1182' FNL & 1130' FEL Section 17, T1S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeLindsay Russell2-32B4 43-013-30371 Section 32, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne Fee %-0Linmar1-19B2 43-013-30600 2032' FNL&2120' FWL Section 19, T2S, R2W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeMarshalli-20A3 43-013-30193 565' FNL & 1821' FEL Section 20, T1S, R3W, U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne FeeMurray 3-2A2 43-013-30816 2211' FNL&2257' FWL Section 2, T1S,R2W,U.S.M. Bluebell Duchesne FeeOman 2-484 43-013-30645 1536' FSL &1849' FWL Section 4, T2S, R4W,U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeRhoades Moon1-35BS 43-013-30155 870' FNL&960' FEL Section 35, T2S, R5W,U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne FeeNimmer2-27B4 43-013-30941 904' FNL &886' FWL Section 27, T2S, R4W, U.S.M. Altamont Duchesne



Form 3160-5 - U D STATES FORM APPROVED
(June1990) DEPARTML OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo.1004-0135

- BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Sedal No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS CA 96-000108
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Alottenor Tdbe Name

Use "APPLICATIONFOR PERMlT' - for such proposals
Ute

7. If Unitor CA, AgreementDesignailon

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

011Well Gas Well Other Olsen #1-27A4
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30064
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. Countyor Parlsh, State

1200' FNL & 1200' FEL
NENE Section 27-T1S-R4W Duchesne County, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S)TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Noticeof Intent Abandonment Changeof Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other Perf & Acidize oispo.. wat.«
(NOTE: Report results of mult¢Ie completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and tru vertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see the attached workover procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

14. I hereby certify that the to going is true and correct

Signed . .. Title Environmental & Safety Analyst Date 08/22/95
Sheila Bremer

(This space for Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Title Date
Conditionsotapproval,Ifany:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes It a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representatlons as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse



OLSEN 1-27A4
Section 27 T1S R4W

Altamont Field
Duchesne Co. Utah

WELL DAT4

Location: 1200 FNL 1200 FEL

Elevation: 6500 GL 6520 KB

Total Depth: 15,805' 12,000'(CIBP capped w/cmt)

Casing: 9-5/8" 40# K-55 ST&C set @ 3457'. Cmt'd wl1900 sx. Cmt'd
w/400 sx at surf.
7-5/8' 39,33.7,26.4# YS-95. Set @ 12503'. Cmt'd w/475 sx.
5-1/2" 22.54# P-110 FJ Hydrill. Set @ 15,556'. TOL @
12,200'. Did not cmt. Sqz liner top 2-25-76 w/200 sx.

Capacity Burst Collapse

Description I_Q Drift (BPF) (PSI) (PSI)

9-5/8" 40# K-55 8.835 8.679 .0758
3950 2570

7-5/8 39# YS-95 6.625 6.500 .0426
10900 9980

7-5/8 33.7#YS-95 6.765 6.640 .0444
9380 7260

7-5/8 26.4#YS-95 6.969 6.844 .0459
7150 3710

5-1/2 22.5 P-110 4.670 4.545 .0211
14530 14520

FJ Hydrill

WELL HISTORY

See Detail

Shut in March of 1994 Last average production 12 BOPD 55 BWPD 13



OLSEN 1-27A4
Section 27 T1S R4W

Altamont Field
Duchense Co. Utah

1. MIRU OWP. Perforate the following interval w/ 2" RTT tbg gun loaded
w/3 JSPF. Hole size .34", penetration 9.25".

10,994-11,983' 43' 129 holes ce a s a b á ), A obs

Slickline tagged TD @ 11,700' on 5-30-95.
Reference Schlumberger BHC Sonic-GR log, run #1, dated 5-6-74.

2. Drop SV. PT tbg to 5000 psi. Pull SV. Drop blanking sleeve.

3. MIRU Dowell to acidize Green River perforations from 10,994-11,983'
.

w/11,000 gals 15% HCL per attached treating schedule. MTP 5000 psi.
*Acid volume may change depending on the number of holes shot.

4. Pull blanking sleeve. Swab test well.

5. Drop SV. Drop pump. Return to production.



O g
GREATERALTAMONTFIELD

¢0ASTAL- QLSEN#1-27A4
NEI4Sec.27,T18·R4W
DuchesneCounty,Utah

PERFORATIONSCHEDULE

DEPTHREFERENCE:SCHLUMBERGERBHCSONIC-GRRun#1,5-6-74

10,994 11,512 11,802'
11,555 11,810

11,010 11,559 11,843*

11,020 11,597
11,028 11,901

11,610 11,914'
11,112 11,623 11,930
11,122 11,639 11,940'
11,132 11,670' 11,946*

11,142 11,690 11,952*
11,163* 11,962*

11,704 11,964'
11,247 11,714 11,983
11,Ž60* 11,735*
11,288* 11,752*

11,770*

11,301 11,788*

11,309 <- As t, oo '
s-so-a a

11,411*
11,493

43 totalfeet, 36 zones
*17 totalfeet minimumdependingon guntypeused

P. T. Loeffler
May30,



e e .

OLSON·1 -27A4
Sec 27; 18; 4W

9 5/9' Shoe: 3457'

Shut in Well oud ti .

- E._.2 3/8' Tubing La et 4 ¾
last Average Production: SealLoc &Brd

20 BOPD*

95 BWPD * 7 ? 7/8' Tubing
50 MCFD* / 6.5#, NuLock, NSO

DownholePump:
Packer: Baker7 5/8' R3@ 10,900'

Surface Equipment 6,a to se,a.to 44' (.ek.a.s

J100 transmisson Perfs 11,373- 11,821' Mar90
Perfs 11,780-11,920' Sep '80

Commenis: 69 feet, g holes
This well is currently shut in ra• ese

Lease held by Reldsted 2-27A4 CIBP 12,052'

Static FLabout 7800' OTIS Packer a 2,164
TOL· 12,200'

7 5/8' Shoe: 12,503'

Perfs 13,603-15,334' Mar76
200 holes

03--Sep-94 5 1/2" Shoe:



UNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
October 12, 1995

ATL TOF: Acting Superintendent, Uintah and Ouray Agency

SUBJECT: DOSignation of Successor Operator

to: Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office
23 1995

We are in receipt of the Designation of successor operator for ag, 1whereby Linmar Petroleum Company resigned as Operator and Coastal GAS&MININGCorporation was designated as the new operator for comnunization Agreemen
(CA) listed below:

Sec./ Legal
CA Number Twnshp/Rng Descrip. Acres96-000118 24-38-7W Al l 640 .09C-000212 18-25-1E All 639.18VR49I-84703C .24-lS-4W All 640.0UTO80I49-85C713 04-4S-6W

. ALL 641.11 OCT2 CT
UTO80I49-85C714 05-4S-6W ALL 641.84996-000058 07-lS-3W ALL 630 .1296-000065 27-lN-lW ALL 640.096-000068 28-2S-5W ALL 640.096-000087 16-lS-3W ALL 640.0964000108 -lS-4W já c | ALL 640.096-000119 33-2S-4W 'ALL 654.0890-000123 09-lS-3W ALL 640 .0§C-000132 18-lS-3W ALL 630.72NRM-715 08-lS-3W ALL 640 .0VR49I-84680C 17-lS-lW ALL 640.0

VR49I-84672C 16-lS-4W ALL 640.0VR49I-84681C 29-lN-lW ALL 640.0
VR49I-84692C 15-lS-4W ALL 640.0
VR49I-84694C 34-lS-lW ALL 640 .0 MINERAL&MININGVR49I-84705C 30-lN-lW ALL 638 . 92 ud U&OAGENCY-- UTO80I49-85C701 04-1S-IW ALL 659.14
UTOSOI49-85C704 03-lS-3W ALL 688.68
ÚTO80I49-86C680 20-lN-IW ALL 640.0
ÚTOSOI49-86C685 12-lS-4W ALL 640.0
UTOSOI49-87C685 01-lS-2W ALL 664.25

The enclosed instruments were approved on October 10, 1995. Coastal Bond No.ll-40-66A will be used to cover all CA operations, plugging and abandonment of
wells.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801) 722-2406, Ext.
51/52/54.

Enclosures OPTIONAL FORM NO. 10
(REv. 1-ao)cc: Lisha Cordova, Utah State DOGM esarema<ascen>tos-ts.e
5010-114



FORM 10 STATE OF UTAH
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 2 4355 West North Temple, 3 Triad, Suite 350, Salt Lake City. UT 84180-1203

MONTHLY OIL AND GAS PRODUCTION REPORT

OPERATOR NAME AND ADDRESS:
UTAff ACCOUNT NUMBER:

N9523

C/0 COASTAL OIL & GAS 5 / 95REPORT PERIOD (MONTH/YEAR):t-+¾¾AR-P£-TROLEWMMPANY
PO BOX 749
DENVER CO 80201-0749

AMENDED REPORT (Highlight Changes)

Well Name Producing Well Days Production Volumes
API Number Entity Location Zone Status Oper OIL(BBL) GAS(MCF) WATER(BBL)

TIMOTHY 1-9A3 -

4301330321 09115 ois 03W 9 GR-WS 072ÍS
ALLRED 1-lbA3
4301330232 09116 ois 03W 16 GR-ws ¶ opoDF7
FISHER 1-16A4
4301330737 09117 015 04W 16 GRRVL ŸÂÛŸÝËŸ$f-

AOLSEN l 27A4f
(4301330064 09119 ois 04W 27 GR-ws ¾600/02

BROWN 2-2889
301330718 09131 025 OSW 28 GR-ws fŠdoddŠf

WILDLIFE RES. l-33BS
01330649 09132 025 OSW 33 GR-ws ifrafal/ffff/dŸ2/, FEE 5.74//

ufE TRIBAL 1-1881E
43oh730969 09135 02S 01E 18 GR-WS fdádâŒÍS-
GOODRLCHl-24Ah

301330760 09136 ois obw 24 GR-ws VAŸî/FYŸJSti
/CARL SMITH 2-25AA'

4301330776 09137 ois 04w 25 GR-ws ý -dom3

FE~
7/5 x

JENKINS 3-l6A3
4301330877 09335 015 03w 16 GR-ws 9/,00007Ÿ
JESSEN l-l5AA
4}Ol330817 09345 ois okw 15 GR-ws VA¥9/s¥/,fel-

WHASEL*NA01 GRD,2-10-A l E'
4304731421 09400 OlS 01E 10 GR-WS terofo/fff¾ 73 PEE 78 Y

"UTE TRIBAL 1-3ozi
4301330813 09405 01N 01W 30 GR-ws VAVîlfŸo66

TOTALS

DMMENT3:

hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge. Date·

lame and Signature: Telephone



Form 3160-5 I TED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(June 1990) DEPAR T OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. LeaseDesignation and $erialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS CA 96-000108
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. If Indian,Alottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" - for such proposals

Ute
7. IfUnitor CA,Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

OilWell Gas Well Other Olsen #l-27A4
2. Name of Operator 9. API WellNo.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30064
3. Address and Telephone No. 10. Field and Pool, Or Exploratory Area

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., Or Survey Description) 11. Countyor Parish, State

1200' FNL & 1200' FEL

NENE Section 27-TlS-R4W Duchesne County, UT
12. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Final Abandonment Notice AlteringCasing Conversion to Injection
Other Store oil in tanlc Dispose water

( E: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed operations(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. Ifwell is directionally
drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and truvertical depths for all markets and zones pertinent to thiswork.)*

The operator requests permission to store oil sludge in the production tank on this location. The tank has been sealed.

APR22 1997

DIV.0FO
MININ3|

14. I hereby Šrtifyth foregoing is trueand c ek

Signed TRI Senior Environmental Analyst Dat 04/18/97
Bonnie Carson

(This space fo Federal or State office use)

APPROVED BY Tit! Dat
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false, ficticious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See Instruction on Reverse



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH 4-KAS L /

2. CDWV 5-LlW'
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed item is completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995
Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS

43-013-30064 9119 27-01S-04W FEE OW P
FIELDSTED 2-2 43-013-30915 9632 27-01S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 43-013-30292 1841 28-01S-04W FEE OW P
FIELDSTED 2-28A4 43-013-31293 11177 28-01S-04W FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN 2-29A4 43-013-31303 11235 29-01S-04W FEE OW P
EVANS UNIT 1-31A4 43-013-30067 1560 31-01S-04W FEE OW P
WARREN 1-32A4 43-013-30174 4730 32-01S-04W FEE OW S
OMAN 2-23A4 43-013-30904 10045 32-01S-04W FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 1-33A4 43-013-30272 1680 33-01S-04W FEE OW P
LINDSAY 2-33A4 43-013-31141 10457 33-01S-04W FEE OW P
UTE 2-34A4 43-013-30978 10070 34-01S-04W FEE OW P
MILES 2-35A4 43-013-31087 1966 35-01S-04W FEE OW P
RUST 2-36A4 43-013-31092 1577 36-01S-04W FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN 2-26A5 43-013-30905 9630 26-01S-05W FEE OW P
JENSEN 2-29A5 43-013-30974 10040 29-01S-05W FEE OW P
JENSEN 1-31A5 43-013-30186 4740 31-01S-05W FEE OW P
BARRETT 1-34A5 43-013-30323 9121 34-01S-05W FEE OW S
BIRCH 1-35A5 43-013-30233 9122 35-01S-05W FEE OW S
FORD 2-36A5 43-013-30911 9406 36-01S-05W FEE OW P
KARL SHISLER U 1-3B1 43-013-30249 5930 03-02S-01W FEE OW S

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/2001
3. The new company has been checked through the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 06/21/2001

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:



O O -

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: N/A

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: N/A

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 06/27/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 06/27/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 06/20/2001

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 06/27/2001

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed has furnished a bond: 400JU0708

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: COMPLETION OF OPERATOR CHANGE

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on: I /

FILING:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

OlVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERJALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTlCES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN.ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do nol use this form for p<oposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen exisling wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or lo

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Exhibir "A"
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

368 Santh 1700 yest any Vernal STATEUtahzie84078 \435-789-4433
4, LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERlDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate dale work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Name Change
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinenl details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE Vice PTOSident

SIGNATURE DATE

El Paso uction Oil & Gas Coäpãñ

NAME(PLEASEPRif ) JOhn T z er TITLE Vice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for ate use only RE EIVED
JUN19 2001

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVISIONOF
OIL, GAS AND



State of Delaware

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, KARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECElVED
JUN19 2001
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND MINING

6 Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:



g O
003/00303/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 40gg CORP. LAW DEPT.

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorgarized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOESHEREBY CERTTFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Directors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that, as amended, said Article shall be andread as follows:
"FTRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas

Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THIRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secretary, this 9th dayof March 2001.

COASTALOIL& GAS CORPORATION

David L. Siddall
Vice PresidentAttest:

STATE OF DELAWARE
SECRETARY OF STATE

DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSt E. Roark, Assistant Secretary \f FILZD 11: 00 AM 03/09/2001
i W 010118394 - 0610204

JUN i 9 2001
DIVISIONOF

OIL,GAS AND



S OF UTAH
DIVISlON OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. Lease Designation and Serial Number

FEE
6. Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name:

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, deepen existing wells,or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 7. Unit Agreement Name:

Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLOR DEEPEN form for such purposes CA96-000108

8. Well Name and Number:
1. Type of Well: OIL GAS OTHER: Olsen #1-27A4

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well Number:

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-30064
3. Address and Telephone Number. 10. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

Altamont
P.O. Box 1148, Vernal UT 84078 (435) -781-7023

4. Location of Well

Footages: 1200'FNL & 1200'FEL County: Duchesne
QQ,Sec., T., R., M.: Section 27-T1S-R4W state: Utah

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT

(Submit in Dupilcate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandon New Construction Abandon* New Construction

Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing Repair Casing Pull or Alter Casing

O Change of Plans Recomplete Change of Plans Pedorate

Convert to injection Perforate Converno Injection Vent or Flare

O Fracture Treat or Acidize Vent or Flare Fracture Treat or Acidize Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other Açidi7e

O Other
Date of work completion ? /26 /01

Approximate date work willstart Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs on WELL
COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG form.

* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report

12. DESCRIBEPROPOSEDORCOMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. Ifwell is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true
vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

The existing perforations from 11,170' - 11, 920' were acidized on the subject location.

Please refer to the attached Chronological Well History.

DMSION OF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

ame & Sign (/( GA ) Title P
QCU

tO Y Anal ySt Date 4/11/01

(This space for State use only)

(5/94) (See instructions on Reverse



e O
THE COASTAL CORPORATION

PRODUCTION REPORT
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

OLSON 1-27A4
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL FIELD
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
TD: 15,805'
5-1/2" LINER @12,200-15,556'
PERFS: 11,373-11,920' 207 holes

1976 Squeezed casing leak at 3400'. Perf 13,603-15,334' 200 holes.

9/80 Set CIBP @12,052'. Perf 11,780-920'

6/1985 Casing leak at 3507'. Sqzd w/ 150 sx down surf and 250 sx in hole. No test.
Pumped addtl 200 sx. New leak at 4790'. Produce w/sidestring.

3/90 Add perfs 11,373-821'

9/1/94 Acquired f/Linmar

2/13-24/98 Pull tbg clean out to 12,052'. MIRU. NDWH. NUBOP. Unsting out of pmp
cavity. POOH w/ 299 jts.2-3/8" tbg & stinger. Rls 7-5/8" R-3 packer. POOH
w/ 351 jts 2-7/8" tbg & pmp. RU Delsco & RIH w/ 6" gauge ring. Tag fill @
11,032'. POOH to 3400' stuck in hole. Pull 2500# on wire line pulled line out
of rope socket. PU 5-3/4" x 1-1/2" overshot & RIH. Tagged fish @ 3400'
chased to bottom @11,032', work overshot over fish, TOOH tbg & fish from
9,500', rec all wireline tools, PU 6 1/2" drag bit, bit sub, & tbg float, RIH to
4,800' (FL @2,800'), prepare to RIH w/ Weatherford foam clean out unit. NU
csg to flat tk. IFL @3143'. Circ w/ foam unit. RIH to 9800' circ to surface
w/foam. RIH tag fill @11,032'. Circ to surface. RU power swivel. Mill on
scale @11,032'. Hard scale for 3 jts. Then fell through. RIH tag fill @11,869'.
Circ w/foam. Could not circ 2000# on foam unit. RU HOT. Pump up to

4000# held. RD HOT. RD foam unit. POOH w/ 2-7/8" & 6-1/2" drag bit.
NU 9.5 well head. Make up Trico AV~ series pmp cavity on r-3 packer & RIH,
Hydro testing below slips to 8500#. Tested cavity to 10,000# held. Set pkr @
10,938'. RU 4 Star to hydro test 2-3/8" tbg 6500#. RIH w/ Trico stinger got
very waxy. Flush w/ hot wtr. Land tbg in hanger. RU Delsco RIH w/
standing valve. POOH truck twisted drive line off. POOH RD Delsco.
NUWH PT tbg to 4000# OK. PT WH 5000# ok.



2/21/01 AFE: RETRIEVE STUCK PMP, ACID STIMULATION
R/R F 1-36B5 TO LOC, R/U, ND 9" 5000# W/H, NU X/O SPOOL & BOP,
UNLAND 2 3/8" TBG, UNSTING 2 3/8" TBG @ 10,912' LET 2 3/8" TBG
EQUALIZE, SDFD. DAY 1

2/22/01 AFE: RETRIEVE STUCK PMP, ACID STIMULATION
OPEN WELL, 0#, POOH W/ 359 JTS 2 3/8" TBG & STINGER, NDBOP,
UNLAND 2 7/8" TBG NUBOP, P/U ON TBG, UNSET 7 5/8" PKR @10,964',
POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG 108 STDS, EOT @4,300', SWI.

DAY 2
2/23/01 AFE: RETRIEVE STUCK PMP, ACID STIMULATION

OPEN WELL, FIN POOH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, V-PMP CAVITY, 1 JT 2 7/8", 7
5/8" R-3 PKR, P/U NEW 7 5/8" R-3 PKR, 1 JT 2 7/I8" TBG, NEW
CAVITY, RIH W/ 2 7/8" TBG, 351 JTS, NDBOP, SET PKR @10,964' S/N
@10,933', LAND TBG W/ 20,000# COMP, NU BOP, P/U STINGER, RIH
W/ 2 3/8" TBG, EOT @4000', SWI.

DAY 3
2/24/01 AFE: RETRIEVE STUCK PMP, ACID STIMULATION

FIN RIH W/ 2 3/8" TBG, X/O, 19 2 3/8" TBG COLLARS, 349 JTS 2 3/8"
TOTAL, STUNG INTO LANDING BOWL @10,913', W/ 8000# COMP,
FLSH 2 7/8" TBG W/ 50 BBLS,RAN S/V, FILL BOTH TBGS W/ 15 BBLS,
P/T 4000# OK, NU WH, RIH W/ W/L & RETRIEVE S/V, RIH W/
BLANKING SLEEV E, LAND IN PMP CAV @10,913', R/ D W/L, SDFN.

DAY 4
2/25/01 AFE: RETRIEVE STUCK PMP, ACID STIMULATION

OPEN WELL, R/U DOWELL, ~ ~~ ' ' " ' W/
4000 GAL 15% HCL, 200 BALL SEALERS, MAX PSI 3,586#, MAX RT 7
BPM, AVG PSI 2685#, AVG RT 6.5 BPM, ISIP 800#, 5 MIN 276#, 10 MIN
75#, 15 MIN 0#, TOT LOAD 209 BBLS,DIV FAIR, R/D DOWELL, NU
F/L, R/U W/L, EQBLANKSLEEVE & PULL RUN IN W/ S/V, PUT IN
PLACE @10,934', R/D W/L, PUT PMP IN TREE, R/U PMP POLE, RLS
RIG, CIRC WELL 2 HRS, DROP PMP, POP.

DAY



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET L DJJ
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X Operator Name Change

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 7/1/2006

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1845-El Paso Production O&G Company N3065-El Paso E&P Company, LP

1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street

Houston, TX 77002 Houston, TX 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 420-2300 Phone: 1 (713) 420-2131

CA No. Unit:

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 7/5/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 7/5/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/30/2006

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 2114377-0181

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: requested 7/18/06

6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: ok

6c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on:

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the rnerger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM not yet BIA not yet

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: not yet

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 7/14/2006

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 7/19/2006

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 7/19/2006

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006

4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 7/19/2006
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 7/5/2006

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473

3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO708

a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a applicable wells moved

The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/20/2006

COMMENTS:

El Paso 1 FORM 4A.xis



STATEOFUTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

MULTIPLELEASES
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBENAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITar CA AGREEMENT MAME

Do not use thisform for pmposalsto drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwallsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
ddll horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 1YPE OF MELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER.
OIL WELL GASWELL OTHER SEE ATTACHED

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PMONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILOCAY:

1339 EL SEGUNDO AVE NE ALBUQUERQUE NM 87113 (505) 344-9380 SEE ATTACHED
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: SEE ATTACHED COUNTY: UINTAH& DUCHESNE

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT O CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE O OTHER: CHANGE OF
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAFlom OPERATOR

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, elc.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL AND GAS COMPANY (CURRENT OPERATOR) HAS
TRANSFERRED ITS OPERATORSHIP TO EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. (NEW OPERATOR) EFFECTIVE dUNE-SO, u
2006 AND THAT EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS CONSIDEREDTO BE THE NEW OPERATOR OF THE
ATTACHEDWELL LOCATIONS.

EL PASO E&P COMPANY, L.P. IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE LEASE(S)
FOR THE OPERATIONSCONDUCTED UPON LEASED LANDS. BOND COVERAGE IS PROVIDED BY THE STATE
OF UTAHSTATEWIDE BLANKETBOND NO. 400JUO705, BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENTNATIONWIDEBOND
NO. 103601420, AND BUREAU OF INDIANAFFAIRSNATIONWIDEBOND NO. 103601473.

El Paso E & P Company, L. P. gggg §
1001 Louisiana
Houston, TX 77002

William M. Griffin, Sr. Vi President

NAME(PLEASEPRI CHERYL CAMERON y, AUTHORIZED REGULATORY AGENT

SIGNAT DATE 6/20/2006

DMslonof011,GasandMining Ë$
EarlenoRussell,Engineerin6Technician'""'""""*"' """" "' DIVOFOIL,GAS&



RECEIVED: Feb. 20, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 OLSEN 1-27A4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013300640000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1200 FNL 1200 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 27 Township: 01.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1 /27 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached procedure and WBS's for further details.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /20 /2012

February 22, 2012

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well OLSEN 1-27A4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013300640000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1200 FNL 1200 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 27 Township: 01.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/27/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached procedure and WBS's for further details. Approved by the
Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: February 22, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/20/2012

RECEIVED: Feb. 20,
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The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013300640000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified. 

3. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

4. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 

5. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

6. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

7. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply. 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

TI, BAS Pr N1NTMG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43013300640000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified.

3. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface.

4. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration.

5. AII requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

6. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

7. AII other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEIVED: Feb. 22,
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Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

2/ 2/201 Wellbore Diagram _ _ _ _ r263

API Well No: 43-013-30064-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: OLSEN 1-27A4

Company Name: EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP
Location: See: 27 T: IS R: 4W Spot: NENE String Information
Coordinates: X: 557958 Y: 4469101

.

Bottom Diameter Weight Length CagA(
String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft) .Ç(CField Name: ALTAMONT
HOL1 3457 12.25

County Name: DUCHESNE SURF 3457 9.625 40
HOL2 12503 8.75
11 12503 7,625 39
Il 12503 7.625 33.7
1 12503 7.625 29.7 ).

12503 7.625 26.4 ·ÿ, T 9
IOL3 15805 6.5

Ll 15556 5 5

S

aub)On

ub) Class Sacks
il 12503 9400 69.(<35 175

Sl]ItF 3457 0 35 1600
SURF 3457 0 G 450
SURF 3457 0 50 250

P oration Information

2ose. i (it sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze
13862 15210

Liner frorn 155p6 [L to 12200 ft ) s iOL
n fr 12503 fl. to 9400 ft

'Lo40

Formation Informathlon

TL . BMSW 3950
GRRV 10421

20 i WSTC 12040

Hole: 6.5 in. @15805 ft.

TD: 15805 TVD: PBTD:

Page
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Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

Injection Well Area of Review
L- OLSEN 1-27A4

43013302080VV 4301330259NA 43013301660VVx --
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« 43013301640VV 4A """"
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I i3302 OW 4301330173
43013È4230133130301 OW 43ÑÑËÊÑ W 4:

¯¯
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->43013300480VV 4301330062 01330129
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43 31374301334027 e4301350123 1333904 4301330052OVy 4301330911

4301330097C)Ai 4301330112 g 430133 0 4 43013312450Vy* 430133 010V
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4 * 4 133 74301330124 4301331138 4301330104OVV ee e 4301350712
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43
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RECEIVED: Feb. 20, 2012

  Date: 02/16/2012 
  Olsen 1-27A4 
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Olsen 1-27A4 
API # 43-013-30915  DOGM Operator: N3065 Field: 55    

Entity: 09119 
Altamont / Bluebell Field – Duchesne County, Utah 

NE/4 NE/4; 1,200’FSL 1,200’FWL of  
Section 27, Township 1 S, Range 4 W USB&M 

Lat. = 40.360760, Long. = -110.420180    
Approximately 2 miles Northwest of Altamont, Utah 

Regulatory Summary Plug & Abandonment Procedure  
 
 
CURRENT STATUS:
According to UDOGM, production from this well last occurred in May of 2007.  It has been 
temporarily abandon for 4 years.  The unit (Section 27-T1S-R4W, Duchesne County) is no 
longer active but the well tract leases (0001058845, 0001058716, 0001058717 & 
0001059301) are active since they were taken between October and November of 2008, each 
having a primary term of 5 years.   

  

 
No surface agreements or access agreements are needed in order to access the well site from 
County Road 4500N. 
 
 

• Fee Land 
Wellbore History 

• Previously covered under CA#96-000108 
• Shell Oil Co. – Rocky Mtn. Div. –King Silver Corp. – Permitted the well   
• MAPCO Inc. Spudded the well on 1/24/1974 at 05:30hrs  
• The well reached TD 8/29/1974 
• The was completed on 11/13/1974 
• Date of first production was 11/14/1974; Completed in Wasatch 
• Abandoned the Wasatch and recompleted to the Green River12/23/1980:  
• Water Encountered during drilling – 2,735-2,815’ (Salty) 
• Porous Formations Encountered: Measured Depth(Sub-Sea Datum) 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e OSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

Olsen 1-27A4
API # 43-013-30915 DOGM Operator: N3065 Field: 55

Entity: 09119
Altamont / Bluebell Field - Duchesne County, Utah

NE/4 NE/4; 1,200'FSL 1,200'FWL of

Section 27, Township 1 S, Range 4 W USB&M

Lat. = 40.360760, Long. = -110.420180

Approximately 2 miles Northwest of Altamont, Utah

Regulatory Summary Plug &Abandonment Procedure

CURRENTSTATUS:
According to UDOGM, production from this well last occurred in May of 2007. It has been
temporarily abandon for 4 years. The unit (Section 27-TlS-R4W, Duchesne County) is no
longer active but the well tract leases (0001058845,0001058716, 0001058717 &
0001059301) are active since they were taken between October and November of 2008, each
having a primary term of 5 years.

No surface agreements or access agreements are needed in order to access the well site from
County Road 4500N.

Wellbore History
• Fee Land
• Previously covered under CA#96-000108
• Shell Oil Co. - Rocky Mtn. Div. -King Silver Corp. - Permitted the well
• MAPCOInc. Spudded the well on 1/24/1974 at 05:30hrs
• The well reached TD 8/29/1974
• The was completed on 11/13/1974
• Date of first production was 11/14/1974; Completed in Wasatch
• Abandoned the Wasatch and recompleted to the Green River12/23/1980:
• Water Encountered during drilling - 2,735-2,815' (Salty)
• Porous Formations Encountered: Measured Depth(Sub-Sea Datum)
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  Date: 02/16/2012 
  Olsen 1-27A4 

2 
Olsen1-27A4RegulatorySummaryPAbandonmentProcedure02162012.docx Reagan E. Rawe 
 

o Duchesne River – 3500’  
o Green River 11920-11780’ 
o Wasatch Red Beds 12040-15805’ 
 

• 10/01/1983  - Mapco Inc. sold well to Linmar Energy Corporation 
• 11/1/1987 – Linmar Energy Corporation sold well to Linmar Petroleum 

Company 
• 9/8/1994 – Linmar Petroleum Company sold well to Coastal Oil & Gas 

Corporation 
• 3/9/2001 – Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. merges with El Paso Production  Oil & 

Gas Company 
• 7/1/2006 – El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company changes name to El Paso 

E&P Company, LP 
  

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e OSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

o Duchesne River - 3500'
o Green River 11920-11780'
o Wasatch Red Beds 12040-15805'

• 10/01/1983 - Mapco Inc. sold well to Linmar Energy Corporation
• 11/1/1987 - Linmar Energy Corporation sold well to Linmar Petroleum

Company
• 9/8/1994 - Linmar Petroleum Company sold well to Coastal Oil & Gas

Corporation
• 3/9/2001 - Coastal Oil & Gas Corp. merges with El Paso Production Oil &

Gas Company
• 7/1/2006 - El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company changes name to El Paso

ERP Company, LP
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Ownership in Well: 
Owner WI% Comments 
El Paso Exploration & 
Production Company, LP 

100.00  

   
Brad Lyle & Dusty Olsen 
are the current surface 
owners  

  

   
 
 
WELL DATA 
 

BHT: ±200℉  Casing 
Fluid: 

10.0ppg 
CaCl2 

BHP: Unknown psig  TD: 15,805’ 
SITP: Unknown  PBTD: 15,556’ 
SICP: Unknown  KB: 6,520’ 
   GL: 

KB-GL: 
6,499’ 
21’ 

 
Tubular Data 
 

 
String 

 
Description 

Burst 
(psi) 

(100%) 

Collapse 
(psi) 

(100%) 

Body 
Yield 
(kips) 

Joint 
Yield 
(kips) 

ID 
(in.) 

Drift 
ID 

(in.) 
Capacity 
(bbl/LF) TOC 

Conductor 
Casing 

13⅜” 68ppf  J-55 
Buttress  @ 0-302’ 3450 1950 - 718 12.41

5 
12.25

9 0.1497 58’ 

17” hole; Cemented with 400 sacks of Class G containing 2% CaCl2;  No Returns; Tagged TOC at 58’ with 1” 
pipe; Determined TOC in casing was at 262’ 

Surface 
Casing 

9” 40.0ppf K55 STC @ 
3457’ 3950 2570 486 561 8.835 8.679 0.0758 Surfa

ce 
12¼” Hole; Cemented with 1600 sacks of 65-35 Pozmix with 1/4lb Flocele/sack, followed by 250 sacks of 50/50 Posmix with 
1/4lm Flocele/sack and tailed with 50 sacks of Class G with 1/4lb Flocele/sack; Top Job of 200 sacks of 25%Cal Seal and 
200 sacks of Class G with 3% CaCl2 cemented to surface 

Production 
Casing 

7”  26.4, 29.7,33.7, 
39.0ppf S95 Buttress 
&LTC; 0 to 12503’ 

7150 
8180 
9380 
9980 

3710 
5120 
7260 
10900 

- 

560 
659 
772 
914 

6.969 
6.875 
6.765 
6.625 

6.844 
6.750 
6.640 
6.500 

0.0472 
0.0459 
0.0445 
0.0444 

Note 
below 

 8” Hole; Cemented with 175 sacks of 65-35 Pozmix containing 10% Salt, 0.5 CFR-2, 0.2% HR4, 1/4lb of Flocele/sack 
followed by 200 sacks of 50-50 Pozmix containing 2%gel, 10% salt, 0.5 CFR-2, 0.2 HR4, 1/4lb Flocele/sack and tailed in 
with 100sacks of Class G containing 10% Salt, 0.5% CFR-2, 0.2 HR4, 1/4lb Flocele/sack; 80-90% returns; TOC in casing at 
12408’Float Collar at 12416’; After drilling out  had to cement open hole with 100 sacks of Class G with 1/8lb of tuff-
fibre/sack at 14753’; Cemented open hole  again with 100 sacks of Class G with 1/8lb of tuff-fibre/sack at 14043’;Again 
Cemented  open hole with 50 sacks of Class G with 1/8lb of tuff-fibre/sack at 13700’; Cemented with 150 sacks of 50-50 
Posmix containing 0.03% HR4 and 1/8lb of tuff-fibre/sack; Holes is Casing @ 3371-3382’; Squeezed  150sacks of Class G 
cement with 1% CaCl2; Re-Squeezed with 100 sacks  of Class G cement with 2% CaCl2 (squeeze pressure 1500psig; Re-
squeezed with 100 sacks of Class G cement and 2% CaCl2 (Squeeze pressure 2000psig); Isolated casing leak at 3371’, 
Circulated balanced plug in casing and Braidenhead Squeezed in stages 100 sacks of Class G ; Spotted another 100 sacks 
of Class G from 3350-3380’ and Braidenhead Squeezed cement; Squeezed an additional 200 sacks of Class G cement; RIH 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e BSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

Ownership in Well:
Owner WI% Comments
El Paso Exploration & 100.00
Production Company, LP

Brad Lyle & Dusty Olsen
are the current surface
owners

WELL DATA

BHT: ±200°F Casing 10.0ppg
Fluid: CaCl2

BHP: Unknown psig TD: 15,805'
SITP: Unknown PBTD: 15,556'
SICP: Unknown KB: 6,520'

GL: 6,499'
KB-GL: 21'

Tubular Data

Burst Collapse Body Joint Drift
(psi) (psi) Yield Yield ID ID Capacity TOCString Description (100%) (100%) (kips) (kips) (in.) (in.) (bbilLF)

Conductor 13¾" 68 f J-55 12.41 12.25 ,99 3450 1950 - 718 0.1497 58Casing Buttress @ 0-302' 5 9
17" hole; Cemented with 400 sacks of Class G containing 2°/oCaCl2; No Returns; Tagged TOC at 58' with 1"
pipe; Determined TOC in casing was at 262'

Surface 9¾"40.0ppf K55 STC @ Surfa3950 2570 486 561 8.835 8.679 0.0758Casing 3457' ce
12¼" Hole; Cemented with 1600 sacks of 65-35 Pozmix with 1/4|b Flocele/sack, followed by 250 sacks of 50/50 Posmix with
1/4lm Flocele/sack and tailed with 50 sacks of Class G with 1/4|b Flocele/sack; Top Job of 200 sacks of 25%Cal Seal and
200 sacks of Class G with 3% CaCl2 cemented to surface

7150 3710 560 6.969 6.844 0.0472
Production 7¾" 26.4, 29.7,33.7, 8180 5120 659 6.875 6.750 0.0459 Note

Casin 39.0ppf S95 Buttress 9380 7260 772 6.765 6.640 0.0445 below&LTC; 0 to 12503 9980 10900 914 6.625 6.500 0.0444
8¾"Hole; Cemented with 175 sacks of 65-35 Pozmix containing 10% Salt, 0.5 CFR-2, 0.2% HR4, 1/4|b of Flocele/sack

followed by 200 sacks of 50-50 Pozmix containing 2%gel, 10% salt, 0.5 CFR-2, 0.2 HR4, 1/4|b Flocele/sack and tailed in
with 100sacks of Class G containing 10% Salt, 0.5% CFR-2, 0.2 HR4, 1/4|b Flocele/sack; 80-90% returns; TOC in casing at
12408'Float Collar at 12416'; After drilling out had to cement open hole with 100 sacks of Class G with 1/8lb of tuff-
fibre/sack at 14753'; Cemented open hole again with 100 sacks of Class G with 1/8lb of tuff-fibre/sackat 14043';Again
Cemented open hole with 50 sacks of Class G with 1/8lb of tuff-fibre/sackat 13700'; Cemented with 150 sacks of 50-50
Posmix containing 0.03% HR4 and 1/8lb of tuff-fibre/sack;Holes is Casing @ 3371-3382'; Squeezed 150sacks of Class G
cement with 1% CaCl2; Re-Squeezed with 100 sacks of Class G cement with 2% CaCl2 (Squeeze pressure 1500psig; Re-
squeezed with 100 sacks of Class G cement and 2% CaCl2 (Squeeze pressure 2000psig); Isolated casing leak at 3371',
Circulated balanced plug in casing and Braidenhead Squeezed in stages 100 sacks of Class G ; Spotted another 100 sacks
of Class G from 3350-3380' and Braidenhead Squeezed cement; Squeezed an additional 200 sacks of Class G cement; RIH
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with RTTS to 7812’ and squeezed 100 sacks of Class G; During Completion Operations - Casing Leak from 3634-3788’; 
Mixed & Squeezed 200 sacks of Class G “neat” cement (42bbls total), Squeezed 140 sacks behind pipe and 
left 60 sacks in casing; Still would pump in at 1bpm @ 400psig; Squeezed 200 sacks of Class G “neat” cement, 
Staged 160 sacks and left 40 sacks in casing; Squeeze pressure 2900psig; Attempted to test casing again; 
Found hole in casing between 3407-3468’; Squeezed 150 sacks of Class G with 0.5% CFR-2; Squeeze pressure 
3900psig; Left  
 

 Production 
Liner 

5½”Hung off with TIW 
Liner Hanger; 12200-
15556’; Below CIBP 

        

Hung off with TIW Liner Hanger with no primary cement job; Later Liner Top was squeezed with 200 sacks of 
Class G cement “Neat” 

Production 
Tubing 

2 ⅞” 6.5ppf N80 SealLoc 
8rd to 10913’ 10570 11160 - 105560 2.441 2.347 0.0058 -- 

Side String 2⅜”1.7ppf N80 SealLoc 
8rd to 10913’ 11200 11780 - 71920 1.995 1.901 0.0039 -- 

 

 
Plug & Abandonment Procedure 

 
1. Notify DOGM of P&A operations at least 24 hours prior to start of well work (See 

Contact List). 
2. Check wellhead and all annuli for pressure; If there is pressure on the annuli, bleed 

the pressure off and fill the annuli as needed; Record all casing pressures along 
with the amount of produced water or mud necessary to fill the casing and kill well; 
Set back pressure valves in tubing hanger 

3. ND the tree; MI&NU a BOP stack.  Load well with produced water; Test rams to 
250psig/5,000psig and all connecting high pressure piping and valves; Pressure 
test the annular to 250psig / 3500psig; Note all pressure tests in the daily report 
and capture each pressure test on a chart;  RU and pull the back pressure valves 
from the tubing hanger 

4. If there is a pump in the hole, retrieve if possible and retrieve the standing valve 
from seating nipple; If no pump or standing valve are installed, proceed to Step 5   

5. PU a landing joint for the 2⅞” tubing and for the Sidestring 2⅜” tubing; Land each 
make up in the tubing hanger 

6. RU pump and high pressure pipe to 2⅞” tubing and take returns from Sidestring 
and production casing annulus  

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e BSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

with RTTS to 7812' and squeezed 100 sacks of Class G, During Completion Operations - Casing Leak from 3634-3788';
Mixed EtSqueezed 200 sacks of Class G "neat" cement (42bbls total), Squeezed 140 sacks behind pipe and
left 60 sacks in casing; Still would pump in at 1bpm @ 400psig; Squeezed 200 sacks of Class G "neat" cement,
Staged 160 sacks and left 40 sacks in casing; Squeeze pressure 2900psig; Attempted to test casing again;
Found hole in casing between 3407-3468'; Squeezed 150 sacks of Class G with 0.5% CFR-2; Squeeze pressure
3900psig; Left

5½"Hung off with TlWProduction Liner Hanger; 12200-
Liner

15556'; Below CIBP
Hung off with TlW Liner Hanger with no primary cement job; Later Liner Top was squeezed with 200 sacks of
Class G cement "Neat"

Production 2 ¼" 6.5ppf N80 SealLoc
, 10570 11160 - 105560 2.441 2.347 0.0058 --

Tubing Brd to 10913

Side String 2¾"1.7ppf N80 SealLoc 11200 11780 - 71920 1.995 1.901 0.0039 --

8rd to 10913

Plug &Abandonment Procedure

1. Notify DOGM of P&A operations at least 24 hours prior to start of well work (See

Contact List).

2. Check wellhead and all annuli for pressure; If there is pressure on the annuli, bleed

the pressure off and fill the annuli as needed; Record all casing pressures along

with the amount of produced water or mud necessary to fillthe casing and killwell;

Set back pressure valves in tubinghanger

3. ND the tree; Ml&NU a BOP stack. Load well with produced water; Test rams to
250psig/5,000psig and all connecting high pressure piping and valves; Pressure

test the annular to 250psig / 3500psig; Note all pressure tests in the daily report

and capture each pressure test on a chart; RU and pull the back pressure valves

from the tubing hanger

4. If there is a pump in the hole, retrieve if possible and retrieve the standing valve

from seating nipple; If no pump or standing valve are installed, proceed to Step 5

5. PU a landing joint for the 2½" tubingand for the Sidestring 2%" tubing;Land each

make up in the tubing hanger

6. RU pump and high pressure pipe to 2½" tubing and take returns from Sidestring

and production casing annulus
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7. Test all connections to 250psig/5000psig; RU squeeze manifold to production 
casing valve; Test all connections and choke manifold to 250psig/5000psig 

8. RU Hot Oil Unit and circulate Sidestring, Tubing and production annulus clean with 
hot solution;   

9. Circulate 9.5ppg fresh water mud down the tubing strings and up the production 
casing 

10. PU and MU a gauge ring run of the 2⅞” Tubing; Pressure test lubricator to 
250psig/3000psig; RIH with assembly to ±9,950’or deep enough to check and see 
if the pump and/or standing valve is still in place; POOH; Make note of any 
obstructions, restrictions, sand fill, paraffin or equipment in the tubing 

11. PU and MU pump pulling tools if the pump is still installed; RIH; Latch and POOH 
with Pump; PU and MU standing valve pulling and equalizing tools and equalize 
and pull the standing valve if it still in place.   

12. RU 2⅜” pulling and handling tools for the 2⅜” Sidestring; Unseat Sidestring and 
TOOH with pipe and LD pipe; Check for NORM; If no NORM is found, note it in the 
daily report; If NORM is found in the tubing; Follow El Paso procedures and chain 
of custody paperwork for handling, wrapping and transporting NORM tubing to a 
proper cleaning or disposal site. 

13. RU 2⅞” pulling and handling tools for the 2⅞” Sidestring; Unseat Sidestring and 
TOOH with pipe and LD pipe; Check for NORM; If no NORM is found, note it in the 
daily report; If NORM is found in the tubing; Follow El Paso procedures and chain 
of custody paperwork for handling, wrapping and transporting NORM tubing to a 
proper cleaning or disposal site. 

14. PU and TIH with workstring to TOC at ±12002’; Establish injection into the 
perforations 
Plug #1 

15. If injection is sufficient for cement squeezing(.5-2.0bpm at a safe and reasonable 
injection pressure), Calculate a safe and adequate squeeze pressure limit prior to 
beginning to mix the cement;  

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e OSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

7. Test all connections to 250psig/5000psig; RU squeeze manifold to production

casing valve; Test all connections and choke manifold to 250psig/5000psig

8. RU Hot Oil Unit and circulate Sidestring, Tubing and production annulus clean with

hot solution;

9. Circulate 9.5ppg fresh water mud down the tubing strings and up the production

casing

10.PU and MU a gauge ring run of the 2½" Tubing; Pressure test lubricator to
250psig/3000psig; RIH with assembly to ±9,950'or deep enough to check and see

if the pump and/or standing valve is still in place; POOH; Make note of any

obstructions, restrictions, sand fill, paraffin or equipment in the tubing
11. PU and MU pump pulling tools if the pump is still installed; RIH; Latch and POOH

with Pump; PU and MU standing valve pulling and equalizing tools and equalize
and pull the standing valve if it still in place.

12.RU 2¾" pulling and handling tools for the 2¾" Sidestring; Unseat Sidestring and

TOOH with pipe and LD pipe; Check for NORM; If no NORM is found, note it in the
daily report; If NORM is found in the tubing;Follow El Paso procedures and chain

of custody paperwork for handling, wrapping and transporting NORM tubing to a

proper cleaning or disposal site.

13.RU 2½" pulling and handling tools for the 2½" Sidestring; Unseat Sidestring and

TOOH with pipe and LD pipe; Check for NORM; If no NORM is found, note it in the
daily report; If NORM is found in the tubing; Follow El Paso procedures and chain

of custody paperwork for handling, wrapping and transportingNORM tubing to a

proper cleaning or disposal site.

14.PU and TlH with workstring to TOC at ±12002'; Establish injection into the
perforations

Plug #1

15.If injection is sufficient for cement squeezing(.5-2.0bpm at a safe and reasonable

injection pressure), Calculate a safe and adequate squeeze pressure limit prior to
beginning to mix the cement;
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16. Mix and pump a ±61 sack balanced cement plug (±11.4bbls) consisting of 16.4ppg 
1.05 yield Class G cement with any necessary additives (BHT=±200℉); Circulate 
cement to Displacing with 9.5ppg fresh water mud until the cement plug is in place 
from  ±10,794’or the pre-determined squeeze pressure is reached using a 
braidenhead squeeze technique; Trap ±1000psig on the squeeze plug and WOC; 
Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up 

17. TIH with pipe and tag the TOC of the squeeze and record in the morning report 
18. POOH to ±10,400’ or ±100’ above the TOC;  

Plug #2 
19. Mix and circulate a ±200’ balanced cement plug with ±50 sacks (±9.4bbls) of 

16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement from ±10,200’ to ±10,400’ using 9.5ppg fresh 
water mud to place the cement; Open the annular choke manifold and workstring 
to allow the cement to equalize in the wellbore; TOOH with tubing above the 
cement and Circulate the hole clean;  WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to 
determine when the cement has set up 

20. TIH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report  
Plug #3 

21. TOOH to 7,500’ and break circulation  
22. Mix and circulate a ±200’ balanced cement plug with ±50 sacks (±9.4bbls) of 

16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement from ±7300’ to ±7,500’ using 9.5ppg fresh 
water mud to place the cement; Open the annular choke manifold and workstring 
to allow the cement to equalize in the wellbore; TOOH with tubing until above 
cement and Circulate the hole clean;  WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to 
determine when the cement has set up 

23. TIH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report  
Plug #4 

24. TOOH with workstring 
25.  RU Eline; PU & MU a circulating perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to 

±5000’ 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e OSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

16. Mix and pump a ±61 sack balanced cement plug (±11.4bbls)consisting of 16.4ppg

1.05 yield Class G cement with any necessary additives (BHT=±200°F); Circulate

cement to Displacing with 9.5ppg fresh water mud until the cement plug is in place

from ±10,794'or the pre-determined squeeze pressure is reached using a

braidenhead squeeze technique;Trap ±1000psig on the squeeze plug and WOC;

Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement has set up

17.TlH with pipe and tag the TOC of the squeeze and record in the morning report

18. POOH to ±10,400' or ±100' above the TOC;

Plug #2

19. Mix and circulate a ±200' balanced cement plug with ±50 sacks (±9.4bbis)of

16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement from ±10,200' to ±10,400' using 9.5ppg fresh

water mud to place the cement; Open the annular choke manifold and workstring

to allow the cement to equalize in the wellbore; TOOH with tubing above the
cement and Circulate the hole clean; WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up

20.TlH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report

Plug #3

21.TOOH to 7,500' and break circulation

22. Mix and circulate a ±200' balanced cement plug with ±50 sacks (±9.4bbis)of

16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement from ±7300' to ±7,500' using 9.5ppg fresh

water mud to place the cement; Open the annular choke manifold and workstring

to allow the cement to equalize in the wellbore; TOOH with tubing until above

cement and Circulate the hole clean; WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to
determine when the cement has set up

23.TlH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report

Plug #4

24. TOOH with workstring

25. RU Eline; PU & MU a circulating perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to
±5000'
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26. PU & MU a mechanical set cement retainer on the workstring; TIH to ±4500’; Set 
cement retainer; Establish circulation or injection into perforations 

27. Mix and circulate a ±500’ squeeze plug cement plug with ±156 sacks (±29.1bbls) 
of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement below the cement retainer and up the 
annulus; Sting out of the cement retainer 

28. Mix and lay in a ±50’ balanced cement plug, 20 sack (±3.8bbls)on top of the 
cement retainer TOOH with tubing until above cement and Circulate the hole 
clean;  WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement 
has set up 

29. TIH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report  
Plug #5 

30. TOOH with workstring 
31.  RU Eline; PU & MU a circulating perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to 

±3900’ 
32. PU & MU a mechanical set cement retainer on the workstring; TIH to ±3400’; Set 

cement retainer; Establish circulation or injection into perforations 
33. Mix and circulate a ±550’ squeeze plug cement plug with ±175 sacks (±32.7bbls) 

of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement below the cement retainer and up the 
annulus; Sting out of the cement retainer 

34. Mix and lay in a ±50’ balanced cement plug, 12 sack (±2.4bbls)on top of the 
cement retainer TOOH with tubing until above cement and Circulate the hole 
clean;  WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement 
has set up 

35. TIH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report  
Plug #6 

36. PU and MU an open ended workstring; TIH to ±2200’; Mix and circulate in  a ±200’ 
balanced cement plug from ±2000’ to ±2200’ below ground level made with 
±81sacks (±15.2bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement; POOH; WOC 

37. Pressure test the balanced plug to 1000psig for 30 minutes on chart 
38. Bubble test 9” casing 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e OSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

26.PU & MU a mechanical set cement retainer on the workstring; TlH to ±4500'; Set

cement retainer; Establish circulation or injection into perforations

27. Mix and circulate a ±500' squeeze plug cement plug with ±156 sacks (±29.1bbis)
of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement below the cement retainer and up the
annulus; Sting out of the cement retainer

28. Mix and lay in a ±50' balanced cement plug, 20 sack (±3.8bbls)ontop of the
cement retainer TOOH with tubing until above cement and Circulate the hole

clean; WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement

has set up

29.TlH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report

Plug #5

30. TOOH with workstring

31. RU Eline; PU & MU a circulating perforation assembly; Test lubricator; RIH to
±3900'

32.PU & MU a mechanical set cement retainer on the workstring; TlH to ±3400'; Set

cement retainer; Establish circulation or injection into perforations

33. Mix and circulate a ±550' squeeze plug cement plug with ±175 sacks (±32.7bbis)
of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement below the cement retainer and up the
annulus; Sting out of the cement retainer

34. Mix and lay in a ±50' balanced cement plug, 12 sack (±2.4bbls)ontop of the
cement retainer TOOH with tubing until above cement and Circulate the hole

clean; WOC; Monitor surface samples of cement to determine when the cement

has set up

35.TlH and tag the top of the balanced plug; Record the depth in the daily report

Plug #6

36.PU and MU an open ended workstring; TlH to ±2200'; Mix and circulate in a ±200'

balanced cement plug from ±2000' to ±2200' below ground level made with

±81sacks (±15.2bbls)of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement; POOH; WOC

37.Pressure test the balanced plug to 1000psig for 30 minutes on chart

38. Bubble test 9¾"casing
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Plug #7 
39. PU and MU an open ended workstring; TIH to ±215’;  Mix and circulate in  a ±200’ 

balanced cement plug from ±15’ to ±215’ below ground level made with ±81sacks 
(±15.2bbls) of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement; POOH; WOC 

40. TIH and tag the top of the cement plug; Record the depth in the daily report  
41. RU casing cutting equipment;  Cut the remaining casing at ≥3’below GL  
42. Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the following:  

43. RD&MO rig & clean up location 
44. 18. Restore location as directed  

1. Well Name: Olsen 1-27A4  
2. Operator Name :  El Paso E&P Company, LP 
3. API Number: 43-013-30064 
4. Location–Qtr/Qtr–Sec–Township–Range: NE/4 NE/4 Section 27, Township 1 S, Range 4 W USB&M 

 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000

e BSO E×ploration Date: 02/16/2012
&Production OISen 1-27A4

Plug #7

39.PU and MU an open ended workstring; TlH to ±215'; Mix and circulate in a ±200'

balanced cement plug from ±15' to ±215' below ground level made with ±81sacks

(±15.2bbis)of 16.4ppg 1.05 yield Class G cement; POOH; WOC

40.TlH and tag the top of the cement plug; Record the depth in the daily report

41.RU casing cutting equipment; Cut the remaining casing at >3'below GL

42.Weld and install dry hole plate. Dry hole plate is to include the following:

1. Well Name: Olsen 1-27A4

2. Operator Name : El Paso E&P Company, LP

3. API Number: 43-013-30064

4. Location-QtrlQtr-Sec-Township-Range: NE/4 NE/4 Section 27, Township 1 S, Range 4 W USB&lv

43.RD&MO rig & clean up location

44.18. Restore location as directed
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Field: Lease: 
Well: 

Utah – Duchesne County 
Wellbore Drawing Status: Current 

Drawing By:   Reagan E. Rawe  02/13/2012 

  

 Olsen  
1-27A4 

      

API #: 43-013-30064 

           

TD=15,805’MD 
(15,805’TVD) 

Casing and Cementing Data         

Hole 
Size 
 

30” 17” 12¼” 8” 6½” 

CSG  
OD 

24” 13⅜” 9⅝” 7” 5½” 
Lnr 

ppf 65.0 
 

40.0 26.4 
29.70 
33.70 
39.00 

 

22.5 

Gr/ 
Thds 

K55 
Buttre

ss 
 

K55 
STC 

YS95 
Buttress 
& /LTC 

P110  
FJ 

Hydrill 

Depth 0-
40’ 

0-302’ 0-3457’ 0-12503’ 12200-
15566’ 

Cement 
Info. 

Cement
ed to  
58’; 

Tagged 
with 1” 
tubing 

Cement 
with 

2700sx; 
Top Job 
to bring 
cement 

to 
surface 

Cemented 
w/475sx; 
Review 

Notes to 
see 

squeezes 
performed 
on casing 

Hung 
with 
TIW 

Hanger
; Not 

Cement
ed 

KB 6520’ 

GL 6499’ 

RKB-GL 21’ 

Location NE4 NE4  Sec 
27  T1S R4W 
USBM 
1200’FNL & 
1200’FEL 

Lat:  40.360760 

Long: -110.420180 

Sundry Notice: 

Status 

Altamont / Bluebell 

Onshore: 
EP Lse #: DOGM Fld#: 55 

5½” TOL @ 12,200’; Hung with TIW Liner Hanger; 
Liner Top Squeezed with 200 sacks of cement 
2/25/1976 

9” @ 3,457’  

5½” Liner @15,556’ (No Primary Cement); 
Liner top Squeezed with 200 sacks of Class G 
cement  

7” Production Casing @ 12,503’ 

GL 

10ppg Inhibited CaCl2 

Wellhead Equipment: 6” OCT Tree; tubing 
Dual Hanger; Tree Swapped with Fieldsted 

Well 

Entity#: 09119 

PBTD @ 15,556’ 

BMSGW @ 3,823’ 

Wasatch Red Beds @12040-13864’ 

Operator #: N3065 

Drilled with 14.5ppg mud 

Lower Green River Marker @ 10,421’ 

2”OD 6.5ppf N80 
SealLoc 8rd with 
Sidestring of 2⅜” 
SealLoc 8rd 

During Drilling Operations-Holes is 7” Casing @ 
3371-3382’; Check Procedure for actions taken 

Perfs: 13,603-15,334’ (March 1976) 

13⅜” set @302’ 

24” @ 40’ 

Duchesne River @ 3500’ 

Baker Loc-Set Packer @ 12062’  

End of Tail Pipe @ 15243’ 

During Completion Operations-Hole is 7” 
Casing @ 3412-3788’ and between 3407-3468; 
Check Procedure for actions taken 

Top of Fill @ 13205’ 

CIBP @ 12052’ with 50’ of Cement on Top 

Perfs 10994-11983’ 

Baker R3 Packer  @ 10964’; 
Landed 2⅞”Tubing w/20,000lbs 
Compression 

Possible Casing Split from 3392-3412’ 

 
 

 
 

 
  

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
  
 

 
 

Possible Casing Leak at 4750’  
 

Dual String V Pump Cavity @ 10913’ with 
Standing Nipple @ 10933’ 

2⅜” Side String landed @10913’ with 
8000lbs Compression 

19 – 2⅜” Tubing Collars 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000sundry Number: 231g¡ggg|(gggggpgk¡gg|g3013300 f.689890Isen

eŸaso E×ploration DOGM Fid#: 55 EP Lse #: Well: 1-27A4
&Production Onshore: Utah - Duchesne County API #: 43-013-30064

Wellbore Drawing Status: Current Operator#: N3065

Entity#: 09119 Wellhead Equipment: 6" OCT Tree; tubing
KB 6520' Dual Hanger; Tree Swapped with Fieldsted

GL weli
GL 6499' 2#"OD 6.5ppf N80 24" @40'

SealLoc Brd with
RKB-GL 21' sidestringof 2¾"

SealLoc Brd 13¾" set @302'
Location NE4 NE4 Sec

27 T1S R4W
USBM During Drilling Operations-Holes is 7)" Casing @
1200'FNL & 3371-3382'; Check Procedure for actions taken

1200'FEL During Completion Operations-Hole is 7)"
Casing @3412-3788' and between 3407-3468;

Lat: 40.360760 Check Procedure for actions taken

9§" @3,457'
Long: -110.420180

10ppg Inhibited CaCl2 Possible Casing Split from 3392-3412'

Sundry Notice:
Duchesne River @3500'

BMSGW @3,823'
Status Possible Casing Leak at 4750'

| 19 -2%" Tubing Collars

I

y 2%" Side String landed @10913'with

I 8000Ibs Compression
Dual String V Pump Cavity @10913' with
Standing Nipple @10933'

Baker R3 Packer @10964';
Landed 2½"Tubing wl20,000Ibs
Compression

Casing and Cementing Data
Lower Green River Marker @10,421'

Hole 30" 17" 12¼" 8)" 6½" Perfs 10994-11983'

Size -

CIBP @12052' with 50' of Cement on Top
CSG 24" 13%" 9%" 7)" 5½" Baker Loc-Set Packer @12062'
OD Lnr

5½" TOL @12,200'; Hung with TIW Liner Hanger;
Liner Top Squeezed with 200 sacks of cement

ppf 65.0 40.0 26.4 22.5 2/25/1976

29.70 Wasatch Red Beds @12040-13864'
33.70
39.00

Grl K55 K55 YS95 P110 7)" Production Casing @12,503'

Thds Buttre STC Buttress FJ -- -- Perfs: 13,603-15,334' (March 1976)
ss & ILTC Hydrill

Top of Fill @13205'

Depth 0- 0-302' 0-3457' 0-12503' 12200- End of Tail Pipe @15243'
40' 15566'

Cement cement Cement Cemented Hung
PBTD @15,556'

Info. ed to with wl475sx; with 5½" Liner @15,556'(No Primary Cement);
58'; 2700sx; Review TIW Liner top squeezedwith 200 sacks of Class G

Tagged Top Job Notes to Hanger cement
with 1" to bring see ; Not
tubing cement squeezes Cement Drilled with 14.5ppg mud

to performed ed
surface on casing TD=15,805'MD

(15,805'TVD)
RE CE IVIFraing Epheaga2 @.paw2
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Field: Lease: 
Well: 

Utah – Duchesne County 
Wellbore Drawing Status: Current 

Drawing By:   Reagan E. Rawe  02/13/2012 

  

 Olsen  
1-27A4 

      

API #: 43-013-30064 

           

TD=15,805’MD 
(15,805’TVD) 

Casing and Cementing Data         

Hole 
Size 
 

30” 17” 12¼” 8” 6½” 

CSG  
OD 

24” 13⅜” 9⅝” 7” 5½” 
Lnr 

ppf 65.0 
 

40.0 26.4 
29.70 
33.70 
39.00 

 

22.5 

Gr/ 
Thds 

K55 
Buttre

ss 
 

K55 
STC 

YS95 
Buttress 
& /LTC 

P110  
FJ 

Hydrill 

Depth 0-
40’ 

0-302’ 0-3457’ 0-12503’ 12200-
15566’ 

Cement 
Info. 

Cement
ed to  
58’; 

Tagged 
with 1” 
tubing 

Cement 
with 

2700sx; 
Top Job 
to bring 
cement 

to 
surface 

Cemented 
w/475sx; 
Review 

Notes to 
see 

squeezes 
performed 
on casing 

Hung 
with 
TIW 

Hanger
; Not 

Cement
ed 

KB 6520’ 

GL 6499’ 

RKB-GL 21’ 

Location NE4 NE4  Sec 
27  T1S R4W 
USBM 
1200’FNL & 
1200’FEL 

Lat:  40.360760 

Long: -110.420180 

Sundry Notice: 

Status 

Altamont / Bluebell 

Onshore: 
EP Lse #: DOGM Fld#: 55 

5½” TOL @ 12,200’; Hung with TIW Liner Hanger; 
Liner Top Squeezed with 200 sacks of cement 
2/25/1976 

9” @ 3,457’  

5½” Liner @15,556’ (No Primary Cement); Liner 
top Squeezed with 200 sacks of Class G cement  

7” Production Casing @ 12,503’ 

GL 
Wellhead Equipment: 6” OCT Tree; tubing 
Dual Hanger; Tree Swapped with Fieldsted 

Well 

Entity#: 09119 

PBTD @ 15,556’ 

BMSGW @ 3,823’ 

Wasatch Red Beds @12040-13864’ 

Operator #: N3065 

Drilled with 14.5ppg mud 

Lower Green River Marker @ 10,421’ 

2”OD 6.5ppf N80 
SealLoc 8rd with 
Sidestring of 2⅜” 
SealLoc 8rd 

During Drilling Operations-Holes is 7” Casing @ 
3371-3382’; Check Procedure for actions taken 

Perfs: 13,603-15,334’ (March 1976) 

13⅜” set @302’ 

24” @ 40’ 

Duchesne River @ 3500’ 

Baker Loc-Set Packer @ 12062’  

End of Tail Pipe @ 15243’ 

During Completion Operations-Hole is 7” 
Casing @ 3412-3788’ and between 3407-3468; 
Check Procedure for actions taken 

Top of Fill @ 13205’ 

CIBP @ 12052’ with 50’ of Cement on Top 

Perfs 10994-11983’ 

Possible Casing Split from 3392-3412’ 

 
 

 
 

 
  

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
  
 

 
 

Possible Casing Leak at 4750’  
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

7 

±10994-10794’; Plug 1: Attempt to Braidenhead 
Squeeze, Leaving ± 200’ of cement in wellbore  

±10200-10400’Plug 2: ± 200’ Balanced Cement Plug in wellbore 

±7300-7500; Plug 3: ± 200’ Balanced Cement Plug in wellbore 

±4500-5000’; Plug 4: ± 500’ 
In-Out Cement Plug in 
wellbore 

±3350-3900’Plug 5: ± 550’ 
In-Out Cement Plug in 
wellbore 

±2000-2200’;Plug 6: ± 
200’ Balanced Cement 
Plug in wellbore 

± 15-215’; Plug 7: ± 200’ Balanced 
Cement Plug in wellbore 

6 

Sundry Number: 23196 API Well Number: 43013300640000sundry Number: 231g¡ggg|(gggggpgk¡gg|g3013300f.689890Isen

eŸ asolE×ploration DOGMFid#:55 EPLse#: Well:1-27A4
&Production Onshore: Utah - Duchesne County API #: 43-013-30064

Wellbore Drawing Status: Current Operator#: N3065

Entity#: 09119 Wellhead Equipment: 6" OCT Tree; tubing
KB 6520' Dual Hanger; Tree Swapped with Fieldsted

GL weli
GL 6499' 2#"OD 6.5ppf N80 24" @40'

SealLoc Brd with ±15-215'; Plug 7: ±200' Balanced
RKB-GL 21' sidestringof 2¾" cementPlug in wellbore

SealLoc Brd 13¾" set @302'
Location NE4 NE4 Sec

2U7BT1SR4W
al

n0 lug 6:ent

Plug in wellbore During Drilling Operations-Holes is 7)" Casing @
1200'FNL & 3371-3382'; Check Procedure for actions taken

1200'FEL During Completion Operations-Hole is 7)"
±3350-3900'Plug 5: ±550' Casing @3412-3788' and between 3407-3468;

Lat: 40.360760 In-Out Cement Plug in Check Procedure for actions taken
wellbore 9)" @3,457'

Long: -110.420180 Possible Casing Split from 3392-3412'

Sundry Notice:
Duchesne River @3500'

BMSGW @3,823'
Status

±4500-5000'; Plug 4: ±500' Possible Casing Leak at 4750'
In-Out Cement Plug in
wellbore

±7300-7500; Plug 3: ±200' Balanced Cement Plug in wellbore

±10200-10400'Plug 2: ±200' Balanced Cement Plug in wellbore

Casing and Cementing Data
Lower Green River Marker @10,421'

Hole 30" 17" 12¼" 89" 6½" --
±10994-10794'; Plug 1: Attempt to Braidenhead
Squeeze, Leaving ±200' of cement in wellbore

Size Perfs 10994-11983'

CIBP @12052' with 50' of Cement on Top
CSG 24" 13%" 9%" 7)" 5½" Baker Loc-Set Packer @12062'
OD Lnr

5½" TOL @12,200'; Hung with TIW Liner Hanger;
Liner Top Squeezed with 200 sacks of cement

ppf 65.0 40.0 26.4 22.5 2/25/1976

29.70 Wasatch Red Beds @12040-13864'
33.70
39.00

Grl K55 K55 YS95 P110 7)" Production Casing @12,503'

Thds Buttre STC Buttress FJ Perfs: 13,603-15,334' (March 1976)
ss & ILTC Hydrill

.... . Top of Fill @13205'

Depth 0- 0-302' 0-3457' 0-12503' 12200- End of Tail Pipe
40' 15566'

Cement cement Cement Cemented Hung
PBTD @15,55k

Info. ed to with wl475sx; with 5½" Liner @15,556'(No Primary Cement); Liner
58'; 2700sx; Review TIW top Squeezed with 200 sacks of Class G cement

Tagged Top Job Notes to Hanger
with 1" to bring see ; Not
tubing cement squeezes Cement

to performed ed Drilled with 14.5ppg mud
surface on casing TD=15,805'MD

(15,805'TVD)
RE CE IVIFraing Epheaga2 @.paw2



RECEIVED: Mar. 21, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 OLSEN 1-27A4 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013300640000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 ALTAMONT 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1200 FNL 1200 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 27 Township: 01.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

3 /9 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see attached detail daily operations summary.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /21 /2012

March 26, 2012

Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well OLSEN 1-27A4

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013300640000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext ALTAMONT

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1200 FNL 1200 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 27 Township: 01.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

3 / 9 / 2 0 12
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached detail daily operations summary. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
March 26, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/21/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 21,



RECEIVED: Mar. 21, 2012

WESTERN

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

WESTERNCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

OLSEN 1-27A4Well

OLSEN 1-27A4SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event P&A LANDWWS/1Rig Name/No.

Start Date 2/21/2012 End Date

1/24/1974Spud Date UWI 027-001-S 004-W 30

Active Datum WARNING!REVIEW DATUM-GROUND LEVEL @6,499.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

157662/44761 / 

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

2/22/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING 

UP. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 10:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG TO LOCATION. RU RIG & EQUIPMENT

10:00 11:00 1.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL W/ 75 BBLS TPW, PUMPING DOWN 2-7/8" 

TBG & RETURNING UP 2-3/8" SIDESTRING @ 1500 PSI

11:00 16:00 5.00 WBP 32 P RU SLICKLINE UNIT. RIH & ATTEMPT TO PUNCH STANDING 

VALVE. TBG DID NOT GO ON VACCUM. ATTEMPT TO FISH 

PUMP. SET DOWN @ SAME DEPTH, BUT UNABLE TO LATCH 

PUMP. ATTEMPT TO FISH STANDING VALVE.. SET DOWN @ 

SAME DEPTH, BUT UNABLE TO LATCH STANDING VALVE. RIH 

W/ JAR DOWN DISCONNECT TOOL. UNABLE TO LATCH TOOLS. 

RD SLICKLINE UNIT

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL PUMPING DOWN 2-3/8" SIDE STRING & 

RETURNING UP 2-7/8" TBG @ 3500 PSI. SDFN

2/23/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFET MEETING ON NIPPLING 

DOWN WELLHEAD. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 10:30 3.00 WBP 16 P NIPPLE DOWN WELLHEAD. NU BOP

10:30 12:00 1.50 WBP 53 P PU ON 2-3/8" SIDE STRING TO 80,000#, (25 K OVER STRING 

WEIGHT). UNABLE TO UNSTING FROM PUMP CAVITY. WORK 

SIDESTRING FOR 1-1/2 HRS. UNABLE TO WORK SIDESTRING 

FREE.

12:00 19:30 7.50 WBP 53 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. RIH W/ FREE POINT TOOL TO 3182'. SET 

DOWN IN PARRIFEN. UNABLE TO WORK DEEPER.POOH & LD 

FREE POINT TOOL. RIH W/ 1-11/16" SPUD ASSEMBLY. WORK 

THROUHG PARRIFEN TO 10882'. POOH & LD SPUD ASSEMBLY. 

RIH W/ 1-11/16" TBG PUNCHER. UNABLE TO WORK PAST 3380'. 

SDFN

2/24/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON 

CIRCULATING W/ HOT OILER

 7:30 10:30 3.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE TBG STRINGS W/ 120 BBLS TPW & 15 GALLONS 

PARRIFEN SOLVENT.

 1March 12, 2012 at  3:05 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000

WESTERN

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv WESTERN

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well OLSEN 1-27A4

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site OLSEN 1-27A4

Rig Name/No. WWS/1 Event P&A LAND

Start Date 2/21/2012 End Date
Spud Date 1/24/1974 UWI 027-001-5 OO4-W30

Active Datum WARNING!REVIEW DATUM-GROUND LEVEL @6,499.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 157662/44761 /
No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
2/22/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 MIRU 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RIGGING

UP. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 10:00 2.50 MIRU 01 P MOVE RIG TO LOCATION. RU RIG & EQUIPMENT

10:00 11:00 1.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL Wl75 BBLS TPW, PUMPING DOWN 2-7/8"

TBG & RETURNING UP 2-3/8" SIDESTRING @ 1500 PSI
11:00 16:00 5.00 WBP 32 P RU SLICKLINE UNIT. RIH & ATTEMPT TO PUNCH STANDING

VALVE. TBG DID NOT GO ON VACCUM. ATTEMPT TO FISH
PUMP. SET DOWN @ SAME DEPTH, BUT UNABLE TO LATCH
PUMP. ATTEMPT TO FISH STANDING VALVE.. SET DOWN @
SAME DEPTH, BUT UNABLE TO LATCH STANDING VALVE. RIH
W/ JAR DOWN DISCONNECT TOOL. UNABLE TO LATCH TOOLS.
RD SLICKLINE UNIT

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL PUMPING DOWN 2-3/8" SIDE STRING &
RETURNING UP 2-7/8" TBG @ 3500 PSI. SDFN

2/23/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFET MEETING ON NIPPLING
DOWN WELLHEAD. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:30 3.00 WBP 16 P NIPPLE DOWN WELLHEAD. NU BOP
10:30 12:00 1.50 WBP 53 P PU ON 2-3/8" SIDE STRING TO 80,000#, (25 K OVER STRING

WEIGHT). UNABLE TO UNSTING FROM PUMP CAVITY. WORK
SIDESTRING FOR 1-1/2 HRS. UNABLE TO WORKSIDESTRING
FREE.

12:00 19:30 7.50 WBP 53 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK. RIH W/ FREE POINT TOOL TO 3182'. SET
DOWN IN PARRIFEN. UNABLE TO WORK DEEPER.POOH & LD
FREE POINT TOOL. RIH Wl1-11/16" SPUD ASSEMBLY. WORK
THROUHG PARRIFEN TO 10882'. POOH & LD SPUD ASSEMBLY.
RIH W/ 1-11/16" TBG PUNCHER. UNABLE TO WORK PAST 3380'.
SDFN

2/24/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
CIRCULATING W/ HOT OILER

7:30 10:30 3.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE TBG STRINGS W/120 BBLS TPW& 15 GALLONS
PARRIFEN SOLVENT.

March 12, 2012 at 3:05 pm 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Mar. 21,



RECEIVED: Mar. 21, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

10:30 15:00 4.50 WBP 53 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK & RIH W/ FREE POINT TOOL TO 2200'. 

UNABLE TO WORK DEEPER. POOH W/ FREE POINT TOOL. RIH 

W/ T BG PUNCHER & WORK IN HOLE TO 3180'. UNABLE TO 

WORK DEEPER.

15:00 16:00 1.00 WBP 18 P RU HOT OILER TO CIRCULATE TBG STRINGS

16:00 23:00 7.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL FOR  6 HRS ADDING 55 GALLONS PARRIFEN 

SOLVENT. SPOT 2000 GALLONS DIESEL @ END OF 2-7/8" TBG 

STRING. SDFN

2/25/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( WIRE LINE OPERATIONS )

 7:30  8:30 1.00 WLWORK 06 P PUMP 65 BBLS DOWN 2-7/8"

 8:30 14:30 6.00 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ FREE POINT TOOLS, PUMP DOWN TO 6000' 

100% FREE @ 6000'

100% FREE @ 8200'

100% FREE @ 10800'

14:30 17:30 3.00 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ CHEMICAL CUTTER PUMP DOWN TO 10868' MAKE CUT 

@ 10,857' POOH RUN INTO PARIFIN @ 3400 + OR - PULL OUT 

OF ROPE SOCKET. RIH W/ FISING TOOLS ATTEMPT TO PUMP 

DOWN C/NOT PUMP DOWN 2-3/8".

17:30 18:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ATTEMPT TO PULL 2-3/8" C/NOT WORK FREE. SWIFWE CSDFWE 

CT.

2/26/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY SDFWE

2/27/2012  6:00  6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/28/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION.  HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CUTTING 

TBG W/ WIRELINE TOOLS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.

 7:30  8:30 1.00 WBP 06 P RU WIRE LINE TRUCK AS HOT OILERS FINISHED CIRCULATING 

TBG STRINGS W/140 BBLS TPW.

 8:30 13:30 5.00 WBP 18 P RIH & FISH CHEMICAL CUTTER @ 10849'. RIH W/ FREE POINT 

TOOLS & FREE POINT 2-3/8" TBG STRING.  2-3/8" TBG STUCK 

@ 6000', 50 % FREE @ 5600' & 100 % FREE @ 5100'.  

PRESSURE TEST TBG STRINGS TO 1500 PSI. TESTED GOOD, 

(NO CHEMICAL CUT). PERFORATE 2-3/8" TBG @ 10864'.

13:30 15:00 1.50 WBP 44 P DISCUSS OPTIONS W/ DENNIS INGRAM FROM UTAH DIVISION 

OF NATURAL RESOURCES. IT WAS AGREED UPON & APROVED 

BY DUSTIN DOUCET W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL 

RESOURCES TO PERFORATE TBG STRINGS & SPOT CMT 

PLUGS @ APPROVED DEPTHS , ALTERNATING TBG STRINGS 

UP TO STUCK DEPTH.

15:00 18:00 3.00 WBP 05 P CIRCULATE 15 BBLS PUMPING DOWN 2-7/8" TBG STRING & 

RETURNING UP CSG, THROUGH HOLES IN 2-3/8"EUE T BG. 

PUMP 60 SX 1.5 YIELD CLASS G CMT DOWN 2-7/8" TBG 

STRING. TBG LOCKED UP 20 BBLS INTO FLUSH, LEAVING 2155' 

CMT IN TBG. ATTTEMPT OO REVERSE OUT. UNABLE TO 

REVERSE CMT OUT OF TBG, PUMPING 1 BMP @ 1500 PSI. RU 

HOT OILER & PRESSURE UP TO 4500 PSI ON TBG. UNABLE TO 

FLUSH CMT. TOP OF CMT @ 3448'. END OF CMT @ 5603'. RU 

HOT OILER TO  2-3/8" TBG STRING. PUMP 20 BBLS TPW DOWN 

2-3/8" TBG & RETURN UP CSG, PUMPING 1/2 BPM @ 1000 PSI. 

SDFN

2/29/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PUMPING 

CMT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 10:00 2.50 WBP 05 P RIH W/ WIRELINE & TAG CMT IN 2-7/8" TBG @ 3194'.RIH W/ TBG 

PUNCHER & PERFORATE 2-3/8" TBG @ 10834'. ESTABLISH 

CIRCULATION, PUMPING DOWN 2-3/8" TBG & UP 7-5/8" CSG. 

CIRCULATE WELL W/ 45 BBLS TPW. MIX & PUMP 60 SX 1.05 

YIELD CLASS G CMT. DISPLACE W/ 41.5 BBLS TPW

10:00 12:00 2.00 WBP 41 P WAIT ON CMT

 2March 12, 2012 at  3:05 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
10:30 15:00 4.50 WBP 53 P RU WIRELINE TRUCK & RIH W/ FREE POINT TOOL TO 2200'.

UNABLE TO WORK DEEPER. POOH W/ FREE POINT TOOL. RIH
WIT BG PUNCHER & WORK IN HOLE TO 3180'. UNABLE TO
WORK DEEPER.

15:00 16:00 1.00 WBP 18 P RU HOT OILER TO CIRCULATE TBG STRINGS
16:00 23:00 7.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE WELL FOR 6 HRS ADDING 55 GALLONS PARRIFEN

SOLVENT. SPOT 2000 GALLONS DIESEL @ END OF 2-7/8" TBG
STRING. SDFN

2/25/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (WIRE LINE OPERATIONS)
7:30 8:30 1.00 WLWORK 06 P PUMP 65 BBLS DOWN 2-7/8"

8:30 14:30 6.00 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ FREE POINT TOOLS, PUMP DOWN TO 6000'
100% FREE @6000'
100% FREE @8200'
100% FREE @ 10800'

14:30 17:30 3.00 WLWORK 18 P RIH W/ CHEMICAL CUTTER PUMP DOWN TO 10868' MAKE CUT

@ 10,857' POOH RUN INTO PARIFIN @ 3400 + OR - PULL OUT
OF ROPE SOCKET. RIH W/ FISING TOOLS ATTEMPT TO PUMP
DOWN C/NOT PUMP DOWN 2-3/8".

17:30 18:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P ATTEMPT TO PULL 2-3/8" C/NOT WORK FREE. SWIFWE CSDFWE
CT.

2/26/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY SDFWE

2/27/2012 6:00 6:30 0.50 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

2/28/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CUTTING
TBG W/ WIRELINE TOOLS. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA.

7:30 8:30 1.00 WBP 06 P RU WIRE LINE TRUCKAS HOT OILERS FINISHED CIRCULATING
TBG STRINGS Wl140 BBLS TPW.

8:30 13:30 5.00 WBP 18 P RIH & FISH CHEMICAL CUTTER @ 10849'. RIH W/ FREE POINT
TOOLS & FREE POINT 2-3/8" TBG STRING. 2-3/8" TBG STUCK

@6000', 50 % FREE @ 5600' & 100 % FREE @ 5100'.
PRESSURE TEST TBG STRINGS TO 1500 PSI. TESTED GOOD,
(NO CHEMICAL CUT). PERFORATE 2-3/8" TBG @ 10864'.

13:30 15:00 1.50 WBP 44 P DISCUSS OPTIONS W/ DENNIS INGRAM FROM UTAH DIVISION
OF NATURAL RESOURCES. IT WAS AGREED UPON & APROVED
BY DUSTIN DOUCET W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL
RESOURCES TO PERFORATE TBG STRINGS & SPOT CMT
PLUGS @APPROVED DEPTHS , ALTERNATING TBG STRINGS
UP TO STUCK DEPTH.

15:00 18:00 3.00 WBP 05 P CIRCULATE 15 BBLS PUMPING DOWN 2-7/8" TBG STRING &
RETURNING UP CSG, THROUGH HOLES IN 2-3/8"EUE T BG.
PUMP 60 SX 1.5 YIELD CLASS G CMT DOWN 2-7/8" TBG
STRING. TBG LOCKED UP 20 BBLS INTO FLUSH, LEAVING 2155'
CMT IN TBG. ATTTEMPT OO REVERSE OUT. UNABLE TO
REVERSE CMT OUT OF TBG, PUMPING 1 BMP @ 1500 PSI. RU
HOT OILER & PRESSURE UP TO 4500 PSI ON TBG. UNABLE TO
FLUSH CMT. TOP OF CMT @ 3448'. END OF CMT @ 5603'. RU
HOT OILER TO 2-3/8" TBG STRING. PUMP 20 BBLS TPW DOWN
2-3/8" TBG & RETURN UP CSG, PUMPING 1/2 BPM @ 1000 PSI.
SDFN

2/29/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PUMPING
CMT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 10:00 2.50 WBP 05 P RIH W/ WIRELINE & TAG CMT IN 2-7/8" TBG @ 3194'.RIH W/ TBG
PUNCHER & PERFORATE 2-3/8" TBG @ 10834'. ESTABLISH
CIRCULATION, PUMPING DOWN 2-3/8" TBG & UP 7-5/8" CSG.
CIRCULATE WELL Wl45 BBLS TPW. MIX & PUMP 60 SX 1.05
YIELD CLASS G CMT. DISPLACE Wl41.5 BBLS TPW

10:00 12:00 2.00 WBP 41 P WAIT ON CMT

March 12, 2012 at 3:05 pm 2 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Mar. 21,



RECEIVED: Mar. 21, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

12:00 17:00 5.00 WBP 05 P RIH & TAG CMT @ 10110'. PERF TBG @ 10104'. MIX & PUMP 40 

SX 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CMT & DISPLACE W/ 38.5 BBLS TPW. 

RIH W/ WIRELINE & PERFORATE 2-3/8" TBG @ 7504. MIX & 

PUMP 40 SX 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CMT & DISPLACE W/ 28 BBLS 

TPW. ALL OPERATIONS TODAY WERE WITNESSED BY DENNIS 

INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

3/1/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CUTTING 

TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 11:30 4.00 WLWORK 53 P RIH W/ CHEMICAL CUTTER & TAG CMT IN 2-3/8" TBG @ 7073'. 

CHEMICAL CUT 2-3/8" TBG @ 5404'. LD 4 JTS 2-3/8" TBG. RIH 

W/ STRING SHOT & MAKE OUTSIDE BACK OFF ON 2-7/8" TBG 

STRING @ 5344'.

11:30 17:30 6.00 WBP 39 P TOOH W/ 2-3/8" TBG. CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER & LD 2-7/8" 

TBG. 65 JTS WERE FULL OF CMT. BOTTOM 10 JTS WERE OPEN. 

SDFN

3/2/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING 

TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30  9:00 1.50 WBP 16 P ND BOP. REMOVE DUAL STRING HANGER SPOOL. NU BOP

 9:00 10:30 1.50 WBP 39 P TIH W/ 6-5/8" BIT & TAG 2-7/8" FISH TOP @ 5344'.

10:30 12:30 2.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE HOLE W/ 150 BBLS TPW

12:30 17:00 4.50 WBP 39 P TOOH LAYING DOWN 2-3/8"TBG & BIT. TIH W/ SKIRTED 

2-7/8EUE COLLAR & SCREW INTO 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN

3/3/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON DUMP 

BAILING CMT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

 7:30 18:30 11.00 WBP 04 P RIH W/ CIBP FOR 2-7/8" TBG. TAG BOTTOM @ 10845'. SET CIBP 

@ 10826'. MADE 4 DUMP BAILER RUNS, DUMP BAILING 3.25 

GALLONS CMT PER RUN 53.417' CMT IN TBG. SDFN

3/4/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

3/5/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

3/6/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; WORKING WITH WIRELINE

 7:00  8:30 1.50 WLWORK 27 P R/U WIRE LINE TIH w 2 7/8" CBP SET AT 7500' TOH L/D SETTING 

TOOL

 8:30  9:30 1.00 WLWORK 21 P P/U TIH PERFORATE AT 7060' TOH L/G GUN

 9:30 10:30 1.00 WBP 05 P R/U PUMP PLUG # 5 20 SX OF CMT

10:30 11:30 1.00 WLWORK 18 P TIH w WIRELINE CUT TBG AT 5395'

11:30 12:00 0.50 WBP 05 P R/U PMP PLUG # 6 35 SX OF CMT w 2% CC

12:00 14:00 2.00 WBP 39 P TOH w TBG

14:00 14:30 0.50 WLWORK 21 P P/U TIH w 3 1/8" GUN PERFORATE @ 4790' TOH R/D WIRELINE

14:30 16:30 2.00 WBREMD 39 P TIH w 2 7/8" TBG RE-PMP PLUG # 6 w ADDITION 35 SX OF CMT 

w 2% CC & LCM TOH TO 4890' REVERSE CICR TOH TO 4575' 

WOC SDFN... 

ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY DUSTIN DOUCET AND DENNIS 

INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

3/7/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; PUMPING CEMENT

 7:00 11:00 4.00 WBP 39 P TIH w 2 7/8" TBG ATTEMPT TO TAG PLUG # 6 FAIL NO CMT 

ATTEMPT TO RE-PMP PLUG #6 TBG PRESSURE UP TOH L/D 19 

JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG PLUGED w/ CEMENT

11:00 14:00 3.00 WBP 05 P TIH w 2 7/8" TBG P/U 19 JTS RE-PMP PLUG #6 w 40 ADDITONAL 

SX OF CMT w 2%CC & LCM TOH w 2 7/8" TBG TO 4700' 

REVERSE CICR  WOC

14:00 15:30 1.50 WBP 05 P TIH w 2 7/8" TBG TAG PLUG #6 AT 5235' 160' PLUG TOH w TBG

15:30 16:00 0.50 WBP 05 P P/U 7 5/8" CICR TIH 145 JTS SET 7 5/8" CEMENT RETAINER AT 

4515'

 3March 12, 2012 at  3:05 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
12:00 17:00 5.00 WBP 05 P RIH & TAG CMT @ 10110'. PERF TBG @ 10104'. MIX & PUMP 40

SX 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CMT & DISPLACE W/ 38.5 BBLS TPW.
RIH W/ WIRELINE & PERFORATE 2-3/8" TBG @ 7504. MIX &
PUMP 40 SX 1.05 YIELD CLASS G CMT & DISPLACE Wl28 BBLS
TPW. ALL OPERATIONS TODAY WERE WITNESSED BY DENNIS
INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

3/1/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON CUTTING
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 11:30 4.00 WLWORK 53 P RIH W/ CHEMICAL CUTTER & TAG CMT IN 2-3/8" TBG @ 7073'.
CHEMICAL CUT 2-3/8" TBG @ 5404'. LD 4 JTS 2-3/8" TBG. RIH
W/ STRING SHOT & MAKE OUTSIDE BACK OFF ON 2-7/8" TBG
STRING @ 5344'.

11:30 17:30 6.00 WBP 39 P TOOH Wl2-3/8" TBG. CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER & LD 2-7/8"

TBG. 65 JTS WERE FULL OF CMT. BOTTOM 10 JTS WERE OPEN.
SDFN

3/2/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING
TBG. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA

7:30 9:00 1.50 WBP 16 P ND BOP. REMOVE DUAL STRING HANGER SPOOL. NU BOP
9:00 10:30 1.50 WBP 39 P TlH W/ 6-5/8" BIT & TAG 2-7/8" FISH TOP @ 5344'.
10:30 12:30 2.00 WBP 06 P CIRCULATE HOLE Wl150 BBLS TPW
12:30 17:00 4.50 WBP 39 P TOOH LAYING DOWN 2-3/8"TBG & BIT. TlH W/ SKIRTED

2-7/8EUE COLLAR & SCREW INTO 2-7/8"EUE TBG. SDFN
3/3/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P TRAVEL TO LOCATION. HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON DUMP

BAILING CMT. FILL OUT & REVIEW JSA
7:30 18:30 11.00 WBP 04 P RIH W/ CIBP FOR 2-7/8" TBG. TAG BOTTOM @ 10845'. SET CIBP

@ 10826'. MADE 4 DUMP BAILER RUNS, DUMP BAILING 3.25
GALLONS CMT PER RUN 53.417' CMT IN TBG. SDFN

3/4/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

3/5/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 SHUT DOWN FOR WEEKEND

3/6/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; WORKING WITH WIRELINE

7:00 8:30 1.50 WLWORK 27 P R/U WIRE LINE TlH w 2 7/8" CBP SET AT 7500' TOH L/D SETTING
TOOL

8:30 9:30 1.00 WLWORK 21 P P/U TlH PERFORATE AT 7060' TOH LIG GUN
9:30 10:30 1.00 WBP 05 P R/U PUMP PLUG #5 20 SX OF CMT
10:30 11:30 1.00 WLWORK 18 P TlH w WIRELINE CUT TBG AT 5395'
11:30 12:00 0.50 WBP 05 P R/U PMP PLUG #6 35 SX OF CMT w 2% CC
12:00 14:00 2.00 WBP 39 P TOH w TBG
14:00 14:30 0.50 WLWORK 21 P P/U TlH w 3 1/8" GUN PERFORATE @ 4790' TOH R/D WIRELINE
14:30 16:30 2.00 WBREMD 39 P TlH w2 7/8" TBG RE-PMP PLUG #6 w ADDITION 35 SX OF CMT

w 2% CC & LCM TOH TO 4890' REVERSE CICR TOH TO 4575'
WOC SDFN...
ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY DUSTIN DOUCET AND DENNIS
INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

3/7/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; PUMPING CEMENT

7:00 11:00 4.00 WBP 39 P TlH w2 7/8" TBG ATTEMPT TO TAG PLUG #6 FAIL NO CMT
ATTEMPT TO RE-PMP PLUG #6 TBG PRESSURE UP TOH L/D 19
JTS OF 2 7/8" TBG PLUGED w/ CEMENT

11:00 14:00 3.00 WBP 05 P TlH w2 7/8" TBG P/U 19 JTS RE-PMP PLUG #6w 40 ADDITONAL
SX OF CMT w 2%CC & LCM TOH w 2 7/8" TBG TO 4700'
REVERSE CICR WOC

14:00 15:30 1.50 WBP 05 P TlH w 2 7/8" TBG TAG PLUG #6 AT 5235' 160' PLUG TOH w TBG
15:30 16:00 0.50 WBP 05 P P/U 7 5/8" CICR TlH 145 JTS SET 7 5/8" CEMENT RETAINER AT

4515'

March 12, 2012 at 3:05 pm 3 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Mar. 21,



RECEIVED: Mar. 21, 2012

WESTERN

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

16:00 17:00 1.00 WBP 05 P FILL 7 5/8" CSG ATTEMPT TO TEST FAILED PMP INTO 1BPM @ 

450 PSI STING INTO RETAINER ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE 

1BPM AT 900 PSI PMP PLUG #7 156 SX OF CMT STING OUT 

LEAVE 20 SX ON TOP OF RETAINER TOC 4422'

17:00 18:00 1.00 WBREMD 39 P TOH w 2 7/8" TBG L/D SETTING TOOL SECURE WELL SDFN 80 

GALS OF DIESEL...ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY DUSTIN 

DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL 

RESOURCES

3/8/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; TRIPPING TUBING

 7:00  9:00 2.00 WBP 45 P P/U TIH w 7 5/8" PKR SET AT 3401' ATTEMPT TO TEST CSG 

FAILED INJECT INTO ANNULAS AT 1BPM 400 PSI ATTEMPT TO 

TEST BELOW PKR FAILED INJECT AT 1BPM 700 PSI  TOH w PKR 

TO 3340' TEST ANNULAS TO 1000 PSI TEST GOOD ATTEMPT 

TO TEST BELOW PKR FAILED INJECT INTO AT 1BPM 400 PSI 

TOH L/D PKR

 9:00 11:00 2.00 WBP 05 P P/U TIH w 7 5/8" CICR SET AT 3340' PMP PLUG # 7 175 SX OF 

CMT STING OUT OF CICR LEAVE 12 SX OF CMT ON TOP OF 

CICR...TOP OF CMT 3290'

11:00 13:30 2.50 WBP 39 P TOH w 2 7/8" TBG L/D SETTING TOOL

13:30 17:30 4.00 WBP 18 P DIG OUT AROUND CELLAR CUT WINDOW IN 9 5/8" CUT 7 5/8" 

CSG DROPPED 13" +/-  PREPARE TO FREE POINT & L/D 7 5/8" 

CSG SECURE WELL SDFN...ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY 

DUSTIN DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF 

NATURAL RESOURCES...87 GALS OF DIESEL

3/9/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; WORKING WITH WIRELINE

 7:00  9:00 2.00 WBP 21 P R/U WIRELINE TRUCK TIH FREE POINT 7 5/8" CSG AT 2200' 75% 

FREE 2105' 100% FREE TOH L/D FREE POINT TOOL TIH AND CUT 

7 5/8" CSG AT 2164' TOH L/D CUTTER R/D WIRELINE

 9:00 12:00 3.00 WBP 39 P R/U CSG EQUIPMENT TOH L/D 7 5/8" CSG R/D CSG EQIPMENT 

CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS FOR 2 7/8" TBG

12:00 16:00 4.00 WBP 05 P TIH w 2 7/8" TBG TO 2226' PMP PLUG #8 ACROSS STUB w 80 

SX OF CMT w 2% CC LCM TOH w 2 7/8" TBG 1300' WOC

16:00 17:30 1.50 WBP 05 P TIH w TBG TAG PLUG #8 SHORT AT 2195' RE-PMP PLUG #8 w 

45 SX OF CMT w LCM TOH w 2 7/8" TBG SECURE WELL SDFN 

80 GALS OF DIESEL...ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY DUSTIN 

DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL 

RESOURCES

3/10/2012  6:00  7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA 

TOPIC; RIGGING DOWN

 7:00  9:30 2.50 WBP 39 P TIH w 2 7/8" TBG TAG PLUG #8 AT 2016' 210' CMT PLUG  TOH 

w TBG TO 215' PMP PLUG #9 95 SX OF CMT TO SURFACE WOC

 9:30 11:00 1.50 WBP 18 P CUT CSG 3' BELOW GL WELD AND INSTALL INFO PLATE

11:00 13:00 2.00 WBP 18 P RDMO CLEAN UP LOCATION RELEASE EQUIPMENT TURN WELL 

OVER FOR SURFACE RECLAMATION...ALL CHANGES 

APPROVED BY DUSTIN DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH 

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

 4March 12, 2012 at  3:05 pm OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000Sundry Number: 24073 API Well Number: 43013300640000

WESTERN

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
16:00 17:00 1.00 WBP 05 P FILL 7 5/8" CSG ATTEMPT TO TEST FAILED PMP INTO 1BPM @

450 PSI STING INTO RETAINER ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE
1BPM AT 900 PSI PMP PLUG #7 156 SX OF CMT STING OUT
LEAVE 20 SX ON TOP OF RETAINER TOC4422'

17:00 18:00 1.00 WBREMD 39 P TOH w2 7/8" TBG L/D SETTING TOOL SECURE WELL SDFN 80
GALS OF DIESEL...ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY DUSTIN
DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL
RESOURCES

3/8/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; TRIPPING TUBING

7:00 9:00 2.00 WBP 45 P P/U TlH w 7 5/8" PKR SET AT 3401' ATTEMPT TO TEST CSG
FAILED INJECT INTO ANNULAS AT 1BPM 400 PSI ATTEMPT TO
TEST BELOW PKR FAILED INJECT AT 1BPM 700 PSI TOH w PKR
TO 3340' TEST ANNULAS TO 1000 PSI TEST GOOD ATTEMPT
TO TEST BELOW PKR FAILED INJECT INTO AT 1BPM 400 PSI
TOH L/D PKR

9:00 11:00 2.00 WBP 05 P P/U TlH w 7 5/8" CICR SET AT 3340' PMP PLUG #7 175 SX OF
CMT STING OUT OF CICR LEAVE 12 SX OF CMT ON TOP OF
CICR...TOP OF CMT 3290'

11:00 13:30 2.50 WBP 39 P TOH w2 7/8" TBG L/D SETTING TOOL
13:30 17:30 4.00 WBP 18 P DIG OUT AROUND CELLAR CUT WINDOWIN 9 5/8" CUT 7 5/8"

CSG DROPPED 13" +/- PREPARE TO FREE POINT & L/D 7 5/8"
CSG SECURE WELL SDFN...ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY
DUSTIN DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF
NATURAL RESOURCES...87 GALS OF DIESEL

3/9/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; WORKING WITH WIRELINE

7:00 9:00 2.00 WBP 21 P R/U WIRELINE TRUCK TlH FREE POINT 7 5/8" CSG AT 2200' 75%
FREE 2105'100% FREE TOH L/D FREE POINT TOOL TlH AND CUT
7 5/8" CSG AT 2164' TOH L/D CUTTER R/D WIRELINE

9:00 12:00 3.00 WBP 39 P R/U CSG EQUIPMENT TOH L/D 7 5/8" CSG R/D CSG EQIPMENT
CHANGE HANDLING TOOLS FOR 2 7/8" TBG

12:00 16:00 4.00 WBP 05 P TlH w 2 7/8" TBG TO 2226' PMP PLUG #8 ACROSS STUB w 80
SX OF CMT w 2% CC LCM TOH w 2 7/8" TBG 1300' WOC

16:00 17:30 1.50 WBP 05 P TlH w TBG TAG PLUG #8 SHORT AT 2195' RE-PMP PLUG #8 w
45 SX OF CMT w LCM TOH w2 7/8" TBG SECURE WELL SDFN
80 GALS OF DIESEL...ALL CHANGES APPROVED BY DUSTIN
DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH DIVISION OF NATURAL
RESOURCES

3/10/2012 6:00 7:00 1.00 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION HSM WRITE AND REVIEW JSA
TOPIC; RIGGING DOWN

7:00 9:30 2.50 WBP 39 P TlH w 2 7/8" TBG TAG PLUG #8 AT 2016' 210' CMT PLUG TOH
w TBG TO 215' PMP PLUG #9 95 SX OF CMT TO SURFACE WOC

9:30 11:00 1.50 WBP 18 P CUT CSG 3' BELOW GL WELD AND INSTALL INFO PLATE
11:00 13:00 2.00 WBP 18 P RDMO CLEAN UP LOCATION RELEASE EQUIPMENT TURN WELL

OVER FOR SURFACE RECLAMATION...ALL CHANGES
APPROVED BY DUSTIN DOUCET AND DENNIS INGRAM W/ UTAH
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

March 12, 2012 at 3:05 pm 4 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Mar. 21,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA
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