
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT
(highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO 6. SURFACE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTUO73409 Federal

7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:
1A.TYPE OF WORK DRILL REENTER DEEPEN NIA

8. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLE ZONE NIA

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP Wellington Federal 31-08
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18th Street, Denver, CO 80202 720-929-6000 UIMMMgnm&d / Ferron
CITY STATE ZIP {Ÿ

4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QMERTR ECTION,TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

AT SURFACE: Û Lat: 39.629606 Long: -110.708892 NWNE Lot 2 Sec. 8
AT PROPOSED PRODUCINGZONE: Same as above

S.L.B.&M.
T14S-R11E

14. DISTANCEINMILESANDDIRECTIONFROM NEARESTTOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE

Approximately 5.6 miles from Price, Utah Carbon UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES INLEASE: 17. NUMBEROF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

405' FNL 2,883.570 ac. 160 ac.

18. DISTANCETO NEARESTWELL(DRILLING,COMPLETED,OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

Wellington Fed 33-5 +I- 2200, 2404'
Utah Statewide Bond: RLBOO5238

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

6121' Ungraded Ground Level Upon APD Approval 5 days drilling plus 9 days completion

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASINGSIZE, GRADE,ANDWEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENTTYPE, QUANTITY,YIELD,ANDSLURRYWEIGHT

11" 8-5/8", 24#, J-55, ST&C 240' 103 sks of Class "A"cement w/ O.25#lsk LCM&2% CaCl2,

mixed @ 15.6 ppg, 1.19 cuft/sk yield wl 100% excess by volume,

enough volume to raise cmt to surface.

7-7/8" 5-1/2", 15.5#, J-55, LT&C 2404' 112 sks of Class "A"cement w/ 0.25#lsk LCM&2%CaCl2,

mixed at 12.5 ppg, 2.03 cuft/sk yield wl 10% excess.

Volumes calculated to circulate from TD to 700' above Ferron

formation with 10% excess by caliper log.

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITHTHE UTAHOILANDGAS CONSERVATIONGENERALRULES:

WELLPLATOR MAPPREPARED BYLICENSEDSURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EVIDENCEOF DIVISIONOF WATERRIGHTSAPPROVALFOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Debby J. Black (Debby.Black anadarko.com) TITLE Staff Regulatory Analyst (Direct 720-929-6472)

SIGNATURE DATE March 19, 2008
Appmvodby thm

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) Utah Divisionof RECEIVEDOil,Gas and Mining

API NUMBERASSIGNED:

D DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
FederalApproval of thb

(11/2001) Action is Necessary gy:
gton eral 31-08 UDOGM APD 3-19-08 (ST) Wellington Fed



Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
Well location, WELLINGTONFEDERAL#31-08,T14S, Ri/E, S.L.B.&M• locoted as shown in Lot 2 of

,,,
wes•4xtor

,,
SCectnin SU'kh.4S, R11E, S.LB.8cM., Carbon

NB9'If467 - 2669.40' (Meas.) 2670.15' (Meas.)
BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATEDON A JEEP TRAIL IN THE NW 1/4
WELL/NGTONFEDERÆ /J1-08 4 Ja'DEMCANO

ON
ARD1RGS M AC NBOyOcMOUL,

7.5
Elev. Ungraded Ground =r 6121' $ LOT 1 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHICMAP) PUBLISHED BY THE

UNITEDSTATES DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING 6460 FEET.

LOT2 BASIS OF BEARINGS
---- BASISOF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

LOT 3 LOT 4 h
N

of Stones Stesi Post

--III- IIMME
--- - --mi---mili-li-I

LOT 6 LOT5 d SC A LE
CERTIFI Illy

THISIS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE FROM
FIEl.DNOTES OF ACTUAL BY ME Y

---- SUPERVISIONAND1HAT THE TO THE
BESTOF MYKNON.EDGE

LOT 7 LOT8
REVISED02-16- GINEERINGmge

SURVEYING
NSS'01'W - 2552.22' (G.LO.) NS9'49'W - 2707.98' (G.LO.)

86 SOUTH 200 E -æ VERNAR. UTAH 84078

LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD83) SCALE DATESURVEYED: DATEDRAWN:LATlTU0E= 39°37'46.58" (39.629606) 1" == 1000' 02-02-06 02-11-06
=

90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 110'42°32.01" (110.708892) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELLHEAD. (AUTONOMOUSNAD27) D.K. L.K. C.H. G.L.O. PLAT

LAT1TUDE= 39'37'46.71" (39.629642) WEATHER RLEA = SECTIONCORNERSLOCATED· LONGITUDE= 110°42'29.44"(110.708178) COLD Kerr-McGee 08 & Gas Onshore
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2008 Cardinal Draw Plan of Development
Carbon County, Utah

OPERATOR: KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L. P.

Federal Lease: UTU-073409

Wellington Federa131-08
NWNE Lot 2, Section 8: Township 14 South - Range 11 East

Carbon County, Utah

Settin epth-
Sacks Top of Ferron Total Depth

Bond Hoede

Pressure

8-5/8", 24# Casing 240' 103
5-1/2", 15.5# Casing 2404' 112 1939' 2404' 1034

DRILLING PROGNOSIS FOR PRODUCTION WELLS

1. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS:

Shallowest Depth Deepest Depth
Formation Measured Sub Sea Measured Sub Sea

Ferron 760 4850 780 4850
B Ferron 1130 3940 2154 4540
Tunnunk 830 4150 2154 4540

Shale
TD 1380 2404

2. ESTlMATED DEPTH OF ANTICIPATED WATER,OIL, GAS OR MINERAL FORMATIONS

Primary Objective: Tunnuck Shale Methane Gas
Secondary Objective: Ferron Methane Gas

Severalcoal seams may be tested for gas producing fornations to total depth. All shallow water zones will
be protected with casing and cement. Cement will be brought 700' above the Ferron unless water is encountered.

The casing and cementing programs shall be conducted as approved to protect and/or isolateall usable
water zones and any prospectively valuable depositsof minerals. All indications of usable water shall
be reported to the authorized officer prior to running the next string of casing or beforeplugging orders
are requested, whichever occurs first.

3. MINIMUM BOP REQUIREMENTS: (Refer to attached schematics)

a) The BOPE shall be closed whenever the well is unattended.
b) The BOPE shall be pressure tested when initially installed, whenever any seal subject to pressure testing

is broken, after repairs, or every 30 days.
c) Kerr-McGee shall notify the Moab and Price BLM offices 24 hours prior to the BOPE test.
d) All BOPE shall meet or exceed the requirements of a 2M system as set forth in Onshore Order No. 2.
e) An accumulator unit will be used that has sufficient capacity to open the hydraulically-controlled choke

line valve (if so equipped), close all rams plus the annular preventer and retain 200 psi above precharge on
the closing manifold without the use of the closing pumps. The accumulator unit will be located at the
master accumulator and on the rig floor.Hydraulic controls will be locatedat the master accumulator.
Manual controls (hand wheels) will also be installedon the blind and pipe rams.

f) Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack working pressure if
isolatedby test plug or 70 percent of internalyield pressure of casing if BOP stack is not isolated from
casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until requirements of test are met,
whichever is longer.

g) Annular type preventers shall be tested to 50 percent of rated working pressure. Pressure shall be
maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of test are met, whichever is longer.

h) Accessories to BOP's include upper and lower Kelly cock valves with handle , floor safety valve and
wireline-retrievable float valves.

Cardinal Draw 2008- MASTER DRILLING PROGS Submittal Wellington Federal 31-08
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4. SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION

As this is a normally pressured coalbed methane play, no gas is anticipated to surface during drilling operations.
Surface casing will be preset with a water-well drilling rig (3D) and production casing will be set with a turnkeyoperator
(Pence). Kerr-McGee will have a company hand on location for all operations. This is done to minimize rig time on
location.

5. CASING PROGRAM:

Hole Size Casing Size Weight Grade Joint Depth Set New/Used Collapse Burst Tension
11" 8-5/8" 24 J-55 ST&C 240 New 1,370 2,950 244,000

7-7/8" 5-1/2" 15.5 J-55 LT&C 2400 New 4,040 4,810 217,000

Conductor pipe will not be utilized on production wells in CardinalDraw

SurfaceCasing:

a) Burst = 0.052 * MW * TVD
= 0.052 * 8.33 ppg * 2139'

= 1040 psi
Safety Factor = Rating/Burst

= 2950/112
= 3

b) Collapse = [0.052* MW * TVD(shoe)]
= [.052* 9.0 ppg * 240']

= 112 psi
Safety Factor = Rating/Collapse

= 1370/88
= 12

c) Tension = Weight * TVD * [1 - (MWl65.5ppg)] + Margin of Overpull
= 24 * 240' * [1 - 9.0/65.5] + 50,000

= 54969 lbf
SafetyFactor = Rating/Tension

= 244,000/4,969
= 4

Surface casing shall have a centralizer on every joint.

ProductionCasing:

a) Burst = 0.052 * 8.33 ppg * 2400' (Evacuated Casing)
= 1040 psi

Burst= (1.45 psilft -0.44 psi/ft) * TVD (Fracture Pressure)
= 2424 psi

Safety Factor = Rating/Burst
= 4810/1041
= 5
= 4810/2424
= 2

b) Collapse = [0.052* 8.33 ppg * 2400']
= 1040 psi

Safety Factor = Rating/Collapse
= 4040/1040
= 4

c) Tension Weight = 15.5 lbs/ft *2400'* [1-(8.33 ppg/65.5 ppg)] + Marginof Overpull
= 15.5 lbs/ft *2400'* 0.873+50,000
= 54731 lbf

SafetyFactor = Rating/Tension
= 217,000/32,530
= 4

Master Drig Pog for Producers 2 of 4
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6. DRILLINGFLUIDSPROGRAM:

Surface:
Kerr-McGee intends to drill the surface casing throughto 10% of total depth using fresh water and gel sweeps.
No gas or water zones will be encountered and as such BOPE will not be used.

Production:
Drilling of the production hole to casing setting depth will be done with air as the drilling fluid.While drilling in an
underbalanced state, Kerr-McGee and/or its turnkeycontractor will maintain sufficient barite and lost-circulation materials
on location to kill water flows and contain gas production ifdeemed necessary. These materials will not be pre-mixed, but
the ability to mix and pump them will be present on location.

Kerr-McGee requests a variance from Onshore Order 2 with regards to the 100 foot blooey line. The length of the blooey
line will be sufficient to reach the middle ofthe reserve pit. Since gas flow is not anticipatedto surface, there will not be
an ignition device. In the event that gas does flow to surface, a continuous ignition system will be installed and utilized on
all remaining and subsequent wells drilled. Air flowline is 8" Schedule80 pipe that runs 90 degrees fromthe well bore to
the reserve pit. The last 7 of flow line is 14" pipe with three, 45 degree, 8" Schedule 80 pipes to disperse cuttings to
reserve pit. Dust will be suppressed by injecting water into the blooey line. Whip-checks will also be utilized on all
pressurized compressors, blooey lines and hoses to maintain physical control. Fire extiguishers will be placed around
location.

The open hole will be loaded with water and a micro-emulsion agent prior to tripping out of the hole to run wireline logs and case.

7. CEMENTING PROGRAM:

8-5/8" SurfaceCasing:
Tail: Class "A" Cement with 0.25#lsk LCM and 2% CaCl2, mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.19 cuft/sk yield with 100% excess by volume.

The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface. In the event cement does not circulate to surface or
fall back of the cement column occurs, remedial cementing shall be done to cement the casing back to surface.

5-1/2" Production Casing:
Tail: Class "A" Cement with 0.25#lsk LCM and 2% CaC12, mixed at 12.5 ppg, 2.03 cuft/sk yield with 10% excess.
Volumes calculated to circulate cement fromTD to 700' above the Ferron formationwith 10% excess by caliper log.

Centralizerswill used used to maintain a minimum of70% Casing-SidewallStandoff

8. LOGGING PROGRAM

Well completion and stimulation procedures will be determined following the evaluation of the drilling
results and open hole logs. A "Sundry Notice" will be submitted for approval outlining the planned completion
procedure at that time.

Cores: None

DSTs: None

Logs: From To
GR TD Surface- if needed
Resistivity Surface Casing TD
Neutron-Density-Cal Surface Casing TD
High Res Pass Surface Casing TD

9. PRESSURE DATA, POTENTIAL HAZARDS

Bottom hole is anticipated to be nornally pressured.
There is no historyof hydrogensulfide gas in the area and none is anticipated.

Master Drig Prog for Producers 3 of 4
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10. ANTICIPATED STARTlNGDATESAND NOTIFICATION OF OPERATIONS:

a) Anticipated Days:

Drilling Days: Approximately 5 Days/Well
Completion Days: Approximately 2 Days/Well
Testing Days: Approximately 7-14 Days/Well

b) Notification of Operations:
Surface Sub-Surface

Bureau of Land Management Bureau of Land Management
Price Field Office Moab Field Office
125 South600 West 82 East Dogwood
Price, Utah 84501 Moab, Utah 84532
(435) 636-3600 (435) 259-2100
Atto: Nathan Sill,NRS Attn: Eric Jones, Senior Engineer

Master Ddg Prog for Producers 4 of 4
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CERTIFICATION STATEMENT

WELL NAME: Wellington Federal 31-08

LEASE NO.: UTU-073409

I hereby certify that I, or person under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that the
statements made in the plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the work
associated with operations herein will be performed by Pense Brothers Drilling Company, Inc.,
Xtreme Coil Drilling Corp., and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with this plan
and the terms and conditions under w

°ch it is approved. This statement is subject to the
provisions of 18 U.S. 1 1 fo ' 1°

g f a false statement.

Name and Title \ k
Grant Schluender/ Dril g Engineer

Dated this 19th day of March,
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Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
Wellington Federal 31-08

405' FNL 1,814' FEL (NW/4 NE/4)
Section 8 Township 14 South - Range 11 East

SLB&M
Carbon County, Utah

Federal Lease: UTUO73409

SURFACE USE PLAN OF OPERATIONS

This Application for Permit to Drill (APD) is filed under the Notice of Staking (NOS) process as stated in
Onshore Order No. 1 (OSO #1) and supporting Bureau of Land Management (BLM) documents. This
NOS process included an on-site meeting on December 17-19, 2007 prior to the submittal of the
application, at which time the specific concerns of Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP (Kerr-McGee)
and the BLM were discussed. Specific concerns of the BLM representatives are addressed herein, as are
specific stipulations from the BLM.

* Specific stipulations arising from the on-site meeting are shown as starred.

WELL LOCATION AND INTRODUCTION:

The proposed location is at 405' FNL 1,814' FEL of Section 8, T14S Rl1E, SLB&M. The well site was
surveyed and staked at a geologically preferable location by Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
(UELS).

An NOS was submitted to BLM in Moab, Utah on October 21, 2007 for this location. An on-site meeting
was held on December 17-19, 2007. Present were: Nathan Sill - BLM, Price; Jim Hartely, Gina Becker,
and Tom Richardson - Kerr-McGee; Nick Hall - Grasslands Consulting; Chuck Bollong - SWCA;
Uintah Engineering and Land Surveying; and Keith Dana - Dana Consulting.

DIRECTIONS TO LOCATION

From Price, Utah, go easterly then southeasterly on Highway 6 (E. Main Street) for approximately 1.1
miles to Airport Road. Turn left (east) onto Airport Road, and continue easterly then northerly for
approximately 5.0 miles to Pipe Road. Turn right (east) on Pipe Road and follow it as it curves
northeasterly then southeasterly for approximately 1.9 miles to the beginning of the access road for
Wellington Federal 33-5. Turn right and continue south for approximately 200' to the beginning of the
access road for Wellington Federal 11-08. Proceed southwesterly for 0.3 miles to the beginning of the
proposed access road for this well. Turn left (southeast) for 0.25 miles to the well pad.

1) EXISTING ROADS
A) The well is a development well.
B) Existing roads within 1 mile consist of an access road for Wellington Federal 11-08, 0.25

miles of location.
C) Plans for improvement and/or maintenance of existing roads are to be maintained in as

good or better conditions then at present and said maintenance will continue until final
abandonment and reclamation of this drilling



Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas O ore LP Page 2
Wellington Federal 31-08 Surface Use Plan of Operations

2) PLANNED ACCESS ROADS (See Topos A, B, and D)
±400' ( 0.08 miles) - Total new road construction, Sec. 8 -Federal, on lease
±900' ( 0.17 miles) - Total new construction, Sec. 5 - Federal, off lease
±1,584' (0.3 miles) - Existing access road for Wellington Federal 11-08, Sec. 5 -

Federal, off lease
±200' (0.04miles) - Existing new access road for Wellington Federal 33-5, Sec. 5
- Federal, off lease

ThisApplicationforPermit to Drill (APD) can serve as a request forBLMto initiate a Right of
Way (ROW) application for access roads and water haul routes, if necessary This ROW can
continue up to the wellhead.

A) Running surface will be crowned/ditched with a running surface ±16' and the total
disturbed width to be ±50'. Plans for improvement and/or maintenance of existing roads
are to maintain in as good or better conditions than at present. A regular maintenance plan
will include,but not be limited to blading, ditching, and surfacing.

B) Borrow ditches to be back sloped 3:1 or shallower.
C) Maximum grades will not exceed BLM standards.
D) Culverts and low-water crossings will be installed as needed prior to drilling. Drainage

to consist of borrow ditches on both sides and "wind ditches" as appropriate. Riprap will
be placed at the inlet and outlet at the culvert adjacent to the wellpad. Low water
crossings may be used during drilling and upon completion if conditions dictate.
Culverts will be installed prior to commencement of drilling operations. The borrow
ditches along the proposed access road will be re-seeded if the well is completed as a
producer. The reseeding of the borrow ditches will reduce the area utilized by this
location.

E) Surfacing material to consist of native material from borrow ditches. Road will be gravel
surfaced. Gravel will be hauled by truck from a licensed facility.

F) No major road cuts are necessary.
G) Fence cuts, gates and/or cattle guards will be installed as necessary.
H) Upgrade and maintain access roads as necessary to prevent solid erosion and

accommodate year-round traffic.
I) All equipment and vehicles will be confined to the access road, pad, and areas specified

in the APD.
J) The proposed access road will be constructed in accordance with roading guidelines

established for oil and gas exploration and development activities as referenced in the
joint BLM/USFS publications: Surface Operatine Standards for Oil & Gas Exploration
and Development. Third Edition and/or BLM Manual Section 9113 concerning road
construction activities on projects under federal jurisdiction.The qualified construction
supervisor shall be an engineer, company superintendent or other representative who is
competent and knowledgeable in oilfield road and drillsite construction, and able to speak
for the operator. The dirt contractor, or drilling/completion foremen whose primary
expertise is not in construction, do not qualify as construction supervisors.

K) Construction activity shall not be conducted using frozen or saturated solid material or
during periods when significant watershed damage (e.g. rutting, extensive sheet soil
erosion, formation of rills/gullies, etc.) is likely to occur.

L) Vegetative debris is not permitted in or under fill embankments.

L\SharedData\Denver\Regulatory\UTAH PROPERTIES- Carbon County AEPCLP-KMG\Wellington Federal 31-08\Wellington Federal 31-08



Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas O ore LP Page 3
Wellington Federal 31-08 Surface Use Plan of Operations

3) LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS
Within a 1-mile radius:

Proposed: 1
Drilling/injection: None
Shut-In: None
Producing: 13

LOCATION OF EXISTING PRODUCING FACILITIES OPERATED BY Kerr-McGee Oil
& Gas Onshore LP
Within one mile: None

4) NEW PRODUCTION FACILITIES PROPOSED
A) BLM will be contacted prior to construction of production facilities. A Sundry Notice

(SN) will be filed if requested by BLM.
B) Meter houses are skid mounted. A pump house may be installed if needed. Flow lines

will be buried alongside or under the access road. Electric power will be buried wires
and poles, also installed alongside the access road. Both will be within the corridor as
surveyed by the archaeologist. Any changes from this plan will be submitted to the
BLM Field Office by Sundry Notices. New flow lines will connect with existing flow
lines, produced fluid will be piped to the existing tank battery.

B) Dimension of Proposed Facility is 260' x 215' or less (55,900 ft2)for drilling operations.
Total disturbance will be approximately 1.28 acres.

C) Site preparation for production will be done with standard excavation equipment using
native materials. Additional surface material will be obtained from commercial sources
or the approved borrow area. Production facilities (including dikes), if used, must be
placed on the cut portion of the location and a minimum of 15 feet from the toe of the
back cut.

D) Production equipment will be painted light reflective colors to limit evaporation and
waste of liquid hydrocarbons, per BLM specifications.
All permanent above-the-ground structures, tank batteries, etc. if used, that will remain
longer than six (6) months will be painted Olive Black, or as specified by BLM. The
exception being that Utah Occupation Health and Safety Act Rules and Regulations are
to be complied with where special safety colors are required.

E) Production facilities are planned on location, and may vary according to actual reservoir
discovered and will be engineered upon completion of well tests. Production facilities
will be clustered and placed away from cut slopes and fill slopes to allow the maximum
recontouring of cut and fill slopes.
If used, a dike will be constructed completely around the production facilities (e.g.
production tanks, water tanks, and/or heater-treater). The dikes for the production
facilities must be constructed of compacted subsoil, hold the capacity of the largest tank,
and be independent of the back cut. Any production pits will be fenced.
If the well is a producer, all production facilities not listed herein will be authorized by
Sundry Notice.

F) No facilities will be constructed off location except as noted in paragraph A) above.
G) Rehabilitation of unneeded, previously disturbed areas will consist of backfilling and

contouring the reserve pit area, back sloping and contouring all cut and fill slopes to the
surrounding topography. No depressions will be left that trap water or form ponds.

L:\SharedData\Denver\Regulatory\UTAH PROPERTIES- Carbon County AEPCLP-KMG\Wellington Federal 3 I-08\Wellington Federal 31-08



Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas O ore LP Page 4
Wellington Federal 31-08 Surface Use Plan of Operations

These areas will be re-seeded. Refer to plans for restoration of surface for additional
details.

H) Pits which contain oil, if used, will be overhead flagged. None are planned at this time.
I) Proposed utility corridor information:

This ApplicationforPermit to Drill (APD) can serve as a request forBLMto initiate a Right of
Way (ROW) application for access roads and water haul routes, if necessary. This ROW can
continue up to the wellhead.

The proposed utility corridor consists of approximately 0.25 total miles (±1,320')of
right-of-way (ROW) on Federal lands.

The following items will be in one trench on one side of the access road:
- A gas transportation pipeline
- A produced water transportation pipeline
On the opposite side of the access road, the power supply (12470 volt power) for the
well will be buried.

The gas transportation pipeline would transport recovered gas from this well to an
existing interconnect with the existing pipeline infrastructure. The existing pipeline is
operated by Kerr-McGee, and the proposed pipeline will be constructed by Kerr-McGee.

The utility corridor alignment will be located adjacent to the proposed access road ROW
between this well and the existing portion of access road.

This utility corridor will begin at this well, then traverse northwesterly approximately
1,320' to existing utility corridor for the Wellington Federal 11-08.

Ownership of the ROW to be utilized is as follows:

Tl4S RllE Sec. 8 Federal, on lease ±400' ±0.08 miles
Tl4S R11E Sec. 5 Federal, off lease ±900' ±0.17 miles

TOTAL LENGTH - NEW CONSTRUCTION TO BE UTILIZED ON FEDERAL
LANDS

ROW-±0.25 MILES

The utility corridor pipeline ROW will be in the existing transportation ROW with
minimal disturbance. Construction equipment will utilize the access road as much as
possible. The ROW will consist of a 70' total width. The actual right of way will include a
50' width from the centerline of the road to the outside edge of the access road ROW as
surveyed by the archeologist.

L:\SharedData\Denver\Regulatory\UTAH PROPERTIES- Carbon County AEPCLP-KMG\Wellington Federal 31-08\Wellington Federal 31-08



Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas O ore LP Page 5
Wellington Federal 31-08 Surface Use Plan of Operations

The gas gathering pipeline construction specifications are as follows:
Gas transportation pipeline:

Diameter: 3.633" AID (4" nominal)
Wall Thickness: 0.409"
Grade SDR 11
Design Pressure: 100 psig
Actual Pressure: 60-95 psig
Pressure Test Fluid: Air
Pipeline Depth: 36"-48"

The water gathering pipeline construction specifications are as follows:
Water gathering pipeline:

Diameter: 4"
Wall Thickness: 1.000"
Grade SDR 9
Design Pressure: 100 psig
Actual Pressure: 60-95 psig
Pressure Test Fluid: Air
Pipeline Depth: 36"-48"

The allocation and sales meters will be located in the immediate vicinity of the wellhead
unless other wise modified by a Sundry Notice.
i) Pipeline shall be constructed as shown on the attached map and plat. Graders shall

be used to construct or to clear the pipeline ROW wherever feasible. Angle dozers
would be used if terrain dictates. The ROW shall not be cleared more than an
additional fifty (50) feet wide (preferably five (5) feet wide on the soil stockpile
side, and twenty (20) feet wide on the working side of the trench minimum)
without approval. Bladed materials shall be placed back into the cleared route once
construction is completed. Pipeline to be welded and dragged with a dozer into
place. Alternatively, certain portions of the pipeline may be constructed by laying
pipe in the existing road borrow ditch, picking the pipe up with side boom cats,
then welding and placing along side of the road. All construction will be with as
little surface disturbance as possible.

ii) Pipeline construction shall not block nor change the natural course of any drainage.
Trenches will be dug with 1-4 backhoes; the number is subject to availability at the
time of construction. A trencher would be used only if the backhoes are not
available. Suspended pipelines, which are not currently anticipated but if needed,
shall provide adequate clearance for maximum runoff.

ii) Pipeline trenches shall be compacted at road crossings during backfilling. Pipeline
trenches shall be maintained in order to correct settlement and erosion. Road
crossings will be trenched to a depth of five (5) feet prior to placing the pipeline in
the trench. Following the placement of the pipeline into the trench all open road
cuts will backfilled and compacted in order to maintain the integrity of the existing
road.

iii) The pipeline will be tested with air prior to filling the trench.
iv) Minimal water will be needed as this well will be air-drilled. When water is

needed, it will be obtained from the city of Price.
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Water requirements are anticipated to be minimal or less than approximately
10,814 bbls (454,188 gallons or 1.40 acre-feet).

v) All above ground permanent structures including production equipment (Valving

and piping, etc.) will be painted a non-contrasting color to blend harmoniously
with the surrounding landscape, as specified by BLM.

vi) Topsoil, as available, will be removed prior to pipeline construction from along the
working side of the pipeline ROW and stockpiled for future reclamation. Topsoil
depth of 6" to be removed as stipulated by BLM.

vii) Pipeline markers will be installedwhere appropriate.
viii) Pipeline construction is anticipated to be approximately three (3) to six (6) weeks.
ix) Anticipated equipment area as follows:

Wellington Federal 44-6, SE/4 SE/4 Sec. 6 T14N RllE. This is an existing
SWD well, and the storage area is covered under BLM ROW UTU-079503

x) Anticipated full time personnel are as follows:
1 - Supervisor
1 - Pipeline supervisor
3 - Trenching crew (welders with helpers)
3 - Trucks
3 - Dozer, Track hoe, Blade

Part-time technical support persons will be on-site from time to time as necessary.
xi) Waterbars are to be constructed at least one (1) foot deep, on the contour with

approximately two (2) feet of drop per 100 feet of waterbar to ensure drainage, and
extended into established vegetation.
All waterbars are to be constructed with the berm on the downhill side to prevent the
soft material from silting in the trench. The initial waterbar should be constructed at
the top of the backslope. Subsequent waterbars should follow the following general
spacing guidelines:

% SLOPE SPACING INTERVAL (feet)
2 or < 200
2 - 4 100
4 - 5 75
5 or 50

5) LOCATION OF WATER SUPPLY
A) Minimal water will be needed as this well will be air-drilled. When water is needed, it

will be obtained from the city of Price.
B) Anticipated water use is as follows:

Air drilling will be used, so the mud drilling water requirements will be minimal, if any.

6) SOURCE OF CONSTRUCITON MATERIALS
A) Construction materials will consist of native materials from borrow ditches and location

areas.
B) Surfacing materials will be obtained form available permitted sources, if needed, and

consist of pit gravel. Gravel will be hauled by truck from a licensed facility.

7) WASTE DISPOSAL
A) Drill cuttings will be buried in reserve pit when dry.
B) Drilling fluid will be evaporated and then buried in the reserve pit when dry.
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C) Reserve pit layout is illustrated on Figures 1 and 2.
* D) Reserve pit will be lined with a synthetic liner 12 mil or thicker. The reserve pit liner shall

be made of any manmade synthetic material of sufficient size and qualities to sustain a
hydraulic conductivity no greater than lx 10¯' cm/sec after installation and which is
sufficiently reinforced to withstand normal wear and tear associated with the installation
and pit use thereof. The liner shall be chemically compatible with all substances that
may be put into the pit.

E) Reserve pit will be fenced on three sides during drilling operations, and on fourth side at
time of rig release. Pit will remain fenced until backfilled.

* F) If used, a flare pit for air drilling will be located minimum 100' from wellbore.
G) Produced fluid will be contained in test tanks during completion and testing.

* H) Sewage disposal facilities will be in accordance with State and Local Regulations. Sewage
may not be buried on location or put in a borehole. Utah Department of Environmental
Quality(UDEQ)Regulations prevent this unless a UDEQPermit is obtained.

* I) Garbage and other waste - burnable waste will be contained in a portable trash cage which
will be totally enclosed with small mesh wire. Cage and contents will be transported to
and trash dumped at a WDEQapproved Sanitary Landfill upon completion of operations.

J) Trash will be picked up if scattered and contained in trash cage as soon as practical after
rig is moved off.

K) Upon release of the drilling rig, rathole and mousehole will be filled. Debris and
equipment not required for production will be removed.

8) ANCILLARY FACILITIES
No ancillary facilities will be necessary.

9) WELLSITE LAYOUT(See Figures 1 and 2)
Note: Bureau of Land Management will be contacted prior to reserve pit construction and

provided an opportunity to inspect the pit prior to filline with water.
A) See attached drill site plat and cut/fill diagram.
B) Roads and well production equipment, such as tanks, treaters, separators, vents,

electrical boxes, and equipment associated with pipeline operation, will be placed on
location so as to permit maximum interim reclamation of disturbed areas. If equipment
is found to interfere with the proper interim reclamation of disturbed areas, the
equipment may be moved so proper recontouring and revegetation can occur.

C) If there is snow on the ground when construction begins, the operator will remove it
before the soil is disturbed, and pile it downhill from the topsoil stockpile location.

D) Both backslope and foreslope will be constructed no steeper than 1½:1.
E) Erosion control measures will be applied pursuant to Kerr-McGee's General Permit to

Discharge Stormwater under the Utah Pollutant Discharge Elimination System and
accompanying Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan.

10) SURFACE PREPARATION
(General)
A) Salvaging and spreading topsoil will not be performed when the ground or topsoil is

frozen or too wet to adequately support construction equipment. If such equipment
creates ruts in excess of four (4) inches deep, the soil will be deemed too wet.

B) Earthwork for interim and final reclamation must be completed within six (6) months of
well completion or plugging (weather permitting).
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C) In areas that will not be drill-seeded, the seed mix will be applied and fertilized per
BLM's Conditions of Approval (COAs).

D) No seeding will occur from May 15 to September 15. Fall seeding is preferred and will
be conducted after September 15 and prior to ground freezing. Spring seeding will be
conducted after the frost leaves the ground and no later that May 15.

E) Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas as directed by the
Field Office Manager. An intensive weed monitoring and control program will be
implemented beginning the first growing season after interim and final reclamation.
Noxious weeds that have been identified during monitoring will be promptly treated and
controlled. A Pesticide Use Proposal (PUP) will be submitted to the BLM for approval
prior to the use of herbicides. All reclamation equipment will be cleaned prior to use to
reduce the potential for introduction of noxious weeds or other undesirable non-native
species. The operator will coordinate all weed and insect control measures with state
and/or local management agencies.

F) Reclaimed areas will be monitored annually. Actions will be taken to ensure that
reclamation standards are met as quickly as reasonably practical.

G) Reclamation monitoring will be documented in an annual reclamation report submitted
to the AO by December 31. The report will document compliance with all aspects of the
reclamation objectives and standards, identify whether the reclamation objectives and
standards are likely to be achieved in the near future without additional actions, and
identify actions that have been or will be taken to meet the objectives and standards. The
report will also include acreage figures for: Initial Disturbed Acres; Successful Interim
Reclaimed Acres; Successful Final Reclaimed Acres. Annual reports will not be
submitted for sites approved by the AO in writing as having met interim or final
reclamation standards. Any time 30% or more of a reclaimed area is redisturbed,
monitoring will be reinitiated.

H) The AO will be informed when reclamation has been completed, is successful, and the
site is ready for final inspection.

INTERIM RESTORATION (Production)
A) Rehabilitation of unneeded, previously disturbed areas will consist of backfilling and

contouring the reserve pit area, back sloping and contouring all cut and fill slopes. These
areas will be re-seeded.

B) Wellpad size will be reduced to minimum size necessary to conduct safe operations. Cuts
and fills will be reduced to 3:1 or shallower.

C) Reserve pits will be closed and backfilled as soon as the pit contents are dry enough to do
so, or no later than the end of the next full summer following rig release, whichever
comes first, to allow sufficient time for the pit contents to dry. Reserve pits remaining
open after this period will require written authorization of the Authorized Office (AO).
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons or trash in the reserve and flare pits
will be removed. Pits will be allowed to dry, be pumped dry, or solidified in-situ prior to
backfilling.

D) Following completion activities, pit liners will be buried to prevent their reemergence to the
surface and interference with long-term successful revegetation. If it was necessary to line
the pit with a synthetic liner, the pit will not be trenched (cut) or filled (squeezed) while
containing fluids. When dry, the pit will be backfilled with a minimum of five (5) feet of
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soil material. In relatively flat areas, the pit area will be slightly mounded to allow for
settling and to promote surface drainage away from the backfilled pit.

E) The portions of the cleared well site not needed for operational and safety purposes will
be recontoured to the original contour if feasible, or if not feasible, to an interim contour
that blends with the surrounding topography as much as possible. Sufficient level area
will remain for setup of a workover rig and to park equipment. In some cases, rig anchors
may need to be pulled and reset after recontouring to allow for maximum interim
reclamation.

* F) Topsoil will be evenly respread and aggressively revegetated over the disturbed area not
needed for all-weather operations back to the rig anchors, including road cuts and fills and
to within a few feet of the production facilities, unless an all-weather, surfaced, access route
or small "teardrop" turnaround is needed on the well pad.

G) Initial seedbed preparation will consist of backfilling, leveling, and ripping all compacted
areas. Final seedbed preparation will consist of contour cultivating to a depth of 4 to 6
inches within 24 hours prior to seeding. Seeding will be conducted no more than 24 hours
following completion of final seedbed preparation. A certified weed-free seed mix designed
by BLM (shown below) to meet reclamation standards will be used. The seed mix will be
used on all disturbed surfaces includingpipelines and road cut and fill slopes.

H) To help mitigate the contrast of recontoured slopes, reclamation will include measures to
feather cleared lines of vegetation and to save and redistribute cleared trees, debris, and
rock over recontoured cut and fill slopes.

* I) A proposed seed mixture for this location in Pinyon/ Juniper habitat is:
Indian ricegrass (Nezpar) Achnatherum hymenoides 2.0
Needle and thread grass Stipa Comata 2.0
Western wheatgrass Pascopyrum smithii 2.0

Gooseberryleaf globemallow Sphaeralcea grossulariifolia 0.5
Palmer penstemon (Cedar) Penstemon palmeri 0.5

Birchleaf mountain mahogany Cercocarpus montanus 1.0
Antelope bitterbrush Purshia Tridentata 1.0
Fourwing saltbush Atriplex canescens _l .0

10.0
J) Reclamation will be considered successful if the following criteria are met, or as specified

by BLM:
· 70 percent of predisturbance cover
· 90 percent dominate species *

· Erosion features equal to or less than surrounding area
* The vegetation will consist of species included in the seed mix and/or occurring in the

surrounding natural vegetation.
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FINAL RESTORATION (P & A - Removal of equipment)
A) Flowlines on location will be removed before site reclamation and all flowlines between

the wellsite and production facilities will remain in place and will be filled with water.
B) If necessary to ensure timely revegetation, the pad will be fenced to BLM standards to

exclude livestock grazing for the first two growing seasons or until seeded species
become firmly established, whichever comes later. Fencing will meet standards found on
page 18 of the Gold Book, 4* Edition, or will be fenced with operational electric fencing.

C) Revegetation will be accomplished by planting mixed grasses as specified below.
Revegetation is recommended for road area as well as around production site.

* D) A proposed seed mixture for this location in Pinyon/ Juniper habitat is:
Indian ricegrass (Nezpar) Achnatherum hymenoides 2.0
Needle and thread grass Stipa Comata 2.0
Western wheatgrass Pascopyrum smithii 2.0

Gooseberryleaf globemallow Sphaeralcea grossulariifolia 0.5
Palmer penstemon (Cedar) Penstemon palmeri 0.5

Birchleaf mountain mahogany Cercocarpus montanus 1.0
Antelope bitterbrush Purshia Tridentata 1.0
Fourwing saltbush Atriplex canescens B

10.0
E) Initial seedbed preparation will consist of backfilling, leveling, and ripping all compacted

areas. Final seedbed preparation will consist of contour cultivating to a depth of 4 to 6
inches within 24 hours prior to seeding. Seeding will be conducted no more than 24 hours
following completion of final seedbed preparation. A certified weed-free seed mix
designed by BLM (shown below) to meet reclamation standards will be used. The seed
mix will be used on all disturbed surfaces including pipelines and road cut & fill slopes.

* F) Distribute topsoil, if any remains, evenly over the location, and seed according to the
above seed mixture. If needed the access road and location shall be ripped or disked prior
to seeding. Perennial vegetation must be established. Additional work shall be required in
case of seeding failures, etc.

G) All disturbed areas, including roads, pipelines, pads, production facilities, and interim
reclaimed areas will be recontoured to the contour existing prior to initial construction or a
contour that blends indistinguishablywith the surrounding landscape. Resalvaged topsoil
will be spread evenly over the entire disturbed site to ensure successful revegetation. To
help mitigate the contrast of recontoured slopes, reclamation will include measures to
feather cleared lines of vegetation and to save and redistribute cleared trees, woody debris,
and large rocks over recontoured cut and fill slopes.

H) BLM will not release the operator's bond until the area has been successfully reclaimed
(evaluation will be made after the first growing season) to the standards of the surface
owner or surface management agency.

I) An above-round tubular metal dry-hole marker will be erected over the drill-hole upon
cessation of drilling and/or testing operations. The marker will be inscribed with the
operator's name, well number, well location, and federal lease number. Upon request of
the surface owner, the casing may be cut off three (3) feet below reclaimed ground
surface (or below plow depth) with a metal plate affixed to the top providing the same
well information as stated above. This must consist of a piece of pipe not less than four
inches in diameter and ten fee in length, of which four feet shall be above the general
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ground level and the remainder being imbedded in cement. The tope of the pipe must be
closed by a welded or screw cap, cement or other means.

J) The Area Manager, Bureau of Land Management, Price Field Office, will be contacted if
there are any questions concerning the above rehabilitation stipulations (435) 636-3600 is
the BLM contact for this location. All rehabilitation work, including seeding, will be
completed by a certified contractor if the well is a dry hole.

11) SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Surface Owner

Drillsite/Access
Bureau of Land Management Sec. 8 and Sec. 5
Price Field Office
125 South 600 West
Price, UT 84501 Phone: 435-636-3600

12) GENERAL INFORMATION
A) The project area is situated within the Colorado Plateau physiograhic province, in the

lowlands that encircle the northern edge of the San Rafael Swell. The Price River
drainage (Castle Valley) is located to the west and south of the project area; the Coal
Creek drainage is located to the east of the project area, and confluences with the Price
River south of the project area near the town of Wellington.

B) Topographic and geologic features - poorly bedded mixture of silt, sand, pebbles, cobbles,
and boulders derived from adjacent uplands formed by the Book Cliffs.

C) Soil characteristics - clay loam.
D) Flora consists of: Juniper, Pinyon pine, Morman tea, Mountain mahogany, Rubber

rabbitbrush, Broom snakeweed (Matchbrush), Crested wheatgrass and Cheatgrass.
E) Fauna - none observed. Typically present: deer, elk, antelope, coyotes, rabbits, birds, and

rodents.
F) Concurrent surface use - grazing and hunting.
G) Mineral Lessor - Bureau of Land Management

Price Field Office
125 South 600 West
Price, UT 84501 Phone: 435-636-3600

H) Proximity of water, occupied dwellings or other features: ±700' west of unnamed
intermittent drainage.

I) Archaeological, cultural and historical information to be contained in a report sent under
separate cover by SWCA Environmental Consultants.

J) Construction activity shall not be conducted using frozen or saturated solid material or
during periods when significant watershed damage (e.g. rutting, extensive sheet soil
erosion, formation of rills/gullies, etc.) is likely to occur.

K) The operator shall be responsible for the prevention and suppression of fires on public
lands caused by its employees, contractors or sub-contractors. During conditions of
extreme fire danger, surface use operations may be limited or suspended in specific areas.

L) Unless otherwise exempted, free and unrestricted public access shall be maintained on the
lease and associated rights-of-way.

M) Facilities approved by the Application for Permit to Drill that are no longer included
within the lease, due to a change in the lease or unit boundary, shall be authorized with a
right-of-way.
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N) Historic, Cultural, and Paleontological Resources
The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might
further disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within five (5)
working days the AO will inform the operator as to:
- whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic Places;
- the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before the site can

be used (assuming in site preservation is not necessary); and,
- a timeframe for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36 CFR 800.11 to

confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the finds of the AO are
correct and that mitigation is appropriate.

If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the expense of the
mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the AO will assume
responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials may be
required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible fro mitigation costs. The AO will
provide technical and procedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon
verification from the AO that the required mitigation has been completed the operator
will then be allowed to resume construction.
"The holder of this authorization shall immediately bring any paleontological resources
or fossils discovered as a result of operations under this authorization to the attention of
the authorized officer. The holder shall suspend all activities in the vicinity of such
discovery until notified to proceed by the authorized officer. The authorized officer will
evaluate, or will have evaluated, such discoveries not later than five (5) working days
after being notified, and will determine what action shall be taken with respect to such
discoveries. The decision as to the appropriate measures to mitigate adverse effects to
significant paleontological resources will be made by the authorized officer after
consulting with the holder. The holder may be responsible for the cost of any
investigations necessary for the evaluation, and for any mitigative measures."

O) Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP maintains a file, per 29 CFR 1910.1200(g)
containing current Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) for all chemicals, compounds,
and/or substances which are used during the course of construction, drilling, completion,
and production operations for this project. Hazardous materials (substances) which may
be transported across these lands may include drilling mud and cementing products which
are primarily inhalation hazards, fuels (flammable and/or combustible), materials that
may be necessary for well completion/stimulation activities such as flammable or
combustible substances and acids/gels (corrosives). The opportunity for Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) listed Extremely Hazardous Substances
(EHS) at the site is generally limited to proprietary treating chemicals. All hazardous
substances, EHS, and commercial preparations will be handled in an appropriate manner
to minimize the potential for leaks or spills to the environment.
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LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE(S):

Operator
Corporate Office:

Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
1099 186 Street
Denver, CO 80202
(720) 929-6000

Jim Klechner, Vice President, Operations
Reed Scott, General Manager, Rockies
Ann Puchalski, Senior Geologist
Grant Schluender, Drilling Engineer II
Debby Black, Staff Regulatory Analyst **

Field Office:
60 South 700 East, Unit #1
Price, UT 84501
(435) 637-3044

Jim Hartley, Production Superintendent

** Contact with any questions regarding this application

CERTIFICATION:

I hereby certify that Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP and its contractors and sub-contractors are
responsible for the operations conducted under this application subject to the terms and conditions of the
mineral lease. Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being provided by
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP under their nationwide bond, BLM Bond No. WYBOOO291.

I hereby certify that I, or someone under my direct supervision, have inspected the drill site and access route
proposed herein; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that I have full knowledge of
the State and Federal laws applicable to this operation; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best
of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed in conformity with this APD package and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. I
also certify that I, or the company I represent, am responsible for operations conducted under this
application. These statements are subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of false
statements.

"
Debby J. Blac
Staff Regulatory Analyst
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Kerr-McGeeOil & GasOnshoreLP
WELLINGTON FEDERAL #31-8
SECTION 8, Tl4S, R11E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION FROM
PRICE, UTAH APPROXIMATELY 1.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTIONOF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHEAST;TURN LEFT AND PROCEED
IN A NORTHEASTERLY, THEN EASTERLY, THEN NORTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 5.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN AN
EASTERLY, THEN NORTHEASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN
NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.9 MILES TO THE
BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD FOR THE #33-5 TO THE
SOUTH; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 200' TO THE BEGINNINGOF THE PROPOSEDACCESS FOR
THE #11-08 TO THE SOUTHWEST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A
SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES TO THE
BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS TO THE SOUTHEAST; FOLLOW
ROAD FLAGS IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3
MILESTO THE PROPOSED LOCATION

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM PRICE, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATIONIS APPROXIMATELY8.6
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Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
WELLINGTON FEDERAL #31-8

LOCATED IN CARBON COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 8, T14S, R11E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTos 02 13 06 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 DNT ^Y YE^¤

swa ik 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:GO. DRAWNBY:B.C.
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EXISTING FENCE

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 1,744' +/-

LEGEND: Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N WELLINGTON FEDERAL #31-8

------ EXISTINGPIPELINE SECTION 8, T14S, R11E, S.L.B.&M.------.------ PROPOSED PIPELINE
11 11 it EXISTING FENCE 405' FNL 1814' FEL
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Surveying T iÏÏÏfÏFR A PH I c 02 13 685 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P TH DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1" = 1000' DRAWNBY:B.C.



APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/04/2008 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-007-31388

WELL NAME: WELLINGTON FED 31-08

OPERATOR: KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ( N2995 ) PHONE NUMBER: 720-929-6000

CONTACT: DEBBY BLACK

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

NWNE 08 140S 110E - -Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0405 FNL 1814 FEL

BOTTOM: 0405 FNL 1814 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: CARBON Geology
LATITUDE: 39.62957 LONGITUDE: -110.7082

UTM SURF EASTINGS:525047 NORTHINGS: 4386475 Surface

FIELD NAME: HELPER ( 18 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTUO73409 PROPOSED FORMATION: FRSD

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: . LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond:Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] .Unit:
(No. RLBOO5238 )

Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No.AIR DRILLE ) /* Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No: cÛ¶/(Date• ) Eff Date: ggg go
Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: 4gó yy a dri µ f 9)nfr r

Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:
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26 25 30 19 28 27

OPERATOR: XTO ENERGY INC (N2615)
UTAH

SEC: 8,18 T.14S R.11E DNR
FIELD: HELPER (18)

COUNTY: CARBON

Wells Status
CAUSE: 241-04 / 9-26-2000 | GAS INJECTION

g GASSTORAGE OIL,GAS&MINING
LOCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION NField Status Unit Status PLUGGED & ABANDONED

ABANDONED EXPLORATORY PRODUCING GAS
ACTIVE GAS STORAGE PRODUCING OIL

NF PP OIL 4 SHUT-IN GASCOMBINED NF SECONDARY
÷ SHUT-IN OIL W E

INACTIVE PENDING
)s( TEMP. ABANDONED

PROPOSED POG
S o TEST WELL

RM N TED PP GEOTHERML & WATER INJECTION S
PP OIL g WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
SECONDARY WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 9-APRIL-2008[¯¯]TERMINATED



statAfUtah A
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JA
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
DivisionDirector

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

April 9, 2008

Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP
1099 18th St.
Denver, CO 80202

Re: Wellington Federal 31-08 Well, 405' FNL, 1814' FEL, NW NE, Sec. 8, T. 14 South,
R. 11 East, Carbon County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-007-31388.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Carbon County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Moab Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801,Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wmeogm.utaltgov OIL, GAS &



O O
Operator: Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP

Well Name & Number Wellington Federal 31-08

API Number: 43-007-31388
Lease: UTUO73409

Location: NW NE Sec._8_ T. 14 South R. 11 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division with 24 hours of spudding the well.

• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 office (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTUO73409
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS N/A
7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT NAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existingwellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or to N/Adrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CBM 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

Wellington Federal 31-08
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP 4300731388

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1099 18th St. Ste 1800 ciTY Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (720) 929-6832 Ferron

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 405' FNL, 1814' FEL LAT:39.629606 LONG:110.708892 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 8 14S 11E STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

2 SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Spud
11/1/2008 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Wellington Federal 31-08 was Spud 11/01/2008 11:00 (Rig: Pense Brothers 18)

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Cindy B. Vue TITLE Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE 11/3/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

(5/2000) (See Instructons on Reverse Side)
NOYO4 2008

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP Operator Account Number: N 2995

Address: 1099 18th St. Ste 1800

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (720) 929-6832

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4300731388 Wellington Federal 31-08 NWNE 8 14S 11E Carbon

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 11/1/2008
Comments:

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for newwell (single well only) Cindy B. Vue

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Name Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new tity Sig
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) e CEIVED Regulatory Analyst 11/3/2008

Title DateNOVO4 2008(5/2000)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTUO73409

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or t° N/Adrillhorizontat laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OlL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CBM .Wellington Federal 31-08

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Kerr-McGee Oil &Gas Onshore LP 4300731388

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1099 18th St. Ste 1800 C TY Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (720) 929-6832 Ferron
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 405' FNL, 1814' FEL LAT:39.629606 LONG: 110.708892 , COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 8 14S 11E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Rig Released
11/4/2008 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATIQN

12- DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well has been drilled to TD of 2452'
Well has been logged, evaluated and casing has been set
DrillRig Pense Brothers 18 was released 11/4/2008 07:00.

Currently preparing well for Completion. DrillingSummary willbe attached with Completion Form. Thank you.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) ndy B. Vue TITLE Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE 11/10/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) NOy12 2008

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



UNITED STATES o°M
N 1

3D1

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires:July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 Lease Serial No.

Refer toAttached Spreadsheet
SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS 6 If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this forrn for proposals to drill or to re-enter an N/A
abandonedwell. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

il Well Gas Well Other eFe
e ( )

2. Name of Operator 9. API WellNoKerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP 43007313g
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area

099 18tLstreetuite 1800
720-929-6832 Ferron

4. Locatiori of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or SurveyDescription) 11. Country or Parish, State
CARBON, UT

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon Change Class of
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal Cement

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports rnust be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiplecompletion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Due to the lack of regional availability of Class "C" cement, Class "G" was used as a subsequent replacement for all Cardinal Draw wells operated by Kerr-
McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP (Please see attached spreadsheet of wells this applies to) . This blend provides more compressive strength and is thus a
better engineered blend.

Each well's cornpletion report will detail the amount used per well. Thank you.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)
Cindy B. Vue

Title Regulatory Analyst

Signature Date 11/17/2008

Approvedb

TH CE FOR FEDERALr R ST O CE USE

r>ate
Õ6ÃdÏtÏonsiÏpEovaÏa are attacne Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify ederaAppf0Val M
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office 4000018N606SSRyentitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 Ú.S.C Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departn f d States any false,
fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructionson page 2)

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
Cardinal Draw 2008 Program

Change to Class G Cement

Subsequent SundryNotice:

Due to the lack of regional availability of Class "C" cement, Class "G" was used as
a subsequent replacement for ali Cardinal Draw wells operated by Kerr-McGee Oil
& Gas Onshore LP (Please see attached spreadsheet of wells this applies to) . This
blend provides more compressive strength and is thus a better engineered blend.

Each well's completion report will detail the amount used per well. Thank you.

WELL NAME
Wellington Federal 32-24 3 Ö3 S\b 3
Wellington Federal 12-24 1-hiò93
Wellington Federal 23-24 't 38€
Wellington Federal 44-24 VM 2Ñ \
Wellington Federal 43-13 4 (p - M3 1
Wellington Federal 42-13 4 Q~b \
Wellington Federal 11-18 4 (73
Wellington Federal 11-19 4
Wellington Federal 24-07 4
Wellington Federal 44-18 A?yC
Wellington Federal 22-07 43 O(y b 51
Wellington Federal 23:18 ¿p OUT 2A \
Wellington Federal 31-18 4 CO~LM
Wellington Federal 31-14 QA 003 . 6
Wellington Federal 21-14 43 901 b
Wellington Federal 31-08 46 .009 y b
Wellington Federal 34-14 43 : COT 3
Wellington Federal 11-09 4 00
Wellington Federal 41-09 4 - O
Wellington Federal 23-14 4 Q
Wellington Federal 11-12 43 11



UNITED STATES O
N 1

3D7

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

UTUO73409
SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to driH or to re-enter an N/A
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
N/A1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other enn
e er 31-08

2. Name of O rator 9. API Well No.Kerr-McGee il &Gas Onshore LP 43-007-31388

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
1Do ir

co
aos 1800

720-929-6832 . Ferron

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or Survey Descnption) 11. Country or Parish, State
NWNE LOT 2 SEC 8-T14S-R11E
405' FNL, 1814' FEL LAT:39.629606 LONG: 110.708892 CARBON, UT

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug andAbandon Temporarily Abandon

Final AbandonmentNotice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any þroposedwork and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and truevertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Wellington Federal 31-08 had its first Water Production of 207 bwpd on 12/01/2008 and
first Gas production of 176 mcfdon 12/01/2008.

Attached is the current wellbore diagram and the Wellsite Security Diagram. Thank you.

14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)
Cindy B. Vue

Title REGULATORY ANALYST

Signature Date 12/03/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by

fitle Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approvalof this notice doesnot warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legalor equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and will ly ake to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction FCEIVED
(Instructions on page 2)

DECO8 2008
DIV.0FOILGARA



OPERATOR Kerr-McGee Oil&Gas Onshore LP Updated: 12/3/08
WELLNAME WellingtonFederal Wellmgton Federal 41-25
Well Number 41-25 SWD Surface Casinq Cementinq
LEGAL 1031' FNL and 937' FWL Hole 17-1/2"
SS-TWN-RNG NENE Sec 25 T14S R10E Casing Size 13-3/8"
COUNTY& STATE Carbon UT 1bs/ft H-40/48# Class G, 22bbis back to surface
FIELD Cardinal Draw depth set 260'
RESERVOIR Navajo-Wingate Sks cmt 315
APl # 43-007-31374
WINS #
K.B. ELEV. 5,604
GROUND LEVEL 5591
TD: 5215'
PBTD:
LONGITU0E 110.7434 Kickoffpoint @823'
LATITUDE 39.583336 Cement plug @790'-1390'
Lease # UTU73409
Unit#
AFE#

WELL HISTORY
DATE ACTION

10/8/08 Spud Well
11/28/08 TD'd Well
11/29/08 Run Logs Fish @ 1424'

Description: Length 364'
1 jt of 10-3/4" washpipe and shoe
1jtof4"DP
2' Sub, 278' of drillcollars 9 jts,
5' sub, 1drillcollar30', 3' sub, and 7 bit

Kickoffpoint @ 1770'

Cmt plug @1740'-2148'

Fish @2148'
Description: Bullnose sub 2' long 6-1/2" OD

Intermediate Casinq Cementing
Hole Size 12-1/2"
Casing Size 9-5/8"
Depth Set 2174, No cement returnsto surface.

Ibs/It H-40/32.3#
sks cmt 711

ProductionCasing CementinqRECEIVl"D HoleSize 8-3/4"
Casing Size 7"
De th Set 5204 5 bbis retumed to pitDECO8 2018 Ibs/ft J55/23#



Wellsite Security Diagram
Wellington Federal 31-8

X-FORMER PUMP UNIT

O
ELL HEAD

METER HOUSE

Wellington Federal 31-8
API # 43-007-31388
NWNE Lot2 Sec 8-T14S-RllE
405' FNL, 1814' FEL
Lat: 39.629606 Long: 110.708892
Carbon County, Utah

RECEIVED
DECO8 2008

DN,0F0\L,0AS&



Form 3160-4
(August 2007)

UNITED STATES
FORMAPPROVEDDEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31, 2010

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
UTUO73409

la. Type of Well
__

Oil Well Gas Well Dry Ü Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: 2 New Well Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff. Resvr., N/A

Other: AUnitor CA Agreement Name and No.

2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP WellingtonFederal 31-08
3. AddreSS 1099 18th St Ste 1800 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. AFI Well No.

Denver, CO 80202 720-929-6832 43-007-31388
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory

NWNE LOT 2 SEC 08 T14S-R11E Ferron
At surface 405' FNL, 1814' FEL LAT:39.629606 LONG: 110.708892 11. Sec., T., R., M., on Block and

Survey or Area SEC S T148-R11E

SAME
At top prod. interval reported below 12. County or Parish 13. State

Attotaldepth SAME Carbon UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 12/01/2008 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
11/01/2008 11/04/2008

[¯|D
& A Ready to Prod. 6129' RKB

18. Total Depth: MD 2452' 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 2365' 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD
TVD TVD TVD

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? No Yes (Submit analysis)

GR, DEhlAITY NFI ITRAN. RFRIRTMTY, CBL with GR/CCLIVDL S Ò¡ þ¾ Was DST run? No Yes (Submit report)
Directional Survey7 No Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cemhenter No f SCkem
nt

Sluæg Vol Cement Top* Amount Pulled

11" 8-5/8"/J-55 24# O' 260' 140 Ms C) 30 O' N/A
9.875" 5-1/2"li-55 15.5# O' 2413 5 5 3 g O' N/A

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-7/8" 2240'
25. Producing Intervals 26. PerforationRecord

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) Ferron 2076' 2202' 2076'-2088' .39" 4 SPF OPEN

2102'-2106' .39" 12 SPF OPEN
C) 2119'-2142' .39" 4 SPF OPEN
D) 2196'-2202' .39" 12 SPF OPEN
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

2076'-2202' STIMULATE11/08/2008 W/ 3135 BBLS TREATED WATER AND 185,521# SAND

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Date Hours Test Dil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

12/01/08 12/1/08 24 0 178 207
Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio PGW

0 176 207
28a. Production - Interval B
Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24 Hr Dil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size FSIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio RECEIVED

*(See instructions and spaces for additional data on page 2) 96(
DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



28b. Production - Interval C
Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval D
Date First Test Date Hours fest Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Tested Productíon BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Solid, used forfuel,vented, etc.)

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests,
including depth interval tested,cushion used, timetool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and
recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth

FERRON 2011'

TUNUCKSHALE 2318'

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procecure):

DRILLING AND COMPLETION OPERATION SUMMARY REPORTS ARE ATTACHED. THANK YOU.

33. Indicate which itemshave been attached by placing a check in the appropriate boxes:

Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) Geologic Report DST Report Directional Survey

O Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification Core Analysis Other:

34. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please pri t CINDY B VUE
, Title REGULATORY ANALYST

Signature Date 12/11/2008

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Continued on page 3) (Form 3160-4, page



ROCKIES

Operation Summary Report
Well: WELLINGTON FEDERAL 31-08

Project: UTAH Site: CARBON Rig Name No: PENSE BROTHERS 18/18

Event: DRILLING Start Date: 11/1/2008 End Date: 11/4/2008 Spud Date: 11/1/2008
Active Datum: RKB @6,129.00ft(above Mean Sea UWl:0/14/S/11/El8/0/NWNE/6/PMIN/405.00/E/0/1,814.00/0/0
Level)

Date Time Duration Phase Code (Subco PIU MDFrom Operation
Start-End (br) j de2 (ft)

4/29/2008 - EVALPR 46 P PREFABED WELLHEAD TO METERHOUSE,
PIPE ANDMATERIALS.METERHOUSE
EQUIPMENT.

- EVALPR 46 P PLUMB DRAIN ANDRE-ROUTE VENTS ON
METER HOUSE.

EVALPR 46 F P SURVEYLOCATION;ENVIRONMENTAL
SURVEYS,REPORTS, SERVICES;
REGULATORY PERMITS;LAND CONTRACTS

11/1/2008 0:01 - 7:00 6.98 DRLSUR 12 D P WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
7:00 - 11:00 4.00 MIRU 01 B P FINISH RIG MOVE,RU
11:00 - 15:00 4.00 DRLCON 02 A P DRILL & SET 40' 13 3/8" CONDUCTOR CSG
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 MIRU 01 B P RIG UP TO DRILL SURFACE HOLE
15:30 - 21:30 6.00 PRPSPD 07 A P ATTEMPTED TO REPAIR,CHANGED OUT AIR

HAMMER
21:30 - 23:00 1.50 DRLSUR 02 A P DRILL 11" HOLE FOR SURFACETD @265'
23:00 - 23:59 0.98 DRLSUR 11 B P RUN 259' 8 5/8" 24#, JS5, ST&C,TIME CHANGE

INCLUDED, ADDED 1 HOUR TO RUN TIME,
LANDED@0100, WITH TIME CHANGE.

11/2/2008 0:01 - 0:59 0.97 DRLSUR 11 B P FINISH RUNNING 8 5/8" CSG, LANDAT 260'
1:00 - 1:30 0.50 CSG 15 A P RIG UP CEMENTERS&SAFETYMEETING
1:30 - 2:15 0.75 RDMO 15 P PRESSURE TEST TO 2000PSI,FILL HOLE,

BREAK CIRC, DROP BALL,PUMP 140 SKS, 30
BBLS15.6# TYPE0-1-O-G2% CACL, 1/4LBISK
CELLOFLAKE, 1/4LBlŠK CFL-3, MAXPUMPING
PS1100, DROP PLUG,DISPLACE WlTH 13.7 BBL
FRESH WATER, FULL RETURNS,12 BBLSA TO
PIT.BUMPPLUG @0215 HRS @600PSI , SMALL
LEAK OFF, REPRESSURED TO 500PSI SHUT
VALVE . FLUSH LINES& BOP STACK RIG DOWN

2:15 - 3:00 0.75 CSG 15 A P FLUSH LINES &BOP STACK, RIG DOWN
CEMENTERS

3:00 - 6:30 3.50 CSG 12 B P WAIT ON CEMENT
6:30 - 8:30 2.00 CSG 13 A P CUT OFF 8 5/8" CSG, WELD ON CSG HEAD
8:30 - 12:00 3.50 CSG 18 A P NIPPLE UP, TO DRILL
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 CSG 13 A P CHANGE OUT ANNULAR BAG,WEATHERFORD
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 CSG 13 C P PRESSURE TEST BOP STACK&CHOKE

MANIFOLD
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 CSG 18 A P PU BHA,
17:00 - 23:59 6.98 CSG 02 A P DRILL OUT TAG@217 DEPTH @2400 HRS

1610'
11/3/2008 0:00 - 11:30 11.50 DRLPRO 02 A P CONT DRILLINGF/1600' T/2452 TD,'90 RPM

ON TOP DRIVE, 3230 CFM AIR PSI ON AIR
PACKAGE75 FPH

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 DRLPRO 04 A P CLEAN HOLE
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 DRLPRO 04 A P FILL HOLE W1WATER
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 DRLPRO 05 A P TOOH, LD/DP, BHA & BIT TO RUNOPEN HOLE

LOGS
14:30 - 17:30 3.00 DRLPRO 07 A S REPAIR HYDRAULICSON CARRIER
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 DRLPRO 05 A P CONTTOOH, LD/DPBHA, HAMMER&BIT
19:00 - 22:30 3.50 DRLPRO 08 F P RU HALLIBURTON &RUN OPEN HOLE LOGS TO

2452' LOGGERS TD.

12/11/2008 2:15:58PM



ROCKIES

Operation Summary Report
Well:WELLINGTON FEDERAL 31-08

Project: UTAH Site: CARBON Rig Name No: PENSE BROTHERS 18/18

Event: DRILLING Start Date: 11/1/2008 End Date: 11/4/2008 Spud Date: 11/1/2008
Active Datum: RKB @6,129.00ft(above Mean Sea UWI: 0/14/S/11/E/8/0/NWNE/6/PMIN/405.00/E/0/1,814.00/0/0
Level)

22:30 - 0:00 1.50 DRLPRO 11 B RU & RUN 56 JOINTS OF T' PRODUCTION CSG
TI 2418'

11/4/2008 0:00 - 3:00 3.00 PROD 11 B P CONT RUNNING56 JTS, 7" PRODUCTION CSG
TO 2418'

3:00 - 5:00 2.00 PROD 15 P RU &CMTCSG &WELL BORE WI SANJEL
PESSURE TEST TO2000, FILL CSG & BREAK
CIR, PUMP 10 BBL SCAVENGER, PUMP 84.2
BBL LEAD, DROP PLUG, DISPLACEWITH 50.5
BBL FRESH WATER,BUMP PLUG @500 OVER
1200 PSI. FLUSH BOP STACK,RIG DOWN

5:00 - 7:00 2.00 PROD 13 A P ND SET SLIPS @48K,RELEASE RIG @0700
HRS

12/11/2008 2:15:58PM



ROCKlES

Operation Summary Report
Well: WELLINGTONFEDERAL 31-08

Project: UTAH Site: CARBON Rig Name No:

Event: COMPLETION Start Date: 11/6/2008 End Date: 11/25/2008 Spud Date: 11/1/2008
Active Datum: RKB @6,129.00ft(above Mean Sea UWl: Ol14/S/11/El8/0/NWNE/6/PMIN/405.00/E/0/1,814.00/0/0
Level)

Date Time Duration Phase Code Subco P/U MDFrom Operation
Start-End (hr) de2 (ft)

11/6/2008 - COMP 37 P MIRU PHOENIX WIRELINE; RIHW/ GUAGERING
&JUNK BASKET,POOH; RIH WI LOGGING
TOOLS, LOG WELL, POOH; PBTD@2,365'; RIH
PERF GUNS; SHOT PERFS @2,076'-2,088'
2,102'-2,106' 2,119'-2,142' 2,196'-2,202'.

11/7/2008 - COMP 36 B P MIRU;HOLD SAFETY MEETING;RU BJ
SERVICES- TEST LINES;PUMP SINGLE STAGE
JOB. BREAKOVER 1,723 PSi; ISIP 936 AVEG
RATE 81 BBL/MIN;5 MINISIP 634 PSI MAX
RATE82 BBL/MIN;10 MIN ISIP 454 PSI AVG
PRESS1,265 PSl;15 MINISIP 299 PSI MAX
PRESSURE 1,289 PSl; RDMO

11/8/2008 7:00 - 17:00 10.00 COMP 30 A P MIRU;R/UPUP AND HAND LINE TO WELL
HEAD, PUMP 130 BBL'S.N/D FRAC VALVE, N/U
KEY'SBOP. R/D FLOOR, R/UTBG EQUIP.P/U
BIT & BIT SUB. RIHW/ TBG,TAG FILL @2,285'.
POOH Wl 8 JTS. SDFN

11/9/2008 7:00 - 17:00 10.00 COMP 30 A P CONTROLWELL RIH W/ TBG; TAG FILL@
2,285'; RIUTBG SWlVEL , PUMP 700 BBL'S,
UNABLE TO BREAK CIRC. POOH WI TBG, BIT &
BIT SUB. P/U BAILER BHA, 10 JTS TBG, RBS
BAILER. RIH WI TBG, TAG FILL @2,285' CIOTO
2,351'. POOH C/O CAVITY. RIH WI BAILER.TAG
FILL @2,351 C/O TO PBTD @2,365'. POOH L/D
TAGJTS. POOH LD BAILER, C/O CAVITY LD
BHA. PREP TO TALLYTBG & BHA. SDFN

11/10/2008 - RDMO 47 P FINAL REPORT
7:00 - COMP 30 A P CONTROL WELL;PIUTBG, SET TAC; R/D TBG

EQUIP. NID KEY'SBOP; EOT @2,240.36; PBTD
@2,365'. TBG LANDED ON KTH FLANGE WI
20,000# TENSIONON TBG'S N/U FLOW LINES.
FLUSHTBGW120 BBL'S.PIU NEW PUMP &
RODS. FILLAND STROKE TEST PUMP @1,000
PSI, GOOD, NO LEAKS.RU UNIT. RDMO

11/25/2008 - COMP P MOVE IN DOZER& BLADE; CLOSE DRILLING
PIT. CONNTOUR LOCATION &RESEED.
GRAVEL LOCATION.

12/11/2008 2:16:34PM



O
UNITED STATES o°,"N 3D7

"" DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires. July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

See Spreadsheet
SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ONWELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Do not use this form for proposals to drlII or to re-enter an n/a
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
nla

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other CBM È I goZeer (See Spreadsheet)
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
Kerr-McGeeOil &Gas Onshore LP See Spreadsheet Ô- ð O 7 - 3/
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10.Field and Pool or Exploratory Area

een
gir

CO 80 2 Cindy.Vue@anadarko.com 720-929-6832 Ferron

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or SurveyDescription) 11. Country or Parish, State
See Spreadsheet Carbon County, Utah

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES)TO INDICATENATUlŒ OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Producdon (StadResume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation WeH Integrhy

SubsequentReport. Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other

O ChangePlans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon Site Drawing

O Final Abandonment Notice O Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated starting dateof any proposed work and approximateduration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Kerr-McGee respectfullysubmits the followingsite drawing for recordon thefollowing19 wellson attached spreadsheet. Thank you.

RECEIVED i

FEBO9 2009

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MlNING

14. I herebycertify that the foregoingis true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)
Cindy B. Vue

Title Regulatory Analyst

Signature Date 02/05/2009

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by

fitle Date
Conditions of approval, if any,are attached. Approval of this noticedoesnot warrant or certify
thatthe applicant holds legal or equitable titleto thoserights in the subject lease which would Office
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C.Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



Kerr-McGee respectfully submits the following site drawing for record on the following
19 wells. Thank you.

Well API Lease No.
Wellington Federal 23-24 43-007-31382 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 12-24 43-007-31392 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 32-24 43-007-31383 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 44-24 43-007-31384 UTUO73409
WellingtonFederal 43-13 43-007-31377 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 42-13 43-007-31376 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 24-7 43-007-31379 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 22-7 43-007-31378 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 31-8 43-007-31388 UTUO73409
Wellington Federal 11-9 43-007-31387 UTUO80560
WellingtonFederal 41-9 43-007-31386 UTUO80560
Wellington Federal 11-19 43-007-31385 UTUO80563
Wellington Federal 11-18 43-007-31380 UTUO80563
WellingtonFederal 44-18 43-007-31390 UTUO80563
Wellington Federal 23-18 43-007-31391 UTUO80563
WellingtonFederal 31-18 43-007-31389 UTUO80563
Wellington Federal 21-14 43-007-31373 UTUO81694
Wellington Federal 31-14 43-007-31371 UTUO81694
Wellington Federal 11-12 43-007-31381



Wellsite Facility Diagram
Carbon County

Utah
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