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Marion Energy Inc.

August 23, 2006

Utah Divisionof OilGas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Exceptional Location Letter (Rule R649-3-3) Exception to Location and Siting ofWells
KenilworthRail Road SWD #1 (304.71ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL/ SE/4 S16 13S-10E)
Helper Prospect, 13S-10E, Carbon County,Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

The KenilworthRail Road SWD #1 well is tobe drilledas a Salt Water Disposal well in whichMarion ,

Energy Inc. willdispose of its produced water in the Navajo and Wingate formations at depths of 8143ft
and 8606ft respectively.

Marion Energy Inc. respectfullyseeks your permission and requests thatthiswellis drilledat the
aforementionedexceptionallocation due tothefollowingreasons:

1. The wellwillbe directionally drilledjustsouth ofour existingKenilworthRailroad #1 location which
enables Marion Energy Inc. tominimizeany further environmentalimpacts tothearea which would
arise from buildingfurther access roads as allaccess tothislocation has been established.

2. MarionEnergy Inc. also seeks your permission todrillthiswell at theaforementionedlocation due to
thetopographicalissues encountered and the limitingspatial restraints we experiencewhen drilling
in and around topographicallychallengingareas such as this.

3. Marion Energy Inc. is theonlyoperator in thearea, and thereare no additionalownerswithin460ft
ofthe proposed location.

Ifyou requireany further information, please do not hesitate tocontactme at (972) 540-2967 ext. 3004
or emailbevans@marionenergy.com

Sc

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

119 SouthTennessee, Suite 200, McKinney,TX, 75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967

Fax: (972)
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August 24, 2006

Utah Divisionof OilGas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Marion Energy Inc. Application for Permit to Drill(KenilworthRailRoad #1 SWD)
Helper Prospect, 138-10E, Carbon County,Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Please find enclosed twocopies of theADP thatpertains tothe KenilworthRail Road #1 SWD, which is
going tobe permitted and drilled as a producedwater disposal wellat our Helperprospect located in
13S-10E Carbon County Utah.

Ifyou requireany further information, please do not hesitate tocontactme at (972) 540-2967 ext. 3004
or emailbevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

ED
AU625 2006

DIV F DiL,GAS&MINING

119 SouthTennessee, Suite200, McKinney,TX, 75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967

Fax:(972)
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT
(highlightchanges)

5. MINERALLEASE NO 8. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL FEE-BH-61504 Fee

1A. TYPE OF WORK; DRILL RE ENTER DEEPEN 7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME;

B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SWD SINGLEZONE O MULTIPLEZONE
8. UNfror CA AGREEMENTNAME:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc KenilworthRailroad #1 SWD
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBERp op 10. FIELDANDPOOL OR WILDCA :

119 So. Tennessee aiv McKinney TX , 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11.MERR TARSECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE; 304.71ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE
--) { {). () SWSE 16 13S 10E

AT PROPOSED PRODUCNGZONE: 304.71ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approx 1/4 ofa mile East of the townof Kenilworth Carbon UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRESIN LEASE: 17. NJMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

304.71ft 3000 40
18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRILLING,COMPLETED,OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

Approx 230ft 8,803 BOO1617(See attached)
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, OR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEVORK WILLSTART: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATlON:

6570' 9/1/2006 30 Days

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND VEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENTTYPE. QUANTITY,YlELD,AND SLURRYWEIGHT

17 1/2" 13 3/8" J-55 61# 500 Premium Plus III 437 sx 1.41 cuft/sk 14.20 ppg
12 1/4" 8 5/8" J-55 32# 4,450 Lead: Prem. Lite 728 SX 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg

DD Tail:50/50 Poz 307 SX 1.41 cuft/sk 14.20 ppg
7 7/8" 5 1/2" N-80 17# 8,803 Lead: Prem. Lite 262 SX 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg

As Liner Tail:50/50 Poz 215 SX 1.41 cuft/sk 14.20 ppg

25. ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWNG ARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITH THE UTAHOILAND GAS CONSERVATIONGENERAL RULES:

WELL PLATOR MAPPREPARED BYLICENSED SURVEYOROR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

O EVIDENCEOF DMSION OF WATERRIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Benjamin Evans
-- TITLE Landman

SIGNATURE DATE 8/15/2006
approvedbyUa

(This space for State use only) Utah DIVISIOn Of

Oil,Gas and Mining RECElVED
API NUMBERASSIGNED APPROVAL: A 6 2 5
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n i Location:KŒn € ŒSL The well locotion was determined using a Trimble 5700
GPS survey grade unit.

Basis of Bearing:
The Basis of Bearing is GPS Measured.

GLO Bearing:
The Bearings inaicated are per the recorded plot obtained
from the U.S. Land Office.

Basis of Elevation:
Basis of ETevation of 6561' being at the Southwest Section
Corner of Section 16, Township 13 South, Ronge 10 East,
Salt Lake Base and Meridian, as shown on the Helper
Quadrongle 7.5 minute series map.

Description of Location·
Proposed Drill Hole located in the SW/4 SE/4 of Section 16,
T13S, R10E, S.L.B.&M., being 304.71' North and 1315.25' West
from the Southwest Section Corner of Section 16, T13S, R10E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridion.

Surveyor's Certi ficate:
I, Albert J. Spensko, a Registered Professional Land Surveyor,
holding Certificate 146652 State of Utah, do hereby certify thatthe information on this drawing is a true and accurate survey
based on data of record and was conducted under my personaldirection and supervision as shown hereon.

Lu o 8852
UTM âge y n,ggg* TALON RESOURCES, INC.

195North100WestP.O.Box1230
1315.25' -

E OF
Phoneg35)6875310 Fuß35)68'14311

KENILWORTH FÆsitalomeety.net
LEv: 6561.0. RAILROAD #I SWD

ELEv: 6570.0
|S88°l6'02"E

- 5205 Marion Energy Inc.
Legend

Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWDO Drill Hole Location NOTES:
SecNon 16, T13S, R10E S.LB.&M.1. UTM and Latitude / Longitude Coordinates '

Metal Cap (Found) are derived usina a GPS Pathfinder and are Carbon County, Utah
shown in NAD 27 Datum. om.n su cm ey

Brass Cap (Searched for, but not found) N. BUTKOVICH L.W.J./A.J.S.
^ GRAPHIC SCAŒ Drawing Na DataCalculated Corner LAT / LONG o sor lood A-f 8/23/06
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holding Certificate 146652 State of Utah, do hereby certify thatthe information on this drawing is a true and accurate survey
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Kenilworth Rail Road #1 SWD

Surface Owner Information

Contact: Mr. Nelson L. Kidder

Address: American Electric Power
248 South Lake Drive
Prestonsburg, KY, 41653

Telephone: (606) 889-3328

Fax: (606) 886-1761

Email:
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases

Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the
actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

1. Estimated Tops/Geologic Markers

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Name MD Production Phase
Upper Blue Gate Shale Surface
Emery "equivalent" 1602ft
Lower Blue Gate Shale 2168ft
Ferron 4177ft
Tunuck Shale 4437ft
Entrada 6806ft
Carmel 7437ft
Navajo 8143ft
Wingate 8606ft
TD 8803ft

2. Estimated Depth of Oil, Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Ferron 4177'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling,
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sand will be reported to the BLM in Moab,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water
flows are detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water
analyses
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3. BOP Equipment

Marion Energy Inc's minimum specifications for pressure to control equipment
are as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double, 3000 psi w.p.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approve stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10 minutes or until
requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test plug is utilized, no
bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline is
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered
to have failed. Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of
BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 60 percent of rated working
pressure. Pressure shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of
test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a. when initially installed;
b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c. following related repairs; and
d. at 40-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all
down stream valves open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball
removed.

Annular preventers (if used) shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not
be performed more than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements,
procedures, etc., and individual components shall be operable ads designed.
Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure
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Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.
Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location
while drilling and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.
Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted
before drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in
place. Blowout preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface
casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed or abandoned.
Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report.
Preventers will be pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The Price River Resource Area Office shall be notified, at least 24 hours prior to
initiating the pressure test, in order to have a representative on location during
pressure testing.

a. The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.
Although a rig has not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment
for this depth of hole in the area use a 11", 3000 psi working pressure blowout
preventor.

b. A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is n_(1to
be used as a fill-up line.

c. The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated
operation of hydraulic preventers.

d. Drill string safety valve(s), to fit Q tools in the drill string, are to be
maintained on the rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4. Casing and Cementing Program
a. The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved

to protect and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones,
lost circulation zones, abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively
valuable deposits of minerals. Any isolating medium other than cement shall
receive approval prior to use. The casing setting depth shall be calculated to
position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which will contain the
maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all
relevant factors, including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fractured
gradients; usable water zones; formation pressures; lost circulation zones;
other minerals; or other unusual characteristics. All indications of usable
water shall be
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b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to 0.50 psi
per foot for exploratory wells (lacking better data).

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot
for exploratory wells (lacking better data)

d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in
the hole/casing annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for
justifiedexceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500
psi compressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and
tested used casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

g. The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary
cement jobor by remedial cementing.

h. All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior
to running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested,
whichever occurs first.

i. Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with
a minimum of one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

j. Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement
fluid. A bottom plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush
fluid, inner string cement method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the
cement from contamination by the mud fluid being displaced ahead of the
cement slurry.

k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressured tested to 0.22 psi per
foot of casing string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed
70 percent of the minimum internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10
percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be taken.

On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for 5M
BOPE system or greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be
performed. Formation at the shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud
weight equivalent anticipated to control the formation pressure to the next
casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be performed before
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Purpose Depth Hole Size O.D. Weight Grade Type New or Used
Surface 0-500' 17 1/2" 13 3/8"61# J-55 ST&C New
Intermed. 0-4450' 12 1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 LT&C New
Produc. 0-8803' 7 7/8" 5-1/2" 17# N-80 LT&C New

o. Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

p. Please refer to DOGM Form 3 for the Cement program associated with this
well.

q. The price River Resource Area Office should be notified, with sufficient lead
time, in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all
casing strings and cementing.

r. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand
cemented until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500
psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the driller's log.

s. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days
after the work is completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells", must include complete
information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size,
grade, weight of casing set, hole size, setting depth,
amounts and type of cement used, whether cement
circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing,
depth of cementing tools used, casing test method and
results, and the date work was done. Show the spud
date on the first reports submitted,

b. Temperature of bond logs must be submitted for each
well where the casing cement was not circulated to the
surface.

t. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Kelly cock

2. No bit float is deemed necessary.

3. A sub with a full opening
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5. Mud Program

a. The purpose circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L PH
0-500' Spud Mud
500-4450' LSND 8.8-9.2 32-40 8-15 ---

4450'-T.D. Air/Foam N/A N/A N/A ---

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one
occur.

A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine,
as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level
will be checked visually.

c. Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or
demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in
drilling, testing or completion operations.

6. Evaluation Program

The anticipated type of amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST's are run, the following
requirements will be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours
unless specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the
authorized officer. However, DST's may be allowed to continue at night if
the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized
and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but
tripping shall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from
the authorized officer. Closed chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or
night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either
reversed out of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This
would involve provided some means for reverse
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Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly
installed before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to "run" during
the test shall have spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program will consist of a DIL-SFL-GR-SP and _GR_CAL, CNL-
FDC will be run over selected intervals, which are to be determined. A DIL-
SFL-GR-SP, will be run from Surface to T.D.

c. The anticipated completion program is as follows:

Marion proposes to perforate for produced water disposal the Navajo interval
and depending on indicated permeability of the sand, we will fracture
stimulate the formation if required

1. Anticipated Pressures and H,S

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 2400 psi. Low pressures are anticipated.

b. No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated.

2. Other Information and Notification Requirements

a. Drilling will commence on approximately August 30, 2006

b. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 30 days.

c. No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no
drilling or workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a
suspended status without prior approval of the AO. If operations are to be
suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

d. Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other
unusual occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the
requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

e. If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry
Notice" Form to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all
conditions of this approved plan are applicable during all operations
conducted with the replacement rig.

f. Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer,
produced water may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period
of up to 90 days. During the period so authorized, and application
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approval of the permanent disposal method, along with the required water
analysis and other information must be submitted to the District Engineer.

g. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior
approval of the AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in
emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the SO> A
"Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with the AO
within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This
report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface
restoration. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment
notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative
or the appropriate Surface Managing
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Surface Use Plan

Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD

Thirteen Point Surface Use Plan

1. Existing Roads

a. The proposed well site is located approximately ½ mile east of Kenilworth
Utah and approximately 3 miles east of Helper, Utah..

b. Directions to the location from Helper, Utah are as follows:

Head south from Helper Utah on Highway 6, take exit state highway 139
approx 2 ½ miles south of Helper, turn left (east). Follow SH 139 to 200
West Street. Turn left (north) on 200 West. Follow 200 west to Kenilworth
Rd, turn right on Kenilworth Rd. Kenilworth Rd ends at Main Street. The
Kenilworth Railroad location is directly east of the town of Kenilworth.

c. For location of access roads see Maps A & B.

d. Topo map A is the vicinity map showing the access route from Kenilworth,
Utah.

e. Topo map B shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows
existing roads in the immediate area

f. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all
drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

g. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction
of any Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the
standards of the
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2. Planned Access Roads

a. The access roads to this location are currently in place, as the Kenilworth
Railroad well is to be drilled justsouth of the existing Kenilworth Railroad #1
location. Access to this location and the pad site its self were recently
constructed by Marion Energy.

b. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved
location and approved access route. Any additional area needed will be
approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-MileRadius of the Proposed Location

a. Water wells - non

b. Injection wells - none

c. Producing wells - Please see topo location map L-1

d. Drilling wells - none

e. Shut-in wells - none

f. For reference please see topo map B

4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities

a. All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or
installed (including pump jacks) will be painted a neutral color to blend with
the surrounding environment. The proposed color for this site is Juniper
Green unless otherwise stipulated. Facilities required to comply with the
Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded.

b. If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the wellpad shall be surrounded by a containment dike or
sufficient capacity to contain at a minimum, the entire content of the largest
tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective requirements
are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

c. All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery

d. The water measurement facility will be installed on the well location. The oil
and water meter will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. Tests for
meter accuracy will be conducted monthly for the first three months on new
meter installations and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO will be
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with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future meter
proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be submitted
to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform
with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore
Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

e. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

f. All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be
adhered to.

g. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and
accommodate year-round traffic.

h. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

i. The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept
open and free of debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated
to reduce erosion, fugitive dust, and impacts to adjacent areas.

j. The area used to contain the proposed facilities will be built using native
materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other arrangements will
be made to acquire them from private sources. These facilities will be
constructed using bulldozers, graders, and workman crews to construct and
place the proposed facilities.

5. Location and Water Supply

a. Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River
Water Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and
transported by a local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

b. No water wells are to be drilled.

6. Source of Construction Material

a. Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.

b. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of
production, the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in
by truck from a local gravel pit over existing access roads in the area. No
special access other than for drilling operations and pipeline construction is
needed.

c. The use of materials under will conform with 43 CFR 3610.2.3. Construction
material will not be located on
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d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
The reserve pit will be lined with a minimum 10mil plastic liner.

b. The reserve pit will be constructed of sufficient size and capacity for the
necessary fluids for drilling and to contain any runoff from the drill site. Pits
will not be constructed within intermittent or perennial stream channels.

c. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in
the pit. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents
hauled to a sanitary landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities
shall be promptly removed and disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed
by the company representative.

d. The reserve pit will be constructed in undisturbed material and below the
natural ground level.

e. A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained in the pit at all times during
the drilling operation and the pit will be fenced during drilling and completion
operations.

e. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its
contents removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved
disposal sight.

f. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

g. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system
will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

h. Sewage will be placed in a portable chemical toilet or holding tank and
disposed of in accordance with state and county regulations.

8 Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the
proposed well.

9. Well Site Layout

a. All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life
of the activity. The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well
pads will be rounded. Cut and fill slopes will be constructed as
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Height of Slope Slope
0-5 feet 3:1
6-10 feet 2:1
Over 10 feet 1-1/2:1

b. All fills will be free from vegetative materials and will be compacted in lifts
no greater than 12 inches in thickness to a minimum of 90 percent Proctor dry
density sufficient to prevent excessive settlement.

c. The working surface of the drill site will be surfaced with crushed gravel to a
depth sufficient to support anticipated loads throughout the life of the well.
Usually a depth of 12 inches of gravel is anticipated.

d. A diversion ditch having the minimum dimensions of 3 feet horizontal to 1
foot vertical (3:1 ditch), will be constructed around the site to divert surface
waters from flowing onto the site. The ditch will be located at the base of the
cut slope and around the toe of the fill slopes (see Drawing No. 1 -

Construction Requirements of Typical Well Sites). A straw dike will be
constructed in the ditch outflow to trap any sediment produced from the raw
slopes. A culvert will be necessary where the access road enters the site.

e. A berm will be constructed around the perimeter of the site to contain all
precipitation, spills, and other fluids from leaving the site. The berm will be a
minimum of 18 inches high, 12 inches wide at the top, and having 1-l/2:1 side
slopes. The site surface will be graded to drain to the reserve pit. The
drainage pattern to be constructed will be modified for each site, depending on
the site specific conditions.

f. The reserve pit will be located on the north side of the location.

g. The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches or maximum available) will be stored
along the perimeter of the location as shown on the location platt.

j. All pits will be fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until cleanup. Reclamation will be undertaken no later than the
fall of the year after all drilling activity has
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10. Plans for Restoration of Surface

Dry Hole

a. Rehabilitation of the entire site will be required and will commence
immediately after the drilling is complete. The site will be restored as nearly
practical to its original condition. Cut and fill slopes will be reduced and
graded to conform to the adjacent terrain.

b. Drainages will be reestablished and temporary measures will be required to
prevent erosion to the site until vegetation is established.

c. After final grading and before the replacement of topsoil, the entire surface of
the site shall be scarified to eliminate slippage surfaces and to promote root
penetration. Topsoil will thenbe spread over the site to achieve an
approximate uniform, stable thickness consistent with the established
contours.

d. A temporary fence will be constructed around the site until vegetation is
established. The fence will then be removed.

e. At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a
subsequent report of abandonment.

Producing Location

a. Site reclamation for producing wells will be accomplished for portions of the
site not required for the continued operation of the well. All disturbed surface
will be treated to prevent erosion and to complement the esthetics of the area.
A new site plan will be required encompassing the facilities required for
operation and interim reclamation measures.

b. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junknot
required for production.

c. Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

d. The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

e. At the end of drilling operations, drilling fluids will be hauled to an approve
disposal site. All polluting substances or contaminated materials, such as oil,
oil-saturated soil, and gravel, will be buried within a minimum of 2 feet of
clean soil as cover or be
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f. Once the reserve pit is dry, the reserve pit and that portion of the location not
needed for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to the
approximate natural contours.

g. The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the
production operation will be topsoiled and re-vegetated. The berm will be
removed and the site graded to drain.

h. The site will be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the surface owner.
This prescription will be determined prior to site construction on a site
specific basis. Nutrients and soil amendments will be applied to the
redistributed surface soil later as necessary to meet the re-vegetation
requirements. Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to
prolonged ground frost.

i. Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method
of control shall be by approved mechanical method or an Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will
be in cooperation with Forest Service personnel.

11. Surface Ownership

Access Roads - All roads to the location are located within the area of ownership
of American Electric Power and are deemed private lands.

Well Pad - The well pad is located on lands owned by American Electric Power

12. Other Information

a. A Class III cultural resource inventory will be completed prior to
disturbance by a qualified professional archaeologist.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are
associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution for
knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting
artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are uncovered during
construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within
five working days the AO will inform the operator to:

i. whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic
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ii. the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake

before the site can be used (assuming the site preservation is not
necessary); and

iii. a time frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under
36 CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays
associated with this process, the AO will assume responsibility for
whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials
may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural
guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from
the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator
will then be allowed to resume construction.

c. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA's Consolidated
list of Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title III of the Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) Of1986, as defined in 40
CFR, would be used, produces, transported, stored, disposed, or associated
with the proposed action.

d. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that
full compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations, and any applicable
Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field
representative to insure compliance.

e. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

f. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating
practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling, producing,
suspended, or abandoned will be identiñed in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.h.

g. "Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" will be filed for approval for all
changes of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-
2.

h. This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the
expiration of the original approval
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13. Lessee's or Operator's Representative and Certification

Permit Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
Keri Clarke
l19 S. Tennessee Suite 200
McKinney, TX, 75069
(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
2901 East 20* Street
Farmington, NM, 87402
Doug Endsley - VP Operations
(505)564-8005

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or Persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access rout; that I am familiar with the conditions which
presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my
knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy Inc. and it's contractors and
subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions under
which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement.

Date
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false statement.

Date

O O

13. Lessee's or Operator's Representative and Certification

Permit Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
Keri Clarke
l19 S. Tennessee Suite 200
McKinney, TX, 75069
(972)540-2967

Drilling & Completion Matters
Marion Energy Inc./Mid-Power Resource Corp.
2901 East 20* Street
Farmington, NM, 87402
Doug Endsley - VP Operations
(505)564-8005

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or Persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access rout; that I am familiar with the conditions which
presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my
knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy Inc. and it's contractors and
subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions under
which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement.

Date



O O
STATEOFUTAH FORM4A

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Bond No. BOO1617 DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SURETY BOND

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS:

That we (operator name) Marion Energy Inc. as Principal,
and

(surety name) U.S. Specialty Insurance Cornpany as surety,duly authorized
and qualified to do business in the State of Utah, are held and firmlybound unto the State of Utah in the sum of:

One Hundred Fifty Thousand and no/100 dollars ($ $150,000.00 )
lawful money of the United States, payable to the Director of the Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining,as agent of the State of Utah, for the use and
benefit of the State of Utah for the faithful payment of which we bind ourselves,our heirs, executors,administratorsand successors, jointlyand
severallyby these presents.

THE CONDITIONOF THIS OBLIGATIONIS SUCH THAT, WHEREAS the Principal is or will be engaged in the drilling, redrilling, deepening,
repairing, operating, and plugging and abandonment of a well or wells and restoring the well site or sites in the State of Utah for the purposes of
oil or gas production and/or the injection and disposal of fluids in connection therewith for the following described land or well:

Blanket Bond: To cover all wells drilled in the State of Utah

Individual Bond: Well No:

Section: Township: Range:

County:
, Utah

NOW, THEREFORE, ifthe above bounden Principal shall comply with all the provisions ofthe laws ofthe State of.Utah and the rules, orders and
requirements of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the State of Utah, including, but not limited to the proper plugging and abandonment of wells
ând well site restoration, then this obligation is void; otherwise,the same shall be and remain in fullforce and effect.

INTESTIMONYWHEREOF, said Principal has hereunto subscribed its name and has caused this instrument to be signed by its duly authorized
officers and its corporate or notary seal to be affixed this
31 day of March

, 20 05

(Corporate or Notary Seal here) Marion Energy Inc.
Principal (company name)

MARYLOUHOLDER By LÊt
MYCOMMISSIONEXPIRES Name (print)

IN TESTIMONYWHEREOF, said Surety has caused this instrument to be signed by its duly authorized officers and its corporate or notary seal
to be affixed this
31 day of March

, 20 05

U.S. Specialty Insurance Company
Sur ty Company (Attach Power of Attorney)

(Corporate or Notary Seal here) By Edwin H. Fran , Ill Attorney-in-Fact
Name (print) Title

Signature

13403 Northwest Freeway
Attestee:Œkar Date: Surety MailingAddress

Houston Texas 77040
City State Zip
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O O
Bond No. B001617

Important Notice Regarding
Terrorism Risk Insurance Act of 2002

In accordance with the Terrorism Risk Insurance Act of 2002 (the "Act"),
this disclosure notice is provided for surety bonds on which U.S. Specialty
Insurance Company is the issuing surety.

The premium attributable to any bond coverage for "acts of terrorism" as
defined in Section 102(1) of the Act is Zero Dollars ($0.00).

The United States will reimburse the Issuing Sureties for ninety percent
(90%) of any covered losses from terrorist acts certified under the Act
exceeding the applicable surety deductible.

The actual coverage provided by your bond for acts of terrorism, as is true
for all coverages, is limited by the terms, conditions, exclusions, penalties,
limits, other provisions of your bond and the underlying contract, any
endorsements to the bond and generally applicable rules of law. This
Important Notice Regarding Terrorism Insurance Risk Act of 2002 is for
informational purposes only and does not create coverage nor become a part
or condition of the attached document.

YOU SHOULD KNOW THAT COVERAGE PROVIDED BY THIS POLICY, IF
WRITTEN, FOR LOSSES CAUSED BY CERTIFIED ACTS OF TERRORISM,
WILL BE EXCLUDED IF THE U.S. GOVERNMENT FAILS TO ENACT AN
EXTENSION TO TRIA OR ENACTS CHANGES TO TRIA THAT
SUBSTANTIALLY CHANGE THE RISK OF LOSS THAT AN INSURER OR
POLICYHOLDER HAS ASSUMED.

The rest of this page is intentionally left blank.

Indem
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O O
POWER OF ATTORNEY PA001617

(To be used with bonds issued on behalf of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY)

Know All Men by These Presents That, U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY (the "Company"), a corporation duly
organized and existing under the laws of the State of Texas, and having its principal office in Houston, Harris County, Texas, does by
thesepresents make, constitute and appoint

Edwin H. Frank III, W. Russell Brown, Jr.

its true and lawful Attorney-in-fact, with full power and authority hereby conferred in its name, place and stead, to execute,
acknowledge and deliver any and all bonds, recognizances, undertakings or other instruments or contracts of suretyship to
include riders, amendments, and consents of surety, providing the bond penalty does not exceed Three Million Dollars
($3,000,000)and to bind the Company thereby as fully and to the same extent as if such bonds were signed by the Executive Vice
President, sealed with the corporate seal of the Companyand duly attested by its Secretary, hereby ratifying and confirming that the
said Attorney-in-Fact may do in the premises. Said appointment is made under and by authority of the following resolutions of the
Board of Directors of the U. S. Specialty Insurance Company:
Be it Resolved, that the President,any Vice-President,any Assistant Vice-President, any Secretaryor any Assistant Secretaryshall be and is hereby vested with full

power and authority to appoint any one or more suitable persons as Attomey(s)-in-Fact to represent and act for and on behalf of the Company subject to the following
provisions:
Attorney-in-Factmay be given full power and authority for and in the name of and of behalf of the Company,to execute, acknowledge and deliver,any and all bonds,

recognizances, contracts, agreements or indemnityand other conditionalor obligatoryundertakings and any and all notices and documents canceling or temiinating the
Company's liability thereunder,and any such instrumentsso executed by any such Attomey-in-Fact shall be binding upon the Companyas if signed by the President
and sealed and effected by the CorporateSecretary.

Be it Resolved, that the signature of any authorized officer and seal of the Company heretofore or hereafter affixed to any power of attorney or any certificate relating
thereto by facsimile,and any power of attomey or certificate bearing facsimilesignature or facsimile seal shall be valid and binding upon the Companywith respect to
any bond or undertaking to which it is attached. (Adopted by unanimous written consent in lieu of meeting on July 7, 2003.)

In Witness Whereof U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY has caused these presents to be signed by its Executive Vice
President, and its corporate seal to be hereto affixed this 15* day of March, 2005.

CorporateSeal U. S. SPECI URAN PANY
By

State of Texas

County of Harris ss: Edward H. Ellis, Jr., Executive Vice President

On this 15* day of March, 2005 before me personally came Edward H. Ellis, Jr., to me known, who, being by me duly sworn, did
depose and say, that he resides in Houston, Texas, that he is Executive Vice President of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE
COMPANY, the company described in and which executed the above instrument; that he knows the seal of said Company; that the
seal affixed to said instrument is such corporate seal; that it was so affixed by order of the Board of Directors of said Company; and
that he signed his name thereto by like order.

Not SH ERR GIBSON f i \ otary Public
MYCO

PIREs
My commission expires ÍO- ( 1 -

I, Chnstopher L. Martin, Secretary of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY, do hereby certify that the above and foregoing
is a true and correct copy of a Power of Attorney, executed by said Company,which is still in full force and effect; furthermore, the
resolutions of the Board of Directors, set out in the Power of Attorney are in full force and effect.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal of said Com Houston, Texas this 31st day of
March , 201.

CorporateSeal

Christo e L. Martin,
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power and authority to appoint any one or more suitable persons as Attomey(s)-in-Fact to represent and act for and on behalf of the Company subject to the following
provisions:
Attorney-in-Factmay be given full power and authority for and in the name of and of behalf of the Company,to execute, acknowledge and deliver,any and all bonds,

recognizances, contracts, agreements or indemnityand other conditionalor obligatoryundertakings and any and all notices and documents canceling or temiinating the
Company's liability thereunder,and any such instrumentsso executed by any such Attomey-in-Fact shall be binding upon the Companyas if signed by the President
and sealed and effected by the CorporateSecretary.

Be it Resolved, that the signature of any authorized officer and seal of the Company heretofore or hereafter affixed to any power of attorney or any certificate relating
thereto by facsimile,and any power of attomey or certificate bearing facsimilesignature or facsimile seal shall be valid and binding upon the Companywith respect to
any bond or undertaking to which it is attached. (Adopted by unanimous written consent in lieu of meeting on July 7, 2003.)

In Witness Whereof U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY has caused these presents to be signed by its Executive Vice
President, and its corporate seal to be hereto affixed this 15* day of March, 2005.

CorporateSeal U. S. SPECI URAN PANY
By

State of Texas

County of Harris ss: Edward H. Ellis, Jr., Executive Vice President

On this 15* day of March, 2005 before me personally came Edward H. Ellis, Jr., to me known, who, being by me duly sworn, did
depose and say, that he resides in Houston, Texas, that he is Executive Vice President of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE
COMPANY, the company described in and which executed the above instrument; that he knows the seal of said Company; that the
seal affixed to said instrument is such corporate seal; that it was so affixed by order of the Board of Directors of said Company; and
that he signed his name thereto by like order.

Not SH ERR GIBSON f i \ otary Public
MYCO

PIREs
My commission expires ÍO- ( 1 -

I, Chnstopher L. Martin, Secretary of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY, do hereby certify that the above and foregoing
is a true and correct copy of a Power of Attorney, executed by said Company,which is still in full force and effect; furthermore, the
resolutions of the Board of Directors, set out in the Power of Attorney are in full force and effect.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal of said Com Houston, Texas this 31st day of
March , 201.

CorporateSeal

Christo e L. Martin,
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Bond No. B001617RO4-05-05

RECElVED
SURETY RIDER APRO8 2005

DIV.0FOII, GAS&MINING

To be attached to and form a part of Bond No. B001617 on behalf of
Marion Enerey Inc. , as principaland executed by
U.S. Specialty Insurance Company , as surety.

Effective date of bond: March 3L 2005
Effective date of change: March 31. 2005

In consideration of the mutual agreement herein contained, the principal and
the surety hereby consent to the followingchanges:

The penalty amount of the bond has changed from:

$150,000.00

TO:

$120,000.00

Nothing herein containedshallvary, alter, or extend any provision or
condition of this bond exceptas herein expressly stated.

SIGNED, SEALEDAND DATED TIIIS: April 5, 2005

State of Utah
Dept. of Natural Resources
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining U.S. SpecialtyInsurance Company
Name of Obligee Na ie re

Signature Signature
EARLENE RUSSELL
ENCINEERINC TECHNICIAN, BONDING W. Russell Bro Jr, Attomey-in-Re

Name and title of person Name and title of person
executing for Principal executingfor
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POWER OF ATTORNEY PA001617

(To be used with bonds issued on behalfof U. S. SPECIALTYINSURANCECOMPANY)

Know All Men by These Presents That, U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY (the "Company"), a corporation duly
organizedand existing under the laws of the State of Texas, and havingits principal office in Houston,Harris County,Texas,does by
thesepresents make, constituteandappoint

Edwin H. Frank IH, W. Russell Brown, Jr.

its true and lawful Attorney-in-fact, with full power and authority hereby conferred in its name, place and stead, to execute,
acknowledge and deliver any and all bonds, recognizances, undertakings or other instruments or contracts of suretyship to
include riders, amendments, and consents of surety, providing the.bond penalty does not exceed Three Million Dollars
($3,000,000)and to bind the Company thereby as fully and to the same extent as if such bonds were signed by the ExecutiveVice
President, sealed with the corporate seal of the Companyand duly attestedby its Secretary, hereby ratifying and confirming that the
said Attomey-in-Fact may do in the premises. Said appointment is made under and by authority of the following resolutions of the
Board of Directorsof the U. S. Specialty Insurance Company:
Be it Resolved,that the President,any Vice-President, any Assistant Vice-President,any Secretaryor any Assistant Secretary shall be and is hereby vested with full

power and authority to appointany one or more suitable persons as Attomey(s)-in-Fact to represent and act for and on behalf of the Companysubjectto the following
provisions:
Anorney-in-Factmay be given full power and authority for and in the narneof and of behalfof the Company, to execute,acknowledge and deliver,any and all bonds,

recognizances, contracts, agreementsor indemnityand other conditionalor obligatory undertakings and any and all notices and documentscanceling or terminatmgthe
Company's liability thereunder,and any such instruments so executed by any such Attomey-in-Fact shall be binding upon the Companyas if signed by the President
and scaled and effected by the Corporate Secretary.
Be it Resolved,that the signature of any authorized officer and seal of the Companyheretoforeor hereafteraffixed to any power of attomey or any certificaterelating

thereto by facsimile,and any power of attorney or certificate bearing facsimilesignatureor facsimileseal shallbe valid and binding upon the Companywith respect to
any bond or undertaking to which it is attached. (Adopted by unanimouswritten consent in lieuof meetingon July 7, 2003.)

In Witness Whereof; U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY has caused these presents to be signed by its Executive Vice
President, and its corporate seal to be hereto affixed this 15* day of March, 2005.

CorporateSeal U. S. SPECI URAN PANY
By

State of Texas •

Countyof Harris ss: Edward H. Ellis, Jr., Executive Vice President

On this 15* day of March, 2005 before me personally came Edward H. Ellis, Jr., to me known, who, being by me duly swom, did
depose and say, that he resides in Houston, Texas, that he is Executive Vice President of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCE
COMPANY, the company described in and which executed the above instrument;that he knows the seal of said Company;that the
seal affixed to said instrument is such corporate seal; that it was so affixedby order of the Board of Directorsof said Company; and
that he signedhis name thereto by like order.

No'
.

SHERR¡ elBSON fi Notary Public
.. uvcommissioN

My commission expires Ù- ( 1 -

I, ChristopherL. Martin, Secretary of U. S. SPECIALTY INSURANCECOMPANY, do hereby certify that the above and foregoing
is a true and correct copy of a Power of Attorney, executed by said Company,which is still in full force and effect; furthermore,the
resolutions of the Board of Directors, set out in the Power of Attorney are in full forceand effect.

In Witness Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal of said Co Houston, Texas this 31st day of
March , 20_0L

CorporateSeal

Christo e L. Martin,
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Marion Energy Inc.
August 24, 2006

Mr.NelsonL Kidder
American Electric Power
248 South LakeDrive
Prestonsburg, KY.41653

RE: Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD(SE/4Section 16 13S-10E,CarbonCounty,Utah)
Blackhawk Coal Lease Dated February15" NE

Dear Mr. Kidder

This letter is intended to seek your permission tocommence drilling operationsontheabovereferenced
weit AEP is thesurface ownerat thislocation, and Marion Energy,Inc. as operatorofthe propettles
underlying the Blackhawk Lease, seeks your permission as soonas possible to begin theconstruction of
this locationso that Marionmaycommence drillingoperations. The wellreferenced aboveis tobe
drilledfroma newpad to be constructedjustsouthoftheexisting KenilworthRailroad#1 pad site.

Should youconcur withourrequest tocommencethe construction of the above referenced well location,
please signifyyouracceptance in the space providedbelow.

Ifyou require anyfurtherinformation,please do not hesitate to contact me at (972) 540-2967 ext.3004
ar email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

BenjaminEvans
Landman
Marion Energyine

Blackhawk Coal Company, as Lesser under the above referenced lease, hereby consentsto allow
Manon Energy inc. to commence theconstructionof theKenilworthRailroad #1 SWDwelllocation.

By: , / Date

Name;NelsonKidder Title:Vice esident
AEP Coal, Inc.

119 South Tennessee. Suite 200, Melonney, TX, 75069
Telephone:(972) $40-2967

Fax: (972)
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WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILE

APD RECEIVED: 08/25/2006 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-007-31229

WELL NAME: KENILWORTH RR 1 SWD

OPERATOR: MARION ENERGY INC ( N2740 ) PHONE NUMBER: 972-540-2967

CONTACT: BENJAMIN EVANS

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SWSE 16 1305 100E Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0304 FSL 1315 FEL
BOTTOM: 0304 FSL 1315 FEL Engineering )p ([ [ Q ,

COUNTY: CARBON
Geology

LATITUDE: 39.68903 LONGITUDE: -110.8016

UTM SURF EASTINGS:517013 NORTHINGS:4393052 Surface

FIELD NAME: HELPER ( 18 )

LEASE TYPE: 4 - Fee

LEASE NUMBER: FEE PROPOSED FORMATION: WINGT

SURFACE OWNER: 4 - Fee COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

y/' Plat R649-2-3.
'

Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit:

(No.BOOl617 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit \/'R649-3-3. Exception
(No.MUNICIRAL )

Drilling Unit
A RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:(Date:
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) . Siting:

Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS :
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CONTACT: BENJAMIN EVANS

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SWSE 16 1305 100E

Tech Review Initials Date
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BOTTOM: 0304 FSL 1315 FEL Engineering )p ([ [ Q ,
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Geology
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Application for Permit to Drill

Statement of Basis
10/25/2006 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page 1

APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Owur CBM
114 43-007-31229-00-00 WD P No
Operator MARION ENERGY INC Surface Owner-APD
Well Name KENILWORTH RR l SWD Unit
Field HELPER Type of Work
Location SWSE 16 13S 10E S 0 FL 0 FL GPS Coord (UTM) 517013E 4393052N

Geologic Statement of Basis
It is unlikely that significant volumes of high quality ground water will be encountered at this location. A
poorly to moderately permeable soil is most likely to be developed on Quaternary/Tertiary Pediment Mantle
covering the Upper part of the Blue Gate Member of the Mancos Shale. The proposed casing and cementing
program should adequately isolate any zones of fresh water that may be penetrated. No underground water
right has been filed within a mile of the location.

Chris Kierst 10/25/2006
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis
The staked location is directly east of the town of Kenilworth, Carbon County, Utah ~.25 mile. The Railroad
#1 well and pad sits north of and adjacent to the proposed disposal well and pad. The location is located at the
base of the cliffs to the east and gradually sloped terrain and drainages to the west. Dry wash drainages are
located throughout the immediate and surrounding area. With its proximity to the town of Kenilworth and the
rocky composition of the soil a liner in the reserve pit will be required. Storm runoff drainage will be diverted
away from the pad and access road.

Mark Jones 10/11/2006
Onsite Evaluator Date / Time

Conditions of Approval / Application for Permit to Drill
Category Condition
Pits A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 12 mils shall be properly installed and

maintained in the reserve pit.
Surface The reserve pit shall be fenced upon completion of drilling operations.
Surface Drainages adjacent to the proposed pad shall be diverted around the
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-SITE PREDRILL EVALUA N
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator MARION ENERGY INC
Well Name KENILWORTH RR 1 SWD
API Number 43-007-31229-0 APD No 114 Field/Unit HELPER
Location: 1/4,1/4 SWSE Sec 16 Tw 13S Rug 10E 0 FL 0 FL
GPS Coord (UTM) 517009 4393055 Surface Owner

Participants
Mark Jones (DOGM), Tonya Hammond (surface rep.), Gayla Williams (Carbon County), Keri Clarke, Ben Evans, Eric
Norton (Marion).

Regional/Local Setting & Topography
The staked location is directly east of the town of Kenilworth, Carbon County, Utah ~

.25 mile. The Railroad #1 well and
pad sits north of and adjacent to the proposed disposal well and pad. The location is located at the base of the cliffs to the
east and gradually sloped terrain and drainages to the west. Dry wash drainages are located throughout the immediate and
surrounding area.

Surface Use Plan
Current Surface Use
Mining

New Road
Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation

0 Width 200 Length 270 Onsite

Ancillary Facilities N

Waste Management Plan Adequate?

Environmental Parameters
Affected Floodplains and/or Wetland N

Flora / Fauna
Pinion-Juniper / sagebrush community.

Soil Type and Characteristics
gravely clay

Erosion Issues N

Sedimentation Issues N

Site Stability Issues N

Drainage Diverson Required Y
drainage diversion away from location required.

Berm Required? N
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Erosion Sedimentation Contr equired? N

Paleo Survey Run? N Paleo Potental Observed? N Cultural Survey Run? N Cultural Resources? Y

Reserve Pit

Site-Specific Factors Site Ranking
Distance to Groundwater (feet) >200 0
Distance to Surface Water (feet) >1000 0
Dist. Nearest Municipal Well (ft) >5280 0
Distance to Other Wells (feet) <300 20
Native Soil Type Mod permeability 10
Fluid Type Air/mist 0
Drill Cuttings Normal Rock 0
Annual Precipitation (inches) 10 to 20 5
Affected Populations >50 10
Presence Nearby Utility Conduits Not Present 0

Final Score 45 1 Sensitivity Level

Characteristics / Requirements
Dugout earthen (130' x 50' x 10'). Liner req.

Closed Loop Mud Required? N Liner Required? Y Liner Thickness 12 Pit Underlayment Required? N

Other Observations / Comments

Mark Jones 10/11/2006
Evaluator Date / Time
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STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 1 of 3

Online Services Agency List Business ) Google Search Utah go

Utah Division of Water Righ

WRPLAT Program Output Listing

Version: 2004.12.30.00 Rundate: 10/25/2006 03:00 PM

Radius search of 5280 feet from a point N305 W1315 from the SE corner, section 16, Township 13S, Range 10E, SL b&m Criteria:wrtypes=W,C,E
podtypes=S,U,D,Sp status=U,A,P usetypes=all

O

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe
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Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top; 44 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress; 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 4,450 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 1,942 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (In) (ft')
1 500 13.375 61.00 J-55 ST&C 500 500 12.39 427.1

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1540 7.058 500 3090 6.18 x 31 595 19.51 J /

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX:801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS:NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the
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Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County
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8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
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Premium: 1.50 (J)
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(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1540 7.058 500 3090 6.18 x 31 595 19.51 J /

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX:801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS:NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the
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Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top; 44 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress; 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 4,450 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 1,942 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (In) (ft')
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Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX:801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS:NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the
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Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top; 44 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress; 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 4,450 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 1,942 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (In) (ft')
1 500 13.375 61.00 J-55 ST&C 500 500 12.39 427.1
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Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1540 7.058 500 3090 6.18 x 31 595 19.51 J /

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX:801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS:NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the



O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 127 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,884 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,803 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 3,842 ft Next setting BHP: 3,841 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 4,450 ft
Injection pressure: 4,450 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (In) (ft')
1 4450 8.625 32.00 J-55 LT&C 4450 4450 7.875 1522.8

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2127 2530 1.190 2884 3930 1.36 y 142 417 2.93 J /

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4450 ft, a mud weight of 9.2 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this desígn willbe that of the

O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 127 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,884 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,803 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 3,842 ft Next setting BHP: 3,841 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 4,450 ft
Injection pressure: 4,450 psi
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Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity
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Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4450 ft, a mud weight of 9.2 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this desígn willbe that of the

O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 127 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi
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8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
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Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2127 2530 1.190 2884 3930 1.36 y 142 417 2.93 J /

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4450 ft, a mud weight of 9.2 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this desígn willbe that of the

O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 127 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,884 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,803 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 3,842 ft Next setting BHP: 3,841 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 4,450 ft
Injection pressure: 4,450 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (In) (ft')
1 4450 8.625 32.00 J-55 LT&C 4450 4450 7.875 1522.8

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 2127 2530 1.190 2884 3930 1.36 y 142 417 2.93 J /

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4450 ft, a mud weight of 9.2 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this desígn willbe that of the



O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Liner Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 4,300 ft

BuLst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi Linertop: 4,300 ft
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,841 psi. 8 Round STC; 1.80 (J)

$N3 440 PL 8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 8,229 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 4503 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 4.767 587.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3841 6290 1.638 3841 7740 2.02 77 348 4.55 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City,Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
For this liner string, the top is rounded to the nearest 100 ft.Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign will be that of the

O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Liner Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 4,300 ft

BuLst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi Linertop: 4,300 ft
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,841 psi. 8 Round STC; 1.80 (J)

$N3 440 PL 8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 8,229 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 4503 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 4.767 587.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3841 6290 1.638 3841 7740 2.02 77 348 4.55 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: November 1,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City,Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
For this liner string, the top is rounded to the nearest 100 ft.Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign will be that of the

O O
Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWD
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Liner Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 4,300 ft

BuLst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 1,905 psi Linertop: 4,300 ft
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,841 psi. 8 Round STC; 1.80 (J)

$N3 440 PL 8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
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Marion Energy Inc.

August 31, 2006

Utah Divisionof OilGas and Mining
ATTN:Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116

RE: Exceptional Location Letter (Rule R649-3-3) Exception to Location and SitingofWells
KenilworthRail Road SWD #1 (304.71ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL / SE/4 S16 138-10E)
Helper Prospect, 13S-10E, Carbon County,Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

The KenilworthRail Road SWD #1 well is to be drilledas a Salt Water Disposal well in which Marion
Energy Inc. willdispose of its produced water, similarto other disposal wells in thearea, in theNavajo
and Wingate formations at depths of 8143ft and 8606ft respectively.

Marion Energy Inc. respectfully seeks your permission and requests thatthiswell is drilledat the
aforementionedexceptionallocation due to thefollowingreasons:

1. The well willbe drilledjust south of our existing KenilworthRailroad #1 location which enables
Marion Energy Inc. to minimizeany further environmental impacts to the area which wouldarise
from buildingfurther access roads as allaccess tothis location has been established.

2. Marion Energy Inc. also seeks your permission todrillthiswell at the aforementioned location due to
thetopographicalissues encountered and the limitingspatialrestraintswe experiencewhen drilling
in and around topographicallychallengingareas such as this.

3. Marion EnergyInc. is theonlyoperator in thearea, and thereare no additionalownerswithin460ft
ofthe proposed location.

Ifyou requireany further information, please do not hesitate tocontact me at (972) 540-2967 ext. 3004
or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200, McKinney,TX, 75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967

Fax: (972)
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JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah November 2, 2006

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
ExecutiveDirector Marion Energy, Inc.
Division of 119 S Tennessee

Oil, Gas & Mining McKinney, TX 75069

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

Re: Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD Well, 304' FSL, 1315' FEL, SW SE, Sec. 16,
T. 13 South, R. 10 East, Carbon County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-007-31229.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Carbon County Assessor

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801)538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940•TTY (801)538-7458•
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Operator: Marion Energy, Inc.
Well Name & Number Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD
API Number: 43-007-31229
Lease: Fee

Location: SW SE Sec. 16 T. 13 South R. 10 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for Pennit to Drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy
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5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATi;RALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESGNADON ANDSERML NUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do notuse thisform for proposals lo dilli newwells, signifmantly deepen exising weis below current botlomamle depth, reenier plugged wells, or to

dritt horizontal ialstals. Use APPLICATlONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL1ormfor such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL -- 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER;
OlL WELL LJ GAS WELL OTHER -Kendworth Railroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR; PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD ANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney TX 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25tt FEL ISE/4 couerry Carbon

GIWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NORCE OF WTW O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicale) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Appaamnek Ada CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUNG PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Oliginal Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwom complebon:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change Casing
1/3/2007

CONVERTWER WPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAllON Sundry

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Marion Energy proposes to change intermediate and production casing for the Kenilworth Railroad #1 Salt Water Disposal Well
as fonows:

Intermediate casing will be changed to a 12 1/4" hole and 9 5/8", K-55, 36# willbe run and cemented with655 sx Prem. Lite
cement w/ a 3.82 cuttiskyield followed by 276 sx, 50/50 Poz with a yield of 1.41 cutt/sk.

Production stringwillbe changed to a 8 3/4" hole and 7" N-80, 23#run to surface and cemented with 537 sx Prem. Lite with a
3.82 cuft/sk yield followed by 187 sx, 50/50 Poz witha yield of 1.41 cuft/skas a tail.

NAME(P PRig Charlotte Parkef TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 1/3/2007

UTÃH ivisloN OF RECEIVED

IL GAS AN UNING
' S go

JANO8 2007
ATE
Y:

"' ""'6'* Olv.OFOLGAS&
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119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney TX 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25tt FEL ISE/4 couerry Carbon

GIWOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NORCE OF WTW O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicale) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Appaamnek Ada CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUNG PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Oliginal Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwom complebon:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change Casing
1/3/2007

CONVERTWER WPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAllON Sundry

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Marion Energy proposes to change intermediate and production casing for the Kenilworth Railroad #1 Salt Water Disposal Well
as fonows:

Intermediate casing will be changed to a 12 1/4" hole and 9 5/8", K-55, 36# willbe run and cemented with655 sx Prem. Lite
cement w/ a 3.82 cuttiskyield followed by 276 sx, 50/50 Poz with a yield of 1.41 cutt/sk.

Production stringwillbe changed to a 8 3/4" hole and 7" N-80, 23#run to surface and cemented with 537 sx Prem. Lite with a
3.82 cuft/sk yield followed by 187 sx, 50/50 Poz witha yield of 1.41 cuft/skas a tail.

NAME(P PRig Charlotte Parkef TITLE Secretary

SIGNATURE DATE 1/3/2007

UTÃH ivisloN OF RECEIVED

IL GAS AN UNING
' S go

JANO8 2007
ATE
Y:

"' ""'6'* Olv.OFOLGAS&



Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Internal fluid density: 2.310 ppg Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,408 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,344 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,546 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 8803 7 23.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 6.25 1945.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3288 3830 1.165 4344 6340 1.46 202 442 2.18 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: March 22,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg An internal gradient of .12 psilft was used for collapse from TD to
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the

Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Internal fluid density: 2.310 ppg Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,408 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,344 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,546 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 8803 7 23.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 6.25 1945.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3288 3830 1.165 4344 6340 1.46 202 442 2.18 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: March 22,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg An internal gradient of .12 psilft was used for collapse from TD to
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the

Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Internal fluid density: 2.310 ppg Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,408 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,344 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,546 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 8803 7 23.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 6.25 1945.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3288 3830 1.165 4344 6340 1.46 202 442 2.18 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: March 22,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg An internal gradient of .12 psilft was used for collapse from TD to
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the

Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Internal fluid density: 2.310 ppg Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,408 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,344 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,546 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 8803 7 23.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 6.25 1945.7

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3288 3830 1.165 4344 6340 1.46 202 442 2.18 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: March 22,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg An internal gradient of .12 psilft was used for collapse from TD to
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the



Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Internal fluid density: 2.210 ppg Bottom hole temperature: 127 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 2,270 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,249 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,803 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 9.200 ppg
Neutral point: 3,844 ft Next setting BHP: 4,207 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 4,450 ft
Injection pressure: 4,450 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 4450 9.625 36.00 K-55 ST&C 4450 4450 8.765 1931.6

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1616 2020 1.250 3249 3520 1.08 160 423 2.64 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: March 22,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
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Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4450 ft, a mud weight of 9.2 ppg An internal gradient of .115 psilft was used for collapse from TD to
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thisdesign willbe thatof the
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: MARION ENERGY, INC

Well Name: KENILWORTH RR 1 SWD

Api No: 43-007-31229 Lease Type: FEE

Section 16 Township 13S Range 10E County CARBON

Drilling Contractor ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRLG RIG # RATHOLE

SPUDDED:
Date 10/ 09/07

Time 6:00 AM

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by RL TATMAN

Telephone # (801) 842-1391

Date 10/10/07 Signed
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FORMSSTATEOF UTAN
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DivisloN OF 011.,GASANDMINING 5. LEASEDEmm ANDSSWAL NUMBBt
FEE-BH-6tSO4

SUNDRY NOT1CESAND REPORTSON WELLS 6. FMAN,AROTIEEORBUBENAME

I UNITerCAAGREEMENTNAME:
Do natueethis somter poposals todit newwens,signitcanlydeepen eKistng weis below Cunert bosom4tole depih, reenterplugged weis, or to

es aura....n.hmals Use APPUCADON FOR PERMfTTODIBLL Om for suchpoposa
1. TYPE ØFWELL ¯¯ ·¯ SW 8 VMELLNAMEand NUMBER:

Olt.WER O GAS WER O OTHER Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD
2. NAMECFOPERATOft 9 APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731229
3. ADONESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBElt 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR VWLDCAT:
vies.Tennesseeste.200 ca s TX 75069 (972)540-2967 MelperField
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

fDDTAGESAT SunreCE: 304.71 it FSL 1315.25tt FEL ISEI4 coumv Carbon

GNUOTR, SECHON, TOWNMIP, RANGE,MERIDmt SWSE 16 13S 10E stase
UTAIT

n CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO1NDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT,OR OTHEROATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O *- O -• D --TE CUWmm
NOT ·Œ MENT

(S nIt in Dupicata) ALTERCANNG MURE TRE SOEmACK TO REPAIR WELL

a.............-- O e--- O NEWCONSTRUCTION O TEWORARH.YABANDON

O CHANGEW PREMOUS E TUNNG REPAR

O ME-G MANDA ON WORW

O -E WELM PLUG MR DISPOSAI.
<s-.a om. r- om

O -E WELLSTATUS PRODUCH (Smmum) MRSHUTŒ

COMMINGLEPRODUCINarCRMADONS RECLAMRONOFWERSTE ØTMER: Spud Sundry
10/14/2007 O CD-WERWPE RECOWLETE-WERENTFOMON

12 DESCRIBEFROPOSEDOR OPERATIONSMahour ai pettirmit tielais itxitudirg tietes, tiep0s, volunus, 910

Unit DrillingRig # 132 spudded the KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD Well on 10-14-2007.

NAME(PLEASE N Endsley TITLE

SIGMiuRE DATE

RECEIVED
OCT23 2007(W2000) (See insbucians on Romaa SMe)
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es aura....n.hmals Use APPUCADON FOR PERMfTTODIBLL Om for suchpoposa
1. TYPE ØFWELL ¯¯ ·¯ SW 8 VMELLNAMEand NUMBER:

Olt.WER O GAS WER O OTHER Kenilworth Railroad #1 SWD
2. NAMECFOPERATOft 9 APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731229
3. ADONESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBElt 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR VWLDCAT:
vies.Tennesseeste.200 ca s TX 75069 (972)540-2967 MelperField
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

fDDTAGESAT SunreCE: 304.71 it FSL 1315.25tt FEL ISEI4 coumv Carbon

GNUOTR, SECHON, TOWNMIP, RANGE,MERIDmt SWSE 16 13S 10E stase
UTAIT

n CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO1NDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT,OR OTHEROATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O *- O -• D --TE CUWmm
NOT ·Œ MENT

(S nIt in Dupicata) ALTERCANNG MURE TRE SOEmACK TO REPAIR WELL

a.............-- O e--- O NEWCONSTRUCTION O TEWORARH.YABANDON

O CHANGEW PREMOUS E TUNNG REPAR

O ME-G MANDA ON WORW

O -E WELM PLUG MR DISPOSAI.
<s-.a om. r- om

O -E WELLSTATUS PRODUCH (Smmum) MRSHUTŒ

COMMINGLEPRODUCINarCRMADONS RECLAMRONOFWERSTE ØTMER: Spud Sundry
10/14/2007 O CD-WERWPE RECOWLETE-WERENTFOMON

12 DESCRIBEFROPOSEDOR OPERATIONSMahour ai pettirmit tielais itxitudirg tietes, tiep0s, volunus, 910

Unit DrillingRig # 132 spudded the KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD Well on 10-14-2007.

NAME(PLEASE N Endsley TITLE

SIGMiuRE DATE

RECEIVED
OCT23 2007(W2000) (See insbucians on Romaa SMe)



FORM 9STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUMDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

1 UNITor CA.AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notusetnistorm for proposals lo drill newwells, significantly deepen exisung wells below current tottom-hole depin, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPUCABON FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals,
f. TYPEOFWELL -- tarn 6. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL LJ GAS WELL OTHER VVU -KenilworthRailroad #1 SWD
2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3, ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FLELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11e s. Tennessee ste.200 am McKinney TX ,,75069 {972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 it FSL 131525ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

oTworn, seenON, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MEUDAN: SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE.OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O NORCE OF WBif O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Dupca ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARiLY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG MCK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit originalForm Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale ofwork completion:

El COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: OSSÌngChange

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLEfE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

11 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, deçàhs, volumes, etc

As of 5:00 am 10-16-2007 13 3/8" casing had been run to +/- 900' and cementing operations were on going. Casing was run to
900' instead of 500' as per the APD in order to get at least 10% of the proposed totaldepth of the weil covered.

oug Endsley TITLE VP Operationa
NAME(PLEASE

10/1612007
sleNATURE ...

DATE

ghis spacefor State use only)

RECEIVED

-, <s..--..--,
OCT2 3 2007

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&
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SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG MCK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit originalForm Only)
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O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLEfE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

11 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, deçàhs, volumes, etc

As of 5:00 am 10-16-2007 13 3/8" casing had been run to +/- 900' and cementing operations were on going. Casing was run to
900' instead of 500' as per the APD in order to get at least 10% of the proposed totaldepth of the weil covered.
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10/1612007
sleNATURE ...

DATE

ghis spacefor State use only)

RECEIVED

-, <s..--..--,
OCT2 3 2007

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&
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f. TYPEOFWELL -- tarn 6. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL LJ GAS WELL OTHER VVU -KenilworthRailroad #1 SWD
2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
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11e s. Tennessee ste.200 am McKinney TX ,,75069 {972) 540-2967 Helper Field
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FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 it FSL 131525ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

oTworn, seenON, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MEUDAN: SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE.OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O NORCE OF WBif O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Dupca ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARiLY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG MCK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit originalForm Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale ofwork completion:

El COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: OSSÌngChange

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLEfE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

11 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, deçàhs, volumes, etc

As of 5:00 am 10-16-2007 13 3/8" casing had been run to +/- 900' and cementing operations were on going. Casing was run to
900' instead of 500' as per the APD in order to get at least 10% of the proposed totaldepth of the weil covered.

oug Endsley TITLE VP Operationa
NAME(PLEASE

10/1612007
sleNATURE ...

DATE

ghis spacefor State use only)

RECEIVED

-, <s..--..--,
OCT2 3 2007

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&

FORM 9STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUMDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

1 UNITor CA.AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notusetnistorm for proposals lo drill newwells, significantly deepen exisung wells below current tottom-hole depin, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPUCABON FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals,
f. TYPEOFWELL -- tarn 6. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL LJ GAS WELL OTHER VVU -KenilworthRailroad #1 SWD
2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3, ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FLELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11e s. Tennessee ste.200 am McKinney TX ,,75069 {972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 it FSL 131525ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

oTworn, seenON, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MEUDAN: SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE.OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O NORCE OF WBif O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Dupca ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARiLY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG MCK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit originalForm Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale ofwork completion:

El COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: OSSÌngChange

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLEfE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

11 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, deçàhs, volumes, etc

As of 5:00 am 10-16-2007 13 3/8" casing had been run to +/- 900' and cementing operations were on going. Casing was run to
900' instead of 500' as per the APD in order to get at least 10% of the proposed totaldepth of the weil covered.

oug Endsley TITLE VP Operationa
NAME(PLEASE

10/1612007
sleNATURE ...

DATE

ghis spacefor State use only)

RECEIVED

-, <s..--..--,
OCT2 3 2007

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee SteO McKinney, Texas $5069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorn spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rd. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 6
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Rigging Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
IEMARKS KBTOGL

Weather Sunny and warm i oads good and clear 15
TIME LOG

enon yo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16.00 Rig Up/ Set in Boiler & Gen Set/ String Blocks/ Raise Derrick/ Work On Conductor & Blooie Line

21:00 16.00 Rig Up Floor/ General Rig Up, Electrical, Water, Pumps, ETC.
21:00 6:00 8.00 Wait On Daylight

Total Mouis 40.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob./Desnok 24.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours In 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Plus SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL Sterate TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan .lET
MST K-600 SERIALNO.
CA Fed 744 DEFTN OUT

;I RNET 00 ENku
pH MaxGet HRS
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G BW
c D ON W DIV.OfOil úAb &MINING
%SOLIDS CUMUI.ATIVECOST ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONRECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Incinadon / Aalmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 8P80
smOKE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee SteO McKinney, Texas $5069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 13, 2007
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6:00 16.00 Rig Up/ Set in Boiler & Gen Set/ String Blocks/ Raise Derrick/ Work On Conductor & Blooie Line
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WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL Sterate TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
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MST K-600 SERIALNO.
CA Fed 744 DEFTN OUT
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pH MaxGet HRS
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%SOLIDS CUMUI.ATIVECOST ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONRECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Incinadon / Aalmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 8P80
smOKE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee SteO McKinney, Texas $5069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorn spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rd. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 6
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Rigging Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
IEMARKS KBTOGL

Weather Sunny and warm i oads good and clear 15
TIME LOG

enon yo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16.00 Rig Up/ Set in Boiler & Gen Set/ String Blocks/ Raise Derrick/ Work On Conductor & Blooie Line

21:00 16.00 Rig Up Floor/ General Rig Up, Electrical, Water, Pumps, ETC.
21:00 6:00 8.00 Wait On Daylight

Total Mouis 40.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob./Desnok 24.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours In 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Plus SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL Sterate TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan .lET
MST K-600 SERIALNO.
CA Fed 744 DEFTN OUT
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pH MaxGet HRS
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c D ON W DIV.OfOil úAb &MINING
%SOLIDS CUMUI.ATIVECOST ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONRECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Incinadon / Aalmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 8P80
smOKE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee SteO McKinney, Texas $5069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorn spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rd. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 6
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Rigging Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
IEMARKS KBTOGL

Weather Sunny and warm i oads good and clear 15
TIME LOG

enon yo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16.00 Rig Up/ Set in Boiler & Gen Set/ String Blocks/ Raise Derrick/ Work On Conductor & Blooie Line

21:00 16.00 Rig Up Floor/ General Rig Up, Electrical, Water, Pumps, ETC.
21:00 6:00 8.00 Wait On Daylight

Total Mouis 40.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP

Hrs. Mob./Desnok 24.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours In 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Poly Plus SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG

VIS AL Sterate TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan .lET
MST K-600 SERIALNO.
CA Fed 744 DEFTN OUT

;I RNET 00 ENku
pH MaxGet HRS
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G BW
c D ON W DIV.OfOil úAb &MINING
%SOLIDS CUMUI.ATIVECOST ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONRECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Incinadon / Aalmuth

MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 8P80
smOKE 8.50



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
:IASE NAME& WELL NO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 14, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUKiY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALÐEPTH Rot. His cumRat Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED tASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Reput No.

65' 0 0 0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 7
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDSY

Drilling CMTOut Of 20" Conductor ¡C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Windy 15
TIME LOG

mole
'

TO Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 17:00 11.00 Rig Up Floor/ Gas Buster/ Pits/ Weld On Blooie Line & Rotating Head/ Torg Kelly & Kelly Spinners
17:00 18:00 1.00 Rig Repair/ Repair Kelly Spinners
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rigging Up/ Set Back Kelly/ Rig Up Bails/ Set Up Pipe Racks To Pick Up BHA/ Strap BHA
22:00 22:30 0.50 Pre-Spud Safety Meeting
22:30 0:00 1.50 Rig Repairl Change Oil in #2 Floor Motor Torg Converter{Should Have Took 1/2 Hour}
0:00 2:30 2.50 PU Hammer & Strip Bearing Assembly
2:30 5:00 2.50 Rig Repair/ Floor Motors Ran Out Of Fuel/ Trace Fuel Lines/ Change Fuel Filters Floor Motors
5:00 6:00 1.00 Make Up Hammer/ Bit Sub/ 8" DCI Cross Over/ Drill Out CMT

Total Dours 19.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 5.00 FUEL USED 300 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 25K

Hrs. Mob./Demot 19.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 25K
TOTALDAYWORM 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 25K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS SSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
VIS AL Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MET K-600 SERIALNO. 121
c^ RFrrlVFn Fed744 DEPTNOUT
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
xx OfT Ž3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 0
pH MaxGel HRs 0.00
CAKE DIVOF(IIL,GAS&MININt cottonseed huns T/8/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP UATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPBÛ BPSÛ
1 8" DC 30.77 smoKE 8.50 8.50

a wmsers swwm K SC K

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
:IASE NAME& WELL NO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 14, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUKiY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALÐEPTH Rot. His cumRat Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED tASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Reput No.

65' 0 0 0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 7
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDSY

Drilling CMTOut Of 20" Conductor ¡C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Windy 15
TIME LOG

mole
'

TO Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 17:00 11.00 Rig Up Floor/ Gas Buster/ Pits/ Weld On Blooie Line & Rotating Head/ Torg Kelly & Kelly Spinners
17:00 18:00 1.00 Rig Repair/ Repair Kelly Spinners
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rigging Up/ Set Back Kelly/ Rig Up Bails/ Set Up Pipe Racks To Pick Up BHA/ Strap BHA
22:00 22:30 0.50 Pre-Spud Safety Meeting
22:30 0:00 1.50 Rig Repairl Change Oil in #2 Floor Motor Torg Converter{Should Have Took 1/2 Hour}
0:00 2:30 2.50 PU Hammer & Strip Bearing Assembly
2:30 5:00 2.50 Rig Repair/ Floor Motors Ran Out Of Fuel/ Trace Fuel Lines/ Change Fuel Filters Floor Motors
5:00 6:00 1.00 Make Up Hammer/ Bit Sub/ 8" DCI Cross Over/ Drill Out CMT

Total Dours 19.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 5.00 FUEL USED 300 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 25K

Hrs. Mob./Demot 19.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 25K
TOTALDAYWORM 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 25K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS SSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
VIS AL Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MET K-600 SERIALNO. 121
c^ RFrrlVFn Fed744 DEPTNOUT
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
xx OfT Ž3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 0
pH MaxGel HRs 0.00
CAKE DIVOF(IIL,GAS&MININt cottonseed huns T/8/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP UATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPBÛ BPSÛ
1 8" DC 30.77 smoKE 8.50 8.50

a wmsers swwm K SC K

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
:IASE NAME& WELL NO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 14, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUKiY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALÐEPTH Rot. His cumRat Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED tASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Reput No.

65' 0 0 0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 7
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDSY

Drilling CMTOut Of 20" Conductor ¡C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Windy 15
TIME LOG

mole
'

TO Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 17:00 11.00 Rig Up Floor/ Gas Buster/ Pits/ Weld On Blooie Line & Rotating Head/ Torg Kelly & Kelly Spinners
17:00 18:00 1.00 Rig Repair/ Repair Kelly Spinners
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rigging Up/ Set Back Kelly/ Rig Up Bails/ Set Up Pipe Racks To Pick Up BHA/ Strap BHA
22:00 22:30 0.50 Pre-Spud Safety Meeting
22:30 0:00 1.50 Rig Repairl Change Oil in #2 Floor Motor Torg Converter{Should Have Took 1/2 Hour}
0:00 2:30 2.50 PU Hammer & Strip Bearing Assembly
2:30 5:00 2.50 Rig Repair/ Floor Motors Ran Out Of Fuel/ Trace Fuel Lines/ Change Fuel Filters Floor Motors
5:00 6:00 1.00 Make Up Hammer/ Bit Sub/ 8" DCI Cross Over/ Drill Out CMT

Total Dours 19.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 5.00 FUEL USED 300 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 25K

Hrs. Mob./Demot 19.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 25K
TOTALDAYWORM 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 25K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS SSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
VIS AL Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MET K-600 SERIALNO. 121
c^ RFrrlVFn Fed744 DEPTNOUT

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
xx OfT Ž3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 0
pH MaxGel HRs 0.00
CAKE DIVOF(IIL,GAS&MININt cottonseed huns T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP UATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPBÛ BPSÛ
1 8" DC 30.77 smoKE 8.50 8.50

a wmsers swwm K SC K

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
:IASE NAME& WELL NO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 14, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUKiY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 0
TOTALÐEPTH Rot. His cumRat Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED tASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Reput No.

65' 0 0 0 20" Conductor 65' RKB 7
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDSY

Drilling CMTOut Of 20" Conductor ¡C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Windy 15
TIME LOG

mole
'

TO Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 17:00 11.00 Rig Up Floor/ Gas Buster/ Pits/ Weld On Blooie Line & Rotating Head/ Torg Kelly & Kelly Spinners
17:00 18:00 1.00 Rig Repair/ Repair Kelly Spinners
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rigging Up/ Set Back Kelly/ Rig Up Bails/ Set Up Pipe Racks To Pick Up BHA/ Strap BHA
22:00 22:30 0.50 Pre-Spud Safety Meeting
22:30 0:00 1.50 Rig Repairl Change Oil in #2 Floor Motor Torg Converter{Should Have Took 1/2 Hour}
0:00 2:30 2.50 PU Hammer & Strip Bearing Assembly
2:30 5:00 2.50 Rig Repair/ Floor Motors Ran Out Of Fuel/ Trace Fuel Lines/ Change Fuel Filters Floor Motors
5:00 6:00 1.00 Make Up Hammer/ Bit Sub/ 8" DCI Cross Over/ Drill Out CMT

Total Dours 19.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 5.00 FUEL USED 300 Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 25K

Hrs. Mob./Demot 19.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 25K
TOTALDAYWORM 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 25K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS SSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
VIS AL Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MET K-600 SERIALNO. 121
c^ RFrrlVFn Fed744 DEPTNOUT

GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
xx OfT Ž3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 0
pH MaxGel HRs 0.00
CAKE DIVOF(IIL,GAS&MININt cottonseed huns T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP UATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPBÛ BPSÛ
1 8" DC 30.77 smoKE 8.50 8.50

a wmsers swwm K SC K



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
EASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 15, 2007
2G NAMEANDNUMBER COUWrY GTATE Days froin spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 1
FUTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Nrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Rqxst Net

733' | 16.5 16.5 j 668' 20" Conductor 65' RKB 8
YnvrY AT REPORTEME REPORWDBY

Ðrilling Actual W/ 17-1/2" Hammer C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
TNARKS KBTO GL

Stuck Drill String Attempting To Dust Per Hammer Hands Request 15
TIME LO 2

mou To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 DrillActuall 65'-82'
7:00 7:30 0.50 Dry Out Hole To Dust
7:30 8:00 0.50 Lay Down 8" DC PU 6" Drill Collar
8:00 8:30 0.50 DrillActual/ 82'-9T Hit Water/ Packed Off/ Stuck Pipe
8:30 9:30 1.00 Work pipeFreel Start Misting/Clean Well Bore Up
9:30 10:00 0.50 Rig Service/ Tighten Swivel Packing
10:00 13:00 3.00 Drill Actuall 97'-175'
13:00 15:00 2.00 Cire Hole Clean/ TOOHI MU 8" DC/ TIH
15:00 16:00 1.00 DrilliActuall 175'-204'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Surveyl Mis-Run
16:30 17:00 0.50 Drill Actual/ 204'-235'
17:00 19:00 2.00 Survey/ 3- Mis-Runs WI7degree Clockl 3/4 Degree With 14 Degree Clock g 226'
19:00 1:00 6.00 Drill Actual/ 235'-516'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Survey g 47T 1/2 Degree
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drill Actuall 516'-733'

Total f leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Nrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 38K

irs. Mob.jDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in 0 Out DOWN 36K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 38K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT tECOFD
lEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
GME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
diEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
WS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
A DAPP TFA Open
slyP Fed-Zan .1ET Open

(CT23 2007 Dura¢ DWH IN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 668
41 MaxGel HRS 16.50

DIV.0fGIL,0MuMilliroCAKE Cotton seed huifs T/B/G
1 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

JAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
9kSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.5

DETI I TNGASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC )RD
No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimatil

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAlcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 s1RottE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
EASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 15, 2007
2G NAMEANDNUMBER COUWrY GTATE Days froin spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 1
FUTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Nrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Rqxst Net

733' | 16.5 16.5 j 668' 20" Conductor 65' RKB 8
YnvrY AT REPORTEME REPORWDBY

Ðrilling Actual W/ 17-1/2" Hammer C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
TNARKS KBTO GL

Stuck Drill String Attempting To Dust Per Hammer Hands Request 15
TIME LO 2

mou To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 DrillActuall 65'-82'
7:00 7:30 0.50 Dry Out Hole To Dust
7:30 8:00 0.50 Lay Down 8" DC PU 6" Drill Collar
8:00 8:30 0.50 DrillActual/ 82'-9T Hit Water/ Packed Off/ Stuck Pipe
8:30 9:30 1.00 Work pipeFreel Start Misting/Clean Well Bore Up
9:30 10:00 0.50 Rig Service/ Tighten Swivel Packing
10:00 13:00 3.00 Drill Actuall 97'-175'
13:00 15:00 2.00 Cire Hole Clean/ TOOHI MU 8" DC/ TIH
15:00 16:00 1.00 DrilliActuall 175'-204'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Surveyl Mis-Run
16:30 17:00 0.50 Drill Actual/ 204'-235'
17:00 19:00 2.00 Survey/ 3- Mis-Runs WI7degree Clockl 3/4 Degree With 14 Degree Clock g 226'
19:00 1:00 6.00 Drill Actual/ 235'-516'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Survey g 47T 1/2 Degree
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drill Actuall 516'-733'

Total f leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Nrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 38K

irs. Mob.jDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in 0 Out DOWN 36K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 38K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT tECOFD
lEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
GME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
diEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
WS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
A DAPP TFA Open
slyP Fed-Zan .1ET Open

(CT23 2007 Dura¢ DWH IN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 668
41 MaxGel HRS 16.50

DIV.0fGIL,0MuMilliroCAKE Cotton seed huifs T/B/G
1 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

JAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
9kSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.5

DETI I TNGASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC )RD
No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimatil

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAlcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 s1RottE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
EASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 15, 2007
2G NAMEANDNUMBER COUWrY GTATE Days froin spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 1
FUTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Nrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Rqxst Net

733' | 16.5 16.5 j 668' 20" Conductor 65' RKB 8
YnvrY AT REPORTEME REPORWDBY

Ðrilling Actual W/ 17-1/2" Hammer C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
TNARKS KBTO GL

Stuck Drill String Attempting To Dust Per Hammer Hands Request 15
TIME LO 2

mou To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 DrillActuall 65'-82'
7:00 7:30 0.50 Dry Out Hole To Dust
7:30 8:00 0.50 Lay Down 8" DC PU 6" Drill Collar
8:00 8:30 0.50 DrillActual/ 82'-9T Hit Water/ Packed Off/ Stuck Pipe
8:30 9:30 1.00 Work pipeFreel Start Misting/Clean Well Bore Up
9:30 10:00 0.50 Rig Service/ Tighten Swivel Packing
10:00 13:00 3.00 Drill Actuall 97'-175'
13:00 15:00 2.00 Cire Hole Clean/ TOOHI MU 8" DC/ TIH
15:00 16:00 1.00 DrilliActuall 175'-204'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Surveyl Mis-Run
16:30 17:00 0.50 Drill Actual/ 204'-235'
17:00 19:00 2.00 Survey/ 3- Mis-Runs WI7degree Clockl 3/4 Degree With 14 Degree Clock g 226'
19:00 1:00 6.00 Drill Actual/ 235'-516'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Survey g 47T 1/2 Degree
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drill Actuall 516'-733'

Total f leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Nrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 38K

irs. Mob.jDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in 0 Out DOWN 36K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 38K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT tECOFD
lEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
GME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
diEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
WS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
A DAPP TFA Open
slyP Fed-Zan .1ET Open

(CT23 2007 Dura¢ DWH IN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 668
41 MaxGel HRS 16.50

DIV.0fGIL,0MuMilliro
CAKE Cotton seed huifs T/B/G

1 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

JAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
9kSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.5

DETI I TNGASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC )RD

No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimatil

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAlcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 s1RottE 8.50

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
EASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 15, 2007
2G NAMEANDNUMBER COUWrY GTATE Days froin spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 1
FUTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Nrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Rqxst Net

733' | 16.5 16.5 j 668' 20" Conductor 65' RKB 8
YnvrY AT REPORTEME REPORWDBY

Ðrilling Actual W/ 17-1/2" Hammer C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
TNARKS KBTO GL

Stuck Drill String Attempting To Dust Per Hammer Hands Request 15
TIME LO 2

mou To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 DrillActuall 65'-82'
7:00 7:30 0.50 Dry Out Hole To Dust
7:30 8:00 0.50 Lay Down 8" DC PU 6" Drill Collar
8:00 8:30 0.50 DrillActual/ 82'-9T Hit Water/ Packed Off/ Stuck Pipe
8:30 9:30 1.00 Work pipeFreel Start Misting/Clean Well Bore Up
9:30 10:00 0.50 Rig Service/ Tighten Swivel Packing
10:00 13:00 3.00 Drill Actuall 97'-175'
13:00 15:00 2.00 Cire Hole Clean/ TOOHI MU 8" DC/ TIH
15:00 16:00 1.00 DrilliActuall 175'-204'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Surveyl Mis-Run
16:30 17:00 0.50 Drill Actual/ 204'-235'
17:00 19:00 2.00 Survey/ 3- Mis-Runs WI7degree Clockl 3/4 Degree With 14 Degree Clock g 226'
19:00 1:00 6.00 Drill Actual/ 235'-516'
1:00 1:30 0.50 Survey g 47T 1/2 Degree
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drill Actuall 516'-733'

Total f leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Nrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours NA UP 38K

irs. Mob.jDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 360 in 0 Out DOWN 36K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 38K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT tECOFD
lEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
GME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
diEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas Copco
WS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
A DAPP TFA Open
slyP Fed-Zan .1ET Open

(CT23 2007 Dura¢ DWH IN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 668
41 MaxGel HRS 16.50

DIV.0fGIL,0MuMilliro
CAKE Cotton seed huifs T/B/G

1 DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

JAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
9kSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.5

DETI I TNGASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC )RD

No. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimatil

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAlcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 s1RottE 8.50



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 16, 2007
RM NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
TOTALDEPFN Rat. Hrs cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING 512E,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 9
ACTIVHYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Rigging Up Cementers C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Two Bad Joints Of Csg Had o Weld/ Casing Crew Had Wrong Equipment 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drill Actuall 733'-922'I TD Surface Drilled To 922' To Fit Surface Casing
10:30 11:00 0.50 Circulate Wellbore Clean For Short Trip
11:00 11:30 0.50 Survey @871' 1/2 Degree
11:30 14:00 2.50 Short Trip TOOH To DC'SI TlH To 880'/ Break Circ/ Circ. Well Bore Clean/ Set Kelly Back & TOOH
14:00 15:00 1.00 Break Hammer Bit & Lay Down Same With Rotating Head Bearing Assembly
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig Up Casing Crew/ Held Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
16:00 18:00 2.00 Run Casing/ Weld On Csing Shoel Let Cooll Casers Had Wrong Size Slips
18:00 20:00 2.00 Wait On 13-3/8" Casing Slips
20:00 22:00 2.00 Install Correct Slip Dies In Casing Slips
22:00 0:00 2.00 Run casing/Collar Egged On Top Of Shoe Joint/ Weld On Float Collar
0:00 3:30 3.50 Run 21 Jts 909.39' Of 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 Surface Casing
3:30 4:00 0.50 Rig DownWeatherford Casign Crew
4:00 6:00 2.00 Rig Up Cementers

Total flows 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.fDemoh 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 720 in 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO, OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
11ME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Atlas COpco

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT K4 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
AU( Û T2 3 LUUA c-32s TOTALFEET 857
pH MaxGei HRs 21.00
CAKE 11 . UEAll..,MAb5tMININi Conon seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%souns cuMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPflON LE:NGWi- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncMnauen / Azimulk

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.0Û MODEL SPSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VN3 Ca sh 7 49 a Tanza eTTE A 94 &

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 16, 2007
RM NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
TOTALDEPFN Rat. Hrs cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING 512E,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 9
ACTIVHYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Rigging Up Cementers C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Two Bad Joints Of Csg Had o Weld/ Casing Crew Had Wrong Equipment 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drill Actuall 733'-922'I TD Surface Drilled To 922' To Fit Surface Casing
10:30 11:00 0.50 Circulate Wellbore Clean For Short Trip
11:00 11:30 0.50 Survey @871' 1/2 Degree
11:30 14:00 2.50 Short Trip TOOH To DC'SI TlH To 880'/ Break Circ/ Circ. Well Bore Clean/ Set Kelly Back & TOOH
14:00 15:00 1.00 Break Hammer Bit & Lay Down Same With Rotating Head Bearing Assembly
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig Up Casing Crew/ Held Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
16:00 18:00 2.00 Run Casing/ Weld On Csing Shoel Let Cooll Casers Had Wrong Size Slips
18:00 20:00 2.00 Wait On 13-3/8" Casing Slips
20:00 22:00 2.00 Install Correct Slip Dies In Casing Slips
22:00 0:00 2.00 Run casing/Collar Egged On Top Of Shoe Joint/ Weld On Float Collar
0:00 3:30 3.50 Run 21 Jts 909.39' Of 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 Surface Casing
3:30 4:00 0.50 Rig DownWeatherford Casign Crew
4:00 6:00 2.00 Rig Up Cementers

Total flows 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.fDemoh 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 720 in 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO, OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
11ME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Atlas COpco

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT K4 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
AU( Û T2 3 LUUA c-32s TOTALFEET 857
pH MaxGei HRs 21.00
CAKE 11 . UEAll..,MAb5tMININi Conon seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%souns cuMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPflON LE:NGWi- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncMnauen / Azimulk

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.0Û MODEL SPSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VN3 Ca sh 7 49 a Tanza eTTE A 94 &

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 16, 2007
RM NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
TOTALDEPFN Rat. Hrs cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING 512E,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 9
ACTIVHYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Rigging Up Cementers C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Two Bad Joints Of Csg Had o Weld/ Casing Crew Had Wrong Equipment 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drill Actuall 733'-922'I TD Surface Drilled To 922' To Fit Surface Casing
10:30 11:00 0.50 Circulate Wellbore Clean For Short Trip
11:00 11:30 0.50 Survey @871' 1/2 Degree
11:30 14:00 2.50 Short Trip TOOH To DC'SI TlH To 880'/ Break Circ/ Circ. Well Bore Clean/ Set Kelly Back & TOOH
14:00 15:00 1.00 Break Hammer Bit & Lay Down Same With Rotating Head Bearing Assembly
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig Up Casing Crew/ Held Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
16:00 18:00 2.00 Run Casing/ Weld On Csing Shoel Let Cooll Casers Had Wrong Size Slips
18:00 20:00 2.00 Wait On 13-3/8" Casing Slips
20:00 22:00 2.00 Install Correct Slip Dies In Casing Slips
22:00 0:00 2.00 Run casing/Collar Egged On Top Of Shoe Joint/ Weld On Float Collar
0:00 3:30 3.50 Run 21 Jts 909.39' Of 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 Surface Casing
3:30 4:00 0.50 Rig DownWeatherford Casign Crew
4:00 6:00 2.00 Rig Up Cementers

Total flows 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.fDemoh 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 720 in 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO, OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
11ME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Atlas COpco

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT K4 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
AU( Û T2 3 LUUA c-32s TOTALFEET 857
pH MaxGei HRs 21.00
CAKE 11 . UEAll..,MAb5tMININi Conon seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%souns cuMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPflON LE:NGWi- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncMnauen / Azimulk

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.0Û MODEL SPSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VN3 Ca sh 7 49 a Tanza eTTE A 94 &

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 16, 2007
RM NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 2
TOTALDEPFN Rat. Hrs cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING 512E,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 9
ACTIVHYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Rigging Up Cementers C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Two Bad Joints Of Csg Had o Weld/ Casing Crew Had Wrong Equipment 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drill Actuall 733'-922'I TD Surface Drilled To 922' To Fit Surface Casing
10:30 11:00 0.50 Circulate Wellbore Clean For Short Trip
11:00 11:30 0.50 Survey @871' 1/2 Degree
11:30 14:00 2.50 Short Trip TOOH To DC'SI TlH To 880'/ Break Circ/ Circ. Well Bore Clean/ Set Kelly Back & TOOH
14:00 15:00 1.00 Break Hammer Bit & Lay Down Same With Rotating Head Bearing Assembly
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig Up Casing Crew/ Held Safety Meeting Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
16:00 18:00 2.00 Run Casing/ Weld On Csing Shoel Let Cooll Casers Had Wrong Size Slips
18:00 20:00 2.00 Wait On 13-3/8" Casing Slips
20:00 22:00 2.00 Install Correct Slip Dies In Casing Slips
22:00 0:00 2.00 Run casing/Collar Egged On Top Of Shoe Joint/ Weld On Float Collar
0:00 3:30 3.50 Run 21 Jts 909.39' Of 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 Surface Casing
3:30 4:00 0.50 Rig DownWeatherford Casign Crew
4:00 6:00 2.00 Rig Up Cementers

Total flows 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.fDemoh 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 720 in 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO, OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
11ME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Atlas COpco

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT K4 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 65
AU( Û T2 3 LUUA c-32s TOTALFEET 857
pH MaxGei HRs 21.00
CAKE 11 . UEAll..,MAb5tMININi Conon seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%souns cuMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPflON LE:NGWi- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm IncMnauen / Azimulk

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.0Û MODEL SPSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VN3 Ca sh 7 49 a Tanza eTTE A 94 &



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE oaysfrom spud
Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
rCTALDEPfH Rot. His cum Ret. His FOOTAŒ DRILLED lAKTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 j 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 10
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Welding Well Head C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Sparatic Showers 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Rig UP Big 4 Cementers
7:00 9:00 2.00 Cmt 905' 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 With 1100sks Class G-Cmt{See Comments Below For Cmt Job}
9:00 10:30 1.50 Wait on Cmt/ Clean Flow Line & Cellar
10:30 11:00 0.50 Rig Down Cementers
11:00 14:00 3.00 Wait On Cmt/ Clean Cellar & Flow Line/ Weld ON Flow Line Manifold
14:00 16:30 2.50 Cut Off Rotating Head/ Cut Off 20" Conductor Pipel Cut 13-3/8" Casing
16:30 18:00 1.50 Set Well Head On Csg & Prep For Welding
18:00 6:00 12.00 Weld On Well Head/ Test Small Pin Hole Leakl Grind Out And Re-Weld/ Test Well Head Small Pin Hole

Pin Hole Leak/ Grind Out & Re-Weld/ Waiting For Well Head TO Coll Off To Test

Totai lloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 Ou DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORif 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD 48.00 MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOF D
DEFU NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MF(i Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT HECEIVFF3 K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH UN0F OlL,GAS&MININ; MaxGet HRS 21.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCDST $0.00 WT. ON Brr 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ItEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Incinauen / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V1/3 C..h 1 CO a waneem tww wm £ SC C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE oaysfrom spud
Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
rCTALDEPfH Rot. His cum Ret. His FOOTAŒ DRILLED lAKTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 j 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 10
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Welding Well Head C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Sparatic Showers 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Rig UP Big 4 Cementers
7:00 9:00 2.00 Cmt 905' 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 With 1100sks Class G-Cmt{See Comments Below For Cmt Job}
9:00 10:30 1.50 Wait on Cmt/ Clean Flow Line & Cellar
10:30 11:00 0.50 Rig Down Cementers
11:00 14:00 3.00 Wait On Cmt/ Clean Cellar & Flow Line/ Weld ON Flow Line Manifold
14:00 16:30 2.50 Cut Off Rotating Head/ Cut Off 20" Conductor Pipel Cut 13-3/8" Casing
16:30 18:00 1.50 Set Well Head On Csg & Prep For Welding
18:00 6:00 12.00 Weld On Well Head/ Test Small Pin Hole Leakl Grind Out And Re-Weld/ Test Well Head Small Pin Hole

Pin Hole Leak/ Grind Out & Re-Weld/ Waiting For Well Head TO Coll Off To Test

Totai lloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 Ou DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORif 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD 48.00 MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOF D
DEFU NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MF(i Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT HECEIVFF3 K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH UN0F OlL,GAS&MININ; MaxGet HRS 21.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCDST $0.00 WT. ON Brr 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ItEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Incinauen / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V1/3 C..h 1 CO a waneem tww wm £ SC C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE oaysfrom spud
Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
rCTALDEPfH Rot. His cum Ret. His FOOTAŒ DRILLED lAKTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 j 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 10
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Welding Well Head C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Sparatic Showers 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Rig UP Big 4 Cementers
7:00 9:00 2.00 Cmt 905' 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 With 1100sks Class G-Cmt{See Comments Below For Cmt Job}
9:00 10:30 1.50 Wait on Cmt/ Clean Flow Line & Cellar
10:30 11:00 0.50 Rig Down Cementers
11:00 14:00 3.00 Wait On Cmt/ Clean Cellar & Flow Line/ Weld ON Flow Line Manifold
14:00 16:30 2.50 Cut Off Rotating Head/ Cut Off 20" Conductor Pipel Cut 13-3/8" Casing
16:30 18:00 1.50 Set Well Head On Csg & Prep For Welding
18:00 6:00 12.00 Weld On Well Head/ Test Small Pin Hole Leakl Grind Out And Re-Weld/ Test Well Head Small Pin Hole

Pin Hole Leak/ Grind Out & Re-Weld/ Waiting For Well Head TO Coll Off To Test

Totai lloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 Ou DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORif 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD 48.00 MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOF D
DEFU NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MF(i Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT HECEIVFF3 K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH UN0F OlL,GAS&MININ; MaxGet HRS 21.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCDST $0.00 WT. ON Brr 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ItEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Incinauen / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V1/3 C..h 1 CO a waneem tww wm £ SC C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE oaysfrom spud
Unit Drilling Co . Rig 132 carbon Utah 3
rCTALDEPfH Rot. His cum Ret. His FOOTAŒ DRILLED lAKTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

922' 4.5 21 j 189' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 10
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Welding Well Head C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Cloudy & Sparatic Showers 15
TIME LOG

mose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Rig UP Big 4 Cementers
7:00 9:00 2.00 Cmt 905' 13-3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 With 1100sks Class G-Cmt{See Comments Below For Cmt Job}
9:00 10:30 1.50 Wait on Cmt/ Clean Flow Line & Cellar
10:30 11:00 0.50 Rig Down Cementers
11:00 14:00 3.00 Wait On Cmt/ Clean Cellar & Flow Line/ Weld ON Flow Line Manifold
14:00 16:30 2.50 Cut Off Rotating Head/ Cut Off 20" Conductor Pipel Cut 13-3/8" Casing
16:30 18:00 1.50 Set Well Head On Csg & Prep For Welding
18:00 6:00 12.00 Weld On Well Head/ Test Small Pin Hole Leakl Grind Out And Re-Weld/ Test Well Head Small Pin Hole

Pin Hole Leak/ Grind Out & Re-Weld/ Waiting For Well Head TO Coll Off To Test

Totai lloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gaffons Boiler Hours NA UP 48K

Hrs. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 Ou DOWN 46K
TOTAL DAYWORif 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD 48.00 MUDMATERIALS1ISED BIT RECOF D
DEFU NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MF(i Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT HECEIVFF3 K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH UN0F OlL,GAS&MININ; MaxGet HRS 21.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCDST $0.00 WT. ON Brr 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ItEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Incinauen / Azimuth

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V1/3 C..h 1 CO a waneem tww wm £ SC C



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenliwotth October 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 4
TUTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rat. Mrs R)OTAGEDRIU.ED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No.

922' 0 21 0 j13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 11
KTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Nippling Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Weld On Well Head
15:00 15:30 0.50 Test Well Head g 1650psi For 30-Mins
15:30 6:00 14.50 Nipple Up Double Ram, Choke Line, KillLine, Hydrill, Attempt To PU Kelly, Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole

Total Coum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours 12hrs UP 48K

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA AFT'FIVED Fed 744 DEFTH OUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK fil T2 3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH Max Get HRs 21.00
CAKE DIV.0F ( ll . GAN MININ( codonseed huis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGWI - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH I | M

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPSO BP80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sTRoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme
1 X/O Sub 2.62 LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenliwotth October 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 4
TUTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rat. Mrs R)OTAGEDRIU.ED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No.

922' 0 21 0 j13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 11
KTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Nippling Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Weld On Well Head
15:00 15:30 0.50 Test Well Head g 1650psi For 30-Mins
15:30 6:00 14.50 Nipple Up Double Ram, Choke Line, KillLine, Hydrill, Attempt To PU Kelly, Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole

Total Coum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours 12hrs UP 48K

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA AFT'FIVED Fed 744 DEFTH OUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK fil T2 3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH Max Get HRs 21.00
CAKE DIV.0F ( ll . GAN MININ( codonseed huis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGWI - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH I | M

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPSO BP80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sTRoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme
1 X/O Sub 2.62 LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenliwotth October 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 4
TUTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rat. Mrs R)OTAGEDRIU.ED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No.

922' 0 21 0 j13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 11
KTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Nippling Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Weld On Well Head
15:00 15:30 0.50 Test Well Head g 1650psi For 30-Mins
15:30 6:00 14.50 Nipple Up Double Ram, Choke Line, KillLine, Hydrill, Attempt To PU Kelly, Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole

Total Coum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours 12hrs UP 48K

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA AFT'FIVED Fed 744 DEFTH OUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK fil T2 3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH Max Get HRs 21.00
CAKE DIV.0F ( ll . GAN MININ( codonseed huis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGWI - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH I | M

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPSO BP80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sTRoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme
1 X/O Sub 2.62 LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenliwotth October 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Cor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 4
TUTALDEPTH Rot His cum Rat. Mrs R)OTAGEDRIU.ED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No.

922' 0 21 0 j13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 11
KTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Nippling Up C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Weld On Well Head
15:00 15:30 0.50 Test Well Head g 1650psi For 30-Mins
15:30 6:00 14.50 Nipple Up Double Ram, Choke Line, KillLine, Hydrill, Attempt To PU Kelly, Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole

Total Coum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 229/ Gallons Boiler Hours 12hrs UP 48K

Hrs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN 46K
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 48K

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 1
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 17-1/2"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG Atlas COgcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA Open
Pv/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MST K-600 SERIALNO. 121
CA AFT'FIVED Fed 744 DEFTH OUT 922
GELS Duragel DEFTHIN 65
ALK fil T2 3 2007 C-325 TOTALFEET 857
pH Max Get HRs 21.00
CAKE DIV.0F ( ll . GAN MININ( codonseed huis T/B/G 0/0/0

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 8-12K

DAPP PREVIOUS COST $0.00 RPM 68-70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 40.8

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGWI - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH I | M

1 17-1/2" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL SPSO BP80 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sTRoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme
1 X/O Sub 2.62 LINER SIZE 6.25



STATEOF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator: Marion Energy Inc Operator Account Number: N 2740

Address: 119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200

McKinney

sigte zip 75069 Phone Number: (972) 540-2967

Well i

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4301530680 Ridge Runner #1-30 NESW 20 148 7E Emery

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

99999 5ð 9/11/2007 / ý / ó 7
Comments:

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4300731229 KenilworthRailroad #1 SWD SWSE 16 13S 10E Carbon

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 99999 10/9/2007
Comments: I

weilAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establishnew entity fornew well (singlewell only) Benjamin Evans
B - Add new well to existing entity(groupor unitwell) (Please_Print)

C - Re assign wellfrom one existingentityto anotherexistingentity Ë k '
D - Re-assign well from one existingentity to a new entity signature
E . Other (Explain in comments'section) Landman 10/31/2007

Tine Date

(50000)

RECEIVED
0CT312 1

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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B - Add new well to existing entity(groupor unitwell) (Please_Print)

C - Re assign wellfrom one existingentityto anotherexistingentity Ë k '
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Tine Date

(50000)
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0CT312 1

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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Well i
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A 99999 10/9/2007
Comments: I

weilAPI
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ACTION CODES:
A - Establishnew entity fornew well (singlewell only) Benjamin Evans
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Tine Date

(50000)

RECEIVED
0CT312 1

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Marion Energy inc. -oco

- at -m

119 S Tennessee, Ste \[p \~bs
ic eMcKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLINGREPORT
"EASENMIESWELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 19, 2007
IIGNAMEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorrt spud
Unit DrillingCo . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 5
NTAL DEPN Ret. Nrs cumRet. Hrs EUTAGE DRinfD IAST CASINGSIZE,WHGHT, GRADE SETO Report A

922' 0 21 0 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 12
WIVHY ATREPORTEME REPOllTEDBY

Picking up toolsand rigging up powerswivelto wash over Kelly shuck. Richard L Tatman
tEMARMS KBTOGL
Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole, 15

TIMELÓG
mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Nipple up BOP
8:30 Rig up Bop testers and test BOPE, test Inside Bop valve, Full open safety Valve, Pipe rams, Blindrams,

Kittline valves, feliefe line Valves choke line and Choke Manifoldto 250 PGifor 5 minutes then 3000 PSI for
10 minutes.I tested Annular preventerto 250 psi for 5 minutes then 1500 PSI for 10 minutes. I Tested
Surface casing to 80% of intemal burst at the shoe (1100 PSI) for 10 minutes.

14:00 5.50 Function tested accumulator
149) Latch up Kellyand tryto pulikelly out of Cement and Failed used Jack hammer to tryto drili 1" holes

18:00 4.00 Around kelly sock to break it free from cement, Break swivel and kelly spinner off of kelly and lay them dwn
18:00 Cut Belloff top of KellySock and remove drive bushings from kelly. I Lay down 1 stand of drill collars from

22:00 4.00 DerrickI Set in piperacks / Unload 10 3/4" wash over pipeand all related equipment
22:00 Pick up 2 jointsof 10 3/4" wash pigeand cross overs to Power Swivet, Rig up powerswivel and powerUnit

6:00 8.00 Air compressor on powerswivel broken I rig up rig air to powerunit for throtteland controle air.

Total Clours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 340 Gallons Boiler Hours 12hrs UP

Hrs. Mob.(Deanok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD ŒCORD MUD MATERIALSfISED B1T RECO
DEPm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME STTNO.
flME Poly Plus SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG
vis AI. Sterate m

DAPP TFA
pyfyp Fed-Zan ÆT
MBT K-400 SERIALNO.
ca FenM DEPM OUT D CEl EDGEt.S Duragel DEPTHIN

MaxGel HRS
CAKE Canon seed hulls T/BIG

DIVOF , are à Käü2 DAILYUST $0.00 WT. ON BIT
DAPP PREVIOUSCOET $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DETI I TNGASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCREFRON I.EN6Wi - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPHI Ima-N- | Ashmn

SAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
peops. 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
SROME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc. -oco

- at -m

119 S Tennessee, Ste \[p \~bs
ic eMcKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLINGREPORT
"EASENMIESWELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 19, 2007
IIGNAMEMID NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorrt spud
Unit DrillingCo . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 5
NTAL DEPN Ret. Nrs cumRet. Hrs EUTAGE DRinfD IAST CASINGSIZE,WHGHT, GRADE SETO Report A

922' 0 21 0 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 12
WIVHY ATREPORTEME REPOllTEDBY

Picking up toolsand rigging up powerswivelto wash over Kelly shuck. Richard L Tatman
tEMARMS KBTOGL
Kelly Cemented in Rat Hole, 15

TIMELÓG
mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Nipple up BOP
8:30 Rig up Bop testers and test BOPE, test Inside Bop valve, Full open safety Valve, Pipe rams, Blindrams,

Kittline valves, feliefe line Valves choke line and Choke Manifoldto 250 PGifor 5 minutes then 3000 PSI for
10 minutes.I tested Annular preventerto 250 psi for 5 minutes then 1500 PSI for 10 minutes. I Tested
Surface casing to 80% of intemal burst at the shoe (1100 PSI) for 10 minutes.

14:00 5.50 Function tested accumulator
149) Latch up Kellyand tryto pulikelly out of Cement and Failed used Jack hammer to tryto drili 1" holes

18:00 4.00 Around kelly sock to break it free from cement, Break swivel and kelly spinner off of kelly and lay them dwn
18:00 Cut Belloff top of KellySock and remove drive bushings from kelly. I Lay down 1 stand of drill collars from

22:00 4.00 DerrickI Set in piperacks / Unload 10 3/4" wash over pipeand all related equipment
22:00 Pick up 2 jointsof 10 3/4" wash pigeand cross overs to Power Swivet, Rig up powerswivel and powerUnit

6:00 8.00 Air compressor on powerswivel broken I rig up rig air to powerunit for throtteland controle air.

Total Clours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 340 Gallons Boiler Hours 12hrs UP

Hrs. Mob.(Deanok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD ŒCORD MUD MATERIALSfISED B1T RECO
DEPm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME STTNO.
flME Poly Plus SIZE
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG
vis AI. Sterate m

DAPP TFA
pyfyp Fed-Zan ÆT
MBT K-400 SERIALNO.
ca FenM DEPM OUT D CEl EDGEt.S Duragel DEPTHIN

MaxGel HRS
CAKE Canon seed hulls T/BIG

DIVOF , are à Käü2 DAILYUST $0.00 WT. ON BIT
DAPP PREVIOUSCOET $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DETI I TNGASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCREFRON I.EN6Wi - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPHI Ima-N- | Ashmn

SAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
peops. 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
SROME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
MSEMM&WIRNO. RED DE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 20, 2007
as mmmo noen couny srm Days from spud
Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 6
fØrAL DEPm . Rd. His . cumRd. Hrs POOTAGEHURED MST CASÐGSHE, WBGHT, GMDE SETO Reput No.

922' 0 21 | 0 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 13
9cnvny arusurrum REPORTEDBY

Laying down wash pipeand Power swivel. |Richard L Tatman
BMRKS KBTO Œ.

15
TIME LOG

mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Finish rigging up and torquingup Power swivel / Wait on Graco hand to repair powerswivel / Fix hydrolic

couplers that were leaking.
12:00 2:30 14.50 Wash over Rathole shuck With 10 3/4" wash pipe./Made 47' at 02:15 I pulledkelly & sock withwinch line.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Break offpowerswivelI Laydown wash pipeand shoe.

Total i murs 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 798 Gations Boiler Hours 24

lirs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 900 in 0 Out
IOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels E

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSI ISED BIT tECOf D
OWTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
flME Poly Plus SIZE
alEIGHT Fed Seal MFG
VIS AL.Sterata TYPE
dit DAPP TFA
W/YP Fed-Zen JET
WT K-400 SERIALNO.

Fed 744 DEP1NOUT
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN
Au c-325 TOTALFEET

MaxW HRS NiIVO2 2007
3KE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
2 DAILYCO5T $0.00 WT.ONBir DMOF X, GAS&MWING
DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILI.ING ASSE IBLY PUMP f ATA WEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPRON U!NGm - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM ImMmNw j AM

MANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
sm0KE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
MSEMM&WIRNO. RED DE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 20, 2007
as mmmo noen couny srm Days from spud
Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 6
fØrAL DEPm . Rd. His . cumRd. Hrs POOTAGEHURED MST CASÐGSHE, WBGHT, GMDE SETO Reput No.

922' 0 21 | 0 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 13
9cnvny arusurrum REPORTEDBY

Laying down wash pipeand Power swivel. |Richard L Tatman
BMRKS KBTO Œ.

15
TIME LOG

mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Finish rigging up and torquingup Power swivel / Wait on Graco hand to repair powerswivel / Fix hydrolic

couplers that were leaking.
12:00 2:30 14.50 Wash over Rathole shuck With 10 3/4" wash pipe./Made 47' at 02:15 I pulledkelly & sock withwinch line.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Break offpowerswivelI Laydown wash pipeand shoe.

Total i murs 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 798 Gations Boiler Hours 24

lirs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 900 in 0 Out
IOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels E

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSI ISED BIT tECOf D
OWTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
flME Poly Plus SIZE
alEIGHT Fed Seal MFG
VIS AL.Sterata TYPE
dit DAPP TFA
W/YP Fed-Zen JET
WT K-400 SERIALNO.

Fed 744 DEP1NOUT
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN
Au c-325 TOTALFEET

MaxW HRS NiIVO2 2007
3KE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
2 DAILYCO5T $0.00 WT.ONBir DMOF X, GAS&MWING
DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILI.ING ASSE IBLY PUMP f ATA WEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPRON U!NGm - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM ImMmNw j AM

MANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
sm0KE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
MSEMM&WIRNO. RED DE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 20, 2007
as mmmo noen couny srm Days from spud
Unit Drilling corp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 6
fØrAL DEPm . Rd. His . cumRd. Hrs POOTAGEHURED MST CASÐGSHE, WBGHT, GMDE SETO Reput No.

922' 0 21 | 0 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 13
9cnvny arusurrum REPORTEDBY

Laying down wash pipeand Power swivel. |Richard L Tatman
BMRKS KBTO Œ.

15
TIME LOG

mon To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Finish rigging up and torquingup Power swivel / Wait on Graco hand to repair powerswivel / Fix hydrolic

couplers that were leaking.
12:00 2:30 14.50 Wash over Rathole shuck With 10 3/4" wash pipe./Made 47' at 02:15 I pulledkelly & sock withwinch line.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Break offpowerswivelI Laydown wash pipeand shoe.

Total i murs 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 798 Gations Boiler Hours 24

lirs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 900 in 0 Out
IOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels E

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSI ISED BIT tECOf D
OWTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
flME Poly Plus SIZE
alEIGHT Fed Seal MFG
VIS AL.Sterata TYPE
dit DAPP TFA
W/YP Fed-Zen JET
WT K-400 SERIALNO.

Fed 744 DEP1NOUT
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN
Au c-325 TOTALFEET

MaxW HRS NiIVO2 2007
3KE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
2 DAILYCO5T $0.00 WT.ONBir DMOF X, GAS&MWING
DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T $0.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILI.ING ASSE IBLY PUMP f ATA WEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCMPRON U!NGm - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM ImMmNw j AM

MANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
sm0KE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAR.YDRILLING REPORT

EASEMM & WER NO. RRD DATE

Raiknad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 21, 2007
3G NME ANDRMBER COUNTY SMTE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 7
forÆ DOW RM. as cumRd. Ms FOOTAGEDRIRED MST CASWGSIZE,WBGIT, GMDE SETO Report No.

922' | 0 21 0 13-3/8" 54.5# STC 3-55 905' RKB 14
-ar aumsna |RWORED BY

Picking up tools ¡Richard L Tatman
sans untoa.

15
TIME LOG

FRON TO HOURS ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Break down and rackout powerswivel
8:00 14:00 6.00 Nipple up rotating head and work on cleaning up location. Trench from flair pitto reserve pit
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pull kelly out of Transport sock and rig up flair lines
18:00 nopple up flowline, Work on yellowdog, hook up gas buster lines and flair lines,prime yellow dog.

6:00 12.00 Pick up and make up kelly,pickup kelly sock I make up saver sub.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 684 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
ss.Nob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 900 in 0 Out DOWN

fDTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Bartels ROTATE
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT RECOF4

DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Ett NO.
flME PolyPlus SIZE
WEIGHT Fei Saat MFG
VIS AL.Sterde TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
PV/yP Fed-Zan JET
MST K SERIALNO.

C-325 TOTALFEET
pH MaxW HRS FOVU2 2007
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT -, GAS&fdgg
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVEosT $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPHON LENGHi - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPM Incinaden / AM

BiAME Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
BOODEL SPSO 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
sm0ME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAR.YDRILLING REPORT

EASEMM & WER NO. RRD DATE

Raiknad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 21, 2007
3G NME ANDRMBER COUNTY SMTE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 7
forÆ DOW RM. as cumRd. Ms FOOTAGEDRIRED MST CASWGSIZE,WBGIT, GMDE SETO Report No.

922' | 0 21 0 13-3/8" 54.5# STC 3-55 905' RKB 14
-ar aumsna |RWORED BY

Picking up tools ¡Richard L Tatman
sans untoa.

15
TIME LOG

FRON TO HOURS ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Break down and rackout powerswivel
8:00 14:00 6.00 Nipple up rotating head and work on cleaning up location. Trench from flair pitto reserve pit
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pull kelly out of Transport sock and rig up flair lines
18:00 nopple up flowline, Work on yellowdog, hook up gas buster lines and flair lines,prime yellow dog.

6:00 12.00 Pick up and make up kelly,pickup kelly sock I make up saver sub.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 684 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
ss.Nob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 900 in 0 Out DOWN

fDTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Bartels ROTATE
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT RECOF4

DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Ett NO.
flME PolyPlus SIZE
WEIGHT Fei Saat MFG
VIS AL.Sterde TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
PV/yP Fed-Zan JET
MST K SERIALNO.

C-325 TOTALFEET
pH MaxW HRS FOVU2 2007
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT -, GAS&fdgg
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVEosT $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPHON LENGHi - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPM Incinaden / AM

BiAME Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
BOODEL SPSO 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
sm0ME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAR.YDRILLING REPORT

EASEMM & WER NO. RRD DATE

Raiknad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 21, 2007
3G NME ANDRMBER COUNTY SMTE Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 7
forÆ DOW RM. as cumRd. Ms FOOTAGEDRIRED MST CASWGSIZE,WBGIT, GMDE SETO Report No.

922' | 0 21 0 13-3/8" 54.5# STC 3-55 905' RKB 14
-ar aumsna |RWORED BY

Picking up tools ¡Richard L Tatman
sans untoa.

15
TIME LOG

FRON TO HOURS ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Break down and rackout powerswivel
8:00 14:00 6.00 Nipple up rotating head and work on cleaning up location. Trench from flair pitto reserve pit
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pull kelly out of Transport sock and rig up flair lines
18:00 nopple up flowline, Work on yellowdog, hook up gas buster lines and flair lines,prime yellow dog.

6:00 12.00 Pick up and make up kelly,pickup kelly sock I make up saver sub.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED 684 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
ss.Nob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 900 in 0 Out DOWN

fDTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Bartels ROTATE
MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT RECOF4

DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Ett NO.
flME PolyPlus SIZE
WEIGHT Fei Saat MFG
VIS AL.Sterde TYPE
WL DAPP TFA
PV/yP Fed-Zan JET
MST K SERIALNO.

C-325 TOTALFEET
pH MaxW HRS FOVU2 2007
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT -, GAS&fdgg
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVEosT $0.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
NO. DESCRIPHON LENGHi - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPM Incinaden / AM

BiAME Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
BOODEL SPSO 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
sm0ME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas )5069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
EASEMME &WELLNO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October22, 2007

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 carbon utah 8
WTALDEPm Rat His cumRct as NOTAGE CWHED LASTCASMGSZE, WBGHT, GRADE SETO REµmt h

985' 3 24 | 63 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 15
IVW Ar REPORTRME WORD BY

Drilling12 3/8" hole at 985' |Richard LTatman
SMARK$ KBTOGL
I am having siriouse issue wi h the rig crews non-productivity and I refuse to sign ladc for the last 3 days. 15

TIME LÒG
mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Pick up 2-8" Collars and 1-6" Collar thenmake up hammer and tripin 4 stands of 6" DC
9:00 11:00 2.00 Torque Kelly unload Hole at 500'
11:00 13:00 2.00 Trip in the hole with 5 Stands Drill pipebreak down 3 g and Kelly up
13:00 16:00 3.00 Waiting on welder to fix Crack in flowline and BOP tester to test Kelly
16:00 16:30 0.50 Pressure test upper and lower Kellyvalves to 250 PSI for 5 min. then Test to 3000 PSI for 10 Min.
16:30 20:00 3.50 Work on Flair lines, Weider repair Flowline.
20·00 20:30 0.50 Pull out of hole To the top of the Drill collars
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pick up DrillingJars (drillerforgot to pickup on way in hole)
21:00 22:00 1.00 Change Slip dies / Rig service
22:00 22:30 0.50 Trip in hole, Tag cement, Kelly up
22:30 0:30 2.00 DrillingFloat cement and shoe tract
0:30 2:30 2.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 922' to 956'
2:30 5:00 2.50 Reaming tighthole
5:00 6:00 1.00 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 956' to 985'

Total lleurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP 56,000

Ass. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 56,000
TOTALDAYWORW 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 56,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOF3
DEPTH NO. OF SADCS/LBS PRODUCTNAME ET NO. 3
GME PolyPlus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG AtlaS CagCO

VIS AL.Sterate TiPE q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
rvive RECE D Fed-Zan ET Open
MET ' ' KAiCO SERIALNo. 61110651-06

unVO2 2(7 Fed ¾ DERH OtK
GELS Durag DEPTHIN 922
ALK ¡ pp p C-325 TOTALFEET 63.8
M MaxGel HRs 3.00

:AKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BET 8-12 K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOUDS CUMUIATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 21.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC 3RD
NO. DESCMPRON LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Tma-Nu j AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 BitSub 2.00 MODEi. 8PSO SPSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 smonE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VH3 C.Ja CO a vaseen aww·sae C SE C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas )5069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
EASEMME &WELLNO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October22, 2007

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 carbon utah 8
WTALDEPm Rat His cumRct as NOTAGE CWHED LASTCASMGSZE, WBGHT, GRADE SETO REµmt h

985' 3 24 | 63 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 15
IVW Ar REPORTRME WORD BY

Drilling12 3/8" hole at 985' |Richard LTatman
SMARK$ KBTOGL
I am having siriouse issue wi h the rig crews non-productivity and I refuse to sign ladc for the last 3 days. 15

TIME LÒG
mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Pick up 2-8" Collars and 1-6" Collar thenmake up hammer and tripin 4 stands of 6" DC
9:00 11:00 2.00 Torque Kelly unload Hole at 500'
11:00 13:00 2.00 Trip in the hole with 5 Stands Drill pipebreak down 3 g and Kelly up
13:00 16:00 3.00 Waiting on welder to fix Crack in flowline and BOP tester to test Kelly
16:00 16:30 0.50 Pressure test upper and lower Kellyvalves to 250 PSI for 5 min. then Test to 3000 PSI for 10 Min.
16:30 20:00 3.50 Work on Flair lines, Weider repair Flowline.
20·00 20:30 0.50 Pull out of hole To the top of the Drill collars
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pick up DrillingJars (drillerforgot to pickup on way in hole)
21:00 22:00 1.00 Change Slip dies / Rig service
22:00 22:30 0.50 Trip in hole, Tag cement, Kelly up
22:30 0:30 2.00 DrillingFloat cement and shoe tract
0:30 2:30 2.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 922' to 956'
2:30 5:00 2.50 Reaming tighthole
5:00 6:00 1.00 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 956' to 985'

Total lleurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP 56,000

Ass. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 56,000
TOTALDAYWORW 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 56,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOF3
DEPTH NO. OF SADCS/LBS PRODUCTNAME ET NO. 3
GME PolyPlus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG AtlaS CagCO

VIS AL.Sterate TiPE q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
rvive RECE D Fed-Zan ET Open

MET ' ' KAiCO SERIALNo. 61110651-06
unVO2 2(7 Fed ¾ DERH OtK

GELS Durag DEPTHIN 922
ALK ¡ pp p C-325 TOTALFEET 63.8
M MaxGel HRs 3.00

:AKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BET 8-12 K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOUDS CUMUIATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 21.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC 3RD
NO. DESCMPRON LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Tma-Nu j AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 BitSub 2.00 MODEi. 8PSO SPSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 smonE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VH3 C.Ja CO a vaseen aww·sae C SE C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas )5069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
EASEMME &WELLNO. RELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October22, 2007

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 carbon utah 8
WTALDEPm Rat His cumRct as NOTAGE CWHED LASTCASMGSZE, WBGHT, GRADE SETO REµmt h

985' 3 24 | 63 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 15
IVW Ar REPORTRME WORD BY

Drilling12 3/8" hole at 985' |Richard LTatman
SMARK$ KBTOGL
I am having siriouse issue wi h the rig crews non-productivity and I refuse to sign ladc for the last 3 days. 15

TIME LÒG
mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Pick up 2-8" Collars and 1-6" Collar thenmake up hammer and tripin 4 stands of 6" DC
9:00 11:00 2.00 Torque Kelly unload Hole at 500'
11:00 13:00 2.00 Trip in the hole with 5 Stands Drill pipebreak down 3 g and Kelly up
13:00 16:00 3.00 Waiting on welder to fix Crack in flowline and BOP tester to test Kelly
16:00 16:30 0.50 Pressure test upper and lower Kellyvalves to 250 PSI for 5 min. then Test to 3000 PSI for 10 Min.
16:30 20:00 3.50 Work on Flair lines, Weider repair Flowline.
20·00 20:30 0.50 Pull out of hole To the top of the Drill collars
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pick up DrillingJars (drillerforgot to pickup on way in hole)
21:00 22:00 1.00 Change Slip dies / Rig service
22:00 22:30 0.50 Trip in hole, Tag cement, Kelly up
22:30 0:30 2.00 DrillingFloat cement and shoe tract
0:30 2:30 2.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 922' to 956'
2:30 5:00 2.50 Reaming tighthole
5:00 6:00 1.00 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 956' to 985'

Total lleurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP 56,000

Ass. Mob.]Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 56,000
TOTALDAYWORW 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 56,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOF3
DEPTH NO. OF SADCS/LBS PRODUCTNAME ET NO. 3
GME PolyPlus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIGHT Fed Seal MFG AtlaS CagCO

VIS AL.Sterate TiPE q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
rvive RECE D Fed-Zan ET Open

MET ' ' KAiCO SERIALNo. 61110651-06
unVO2 2(7 Fed ¾ DERH OtK

GELS Durag DEPTHIN 922
ALK ¡ pp p C-325 TOTALFEET 63.8
M MaxGel HRs 3.00

:AKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BET 8-12 K

DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOUDS CUMUIATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 21.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC 3RD
NO. DESCMPRON LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Tma-Nu j AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 BitSub 2.00 MODEi. 8PSO SPSO 477 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 smonE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i VH3 C.Ja CO a vaseen aww·sae C SE C



Marion Energy inc.
119 5 Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

ŒASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STW Days Womspud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 9
TOTALDEPfH Ret. His cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

2120' 21.5 45.5 1135 ¡13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 16
4CRVHYAf REPORTEME REPORTEDBY

Drilling 12 3/8" hole at 2120' / Dusting! ¡Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.
Hole in tiowline under rig flor r / Fixed with duct tape until welder arives. 15

TIME LhŠ
moss to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 985' to 1017'
6:30 7:30 1.00 Circulate hole clean with stiff foam, turn injection pumpoff and dry hole up.
7:30 12:00 4.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1017' to 1268'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
12:30 16:00 3.50 Dritiing12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1268' to 1423'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Wireline Survey =

.5 Deg. g 1389'
16:30 2:00 9.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1423' to 1925'
2:00 2:30 0.50 Wireline Survey = 1 Deg. @ 1877"
2:30 6:00 3.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1925' to 2120'

Total f iours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gallons Boiter Hours 24 UP 84,000

Hrs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours In 0 Out DOWN 84,000
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 84,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOF;)
DEFm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bif NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIŒr Fed Seal MFG AtlaS CapcO
VIs AL.Sterate TYPe q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
PvfyP e , e.. Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT L VC K(iCO SERIALNo. 61110651-06

ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 1198
pH DIV.0FGlL,0>1 [ENG MGel HRs 24.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
cL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 48.9

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCMPflON LENGm - FT PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPM Incinaden / Am

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 ptAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 SGODEL SPSO 8P80 4T7 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 5 Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

ŒASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STW Days Womspud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 9
TOTALDEPfH Ret. His cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

2120' 21.5 45.5 1135 ¡13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 16
4CRVHYAf REPORTEME REPORTEDBY

Drilling 12 3/8" hole at 2120' / Dusting! ¡Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.
Hole in tiowline under rig flor r / Fixed with duct tape until welder arives. 15

TIME LhŠ
moss to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 985' to 1017'
6:30 7:30 1.00 Circulate hole clean with stiff foam, turn injection pumpoff and dry hole up.
7:30 12:00 4.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1017' to 1268'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
12:30 16:00 3.50 Dritiing12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1268' to 1423'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Wireline Survey =

.5 Deg. g 1389'
16:30 2:00 9.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1423' to 1925'
2:00 2:30 0.50 Wireline Survey = 1 Deg. @ 1877"
2:30 6:00 3.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1925' to 2120'

Total f iours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gallons Boiter Hours 24 UP 84,000

Hrs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours In 0 Out DOWN 84,000
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 84,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOF;)
DEFm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bif NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIŒr Fed Seal MFG AtlaS CapcO
VIs AL.Sterate TYPe q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
PvfyP e , e.. Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT L VC K(iCO SERIALNo. 61110651-06

ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 1198
pH DIV.0FGlL,0>1 [ENG MGel HRs 24.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
cL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 48.9

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCMPflON LENGm - FT PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPM Incinaden / Am

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 ptAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 SGODEL SPSO 8P80 4T7 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 5 Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

ŒASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STW Days Womspud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 9
TOTALDEPfH Ret. His cumRot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

2120' 21.5 45.5 1135 ¡13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 16
4CRVHYAf REPORTEME REPORTEDBY

Drilling 12 3/8" hole at 2120' / Dusting! ¡Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.
Hole in tiowline under rig flor r / Fixed with duct tape until welder arives. 15

TIME LhŠ
moss to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 985' to 1017'
6:30 7:30 1.00 Circulate hole clean with stiff foam, turn injection pumpoff and dry hole up.
7:30 12:00 4.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1017' to 1268'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
12:30 16:00 3.50 Dritiing12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1268' to 1423'
16:00 16:30 0.50 Wireline Survey =

.5 Deg. g 1389'
16:30 2:00 9.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1423' to 1925'
2:00 2:30 0.50 Wireline Survey = 1 Deg. @ 1877"
2:30 6:00 3.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 1925' to 2120'

Total f iours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gallons Boiter Hours 24 UP 84,000

Hrs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours In 0 Out DOWN 84,000
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 84,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSf ISED BIT RECOF;)
DEFm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bif NO. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIŒr Fed Seal MFG AtlaS CapcO
VIs AL.Sterate TYPe q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
PvfyP e , e.. Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT L VC K(iCO SERIALNo. 61110651-06

ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 1198
pH DIV.0FGlL,0>1 [ENG MGel HRs 24.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
cL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 48.9

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
No. DESCMPflON LENGm - FT PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPM Incinaden / Am

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 ptAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 SGODEL SPSO 8P80 4T7 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 SROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENME &WEU.ND. RELD DATE

Railmad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 24, 2007
RIGNME ANDNUMBER COUIRY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrilling Co . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 10
fØTALDEPTH Rot. His cumRA Hrs FDDTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSI2E, WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report Na

3712' 21.5 67 1597' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 17
HY ATREPORTRME REPORTEDBY

Drilling12 3/8" hole at 3717' / Dusting! Richard L Tatman
KBTOGL.

15
TIME LO3

mon m nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2120' to 2238 WI 2800 CFM
7:00 7:30 0.50 Wireline Survey = 1 Deg. @2196"
7:30 10:00 2.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2238 to 2456' W/ 2800 CFM
10:00 10:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
10:30 16:00 5.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2456' to 2835' WI 3500 CFM
16:00 16:30 0.50 Blow hole clean for 30 min.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Wireline Survey =

.1 Deg. g 2810'
17:00 3:00 10.00 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2835' to 3555' W/ 3500 CFM
3:00 3:30 0.50 Wireline survey=

.1 Deg. (I) 3502'
3:30 6:00 2.50 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3555' to 3712' WI 3500 CFM

Total Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 644 Galtons Boiler Hours 24 UP 75,000

Hrs. Nob./Demot 0.00 Bble. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 72,000
TOTALDAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 73,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT tECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTTNo. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIGir tal Seal MFG Atlas CagcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
PVfYP Fed-Zan JET open
M" RECE IVE K-600 SERIALNo. 61110651¾
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT
GELS NOVO2 2007 Duragel DEPTHIN 922
AtX C-325 TOTALFEET 1198
pH pg Op (p pop MaxGel HRs 24.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 48.9

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA hŒVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCMPHON LEN61H - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncinaUen | AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 BitSub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sm0KE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
9 VH3 Cush 3 £9 a wasmus owwm A 3¾ C 3C 4 OOOf fi

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENME &WEU.ND. RELD DATE

Railmad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 24, 2007
RIGNME ANDNUMBER COUIRY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrilling Co . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 10
fØTALDEPTH Rot. His cumRA Hrs FDDTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSI2E, WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report Na

3712' 21.5 67 1597' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 17
HY ATREPORTRME REPORTEDBY

Drilling12 3/8" hole at 3717' / Dusting! Richard L Tatman
KBTOGL.

15
TIME LO3

mon m nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2120' to 2238 WI 2800 CFM
7:00 7:30 0.50 Wireline Survey = 1 Deg. @2196"
7:30 10:00 2.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2238 to 2456' W/ 2800 CFM
10:00 10:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
10:30 16:00 5.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2456' to 2835' WI 3500 CFM
16:00 16:30 0.50 Blow hole clean for 30 min.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Wireline Survey =

.1 Deg. g 2810'
17:00 3:00 10.00 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2835' to 3555' W/ 3500 CFM
3:00 3:30 0.50 Wireline survey=

.1 Deg. (I) 3502'
3:30 6:00 2.50 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3555' to 3712' WI 3500 CFM

Total Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 644 Galtons Boiler Hours 24 UP 75,000

Hrs. Nob./Demot 0.00 Bble. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 72,000
TOTALDAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 73,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT tECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTTNo. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIGir tal Seal MFG Atlas CagcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
PVfYP Fed-Zan JET open
M" RECE IVE K-600 SERIALNo. 61110651¾
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT
GELS NOVO2 2007 Duragel DEPTHIN 922
AtX C-325 TOTALFEET 1198
pH pg Op (p pop MaxGel HRs 24.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 48.9

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA hŒVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCMPHON LEN61H - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncinaUen | AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 BitSub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sm0KE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
9 VH3 Cush 3 £9 a wasmus owwm A 3¾ C 3C 4 OOOf fi

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENME &WEU.ND. RELD DATE

Railmad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 24, 2007
RIGNME ANDNUMBER COUIRY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrilling Co . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 10
fØTALDEPTH Rot. His cumRA Hrs FDDTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSI2E, WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report Na

3712' 21.5 67 1597' 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 17
HY ATREPORTRME REPORTEDBY

Drilling12 3/8" hole at 3717' / Dusting! Richard L Tatman
KBTOGL.

15
TIME LO3

mon m nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2120' to 2238 WI 2800 CFM
7:00 7:30 0.50 Wireline Survey = 1 Deg. @2196"
7:30 10:00 2.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2238 to 2456' W/ 2800 CFM
10:00 10:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
10:30 16:00 5.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2456' to 2835' WI 3500 CFM
16:00 16:30 0.50 Blow hole clean for 30 min.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Wireline Survey =

.1 Deg. g 2810'
17:00 3:00 10.00 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 2835' to 3555' W/ 3500 CFM
3:00 3:30 0.50 Wireline survey=

.1 Deg. (I) 3502'
3:30 6:00 2.50 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3555' to 3712' WI 3500 CFM

Total Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 644 Galtons Boiler Hours 24 UP 75,000

Hrs. Nob./Demot 0.00 Bble. Water hauled last 24 hours in 0 Out DOWN 72,000
TOTALDAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 73,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT tECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BTTNo. 2
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIGir tal Seal MFG Atlas CagcO

VIS AL.Sterate TYPE Q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA
PVfYP Fed-Zan JET open
M" RECE IVE K-600 SERIALNo. 61110651¾
CA Fed 744 DEFTHOUT
GELS NOVO2 2007 Duragel DEPTHIN 922
AtX C-325 TOTALFEET 1198
pH pg Op (p pop MaxGel HRs 24.50
CAKE Cotton seed hulls T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 48.9

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA hŒVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCMPHON LEN61H - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncinaUen | AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 BitSub 2.00 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 sm0KE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
9 VH3 Cush 3 £9 a wasmus owwm A 3¾ C 3C 4 OOOf fi



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASEMME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilwoith October 25, 2007
RIGIMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE• Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
TOTALÐEPIN Ret Hrs cum Ret His IOOTAGEDRittED 1A5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GitADE SET@ Rqxxt a

4153' | 6 73 | 441 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 18
ACHVHYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Stuck pipe While puffingout « f the hole apparently something solid fell in on us. Posibly cement from Shoe. 15
TIME LOG

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3712' to 4153' WI 3500 CFM
12:00 12:30 0.50 Circulate bottoms up
12:30 14:00 1.50 Pull out of hole for loggs
14:00 18:30 4.50 Stuck pipe at 2783' Work stuck pipe/ Jar on stuck pipe.
18:30 19:00 0.50 Free Pipe / Set Kelly back.
19:00 20:00 1.00 Pull out of hole / lay down hammer bit Pick up Mud motor
20:00 0:30 4.50 Lay down hammer bit Pick up Mud motor / Weld Patch on Flowline.
0:30 1:00 0.50 Trip in hole with Bit Motor, 2- 8" De and 3- 6" Dc's
1:00 4:00 3.00 Strap BHA and Pick up 12 6" DC's and ars
4:00 5:30 1.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3555' to 3712' WI 3500 CFM
5:30 6:00 0.50 Mist hole @ 1500'

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Mrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gations Boiter Hours 24 UP 79,000

Hrs. Mob.JDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed fast 24 hours 0 in 0 Out DOWN 77,000
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O used on wen & road Barrels ROTATE 78,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi lSED BIT RECOFD
DEPN NO. OF SACKSliBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 2
flME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIŒrr Fed seal Mrc Atlas Capco
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA

"I" REGEI ED "" 3" °P'"
MET K-fi00 SERIALNo. 61110651-06
c^ NO\O2 2007 Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4153'
GELS Duragel DEVfHIN 922

DIVOFOl
,
P' M:N C-325 TOTALRET 3231

pH MaxGel HRS 51.50
CAKE Cxikonseed hulls T/lyG 2,2,bt,g,n,1,wt,td

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 62.7

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP OATA WEVIATION REC )RD
Na DESCMPHON LÆNGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm I •Mm= / AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V it3 Ca sh 3 C*h a waneer erwm & ¾c g" SC $ SOGI A

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASEMME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilwoith October 25, 2007
RIGIMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE• Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
TOTALÐEPIN Ret Hrs cum Ret His IOOTAGEDRittED 1A5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GitADE SET@ Rqxxt a

4153' | 6 73 | 441 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 18
ACHVHYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Stuck pipe While puffingout « f the hole apparently something solid fell in on us. Posibly cement from Shoe. 15
TIME LOG

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3712' to 4153' WI 3500 CFM
12:00 12:30 0.50 Circulate bottoms up
12:30 14:00 1.50 Pull out of hole for loggs
14:00 18:30 4.50 Stuck pipe at 2783' Work stuck pipe/ Jar on stuck pipe.
18:30 19:00 0.50 Free Pipe / Set Kelly back.
19:00 20:00 1.00 Pull out of hole / lay down hammer bit Pick up Mud motor
20:00 0:30 4.50 Lay down hammer bit Pick up Mud motor / Weld Patch on Flowline.
0:30 1:00 0.50 Trip in hole with Bit Motor, 2- 8" De and 3- 6" Dc's
1:00 4:00 3.00 Strap BHA and Pick up 12 6" DC's and ars
4:00 5:30 1.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3555' to 3712' WI 3500 CFM
5:30 6:00 0.50 Mist hole @ 1500'

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Mrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gations Boiter Hours 24 UP 79,000
Hrs. Mob.JDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed fast 24 hours 0 in 0 Out DOWN 77,000
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O used on wen & road Barrels ROTATE 78,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi lSED BIT RECOFD
DEPN NO. OF SACKSliBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 2
flME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIŒrr Fed seal Mrc Atlas Capco
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA

"I" REGEI ED "" 3" °P'"
MET K-fi00 SERIALNo. 61110651-06
c^ NO\O2 2007 Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4153'
GELS Duragel DEVfHIN 922

DIVOFOl
,
P' M:N C-325 TOTALRET 3231

pH MaxGel HRS 51.50
CAKE Cxikonseed hulls T/lyG 2,2,bt,g,n,1,wt,td

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 62.7

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP OATA WEVIATION REC )RD

Na DESCMPHON LÆNGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm I •Mm= / AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V it3 Ca sh 3 C*h a waneer erwm & ¾c g" SC $ SOGI A

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASEMME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilwoith October 25, 2007
RIGIMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE• Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
TOTALÐEPIN Ret Hrs cum Ret His IOOTAGEDRittED 1A5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GitADE SET@ Rqxxt a

4153' | 6 73 | 441 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 18
ACHVHYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Stuck pipe While puffingout « f the hole apparently something solid fell in on us. Posibly cement from Shoe. 15
TIME LOG

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Drilling12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3712' to 4153' WI 3500 CFM
12:00 12:30 0.50 Circulate bottoms up
12:30 14:00 1.50 Pull out of hole for loggs
14:00 18:30 4.50 Stuck pipe at 2783' Work stuck pipe/ Jar on stuck pipe.
18:30 19:00 0.50 Free Pipe / Set Kelly back.
19:00 20:00 1.00 Pull out of hole / lay down hammer bit Pick up Mud motor
20:00 0:30 4.50 Lay down hammer bit Pick up Mud motor / Weld Patch on Flowline.
0:30 1:00 0.50 Trip in hole with Bit Motor, 2- 8" De and 3- 6" Dc's
1:00 4:00 3.00 Strap BHA and Pick up 12 6" DC's and ars
4:00 5:30 1.50 Drilling 12 3/8" hole With Pneumatic Hammer and convex bit from 3555' to 3712' WI 3500 CFM
5:30 6:00 0.50 Mist hole @ 1500'

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Mrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 684 Gations Boiter Hours 24 UP 79,000
Hrs. Mob.JDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed fast 24 hours 0 in 0 Out DOWN 77,000
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O used on wen & road Barrels ROTATE 78,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSi lSED BIT RECOFD
DEPN NO. OF SACKSliBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 2
flME Poly Plus SIZE 12 3/8"
WEIŒrr Fed seal Mrc Atlas Capco
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE q12RDYY
WL DAPP TFA

"I" REGEI ED "" 3" °P'"
MET K-fi00 SERIALNo. 61110651-06
c^ NO\O2 2007 Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4153'
GELS Duragel DEVfHIN 922

DIVOFOl
,
P' M:N C-325 TOTALRET 3231

pH MaxGel HRS 51.50
CAKE Cxikonseed hulls T/lyG 2,2,bt,g,n,1,wt,td

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 5-6 k
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 50
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 62.7

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP OATA WEVIATION REC )RD

Na DESCMPHON LÆNGHi - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm I •Mm= / AM

1 12-3/8" Hammer 6.72 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Bit Sub 2.00 MODEL 8PSO 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
i V it3 Ca sh 3 C*h a waneer erwm & ¾c g" SC $ SOGI A



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

:BSE MME & MR NO. RRD DE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 26, 2007
RIGMME MID MUMBER COUNTY STATE oeys frorti spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 12
OTAL DEPm Rd. Was Rat & ©ØiAŒ DRIKED CA5fNGSIZE,WBGK, W©E SET@ HmµmtNa

4470' 11.5 74.5 317 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 19
t'ilVHY ATREIGETTIME REPORIEDBY

arculatinghole clean to tripout for loggs Richard L Tatman
REMRKS KBTOa.
Formation Break at top of Tu lunk Shale @4405' 15

TIME LOG
Fnose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 install New Weight indicator
6:30 13:30 7.00 Trip in hole IStage in (Kelly up and mist hole at 1500',2500', 3500'. Tag up at 405T
13:30 15:30 2.00 Mist hole and work pipeup and down To clean up hole.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Wash and ream from 405T to 4138'
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate / Pump arieated KCLsweep around to clean out hole.
18:00 5:30 11.50 Drilling12 1/4" hole from 4153' to 4470' withAir motor/ (Formation break at top of tununk4405')
5:30 6:00 0.50 Cirutate hole clean with Air Mist work pipeup and down.

Total:leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
ifra. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 1050 Galkns' Boiler flours 24 132,000

Hrs. Nob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 O DOWN 115,000
TOTALDAYWORR 23.50 Total H2O at ad on well & road Barrels 125,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAi.$USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bir NO. 3
RME Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Security
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
WL DAPP TFA
evive hb ElySD Fed-zan Yr OPEN
MET K-600 SERIALNo. 1039401
ca Nu u2 2W Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GEIS Duragel DEFTHIN 4153
Aix IJlv OF0 , GAS&MINING c-325 TOTALTEET 317
pH MaxGel HRS 11.50
CAKE cottonseed hulls T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA EVIATIONREC )RD

1 8" PDM 42.67 atAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 BSODEL BPSO 8PB0 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 STROME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

19 CM TV"NC 12A £7 a sman ew•»m A SC & 3C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

:BSE MME & MR NO. RRD DE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 26, 2007
RIGMME MID MUMBER COUNTY STATE oeys frorti spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 12
OTAL DEPm Rd. Was Rat & ©ØiAŒ DRIKED CA5fNGSIZE,WBGK, W©E SET@ HmµmtNa

4470' 11.5 74.5 317 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 19
t'ilVHY ATREIGETTIME REPORIEDBY

arculatinghole clean to tripout for loggs Richard L Tatman
REMRKS KBTOa.
Formation Break at top of Tu lunk Shale @4405' 15

TIME LOG
Fnose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 install New Weight indicator
6:30 13:30 7.00 Trip in hole IStage in (Kelly up and mist hole at 1500',2500', 3500'. Tag up at 405T
13:30 15:30 2.00 Mist hole and work pipeup and down To clean up hole.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Wash and ream from 405T to 4138'
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate / Pump arieated KCLsweep around to clean out hole.
18:00 5:30 11.50 Drilling12 1/4" hole from 4153' to 4470' withAir motor/ (Formation break at top of tununk4405')
5:30 6:00 0.50 Cirutate hole clean with Air Mist work pipeup and down.

Total:leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
ifra. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 1050 Galkns' Boiler flours 24 132,000

Hrs. Nob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 O DOWN 115,000
TOTALDAYWORR 23.50 Total H2O at ad on well & road Barrels 125,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAi.$USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bir NO. 3
RME Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Security
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
WL DAPP TFA
evive hb ElySD Fed-zan Yr OPEN
MET K-600 SERIALNo. 1039401
ca Nu u2 2W Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GEIS Duragel DEFTHIN 4153
Aix IJlv OF0 , GAS&MINING c-325 TOTALTEET 317
pH MaxGel HRS 11.50
CAKE cottonseed hulls T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA EVIATIONREC )RD

1 8" PDM 42.67 atAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 BSODEL BPSO 8PB0 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 STROME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

19 CM TV"NC 12A £7 a sman ew•»m A SC & 3C

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

:BSE MME & MR NO. RRD DE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 26, 2007
RIGMME MID MUMBER COUNTY STATE oeys frorti spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 12
OTAL DEPm Rd. Was Rat & ©ØiAŒ DRIKED CA5fNGSIZE,WBGK, W©E SET@ HmµmtNa

4470' 11.5 74.5 317 13-3/8" 54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 19
t'ilVHY ATREIGETTIME REPORIEDBY

arculatinghole clean to tripout for loggs Richard L Tatman
REMRKS KBTOa.
Formation Break at top of Tu lunk Shale @4405' 15

TIME LOG
Fnose To nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 install New Weight indicator
6:30 13:30 7.00 Trip in hole IStage in (Kelly up and mist hole at 1500',2500', 3500'. Tag up at 405T
13:30 15:30 2.00 Mist hole and work pipeup and down To clean up hole.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Wash and ream from 405T to 4138'
17:00 18:00 1.00 Circulate / Pump arieated KCLsweep around to clean out hole.
18:00 5:30 11.50 Drilling12 1/4" hole from 4153' to 4470' withAir motor/ (Formation break at top of tununk4405')
5:30 6:00 0.50 Cirutate hole clean with Air Mist work pipeup and down.

Total:leurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
ifra. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 1050 Galkns' Boiler flours 24 132,000

Hrs. Nob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 in 0 O DOWN 115,000
TOTALDAYWORR 23.50 Total H2O at ad on well & road Barrels 125,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIAi.$USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTNAME Bir NO. 3
RME Poly Plus SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGif Fed Seal MFG Security
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
WL DAPP TFA
evive hb ElySD Fed-zan Yr OPEN
MET K-600 SERIALNo. 1039401
ca Nu u2 2W Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GEIS Duragel DEFTHIN 4153
Aix IJlv OF0 , GAS&MINING c-325 TOTALTEET 317
pH MaxGel HRS 11.50
CAKE cottonseed hulls T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA EVIATIONREC )RD

1 8" PDM 42.67 atAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DC'S 59.91 BSODEL BPSO 8PB0 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 STROME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

19 CM TV"NC 12A £7 a sman ew•»m A SC & 3C



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
UK MME &WER NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 27, 2007
RIGMME ANDROBER COUIRY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 13
vomoso not as enmaa.ms voorAeraanHD IA5TCHOSIZE,WBGHT,WADE SET@ Reporth

4470' 0 74.5 | 0 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 20
ACilVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wash Casing down at 3980' Richard L Tatman
REIMMS lŒTO R.

15
TIME LOG

mon lo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Circulate for logs
6:30 7:00 0.50 Trip in hole IStage in (Kelly up and mist hole at 1500',2500', 3500'. Tag up at 405T
7:00 11:30 4.50 Pull out of hole for Loggs
11:30 12:00 0.50 Rug up loggers
12:00 13:30 1.50 First run - Triple Combo I neutron interfeared wiyh GL because no fluid in hole.
13·30 16:30 3.00 Second Run - CCL I Temp-Nose
16:30 18:30 2.00 Rig up Weatherford Casing crew.
18:30 19:00 0.50 Make up shoe and float Torque themto 4470 ft/Ibs.
19 23:30 4.50 Run Casing to 4300' Rig up eirculating equipment torqueall connections to OPT. 3870 ft/\bs
23:30 1:30 2.00 Fillcasing and load hole
1 30 6:00 4.50 Wash down casing from 4235 to 4340'

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
I I

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 1050 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN
IOYALDAYWORP 24.00 Total N2O « ad on well & food Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 3
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 12 1/4
WBGHT Rui Seal WG Security
VIS AL Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
WL DAPP TFA
PVfYP Fed-Zan JET OPEN
MBT - t- , K<00 SERIAt.No. 1039401O-C It cD Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 4153
Atx ' C-325 WTAL FEET 317
pH MaxGel HRS 11.50
:AKE

DIVCTCs, NG Cottonseedhulls T/8/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 RoP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
MA DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Twa-N- | AM

1 8" PDM 42.67 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 MODEL BPB0 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme

i l £© MC 22n AT a wasmaa seem C 3C C SC +1000 A

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
UK MME &WER NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 27, 2007
RIGMME ANDROBER COUIRY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 13
vomoso not as enmaa.ms voorAeraanHD IA5TCHOSIZE,WBGHT,WADE SET@ Reporth

4470' 0 74.5 | 0 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 20
ACilVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wash Casing down at 3980' Richard L Tatman
REIMMS lŒTO R.

15
TIME LOG

mon lo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Circulate for logs
6:30 7:00 0.50 Trip in hole IStage in (Kelly up and mist hole at 1500',2500', 3500'. Tag up at 405T
7:00 11:30 4.50 Pull out of hole for Loggs
11:30 12:00 0.50 Rug up loggers
12:00 13:30 1.50 First run - Triple Combo I neutron interfeared wiyh GL because no fluid in hole.
13·30 16:30 3.00 Second Run - CCL I Temp-Nose
16:30 18:30 2.00 Rig up Weatherford Casing crew.
18:30 19:00 0.50 Make up shoe and float Torque themto 4470 ft/Ibs.
19 23:30 4.50 Run Casing to 4300' Rig up eirculating equipment torqueall connections to OPT. 3870 ft/\bs
23:30 1:30 2.00 Fillcasing and load hole
1 30 6:00 4.50 Wash down casing from 4235 to 4340'

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
I I

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 1050 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN
IOYALDAYWORP 24.00 Total N2O « ad on well & food Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 3
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 12 1/4
WBGHT Rui Seal WG Security
VIS AL Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
WL DAPP TFA
PVfYP Fed-Zan JET OPEN
MBT - t-

, K<00 SERIAt.No. 1039401O-C It cD Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 4153
Atx ' C-325 WTAL FEET 317
pH MaxGel HRS 11.50
:AKE

DIVCTCs, NG Cottonseedhulls T/8/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 RoP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
MA DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Twa-N- | AM

1 8" PDM 42.67 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 MODEL BPB0 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme

i l £© MC 22n AT a wasmaa seem C 3C C SC +1000 A

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
UK MME &WER NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 27, 2007
RIGMME ANDROBER COUIRY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 13
vomoso not as enmaa.ms voorAeraanHD IA5TCHOSIZE,WBGHT,WADE SET@ Reporth

4470' 0 74.5 | 0 |13-3/8"54.5# STCJ-55 905' RKB 20
ACilVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wash Casing down at 3980' Richard L Tatman
REIMMS lŒTO R.

15
TIME LOG

mon lo nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Circulate for logs
6:30 7:00 0.50 Trip in hole IStage in (Kelly up and mist hole at 1500',2500', 3500'. Tag up at 405T
7:00 11:30 4.50 Pull out of hole for Loggs
11:30 12:00 0.50 Rug up loggers
12:00 13:30 1.50 First run - Triple Combo I neutron interfeared wiyh GL because no fluid in hole.
13·30 16:30 3.00 Second Run - CCL I Temp-Nose
16:30 18:30 2.00 Rig up Weatherford Casing crew.
18:30 19:00 0.50 Make up shoe and float Torque themto 4470 ft/Ibs.
19 23:30 4.50 Run Casing to 4300' Rig up eirculating equipment torqueall connections to OPT. 3870 ft/\bs
23:30 1:30 2.00 Fillcasing and load hole
1 30 6:00 4.50 Wash down casing from 4235 to 4340'

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
I I

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.50 FUEL USED 1050 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob.jDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O In 0 Out DOWN
IOYALDAYWORP 24.00 Total N2O « ad on well & food Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 3
TIME Poly Plus SI2E 12 1/4
WBGHT Rui Seal WG Security
VIS AL Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
WL DAPP TFA
PVfYP Fed-Zan JET OPEN
MBT - t-

, K<00 SERIAt.No. 1039401O-C It cD Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GELS Duragel DEPTHIN 4153
Atx ' C-325 WTAL FEET 317
pH MaxGel HRS 11.50
:AKE

DIVCTCs, NG Cottonseedhulls T/8/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 RoP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
MA DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Twa-N- | AM

1 8" PDM 42.67 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 MODEL BPB0 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degme

i l £© MC 22n AT a wasmaa seem C 3C C SC +1000 A



Marion Energy inc.
119 5 Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
MASEWSŒ &WEL NO. RRD DATE

Raiticed SWD1 Kenilworth October 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDMUMBER COWTY STATE Days horn spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon utan 15
mraono m.ms a.nu.ms mornermatso asraesuE,WBGHT,WADE SEr@ Mputa

4470' 0 74.5 j 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4340' RKB 21
ACTIYlTYATREFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wash Casing down at 3980' ecilCrow/Richard Crow
REMARKS OTOGL

15
TEMELOG

m0N TO HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Wash From 3980 To 4006

11:30 12:30 1 RIDCSG. Crew
12:30 15:30 3A)0 R/U Big 4 CEMENT Crew
1530 18:00 2.50 Pump Cement (Lead 11ppg 600sks Tail 14.2 300sks)Displacement/332 Bbts.
18 00 18;30 0.50 Cementing
18 30 19:00 0.50 RID Big 4 Cement Crew
19 23'00 4.00 Wait On Cement
23:00 0:00 1.00 Back Dogs on Stack/WSI /Set 60;000 On Slips
0:00 2:0û 2,00 Cut offLanding Joint
2:00 4:00 2.00 Final Cut On Csg/ Set Seal
4 5:00 1.00 Set Stack & Nipple Up
5:00 6:00 1.00 Set Plugl Test Choke Lines 300psi Smint 3000psi 10min/ Test Csp 1500psi 30min

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER NOURS STRING WT

Hra. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Galtons Boner Hours 24
Hrs. Mob.fDesnok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled fast 24 hours 0 in 0 DOWN
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 1710 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSI ISED BIT RECOFD
DEPm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME NT NO. 3
RME PolyPlus SIZE 12 1/4
WBŒT Fed Seat Mm Security
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
wt DAPP TFA

PvjyP Fed-Zan JET OPEN
,,, ntoope K-4iCO SERIALNO. 1039401
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GELS Ë Ë¶ Duragel DEFTHIN 4153
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 317
pH

DITOf I', MS &MINING MaxGel HRs 11.50
CAKE Canon seed hulls T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
960005 CUMULATIVECOST $0:00 ROP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
IMA DESCMPHON LENGTil - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI T-a-N- | AM

1 8" PDM 42.67 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degime

14 Km BC'C 22A 47 msmenewwm & 3C C TC (2W& A

Marion Energy inc.
119 5 Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
MASEWSŒ &WEL NO. RRD DATE

Raiticed SWD1 Kenilworth October 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDMUMBER COWTY STATE Days horn spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon utan 15
mraono m.ms a.nu.ms mornermatso asraesuE,WBGHT,WADE SEr@ Mputa

4470' 0 74.5 j 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4340' RKB 21
ACTIYlTYATREFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wash Casing down at 3980' ecilCrow/Richard Crow
REMARKS OTOGL

15
TEMELOG

m0N TO HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Wash From 3980 To 4006

11:30 12:30 1 RIDCSG. Crew
12:30 15:30 3A)0 R/U Big 4 CEMENT Crew
1530 18:00 2.50 Pump Cement (Lead 11ppg 600sks Tail 14.2 300sks)Displacement/332 Bbts.
18 00 18;30 0.50 Cementing
18 30 19:00 0.50 RID Big 4 Cement Crew
19 23'00 4.00 Wait On Cement
23:00 0:00 1.00 Back Dogs on Stack/WSI /Set 60;000 On Slips
0:00 2:0û 2,00 Cut offLanding Joint
2:00 4:00 2.00 Final Cut On Csg/ Set Seal
4 5:00 1.00 Set Stack & Nipple Up
5:00 6:00 1.00 Set Plugl Test Choke Lines 300psi Smint 3000psi 10min/ Test Csp 1500psi 30min

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER NOURS STRING WT

Hra. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Galtons Boner Hours 24
Hrs. Mob.fDesnok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled fast 24 hours 0 in 0 DOWN
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 1710 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSI ISED BIT RECOFD
DEPm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME NT NO. 3
RME PolyPlus SIZE 12 1/4
WBŒT Fed Seat Mm Security
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
wt DAPP TFA

PvjyP Fed-Zan JET OPEN
,,, ntoope K-4iCO SERIALNO. 1039401
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GELS Ë Ë¶ Duragel DEFTHIN 4153
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 317
pH

DITOf I', MS &MINING MaxGel HRs 11.50
CAKE Canon seed hulls T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
960005 CUMULATIVECOST $0:00 ROP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
IMA DESCMPHON LENGTil - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI T-a-N- | AM

1 8" PDM 42.67 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degime

14 Km BC'C 22A 47 msmenewwm & 3C C TC (2W& A

Marion Energy inc.
119 5 Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
MASEWSŒ &WEL NO. RRD DATE

Raiticed SWD1 Kenilworth October 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDMUMBER COWTY STATE Days horn spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon utan 15
mraono m.ms a.nu.ms mornermatso asraesuE,WBGHT,WADE SEr@ Mputa

4470' 0 74.5 j 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4340' RKB 21
ACTIYlTYATREFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wash Casing down at 3980' ecilCrow/Richard Crow
REMARKS OTOGL

15
TEMELOG

m0N TO HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:30 5.50 Wash From 3980 To 4006

11:30 12:30 1 RIDCSG. Crew
12:30 15:30 3A)0 R/U Big 4 CEMENT Crew
1530 18:00 2.50 Pump Cement (Lead 11ppg 600sks Tail 14.2 300sks)Displacement/332 Bbts.
18 00 18;30 0.50 Cementing
18 30 19:00 0.50 RID Big 4 Cement Crew
19 23'00 4.00 Wait On Cement
23:00 0:00 1.00 Back Dogs on Stack/WSI /Set 60;000 On Slips
0:00 2:0û 2,00 Cut offLanding Joint
2:00 4:00 2.00 Final Cut On Csg/ Set Seal
4 5:00 1.00 Set Stack & Nipple Up
5:00 6:00 1.00 Set Plugl Test Choke Lines 300psi Smint 3000psi 10min/ Test Csp 1500psi 30min

Total Cours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USI I BOILER NOURS STRING WT

Hra. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Galtons Boner Hours 24
Hrs. Mob.fDesnok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled fast 24 hours 0 in 0 DOWN
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 1710 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSI ISED BIT RECOFD
DEPm NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME NT NO. 3
RME PolyPlus SIZE 12 1/4
WBŒT Fed Seat Mm Security
VIS AL.Sterate TYPE EBXS5245
wt DAPP TFA

PvjyP Fed-Zan JET OPEN
,,, ntoope K-4iCO SERIALNO. 1039401
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT 4470
GELS Ë Ë¶ Duragel DEFTHIN 4153
ALK C-325 TOTALFEET 317
pH

DITOf I', MS &MINING MaxGel HRs 11.50
CAKE Canon seed hulls T/8/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 18-35 K
DAPP PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 80-40
960005 CUMULATIVECOST $0:00 ROP(fph) 27.6

DRILLING ASSE 1BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
IMA DESCMPHON LENGTil - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPHI T-a-N- | AM

1 8" PDM 42.67 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
2 8" DCS 59.91 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 X/O Sub 2.62 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degime

14 Km BC'C 22A 47 msmenewwm & 3C C TC (2W& A



Marion Energy inc.

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
ŒASEME&MENO. RED DE

Railroad SWO 1 Kenilworth October 29, 2007
:UGNME MD RMBER COUWY srm Days from spud
UnitDrilling Cor3. Rig 132 Carbon utan 15

TA CHW M Hrs amm Hm FOOTME DIUR£Ð UETOWNGSf2E, WBGHT, GMDE SEf © kpata

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 22
ACTMIYMMERRTTIME REPORTEDBY

orillingcementAnd Float Equipment Richard crow/Cecil crow
REMUS KBTOGL.

15
TIMELOG

m0N TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:® 6:30 0.50 Test Choke LineT /300 Lowl3000 High
6:30 7:00 0.50 Test Csg. T1500 For 30Min.
7:00 9:30 150 Put Rotary Back in Place
930 10:30 1.00 LD.8" Drill Collars
10:30 12:30 2.00 Rig Up Loggers/ Run Bon LogTo 4178'
1290 18:00 5.50 Weld ON Flow Line
18:W 21:00 3.00 Weid ON Flow Une
21:W 22::00 1.00 Pick Up BHA--Dress Stabilizers-Pick Up Mud Motor Make Up PDC Bit
22::00 0:00 2.00 T1H./Collars
O00 12:30 0.50 Pick KellyUp IBroke Cir.
1230 3:00 2.50 T.LH. /Tag Cement g4178
3•00 4:00 1.00 Wash Ream Cement
4:00 5:00 1.00 Layed Down Two Stands / To Ream Cement
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash Ream Cement

Tatal Lleurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP 121/K

Hrs. Mob.JDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1010 in 0 Out DOWN 108/K
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 97/K

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT RECORD
I I

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 4
TIME Poly Plus 512E 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MRs Smith
vis 26 AL.Sterate TYPE M616
WL DAPP TFA

v/YP Fed-zan 1ET 18-Jun

MBT 1ECE g K-400 SERIALNo. JX1408

as NOVU2 7087 4178
ALK C-325 TOTALTEET
pH 9 A UL,GAsgg MaxGel HRS
CAKE Catten seed hults TIB/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 4/8K
DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T $0.00 RPM 45/60
%SOUDS CUMULATIVE005T $0.00 ROP(fph}

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ÆVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPH I ••in•• / aman...es.

1 Bit 1.23 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8PSO BPSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1(2

Marion Energy inc.

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
ŒASEME&MENO. RED DE

Railroad SWO 1 Kenilworth October 29, 2007
:UGNME MD RMBER COUWY srm Days from spud
UnitDrilling Cor3. Rig 132 Carbon utan 15

TA CHW M Hrs amm Hm FOOTME DIUR£Ð UETOWNGSf2E, WBGHT, GMDE SEf © kpata

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 22
ACTMIYMMERRTTIME REPORTEDBY

orillingcementAnd Float Equipment Richard crow/Cecil crow
REMUS KBTOGL.

15
TIMELOG

m0N TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:® 6:30 0.50 Test Choke LineT /300 Lowl3000 High
6:30 7:00 0.50 Test Csg. T1500 For 30Min.
7:00 9:30 150 Put Rotary Back in Place
930 10:30 1.00 LD.8" Drill Collars
10:30 12:30 2.00 Rig Up Loggers/ Run Bon LogTo 4178'
1290 18:00 5.50 Weld ON Flow Line
18:W 21:00 3.00 Weid ON Flow Une
21:W 22::00 1.00 Pick Up BHA--Dress Stabilizers-Pick Up Mud Motor Make Up PDC Bit
22::00 0:00 2.00 T1H./Collars
O00 12:30 0.50 Pick KellyUp IBroke Cir.
1230 3:00 2.50 T.LH. /Tag Cement g4178
3•00 4:00 1.00 Wash Ream Cement
4:00 5:00 1.00 Layed Down Two Stands / To Ream Cement
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash Ream Cement

Tatal Lleurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP 121/K

Hrs. Mob.JDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1010 in 0 Out DOWN 108/K
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 97/K

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT RECORD
I I

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 4
TIME Poly Plus 512E 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MRs Smith
vis 26 AL.Sterate TYPE M616
WL DAPP TFA

v/YP Fed-zan 1ET 18-Jun

MBT 1ECE g K-400 SERIALNo. JX1408

as NOVU2 7087 4178
ALK C-325 TOTALTEET
pH 9 A UL,GAsgg MaxGel HRS
CAKE Catten seed hults TIB/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 4/8K
DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T $0.00 RPM 45/60
%SOUDS CUMULATIVE005T $0.00 ROP(fph}

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ÆVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPH I ••in•• / aman...es.

1 Bit 1.23 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8PSO BPSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1(2

Marion Energy inc.

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
ŒASEME&MENO. RED DE

Railroad SWO 1 Kenilworth October 29, 2007
:UGNME MD RMBER COUWY srm Days from spud
UnitDrilling Cor3. Rig 132 Carbon utan 15

TA CHW M Hrs amm Hm FOOTME DIUR£Ð UETOWNGSf2E, WBGHT, GMDE SEf © kpata

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 22
ACTMIYMMERRTTIME REPORTEDBY

orillingcementAnd Float Equipment Richard crow/Cecil crow
REMUS KBTOGL.

15
TIMELOG

m0N TO HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:® 6:30 0.50 Test Choke LineT /300 Lowl3000 High
6:30 7:00 0.50 Test Csg. T1500 For 30Min.
7:00 9:30 150 Put Rotary Back in Place
930 10:30 1.00 LD.8" Drill Collars
10:30 12:30 2.00 Rig Up Loggers/ Run Bon LogTo 4178'
1290 18:00 5.50 Weld ON Flow Line
18:W 21:00 3.00 Weid ON Flow Une
21:W 22::00 1.00 Pick Up BHA--Dress Stabilizers-Pick Up Mud Motor Make Up PDC Bit
22::00 0:00 2.00 T1H./Collars
O00 12:30 0.50 Pick KellyUp IBroke Cir.
1230 3:00 2.50 T.LH. /Tag Cement g4178
3•00 4:00 1.00 Wash Ream Cement
4:00 5:00 1.00 Layed Down Two Stands / To Ream Cement
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash Ream Cement

Tatal Lleurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP 121/K

Hrs. Mob.JDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 1010 in 0 Out DOWN 108/K
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 97/K

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS 1SED BIT RECORD
I I

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 4
TIME Poly Plus 512E 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.4 Fed Seal MRs Smith
vis 26 AL.Sterate TYPE M616
WL DAPP TFA

v/YP Fed-zan 1ET 18-Jun

MBT 1ECE g K-400 SERIALNo. JX1408

as NOVU2 7087 4178
ALK C-325 TOTALTEET
pH 9 A UL,GAsgg MaxGel HRS
CAKE Catten seed hults TIB/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT 4/8K
DAPP PREVIOUSCO5T $0.00 RPM 45/60
%SOUDS CUMULATIVE005T $0.00 ROP(fph}

DRILLING ASSE IBLY PUMP I ATA ÆVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPH I ••in•• / aman...es.

1 Bit 1.23 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8PSO BPSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 smoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1(2



Marion Energy inc. Ka e \0 e
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October 30, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 16
TOTALDEPW Ret Hrs cumRot His NOTAGE DRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET R &

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 23
ACOVIIYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Clean Sluffing Hole |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME10G

mon to nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 0.8.00 2.00 Drill Out Cement Float,Shoe

0.8.00 9:30 1.50 Change Over To Airated Fluid
9:30 10:30 1.00 Wash And Ream F/4393 T/4470 No Fill
10:30 17:30 7.00 Actual DrillFI4470 T4581
17:30 18:00 0.50 Survey @4558'-2 Degrees
18:00 23:00 5.00 Actual Drill F4581 T/4720
23 00 0:00 1.00 Hole Pack Off /Clean Cir / Hole
0:00 2:00 2.00 Actual Drill FI4720 T/4767
2:00 6:00 4.00 Hole Pack Off /Clean Cir./ Hole
0·00
0:00
0:00 NPCEIVCD

NO 8 2007
OFQi;tyE AMINING

Total Coms 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Gations Boiler Hours 24 UP 130K TI

Hrs. Mob.jDemak 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 O DOWN 121K
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O ut adon weN& road Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAtS MSED BIT tECORD
DEFU 4643 NO. OF SACKSILBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGur 8,5 rei seal Mm Smith
vis 26 AL Stemte TYPE M616
WL 80-Sks. K.C.L TFA
Pv/yP Fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun

MBT K4iCO SERIALNo. JX1408
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT
GELS Duragel DEFm m 4178
Atx .4/.6

C-325 TOTALMET 582'
pH 10.5 MaxGel HRS 19.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT.ON BIT 4/8K
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 45/60
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DETLLINGASSE 1Bl.Y PUMP f ATA bSVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCMPTION LENSM - FT PWSP NO. 1 2 DEPTN Inne •=N=••| Anime

1 Bit 1.23 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MoDEL , SPSO 8PSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 sinoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc. Ka e \0 e
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October 30, 2007
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23 00 0:00 1.00 Hole Pack Off /Clean Cir / Hole
0:00 2:00 2.00 Actual Drill FI4720 T/4767
2:00 6:00 4.00 Hole Pack Off /Clean Cir./ Hole
0·00
0:00
0:00 NPCEIVCD

NO 8 2007
OFQi;tyE AMINING
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Pv/yP Fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun

MBT K4iCO SERIALNo. JX1408
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT
GELS Duragel DEFm m 4178
Atx .4/.6

C-325 TOTALMET 582'
pH 10.5 MaxGel HRS 19.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G
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Marion Energy inc. Ka e \0 e
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October 30, 2007
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Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 16
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NO 8 2007
OFQi;tyE AMINING
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Marion Energy inc. Ka e \0 e
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth October 30, 2007
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NO 8 2007
OFQi;tyE AMINING

Total Coms 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1050 Gations Boiler Hours 24 UP 130K TI

Hrs. Mob.jDemak 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 O DOWN 121K
TOTALDAYWORR 24.00 Total H2O ut adon weN& road Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIAtS MSED BIT tECORD
DEFU 4643 NO. OF SACKSILBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 4
TIME Poly Plus SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGur 8,5 rei seal Mm Smith
vis 26 AL Stemte TYPE M616
WL 80-Sks. K.C.L TFA
Pv/yP Fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun

MBT K4iCO SERIALNo. JX1408
CA Fed 744 DEPTHOUT
GELS Duragel DEFm m 4178
Atx .4/.6

C-325 TOTALMET 582'
pH 10.5 MaxGel HRS 19.00
CAKE Cotton seed hulis T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT.ON BIT 4/8K
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST $0.00 RPM 45/60
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $0.00 ROP(fph)

DETLLINGASSE 1Bl.Y PUMP f ATA bSVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCMPTION LENSM - FT PWSP NO. 1 2 DEPTN Inne •=N=••| Anime

1 Bit 1.23 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MoDEL , SPSO 8PSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 sinoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LOSE ME &WEU.NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 31, 2007
MG -E ANDRNBER COUmY EfŒ DByS from spud
UnitDrilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 17
f6fALOWN Ret½s cunM.As FOOTROMRED WTCASMGSEE,WHGHT,GRADE SEE Repcuta 22

4470' 0 74.5 0 19-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 24
WIVHYArBBWTEM REPORTEDBY

Hole suffingIn Mixing Mud /Cir. (Richard CrowfCecilCrow
REMRMS KBTOGL.

15
TIME106

mon to nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Hole Pack Off -Cir.IClean Hole
10'30 11:00 0.50 2 Jts. DrillPipe
11:00 14:00 3.00 Cir. Mud Up Tol30 Vis.To Get Back To Stm.
14:00 15:00 1.00 T.O.O.H. 5 Stds.To Wt.I Mud up
15:00 18:00 3.00 Cir. Mud Up Tol 60Vis.I 10 + Mud Wt.
18:00 5:00 11.00 Con. Mud I Cir Hole
5'00 0.6.00 1.00 T.LH. 1 Std. Cir. Hole

0.6.00
0:00
0:00o-oo
0:00

Novg
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINNo

Total Clours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 987 Gallons BoHer Hours 24 UP 130KT/

Hrs. Mob.fDemot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN 121K
TOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O und on well& road Barrels OTATE 98K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSI ISED BIT RECORD
DEPM 4643 NO. OF SACKS/1.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 4
TIME 1 Poly Plus 512E 8 3/4
WEIŒT 8,5 30 Sks. Fed Seal Mrs Smith
vis 26 2 Sks. Dris Pack TYPE M616
WL 4Sks. caustic TFA
Pv/vP 48sks. Fed-Zan )ET 18-Jun

Mirr 6 sks. planumPac. SERIALNO. 3X1408
CA 800 Sks. Bar DEFU OUT
GELS 60 Sks. Duragel DEFM IN 4178
Atx .4/.6

c-325 TOTAt.FEET 582'
pH 10.5 180 MaxGel HRs 24.00
CAME Ceuen seed huis T/8/G

CL DAILYG)ST $5,086.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCO5T $1,800.00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $6,886.00 flOP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE SBLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC MtD
ita. DESCMPHON 1-GIN - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPm I- -N- | AM

1 Bit 1.23 OGAME Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BOODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Stabillmer 5.71 Sm0ME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degime
4 CH m SA GO m ensmew ww•we < SE C SC +2OM A

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LOSE ME &WEU.NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth October 31, 2007
MG -E ANDRNBER COUmY EfŒ DByS from spud
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f6fALOWN Ret½s cunM.As FOOTROMRED WTCASMGSEE,WHGHT,GRADE SEE Repcuta 22
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TIME106

mon to nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Hole Pack Off -Cir.IClean Hole
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0.6.00
0:00
0:00o-oo
0:00

Novg
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINNo
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TOTALDAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O und on well& road Barrels OTATE 98K

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSI ISED BIT RECORD
DEPM 4643 NO. OF SACKS/1.BS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 4
TIME 1 Poly Plus 512E 8 3/4
WEIŒT 8,5 30 Sks. Fed Seal Mrs Smith
vis 26 2 Sks. Dris Pack TYPE M616
WL 4Sks. caustic TFA
Pv/vP 48sks. Fed-Zan )ET 18-Jun

Mirr 6 sks. planumPac. SERIALNO. 3X1408
CA 800 Sks. Bar DEFU OUT
GELS 60 Sks. Duragel DEFM IN 4178
Atx .4/.6

c-325 TOTAt.FEET 582'
pH 10.5 180 MaxGel HRs 24.00
CAME Ceuen seed huis T/8/G

CL DAILYG)ST $5,086.00 WT. ON BIT

DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCO5T $1,800.00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $6,886.00 flOP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE SBLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC MtD
ita. DESCMPHON 1-GIN - FF PUtiP NO. 1 2 DEPm I- -N- | AM

1 Bit 1.23 OGAME Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BOODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Stabillmer 5.71 Sm0ME 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degime
4 CH m SA GO m ensmew ww•we < SE C SC +2OM A



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒME MME & WEŒ NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth November 1, 2007
RIGNAMEMD NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorn spud
Unit Drilling . Riq 132 carbon Utah 17
TOTALDBW Ret. Hm Rct as NOTAGE DRIGED OGT CASINGSf2E,WMT, GRADE SETO Reput¾ 22

4470' 0 74.5 1 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 24
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

HoleStuffing In Mixing Mudfcir. Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Jarred Pipe Free @4725'I Br ng Mud Up To 11ppg & 80+vis 15
TIME LO3

moM 10 HOUns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Stageing in 1 Std. At A Time Cir. /Cleaning Hole
7:30 8:00 0.50 Stageing in 1 Std. At A Time Cir. TCleaning Hole
8:00 10:30 2.50 Condition Mud & Circulate Hole Clean
10:30 11:30 1.00 T1H 3-Stds. Circ. Down
11:30 18:00 6.50 Con. Mudi Cir. Hole/ Stuck ABit 4725' Jarred Freel Losing Hole
18:00 3:30 9.50 Cond Mud &Circ.I Brought Mud Up To 10 7ppg 80+vis
3:30 6:00 2.50 Stroke Pipe To Free Up Weliboret Making Progress/ Gainíng Back On Well/Reaming Depth 4725'
6:00
0:00
8
0 00

ITEckweg
0:00
o:oo U8

T Clours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILERHOURS S
Hra. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 967 Gallons Boiler Nours 24 UP 130K TI

Hrs. Mala.jDemot 0.0Œ Ebis. Water hauled last 24 houra O Out DOWN 121K
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECORD
DEFm 4643 NŒ OF SM:K5/LB5 PRODUCTN@lE HETNO. 4
TIME 10sks. Ugnite SIZE 8 3/4
WElair 8,5 35sks. Fed Seal MFG Smith
vis 26 Dris Pack TYPE M616
WL (sks, caustic TFA
PVfYP 31sks. FakZan JET 18-Jun

feT seks. platiumPac. SEIUALNo. JX1408
CA 840sks. Bar DEPTHOUT
GELS Ouragel DEFM IN 4178
Atx .4/.6

C-325 TUTALFEET 582'
pH 10.5 16ssks, MaxGel HRS 24.00
CAKE Asks. myacide T/8/G
cL DAILYCOST $17,753.00 WT. ON Sff
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST $6,886.00 RPM
%SŒlDS CUMULATIVECOST $24649.00 ROP(fph}

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONRECJRD
lia DESCMPHON AMGM-FF SUitPitO. 1 2 DEpm an.ralhadniE

1 Bit 1.23 pfANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BIODEL 8PSO 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 smaitE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ŒME MME & WEŒ NO. RRD DME

Railroad SWD1 Kenilworth November 1, 2007
RIGNAMEMD NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days frorn spud
Unit Drilling . Riq 132 carbon Utah 17
TOTALDBW Ret. Hm Rct as NOTAGE DRIGED OGT CASINGSf2E,WMT, GRADE SETO Reput¾ 22

4470' 0 74.5 1 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 24
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

HoleStuffing In Mixing Mudfcir. Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARMS KBTOGL.

Jarred Pipe Free @4725'I Br ng Mud Up To 11ppg & 80+vis 15
TIME LO3

moM 10 HOUns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Stageing in 1 Std. At A Time Cir. /Cleaning Hole
7:30 8:00 0.50 Stageing in 1 Std. At A Time Cir. TCleaning Hole
8:00 10:30 2.50 Condition Mud & Circulate Hole Clean
10:30 11:30 1.00 T1H 3-Stds. Circ. Down
11:30 18:00 6.50 Con. Mudi Cir. Hole/ Stuck ABit 4725' Jarred Freel Losing Hole
18:00 3:30 9.50 Cond Mud &Circ.I Brought Mud Up To 10 7ppg 80+vis
3:30 6:00 2.50 Stroke Pipe To Free Up Weliboret Making Progress/ Gainíng Back On Well/Reaming Depth 4725'
6:00
0:00
8
0 00

ITEckweg
0:00
o:oo U8

T Clours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILERHOURS S
Hra. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 967 Gallons Boiler Nours 24 UP 130K TI

Hrs. Mala.jDemot 0.0Œ Ebis. Water hauled last 24 houra O Out DOWN 121K
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECORD
DEFm 4643 NŒ OF SM:K5/LB5 PRODUCTN@lE HETNO. 4
TIME 10sks. Ugnite SIZE 8 3/4
WElair 8,5 35sks. Fed Seal MFG Smith
vis 26 Dris Pack TYPE M616
WL (sks, caustic TFA
PVfYP 31sks. FakZan JET 18-Jun

feT seks. platiumPac. SEIUALNo. JX1408
CA 840sks. Bar DEPTHOUT
GELS Ouragel DEFM IN 4178
Atx .4/.6

C-325 TUTALFEET 582'
pH 10.5 16ssks, MaxGel HRS 24.00
CAKE Asks. myacide T/8/G
cL DAILYCOST $17,753.00 WT. ON Sff
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST $6,886.00 RPM
%SŒlDS CUMULATIVECOST $24649.00 ROP(fph}

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONRECJRD
lia DESCMPHON AMGM-FF SUitPitO. 1 2 DEpm an.ralhadniE

1 Bit 1.23 pfANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BIODEL 8PSO 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 smaitE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

U%E ME & WEU.NO. MRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilwotth November 2, 2007
SG ME MD MBER COUMY STM DByS from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 18
ana DWM R . Ms cumM. As OTAGEDRTRED tWT CMING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 25
orvnY Af REPORTHME REÞORTEDBY

HoleSluffing In MixingMud|Cir. ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
armaa usToet

Jarred Pipe Free @ 4725Y Bt ng Mud Up To 11ppg & 80+vis 15
TIMELÒG

mope w moms ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 10·00 4.00 con.Mud Icir Work Pipe
10:00 10:30 0.50 Rig Service
10:30 18:00 7.50 Con.Mud ICir. Work Pipe
18:00 12;30 6.50 Con Mud]Cir Watk Pipe
12;30 TripOut Hole To Change Air Motor To Mud Motor
0:00
9:00
0:00
0:00
850
0:00
0:00

RCCE¾FDa:oo
oso NOVU8 pag7
0:00 UIVOfOIL,584 gf¾WOTelan loms 18.50 FUEL ANDWATERUSE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hra. Rig Repair 0 00 FUEL USED 987 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 130K TI
Hrs. Mob.|Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 160 Bbis. O O DOWN 121K
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Totat H2O ut ad on well & road 100 Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUDJE GORD SSUDMATERIALSt iSED BIT RECORD
DEFm 47676 NO. OF 5ACK5/iBS PRODUCTMME Eff NO. 4
TIME 18:ÛO 10sks. Ugnite SIZE $ 3/4
WEIŒrr 11 8 5/boxes supersweep MFG Smith
ws 84 2¢5get polyseen TYPE M616
WL 3sks, caustic TFA
Pv/YP 60/80 50sks. Fed-Zan JET 18400
Mar $sks platiumPac. SERIÆ.fKL JX1¾
cA 360sks. Bar DEPTHOUT 4760
GELS 4Û(12Û 25sks. asphasal DEFPH IN 4178
ALK .4/.6 1/5gak C-325 TOTM.FEET 582'
pH 9,5 104sks. MarGel HRS 24.00
CAKE 2/32 5sks. myacide T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $22,00400 WT. ON BIT
CAPP RO KCL PREVIOUSCOST $17,7&00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $40,567.00 ROP(fph)

DRRIWIG ASSE1BLY PUMPI ATA VIATION REC)RD
NO DESCRIFFION miBRI -FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncMaadem/ Asime

1 Bit 1.23 mmcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 3.71 55801(E 8.50 8 50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

U%E ME & WEU.NO. MRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilwotth November 2, 2007
SG ME MD MBER COUMY STM DByS from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 18
ana DWM R . Ms cumM. As OTAGEDRTRED tWT CMING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 25
orvnY Af REPORTHME REÞORTEDBY

HoleSluffing In MixingMud|Cir. ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
armaa usToet

Jarred Pipe Free @ 4725Y Bt ng Mud Up To 11ppg & 80+vis 15
TIMELÒG

mope w moms ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 10·00 4.00 con.Mud Icir Work Pipe
10:00 10:30 0.50 Rig Service
10:30 18:00 7.50 Con.Mud ICir. Work Pipe
18:00 12;30 6.50 Con Mud]Cir Watk Pipe
12;30 TripOut Hole To Change Air Motor To Mud Motor
0:00
9:00
0:00
0:00
850
0:00
0:00

RCCE¾FDa:oo
oso NOVU8 pag7
0:00 UIVOfOIL,584 gf¾WOTelan loms 18.50 FUEL ANDWATERUSE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hra. Rig Repair 0 00 FUEL USED 987 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 130K TI
Hrs. Mob.|Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 160 Bbis. O O DOWN 121K
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Totat H2O ut ad on well & road 100 Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUDJE GORD SSUDMATERIALSt iSED BIT RECORD
DEFm 47676 NO. OF 5ACK5/iBS PRODUCTMME Eff NO. 4
TIME 18:ÛO 10sks. Ugnite SIZE $ 3/4
WEIŒrr 11 8 5/boxes supersweep MFG Smith
ws 84 2¢5get polyseen TYPE M616
WL 3sks, caustic TFA
Pv/YP 60/80 50sks. Fed-Zan JET 18400
Mar $sks platiumPac. SERIÆ.fKL JX1¾
cA 360sks. Bar DEPTHOUT 4760
GELS 4Û(12Û 25sks. asphasal DEFPH IN 4178
ALK .4/.6 1/5gak C-325 TOTM.FEET 582'
pH 9,5 104sks. MarGel HRS 24.00
CAKE 2/32 5sks. myacide T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $22,00400 WT. ON BIT
CAPP RO KCL PREVIOUSCOST $17,7&00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $40,567.00 ROP(fph)

DRRIWIG ASSE1BLY PUMPI ATA VIATION REC)RD
NO DESCRIFFION miBRI -FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncMaadem/ Asime

1 Bit 1.23 mmcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 3.71 55801(E 8.50 8 50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

U%E ME & WEU.NO. MRD DME

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilwotth November 2, 2007
SG ME MD MBER COUMY STM DByS from spud
Unit Drilling . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 18
ana DWM R . Ms cumM. As OTAGEDRTRED tWT CMING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No.

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 25
orvnY Af REPORTHME REÞORTEDBY

HoleSluffing In MixingMud|Cir. ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
armaa usToet

Jarred Pipe Free @ 4725Y Bt ng Mud Up To 11ppg & 80+vis 15
TIMELÒG

mope w moms ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 10·00 4.00 con.Mud Icir Work Pipe
10:00 10:30 0.50 Rig Service
10:30 18:00 7.50 Con.Mud ICir. Work Pipe
18:00 12;30 6.50 Con Mud]Cir Watk Pipe
12;30 TripOut Hole To Change Air Motor To Mud Motor
0:00
9:00
0:00
0:00
850
0:00
0:00

RCCE¾FDa:oo
oso NOVU8 pag7
0:00 UIVOfOIL,584 gf¾WOTelan loms 18.50 FUEL ANDWATERUSE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hra. Rig Repair 0 00 FUEL USED 987 Gallons Boiler Hours 24 130K TI
Hrs. Mob.|Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 160 Bbis. O O DOWN 121K
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Totat H2O ut ad on well & road 100 Barrels ROTATE 98K

MUDJE GORD SSUDMATERIALSt iSED BIT RECORD
DEFm 47676 NO. OF 5ACK5/iBS PRODUCTMME Eff NO. 4
TIME 18:ÛO 10sks. Ugnite SIZE $ 3/4
WEIŒrr 11 8 5/boxes supersweep MFG Smith
ws 84 2¢5get polyseen TYPE M616
WL 3sks, caustic TFA
Pv/YP 60/80 50sks. Fed-Zan JET 18400
Mar $sks platiumPac. SERIÆ.fKL JX1¾
cA 360sks. Bar DEPTHOUT 4760
GELS 4Û(12Û 25sks. asphasal DEFPH IN 4178
ALK .4/.6 1/5gak C-325 TOTM.FEET 582'
pH 9,5 104sks. MarGel HRS 24.00
CAKE 2/32 5sks. myacide T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $22,00400 WT. ON BIT
CAPP RO KCL PREVIOUSCOST $17,7&00 RPM
%SOUDS CUMULATIVECOST $40,567.00 ROP(fph)

DRRIWIG ASSE1BLY PUMPI ATA VIATION REC)RD
NO DESCRIFFION miBRI -FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncMaadem/ Asime

1 Bit 1.23 mmcE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8PSO 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 3.71 55801(E 8.50 8 50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
(EASENWE & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth tiovember3, 2007
MG NME ANDNUMBER COUMrY STG Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Riq 132 Carbon Utah 19
TUTALDEPfH Rat. His Rat. Hrs FOUTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ ReportNa

4470' O 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 26
Acnvny Ær REPORTEME REPORFEDBY

Trip Out Hole Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
25-5 KBTD GL.

T/O/H. Break Ever Joint Due To Over Torqued 15
TIME 10 i

mon le nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 14:00 8,00 T.OH./Break Every JT Due To Over Torqued
14:00 !4:30 0.50 Rig Service
14:30 17:30 3,00 T.OH./Break Every JT. Due To Over Torqued
17:30 18;00 0.50 WIO/ pinsFor Tongs
18;00 18:30 0.50 Rip Service
18:30 23:30 5.00 WlO/ pinsFor Tongs
23:30 0.6:00 6.50 T.OM./Break Every JT. Due To Over Torqued
0.6:00
0:00
8:00
0:00
0:00

Total Unurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS ST G
Mrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 24tus Boiler Hours 24 UP 56,000

Nrs. Mob.fDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 24 0 Out N
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS11SED BIT RECORD
DEFru 47676 No. oF sAcK5]IB5 PRODUCTNAME BEFNO. 4
TIME 7;30am isks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIŒrT 12.1 ibox supersweep MFG Smith
vis 133 2sks polysset TYPE M616
WL 1sks caustic TFA
Pv/vP 52/30 Fed-Zan JET 18-Jun
MBT teks planum Pac. SEluALNo. JX1408
CA *IO Bar DEPTHOUT 4760
GELS 18/65 125sks asphasol DEPTHIN 4178
ALK .4/.6

C-325 TOTALFEET 582'
pH 10 MaxGel HRs 24.00
CAKE 2/32 1-sgal myadde T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $14,648.00 Wr. ON SIT
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST .940,567.00 RPM
%SOLIDS Û.75 CUMULATIVECOST $62,101.0û ROP(fph)

DPH I WIGASSE 18LY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
MIL DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUitP 80. 1 2 DEPR I =m=••| M

1 Bit 1.23 ptANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BOODEL BPSO 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
1 StabiBrer 5.71 SmeitE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
(EASENWE & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth tiovember3, 2007
MG NME ANDNUMBER COUMrY STG Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Riq 132 Carbon Utah 19
TUTALDEPfH Rat. His Rat. Hrs FOUTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ ReportNa

4470' O 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 26
Acnvny Ær REPORTEME REPORFEDBY

Trip Out Hole Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
25-5 KBTD GL.

T/O/H. Break Ever Joint Due To Over Torqued 15
TIME 10 i

mon le nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 14:00 8,00 T.OH./Break Every JT Due To Over Torqued
14:00 !4:30 0.50 Rig Service
14:30 17:30 3,00 T.OH./Break Every JT. Due To Over Torqued
17:30 18;00 0.50 WIO/ pinsFor Tongs
18;00 18:30 0.50 Rip Service
18:30 23:30 5.00 WlO/ pinsFor Tongs
23:30 0.6:00 6.50 T.OM./Break Every JT. Due To Over Torqued
0.6:00
0:00
8:00
0:00
0:00

Total Unurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS ST G
Mrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 24tus Boiler Hours 24 UP 56,000

Nrs. Mob.fDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 24 0 Out N
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS11SED BIT RECORD
DEFru 47676 No. oF sAcK5]IB5 PRODUCTNAME BEFNO. 4
TIME 7;30am isks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIŒrT 12.1 ibox supersweep MFG Smith
vis 133 2sks polysset TYPE M616
WL 1sks caustic TFA
Pv/vP 52/30 Fed-Zan JET 18-Jun
MBT teks planum Pac. SEluALNo. JX1408
CA *IO Bar DEPTHOUT 4760
GELS 18/65 125sks asphasol DEPTHIN 4178
ALK .4/.6

C-325 TOTALFEET 582'
pH 10 MaxGel HRs 24.00
CAKE 2/32 1-sgal myadde T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $14,648.00 Wr. ON SIT
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST .940,567.00 RPM
%SOLIDS Û.75 CUMULATIVECOST $62,101.0û ROP(fph)

DPH I WIGASSE 18LY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
MIL DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUitP 80. 1 2 DEPR I =m=••| M

1 Bit 1.23 ptANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BOODEL BPSO 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
1 StabiBrer 5.71 SmeitE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
(EASENWE & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth tiovember3, 2007
MG NME ANDNUMBER COUMrY STG Days from spud
Unit Drilling . Riq 132 Carbon Utah 19
TUTALDEPfH Rat. His Rat. Hrs FOUTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ ReportNa

4470' O 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 26
Acnvny Ær REPORTEME REPORFEDBY

Trip Out Hole Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
25-5 KBTD GL.

T/O/H. Break Ever Joint Due To Over Torqued 15
TIME 10 i

mon le nouns ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 14:00 8,00 T.OH./Break Every JT Due To Over Torqued
14:00 !4:30 0.50 Rig Service
14:30 17:30 3,00 T.OH./Break Every JT. Due To Over Torqued
17:30 18;00 0.50 WIO/ pinsFor Tongs
18;00 18:30 0.50 Rip Service
18:30 23:30 5.00 WlO/ pinsFor Tongs
23:30 0.6:00 6.50 T.OM./Break Every JT. Due To Over Torqued
0.6:00
0:00
8:00
0:00
0:00

Total Unurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS ST G
Mrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 24tus Boiler Hours 24 UP 56,000

Nrs. Mob.fDemok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 24 0 Out N
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 0 Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS11SED BIT RECORD
DEFru 47676 No. oF sAcK5]IB5 PRODUCTNAME BEFNO. 4
TIME 7;30am isks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIŒrT 12.1 ibox supersweep MFG Smith
vis 133 2sks polysset TYPE M616
WL 1sks caustic TFA
Pv/vP 52/30 Fed-Zan JET 18-Jun
MBT teks planum Pac. SEluALNo. JX1408
CA *IO Bar DEPTHOUT 4760
GELS 18/65 125sks asphasol DEPTHIN 4178
ALK .4/.6

C-325 TOTALFEET 582'
pH 10 MaxGel HRs 24.00
CAKE 2/32 1-sgal myadde T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $14,648.00 Wr. ON SIT
DAPP 0.0 KCL PREVIOUSCOST .940,567.00 RPM
%SOLIDS Û.75 CUMULATIVECOST $62,101.0û ROP(fph)

DPH I WIGASSE 18LY PUMP i ATA MEVIATIONREC )RD
MIL DESCMPHON LENGm - FT PUitP 80. 1 2 DEPR I =m=••| M

1 Bit 1.23 ptANE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 MudMotor 32.91 BOODEL BPSO 8PSO 477' 1/2 Degree
1 StabiBrer 5.71 SmeitE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

OAR.Y ORIU.ING REPORT
uASENAMERWRUR RED DATE

RailroadSWD1 Kenifword1 November 4, 2007
usmemamma coumv isim oeysfromspud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 20
TGTMOEPU M. Hm dets W. A MOTArsEORRGB LASTCASIWSHE, WHGHT,GMDE SEig Repmt No

4470' i 0 74,5 0 9-5(8" 36# F55 STC 4306' RKB 27
ACIWHYAf SEFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip In Hole Richard Crow/Cecilcrow
tEMANE5 MBTOGL

Check Torque On Drill Pipett 2950/ Collars To 3900+ 15
TWE thG

mon To nouns ACTIVITYDETAR.
6:08 12;30 6.50 T.O H Break Ever Joint! Layed Stabilizer& Mud Motor
12;30 16:30 4.00 T.LH. With MudMotor/Bit/B.H.A.& †Std DriliPipe
16:30 18:00 1:50 Cut Off 120' Of Drill Line
18:00 21:00 3.00 Slip Drill Line Adjust Brakes
2000 23:30 2.50 Trip in Hole Check Torque On Every Joint To 2950 Ft/Lbs
23:30 0:30 1 00 Clean LC M. Out Mud Pumps
0:30 3:30 3.00 Trip In Hole Check Torque On Every Joint To 2950 Ft/Lbs.
3:30 6;00 2.50 Wash Ream To Bottom
SpO
8:00

RCCEgge
o:oo
o:eo NOVU8 ¿pp7

Total Cloura 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 975 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP
s. Neb.f Demet O 90 BMs. Water innded last 2nours 300 0 Out

TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total M2O ut ad on well & roa 100 Barrels ROTATE
MUD lEC0RC MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT tECORD

3EPTH 4760 NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTMME 800 NO. 3 4
TDIE 7;30am per sizE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 supersweep MF<i Smith
vis 133 polyswei fYPE M616 HPS3

L caMdk TEA

PvivP 52/30 Fed-zan 1ET 18-Jun 28-Mar
MBT platium Pac. %RIAL No. JX1408 DA3768

Bar SEPTl+OUT 4760
GELS 18/65 asphasol DEPTHIN 4178 4760
AIX .4f.6

C-325 TOTALFEET 582'
au 10 MenGet :*ts 24.00 LOG
CAKE 2/32 myacide f/B/G
et oma.vcost somo wr.oN srr 5/12K
aneP Oiß KCL MEVIOUS COST %567.00 RM 6Û
msouns 0.75 CUMU TIVECOST $62,101.00 ROPgph)

DRILt.tNGA$$E 4BLY 90MP1 ATA MEVIAT10NitEC)RD
no. assemenose tmsm-Fr essenso. 1 2 norm T-a-a-; Asimune

1 Bit LOG 54AKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL SPSO SPSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Stabiliser 5.71 SMONE 8.50 8.58 87f 1/2 Degree
12 6" DC 330.47 UNERSIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
I 3ars 29.02 SPM 92 18TT

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

OAR.Y ORIU.ING REPORT
uASENAMERWRUR RED DATE

RailroadSWD1 Kenifword1 November 4, 2007
usmemamma coumv isim oeysfromspud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 20
TGTMOEPU M. Hm dets W. A MOTArsEORRGB LASTCASIWSHE, WHGHT,GMDE SEig Repmt No

4470' i 0 74,5 0 9-5(8" 36# F55 STC 4306' RKB 27
ACIWHYAf SEFORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip In Hole Richard Crow/Cecilcrow
tEMANE5 MBTOGL

Check Torque On Drill Pipett 2950/ Collars To 3900+ 15
TWE thG

mon To nouns ACTIVITYDETAR.
6:08 12;30 6.50 T.O H Break Ever Joint! Layed Stabilizer& Mud Motor
12;30 16:30 4.00 T.LH. With MudMotor/Bit/B.H.A.& †Std DriliPipe
16:30 18:00 1:50 Cut Off 120' Of Drill Line
18:00 21:00 3.00 Slip Drill Line Adjust Brakes
2000 23:30 2.50 Trip in Hole Check Torque On Every Joint To 2950 Ft/Lbs
23:30 0:30 1 00 Clean LC M. Out Mud Pumps
0:30 3:30 3.00 Trip In Hole Check Torque On Every Joint To 2950 Ft/Lbs.
3:30 6;00 2.50 Wash Ream To Bottom
SpO
8:00

RCCEgge
o:oo
o:eo NOVU8 ¿pp7

Total Cloura 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 975 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP
s. Neb.f Demet O 90 BMs. Water innded last 2nours 300 0 Out

TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total M2O ut ad on well & roa 100 Barrels ROTATE
MUD lEC0RC MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT tECORD

3EPTH 4760 NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTMME 800 NO. 3 4
TDIE 7;30am per sizE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 supersweep MF<i Smith
vis 133 polyswei fYPE M616 HPS3

L caMdk TEA

PvivP 52/30 Fed-zan 1ET 18-Jun 28-Mar
MBT platium Pac. %RIAL No. JX1408 DA3768

Bar SEPTl+OUT 4760
GELS 18/65 asphasol DEPTHIN 4178 4760
AIX .4f.6

C-325 TOTALFEET 582'
au 10 MenGet :*ts 24.00 LOG
CAKE 2/32 myacide f/B/G
et oma.vcost somo wr.oN srr 5/12K
aneP Oiß KCL MEVIOUS COST %567.00 RM 6Û
msouns 0.75 CUMU TIVECOST $62,101.00 ROPgph)

DRILt.tNGA$$E 4BLY 90MP1 ATA MEVIAT10NitEC)RD
no. assemenose tmsm-Fr essenso. 1 2 norm T-a-a-; Asimune

1 Bit LOG 54AKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL SPSO SPSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Stabiliser 5.71 SMONE 8.50 8.58 87f 1/2 Degree
12 6" DC 330.47 UNERSIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
I 3ars 29.02 SPM 92 18TT



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAlt.Y ORTH TMC REPORT
UBSE IME &WEL NO. BRD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 KenifWOrtl‡ November 5, 2007

Unit Drillingcorp.Rig 132 Carbon Utah 21
TUTALDEPRf Ret. His cuntRot. His FOffAGE DRTLLED IASTCASINGSfZE,WBGMT,MDE SErg mµ t No.

4470' 0 74.5 0 9-5/8" 36#>55 STC 4306' RKB 28
ACHVHYATMPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Actual Driß Richard Crow/CecitCrow
amms a roat.
Oepth Change <F 14770 / TI 7613 15

TIME108
man To unuus ACTIVITYDETAIL
6:00 12:00 6,00 Actual DrillFI4761 T/4770
12:W 14:00 2.00 Loseing Volume Dowm Hole ICirTo BuildVotume /Conditon Mud
14:00 18:00 4ßD Reaming I Washing Down To 4770'
18:00 20:00 2.00 Rreaming / Wash Down To 47ô1'--<Depth Change 4770/ To 4761' >

20:00 0.6:00 1Œ00 Actuat Drin F4761 Tl4823
0.ROO
0:00
0:00
4:00
8:00
0:00

00

mm DIVOFGIL,CAbgg/NINA
Total E|lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs.Rig Repair 0.00 FUfËLUSED 975 24hrs Boiler Nours 24 122K
anto...« aoo sens.watermanteriast24eoors o o soK
TOTALDAYWOR& 24-00 Total H2O m ad on well & road 250 Banels ROTATE 65/70 R.P M

MUD lECóRC MUD MATERIALEJSED Brf IECORD
DEPN 467Û' NO.GF 5MK5]EBS PRODLCrMME Brr No. 3 4
RNE S;OÛgm taks pac-r SIZE A 3/4 $ 3/4
WEIGur 11.7 4sks. supersweep MFG Smith
es $2 TYPE M616 flPS3
wt SA ande a
PVfYP 50(35 30 Fed-Zan XT 18-Jun 28-Mar

MET elanumvac. seRIAtmo. 3X1408 OA3768
2 Bar SEPTROtif 4760
cas 12/27 50sks asphasoi DEFW IN 4178 4760

.15/ 6 2 C-325 TOTA FEET 582'
9 Mense Has 24.00 25,00

CME 2/32 Reho myacide T/B/G
Q. DAILY005T ‡17,020.00 WT.ON ÐFF 1Ž/35 K,
an. 45 enevioustust teper.ca 65/70
%soucs 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $79,12LOO ROP(fph)

DRILEDIGASSE4BLY PUMPi ATA NEVIATIONREC3RD
m. ossempraos talem-n suomalo. 1 2 DEPM IncMaadon f -

1 Bit 1.00 54AKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 ## MooEL SPSO SPSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Stabilizer 5.71 Em0NE $.5Û 8.5Û $71' 1(ÀDegree

12 6" DC 330.47 LMERSIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
1 Jars 29.02 SPM 120 18TP



Marion Energy inc.
119 STennessee, Ste \SS gMcKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LEASE$IAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 6, 2007
RIGMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 22
forAL DEPFH Rat Hrs cum Rat Hrs R)0TAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SETg Repmt a 22

4968' 49 123.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 29
RTlvitY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TripOut Of Hole/ Pick Up P.D.C.Bit RichardCrow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROli Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Actual DrillFI 4823 T/4887
15:00 15;30 0.50 Rig Service
15;30 18:00 2.50 Actual Drill 4887 T/4898'
18:00 3:00 9,00 ACTUAL Drill4898' TI4968'
3:00 4:30 1.50 Cir To Trip out Hole Set Kelly Back
4:30 6:00 1.50 T.O.H./ To Pick Up PDC Bit
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

si DECCIVED

o:oo
0:00 vië ùE GIL,CAD&MINING

Totai llours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE|BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1095 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 122K

irs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 houra 500 0 Out DOWN 90K
fGTALDAYWOR& 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 250 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT tECOi D
DEPN 4887 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTFNO. 3 4
(IME 15:00 2sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11 8 reho MFG Smith
VIs 57+ 196sks Kci TYPE M616 HP53
wt. 6.6 1sks causUc D%
Pv/YP 35/30 10sks fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun 28-Mar
MBT 1sks platium Pac. SERIAL No. JX1408 DA3768
CA 2 superio DEVm OUT 4760 4968'
GEIS 8/24 DEPTN IN 4178 4760
Auc .15|.6 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 582' 207
pH 9 10ska samiust HRs 24.00 49.00
CAKE Ž/32 ks myacide f/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $6,808.00 NT. ON err 12/35 K.
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $79,121.00 RPM 65/70
%souns 15.00 CUMULATIVECOST $85,929.00 ROP(fph) 5/20'

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMPI ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
lia. DESCMPflOft MiiGTH - FT PUiiP NO. 1 2 DEPEN Inc¾nadon / Asimuth
1 Bit 1.00 esAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Molor 32.91 ## idODEL 8P80 8P80 4T1' 1/2 Degme
1 Stabiliser 5.71 smOKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DC 330.47 UNER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
1 Jars 29.02 sm 120 1877'

Marion Energy inc.
119 STennessee, Ste \SS gMcKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LEASE$IAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 6, 2007
RIGMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 22
forAL DEPFH Rat Hrs cum Rat Hrs R)0TAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SETg Repmt a 22

4968' 49 123.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 29
RTlvitY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TripOut Of Hole/ Pick Up P.D.C.Bit RichardCrow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROli Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Actual DrillFI 4823 T/4887
15:00 15;30 0.50 Rig Service
15;30 18:00 2.50 Actual Drill 4887 T/4898'
18:00 3:00 9,00 ACTUAL Drill4898' TI4968'
3:00 4:30 1.50 Cir To Trip out Hole Set Kelly Back
4:30 6:00 1.50 T.O.H./ To Pick Up PDC Bit
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

si DECCIVED

o:oo
0:00 vië ùE GIL,CAD&MINING

Totai llours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE|BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1095 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 122K

irs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 houra 500 0 Out DOWN 90K
fGTALDAYWOR& 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 250 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT tECOi D
DEPN 4887 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTFNO. 3 4
(IME 15:00 2sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11 8 reho MFG Smith
VIs 57+ 196sks Kci TYPE M616 HP53
wt. 6.6 1sks causUc D%
Pv/YP 35/30 10sks fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun 28-Mar
MBT 1sks platium Pac. SERIAL No. JX1408 DA3768
CA 2 superio DEVm OUT 4760 4968'
GEIS 8/24 DEPTN IN 4178 4760
Auc .15|.6 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 582' 207
pH 9 10ska samiust HRs 24.00 49.00
CAKE Ž/32 ks myacide f/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $6,808.00 NT. ON err 12/35 K.
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $79,121.00 RPM 65/70
%souns 15.00 CUMULATIVECOST $85,929.00 ROP(fph) 5/20'

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMPI ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
lia. DESCMPflOft MiiGTH - FT PUiiP NO. 1 2 DEPEN Inc¾nadon / Asimuth
1 Bit 1.00 esAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Molor 32.91 ## idODEL 8P80 8P80 4T1' 1/2 Degme
1 Stabiliser 5.71 smOKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DC 330.47 UNER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
1 Jars 29.02 sm 120 1877'

Marion Energy inc.
119 STennessee, Ste \SS gMcKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LEASE$IAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 6, 2007
RIGMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 22
forAL DEPFH Rat Hrs cum Rat Hrs R)0TAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SETg Repmt a 22

4968' 49 123.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 29
RTlvitY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TripOut Of Hole/ Pick Up P.D.C.Bit RichardCrow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROli Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Actual DrillFI 4823 T/4887
15:00 15;30 0.50 Rig Service
15;30 18:00 2.50 Actual Drill 4887 T/4898'
18:00 3:00 9,00 ACTUAL Drill4898' TI4968'
3:00 4:30 1.50 Cir To Trip out Hole Set Kelly Back
4:30 6:00 1.50 T.O.H./ To Pick Up PDC Bit
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

si DECCIVED

o:oo
0:00 vië ùE GIL,CAD&MINING

Totai llours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE|BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1095 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 122K

irs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 houra 500 0 Out DOWN 90K
fGTALDAYWOR& 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 250 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT tECOi D
DEPN 4887 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTFNO. 3 4
(IME 15:00 2sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11 8 reho MFG Smith
VIs 57+ 196sks Kci TYPE M616 HP53
wt. 6.6 1sks causUc D%
Pv/YP 35/30 10sks fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun 28-Mar
MBT 1sks platium Pac. SERIAL No. JX1408 DA3768
CA 2 superio DEVm OUT 4760 4968'
GEIS 8/24 DEPTN IN 4178 4760
Auc .15|.6 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 582' 207
pH 9 10ska samiust HRs 24.00 49.00
CAKE Ž/32 ks myacide f/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $6,808.00 NT. ON err 12/35 K.
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $79,121.00 RPM 65/70
%souns 15.00 CUMULATIVECOST $85,929.00 ROP(fph) 5/20'

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMPI ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
lia. DESCMPflOft MiiGTH - FT PUiiP NO. 1 2 DEPEN Inc¾nadon / Asimuth
1 Bit 1.00 esAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Molor 32.91 ## idODEL 8P80 8P80 4T1' 1/2 Degme
1 Stabiliser 5.71 smOKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DC 330.47 UNER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
1 Jars 29.02 sm 120 1877'

Marion Energy inc.
119 STennessee, Ste \SS gMcKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
LEASE$IAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 6, 2007
RIGMMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 22
forAL DEPFH Rat Hrs cum Rat Hrs R)0TAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SETg Repmt a 22

4968' 49 123.5 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 29
RTlvitY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TripOut Of Hole/ Pick Up P.D.C.Bit RichardCrow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROli Houns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:00 9.00 Actual DrillFI 4823 T/4887
15:00 15;30 0.50 Rig Service
15;30 18:00 2.50 Actual Drill 4887 T/4898'
18:00 3:00 9,00 ACTUAL Drill4898' TI4968'
3:00 4:30 1.50 Cir To Trip out Hole Set Kelly Back
4:30 6:00 1.50 T.O.H./ To Pick Up PDC Bit
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

si DECCIVED

o:oo
0:00 vië ùE GIL,CAD&MINING

Totai llours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE|BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1095 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 122K

irs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 houra 500 0 Out DOWN 90K
fGTALDAYWOR& 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 250 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALS ISED BIT tECOi D
DEPN 4887 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTFNO. 3 4
(IME 15:00 2sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11 8 reho MFG Smith
VIs 57+ 196sks Kci TYPE M616 HP53
wt. 6.6 1sks causUc D%
Pv/YP 35/30 10sks fed-Zan 3ET 18-Jun 28-Mar
MBT 1sks platium Pac. SERIAL No. JX1408 DA3768
CA 2 superio DEVm OUT 4760 4968'
GEIS 8/24 DEPTN IN 4178 4760
Auc .15|.6 1 C-325 TOTALFEET 582' 207
pH 9 10ska samiust HRs 24.00 49.00
CAKE Ž/32 ks myacide f/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $6,808.00 NT. ON err 12/35 K.
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $79,121.00 RPM 65/70
%souns 15.00 CUMULATIVECOST $85,929.00 ROP(fph) 5/20'

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMPI ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
lia. DESCMPflOft MiiGTH - FT PUiiP NO. 1 2 DEPEN Inc¾nadon / Asimuth
1 Bit 1.00 esAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Molor 32.91 ## idODEL 8P80 8P80 4T1' 1/2 Degme
1 Stabiliser 5.71 smOKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DC 330.47 UNER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
1 Jars 29.02 sm 120 1877'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETÄTE Days from spud

UnitDrillingcorp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 24
COTALDEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LA5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repolt No. 22

4968' 3 125 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 31
ACTIViTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing vis& Wt. Back UP Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Condition Mud & Circulate
11:00 18;00 7.00 Reaming F/4739 T 4926
18;00 3;00 9.00 Reaming F/4739 T /5001
3;00 6;00 3.00 Actual Drill FI 5001 TI 5006.
6;00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

DECEIVED

00
0 UIV,ut ulL,GAG&MIN1NC

Total flours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k

·hs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 98k
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD IECORE MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5006' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME pm 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.8 4sks reho MFG Smith
vIs 79 98sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.4 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan 3ET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT 20sks aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superio DEPTN OUT

GELs 12/23 10sks Durogel DEFTN IN 4968'
ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTALFEET 4/12k
pH 9 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gaL myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $12,293.00 WT.ONSIT 4/'12k
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $90,306.00 RPM
%SOLIDs 19.00 cUMULATIVECOST $102,599.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA isEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS . 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

I
12 6" DrillCollarS 2 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRE5SURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETÄTE Days from spud

UnitDrillingcorp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 24
COTALDEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LA5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repolt No. 22

4968' 3 125 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 31
ACTIViTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing vis& Wt. Back UP Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Condition Mud & Circulate
11:00 18;00 7.00 Reaming F/4739 T 4926
18;00 3;00 9.00 Reaming F/4739 T /5001
3;00 6;00 3.00 Actual Drill FI 5001 TI 5006.
6;00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

DECEIVED

00
0 UIV,ut ulL,GAG&MIN1NC

Total flours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k

·hs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 98k
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD IECORE MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5006' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME pm 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.8 4sks reho MFG Smith
vIs 79 98sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.4 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan 3ET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT 20sks aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superio DEPTN OUT

GELs 12/23 10sks Durogel DEFTN IN 4968'
ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTALFEET 4/12k
pH 9 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gaL myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $12,293.00 WT.ONSIT 4/'12k
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $90,306.00 RPM
%SOLIDs 19.00 cUMULATIVECOST $102,599.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA isEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS . 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

I
12 6" DrillCollarS 2 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRE5SURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETÄTE Days from spud

UnitDrillingcorp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 24
COTALDEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LA5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repolt No. 22

4968' 3 125 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 31
ACTIViTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing vis& Wt. Back UP Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Condition Mud & Circulate
11:00 18;00 7.00 Reaming F/4739 T 4926
18;00 3;00 9.00 Reaming F/4739 T /5001
3;00 6;00 3.00 Actual Drill FI 5001 TI 5006.
6;00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

DECEIVED

00
0 UIV,ut ulL,GAG&MIN1NC

Total flours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k

·hs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 98k
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD IECORE MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5006' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME pm 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.8 4sks reho MFG Smith
vIs 79 98sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.4 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan 3ET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT 20sks aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superio DEPTN OUT

GELs 12/23 10sks Durogel DEFTN IN 4968'
ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTALFEET 4/12k
pH 9 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gaL myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $12,293.00 WT.ONSIT 4/'12k
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $90,306.00 RPM
%SOLIDs 19.00 cUMULATIVECOST $102,599.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA isEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS . 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

I
12 6" DrillCollarS 2 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRE5SURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETÄTE Days from spud

UnitDrillingcorp.Rig 132 carbon Utah 24
COTALDEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LA5TCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repolt No. 22

4968' 3 125 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 31
ACTIViTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing vis& Wt. Back UP Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Condition Mud & Circulate
11:00 18;00 7.00 Reaming F/4739 T 4926
18;00 3;00 9.00 Reaming F/4739 T /5001
3;00 6;00 3.00 Actual Drill FI 5001 TI 5006.
6;00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

DECEIVED

00
0 UIV,ut ulL,GAG&MIN1NC

Total flours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k

·hs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 98k
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P.M.

MUD IECORE MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5006' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME pm 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.8 4sks reho MFG Smith
vIs 79 98sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.4 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan 3ET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT 20sks aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superio DEPTN OUT

GELs 12/23 10sks Durogel DEFTN IN 4968'
ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTALFEET 4/12k
pH 9 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gaL myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $12,293.00 WT.ONSIT 4/'12k
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $90,306.00 RPM
%SOLIDs 19.00 cUMULATIVECOST $102,599.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA isEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8PSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS . 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

I
12 6" DrillCollarS 2 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRE5SURE 2810'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 23
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. 22

4968' 0 125 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 30
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing Vis & Wt. Back UP |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Hole Sluffing In /Lost Contro Of Water Zone Cuting Vis / Weight Down. Am At Present GainingOn It. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Trip Hole Pick UP PDC Bit
8:00 9:30 · 1.50 Rig Service Changed Oil On Floor Motors
9:30 13:30 4.00 Walt On shockSub
13:30 18:00 4.50 Trip In Hole
18:00 20:30 2.50 Trip In Hole Hit Bridge /90 ' From Bottom Lost Cir.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Trip Out 6 Stands
21:00 0:00 3.00 Condition Mud /Circulate Hole / Repain Cir.
0:00 1:30 1.50 Trip In 4 Stands IReaming To Bottom
1:30 2:30 1.00 LD 6-Jts DPI TlH 2-Stds
2:30 3:30 1.00 Reaming & Circulating
3:30 6:00 2.50 Circulate & Condition Mud/ Mixing LCM & Bringing Wt. & Vis Up To Hold Back Sluffing Shales
6:00
0:00 RFCEIVED
0:00
0:00 NOV19 20070:00
0:00 nivnF nil, ¾? &MININQ
Total Nours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k
49. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O O Out DOWN 98k
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P M.

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4980' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME 10:00 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.3 4sks reho MFG Smith
vis 60 49sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.6 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superlo DEPTH OUT

GELs 11/28 10sks Durogel DEPTH IN
ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTAL FEET 4968'
pH 8.5 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gal. myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $4,377.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $85,929.00 RPM
%souos 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $90,306.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP i ATA I+EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

12 6" Drill CollarS SPM 1877 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRESSURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 23
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. 22

4968' 0 125 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 30
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing Vis & Wt. Back UP |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Hole Sluffing In /Lost Contro Of Water Zone Cuting Vis / Weight Down. Am At Present GainingOn It. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Trip Hole Pick UP PDC Bit
8:00 9:30 · 1.50 Rig Service Changed Oil On Floor Motors
9:30 13:30 4.00 Walt On shockSub
13:30 18:00 4.50 Trip In Hole
18:00 20:30 2.50 Trip In Hole Hit Bridge /90 ' From Bottom Lost Cir.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Trip Out 6 Stands
21:00 0:00 3.00 Condition Mud /Circulate Hole / Repain Cir.
0:00 1:30 1.50 Trip In 4 Stands IReaming To Bottom
1:30 2:30 1.00 LD 6-Jts DPI TlH 2-Stds
2:30 3:30 1.00 Reaming & Circulating
3:30 6:00 2.50 Circulate & Condition Mud/ Mixing LCM & Bringing Wt. & Vis Up To Hold Back Sluffing Shales
6:00
0:00 RFCEIVED
0:00
0:00 NOV19 20070:00
0:00 nivnF nil, ¾? &MININQ
Total Nours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k
49. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O O Out DOWN 98k
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P M.

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4980' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME 10:00 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.3 4sks reho MFG Smith
vis 60 49sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.6 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superlo DEPTH OUT

GELs 11/28 10sks Durogel DEPTH IN
ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTAL FEET 4968'
pH 8.5 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gal. myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $4,377.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $85,929.00 RPM
%souos 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $90,306.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP i ATA I+EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

12 6" Drill CollarS SPM 1877 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRESSURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 23
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. 22

4968' 0 125 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 30
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing Vis & Wt. Back UP |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Hole Sluffing In /Lost Contro Of Water Zone Cuting Vis / Weight Down. Am At Present GainingOn It. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Trip Hole Pick UP PDC Bit
8:00 9:30 · 1.50 Rig Service Changed Oil On Floor Motors
9:30 13:30 4.00 Walt On shockSub
13:30 18:00 4.50 Trip In Hole
18:00 20:30 2.50 Trip In Hole Hit Bridge /90 ' From Bottom Lost Cir.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Trip Out 6 Stands
21:00 0:00 3.00 Condition Mud /Circulate Hole / Repain Cir.
0:00 1:30 1.50 Trip In 4 Stands IReaming To Bottom
1:30 2:30 1.00 LD 6-Jts DPI TlH 2-Stds
2:30 3:30 1.00 Reaming & Circulating
3:30 6:00 2.50 Circulate & Condition Mud/ Mixing LCM & Bringing Wt. & Vis Up To Hold Back Sluffing Shales
6:00
0:00 RFCEIVED
0:00
0:00 NOV19 20070:00
0:00 nivnF nil, ¾? &MININQ
Total Nours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k
49. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O O Out DOWN 98k
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P M.

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4980' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME 10:00 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.3 4sks reho MFG Smith
vis 60 49sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.6 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superlo DEPTH OUT

GELs 11/28 10sks Durogel DEPTH IN

ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTAL FEET 4968'
pH 8.5 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gal. myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $4,377.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $85,929.00 RPM
%souos 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $90,306.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP i ATA I+EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

12 6" Drill CollarS SPM 1877 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRESSURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 7, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 23
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. 22

4968' 0 125 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 30
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Bringing Vis & Wt. Back UP |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Hole Sluffing In /Lost Contro Of Water Zone Cuting Vis / Weight Down. Am At Present GainingOn It. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Trip Hole Pick UP PDC Bit
8:00 9:30 · 1.50 Rig Service Changed Oil On Floor Motors
9:30 13:30 4.00 Walt On shockSub
13:30 18:00 4.50 Trip In Hole
18:00 20:30 2.50 Trip In Hole Hit Bridge /90 ' From Bottom Lost Cir.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Trip Out 6 Stands
21:00 0:00 3.00 Condition Mud /Circulate Hole / Repain Cir.
0:00 1:30 1.50 Trip In 4 Stands IReaming To Bottom
1:30 2:30 1.00 LD 6-Jts DPI TlH 2-Stds
2:30 3:30 1.00 Reaming & Circulating
3:30 6:00 2.50 Circulate & Condition Mud/ Mixing LCM & Bringing Wt. & Vis Up To Hold Back Sluffing Shales
6:00
0:00 RFCEIVED
0:00
0:00 NOV19 20070:00
0:00 nivnF nil, ¾? &MININQ
Total Nours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 24hrs Boiler Hours 24 UP 127k
49. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O O Out DOWN 98k
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 65/70 R.P M.

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4980' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 5
TIME 10:00 1sks pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.3 4sks reho MFG Smith
vis 60 49sks Kcl TYPE M616VSPX
WL 6.6 1sks caustic TFA

PV/YP 4o/32 5sks Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 1sks superlo DEPTH OUT

GELs 11/28 10sks Durogel DEPTH IN

ALK .15/.6 40 barite TOTAL FEET 4968'
pH 8.5 2sks Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 1/5gal. myacide T/B/G

CL 3,600 DAILYCOST $4,377.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $85,929.00 RPM
%souos 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $90,306.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP i ATA I+EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

12 6" Drill CollarS SPM 1877 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collars SURF PRESSURE 2810'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 9, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 25
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cumRot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

5300' 23.5 151.5 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 32
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillinq@5300' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore is clean andin good shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACFIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:30 9.50 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5006' to 5050'
15:30 16:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5050' to 5300'

REUFIVED
NUVi A2007

DMOFOIIGB &MINING

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP 128,000

drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 126,000
FOTAL DAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 127,000

MUD lECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5012 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5
TIME 6:30 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 4 reho MFG Smith
vis 66 0 Kci TYPE M616VSPX
WL 4.8 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 40/53 35 Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT ? 5 aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 80 2 superlo DEPT11OUT

GELS 12/26 Durogel DEPTH IN 4968'
ALK .2/.8 1 black fury TOTAL FEET 332
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 26.50
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G

CL 36,000 DAILYCOST $15,217.00 WT. ON BIT 12-35 K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $102,599.00 RPM 80/40
%SOLIDs 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $117,816.00 ROP(fph) 12.5

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA I?EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' Ò.5°

12 6" Drill Collat5 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collais SURF PRESSURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 9, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 25
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cumRot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

5300' 23.5 151.5 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 32
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillinq@5300' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore is clean andin good shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACFIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:30 9.50 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5006' to 5050'
15:30 16:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5050' to 5300'

REUFIVED
NUVi A2007

DMOFOIIGB &MINING

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP 128,000

drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 126,000
FOTAL DAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 127,000

MUD lECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5012 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5
TIME 6:30 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 4 reho MFG Smith
vis 66 0 Kci TYPE M616VSPX
WL 4.8 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 40/53 35 Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT ? 5 aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 80 2 superlo DEPT11OUT

GELS 12/26 Durogel DEPTH IN 4968'
ALK .2/.8 1 black fury TOTAL FEET 332
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 26.50
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G

CL 36,000 DAILYCOST $15,217.00 WT. ON BIT 12-35 K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $102,599.00 RPM 80/40
%SOLIDs 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $117,816.00 ROP(fph) 12.5

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA I?EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' Ò.5°

12 6" Drill Collat5 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collais SURF PRESSURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 9, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 25
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cumRot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

5300' 23.5 151.5 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 32
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillinq@5300' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore is clean andin good shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACFIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:30 9.50 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5006' to 5050'
15:30 16:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5050' to 5300'

REUFIVED
NUVi A2007

DMOFOIIGB &MINING

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP 128,000

drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 126,000
FOTAL DAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 127,000

MUD lECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5012 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5
TIME 6:30 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 4 reho MFG Smith
vis 66 0 Kci TYPE M616VSPX
WL 4.8 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 40/53 35 Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT ? 5 aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 80 2 superlo DEPT11OUT

GELS 12/26 Durogel DEPTH IN 4968'
ALK .2/.8 1 black fury TOTAL FEET 332
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 26.50
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G

CL 36,000 DAILYCOST $15,217.00 WT. ON BIT 12-35 K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $102,599.00 RPM 80/40
%SOLIDs 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $117,816.00 ROP(fph) 12.5

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA I?EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' Ò.5°

12 6" Drill Collat5 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collais SURF PRESSURE 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 9, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 25
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cumRot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

5300' 23.5 151.5 0 |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 32
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillinq@5300' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore is clean andin good shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACFIVITY DETAIL
6:00 15:30 9.50 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5006' to 5050'
15:30 16:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5050' to 5300'

REUFIVED
NUVi A2007

DMOFOIIGB &MINING

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRINGWT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP 128,000

drs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O 360 0 Out DOWN 126,000
FOTAL DAYWORh 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 200 Barrels ROTATE 127,000

MUD lECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5012 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 5
TIME 6:30 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 4 reho MFG Smith
vis 66 0 Kci TYPE M616VSPX
WL 4.8 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 40/53 35 Fed-Zan JET 3x16/ 3x20
MBT ? 5 aspitasol SERIAL No. JW7325
CA 80 2 superlo DEPT11OUT

GELS 12/26 Durogel DEPTH IN 4968'
ALK .2/.8 1 black fury TOTAL FEET 332
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 26.50
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G

CL 36,000 DAILYCOST $15,217.00 WT. ON BIT 12-35 K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $102,599.00 RPM 80/40
%SOLIDs 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $117,816.00 ROP(fph) 12.5

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA I?EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' Ò.5°

12 6" Drill Collat5 SPM 1877' 1°

1 Jars 31.80 GPM 2196' 1°

6 6" Drill Collais SURF PRESSURE 2810'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
ASEMMERWEU.NO. BRD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 10, 2007
:RGMME RID NUMBER C0um sim oays from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon utah 26
rorAt DEPFM Rat. Hrs Rat. Hrs FOOTAGEDRIGED LASTCASINGSIZE,WErmit, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

5410' 9.5 j 161 110 \9-5/8"36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 33
scavnY AT RWORTEME REPORE BT

Trip in hole with new bit and motor. Richard LTatman
REMMS MBTOGL.

Pullud through tightspots ficm 5030' to 4560' I 45 k overpull. 15
TIMELOG

ynon nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drilling8 3/4" Hole from 5300' to 5333'
7:30 9:30 2.00 Run deviation survey g 5247 First run missrun second run i deg.
9:30 10:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig
10:00 18:00 8.00 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5333' to 5410'
18:00 19:00 1.00 Circulate htms up Mix pill/ Set kelly back and blow down
19:00 20:00 1.00 Pull out of hole Putt into tightspot at 5030' Kelly up and work through.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Pull out of hele 11 stands to shoe
21:00 22:30 1.50 Circulate and build pillI Pump pill/ Set kelly back and blow down again.
22:30 4:30 6.00 Poll out ofhole I Lay down 1 drill collarand Mud motor
4:30 6:00 1.50 Stap new motor / makeup bit/ pickup 1 DCI trip in hole

REChiVFD
NUV19 pgg7

DIVU UK,GAS&MINING
Totalliours 24.00 FUELANDWATERUSEI BOILERHOURS ( STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP 130,000
iss. Mob.|Demot 0.00 Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in! O 124,000
(OTALDAYWORF 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5401 740. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME STFNO. 5
HME Î4:ÛÛ pac-r 5IZE $ 3/4
WEIGrir 11.7 4 who MFG Smith
vis 78 0 Kd TYPE M616VSPX
a 4.4 2 ausde TFA

Pv¡YP 36/42 35 MZan lET 3X16/ 3X20

Mar ? 5 aspRasoi 3ERIAt. No. JW7325
60 2 superlo DEPTHOUT 5410'

GELS 12/26 Durogel DEP m IN 4968'
At.K .2/1.0 1 black fury TUTALFEET 442
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash | & 36,00
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/8/G

CL 27,000 DAILYCOST $15,217.00 NT. ONBIT 12-40 k
KCL 5.Û PREVIOUS CO5T $102,599.00 RPM ßÛ/4Û
%souns 21.00 CUMULATIVECOST $117,816.00 ROP(fph) 12.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCMPTION LEGIN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM IncMnaden / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 SPSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 sinoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LMERSI2E 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" DrillCollarS SPM 1877

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
ASEMMERWEU.NO. BRD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 10, 2007
:RGMME RID NUMBER C0um sim oays from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon utah 26
rorAt DEPFM Rat. Hrs Rat. Hrs FOOTAGEDRIGED LASTCASINGSIZE,WErmit, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

5410' 9.5 j 161 110 \9-5/8"36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 33
scavnY AT RWORTEME REPORE BT

Trip in hole with new bit and motor. Richard LTatman
REMMS MBTOGL.

Pullud through tightspots ficm 5030' to 4560' I 45 k overpull. 15
TIMELOG

ynon nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Drilling8 3/4" Hole from 5300' to 5333'
7:30 9:30 2.00 Run deviation survey g 5247 First run missrun second run i deg.
9:30 10:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig
10:00 18:00 8.00 Drilling 8 3/4" Hole from 5333' to 5410'
18:00 19:00 1.00 Circulate htms up Mix pill/ Set kelly back and blow down
19:00 20:00 1.00 Pull out of hole Putt into tightspot at 5030' Kelly up and work through.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Pull out of hele 11 stands to shoe
21:00 22:30 1.50 Circulate and build pillI Pump pill/ Set kelly back and blow down again.
22:30 4:30 6.00 Poll out ofhole I Lay down 1 drill collarand Mud motor
4:30 6:00 1.50 Stap new motor / makeup bit/ pickup 1 DCI trip in hole

REChiVFD
NUV19 pgg7

DIVU UK,GAS&MINING
Totalliours 24.00 FUELANDWATERUSEI BOILERHOURS ( STRINGWT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP 130,000
iss. Mob.|Demot 0.00 Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in! O 124,000
(OTALDAYWORF 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORE MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5401 740. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME STFNO. 5
HME Î4:ÛÛ pac-r 5IZE $ 3/4
WEIGrir 11.7 4 who MFG Smith
vis 78 0 Kd TYPE M616VSPX
a 4.4 2 ausde TFA

Pv¡YP 36/42 35 MZan lET 3X16/ 3X20

Mar ? 5 aspRasoi 3ERIAt. No. JW7325
60 2 superlo DEPTHOUT 5410'

GELS 12/26 Durogel DEP m IN 4968'
At.K .2/1.0 1 black fury TUTALFEET 442
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash | & 36,00
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/8/G

CL 27,000 DAILYCOST $15,217.00 NT. ONBIT 12-40 k
KCL 5.Û PREVIOUS CO5T $102,599.00 RPM ßÛ/4Û
%souns 21.00 CUMULATIVECOST $117,816.00 ROP(fph) 12.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCMPTION LEGIN - FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPM IncMnaden / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL 8P80 SPSO 477 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 sinoxE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LMERSI2E 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" DrillCollarS SPM 1877



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAII..YDRILLING REPORT
LMSE MME & WER NO. HRD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 K&liiWOrth November 11, 2007
IBG tiMIE MID mmBER COURY STKTE oays from spud

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 27
TOW DBW Rat as Rat. As MOTAGE ORERED WT WING 572E, WBGHT, GMDE SET @ Report No .

5426' 2,5 163,5 16' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 34
ACTMIY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drilling@ 5426' Richard LTatman
REMANK5 KBTO GL

Break bit in with 18 k WOB I Drillingwith 38 to 40 K WOS 5 it/ hr. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:30 7.50 Trip in hole I Break circulation at 2000' then again at 4306' I continue in hole to 4748' tag up
13:30 17:00 3.50 Kelly up wash and ream from 4748 to 493ß'
17:00 18:00 1.00 Trip in hole to 5179' I remove Elevators and pickup Kelly.
18:00 3:30 9.50 Wash and ream from 5159' to 5410'
3:30 6:00 2.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5410 to 5426' ( hreak in new bit with 18 K)

RECFIVED
MMi .9 my

UN.OFOILQASAMINING
Tota! Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED | 568 Boiler Hours 24 UP 130,000
lis.Mob]Demot 0.00 Bbia. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in O Out DOWN 124,000
10TAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATER2At.STSED BIT tÈCOAD
DErm 5301 NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTMME err No. 5 6
rme 20:00 pac-r sizE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGerr 11,7 4 reho MFU Smith Reed
vis 79 o Kci rYPE M616VSPX HP 52 XKPR
WL 4 2 causue TFA

PV/YP 4Û|32 35 Fed-Zan 1ET 3X16/ 3X20 Open

met 13% 5 aspitasol 5ERIAL No. JW7325 MR1446
CA 40 2 superlo DEPTHOUT 5410'
GELS 11/29 Dumgel DEFB IN 4968' 5410
ALK .15/.8 1 blackfury TUTALFEET 442 16
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS 36.00 2.50
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G
et 22,000 DAILYCOST $7,00.00 NT. ONBIT 12-40 k 18-40 K
KEL 4.Û PREVIOU5 COST $117,816.00 RPM 8Û 4Û 8Û/40
asoues 19.00 DJMULARVECOST $124,859.00 ROP(fph) 12.3 6.4

DRILt.ING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
MO. DESCRIPFION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Inc¾nadon / Azimuda

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degee
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL SPBÛ BPBÛ 4TT 1/2 ÛBgree

1 Shock Sub 7,88 STRoxa 8,50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SI2E 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" DrillCollars sPM 124 18TT

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAII..YDRILLING REPORT
LMSE MME & WER NO. HRD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 K&liiWOrth November 11, 2007
IBG tiMIE MID mmBER COURY STKTE oays from spud

Unit Drilling . Rig 132 carbon Utah 27
TOW DBW Rat as Rat. As MOTAGE ORERED WT WING 572E, WBGHT, GMDE SET @ Report No .

5426' 2,5 163,5 16' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 34
ACTMIY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drilling@ 5426' Richard LTatman
REMANK5 KBTO GL

Break bit in with 18 k WOB I Drillingwith 38 to 40 K WOS 5 it/ hr. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:30 7.50 Trip in hole I Break circulation at 2000' then again at 4306' I continue in hole to 4748' tag up
13:30 17:00 3.50 Kelly up wash and ream from 4748 to 493ß'
17:00 18:00 1.00 Trip in hole to 5179' I remove Elevators and pickup Kelly.
18:00 3:30 9.50 Wash and ream from 5159' to 5410'
3:30 6:00 2.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5410 to 5426' ( hreak in new bit with 18 K)

RECFIVED
MMi .9 my

UN.OFOILQASAMINING
Tota! Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUELUSED | 568 Boiler Hours 24 UP 130,000
lis.Mob]Demot 0.00 Bbia. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in O Out DOWN 124,000
10TAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATER2At.STSED BIT tÈCOAD
DErm 5301 NO. OF SACK5/LBS PRODUCTMME err No. 5 6
rme 20:00 pac-r sizE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGerr 11,7 4 reho MFU Smith Reed
vis 79 o Kci rYPE M616VSPX HP 52 XKPR
WL 4 2 causue TFA

PV/YP 4Û|32 35 Fed-Zan 1ET 3X16/ 3X20 Open

met 13% 5 aspitasol 5ERIAL No. JW7325 MR1446
CA 40 2 superlo DEPTHOUT 5410'
GELS 11/29 Dumgel DEFB IN 4968' 5410
ALK .15/.8 1 blackfury TUTALFEET 442 16
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS 36.00 2.50
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G
et 22,000 DAILYCOST $7,00.00 NT. ONBIT 12-40 k 18-40 K
KEL 4.Û PREVIOU5 COST $117,816.00 RPM 8Û 4Û 8Û/40
asoues 19.00 DJMULARVECOST $124,859.00 ROP(fph) 12.3 6.4

DRILt.ING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
MO. DESCRIPFION LENGm - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPm Inc¾nadon / Azimuda

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degee
1 Mud Motor 32.91 MODEL SPBÛ BPBÛ 4TT 1/2 ÛBgree

1 Shock Sub 7,88 STRoxa 8,50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SI2E 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" DrillCollars sPM 124 18TT



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY ORILLING REPORT
LMSEMMERWRMO. RRO IMTE

Railroati SWO 1 Kenilworth November 12, 2007
WG SWŒ AND mmBER UUIRY srm oays from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 28
fora DHIW Rat. Hra maNat. His FOGTMEÐRIGED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Renart No .

5547' 15 163.5 | 16' 9-5(8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 35
ACIWITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Well Shut in / KillOperations at 5547'| Increasing MW to 11.7 Richard LTatman
REMANES KBTO GL

181TP = 345 Psi1 15
TIME LOG

mon nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Drilling8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5426' to 5455'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
12:30 21:30 9.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5455' to 5547' Drilling break @5540' 20 bbt pain lost 60 psi SPP
21:30 1:30 4.00 Killwell on choke Using the "Drillers method" SITP= 345 Psi Killmud weight = 11.7 ppg
1:30 6:00 4.50 Circulatin the well on Choke to raise mud weight to 11.7 PPg

RECEIVED
NOyIg 747

DN.UEUIL,GAS&MiNING
Tobd Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 568 Boiler Hours 24 130,000
Am. Mek/Demot O00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in 0 DOWN 124,000
fDTALDAYWOR¥ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD & MUD MATERIALS TSED BIT RECORD
DErne 5412 NO.0F SACK5|tBS PRODUCT MME 6tr NO. 6
rose 5:00 pac-r 512E S 3/4
WElmff 11.4 4 reho MFG Reed
vis 73 o Kci TvpE HP 52 XKPR
a 3.8 2 causde TFA

PVfYP 34/26 35 r-ed-fan TET Open

:wr 12% 5 asphaso! SBmL NO. MR1446
a 40 2 supedo DEPB OUT
Gas 11/29 Durogel DEPB IN 5410
Aut .15/.8 1 black fury TOTALFEET 16
en 9.5 2 SodaAsh HRS 2.50

E 2/32 2 myacide f/B/G
2 22,000 DAtty cost $4,616.00 «T. onstT 18-40 K
Ka. 4.0 PREVIOUS COST $124,859.00 RPM $Ûj4Û
%souns 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $129,475.00 ROP(fph) 6.4

DRILLINGASSE4BLY PUMPI ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
mo. oEscmPr2Oli 1.EIOGM- PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclinmuon | &•1m•*4

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 Moon. BPSO 8PSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 smDKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" Drill CoBarS SPM 124 1877

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY ORILLING REPORT
LMSEMMERWRMO. RRO IMTE

Railroati SWO 1 Kenilworth November 12, 2007
WG SWŒ AND mmBER UUIRY srm oays from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 28
fora DHIW Rat. Hra maNat. His FOGTMEÐRIGED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Renart No .

5547' 15 163.5 | 16' 9-5(8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 35
ACIWITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Well Shut in / KillOperations at 5547'| Increasing MW to 11.7 Richard LTatman
REMANES KBTO GL

181TP = 345 Psi1 15
TIME LOG

mon nouns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Drilling8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5426' to 5455'
12:00 12:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
12:30 21:30 9.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5455' to 5547' Drilling break @5540' 20 bbt pain lost 60 psi SPP
21:30 1:30 4.00 Killwell on choke Using the "Drillers method" SITP= 345 Psi Killmud weight = 11.7 ppg
1:30 6:00 4.50 Circulatin the well on Choke to raise mud weight to 11.7 PPg

RECEIVED
NOyIg 747

DN.UEUIL,GAS&MiNING
Tobd Dours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 568 Boiler Hours 24 130,000
Am. Mek/Demot O00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in 0 DOWN 124,000
fDTALDAYWOR¥ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 128,000

MUD & MUD MATERIALS TSED BIT RECORD
DErne 5412 NO.0F SACK5|tBS PRODUCT MME 6tr NO. 6
rose 5:00 pac-r 512E S 3/4
WElmff 11.4 4 reho MFG Reed
vis 73 o Kci TvpE HP 52 XKPR
a 3.8 2 causde TFA

PVfYP 34/26 35 r-ed-fan TET Open

:wr 12% 5 asphaso! SBmL NO. MR1446
a 40 2 supedo DEPB OUT
Gas 11/29 Durogel DEPB IN 5410
Aut .15/.8 1 black fury TOTALFEET 16
en 9.5 2 SodaAsh HRS 2.50

E 2/32 2 myacide f/B/G
2 22,000 DAtty cost $4,616.00 «T. onstT 18-40 K
Ka. 4.0 PREVIOUS COST $124,859.00 RPM $Ûj4Û
%souns 19.00 CUMULATIVECOST $129,475.00 ROP(fph) 6.4

DRILLINGASSE4BLY PUMPI ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
mo. oEscmPr2Oli 1.EIOGM- PT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclinmuon | &•1m•*4

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 32.91 Moon. BPSO 8PSO 4TT 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 smDKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" Drill CoBarS SPM 124 1877



Marion Energy inc. Os 4 jos s- g

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ASENAME&WRL NO. BRD MTE

Railroad SWD 1 KenilWOtth November 13, 2007
MGMME MD MUMBER COUNIY oays fue spud
UnitorillingcorpRiq 132 Carbon utah 29
TOTX DEPHI Ret Mrs n Rot Hm FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSfZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SETg Report No. .

5730' 19.5 198.5 183' 9-5/8" 36#3-55 STC 4306' RKB 36
ACifvI1YATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingat 5730' Richard LTatman
REMANNE KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

mon nouns ACTIVITY ÐETAIL
650 10:00 4 00 Continue mudding up to 11 7 well on choke
1090 18:30 8.50 Dritting 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5547 to 5650
18:30 19:00 0.50 Rig service
19:00 6:00 11110 Orilling8 314" tmlewithmud motor from 5660' to 5730'

RECEIVbu
NOVI 9 2UW

Ulv.UFUIL,GAb&MINING

Totai Cours 24.00 FUELAND WATER USE I BOILERHOURS STRING WT
Hrs. MigRepair ROO FUEL USED 789 Boiter Roure 24 ‡36,000

its. WIDeme 400 Bble. Water hauled inst 24 hours 100 in 0 132,000
IOTAL DAYWOR 24.00 Total H2O ut id on well & road Barrels ROTATE 134,000

MUD RECORE MUDMATENIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5678 L OFsAmsytes vaantcrmME Brr No. 6
FDGE 21:ÛÛ 6 pac-r 52E &3/4
WEIGKr 11.6 4 reho MFG Reed
VIS 42 0 Kci ftBE HP Š2 ¾KPR
WL 4 2 camde (FA
PV/YP 35/28 35 Fed-Zan lET open
MBT 12% 5 aspitasd SŒ¾LM MR1446
00 15 2 superlo DEPTHOUT

GELS 1Ûf24 8 Durogel ÒEP111IN 5410
Att .35/.85 1 bim¢kfury JOTALFEET 199
pH 10 2 Sodakh HRS 22,0Û
CAKE 2/32 2 myacide T/B/G

CL 29¿ÛÛA MR.Y<05T $4;616;00 NT, ONBET 18-4ÛË
Ick 5.5 GREVIOU5COST *G4,859BO RPM 80/40
%souns 20d0 CUMULATIVECOET $129,475.00 ROP(fph) 9.Û

onnauhas aser animaan orANORREE AD
no. i-mnOR UNGm-N MWMO. 2 DEWW Inc¾naden/ Aalms-Ma

1 Bit 1.00 BOAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Notor 32ß7 BSODEL SPBÛ BPBÛ 4TP 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 7.88 srnoxg 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 UNERSIzE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5'
12 6" ÐrillCollars 330.47 mm 124 18TT



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESlGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRISENAME:

T UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Donot use Ihis form for proposals to drill new walls, significanuydeepen existing weis below currentbottom4tok depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRlLL fonn for such proposals.

1 TYPEOF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER SW pe woMrtEh roEa

# 1 SWD
2 NAMEOFOPERATOR 9. APINUMBER:

MarionEnergy, Inc. 4300731229
1 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL OR WILDCAT:

119 s. Tennessee ste.200 McKinney TX 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISEl4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR,SECTION,TOWNSHIP.RANGE,MERIDIAN:SWSE16 13S 10E STATE;
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSloN TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIRWELL

AppmWmate date work will start: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ASANDON

O CHANGE TOPREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL
[Submit Orignal Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work compfelion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECIAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Report
11/21/2007 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currentlytrippingfor bit @6540' KB at the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB. Cement w/ 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yelld as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbls to surface.

NAME(PLEASEPRIN OU Endsley TITLE VPOperations

SIGNATURE DATE 11/21/2007

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions om Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
NOV2 3 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESlGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRISENAME:

T UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Donot use Ihis form for proposals to drill new walls, significanuydeepen existing weis below currentbottom4tok depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRlLL fonn for such proposals.

1 TYPEOF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER SW pe woMrtEh roEa

# 1 SWD
2 NAMEOFOPERATOR 9. APINUMBER:

MarionEnergy, Inc. 4300731229
1 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL OR WILDCAT:

119 s. Tennessee ste.200 McKinney TX 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISEl4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR,SECTION,TOWNSHIP.RANGE,MERIDIAN:SWSE16 13S 10E STATE;
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSloN TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIRWELL

AppmWmate date work will start: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ASANDON

O CHANGE TOPREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL
[Submit Orignal Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work compfelion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECIAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Report
11/21/2007 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currentlytrippingfor bit @6540' KB at the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB. Cement w/ 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yelld as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbls to surface.

NAME(PLEASEPRIN OU Endsley TITLE VPOperations

SIGNATURE DATE 11/21/2007

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions om Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
NOV2 3 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESlGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRISENAME:

T UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Donot use Ihis form for proposals to drill new walls, significanuydeepen existing weis below currentbottom4tok depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRlLL fonn for such proposals.

1 TYPEOF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER SW pe woMrtEh roEa

# 1 SWD
2 NAMEOFOPERATOR 9. APINUMBER:

MarionEnergy, Inc. 4300731229
1 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL OR WILDCAT:

119 s. Tennessee ste.200 McKinney TX 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISEl4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR,SECTION,TOWNSHIP.RANGE,MERIDIAN:SWSE16 13S 10E STATE;
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSloN TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIRWELL

AppmWmate date work will start: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ASANDON

O CHANGE TOPREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL
[Submit Orignal Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work compfelion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECIAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Report
11/21/2007 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currentlytrippingfor bit @6540' KB at the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB. Cement w/ 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yelld as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbls to surface.

NAME(PLEASEPRIN OU Endsley TITLE
VPOperations

SIGNATURE DATE
11/21/2007

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions om Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
NOV2 3 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5, LEASEDESlGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. 1FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRISENAME:

T UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Donot use Ihis form for proposals to drill new walls, significanuydeepen existing weis below currentbottom4tok depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRlLL fonn for such proposals.

1 TYPEOF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER SW pe woMrtEh roEa

# 1 SWD
2 NAMEOFOPERATOR 9. APINUMBER:

MarionEnergy, Inc. 4300731229
1 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL OR WILDCAT:

119 s. Tennessee ste.200 McKinney TX 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISEl4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR,SECTION,TOWNSHIP.RANGE,MERIDIAN:SWSE16 13S 10E STATE;
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSloN TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIRWELL

AppmWmate date work will start: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ASANDON

O CHANGE TOPREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUGBACK WATERDISPOSAL
[Submit Orignal Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work compfelion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECIAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Report
11/21/2007 O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currentlytrippingfor bit @6540' KB at the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB. Cement w/ 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yelld as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbls to surface.

NAME(PLEASEPRIN OU Endsley TITLE
VPOperations

SIGNATURE DATE
11/21/2007

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions om Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
NOV2 3 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILYORILLINGREPORT
trmramNrnWFli ND. fifla DATT

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 14 2007
:aa mama nunnen couw þrm Days fromspud
unitorillingcorp.Rig 132 Catbon Utah 30
(OTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs gumRot Hrs FOOTAGEDRRLED (AST£ASINGSIZE,WEIGHT GRADE SET19 Repcit No. .

5862' 23.5 222 183' 925/8" 36#155 STC 4386' RKB 37
ACITÆY ATREPORTTIME REPOfiTEDBY

Drilling at 5862' Richard L Tatman

hting u temto Trip for Bit.
ama.

15

emon ons ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4 50 brining8 3/4" trole with mud motor from 5730' to 5758'
10:30 11:00 SO Rig service
11:00 ßdC 19 00 Dritiing 8 3/4"hole with mud motor from 57ô8' to 5862'

RFCEIVCD
V2320W
b GAO&MWNG

Total Dours 24 00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILERROURS STRfNG WT
Hrs. Rig Repair ROO FUEL USED 1253 Boiler Moure 24 UP 138 000

ks. NebjDemet 100 BMs. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 in 0 Out DOWN 134 000
IOTAURATWORE 24200 Totaill2O und on won & mad Barrels ROTATE 136 000

nuo econ muamrERWS BED EFF MthRik

Imr 9:0 pac-r size 8 3/4
waarr 1LG tz rene we Reed
as 55 25 Ka tynE kiP 52 XKPR
A 3,8 2 cannic TrA

Pviiv 29/16 10 Fe Zan TET Open

T 12Ÿo O aspitasof WMALA MR1446
15 superio DEPROtPF

LS 7/Z2 8 Durogel DEPTum 5410
.2/.7 o blacuury ToTAL FEET 452

pu 95 sodaAan as 45.50
E 2/32 myacide Tg)G

28,000 omtY posT 46797m err.owsrr 18740K
53 PREVIOUS CO5T $UK ßD NPPU $ÛjÅÛ

%50L 5 &ÛÛ CUMULATIVECOST W3f 100 &OPgptg 9.9
DRRAINGASSE 48tY PUMP ATA WATION RECMD

150. DESCRžPTION l.ENGm - FF Pt-P1tO. 1 DEPM IncNa-Mon / Aahm

1 Bit i 00 GAME Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Notar 32.07 BIODEL BPSO BPSD 477 1|2 Degree
1 Shodt Sub 7.88 smoxE 8.50 8.50 8716 1/2 Degree
1 IBS 5.71 8.NEitSIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' Û5°

12 6" DrmColars 33Œ47 slet 124 1877



Marion Energy inc.
119 STennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY ORILLIBG REPORT
ifkT AMMr & Wri! NO. Titin DATT

Raikoad SWO 1 Kenilworth November 15, 2007
mmat Aramens:N muma min anyskom spud
Unit Drillingforp.Rig 132 carbon utah 31
OTALDEPR Rat.¾ um Ret Hrs FDOTAGEORRLED CASING92E WEIGHT,GRADE SET eport Na .

5882 5 227 ( 20'" 9-5/ßf 36# 1 55 STC 4306 RKS 38
ACB17YATREfWTTIME RET RTEDBY

Bumpingmudweight up to 11.9+ to pullout af note Richard L Tatman
3ENARNE KBTOßL

The welUis still flowing when we tyrto tri out! flirs me getting smulier as we increase theweight 15
TIME LAS

suon souns ACTIWTY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4 50 Drilling 8 3/4" hele with mud motorirom 58621 to 6878'
10:30 12:00 150 Rig repairs / Work on Pump #2 Swabbs / Pump #1 willnot idle up enoughto allow us enough stk to drift
12:00 13:00 1110 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with taud motor from 5878' to 5882' bring mud weight up to 4£7+ ppg from 11 5
13iCD 13f30 0.50 Condition med sicculatepump pill
13:30 Set keily back I drop Survey I Work pipewhile waiting for surveyl Pull out of hole i standl well flowing 15 to

14:30 LOG 2G Gaions/minute Totaling 7 bbigainV Stuokpîpe.
14:30 18:00 3.50 Work stuck pipe i Jar Downwith 45K keep 1300 psi on drill string I free pipe obtain circulation work hole
18:00 Condition mud and Circulate Weight mud up to 11.8+-119 ppgI we saw 12 to 15 fot flair while circulating

3:00 9.00 To weght up sonomeup gas,
3:00 SiB0 2 00 Single out of hole with keny I oump out 9 icints I checkTor flow Welt Fiowing.
5:00 6:00 1.00 Condition mud circulate gasout and hump weight up ton19 to 11.9+

RFr'ENED
MW)320e

UNOFQita SAMINiNu
Total (3ems 24.00 fuEL ANDWATERtfSE I BOILERNOURS STRING WT

Nee. NigRepair ROO PUEL USED 1235 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138 000
Ars. MIDemd 0 00 BNs Water hatned last24hours 200 in 0 O DOWN 134,000
TOIWLOAYWORP 24 00 Total H2O ut ad on weit & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD ŒCORE MUD itWFERIAI..S SED 917 ŒODRO
DErm 5797 NO.0FSMK5/tBS ODUCTMME BirNO. 6
nest 19:00 e pac-r mm 8 3/4
waanr 117+ reho WFe Reed

s 45 Ice! TYPE HP 52 XKPR
4.4 causue Tia

avivP 21/10 2e razan 4ET open
wr 8Ÿ¾ aspitasol SEIHR NO. MR1446
04 30 supulo 3EPTHRT
ms 2/9 DumgeE DEPTHIN 5410
ax .157.8 blacAfury TOTALNBET $52
yt 9 sodan ans 45.50
cmE 2/32 <ao surne risic
et 24 000 warrcost ¢,992.90 wr,wert 189X
act 5.5 MEVIOUS CO5T $UU,m;00 APPT $ÛfŠÛ

senos 2û 00 cumterrive cosT $145,86400 koeVA;r 9,9
DR3LL3NGASBE40LY PUMP1 ATA DEWATIONREC3RD

NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FY PUMP WO. 1 2 DEPW IncinaBon f Aarnaude

1 Bit LOO MAKE N3t N22 126' 3 4 00tyt
1 Mud9totor 32.07 NooEt. SP80 BPSO 4TT 1/2 Ðegree
1 Shodc Sub 7,88 smONE 8.50 8.50 871* 1/2 Degree
1 18S 511 uxEltStzE 6,25 6.25 1389' 0.5'

12 6" DrBCoNars 330.4T sen 124 1877



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

OAN.Y DRILLINGREPORT
CASF ilApif A Wil l MD- TTFi n DATr

ailroadSWO 1 KenilWOtth November 16e2007
marea maasum any par asys from spud

Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 32
YOTALDEPU Rot Hrre cumRat Nrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGBZE,WEIGH, GRADE SET@ Rapert No. .

5882 0 227 0 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 39
ACHVRYATREi'ORTRME REKETED W

Wash and Ream badt to bottom @ 5235' Richard LTatman
RENAsis 15TOGL

Tagged up at 4985' startedwash and team circulate out tripgas with 10 000 units and 24° flair on buster. f6
TIME WB

man muss ACTIVITY DETAIL
9:00 7:00 1 00 Condition mud andweight upto 12ppg
7:00 14:30 7.50 Pull out af hole, Pump pill at shoe, laydown stabiliser shock tool and Mudmatot
14:30 15:30 LOG Make up bit and med motorgick up new shook sub.
15:30 21:00 5 50 Trip in hole Pick up new jars ibreak circulation at 1500' and again at shoe.
21:00 22:30 1.50 jnstati new Rotating head insert
22:3û 23:Oû û.50 Trip in hole tag bridge at 4985' JPiok up keily
23:00 6:00 7.00 Wash and ream from 4986' to 5203' Circulated up trip gas on the uster 10 000 units 24' flair.)

IllCEIVHJ

YŽ3 ZUU/

ONDEUIL,bAb&Mm

TotaH2eurs 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE TSOILER HOURS STRING WT
Brs. Mig Repair OAD FUEL USED \ 1235 Boiler Noors 24 UP 138;GOO

Ass.Mab]Demel 0.00 Ebis. Water hastled last 24 hours 200 în D Out DOWN 134,000
TOTALDAYWORE 2430 Total H2O und on wo!! Excad Barrels ROTATE 136,000

lWO (ECORE UDMTEIORS JSED Bif (ECURD
aePm 5797 No.oEsAcaskas coucrnANE strao. 7 . 6
retE 19 ÛÜ pac-r 52E $ 3 4 8 3 4
warair 11.7+ n reho MFG Securãy Reed

as 45 Ka 1995 EBXS305 NP 52 XKPR
wt 4.4 causee mt
hvjYP 21/10 40 Fed-zan Er open opert
warr 8Ÿo 12 asphase $Ë¾AL No. 10771585 NR1446
04 3Û SEPROUT

GELS 2/9 Durogel DEFru m 5882' 541Œ
ALK .15/ß 1 Mvacide ToTaveer 452
pu 9 scena a 45 5G
CAKF 2 3 200 Rarne T/R/G 8 B,llga,f¿¾,st,mp

CL 4;ÛÛÛ Altf COST 18þ54N Wr. onarr 18-40 X
a:r. 5.5 PREvlous cosT $199 9.m arie 80/40

stums 20.00 anonArtvFetwr 4164sta.nn noPVr
amu.maAss 80r FulevaATA Jevrartos necAmo

MO. DESCMPflOlf UNESTR-FT PUitP1to. 1 2 DEPWF Im¾nadan TAmmum
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degme
1 Ntxt Motor 32 07 900DEL PSÛ SPAÛ 4TT 1/2 DBgtte
1 Shock Sub 7.86 armour 8.50 8.50 STY 1/2 Degree
1 185 5.71 MBIER.SIzE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5*

12 6" Dril Collars 330.47 wat 124 1877



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STÄTE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCo . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 33
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET © Report No. .

5960' | 12 239 78 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 40
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @5960 |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Carying bachground gas at 200 to 1500 and connection gasses @2300 to 2500 with a 3 to 5 ft flair on btms u 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Wash and ream from 5203' to 5882'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5882' to 5960'

AECEIVCD

DMOFOIL,GMÑMlMNG

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED | 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

ts. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD RECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 5882 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7

'
6

TIME 14:00 2 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.1 reho MFG Security Reed
vis 42 15 Kci TYPE EBXS30S HP 52 XKPR
WL 6.8 4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/10 . 40 Fed-Zan 3ET Open Open
MBT Û% 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585 MR1446
cA 340 superlo DEFTN OUT

GELs 4/7 6 Durogel DEFTN IN 5882' 5410
ALK .0/.45 1 Myacide FOTALFEET 78 452
pH 8 3 Soda Ash HRS 12.00 45.50
cAKE 2/32 40 Barite f/B/G 8,8,lt,a,f,5,st,rop

CL 2,100 DAILYCOST $1,946.00 WT. ON BIT 18/44 18-40 K
KCL 4.0 PREVIOUSCOST $164,518.00 RPM 60 / 80 80/40
%SOLIDs 20.00 cUMULATIVECOST $166,464.00 ROP(fph) 6.5 9.9

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124 1877' 1°

6 6" DrillCollars 181.84 GPM 412.00 2196' 1°

SURF PRESSURE 16·ã0.0 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STÄTE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCo . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 33
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET © Report No. .

5960' | 12 239 78 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 40
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @5960 |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Carying bachground gas at 200 to 1500 and connection gasses @2300 to 2500 with a 3 to 5 ft flair on btms u 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Wash and ream from 5203' to 5882'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5882' to 5960'

AECEIVCD

DMOFOIL,GMÑMlMNG

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED | 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

ts. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD RECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 5882 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7

'
6

TIME 14:00 2 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.1 reho MFG Security Reed
vis 42 15 Kci TYPE EBXS30S HP 52 XKPR
WL 6.8 4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/10 . 40 Fed-Zan 3ET Open Open
MBT Û% 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585 MR1446
cA 340 superlo DEFTN OUT

GELs 4/7 6 Durogel DEFTN IN 5882' 5410
ALK .0/.45 1 Myacide FOTALFEET 78 452
pH 8 3 Soda Ash HRS 12.00 45.50
cAKE 2/32 40 Barite f/B/G 8,8,lt,a,f,5,st,rop

CL 2,100 DAILYCOST $1,946.00 WT. ON BIT 18/44 18-40 K
KCL 4.0 PREVIOUSCOST $164,518.00 RPM 60 / 80 80/40
%SOLIDs 20.00 cUMULATIVECOST $166,464.00 ROP(fph) 6.5 9.9

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124 1877' 1°

6 6" DrillCollars 181.84 GPM 412.00 2196' 1°

SURF PRESSURE 16·ã0.0 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STÄTE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCo . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 33
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET © Report No. .

5960' | 12 239 78 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 40
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @5960 |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Carying bachground gas at 200 to 1500 and connection gasses @2300 to 2500 with a 3 to 5 ft flair on btms u 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Wash and ream from 5203' to 5882'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5882' to 5960'

AECEIVCD

DMOFOIL,GMÑMlMNG

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED | 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

ts. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD RECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 5882 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7

'
6

TIME 14:00 2 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.1 reho MFG Security Reed
vis 42 15 Kci TYPE EBXS30S HP 52 XKPR
WL 6.8 4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/10 . 40 Fed-Zan 3ET Open Open

MBT Û% 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585 MR1446
cA 340 superlo DEFTN OUT

GELs 4/7 6 Durogel DEFTN IN 5882' 5410
ALK .0/.45 1 Myacide FOTALFEET 78 452
pH 8 3 Soda Ash HRS 12.00 45.50
cAKE 2/32 40 Barite f/B/G 8,8,lt,a,f,5,st,rop

CL 2,100 DAILYCOST $1,946.00 WT. ON BIT 18/44 18-40 K
KCL 4.0 PREVIOUSCOST $164,518.00 RPM 60 / 80 80/40
%SOLIDs 20.00 cUMULATIVECOST $166,464.00 ROP(fph) 6.5 9.9

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124 1877' 1°

6 6" DrillCollars 181.84 GPM 412.00 2196' 1°

SURF PRESSURE 16·ã0.0 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME& WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 17, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STÄTE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCo . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 33
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET © Report No. .

5960' | 12 239 78 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 40
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @5960 |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Carying bachground gas at 200 to 1500 and connection gasses @2300 to 2500 with a 3 to 5 ft flair on btms u 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Wash and ream from 5203' to 5882'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5882' to 5960'

AECEIVCD

DMOFOIL,GMÑMlMNG

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED | 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

ts. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water haufed last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
FOTAL DAYWORP 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD RECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 5882 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7

'
6

TIME 14:00 2 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.1 reho MFG Security Reed
vis 42 15 Kci TYPE EBXS30S HP 52 XKPR
WL 6.8 4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/10 . 40 Fed-Zan 3ET Open Open

MBT Û% 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585 MR1446
cA 340 superlo DEFTN OUT

GELs 4/7 6 Durogel DEFTN IN 5882' 5410
ALK .0/.45 1 Myacide FOTALFEET 78 452
pH 8 3 Soda Ash HRS 12.00 45.50
cAKE 2/32 40 Barite f/B/G 8,8,lt,a,f,5,st,rop

CL 2,100 DAILYCOST $1,946.00 WT. ON BIT 18/44 18-40 K
KCL 4.0 PREVIOUSCOST $164,518.00 RPM 60 / 80 80/40
%SOLIDs 20.00 cUMULATIVECOST $166,464.00 ROP(fph) 6.5 9.9

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA MEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124 1877' 1°

6 6" DrillCollars 181.84 GPM 412.00 2196' 1°

SURF PRESSURE 16·ã0.0 2810'



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 34
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hm cum Rot. Hrs R)OTAGEDRILLED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6125' | 23 262 165 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 41
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @6125' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Back groung gasses have fa len off to 150 to 350 and connection gasses are only peaking to 550 to 650. | 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:30 7.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5960' to 6043'
13:30 14:30 1.00 Lubricate rig
14:30 6:00 15.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6043' to 6125'

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED | 1276 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

•Im. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
FOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD RECORE MUDMATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 5956 NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 7 6
T[ME 5:00 3 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.1 febo MFG Security Reed
vis 52 60 Kcl IYPE EBXS30S HP 52 XKPR
WL 5.8 4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 27/21 8 Fed-Zan JET Open Open

MBT 12% 12 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585 MR1446
cA 240 superlo DEFTH OUT

GELs 6/14 58 Durogel DEPTN IN 5882' 5410
ALK .15/.6 1 Myacide FOTALFEET 243 452
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 35.00 45.50
CAKE 2/32 320 Barite T/B/G 8,8,It,a,f,5,st,rop
CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $15,783.00 WT.ON Brr 36-46 18-40 K
KCL 4.0 PREVIOUS COST $166,464.00 RPM 60 / 80 80/40
%SOLIDs 20.00 cUMULATIVECOST $182,247.00 ROP(fph) 4.5 9.9

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 226' 3/4 Degree
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80 477' 1/2 Degree
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50 871' 1/2 Degree

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1389' 0.5°

1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124 1877' 1°

6 6" DrillCollars 181.84 GPM 412.00 2196' 1°

SURF PRESSURE 1660.0 2810'

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 34
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hm cum Rot. Hrs R)OTAGEDRILLED lASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6125' | 23 262 165 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 41
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @6125' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Back groung gasses have fa len off to 150 to 350 and connection gasses are only peaking to 550 to 650. | 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:30 7.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 5960' to 6043'
13:30 14:30 1.00 Lubricate rig
14:30 6:00 15.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6043' to 6125'

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED | 1276 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

•Im. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
FOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000
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Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 19, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 35
(OTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6288' 23.5 285.5 165 9-5/8" 36# .'J-55STC 4306' RKB 42
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @6288' Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Back ground gas is up to 1100 with connection gas as high as 2300 mud weight up to 11.7 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6125' to 6175'
13:00 13:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
13:30 6:00 16.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6175' to 6288"

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
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im. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled fast 24 hours 0 in 0 Out DOWN 134,000
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MUD RECORE MUDMATERIALSJSED BIT (ECORD
DEPTN' 6209 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 7 6
TIME 6:00 5 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 reho MFG Security Reed
vis 46 12 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S HP52 XKPR
WL 5.4 to caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 8 Fed-Zan JET Open Open

MBT 13°/o 20 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585 MR1446
cA 280 superlo DEPTNOUT

GELs 6/15 0 Durogel DEFTHIN 5882' 5410
ALK .3/.5 1 Myacide TOTALFEET 243 452
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 35.00 45.50
CAKE 2/32 545 sarine Tis/G s,s,it,a,f,s,st,rop
ct 2,600 DAILYCOST $11,272.00 WT. ON Brr 36-46 18-40 K
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $182,247.00 RPM 60 / 80 80/40
%SOLIDS 18.00 cUMULATIVECOST $193,519.00 ROP(fph) 4.5 9.9

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
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FORM 9STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, orto

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL O GAS WELL Q OTHER SWD

.KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 clTY McKinney STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR TR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) O ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart O CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME O PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit OriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Report
11/21/2007 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently trippingfor bit @6540' KBat the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB.Cement wl 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbis to surface.

ou Endsley TITLE VP OperationsNAME(PLEASE PRIN

DATE 11/21/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) NOV3 O2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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Currently trippingfor bit @6540' KBat the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB.Cement wl 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbis to surface.

ou Endsley TITLE VP OperationsNAME(PLEASE PRIN

DATE 11/21/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) NOV3 O2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

FORM 9STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, orto

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GAS WELL Q OTHER SWD
.KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 clTY McKinney STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR TR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) O ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart O CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME O PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit OriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Report
11/21/2007 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Currently trippingfor bit @6540' KBat the base of the Morrison formation. Intermediate casing was run as follows: Ran 104 jts,
9 5/8", 36 #, J-55, ST &C set @4340' KB.Cement wl 600 sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild as lead followed with 300 sks, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Floats held. Circulated 20 bbis to surface.

ou Endsley TITLE VP OperationsNAME(PLEASE PRIN

DATE 11/21/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) NOV3 O2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 20, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 36
FOTAL DEFTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6438' | 23.5 309 150 9-5/8" 36# .J-55STC 4306' RKB 43
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @6438' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Verbaly reported low gas reEding but later found out that the gas detection equipment was not working properly 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6288" to 6363'
16:30 17:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
17:00 6:00 13.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6363' to 6438'

RECEiVED
NOV3 u 2007

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1325 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

irs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on we11& road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6509 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNo. 7
TIME 6:00 5 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 reho MFG Security
vis 46 12 Kei rYPE EBXS30S
WL 5.4 10 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 8 Fal-Zan JET Open

MBT 13% 20 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585
CA 280 superlo DEFTN OUT

GELs 6/15 0 Durogel DEPTN IN 5882'
ALK .3/.5 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 556
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 82.00
CAKE 2/32 545 Barite T/B/G
CL 2,600 DAILYCOST $11,272.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $193,519.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDS 18.00 cUMULATIVECOST $204,791.00 ROP(fph) 6.7

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA INEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1'
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL SPSO SPSO
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50
12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
6 6" Drill Collars 181.84 GPM 412.00

SURF PRESSURE

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
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SURF PRESSURE
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119 S Tennessee, Ste
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DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
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6 6" Drill Collars 181.84 GPM 412.00

SURF PRESSURE

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 20, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 36
FOTAL DEFTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6438' | 23.5 309 150 9-5/8" 36# .J-55STC 4306' RKB 43
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drillingahead @6438' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Verbaly reported low gas reEding but later found out that the gas detection equipment was not working properly 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6288" to 6363'
16:30 17:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
17:00 6:00 13.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6363' to 6438'

RECEiVED
NOV3 u 2007

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1325 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

irs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on we11& road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6509 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNo. 7
TIME 6:00 5 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 reho MFG Security
vis 46 12 Kei rYPE EBXS30S
WL 5.4 10 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 8 Fal-Zan JET Open

MBT 13% 20 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585
CA 280 superlo DEFTN OUT

GELs 6/15 0 Durogel DEPTN IN 5882'
ALK .3/.5 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 556
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRs 82.00
CAKE 2/32 545 Barite T/B/G
CL 2,600 DAILYCOST $11,272.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $193,519.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDS 18.00 cUMULATIVECOST $204,791.00 ROP(fph) 6.7

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA INEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1'
1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL SPSO SPSO
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50
12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
6 6" Drill Collars 181.84 GPM 412.00

SURF PRESSURE



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 21, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 37
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 15 324 80 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 44
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Circulateand conditionmud@5169' Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

Swabbed Formation fluids in o well trying to pull Pipe with 12.0 PPG fluid. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 21:00 15.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6438' to 6518' / Bring mud weight up to 12.0 ppg
21:00 22:00 1.00 Circulate and pumpSweep I Build pill.
22:00 22:30 0.50 Drop survey
22:30 0:30 2.00 Single out 12 jointson Kelly Without Pump in.
0:30 2:00 1.50 Set Kelly back Pull out of hole to 5169' Hole not filling properlygain of 4 bbis. Kelly back up.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Circulate gas Out on Buster (7000 Units I 16' Flair) / Circulate and condition mud weight up to 12.5 ppg

RECCIVED
NOV3 0 200/

DIVOf OIL,GAb&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1214 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

Nss. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6509 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7
TIME 6:00 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 6 reho MFG Security
vis 46 36 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S
WL 5.4 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 15 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 13°/o 24 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585
cA 280 superlo DEPB OUT 6518'
GELs 6/15 363 Durogel DEFTH IN 5882'
ALK .3/.5 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636
pH 9.5 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 soo Barite Tis/G

CL 2,600 DAILYCOST $17,348.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $204,791.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDs 18.00 CUMULATIVECOST $222,139.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 21, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 37
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .
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DIVOf OIL,GAb&MINING
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DEPTH 6509 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7
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WEIGHT 11.5 6 reho MFG Security
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pH 9.5 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 soo Barite Tis/G

CL 2,600 DAILYCOST $17,348.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 21, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 37
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DIVOf OIL,GAb&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
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1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 21, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 37
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 15 324 80 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 44
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Circulateand conditionmud@5169' Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

Swabbed Formation fluids in o well trying to pull Pipe with 12.0 PPG fluid. 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 21:00 15.00 Drilling 8 3/4" hole with mud motor from 6438' to 6518' / Bring mud weight up to 12.0 ppg
21:00 22:00 1.00 Circulate and pumpSweep I Build pill.
22:00 22:30 0.50 Drop survey
22:30 0:30 2.00 Single out 12 jointson Kelly Without Pump in.
0:30 2:00 1.50 Set Kelly back Pull out of hole to 5169' Hole not filling properlygain of 4 bbis. Kelly back up.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Circulate gas Out on Buster (7000 Units I 16' Flair) / Circulate and condition mud weight up to 12.5 ppg

RECCIVED
NOV3 0 200/

DIVOf OIL,GAb&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 1214 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

Nss. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6509 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7
TIME 6:00 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 6 reho MFG Security
vis 46 36 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S
WL 5.4 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 15 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 13°/o 24 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585
cA 280 superlo DEPB OUT 6518'
GELs 6/15 363 Durogel DEFTH IN 5882'
ALK .3/.5 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636
pH 9.5 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 soo Barite Tis/G

CL 2,600 DAILYCOST $17,348.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $204,791.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDs 18.00 CUMULATIVECOST $222,139.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 10.42 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 22, 2007
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 38
COTALDEFfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 45
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabs and liners on mud pumps |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Condition mud and circulate / Raise mud weight to 12.5 PPG
13:00 14:30 1.50 Trip out of hole 9 stands to casing shoe.
14:30 15:30 1.00 Kelly up and Pump pill
15:30 20:00 4.50 Pull out of hole.
20:00 21:30 1.50 Lay down Old mud motor and shock sub.
21:30 0:30 3.00 Pick up new Motor bit and Stabilizer/ Function test BOP
0:30 4:30 4.00 Trip in hole to 4366'
4:30 6:00 1.50 Kelly up, break Circulation / Change out 6.25 liners in pumps,Liner back to 5.5"

RECEIVED

DIVOf OIL,Lob &MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boller Hours 24 UP 140,000

Em. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5169 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 13:00 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 61 36 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 32/21 15 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 24 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 superlo DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/19 363 Durogel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/.9 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 500 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 | 80
%SOLIDs 25.00 cUMULATIVECOST $228,986.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 22, 2007
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 38
COTALDEFfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 45
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabs and liners on mud pumps |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Condition mud and circulate / Raise mud weight to 12.5 PPG
13:00 14:30 1.50 Trip out of hole 9 stands to casing shoe.
14:30 15:30 1.00 Kelly up and Pump pill
15:30 20:00 4.50 Pull out of hole.
20:00 21:30 1.50 Lay down Old mud motor and shock sub.
21:30 0:30 3.00 Pick up new Motor bit and Stabilizer/ Function test BOP
0:30 4:30 4.00 Trip in hole to 4366'
4:30 6:00 1.50 Kelly up, break Circulation / Change out 6.25 liners in pumps,Liner back to 5.5"

RECEIVED

DIVOf OIL,Lob &MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boller Hours 24 UP 140,000

Em. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5169 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 13:00 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 61 36 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 32/21 15 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 24 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 superlo DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/19 363 Durogel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/.9 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 500 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 | 80
%SOLIDs 25.00 cUMULATIVECOST $228,986.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 22, 2007
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 38
COTALDEFfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 45
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabs and liners on mud pumps |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Condition mud and circulate / Raise mud weight to 12.5 PPG
13:00 14:30 1.50 Trip out of hole 9 stands to casing shoe.
14:30 15:30 1.00 Kelly up and Pump pill
15:30 20:00 4.50 Pull out of hole.
20:00 21:30 1.50 Lay down Old mud motor and shock sub.
21:30 0:30 3.00 Pick up new Motor bit and Stabilizer/ Function test BOP
0:30 4:30 4.00 Trip in hole to 4366'
4:30 6:00 1.50 Kelly up, break Circulation / Change out 6.25 liners in pumps,Liner back to 5.5"

RECEIVED

DIVOf OIL,Lob &MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boller Hours 24 UP 140,000

Em. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5169 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 13:00 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 61 36 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 32/21 15 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 24 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 superlo DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/19 363 Durogel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/.9 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 500 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 | 80
%SOLIDs 25.00 cUMULATIVECOST $228,986.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 22, 2007
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 38
COTALDEFfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 45
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabs and liners on mud pumps |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURS ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Condition mud and circulate / Raise mud weight to 12.5 PPG
13:00 14:30 1.50 Trip out of hole 9 stands to casing shoe.
14:30 15:30 1.00 Kelly up and Pump pill
15:30 20:00 4.50 Pull out of hole.
20:00 21:30 1.50 Lay down Old mud motor and shock sub.
21:30 0:30 3.00 Pick up new Motor bit and Stabilizer/ Function test BOP
0:30 4:30 4.00 Trip in hole to 4366'
4:30 6:00 1.50 Kelly up, break Circulation / Change out 6.25 liners in pumps,Liner back to 5.5"

RECEIVED

DIVOf OIL,Lob &MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boller Hours 24 UP 140,000

Em. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5169 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 13:00 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 61 36 Kcl TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 32/21 15 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 24 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 superlo DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/19 363 Durogel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/.9 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 500 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 | 80
%SOLIDs 25.00 cUMULATIVECOST $228,986.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. RELD DKTE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 39
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Repoit No. .

6518' | 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 46
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabsand liners on mud pumps Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Change Swabs& Liners From 6.25 To 5 1/2"
12:30 13:00 0.50 Press. Test Pumps To 1300 psi No Leaks
13:00 14:30 1.50 Set Kelly Back Trip In Hole
14:30 18:00 3.50 Hit Bridge At 5147' Pick Up Kelly Reaming F/ 5169'
18:00 22:00 4.00 Reaming FI 5169 T/ 5183'
22:00 0.6:00 8.00 Conditon Mud To A 70+ Vis. 11.8/ 12.2 Wt.
0.6:00
0:00

RECEIVED
NOV3 O2m/

DIVOFDit, GA36MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
lirs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uf ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5172' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 7 8
TIME 7;00pm 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 4 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 52 0 Kci TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 o caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 10 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 0 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 5/16 52 Durogel DEFTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 0 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8.5 4 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 280 Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 24,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" firill Onfl;nt 1R1 RA CDM Â19

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. RELD DKTE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 39
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Repoit No. .

6518' | 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 46
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabsand liners on mud pumps Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Change Swabs& Liners From 6.25 To 5 1/2"
12:30 13:00 0.50 Press. Test Pumps To 1300 psi No Leaks
13:00 14:30 1.50 Set Kelly Back Trip In Hole
14:30 18:00 3.50 Hit Bridge At 5147' Pick Up Kelly Reaming F/ 5169'
18:00 22:00 4.00 Reaming FI 5169 T/ 5183'
22:00 0.6:00 8.00 Conditon Mud To A 70+ Vis. 11.8/ 12.2 Wt.
0.6:00
0:00

RECEIVED
NOV3 O2m/

DIVOFDit, GA36MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
lirs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uf ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5172' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 7 8
TIME 7;00pm 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 4 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 52 0 Kci TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 o caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 10 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 0 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 5/16 52 Durogel DEFTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 0 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8.5 4 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 280 Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 24,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" firill Onfl;nt 1R1 RA CDM Â19

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. RELD DKTE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 39
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Repoit No. .

6518' | 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 46
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabsand liners on mud pumps Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Change Swabs& Liners From 6.25 To 5 1/2"
12:30 13:00 0.50 Press. Test Pumps To 1300 psi No Leaks
13:00 14:30 1.50 Set Kelly Back Trip In Hole
14:30 18:00 3.50 Hit Bridge At 5147' Pick Up Kelly Reaming F/ 5169'
18:00 22:00 4.00 Reaming FI 5169 T/ 5183'
22:00 0.6:00 8.00 Conditon Mud To A 70+ Vis. 11.8/ 12.2 Wt.
0.6:00
0:00

RECEIVED
NOV3 O2m/

DIVOFDit, GA36MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
lirs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uf ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5172' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 7 8
TIME 7;00pm 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 4 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 52 0 Kci TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 o caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 10 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 0 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 5/16 52 Durogel DEFTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 0 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8.5 4 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 280 Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 24,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" firill Onfl;nt 1R1 RA CDM Â19

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. RELD DKTE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 39
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Repoit No. .

6518' | 0 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 46
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Change out swabsand liners on mud pumps Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Change Swabs& Liners From 6.25 To 5 1/2"
12:30 13:00 0.50 Press. Test Pumps To 1300 psi No Leaks
13:00 14:30 1.50 Set Kelly Back Trip In Hole
14:30 18:00 3.50 Hit Bridge At 5147' Pick Up Kelly Reaming F/ 5169'
18:00 22:00 4.00 Reaming FI 5169 T/ 5183'
22:00 0.6:00 8.00 Conditon Mud To A 70+ Vis. 11.8/ 12.2 Wt.
0.6:00
0:00

RECEIVED
NOV3 O2m/

DIVOFDit, GA36MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATERUSE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 735 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
lirs. Mob./Demok 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 in 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uf ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5172' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 7 8
TIME 7;00pm 0 pac-r SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 4 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 52 0 Kci TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 o caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 10 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 0 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 5/16 52 Durogel DEFTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 0 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8.5 4 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 280 Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 24,000 DAILYCOST $8,764.00 WT. ON BIT 36-46
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60 / 80
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 35.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 5.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" firill Onfl;nt 1R1 RA CDM Â19



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days frOm spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 40
(OTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 47
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

T/I/H |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Reaming F/5183 Con. Mud To 85 To 100 Vis.
12:00 18:00 6.00 T/O/H Pluged Jets In Bit
18:00 21:30 3.50 UD Old B.H.A. Pick Up New B.H.A.
21:30 22:30 1.00 Trip in hole with BHA and one stand drill pipe
22:30 0.1:30 3.00 Cut off 137 feet of drilling line
0.1:30 0.6:00 4.50 Change swabs and liners to 6.25"
0.6:00
0:00

RFCElVED
NDygg gg

DIVOFoll,R'd RNING
Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
Am. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
IOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ue3d on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPIN 5178' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 6:00 1box supeisweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 97 3 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 3 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/36 70 maxGel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 1 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 28o Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 2,800 DAILYCOST $8,227.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.ÜO MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jais 31.72 SPM 124
g gn n.-lii milow 101 OA sua A13

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days frOm spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 40
(OTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 47
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

T/I/H |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Reaming F/5183 Con. Mud To 85 To 100 Vis.
12:00 18:00 6.00 T/O/H Pluged Jets In Bit
18:00 21:30 3.50 UD Old B.H.A. Pick Up New B.H.A.
21:30 22:30 1.00 Trip in hole with BHA and one stand drill pipe
22:30 0.1:30 3.00 Cut off 137 feet of drilling line
0.1:30 0.6:00 4.50 Change swabs and liners to 6.25"
0.6:00
0:00

RFCElVED
NDygg gg

DIVOFoll,R'd RNING
Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
Am. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
IOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ue3d on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPIN 5178' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 6:00 1box supeisweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 97 3 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 3 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/36 70 maxGel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 1 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 28o Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 2,800 DAILYCOST $8,227.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.ÜO MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jais 31.72 SPM 124
g gn n.-lii milow 101 OA sua A13

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days frOm spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 40
(OTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 47
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

T/I/H |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Reaming F/5183 Con. Mud To 85 To 100 Vis.
12:00 18:00 6.00 T/O/H Pluged Jets In Bit
18:00 21:30 3.50 UD Old B.H.A. Pick Up New B.H.A.
21:30 22:30 1.00 Trip in hole with BHA and one stand drill pipe
22:30 0.1:30 3.00 Cut off 137 feet of drilling line
0.1:30 0.6:00 4.50 Change swabs and liners to 6.25"
0.6:00
0:00

RFCElVED
NDygg gg

DIVOFoll,R'd RNING
Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
Am. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
IOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ue3d on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPIN 5178' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 6:00 1box supeisweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 97 3 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 3 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/36 70 maxGel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 1 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 28o Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 2,800 DAILYCOST $8,227.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.ÜO MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jais 31.72 SPM 124
g gn n.-lii milow 101 OA sua A13

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days frOm spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 40
(OTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 47
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

T/I/H |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:00 6.00 Reaming F/5183 Con. Mud To 85 To 100 Vis.
12:00 18:00 6.00 T/O/H Pluged Jets In Bit
18:00 21:30 3.50 UD Old B.H.A. Pick Up New B.H.A.
21:30 22:30 1.00 Trip in hole with BHA and one stand drill pipe
22:30 0.1:30 3.00 Cut off 137 feet of drilling line
0.1:30 0.6:00 4.50 Change swabs and liners to 6.25"
0.6:00
0:00

RFCElVED
NDygg gg

DIVOFoll,R'd RNING
Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000
Am. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
IOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ue3d on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPIN 5178' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 6:00 1box supeisweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.1 6 reho MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 97 3 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8.5 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/16 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 15% 3 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 160 4 MaxGel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 10/36 70 maxGel DEPTH IN 5882' 6518'
ALK 0/5 1 Myacide TOTALFEET 636 0
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 28o Barite Tis/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fe,pr

CL 2,800 DAILYCOST $8,227.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.ÜO MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 MudMotor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jais 31.72 SPM 124
g gn n.-lii milow 101 OA sua A13



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 41
(OTAL DEPTH Rot His cum Rot. Hrs F<)OTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGEff, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 48
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Cir. Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS K6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 ChangeSwabs& Liners IN Mud Pump #1
7:00 9:30 2.50 Trip in hole to shoe
9:30 11:00 1.50 Pick kelly up to break cir.& fill pipelHad 5 to 15' flares at flare line.
11:00 12:00 1.00 Set kelly back /Trip in hole
12:00 15;30 3.50 Pick kelly up / Reaming F/ 5183' /
15;30 17:00 1.50 TI Ol H to shoe . Rotary gear & chain broke
17:00 18:00 1.00 Kelly up cir. I mix mud.
18:00 14:24 12.00 Cir. Hole / Wait on parts for rig

RECCWED
NOV3 O200/

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS S I ÀHŠG
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

Nrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPm 5202' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 16:00 supersweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 3 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 57+ 2 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 11.4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/12 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585 115839
cA 440 13 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 4/10 23 maxGel DEPR IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 1 Myacide roTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 20 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 22,000 DAILYCOST $7,318.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 0.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" r3rill Cnilmre 191 Ra enu d19

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 41
(OTAL DEPTH Rot His cum Rot. Hrs F<)OTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGEff, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 48
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Cir. Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS K6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 ChangeSwabs& Liners IN Mud Pump #1
7:00 9:30 2.50 Trip in hole to shoe
9:30 11:00 1.50 Pick kelly up to break cir.& fill pipelHad 5 to 15' flares at flare line.
11:00 12:00 1.00 Set kelly back /Trip in hole
12:00 15;30 3.50 Pick kelly up / Reaming F/ 5183' /
15;30 17:00 1.50 TI Ol H to shoe . Rotary gear & chain broke
17:00 18:00 1.00 Kelly up cir. I mix mud.
18:00 14:24 12.00 Cir. Hole / Wait on parts for rig

RECCWED
NOV3 O200/

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS S I ÀHŠG
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

Nrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPm 5202' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 16:00 supersweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 3 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 57+ 2 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 11.4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/12 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585 115839
cA 440 13 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 4/10 23 maxGel DEPR IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 1 Myacide roTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 20 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 22,000 DAILYCOST $7,318.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 0.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" r3rill Cnilmre 191 Ra enu d19

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 41
(OTAL DEPTH Rot His cum Rot. Hrs F<)OTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGEff, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 48
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Cir. Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS K6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 ChangeSwabs& Liners IN Mud Pump #1
7:00 9:30 2.50 Trip in hole to shoe
9:30 11:00 1.50 Pick kelly up to break cir.& fill pipelHad 5 to 15' flares at flare line.
11:00 12:00 1.00 Set kelly back /Trip in hole
12:00 15;30 3.50 Pick kelly up / Reaming F/ 5183' /
15;30 17:00 1.50 TI Ol H to shoe . Rotary gear & chain broke
17:00 18:00 1.00 Kelly up cir. I mix mud.
18:00 14:24 12.00 Cir. Hole / Wait on parts for rig

RECCWED
NOV3 O200/

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS S I ÀHŠG
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

Nrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPm 5202' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 16:00 supersweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 3 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 57+ 2 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 11.4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/12 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585 115839
cA 440 13 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 4/10 23 maxGel DEPR IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 1 Myacide roTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 20 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 22,000 DAILYCOST $7,318.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 0.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" r3rill Cnilmre 191 Ra enu d19

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 41
(OTAL DEPTH Rot His cum Rot. Hrs F<)OTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGEff, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 48
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Cir. Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS K6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 ChangeSwabs& Liners IN Mud Pump #1
7:00 9:30 2.50 Trip in hole to shoe
9:30 11:00 1.50 Pick kelly up to break cir.& fill pipelHad 5 to 15' flares at flare line.
11:00 12:00 1.00 Set kelly back /Trip in hole
12:00 15;30 3.50 Pick kelly up / Reaming F/ 5183' /
15;30 17:00 1.50 TI Ol H to shoe . Rotary gear & chain broke
17:00 18:00 1.00 Kelly up cir. I mix mud.
18:00 14:24 12.00 Cir. Hole / Wait on parts for rig

RECCWED
NOV3 O200/

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS S I ÀHŠG
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP 140,000

Nrs. Mob./Demot 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORP 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 12 Barrels ROTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPm 5202' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 16:00 supersweep SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.7 3 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 57+ 2 poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 11.4 caustic TFA

PV/YP 24/12 25 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10771585 115839
cA 440 13 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELS 4/10 23 maxGel DEPR IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 1 Myacide roTAL FEET 636 0
pH 8 Soda Ash HRS 97.00
CAKE 2/32 20 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 22,000 DAILYCOST $7,318.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 0.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" Drill Collars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
A A" r3rill Cnilmre 191 Ra enu d19



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 26, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 42
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 49
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Cir.Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Code 8 for 18 hrs 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:00 12.00 Cir. Hole/ wait on parts to repair rig. Code 8.
6:00 00;00 6.00 Code 8
00;00 0.6.00 6.00 Trip in hole layed 24 jts./Reaming to bottom
0.6.00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

RECRVED
NOV3O2007

UN.0FOIL,GM &MINig
Total Ilours 6.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.75 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 P 140,000
Brs. Mob./Demoi: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out OWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 6.75 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 90 Barrels OTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4409' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTTNo. 7 8
TIME 0.5.00am to KcL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.2+ Pac-ul Mr<; Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 10.6 caustic TFA

PV/YP 26/18 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 40 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 maxGel DEP m IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 40 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 s2o Barite r/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 27,000 DAILYCOST $11,383.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
6 6" Drill Cnilarc 1R1 R4 cou 417

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 26, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 42
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 49
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Cir.Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Code 8 for 18 hrs 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:00 12.00 Cir. Hole/ wait on parts to repair rig. Code 8.
6:00 00;00 6.00 Code 8
00;00 0.6.00 6.00 Trip in hole layed 24 jts./Reaming to bottom
0.6.00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

RECRVED
NOV3O2007

UN.0FOIL,GM &MINig
Total Ilours 6.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.75 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 P 140,000
Brs. Mob./Demoi: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out OWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 6.75 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 90 Barrels OTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4409' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTTNo. 7 8
TIME 0.5.00am to KcL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.2+ Pac-ul Mr<; Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 10.6 caustic TFA

PV/YP 26/18 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 40 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 maxGel DEP m IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 40 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 s2o Barite r/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 27,000 DAILYCOST $11,383.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
6 6" Drill Cnilarc 1R1 R4 cou 417

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 26, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 42
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 49
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Cir.Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Code 8 for 18 hrs 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:00 12.00 Cir. Hole/ wait on parts to repair rig. Code 8.
6:00 00;00 6.00 Code 8
00;00 0.6.00 6.00 Trip in hole layed 24 jts./Reaming to bottom
0.6.00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

RECRVED
NOV3O2007

UN.0FOIL,GM &MINig
Total Ilours 6.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.75 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 P 140,000
Brs. Mob./Demoi: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out OWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 6.75 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 90 Barrels OTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4409' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTTNo. 7 8
TIME 0.5.00am to KcL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.2+ Pac-ul Mr<; Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 10.6 caustic TFA

PV/YP 26/18 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 40 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 maxGel DEP m IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 40 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 s2o Barite r/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 27,000 DAILYCOST $11,383.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
6 6" Drill Cnilarc 1R1 R4 cou 417

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 26, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 42
rOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 321 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 49
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Cir.Hole W/O/ Parts to repair rig |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

Code 8 for 18 hrs 15
TIME LOG

FROM HOUns ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:00 12.00 Cir. Hole/ wait on parts to repair rig. Code 8.
6:00 00;00 6.00 Code 8
00;00 0.6.00 6.00 Trip in hole layed 24 jts./Reaming to bottom
0.6.00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

RECRVED
NOV3O2007

UN.0FOIL,GM &MINig
Total Ilours 6.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 0.75 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 P 140,000
Brs. Mob./Demoi: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out OWN 136,000
TOTALDAYWORit 6.75 Total H2O ut ad on well & road 90 Barrels OTATE 138,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4409' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BTTNo. 7 8
TIME 0.5.00am to KcL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.2+ Pac-ul Mr<; Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 10.6 caustic TFA

PV/YP 26/18 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 40 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 maxGel DEP m IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 40 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 s2o Barite r/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

CL 27,000 DAILYCOST $11,383.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Non Rotating Stat 6.09 STROKE 8.50 8.50

12 6" DrillCollars 330.47 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.72 SPM 124
6 6" Drill Cnilarc 1R1 R4 cou 417



4'S OCO'2 \cXFI
Marion Energy inc- kr \3s \0e

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 27, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 43
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 50
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Mud Pump Down /Code 8
8:30 9:30 1.00 Trip in hole
9:30 13:30 3.50 Reaming F/5130 T/5181'14:
13:30 14:00 0.50 Trying to ream past junk in hole
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pump pill/TIO/H
18:00 21:30 3.50 T/O/OlH L/DI Mud motor & bit
21:30 0.2.00 4.50 Pick up mill &\unk basket .Waiting on new set jars
0.2.00 0.5:30 3.50 Tirip in hole to 4435'
5:30 6:00 0.6:00 Pick kelly up / break cir.

AFr FIVED
OFC1n 2007

nivnFnii,naAMINI¥4
Total Hours 21.50 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.50 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Brs. Mob./Demot: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH T/O/O/H NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 21:00 16 KCL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 8 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 35/36 27 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 32 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 54 maxGel DEPTN IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 390 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

cL 3,500 DAILYCOST $14,451.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 22.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP isATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM 124

11 firill Cnil;\ \ CDM 41)

4'S OCO'2 \cXFI
Marion Energy inc- kr \3s \0e

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 27, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 43
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 50
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Mud Pump Down /Code 8
8:30 9:30 1.00 Trip in hole
9:30 13:30 3.50 Reaming F/5130 T/5181'14:
13:30 14:00 0.50 Trying to ream past junk in hole
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pump pill/TIO/H
18:00 21:30 3.50 T/O/OlH L/DI Mud motor & bit
21:30 0.2.00 4.50 Pick up mill &\unk basket .Waiting on new set jars
0.2.00 0.5:30 3.50 Tirip in hole to 4435'
5:30 6:00 0.6:00 Pick kelly up / break cir.

AFr FIVED
OFC1n 2007

nivnFnii,naAMINI¥4
Total Hours 21.50 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.50 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Brs. Mob./Demot: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH T/O/O/H NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 21:00 16 KCL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 8 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 35/36 27 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 32 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 54 maxGel DEPTN IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 390 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

cL 3,500 DAILYCOST $14,451.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 22.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP isATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM 124

11 firill Cnil;\ \ CDM 41)

4'S OCO'2 \cXFI
Marion Energy inc- kr \3s \0e

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 27, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 43
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 50
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Mud Pump Down /Code 8
8:30 9:30 1.00 Trip in hole
9:30 13:30 3.50 Reaming F/5130 T/5181'14:
13:30 14:00 0.50 Trying to ream past junk in hole
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pump pill/TIO/H
18:00 21:30 3.50 T/O/OlH L/DI Mud motor & bit
21:30 0.2.00 4.50 Pick up mill &\unk basket .Waiting on new set jars
0.2.00 0.5:30 3.50 Tirip in hole to 4435'
5:30 6:00 0.6:00 Pick kelly up / break cir.

AFr FIVED
OFC1n 2007

nivnFnii,naAMINI¥4
Total Hours 21.50 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.50 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Brs. Mob./Demot: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH T/O/O/H NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 21:00 16 KCL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 8 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 35/36 27 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 32 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 54 maxGel DEPTN IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 390 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

cL 3,500 DAILYCOST $14,451.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 22.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP isATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM 124

11 firill Cnil;\ \ CDM 41)

4'S OCO'2 \cXFI
Marion Energy inc- kr \3s \0e

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 27, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 43
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 50
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket |Richard Crow/CecilCrow
KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM HOURs ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Mud Pump Down /Code 8
8:30 9:30 1.00 Trip in hole
9:30 13:30 3.50 Reaming F/5130 T/5181'14:
13:30 14:00 0.50 Trying to ream past junk in hole
14:00 18:00 4.00 Pump pill/TIO/H
18:00 21:30 3.50 T/O/OlH L/DI Mud motor & bit
21:30 0.2.00 4.50 Pick up mill &\unk basket .Waiting on new set jars
0.2.00 0.5:30 3.50 Tirip in hole to 4435'
5:30 6:00 0.6:00 Pick kelly up / break cir.

AFr FIVED
OFC1n 2007

nivnFnii,naAMINI¥4
Total Hours 21.50 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

Hrs. Rig Repair 2.50 FUEL USED 695 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Brs. Mob./Demot: 0.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTH T/O/O/H NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 7 8
TIME 21:00 16 KCL SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 8 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed/Hycolog
vis 60+ poly + TYPE EBXS30S DSR616M-F1
WL 8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 35/36 27 Fed-Zan JET open 6x16
MBT 0% 1 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585 115839
cA 440 32 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6518'
GELs 7/13 54 maxGel DEPTN IN 5882' 6518'
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 636 0
pH 9 9 Soda Ash HRs 97.00
CAKE 2/32 390 Barite T/B/G 3,5,wt,a,e,1,fc,pr

cL 3,500 DAILYCOST $14,451.00 WT. ON BIT 30/45k
KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM 60/70
%SOLIDs 22.00 CUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph) 6.6

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP isATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 36.50 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM 124

11 firill Cnil;\ \ CDM 41)



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 44
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGhir,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 51'
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Triping in hole/with mill&junkbasket Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7;30 1.50 Trip in hole
7;30 10:30 3.00 Milling / Reaming Fl 5142'
10:30 12:30 2.00 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
12:30 13:30 1.00 Reaming FI 5170' I 5102'
13:30 17:00 3.50 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
17:00 18:00 1.00 Reaming F/5170 /T /5179'
18:00 0.6:oo 12.00 Reamjng F/ 5179 T/
0.6:oo

DEC1O2007
DIV.OrOIL,GAS&MININû

Total Iloum FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O und on well & road 75 Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 8 9
71ME 8;30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 2 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE DSR616M-F1

WL 6.8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan .1ET 16-Jun open
MBT 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585
cA 440 25 Durgel DEPTN OUT

GELs 7/13 0 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 sodaAsh HRS

CAKE 2/32 1ooo Barite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $13,561.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM

%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 44
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGhir,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 51'
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Triping in hole/with mill&junkbasket Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7;30 1.50 Trip in hole
7;30 10:30 3.00 Milling / Reaming Fl 5142'
10:30 12:30 2.00 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
12:30 13:30 1.00 Reaming FI 5170' I 5102'
13:30 17:00 3.50 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
17:00 18:00 1.00 Reaming F/5170 /T /5179'
18:00 0.6:oo 12.00 Reamjng F/ 5179 T/
0.6:oo

DEC1O2007
DIV.OrOIL,GAS&MININû

Total Iloum FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O und on well & road 75 Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 8 9
71ME 8;30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 2 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE DSR616M-F1

WL 6.8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan .1ET 16-Jun open
MBT 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585
cA 440 25 Durgel DEPTN OUT

GELs 7/13 0 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 sodaAsh HRS

CAKE 2/32 1ooo Barite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $13,561.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM

%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 44
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGhir,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 51'
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Triping in hole/with mill&junkbasket Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7;30 1.50 Trip in hole
7;30 10:30 3.00 Milling / Reaming Fl 5142'
10:30 12:30 2.00 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
12:30 13:30 1.00 Reaming FI 5170' I 5102'
13:30 17:00 3.50 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
17:00 18:00 1.00 Reaming F/5170 /T /5179'
18:00 0.6:oo 12.00 Reamjng F/ 5179 T/
0.6:oo

DEC1O2007
DIV.OrOIL,GAS&MININû

Total Iloum FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O und on well & road 75 Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 8 9
71ME 8;30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 2 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE DSR616M-F1

WL 6.8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan .1ET 16-Jun open
MBT 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585
cA 440 25 Durgel DEPTN OUT

GELs 7/13 0 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 sodaAsh HRS

CAKE 2/32 1ooo Barite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $13,561.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM

%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 44
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGhir,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 51'
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Triping in hole/with mill&junkbasket Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7;30 1.50 Trip in hole
7;30 10:30 3.00 Milling / Reaming Fl 5142'
10:30 12:30 2.00 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
12:30 13:30 1.00 Reaming FI 5170' I 5102'
13:30 17:00 3.50 Code 8 #2 pumpDown
17:00 18:00 1.00 Reaming F/5170 /T /5179'
18:00 0.6:oo 12.00 Reamjng F/ 5179 T/
0.6:oo

DEC1O2007
DIV.OrOIL,GAS&MININû

Total Iloum FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 785 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 180 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O und on well & road 75 Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 8 9
71ME 8;30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 2 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE DSR616M-F1

WL 6.8 1 caustic TFA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan .1ET 16-Jun open
MBT 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10771585
cA 440 25 Durgel DEPTN OUT

GELs 7/13 0 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 sodaAsh HRS

CAKE 2/32 1ooo Barite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $13,561.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $222,139.00 RPM

%SOLIDS 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $230,886.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock Sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 6" Drill Collars 30.98 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 IBS 6.09 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 29, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 45
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 | |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 52
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket Richard Crow Cecil Crow
6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Reaming F5212 TS325
16:00 17:00 1.00 Mix&pump pill
17:00 18:00 1.00 Check flow & blow down kelly
18:00 23:00 5.00 T/O/O/H
23:00 0:00 1.00 Lay down tools T
0:00 3:00 3.00 Test B.O.P.
3:00 5:00 2.00 P ick up tolls
5:00 6:00 1,00 Trip in hole

B.O.P. Test 300 /3000psi -Ok
Inside & outside choke line value 300 /3000 psi.-Ok

Primary & Secondary values 300 /3000 psi.-Ok
Hydrill300 /1500 psi.-Ok RECEIVED
choke manifold-300 / 3000psi.-Ok
Upper kelly& Floor value 300 /3000psi -Ok DFCi n 2007
Killline 300 / 3000psi-Ok

DIV,0Fnii, GAR&MINIM

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 655 Boiler Hours 24 UP

drs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORh Total H2O ut ad on well & road 175 Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 8 9
FIME 8,30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGur 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r PfPE DSR616M-F1
WL 6.8 5 caustic TFA
PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET 16-Jun open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585
CA 440 60 Durgel DEFTH OUT
GELS 7/13 10 maxGel DEFTN IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TUTALFEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 830 Barite f/B/G
CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $18,794.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $222,139.00 RPM
%SOLIDS 22.OÛ CUMULATIVECOST $249,689.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP 14ATA I EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25
1 5 SPM

11 DrillColla\ \

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 29, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 45
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 | |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 52
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket Richard Crow Cecil Crow
6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Reaming F5212 TS325
16:00 17:00 1.00 Mix&pump pill
17:00 18:00 1.00 Check flow & blow down kelly
18:00 23:00 5.00 T/O/O/H
23:00 0:00 1.00 Lay down tools T
0:00 3:00 3.00 Test B.O.P.
3:00 5:00 2.00 P ick up tolls
5:00 6:00 1,00 Trip in hole

B.O.P. Test 300 /3000psi -Ok
Inside & outside choke line value 300 /3000 psi.-Ok

Primary & Secondary values 300 /3000 psi.-Ok
Hydrill300 /1500 psi.-Ok RECEIVED
choke manifold-300 / 3000psi.-Ok
Upper kelly& Floor value 300 /3000psi -Ok DFCi n 2007
Killline 300 / 3000psi-Ok

DIV,0Fnii, GAR&MINIM

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 655 Boiler Hours 24 UP

drs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORh Total H2O ut ad on well & road 175 Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 8 9
FIME 8,30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGur 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r PfPE DSR616M-F1
WL 6.8 5 caustic TFA
PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET 16-Jun open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585
CA 440 60 Durgel DEFTH OUT
GELS 7/13 10 maxGel DEFTN IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TUTALFEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 830 Barite f/B/G
CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $18,794.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $222,139.00 RPM
%SOLIDS 22.OÛ CUMULATIVECOST $249,689.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP 14ATA I EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25
1 5 SPM

11 DrillColla\ \

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 29, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 45
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 | |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 52
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket Richard Crow Cecil Crow
6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Reaming F5212 TS325
16:00 17:00 1.00 Mix&pump pill
17:00 18:00 1.00 Check flow & blow down kelly
18:00 23:00 5.00 T/O/O/H
23:00 0:00 1.00 Lay down tools T
0:00 3:00 3.00 Test B.O.P.
3:00 5:00 2.00 P ick up tolls
5:00 6:00 1,00 Trip in hole

B.O.P. Test 300 /3000psi -Ok
Inside & outside choke line value 300 /3000 psi.-Ok

Primary & Secondary values 300 /3000 psi.-Ok
Hydrill300 /1500 psi.-Ok RECEIVED
choke manifold-300 / 3000psi.-Ok
Upper kelly& Floor value 300 /3000psi -Ok DFCi n 2007
Killline 300 / 3000psi-Ok

DIV,0Fnii, GAR&MINIM

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 655 Boiler Hours 24 UP

drs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORh Total H2O ut ad on well & road 175 Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 8 9
FIME 8,30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGur 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r PfPE DSR616M-F1
WL 6.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET 16-Jun open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585
CA 440 60 Durgel DEFTH OUT

GELS 7/13 10 maxGel DEFTN IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TUTALFEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 830 Barite f/B/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $18,794.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $222,139.00 RPM
%SOLIDS 22.OÛ CUMULATIVECOST $249,689.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP 14ATA I EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25
1 5 SPM

11 DrillColla\ \

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 29, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 45
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 | |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 52
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Triping in hole/with mill&junk basket Richard Crow Cecil Crow
6 TO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Reaming F5212 TS325
16:00 17:00 1.00 Mix&pump pill
17:00 18:00 1.00 Check flow & blow down kelly
18:00 23:00 5.00 T/O/O/H
23:00 0:00 1.00 Lay down tools T
0:00 3:00 3.00 Test B.O.P.
3:00 5:00 2.00 P ick up tolls
5:00 6:00 1,00 Trip in hole

B.O.P. Test 300 /3000psi -Ok
Inside & outside choke line value 300 /3000 psi.-Ok

Primary & Secondary values 300 /3000 psi.-Ok
Hydrill300 /1500 psi.-Ok RECEIVED
choke manifold-300 / 3000psi.-Ok
Upper kelly& Floor value 300 /3000psi -Ok DFCi n 2007
Killline 300 / 3000psi-Ok

DIV,0Fnii, GAR&MINIM

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 655 Boiler Hours 24 UP

drs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 270 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORh Total H2O ut ad on well & road 175 Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEFTH 5179' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 8 9
FIME 8,30am 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGur 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Reed/Hycolog Mill
vis 62 2 Pac-r PfPE DSR616M-F1
WL 6.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET 16-Jun open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIALNo. 10771585
CA 440 60 Durgel DEFTH OUT

GELS 7/13 10 maxGel DEFTN IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TUTALFEET 0 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 830 Barite f/B/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $18,794.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUSCOST $222,139.00 RPM
%SOLIDS 22.OÛ CUMULATIVECOST $249,689.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP 14ATA I EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25
1 5 SPM

11 DrillColla\ \



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 30, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 46
COTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 53
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaminq at 5346 |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS Trip gas while reaming at 5358' was up to 10,000 units, with 15' to 20' flair KBTOGL.

(Flame was bright yellow-orange flame with some blue at the bottom, Like a Bic lighter) 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Trip in hole to 4426'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Service Rip.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Trip in hole to 5113'
12:30 13:00 0.50 Wash and ream from 5113' to 5144'
13:00 14:30 1.50 Circulate out Trip gas and Keep pipemoveing.
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5331'
15:00 18:00 3.00 Wash and ream from 5331' to 5362'
18:00 18:30 0.50 Laydown 2 oints try to run stand,
18:30 6:00 11.50 Ream past ledge at 5346' try to make connection with no luck continue reaming from 5331' to 5362'

REUtlVtU

DE.Ci U 2007
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINIF3

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1241 Boiler Hours 24 UP 98,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 92,000
FOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 95,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 9:00 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 6.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 440 60 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELs 7/13 10 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 sarite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $3,886.00 WT. ON B1T

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $312,371.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $316,257.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 5 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 30, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 46
COTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 53
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaminq at 5346 |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS Trip gas while reaming at 5358' was up to 10,000 units, with 15' to 20' flair KBTOGL.

(Flame was bright yellow-orange flame with some blue at the bottom, Like a Bic lighter) 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Trip in hole to 4426'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Service Rip.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Trip in hole to 5113'
12:30 13:00 0.50 Wash and ream from 5113' to 5144'
13:00 14:30 1.50 Circulate out Trip gas and Keep pipemoveing.
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5331'
15:00 18:00 3.00 Wash and ream from 5331' to 5362'
18:00 18:30 0.50 Laydown 2 oints try to run stand,
18:30 6:00 11.50 Ream past ledge at 5346' try to make connection with no luck continue reaming from 5331' to 5362'

REUtlVtU

DE.Ci U 2007
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINIF3

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1241 Boiler Hours 24 UP 98,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 92,000
FOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 95,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 9:00 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 6.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 440 60 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELs 7/13 10 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 sarite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $3,886.00 WT. ON B1T

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $312,371.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $316,257.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 5 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 30, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 46
COTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 53
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaminq at 5346 |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS Trip gas while reaming at 5358' was up to 10,000 units, with 15' to 20' flair KBTOGL.

(Flame was bright yellow-orange flame with some blue at the bottom, Like a Bic lighter) 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Trip in hole to 4426'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Service Rip.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Trip in hole to 5113'
12:30 13:00 0.50 Wash and ream from 5113' to 5144'
13:00 14:30 1.50 Circulate out Trip gas and Keep pipemoveing.
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5331'
15:00 18:00 3.00 Wash and ream from 5331' to 5362'
18:00 18:30 0.50 Laydown 2 oints try to run stand,
18:30 6:00 11.50 Ream past ledge at 5346' try to make connection with no luck continue reaming from 5331' to 5362'

REUtlVtU

DE.Ci U 2007
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINIF3

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1241 Boiler Hours 24 UP 98,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 92,000
FOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 95,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 9:00 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 6.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 440 60 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELs 7/13 10 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 sarite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $3,886.00 WT. ON B1T

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $312,371.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $316,257.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 5 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth November 30, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 46
COTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6518' 0 | 321 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 53
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaminq at 5346 |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS Trip gas while reaming at 5358' was up to 10,000 units, with 15' to 20' flair KBTOGL.

(Flame was bright yellow-orange flame with some blue at the bottom, Like a Bic lighter) 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Trip in hole to 4426'
11:00 11:30 0.50 Service Rip.
11:30 12:30 1.00 Trip in hole to 5113'
12:30 13:00 0.50 Wash and ream from 5113' to 5144'
13:00 14:30 1.50 Circulate out Trip gas and Keep pipemoveing.
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5331'
15:00 18:00 3.00 Wash and ream from 5331' to 5362'
18:00 18:30 0.50 Laydown 2 oints try to run stand,
18:30 6:00 11.50 Ream past ledge at 5346' try to make connection with no luck continue reaming from 5331' to 5362'

REUtlVtU

DE.Ci U 2007
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINIF3

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1241 Boiler Hours 24 UP 98,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 92,000
FOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 95,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 9:00 5 Reno SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 62 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 6.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 36/24 5 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 440 60 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELs 7/13 10 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .2/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 0
pH 9.5 2 Soda Ash HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 sarite Tis/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $3,886.00 WT. ON B1T

KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $312,371.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $316,257.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 mill 1.74 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 junkbasket 6.76 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 6"Drill Collar 30.98 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Shock Sub 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 5 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 1, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 47
FOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6544' 3 | 324 19 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 54
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drilling @6537 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5362 to 5768'
16:00 17:30 1.50 Stuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
17:30 21:00 3.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5675 to 592T
21:00 21:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
21:30 3:00 5.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5927' to 6518'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6518' to 6544'

RECEIVED
DEC1O2007

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MININ

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1026 Boiler Hours 24 UP 107,000

Mrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 102,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O uEad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 19:30 5 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Securig
vis 65 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 11.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 30/34 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 120 95 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 9/13 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 19
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 3.00
CAKE 2/32 360 Barite T/B/G

CL 38,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 18-45

KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 1, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 47
FOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6544' 3 | 324 19 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 54
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drilling @6537 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5362 to 5768'
16:00 17:30 1.50 Stuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
17:30 21:00 3.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5675 to 592T
21:00 21:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
21:30 3:00 5.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5927' to 6518'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6518' to 6544'

RECEIVED
DEC1O2007

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MININ

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1026 Boiler Hours 24 UP 107,000

Mrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 102,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O uEad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 19:30 5 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Securig
vis 65 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 11.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 30/34 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 120 95 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 9/13 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 19
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 3.00
CAKE 2/32 360 Barite T/B/G

CL 38,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 18-45

KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 1, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 47
FOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6544' 3 | 324 19 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 54
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drilling @6537 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5362 to 5768'
16:00 17:30 1.50 Stuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
17:30 21:00 3.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5675 to 592T
21:00 21:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
21:30 3:00 5.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5927' to 6518'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6518' to 6544'

RECEIVED
DEC1O2007

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MININ

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1026 Boiler Hours 24 UP 107,000

Mrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 102,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O uEad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 19:30 5 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Securig
vis 65 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 11.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 30/34 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 120 95 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 9/13 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 19
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 3.00
CAKE 2/32 360 Barite T/B/G

CL 38,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 18-45

KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 1, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 47
FOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6544' 3 | 324 19 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 54
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drilling @6537 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5362 to 5768'
16:00 17:30 1.50 Stuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
17:30 21:00 3.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5675 to 592T
21:00 21:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
21:30 3:00 5.50 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 5927' to 6518'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6518' to 6544'

RECEIVED
DEC1O2007

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MININ

Total flours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1026 Boiler Hours 24 UP 107,000

Mrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 102,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O uEad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6518 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 19:30 5 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Securig
vis 65 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 11.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 30/34 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
cA 120 95 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 9/13 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 19
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 3.00
CAKE 2/32 360 Barite T/B/G

CL 38,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 18-45

KCL 7.0 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 22.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIFTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 7.78 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 2, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 48
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED USE CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6564 4.5 | 328.5 20 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 55
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Drilling@6564' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole Is caving uncontrolably 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6544' to 6564'.
10:30 12:30 2.00 Hole Caving in IStuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
12:30 Wash and ream back to bottom with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6367 to 6430' Plugged Flowline from Gas

14:30 2.00 Buster with Cavings and ran 150 bbis mud out the end of flair line, lost 40 bbis mud unplugging and draining
14:30 16:30 2.00 Circulate and condition mud Build volume.
16:30 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6430" to 6493' hole Caving, washing 3 1/2" diamiter Chunks out

20:30 4.00 of hole./ Increased Viscosity to 100 then 150 seconds / Quart, I Pack off again.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pull out and lay down 2 joints / Reastablish Circulation. (lost 50' of hole)
21:00 6:00 9.00 Wash and ream back to bottom with 3 to 6 k WOB from 6443 to 6564'

HECEIVFF
DEC1Ô2nn7

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINNA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1320 Boiler Hours 24 UP 104,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 99,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 99,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vIs 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
CA 140 80 Durgel DEFTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 46
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 7.50
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 45
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.1

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [·ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 2, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 48
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED USE CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6564 4.5 | 328.5 20 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 55
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Drilling@6564' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole Is caving uncontrolably 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6544' to 6564'.
10:30 12:30 2.00 Hole Caving in IStuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
12:30 Wash and ream back to bottom with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6367 to 6430' Plugged Flowline from Gas

14:30 2.00 Buster with Cavings and ran 150 bbis mud out the end of flair line, lost 40 bbis mud unplugging and draining
14:30 16:30 2.00 Circulate and condition mud Build volume.
16:30 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6430" to 6493' hole Caving, washing 3 1/2" diamiter Chunks out

20:30 4.00 of hole./ Increased Viscosity to 100 then 150 seconds / Quart, I Pack off again.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pull out and lay down 2 joints / Reastablish Circulation. (lost 50' of hole)
21:00 6:00 9.00 Wash and ream back to bottom with 3 to 6 k WOB from 6443 to 6564'

HECEIVFF
DEC1Ô2nn7

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINNA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1320 Boiler Hours 24 UP 104,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 99,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 99,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vIs 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
CA 140 80 Durgel DEFTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 46
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 7.50
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 45
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.1

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [·ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 2, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 48
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED USE CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6564 4.5 | 328.5 20 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 55
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Drilling@6564' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole Is caving uncontrolably 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6544' to 6564'.
10:30 12:30 2.00 Hole Caving in IStuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
12:30 Wash and ream back to bottom with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6367 to 6430' Plugged Flowline from Gas

14:30 2.00 Buster with Cavings and ran 150 bbis mud out the end of flair line, lost 40 bbis mud unplugging and draining
14:30 16:30 2.00 Circulate and condition mud Build volume.
16:30 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6430" to 6493' hole Caving, washing 3 1/2" diamiter Chunks out

20:30 4.00 of hole./ Increased Viscosity to 100 then 150 seconds / Quart, I Pack off again.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pull out and lay down 2 joints / Reastablish Circulation. (lost 50' of hole)
21:00 6:00 9.00 Wash and ream back to bottom with 3 to 6 k WOB from 6443 to 6564'

HECEIVFF
DEC1Ô2nn7

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINNA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1320 Boiler Hours 24 UP 104,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 99,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 99,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vIs 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
CA 140 80 Durgel DEFTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 46
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 7.50
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 45
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.1

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [·ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 2, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 48
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED USE CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6564 4.5 | 328.5 20 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 55
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Drilling@6564' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole Is caving uncontrolably 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6544' to 6564'.
10:30 12:30 2.00 Hole Caving in IStuck pipe,Packed off, work free and reastablish circulation.
12:30 Wash and ream back to bottom with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6367 to 6430' Plugged Flowline from Gas

14:30 2.00 Buster with Cavings and ran 150 bbis mud out the end of flair line, lost 40 bbis mud unplugging and draining
14:30 16:30 2.00 Circulate and condition mud Build volume.
16:30 Wash and ream with 10 to 12 k WOB from 6430" to 6493' hole Caving, washing 3 1/2" diamiter Chunks out

20:30 4.00 of hole./ Increased Viscosity to 100 then 150 seconds / Quart, I Pack off again.
20:30 21:00 0.50 Pull out and lay down 2 joints / Reastablish Circulation. (lost 50' of hole)
21:00 6:00 9.00 Wash and ream back to bottom with 3 to 6 k WOB from 6443 to 6564'

HECEIVFF
DEC1Ô2nn7

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINNA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1320 Boiler Hours 24 UP 104,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 100 0 Out DOWN 99,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 99,000

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vIs 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TTA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595
CA 140 80 Durgel DEFTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEFTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 46
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 7.50
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 45
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 6.1

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [·ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATT

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 3, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUMTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 49
COTALDEFTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6748' 23.5 352 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 56
ACTIVfTY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drillinq@6748' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Drilling is going great and the hands are getting the Location Cleaned up and the rig back in shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6564' to 658T.
10:30 11:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
11:00 6:00 19.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6748.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000

FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur M on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000
MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 140 80 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 230
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 31.00
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 7.5

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 R l*lVED
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 IN 1 O20072 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 I IVOF01\ AAR&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATT

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 3, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUMTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 49
COTALDEFTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6748' 23.5 352 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 56
ACTIVfTY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drillinq@6748' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Drilling is going great and the hands are getting the Location Cleaned up and the rig back in shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6564' to 658T.
10:30 11:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
11:00 6:00 19.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6748.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000

FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur M on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000
MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 140 80 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 230
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 31.00
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 7.5

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 R l*lVED
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 IN 1 O20072 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 I IVOF01\ AAR&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATT

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 3, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUMTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 49
COTALDEFTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6748' 23.5 352 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 56
ACTIVfTY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drillinq@6748' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Drilling is going great and the hands are getting the Location Cleaned up and the rig back in shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6564' to 658T.
10:30 11:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
11:00 6:00 19.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6748.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000

FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur M on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000
MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 140 80 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 230
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 31.00
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 7.5

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 R l*lVED
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 IN 1 O20072 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 I IVOF01\ AAR&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATT

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 3, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUMTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 49
COTALDEFTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED lAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

6748' 23.5 352 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 56
ACTIVfTY AT REPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Drillinq@6748' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Drilling is going great and the hands are getting the Location Cleaned up and the rig back in shape. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 10:30 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6564' to 658T.
10:30 11:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
11:00 6:00 19.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6748.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1368 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000

FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ur M on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000
MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH 6464 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10
TIME 14:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 5 Pac-ul MFG Security
vis 64 2 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 9.8 5 caustic TFA

PV/YP 25/30 26 Fed-Zan JET open
MBT 16% 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 140 80 Durgel DEPTH OUT

GELS 8/15 90 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .15/1.2 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 230
pH 9 2 Soda Ash HRs 31.00
CAKE 2/32 880 Barite T/B/G

CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $12,312.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $316,257.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $328,569.00 ROP(fph) 7.5

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 R l*lVED
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 IN 1 O20072 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 I IVOF01\ AAR&



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 4, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 50
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6900' 23.5 | 375.5 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 57
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drilling @6900' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS K6TO GL.

Getting Ready to tripfor a bit 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6836'.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
17:00 6:00 13.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6836' to 6900'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1348 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Brs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul Mrs Security
VIs 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 120 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6900
GELs 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 382
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRs 54.50
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G
CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $14,980.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $328,569.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $343,549.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP f ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 RECEIVFD
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DEC1O2007
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM 105 DI\ OF01L,GA¶

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 4, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 50
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6900' 23.5 | 375.5 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 57
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drilling @6900' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS K6TO GL.

Getting Ready to tripfor a bit 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6836'.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
17:00 6:00 13.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6836' to 6900'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1348 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Brs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul Mrs Security
VIs 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 120 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6900
GELs 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 382
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRs 54.50
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G
CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $14,980.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $328,569.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $343,549.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP f ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 RECEIVFD
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DEC1O2007
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM 105 DI\ OF01L,GA¶

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 4, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 50
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6900' 23.5 | 375.5 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 57
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drilling @6900' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS K6TO GL.

Getting Ready to tripfor a bit 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6836'.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
17:00 6:00 13.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6836' to 6900'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1348 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Brs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul Mrs Security
VIs 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 120 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6900
GELs 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 382
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRs 54.50
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G
CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $14,980.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $328,569.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $343,549.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP f ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 RECEIVFD
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DEC1O2007
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM 105 DI\ OF01L,GA¶

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 4, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 50
COTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6900' 23.5 | 375.5 20 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 57
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Drilling @6900' |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS K6TO GL.

Getting Ready to tripfor a bit 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6587' to 6836'.
16:30 17:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
17:00 6:00 13.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6836' to 6900'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1348 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Brs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 100,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul Mrs Security
VIs 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL NO. 10721595
cA 120 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6900
GELs 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide TOTALFEET 382
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRs 54.50
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G
CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $14,980.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $328,569.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 cUMULATIVECOST $343,549.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP f ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 RECEIVFD
1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DEC1O2007
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 RollerReamer 6.09 SPM 105 DI\ OF01L,GA¶



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 5, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 51
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 6.5 382 31' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 58
ACTIVTTYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Tripping back in hole with new bit @Shoe. |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6900' to 6931'
12:30 14:00 1.50 Condition mud and Circulate hole clean.
14:00 22:00 8.00 Pull out of hole, lay down 5 jointson bottom,
22:00 2:30 4.50 Lay down mud motor, bit, Shock sub and 3 pointreamer. I pickup new motor, bit, Dog sub and NRRS.
2:30 3:30 1.00 Trip in hole
3:30 4:30 1.00 Lay down Jars And Pick up new HMJ ar.
4:30 6:00 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 856 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 100,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û 11
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFC Security Reed Hycolog
vis 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 120 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide FOTALFEET 413
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRS 61.00
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $9,904.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $365,882.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $375,786.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP UATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH th

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DECI 0 2uut
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 LIV.UFUIL,GAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 5, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 51
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 6.5 382 31' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 58
ACTIVTTYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Tripping back in hole with new bit @Shoe. |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6900' to 6931'
12:30 14:00 1.50 Condition mud and Circulate hole clean.
14:00 22:00 8.00 Pull out of hole, lay down 5 jointson bottom,
22:00 2:30 4.50 Lay down mud motor, bit, Shock sub and 3 pointreamer. I pickup new motor, bit, Dog sub and NRRS.
2:30 3:30 1.00 Trip in hole
3:30 4:30 1.00 Lay down Jars And Pick up new HMJ ar.
4:30 6:00 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 856 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 100,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û 11
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFC Security Reed Hycolog
vis 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 120 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide FOTALFEET 413
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRS 61.00
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $9,904.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $365,882.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $375,786.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP UATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH th

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DECI 0 2uut
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 LIV.UFUIL,GAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 5, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 51
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 6.5 382 31' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 58
ACTIVTTYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Tripping back in hole with new bit @Shoe. |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6900' to 6931'
12:30 14:00 1.50 Condition mud and Circulate hole clean.
14:00 22:00 8.00 Pull out of hole, lay down 5 jointson bottom,
22:00 2:30 4.50 Lay down mud motor, bit, Shock sub and 3 pointreamer. I pickup new motor, bit, Dog sub and NRRS.
2:30 3:30 1.00 Trip in hole
3:30 4:30 1.00 Lay down Jars And Pick up new HMJ ar.
4:30 6:00 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 856 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 100,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û 11
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFC Security Reed Hycolog
vis 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 120 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide FOTALFEET 413
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRS 61.00
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $9,904.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $365,882.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $375,786.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP UATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH th

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DECI 0 2uut
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 LIV.UFUIL,GAS&

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 5, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 51
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 6.5 382 31' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 58
ACTIVTTYAT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY

Tripping back in hole with new bit @Shoe. |R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 6900' to 6931'
12:30 14:00 1.50 Condition mud and Circulate hole clean.
14:00 22:00 8.00 Pull out of hole, lay down 5 jointson bottom,
22:00 2:30 4.50 Lay down mud motor, bit, Shock sub and 3 pointreamer. I pickup new motor, bit, Dog sub and NRRS.
2:30 3:30 1.00 Trip in hole
3:30 4:30 1.00 Lay down Jars And Pick up new HMJ ar.
4:30 6:00 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 856 Boiler Hours 24 UP 106,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 100,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 104,000

MUD tECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1Û 11
TIME 18:00 0 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.3 6 Pac-ul MFC Security Reed Hycolog
vis 117 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S
WL 39 0 caustic TFA

PV/YP 39/46 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 17.50 14 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 120 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 13/40 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .0/.7 2 Myacide FOTALFEET 413
pH 8 0 Soda Ash HRS 61.00
CAKE 2/32 330 Barite T/B/G

CL 29,000 DAILYCOST $9,904.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $365,882.00 RPM 55/75
%SOLIDs 23.00 CUMULATIVECOST $375,786.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP UATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH th

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DECI 0 2uut
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105 LIV.UFUIL,GAS&



Marion Energy inc· R; l'bs \0e119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 6, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 52
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTCASING SI2E, WEIGiff, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 59
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Reaming and working tight h 3\e from 5240 to 5275' Posibly vertical slab. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.
7:30 8:30 1.00 Kelly up Break Circulation.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Hook up new choke line to Buster.
9:00 10:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 5240'
10:30 6:00 19.50 Wash and Ream from 5240' to 5275' Work throughhole at 5250 to 5268 repetedly, Pick up 10' Pup joint.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10 11
TIME 22:00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vis 82 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 10.4 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 46/28 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 18.00 9 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 8ÛÛ 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 14/37 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .25/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 0 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 <ao Barite Tis/G

CL 42,000 DAILYCOST $12,601.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 7.8 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,387.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP 1 ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL ÛPBÛ BPBÛ
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105

10 6" f)C 300 47 CDM $

Marion Energy inc· R; l'bs \0e119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 6, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 52
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTCASING SI2E, WEIGiff, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 59
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Reaming and working tight h 3\e from 5240 to 5275' Posibly vertical slab. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.
7:30 8:30 1.00 Kelly up Break Circulation.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Hook up new choke line to Buster.
9:00 10:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 5240'
10:30 6:00 19.50 Wash and Ream from 5240' to 5275' Work throughhole at 5250 to 5268 repetedly, Pick up 10' Pup joint.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10 11
TIME 22:00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vis 82 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 10.4 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 46/28 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 18.00 9 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 8ÛÛ 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 14/37 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .25/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 0 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 <ao Barite Tis/G

CL 42,000 DAILYCOST $12,601.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 7.8 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,387.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP 1 ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL ÛPBÛ BPBÛ
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105

10 6" f)C 300 47 CDM $

Marion Energy inc· R; l'bs \0e119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 6, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 52
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTCASING SI2E, WEIGiff, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 59
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Reaming and working tight h 3\e from 5240 to 5275' Posibly vertical slab. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.
7:30 8:30 1.00 Kelly up Break Circulation.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Hook up new choke line to Buster.
9:00 10:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 5240'
10:30 6:00 19.50 Wash and Ream from 5240' to 5275' Work throughhole at 5250 to 5268 repetedly, Pick up 10' Pup joint.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10 11
TIME 22:00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vis 82 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 10.4 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 46/28 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 18.00 9 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 8ÛÛ 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 14/37 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .25/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 0 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 <ao Barite Tis/G

CL 42,000 DAILYCOST $12,601.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 7.8 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,387.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP 1 ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL ÛPBÛ BPBÛ
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105

10 6" f)C 300 47 CDM $

Marion Energy inc· R; l'bs \0e119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 6, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 52
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTCASING SI2E, WEIGiff, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 59
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 R.L. Tatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Reaming and working tight h 3\e from 5240 to 5275' Posibly vertical slab. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:30 1.50 Trip in hole to Shoe.
7:30 8:30 1.00 Kelly up Break Circulation.
8:30 9:00 0.50 Hook up new choke line to Buster.
9:00 10:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 5240'
10:30 6:00 19.50 Wash and Ream from 5240' to 5275' Work throughhole at 5250 to 5268 repetedly, Pick up 10' Pup joint.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6845 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 10 11
TIME 22:00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vis 82 6 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 10.4 2 caustic TFA

PV/YP 46/28 34 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 18.00 9 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 8ÛÛ 0 Durgel DEFTH OUT 6931 6931
GELS 14/37 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .25/1.1 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 0 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 <ao Barite Tis/G

CL 42,000 DAILYCOST $12,601.00 WT. ON BIT 42
KCL 7.8 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,387.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP 1 ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°

1 PDM 33.09 MODEL ÛPBÛ BPBÛ
1 Shock sub 7.78 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM 105

10 6" f)C 300 47 CDM $



AS-g-3\99
RECENED

Marion Energy inc.he661 6
DECZ4 2007119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 7, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 53

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 60
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KB TO GL.

Getting mud weight up to 13 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Reaming FI 5275' T/ 5277'
9:00 9:30 0.50 Rig Service
9:30 18:00 8.50 Reaming F/ 5277' TI 5299'
18:00 0.6:00 12.00 Hole sluff off lost 40 feet of hole/ reaming tighthole
0.6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5261' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 10 11
TIME 17:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.4 16 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vIs 82 16 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 7.6 a caustic TFA
PV/YP 40/33 5 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 16.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6931 6931
GELs 10/26 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .3/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 6 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 46,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ON BYT 42
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Ream-Keyseat 5.73 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIze 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM

AS-g-3\99
RECENED

Marion Energy inc.he661 6
DECZ4 2007119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 7, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 53

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 60
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KB TO GL.

Getting mud weight up to 13 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Reaming FI 5275' T/ 5277'
9:00 9:30 0.50 Rig Service
9:30 18:00 8.50 Reaming F/ 5277' TI 5299'
18:00 0.6:00 12.00 Hole sluff off lost 40 feet of hole/ reaming tighthole
0.6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5261' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 10 11
TIME 17:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.4 16 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vIs 82 16 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 7.6 a caustic TFA
PV/YP 40/33 5 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 16.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6931 6931
GELs 10/26 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .3/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 6 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 46,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ON BYT 42
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Ream-Keyseat 5.73 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIze 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM

AS-g-3\99
RECENED

Marion Energy inc.he661 6
DECZ4 2007119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 7, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 53

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 60
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KB TO GL.

Getting mud weight up to 13 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Reaming FI 5275' T/ 5277'
9:00 9:30 0.50 Rig Service
9:30 18:00 8.50 Reaming F/ 5277' TI 5299'
18:00 0.6:00 12.00 Hole sluff off lost 40 feet of hole/ reaming tighthole
0.6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5261' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 10 11
TIME 17:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.4 16 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vIs 82 16 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 7.6 a caustic TFA
PV/YP 40/33 5 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 16.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6931 6931
GELs 10/26 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .3/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 6 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 46,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ON BYT 42
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Ream-Keyseat 5.73 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIze 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM

AS-g-3\99
RECENED

Marion Energy inc.he661 6
DECZ4 2007119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 7, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 53

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .]-55 STC 4306' RKB 60
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming Through Tight hole @5275 Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KB TO GL.

Getting mud weight up to 13 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:00 3.00 Reaming FI 5275' T/ 5277'
9:00 9:30 0.50 Rig Service
9:30 18:00 8.50 Reaming F/ 5277' TI 5299'
18:00 0.6:00 12.00 Hole sluff off lost 40 feet of hole/ reaming tighthole
0.6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 105 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTALDAYWORN 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5261' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 10 11
TIME 17:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.4 16 Pac-ul MFG Security Reed Hycolog
vIs 82 16 Pac-r TYPE EBXS22S DSX168A1
WL 7.6 a caustic TFA
PV/YP 40/33 5 Fed-Zan JET open 9x16
MBT 16.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. 10721595 207142
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT 6931 6931
GELs 10/26 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6518
ALK .3/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET 413
pH 9.5 6 Soda Ash HRs 61.00
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 46,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ON BYT 42
KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 55/75 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph) 7.0

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.02 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 Ream-Keyseat 5.73 STROKE 8.50 8.50
2 6" DC 60.92 LINER SIze 6.25 6.25
1 Roller Reamer 6.09 SPM



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 8, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 54
FGTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' | 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 61
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip for mudmotor & bit Richard Crow /CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL,

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Reaming tighthole/ getting weight up to 13+
13:00 14:00 1.00 Condition mud to trip out of hole
14:00 14:30 0.50 Blow down kelly
14:30 18:00 3.50 T.O.H. Change bit to tri-cone
18:00 22:30 4.50 TOH/ Lay down mud motor
22:30 23:30 1.00 Strap B.H.A.
23:30 4:00 4.50 Pick up mud motor/ T.I.H.
4:00 5:00 1.00 Install rotating rubber
5:00 6:00 1.00 Break cir. @ shoe
6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 63 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

His. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5256' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 12:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 16 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 102 16 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 5.6 8 caustic TFA
PV/YP 44/39 5 Fed-Zan :JET Open
MBT 19.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT
GELS 14/35 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.6 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10 6 sodaAsh HRS
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 52,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL 9.5 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDS 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP isATA 11EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 8, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 54
FGTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' | 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 61
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip for mudmotor & bit Richard Crow /CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL,

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Reaming tighthole/ getting weight up to 13+
13:00 14:00 1.00 Condition mud to trip out of hole
14:00 14:30 0.50 Blow down kelly
14:30 18:00 3.50 T.O.H. Change bit to tri-cone
18:00 22:30 4.50 TOH/ Lay down mud motor
22:30 23:30 1.00 Strap B.H.A.
23:30 4:00 4.50 Pick up mud motor/ T.I.H.
4:00 5:00 1.00 Install rotating rubber
5:00 6:00 1.00 Break cir. @ shoe
6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 63 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

His. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5256' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 12:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 16 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 102 16 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 5.6 8 caustic TFA
PV/YP 44/39 5 Fed-Zan :JET Open
MBT 19.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT
GELS 14/35 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.6 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10 6 sodaAsh HRS
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 52,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL 9.5 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDS 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP isATA 11EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE
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Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 54
FGTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' | 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 61
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip for mudmotor & bit Richard Crow /CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL,

15
TIME LOG
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6:00 13:00 7.00 Reaming tighthole/ getting weight up to 13+
13:00 14:00 1.00 Condition mud to trip out of hole
14:00 14:30 0.50 Blow down kelly
14:30 18:00 3.50 T.O.H. Change bit to tri-cone
18:00 22:30 4.50 TOH/ Lay down mud motor
22:30 23:30 1.00 Strap B.H.A.
23:30 4:00 4.50 Pick up mud motor/ T.I.H.
4:00 5:00 1.00 Install rotating rubber
5:00 6:00 1.00 Break cir. @ shoe
6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 63 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

His. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5256' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 12:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 16 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 102 16 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 5.6 8 caustic TFA
PV/YP 44/39 5 Fed-Zan :JET Open
MBT 19.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT
GELS 14/35 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.6 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10 6 sodaAsh HRS
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 52,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL 9.5 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDS 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP isATA 11EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 8, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 carbon Utah 54
FGTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' | 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# 3-55 STC 4306' RKB 61
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Trip for mudmotor & bit Richard Crow /CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL,

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 13:00 7.00 Reaming tighthole/ getting weight up to 13+
13:00 14:00 1.00 Condition mud to trip out of hole
14:00 14:30 0.50 Blow down kelly
14:30 18:00 3.50 T.O.H. Change bit to tri-cone
18:00 22:30 4.50 TOH/ Lay down mud motor
22:30 23:30 1.00 Strap B.H.A.
23:30 4:00 4.50 Pick up mud motor/ T.I.H.
4:00 5:00 1.00 Install rotating rubber
5:00 6:00 1.00 Break cir. @ shoe
6:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 63 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

His. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5256' NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 12:00 12 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.5 16 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 102 16 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 5.6 8 caustic TFA
PV/YP 44/39 5 Fed-Zan :JET Open
MBT 19.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 640 0 Durgel DEPTH OUT
GELS 14/35 0 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.6 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10 6 sodaAsh HRS
CAKE 2/32 80 Barite T/B/G
CL 52,000 DAILYCOST $11,785.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL 9.5 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDS 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $387,571.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP isATA 11EVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DECL4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASE NAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 9, 2007
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 55
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAETCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 62
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming To Bottom Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Cir.I Con. Mud
6:30 8:00 1.50 T.I.H
8:00 18:00 10.00 Rea ming F/5188' TI 5251'
18:00 23;30 5.50 Reaming F/5221' TI 5378'
23;30 0.12:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5589'
0:00 0.1.00 1.00 Reaming F/5589' TI 5693'

0.1.00 0.2.00 1.00 T.I.H./ F/5693' TI 6535'
0.2.00 0.6.00 0.4.00 Reaming FI 6535' TI 6869'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 67 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5283' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 18:00 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 85 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 4.4 4 caustic TFA
Pv/yP 49/30 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 18.00 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA Durgel DEPTHOUT
GELS 12/41 ma×Gel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET

pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 40 Barite T/B/G

CL 48,000 DAILYCOST $6,749.00 WT. ONBIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 25.00 CUMULATIVECOST $382,535.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH

MAKE Nat Idat 5790
Inclinatio1n / Azimuth

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASE NAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
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RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 55
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAETCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .
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ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
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REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
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8:00 18:00 10.00 Rea ming F/5188' TI 5251'
18:00 23;30 5.50 Reaming F/5221' TI 5378'
23;30 0.12:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5589'
0:00 0.1.00 1.00 Reaming F/5589' TI 5693'

0.1.00 0.2.00 1.00 T.I.H./ F/5693' TI 6535'
0.2.00 0.6.00 0.4.00 Reaming FI 6535' TI 6869'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 67 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5283' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 18:00 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 85 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 4.4 4 caustic TFA
Pv/yP 49/30 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 18.00 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA Durgel DEPTHOUT
GELS 12/41 ma×Gel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET

pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 40 Barite T/B/G

CL 48,000 DAILYCOST $6,749.00 WT. ONBIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 25.00 CUMULATIVECOST $382,535.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH

MAKE Nat Idat 5790
Inclinatio1n / Azimuth

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM
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ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
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%SOLIDs 25.00 CUMULATIVECOST $382,535.00 ROP(fph)
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23;30 0.12:00 0.50 Trip in hole to 5589'
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Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5283' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 18:00 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 85 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 4.4 4 caustic TFA

Pv/yP 49/30 2 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 18.00 4 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA Durgel DEPTHOUT

GELS 12/41 ma×Gel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET

pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS

CAKE 2/32 40 Barite T/B/G

CL 48,000 DAILYCOST $6,749.00 WT. ONBIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 25.00 CUMULATIVECOST $382,535.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH

MAKE Nat Idat 5790
Inclinatio1n / Azimuth

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 56
EOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 63
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Building volume & mixingmud ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Lost circulate @6974' 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 3.50 Reaming F/ 6869' T/ 6932'
9:30 16:00 6.50 #2 pump down / cir. Hole with #1 pumpwith 595 psi. not enough to drill with code 8
16:00 18:00 2.00 Actual drill FI 6931 T/ 6945'
18:00 23:30 5.50 Actual drill F/6945' TI 6974' TI 6974' Lost cir, 400 Bbis.
23:30 1:30 2.00 Pulled 8 stnds.
1:30 3:00 1.50 Building volume condition mud
3:00 5:00 2.00 Pulled 19 stnds. To shoe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Condition mud,

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 6.30 FUEL USED 67 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
FOTALDAYWORK 17.30 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6887' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 0.5.00 10 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 104 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.8 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 61/34 10 Fed-Zan :IET Open
MBT 16.00 6 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
cA 8Û 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 15/45 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 160 Barite Tisic
CL 56,000 DAILYCOST $9,193.00 WT. ONBrr 25/35K
KCL 10.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $384,979.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°
1 MudMotor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8,50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 56
EOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 63
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Building volume & mixingmud ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Lost circulate @6974' 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 3.50 Reaming F/ 6869' T/ 6932'
9:30 16:00 6.50 #2 pump down / cir. Hole with #1 pumpwith 595 psi. not enough to drill with code 8
16:00 18:00 2.00 Actual drill FI 6931 T/ 6945'
18:00 23:30 5.50 Actual drill F/6945' TI 6974' TI 6974' Lost cir, 400 Bbis.
23:30 1:30 2.00 Pulled 8 stnds.
1:30 3:00 1.50 Building volume condition mud
3:00 5:00 2.00 Pulled 19 stnds. To shoe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Condition mud,

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 6.30 FUEL USED 67 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
FOTALDAYWORK 17.30 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6887' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 0.5.00 10 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 104 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.8 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 61/34 10 Fed-Zan :IET Open
MBT 16.00 6 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
cA 8Û 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 15/45 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 160 Barite Tisic
CL 56,000 DAILYCOST $9,193.00 WT. ONBrr 25/35K
KCL 10.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $384,979.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°
1 MudMotor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8,50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 56
EOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 63
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Building volume & mixingmud ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Lost circulate @6974' 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 3.50 Reaming F/ 6869' T/ 6932'
9:30 16:00 6.50 #2 pump down / cir. Hole with #1 pumpwith 595 psi. not enough to drill with code 8
16:00 18:00 2.00 Actual drill FI 6931 T/ 6945'
18:00 23:30 5.50 Actual drill F/6945' TI 6974' TI 6974' Lost cir, 400 Bbis.
23:30 1:30 2.00 Pulled 8 stnds.
1:30 3:00 1.50 Building volume condition mud
3:00 5:00 2.00 Pulled 19 stnds. To shoe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Condition mud,

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 6.30 FUEL USED 67 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
FOTALDAYWORK 17.30 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6887' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 0.5.00 10 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 104 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.8 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 61/34 10 Fed-Zan :IET Open
MBT 16.00 6 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
cA 8Û 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 15/45 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 160 Barite Tisic
CL 56,000 DAILYCOST $9,193.00 WT. ONBrr 25/35K
KCL 10.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $384,979.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°
1 MudMotor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8,50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 10, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 56
EOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Report No. .

6931' 0 | 382 0 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 63
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Building volume & mixingmud ¡Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Lost circulate @6974' 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 3.50 Reaming F/ 6869' T/ 6932'
9:30 16:00 6.50 #2 pump down / cir. Hole with #1 pumpwith 595 psi. not enough to drill with code 8
16:00 18:00 2.00 Actual drill FI 6931 T/ 6945'
18:00 23:30 5.50 Actual drill F/6945' TI 6974' TI 6974' Lost cir, 400 Bbis.
23:30 1:30 2.00 Pulled 8 stnds.
1:30 3:00 1.50 Building volume condition mud
3:00 5:00 2.00 Pulled 19 stnds. To shoe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Condition mud,

Total Hours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 6.30 FUEL USED 67 Boiler Hours 24 UP 96,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 94,000
FOTALDAYWORK 17.30 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 90,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6887' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 0.5.00 10 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 12.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 104 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.8 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 61/34 10 Fed-Zan :IET Open
MBT 16.00 6 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
cA 8Û 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 15/45 maxGel DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 1 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 10.5 4 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 160 Barite Tisic
CL 56,000 DAILYCOST $9,193.00 WT. ONBrr 25/35K
KCL 10.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 24.00 cUMULATIVECOST $384,979.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Ñat 5790 1°
1 MudMotor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8,50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FÏELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 11, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 57
FOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6974' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .'l-55 STC 4306' RKB 64
ACTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming to bottom . Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Dump three pits full of cuttings /building volume mixing mud
16:30 18:00 1.50 T.l.H I Kelly up break cir.
18:00 21:30 3.50 Reaming FI 5227' TI 5245'
21:30 23:30 2.00 P.U.O.B.I Build volume I condition mud
23:30 6:00 6.50 Reaming F/ 5227 T/ 5342'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 98,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4324 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME o.4.00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 72 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 6.6 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 72/31 15 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 10.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 60 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/9 15 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK / 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 6 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 290 Barite T/B/G
CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $12,757.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 6.1/4% PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 60.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,543.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" 13it 1.5Ü MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FÏELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 11, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 57
FOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6974' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .'l-55 STC 4306' RKB 64
ACTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming to bottom . Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Dump three pits full of cuttings /building volume mixing mud
16:30 18:00 1.50 T.l.H I Kelly up break cir.
18:00 21:30 3.50 Reaming FI 5227' TI 5245'
21:30 23:30 2.00 P.U.O.B.I Build volume I condition mud
23:30 6:00 6.50 Reaming F/ 5227 T/ 5342'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 98,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4324 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME o.4.00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 72 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 6.6 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 72/31 15 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 10.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 60 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/9 15 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK / 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 6 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 290 Barite T/B/G
CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $12,757.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 6.1/4% PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 60.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,543.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" 13it 1.5Ü MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FÏELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 11, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 57
FOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6974' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .'l-55 STC 4306' RKB 64
ACTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming to bottom . Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Dump three pits full of cuttings /building volume mixing mud
16:30 18:00 1.50 T.l.H I Kelly up break cir.
18:00 21:30 3.50 Reaming FI 5227' TI 5245'
21:30 23:30 2.00 P.U.O.B.I Build volume I condition mud
23:30 6:00 6.50 Reaming F/ 5227 T/ 5342'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 98,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4324 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME o.4.00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 72 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 6.6 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 72/31 15 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 10.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 60 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/9 15 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK / 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 6 Polylv HRS

CAKE 2/32 290 Barite T/B/G
CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $12,757.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 6.1/4% PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 60.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,543.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" 13it 1.5Ü MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FÏELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 11, 2007
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 57
FOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET ® Report No. .

6974' 0 382 0 9-5/8" 36# .'l-55 STC 4306' RKB 64
ACTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Reaming to bottom . Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:30 10.50 Dump three pits full of cuttings /building volume mixing mud
16:30 18:00 1.50 T.l.H I Kelly up break cir.
18:00 21:30 3.50 Reaming FI 5227' TI 5245'
21:30 23:30 2.00 P.U.O.B.I Build volume I condition mud
23:30 6:00 6.50 Reaming F/ 5227 T/ 5342'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 400 0 Out DOWN 98,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4324 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME o.4.00 2 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.6 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vIs 72 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 6.6 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 72/31 15 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 10.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 60 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/9 15 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK / 2 Myacide TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 6 Polylv HRS

CAKE 2/32 290 Barite T/B/G
CL 32,000 DAILYCOST $12,757.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 6.1/4% PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 30/60
%SOLIDs 60.00 CUMULATIVECOST $388,543.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" 13it 1.5Ü MAKE Nat Nat 5190 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



. RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0F01L,GAS&MlNING
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 12, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 58

TOTALDEFFH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 65
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY
Actual Drill |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole is making 3 to 5 bbis. H 2/0 per hour.. 15
TIME LO3

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Reaming FI 5342' TI 5374'
7:00 8:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6832'
8:30 15:30 . 7,00 Break circ,/ Reaming F/ 6832' TI 6974'
15:30 18:00 2.50 Actu ral Fl 6974' TI 6987'
18:00 6;00 12.00 Actual drill F/6987' TI 7072'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiter Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 560 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI( 24.00 Totai H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6885 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 11:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 22 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 70 22 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.2 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 70/35 28 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 8.00 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. FH30VPS
cA 10 20 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/7 25 geL DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .2/.45 20 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 16 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 340 Barite T/B/G
CL 28,000 DAILYCOST $27,204.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDS $ CUMULATIVECOST $402,990.00 ROP(fph) 7.9

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

. RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0F01L,GAS&MlNING
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 12, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 58

TOTALDEFFH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 65
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY
Actual Drill |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole is making 3 to 5 bbis. H 2/0 per hour.. 15
TIME LO3

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Reaming FI 5342' TI 5374'
7:00 8:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6832'
8:30 15:30 . 7,00 Break circ,/ Reaming F/ 6832' TI 6974'
15:30 18:00 2.50 Actu ral Fl 6974' TI 6987'
18:00 6;00 12.00 Actual drill F/6987' TI 7072'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiter Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 560 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI( 24.00 Totai H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6885 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 11:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 22 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 70 22 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.2 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 70/35 28 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 8.00 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. FH30VPS
cA 10 20 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/7 25 geL DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .2/.45 20 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 16 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 340 Barite T/B/G
CL 28,000 DAILYCOST $27,204.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDS $ CUMULATIVECOST $402,990.00 ROP(fph) 7.9

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

. RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0F01L,GAS&MlNING
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 12, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 58

TOTALDEFFH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 65
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY
Actual Drill |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole is making 3 to 5 bbis. H 2/0 per hour.. 15
TIME LO3

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Reaming FI 5342' TI 5374'
7:00 8:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6832'
8:30 15:30 . 7,00 Break circ,/ Reaming F/ 6832' TI 6974'
15:30 18:00 2.50 Actu ral Fl 6974' TI 6987'
18:00 6;00 12.00 Actual drill F/6987' TI 7072'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiter Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 560 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI( 24.00 Totai H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6885 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 11:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 22 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 70 22 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.2 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 70/35 28 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 8.00 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. FH30VPS
cA 10 20 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/7 25 geL DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .2/.45 20 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 16 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 340 Barite T/B/G
CL 28,000 DAILYCOST $27,204.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDS $ CUMULATIVECOST $402,990.00 ROP(fph) 7.9

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

. RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0F01L,GAS&MlNING
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 12, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 58

TOTALDEFFH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' |9-5/8"36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 65
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY
Actual Drill |Richard Crow/Cecil Crow
REMARKS KB TO GL.

Hole is making 3 to 5 bbis. H 2/0 per hour.. 15
TIME LO3

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 Reaming FI 5342' TI 5374'
7:00 8:30 1.50 Trip in hole to 6832'
8:30 15:30 . 7,00 Break circ,/ Reaming F/ 6832' TI 6974'
15:30 18:00 2.50 Actu ral Fl 6974' TI 6987'
18:00 6;00 12.00 Actual drill F/6987' TI 7072'

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 38 Boiter Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 560 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI( 24.00 Totai H2O used on well & road 300 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 6885 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 11:00 6 RehoSmart SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 22 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 70 22 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3.2 4 caustic TFA
PV/YP 70/35 28 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 8.00 12 aspitasol SERIALNo. FH30VPS
cA 10 20 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/7 25 geL DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .2/.45 20 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 16 Polylv HRS
CAKE 2/32 340 Barite T/B/G
CL 28,000 DAILYCOST $27,204.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDS $ CUMULATIVECOST $402,990.00 ROP(fph) 7.9

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80
11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



RECEIVED
Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007
McKinney,Texas 75069

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 59

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 66
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actual Drill Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Contain water flow to 1 to 2 t bls. A hour. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Actural drill F/ 7072' T/
8:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service /changed out rotary chain
10:00 18,00 8.00 Actual drill FI 7090' T/7139'
18:00 6;00 12;00 Actual drill F/7139' TI 7208'
6;00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 55" Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORC MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH 7167 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 12
TIME 22:00 53 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 68 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 68/32 10 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 12.00 13 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 20 4 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELs 3/5 120 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 11o KcL TOTAL FEET

pH 10 10 Polylv HRS 42.00
CAKE 2/32 50 Barite T/8/G

cL 43,000 DAILYCOST $10,220.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 9.00 CUMULATIVECOST $386,006.00 ROP(fph) 6/7.9

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

RECEIVED
Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007
McKinney,Texas 75069

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 59

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 66
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actual Drill Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Contain water flow to 1 to 2 t bls. A hour. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Actural drill F/ 7072' T/
8:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service /changed out rotary chain
10:00 18,00 8.00 Actual drill FI 7090' T/7139'
18:00 6;00 12;00 Actual drill F/7139' TI 7208'
6;00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 55" Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORC MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH 7167 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 12
TIME 22:00 53 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 68 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 68/32 10 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 12.00 13 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 20 4 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELs 3/5 120 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 11o KcL TOTAL FEET

pH 10 10 Polylv HRS 42.00
CAKE 2/32 50 Barite T/8/G

cL 43,000 DAILYCOST $10,220.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 9.00 CUMULATIVECOST $386,006.00 ROP(fph) 6/7.9

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

RECEIVED
Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007
McKinney,Texas 75069

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 59

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 66
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actual Drill Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Contain water flow to 1 to 2 t bls. A hour. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Actural drill F/ 7072' T/
8:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service /changed out rotary chain
10:00 18,00 8.00 Actual drill FI 7090' T/7139'
18:00 6;00 12;00 Actual drill F/7139' TI 7208'
6;00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 55" Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORC MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH 7167 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 12
TIME 22:00 53 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 68 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 68/32 10 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 12.00 13 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 20 4 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELs 3/5 120 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 11o KcL TOTAL FEET

pH 10 10 Polylv HRS 42.00
CAKE 2/32 50 Barite T/8/G

cL 43,000 DAILYCOST $10,220.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 9.00 CUMULATIVECOST $386,006.00 ROP(fph) 6/7.9

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

RECEIVED
Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007
McKinney,Texas 75069

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 13, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 59

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

6974' 0 404 7072' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 66
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actual Drill Richard Crow/CecilCrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Contain water flow to 1 to 2 t bls. A hour. 15
TIME LOG

FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Actural drill F/ 7072' T/
8:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service /changed out rotary chain
10:00 18,00 8.00 Actual drill FI 7090' T/7139'
18:00 6;00 12;00 Actual drill F/7139' TI 7208'
6;00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 55" Boiler Hours 24 UP 103,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 98,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road 150 Barrels ROTATE 94,000

MUD IECORC MUD MATERIALS ISED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH 7167 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 12
TIME 22:00 53 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 68 6 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 3 caustic TFA
PV/YP 68/32 10 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 12.00 13 aspitasol SERIAL No. FH30VPS
CA 20 4 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELs 3/5 120 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK .35/.7 11o KcL TOTAL FEET

pH 10 10 Polylv HRS 42.00
CAKE 2/32 50 Barite T/8/G

cL 43,000 DAILYCOST $10,220.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $375,786.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 9.00 CUMULATIVECOST $386,006.00 ROP(fph) 6/7.9

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP I·ATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT - e a sy

LEASENAME&WELLNO.
FIELD DATERailroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 14, 2007

RIGNAMEAND NUMBER
COUNTY STATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 60

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTECASING SIZE, WEIGETT,GRADE SET© Report No. .7355 16 420 147 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 67
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME

REPORTEDBYDrillingAt 7355' Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.Water flow is still present wit i well flowing on Connections at the rate of 3 to 5 gpm. 15TIME LOS
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 2.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7208' to 7233'.
9:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service.
10:00 23:30 13.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7233' to 7328'.
23:30 0:30 1.00 Rig Service I Inspect Brakes.
0:30 1:30 1.00 Repair Rig / Work on weight indicator.
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7328' to 7355'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1300 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTN 7285 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 17:00 45 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 59 0 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 26/12 14 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. FH30VPS
CA 60 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 140 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK

.25/.6 o KcL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 58.00
CAKE 2/32 100 Barite Tis/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $12 361.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 cUMULATIVECOST $507,213.00 ROP(fph) 7.3

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM 105

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT - e a sy

LEASENAME&WELLNO.
FIELD DATERailroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 14, 2007

RIGNAMEAND NUMBER
COUNTY STATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 60

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTECASING SIZE, WEIGETT,GRADE SET© Report No. .7355 16 420 147 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 67
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME

REPORTEDBYDrillingAt 7355' Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.Water flow is still present wit i well flowing on Connections at the rate of 3 to 5 gpm. 15TIME LOS
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 2.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7208' to 7233'.
9:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service.
10:00 23:30 13.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7233' to 7328'.
23:30 0:30 1.00 Rig Service I Inspect Brakes.
0:30 1:30 1.00 Repair Rig / Work on weight indicator.
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7328' to 7355'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1300 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTN 7285 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 17:00 45 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 59 0 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 26/12 14 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. FH30VPS
CA 60 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 140 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK

.25/.6 o KcL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 58.00
CAKE 2/32 100 Barite Tis/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $12 361.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 cUMULATIVECOST $507,213.00 ROP(fph) 7.3

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM 105

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT - e a sy

LEASENAME&WELLNO.
FIELD DATERailroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 14, 2007

RIGNAMEAND NUMBER
COUNTY STATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 60

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTECASING SIZE, WEIGETT,GRADE SET© Report No. .7355 16 420 147 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 67
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME

REPORTEDBYDrillingAt 7355' Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.Water flow is still present wit i well flowing on Connections at the rate of 3 to 5 gpm. 15TIME LOS
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 2.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7208' to 7233'.
9:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service.
10:00 23:30 13.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7233' to 7328'.
23:30 0:30 1.00 Rig Service I Inspect Brakes.
0:30 1:30 1.00 Repair Rig / Work on weight indicator.
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7328' to 7355'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1300 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTN 7285 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 17:00 45 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 59 0 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 26/12 14 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. FH30VPS
CA 60 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 140 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK

.25/.6 o KcL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 58.00
CAKE 2/32 100 Barite Tis/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $12 361.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 cUMULATIVECOST $507,213.00 ROP(fph) 7.3

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM 105

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT - e a sy

LEASENAME&WELLNO.
FIELD DATERailroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 14, 2007

RIGNAMEAND NUMBER
COUNTY STATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 60

TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LASTECASING SIZE, WEIGETT,GRADE SET© Report No. .7355 16 420 147 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 67
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME

REPORTEDBYDrillingAt 7355' Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.Water flow is still present wit i well flowing on Connections at the rate of 3 to 5 gpm. 15TIME LOS
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 9:30 2.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7208' to 7233'.
9:30 10:00 1.50 Rig service.
10:00 23:30 13.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7233' to 7328'.
23:30 0:30 1.00 Rig Service I Inspect Brakes.
0:30 1:30 1.00 Repair Rig / Work on weight indicator.
1:30 6:00 4.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7328' to 7355'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1300 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD

DEPTN 7285 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 17:00 45 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.5 6 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 59 0 Pac-r TYPE PF6872
WL 3 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 26/12 14 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 8 aspitasol SERIAL NO. FH30VPS
CA 60 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 140 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK

.25/.6 o KcL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 58.00
CAKE 2/32 100 Barite Tis/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $12 361.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 cUMULATIVECOST $507,213.00 ROP(fph) 7.3

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP [ ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80

11 6"DDc 365.75 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM 105



Marion Energy inc. RECE1VED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DN.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO- FIELD DATE
RailroadSWD1 Kenilworth December 15, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 61
FOTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. ,

7459 21.5 441.5 104' 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 68
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
DrillingAt 7459' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.
Turned off Whater flow with 1.5 ppg 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7355' to 7360'.
6:30 8:00 1.50 Repair rotating ruber
8:00 15:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7360' to 7390'.
15:00 16:00 1.00 Wireline Survey @7316' = 1.5 deg.
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7390' to 7459'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7359 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 6:00 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 61 8 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS
WL 3.6 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 25/10 0 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872
cA 80 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 20 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK -15/.8 0 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRS 79.50
CAKE 2/32 35 Barite T/B/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $8397.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 CUMULATIVECOST $503,249.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

11 6"DDc 329.71 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECE1VED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DN.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO- FIELD DATE
RailroadSWD1 Kenilworth December 15, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 61
FOTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. ,

7459 21.5 441.5 104' 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 68
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
DrillingAt 7459' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.
Turned off Whater flow with 1.5 ppg 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7355' to 7360'.
6:30 8:00 1.50 Repair rotating ruber
8:00 15:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7360' to 7390'.
15:00 16:00 1.00 Wireline Survey @7316' = 1.5 deg.
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7390' to 7459'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7359 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 6:00 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 61 8 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS
WL 3.6 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 25/10 0 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872
cA 80 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 20 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK -15/.8 0 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRS 79.50
CAKE 2/32 35 Barite T/B/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $8397.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 CUMULATIVECOST $503,249.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

11 6"DDc 329.71 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECE1VED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DN.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO- FIELD DATE
RailroadSWD1 Kenilworth December 15, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 61
FOTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. ,

7459 21.5 441.5 104' 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 68
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
DrillingAt 7459' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.
Turned off Whater flow with 1.5 ppg 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7355' to 7360'.
6:30 8:00 1.50 Repair rotating ruber
8:00 15:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7360' to 7390'.
15:00 16:00 1.00 Wireline Survey @7316' = 1.5 deg.
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7390' to 7459'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7359 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 6:00 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 61 8 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS
WL 3.6 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 25/10 0 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872
cA 80 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 20 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK -15/.8 0 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRS 79.50
CAKE 2/32 35 Barite T/B/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $8397.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 CUMULATIVECOST $503,249.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

11 6"DDc 329.71 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM

Marion Energy inc. RECE1VED
119 S Tennessee, Ste DEC2 4 2007McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DN.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME&WELLNO- FIELD DATE
RailroadSWD1 Kenilworth December 15, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 61
FOTALDEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. ,

7459 21.5 441.5 104' 9-5/8" 36# 1-55 STC 4306' RKB 68
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
DrillingAt 7459' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.
Turned off Whater flow with 1.5 ppg 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:30 0.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7355' to 7360'.
6:30 8:00 1.50 Repair rotating ruber
8:00 15:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7360' to 7390'.
15:00 16:00 1.00 Wireline Survey @7316' = 1.5 deg.
16:00 6:00 14.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7390' to 7459'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 146,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 140,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 144,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7359 NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO. 12
TIME 6:00 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 10.2 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith
vis 61 8 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS
WL 3.6 0 caustic TFA
PV/YP 25/10 0 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 14.00 12 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872
cA 80 0 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/5 20 gel. DEPTH IN 6931
ALK -15/.8 0 KCL TOTAL FEET
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRS 79.50
CAKE 2/32 35 Barite T/B/G
CL 44,000 DAILYCOST $8397.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $494,852.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 10.00 CUMULATIVECOST $503,249.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

11 6"DDc 329.71 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Jars 31.69 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
6 6"DC 181.07 SPM



Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

DIR0"0", UF MlfIINGLEASENAME &WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 16, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 62
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

7468' | 2 | 443.5 9' 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 69
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Drilling At 7468' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Picked up 12 Joints of heavy weight Drill pipe on top of The jars 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7459' to 7468' Finish Bringing Mud weight up to 11.5 ppg.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Pull out of hole for Bit.
13:00 15:30 2.50 Pick up New Bit and shock sub, Strap jarsand 12 jointsheavy weight.
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip in hole to top of collars, Pick up new Jars, and 1 joint of Hwdp
18:00 18:00 14.00 Slip and cut 80' of drilling line.
19:00 20:00 2.00 Lubricate rig / Recalibrate weight indicator.
20:00 22:00 2.00 Pick up 11 joints of hwdp and 4 jointsof dp.
22:00 22:30 0.50 Install rotating head
22:30 3:30 5.00 Trip in hole / Break circulation at 4400', 6000'.
3:30 5:00 1.50 Laydown 13 Jointsof driff pipe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash 70' to bottom with new bit.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 134,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD IECORD MUDMATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7468 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12 13
TIME 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith Smith
vis 54 12 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS FH40 VPS
WL 5.6 0 caustic TFA
evjyP 23/9 14 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT 12.00 28 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872 PG1602
cA 120 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 7468'
GELS 2/4 90 gel. DEPTH IN 6931 7468
ALK .1/1.2 0 KCL TOTAL FEET 537'
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 81.50
CAKE 2/32 1235 Barite T/B/G
CL 31,000 DAILYcOST $24 154.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $503,249.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 15.00 cUMULATIVECOST $527,403.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuthi 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°
1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50

17 6"Dc 542.61 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

17 4 1/2" HWDP 36637 CDM A

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

DIR0"0", UF MlfIINGLEASENAME &WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 16, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 62
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

7468' | 2 | 443.5 9' 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 69
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Drilling At 7468' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Picked up 12 Joints of heavy weight Drill pipe on top of The jars 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7459' to 7468' Finish Bringing Mud weight up to 11.5 ppg.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Pull out of hole for Bit.
13:00 15:30 2.50 Pick up New Bit and shock sub, Strap jarsand 12 jointsheavy weight.
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip in hole to top of collars, Pick up new Jars, and 1 joint of Hwdp
18:00 18:00 14.00 Slip and cut 80' of drilling line.
19:00 20:00 2.00 Lubricate rig / Recalibrate weight indicator.
20:00 22:00 2.00 Pick up 11 joints of hwdp and 4 jointsof dp.
22:00 22:30 0.50 Install rotating head
22:30 3:30 5.00 Trip in hole / Break circulation at 4400', 6000'.
3:30 5:00 1.50 Laydown 13 Jointsof driff pipe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash 70' to bottom with new bit.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 134,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD IECORD MUDMATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7468 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12 13
TIME 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith Smith
vis 54 12 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS FH40 VPS
WL 5.6 0 caustic TFA
evjyP 23/9 14 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT 12.00 28 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872 PG1602
cA 120 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 7468'
GELS 2/4 90 gel. DEPTH IN 6931 7468
ALK .1/1.2 0 KCL TOTAL FEET 537'
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 81.50
CAKE 2/32 1235 Barite T/B/G
CL 31,000 DAILYcOST $24 154.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $503,249.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 15.00 cUMULATIVECOST $527,403.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuthi 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°
1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50

17 6"Dc 542.61 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

17 4 1/2" HWDP 36637 CDM A

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

DIR0"0", UF MlfIINGLEASENAME &WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 16, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 62
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

7468' | 2 | 443.5 9' 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 69
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Drilling At 7468' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Picked up 12 Joints of heavy weight Drill pipe on top of The jars 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7459' to 7468' Finish Bringing Mud weight up to 11.5 ppg.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Pull out of hole for Bit.
13:00 15:30 2.50 Pick up New Bit and shock sub, Strap jarsand 12 jointsheavy weight.
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip in hole to top of collars, Pick up new Jars, and 1 joint of Hwdp
18:00 18:00 14.00 Slip and cut 80' of drilling line.
19:00 20:00 2.00 Lubricate rig / Recalibrate weight indicator.
20:00 22:00 2.00 Pick up 11 joints of hwdp and 4 jointsof dp.
22:00 22:30 0.50 Install rotating head
22:30 3:30 5.00 Trip in hole / Break circulation at 4400', 6000'.
3:30 5:00 1.50 Laydown 13 Jointsof driff pipe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash 70' to bottom with new bit.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 134,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD IECORD MUDMATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7468 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12 13
TIME 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith Smith
vis 54 12 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS FH40 VPS
WL 5.6 0 caustic TFA
evjyP 23/9 14 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT 12.00 28 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872 PG1602
cA 120 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 7468'
GELS 2/4 90 gel. DEPTH IN 6931 7468
ALK .1/1.2 0 KCL TOTAL FEET 537'
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 81.50
CAKE 2/32 1235 Barite T/B/G
CL 31,000 DAILYcOST $24 154.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $503,249.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 15.00 cUMULATIVECOST $527,403.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuthi 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°
1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50

17 6"Dc 542.61 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

17 4 1/2" HWDP 36637 CDM A

Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

DIR0"0", UF MlfIINGLEASENAME &WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 16, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spudUnit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 62
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

7468' | 2 | 443.5 9' 9-5/8" 36# .1-55 STC 4306' RKB 69
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
Drilling At 7468' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS

KBTO GL.
Picked up 12 Joints of heavy weight Drill pipe on top of The jars 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:00 2.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7459' to 7468' Finish Bringing Mud weight up to 11.5 ppg.
8:00 13:00 5.00 Pull out of hole for Bit.
13:00 15:30 2.50 Pick up New Bit and shock sub, Strap jarsand 12 jointsheavy weight.
15:30 18:00 2.50 Trip in hole to top of collars, Pick up new Jars, and 1 joint of Hwdp
18:00 18:00 14.00 Slip and cut 80' of drilling line.
19:00 20:00 2.00 Lubricate rig / Recalibrate weight indicator.
20:00 22:00 2.00 Pick up 11 joints of hwdp and 4 jointsof dp.
22:00 22:30 0.50 Install rotating head
22:30 3:30 5.00 Trip in hole / Break circulation at 4400', 6000'.
3:30 5:00 1.50 Laydown 13 Jointsof driff pipe
5:00 6:00 1.00 Wash 70' to bottom with new bit.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 138,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 134,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O utad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 136,000

MUD IECORD MUDMATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7468 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 12 13
TIME 10 durgel SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.6 9 Pac-ul MFG Smith Smith
vis 54 12 Pac-r TYPE FH30VPS FH40 VPS
WL 5.6 0 caustic TFA
evjyP 23/9 14 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT 12.00 28 aspitasol SERIAL No. PF6872 PG1602
cA 120 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 7468'
GELS 2/4 90 gel. DEPTH IN 6931 7468
ALK .1/1.2 0 KCL TOTAL FEET 537'
pH 9.5 0 Polylv HRs 81.50
CAKE 2/32 1235 Barite T/B/G
CL 31,000 DAILYcOST $24 154.00 WT. ON Brr 25/35K
KCL 6.0 PREVIOUS COST $503,249.00 RPM 58/65
%SOLIDs 15.00 cUMULATIVECOST $527,403.00 ROP(fph) 5.0

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECJRD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuthi 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°
1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50

17 6"Dc 542.61 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

17 4 1/2" HWDP 36637 CDM A



. RECEIVEDMarion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, ste DECZ4 2007

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.0F01L,GAS&MINING
LEASENAME &WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 17, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 63

TOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

7625' 24 | 467.5 | 157 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 70
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPOETEDBY

DrillingAt 7625' Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.
Adjusting Mud Propertys in Freperation to Drill anhidright | 15

TIME LOG
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 6:00 24.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7468' to 7625'.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1938 Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hrs. Mob./Demob Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 200 0 Out DOWN 130,000
FOTAL DAYWORlt 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barre\s ROTATE 140,000

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7510 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 12 13
TIME 12:00 40 Reho SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.8 11 Desco MFG Smith Smith
vIs 49 115 KCL TYPE FH30VPS FH40 VPS
WL 4.8 5 Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP 22/8 36 Fed-Zan JET Open Open
MBT 10.00 11 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PF6872 PG1602
cA 80 39 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 7468'
GELS 2/3 4 Cotton seed DEPTH IN 6931 7468
ALK .15/.9 75 Sawdust TOTAL FEET 537 157
pH 9.5 19 Mica HRs 81.50 24.00
CAKE 2/32 0 Barite T/B/G 3,4,wt,a,e,1,fc,hr
CL 34,000 DAILYCOST $16 072.00 WT. ON BIT 25/35K 36 to 44 K
KCL 6.5 PREVIOUS COST $527,403.00 RPM 58/65 56/80
%SOLIDs 13.00 CUMULATIVECOST $543,475.00 ROP(fph) 5.0 6.5

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP 1*ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
i 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $190 1°
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1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM
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cA 80 39 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 7468'
GELS 2/3 4 Cotton seed DEPTH IN 6931 7468
ALK .15/.9 75 Sawdust TOTAL FEET 537 157
pH 9.5 19 Mica HRs 81.50 24.00
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DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP 1*ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
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Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 DEC2 4 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT ny nFnlI /Af UtlfilNGFIELD DATELEASENAME& WELL NO.

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 18, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 64
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LA5f CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

7802' | 18.5 486 177 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 71
ACTIVITY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY
DrillingAt 7802' |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.
Lost Approx 500 bbls so far./ Drilled anhyd. Starting at 7716 with no visible affect on the mud. 15

TIME LO3
FROM ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 11:00 5.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7625' to 7669'.
11:00 11:30 0.50 Lubricate rig
11:30 1:00 13.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7669' to 7802'. Drilled Anhyd. Starting at 7716'
1:00 6:00 5.00 Lost circulation / Hole is full but Will not circulate./ Mix and condition mud, rebuild volume.

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1360 Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hns. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O used on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 7629 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 13
TIME 6:00 235 Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.8 250 Gel MFG Smith
vIs 67 45 KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL 32 0 Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP 28/12 28 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 16.00 0 Pollyswell SERIAL NO. PG1602
cA 40 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 5/14 4 Cotton seed DEPTH IN 7468
ALK .3/.7 75 Sawdust TOTAL FEET 334
pH 9.5 19 Mica HRs 42.00
CAKE 2/32 0 Barite T/B/G
CL 46,000 DAILYCOST $11,343.00 WT. ON Brr 36 to 44 K
KCL 7.5 PREVIOUS COST $543,475.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIos 15.00 CUMULATIVECOST $554,818.00 ROP(fph) 8.0

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°
1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50

17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105
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O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wella, significantlydeepen existing wells Delow current bottom-hole deptli, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposats.

L TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Kenilworth Railroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200
y

McKinney STATE TX ziP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIOTR,SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE.MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

12/23/2007 CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START)RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearty show all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

In an effort to minimizepotential damage from mud contamination to the Navajo section, MarionEnergy proposes the following
changes to the KRR #1 SWD. We plan to run 7",23#,P-110 casing to a depth of approx. 8085' just above the Navajo to surface,
with a stage tool set at +/- 5400'. We will two stage cement the pipe as follows. First stage will be 600 sx, 50/50 poz, 1.25 yelld,
14#ppg slurry weight. The stage toolwillbe openedand circulated for 3 hours minimum.Second stage willconsist of 295 sx, 50
50 poz, 1.25 yelld and 14 ppg slurryweight. Cement willbe circulated into 400' into the 9 5/8" intermediate casing overlap. We
willdrill the Navajo witha 6 1/4" bit and an air foam or polymer system. We will then run 5 1/2", 17#, N-80 casing as a liner with
200' of overlap in the 7". The liner hangar willconsist of a dual pack-offwith tie-backassembly for pressure seal between
casing strings.
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FEE-BH-61504
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wella, significantlydeepen existing wells Delow current bottom-hole deptli, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposats.
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3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200
y

McKinney STATE TX ziP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIOTR,SECTION,TOWNSHIP,RANGE.MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH
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willdrill the Navajo witha 6 1/4" bit and an air foam or polymer system. We will then run 5 1/2", 17#, N-80 casing as a liner with
200' of overlap in the 7". The liner hangar willconsist of a dual pack-offwith tie-backassembly for pressure seal between
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Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 178 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 4,160 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 2,211 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,990 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 6,930 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 8085 7 23.00 P-110 LT&C 8085 8085 6.241 1787.1

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) F or (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 3990 4440 .113 3990 8720 2.19 186 732 3.94 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: December 27,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8085 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsíbility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 2006-11 Marion Kenilworth RR 1 SWDrev.
Operator: Marion Energy, Inc
String type: Production Liner Project ID:

43-007-31229
Location: Carbon County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 7,893 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 3,288 psi Liner top: 7,885 ft
Intemal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,344 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 8,673 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft3)
1 903 5.5 17.00 N-80 LT&C 8803 8803 4.767 117.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 4344 6290 1.448 4344 7740 1.78 15 348 22.67 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: December 27,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
For this liner string, the top is rounded to the nearest 100 ft.Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe thatof the
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Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801/538-5357 Date: December 27,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801/539-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
For this liner string, the top is rounded to the nearest 100 ft.Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8803 ft, a mud weight of 9.5 ppg The
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe thatof the
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O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontat laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL S 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL Q OTHER KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee Ste.200 GTY McKinney STATE TX zi,75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

91. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPA1RWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

12/23/2007 2 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECIAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

In an effort to minimize potential damage from mud contamination to the Navajo section, Marion Energy proposes the following
changes to the KRR #1 SWD. We plan to run 7",23#,P-110 casing to a depth of approx. 8085' just above the Navajo to surface,
with a stage toolset at +/- 5400'. We willtwostage cement the pipe as follows. First stage willbe 600 sx, 50/50 poz, 1.25 yeild,
14#ppg slurry weight. The stage toolwillbe opened and circulated for 3 hours minimum. Second stage willconsist of 295 sx, 50
50 poz, 1.25 yelld and 14 ppg slurry weight. Cement willbe circulated into 400' into the9 5/8" intermediate casing overlap. We
willdrillthe Navajo with a 6 1/4" bit and an air foam or polymer system. We willthen run 5 1/2", 17#, N-80 casing as a liner with
200' of overlap in the 7". The liner hangar willconsist of a dual pack-off with tie-backassembly for pressure seal between
casing strings.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT g Endsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 12/19/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DEC3 1 2007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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Marion Energy inc.
OD~\-3 apcy

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL140. FIEI.D DATE
Railroad $WD1 Kenilworth December 19, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUlHY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 65
(OTAL DEPTH Rot. His cumRot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRIllED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET Repo No.' 7946' j 17.5 | 503.5 144 j9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB

ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REFORTEDBY
DrillingAt 7802' ¡Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL
Lost Approx 500 bbis so far./ Drilled anhyd. Starting at 7716 with no visible affect on the mud. 15

TIME LOG
MOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Lost circulation / Hole is full but Will not circulatel Mix and condition mud, rebuild volume.

12:30 2:30 14.00 DriHingwith Mud Motor from 7802' to 7921'.
2:30 3:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
3:00 6:00 3.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 792f to 7946'.

RECOVED

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1235 Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hrs. Mob./Demol Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 130,000
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH 7828 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 13
TIME 12:ÛO 235 Duragel SIZE = 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.2 250 Gel MFG Smith
vrs 45 45 KCL TYPE FH40VPS
WL 7.8 0 Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP 18/7 28 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT 12.00 0 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG1602
cA 60 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELs 2/4 4 Cotton seed DEFTH IN 7468
ALK .15/.85 75 Sawdust TOTALFEET 478'
pH 9 19 Mica HRs 59.50
CAKE 2/32 o sarite Tja/G
CL 33,000 DAILYCOST $13,186.00 WT. ON BIT 36 tO 44 K
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUSCOST $554,818.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDs 13.00 CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION ŒNGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL SP80 8PSO 7316' 1.5°
1 Shocksub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50

17 6"Oc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31 03 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
OD~\-3 apcy
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Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
1.EASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 20, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY KIKFE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 66
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 73
ACTIVTFYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Circulatingconditionmud. |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Short trip went without any p oblems. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7946' to 8016'.
12:30 13:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
13:00 20:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 8016" to 8085'.
20:00 0:30 4.50 Circulate and condition
0:30 1:00 0.50 Set back kelly and blow down
1:00 6:00 5.00 Short tripto 4300' and back to bottom.

RECEIVED
JANO2 ? 8

DIVOFOlt, GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1325 Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8085.00 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO. 13
TIME 19:30 235 Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 250 Gel Mrs Smith
vIs 64 45 KCL TYPE FH40VPS
WL 4.4 0 Super Sweep TFA

Pv/YP 19/9 28 Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MBT 15.00 0 Pollyswell SERIALNo. PG1602
cA 0 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8085
GELs 4/8 4 Cotton seed DEPTH IN 7468
ALK .35/.5 75 Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH 9.5 19 Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE 2/32 0 Barite T/B/G

CL 57,000 DAILYCOST $18,784.00 WT.ONBrr 36 to 44 K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS 18.00 cDMULATIVECOST $586,788.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat hat 5790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
1.EASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 20, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY KIKFE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 66
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 73
ACTIVTFYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Circulatingconditionmud. |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Short trip went without any p oblems. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7946' to 8016'.
12:30 13:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
13:00 20:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 8016" to 8085'.
20:00 0:30 4.50 Circulate and condition
0:30 1:00 0.50 Set back kelly and blow down
1:00 6:00 5.00 Short tripto 4300' and back to bottom.

RECEIVED
JANO2 ? 8

DIVOFOlt, GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1325 Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8085.00 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO. 13
TIME 19:30 235 Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 250 Gel Mrs Smith
vIs 64 45 KCL TYPE FH40VPS
WL 4.4 0 Super Sweep TFA

Pv/YP 19/9 28 Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MBT 15.00 0 Pollyswell SERIALNo. PG1602
cA 0 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8085
GELs 4/8 4 Cotton seed DEPTH IN 7468
ALK .35/.5 75 Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH 9.5 19 Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE 2/32 0 Barite T/B/G

CL 57,000 DAILYCOST $18,784.00 WT.ONBrr 36 to 44 K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS 18.00 cDMULATIVECOST $586,788.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat hat 5790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
1.EASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 20, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY KIKFE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 66
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4306' RKB 73
ACTIVTFYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Circulatingconditionmud. |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Short trip went without any p oblems. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 12:30 6.50 Drilling with Mud Motor from 7946' to 8016'.
12:30 13:00 0.50 Lubricate rig
13:00 20:00 7.00 Drilling with Mud Motor from 8016" to 8085'.
20:00 0:30 4.50 Circulate and condition
0:30 1:00 0.50 Set back kelly and blow down
1:00 6:00 5.00 Short tripto 4300' and back to bottom.

RECEIVED
JANO2 ? 8

DIVOFOlt, GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1325 Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 300 0 Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8085.00 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO. 13
TIME 19:30 235 Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 11.5 250 Gel Mrs Smith
vIs 64 45 KCL TYPE FH40VPS
WL 4.4 0 Super Sweep TFA

Pv/YP 19/9 28 Fed-Zan 3ET Open
MBT 15.00 0 Pollyswell SERIALNo. PG1602
cA 0 6 Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8085
GELs 4/8 4 Cotton seed DEPTH IN 7468
ALK .35/.5 75 Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH 9.5 19 Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE 2/32 0 Barite T/B/G

CL 57,000 DAILYCOST $18,784.00 WT.ONBrr 36 to 44 K
KCL 8.5 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS 18.00 cDMULATIVECOST $586,788.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat hat 5790 1°
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 21, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNÌY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 67
roTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' ,
9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4335' RKB 74

ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

code8 rig repair RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Cir. For logs
8:30 18:00 9.50 Trip out of hole
18:00 19:00 1.00 Rig up wireline for logs
19:00 0.12:30 5.50 Ran logs toß073'

0.12:30 0.1.;00 1.00 Rig down loggers
0.1.;00 2:00 1.00 Rig service

2:00 6:00 4.00 Code 8 Iworking on brakes

RECE!VED
JANO2 2008

DIV.0ECIL,CADM20

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 4;00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 20.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1TNO. 13
TIME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Gel MFG Sinith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan Ji¯r Open
MBT Pdllyswell SERIAL NO. PG16Û2
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEFTH IN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRS 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON Bir 36 tO 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 gPM 56/80
VosoLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ÀQP(f¢h) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $190 i*
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 srRoKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 sgu 105

19 A 11pn I-RAlnD 2K 27 enu 2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 21, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNÌY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 67
roTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' ,
9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4335' RKB 74

ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

code8 rig repair RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Cir. For logs
8:30 18:00 9.50 Trip out of hole
18:00 19:00 1.00 Rig up wireline for logs
19:00 0.12:30 5.50 Ran logs toß073'

0.12:30 0.1.;00 1.00 Rig down loggers
0.1.;00 2:00 1.00 Rig service

2:00 6:00 4.00 Code 8 Iworking on brakes

RECE!VED
JANO2 2008

DIV.0ECIL,CADM20

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 4;00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 20.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1TNO. 13
TIME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Gel MFG Sinith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan Ji¯r Open
MBT Pdllyswell SERIAL NO. PG16Û2
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEFTH IN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRS 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON Bir 36 tO 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 gPM 56/80
VosoLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ÀQP(f¢h) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $190 i*
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 srRoKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 sgu 105

19 A 11pn I-RAlnD 2K 27 enu 2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 21, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNÌY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 67
roTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' ,
9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4335' RKB 74

ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

code8 rig repair RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Cir. For logs
8:30 18:00 9.50 Trip out of hole
18:00 19:00 1.00 Rig up wireline for logs
19:00 0.12:30 5.50 Ran logs toß073'

0.12:30 0.1.;00 1.00 Rig down loggers
0.1.;00 2:00 1.00 Rig service

2:00 6:00 4.00 Code 8 Iworking on brakes

RECE!VED
JANO2 2008

DIV.0ECIL,CADM20

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 4;00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 20.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1TNO. 13
TIME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Gel MFG Sinith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan Ji¯r Open
MBT Pdllyswell SERIAL NO. PG16Û2
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEFTH IN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRS 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON Bir 36 tO 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 gPM 56/80
VosoLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ÀQP(f¢h) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $190 i*
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 srRoKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 sgu 105

19 A 11pn I-RAlnD 2K 27 enu 2

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 21, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNÌY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 67
roTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' ,
9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC 4335' RKB 74

ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

code8 rig repair RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 8:30 2.50 Cir. For logs
8:30 18:00 9.50 Trip out of hole
18:00 19:00 1.00 Rig up wireline for logs
19:00 0.12:30 5.50 Ran logs toß073'

0.12:30 0.1.;00 1.00 Rig down loggers
0.1.;00 2:00 1.00 Rig service

2:00 6:00 4.00 Code 8 Iworking on brakes

RECE!VED
JANO2 2008

DIV.0ECIL,CADM20

Total floum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair 4;00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000

Hm. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 130,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 20.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000

MUD lECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED B1TRECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1TNO. 13
TIME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Gel MFG Sinith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan Ji¯r Open
MBT Pdllyswell SERIAL NO. PG16Û2
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEFTH IN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRS 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON Bir 36 tO 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 gPM 56/80
VosoLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ÀQP(f¢h) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat $190 i*
1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 srRoKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 sgu 105

19 A 11pn I-RAlnD 2K 27 enu 2



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. HELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 22, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 69
COTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Repoit No. .

8085' 13.5 527 | 139' \9-5/8"36# 3-55 STC 4335' RKB 76
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTED BY

T./I./H. RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Going in hole have to melt i:e off pins and boxes of drill pipe. 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Rig repair / Code 8
18:00 19:00 1.00 Code 8
19:00 6:00 11.00 Trip in hole I break circ. At4335' And 6363'
6:00
0:00
0:00

REcavED
JANO29

DROFgy GAS&MINI

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 13.00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN 130,000

TOTALDAYWOR¥ 11.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000
MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 13
(IME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Get MFG Siviith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP | Fed-2an JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG1602
CA Soda Ash DEFTN OUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON sir 36 to 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA i+EVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7Š1Ñ 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

12 4 1/2" HWDP 366.27 GPM 3.22
SURF PRESSURE

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. HELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 22, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 69
COTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Repoit No. .

8085' 13.5 527 | 139' \9-5/8"36# 3-55 STC 4335' RKB 76
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTED BY

T./I./H. RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Going in hole have to melt i:e off pins and boxes of drill pipe. 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Rig repair / Code 8
18:00 19:00 1.00 Code 8
19:00 6:00 11.00 Trip in hole I break circ. At4335' And 6363'
6:00
0:00
0:00

REcavED
JANO29

DROFgy GAS&MINI

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 13.00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN 130,000

TOTALDAYWOR¥ 11.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000
MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 13
(IME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Get MFG Siviith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP | Fed-2an JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG1602
CA Soda Ash DEFTN OUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON sir 36 to 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA i+EVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7Š1Ñ 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

12 4 1/2" HWDP 366.27 GPM 3.22
SURF PRESSURE

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. HELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 22, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 69
COTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Repoit No. .

8085' 13.5 527 | 139' \9-5/8"36# 3-55 STC 4335' RKB 76
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTED BY

T./I./H. RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Going in hole have to melt i:e off pins and boxes of drill pipe. 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Rig repair / Code 8
18:00 19:00 1.00 Code 8
19:00 6:00 11.00 Trip in hole I break circ. At4335' And 6363'
6:00
0:00
0:00

REcavED
JANO29

DROFgy GAS&MINI

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 13.00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN 130,000

TOTALDAYWOR¥ 11.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000
MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 13
(IME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Get MFG Siviith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP | Fed-2an JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG1602
CA Soda Ash DEFTN OUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON sir 36 to 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA i+EVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7Š1Ñ 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

12 4 1/2" HWDP 366.27 GPM 3.22
SURF PRESSURE

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. HELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 22, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCor . Rig 132 Carbon Utah 69
COTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET© Repoit No. .

8085' 13.5 527 | 139' \9-5/8"36# 3-55 STC 4335' RKB 76
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTED BY

T./I./H. RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Going in hole have to melt i:e off pins and boxes of drill pipe. 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 18:00 12.00 Rig repair / Code 8
18:00 19:00 1.00 Code 8
19:00 6:00 11.00 Trip in hole I break circ. At4335' And 6363'
6:00
0:00
0:00

REcavED
JANO29

DROFgy GAS&MINI

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 13.00 FUEL USED 37" Boiler Hours 24 UP 145,000
rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN 130,000

TOTALDAYWOR¥ 11.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 140,000
MUD IECORE MUD MATERIALSJSED BIT RECORD

DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 13
(IME Duragel SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT Get MFG Siviith
VIS KCL TYPE FH40 VPS
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP | Fed-2an JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG1602
CA Soda Ash DEFTN OUT 8085
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN 7468
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET 617
pH Mica HRs 73.00
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON sir 36 to 44 K
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 56/80
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 8.Û

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP I ATA i+EVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 8 3/4" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

1 Mud Motor 33.08 MODEL 8P80 8P80 7Š1Ñ 1.5°

1 Shock sub 6.89 STROKE 8.50 8.50
17 6"Dc 512.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Jars 31.03 SPM 105

12 4 1/2" HWDP 366.27 GPM 3.22
SURF PRESSURE



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REP RT
ŒASE NAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70
COTALDEPfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 77
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TIH W/ P-110 LTC23# 7" Csq RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Landed casing at 8031.39' 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 T1H. Break cir
7:00 8:00 1.00 Ream to bottom
8:00 12:00 4.00 Con. Mud to 11.4 wt.
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rip up lay down crew
12:30 18:00 5.50 Pooh laying down drill pipe
18:00 3:00 9.00 Laying down drill pipe& BHA
3:00 4:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
4:30 5:30 1.00 Make up shoe&Stab Through Intermediate Took 45 min. Due To Shoe Design
5:30 6:00 0.50 Make Up Float Collar ITIH With P-110 LTC 23#7" Csg

RECENE

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI‡ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PVfYP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Cotton seed DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Mica HRS

cAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOL1DS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSEABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTIØN LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH i Inclination / Azimuth

mKE Ñat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL SP80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REP RT
ŒASE NAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70
COTALDEPfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 77
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TIH W/ P-110 LTC23# 7" Csq RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Landed casing at 8031.39' 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 T1H. Break cir
7:00 8:00 1.00 Ream to bottom
8:00 12:00 4.00 Con. Mud to 11.4 wt.
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rip up lay down crew
12:30 18:00 5.50 Pooh laying down drill pipe
18:00 3:00 9.00 Laying down drill pipe& BHA
3:00 4:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
4:30 5:30 1.00 Make up shoe&Stab Through Intermediate Took 45 min. Due To Shoe Design
5:30 6:00 0.50 Make Up Float Collar ITIH With P-110 LTC 23#7" Csg

RECENE

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI‡ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PVfYP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Cotton seed DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Mica HRS

cAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOL1DS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSEABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTIØN LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH i Inclination / Azimuth

mKE Ñat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL SP80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REP RT
ŒASE NAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70
COTALDEPfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 77
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TIH W/ P-110 LTC23# 7" Csq RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Landed casing at 8031.39' 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 T1H. Break cir
7:00 8:00 1.00 Ream to bottom
8:00 12:00 4.00 Con. Mud to 11.4 wt.
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rip up lay down crew
12:30 18:00 5.50 Pooh laying down drill pipe
18:00 3:00 9.00 Laying down drill pipe& BHA
3:00 4:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
4:30 5:30 1.00 Make up shoe&Stab Through Intermediate Took 45 min. Due To Shoe Design
5:30 6:00 0.50 Make Up Float Collar ITIH With P-110 LTC 23#7" Csg

RECENE

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI‡ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PVfYP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Cotton seed DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Mica HRS

cAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOL1DS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSEABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTIØN LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH i Inclination / Azimuth

mKE Ñat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL SP80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REP RT
ŒASE NAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 23, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70
COTALDEPfH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 77
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

TIH W/ P-110 LTC23# 7" Csq RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Landed casing at 8031.39' 15
TIME LOG

mOM TO Hours ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 7:00 1.00 T1H. Break cir
7:00 8:00 1.00 Ream to bottom
8:00 12:00 4.00 Con. Mud to 11.4 wt.
12:00 12:30 0.50 Rip up lay down crew
12:30 18:00 5.50 Pooh laying down drill pipe
18:00 3:00 9.00 Laying down drill pipe& BHA
3:00 4:30 1.50 Rig up casing crew
4:30 5:30 1.00 Make up shoe&Stab Through Intermediate Took 45 min. Due To Shoe Design
5:30 6:00 0.50 Make Up Float Collar ITIH With P-110 LTC 23#7" Csg

RECENE

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOlLER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI‡ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PVfYP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Cotton seed DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Mica HRS

cAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $0.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOL1DS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSEABLY PUMP i ATA DEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTIØN LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH i Inclination / Azimuth

mKE Ñat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL SP80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUlüY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70

TOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRELLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hows ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Ran 7" casing / Landed casing at 8031'
16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig casing crew Irig up circ. Swedge
18:00 4:30 10.50 Conditon mud/ buildvolume to killwell
4:30 Rig up cement head /Pressure test 3500psi./ pump 20 bbis fresh water/ pump425 sks. 50/50poz
0:00 0.6:00 14.2ppg/ 1.26 yield/ 5.75 gal sk. Pump 95.1kci disp./ 224 bbis. Mud
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

st·iCE1VED

JANO2 2008

V.0FOIL,as &MiNiNG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./DemoË Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Mica HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOET $0.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
MODEL 8PSO 8P80 7316' 1.5°

GTROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUlüY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70

TOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRELLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hows ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Ran 7" casing / Landed casing at 8031'
16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig casing crew Irig up circ. Swedge
18:00 4:30 10.50 Conditon mud/ buildvolume to killwell
4:30 Rig up cement head /Pressure test 3500psi./ pump 20 bbis fresh water/ pump425 sks. 50/50poz
0:00 0.6:00 14.2ppg/ 1.26 yield/ 5.75 gal sk. Pump 95.1kci disp./ 224 bbis. Mud
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

st·iCE1VED

JANO2 2008

V.0FOIL,as &MiNiNG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./DemoË Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Mica HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOET $0.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
MODEL 8PSO 8P80 7316' 1.5°

GTROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUlüY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70

TOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRELLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hows ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Ran 7" casing / Landed casing at 8031'
16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig casing crew Irig up circ. Swedge
18:00 4:30 10.50 Conditon mud/ buildvolume to killwell
4:30 Rig up cement head /Pressure test 3500psi./ pump 20 bbis fresh water/ pump425 sks. 50/50poz
0:00 0.6:00 14.2ppg/ 1.26 yield/ 5.75 gal sk. Pump 95.1kci disp./ 224 bbis. Mud
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

st·iCE1VED

JANO2 2008

V.0FOIL,as &MiNiNG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./DemoË Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Mica HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOET $0.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
MODEL 8PSO 8P80 7316' 1.5°

GTROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 24, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUlüY STATE Days from spud
UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 70

TOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRELLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

RMCrow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hows ACTIVITY DETAIL
6:00 16:00 10.00 Ran 7" casing / Landed casing at 8031'
16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig casing crew Irig up circ. Swedge
18:00 4:30 10.50 Conditon mud/ buildvolume to killwell
4:30 Rig up cement head /Pressure test 3500psi./ pump 20 bbis fresh water/ pump425 sks. 50/50poz
0:00 0.6:00 14.2ppg/ 1.26 yield/ 5.75 gal sk. Pump 95.1kci disp./ 224 bbis. Mud
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

st·iCE1VED

JANO2 2008

V.0FOIL,as &MiNiNG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./DemoË Bbts. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Gel MFG
VIS KCL TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Cotton seed DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Mica HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOET $0.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP I ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5190 i"
MODEL 8PSO 8P80 7316' 1.5°

GTROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iÆASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack-Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV tool with 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump 2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt. 14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt.11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rig down cementers .Rig up to land pack-off in well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Houm 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USS I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS TSED BIT RECORD
DEPTE 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1T NO.

TIME 13:OÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 Caustic MFG

vIs 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA 6 Soda Ash DEPT11OUT
GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTH IN

ALK .45/f.7 Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH 1Û 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 Barite Tis/G

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL Û.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%souDs 17.00 cDMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Ñat Ñat SÄ90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO 7316' 1.5°

STRØKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iÆASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack-Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV tool with 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump 2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt. 14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt.11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rig down cementers .Rig up to land pack-off in well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Houm 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USS I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS TSED BIT RECORD
DEPTE 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1T NO.

TIME 13:OÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 Caustic MFG

vIs 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA 6 Soda Ash DEPT11OUT
GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTH IN

ALK .45/f.7 Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH 1Û 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 Barite Tis/G

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL Û.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%souDs 17.00 cDMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Ñat Ñat SÄ90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO 7316' 1.5°

STRØKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iÆASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack-Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV tool with 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump 2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt. 14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt.11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rig down cementers .Rig up to land pack-off in well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Houm 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USS I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS TSED BIT RECORD
DEPTE 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1T NO.

TIME 13:OÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 Caustic MFG

vIs 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA 6 Soda Ash DEPT11OUT
GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTH IN

ALK .45/f.7 Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH 1Û 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 Barite Tis/G

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL Û.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%souDs 17.00 cDMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Ñat Ñat SÄ90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO 7316' 1.5°

STRØKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
iÆASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack-Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV tool with 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump 2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt. 14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt.11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rig down cementers .Rig up to land pack-off in well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Houm 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USS I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demol: Bbls. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALS TSED BIT RECORD
DEPTE 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME B1T NO.

TIME 13:OÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 Caustic MFG

vIs 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA 6 Soda Ash DEPT11OUT
GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTH IN

ALK .45/f.7 Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH 1Û 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 200 Barite Tis/G

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL Û.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%souDs 17.00 cDMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP DATA DEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Ñat Ñat SÄ90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO 7316' 1.5°

STRØKE 8.50 8.50
LINERSI2E 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. F[ELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNIY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 | 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBL log |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL
Well still flowing flowing hava 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking I waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI toolhand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took toolto mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPRl NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasal TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPR1 OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TDTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA lìEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIWWION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 P
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. F[ELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNIY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 | 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBL log |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL
Well still flowing flowing hava 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking I waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI toolhand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took toolto mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPRl NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasal TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPR1 OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TDTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA lìEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIWWION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 P
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. F[ELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNIY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 | 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBL log |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL
Well still flowing flowing hava 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking I waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI toolhand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took toolto mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPRl NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasal TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPR1 OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TDTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA lìEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIWWION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 P
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. F[ELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNIY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 | 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBL log |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL
Well still flowing flowing hava 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking I waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI toolhand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took toolto mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPRl NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasal TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPR1 OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TDTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA lìEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIWWION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFrH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 P
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73

TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum RoL His FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff RMCrow/ CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT @774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H20 uE ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.

T[ME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73

TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum RoL His FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff RMCrow/ CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT @774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H20 uE ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.

T[ME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73

TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum RoL His FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff RMCrow/ CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT @774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H20 uE ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.

T[ME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73

TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum RoL His FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff RMCrow/ CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT @774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloum 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H20 uE ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.

T[ME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FF PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5790 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEFTH Rot Hrs cum Rot His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack--Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV toolwith 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt.14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt 11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rip down cementers .Rig up to land pack-offin well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME 13:ÛÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 caustic MFG

vis 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA 6 Soda Ash DEPTHOUT

GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTN IN

ALK .45//.7 sawdust TOTALFEET

pH 10 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 2oo Barite Tisis

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat b)90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEFTH Rot Hrs cum Rot His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack--Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV toolwith 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt.14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt 11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rip down cementers .Rig up to land pack-offin well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME 13:ÛÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 caustic MFG

vis 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA 6 Soda Ash DEPTHOUT

GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTN IN

ALK .45//.7 sawdust TOTALFEET

pH 10 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 2oo Barite Tisis

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat b)90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEFTH Rot Hrs cum Rot His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack--Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV toolwith 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt.14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt 11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rip down cementers .Rig up to land pack-offin well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME 13:ÛÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 caustic MFG

vis 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA 6 Soda Ash DEPTHOUT

GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTN IN

ALK .45//.7 sawdust TOTALFEET

pH 10 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 2oo Barite Tisis

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat b)90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 25, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 71
TOTALDEFTH Rot Hrs cum Rot His FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 78
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Wait on cement/ Set Pack--Off Tool |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well bore started flowing @12:00am | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Drop D.V.tool bomb
7:00 8:30 1.50 Open DV toolwith 700 to 1000psi.
8:30 12:00 3.50 Circulate 4to 6 hrs.let stage 1 set up
12:00 13:30 1.50 Rig up to pump2nd stage 475 sks.,50/50 poz.wt.14.2 ,yield 1.26 ,5.75 gal. sks. / 435sks. Hi fill type 5
13:30 18:00 4.50 wt 11, yield 3.82 / 23 gal. sks.Rip down cementers .Rig up to land pack-offin well head
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on cement / Landed pack-offtool
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE / BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hm. Mob./Demol: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8054' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME 13:ÛÛ 334 Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT 11.2 2 caustic MFG

vis 54 12 Asphasol TYPE

WL 4.2 Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP 54/18 12 Fed-Zan JET

MBT 0.13 Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA 6 Soda Ash DEPTHOUT

GELS 3/8 10 Desco DEPTN IN

ALK .45//.7 sawdust TOTALFEET

pH 10 2 Pack-r HRS

CAKE 2/32 2oo Barite Tisis

CL 51,000 DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL 0.1 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDs 17.00 cUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat b)90 1°

MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drillingcorp.Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His F()OTAGEDRILLED LAETCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBLlog |RM Crow/CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well still flowing flowing have 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking / waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI tool hand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took tool to mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hes. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT
GELS Desco DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 1°
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drillingcorp.Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His F()OTAGEDRILLED LAETCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBLlog |RM Crow/CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well still flowing flowing have 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking / waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI tool hand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took tool to mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hes. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT
GELS Desco DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 1°
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drillingcorp.Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His F()OTAGEDRILLED LAETCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBLlog |RM Crow/CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well still flowing flowing have 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking / waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI tool hand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took tool to mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hes. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT
GELS Desco DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 1°
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 26, 2007
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit Drillingcorp.Rig 132 Carbon Utah 72
TOTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His F()OTAGEDRILLED LAETCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 13.5 | 527 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 79
ACTIVITYAT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Getting ready run CBLlog |RM Crow/CECrow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Well still flowing flowing have 2 2" lines runing to resivor pit 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 18:00 12.00 Wait on cement/ pack-offtool leaking / waiting on W.S.I. well head to replace
18:00 20:30 2.50 Wait on WSI tool hand.
20:30 2:00 5.50 Trying to get pack-offtoolto set/ would not set WSI took tool to mechine shop to be mill down.
2:00 6:00 4.00 Wait on wire line truckto run CBL log to check cement to see why well want stop flowing.
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00
0:00

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 40" Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hes. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT
GELS Desco DEPTHIN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 1°
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 j 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT g 774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloms 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

¾rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTN IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 i'
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 j 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT g 774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloms 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

¾rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTN IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 i'
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 j 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT g 774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloms 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

¾rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTN IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 i'
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 27, 2007
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 73
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 13.5 527 j 139' 7" /23# /P110 8031.39 80
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on WSI wellhead to bring packoff |RM Crow/ CE Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:30 2.50 Wait on loggers
8:30 9:00 0.50 Rig up loggers/ safety meeting
9:00 11:00 2.00 Ran bond log
11:00 14:00 3.00 Ran temp. log
14:00 14:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
14:30 18:00 1.50 Change ouy 4 1/2" to 3 1/2" piperams
18:00 6:00 12.00 Wait on WSI to bring pack-offtoolfrom mechine shop
6:00
0:00

BOND LOG /TOP OF CEMENT g 774'
TEMP./CCL LOG MAXTEMP. 137.4 5 At 5699'
LOW TEMP. 70.8 AT 30'

Total Iloms 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 32" Boiler Hours 24 UP

¾rs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTN IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 5/90 i'
MODEL 8P80 8P80 7316' 1.5°

STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc.
119STennessee,Ste ÌÛ SS $Q,

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTT ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
TOTALDEPIN Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope I Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blindrams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out tool hand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow lineJlnstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

UNEIVED
JAN0&2008

DIVDF0ff
, 8AT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Causuc MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol FYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswei SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
/oSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPFH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119STennessee,Ste ÌÛ SS $Q,

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTT ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
TOTALDEPIN Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope I Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blindrams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out tool hand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow lineJlnstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

UNEIVED
JAN0&2008

DIVDF0ff
, 8AT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Causuc MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol FYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswei SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
/oSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPFH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119STennessee,Ste ÌÛ SS $Q,

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTT ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
TOTALDEPIN Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope I Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blindrams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out tool hand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow lineJlnstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

UNEIVED
JAN0&2008

DIVDF0ff
, 8AT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Causuc MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol FYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswei SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
/oSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPFH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119STennessee,Ste ÌÛ SS $Q,

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTT ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
TOTALDEPIN Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Repoit No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope I Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blindrams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out tool hand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow lineJlnstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

UNEIVED
JAN0&2008

DIVDF0ff
, 8AT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNo. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Causuc MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol FYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswei SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
/oSOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP ATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPFH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FFELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANONUMBER COUNTY KIATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | | 527 j 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTMTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL
New Annular BOP showed un at 03:30 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plugI rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer / Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

' flECEIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0FOIL,Oh &MiNING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER US iI BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP

·Irs. Mob./Demoll Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well& road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORE MUDMATERIALSJSED BIT RECOf D
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Amphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON B1T
KCL PREVIGUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCRIFFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FFELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANONUMBER COUNTY KIATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | | 527 j 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTMTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL
New Annular BOP showed un at 03:30 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plugI rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer / Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

' flECEIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0FOIL,Oh &MiNING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER US iI BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP

·Irs. Mob./Demoll Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well& road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORE MUDMATERIALSJSED BIT RECOf D
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Amphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON B1T
KCL PREVIGUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCRIFFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FFELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANONUMBER COUNTY KIATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | | 527 j 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTMTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL
New Annular BOP showed un at 03:30 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plugI rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer / Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

' flECEIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0FOIL,Oh &MiNING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER US iI BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP

·Irs. Mob./Demoll Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well& road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORE MUDMATERIALSJSED BIT RECOf D
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Amphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON B1T
KCL PREVIGUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCRIFFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELLNO. FFELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANONUMBER COUNTY KIATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | | 527 j 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTMTYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE |Richard L Tatman
REMARKS KB TO GL
New Annular BOP showed un at 03:30 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plugI rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer / Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

' flECEIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0FOIL,Oh &MiNING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER US iI BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP

·Irs. Mob./Demoll Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H20 ut ad on well& road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORE MUDMATERIALSJSED BIT RECOf D
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Amphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON B1T
KCL PREVIGUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE WBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC )RD
NO. DESCRIFFION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 2 DEPTH IncHnation / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 31, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE cays from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 77
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' j 527 | 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 84
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKs Niple up Went slow as hell Due to Short handed crew and we had to wait on some ring gaskets asToet

The set i had on Hand Got ciushed by the Hands when they Put then in wrong. | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Finish Cement job.
7:00 11:00 4.00 Wait on cement / Finish cleaning Tanks.
11:00 15:00 4.00 Nipple down "B" section / Start Stacking BOPE.
15:00 20:00 5.00 Wait on Nipple Up crew and / New API Ring Gaskets for Hydrill
20:00 5:30 9.50 Nipple up and tightendown BOPE
5:30 6:00 6.00 Rig up Bop Testers.

DECCIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0F0lL,üAS&MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

His. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 i Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTTI NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEEGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

IPV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON HET

IKCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

muœ Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8P80
SFROKE 8.50 8.50
uNER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 31, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE cays from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 77
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' j 527 | 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 84
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKs Niple up Went slow as hell Due to Short handed crew and we had to wait on some ring gaskets asToet

The set i had on Hand Got ciushed by the Hands when they Put then in wrong. | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Finish Cement job.
7:00 11:00 4.00 Wait on cement / Finish cleaning Tanks.
11:00 15:00 4.00 Nipple down "B" section / Start Stacking BOPE.
15:00 20:00 5.00 Wait on Nipple Up crew and / New API Ring Gaskets for Hydrill
20:00 5:30 9.50 Nipple up and tightendown BOPE
5:30 6:00 6.00 Rig up Bop Testers.

DECCIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0F0lL,üAS&MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

His. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 i Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTTI NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEEGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

IPV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON HET

IKCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

muœ Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8P80
SFROKE 8.50 8.50
uNER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 31, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE cays from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 77
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' j 527 | 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 84
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKs Niple up Went slow as hell Due to Short handed crew and we had to wait on some ring gaskets asToet

The set i had on Hand Got ciushed by the Hands when they Put then in wrong. | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Finish Cement job.
7:00 11:00 4.00 Wait on cement / Finish cleaning Tanks.
11:00 15:00 4.00 Nipple down "B" section / Start Stacking BOPE.
15:00 20:00 5.00 Wait on Nipple Up crew and / New API Ring Gaskets for Hydrill
20:00 5:30 9.50 Nipple up and tightendown BOPE
5:30 6:00 6.00 Rig up Bop Testers.

DECCIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0F0lL,üAS&MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

His. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 i Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTTI NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEEGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

IPV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON HET

IKCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

muœ Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8P80
SFROKE 8.50 8.50
uNER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 31, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE cays from spud

UnitDrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 77
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs tum Rot. Hrs FOCTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' j 527 | 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 84
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKs Niple up Went slow as hell Due to Short handed crew and we had to wait on some ring gaskets asToet

The set i had on Hand Got ciushed by the Hands when they Put then in wrong. | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Finish Cement job.
7:00 11:00 4.00 Wait on cement / Finish cleaning Tanks.
11:00 15:00 4.00 Nipple down "B" section / Start Stacking BOPE.
15:00 20:00 5.00 Wait on Nipple Up crew and / New API Ring Gaskets for Hydrill
20:00 5:30 9.50 Nipple up and tightendown BOPE
5:30 6:00 6.00 Rig up Bop Testers.

DECCIVED
JAN04 2008

DIV.0F0lL,üAS&MINING
Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT

His. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 i Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEFTTI NO.OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEEGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

IPV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIALNO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT.ON HET

IKCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

muœ Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8PSO 8P80
SFROKE 8.50 8.50
uNER SIZE 6.25 6.25
sPM



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
LFASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 30, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNT( 500E Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 76
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 83
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on cement |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

ft took 1740 Psi to inject into casing annulas 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 Wait on Well head componants to be milled and Delivered to location.I Nipple down BOPE to set B section
22:30 16.50 Nipple down stack and unstack BOP Componants, Blow out mud lines clean tanks.

22:30 0:00 1.50 Install Pack off in well head and Nipple up "B" section on well head.
0:00 Rig up Supirior Cement Truck and Try to Pump into well bore with 1150 Psi, Could not inject. Called for

Authorization for Higher pressureand Started injecting water Into Casing annulas On well head Bulheaded in
6:00 6.00 20 BBI at 1735 Psi Start in with cement. @ 3 bpm and 1740 psi.

RFCFIVED
JANO4 2008

MyOFDIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 900 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV)YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFIN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTE IN

ALK Sawdust FOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC)RD

NO. DESCRIPTION UENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination | Azimuth
MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
LFASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 30, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNT( 500E Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 76
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 83
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on cement |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

ft took 1740 Psi to inject into casing annulas 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 Wait on Well head componants to be milled and Delivered to location.I Nipple down BOPE to set B section
22:30 16.50 Nipple down stack and unstack BOP Componants, Blow out mud lines clean tanks.

22:30 0:00 1.50 Install Pack off in well head and Nipple up "B" section on well head.
0:00 Rig up Supirior Cement Truck and Try to Pump into well bore with 1150 Psi, Could not inject. Called for

Authorization for Higher pressureand Started injecting water Into Casing annulas On well head Bulheaded in
6:00 6.00 20 BBI at 1735 Psi Start in with cement. @ 3 bpm and 1740 psi.

RFCFIVED
JANO4 2008

MyOFDIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 900 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV)YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFIN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTE IN

ALK Sawdust FOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC)RD

NO. DESCRIPTION UENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination | Azimuth
MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
LFASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 30, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNT( 500E Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 76
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 83
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on cement |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

ft took 1740 Psi to inject into casing annulas 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 Wait on Well head componants to be milled and Delivered to location.I Nipple down BOPE to set B section
22:30 16.50 Nipple down stack and unstack BOP Componants, Blow out mud lines clean tanks.

22:30 0:00 1.50 Install Pack off in well head and Nipple up "B" section on well head.
0:00 Rig up Supirior Cement Truck and Try to Pump into well bore with 1150 Psi, Could not inject. Called for

Authorization for Higher pressureand Started injecting water Into Casing annulas On well head Bulheaded in
6:00 6.00 20 BBI at 1735 Psi Start in with cement. @ 3 bpm and 1740 psi.

RFCFIVED
JANO4 2008

MyOFDIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 900 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV)YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFIN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTE IN

ALK Sawdust FOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC)RD

NO. DESCRIPTION UENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination | Azimuth
MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT
LFASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 30, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNT( 500E Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 76
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 83
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Waiting on cement |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

ft took 1740 Psi to inject into casing annulas 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 Wait on Well head componants to be milled and Delivered to location.I Nipple down BOPE to set B section
22:30 16.50 Nipple down stack and unstack BOP Componants, Blow out mud lines clean tanks.

22:30 0:00 1.50 Install Pack off in well head and Nipple up "B" section on well head.
0:00 Rig up Supirior Cement Truck and Try to Pump into well bore with 1150 Psi, Could not inject. Called for

Authorization for Higher pressureand Started injecting water Into Casing annulas On well head Bulheaded in
6:00 6.00 20 BBI at 1735 Psi Start in with cement. @ 3 bpm and 1740 psi.

RFCFIVED
JANO4 2008

MyOFDIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 900 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV)YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFIN OUT

GELS Desco DEFTE IN

ALK Sawdust FOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)
DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC)RD

NO. DESCRIPTION UENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEFTH Inclination | Azimuth
MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 29, 2007
IRIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 75
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 82
ACHVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Waitingon Well Head components |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Trying to instal the B section to Bullhead cement. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Continue to tryto get packoff to seal under pressure.
8:00 9:00 1.00 Rig down BOP tester.
9:00 12:00 3.00 Nipple down Bope and Flow line.
12:00 15:00 3.00 Retrive Pack off out of Well head and Try to clean out and reset a New Pack off.
15:00 Nipple down BOPE and Try to install Pack-off and B-section / The Casing landing mandrel is wrong for the

6:00 15.00 well head so non of these partwill work. I Wait on new componants to come from WSI in Farmington.

RECEIVED
JANOle 2000

DIV.Ol-UIL,UA&&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 895 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Irs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALS USED B1T RECORD
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS , Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP JATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPAÛ SPSÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 29, 2007
IRIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 75
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 82
ACHVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Waitingon Well Head components |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Trying to instal the B section to Bullhead cement. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Continue to tryto get packoff to seal under pressure.
8:00 9:00 1.00 Rig down BOP tester.
9:00 12:00 3.00 Nipple down Bope and Flow line.
12:00 15:00 3.00 Retrive Pack off out of Well head and Try to clean out and reset a New Pack off.
15:00 Nipple down BOPE and Try to install Pack-off and B-section / The Casing landing mandrel is wrong for the

6:00 15.00 well head so non of these partwill work. I Wait on new componants to come from WSI in Farmington.

RECEIVED
JANOle 2000

DIV.Ol-UIL,UA&&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 895 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Irs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALS USED B1T RECORD
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS , Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP JATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPAÛ SPSÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 29, 2007
IRIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 75
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 82
ACHVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Waitingon Well Head components |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Trying to instal the B section to Bullhead cement. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Continue to tryto get packoff to seal under pressure.
8:00 9:00 1.00 Rig down BOP tester.
9:00 12:00 3.00 Nipple down Bope and Flow line.
12:00 15:00 3.00 Retrive Pack off out of Well head and Try to clean out and reset a New Pack off.
15:00 Nipple down BOPE and Try to install Pack-off and B-section / The Casing landing mandrel is wrong for the

6:00 15.00 well head so non of these partwill work. I Wait on new componants to come from WSI in Farmington.

RECEIVED
JANOle 2000

DIV.Ol-UIL,UA&&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 895 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Irs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALS USED B1T RECORD
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS , Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP JATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPAÛ SPSÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 29, 2007
IRIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 75
TOTALDEPTH Rot His cumRot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 82
ACHVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Waitingon Well Head components |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Trying to instal the B section to Bullhead cement. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Continue to tryto get packoff to seal under pressure.
8:00 9:00 1.00 Rig down BOP tester.
9:00 12:00 3.00 Nipple down Bope and Flow line.
12:00 15:00 3.00 Retrive Pack off out of Well head and Try to clean out and reset a New Pack off.
15:00 Nipple down BOPE and Try to install Pack-off and B-section / The Casing landing mandrel is wrong for the

6:00 15.00 well head so non of these partwill work. I Wait on new componants to come from WSI in Farmington.

RECEIVED
JANOle 2000

DIV.Ol-UIL,UA&&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 895 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP
Irs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD IECORD MUD MATERIALS USED B1T RECORD
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS , Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan 3ET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEFTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP JATA DEVIATION REC)RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPAÛ SPSÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ILEASENAME& WELLNO. FEELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNlY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 74
rOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 81
ACTIVITY ATREPORYTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Having troublegetting Pack off assembly to seal. 15
. TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 11:00 5.00 Set Pack off in well head.
11:00 18:00 7.00 Set new BHA on pipe racks I Sort Pipe.
18:00 22:00 4.00 Change out Kelly with 4 1/4" (3 1/4" IF)
22:00 0:00 2.00 Wait on BoP Tester
0:00 Test Kelly and Full open safety valves as well as inside BOP valve to 300 Low and 3000 high. Try to get

6:00 6.00 Pack offto seal under pressure.

gt-CENED

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1200 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP

His. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT PoNyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPHi OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION ŒNGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuth

MANE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ILEASENAME& WELLNO. FEELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNlY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 74
rOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 81
ACTIVITY ATREPORYTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Having troublegetting Pack off assembly to seal. 15
. TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 11:00 5.00 Set Pack off in well head.
11:00 18:00 7.00 Set new BHA on pipe racks I Sort Pipe.
18:00 22:00 4.00 Change out Kelly with 4 1/4" (3 1/4" IF)
22:00 0:00 2.00 Wait on BoP Tester
0:00 Test Kelly and Full open safety valves as well as inside BOP valve to 300 Low and 3000 high. Try to get

6:00 6.00 Pack offto seal under pressure.

gt-CENED

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1200 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP

His. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT PoNyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPHi OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION ŒNGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuth

MANE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ILEASENAME& WELLNO. FEELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNlY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 74
rOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 81
ACTIVITY ATREPORYTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Having troublegetting Pack off assembly to seal. 15
. TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 11:00 5.00 Set Pack off in well head.
11:00 18:00 7.00 Set new BHA on pipe racks I Sort Pipe.
18:00 22:00 4.00 Change out Kelly with 4 1/4" (3 1/4" IF)
22:00 0:00 2.00 Wait on BoP Tester
0:00 Test Kelly and Full open safety valves as well as inside BOP valve to 300 Low and 3000 high. Try to get

6:00 6.00 Pack offto seal under pressure.

gt-CENED

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1200 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP

His. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT PoNyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPHi OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION ŒNGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuth

MANE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
ILEASENAME& WELLNO. FEELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth December 28, 2007
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNlY 5TATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 74
rOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. His FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 81
ACTIVITY ATREPORYTIME REPORTEDBY

Testing BOPE Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL.

Having troublegetting Pack off assembly to seal. 15
. TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 11:00 5.00 Set Pack off in well head.
11:00 18:00 7.00 Set new BHA on pipe racks I Sort Pipe.
18:00 22:00 4.00 Change out Kelly with 4 1/4" (3 1/4" IF)
22:00 0:00 2.00 Wait on BoP Tester
0:00 Test Kelly and Full open safety valves as well as inside BOP valve to 300 Low and 3000 high. Try to get

6:00 6.00 Pack offto seal under pressure.

gt-CENED

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL ANDWATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 1200 gallons Boiler Hours 24 UP

His. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT PoNyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPHi OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA MEVIATIONREC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION ŒNGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination | Azimuth

MANE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8PSO
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
SPM



Marion Energy inc. 7~/35 R/of s-¾
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 3 Ÿ~3 | Ÿ
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 8, 2008
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 85
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum RoL Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 92
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

|Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 8:00 2.00 Lay down SS/BS/ Bit . Rig up wire line loggers
8:00 13;00 5.00 Logging hole
13;00 13:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
13:30 15:30 2.00 T.I.H./ with BHA
15:30 18:00 2.50 Rig up lay down crew .Lay down BHA
18:00 18:30 0.50 Lay down BHA
18:30 20:00 1.50 Fixed fast line on lay down truck

20;00 21:30 1.50 Moved collars off piperacks I putcasing & 25 jts.31/2drill pipe
21:30 6:00 8.50 Run 51/2"

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O uE 3d on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFC

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN RFC
¯\Vt-D

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS RNi 4 EN
CAKE KCL T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT DDI OFOILGAS&MINING
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. 7~/35 R/of s-¾
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 3 Ÿ~3 | Ÿ
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 8, 2008
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 85
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum RoL Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 92
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

|Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 8:00 2.00 Lay down SS/BS/ Bit . Rig up wire line loggers
8:00 13;00 5.00 Logging hole
13;00 13:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
13:30 15:30 2.00 T.I.H./ with BHA
15:30 18:00 2.50 Rig up lay down crew .Lay down BHA
18:00 18:30 0.50 Lay down BHA
18:30 20:00 1.50 Fixed fast line on lay down truck

20;00 21:30 1.50 Moved collars off piperacks I putcasing & 25 jts.31/2drill pipe
21:30 6:00 8.50 Run 51/2"

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O uE 3d on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFC

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN RFC
¯\Vt-D

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS RNi 4 EN
CAKE KCL T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT DDI OFOILGAS&MINING
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. 7~/35 R/of s-¾
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 3 Ÿ~3 | Ÿ
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 8, 2008
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 85
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum RoL Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 92
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

|Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 8:00 2.00 Lay down SS/BS/ Bit . Rig up wire line loggers
8:00 13;00 5.00 Logging hole
13;00 13:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
13:30 15:30 2.00 T.I.H./ with BHA
15:30 18:00 2.50 Rig up lay down crew .Lay down BHA
18:00 18:30 0.50 Lay down BHA
18:30 20:00 1.50 Fixed fast line on lay down truck

20;00 21:30 1.50 Moved collars off piperacks I putcasing & 25 jts.31/2drill pipe
21:30 6:00 8.50 Run 51/2"

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O uE 3d on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFC

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN RFC
¯\Vt-D

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS RNi 4 EN
CAKE KCL T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT DDI OFOILGAS&MINING
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. 7~/35 R/of s-¾
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069 3 Ÿ~3 | Ÿ
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 8, 2008
RIG NAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 85
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum RoL Hrs FOGTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 92
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

|Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 8:00 2.00 Lay down SS/BS/ Bit . Rig up wire line loggers
8:00 13;00 5.00 Logging hole
13;00 13:30 0.50 Rig down loggers
13:30 15:30 2.00 T.I.H./ with BHA
15:30 18:00 2.50 Rig up lay down crew .Lay down BHA
18:00 18:30 0.50 Lay down BHA
18:30 20:00 1.50 Fixed fast line on lay down truck

20;00 21:30 1.50 Moved collars off piperacks I putcasing & 25 jts.31/2drill pipe
21:30 6:00 8.50 Run 51/2"

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTAL DAYWORE 24.00 Total H2O uE 3d on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD tECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFC

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN RFC
¯\Vt-D

ALK Sawdust TOTALFEET

pH Pack-r HRS RNi 4 EN
CAKE KCL T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT DDI OFOILGAS&MINING
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51



Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO- FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 7, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 84
TOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 91
ACTIVfTY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip out hole / for logs |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL
Rig Repair Throttle Controls an Draworks. 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.50 Trip in hole to cir. Bottoms up
7:00 9:30 2.50 Cut 144' drilling line
9:30 10:30 1.00 TI II H
10:30 12:00 1.50 Break circ.
12:00 18:00 6.00 Rig repair I code 8
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rig repair I code 8
22:00 22:30 0.05 Reaming F/8500' TI 8524;
22:30 6:00 7.50 Trip oit hole for logs

RECEIVED
JAN1 fi 2008

DIV.0fOlL,ûAD&MlldlldG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 10.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN 14.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 Caustic MFG Smith Smith
vis 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP N/C Fed-Zan JET open open
MBT N/C Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C KCL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%sot10s N/C cUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO- FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 7, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 84
TOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 91
ACTIVfTY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip out hole / for logs |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL
Rig Repair Throttle Controls an Draworks. 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.50 Trip in hole to cir. Bottoms up
7:00 9:30 2.50 Cut 144' drilling line
9:30 10:30 1.00 TI II H
10:30 12:00 1.50 Break circ.
12:00 18:00 6.00 Rig repair I code 8
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rig repair I code 8
22:00 22:30 0.05 Reaming F/8500' TI 8524;
22:30 6:00 7.50 Trip oit hole for logs

RECEIVED
JAN1 fi 2008

DIV.0fOlL,ûAD&MlldlldG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 10.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN 14.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 Caustic MFG Smith Smith
vis 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP N/C Fed-Zan JET open open
MBT N/C Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C KCL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%sot10s N/C cUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO- FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 7, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 84
TOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 91
ACTIVfTY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip out hole / for logs |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL
Rig Repair Throttle Controls an Draworks. 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.50 Trip in hole to cir. Bottoms up
7:00 9:30 2.50 Cut 144' drilling line
9:30 10:30 1.00 TI II H
10:30 12:00 1.50 Break circ.
12:00 18:00 6.00 Rig repair I code 8
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rig repair I code 8
22:00 22:30 0.05 Reaming F/8500' TI 8524;
22:30 6:00 7.50 Trip oit hole for logs

RECEIVED
JAN1 fi 2008

DIV.0fOlL,ûAD&MlldlldG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 10.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN 14.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 Caustic MFG Smith Smith
vis 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP N/C Fed-Zan JET open open
MBT N/C Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C KCL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%sot10s N/C cUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME& WELL NO- FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 7, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 84
TOTAL DEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 91
ACTIVfTY ATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip out hole / for logs |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL
Rig Repair Throttle Controls an Draworks. 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.50 Trip in hole to cir. Bottoms up
7:00 9:30 2.50 Cut 144' drilling line
9:30 10:30 1.00 TI II H
10:30 12:00 1.50 Break circ.
12:00 18:00 6.00 Rig repair I code 8
18:00 22:00 4.00 Rig repair I code 8
22:00 22:30 0.05 Reaming F/8500' TI 8524;
22:30 6:00 7.50 Trip oit hole for logs

RECEIVED
JAN1 fi 2008

DIV.0fOlL,ûAD&MlldlldG

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 10.00 FUEL USED 820 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORN 14.00 Total H2O usad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD lECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 Caustic MFG Smith Smith
vis 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP N/C Fed-Zan JET open open
MBT N/C Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C KCL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%sot10s N/C cUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51



Marion Energy inc. y aos a y119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 6, 2008
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillinqCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 83
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 90
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole for wiper trip/To log |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Homs

6:00 9:00 3.00 Actual Drill F/8490' TI 8524'
9:00 14:00 5.00 Cir. Drilling soap out mud.
14:00 18:00 4.00 Mud motor quit/Trip out hole
18:00 23:30 5.50 Trip out of hole/ lay down mud motor
23:30 6:00 6.50 Make up bit trip in hole to clean bottom of hole
6:00
0:00

RECEIVbu
JANl 4 20uu

DIV.Ul·UIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 820 Boller Hours 24 UP 148,000

Mrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 22.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 caustic MFG Smith Smith
vIs 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open Open

MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEPTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C 35 KcL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT. ON Brr 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. y aos a y119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 6, 2008
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillinqCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 83
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 90
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole for wiper trip/To log |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Homs

6:00 9:00 3.00 Actual Drill F/8490' TI 8524'
9:00 14:00 5.00 Cir. Drilling soap out mud.
14:00 18:00 4.00 Mud motor quit/Trip out hole
18:00 23:30 5.50 Trip out of hole/ lay down mud motor
23:30 6:00 6.50 Make up bit trip in hole to clean bottom of hole
6:00
0:00

RECEIVbu
JANl 4 20uu

DIV.Ul·UIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 820 Boller Hours 24 UP 148,000

Mrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 22.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 caustic MFG Smith Smith
vIs 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open Open

MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEPTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C 35 KcL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT. ON Brr 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. y aos a y119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 6, 2008
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillinqCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 83
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 90
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole for wiper trip/To log |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Homs

6:00 9:00 3.00 Actual Drill F/8490' TI 8524'
9:00 14:00 5.00 Cir. Drilling soap out mud.
14:00 18:00 4.00 Mud motor quit/Trip out hole
18:00 23:30 5.50 Trip out of hole/ lay down mud motor
23:30 6:00 6.50 Make up bit trip in hole to clean bottom of hole
6:00
0:00

RECEIVbu
JANl 4 20uu

DIV.Ul·UIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 820 Boller Hours 24 UP 148,000

Mrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 22.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 caustic MFG Smith Smith
vIs 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open Open

MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEPTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C 35 KcL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT. ON Brr 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. y aos a y119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 6, 2008
RIG NAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud

Unit DrillinqCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 83
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 29 | 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 90
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Trip in hole for wiper trip/To log |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Homs

6:00 9:00 3.00 Actual Drill F/8490' TI 8524'
9:00 14:00 5.00 Cir. Drilling soap out mud.
14:00 18:00 4.00 Mud motor quit/Trip out hole
18:00 23:30 5.50 Trip out of hole/ lay down mud motor
23:30 6:00 6.50 Make up bit trip in hole to clean bottom of hole
6:00
0:00

RECEIVbu
JANl 4 20uu

DIV.Ul·UIL,GAS&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 820 Boller Hours 24 UP 148,000

Mrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORit 22.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN 8524' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BIT No. 14 15
TIME 16:00 Duragel SIZE 6 1/4 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.7 caustic MFG Smith Smith
vIs 29 Asphasol TYPE XR-40 XR40Y
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open Open

MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044 PH1853
cA N/C Soda Ash DEPTH OUT 8524
GELs N/C Desco DEPTH IN 8085' 8524
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET 439'
pH 8.5 Pack-r HRs 29.00
CAKE N/C 35 KcL T/B/G

CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT. ON Brr 10/15k
KCL 5.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM 60
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph) 0.3

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51



Marion Energy inc. L¡y -oo
9-ara79

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 5, 2008
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 82
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 89
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 7:30 1.50 Actual Drill F/ 8173 TI 8184'
7:30 9:30 2.00 code 8 / both pumpsdown
9:30 18:00 8.50 Actual Drill FI 8184 TI 8285'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Actual drill FI 8285 TI 8490;63
6:00
0:00
0:00

REChlVt-u
JAN14 2005

DW.0EDIL,GAS&MINING

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 63" Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 128,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEP m 8190' NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 14
TIME 1Û:ÛO Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.6 caustic MFG Smith
vis 27 Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA N/C Soda Ash DEFTH OUT
GELS N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085'
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH 8 Pack-r HRS
CAKE N/C 35 KCL T/B/G
CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT.ONBIT
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 B1T 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. L¡y -oo
9-ara79

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 5, 2008
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 82
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 89
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 7:30 1.50 Actual Drill F/ 8173 TI 8184'
7:30 9:30 2.00 code 8 / both pumpsdown
9:30 18:00 8.50 Actual Drill FI 8184 TI 8285'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Actual drill FI 8285 TI 8490;63
6:00
0:00
0:00

REChlVt-u
JAN14 2005

DW.0EDIL,GAS&MINING

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 63" Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 128,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEP m 8190' NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 14
TIME 1Û:ÛO Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.6 caustic MFG Smith
vis 27 Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA N/C Soda Ash DEFTH OUT
GELS N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085'
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH 8 Pack-r HRS
CAKE N/C 35 KCL T/B/G
CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT.ONBIT
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 B1T 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. L¡y -oo
9-ara79

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 5, 2008
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 82
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 89
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 7:30 1.50 Actual Drill F/ 8173 TI 8184'
7:30 9:30 2.00 code 8 / both pumpsdown
9:30 18:00 8.50 Actual Drill FI 8184 TI 8285'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Actual drill FI 8285 TI 8490;63
6:00
0:00
0:00

REChlVt-u

JAN14 2005
DW.0EDIL,GAS&MINING

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 63" Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 128,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEP m 8190' NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 14
TIME 1Û:ÛO Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.6 caustic MFG Smith
vis 27 Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA N/C Soda Ash DEFTH OUT
GELS N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085'
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH 8 Pack-r HRS
CAKE N/C 35 KCL T/B/G
CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT.ONBIT
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 B1T 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. L¡y -oo
9-ara79

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME & WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 5, 2008
RIGNAME ANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 82
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASING SIZE,WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 89
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. |Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houm

6:00 7:30 1.50 Actual Drill F/ 8173 TI 8184'
7:30 9:30 2.00 code 8 / both pumpsdown
9:30 18:00 8.50 Actual Drill FI 8184 TI 8285'
18:00 6:00 12.00 Actual drill FI 8285 TI 8490;63
6:00
0:00
0:00

REChlVt-u

JAN14 2005
DW.0EDIL,GAS&MINING

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 2.00 FUEL USED 63" Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN 128,000
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 22.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUDMATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEP m 8190' NO.OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 14
TIME 1Û:ÛO Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT 8.6 caustic MFG Smith
vis 27 Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL N/C Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP N/C 4 Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT N/C 1 Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA N/C Soda Ash DEFTH OUT
GELS N/C Desco DEFTH IN 8085'
ALK N/C 10 Sawdust TOTALFEET
pH 8 Pack-r HRS
CAKE N/C 35 KCL T/B/G
CL N/C DAILYCOST $2,021.00 WT.ONBIT
KCL 8.0 PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDs N/C CUMULATIVECOST $570,025.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth
1 B1T 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP 787.81 LINERSIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51



Marion Energy inc. s-oo?-- 3/wÿ
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 4, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 81
FOTAL DEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED IÆT CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET® Repod No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 88
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Con. Mud & cir.. Build volume
7:00 7:30 0.50 Reaming FI 5659 T/ 5707'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Set kelly back blow down
8:00 11:30 3.50 Pick up pipelReam F/5697' TI 5770'
11:30 Pick up pipe/Build volume in pits/ shoe @8062' waiting to drill out untillvoulme is @400 Bbls.
0:00 18:00 6.50 Thawing out gas buster/ U-2 line is frozen
18:00 19:30 1.50 Thawing out gas buster I change out shaker screens
19:30 20:00 0.50 Drill out cement & shoe /8062' T/8096'
20:00 2:30 6.50 Actural drill FI 8096' T/ 8173' Lost cir.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Building volume /mixing Fed-zan/ saw dust

DECEIVED
JAN13 2008

DIVOF01L,GAS&MIMNG

Total Ilours FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 854 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 520 0 Out DOWN 128,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O ut ad on well & road 475 Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. s-oo?-- 3/wÿ
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 4, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 81
FOTAL DEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED IÆT CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET® Repod No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 88
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Con. Mud & cir.. Build volume
7:00 7:30 0.50 Reaming FI 5659 T/ 5707'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Set kelly back blow down
8:00 11:30 3.50 Pick up pipelReam F/5697' TI 5770'
11:30 Pick up pipe/Build volume in pits/ shoe @8062' waiting to drill out untillvoulme is @400 Bbls.
0:00 18:00 6.50 Thawing out gas buster/ U-2 line is frozen
18:00 19:30 1.50 Thawing out gas buster I change out shaker screens
19:30 20:00 0.50 Drill out cement & shoe /8062' T/8096'
20:00 2:30 6.50 Actural drill FI 8096' T/ 8173' Lost cir.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Building volume /mixing Fed-zan/ saw dust

DECEIVED
JAN13 2008

DIVOF01L,GAS&MIMNG

Total Ilours FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 854 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 520 0 Out DOWN 128,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O ut ad on well & road 475 Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. s-oo?-- 3/wÿ
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 4, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 81
FOTAL DEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED IÆT CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET® Repod No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 88
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Con. Mud & cir.. Build volume
7:00 7:30 0.50 Reaming FI 5659 T/ 5707'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Set kelly back blow down
8:00 11:30 3.50 Pick up pipelReam F/5697' TI 5770'
11:30 Pick up pipe/Build volume in pits/ shoe @8062' waiting to drill out untillvoulme is @400 Bbls.
0:00 18:00 6.50 Thawing out gas buster/ U-2 line is frozen
18:00 19:30 1.50 Thawing out gas buster I change out shaker screens
19:30 20:00 0.50 Drill out cement & shoe /8062' T/8096'
20:00 2:30 6.50 Actural drill FI 8096' T/ 8173' Lost cir.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Building volume /mixing Fed-zan/ saw dust

DECEIVED
JAN13 2008

DIVOF01L,GAS&MIMNG

Total Ilours FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 854 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 520 0 Out DOWN 128,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O ut ad on well & road 475 Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51

Marion Energy inc. s-oo?-- 3/wÿ
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 4, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 81
FOTAL DEPTH Rot. HIS cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED IÆT CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET® Repod No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 88
ACTIVITY ATREPORTTIME REPORTED BY

Actural DrillWith Some Lost Cir. Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTOGL.

15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 7:00 1.00 Con. Mud & cir.. Build volume
7:00 7:30 0.50 Reaming FI 5659 T/ 5707'
7:30 8:00 0.50 Set kelly back blow down
8:00 11:30 3.50 Pick up pipelReam F/5697' TI 5770'
11:30 Pick up pipe/Build volume in pits/ shoe @8062' waiting to drill out untillvoulme is @400 Bbls.
0:00 18:00 6.50 Thawing out gas buster/ U-2 line is frozen
18:00 19:30 1.50 Thawing out gas buster I change out shaker screens
19:30 20:00 0.50 Drill out cement & shoe /8062' T/8096'
20:00 2:30 6.50 Actural drill FI 8096' T/ 8173' Lost cir.
2:30 6:00 3.50 Building volume /mixing Fed-zan/ saw dust

DECEIVED
JAN13 2008

DIVOF01L,GAS&MIMNG

Total Ilours FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 854 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 520 0 Out DOWN 128,000
FOTAL DAYWORI¢ Total H2O ut ad on well & road 475 Barrels ROTATE 60

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40
WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST WT. ON BIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE dBLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

1 BIT 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

1 MUDMOTOR 29.90 MODEL 8P80 8P80
1 SHOCKSUB 9.14 STROKE 8.50 8.50

26 HWDP LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 JARS 29.51



Marion Energy inc. Ys- 9-3/g
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME &WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 3, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 80

TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 87
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Taqqed stage collarpreparingto circulate. |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Rig on down time @ 21:30 F lling Pit with Kcl Water / All 4" hoses froze up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 14:00 8.00 Pick up Drill Pipe Run in hole
14:00 15:00 1.00 Lubricate rig
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig repairs / Weld on Rig floor fix Stand pipeand Make up chain box.
16:00 18:30 2.50 Pick up Drill Pipe Run in hole
18:30 21:30 3.00 Fill Mud tanks with KCL water and get ready to circulate.
21:30 4:00 6.50 Re assemble circulating system Gel gates Thaw out frozen lines and kelly
4:00 6:00 9.00 Circulate and mix KCL water

RECEIVED
JAN1 li 2008

DIVOFOlL,CIT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 847 Boiter Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ur ed on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc. Ys- 9-3/g
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME &WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 3, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 80

TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 87
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Taqqed stage collarpreparingto circulate. |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Rig on down time @ 21:30 F lling Pit with Kcl Water / All 4" hoses froze up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 14:00 8.00 Pick up Drill Pipe Run in hole
14:00 15:00 1.00 Lubricate rig
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig repairs / Weld on Rig floor fix Stand pipeand Make up chain box.
16:00 18:30 2.50 Pick up Drill Pipe Run in hole
18:30 21:30 3.00 Fill Mud tanks with KCL water and get ready to circulate.
21:30 4:00 6.50 Re assemble circulating system Gel gates Thaw out frozen lines and kelly
4:00 6:00 9.00 Circulate and mix KCL water

RECEIVED
JAN1 li 2008

DIVOFOlL,CIT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 847 Boiter Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ur ed on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc. Ys- 9-3/g
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME &WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 3, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 80

TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED lAST CASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET @ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 87
ACTIVITYATREPORT TIME REPORTEDBY

Taqqed stage collarpreparingto circulate. |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTO GL.

Rig on down time @ 21:30 F lling Pit with Kcl Water / All 4" hoses froze up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 14:00 8.00 Pick up Drill Pipe Run in hole
14:00 15:00 1.00 Lubricate rig
15:00 16:00 1.00 Rig repairs / Weld on Rig floor fix Stand pipeand Make up chain box.
16:00 18:30 2.50 Pick up Drill Pipe Run in hole
18:30 21:30 3.00 Fill Mud tanks with KCL water and get ready to circulate.
21:30 4:00 6.50 Re assemble circulating system Gel gates Thaw out frozen lines and kelly
4:00 6:00 9.00 Circulate and mix KCL water

RECEIVED
JAN1 li 2008

DIVOFOlL,CIT&MINING

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 847 Boiter Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTALDAYWORK 24.00 Total H2O ur ed on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD (ECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smith
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL No. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25



Marion Energy inc. ys- oc sig
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth 3anuary 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope / Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blind rams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out toolhand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow line.IInstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

REChlVED
JAN1&2008

DIV.0P0lt,GAS&MININA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smitti
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPSÛ ÛPÛÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc. ys- oc sig
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth 3anuary 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope / Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blind rams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out toolhand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow line.IInstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

REChlVED
JAN1&2008

DIV.0P0lt,GAS&MININA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smitti
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPSÛ ÛPÛÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc. ys- oc sig
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth 3anuary 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope / Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blind rams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out toolhand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow line.IInstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

REChlVED
JAN1&2008

DIV.0P0lt,GAS&MININA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smitti
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPSÛ ÛPÛÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy inc. ys- oc sig
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth 3anuary 2, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY ETATE Days from spud

Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 79
COTALDEFTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 86
ACTIVITY AT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Picking up pipe@ 1609', workingon pipespinner Richard LTatman
REMARKS KBTOGL

Progress is slow with Drill string pick up. 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Hours

6:00 8:00 2.00 Nipple Up Annular Preventer
8:00 Test Bope / Pressure test Annular to 250 low and 1500 psi High for 30 min. / Test Blind rams at 250 low

12:30 4.50 and 3000 Psi high for 30 minutes. Finish testing last set of Coke valves.
12:30 13:30 1.00 Retrive Brige Plug and load out toolhand.
13:30 20:00 6.50 Pull Rotary Table / Nipple up Rotating head and flow line.IInstall Rotary table.
20:00 21:00 1.00 Rig up Laydown Machine. I Safety meeting.
21:00 6:00 9.00 Pick up Mud motor and Shock sub / trip in hole to 1609' Pick up Pipe.

REChlVED
JAN1&2008

DIV.0P0lt,GAS&MININA

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hm. Rig Repair FUEL USED 937 Boiler Hours 24 UP

Hrs. Mob./Demoh Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours O Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O ur ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS JSED BIT RECOF D
DEPTH NO. OFSACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT No. 14
TIME Duragel SIZE 6 1/4
WEIGHT Caustic MFG Smitti
VIS Asphasol TYPE XR-40

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET Open

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO. PG7044
CA Soda Ash DEPTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN 8085'
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM

%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPSÛ ÛPÛÛ
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25



Marion Energy mc. yzyy119 S Tennessee, Ste /
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rip 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testinq BOPE |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

New Annular BOP showed up at 03:3o | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houn

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plug/ rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer/ Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

REC VED
MN142888

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS
UNOFOIL,CAggg

Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUSCOST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPBÛ 8Ÿ8Û
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy mc. yzyy119 S Tennessee, Ste /
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rip 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testinq BOPE |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

New Annular BOP showed up at 03:3o | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houn

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plug/ rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer/ Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

REC VED
MN142888

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS
UNOFOIL,CAggg

Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUSCOST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPBÛ 8Ÿ8Û
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy mc. yzyy119 S Tennessee, Ste /
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rip 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testinq BOPE |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

New Annular BOP showed up at 03:3o | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houn

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plug/ rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer/ Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

REC VED
MN142888

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS
UNOFOIL,CAggg

Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUSCOST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPBÛ 8Ÿ8Û
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

Marion Energy mc. yzyy119 S Tennessee, Ste /
McKinney,Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELL NO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 1, 2008
RIGNAMEANDNUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rip 132 Carbon Utah 78
TOTALDEPTH Rot. Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LAST CASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 527 7", 23#, P110 8031.39 85
ACTIVITYAT REPORTTIME REPORTEDBY

Testinq BOPE |Richard LTatman
REMARKS KB TO GL.

New Annular BOP showed up at 03:3o | 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO Houn

6:00 Test BOPE Test Plug and Cup Packer not holding, Change out Cup, X-o Sub Is To Large, change cross over,
Try to test Annular, Test Failed Annulare Failed Ruptured Bag. Tested Pipe ramd and Choke Line to 250 low

18:00 12.00 and 3000 High for 30 min.
18:00 19:00 1.00 Take out test plug/ rig down Test truckand move it out of the way.
19:00 2:00 7.00 Nipple down Annular preventer/ Wait on Annular and brige plug.
2:00 3:00 1.00 Set Packer @90'
3:00 6:00 3.00 Unioad NEW Annulare Preventer / Nipple up new Annular

REC VED
MN142888

Total Ilours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS
UNOFOIL,CAggg

Hrs. Rig Repair FUEL USED 850 Boiler Hours 24 UP
Hrs. Mob./Demoi: Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 24.00 Total H2O und on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTN NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.

TIME Duragel SIZE

WEIGHT Caustic MFG

VIS Asphasol TYPE

WL Super Sweep TFA

PV/YP Fed-Zan JET

MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.

CA Soda Ash DEFTH OUT

GELS Desco DEPTH IN

ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET

pH Pack-r HRS

CAKE Barite T/B/G

CL DAILYCOST $10,796.00 WT. ON BIT

KCL PREVIOUSCOST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $578,800.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLING ASSE ABLY PUMP >ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH- FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Nat Nat 7316' 1.5°

MODEL SPBÛ 8Ÿ8Û
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25



O Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste RECEIVED

McKinney,Texas 75069 JAN18 2008DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FÏELD bit oF OIL,Gff¾ MININGRailroad SWD 1 5 \() 6 Kenilworth Januaif , 2008
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah $$ Š pTOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 | 5.5 17 lb. flush jt. 555.22 94
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
RIGGINGDOWN Richard Crow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOS

FROM TO Hours
6:00 6:30 0.50 Ran 5.jts. Of 5.5 casing with cross over/ packer land liner 5.5
6:30 9:30 3.00 Pick up 24 Jts. 3 1/2" drill p
9:30 14:00 4.50 Trip in hole to set liner & cement
14:00 15:30 1.50 Install cement head & broke circ.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Hung hanger & release setting tool
17:00 18:00 1.00 Cement 5.5 casing
18:00 6:00 12.00 Laying down drill pipe

Bump Plug with 1100 PSI. then agin with2000PSI float held
Slurry wt.14.2 / Slurry yield 1.26 / Water gal. sk. 5.75
Cement w/ 50sks. 50/50 poz/ 18 sks.poz./12 lbs.cff/ 8 lbs cdi-33/240 lbs. salt/ 1 sk. Gel.

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 852 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uted on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS]LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE KCL T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO; DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Mat Nat 7316' 1 5°
MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

O Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste RECEIVED

McKinney,Texas 75069 JAN18 2008DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FÏELD bit oF OIL,Gff¾ MININGRailroad SWD 1 5 \() 6 Kenilworth Januaif , 2008
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah $$ Š pTOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 | 5.5 17 lb. flush jt. 555.22 94
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
RIGGINGDOWN Richard Crow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOS

FROM TO Hours
6:00 6:30 0.50 Ran 5.jts. Of 5.5 casing with cross over/ packer land liner 5.5
6:30 9:30 3.00 Pick up 24 Jts. 3 1/2" drill p
9:30 14:00 4.50 Trip in hole to set liner & cement
14:00 15:30 1.50 Install cement head & broke circ.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Hung hanger & release setting tool
17:00 18:00 1.00 Cement 5.5 casing
18:00 6:00 12.00 Laying down drill pipe

Bump Plug with 1100 PSI. then agin with2000PSI float held
Slurry wt.14.2 / Slurry yield 1.26 / Water gal. sk. 5.75
Cement w/ 50sks. 50/50 poz/ 18 sks.poz./12 lbs.cff/ 8 lbs cdi-33/240 lbs. salt/ 1 sk. Gel.

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 852 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uted on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS]LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE KCL T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO; DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Mat Nat 7316' 1 5°
MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

O Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste RECEIVED

McKinney,Texas 75069 JAN18 2008DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FÏELD bit oF OIL,Gff¾ MININGRailroad SWD 1 5 \() 6 Kenilworth Januaif , 2008
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah $$ Š pTOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 | 5.5 17 lb. flush jt. 555.22 94
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
RIGGINGDOWN Richard Crow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOS

FROM TO Hours

6:00 6:30 0.50 Ran 5.jts. Of 5.5 casing with cross over/ packer land liner 5.5
6:30 9:30 3.00 Pick up 24 Jts. 3 1/2" drill p
9:30 14:00 4.50 Trip in hole to set liner & cement
14:00 15:30 1.50 Install cement head & broke circ.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Hung hanger & release setting tool
17:00 18:00 1.00 Cement 5.5 casing
18:00 6:00 12.00 Laying down drill pipe

Bump Plug with 1100 PSI. then agin with2000PSI float held
Slurry wt.14.2 / Slurry yield 1.26 / Water gal. sk. 5.75
Cement w/ 50sks. 50/50 poz/ 18 sks.poz./12 lbs.cff/ 8 lbs cdi-33/240 lbs. salt/ 1 sk. Gel.

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 852 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uted on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS]LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE KCL T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO; DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Mat Nat 7316' 1 5°
MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25

O Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste RECEIVED

McKinney,Texas 75069 JAN18 2008DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASENAME&WELLNO. FÏELD bit oF OIL,Gff¾ MININGRailroad SWD 1 5 \() 6 Kenilworth Januaif , 2008
RIG NAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah $$ Š pTOTAL DEPTH Rot. His cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE, WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' | 29 | 556 | 5.5 17 lb. flush jt. 555.22 94
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
RIGGINGDOWN Richard Crow
REMARKS

KBTO GL.

15
TIME LOS

FROM TO Hours

6:00 6:30 0.50 Ran 5.jts. Of 5.5 casing with cross over/ packer land liner 5.5
6:30 9:30 3.00 Pick up 24 Jts. 3 1/2" drill p
9:30 14:00 4.50 Trip in hole to set liner & cement
14:00 15:30 1.50 Install cement head & broke circ.
15:30 17:00 1.50 Hung hanger & release setting tool
17:00 18:00 1.00 Cement 5.5 casing
18:00 6:00 12.00 Laying down drill pipe

Bump Plug with 1100 PSI. then agin with2000PSI float held
Slurry wt.14.2 / Slurry yield 1.26 / Water gal. sk. 5.75
Cement w/ 50sks. 50/50 poz/ 18 sks.poz./12 lbs.cff/ 8 lbs cdi-33/240 lbs. salt/ 1 sk. Gel.

Total f lours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 FUEL USED 852 Boiler Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
FOTALDAYWORit 24.00 Total H2O uted on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS]LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
PV/YP Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO.
CA Soda Ash DEPTHOUT
GELS Desco DEPTH IN
ALK Sawdust TOTAL FEET
pH Pack-r HRS
CAKE KCL T/B/G
CL DAILYCOST WT. ONBIT
KCL PREVIOUS COST $568,004.00 RPM
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVECOST $568,004.00 ROP(fph)

DRILLINGASSE 4BLY PUMP )ATA DEVIATION REC3RD
NO; DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH Inclination / Azimuth

MAKE Mat Nat 7316' 1 5°
MODEL 8P80 8P80
STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25



RECEIVED
Marion Energy inc. JAN18 2008

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney,Texas 75069 DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

DAILYDRILLING REPORT
i me-mumme-irLEASENAME &WELLNO. FIELD DATE

Railroad SWD 1 Kenilworth January 10, 2008
RIGNAMEAND NUMBER COUNTY STATE Days from spud
Unit DrillingCorp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 87
TOTALDEPTH Rot Hrs cum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGEDRILLED LASTCASINGSIZE,WEIGHT,GRADE SET@ Report No. .

8085' 29 556 | 5.5 17 lb. flush jt. 555.22 94
ACTIVITYATREPORTTIME REPORTEDBY
RIGGINGDOWN Richard Crow
REMARKS KBTO GL
AllUnit hands gave 110% running cas./setting liner &Cementing 15

TIME LOG
FROM TO Houm
6:00 18:00 12.00 Rig is released at 18:00 1/9/08
18:00 6:00 12.00 Rigging down to stack out y yard in Wellington Utah
6:00
0:00
0:00
0:00 \
0:00

Total llours 24.00 FUEL AND WATER USE I BOILER HOURS STRING WT
Hrs. Rig Repair 0.00 TEL ÜSEÖ 568 Boller Hours 24 UP 148,000

Hrs. Mob./Demot 12.00 Bbis. Water hauled last 24 hours 0 Out DOWN
TOTAL DAYWORI¢ 12.00 Total H2O ut ad on well & road Barrels ROTATE

MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALSUSED BIf RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCTNAME BITNO.
TIME Duragel SIZE
WEIGHT Caustic MFG
VIS Asphasol TYPE
WL Super Sweep TFA
P Fed-Zan JET
MBT Pollyswell SERIAL NO,
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

O DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL SW 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200

ciTY McKinney STATE TX ziP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:

UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: First String
10/28/2007 O coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Intermediate Casing

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Cement 4340' 9-5/8" 36# J-55 STC WI Lead 600sks 11ppg 3.82yeild 23gallsk H2O, Tail 300sks 14.2ppg 1.26yeild 5.75gallsk
H2O
Displace WI 322bbls H2O Plug Did Not Hit/ Pump 4-bbis Over Displacement Floats Heldl Cement To Surface

SNAME(PLEASE PR g Endsley

DA

Operations

(This space for State use only) RECENED

FEBi 3 2003
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, menter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such poposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL SW 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER Kenilworth Railroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Second Intermediate
12/25/2007

coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OSSing

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ran 198 jts 7",.P110, 23# csg set @8031'. DVtool@5700'. Pumped 1st stage cement w/ 425 sx, 50/50 poz, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Open DVtooland circulate 6 hours. Pump 2nd stage w/ 435 sks, Premium Lite, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild followed by 475 sx,
50/50 por 14.2 ppg, 1.26 yeild. Circulate 3 bbis cement to surface. Close DV tool.

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Oug ndsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE --f DATE 2/6/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

FEBi 3 2003
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OFO\L,GAS&
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12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ran 198 jts 7",.P110, 23# csg set @8031'. DVtool@5700'. Pumped 1st stage cement w/ 425 sx, 50/50 poz, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Open DVtooland circulate 6 hours. Pump 2nd stage w/ 435 sks, Premium Lite, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild followed by 475 sx,
50/50 por 14.2 ppg, 1.26 yeild. Circulate 3 bbis cement to surface. Close DV tool.

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Oug ndsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE --f DATE 2/6/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

FEBi 3 2003
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OFO\L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, menter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such poposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL SW 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER Kenilworth Railroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Second Intermediate
12/25/2007

coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OSSing

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Ran 198 jts 7",.P110, 23# csg set @8031'. DVtool@5700'. Pumped 1st stage cement w/ 425 sx, 50/50 poz, 14.2 ppg, 1.26
yeild. Open DVtooland circulate 6 hours. Pump 2nd stage w/ 435 sks, Premium Lite, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild followed by 475 sx,
50/50 por 14.2 ppg, 1.26 yeild. Circulate 3 bbis cement to surface. Close DV tool.

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Oug ndsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE --f DATE 2/6/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED

FEBi 3 2003
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OFO\L,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCESO DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESfGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work wilîstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Surface Casing
10/17/2007 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Cement 21 Jts 905' 13 3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 Csg With 1100sks 632.88cu/ft Class-G Cmt 2% ca 1/4# flocele 1.15yelld 5-gallsk

Pumped 100% excess per permit/ Pumped 125bbis H2O Aheadl 20bbis Mud Flush/ 225bbis Class-G Cmt/ 129.7bbis
Displacement
360psi Lift/Bumped Plug @880psil Floats Did Not Holdl Shut In Cmt Head With 80psi For 1-Hour Floats Held

Endsley TITLE VP Operations
NS NEATULREASEPRIN

DATE
2/6/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECENED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side>
FEBi 3 2008

Div.0FOIL,GAS&
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NS NEATULREASEPRIN
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(This space for State use only)
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(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side>
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Div.0FOIL,GAS&
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(Submit Original Form Only)
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10/17/2007 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
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FEBi 3 2008

Div.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCESO DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESfGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney STATE TX ZIP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISE/4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work wilîstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Surface Casing
10/17/2007 O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Cement 21 Jts 905' 13 3/8" 54.5# STC J-55 Csg With 1100sks 632.88cu/ft Class-G Cmt 2% ca 1/4# flocele 1.15yelld 5-gallsk

Pumped 100% excess per permit/ Pumped 125bbis H2O Aheadl 20bbis Mud Flush/ 225bbis Class-G Cmt/ 129.7bbis
Displacement
360psi Lift/Bumped Plug @880psil Floats Did Not Holdl Shut In Cmt Head With 80psi For 1-Hour Floats Held

Endsley TITLE VP Operations
NS NEATULREASEPRIN

DATE
2/6/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECENED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side>
FEBi 3 2008

Div.0FOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

O
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Fee-BH-61504
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL GWA

L DRY OTHER
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
NE

L
HOR Z NEP-

RY
FSFVR.

OTHER KenilWOrth Railroad # 1A
2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER: f-Ø#

Marion Energy, Inc. 40g731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

119 S. Tennessee #200 ciTY McKinney STATE TX ze 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4, LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN
ATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25 ft FEL SWSE 16 13S 10E
AT TOP PRODUÖlNG INTERVALREPORTED BELOW 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25 ft FEL

ATTOTALDEPTH: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25 ft FEL "CC NTY 13. STATE
UTAH

14 DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16 DATECOMPLETED: 17 ELEVATIONS{DF, RKB, RT, GL):
10/10/2007 1/9/2008 2125/2008 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE O 6585 KB

18 TOTALDEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUGSET:

Tv¤ 8,095 Tvo 8,045 TVD 5,650
22 TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOÖS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23

ompensated Photo Density ompensated Dual Nuetron, WASWELLCORED9 NO YES (Submitanalysis)

dual Laterolog andfBLj~P)/C;p 864 TR/pfE CORJAÛ WASDSTRUN? NO YES (S bmit epo

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASINGAND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE CEMHENTER CNEMENF
S

KES VOLSUUMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

17 1/2 13 3/E K-55 54.5 # 0 905 "G" 1,325 Surface
12 1/4 9 5/8 Já5 36# 0 4,340 Lite 60( Surface

50/50 300

8 3/4 7" P110 26# 0 8,031 5,700 Lite 435 Surface
50/50 900

6 1/4 5 1/2 N-80 17# 7,870 8,095 50/60 50 Surface
26. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2 7/8" 5,530 5,530
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Cedar Mountain 4,752 5,581 5,538 5,550 .43 48 open Squeezed

(B) 5,556 5,566 .43 40 open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Sqwd

28. ACID,FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

5538-5566 2,000 gals 7 1/2 % HCL

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICALIMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

RECOM
(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

MAR0 4 2003

DKOF0\L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)
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MAR0 4 2003

DKOF0\L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT O FORM 8
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5538-5566 2,000 gals 7 1/2 % HCL

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICALIMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

RECOM
(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

MAR0 4 2003

DKOF0\L,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES (highlight changes)

O
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Fee-BH-61504
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL GWA

L DRY OTHER
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
NE

L
HOR Z NEP-

RY
FSFVR.

OTHER KenilWOrth Railroad # 1A
2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER: f-Ø#

Marion Energy, Inc. 40g731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

119 S. Tennessee #200 ciTY McKinney STATE TX ze 75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
4, LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN
ATSURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25 ft FEL SWSE 16 13S 10E
AT TOP PRODUÖlNG INTERVALREPORTED BELOW 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25 ft FEL

ATTOTALDEPTH: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25 ft FEL "CC NTY 13. STATE
UTAH

14 DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16 DATECOMPLETED: 17 ELEVATIONS{DF, RKB, RT, GL):
10/10/2007 1/9/2008 2125/2008 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE O 6585 KB

18 TOTALDEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACK T.D.: MD 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUGSET:

Tv¤ 8,095 Tvo 8,045 TVD 5,650
22 TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOÖS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23

ompensated Photo Density ompensated Dual Nuetron, WASWELLCORED9 NO YES (Submitanalysis)

dual Laterolog andfBLj~P)/C;p 864 TR/pfE CORJAÛ WASDSTRUN? NO YES (S bmit epo

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASINGAND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE CEMHENTER CNEMENF
S

KES VOLSUUMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

17 1/2 13 3/E K-55 54.5 # 0 905 "G" 1,325 Surface
12 1/4 9 5/8 Já5 36# 0 4,340 Lite 60( Surface

50/50 300

8 3/4 7" P110 26# 0 8,031 5,700 Lite 435 Surface
50/50 900

6 1/4 5 1/2 N-80 17# 7,870 8,095 50/60 50 Surface
26. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
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26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Cedar Mountain 4,752 5,581 5,538 5,550 .43 48 open Squeezed

(B) 5,556 5,566 .43 40 open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Sqwd

28. ACID,FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

5538-5566 2,000 gals 7 1/2 % HCL

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICALIMECHANICAL LOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

RECOM
(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

MAR0 4 2003

DKOF0\L,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

2/22/2008 24 RATES: 300 125 Flowing
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS IL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

RATES: -' 300 125 SI
INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD, METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26}

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. Pl GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OlL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF; WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. Pi GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSIT10N OF GAS (sold,Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time toolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measuredp
Depth)

Ferron 4,155
Ferron 4,155 4,411 Sand, Coal, Water, &Gas Tunuck 4,411
Cedar Mountain 4,752 5,581 Sand, Shale, Water &Gas Dakota 4,698
Entrada 6,781 7,688 Sand, Water Cedar Mountain 4,752
Navajo 8,144 8,481 Sand, Water Morrison 5,581

Summerville 6,245
Curtis 6,617
Entrada 6,781
Carmel 7,688
Navajo 8,144

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (include plugg ig procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Ug ndsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 2/27/2008

This report must be submitted wi days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**lTEM 24: Cement Top--Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL), cement bond fog (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
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RATES: -' 300 125 SI
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RATES: -+
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RATES: ->
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RATES: -+
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32. DISPOSIT10N OF GAS (sold,Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time toolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measuredp
Depth)
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Curtis 6,617
Entrada 6,781
Carmel 7,688
Navajo 8,144

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (include plugg ig procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Ug ndsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 2/27/2008

This report must be submitted wi days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**lTEM 24: Cement Top--Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL), cement bond fog (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IF1NDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this fonn for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER .

Kenilworth Railroad # 1A
2 NAME0F 0PERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney
STATE TX zie75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISEl4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

2/25/2008 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: TOSt New Zone

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Marion Energy, Inc. encountered a gas bearing sand from 5536'-5580' KB.We perforated from 5538'-5550' and 5556'-5566'
wl 4 shots per foot. We had 2100 psi at surface immediately after perforating. We flow tested the well to clean up drilling.The
well was acidized w/ mud acid to help clean the damage. We did this under a packer and flowed the well back. We feel the
results indicate a commercial discovery in the Cedar Mountain formation.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) D Endsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 2/27/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OF0\L, GAS&
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results indicate a commercial discovery in the Cedar Mountain formation.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) D Endsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 2/27/2008

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OF0\L, GAS&

STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

FEE-BH-61504

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IF1NDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this fonn for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER .

Kenilworth Railroad # 1A
2 NAME0F 0PERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney
STATE TX zie75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 304.71 ft FSL 1315.25ft FEL ISEl4 COUNTY: Carbon

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 16 13S 10E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

2/25/2008 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: TOSt New Zone

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Marion Energy, Inc. encountered a gas bearing sand from 5536'-5580' KB.We perforated from 5538'-5550' and 5556'-5566'
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well was acidized w/ mud acid to help clean the damage. We did this under a packer and flowed the well back. We feel the
results indicate a commercial discovery in the Cedar Mountain formation.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) D Endsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE DATE 2/27/2008

(This space for State use only)
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(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
FEE-BH-61504

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL Q GAS WELL Ü OTHER SWD

KenilworthRailroad # 1 SWD
NAMËÖF ØËEÑATÖR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731229
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119 S. Tennessee Ste. 200 McKinney

, STATE TX ziP75069 (972) 540-2967 Helper Field
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CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Marion Energy, Inc. originally intended to drill this well for the purpose of future produced water disposal. While drilling, a gas
bearing zone was encountered that we believe is the Cedar Mountain formation, a Jurrasic aged sandstone. We encountered
slightly higher than normal pressures as demonstrated by the need to circulate11 ppg drillingmud to contain the zone. We
intend to attempt to determine commerciality of this zone and would request a name change tothe KenilworthRailroad 1-Aand
a status change togas well.

NAME(PLEASE PRI g Endsley TITLE VP Operations

SIGNATURE ..« DATE 2/27/2008

(This space for State use only) APPROVEDBYTHESTATE
OF UTAH DIVISION OF RECEIVED
OiL, GAR, AND INING
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR. ExecutiveDirector

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

December 9, 2010

Certified Mail No.: 7004 1160 0003 0190 4789

DIVISION ORDER

MarionEnergy, Inc.
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, Texas 75069 h/W#½ À¾ $- ÀAttn: Mr. Keri Clark SS jgg þ¾
Subject: Bonding for Individual Wells

Dear Mr. Clark:

As of the date of this Order Marion Energy Inc. (Marion) has not satisfactorily
demonstrated Marion's financial ability to meet Utah Code §40-6-5(f)and Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rule (R649-3-6) requirements for state-wide bonding as requested in the
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) certified letter dated October 25, 2010.

The Division is hereby ordering individual well bonds (R649-3-1.5) for all wells (see
Attachment A) currently covered under Marion's $120,000blanket bond. The total individual
well bond obligation will be $421,500.

Therefore, Marion has 30 days from the date of this Order to post the additional
bonding or enter into an agreement with the Division to satisfy this Order.

Marion has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and
Mining a request for review, according to procedures set forth in Utah Administrative CodeR649-10-6. A request for review of a Division Order must be filed with the secretary to the
Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-5277, within 30 days of issuance of the Order.

In the event Marion does not comply with this Division Order for Individual Well
Bonding the Division will file for a formal hearingbeforethe Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
pursuant to Utah §40-6-11(3)& (4).

UTAH

DNR

1594West North Temple,Suite 1210,PO Box 145801, SaltLake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 • facsimile(801)359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov DIL, GAS &
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Page 2
Subject: Division Order - Bonding for Individual Wells.
December 9, 2010

For bonding assistance please contact Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor at (801) 538-
5316. General questions regarding this Order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance
Manager at (801) 538-5280, or John Rogers, Oil and Gas Associate Director at (801) 538-5349.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js
Exhibits
cc: John Rogers, Associate Director

Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor
Compliance File
Well Files

N:\O&G Reviewed
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Attachment A

Well Name Well API Well Depth Bond

Cordingly Cyn 15-2 43-007-30102 4890 $30,000
Cordingly Cyn 15-1 43-007-31065 4735 $30,000
Cordingly Cyn 15-5 43-007-31167 4500 $30,000
Alpine School District 6-17 43-007-31181 5825 $30,000
Alpine School District 3-17 43-007-31182 5300 $30,000
Oman 10-29 43-007-31210 5500 $30,000
Utah Fuel 8 43-007-16015 4390 $30,000
Kenilworth RR 1 43-007-31006 4445 $30,000
Kenilworth RR 2 43-007-31007 5007 $30,000
Ballpark Cyn 1 43-007-31015 4468 $30,000
Cordingly Cyn 11-1 43-007-31070 5520 $30,000
Ballpark Cyn 17-2 43-007-31169 not reported $30,000
Cordingly Cyn 10-1 43-007-31173 6435 $30,000
Ballpark Cyn 16-2X 43-007-31207 489 $1,500
Kennilworth RR 1-A 43-007-31229 8045 $30,000

TOTAL
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R.HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director April 14, 2011

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7005 1820 0001 5562 9023
Mr. Keri Clarke 4 pp
Marion Energy Inc.
119 South Tennessee, Ste 200
McKinney, TX 75069

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Mr. Clarke:

As of January 2011, Marion Energy Inc. (Marion) has four (4) Fee Lease Wells and two
(2) State Lease Wells (see Attachment A) that have been added to Marion's non-compliance list
concerning the requirements for extended shut-in or temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.
These wells are in addition to those currently under the stipulated order in Clear Creek.
Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires the filing of a Sundry Notice in
accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining (Division) approval.
Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, unless the Division
grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-
3-36-1.3.3).

This is also a reissuance of a SECOND NOTICE for the Ballpark CYN 16-2X well
(Attachment A). This well had a first notice sent via certified mail on August 26, 2008, and a
second notice sent certified mail on May 04, 2009. To date the Division has not received any of
the required information to bring said well into compliance with aforementioned rules. Please
submit the required information for extended SI/TA status within 30 days of this notice or further
actions will be initiated.

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Utah Division of Oil,
Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3). um

DNR
Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MITy

1594 West North Temple,Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114 -5801

telephone (80 l) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (80 I) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.goy OIL, GAS &
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Page 2
Marion Energy Inc.
April 14, 2011

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: Compliance File

Well File
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA

N:\O&G Reviewed
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive
Reissuance of 2ND NOTICE

1 BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 43-007-31207 FEE 4 Years 7 Months
1 ' NOTICE

2 CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 43-007-31173 FEE 4 Years 6 Months
3 ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 43-007-31181 ML-1257 2 Years 1 Month
4 OMAN 10-29 43-007-31210 ML-1256 2 Years 5 Months
5 BALLPARK CYN 17-2 43-007-31169 FEE 4 Years 8 Months
6 KENILWORTH RR 1-A 43-007-31229 FEE 1 Year 2
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MARION
ENERGY

May 5, 2011

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
1594e s0tNorth Temple RECENED
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114

Attention: Dustin Doucet
DN.0FO\L,GAS&MINING

Re: Notice -- Extended SI/TAWell Leases

Dear Dustin

in response to your certified letter of April 14, 2011, we are providing you with information for wells
that are currently structured as shut in or temporarilyabandoned wells (SIITA) by DOGM. Each well
has individual information and is listed below.

Ballpark Canyon 16-2X 45 g 2 Í2Û Î lSS lOÑ Ålp
This well is córrentlyonly drilled to 500 feet on the Ballpark site, with surface casing set. This well is
planned to be drilled in the future to develop the Helper field. The casing is 18" above the ground
and it has a cap welded on the casing. This well was a replacement for the Ballpark Canyon well
16-2 where the drilling was lost on the well while drilling surface pipe. As far as DOGM is concerned
thiswellhas not been sufficientlydrilled but will be thisyear.

Cordingly Canyon 10-1 4g oon y;73 US DE E

This well was drilled to the Ferron but the Ferron portion of the hole collapsed and the well was
cased throughthe lower Mancos. We have provided a wellbore diagram for your use. There is
currently no pressure on the casing with no tubingin the hole. We currently plan to develop this into
a Mancos well in the near future. We do not have a casing pressure and fluid level on thiswell.

Ballpark Canyon 17-2 #3 g g ) Q \ SS ) þ g Î þ
This well is the same as the 16-2X well, and has been only drilled to 500 feet with surface casing
set. It is currentlycapped on the surface.

Kenilworth RR 1-A 4) QCy 22'
There is a wellbore diagram attached for thiswell. We had drilled thiswell to be a SWD well for
Kenilworth. However we had positive response from the Cedar Mountain formation in the Buckhorn
Conglomerate. Because of thiswe decided not to make it a SWD well at that time.We are currently
waiting for a thirdparty engineering report to advise us how to sidetrack the well to make it
productive. We do not have a casing pressure test and fluid level on thiswell.

901 N. McDonald Street, Suite 601, McKinney,TX,75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967

Fax: (972)
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productive. We do not have a casing pressure test and fluid level on thiswell.

901 N. McDonald Street, Suite 601, McKinney,TX,75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967

Fax: (972)

MARION
ENERGY

May 5, 2011

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources
1594e s0tNorth Temple RECENED
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114

Attention: Dustin Doucet
DN.0FO\L,GAS&MINING

Re: Notice -- Extended SI/TAWell Leases

Dear Dustin

in response to your certified letter of April 14, 2011, we are providing you with information for wells
that are currently structured as shut in or temporarilyabandoned wells (SIITA) by DOGM. Each well
has individual information and is listed below.

Ballpark Canyon 16-2X 45 g 2 Í2Û Î lSS lOÑ Ålp
This well is córrentlyonly drilled to 500 feet on the Ballpark site, with surface casing set. This well is
planned to be drilled in the future to develop the Helper field. The casing is 18" above the ground
and it has a cap welded on the casing. This well was a replacement for the Ballpark Canyon well
16-2 where the drilling was lost on the well while drilling surface pipe. As far as DOGM is concerned
thiswellhas not been sufficientlydrilled but will be thisyear.

Cordingly Canyon 10-1 4g oon y;73 US DE E

This well was drilled to the Ferron but the Ferron portion of the hole collapsed and the well was
cased throughthe lower Mancos. We have provided a wellbore diagram for your use. There is
currently no pressure on the casing with no tubingin the hole. We currently plan to develop this into
a Mancos well in the near future. We do not have a casing pressure and fluid level on thiswell.

Ballpark Canyon 17-2 #3 g g ) Q \ SS ) þ g Î þ
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MARION
ENERGY

Alpine School District 6-17 6 ÛÕ¶ $

In February of thisyear we met with the Oil and Gas board to present a SWD proposal to convert
the wells 3-17 and 6-17 on the Alpine School District site. This was approved. We have performed
an MIT on the 3-17 and have converted it into a SWD well. We have not done the MIT on the 6-17
well, thoughwe willprobably do it thissummer. There is a wellbore diagram attached for your
perusal.

Oman 10-29

This well was drilled twoyears ago in Clear Creek to the Ferron formation. The well was perforated
but has never been stimulated for production. There is a plan to complete thiswell thissummer as
part of our plan to bring Clear Creek onto full production. There is a wellbore diagram attached for
your perusal. We do not have a casing pressure test and fluid level on this well.

We respectfully request that DOGM extend the SITTAstatus on these wells. We hope thisanswers
some of your concerns regarding the wells in your notice. Please contact me should you need
anything further,

Y lyb

Keri Clarke
Vice President Land
Marion Energy Inc.

Cc: Jim Hansen
LaVonne Garrison - SITLA

901 N. McDonald Street, Suite 601, McKinney,TX, 75069
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UTAH DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Oil and Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801

Salt Lake City,Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

NOTICE OF VIOLATION
STATE OF UTAH

OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION ACT

To the following operator:
Name: MARION ENERGY INC.

Well(s) or Site(s): 1.) BALLPARK CYN 16-2X API #: 43-007-31207

2.) CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 43-007-31173

3.) BALLPARK CYN 17-2 43-007-31169

4.) KENILWORTH RR 1-A 43-007-31229 ---

5.) ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT 6-17 43-007-31181

6.) OMAN 10-29 43-007-31210

Date and Time of Inspection/Violation: August 24, 2011

Mailing Address: Attn: Keri Clarke

901 N McDonald St, Ste 601

McKinney, TX 75069-2157

Under the authorityof the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act, Section 40-6 et. Seq., Utah Code Annotated,
1953, as amended, the undersigned authorized representative of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
(Division) has conducted an inspection of the above described site and/or records on the above date and
has found alleged violation(s) of the act, rules or permit conditions as described below.

Description of Violation(s):

Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells - According to Rule R649-3-36, the operator is
required to supply the Division with reasons for extended Sl/TA. the length of time for extended SI/TA and
proof of well bore integrity for every well SI/TA over 12 consecutive months. After 5 years of continued
SI/TA, the wells are to be pluqqed unless good cause is supplied to the Division for extended SI/TA in
addition to the required information just mentioned.

The Division has initiated several contacts withMarion Energy Inc. (Marion) requesting required
documents and action per R649-3-36. A first notice of non-compliance was sent out via certified mail on
April 26, 2011 to Marion concerning these wells. This notice also served as a re-issuance of a second notice
for well #1 listed above. Marion responded with a letter dated May 5, 2011, and received by the Division on
May 9, 2011. AIIrequests were denied by the Division on August 3, 2011, due to insufficient information
provided by Marion. In this letter Marion addressed the above wells as follows:Well #1 was stated as being
drilled to 500' with surface casinq set and a cap welded on the casing. Well #2 was said to have future plans
of beinq developed into the Mancos, and lacked any information supporting integrity. Well #3 was stated to
be the same as well #1 also beinq capped at surface. Well #4 was planned for sidetrack, also lacking any
information showing integrity.Well #5 stated the plan to do an MITthissummer. Well#6 was planned to
complete thissummer. The Division recently conducted inspections on each well listed above and found the
claims of wells 1 and 3 to be inaccurate as far as beinq capped at surface. Wells 1 and 3 were found with
only plastic threadprotectors at surface. Well#4 shows signs of wellhead leakinq and also fluidtank leaking
outside of containment.
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UTAH DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Oil and Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

These findings cause concern that the casing or equipment condition may make the well a risk to
public health and safety or the environment (R649-3-36-1.3). To date our records indicate thatno further
work has been done as planned or requests submitted by Marion to move these wells into compliance.
These wells need to be secured properly.

Action: For the wells subject to thisnotice, Marion Energy Inc. shall secure these wells properly and either
submit the information required by R649-3-36, plug and abandon or place the wells on production.

This notice shall remain in effect untilit is modified,terminated, or vacated by a written notice of an
authorized representative of the director of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining. Failure to complywith this
notice will result in the Division pursuing further actions against said operator. Further actions may include
initiation of agency actions to order full cost bonding and plugging and abandonment of wells and requests
for bond forfeiture and civil penalties.

Compliance Deadline: 2Ö W
Date of Service Mailing: Auqust 25, 2011

C M O 70 1 01 0001 3568 1212

Division's Representative Operator or Representative

(If presented in person)

cc: Compliance File
Well Files

6/2005
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UTAH DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Oil and Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

NOTICE OF VIOLATION
STATE OF UTAH

OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION ACT
******Akkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk**********************

To the following operator:

Name: MARION ENERGY INC.

Well(s) or Site(s): 1.) BALLPARK CYN 16-2X API #: 43-007-31207

2.) CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 43-007-31173

3.) BALLPARK CYN 17-2 43-007-31169

4.) KENILWORTH RR 1-A 43-007-31229 1%S (DE tG
5.) ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT 6-17 43-007-31181

6.) OMAN 10-29 43-007-31210

7.) BALLPARK CANYON #1 43-007-31015

8.) CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 43-007-31167

9.) KENILWORTH RR #1 43-007-31006

10.) KENILWORTH RR#2 43-007-31007

11.) CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 43-007-31064

12.) CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 43-007-31065

13.) CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 43-007-31070

Date and Time of Inspection/Violation: December 10, 2012

Mailing Address: Attn: Keri C\arke

3580 Orr Road

Allen, TX 75002

Under the authority of the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act, Section 40-6 et. Seq., Utah Code Annotated, 1953, as
amended, the undersigned authorized representative of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) has conducted
an inspection of the above described site and/or records on the above date and has found alleged violation(s) of the
act, rules or permit conditions as described below.

Description of Violation(s):

Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Ternporarily Abandoned \/Vells- According to Rule R649-3-36, the operator is required
to supply the Division with reasons for extended SITTA,the length of time for extended Sl/TA and proof of well bore
integrity for every well SITTAover 12 consecutive months. After 5 years of continued SI/TA, the wells are to be
pluqqed unless good cause is supplied to the Division for extended Sl/TA in addition to the required information just
mentioned.

Rule R649-3-4.3, Bonding - Ifthe division finds that a well subiect to this bondinq rule is in violation of Rule R649-3-
36., Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells, the division shall reguire a bond amount for the applicable well in the
amount of actual pluqqinq and site restoration costs.

Rule R649-3-4.4.1. Bonding - Within 30 davs of notification bv the division, the operator shall submit to the division an
estimate of pluqqinq and site restoration costs for division reviewand approval.
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r UTAH DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Oil and Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

The Division has initiated several contacts with Marion Enerav Inc. (Marion) requesting required documents and
action per R649-3-36. Wells 1 - 6 have previously been issued Sl/TA Notices and Notices of Violation without
anything being accomplished to move these wells out of violation. Wells 7 and 8 have also been issued a SI/TA
Notice without having met the requirements of R649-3-36. Wells 9 - 13 are also in violation of R649-3-36 having been
added to Marion's SI/TA violation list. All wells listed above are currently under a Division Order for individual well
bonding.

There has not been any evidence of effort beinq made to bring these wells into compliance. These wells are in
violation of R-649-3-36 as listed above. The Division requires Marion to put up full cost bonding for all wells in
violation above per R649-3-4. It is also mandatory that Marion submit all documentation as required by R649-3-36
concerning shut-in and temporarilyabandoned wells.

Immediate Action; For the wells subject to this notice, Marion shall fulfill full cost bonding requirements for
each well. Marion shall also submit all information as required by R649-3-36 or plug and abandon or place
the wells on production.

* Fines may be levied up to $10,000.00 per day for every well in violation given the authority
provided under U.C.A. 40-6-11, part 4.

This notice shall remain in effect until it is modified, terminated, or vacated by a written notice of an authorized
representative of the director of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining. Failure to comply with this notice will result in the
Division pursuing further actions against said operator. Further actions may include initiation of agency actions to
order full cost bonding and plugging and abandonment of wells and requests for bond forfeiture and civil penalties.

Compliance Deadline: February 8, 2013

Da of Service Mailing: JanuarvŠ3 2913 Certified Mail No: 7010 1670 0001 4810 3645

Division's Representative Operator or Representative

(If presented in person)

cc: Compliance File
Well Files
SITLA

6/2005
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à marion
ENERGY

January 18, 2013

Department of NaturalResources
DivisionofOiland Gas &Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suile 1210
Salt Lake City,Utah 84114

Atlenlion:Dustin Doucet

Re: Noticeof Violalion- Clear Creek and Helper Fields

Dear Duslin,

in response to your certilled letier of January 3, 2013, we are providingyou wilh information for wells thatare currentlystructured as shut in or temporarilyabandonedwells (Sl/TA)by DOGM.Each wellhasindividual inkxmation and is lisled below

As you know, for the last twoand a halfyears MarionEnergy Inc. (Marion)has been under financialsiress thathasnotallowedactiveoperationsin the Clear Creek and Helper fields,beyond mainlainingafieldpresence and takingsome limiled,preliminaryaclionsto resuming operahons. In thelast fewmonths, however, Marion has been able to improveils financialposition tothe pointof resuming activeoperations in theClear Creek lield,withfurther financialimprovement expected as thatfield is put backon production.

Marionexplained thesecircumslances10 DOGMand the Board of Oil,Gas and Miningat theOclober26, 2012 hearing, where Marionsoughtand obtained Board approval to reinstituteactive operations atClear Creek. As discussed at thehearing, Marion's funding is currently limiled tothe monies needed 10put theClearCreek lield back on production, beginning withtheOman 2-20 and Oman 10-29 wells,butonce thatoccurs Marionexpects ils iinancial positiontocontinue to improve tothepoint it can meet allofils obligationswithrespect io ils SI/TAwells, and to move back intoactive operationset the Helper Field

Consistent with discussions at the October Board hearing, we have now rehabiliiatedthemalerdisposal (WD)system in the accessibleportionof theClear Creek tieldand we are activelyworkingonrestoring productionat thetwoinitiallylargeled wells, despite theextremewinterweather condilionsthatset in severalweeks ago.

Helper

The wens listed in the NOVfor the Helper Field are al modemwens, having been driRedin 2005 or later.This tieldwas in production untilOclober 2010, thoughthe weis are now shut in. AHofthe Helper wellslisted in theNOVare currentlyattachedtoa gas and watersystem (theAnadarko sales and SWDsystem). This system is controledentirelyby Anadarko. Marionconducted an inspecion ofthe Helper
Field on 1-16-13 and confirmed that thereis noevidence ofanygas or water leaks at anyof the wels.
We undersland that DOGMhas also recentlyinspected the Helper Field and æached thesame
conclusion. Marion plans to bring this field into operation soon, as finances allow.Please be advisedthatMarionhas already provided weibore diagmms of all of theweHs referenced below.

3580 Orr Road,
Aien, Texas,
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Baipark Canyon 16-2X

This wei is onlydriled to 500 feet on the Banparksite withsurface casingset The casingis 18"abovetheground and ithas a cap welded on thecasing. This wei was a replacement for the Balpark Canyon16-2 where thedriHingwas lost on thewellwhiledriling surfacepipe. Marionplans todrinthiswelltotheFerron in thefuture.

Baipark Canyon 17-2

This wel is the same as the16-2Xwel, and has been only drilledto 500 feet wilhsurface casing set it iscurrentlycapped on thesurface.

BallparkCanyon FI

This wen is drilledas a Ferron wei and has been compleled.Ithas been producing in the past thoughitis cunently shut in.There is a pumping uniton thewellAmong theHelper Fieldweis, thiswei is the onethathas theclosest proximilytooccupied struelures. We closelyinspected thiswellon 1-16-13 andconlirmed thatthereare no issues.

CordinglyCanyon 10-1

This wel was driled as a Fenon producer. However because of hole issues in the deeper sectionitwasexpectedtobe completedas a Mancos wel. Marionplans io complete thewel, and produce the wel inthefulure.

KenilwodhRRif1A

We had originaiy driied thiswel tobe a SWD wel for Helper. However we had posillve response fromthe Buckhom Conglomerate andwe compleledthewell in thatzone, The wellhas produced in the pastand we wiiplan io bring itback online soon. A situationregarding theweihead leakingat the sitewashandled by our operationspeople and thewei site is now clean of thisspii.
KenilworthRIW1

This wei was producing untilitwas shut in.There is a pumping uniton the well Marionplans to bringthiswenintopmduction soon.

KenilworthRR#2

This wel was producing untilitwas shut in.There is a pumping uniton thewei. Marionplans to bringthiswei intoproduction soon.

CordinglyCanyon 15-5

This wellwas driHedto theMancos formationand was completed.Itdid produce for a short timebeforebeing shut in. Marion plans towork on thiswei and toproduce itsoon.

3580 Orr Road,
Allen,Texas,
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This wel is the same as the16-2Xwel, and has been only drilledto 500 feet wilhsurface casing set it iscurrentlycapped on thesurface.

BallparkCanyon FI

This wen is drilledas a Ferron wei and has been compleled.Ithas been producing in the past thoughitis cunently shut in.There is a pumping uniton thewellAmong theHelper Fieldweis, thiswei is the onethathas theclosest proximilytooccupied struelures. We closelyinspected thiswellon 1-16-13 andconlirmed thatthereare no issues.

CordinglyCanyon 10-1

This wel was driled as a Fenon producer. However because of hole issues in the deeper sectionitwasexpectedtobe completedas a Mancos wel. Marionplans io complete thewel, and produce the wel inthefulure.

KenilwodhRRif1A

We had originaiy driied thiswel tobe a SWD wel for Helper. However we had posillve response fromthe Buckhom Conglomerate andwe compleledthewell in thatzone, The wellhas produced in the pastand we wiiplan io bring itback online soon. A situationregarding theweihead leakingat the sitewashandled by our operationspeople and thewei site is now clean of thisspii.
KenilworthRIW1

This wei was producing untilitwas shut in.There is a pumping uniton the well Marionplans to bringthiswenintopmduction soon.

KenilworthRR#2

This wel was producing untilitwas shut in.There is a pumping uniton thewei. Marionplans to bringthiswei intoproduction soon.

CordinglyCanyon 15-5

This wellwas driHedto theMancos formationand was completed.Itdid produce for a short timebeforebeing shut in. Marion plans towork on thiswei and toproduce itsoon.

3580 Orr Road,
Allen,Texas,
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CordinglyCanyon 15-2

This wei was driied totheFerron formationand was completed.This wellwas producing untilitwasshut in.There is not currentlya hydraulicpumping uniton the well.Marionplans towork on thewei,replace the pumping unitand bring it back intoproduction soon.
CordinglyCanyon 15-1

This wellwas driied tothe Ferron formationand was completed. This wel was producinguntilitwasshut in. Itcurrently has a pumping uniton the well Marionplans to bring thiswei intoproductionsoon.
CordinglyCanyon 11-1

This wei was drilledtotheFerron formationand was completed. This wei was producing untilitwasshut in.These is not currentlya hydraulicpumping uniton the well Marionplans towork on the wei,replace the pumping unitand bring it inloproduction soon.
Clear Creek

The NOVlisis twowellsin the Clear Creek Field, the ASD &17 and theOman 10-29. Bolhof these aremodem weis driled añer 2005. The Clear Creek Fieldcame offproductionin July 2011 due to financialissues and a rupture in thewater disposal line.We have inspected both of theseweis in the last fewweeks and neitherhas any leaks or olher problems.

Folowing the Board hearing in Iale October, Marionhas re-commenced operationsinthe Clear CreekField. It has done an MITon thecurrentSWD well(theASD 3-17). Ithas replaced sevemi AirVacs onthewater line in the field,and tested the wholesystem. It has commencedoperalionsin the iield ontwoweis, the Oman 2-20 and theOman 10-29. Given ils financial situation improving, Marionplans toexpand operations to additionalClear Cleek weis in the near future. Please be advised thatMarionhasprovidedweiborediagrams on these weis in thepast.

ASD 6-17

This wei was driRed as a Ferron wei and was completed.Marionsubmilled applications toconvert thiswelland theASD 3-17 wei into WD weis, to ensure thatat least one WD wellwas permitied. Atler theASD 3-17 was approved, itwas determined thatitwouldsuffice and anotherWD wei was notneeded atthattime.The wei cunently has a rolallexpumping uniton it Marionplans to commence operations onthisweUand bring iton toproduclionsoon.

Oman 10-29

This wei was driied totheFerron but was not compleled. Since resuming operations in theClear Creekliekl in November, Marionhas sent in a completionformfor thewell,and has done a flowtest on theweH.Recent operationsin the last monthhave seen a production pump placed on the wel. As weatherimproves in thearea Marionwii produce thewel.
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Bondinq

Mariondoes not currentlyhave thefinancialwherewithaltoundertake fui cost bonding of al of theweislisted in theNOV,and wiinot be in a conditionto do so untilits financialsituationfurther improves. Wenole,however, thatMarioncurrentlyis bonded withDOGMfor $451,500($421,500surety bond and$30,000cash bond), and DOGMholds an additional$184,000of cash for reclamation of Marionweis,meaningthereis over $630,000in place withDOGMfor reclamation, When added toMarion'sfederaland SITLAbonds, there is just under $1,000,000currendyavailable for Marion reclamalion.
Based on theabove information,Marionrespectfuiy requests thatDOGM extendthe SITTAslatus onthese Weis, and withholdfurther enforcementaclion whileMarionbrings the Clear Creek Fieldback onproductionand continuestoimprove ils financialcondilionto the point itcan put move back intotheHelper fieldand put those weis back into producion as wei, therebyremoving theweis from SIITAstatus.

We would be happy to meetwilhyou lo further discuss thismaner. In the meantime,feel free to contactus shouldyou need anythingfurlher.

Yours Sincerely,

KeriClarke

3580 Orr Road,
Alen, Texas,
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& State of Utah
/ DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

°•s ./ MICHAEL R. STYLER
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR. Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

DIVISION ORDER

February 22, 2013
Certified Mail #7010 16700001 4810 3898

Marion Energy
Attn: Keri Clarke
3 e0 O«XR5a0d0

2 \SS 10E lb
RE: Division Order to Comply with the Notice of Violation Issued to Marion Energy on January 3, 2013

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) memorializes the actions Marion Energy (Marion) is
required to perform in order to return the wells listed below to compliance under Utah Admin. CodeR649-3-36.

1) BALLPARK CYN 16-2X API # 43-007-31207
2) CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 API # 43-007-31173
3) BALLPARK CYN 17-2 API # 43-007-31169
4) KENILWORTH RR 1-A API # 43-007-31229
5) ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT 6-17 API # 43-007-31181
6) OMAN 10-29 API # 43-007-31210
7) BALLPARK CYN #1 API # 43-007-31015
8) CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 API # 43-007-31167
9) KENILWORTH RR #1 API # 43-007-31006
10) KENILWORTH RR #2 API # 43-007-31007
l1) CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 API # 43-007-31064
12) CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 API # 43-007-31065
13) CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 API # 43-007-31070

The Division requires the following actions to be completed by Marion Energy by the prescribed dates
listed below:

1) Provide the following monthly readings for each well listed above on the first of every month
beginning on April 1, 2013.

a. Surface Pressure
b. Casing Pressure
c. Fluid Levels

UTAH

DNR

1594West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 . facsimile(801)359-3940 . TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov on, sus a
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Page 2
February 22, 2013
Subject: Division Order to Comply with Notice of Violation

2) Plug and abandon the following wells by:
a. BALLPARK CYN 16-2X July 1, 2013
b. BALLPARK CYN 17-2 July 1, 2013
c. CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 July 1, 2013

3) Return the remaining wells not listed in Paragraph 2 to compliance by production, a MIT and
plan in accordance with U.A.C. R649-3-36, or plug and abandon by July 1, 2013.

Marion has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining a
request for review according to procedures set forth in R649-10-6. A request for review of a Division
Order must be filed with the secretary to the Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-5277, within 30 days of
issuance of the order.

In the event Marion does not comply with the Division Order by the dates listed above, the Division
will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining, as described in the U.A.C. R641,
requesting a Board Order to plug and restore the well sites. Should this matter be brought before the
Board, the Division will seek bond forfeiture (R649-3-36), liability for plugging costs in excess of bondforfeiture amounts (R649-3-1-4) and civil penalties of up to $10,000per day for each day of violation
(Utah Code Ann. §40-6-11).

Questionsregarding this order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance Manager at (801)-
538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Engineer, at (801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js

Exhibit

cc: John Rogers, Associate Director
Cameron Johnson, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Engineer
Compliance File
Well Files

N:\O&G Reviewed
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Marion has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining a
request for review according to procedures set forth in R649-10-6. A request for review of a Division
Order must be filed with the secretary to the Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-5277, within 30 days of
issuance of the order.

In the event Marion does not comply with the Division Order by the dates listed above, the Division
will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining, as described in the U.A.C. R641,
requesting a Board Order to plug and restore the well sites. Should this matter be brought before the
Board, the Division will seek bond forfeiture (R649-3-36), liability for plugging costs in excess of bondforfeiture amounts (R649-3-1-4) and civil penalties of up to $10,000per day for each day of violation
(Utah Code Ann. §40-6-11).

Questionsregarding this order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance Manager at (801)-
538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Engineer, at (801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js
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cc: John Rogers, Associate Director
Cameron Johnson, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Engineer
Compliance File
Well Files
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UTAH DEPARTMENT OP NATURALRESOURCES
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Oiland Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(601) 359-3940 Fax

NOTICE OF VIOLATION
STATE OF UTAH

OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION ACT

To the fo!Iowingoperator:
Name: MARIÓNENERGY INC.
Well(s) or Site(s): 1.) BALLPARKCYN 16-2X API : 43-007-31207

2.) CORDINGLY0YN 10-1 43-001-31173
3.) SALLPARKCYN 17-2 43-007-31169

4.) KENILWORTHRR 1-A 43-007-31229

5.) ALPtNE SCHOOLOISTR CT 6-17 43-007-3118¾

6.) OMAN 10-29 43-007-31210
7.) BALLPARKCANYON#1 43-007-31015

8.) CORDINGLYCYN 15-5 43-007-31167
9.) KEN(LWORTHRR #1 43-0Di-31006
10.)KENILWORTHRR#2 43-007-31007
11.) CORDINGLYCYN 15-2 43-007-31064
12.) CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 434107-31065

13) CORDINGLYCYN 11-1 43-007-31070

Date and Time of InspectionMolation: December 10, 2012
Maiting Address: Attn: Keri Cladte

3580 Orr Road
Allen, TX 75002

Under the authorityof the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act,Section 40-6 et. Seq., Utah Code Annotated, 1953, asamended, the undersigned authorizedrepresentative of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division)has conductedan inspection of the above described site and/or records on the above date and has found alleged violation(s) of theact, rules or permit conditionsas described below.

Description of Violation(s):
Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells - According to Rule R649-3-36, the operator is requiredto suoply the Division with masons for extended SUTA the length of timefor extended SI/TAand oroofof wei boreintegrity for every well Sf/TA over 12 consecutïve months. After 5 years of continued SUTA the weas afeto bepluqqed unless good cause is supplied to the Division for extended SVTAin additionto the required infounation justm_egioned
Rule R649-3-4.3,Bonding - If the division finds that a wen subject to this bonding rule is in violationof Rule RS49-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarity Abandoned Wells, the division shad require a bond amount for the applicablewett in theamount of actual plugging and site reatoration costs.
Rule R649-3-4.4.L Bonding - Wíthin 30 days of notificationby the division the operator shall subtnitto thedivision anestimate ofplugging and site restoration costs for division revieW and approvat
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UTAHDEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Oit and Gas Pogram

1594 West Nortft Temi)(e, Sulle 1210. Box 146801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

The Division has initiated several contacts withMarion Energy inc. (Marion) tequesting required documents andaction per R649,3-36. Wells 1 - 6 have previously been issued SIITANotices and Notices of Violationwithoutanythingbeing accomplished to move these wells out ofviolation. Wells 7 and 8 have also been issued a SitTANotice without having met the requirements of R649-3-3ß. Wells 9 - 13 are also in violation of R649-3-36 having beenadded toMarion'sSIITAviolationlist Allweis listed above are cunently undera DivisionOrderforindividual weKbonding.

There has not been any evidence of elloit being made tobring these wells into compliance. These weNs are inviolation of R-649-3-30as listed above. The Division requires Marion to put up Tullcost bonding for aBwella inviolation above per R649-34 It is also mandatory that Marion submitaR documentation as required by R649-3-36
conceminq shut-in and temporarilyabandoned welin.

Immediate Action: For the wells subject to this notice, Marion shall fulfill fullcost bondinq requirements foreach well. Mariori shall also submit all information as required by RS49-3-36 or plug and abandon or placethe wells on ;)roduction.

* Fines may be levied up ta¶t0,000.00 per day tur every weR in violation given the authorityprovided underU.C.A.40-8-ft, parta

This notice shaK remain in effect unti it is modilied, tenninatet or vacated by a wnlien noticeof an authorizedrepresentativeof the director of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Failureto complywiththisnoticewillresult in theDivisionpursuing further actions against said operalor. Furtheractions may include initiationof agency actions inorder fullcost bonding and plugging andabandonment af weils and requests for bond forfeiture and civilpe

Compliance Deadline: February 8 2013
D f Sesvice Mailing January 2013 Certified MailNo: 7010 16700001 48 103645

Dïvision'sRepreserdative Operator or Representative
(Ifpresented in person)

oc: ComplianceFile
Well Files
SITLA

6/2005
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manon
ENERGY

Febmaly 5, 2013

Department of Natural Resoun:es
DivisionofOilGas and Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suite 1210
Price, Ulah 84114

Atlantion: DustinDoucet
Petroleum Engineer

Re: Notilicationof ViolationJanuary 3, 2013
Operation Plan

Dear Dustin,

Folowing upon oureadier(Jan 18, 2013) letter to the Division,and subsequentdiscussions between
Marion,MichaelMalmquistof Parsons Behle, and Cameron Johnson, attomeyfor the Divisionof OilGas and Mining,Marionhas been asked10 put togethera plan of operationfor the wells mentioned onthe referenced violation.As the Divisionis aware Marionis currentlyimproving ils financialsituation. ThiswillallowMarionto operale the fields in Utah fully,as it has done so in the past From thissituationMarionwii plan todo the folowing;

Helper

Currentlyau thewensin Helper are connectedto theAnadarko gas and water disposal system. Each oftheweis on the Kenilworthand Cordinglysides ofthe fieldare connected by a closed gas and water
pipelinesystem to the Anadarko connectionpoint, througha Marionrightof way. Thissystemis currentlyshut down. Marionwinhave to contact Anadarko to set the system operational again. Marioncurrently
has a gas purchase and water disposal agreementin place withAnadarko. Priortoresuming operations
Marionwinneed to inspect each wel todetermine whether equipmentis missing(due to scavenging)or
otherwise in need ofreplacementor rehabilitationbefore the weis can be tumedback on.

Baupark Canyon 16-2X

This wel is currentlydriHed to 500' withsurfacecasingset in the shaiow hole. This wenwil need a rig
set to alow Marionto set cement in the hole, reduce thesurface casing, cap thewelland abandon the
weH.This wei wii be abandonedby the date of theJune Board hearing being June 26, 2013.

BallparkCanyon 17-2

This wen is currentlydriied to 500' withsurface casing set in theshallowhole. This weHwillneed a rig
set toalow Marionto set cement in the hole, reduce the surface casing, cap the wei and abandon the
wen. This wei wil be abandonedby thedate of the June Board hearing being June 26, 2013.

3580 Orr Road,
Alen, Texas,
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CordinglyCanyon 10-1

This wel has notbeen completedin theMancos section of the wei. Because of downhole wei problemsMarionplans to set a rig,plug the wei withcement and abandon thewen. This wei wiHbe abandoned bythe date August 8, 2013.

KenilworthRailroad#1A

This wellwas last produced in February 2009. It is a Buckhom Conglomerate wenand is capable ofproduction.This wel currentlyhas a pumping uniton the well.We willattempt tobring thewen onproduction priortotheend of 2013. ifthe wel is notproducingan MITwillbe done.

BanparkCanyon #1

This wellwas last produced in July 2010. It is a Ferron wei and currentlyhas a pumping uniton thewei.We wit attempt to bring the wellon production prior1othe end of 2013. Ifthewel is not producinganMITwinbe done.

KenilworthRailroad#1

This wellwas last produced in September 2010. It is a Ferron wen and currently has a pumping unitonthe wei. We wii attempt tobring the wellon productionpriorto the end of 2013. Ifthewell is notproducing an MIT willbe done.

KenilworthRailroad#2

This wellwas last produced in September 2010. It is a Ferron welland currentlyhas a pumping unitontheweltWe wiiattempttobringthewei on productionpriortothe end of 2013. IftheweUis not
producing an MITwii be done.

CordinglyCanyon 15-5

This wei was last produced inApril 2010. It is a Mancos weß, thoughit does not currently have a
pumping uniton the well Marionwil replace the equipment needed and winattempt to bringthe wel on
production priortotheend of 2013. Ifthewei is not producingan MITwinbe done.

CordinglyCanyon 1&-1

This wel was last produced in September 2010. This is a Ferron welland currently has a pumping unit
on thewefLWe wiHattempt to bring the wellon productionpriorto the end of 2013. Ifthe weHis not
producing an MITwinbe done.

CordinglyCanyon 15-2

This wei was last produced in September 2010. This is a Ferron wei, thoughit does not have a
hydraulic pumping uniton the well. Marionwinreplace the equipment needed, and winattempt to bring
the weß on production priorto the end of 2013. Ifthe wen is not producing an MITwillbe done.

3580 Orr Road,
AHen.Texas,
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the weß on production priorto the end of 2013. Ifthe wen is not producing an MITwillbe done.
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This wellwas last produced in September 2010. This is a Ferron wel, thoughit does not have ahydraulic pumping uniton the well Marionwiureplace the equipment needed, and willattempt to bringthe wellon production prior to theend of 2013. Ifthewellis not producing an MITwil be done.

Clear Creek

Oman 10-29.

This wel was driled to theFerron formalionbut was not completed. Recent operationsinthe last monthhave seen a pmduction pump placed on the well As weather improves in the area Marionwil attempt toproduce the wen.

AlpineSchool District6-17

This wel was drilled as a Ferron wei and was completed. Marionsubmitted applications to convert this
weHand the ASD 3-17 weH into water disposal wens. Afterthe ASD 3017 was approved, it was
determined thatone weKwas needed, and anoiher WD wellwas not needed at that time.The wel
currentlyhas a rotaflexpumping uniton it Marionplans to attempt productionfrom the wei by the end of2013. Ifthewel is not producing an MITwiHbe done.

Marionis proposing thisplan to address the January 3, 2013 Notice of Violation. Given the constraints of
Marion's financialsituation, we believe the plan containsreasonable timeframes for conducting work
either to abandonor put back on productionthe weRslisted in the NOV. We look forwardtohearing
from you regarding thismatter

Yours Sincerely

KeriClarke
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February 13,2013

Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suite1210
Salt Lake City,Utah 84114

Attention:Cameron Johnson, Assistant Attomey General

Re: Notificationof ViolationJanuary 3, 2013
Operation Plan

Dear Cameron,

This respondsto the email you sent to MikeMalmquiston behalf of the Division on February 8, 2013.

Anadarko Gas Purchase andWater Disposal Agreements

Marionhas in place a Gas Purchase Agreement withAnadarko lo purchase al gas produced in the field.
Anadarko has historicaly purchased gas from the fieldand wil continue todo so in thefulure. Marion
also has a Water Disposal System Agreement withAnadarko for al water produced in the Helper field.
Currenliy,MarionowesAnadarko of $47,500forwater disposal fees from historical production.As its
financialsitualionimproves Marionwinsettlethe account. Beyond settling ils account, Mariondoes not
anticipale any commercial issues withAnadarko thatcould interfere withgas sales or water disposal.

Water Disposal and Gas Gathering Sysiem

Once Marioncompleted its initialdriling program in the Helper Fieldand established thatthe weis were
productive,twoseparate HDPE trunklines were laid,one for gas and one for water. Each of the weis
was tiedin to the trunklines utilizingHDPE pipe. The tie lines and trunklines are owned by Marion. The
trunklines terminateat a facilitybuiltand operated by Anadarko near Kenilworth.A free water knock-out
was setto drop out any water in suspension withthe gas before delivery into Anadarko. The system is a
closed system. Naluralgas productionat the Helper fieldwas suspended whenMarionran intofinancial
issues. This decision to suspend productionwas made by Mariondue to the cash and human resource
issues, not by Anadarko lockingthe company outofthesystem. Each wellwas isolated from thegas
and water lines by shuttingthe respective valves ateach weihead.Additionally,at thetimethefieldwasshut-in

Anadarko was made aware of the Marionsituation. Subsequently, Anadarko fieldpersonnel securedthe
aforementionedequipment. The Helper pipelinesystemwas fullyoperationaland problem free when it
was shut down. We would not anticipateany problems withthe pipe itself,but here maybe some
weihead valves thatwii need to be examined before recommencing fieldoperations.

FinancialSituation

Mariondoes not believe that these negotiations are in vain due to its financial condition Marionhas
reason to believe that ils financial situalion willimprove withina timeframe thataccommodates the
compliance scheduleaddressed in thisand priorletters. More specifically,Marionexpectsto have
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access toadditionalfundingduring thefirsthalfof March2013 thatwillallowit tobegin the work in the
Helper field,withanother infusionin May2013.

Produce or MITWells

Mariondoes notbelieve thatitcan produce thewells by Aprill, 2013. Marionaccepls the Division's
pmposal to divide the wells into Pods withassociatedMITcompleliondates, but proposes thatan
additionalmonthbe added to the proposed MITcompletiondate foreach pod, as wellas the fullcost
bonding and backup date. This liming is moreconsistent withMarion's expeclation of when itwillhavethe available financialresources.

Pod 1: BallparkCanyon #1, KenilworthRailroad#1A, #1, #2: The MIT date for thispod of wells
would be June 1, 2013. The work would begin on theKenilworthRailroad#1A. The backup date forfult
cost bonding and showing ofwellintegritywould be July 1, 2013.

Pod 2: CordinglyCanyon 15-5, 15-2, 15-1, 11-1:The MITdate for thispod ofwellswouldbe
August 1, 2013. The backup date for fullcost bonding and showing of well integritywould be September
1 2013.

Pressure and Fluid Level Information

Withregard to DOGM's request for informationon pressures and fluidlevels in the Helperwells,we
would likelo makethe foHowingcomments. First,anyfielddata thatwas acquiredwhilethe fieldwas
operational willonly show what the operalingpressure of the systemwas Typicany, Anadarko was able
to keep enoughcompression operalingfield-wide to maintain 25-30 psi on our gas system. Second, the
water system in essence gravityfed into the Anadarko system,and as such,therewas negligible
pressure on this line at all times.Third,since the inechanical integrityof thecasing is the concem, the
tubingpressure would not provide meaningful information

We are not sure ifthesentence is supposed to read "productionpressures" and ifso what thatwould
mean exactly. As staled before, the fieldpressure was 25-30 psi when the fieldwas in operation.Since
thefieldis currentlyshut in there is no productionor"productionpressure." Allprevious production has
been reported. Conceming the last part of the sentencedealing withsurface pressures, fluidlevels etc.,
we see no definitiveconefation between thoseitems and casing integrity. Gathering such infonnation
now, and particularlygiven Mariorfs need tobe as efficientas possible with money and personnel,
would not appear to be a productive expenditureof resources. Marionproposes thatthisrequest be
withdrawn,and thatwe be allowed to focus on puttingourselvesin a positionto undedake MITs,which
are the truemeasure ofwell integrity,onthe scheduleproposed above. We wouldexpectthatwhen
Marionenters the Helper fieldtobegin the MITprocess the fluidlevels and surfacewellhead pressure
data willbe gathered for reservoir engineeringreasons, and we would be happy to providethat
informationto the Divisionas itis obtained.

Marionhopes this letter addresses thecommerds and requirernents outlined by the Oiland Gas Division
in your emailfrom February 8, 2013.

We look forward to hearing from you.

Yours Sincerely

KeriClarke
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January 18, 2013

Department of NaturalResources
DivisionofOiland Gas &Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suile 1210
Salt Lake City,Utah 84114

Atlenlion:Dustin Doucet

Re: Noticeof Violalion- Clear Creek and Helper Fields

Dear Duslin,

in response to your certilled letier of January 3, 2013, we are providingyou wilh information for wells thatare currentlystructured as shut in or temporarilyabandonedwells (Sl/TA)by DOGM.Each wellhasindividual inkxmation and is lisled below

As you know, for the last twoand a halfyears MarionEnergy Inc. (Marion)has been under financialsiress thathasnotallowedactiveoperationsin the Clear Creek and Helper fields,beyond mainlainingafieldpresence and takingsome limiled,preliminaryaclionsto resuming operahons. In thelast fewmonths, however, Marion has been able to improveils financialposition tothe pointof resuming activeoperations in theClear Creek lield,withfurther financialimprovement expected as thatfield is put backon production.

Marionexplained thesecircumslances10 DOGMand the Board of Oil,Gas and Miningat theOclober26, 2012 hearing, where Marionsoughtand obtained Board approval to reinstituteactive operations atClear Creek. As discussed at thehearing, Marion's funding is currently limiled tothe monies needed 10put theClearCreek lield back on production, beginning withtheOman 2-20 and Oman 10-29 wells,butonce thatoccurs Marionexpects ils iinancial positiontocontinue to improve tothepoint it can meet allofils obligationswithrespect io ils SI/TAwells, and to move back intoactive operationset the Helper Field

Consistent with discussions at the October Board hearing, we have now rehabiliiatedthemalerdisposal (WD)system in the accessibleportionof theClear Creek tieldand we are activelyworkingonrestoring productionat thetwoinitiallylargeled wells, despite theextremewinterweather condilionsthatset in severalweeks ago.

Helper

The wens listed in the NOVfor the Helper Field are al modemwens, having been driRedin 2005 or later.This tieldwas in production untilOclober 2010, thoughthe weis are now shut in. AHofthe Helper wellslisted in theNOVare currentlyattachedtoa gas and watersystem (theAnadarko sales and SWDsystem). This system is controledentirelyby Anadarko. Marionconducted an inspecion ofthe Helper
Field on 1-16-13 and confirmed that thereis noevidence ofanygas or water leaks at anyof the wels.
We undersland that DOGMhas also recentlyinspected the Helper Field and æached thesame
conclusion. Marion plans to bring this field into operation soon, as finances allow.Please be advisedthatMarionhas already provided weibore diagmms of all of theweHs referenced below.
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Baipark Canyon 16-2X

This wei is onlydriled to 500 feet on the Banparksite withsurface casingset The casingis 18"abovetheground and ithas a cap welded on thecasing. This wei was a replacement for the Balpark Canyon16-2 where thedriHingwas lost on thewellwhiledriling surfacepipe. Marionplans todrinthiswelltotheFerron in thefuture.

Baipark Canyon 17-2

This wel is the same as the16-2Xwel, and has been only drilledto 500 feet wilhsurface casing set it iscurrentlycapped on thesurface.

BallparkCanyon FI

This wen is drilledas a Ferron wei and has been compleled.Ithas been producing in the past thoughitis cunently shut in.There is a pumping uniton thewellAmong theHelper Fieldweis, thiswei is the onethathas theclosest proximilytooccupied struelures. We closelyinspected thiswellon 1-16-13 andconlirmed thatthereare no issues.

CordinglyCanyon 10-1

This wel was driled as a Fenon producer. However because of hole issues in the deeper sectionitwasexpectedtobe completedas a Mancos wel. Marionplans io complete thewel, and produce the wel inthefulure.

KenilwodhRRif1A

We had originaiy driied thiswel tobe a SWD wel for Helper. However we had posillve response fromthe Buckhom Conglomerate andwe compleledthewell in thatzone, The wellhas produced in the pastand we wiiplan io bring itback online soon. A situationregarding theweihead leakingat the sitewashandled by our operationspeople and thewei site is now clean of thisspii.
KenilworthRIW1

This wei was producing untilitwas shut in.There is a pumping uniton the well Marionplans to bringthiswenintopmduction soon.

KenilworthRR#2

This wel was producing untilitwas shut in.There is a pumping uniton thewei. Marionplans to bringthiswei intoproduction soon.

CordinglyCanyon 15-5

This wellwas driHedto theMancos formationand was completed.Itdid produce for a short timebeforebeing shut in. Marion plans towork on thiswei and toproduce itsoon.
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CordinglyCanyon 15-2

This wei was driied totheFerron formationand was completed.This wellwas producing untilitwasshut in.There is not currentlya hydraulicpumping uniton the well.Marionplans towork on thewei,replace the pumping unitand bring it back intoproduction soon.
CordinglyCanyon 15-1

This wellwas driied tothe Ferron formationand was completed. This wel was producinguntilitwasshut in. Itcurrently has a pumping uniton the well Marionplans to bring thiswei intoproductionsoon.
CordinglyCanyon 11-1

This wei was drilledtotheFerron formationand was completed. This wei was producing untilitwasshut in.These is not currentlya hydraulicpumping uniton the well Marionplans towork on the wei,replace the pumping unitand bring it inloproduction soon.
Clear Creek

The NOVlisis twowellsin the Clear Creek Field, the ASD &17 and theOman 10-29. Bolhof these aremodem weis driled añer 2005. The Clear Creek Fieldcame offproductionin July 2011 due to financialissues and a rupture in thewater disposal line.We have inspected both of theseweis in the last fewweeks and neitherhas any leaks or olher problems.

Folowing the Board hearing in Iale October, Marionhas re-commenced operationsinthe Clear CreekField. It has done an MITon thecurrentSWD well(theASD 3-17). Ithas replaced sevemi AirVacs onthewater line in the field,and tested the wholesystem. It has commencedoperalionsin the iield ontwoweis, the Oman 2-20 and theOman 10-29. Given ils financial situation improving, Marionplans toexpand operations to additionalClear Cleek weis in the near future. Please be advised thatMarionhasprovidedweiborediagrams on these weis in thepast.

ASD 6-17

This wei was driRed as a Ferron wei and was completed.Marionsubmilled applications toconvert thiswelland theASD 3-17 wei into WD weis, to ensure thatat least one WD wellwas permitied. Atler theASD 3-17 was approved, itwas determined thatitwouldsuffice and anotherWD wei was notneeded atthattime.The wei cunently has a rolallexpumping uniton it Marionplans to commence operations onthisweUand bring iton toproduclionsoon.

Oman 10-29

This wei was driied totheFerron but was not compleled. Since resuming operations in theClear Creekliekl in November, Marionhas sent in a completionformfor thewell,and has done a flowtest on theweH.Recent operationsin the last monthhave seen a production pump placed on the wel. As weatherimproves in thearea Marionwii produce thewel.
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Bondinq

Mariondoes not currentlyhave thefinancialwherewithaltoundertake fui cost bonding of al of theweislisted in theNOV,and wiinot be in a conditionto do so untilits financialsituationfurther improves. Wenole,however, thatMarioncurrentlyis bonded withDOGMfor $451,500($421,500surety bond and$30,000cash bond), and DOGMholds an additional$184,000of cash for reclamation of Marionweis,meaningthereis over $630,000in place withDOGMfor reclamation, When added toMarion'sfederaland SITLAbonds, there is just under $1,000,000currendyavailable for Marion reclamalion.
Based on theabove information,Marionrespectfuiy requests thatDOGM extendthe SITTAslatus onthese Weis, and withholdfurther enforcementaclion whileMarionbrings the Clear Creek Fieldback onproductionand continuestoimprove ils financialcondilionto the point itcan put move back intotheHelper fieldand put those weis back into producion as wei, therebyremoving theweis from SIITAstatus.

We would be happy to meetwilhyou lo further discuss thismaner. In the meantime,feel free to contactus shouldyou need anythingfurlher.

Yours Sincerely,

KeriClarke
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& State of Utah
/ DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

°•s ./ MICHAEL R. STYLER
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR. Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

DIVISION ORDER

February 22, 2013
Certified Mail #7010 16700001 4810 3898

Marion Energy
Attn: Keri Clarke
3 e0 O«XR5a0d0

2 \SS 10E lb
RE: Division Order to Comply with the Notice of Violation Issued to Marion Energy on January 3, 2013

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) memorializes the actions Marion Energy (Marion) is
required to perform in order to return the wells listed below to compliance under Utah Admin. CodeR649-3-36.

1) BALLPARK CYN 16-2X API # 43-007-31207
2) CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 API # 43-007-31173
3) BALLPARK CYN 17-2 API # 43-007-31169
4) KENILWORTH RR 1-A API # 43-007-31229
5) ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT 6-17 API # 43-007-31181
6) OMAN 10-29 API # 43-007-31210
7) BALLPARK CYN #1 API # 43-007-31015
8) CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 API # 43-007-31167
9) KENILWORTH RR #1 API # 43-007-31006
10) KENILWORTH RR #2 API # 43-007-31007
l1) CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 API # 43-007-31064
12) CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 API # 43-007-31065
13) CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 API # 43-007-31070

The Division requires the following actions to be completed by Marion Energy by the prescribed dates
listed below:

1) Provide the following monthly readings for each well listed above on the first of every month
beginning on April 1, 2013.

a. Surface Pressure
b. Casing Pressure
c. Fluid Levels

UTAH

DNR

1594West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 . facsimile(801)359-3940 . TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov on, sus a
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Page 2
February 22, 2013
Subject: Division Order to Comply with Notice of Violation

2) Plug and abandon the following wells by:
a. BALLPARK CYN 16-2X July 1, 2013
b. BALLPARK CYN 17-2 July 1, 2013
c. CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 July 1, 2013

3) Return the remaining wells not listed in Paragraph 2 to compliance by production, a MIT and
plan in accordance with U.A.C. R649-3-36, or plug and abandon by July 1, 2013.

Marion has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining a
request for review according to procedures set forth in R649-10-6. A request for review of a Division
Order must be filed with the secretary to the Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-5277, within 30 days of
issuance of the order.

In the event Marion does not comply with the Division Order by the dates listed above, the Division
will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining, as described in the U.A.C. R641,
requesting a Board Order to plug and restore the well sites. Should this matter be brought before the
Board, the Division will seek bond forfeiture (R649-3-36), liability for plugging costs in excess of bondforfeiture amounts (R649-3-1-4) and civil penalties of up to $10,000per day for each day of violation
(Utah Code Ann. §40-6-11).

Questionsregarding this order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance Manager at (801)-
538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Engineer, at (801) 538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager

CLD/js

Exhibit

cc: John Rogers, Associate Director
Cameron Johnson, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Engineer
Compliance File
Well Files

N:\O&G Reviewed
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UTAH DEPARTMENT OP NATURALRESOURCES
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Oiland Gas Program

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(601) 359-3940 Fax

NOTICE OF VIOLATION
STATE OF UTAH

OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION ACT

To the fo!Iowingoperator:
Name: MARIÓNENERGY INC.
Well(s) or Site(s): 1.) BALLPARKCYN 16-2X API : 43-007-31207

2.) CORDINGLY0YN 10-1 43-001-31173
3.) SALLPARKCYN 17-2 43-007-31169

4.) KENILWORTHRR 1-A 43-007-31229

5.) ALPtNE SCHOOLOISTR CT 6-17 43-007-3118¾

6.) OMAN 10-29 43-007-31210
7.) BALLPARKCANYON#1 43-007-31015

8.) CORDINGLYCYN 15-5 43-007-31167
9.) KEN(LWORTHRR #1 43-0Di-31006
10.)KENILWORTHRR#2 43-007-31007
11.) CORDINGLYCYN 15-2 43-007-31064
12.) CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 434107-31065

13) CORDINGLYCYN 11-1 43-007-31070

Date and Time of InspectionMolation: December 10, 2012
Maiting Address: Attn: Keri Cladte

3580 Orr Road
Allen, TX 75002

Under the authorityof the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act,Section 40-6 et. Seq., Utah Code Annotated, 1953, asamended, the undersigned authorizedrepresentative of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division)has conductedan inspection of the above described site and/or records on the above date and has found alleged violation(s) of theact, rules or permit conditionsas described below.

Description of Violation(s):
Rule R649-3-36, Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells - According to Rule R649-3-36, the operator is requiredto suoply the Division with masons for extended SUTA the length of timefor extended SI/TAand oroofof wei boreintegrity for every well Sf/TA over 12 consecutïve months. After 5 years of continued SUTA the weas afeto bepluqqed unless good cause is supplied to the Division for extended SVTAin additionto the required infounation justm_egioned
Rule R649-3-4.3,Bonding - If the division finds that a wen subject to this bonding rule is in violationof Rule RS49-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarity Abandoned Wells, the division shad require a bond amount for the applicablewett in theamount of actual plugging and site reatoration costs.
Rule R649-3-4.4.L Bonding - Wíthin 30 days of notificationby the division the operator shall subtnitto thedivision anestimate ofplugging and site restoration costs for division revieW and approvat
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UTAHDEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Oit and Gas Pogram

1594 West Nortft Temi)(e, Sulle 1210. Box 146801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(801) 538-5340 Phone

(801) 359-3940 Fax

The Division has initiated several contacts withMarion Energy inc. (Marion) tequesting required documents andaction per R649,3-36. Wells 1 - 6 have previously been issued SIITANotices and Notices of Violationwithoutanythingbeing accomplished to move these wells out ofviolation. Wells 7 and 8 have also been issued a SitTANotice without having met the requirements of R649-3-3ß. Wells 9 - 13 are also in violation of R649-3-36 having beenadded toMarion'sSIITAviolationlist Allweis listed above are cunently undera DivisionOrderforindividual weKbonding.

There has not been any evidence of elloit being made tobring these wells into compliance. These weNs are inviolation of R-649-3-30as listed above. The Division requires Marion to put up Tullcost bonding for aBwella inviolation above per R649-34 It is also mandatory that Marion submitaR documentation as required by R649-3-36
conceminq shut-in and temporarilyabandoned welin.

Immediate Action: For the wells subject to this notice, Marion shall fulfill fullcost bondinq requirements foreach well. Mariori shall also submit all information as required by RS49-3-36 or plug and abandon or placethe wells on ;)roduction.

* Fines may be levied up ta¶t0,000.00 per day tur every weR in violation given the authorityprovided underU.C.A.40-8-ft, parta

This notice shaK remain in effect unti it is modilied, tenninatet or vacated by a wnlien noticeof an authorizedrepresentativeof the director of the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Failureto complywiththisnoticewillresult in theDivisionpursuing further actions against said operalor. Furtheractions may include initiationof agency actions inorder fullcost bonding and plugging andabandonment af weils and requests for bond forfeiture and civilpe

Compliance Deadline: February 8 2013
D f Sesvice Mailing January 2013 Certified MailNo: 7010 16700001 48 103645

Dïvision'sRepreserdative Operator or Representative
(Ifpresented in person)

oc: ComplianceFile
Well Files
SITLA

6/2005
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Febmaly 5, 2013

Department of Natural Resoun:es
DivisionofOilGas and Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suite 1210
Price, Ulah 84114

Atlantion: DustinDoucet
Petroleum Engineer

Re: Notilicationof ViolationJanuary 3, 2013
Operation Plan

Dear Dustin,

Folowing upon oureadier(Jan 18, 2013) letter to the Division,and subsequentdiscussions between
Marion,MichaelMalmquistof Parsons Behle, and Cameron Johnson, attomeyfor the Divisionof OilGas and Mining,Marionhas been asked10 put togethera plan of operationfor the wells mentioned onthe referenced violation.As the Divisionis aware Marionis currentlyimproving ils financialsituation. ThiswillallowMarionto operale the fields in Utah fully,as it has done so in the past From thissituationMarionwii plan todo the folowing;

Helper

Currentlyau thewensin Helper are connectedto theAnadarko gas and water disposal system. Each oftheweis on the Kenilworthand Cordinglysides ofthe fieldare connected by a closed gas and water
pipelinesystem to the Anadarko connectionpoint, througha Marionrightof way. Thissystemis currentlyshut down. Marionwinhave to contact Anadarko to set the system operational again. Marioncurrently
has a gas purchase and water disposal agreementin place withAnadarko. Priortoresuming operations
Marionwinneed to inspect each wel todetermine whether equipmentis missing(due to scavenging)or
otherwise in need ofreplacementor rehabilitationbefore the weis can be tumedback on.

Baupark Canyon 16-2X

This wel is currentlydriHed to 500' withsurfacecasingset in the shaiow hole. This wenwil need a rig
set to alow Marionto set cement in the hole, reduce thesurface casing, cap thewelland abandon the
weH.This wei wii be abandonedby the date of theJune Board hearing being June 26, 2013.

BallparkCanyon 17-2

This wen is currentlydriied to 500' withsurface casing set in theshallowhole. This weHwillneed a rig
set toalow Marionto set cement in the hole, reduce the surface casing, cap the wei and abandon the
wen. This wei wil be abandonedby thedate of the June Board hearing being June 26, 2013.

3580 Orr Road,
Alen, Texas,
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CordinglyCanyon 10-1

This wel has notbeen completedin theMancos section of the wei. Because of downhole wei problemsMarionplans to set a rig,plug the wei withcement and abandon thewen. This wei wiHbe abandoned bythe date August 8, 2013.

KenilworthRailroad#1A

This wellwas last produced in February 2009. It is a Buckhom Conglomerate wenand is capable ofproduction.This wel currentlyhas a pumping uniton the well.We willattempt tobring thewen onproduction priortotheend of 2013. ifthe wel is notproducingan MITwillbe done.

BanparkCanyon #1

This wellwas last produced in July 2010. It is a Ferron wei and currentlyhas a pumping uniton thewei.We wit attempt to bring the wellon production prior1othe end of 2013. Ifthewel is not producinganMITwinbe done.

KenilworthRailroad#1

This wellwas last produced in September 2010. It is a Ferron wen and currently has a pumping unitonthe wei. We wii attempt tobring the wellon productionpriorto the end of 2013. Ifthewell is notproducing an MIT willbe done.

KenilworthRailroad#2

This wellwas last produced in September 2010. It is a Ferron welland currentlyhas a pumping unitontheweltWe wiiattempttobringthewei on productionpriortothe end of 2013. IftheweUis not
producing an MITwii be done.

CordinglyCanyon 15-5

This wei was last produced inApril 2010. It is a Mancos weß, thoughit does not currently have a
pumping uniton the well Marionwil replace the equipment needed and winattempt to bringthe wel on
production priortotheend of 2013. Ifthewei is not producingan MITwinbe done.

CordinglyCanyon 1&-1

This wel was last produced in September 2010. This is a Ferron welland currently has a pumping unit
on thewefLWe wiHattempt to bring the wellon productionpriorto the end of 2013. Ifthe weHis not
producing an MITwinbe done.

CordinglyCanyon 15-2

This wei was last produced in September 2010. This is a Ferron wei, thoughit does not have a
hydraulic pumping uniton the well. Marionwinreplace the equipment needed, and winattempt to bring
the weß on production priorto the end of 2013. Ifthe wen is not producing an MITwillbe done.

3580 Orr Road,
AHen.Texas,
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CordinglyCanyon 11-1

This wellwas last produced in September 2010. This is a Ferron wel, thoughit does not have ahydraulic pumping uniton the well Marionwiureplace the equipment needed, and willattempt to bringthe wellon production prior to theend of 2013. Ifthewellis not producing an MITwil be done.

Clear Creek

Oman 10-29.

This wel was driled to theFerron formalionbut was not completed. Recent operationsinthe last monthhave seen a pmduction pump placed on the well As weather improves in the area Marionwil attempt toproduce the wen.

AlpineSchool District6-17

This wel was drilled as a Ferron wei and was completed. Marionsubmitted applications to convert this
weHand the ASD 3-17 weH into water disposal wens. Afterthe ASD 3017 was approved, it was
determined thatone weKwas needed, and anoiher WD wellwas not needed at that time.The wel
currentlyhas a rotaflexpumping uniton it Marionplans to attempt productionfrom the wei by the end of2013. Ifthewel is not producing an MITwiHbe done.

Marionis proposing thisplan to address the January 3, 2013 Notice of Violation. Given the constraints of
Marion's financialsituation, we believe the plan containsreasonable timeframes for conducting work
either to abandonor put back on productionthe weRslisted in the NOV. We look forwardtohearing
from you regarding thismatter

Yours Sincerely

KeriClarke

3580 Orr Road,
Allen, Texas,
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February 13,2013

Department of Natural Resources
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suite1210
Salt Lake City,Utah 84114

Attention:Cameron Johnson, Assistant Attomey General

Re: Notificationof ViolationJanuary 3, 2013
Operation Plan

Dear Cameron,

This respondsto the email you sent to MikeMalmquiston behalf of the Division on February 8, 2013.

Anadarko Gas Purchase andWater Disposal Agreements

Marionhas in place a Gas Purchase Agreement withAnadarko lo purchase al gas produced in the field.
Anadarko has historicaly purchased gas from the fieldand wil continue todo so in thefulure. Marion
also has a Water Disposal System Agreement withAnadarko for al water produced in the Helper field.
Currenliy,MarionowesAnadarko of $47,500forwater disposal fees from historical production.As its
financialsitualionimproves Marionwinsettlethe account. Beyond settling ils account, Mariondoes not
anticipale any commercial issues withAnadarko thatcould interfere withgas sales or water disposal.

Water Disposal and Gas Gathering Sysiem

Once Marioncompleted its initialdriling program in the Helper Fieldand established thatthe weis were
productive,twoseparate HDPE trunklines were laid,one for gas and one for water. Each of the weis
was tiedin to the trunklines utilizingHDPE pipe. The tie lines and trunklines are owned by Marion. The
trunklines terminateat a facilitybuiltand operated by Anadarko near Kenilworth.A free water knock-out
was setto drop out any water in suspension withthe gas before delivery into Anadarko. The system is a
closed system. Naluralgas productionat the Helper fieldwas suspended whenMarionran intofinancial
issues. This decision to suspend productionwas made by Mariondue to the cash and human resource
issues, not by Anadarko lockingthe company outofthesystem. Each wellwas isolated from thegas
and water lines by shuttingthe respective valves ateach weihead.Additionally,at thetimethefieldwasshut-in

Anadarko was made aware of the Marionsituation. Subsequently, Anadarko fieldpersonnel securedthe
aforementionedequipment. The Helper pipelinesystemwas fullyoperationaland problem free when it
was shut down. We would not anticipateany problems withthe pipe itself,but here maybe some
weihead valves thatwii need to be examined before recommencing fieldoperations.

FinancialSituation

Mariondoes not believe that these negotiations are in vain due to its financial condition Marionhas
reason to believe that ils financial situalion willimprove withina timeframe thataccommodates the
compliance scheduleaddressed in thisand priorletters. More specifically,Marionexpectsto have

3580 Orr Road,
AHen,Texas,
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access toadditionalfundingduring thefirsthalfof March2013 thatwillallowit tobegin the work in the
Helper field,withanother infusionin May2013.

Produce or MITWells

Mariondoes notbelieve thatitcan produce thewells by Aprill, 2013. Marionaccepls the Division's
pmposal to divide the wells into Pods withassociatedMITcompleliondates, but proposes thatan
additionalmonthbe added to the proposed MITcompletiondate foreach pod, as wellas the fullcost
bonding and backup date. This liming is moreconsistent withMarion's expeclation of when itwillhavethe available financialresources.

Pod 1: BallparkCanyon #1, KenilworthRailroad#1A, #1, #2: The MIT date for thispod of wells
would be June 1, 2013. The work would begin on theKenilworthRailroad#1A. The backup date forfult
cost bonding and showing ofwellintegritywould be July 1, 2013.

Pod 2: CordinglyCanyon 15-5, 15-2, 15-1, 11-1:The MITdate for thispod ofwellswouldbe
August 1, 2013. The backup date for fullcost bonding and showing of well integritywould be September
1 2013.

Pressure and Fluid Level Information

Withregard to DOGM's request for informationon pressures and fluidlevels in the Helperwells,we
would likelo makethe foHowingcomments. First,anyfielddata thatwas acquiredwhilethe fieldwas
operational willonly show what the operalingpressure of the systemwas Typicany, Anadarko was able
to keep enoughcompression operalingfield-wide to maintain 25-30 psi on our gas system. Second, the
water system in essence gravityfed into the Anadarko system,and as such,therewas negligible
pressure on this line at all times.Third,since the inechanical integrityof thecasing is the concem, the
tubingpressure would not provide meaningful information

We are not sure ifthesentence is supposed to read "productionpressures" and ifso what thatwould
mean exactly. As staled before, the fieldpressure was 25-30 psi when the fieldwas in operation.Since
thefieldis currentlyshut in there is no productionor"productionpressure." Allprevious production has
been reported. Conceming the last part of the sentencedealing withsurface pressures, fluidlevels etc.,
we see no definitiveconefation between thoseitems and casing integrity. Gathering such infonnation
now, and particularlygiven Mariorfs need tobe as efficientas possible with money and personnel,
would not appear to be a productive expenditureof resources. Marionproposes thatthisrequest be
withdrawn,and thatwe be allowed to focus on puttingourselvesin a positionto undedake MITs,which
are the truemeasure ofwell integrity,onthe scheduleproposed above. We wouldexpectthatwhen
Marionenters the Helper fieldtobegin the MITprocess the fluidlevels and surfacewellhead pressure
data willbe gathered for reservoir engineeringreasons, and we would be happy to providethat
informationto the Divisionas itis obtained.

Marionhopes this letter addresses thecommerds and requirernents outlined by the Oiland Gas Division
in your emailfrom February 8, 2013.

We look forward to hearing from you.

Yours Sincerely

KeriClarke

3580 Orr Road,
AHen, Texas,



... RECElVED
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MUNG
6. [F INDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Kenilworth/Cordingly Field

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

31 No. Main Street an Helper Ut 7,,84626 (435) 650-3923 Kenilworth/Cordingly Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbam

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O AClDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DiŠPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATlONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Kenilworth/Cordingly Field

Well pressures taken and documented. See attachment.

We are currently unable to get fluid levels but are working to correct the issue.

DaveSmith Construction/Maintenance
SNAG REEA ATLEE

4/1/2013

(This space for State use only) Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) For Record

... RECElVED
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MUNG
6. [F INDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Kenilworth/Cordingly Field

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

31 No. Main Street an Helper Ut 7,,84626 (435) 650-3923 Kenilworth/Cordingly Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbam

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O AClDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DiŠPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATlONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Kenilworth/Cordingly Field

Well pressures taken and documented. See attachment.

We are currently unable to get fluid levels but are working to correct the issue.

DaveSmith Construction/Maintenance
SNAG REEA ATLEE

4/1/2013

(This space for State use only) Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) For Record

... RECElVED
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MUNG
6. [F INDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Kenilworth/Cordingly Field

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

31 No. Main Street an Helper Ut 7,,84626 (435) 650-3923 Kenilworth/Cordingly Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbam

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O AClDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DiŠPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATlONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Kenilworth/Cordingly Field

Well pressures taken and documented. See attachment.

We are currently unable to get fluid levels but are working to correct the issue.

DaveSmith Construction/Maintenance
SNAG REEA ATLEE

4/1/2013

(This space for State use only) Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) For Record
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Kenihuodh/Cordingly

Pressures

15-1

Tubing 0 Casing 5

15-5

Tubing 0 Casing 0

15-2

Tubing 0 Casing 0

10-1

Tubing 0 Casing 15

Cordingly 11-1
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15-3

Tubing 20' Casing 50
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INSTRUCTIONS

This form shall be submitted by the operator to show the intention and/or completion of the following:
e miscellaneous work projects and actions for which other specific report forms do not exist;
e all other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas

Conservation General Rules, including:
- minor deepening of an existing well bore,
- plugging back a well,
- recompleting to a different producing formation within an existing well bore (intent only),
- reperforating the current producing formation,
- drilling a sidetrack to repair a well,
- reporting monthly the status of each drillingwell.

This form is not to be used for pronosals to
- drillnew wells,
- reenter previously plugged and abandoned wells,
- significantlydeepen existing wells below theircurrent bottom-hole depth,
- drillhorizontal laterals from an existing well bore,
- drill hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests.

Use Form 3, Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for such proposals.

NOTICE OF INTENT - A notice of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submitted in duplicate and must be received and approved by the divisionbefore the work is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the division in ample time for proper consideration and action. In cases of
emergency, the operator may obtain verbal approval to commence work.Withinfive days after receivingverbal approval,
the operator shall submit a Sundry Notice describing the work and acknowledging the verbal approval.

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submitted to the division within 30 days of the completion of
the outlined work. Specific details of the work performed should be provided, including dates, well depths, placement
of plugs, etc.

WELL ABANDONMENT - Proposals to abandon a well and subsequent reports of abandonment should include reasons
for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significant fluid
contents not sealed off by cement or otherwise; depths (topand bottom) and method of placement of cement plugs;
mud or other material placed below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method of parting of any casing, liner,
or tubingpulled and the depth to top of any left in the hole; method of closing top of well;and date well site conditioned
for final inspection looking to approval of the abandonment.

In addition to any Sundry Notice forms submitted, Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log must
be submitted to the division to report the results of the following operations:
• completing or plugging a new well,
• reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well,
• significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the current bottom-hole depth,
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore,
e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests,
• recompleting to a different producing formation.

Send to:

Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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- drill hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests.

Use Form 3, Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for such proposals.

NOTICE OF INTENT - A notice of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submitted in duplicate and must be received and approved by the divisionbefore the work is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the division in ample time for proper consideration and action. In cases of
emergency, the operator may obtain verbal approval to commence work.Withinfive days after receivingverbal approval,
the operator shall submit a Sundry Notice describing the work and acknowledging the verbal approval.
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• completing or plugging a new well,
• reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well,
• significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the current bottom-hole depth,
• drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore,
e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests,
• recompleting to a different producing formation.

Send to:

Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



1) BALLPARKCYN 16-2X API # 43-007-31207
2) CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 API # 43-007-3 1173
3) BALLPARKCYN 17-2 API # 43-007-31169
4) KENILWORTH RR 1-A API # 43-007-31229
5) ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT 6-17 API #43-007-31181
6) OMAN 10-29 API # 43-007-31210
7) BALLPARK CYN #1 API # 43-007-31015
8) CORDINGLYCYN 15-5 API # 43-007-31167
9) KENILWORTHRR #1 API # 43-007-31006
10) KENILWORTH RR #2 API # 43-007-31007
11) CORDINGLYCYN 15-2 API # 43-007-31064
12) CORDINGLYCYN 15-1 API # 43-007-31065
13) CORDINGLYCYN I1-1 API #

1) BALLPARKCYN 16-2X API # 43-007-31207
2) CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 API # 43-007-3 1173
3) BALLPARKCYN 17-2 API # 43-007-31169
4) KENILWORTH RR 1-A API # 43-007-31229
5) ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT 6-17 API #43-007-31181
6) OMAN 10-29 API # 43-007-31210
7) BALLPARK CYN #1 API # 43-007-31015
8) CORDINGLYCYN 15-5 API # 43-007-31167
9) KENILWORTHRR #1 API # 43-007-31006
10) KENILWORTH RR #2 API # 43-007-31007
11) CORDINGLYCYN 15-2 API # 43-007-31064
12) CORDINGLYCYN 15-1 API # 43-007-31065
13) CORDINGLYCYN I1-1 API #
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING & LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

6 1F INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7 UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for pmposals to dnti new wells. signilicantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hoe depth. reenter plugged wens, or lodrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILLform forsuch proposals

i TYPE OF WELL --- 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL LQ OTHER .Kenilworth/CordinglyCanyon
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR

9 API NUMBER
Marion Energy, Inc.

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDANDPOOL OR WILDCAT31 No. Main St om Helper 84526 (435) 650-3923 Kenilworth
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE. COUNTY Carbon

QTROTR, SECTION. TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN STATE
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(Submd in DLelicate) ALTER CASING MACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Appror.mate date work wiOstart CASINGREPAR NEWCONSTRUCTON TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON O VENT OR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLJG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATU MODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion
O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER

O coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

See attached documents. Pressures and water and gas for April.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas a ning
nly

Dave Smith
TITLE CODSÍTUCtÎOn/Maintenance

DATE 5/1/2013

(Tills space for State use only)

RECEIVED
MAY0 12013(&2000) (See Instructions on Rewrse Side)

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&
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Pressures
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Tubing 0 Casing 5
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Clear Creek

1029

Tubing 0 Casing 0
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
SPENCER J. COX JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Dívision Director

June 2, 2014

Certified Mail #7003 2260 0003 2358 7004

Jeff Clarke
Marion Energy, Inc.
3580 Orr Road (gg gg
Allen, Texas 75002

Subject: Notice of Violation for Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells

Dear Mr. Clarke:

The Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) issued Marion Energy, Inc (Marion) a
Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Notice of Violation (NOV), dated January 3, 2013, for the
following thirteen (13) wells.

Ballpark Cyn 16-2X 43-007-31207 Plugged and Abandoned - June 2013
Cordingly Cyn 10-1 43-007-31173 Plugged and Abandoned - October 2012
Ballpark Cyn 17-2 43-007-31169 Plugged and Abandoned - June 2013
Kenilworth RR 1-A 43-007-31229 Last Production - November 2008
Alpine School District 6-17 43-007-31181 Last Production - November 2008
Oman 10-29 43-007-31210 Comp - November 2008, Never Produced
Ballpark Cyn #1 43-007-31015 Last Production - June 2010
Cordingly Cyn 15-5 43-007-31167 Last Production - April 2010
Kenilworth RR #1 43-007-31006 Last Production - August 2010
Kenilworth RR#2 43-007-31007 Last Production - August 2010
Cordingly Cyn 15-2 43-007-31064 Last Production - August 2010
Cordingly Cyn 15-1 43-007-31065 Last Production - August 2010
Cordingly Cyn 11-1 43-007-31070 Last Production - August 2010

Marion plugged and abandoned the Ballpark Cyn 16-2X, Cordingly Cyn 10-1 and
Ballpark Cyn 17-2 wells. The other ten (10) wells are still in noncompliance with Rule R64-3-16
Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Wells. If work was done on the wells Marion has not
submitted notice of intent or subsequent sundry notices to the Division. If any work has been
done on the wells please submit sundries immediately for the well files.

The operator is responsible to file, yearly, for extended shut-in or temporary
abandonment for wells shut-in or temporarily abandoned for a period of twelve (12) consecutive
months. Marion must file a Sundry Notice providing the following information for each of the
above ten noncompliance wells; reasons for shut-in or temporarily abandonment of the well, UTAH

length of time the well is expected to be shut-in or temporarily abandoned and an explanatioDNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www ogm.utah.gov

OIL, GAS &
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Page 2
Marion Energy, Inc.
June 2, 2014

and supporting data showing the well has integrity (R649-3-36.1). After review the Division will
either approve the continued shut-in or temporarily abandoned status or require remedial action
(R649-3-36.2). After five (5) years of non-activity or non-productivity, the well shall be plugged
in accordance with R649-3-24, unless approval for extended shut-in time is given by the
Division upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-36.3). Please note, three (3) of
the ten noncompliance wells listed above have been shut-in over five (5) years.

Marion has until June 30, 2014 to submit sundries, for the subject wells, in accordance
with Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule 649-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarily
Abandoned Wells.

Should Marion not meet shut-in and temporarily abandoned well requirements, the
Division is prepared to file a Notice of Agency Action (NAA) for Commencement of Informal
Adjudicative Proceedings (R649-10-3) for this matter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rule R649-10 Administrative Procedures.

If you have any questions or need further assistance, please feel free to contact me at
clintondworshak@utah.gov or 801-538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer, at dustindoucet@utah.gov
or 801-538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Oil and Gas Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Oil & Gas Associate Director

Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Well Files
Compliance File

N:\O&G Reviewed

Page 2
Marion Energy, Inc.
June 2, 2014

and supporting data showing the well has integrity (R649-3-36.1). After review the Division will
either approve the continued shut-in or temporarily abandoned status or require remedial action
(R649-3-36.2). After five (5) years of non-activity or non-productivity, the well shall be plugged
in accordance with R649-3-24, unless approval for extended shut-in time is given by the
Division upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-36.3). Please note, three (3) of
the ten noncompliance wells listed above have been shut-in over five (5) years.

Marion has until June 30, 2014 to submit sundries, for the subject wells, in accordance
with Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule 649-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarily
Abandoned Wells.

Should Marion not meet shut-in and temporarily abandoned well requirements, the
Division is prepared to file a Notice of Agency Action (NAA) for Commencement of Informal
Adjudicative Proceedings (R649-10-3) for this matter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rule R649-10 Administrative Procedures.

If you have any questions or need further assistance, please feel free to contact me at
clintondworshak@utah.gov or 801-538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer, at dustindoucet@utah.gov
or 801-538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Oil and Gas Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Oil & Gas Associate Director

Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Well Files
Compliance File

N:\O&G Reviewed

Page 2
Marion Energy, Inc.
June 2, 2014

and supporting data showing the well has integrity (R649-3-36.1). After review the Division will
either approve the continued shut-in or temporarily abandoned status or require remedial action
(R649-3-36.2). After five (5) years of non-activity or non-productivity, the well shall be plugged
in accordance with R649-3-24, unless approval for extended shut-in time is given by the
Division upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-36.3). Please note, three (3) of
the ten noncompliance wells listed above have been shut-in over five (5) years.

Marion has until June 30, 2014 to submit sundries, for the subject wells, in accordance
with Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule 649-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarily
Abandoned Wells.

Should Marion not meet shut-in and temporarily abandoned well requirements, the
Division is prepared to file a Notice of Agency Action (NAA) for Commencement of Informal
Adjudicative Proceedings (R649-10-3) for this matter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rule R649-10 Administrative Procedures.

If you have any questions or need further assistance, please feel free to contact me at
clintondworshak@utah.gov or 801-538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer, at dustindoucet@utah.gov
or 801-538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Oil and Gas Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Oil & Gas Associate Director

Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Well Files
Compliance File

N:\O&G Reviewed

Page 2
Marion Energy, Inc.
June 2, 2014

and supporting data showing the well has integrity (R649-3-36.1). After review the Division will
either approve the continued shut-in or temporarily abandoned status or require remedial action
(R649-3-36.2). After five (5) years of non-activity or non-productivity, the well shall be plugged
in accordance with R649-3-24, unless approval for extended shut-in time is given by the
Division upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-36.3). Please note, three (3) of
the ten noncompliance wells listed above have been shut-in over five (5) years.

Marion has until June 30, 2014 to submit sundries, for the subject wells, in accordance
with Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule 649-3-36 Shut-in and Temporarily
Abandoned Wells.

Should Marion not meet shut-in and temporarily abandoned well requirements, the
Division is prepared to file a Notice of Agency Action (NAA) for Commencement of Informal
Adjudicative Proceedings (R649-10-3) for this matter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rule R649-10 Administrative Procedures.

If you have any questions or need further assistance, please feel free to contact me at
clintondworshak@utah.gov or 801-538-5280 or Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer, at dustindoucet@utah.gov
or 801-538-5281.

Sincerely,

Clinton Dworshak
Oil and Gas Compliance Manager

CLD/js
cc: John Rogers, Oil & Gas Associate Director

Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Well Files
Compliance File

N:\O&G Reviewed



RECEIVED: Jul. 14, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 KENILWORTH RR 1-A 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 MARION ENERGY, INC.

9. API NUMBER:
 43007312290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 HELPER 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0304 FSL 1315 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 16 Township: 13.0S Range: 10.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 CARBON 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/31 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The wells in the Helper field continue in temporary shut-in
status due to Marion’s financial circumstances. Marion

recently was recapitalized with funds to put the Clear Creek
field on production, when that is accomplished Marion will
have income to put the Helper wells back on production.
Currently Marion Energy is in the process of Studying the

feasibility of sidetracking the Kenilworth Railroad #1-A. The
feasibility study is being carried out to determine the viability
of a completion in the Buckhorn Conglomerate. Work will be
carried out on this well in October. This well now has a casing pressure of 1,600lbs which was taken

on 7/12/2014.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Ben Evans 214 592-8615

TITLE
 Landman

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /14 /2014

September 18, 2014

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well KENILWORTH RR 1-A

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43007312290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967 Ext HELPER

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON

0304 FSL 1315 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSE Section: 16 Township: 13.0S Range: 10.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/31/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The wells in the Helper field continue in temporary shut-in
Accepted by the

status due to Marion's financial circumstances. Marion Utah Division of
recently was recapitalized with funds to put the Clear Creek Oil, Gas and Mining

field on production, when that is accomplished Marion will FOR RECORD ONLY
have income to put the Helper wells back on production.
Currently Marion Energy is in the process of Studying the [|C35Sf?IfWAÍÍnfC Û00fl0DSuÎAppf0TR

feasibility of sidetracking the Kenilworth Railroad #1-A. The September , 20 4
feasibility study is being carried out to determine the viability
of a completion in the Buckhorn Conglomerate. Work will be
carried out on this well in October. This well now has a casing pressure of 1,600lbs which was taken

on 7/12/2014.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Ben Evans 214 592-8615 Landman

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/14/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 14,
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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well KENILWORTH RR 1-A

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43007312290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
2150 South Central Expressway , McKinney, TX, 75070 972 540-2967 Ext HELPER

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON

0304 FSL 1315 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSE Section: 16 Township: 13.0S Range: 10.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/31/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The wells in the Helper field continue in temporary shut-in
Accepted by the

status due to Marion's financial circumstances. Marion Utah Division of
recently was recapitalized with funds to put the Clear Creek Oil, Gas and Mining

field on production, when that is accomplished Marion will FOR RECORD ONLY
have income to put the Helper wells back on production.
Currently Marion Energy is in the process of Studying the [|C35Sf?IfWAÍÍnfC Û00fl0DSuÎAppf0TR

feasibility of sidetracking the Kenilworth Railroad #1-A. The September , 20 4
feasibility study is being carried out to determine the viability
of a completion in the Buckhorn Conglomerate. Work will be
carried out on this well in October. This well now has a casing pressure of 1,600lbs which was taken

on 7/12/2014.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Ben Evans 214 592-8615 Landman

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/14/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 14,



RECEIVED: Sep. 18, 2014

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43007312290000

As discussed on our conference call in August, sundry's meeting the requirements of rule
R649-3-36 should be submitted for all wells not in compliance with that rule. This sundry did

not meet those requirements, but we do take note of the information provided. 

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
'

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OTI. BAS Pr N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43007312290000

As discussed on our conference call in August, sundry's meeting the requirements of rule
R649-3-36 should be submitted for all wells not in compliance with that rule. This sundry did

not meet those requirements, but we do take note of the information provided.

RECEIVED: Sep. 18,

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
'

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. BAS Pr N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43007312290000

As discussed on our conference call in August, sundry's meeting the requirements of rule
R649-3-36 should be submitted for all wells not in compliance with that rule. This sundry did

not meet those requirements, but we do take note of the information provided.

RECEIVED: Sep. 18,

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
'

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTI. BAS Pr N1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43007312290000

As discussed on our conference call in August, sundry's meeting the requirements of rule
R649-3-36 should be submitted for all wells not in compliance with that rule. This sundry did

not meet those requirements, but we do take note of the information provided.

RECEIVED: Sep. 18,



RECEIVED: Sep. 16, 2014

Additional Sundry Information 

 

Comparing tubing and casing pressures taken in April 2013 to July 2014 shows each of the four 
wells in question have had casing pressure increases. In most cases these increases were 
significant. Given the amount of time these wells have been shut-in, the observed increase in 
casing pressure would have been unlikely had there been casing integrity issues. The 
measured casing pressures are recorded at surface from the wellhead. None of the wells in 
Helper have packers in them. The pressures recorded in January are typical of build up 
pressures observed historically in this field assuming the wells haven't had recent workovers or 
haven't been vandalized by casing or tubing valves being opened by people other than Marion 
employees.  

 

Marion has an employee that makes rounds through the field on a regular basis. Casing and 
tubing pressures will be submitted via sundry notice once a month 

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

Additional Sundrv Information

Comparing tubing and casing pressures taken in April 2013 to July 2014 shows each of the four
wells in question have had casing pressure increases. In most cases these increases were
significant. Given the amount of time these wells have been shut-in, the observed increase in
casing pressure would have been unlikely had there been casing integrity issues. The
measured casing pressures are recorded at surface from the wellhead. None of the wells in
Helper have packers in them. The pressures recorded in January are typical of build up
pressures observed historically in this field assuming the wells haven't had recent workovers or
haven't been vandalized by casing or tubing valves being opened by people other than Marion
employees.

Marion has an employee that makes rounds through the field on a regular basis. Casing and
tubing pressures will be submitted via sundry notice once a month

RECEIVED: Sep. 16,

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

Additional Sundrv Information

Comparing tubing and casing pressures taken in April 2013 to July 2014 shows each of the four
wells in question have had casing pressure increases. In most cases these increases were
significant. Given the amount of time these wells have been shut-in, the observed increase in
casing pressure would have been unlikely had there been casing integrity issues. The
measured casing pressures are recorded at surface from the wellhead. None of the wells in
Helper have packers in them. The pressures recorded in January are typical of build up
pressures observed historically in this field assuming the wells haven't had recent workovers or
haven't been vandalized by casing or tubing valves being opened by people other than Marion
employees.

Marion has an employee that makes rounds through the field on a regular basis. Casing and
tubing pressures will be submitted via sundry notice once a month

RECEIVED: Sep. 16,

Sundry Number: 53321 API Well Number: 43007312290000

Additional Sundrv Information

Comparing tubing and casing pressures taken in April 2013 to July 2014 shows each of the four
wells in question have had casing pressure increases. In most cases these increases were
significant. Given the amount of time these wells have been shut-in, the observed increase in
casing pressure would have been unlikely had there been casing integrity issues. The
measured casing pressures are recorded at surface from the wellhead. None of the wells in
Helper have packers in them. The pressures recorded in January are typical of build up
pressures observed historically in this field assuming the wells haven't had recent workovers or
haven't been vandalized by casing or tubing valves being opened by people other than Marion
employees.

Marion has an employee that makes rounds through the field on a regular basis. Casing and
tubing pressures will be submitted via sundry notice once a month

RECEIVED: Sep. 16,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date: 6/1/2015 
FORMER OPERA TOR: NEW OPERATOR: 
Marion Energy, Inc Vtah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC 
1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 
Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008 
281-540-0028 281-540-0028 

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral 
See Attache Listq 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161 

REVIEW: 

Surface 

6/24/2015 
6/24/2015 

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A 
3. Reports current for ProductionlDisposition & Sundries: 
4. OPS/SIITA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 

6/25/2015 
6/25/2015 

5. VIC5 on all disposaVinjection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 
3. Vnit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SU46335 
N/A 
SU46334 and SU46341 

7/9/2015 
7/9/2015 
7/912015 
N/A 
7/9/2015 
7/9/2015 

6/25/2015 

Type 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notifY all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015 
COMMENTS: 

Status 

7/9/2015 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 6/1/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Marion Energy, Inc Utah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC
1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250
Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008
281-540-0028 281-540-0028

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attache Listq

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/24/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/24/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/25/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/25/2015
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/25/2015

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SU46335
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SU46334 and SU46341

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 7/9/2015
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015
COMMENTS:

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 6/1/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Marion Energy, Inc Utah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC
1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250
Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008
281-540-0028 281-540-0028

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attache Listq

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/24/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/24/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/25/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/25/2015
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/25/2015

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SU46335
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SU46334 and SU46341

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 7/9/2015
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 7/9/2015
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015
COMMENTS:



Marion Energy, Inc to 
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC 
Effective 611/2015 
Well Name Sec'TWN 

--I------

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 

------- r-----
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 
UTAH FUEL I 5 140S 
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 
BALLPARKCYN 17-2 16 130S 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 
CORDINGL Y CYN 10-1 15 130S 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 1130S 
UTAH FUEL A-I 6 140S 
UTAH FUEL 8 19 130S 
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 
KENILWORTH RR#1 16 130S 
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S 
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 
CORDINGLYCYN 11-1 11 130S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 
KENILWORTH RR I-A 16 130S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 117 1 140S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 

RNG 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
100E 
070E 
070E 
100E 
070E 
070E 
070E 
070E 

API ! Entity Mineral Surface Type Status Unit 
4300731182 2550 State Fee WD A CLEAR CREEK 
4301530682 2550 Federal Federal GW lOPS CLEAR CREEK 
4301530683 16130 'Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK 
4300716016 2550 Fee Fee GW P CLEAR CREEK 
4301530269 '2550 Federal Federal 

- 1---------

GW P CLEAR CREEK 
4300716009 12550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716010 12550 I Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716011 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716012 2550 1 Fee Fee GW iPA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716013 2550 iFee 'Fee !GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300730102 ,2550 I State Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300731169 ; 15494 Fee Fee D PA 
4300731170 15495 Federal Fee D PA 
4300731171 15434 I Fee Fee D PA 
4300731173 15435iFee Fee D PA 
4300731207 115496 1 Fee Fee D PA -

4301516021 2550 iFee Fee iGW PA CLEAR CREEK 
4300716015 12550 !Fee Fee 'GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300730289 12550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300731006 114624 Fee Fee GW S 
4300731007 14625 !Fee Fee GW S 
4300731015 15159 Fee Fee GW S ---

4300731064 i 15160 State Fee IGW S 
4300731065 i15161 State Fee GW S 
4300731070 115432 ,Fee Fee GW S 
4300731167 15433 State Fee GW S 
4300731168 ,16041 Federal Fee GW S 
4300731181 2550 ,State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300731210 12550 :State Fee IGW S CLEAR CREEK 
4300731229 116456: Fee Fee GW S 
4301530271 12550 I Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4301530680 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK 
4301530684 2550 Federal Federal GW IS CLEAR CREEK 
4301530685 12550 _Federal Federal !GW S CLEAR CREEK 

1 6/25/2015 

Marion Energy,Irx:to
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
Effective 6/1/2015
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status Unit
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 2550 State Fee WD A CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 2550 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 16130 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 2550 Fee Fee GW P CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 2550 Federal Federal GW P CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 2550 State Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
BALLPARKC304 17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 15494 Fee Fee D PA
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 100E 4300731170 15495 Federal Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 15434 Fee Fee D PA
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 15435 Fee Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 15496 Fee Fee D PA
UTAH FUEL A-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 2550 Fee Fee GNV S CLEAltCIDEEK
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 14624 Fee Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 14625 Fee Fee GW S
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 15159 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 15160 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 15161 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 ll 130S 100E 4300731070 15432 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 15433 State Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 16041 Federal Fee GW S
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR 1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 16456 Fee Fee GW S
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK

1

Marion Energy,Irx:to
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
Effective 6/1/2015
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status Unit
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 2550 State Fee WD A CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 2550 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 16130 Federal Federal GW OPS CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 2550 Fee Fee GW P CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 2550 Federal Federal GW P CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 2550 State Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
BALLPARKC304 17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 15494 Fee Fee D PA
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 100E 4300731170 15495 Federal Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 15434 Fee Fee D PA
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 15435 Fee Fee D PA
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 15496 Fee Fee D PA
UTAH FUEL A-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 2550 Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 2550 Fee Fee GNV S CLEAltCIDEEK
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 14624 Fee Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 14625 Fee Fee GW S
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 15159 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 15160 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 15161 State Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 ll 130S 100E 4300731070 15432 Fee Fee GW S
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 15433 State Fee GW S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 16041 Federal Fee GW S
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
KENILWORTH RR 1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 16456 Fee Fee GW S
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 2550 Federal Federal GW S CLEAR CREEK

1



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantty deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL D GAS WELL D OTHER Compressor 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC 

STATE TX ZIP 77008 I PHONE NUMBER: 

(281) 540-0028 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

1415 North Loop West, STE en-v Houston 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 

OTR/OTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 33 13S 7E 

ML-1257 
6. IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

Clear Creek 
8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

9. API NUMBER: 

10. FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT: 

COUNTY: Carbon 

STATE: 

UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

~ D ACIDIZE D DEEPEN D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submij in Duplicate) D ALTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANOON 

6/1/2015 D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE D TUBING REPAIR 

D CHANGE TUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON D VENT OR FLARE 

D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME D PLUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

D D D CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT·OFF 
Date of work completion: 

D D D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: 

D CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE· DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc, is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek 
Compressor Station" and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction 
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC bond number S U 41P334 . 
"Clear Creek Compressor Station" 
Sec 33 13S 7E NWNW 

Date: let (( \ (~ 
Title: vi 

Signature: W~~~~~~'--tP~L.M~-- Date: (, r , ,. lA , or 
Name: PATlZ« .. t..J. ~b..n4.rr Title: kc.f\J'r''' It ... D'J) ~~ (~+.A.C'f' 

NAME (PLEASE It=~-+~~""M_a,--,,<-=--,.,----"-Ikc...:..:::. :::--ll......::J4'(::.=oou.... __ _ 

SIGNATURE--"HLJ!U""_"""'~:""IC!!!=-...JMIIICIo .. 1:=-.... .Mi~:..:II""_"IIIII;i/ _________ _ 
TITLE ,.....~.....".~N=T'=--.. _~=,=eI\\.=..:....1i1>.a.>I..IIOL...Am~ .. EJAL1.lAkr1:=-:~"'I:.-J--=-t:Ac..r 

~ - 'i".~, C DATE 

(This space for State use only) 

APPRO'VED 
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

JUL 09 2015 
. ~ OIL GAS & MINING _ 

BY; ~o en Q Q t<\rl t...t\O... 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creekdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Compressor 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE y Houston STATE TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWNW 33 13S 7E STATE:

UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc. is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek
Compressor Station" and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLCbond number du dr3W .

"Clear Creek Compressor Station"
Sec 33 13S 7E NWNW

Marion Ener

Signat e: Date:

Name: UA, Title:

S

ganha

u e:

r tion LLC

Date: i Nt

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE A& 4

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

JULO9 2015
OlL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Clear Creekdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Compressor 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE y Houston STATE TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:NWNW 33 13S 7E STATE:

UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc. is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek
Compressor Station" and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLCbond number du dr3W .

"Clear Creek Compressor Station"
Sec 33 13S 7E NWNW

Marion Ener

Signat e: Date:

Name: UA, Title:

S

ganha

u e:

r tion LLC

Date: i Nt

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE A& 4

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

JULO9 2015
OlL GAS &



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new weUs, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill horizonlallaterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL D GAS WELL III OTHER ______________________ ___ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Marion Energy, Inc 

STATE TX ZIP 77008 
I PHONE NUMBER: 

I (281) 540-0028 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

1415 N Loop W. STE 1250 CITY Houston 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 

OTRIOTR. SECTION. TOWNSHIP. RANGE. MERIDIAN: 

ML-1257 
6. IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

Clear Creek Unit 
8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

9. API NUMBER: 

10. FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT: 

Helper Field 

COUNTY: 

STATE: 

UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

12l D ACIDIZE D DEEPEN D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submit in Duplicate) D AlTER CASING D FRACTURE TREAT D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

6/1/2015 D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE D TUBING REPAIR 

D CHANGE TUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON D VENT OR FLARE 

D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D CHANGE WELL NAME D PlUG BACK D WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Fonn Only) 

D D D CHANGE WELL STATUS PROOUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

D D D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS REClAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: 

D CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates. depths. volumes. etc. 

As of June 1 st, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unit and Helper Field assets. In 
conjunction with this reSignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your 
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. as successor unit operator and on 
behalf of Marion Energy, Inc_ regarding this change. 

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval. 
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. I ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's official resignation and request 
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC_ 

S;9
naP9-

Doug FI nery 
Vice President 

~'~~t-T ~~rr 
SIGNATURE w~ 

(This space for State use only) 

Date: Co /,, /I:j 

TITLE 

DATE 

APPROVED 
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) JUL 09 2015 

DIV. OIL GAS & MINING 

BY: @ncb, 51 Q rt\JdJ..C\9.. 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Clear Creek Unitdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1415 N Loop W, STE 1250 an Houston TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028 Helper Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As of June ist, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unitand Helper Field assets. In
conjunction with this resignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as successor unit operator and on
behalf of Marion Energy, Inc. regarding this change.

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval.
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. I ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's officialresignation and request
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.

Signat e: Date:

Doug FI nery
Vice President

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

D1V.OlL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Clear Creek Unitdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

1415 N Loop W, STE 1250 an Houston TX ZIP77008 (281) 540-0028 Helper Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES ATSURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/1/2015 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As of June ist, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unitand Helper Field assets. In
conjunction with this resignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.as successor unit operator and on
behalf of Marion Energy, Inc. regarding this change.

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval.
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. I ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's officialresignation and request
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.

Signat e: Date:

Doug FI nery
Vice President

NAME(PLEASE INT) TITLE

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

D1V.OlL GAS &



APPENDIX A 

Well List 

Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Status 
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 A 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1 16 130S 100E 4300731172 LA 
JACOB 5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731190 LA 
JACOB 4-8 5 140S 070E 4300731191 LA 
OMAN 2-31 30 130S 070E 4300731246 LA 
OMAN 3-32 29 130S 070E 4300731247 LA 
MADSEN 11-20 19 130S 070E 4300731297 LA 
OMAN 7-19 19 130S 070E 4300731298 LA 
WOOLSEY 3-31 31 130S 070E 4300731305 LA 
OLD RAIL ROAD GRADE 17-1 17 130S 100E 4300731354 LA 
KENILWORTH WASH 18-1 18 130S 100E 4300731355 LA 
ALRAD CYN 13-1 13 130S 100E 4300731357 LA 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-6 15 130S 100E 4300731416 LA 
RIDGE RUNNER 7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 LA 
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 OPS 
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 OPS 
UTAH FUEL 10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 P 
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 P 
UTAH FUEL 1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 PA 
UTAH FUEL 2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 PA 
UTAH FUEL 3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 PA 
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 PA 
UTAH FUEL 5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 PA 
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 PA 
BALLPARK CYN 17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 PA 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 16 130S 100E 4300731170 PA 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 PA 
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 PA 
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 PA 
UTAH FUEL A-l 6 140S 070E 4301516021 PA 
OMAN 14-20 29 130S 070E 4300731209 RET 
CORDINGLY CYN 2-1 2 130S 100E 4300731236 RET 
SWDl 28 130S 100E 4300731417 RET 
SHIMMIN 33-1 33 120S 110E 4300731431 RET 
SEAMONS 5-8 8 130S 070E 4300731432 RET 
CRITCHLOW 29-1 29 120S 110E 4300731433 RET 
RADAKOVICH 12-5-1 5 130S 070E 4300731434 RET 
ALLRED 10-1 10 120S 110E 4300731435 RET 

APPENDIXA

\VellList

Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Status
ALPINESCHOOLDIST3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 A
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1 16 130S 100E 4300731172 LA
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731190 LA
JACOB4-8 5 140S 070E 4300731191 LA
OMAN2-31 30 130S 070E 4300731246 LA
OMAN3-32 29 130S 070E 4300731247 LA
MADSEN11-20 19 130S 070E 4300731297 LA
OMAN7-19 19 130S 070E 4300731298 LA
VVOOLSEY3-31 31 130S 070E 4300731305 LA
OLDRAILROADGFukDE17-1 17 130S 100E 4300731354 LA
KENILVVORTHMULiH18-1 18 130S 100E 4300731355 LA
ALFULDCYN13-1 13 130S 100E 4300731357 LA
CORDINGLYCYN15-6 15 130S 100E 4300731416 LA
RIDGERUNNER7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 LA
RIDGERUNNER8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 OPS
RIDGERUNNER2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 OPS
UTAHFUEL10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 P
RIDGERUNNER13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 P
UTAHFUEL1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 PA
UTAHFUEL2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 PA
UTAHFUEL3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 PA
UTAHFUEL4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 PA
UTAHFUEL5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 PA
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 PA
BALLPARKCYN17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 PA
KENILM/ORTHRAILROAD15--‡ 16 130S 100E 4300731170 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 PA
CORDINGLYCYN10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 PA
UTAHFUELA-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 PA
OMAN14-20 29 130S 070E 4300731209 RET
CORDINGLYCYN2-1 2 130S 100E 4300731236 RET
SVVD1 28 130S 100E 4300731417 RET
SHIMMIN33-1 33 120S 110E 4300731431 RET
SEAMONS5-8 8 130S 070E 4300731432 RET
CRITCHLOVV29-1 29 120S 110E 4300731433 RET
RADAKOVICH12-5-1 5 130S 070E 4300731434 RET
ALLRED10-1 10 120S 110E 4300731435

APPENDIXA

\VellList

Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Status
ALPINESCHOOLDIST3-17 17 130S 070E 4300731182 A
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1 16 130S 100E 4300731172 LA
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731190 LA
JACOB4-8 5 140S 070E 4300731191 LA
OMAN2-31 30 130S 070E 4300731246 LA
OMAN3-32 29 130S 070E 4300731247 LA
MADSEN11-20 19 130S 070E 4300731297 LA
OMAN7-19 19 130S 070E 4300731298 LA
VVOOLSEY3-31 31 130S 070E 4300731305 LA
OLDRAILROADGFukDE17-1 17 130S 100E 4300731354 LA
KENILVVORTHMULiH18-1 18 130S 100E 4300731355 LA
ALFULDCYN13-1 13 130S 100E 4300731357 LA
CORDINGLYCYN15-6 15 130S 100E 4300731416 LA
RIDGERUNNER7-20 20 140S 070E 4301530681 LA
RIDGERUNNER8-19 20 140S 070E 4301530682 OPS
RIDGERUNNER2-18 17 140S 070E 4301530683 OPS
UTAHFUEL10 5 140S 070E 4300716016 P
RIDGERUNNER13-17 17 140S 070E 4301530269 P
UTAHFUEL1 5 140S 070E 4300716009 PA
UTAHFUEL2 32 130S 070E 4300716010 PA
UTAHFUEL3 32 130S 070E 4300716011 PA
UTAHFUEL4 30 130S 070E 4300716012 PA
UTAHFUEL5 31 130S 070E 4300716013 PA
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 130S 070E 4300730102 PA
BALLPARKCYN17-2 16 130S 100E 4300731169 PA
KENILM/ORTHRAILROAD15--‡ 16 130S 100E 4300731170 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2 16 130S 100E 4300731171 PA
CORDINGLYCYN10-1 15 130S 100E 4300731173 PA
BALLPARKCYN16-2X 16 130S 100E 4300731207 PA
UTAHFUELA-1 6 140S 070E 4301516021 PA
OMAN14-20 29 130S 070E 4300731209 RET
CORDINGLYCYN2-1 2 130S 100E 4300731236 RET
SVVD1 28 130S 100E 4300731417 RET
SHIMMIN33-1 33 120S 110E 4300731431 RET
SEAMONS5-8 8 130S 070E 4300731432 RET
CRITCHLOVV29-1 29 120S 110E 4300731433 RET
RADAKOVICH12-5-1 5 130S 070E 4300731434 RET
ALLRED10-1 10 120S 110E 4300731435



RADAKOVICH 12-5 5 130S 070E 4300731436 RET 
SEAMONS 5-8-2 8 130S 070E 4300731437 RET 
WOOLSEY 3-31-1 31 130S 070E 4300731438 RET 
ALLRED 13-1 13 120S 110E 4300731439 RET 
JACOB 5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731513 RET 
UTAH FUEL 8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 S 
OMAN 2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 S 
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 S 
KENILWORTH RR #2 16 130S lOOE 4300731007 S 
BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 11 130S 100E 4300731070 S 
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 S 
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 S 
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 S 
OMAN 10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 S 
KENILWORTH RR I-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 S 
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 S 

Facility List 

Clear Creek Compressor Station 33 13S 7E 

RADAKOVICH12-5 5 130S 070E 4300731436 RET
SEAMONS5-8-2 8 130S 070E 4300731437 RET
VVOOLSEY3-31-1 31 130S 070E 4300731438 RET
ALLRED13-1 13 120S 110E 4300731439 RET
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731513 RET
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 S
OMAN2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 S
KENILVVORTHRR#1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 S
KENILVVORTHRR#2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 S
BALLPARKCANYON#1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 S
CORDINGLYCYN11-1 11 130S 100E 4300731070 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 S
ALPINESCHOOLDIST6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 S
OMAN10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 S
KENILVVORTHRR1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 S
REDGERUNNER11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 S
RIDGERUNNER1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 S
RIDGERUNNER2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 S
RI]DGERUNNER11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 S

Facility List

Clear Creek Compressor Station 33 13S

RADAKOVICH12-5 5 130S 070E 4300731436 RET
SEAMONS5-8-2 8 130S 070E 4300731437 RET
VVOOLSEY3-31-1 31 130S 070E 4300731438 RET
ALLRED13-1 13 120S 110E 4300731439 RET
JACOB5-5 5 140S 070E 4300731513 RET
UTAHFUEL8 19 130S 070E 4300716015 S
OMAN2-20 20 130S 070E 4300730289 S
KENILVVORTHRR#1 16 130S 100E 4300731006 S
KENILVVORTHRR#2 16 130S 100E 4300731007 S
BALLPARKCANYON#1 16 130S 100E 4300731015 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-2 15 130S 100E 4300731064 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-1 15 130S 100E 4300731065 S
CORDINGLYCYN11-1 11 130S 100E 4300731070 S
CORDINGLYCYN15-5 15 130S 100E 4300731167 S
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 16 130S 100E 4300731168 S
ALPINESCHOOLDIST6-17 17 130S 070E 4300731181 S
OMAN10-29 29 130S 070E 4300731210 S
KENILVVORTHRR1-A 16 130S 100E 4300731229 S
REDGERUNNER11-20 20 140S 070E 4301530271 S
RIDGERUNNER1-30 20 140S 070E 4301530680 S
RIDGERUNNER2-19 17 140S 070E 4301530684 S
RI]DGERUNNER11-17 17 140S 070E 4301530685 S

Facility List

Clear Creek Compressor Station 33 13S



RECEIVED: Sep. 22, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 FEE 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 KENILWORTH RR 1-A 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC

9. API NUMBER:
 43007312290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 , Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 HELPER 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0304 FSL 1315 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 16 Township: 13.0S Range: 10.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 CARBON 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

9 /24 /2015

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Flow Test

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 We plan to do a 1-3 day flow test through a separator and flare the gas.
This operation will be daylight only. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028

TITLE
 Project Manager

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /22 /2015

October 05, 2015

Sundry Number: 66287 API Well Number: 43007312290000Sundry Number: 66287 API Well Number: 43007312290000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING FEE

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well KENILWORTH RR 1-A

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAHGAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43007312290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 , Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext HELPER

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON

0304 FSL 1315 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSE Section: 16 Township: 13.0S Range: 10.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

9/24/2015
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Flow Test

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

We plan to do a 1-3 day flow test through a separator and flare the gas. Approved by the
This operation will be daylight only. Ubatobaddl6p2015

OFI, Gas and Mining

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/22/2015

RECEIVED: Sep. 22,
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