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February 9, 2006

Scott Jacoby

Marion Energy, Inc.

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, TX 75069

Re:  Zone change request and conditional use permit request for six (6) gas wells in the Clear
Creek arca: Alpine School District 3-17, Oman 14-20, Jacob 5-5, Madsen 2-30, Woolsey 3-31,
and Oman 7-19.

Dear Mr. Jacoby:

This is to confirm that the Carbon County Planning Commission met in a regularly scheduled
meeting February 7, 2006 to consider Marion Energy, Inc.’s request for a zone change from WS
to MR, and for a conditional use permit for six (6) gas wells, as mentioned above.

As you know from having attended this meeting, the requests were approved, with the following
additional conditions:
- Use liners for containment ponds, and any diesel tanks

- Berms around sites
- No noise emitted beyond 55 db at 100” from well head; baffle is necessary

- Keep truck traffic through Clear Creek to a minimum

- Control erosion

- No open fires allowed on site, unless attended
We will now submit an ad for the public notice to the Sun Advocate, for which you will be
billed, for a public hearing to be held before the County Commission Wednesday March 1, 2006
at 4:30 p.m. in the Courthouse. You may want to attend this meeting to answer any questions
which may arise.

Please contact our office if you have any questions.

Zoning Administrator

Cc:  Mel Coonrod, EIS

Dave Levanwer Lew Korenko
Building Official/Director of Planning Deputy Building Otficial
H36-3261 H36-3262
Gayla Willtame Res Sacco Ann Price
Zoning Administrator Lands and Access Coordinater Administrative Assistant

636-3710 636-3712 £36-3260



CARBON CoOuNTY PLANNING AND BuiLping DEPARTMENT

120 East Main Street s Price, Utah 84501 . 3516303060 . Fax (435 H306-3204

D Ly
Selding Officiag

Director of Planning March 9, 2006
6363261
Law Korenno SCOt,t JaCOby
Deputy Building Marlon Energys Inc.
Official 119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
636-3262 McKinney, Tx 75069
GAYLA Wil 1angg . . .
Deputy Zoning Re: zone change request and application for conditional yse permits for the
Administrator following gas wells in the Scofield/Clear Creek area of Carbon County, Utah:
6363710 Alpine School Djstrict 3-17 Oman 14-2¢

Jacob 5-5 Madsen 2-3¢

Woolsey 3-31 Oman 7-19

Dear Mr. Jacoby:

This is to confirm that the Carbon County Commission met I a special meeting
March 8, 2006, to consider your request for zope changes from wg to MR for one
3-acre parce] and five 2-acre parcels, and for g conditional yse permit to drill and
Operate six (6) gas wells on the above-mentioned sites.

Marion Energy wag Iepresented at this meeting by Kerq Clarke and Me] Coonrod:

after much discussion and the addition of some conditions, the request was
approved. (Copy of conditions enclosed.)

Please contact our office if you have any questions,
- Sincerely, -
Gayla M. Williams

Zoning Administrator

Ce: Mel Coonrod



MID-
POWER

RESOURCE CORPORATION

April 26, 2006

Diana Whitney

State of Utah

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Directional Drilling R649-3-11

Alpine School District #3-17: 2014.49°FEL, 692.77°FNL NE/4 S17 13S-7E (Surface)
1585ft FWL 95ft FNL / NW/4 S17 13S-7E (bottom hole)
Carbon County, UT.

Dear Ms. Whitney

Pursuant to the filing of Mid-Power Resource Corporation’s Application for Permit to Drill the above
referenced well on January 5™ 2006, we are hereby submitting this letter in accordance with Oil and Gas
Conservation Rule R649-3-11 pertaining to the exception to location and Siting of wells.

. The Alpine School District #3-17 well is located within the Clear Creek Federal Unit Area.

. Mid-Power Resource Corporation is permitting this well as a directional well in order to maximize
drainage of the reservoir in a topographically challenging area.

. The concept of drilling Multiple directional wells from a single pad site will allow Mid-Power
Resource Corporation to minimize surface disturbance that would be otherwise cause by two or
more separate pad sites, as the plan is to drill two directional wells from this pad.

. Mid-Power Resource Corporation hereby certifies that it is the sole owner within 460 feet of the
entire directional well bore.

Therefore, based upon the above information Mid-Power Resource Corporation requests the permit be
granted pursuant to R649-3-11.

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans

Landman

Marion Energy Inc.

(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702) 838-5087
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April 28, 2006

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah

84116

RE:  Alpine School District #3-17 and #6-17
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Application for Permit to Drill
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney

Please find enclosed two copies of the above referenced well APD’s that are to be
drilled in our Clear Creek Unit located in 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery
Counties, Utah.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(972) 540-2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

0 ):-/g
-

Benjamin Evans

Landman

Marion Energy Inc.

(Agent for Mid-Power Resource Corp.)

MAY 0 1 2006

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702) 838-5087



STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT []
(highlight changes)

5. MINERAL LEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL STATE ML-1257 | Fee
1A TYPE OF WORK: DRILLEZ]  REENTER [J  DEEPEN [] 7- P INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
: 7
srveeorwet:  OIL ] oAs OTHER SINGLE ZONE 1 muLTiPLE ZONE [] Clear Creek Unit
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Mid-Power Resource Corp. Alpine School District #3-17
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WALDCAT:
8290 W. Sahara, St 186 ., Las Vegas ... NV, 89117 (702) 838-0716 I
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) l_l?ga Zq g )( ({ 3 7~ 1; 0 2 Y 3q lp ?LLL;}?J; 11&;5@1}; SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
AT SURFACE: 201449 FEL, 69277 FNL NE/4 - '“, /éo 3 g?’) 6/? ;——7@ I)( yﬂ‘//’ ,;‘;7/\// NWNE 17 138 7E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCNG zoNe:  1585ft FWL 95ft FNL / NW/4 (NE NW) » »
34, 690 46 10k
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: . ) 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
: TAH
Approx 2 miles South of Scofield Utah y ‘,‘&\\\‘N\ Carbon v
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: ‘\\\i 14 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
100° 240" 120 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: RO N 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET) . v - N . )
20ft from directional well drilled from same pad Ygpt 4850 See attached - Bond Document
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WL\ START: L 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
7921.6 GR 5/30/2006 217 | 30days
24, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH { - CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17 1/2" 13 3/8" J-55 61# 500 | Premium Plus I 517 sx  1.41 cuft/sk 14.20 ppg
12 1/4" 8 5/8" J-55 36# 2,100 | Lead: Prem. Lite 200 sx 3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg
. /| Tail: 50/50 Poz 79 sx  1.41 cuft/sk 14.20 ppg
77/8" 51/2" J-55 17# " 5,304 Lead: Prem. Lite 350 sx  3.82 cuft/sk 11 ppg
Tail: 50/50 Poz 275 sx  1.41 cuft/sk 14.20 ppg
25, ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWNG ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCEWITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:
iZ] WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER IZ COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN
L—_] EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER L__I FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

NAME (PLEASE prINT) BENjamin Evans mme Landman

p) T é\—’% oare 4128/2006
f:

(This space for State use only)

SIGNATURE

, © Approvedbythe I
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: 43 Q¢ - ’)7’ IQ’Z/ . ) Q,APWISIOH of i
i Oil, Gas and Mining

MAY 0 1 2006

(11/2001)



Note:
A more definite locotion to be
located when weather permits.

Township 13 South

Range 7 Fast

| (N89°57'W - 5226.5&')_L

o (TARGET) - ©
1585.00" T - ~ <Y (SURFACE
CALC. ‘§ S ALPINE SCHooL
N 393890 e BTN ESY
LEV: .6'

E 48575 i T oL

M .
N69°L7'L9" N 4393708 CALC.
1733.72" E 486248

(NORTH - 5280.00")

17

(NORTH - 5280.00")

Note:

The UTM’s for the
the control station
1979. PID A15839

Scofield Cemetary US|

ell location has been,determined from
Quad Scofield

Legend
®

Drill Hole Location

Metal Cap (Found)

O Brass Cap (Searched for, but not found)

Colculated Corner

( )owo

GPS Measured |

(N89°52'W - 525].62')

NOTES:

1. UTM and Latitude

Longitude Coordinates
are derived usin

a GPS Pathfinder and are

shown in NAD 2 atum.
SURFACE [TARGET
LAT / LONG LAT / LONG
39°L1'L]1.969"N S9°L1'L7.8L3"N
11°09'37.L07"W 111°09'58.247"W

Location:

The well location was determined using o Trimble 5700
GPS survey grade unit.

Basis of Bearing:
The Basis of Bearing is GPS Measured.

GLO Bearin

The Bearings ind?éoted are per the recorded plat obtained
from the U.S. Land Office.

Basis of Elevation.

Basis of Elevation of 7740 being a NGS Triangulotion Point —
Scofield Cemetary Carbon County, Utah in Section 32, Township
12 South, Range 7 East, Salt Laoke Base and Meridian, as shown
on the USGS Quad Scofield (1979).

Descriﬂt'io_n of Location:

Proposed Drill Hole located in the NW/4 NE/4 of Section 17,
T13S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 692.77° South and 2014.49° West
from the Northeast Section Corner of Section 17, T13S, R7E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridian.

T £l ¥

Proposed Target located in the NE/4 NW/4 of Section 17,
T13S, R7E, S.L.B.&M., being 95.00° South and 1585.00° East
from the Northwest Section Corner of Section 17, T13S, R7E,
Salt Lake Base & Meridian.

Surveyor's Certificate:
l, Albert J. Spensko, o Registered Professional Land Surveyor,
holding Certificate 146652 State of Utah, do hereby certify that

the information on this drawing is a true ond accurate survey

based on data of record and was conducted under my personal
direction and supervision as shown hereon.

(Q

TALON RESOURCES, INC.

195 North 100 West P.0. Box 1230
Huntington, Utak 84528

Phone (435)687-5310  Fax (435)687-5311
E-Matil taloneetv.net

I@ Marion Energy Inc.

Alpine School District #3-17
Section 17, T13S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.
Carbon County, Utah

Drown By: Checked By:
N. BUTKOVICH LW.J./AJS.

GRAPHIC SCALE [T
( IN FEET ) 1" = 1000

1 inch = 1000 ft.

Job No.
2154—-1A




True Vertical Depth [1000ft/in}

G
Marion Energy, Inc.
R ASD #3-17 v
M  Magnetic North: 9.12° Sec. 17-T13S-R7E .
Siugnetie Fid Clear Creek Unit, Carbon County, Utah WGamennrd
Strength: 35838nT Preliminary Plan
Dip Angle: 32.93°
Date: 5/2/2006
Model: igrf2005 O — FIELD DETAILS
Carbons County UTM 27
Name +N/-S +E~W Northing Easting Latitude Longitude Slot = s s T i "
317 0.00 0.00  4393708.00 486248.00  39°41'41.969N  111°09'37.407W  N/A ""ﬂ,‘::- ﬁﬂ’;ﬁ?;’;ﬁ;“‘n}“ S——
Magnetic Model: igrf2005
Sysiem Datum: Mean Ses Level
1 TARGET DETAILS Local North: Grid North
- | Name TVD +N/-8 +E-W Northing Easting Latitude Longitude  Shape
] 5% | Ferron 399600 59844 -1626.52  4393890.41 48575224 39°41'47.85N  111°09'S8.237W  Circle (Radius: 100)
o 0° 0 MD Start Hold
] SECTION DETAILS STTE DETALLS
3 . ASD #3-17
-4 Sec MD Inc Azi TVD +N/-§ +E-W DLeg TFace VSec Target
o Site Centre Northing: 4353708.00
1 000 000 290.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 Easting: 486244,00
1 2 165116  0.00 29020  165L16 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
i 3 331782 50.00 290.20 3114.19 235.57 -640.26 300  290.20 682.23 .. Ground Level: 7921.60
E 4 468967 S0.00 29020 399600 59844  -162652  0.00 000 173312 Ferron Posltions Dwctilutr: W0
L000—————— S 862310 5000 29020  4596.00 84535  -2297.59 0.00 000  2448.17 AavorgERes
4 1651 i3 1651 MD Start Build 3.00 10007
1 ] ! SECTIONS
200 ¥ ] |
0] 7507 — ]
4 = '
g = 1 SECTION 17
- - N
B | % -
E | = 500 RS
- | Ol
] ! £ 1
i [ e =] E
30007 5514 I 5507 3318 MD Start Hald Z 2507 S
: ! PO 5]
J | = 4 ¢
" @ | N
3 0] L
]399 1733 | 90 MD Start Hold ] _ !
40007 | B 11| [ S i o o i e e e e S e e o e i s e e e
1 -2500 -2250  -2000 -1750 -1500  -1250 -1000 -750 -500 -250 0 250
4 West(-)/East(+) [500ft/in]
14596 2448 80° 5623 MD TD
] Plan: Plan #1 (3-17/1)
suuu ™ T T T TTT ™1 T ] ; . .
0 1000 2000 3000 Created By: Brian Varcoe Date: 5/2/2006

Vertical Section at 290.20° [1000ft/in]

Checked: Date:




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES

Planning Report
Company: Marion Energy, Inc. Date:  5/2/2006 Time: 14:58:55 Page: 1
Field: Carbon County UTM 27 Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: ASD #3-17, Grid North
Site: ASD #3-17 Vertical (TVD) Reference: SITE 7936.6
Well: 3-17 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,290.20Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Plan: Plan #1
Field: Carbon County UTM 27
UTAH
Map System:Universal Transverse Mercator Map Zone: UTM Zone 12, North 114W to 108W
Geo Datum: NAD27 (Clarke 1866) Coordinate System: Site Centre
Sys Datum: Mean Sea Level Geomagnetic Model: igrf2005
Site: ASD #3-17
Site Position: Northing: 4393708.00 m  Latitude: 39 41 41969 N
From: Map Easting: 486248.00 m  Longitude: 111 9 37407 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.00 ft North Reference: Grid
Ground Level: 7921.60 ft Grid Convergence: -0.10 deg
Well: 3-17 Slot Name:
Well Position: +N/-S 0.00 ft Northing: 4393708.00 m  Latitude: 39 41 41969 N
+E/-W 0.00 ft Easting: 486248.00 m  Longitude: 111 9 37407 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.00 ft
Wellpath: 1 Drilled From: Surface
Tie-on Depth: 0.00 ft
Current Datum: SITE Height 7936.60 ft  Above System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Magnetic Data: 5/2/2006 Declination: 9.02 deg
Field Strength: 35838 nT Mag Dip Angle: 32.93 deg
Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +E/-W Direction
ft ft ft deg
0.00 0.00 0.00 290.20
Plan: Plan #1 Date Composed: 5/2/2006
Version: 1
Principal: Yes Tied-to: From Surface
Plan Section Information
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W DLS Build Turm TFO  Target
ft deg deg ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
0.00 0.00 290.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1651.16 0.00 290.20 1651.16 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3317.82 50.00 290.20 3114.19 23557 -640.26 3.00 3.00 0.00 290.20
4689.67 50.00 290.20 3996.00 508.44 -1626.52 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 Ferron
5623.10 50.00 290.20 4596.00 84535 -2297.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Section 1 : Start Hold
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W VS DLS Build Turn TFO
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
0.00 0.00 290.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1600.00 0.00 290.20 1600.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 290.20
1651.16 0.00 290.20 1651.16 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 290.20
Section 2 : Start Build 3.00
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W VS DLS Build Turn TFO
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
1700.00 1.47 290.20 1699.99 0.22 -0.59 0.62 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
1800.00 447 290.20 1799.85 2.00 -5.44 5.80 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
1900.00 7.47 290.20 1899.30 5.59 -15.19 16.19 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2000.00 1047 290.20 1998.06 10.97 -29.82 31.77 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2100.00 1347 290.20 2095.88 18.13 -49.27 52.50 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2200.00 16.47 290.20 2192.48 27.04 -73.50 78.32 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2300.00 19.47 290.20 2287.59 3769 -102.45 109.16 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2400.00 22 .47 290.20 2380.96 50.05 -136.02 144.94 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2500.00 2547 290.20 2472.33 64.07 -174.14 185.55 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2600.00 28.47 290.20 2561.45 79.73  -216.69 230.89 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2700.00 3147 290.20 2648.07 96.97 -263.56 280.83 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES

Planning Report
Company: Marion Energy, Inc. Date: 5/2/2006 Time: 14:58:55 Page: 2
Field: Carbon County UTM 27 Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: ASD #3-17, Grid North
Site: ASD #3-17 Vertical (TVD) Reference: SITE 7936.6
Well: 3-17 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,290.20Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Plan: Plan #1
Section 2 : Start Build 3.00
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W VS DLS Build Turn TFO
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
2800.00 3447 290.20 2731.96 115.76  -314.62 335.24 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
2900.00 37.47 290.20  2812.89 136.03  -369.73 393.96 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
3000.00 40.47 290.20 2890.63 157.75 -428.74 456.84 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
3100.00 43.47 290.20  2964.98 180.83  -491.49 523.70 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
3200.00 46.47 290.20 3035.72 20523  -557.80 594.36 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
3300.00 4947 290.20 3102.67 230.87  -627.50 668.62 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
3317.82 50.00 290.20 3114.19 23557 -640.26 682.23 3.00 3.00 0.00 0.00
Section 3 : Start Hold
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W VS DLS Build Turn TFO
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
3400.00 50.00 290.20 3167.02 257.31 -699.34 745.18 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3500.00 50.00 290.20 3231.30 283.76  -771.23 821.78 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3600.00 50.00 290.20 3295.57 310.21 -843.13 898.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3700.00 50.00 290.20 3359.85 33666 -915.02 974.99 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3800.00 50.00 290.20 3424.13 363.11 -986.91  1051.59 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3900.00 50.00 290.20 3488.41 389.56 -1058.81 1128.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4000.00 50.00 290.20 3552.69 416.02 -1130.70 1204.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4100.00 50.00 290.20 3616.97 44247 -1202.59 1281.41 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4200.00 50.00 290.20 3681.25 46892 -127448 1358.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4300.00 50.00 290.20 3745.53 49537 -1346.38 1434.62 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4400.00 50.00 290.20 3809.80 521.82 -1418.27 1511.22 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4500.00 50.00 290.20 3874.08 548.27 -1490.16  1587.82 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4600.00 50.00 290.20 3938.36 574.72 -1562.06 1664.43 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4689.67 50.00 290.20 3996.00 598.44 -1626.52 1733.12 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Section 4 : Start Hold
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W VS DLS Build Turn TFO
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
4700.00 50.00 290.20  4002.64 601.18 -1633.95 1741.03 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4800.00 50.00 290.20  4066.92 62763 -1705.84 1817.64 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4900.00 50.00 290.20  4131.20 654.08 -1777.73 1894.24 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5000.00 50.00 290.20  4195.48 680.53 -1849.63 1970.85 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5100.00 50.00 290.20  4259.76 706.98 -1921.52 2047.45 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5200.00 50.00 290.20 4324.03 733.43 -1993.41 2124.06 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5300.00 50.00 290.20  4388.31 759.88 -2065.30 2200.66 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5400.00 50.00 290.20  4452.59 786.34 -2137.20 2277.26 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5500.00 50.00 290.20  4516.87 812.79 -2209.09 2353.87 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5600.00 50.00 290.20  4581.15 839.24 -2280.98 243047 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5623.10 50.00 290.20  4596.00 84535 -2297.59 2448.17 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W VS DLS Build Turn Tool/Comment
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft
1600.00 0.00 290.20 1600.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1651.16 0.00 290.20 1651.16 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1700.00 1.47 290.20 1699.99 0.22 -0.59 0.62 3.00 3.00 0.00
1800.00 447 290.20 1799.85 2.00 -5.44 5.80 3.00 3.00 0.00
1900.00 7.47 290.20 1899.30 5.59 -15.19 16.19 3.00 3.00 0.00
2000.00 1047 290.20 1998.06 10.97 -29.82 31.77 3.00 3.00 0.00
2100.00 1347 290.20  2095.88 18.13 -49.27 52.50 3.00 3.00 0.00
2200.00 16.47 290.20 2192.48 27.04 -73.50 78.32 3.00 3.00 0.00
2300.00 19.47 290.20  2287.59 3769 -102.45 109.16 3.00 3.00 0.00
2400.00 22.47 290.20  2380.96 50.05 -136.02 144.94 3.00 3.00 0.00
2500.00 25.47 290.20  2472.33 64.07 -174.14 185.55 3.00 3.00 0.00
2600.00 28.47 29020 2561.45 79.73  -216.69 230.89 3.00 3.00 0.00
2700.00 3147 290.20 2648.07 96.97  -263.56 280.83 3.00 3.00 0.00
2800.00 3447 290.20 2731.96 115.76  -314.62 335.24 3.00 3.00 0.00
2900.00 37.47 290.20 2812.89 136.03  -369.73 393.96 3.00 3.00 0.00




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES

Planning Report
Company: Marion Energy, Inc. Date: 5/2/2006 Time: 14:58:55 Page: 3
Field: Carbon County UTM 27 Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: ASD #3-17, Grid North
Site: ASD #3-17 Vertical (TVD) Reference: SITE 7936.6
Well: 317 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,290.20Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Plan: Plan #1
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W \L) DLS Build Turn Tool/Comment
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft
3000.00 40.47 290.20 2890.63 157.75  -428.74 456.84 3.00 3.00 0.00
3100.00 43.47 290.20 2964.98 180.83  -491.49 523.70 3.00 3.00 0.00
3200.00 46.47 290.20 3035.72 20523  -557.80 594.36 3.00 3.00 0.00
3300.00 49.47 290.20 3102.67 230.87 -627.50 668.62 3.00 3.00 0.00
3317.82 50.00 290.20 311419 23557 -640.26 682.23 3.00 3.00 0.00
3400.00 50.00 290.20 3167.02 257.31 -699.34 745.18 0.00 0.00 0.00
3500.00 50.00 290.20 3231.30 28376  -771.23 821.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
3600.00 50.00 290.20 3295.57 310.21 -843.13 898.38 0.00 0.00 0.00
3700.00 50.00 290.20 3359.85 336.66 -915.02 974.99 0.00 0.00 0.00
3800.00 50.00 290.20 3424.13 363.11 -986.91  1051.59 0.00 0.00 0.00
3900.00 50.00 290.20 3488.41 389.56 -1058.81 1128.20 0.00 0.00 0.00
4000.00 50.00 290.20 3552.69 416.02 -1130.70 1204.80 0.00 0.00 0.00
4100.00 50.00 290.20 3616.97 44247 -1202.59 1281.41 0.00 0.00 0.00
4200.00 50.00 290.20 3681.25 468.92 -1274.48  1358.01 0.00 0.00 0.00
4300.00 50.00 290.20 3745.53 40537 -1346.38 143462 0.00 0.00 0.00
4400.00 50.00 290.20 3809.80 521.82 -1418.27 1511.22 0.00 0.00 0.00
4500.00 50.00 290.20 3874.08 548.27 -1490.16  1587.82 0.00 0.00 0.00
4600.00 50.00 290.20 3938.36 57472 -1562.06 1664.43 0.00 0.00 0.00
4689.67 50.00 290.20 3996.00 598.44 -1626.52 1733.12 0.00 0.00 0.00 Ferron
4700.00 50.00 290.20 4002.64 601.18 -1633.95 1741.03 0.00 0.00 0.00
4800.00 50.00 290.20 4066.92 627.63 -1705.84 1817.64 0.00 0.00 0.00
4900.00 50.00 290.20 4131.20 654.08 -1777.73 1894.24 0.00 0.00 0.00
5000.00 50.00 290.20  4195.48 680.53 -1849.63 1970.85 0.00 0.00 0.00
5100.00 50.00 290.20 4259.76 706.98 -1921.52 2047.45 0.00 0.00 0.00
5200.00 50.00 290.20 4324.03 733.43 -1993.41  2124.06 0.00 0.00 0.00
5300.00 50.00 290.20 4388.31 7590.88 -2065.30 2200.66 0.00 0.00 0.00
5400.00 50.00 290.20 4452.59 786.34 -2137.20 2277.26 0.00 0.00 0.00
5500.00 50.00 290.20 4516.87 812.79 -2209.09 2353.87 0.00 0.00 0.00
5600.00 50.00 290.20 4581.15 839.24 -2280.98 2430.47 0.00 0.00 0.00
5623.10 50.00 290.20 4596.00 84535 -2297.59 244817 0.00 0.00 0.00 PBHL
Targets
Map Map <-— Latitude --—> < Longitude —>
Name Description TVD +N/-S +E/-W Northing  Easting Deg Min Sec Deg Min Sec
Dip. Dir. ft ft ft m m
Ferron 3996.00 598.44 -1626.52 4393890.41 485752.24 39 4147856 N 111 958237 W
-Circle (Radius: 100)
-Plan hit target
Annotation
MD TVD
ft ft
5623.10 4596.00 PBHL




Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator
Operator Name Change Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 4/28/2006
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2215-Mid-Power Resource Corporation N2740-Marion Energy, Inc.
8290 W Sahara Ave #186 119 S Tennessee, Suite 200
Las Vegas, NV 89117 McKinney, TX 75069
Phone: 1-(702) 838-0716 Phone: 1-(972) 540-2967
CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |[LEASE |WELL |WELL
NO TYPE TYPE | STATUS

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 [130S |070E {4300731181 State GW NEW

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 ]130S J070E }4300731182 State GW NEW

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on:  5/12/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/8/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 4/7/2005

Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5868337-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

6a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
6b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

Marion Energy 3 FORM 4A.xls 5/18/2006



@ Marion Energy Inc.

N

May 3, 2006
Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Diana Whitney
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah
84116
RE: Cordingly Canyon #11-1 Amended Location and ASD #3-17 Survey
Dear Ms. Whitney
Please find enclosed a copy of the correct survey for the Alpine School District #3-17 well and also an
amended Form 3 for the Cordingly Canyon #11-1 well. Per Mark Jones’ recommendations the pad has
been moved to the south of its original location. | have also included the exceptional location letter that
pertains to the Cordingly Canyon #11-1 that also reflects the new footages.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at (972) 540-2967 ext. 3004
or email bevans@marionenergy.com

Sincerely,

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

RECEIVED
MAY 0 4 2006

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MININE

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200, McKinney, TX, 75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967
Fax; (972) 547-0442



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: Alpine School District #3-17
APl number: 4300731182
Location: st NWNE Sactoe 17 o 138 b TE

Company that filed original application: | Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Date original permit was issued:

Company that permit was issued to: Not Yet Approved

Check

one Desired Action:

¥’ | Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Driil to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes | No

«

If located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?

Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

ANANE NN

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. B001617 v

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drill that is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (please print) Benjamin Evans___ Title Landman
Signature g a - = Date 05/09/2006

Representing (company nafme) _Marion Energy Inc.

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individuai(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
Permit to Drill. . oy 1y

RN ()

(3/2004)

MAY 0 3 2006



S1ATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU- CL30I8)

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
driil horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: |
dLeaR  Chgexk umIT

TTYPEOFWELL i welL [0 caswelt ] oTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

Mid- Power Acsource C’orpom_tiord

9. API NUMBER:

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. - PHONE NUMBER.
$290 . saunea ATz, ., As veeAs NV L. €907 [703)83% 0 T1¢

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: .
QLEAR, AAEEK FEDERAL UNIT

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: N A

QTRAQATR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NA

counTy: ARRoN ANOD EMERY

STATE:
UTAH

1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[J NOTICE OF INTENT [ acoize DkDEPm ' ﬁ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Submit in Duphcate) [ Atercasing [] FRACTURE TREAT ] siDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [[] casin REPAR [C] New consTRuCTION [C] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[C] crance To PREVIOUS PLANS ] oreraTORCHANGE [} tuenc rRePair
O] cHancETUBING [C] PLucAND ABANDON [J ventorRARE
0 suBSEQUENT REPORT [ cranceweLL NaME O ePweeac [(] waTer pisPosaL
mf:u:x;:::“ o [0 cnanceweLL sTATUS [[] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [[] warer sHut-oFF
[J commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [T] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ omer:
[ converTweLL TYpE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detaits including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Mid-Cower p\esource_. 00(\9004.,-{;\0'\/‘{-4&& dc,s}&no—-lkd Opn.i‘oo\-or ol ‘+he ouo'n‘L/
Nesigns  Be uot Opemd—ov; eSS eative uPoM “Hie Rf‘br‘oua_\ o +Haa

Successor (mt opud«ar\, M ARIDR ENERGY Toe . Mid-Fower Aesaurce_

F&ckloowied%cs AND Afpro\)&s. +Hhis QJI\A:O@(,

PkeAse relker to ALl Documesk s Submitred

Marion Euer?ﬁ AS

Suctesso u:o‘u‘\-Oﬁ)Q/\A—-tor‘ AND 00 BAcha (€ of Mid- fraer ﬁ)esoch

Me m&mey ‘s CJ’HAM@{ ,

SIGNATURE 4&6—0\1\ AN»NA DATE
—

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)_sSULS A ) ﬂlmf’gaL_" TITLE Qz%_é%ubf#w'
?’Lk—c/ 9, Fvo(e

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED _£7/8106- - -

(See Instructions on.Reverse Skle)

(5/2000)

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician

RECEIVED
MAY 12 2006
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININ:



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIL NUMBER:

UTU-063018X

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, of to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER A
- v See Attachment "A'
7. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Marion Energy Inc. (N2740)
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S Tennessee Ste #200 .., McKinney state TX zp 79069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek Federal unit
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: N/A county. Carbon and Emery
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: N/A STATE:
UTAH
M. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioize [J oeepen [} REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[Z] NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [ ALtercasiNg [] FRACTURETREAT [C] siDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [:] CASING REPAR |:] NEW CONSTRUCTION [j TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[TJ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [/] operATOR cHanGE [C] TuewcRrepPar
[ crance TuaING [[] PLUG AND ABANDON [] venTorLare
[J suBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHANGE WELL NAME [J epuseack [[J waTter DIsPosaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[ cHance weLL sTATUS [ PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] water sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [[] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O otrer:
[ converTweLLTYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Marion Energy Inc. will take over operation of the Clear Creek Federal Unit which is currently operated by Mid-Power Resource

Corporation, and is located in both Carbon and Emery Counties Utah.

Please See attachment "A" for well Names, APl numbers, and legal descriptions

BLm Bemd = U TB 000/79
Special Boncl = B 03775
Stte +Fee Bond = B0 06l

EPPective 4/a8/an0e

NARIS

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Keri Cla”y'! (7 \/I AN

TITLE

Vice President Land (Marion Energy Inc)

SR8

SIGNATURE DATE

q‘e(QG

(This space for State use only)

APPROVED 5 //8106

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician

DNINI B S¥D 10 40 Na

RS

sEINESEL



Attachment A
Marion Energy Inc.

Clear Creek Unit
Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Well Name AP| Number

Utah Fuel No. 1 43-007-16009-00-00
Utah Fuel No. 2 43-007-16010-00-00
Utah Fuel No. 3 43-007-16011-00-00
Utah Fuel No. 4 43-007-16012-00-00
Utah Fuel No. 5 43-007-16013-00-00
Utah Fuel No. 8 43-007-16015-00-00

Utah Fuel No. 10

Utah State M.L. 1256-1
Oman 2-20

Utah Fuel A-1

Alpine School District #6-17
Alpine School District #3-17
Ridge Runner 11-20

Ridge Runner 13-17

Ridge Runner #1-30

Ridge Runner #7-20

Ridge Runner #8-19

Ridge Runner #2-18

Ridge Runner #11-18
Ridge Runner #11-17

* Not Yet Spudded

43-007-16016-00-00
43-007-30102-00-00
43-007-30289-00-00
43-015-16021-00-00
43-007-31181-00-00
43-007-31182-00-00
43-015-30271-00-00
43-015-30269-00-00
43-015-30680-00-00
43-015-30681-00-00
43-015-30682-00-00
43-015-30683-00-00
43-015-30684-00-00
43-015-30685-00-00

Wells

Status
Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Plugged and Abandoned
Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Shut-in

Plugged and Abandoned
Pemit not yet Approved
Permit not yet Approved
Shut-in

Shut-in

Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)*
Approved APD (NYS)
Approved APD (NYS)*

Section
Township

-Range
.5 T14S R7E

S
S.32T13SR7E
S.32T13S R7E
S.30 T13S R7E
S.31 T13S R7E
S.19T13S R7E
S.5T14S R7E
S.29T13S 7E
S$.20 T13S R7E
S$.6T14S R7E
S. 17 T13S R7E
S. 17 T13SR7E
S.20T14S R7E
S. 17 T14S R7E
S.20 T14S R7E
S.20T14S R7E
S.20T14S R7E
S.17 T14S R7E
S. 17 T14S R7E
S. 17 T14SR7E

Plugged Wells _or Abandoned Well Sites in area (noted but not changed)

Clear Creek 1
Clear Creek Unit No. 16
Clear Creek Unit No. 17

43-007-20068-00-00
43-015-16018-00-00
43-015-30053-00-00

G W Deck A-1 43-007-16008-00-00
Gov't 1-17 43-007-11179-00-00
Kearns A-1 43-015-11217-00-00

43-015-10897-00-00
43-015-10304-00-00
43-015-10306-00-00
43-007-16014-00-00
43-007-16017-00-00
43-015-16023-00-00
43-015-16024-00-00
43-007-20119-00-00

Kemmerer Coal 1
Kemmerer Coal 2

C. K. Steiner A-1

Utah Fuel No. 7

H. E. Walton No. 1

H.E. Walton A-3

P.T. Walton No. 1-X
Clear Creek Water Well 1
Deck 1 43-007-20356-00-00
Clear Creek U 18 43-007-30043-00-00
1-18 43-015-20300-00-00
P.T. Walton 1 43-015-20302-00-00
Clear Creek Unit 1 43-015-30090-00-00
Clear Creek (Deep) 2 43-015-30307-00-00

Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Location Abandoned

Location Abandoned

Location Abandoned

Plugged and Abandoned
Plugged and Abandoned
Location Abandoned

S. 17 T14S R7E
S.29 T14S R7E
S.20 T14S R7E
S.8T14S R7E

S.17 T14S R7E
S.32 T14S R7E
.24 T14S R6E
.24 T14S R6E
.5 T168S R7E

.17 T13S R7E
.17 T14S R7E
.30 T14S R7E
.19 T14S R7E
.17 T14S R7E
.8T14S R7E

.20 T13S R7E
.18 T14S R7E
.19 T14S R7E
.19 T14S R7E
.19 T14S R7E

w 0o n nnoononnonnuononooon



5.

Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Drilling Plan
Page DP-I-

Drilling Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Alpine School District #3-17

Geologic Surface Formation

a. Quaternary
Estimated Tops
Name VD 1D Production Phase
Emery 5000 500 Gas
Blue Gate 1650’ 1654 Gas
Ferron 3980 4530 Gas . -
g R\
D 4581 5304’ ’\;, .
Casing Program D o
\ P \ A /& D
a. See Form #3 Section 24. & P
(-

Operators Specifications for Pressure Control Equipment

2000 psi WP Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (Schematic Attached).

a.

b. Functional test daily.

c. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is greater)
prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the internal yield
pressure of the casing,

d. All ram-type preventers and related control equipment shall be tested at the rated
working pressure of the stack assembly or at 70 percent of the minimum internal yield
pressure of the casing, whichever is less. Tests shall be done at the time of installation,
prior to drilling out, and weekly. All testes shall be for a period of 15 minutes.

Auxiliary Equipment

a. Kelly Cock - Yes

b. Float at the bit - No

c. Monitoring Equipment on the mud system - visually

d. Full opening safety valve on rig floor - Yes

e. Rotating head - Yes



Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Drilling Plan
Page DP-2-

f. The blooie line shall be at least 6 inches in diameter and extend at least 100 feet from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

g. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling below
500 feet).

h. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

i. A mistor with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the blooie
lines for dust suppression.

6. Proposed Circulating Medium

Depth Mud Type
0 to TD Air / Mist
7. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program
a. Cores~ Possible core of Ferron Sand
b. DST- None anticipated
c. Logging - DIL-GR (TD to base of surface casing).

a. FDC-CNL-GR-Cal (TD to base of surface casing).

d. Formation and Completion Interval: Ferron interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.

Simulation:  Simulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.
e. Frac gradient: Approximately 0.80 psi/ft.

8. Anticipated Cementing Program:
a. See Form #3, Section 24.

Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to circulate cement to
the surface. A bond log will b e run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by the
authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

9. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards:

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H,S has been encountered in or known to
exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area. Maximum anticipated bottom hole
pressure equals approximately 1500 psi (calculated 0.517 psi/ft) and maximum anticipated surface
pressure equals approximately 862 psi (bottom hole pressure minus the pressure of a partially evacuated
hole calculated at 0.22 psi/ft).



Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Surface Use Plan
Page SU-I-

Surface Use Plan
Mid-Power Resource Corporation
Alpine School District 3-17

Existing Road:

a.
b.

Topo Map ‘A’ is the vicinity map showing the access route from Scofield, Utah.

Topo Map ‘B’ shows the proposed access road to each well. It also shows existing roads
in the immediate area.

The existing and proposed access road, unless otherwise stated, shall be crowned,
ditched, and dipped from the nearest improved road.

Occasional maintenance blading and storm repairs will keep roads in good condition.
There shall be no mud blading on the access road. Vehicles may be towed through the
mud provided they stay on the roadway.

Planned Access Roads:

o w

o

@ mo oo

Maximum grade will be 8% or less.

No turnouts are required.

Low water crossings to be placed in the proposed access road during drilling process and
culverts may be installed at a later date.

Road surface material will be that native to the area.

No cattleguards are required.

The proposed access road was flagged at the time the location was staked.

The back slopes of the proposed access road will be no steeper than vertical or ¥:1 in
rock and 2:1 elsewhere.

Location of Existing Wells:

a.

See Topo Map ‘B’

Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities:

a.

b.

All Petroleum Production Facilities are to be contained within the proposed location
sites.
In the event that production of these wells is established, the following will be shown:
i. Proposed location and attendant lines, by flagging, if off well pad.

ii. Dimensions of facilities.

iii. Construction methods and materials.
The area used to contain the proposed production facilities will be built using native
materials. If these materials are not acceptable, then other arrangements will be made to
acquire them from private sources. These facilities will be constructed using bulldozers,
graders, and workman crews to construct and place the proposed faculties.
All permanent facilities placed on the locations shall be painted a non-reflective color,
which will blend with the natural environment.
A dike shall be constructed around the tank battery, of sufficient capacity to adequately
contain at least 110 percent of the storage capacity of the largest tank within the dike.
All buried pipelines shall be covered to a depth of 3 feet except at road crossings where
they shall be covered to a depth of 4 feet.



Mid-Power Resource Corporation

Surface Use Plan

Page SU-2-

g Construction width of the right-of-way/pipeline route shall be restricted to 50 feet of
disturbance.

h. Pipeline location warning signs shall be installed within 90 days upon completion of
construction.

Location and Water Supply:

a. Any water to be used for the drilling of this well will be from the Price River Water
Improvement District (an adjudicated industrial water source) and transported by a
local trucking company (Nielson Construction).

b. No water wells are to be drilled.

Source of Construction Materials:

a. No construction materials are needed for drilling operations. In the event of production,
the small amount of gravel needed for facilities will be hauled in by truck form a local
gravel pit over existing access roads from the area. No special access other than for
drilling operations and pipeline construction is needed.

b. All access roads crossing BLM land is shown on Topo Map ‘B’.

c¢. All well pad surface disturbance areas are on Alpine School District (FEE) lands.

Methods for Handling Waste Disposal:

Drill cuttings will be buried in the reserve pit when covered.

Drilling fluids will be contained in the reserve pit.

c. Any hydrocarbon liquids produced while production testing will be contained in a test
tank. Any unavoidable spills of oil or other adverse substances or materials will be
removed immediately during drilling progress or during completion operations.

d. Portable chemical toilets will be provided and services by a local commercial sanitary
service.

e. Garbage and trash will be collected in a trash cage and its contents hauled to a sanitary
landfill. All wastes caused by the construction activities shall be promptly removed and
disposed of in a sanitary landfill or as directed by the company representative.

f. Prior to commencement of drilling, the reserve pit will be fenced on three sides using 39-
inch net wire with at least one (1) strand of barbed wire. All wire is to be stretched
before attaching to corner posts. When drilling activities are completed it will be fenced
on the fourth side and allowed to dry (if liquids are present). After drying, the fences
will be removed and the pits shall be buried. Reclamation will be undertaken no later
than the fall of the year after all drilling activity has ceased.

o

Ancillary Facilities:

a. No airstrips, camps, or other living facilities will be built off the locations. Housing and
office trailers will be on the location as seen on the location layout.

Well Site Layout:

a. See attached cut sheet.
b. Company representatives will determine if the pit is to be lined, and if so, the type of
material to be used.
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Topsoil shall be stripped to a depth of 4 to 6 inches and stockpiled as shown on the
location layout plat.

The back slopes of the locations will be no steeper than vertical or ¥:1 in rock and 2:1
elsewhere.

The upper edges of all cut banks on the access roads and well pads will be rounded.
Catchment ponds to be placed as required to intercept drainage re-routes.

Plans for Restoration:

Immediately upon completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

Before any dirt work to restore the location takes place, the reserve pit must be
completely dry. The reserve pit will be reclaimed within one (1) year from the date of
well completion.

All disturbed areas will be seeded with the mixture, which is found suitable by the Utah
Division of Wildlife Resources and the landowner.

The seedbed will be prepared by disking, following the natural contour. Drill seed on
contour at a depth no greater than ¥ inch. In areas that cannot be drilled, the seed will
be broadcast at double the seeding rate and harrowed into soils. Certified seed is
recommended.

Fall seeding will be completed after September, and prior to prolonged ground frost.

If the well is a producer, access roads will be upgraded and maintained as necessary to
prevent soil erosion, and accommodate year round traffic. Areas unnecessary to
operations will be reshaped, topsoil distributed, and seed distributed according to the
above mixtures. Perennial vegetation would be established. Additional work may be
required in case of seeding failures, etc.

If the well is abandoned or is a dry hole, the access road and location will be restored to
approximate the original contours. During reclamation of the site, the fill material will
be pushed into cuts and up over the back slope. No depressions will be left that would
trap water or form ponds. Topsoil will be distributed evenly over the location and
seeded according to the above mixture. The access road and the location shall be ripped
or disked prior to seeding. Perennial vegetation must be established. Additional work
shall be required in case of seeding failures, etc.

Annual or noxious weeds shall be controlled on all disturbed areas. Method of control
shall be by an approved mechanical method or an Environmental Protection Agency
(EPA) registered herbicide. All herbicide application will be in cooperation with Carbon
County Weed Control personnel.

Other Information:

a.

b.

C.

Man uses the area for the primary purpose of grazing domestic livestock.
i, All activity shall cease when soils or road surfaces become saturated to a depth
of three inches, unless otherwise approved by the company representative.

ii. If any fossils are discovered during construction, the operator shall cease
construction immediately and notify the company representative so as to
determine the significance of the discovery.

A Class 11T cultural resource inventory was completed prior to disturbance by a qualified
professional archaeologist.

The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are
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uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might
further disturb such materials and contact the State Historic Preservation Office
(SHPO). The SHPO Officer will outline (if any) what mitigation is appropriate.

i. If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the expense of
mitigation and/or delays associate with this process, the SHPO will assume
responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed
materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The SHPO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for
the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from the State that the required
mitigation has been completed, the operator will be allowed to resume
construction.

d. Less than 10,000 pounds of any chemical(s) from the EPA's Consolidated list of
Chemicals Subject to Reporting Under Title IIl of the Superfund Amendments and
Reauthorization Act (SARA) of 1986, and less then threshold planning quantity (TPQ) of
any extremely hazardous substance(s), as defined in 40 CFR, would be used, produced,
transported, stored, disposed, or associated with the proposed action.

Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative:

Marion Energy, Inc.
Mr. Keri Clarke
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, Texas 75069
(972) 540-2967

Certification:

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site(s) and access route(s); that I am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Marion Energy, Inc.
and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions
under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provision of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

%&@\j\ 4/28/2006

Keri Clarke Date
Company Representative
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MEMORANDUM OF SURFACE USE AGREEMENT

KNOW All MEN BY THESE PRESENTS:

That Alpine School District, whose address is 575 North 100 East, American Fork, UT,
84003 ("Grantor") and Mid-Power Resource Corporation, represented by its authorized
agent Marion Energy Inc. (Mid-Power), whose address is 119 South Tennessee, Suite
200, McKinney, Texas, 75069("Grantee,") have entered into a Surface Use and Damage
Agreement dated effective as of /| iz N 200 ("Agreement"). { &idaibiF 6) (%/

} :
The Agreement, which is unrecorded and may be found in the files of the Grantor

and Grantee, is adopted herein and made a part hereof by reference to the same full extent
as if all its provisions were copied in full in this Memorandum.

Pursuant to the terms of the Agrecment, Grantor grants to Grantee and all of its
parent, subsidiary, or other affiliated companies, their agents, employees and others
authorized by them the right-of-way to use the Property described in Exhibit A and
Exhibit Al, attached hereto and made a part of this Memorandum ("Property™), for the
purpose of access to and from mineral leases it owns and operates underlying and in the
vicinity of the Property ("Leases"), for well locations, and other facilities related to its
conduct of operations pursuant to the Leases.

This Memorandum shall be binding on and inure to the benefit of Grantor and
Grantee, thejr respective heirs, administrators, successors and assigns.

The parties hereto have executed this Memorandum as of the dates of the
respective acknowledgements.

/ //‘ ““7 ) Y
= e N QU

Represenunpitie Alpine School District Representing Mid-Power
575 North 100 East, American Fork, 119 S. Tennessee, Suite 200
UT, 84003 McKinney, Texas, 75069

G
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EXHIBIT "B"

STATE OF UTAH }
}ss
COUNTY OF CARBON }

ThZ)forcgoing instrument was acﬁowledoed Ibﬂ/l'or this 25 day of
fﬂl

il , 2006 by_ K.0bex , personally
known to me who acknowledged before me that they executed the foregoing instrument

for the uses and purposes set forth herein.

Notary Public

WITNESS my hand and seal.

My Commission Expires:

4%

Texas
STATE OF-UFAH }
Lol }ss

COUNTY OF-€ARBON }

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me on this [ tL’dﬂy of

AQ/’« | 2006by <ERL CLARKE , 0N
behalf of said company.
WITNESS my hand and seal.
My Commission Expires: /S,;;zf 440@
Notary Public (/
o . y
\_ngﬂtl'in’\_li’ij'_ /ZI 00
SRt SCOTT 5. JACOBY
£ & Notary Public, State of Texas
2 E'—, ,.}4 "¢'$: My Commission Expires
2 ,,g;,‘,‘n‘ September 12, 2009

Pg.

@oo7
2
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GRANT OF EASEMENT

This grant of easement is entered into and made effective this 25 day of April
2006, by and between Tommy Jobn Nicolaides, of 989 Military Drive, Salt Lake City,
Utah 84108 (“Owner”), and Marion Energy Inc., 119 8. T ennessee, Suite 200,
McKinney, TX 75069 of (“Operator”). - -

WITNESSETH

Owner owns an interest in the mineral estate under those certain lands
described on Exhibit “A” attached hereto and made a part hereof (the “Subject
Lands”) which lands are subject to a Surface Use Easement between the surface estate
owner and Operator, also described on Exhibit “A” (the “Easement”); :

Operator is the lessee of an oil and gas lease covering the Subject Lands and
under oil and gas leases covering other lands in the swrrounding area. Operator’s
operations in the area contemplate a surface drillsite on the Subject Lands which will
include wells drilled into and bottomed in lands adjacent to the Subject Lands or other
lands; , '

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises and: other valuable
consideration, the sufficiency and receipt of which are hereby acknowledged, Owner
grants to Operator, its successors and assigns, in addition to any rights granted under
the Owner’s Lease, such right of way and easement in, on, over, across and through
the subsurface of the Subject Lands as Operator may reasonably require for boring
well holes, casing same, and othexwise completing, producing and maintaining wells
either in the Subject Lands or on any lands other than the Subject Lands from a
location of operations on the Subject Lands, subject to the following terms and
conditions: ,

1. For all purposes herein, any wells drilled into and:the producing
intervals of which are bottomed under other lands, the surface locations
of which are located on the Subject Lands, shall be considered to have
been drilled in such other lands and the operation of such wells shall be
conducted in accordance with the terms and conditions of the oil and
gas leases covering the bottom locations of such wells.

2. Should the Owner’s Lease covering the surface drillsite location
terminate due to lack of production, or for aiy other reason, the rights
granted Operator under this agreement shall not terminate or expire so
long as drilling, completing, producing or maintenance activities are
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being conducted from the Subject Lands for the benefit of other lands in
the surrounding area.

3. When the easement granted hereunder is no longer useful, necessary or
convenient to Operator, Operator shall, at the request of Owner, execute
and record a release of this easement. However, Operator shall have no
obligation to remove any of its underground equipment but shall have
the option, at its sole discretion, to do so.

4, The rights granted herein may be assigned by the parties in whole or in
part, and the terrs, conditions and provisions hereof shall extend to and
be binding upon the parties, their successors and assigns. :

Operator: M/Larion Energy Inc.
y

Owner:
.\(// . {K
<
ommy John olaxdes ’ Its L2 25D
State of Utah )

), .
County of, ?)'IMAM )
Z/jﬂ/day of

he foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me thxs
2006 by Tommy John Nicolaides.

A

Notary public
My commission expires: '

A% YA,

.- TISHA LARSEN
) e
PHHAIH UT 84627

" COMN. EXPIRES 4-13-2009




Exhibit “A”

Attached to and made part of that certain Grant of Easement dated
April 25, 2006 by and between Tommy John Nicolaides (Owner)
and Marion Engery, Inc. (Operator).

The Northwest quarter of the Northeast quarter of Section 17,

Township 13 South, Range 7 East, Salt Lake Base and Meridian,
Carbon County, Utah., '

100/100 4 Wd 60171 03K 900¢-30-ddy
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Mid-Power Resource Corporation

' ABéBO Wost éahaﬁa Avanﬁe. Sulle 186
Las Vegas, Nevada 89117
702-338-0718 Fam 702-838-5087

August 25, 2005

Mr. Keri Clarke

Vice President - Land

Marion Energy Inc.

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
- MeKinney, Texas 75089

Re: Clear Creek Unit — Carbon/Emery Counties, Utah
Dear Mr. Clarke:

Mid-Power Resource Corporation, as operator of the Clear Creek Unit located in
Carbon/Emery Counties, Utah, hereby, authorizes and empowers Marion Energy
Inc. to act as a designated agent on its behaif.

As designated agent, Marion Energy Inc. shall handie all operational matters
relating to the Clear Creek Unit and shall deal directly with ail State and Federal
regulatory agencies in Utah (USDA Forest Service, BLM, and the DOGM) on
such operational matters.

This authorization is in accordance with the terms and conditions outlined in the
Farmout and Exploration Agreement entered into on February 22, 2005 by and
between Mid-Power Resource Corporation and Marion Energy Inc.

Sincerely, :
President

z-d IbLE-bTI2-20L 201440 SUTIUNODOH dz1:21 an RN o3an
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 4B
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

BondNo. __9578030406 DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

COLLATERAL BOND

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS:

That we (oparator name) _MId-Power Resource Corporation as Principal,
which ia duly authorized and qualified to do business in the State of Litah, are heid and firmly bound unto the State of Utah in the sum of:
Ona Hundred Elghty Four Thousand One Hundred Eighty: dollars ($_$184,180.00

lawful money of the United States by virtue of the Joliowing financial instruments (cash account, negotiable bonds of the United States, a state
or municipality, or negotiable certificate of deposit — see Rule R649-3-1):

Negotiable Cerlificate of Deposit #9578030406

payable to the Director of the Divisian of Oit, Gas and Mining, as agent of the State of Utah, for the use and benofit of the Blate of Lkah for the
faithiul payment of which we bind ourseives, our helrs, executors, administrators and successors, jointly and severally by these presents.

THE CONDITION OF THIS OBLIGATION IS SUCH THAT, WHEREAS the Principal Is or will be engaged in the driling, redriling, deepening,
repairing, operating, and plugging and abandonment of a we#l or wells and restoring the well sita or sltes in the State of Utah for the purposes of
oil or gas production and/or the injection and disposal of ffulds In connection therewith for the following described land oc well:

~Y_ Blanket Bond (T&,ﬁwqwﬁdfﬂmpﬂfhﬁﬂm&m EbUaky MiKe. bAu':s)
—_ Individual Bond: Well No:

Secton: _________ Township: Range:

County: , Utah

NOW, THEREFORE, {f the above bounden Principal shall comply with all the provisions of the laws of the State of Utah and the rules, orders and
requirements of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of (he State of Utah, Including, but not kmited 1o the proper plugging and abandonment of wells
and well site restoration, then this obégation is void; otherwlse, the same shall be and remalin In full force and effect.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, said Princlpal has hereunto subscribed tis name and has caused this instrument to ba sigived by its duly auhorized
officers and its corporate or notary seal to be affixed this

Z.S dayof _March ,20 05
(ﬁComorate or Notary Seal here)

[ See attached Jurat

Mid-Power Resource Corparation

Altestee; Datuo:
Principal (company name)
By James W. Scott CEO & President
%ﬂ"e m
Signature

- COPY
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ALL-PURPOSE ACKNOWLEDGMENT

State of Califomnia

County of _SQ0RAMONTO _

DATE) ¥ (NOTARY)

personally appeared g) 0 Me=. CSQO‘}")‘

SIGNER(S)

. Mpersonally known to me - OR - [7] proved to me on the basis of satisfactory

: evidence to be the person(s) whose name(s)

is/are subscribed to the within instrument and

acknowledged to me that hefshe/they executed

the same in hisfher/their authorized

AYANAHEPBURN‘& capacity(ies). and that by his/her/their

Comn § 1543641 signatures(s) on the instrument the person(s),

or the cntity upon behall of which the
person(s) acted, executed the instrument.

WITNESS my hand and official seal.

NOTARY'S SIGNATURE

mmmems O PTIONAL INFORMATION sssemm—m
The information below is not required by law. However, it could prevent fmudulent attachmenl of this acknowl-
cdgment 1o an unauthorized document.

CAPACITY CLAIMED BY SIGNER (PRINCIPAL)  DESCRIPTION OF ATTACHED DOCUMENT

WK wovibuaL
] CORPORATE OFFICER Q‘l’%[ m_d

TITLE OR TYPE OF DOCUMENT

T TITLE )
(] PARTNER(S) j—-

(0 ATTORNEY-IN-FACT NUMBER OF PAGES
(] TRUSTEE(S)

[} GUARDIAN/CONSERVATOR
("] OTHER:

DATE OF DOCUMENT

QTHER

SIGNER IS REPRESENTING: RIGHT THUMBPRINT
NAMEOF PERSON(S) OR ENTITY(IES) OF

SIGNER

Top of thumbprint kece

APA 599 VALLEY-SIERRA. 800-367 3169

¥°d I¥LE-¥#12-20L 8014340 2uiaunocooy eg¥:0l SO 21 22
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August 24, 2004

Mr. Ed Bonner

State of Utah

School and Institutional Trust
Lands Administration

675 East 500 South, Suite 500

Salt Lake City, Utah 84102-2818

Re:  Mid-Power Rasource Corporation
Bonding Requirement Changes

Dear Ed:

In'response to TLA's bonding requirement changes, we have reviewed and verifisd that
our bonding requirements are in compliance with the new rules.

Our findings indicate that a cash deposit in the amount of $20,000 was accepted by TLA
on September 11, 2002 as surety to cover operations of the Utah Mineral State Well and
the Oman 2-20 Well under lease ML1256. Those two wells are also covered under our
bond with DOGM for plugging and abandonment.

Since the new rules require operators to post a performance bond with TLA in the
amount of $5,000 per well, we request that the cash balance of $10,000 be release back
to Mid-Power Resource Corporation.

Please feel free to contact me should you have any questions conceming this matter. |
can be reached at 702-838-0716.

Sincerely,

Susan Trimboli

ccC: Earlene Russell - DOGM — Fax Number 801-359-3940
Mark Roedell -Mid-Power Service Corporation

1#LE-¥12-20L 301440 2Juraunoosoy eg4+:01 SO 21
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School and Institutional
Utah! TRUST LANDS ADMINISTRATION

675 Sast 500 South, Sulte 660
i -2818
Olene S. Walker Sak Lake City, Utah 84102-2,
Gavornor B01.538-5100
Kevin §. Carter | 807-365-0922 (Fax)
Director hitp://veares.trustiands.cam

May 4, 2004

MID-POWER RESQURCES CORPORATION
3753 HOWARD HUGES PARKWAY

SUITE 200

LAS VEGAS, NV 89109

RE: Banding Requirement Changes
Effective: February 24, 2004

Dear Sir or Madam:

Effective February 24, 2004, School and Institutional Trust Lands Administration (“TLA") entered
into an agreement with the Board of Qil, Gas and Mining (“DOGM") to transfer to DOGM the
responsibility of maintaining a sufficient performance bond to plug each dry or abandoned well,
repair each well causing poliution, and maintain and restore each well site, if necessary. In the
past, operalors have been required to post bonds in various amounts with TLA to cover their
operations on lands owned and administered by TLA; with DOGM if the company had operations
on fee lands in Ulah; and, still another, if its operations were on federat lands. Under our new
agreement with DOGM, TLA will no longer require operators to post a plugging and reclamation
bond with this office. All plugging and reclamation bonds for operations on TLA lands or fee
lands will now be administered by DOGM under their rule R649-3-1, as revised July 1, 2003, if
you currently have a bond in place with DOGM, please check with their office as it may be
sufficient to caver operations on trust lands and no additional bond may be required. The DOGM
rules can be viewed and bond forms can be downloaded from the DOGM website at
http://ogm.utah.qov/oilgas.

Operators will be required, however, to post a performance bond in the amount of $5,000 per
well or $15,000 statewide with TLA to cover lease cbligations on TLA lands not otherwise
covered by the DOGM bond. Delinquent or unpaid royalties would be examples of deficiencies
that couid be remedied by the bond. The surety sources are the same as set out in TLA's
current rules at R850-20-2800.

Your company has 120 days from the date of this letter or until September 1, 2004, to verify and
update your bonding to come into compliance with the new rules. Should you need assistance or
have compliance questions, please contact the following people for help:

At TLA — Ed Bonner (801/538-5151 or edbonner@utah.gov)
At DOGM - Earlene Russell (801/538-5336 or earlenerussell@utah.gov)

As soon as TLA is provided evidence by your company that: (1) it has sufficient bonding wilh

DOGM lo cover plugging and reclamation operations; {2) your company has no outstanding
obligations with TLA that would be remedied by your bond, and, (3) your company provides TLA

Ufh!

20
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—~——— ~ - ——with-the-appropriate-well or-statewide replacement hond for {uture lease_obligations _in the
appropriate amount, your current bond will be released. If you would like your bond with TLA o
be lransferred to DOGM's ownership, and if the instrument allows for such a transfer, please
make arrangements with your surety and with DOGM. No bonds will be released by TLA until

sufficient evidence is provided that all requirad bonding is in place and {hat there are no

outstanding obligations to TLA.

There will be a transition period, but TLA sees this as a positive move for the industry that will
simplify your statewide bonding requirements in the State of Utah.

We appreciate your assistance with these changes and look forward to hearing from you.

Yours very truly,

SCHOQGL AND INSTITUTIONAL TRUST

Assls@ant Director/Oil & Gas

Lcd 1+LE-+12-200L
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April 14, 2004

NOTICE TO OPERATORS
Concerning
Plugging Bonds for State Lease Wells

Fekkkkkdkkkdkkkkkkhkkkkkkkhkhkkihkkikkkikhkkkkk

Effective February 24, 2004, the School and Institutional Trust Lands
Administration (SITLA) entered into an agreement with the Board and Division of Oil,
Gas and Mining (DOGM) to transfer to DOGM the responsibility of maintaining sufficient
bonds to cover drilling, operating and plugging of wells and the restoration of each well
site. In the past, operators have been required to post bonds in various amounts with
SITLA to cover their operations on lands owned and administered by SITLA, with
DOGM if the company had operations on fee lands in Utah, and still another if its
operations were on federal lands. Under this new agreement, SITLA will no longer
require operators to post a plugging and reclamation bond. All plugging and
reclamation bonds for operations on SITLA lands and fee lands will now be
administered by DOGM under their rule R649-3-1, as revised July 1, 2003.

Operators are required, however, to post a performance bond for delinquent or
unpaid royalties in the amount of $5,000 per well or $15,000 statewide with SITLA to
cover lease obligations on SITLA lands not otherwise covered by the DOGM bond.
The surety sources are the same as set out in SITLA’s current rules at R850-20-2800.
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WORKSHEET
"APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 05/01/2006

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17

ey

BENJAMIN EVANS

WELL NAME:

OPERATOR: =y ( N2ngd )

CONTACT:

PROPOSED LOCATION:

17 1308 070E
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
0095 FNL 1585 FWL

NWNE

SURFACE:
BOTTOM:

COUNTY : CARBON

LATITUDE: 39.69494
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 486248
CLEAR CREEK

LONGITUDE: -111.1604
NORTHINGS: 4393702

FIELD NAME: ( 10 )

3
ML-1257
4

LEASE TYPE: State

LEASE NUMBER:
SURFACE OWNER:

Fee

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-007-31182

PHONE NUMBER: 702-838-0716

INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

Tech Review Initials Date
Engineering T>V<@> Q/ZG{0£5
Geology

Surface

PROPOSED FORMATION: FRSD

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

&~ Plat

Bond: Fed[] Indl[]
(No. _febdilgt™

Potash (Y/N)

0il Shale 190-5

Water Permit
(No. PRRV

RDCC Review
(Date:

Sta[] Feell
)

(B) or 190-3 or 190-13

(Y/N)

Fee Surf Agreement @Q/N)

)

Intent to Commingle (Y/N)

LOCATION AND SITING:
R649-2-3.

Unit: CLEAR CREEK

R649-3-2. General

Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

R649-3-3. Exception

Drilling Unit

Board Cause No:
Eff Date:
Siting:

~/ R649-3-11.

Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

~

Ne(dg \P.\n H/OC;'=&$OC,B

STIPULATIONS:

L’Q;yocdvtﬂ NSfif

Zs QV‘A:;,EWW o %%t S




Ti13S R7E

BHL @

317

ALPINE SCHOOL
DIST 3-17

T DIST 647

- @AI.PI.\'I SCHOOL

BHL

[S]

CLEAR CREEK HELD
CLEAR CREEK UNIT

COOK 17-2
®

UTAH FUEL 7
L3
COOR 21
OMAN 220
OPERATOR: MID-POWER RES CORP (N2215)
SEC: 17 T.13S R.7E w .v
AN
FIELD: CLEAR CREEK (10) ~J
COUNTY: CARBON %
Wells Status
SPACING: R649-3-11 / DIRECTIONAL DRILLING GAS INJECTION f i
e Utah Oil Gas and Mining
% LOCATION ABANDONED
® NEW LOCATION N
Field Status UnitEs;:;tLu(s) RATORY & PLUGGED & ABANDONED
ABANDONED PRODUCING GAS
-] % GAS STORAGE @ PRODUCING OIL
L ACTIVE NE PP OIL SHUT-IN GAS
COMBINED NF SECONDARY SHUT-IN OIL W E
, PENDING =
] INACTIVE s ST O % TEMP. ABANDONED
1 PROPOSED o GAS TEST WELL
STORAGE = LA S
. TERMINATED PP GEOTHERML £ WATER INJECTION .
| [ PPOIL © WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA WHITNEY
[ ] SECONDARY /M WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 9-MAY-2006
[ ) TERMINATED ~  DRILLING




DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS
OPERATOR: Marion Energy. Inc.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Alpine School District 3-17
API NUMBER: 43-007-31182

LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NWNE Sec:17 TWP: 13 S RNG: 7E 692 FNL 2014 FEL

Geology/Ground Water:

A well drilled at this location will likely spud into a poorly to moderately permeable soil developed on
Quaternary Terrace deposits covering the Cretaceous age Star Point Sandstone Member of the Mancos Shale.
High quality ground water is likely to be encountered in the sandstone Members encountered in the upper
Mancos Shale. Water quality will deteriorate in the deeper strata. The nearest mapping of the base of
moderately saline ground water (~15 miles east northeast) implies that the base of moderately saline ground
water is likely to be above sea level and within several thousand feet of the surface. Several filings have been
made on subsurface water rights within a mile of the location. The proposed casing and cementing program should
be sufficient protect the shallow ground water resource if the surface casing is extended below the Emery Sandstone

Member of the Mancos Shale. The drilling fluid system presently calls for air/mist to TD. It is very unlikely that

this system will be implemented much below the surface owing to very permeable sandstones and large fresh water

flows to significant depth as reported from nearby drilling. A fresh water/gel/polymer mud system will likely be

necessary shortly after spud. In any case, the mud system should be benign to protect the ground water resource.

Reviewer: Christopher J. Kierst Date: 6/6/06

Surface:

Proposed well is located ~2 miles south of Scofield, Carbon County, Utah. The property is located on the west side
of a narrow mountain valley and at the mouth of Green Canyon. The primary surface use of the immediate and
surrounding area of the proposed well is Alpine School District education and recreation activities, as well as
wildlife habitat. The location is staked on property owned by Alpine School District. Access to this well will be
along existing UDOT maintained roads and upgraded two-track roads. The direct area drains to the east into Mud
Creek, eventually making its way into Scofield Reservoir, ~3.5 miles north. Live water boarders this location as
staked on both the south and north sides. A live running stream flows out of Green Canyon, this stream directly
boarders the north side of the pad. A small spring surfaces directly west of the pad ~100 yards then flows in a
northwest to southeast direction, this boarders the south side of the pad and is very marshy. The west side, although
not directly boarding the pad, has live water issues as well. A municipal water source is located within 1000 feet of
the proposed well. There are significant impacts to the operations of the school district’s education program that
takes place on this property. Safety of the school children is of great concern. Hydrology (surface and subsurface) is
a concern of The Division and has been a very publicly voiced concern of Carbon County officials regarding drilling
activities in the Scofield area. This particular pad has several issues relating to hydrology that will need to be
addressed. In addressing these concerns it will be required by the operator to; berm the location on all four sides,
utilize a closed mud system (no open pits on location), provide and maintain adequate runoff drainage above and
around the location, fencing the location. M. Jones (DOGM), Ben Evans, Erik Norton (Marion), Gayla Williams
(Carbon County), Keith Larsen, Boyd McAfee, John Burton, Rob Smith (Alpine School Dist.), Ed Bonner (SITLA)




were in attendance for the pre-site iuspection. (Further evaluation and discussions with Marion resulted in changing

the pad layout and the pit lining requirements. The reserve pit will be moved to the north side of the pad and the pit

will be lined with a 60 mil liner with an apron extended under the drilling equipment. The pit and its contents are to

be removed at the end of drilling activities. Production tanks are to be located in a suitable place away from the
drilling pad and surface waters. Brad Hill 06-15-06)

Reviewer: Mark L. Jones Date:_ June 6. 2006

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

—

The reserve pit will be moved to the north side of the pad.

The reserve pit shall be lined with a 60 mil liner with an apron extended under the drilling
equipment.

The reserve pit and its contents are to be removed at the end of drilling activities.

Production tanks are to be located in a suitable place away from the drilling pad and surface waters.
Provide adequate drainage and erosion protection for the location and existing drainages.

Berms shall be placed surrounding the entire pad.

Fencing shall be installed around the pad to keep school children away from equipment both during
drilling and production operations.

8. Silt fences shall be placed at the base of all fill material and at the edge of the pad adjacent to any surface
water.

0

NownhAEWw



ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Division of 0Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: Marion Energy, Inc.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: Alpine School District 3-17

API NUMBER: 43-007-31182
LEASE: State FIELD/UNIT:
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NWNE Sec: 17 TWP: 13S RNG: 7E 692 FNL 2014 FEL

LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WEEL.
GPS COORD (UTM): X= 486243 E; Y= 4393716 N SURFACE OWNER: Alpine School
District.

PARTICIPANTS
M. Jones (DOGM), Ben Evans, Erik Norton, Gayla Williams (Carbon County),
Keith Larsen, Boyd McAfee, John Burton, Rob Smith (Alpine School Dist.),
Ed Bonner (SITLA).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

Proposed well is located ~2 miles south of Scofield, Carbon County,
Utah. The property is located on the west side of a narrow mountain
valley and at the mouth of Green Canyon. The primary surface use of the
immediate and surrounding area of the proposed well is Alpine School
District education and recreation activities, as well as wildlife
habitat. The location is staked on property owned by Alpine School
District. Access to this well will be along existing UDOT maintained
roads and upgraded two-track roads. The direct area drains to the east
into Mud Creek, eventually making its way into Scofield Reservoir, ~3.5
miles north.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: Education and recreation, as well as wildlife
habitat.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: 370’ x 180’ w/ 225’ x 50’ x 12’ included
pit.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1-MILE RADIUS: 6 producing,
proposed, shut-in, injection, and/or PA wells are within a 1 mile radius
of the above proposed well.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: Production facilities
will be on location; no pipelines are planned at this time.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: Obtained locally and trucked to site.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: None anticipated.

WILL DRILLING AT THIS LOCATION GENERATE PUBLIC INTEREST OR CONCERNS?

(EXPLAIN): Yes. Alpine School District does not want this well to be
drilled. They have made mention that they feel as though they have been
“bullied” into this. They understand they cannot stop someone from




drilling however tuey feel that Marion has not seriously considered the
impact to the operations of the school district’s education program that
takes place on this property. Safety of the school children is of great
concern. There are significant impacts to the operations of the surface
use with the permitting, drilling, and production of this location and
its wells. Hydrology, surface and subsurface, is of great concern to
The Division and has been a very publicly voiced concern of Carbon
County officials regarding drilling activities in the Scofield area.
This particular pad has several issues relating to hydrology. I
question the placement of this location. Have alternative locations
been looked at and exhausted by Marion before choosing this location?

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

Addressed in the APD in the 13-point surface use plan item #7 Methods
for Handling Waste Disposal.

ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: Live water boarders this location
as staked on both the south and north sides. A live running stream flows
out of Green Canyon, this stream directly boarders the north side of the
pad. A small spring surfaces directly west of the pad ~100 yards then
flows in a northwest to southeast direction, this boarders the south
side of the pad and is very marshy. The west side, although not
directly bordering the pad, has live water issues as well.

FLORA/FAUNA:_ Grasses, sagebrush, pine community. Various species of
wildlife.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: Sandy clay loam.

SURFACE FORMATION & CHARACTERISTICS: Quaternary alluvium

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: Erosive upon disturbance.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: None observed.

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: No open reserve pit will be allowed. Must use closed
mud system.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): Closed mud system.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

As per surface use agreement.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: Signed.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: None requested by landowner.




OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMuNTS

The APD outlines drilling this well completely with air. Two other
wells have been drilled within the past 4 years ~1 mile south of this
proposed well. Both of these previously drilled wells also expected to
drill with air, both had to turn to mud at ~ 200’ due to water flows. I
anticipate this proposed well will also require going to mud prior to
setting surface pipe.

The access into the location is proposed from the south, from Eccles
Canyon, along an existing Questar Pipeline that feeds the school
district facilities. This pipeline runs directly bordering the location
0of the east side of the pad. This access 1is at the request of the
school district. I made comment that this may need some further thought
and pointed out a few items that should be of concern to the school
district. These points were; 1) this access would allow unwelcome
visitors easier access into the school districts facilities from the
“back side”. 2) This access would also necessitate construction and
disturbance to the surface that the school district has strongly been
opposed to. The access was proposed over the top of the Questar line
and I pointed out that you don’t want this access on top of that gas
line and Questar wont allow it! Thus, creating more surface damage and
impact. The school district said they would consider these points.

The reserve pit for this location was of great concern during the pre-
site visit surrounding the points of hydrology and safety for the school
children. It was discussed that the reserve pit would be lined. It was
also discussed that the pit would be reclaimed pricr to snowfall.
Leaving this pit open, then covered with 8 feet of snow is a huge safety
concern with the presence of school children on this property during the
winter months. After reviewing the notes taken during the pre-site
inspection, and after consultation with Brad Hill, DOGM permitting
supervisor, it was decided that a closed mud system would be required
for this location.

Another recreation/education property and facility is also located close
to the proposed well location. It is owned by the LDS Church and is
used by the church year-round for education and recreation of church
members, primarily youth activities. It is located ~ 800’ southeast of
the proposed location.

ATTACHMENTS

Photos of this location were taken and placed on file. Additional
photos taken on June 5, 2006.

Mark L. Jones May 25, 2006 / 11:00 am
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE DATE/TIME




Evaauation Ranking Criteria and Ranking Sc.oure
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200
100 to 200
75 to 100
25 to 75
<25 or recharge area

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000
300 to 1000
200 to 300
100 to 200
< 100

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280

1320 to 5280

500 to 1320

<500

Distance to Other Wells ({feet)

>1320

300 to 1320

<300

Native Soil Type
Low permeability
Mod. permeability
High permeability

Fluid Type

Air/mist

Fresh Water

TDS >5000 and <10000

TDS >10000 or 0il Base Mud Fluid
containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock
Salt or detrimental

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10
10 to 20
>20

Affected Populations
<10
10 to 30
30 to 50
>50

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present

Unknown

Present

Final Score

125

Ranking

15

(Level

I

Site Ranking

20

20

20

20

10

10

10

15

Sensitivity)

Sensitivity Level [ = 20 or more; total containment is required, consider criteria for excluding pit use.

Sensitivity Level I = 15-19: lining is discretionary.

Sensitivity Level Il = below 15; no specific lining is required .




Criteria for determining when to exclude or discourage the use of reserve
pits on a proposed drilling location

1. Proposed well location is situated near a surface water source or
drainage, such that a breach of a pit would result in fluid entering
surface waters.

2. Proposed well location is built on materials such that a breach of a
pit would result in fluid entering shallow ground water, and/or could
be conducted to nearby surface waters.

Example of 1)
Pit would be located above a stream such that any loss of fluid to the

location surface would drain naturally to the stream, and strata
beneath the pit is fractured or otherwise permeable such that a leak
from the pit would result in fluid entering the stream or drainages
leading directly to the stream.

Example of 2)
Pit would be located on the flood plain of a stream such that any loss

of fluid to the surface, or from a pit leak, would flow through
permeable near surface materials directly to the nearby stream.

It is unlawful for any person to discharge a pollutant into “Waters of the
State” or to place or cause to be placed any wastes in a location where
there is probable cause to believe it will cause pollution. Discharge of
pollutants into surface waters must be covered under a UPDES or NPDES
permit or could be subject to penalties under the Utah Water Quality Act or
Federal Clean Water Act. Waters of the State is broadly defined and
includes all surface and ground waters (not confined and retained within
private property limits) and drainage systems.

Alternatives to consider:
1. Use a closed mud system.

2. Move the location.
3. Directional drill.



STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 1 of 5

State Online Services

Agency List Business.utah.gov

UtaH DivisSiON OF WATER RIGHTS

Search Utah.gov m

WRPLAT Program Output Listing

Version: 2004.12.30.00 Rundate: 06/06/2006 11:44 AM
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STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS
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STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS

Number

91-1986

91-200

91-2972

91-2973

91-3012

91-345

Type/Location
Surface

S1020 W310 NE 17
13S 7E SL

Underground

N450 ES00 S4 08 13S

7E SL

Surface

S700 W1840 E4 08
13S7E SL

Surface

S700 W1840 E4 08
13S 7E SL

Surface

S700 W1840 E4 08
13S 7E SL

Surface

S700 W1840 E4 08
13S 7E SL

Surface

S700 W1840 E4 08
13S 7E SL

Surface

S1030 W300 NE 17
13S 7E SL

Surface

S650 W100 N4 17

P

18720000 O

0.050 0.000

19540322 DIO 0.134 0.000

18740000 I

18740000 1

18740000 I

18740000 IS

18740000 1

18690000 IS

18740000 1

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe

0.106 0.000

0.106 0.000

0.381 0.000

0.170 0.000

0.075 0.000

0.015 0.000

0.750 0.000

CORPORATION OF THE PRESIDING
BISHOP LDS CHURCH

ATTN: NATURAL RESOURCE
SERVICES

ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT
50 NORTH CENTER STREET

CARBON CO. REC.
TRANSPORTATION SPECIAL
SERVICE DIS

A SPECIAL SERVICE DIST. CREATED
BY CO. OF CARBON

CARBON CO. REC.
TRANSPORTATION SPECIAL
SERVICE DIS

A SPECIAL SERVICE DIST. CREATED
BY CO. OF CARBON

CARBON CO. REC.
TRANSPORTATION SPECIAL
SERVICE DIS

A SPECIAL SERVICE DIST. CREATED
BY CO. OF CARBON

CARBON CO. REC.
TRANSPORTATION SPECIAL
SERVICE DIS

A SPECIAL SERVICE DIST. CREATED
BY CO. OF CARBON

FRED AND SHELIA JENSEN
P.O. BOX 113

CORPORATION OF THE PRESIDING
BISHOP LDS CHURCH

ATTN: NATURAL RESOURCE
SERVICES

TOM NICOLAIDES
1026 EAST 1ST SOUTH

Page 3 of 5
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STATE OF UTAH, DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS Page 4 of 5

13S 7E SL
ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT BOARD
913460 Underground P 19530715DIO 0.1340.000 o ES N
17\1};158(15500 $4.08 135 50 NORTH CENTER
| KANAWHA AND HOCKING COAL
91-4140 Underground P 18820000 DO 0.150 0.000 AND COKE COMPANY
?;2270E\gi10 NE 17 700 WEST GATE TOWER
KANAWHA AND HOCKING COAL
91-4159  Underground P 18820000 O 1.000 0.000 AND COKE COMPANY
11\]313227(1)3?1? 80 SE 08 700 WEST GATE TOWER
91-4195  Surface P 18740000M 0.100 0.000 SCOFIELD TOWN
?gzstéggis N4 17 SCOFIELD UT 84538
221912 Underground A 199802090  0.000 427.000 CANYON FUEL COMPANY LLC
11‘1335 (;I‘EE ls7L30 SW 17 ATTN: PROPERTY ADMINISTRATION
E1560  Underground A 19790719 X 0.000 118.000 CANYON FUEL COMPANY LLC.
11\13486(;&1325 SW 17 ATTN: PROPERTY ADMINISTRATION
ROBERT AND ELLEN RADAKOVICH
E1658  Surface A 198003030  0.0001.000 RoDEEEAD B RUST
?;5073’;340 E4 08 ROBERT RADAKOVICH, TRUSTEE
KANAWHA AND HOCKING COAL
E1784  Surface A 19810206 M 0.000 15000 o o ANy
?§§o7gzs430 NW 17 SCOFIELD ROUTE
EI1906  Underground frvl—‘;})l A 198105280  0.000 118.000 CANYON FUEL COMPANY LLC
11‘13486(;518125 SW 17 ATTN: PROPERTY ADMINISTRATION
well CORPORATION OF THE PRESIDING
E2475  Underground well A 19861008D 00001000 b Rt HURCH
$1400 W1305 NE 17 ATTN: NATURAL RESOURCE

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe 06/06/2006
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13S 7E SL SERVICES
E772 Underground frvff’g A 197405150 0446 0.000 VALLEY CAMP COAL COMPANY

N1150 W400 SE 08

138 7E SL CASTLE GATE UT 84514

Natural Resources | Contact | Disclaimer | Privacy Policy | Accessibility Policy

http://utstnrwrt6.waterrights.utah.gov/cgi-bin/mapserv.exe 06/06/2006
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Brad Hill - Connie Stauffer Lease and Easement
From: "Ben Evans" <bevans@marionenergy.com>
To: <bradhill@utah.gov>

Date: 6/20/2006 12:31 PM
Subject: Connie Stauffer Lease and Easement

Mr. Hill

Please find attached to this email the lease and sub surface easement documents signed by Ms. Stauffer. Keri
had asked me to forward this information to you as you had received a phone call from Ms. Stauffer earlier in the
week.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thanks
Ben Evans

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy, Inc

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, Texas
75069

Tel: (972) 540-2967 ext. 3004

Cell: (214) 534-0358
Fax: (972) 547-0442

file://C:\Documents and Settings\ogmuser\Local Settings\Temp\GW }00002.HTM 6/22/2006
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GRANT OF EASEMENT

This grant of easement is entered into and made effective this 4th day of May
2006, by and between Connie Stauffer, of 2100 bengal Blvd. #E-102, Cottonwood
Heights, UT 84121 (“Owner”), and Marion Energy Inc., 119 S. Tennessee, Suite 200,
McKinney, TX 75069 of (“Operator”).

WITNESSETH

Owner owns an imtersst in the mineral estate under those certain lands
described on Exhibit “A” anached hereto and made a part hereof (the “Subject
Lands”) which lands are subject to a Surface Use Easement between the surface estate
awner and Operator, also described on Exhibit “A” (the “Easement™);

Operator is the lessee of an oil and gas lease covering the Subject Lands and
under 0il and gas leases covering other lands in the surrounding area. Qperator’s
operations in the area contemplate a surface drillsite on the Subject Lands which will
inchade wells drilled into and bottomed in lands adjacent to the Subject Lands or other
lands;

NOW, THEREFORR, in consideration of the premises and other valuable
consideration, the sufficiency and receipt of which are hereby acknowledged, Owner
grants to Qperator, its successors and assigns, in additon to any rights granted under
the Owner’s Lease, such right of way and eascment in, on, over, across and through
the subsurface of the Subject Lands as Operator may reasonably require for boring
well holes, casing same, and otherwise completing, producing and maintaining wells
cither in the Subject Lands or on any lands other than the Subject Lands from a
location of operations on the Subject Lands, subject to the following terms and
conditions:

1. For all purposes herein, any wells drilled into and the producing
intervals of which are bottomed under other lands, the surface locations
of which are located on the Subject Lands, shall be considered to bave
been drilled in such other lands and the operation of such wells shall be
conducted in accordance with the terms and conditions of the oil and
gas leases covering the bottom locations of such wells.

2. Should the Owner's Lease covering the surface drillsite location
terminate due to lack of produetion, ox for any other reason, the rights
granted Operator under this agreement shall not terminate or expire 50
long as drilling, completing, producing or maintenance activities are

g4 LT NAR 0ART7 L8
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being conducted from the Subject Lands for the benefit of other lands in
the surrounding area.

3. When the easement granted hereunder i8 no longer useful, necessary or
convenient to Operator, Operator shall, at the request of Owner, cxecute
and record a release of this easement. However, Operator shall have no
obligation to remove any of its underground equipment but shall have
the option, at its sole discretion, to do so.

4, The rights granted hercin may be assigned by the parties in whole or in

part, and the terms, conditions and provisions hereof shall extend 1o and
be binding upon the parties, their successors and assigns.

Qwuner:

e, D,

Connie Stauffer Ead Its
KRl UCTARRE
VICE PRESIDENT - LAND
State of Utah )
)
County o

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this é” day of

'ﬂ[%__, 2006 by Connie Stauffer.

Notary public
My commission expires:

W-A%7207 ,
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EXHIBIT “A™*

Attached to and madc a part of that certain Grant of Easement, dated May 4, 2006, by and
between Connie Stauffer, Owner and Marion Energy Ine.

TOWNSHIP 13 SQUTH, RANGE 7 EAST, SLM

Section 17: NW/ANE/4



PAID UP OIL AND GAS LEASF,

THIS LBASP AGREEMENT is made a3 of the 41ty day of May, 1006, by and batween Coonie Sigufier whose address is 2100 Beagal Blvd 45-102,
Cononwood Helghs, UT 84121 as Leasor {whether onc or more), snd - Weleott LLC., with offices ar §50 Cedar Avenns, Grand Juacbon, CO
§150]- us Lowwce.

1. Description. In considecation of a cash boous in hand paid and the covenants herein contained, Lessor hereby grants, Jepses and lews exclusively to
Lessec the following deacribed land, hiereinafier called Leased Premises:

The Northwest quarter of the Northeast quartcr of Section 17, Township 13 South, Range 7 East, Sait Lake Base and Meridiaa,

in the County{les) of Carbon, State of Uszh contalning 40.00 @oss awves, more or fess (Ineluding any Interests therein which Lessor may hereafter
acquite by reversion, prescription or otherwise), for the purpase of explering for, developing, producing and pmrketing oil and g, along with all
hydrocarbon ard non hydrocarbon sut produced in iation therewith. The tenm “gzas™ as used beroin includes balhum, sarbon dioxide,
gas sulfur pounds, ¢oal bed methane and all sub prodaced in clation therewith fom coal-beesing formations, and otber
comamercial gasss, as well as noxmal lydrocarbou gases. In addition to the sbove-described land, this leass and the term “Leased Premises” also
cavers nccrerions and any amall strips or pareels of land now or heyeafier owaed by Lessor which are comiguous or adjacent to the above-deseribed
\and, and, in cansideraion of the afurernentloned cash bonug, Lessor agroes 10 executs a2 Lesseo’s request any additional or supplémental instrumeots
for a more complete or accurate description of the Jand 5o ¢ovcred. For the purposs of determining the amount of any payments hased on acreage
heveunder, the number of gross acies abovs specificd shall bo docined correct, whether actually more or less.

3. Term of Leass. This lease, whlch Is a "paid-up* lcasc vequiting o rentuls, shall be in force for a pritoary term of five (3) ycars from the date
hereot, and for as Jong Lhereafter s oi) oF gas or othey substances covered hereby are produced in peying quantities from the Leased Promises or tfom
lands pooled or unitized therewith or this lease is otherwisc meintained in eficct pursuant to the provisions bereof. This leasc tpay, at Lesses's
option, be extended as ro all or past of he leads covered hereby for 2a additional term of five (5) years campencing on the date that the Jease would
have expired but for the extension. Lessee may eereiss its option by paying of teadering 10 Lotsor an extension payment equel to the paymeat of
the primary five () year tevm of this lease.

3. Royalty Payment. Royeltics ou ofl, gas and other substances produced and saved hereunder shall be paid by Lessee o Lessor as follows:
(a) For oil and cther itquid hydrocarbons separated a1 Lessee's sepurator faciliries, the soyalty shall be one-cighth (1/8) of such production, to
be dedivered ol Lessee's opuon 10 Lessor ar the wellhazd or 10 Lessor's credlr as the oil purchaser's transportetion fucilities, provided that
Lesseo shull bave the continuing tight 1o sell sueb production 1o itself or an affiliate at the welihead markes price then prevailing In the
same ficld (or if there is oo such price thes provailing in e saao field, then in the nearest feld in which there is such s prevailing price)
for production of sirilar grade and gravity; R
{b) for gas (including caslnghewd gos) and all othor substancgs covered hereby, the royalty shall be onc-¢ighth (1/3) of the proceeds realized by
Lessee Srom the sale thereof, provided that Lessec shall have the conrninuing right 1o sell such production o itsaif or an affillate ar the
prevailing wellhead market price paid for production of similar quality in the skme field (of if theve is no such price then prevailing in the
same ficld, then in the nearest ficld in which 1here is such a prevailiag price) pursuant (o comparable purchase arrsngemenits cotered info on
the same or nearest preceding dete as the date on which Lesses or its affiliate cosnmerces its purchases hereusder, md
(€} in calculating royalties on production hereunder, Lessce mway deduct Lessor's proportionats part of say 94 valorem, producrica and excise
taxes, ead any costs incurred by Lessee in treating, processing, delivering and otherwise marketiog such producrion.
If as the end of the primary torm or any Lne thercafier one or more wells on the Leased Premises or Jands pooled or unitized therewith are capablc of
producing oll or gas or other substances covered hereby in paying quantitics, but such wel) or welis are zither shut in or preduction therefrom is uot
being soid by Lesses or other non producing operations are being comtucted as set out below, such well or wells shel) nevertheless be docted 1o be
producing in paying quantities for the purpose of mainzaining this fesse. Lessee shall be ohliguted to pay or tender 10 Lessor on or before the
xaniversary datc of this feasc next ensumg afles the cupirerion of nincty (90) days from the date such well Is shut-in or b which dewatering
operntions have commenced and thereafier 0a or before the succeeding saniversery dates of this lease during the period or pedods such well I3 shut-
In o i3 in the process of dewatcering, a3 royalty the amount of One dollar per year per nes royalty acre realred hereunder, provided that, if Jeascd
minerals from any well are soid or used as aforcsald prior W any such anniveisary dafe of this lease, or if B sny such anniversary dze, this lease I
beipg mainnined in force and effect otherwise than by reason of such shut-in or dewalering well, Levsee shall not be obligeaed 1o pay or tender, on or
before (hat particular anniversary dare, sald swn of moncy. Sach shus-in or dewstering payment shall be desmed a royalty under all provisions of thiy
legsc. Lessee's failura to propesty pay shut-ln royelty shall render Lessee linble for the amount due, but shall not opeTate to terminate this lease.

4. Depository Agent Al shut-in roysity paymeots under this lease ehall be paid or tendercd to Lessor or to Lessor's credit with 8 depositery bask or
other depository sgent, the name of which will ba supplied to Lesses upon sequest, and which shall be Lessar's depasitory agent for receiviog
piyments regirdless of changes in the ownexship of said land. All payments or tenders may be made in curmency, or by check or by draft rnd such
piyments or Tenders to Lesso of o the deposttosy by deposit in the ULS. Mails In a stamped envelope addressed to the depositary or to the Lessor &t
the lest address known 1o Lessee shall constimte proper payment. If the deposiiory should Hguidutc or be sucoeedad by another mstitution, of for sy
reason fail or refuse fo accept payment hereunder, Lessor shall, a1 Lesse's request, dellver 1o [essee u proper recordable instrument naming sother
{nstirotion As depository agent 10 recoive payraeors.

5. Operations. Included woder this anticle, byt pot by way of liritation, are those opezarions thar may be conducied & an effort to dewater coalbed
formavons in an cffort 1o produce methae pas or other associated products thevefrom, if there be such. If Lessee drills a well which is incapable of
producing lo paying quastities (heseinafier called “dry hole™) on the Leasad Premisoy or Jands pooled or unitized thesewith, or if all production
(whcther or not in paying Guaniities) permanemily censes for any causs, Including & revision of unis bonndaries purmnant to the provisions of
Paragraph 6 or ihc acifon of aay gevernmental antherity or if coalbed dewalering operations cease, then in the eveon this leasc is not otherwise boing
maintained ip futce it shall nevertheless remain in force if Lesses commences operations for reworking aa exdstig well or for drilling ar addhionsl
well or for otherwise abuining or restoring production on the Leased Premises or lands pooled or unitized therewith, or re-sstablishes coalbed
dewnlering operatiovs, within 180 days afier completion of operatioas on such diy hole or within 180 days after such cessation of all produciion or
coulbed dewalering cessation. If at the end of the primary rerm, or at any e thereafler, this lease is not otheswiss being maintained in force bot
Lessee is then engaged in drilling, reworking or any other operations reasonably calculated 1o obiain or resiore production therefrom, o operations 10
re-esteblish coalbed dewntening operations, this lease shall remain in forco $0 loag as any 0oe of Iwore of such operstions are proscoutsd with no
Inrerruption of more than 180 consccutlve days, sad it any such operarons result in the production of olf or gas or other subsianccs covered hercby,
as {ony thereafter a3 there is production in paying quantities fom the Leascd Promises or lanus pooled or unjtized thesewlth, Afler completion of a
well capable of producing In paying quantitics hercunder, Lessee shall drill sach eddivoon! wells on the Leased Premlses or lands peoled or unitized
thevewith ax a reasonably prudent opcrator would drill under the sama or simnilar Circumsances to protsct tbe Leased Premises from uncompeasated
dreinage by any well or wellz locaizd on other Jands nor pooled or unitized therswith. There shall be no covenant to drill explomstory wclls or any
addirional wells except as expressly provided herein. It is also understood that operations may include, and Lessor is granted the cxclusive right to
inject zir, gas, water, brine and other fluids from any source {other than Lessce's pomble or irigation water sousco) into subsurface sara that are
below and separated from the source of said Lessee’s waler source.
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6: Puoling and Unitlzerian, Lesses, ot its option, is hercby given the right and power ot sny time aad fror time 1o Time 2 a recurring righs, efther
before o1 after production, 28 to all or any past of the land dexcribied herein and as 1o any onc or morc of tha formations bercvndes, ta pool of unidze
the leasehold cstate snd the mineral estats covared by this lease with orber land, Ieasc of leases ia the immediate viciniry for the yroduction of ofl 2nd
gas, ar scp ly for tho production of gither, when in Lessee’s judgment It is neceasary or advisable to da s, mad Irespuctive of whether anthority
similar 15 this &xiss with respect to soch other Jaad, laase or Jeases. Likewise, unfts previously formed to fnelude formations not produciag oil or
g3, tky be reformed 1o excinde such noe-producing formations. The formlug or reforming of any unit shall be accomplished by Lessoe executing
ard filing of record a declasation of such uninization or reformation, which declararion shall deseribe the unit. Any unit may iacluds land upon which
 well has theretofore been completed or upon which operarions for drilling have th fore heen d, Production, drilling or reworking
operazions or ¥ well shut in for want of a warket anywhere on a unit which includes all or a part of this lease shatl be treaved s if it were produchion.
drilling or reworking operations or a well shut in for want of a market under this lease. In tea of the royalties elscwhers hersin specified, including
shut-in gas soyalties, Lessor shall seceive on production fiom the unit so pocled royaltics only o the pestion of such productioa allocated 1o his
Joass; such aliocation ahall be that proportion of the unit production that 1he 1otal pumber of surface acres covered by this leaso aad weluded m the
unit bears to the Total number of surface acres i such unic n addition to the faregolng, Lessee sball have the right 10 unisize, pool, or combine alf or
any past of 1he above describad lands as 1o one or more of the formations thereunder with other lands in the same gencral area by entering into &
coapermtive o1 unif plan of development os operation approved by any governmental authority and, from time W tine, with fike approval, 1o modify,
chasige or tezminate amy such plan or agreement and, in such event, the tanns, conditions and provisions of this lease shal) be deemed moditied 1o
conform 10 the weams. conditions, aad provistons of such approved cooperadive or uakt plan of development or operadon ond, particulerly, all drilling
and development requirements of 1his lease, express or implicd, ghall be sarisfied by compliance with the diilling end devclopment requirements of
such plan or agreement, end this lease shall not terminate or expice during the life of such plan or agreement. In the cvent that xaid sbove descrided
lands or any part thereof, shall bereafter be opersted under any such cooperative o5 unit plan of development or operation wherehy the production
therefiom ta allocated to diffezent portions of the land covered by said plag, then the production allocated 1o any particular eact of land shail, for the
purposc of corpating th royalties to be paid bereander to Lessor, be regarded as having been produced from the partjoular wact of land to which it is
allocated and not to any other tract of land; and the roynity puyrypents o be made heveundsr 1o Lessor shail be based upon production only as so
allocated  Lessor shall formally rxpreas Lessor's condént 1o Any Coopcrative or wait plas of develop or o dopted by Lessee amd
approved by any governmentsl agency by executing the szme upon request of Lessee,

L4

7, Paymext Reductions, If Lessor owng Jess than the ] ruineral esiale In all of any part of the Leased Premises, the royalties and shut-in royaliies
payable hereunder for any well on a0y part of the Leased Premisss or lands pooled therewith shall be reduced to the proportion thal Lessor's intevest
in such part of the Leased Premiises bears 10 the full mineral estate in such part of the Lensed Pramises. To the satnt ay royalty or olher payment
atributable 1o the auneral estate covered by this lease is payable 10 sommoonc other than Lessor, such royalty or other payment shall be deducted from
the corrosposding amount otierwise payablr 1o Lassor bereunder.

8. Ownersblp Changes. The intercst of cither Leasor or Lessee herevader may be assigasd, dovised or otherwise transferred o whole or in pan, by
area and/or by depth or zone, and the rights and obligatons of the parties hereander shall exiend % their respective heks, devisees, executors,
a¢ministrators, successors and Bssigns. No chunge in Lessor’s ownesship shali have the effect of reducing the rights or enlanging the abligarions of
Lesser hereunder, and no change in ownership shall be binding on Lessce until 60 days after Lessov has been firnished the original or duly
authenticaed copies of tha documants evtablishing such change of ownervhip to the satisfaction of Lessee or unti) Lassor has satisfied the oorification
requirements contained in Lessee’s usual form of division arder. In the ovent of the death of any person eatitled 10 shut-in toyshics hexreunder, Lessez
may pay of 1ender such shun-in royahies 1o the credit of decedent or decedent’s estats in the depository provided for above. If 31 any tirac two or more
Pporsons eee catilled to shut-in Toyalties beseunder, Lessce may pay ot tcoder such shit-in reyahties 10 such pirsons of (6 tilr credit in the depository,
sithex jointly, or separately in proportion @ the interest which each owns. 1f Lessce tansfers its nterest hezeunder in wholé or in past Lessea shal) be
relicved of all obligations therealier arising with respect 10 the wansferred interest, and fallure of the tranaferce to satisfy sueh obligations with

pect 10 the ed | shall not affeet the rights of Lesses with respect 10 2ny inwevest rot so transferred If Lessec transfors & fudl of
undivided imtcrest n all or any porvion of the Area coverad by this lease, the obligation to pay or tender shut-in royalties bereunder shall be divided
berween Lessec and the transferes In proportior: to the nct acreuge inlerest 1 this lease shen held by cach.

9. Release of Lesse. Lessee may, at sny tme and from timo to time, deliver 1o Lessor or fie of sécord @ writen yalzase of thiy lease as 1o a full or
undivided interess in all or any pordon of the area covered by this jease or any depths or zomes tharsunder, and shall thereupon be relieved of all
obligaiony thereafier arising with respect 1o the § 30 seleased, If Lessee rel lass than all of the interest or area covered horcby, Lesset's
obligation 10 pay of 1ender chur-ia rayalties shell be proportionately reduced in sccordance with the net screage interest retained hereunder.

10. Anciliary Righis. In exploring for, dcvcloping, producing md marketing oil. gas and other subyumces covered hercby on the Leascd Premisos or
laqds pooled of unitized therewith, fn prigary and/or ehanced recovery, Lessce shall have the right of ingress 1nd egress elovg with the right to
conduer such operstions on the Lezsed Promises as may be reasonably necessary for such purposes, inehuding but not limited io geophysical
operstions, the drilling of welts, and the consmuction and use of roads, canals, pipelines, tanks, waler wells, disposal wells, injection Wells, pirs,
electric and tcicphone lines, power stations, and other facilities deemad necessary by Lessee to discover, paoduce, store, teat andior taspon
production. Lessee mmay use in such operations, fice of cost, wny oil, 823, waler and/or other substances produced on the Leused Promises, excopt
waley Brom Lessors wells cr ponds. In exploring, developing, produting or masketng fom the Lensed Premiscs or lands pooled or unitizod
therewith, the ancillary rights granted herein shall apply (s) 10 the catire Leased Premises doscribed in Paragraph 1 abave, norwithstanding any partial
release or other partial terminasion of this lease, and (b) to any other lands in which Lessor now of bereafter has authority fo grant such rights in the
vicinity ofthe Leaved Premises or lands pooled or unidzed therewith. When requesied by Lessor in wiiting, Lessee shal) bury tts plpelines blow
ordinary plow depth on culdvared lands. No well shall be located lcas than 400 feer fiom any bouse o bam now on the Leaszd Premises or other
1ands of Lessor used by Lossoa bermunder, withour Lessor's canseat, and Lessee sball pay for damage caused by its operations 1o butldicgs and other
iimprovements now on the Lemsed Promises, o1 such other lands, and to commercial imber mad growing crops thereon. Lesses shall bave the right wt
any Bme to remove s xtuses, equipment ucd materialy, inclading well casing, from the Lensed Premises or such other kaods duriog the tenm of tkis
fease or within » reasonable Gme thereater

11 Regulation aud Delay. Lessce’s oblipations under this lease, whether express or implied, shal] be subject 10 alf spplicable laws, sules, regulatioss
and onders of any govemmenta) authority baving furisdiction, includiag estrictions on the dvilling and production of wells, and segulation of the
price or transportation of oll, gas and other aubstances covered heseby. When drilling, reworking, production or other operations are prevenied or
delayed by such inwy, rulcy, regulatious or ordeis, or by inebility to obtain necessary permils, equipment, services, material, water, cleatricity, fudl,
access or eapements, or by £1c, S00d, adverse weather conditions, war, saborage, rebeltion, inarvection, rot, strike or labor dispuies, or by iosbility
1o obrain a sarisfactory market for production or fuilure of purchasers or carriers to rake or transpont such producion, or by angy other cuuse not
reasorably within Lessee's control, this lease shall not terminate b of such preventdon or delay, and, al Lessee’s option, the period of such
preveation or delay ahall be rdded (o the tesm heredf, Lessee shall nor be linble for breach of any provisions or implicd covenants of this lease when
drilting. production or other opcradon:s e yo prevented or delayed.

12. Breach or Default No Utigation shall be initiated by Lessor for damages, forfeinure or cancellarion with respect 1o any breach or defaclt by
Lessee hersunder, for a period af at leaxt 90 days after Legsor bas given Lessee writien gotice fully describing the breach or default, md then only it
Lesses fails 10 remedy the breach or default within such perfod. In the eveat the matter is Jitigated and tiere is 8 final judicial determinalion that o
breach or defaylt has occurred, tis lease shall not be forfeitad or cancelled {n whole o in part unless Lesses js given 2 reasonable ime ofter said
judicial ¢atasmination 10 vemedy the breack or default and Losssc fails to do so.

Revised /1108



13. Warrauty of Title. Lessor herchy warraots and agrees to defend title cosveyed 1o Lessce bercunder, and agrecs thal Lesses st Leasec’s option
mey pay and discharge aoy taxas, mongages of liens mxdating, levied or assessed on of agains tha Loascd Promises. [f Lessee exercises such option,
Lessee sholl be mbrogaced 10 the rights of the party 1o whom paymest (s made, aod, in addition 1o its other rights, say reimburse itseif out of any
royaltics or shut-is royaltics otheswise payable 1o Lessor h dev, In the event Lesses is mads sware of any claim inconsivtent with Lessors ride,
Lessee may suspend the paymenr of royeities and shut-in royaldes borcundes, without intesest, until Lessac has been fumished sarisfactory evidencs
that such claim has been resolved.

14, Limited Lishility. Lessee shall inderantly and hold Lessor h@m from amy sud all Yisbility, Yens, cleims and ¢nvironmeatal lisbiljty arisng
out of Lessee’s operations under the terms of this lcase.

15. Sole Agy This Ags may be exectted in counrerpars and all countespars shall be canstrued wgether and shull constinute ons
Aprezoest Upon execution, this lease shall be biading on the signatory end the signatory's belrs, devisers, mxecumtors, administrators, succossors and
assigns, whether or not thiy leasc has been execured hy all pardes herelnabove oamed ax Lessor. Any prior agreement of Tepresculanon, oral or
wrifice, berween the partes is syperseded by this Agresment and this Agreement between the partics abovs s the sole and oaly agreement now in
cffect between such partiex.

IN WITNESS WHEREQF, this lcasc Is executed 1o bo cftective as of the date first writico above,

LESSOR (WHETHER ONE OR MORE)
2] .
Connic Stauffer
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
STATE OF Umah )

)ss,
COUNTY OF Sanpete

On this dih day of May, 2006 , before me, the undersigned, a Notary Public in and for said County and State, __Copnie

Stauffer _ personally appeared and persenally known to me, or proved 10 me on the basis of satisfactory evidence, to be
the person whose name is subscribed to the within instrument sad ackmowledged 10 me that he executed the same in his
authorized capacity, and that by his signature on the instrument, the person, or the entity upon which the person acted,
executed the instrument. ‘

My Commission Expires Lf"[ 6‘W

After Recording Return to:

womn, L.LC~ :rh-n-n—— ARt LR S
550 Cedar Avenus, Grand Junction, CO 81501 > IGHA LARSEN
(970) 242-5957 &\ MOTARY PUBLIC - STATE of UTAY
8 736 EAST 25 SOUTH
& EPHRANS, UT 84527
COMU,_EXPIRES 412-200%

Revised 6/11/08



+0-06 Marion Alpine School L _trict 3-17

Casing Schematic
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Well name: 06-06 Marion Alpine School District 3-17
Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Surface Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: -5 psi
Internal gradient: 0.447 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 218 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body vyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 2,096 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 437 ft Next setting BHP: 915 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure 500 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (lbs/ft) ) (ft) (in) (ft)

1 500 13.375 61.00 J-55 ST&C 500 500 12.39 60.7
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 218 1540 7.063 218 3090 14.17 30 595 19.52 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: June 15,2006
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 06-06 Marion Alpine School District 3-17

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Intermediate Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 94 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,502 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,753 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 52 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 13.46 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,596 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 1,833 ft Next setting BHP: 2,053 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,096 ft
Injection pressure 2,096 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Iinternal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) ()

1 2100 8.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 2096 2100 7.7 150.7
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

{psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 914 3341 3.654 1753 4460 2.54 75 434 5.75J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: June 15,2006
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Duniop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2096 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 06-06 Marion Alpine School District 3-17

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Production Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.600 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 129 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 368 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: -1 psi
Internal gradient: 0.447 psilft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 2,053 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 2448 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 50 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 4,691 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(t) (in) (lbs/ft) (ft) () (in) (ft")

1 5623 55 17.00 J-55 ST&C 4596 5623 4.767 193.8
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 2053 4910 2.391 2053 5320 2.59 78 229 2.93J

Prepared  Clinton Dworshak Date: June 15,2006
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4596 ft, a mud weight of 8.6 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
PHONE CONVERSATION DOCUMENTATION FORM

Route original/copy to:

O3 well File ASD> G -3 l:-ISuspens& Oother
~i ASD 3-1R (Return Date)
(Loc.) Sec |3 Twp_|3S Rng2E (To-Initials)
(API No.)
) = - —
1. Date of Phone Call: OG ~21-0k Time: (L 5%
2. DOGM Employee (name) Emb Q\\ L ( D\Initiated Call)
Talked to: )

Name Q(OU PE  StaFER.  (Omnitiated Call) - Phone No. ()

. of (Company/Organization) M inerac DUWNER

3. Topic of Conversation: MQA SrougreR. CALLED | T STATE. “THAT

THeEY Han  WoRrked owt  THE  EASEMEaT w00
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DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

Tuly 26, 2006

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAELR. STYLER
Executive Director

Marion Energy Inc.

Division of 8290 West Sahara, Suite 186
Oil, Gas & Mining Las Vegas, NV 89117
JOHNR. BAZA

Division Director

Re: Alpine School District 3-17 Well, 692' FNL, 2014' FEL, NW NE, Sec. 17,
T. 13 South, R. 7 East, Bottom Location 95' FNL, 1585' FWL, NE NW,

Sec. 17, T. 13 South, R. 7 East, Carbon County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-007-31182.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
mf
Enclosures
cc: Carbon County Assessor

SITLA
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Officer

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 » facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 * www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Marion Energy Inc.

Well Name & Number Alpine School District 3-17

API Number: 43-007-31182

Lease: ML-1257

Location: NW NE Sec._17 T. 13 South R. 7 East
Bottom Location: NE NW Sec._17 T. 13 South R. 7 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:
e 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
24 hours prior to spudding the well
within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):
e Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

e Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

W

. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the well.

(9, ]

. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

o

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in the
Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)



Page 2
43-007-31182
July 26, 2006

7. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIL NUMBER:

STATE ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

B IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME.

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLwell L1 eAsweLL /] OTHER Alpine School District #3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Marion Energy Inc. 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 S. Tennessee STE 200 .., McKinney stare TX 7 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL
rFooTaces AT surFace: 2014.49°FEL, 692.77'FNL NE/4

county: Carbon

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 17 138 7E STATE:
UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] acioize ] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
7] NoTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) (] ALtercasing (] FRACTURETREAT [C] SIDETRACKTO REPAR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [[] casiNG REPAR [[] NewconsTRUCTION ] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHaNGe To PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraTOR CHANGE [J TusinG Rerair
[O crance TuBiNG [ PLuc AND ABANDON [[] venTorFLARE
[J sussequenT REPORT [T] cHANGEWELL NAME [ epruseack [] warteR DisPosAL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHance weLL sTATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[] coMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omer Move Location of Pit
[[] converT weLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As per the approval documents that correspond with the APD for the Alpine School District #3-17 well, this sundry notice
serves to outline the requested change in location of the reserve pit within this pad site. The pit has been moved from the
south side of the pad to the north side as outlined on the attached survey as per the request of the DOGM.

Accepted by the
Utah Divisign of
Oil, Gas and Mining
Daten, Ol - |
y: |

NAME (PLEASE PRIT)_B€Njamin Evans rme Landman

SIGNATURE % - @l‘@ oare _9/7/2006

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

YU EIVED
SEP 11 2008

UV OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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TALON RESOURCES, INC.

195 North 100 West .0, Box 1230
Huntington, Utah 84528
Phone (435)687-3310  Fax (435)687-5311
E-Mail talonsetv.net

@ Marion Energy Inc.

LOCATION LAYOUT
Sectlon 17, T13S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

% LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.
State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposais 10 drill new wells, significantly deepen existing weils below current botiom-hole depih, reenter plugged wells, of to
driti horizontal taterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME.

|eeme—— wemromantere
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL
oitwen [ GAS WELL OTHER

8 WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Alpine School District 3-17

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

S, AP NUMBER

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF GPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER. 0. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT.
119 So. Tennessee #200 ..., McKinney srare VX 2 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT surFace: 2014.49' FEL 692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QTRAQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, Merioian: NWINE 17 138 7E STATE: "
UT;
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
m’ NOTICE OF INTENT [} acoee [} oeeren [[] RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duphicate) ] avercasing [ eracture mReAT [J swerrackToRePARwWELL
Approximate date work witl start: E] CASING REPAIR [C] newconstrucTiON [C] vemPoRARILY ABANDON
[[] crance To Previous PLaNS [[] operaror crance [ vweinc repar
[ cnancevusme [ ruseanp ssanoon [ venrorAare
SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ chance weL name [J ruceacx [] wareroisposaL
{Sutimit Original Form Onsly}
! D CHANGE WELL STATUS D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work compietion:
[0 coumncLe PronucinG FORMATIONS  []  RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE Al oner Casing Sundry
9/26/2006
[0 corverrwew tvee [} recompLETE - OFFERENT FORMATION

12, DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Due to problems drilling in impending winter weather we propose to change the casing to 10 3/4, J-55, 45.5#

Intermediate: 7 5/8", J-55, 24 #, set at 2100’
Liner: 5 1/2",J-55, 17#

'RECEIVED
0CT 02 2006
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

VP Operations

name (PLease printyD0Ug Endsley Tme

sownreDUGEOCR0 s ) ) (00PN saes  owe 92612006

(e space fo state wse onty) s, =0 W E D) ny THE QTATE

£ UTAH DIVISION OF
QIL}J AS, ANMD MINING

OAT l S

(5¢2000) ongs (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

A A ki

%S:rf«%w\& l«k;mc&4+c Casing Inrnys St Ve cemented el fosudace



2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Casing Schematic
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Well name: 2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Operator: Marion Energy Inc
String type:  Surface Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 70 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psifft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 2,096 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 438 ft Next setting BHP: 915 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft’)

1 500 10.75 45.50 J-55 ST&C 500 500 9.825 269.9
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor {Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 218 2090 9.581 500 3580 7.16 23 493 21.67J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: October 12,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Intermediate Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 94 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 956 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,502 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psifft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,753 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 52 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 1346 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,596 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 1,833 ft Next setting BHP: 2,053 psi
Fracture mud wit: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,096 ft
Injection pressure: 2,096 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (')

1 2100 7.625 24.00 H-40 ST&C 2096 2100 6.9 565.2
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor {psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 915 1949 2.132 1753 2750 1.57 50 212 421

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: October 12,2006
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2096 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Production Liner Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors: Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.600 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 129 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,042 psi

Internal gradient: 0.220 psifft Tension: Directional well information:

Calculated BHP 2,053 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 2448 ft

No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 50 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 4,691 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) ()

1 5623 5.5 17.00 J-55 ST&C 4596 5623 4767 734
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 2053 4910 2.391 2053 5320 2.59 78 229 293J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Date: October 12,2006
Salt Lake City, Utah

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4596 ft, a mud weight of 8.6 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



.0-06 Marion Alpine School L _trict 3-17

Casing Schematic

13-3/8"
MW 84
Frac 19.3

Y.
(, o) g LY (Usa6) = QO

A '\"h”( ) 7 20 tl '51-’;’

7]

~

.))qu‘u.)r g e )

ROFE Do /

S O = 2090 -

U 5% 7 2163
Mo+ pw’uu.q @ ~3u¢" C‘? \S[\o& : 5“-/
]
TeuT ch 1Seo # (o5 /)N,ﬂevt" ) —

TIa (sa, N
20f 7 5192

May pressust @ It Gy S»W-@f)

/‘:’;l— ’lU I1Svo a (0} /,’J/).uk\) ‘6‘

\/aréc'( ~e o< f2efy,

\/L,'/ Iff"/ﬁ (4,'(.1[.‘“/1

e ¢
Surface 1
500. MD
500. TVD

fosd dlu (A

‘/C.J/ o 7.1 [Jr-s[p;..,,

If30 Toe Vel
Intermediate
2100. MD
2096. TVD
289 Too T‘-—V( 14/ 1<y UJU'L"“-T

G$30 Feroen

$623. MD
4596. TVD



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.

State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals D drilt new welis, significantly deepen existing wells balow current bottom-hole depith, reenter piugged wells, or to
drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. iF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

e e
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPEOF WELL

6. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

owwew [1 eAswELL OTHER Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR. 9. APi NUMBER.
Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD AND POCL, OR YALDCAT:
119 So. Tennessee #2200 ..., McKinney srare TX 2, 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTaces AT surFace: 2014.49' FEL,692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDAN: NWNE 17 138 T7E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION | TYPE OF ACTION _
NOTIGE OF INTENT ] acwoee [[] oespen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duplicarte) [0 arercasing [] rracture TrReaT [[] soerrack 1o REPARWELL
Approximate date work witl start: [J caoncrerar ] wewconsTrucTioN [[] 7emPoRaRILY ABANDON
12/5/2006 ] cance vo Previous pLANS [[] oreraror crance [[] tusing repar
] cnanceTuemne [[] rucanp asanpon [ ventorAARE
] suesequent ReporT [0 crance wer nave [ suesack [} warer misposac
(Subeit Original Form Only) .
[] cHancEwELL sTATUS ] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [] waTer sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
_ [ commincLe propucinG ForMaTioNs  []  RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE kA omer: Change Casing
[ converrwew Tvee [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Program

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearty show afl pertinent defails including dates, depths, volumes, efc.

We plan to run 10 3/4", J-55, 40.5 # at 500, in a 14 3/4" hole. We will cement with 345 sx, Class "G", 14.2 ppg, 1.41 cuft/sk. We
will then drill an 8 3/4" hole to 2100' and run 7 5/8", J-55, 26.4 # casing and cement with 262 sx 50/50 Poz, 14.2 ppg,

1.41 cuft/sk. A 6 3/4" hole will be drilled to TD of 5304'. A 5 112", J-55, 17 #, liner will be run and set at +/- 5154'. The liner will
be cemented with 100 sx, Premium Lite cement, 11.0 ppg, 3.82 cuft/sk, as lead and 104 sx, 50/50 Poz, 14.2 ppg, 1.41 cuft/sk

as tail.
NAME (PLEASE Ddug Endsley mme VP Operations
SIGNATURE I : AQ'_/Z\/\.\ DATE 1 1’9,2006
ﬁé‘) g
{This space for State use only)
ATERONED BY THE STATE RECEIVED
R OTA SIONM
Tk, GAB, 0D m?a‘\ssg é NOV 1 6 2006
(5/2000) = h k., ;V_: . 2 29 Oga (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
A2 ,/ 29/0¢ ol omcm e DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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Well name: 2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Surface Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 72 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 185 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 24 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body vyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 2,096 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 438 ft Next setting BHP: 915 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) () (ft) (in) (ft))

1 500 10.75 40.50 J-55 ST&C 500 500 9.925 2754
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 218 1580 7.243 __~ 500 3130 6.26 ,— 20 420 20.74 J .—
Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: December 28,2006
by: Div of Qil,Gas & Minerals Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name:

Operator: Marion Energy Inc
String type:  Intermediate
Location: Carbon Co.

2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Project ID:
43-007-31182

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 94 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 529 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,435 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psifft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,686 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 52 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 13.46 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,391 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 1,836 ft Next setting BHP: 1,962 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,096 ft
Injection pressure: 2,096 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft°)

1 2100 7.625 26.40 J-55 ST&C 2096 2100 6.844 556.2
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 914 2811 3.074 _—~ 1686 4140 246 - 55 315 569J
Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: December 28,2006

by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals
ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Salt Lake City, Utah

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2096 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17mod

Well name:

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Production Liner Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.600 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 126 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 1,950 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 996 psi Liner top: 1,950 ft
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,962 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 2204 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 50 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 4,818 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft")

1 3304 5.5 17.00 J-55 ST&C 4391 5304 4.767 431.2
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor {psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1962 4910 2503 .~ 1962 5320 2.71 41 229 5634 —
Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: December 28,2006

by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals
ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop
For this liner string, the top is rounded to the neares
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Salt Lake City, Utah

& Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

t 100 ft.Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4391 ft, a mud weight of 8.6 ppg The

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 8

I 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals 10 drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, teendes phigged wells, or o
drili horizontal faterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME.

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Clear Creek Unit

. TYPEOFWELL
! owLwet, [1 easwelL ] OTHER

2. WELL NAME and NUMEER:

Alpine School District 3-17

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

% API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OFERATOR: _ PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 So. Tennessee #200 ..., McKinney srare X 70 79069 {972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTaces AT surrace: 2014.49 FEL,692.77 FNL = county: Garbon
QTROTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MeriDia: NWNE - 17 - 138 7E STATE: AH
UT.

1" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
O OF INTENT [ acoeze [] oeeren [ RePeRFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit tn Duplicate) ] aurercasing [ rracrure TREAT [[] swerrackToREPAIRWELL
Approximate date work wiil start ] crsmcrerar [] wewconstrucTiON [[] vemporariLy AsanDoN
[[] cranceToPrREVIOUS PLANS [] oreraTOR cHanGE [ vweincrepar
O ownceTusne [ rrucanp asanpoy [] veworrare
SUBSEQUENT REPORT [0 onancewew name [ ruesack [] water DisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[0 cranceweL sTaTUs [[] PrODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) [ warer stur-off
Daie of wotk completion:

[[] commincLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [[] recLamamion oF weLL SITE

71372006

[ conwerrwetree [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

omer: Spud Sundry

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, efc.
Benco Services spudded the ASD 6-17 and ASD 3-17 on 6/26/2006 by setting 40' conductor pipe and cementing it in.

Anticipated date to move a drilling rig in is September 2006.

NAME (PLEAGE Doug Endsley yme VP Operations
(F }X/\M W’\ DATE 7/3/2006
{This space for State use only)

REEEIVED

(5V2000) {See Instructions on Reverse Sifis)

APRPR D207



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

et e t—————————— ettty
§. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals b drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current battom-hole depth, teenter plugged wells, of o
deilt horizontal taterats, {ise APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

- Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPEOFWB.L
owwewt [ GASWELL B/l OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Alpine School District 3-17

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. AP! NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER, 70 FIELD AND POCL, OR YWILDCAT.
119 So. Tennessee #200 ... McKinney care TX 25 79069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rootaces AT surrace: 2014.49" FEL,692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QTRIGTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MEriDia: NWNE - 17 138 7E STATE: UTAH
11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [} acwoee ] oeeeen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Submit in Dupiicate) O aurercasme [0 rracture REAT [] siETRACK TOREPAIRWELL

] newconsTrucTioN
D OPERATOR CHANGE
[ Puucano apanpon

Approximate date work will start [J casinererar

[[] cranceTo previous pLaNS

D CHANGE TUBING

b sussequent reporT [ crancewew naue [ rwesack
{Submit Original Form Only)
D CHANGE WELL STATUS [[] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME)
Daiez of work completion
] commmeLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
4212007

3 comerrwaLTyre [[] mecompLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] vemporariLy asaNDON
[ wueine repar

] ventorAARE

[J water oisposaL

[] waver sHut-OFF

omver: Drilling Follow-Up
Sundry

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show al pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, efc.

Waiting on drilling rig.

NAME (PLEASE Qoug Endsley mme VP Operations
SIGNATURE oare  H2/2007
g /
{This space for State use only)
~ RECEIVED
{5¥2000) (Sea Instructions on Reverse Sire) ,‘.‘;APR 0 52007

~r DNOF O”., GAS & pnrasa
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9725478442

MARION ENERGY

PAGE 82/82

STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING
ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operstor: _Marion Energy Inc. Operator Acoount Number: N 2740
Address: 119 8. Tenneassee, Ste. 200
city McKinney
siate X zip 75069 Phone Number- (972) 540-2967
Well 1
API Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4300731182 Alpine School District #3-17 NWNE| 17 138 TE Carbon
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number @ffective Date
KB 99999 4550 6/26/2008 H2/07
Comments: ! Y
FRSN — B NENW —
Well 2 .
_API Number Weil Name QQ [ Sec | Twp | Rng County
4300731181 Alpine School District #6-17 NWNE| 17 138 7E Carbon
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
: Number Number -+ Effective Date
XA 99999 2550 612612006 #3/07
Comments: T
FRSD  BHL sENW
Wel 3
APl Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4300731168 Kenliworth Raliroad #15-3 SESE 16 138 | 10E Carbon
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
A 99999 /604 7/10/2006 4a3/07
Comment=: LR D By - SWs W Seels —
AGCTION CODES:
A - Establish now entity for new well (single well only) Benjamin Evans
B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) ( éﬁg
C - Re-assign well from one exigting entity to another existing entity g :§
D - Ro-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature -
E - Other (Expiain In ‘comments’ section) Landman 2 o1
e RECEIVEL™

(5i2000)

APR 12 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINI‘




STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERWAL NUMBER:
State ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME.

Dorumemsformtorpmposalsbdnlnewweus significantly deepen existing welis beiow current bottom-hole depth, reenter pugged welis, or to Clear Creek Unit
drili horizontal taterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such propasals.

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
, owwei [ caswel B oTHER Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR. S. AP NUMBER:
Marion Energy, inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD AND POCL, OR WILDCAT.
119 So. Tennessee #200 .. Mckinney stare JK 7 79068 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT surFace: 2014.49' FEL ,692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QTRITR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MeriDIAN: NWNE 17 135S 7E STATE:
UTAH
TN CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
B nonceor [ acioze [] oespen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Subknit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING [[] rracrure TREAT [[] sibeTRACK TOREPAIRWELL
Approximate date work wil start ] casnorerar [ newconstrucTioN [] vemrorariLY asaNDON
7/5/2007 ] cranceTo Previous PLANS [[] orerator cHance [ rusine repar
[ cwanceTuBme ] PwsanD asanDon ] vevror AARE
[l susssquenT REPORT ] crance wei nave ] pwesack [J warer oisposac
{Submit Original Form Only) .
[] cranceweL sTATUS ] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME) [ warer sHut-oFF
DOaie of work completion:
[] commincLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ]  RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [] oner:
[ converrwerLtvee [[] RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, efc.

Due to problems encountered while drilling the ASD 6-17 we intend to change the casing program for the ASD 3-17 in the
following manner.

The intermediate casing will be 6hanged from 8 5/8" to 9 5/8", J-55, 36#. We will use the same type of cement but volumes will
be changed to 230 sx of Premium Lite with a yield of 3.82 cuft. per sk and a siurry weight of 11 ppg. as lead and 194 sx of
50/50 Poz with a yield of 1.41 cuft per sk and a slurry weight of 14.2 ppg. These volumes reflect 75% excess over ideal hole

volumes.

The production casing will be changed to 7*, N-80, 23# and the hole size will be changed to 8 3/4" from 7 7/8". We will use the
same type of cement as shown on the approved APD. The new volumes for the lead cement will be 296 sx of Premium Lite with
the same yield and weight as mentioned above. The tait cement will be 186 sx of 50/50 Poz with the same y;eld and weight as
mentioned above. These volumes were also calculated with 75% excess. . :

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker me Secretary

{

(e spcs o site s R, O ROVED BY THE STATE

Or UTAH DIVISION OF RECEIVED
i GAS, £ WD MINING
T JUN 2 8 2007

(5/2000) [:: b on Revecse Side)

Y

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modIl

Casing Schematic
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Well name:

Operator: Marion Energy Inc
String type:  Intermediate
Location: Carbon Co.

Project ID:
43-007-3

2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modll

1182

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No °
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 94 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 90 ft

Burst

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,435 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psifft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,686 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 52 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 1347 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,391 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 1,836 ft Next setting BHP: 1,962 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,096 ft
Injection pressure: 2,096 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')

1 2100 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 2096 2100 8.796 9115 °
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 915 1948 2129 .~ 1686 3520 2.09 ~ 75 394 522J
Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: July 10,2007

by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Salt Lake City, Utah

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2096 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in

directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modIl

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

String type:  Production Liner Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.600 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F .
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 126 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 996 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psi/ft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,962 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 2204 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 50 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 4,421 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
() (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) ()

1 5304 7 23.00 N-80 LT&C 4391 5304 6.25 1172.4
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1962 3830 1952 __~ 1962 6340 3.23 - 101 442 438J ~
Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: July 10,2007
by: Div of Qil,Gas & Minerals Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4391 ft, a mud weight of 8.6 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.
Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

s e T
] 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for propasals Yo drill new welis, significantly desp \g wells below current botiom-hole depth, reenter plugged welis, or to
drill horizontat katerals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. iF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

owwet [ cGaswew OTHER

2. WELL NAUE and NUMBER:

Alpine School District 3-17

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

S, AP NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 So. Tennessee £200 ., McKinney seaze TX 7,0 75069 (972) 5402967 | Wildcat
4, LOCATION OF WELL
FooTAGES AT SURFace: 2014.49' FEL,692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QTRIGTR, SECTION, TownsHP, Rance, uerioi: NWNE 17 138 7E STATE:

UTAH

1" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SuBMISSION | TYPE OF ACTION _
4B nomceor [} acioze [] oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Duphcate) [[] aurercasme [ rracrure reat [[] sioeTRacK TOREPAIRWELL
Approximate date work will start [J casncrerar [] wewconsTrRucTION [[] vemPorariLY aBanDON
7/3/2007 [ cranceTorrevious pLaNS [[] oreraTor cHance [ veinc repar
O cwnceTusmne [ ruucAnp AsanDON {1 vesrorFLARE
B/SUBSEQJE\ITREPORT [ crancewer name [] Pwesac [J wearer misposac
(Submit Originat Form Only)
) [] cnanceweLL sTATUS [ PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) ] waTER sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:

[J commNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ reciamanon oF wew siTe

[0 recompLere - IFFERENT FORMATION

[ converrwew Tvre

omer:_Resume Drilling

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, efc.
Masion Energy, Inc. intends to resume drilling on the Alpine School District 3-17 somewhere around 7-3-2007.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Charlotte Parker e Secretary
— ( hOav(\QHtQP@ Ko oare 672672007
mmfubtmm
RECEIVED
. JUL 02 2007
(2000) (Sea tnstnictions on Reverse Sids)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MIN!.\'r./\



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

Sate ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAM_E:
Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
onwel [1 caswel W] oTHER Alpine School District #3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: B, AP NUMBER:
Marion Energy Inc. 400731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 70. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
119 8. Tennessee STE 200 ., McKinney state TX 7 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 692.77' FNL, 2014.49 FEL, NE/4 county: Carbon
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDAN: NWNE 17 13S 7E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioize [7] oeepen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[/] NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) (] ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT

Approximate date work will start: [:] CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION

[J cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE

[] cHanGe TuBING

[0 suesequenT RePORT

[C] cHANGE WELL NaME
(Submit Original Form Only)

PLUG BACK
[C] CcHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)
Date of work completion:

O
O
L]
[[] PLuc anD ABANDON
(]
O
U

D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[] coNvERT WELLTYPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[] TemPORARILY ABANDON
[ tueinGRePAR

[C] venToRFLARE

[C] waTER DISPOSAL

[C] WATER SHUT-OFF

7] orer: New Bottom Hole
Location

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The purpose of this sundry report is to amend the bottom hole location of the Alpine School District #3-17 bottom hole location.

The new bottom hole location will no longer be located within the confines of lease ML-1257 (as referenced above), and will
now be located, once the well reaches total depth, under lease FEE/UT 2570-00023-AD. (attached for your reference)

The new bottom hole location is as follows:
148ft FSL, 1415ft FWL / SW/4 S8 13S-7E (bottom hole)

Please see the attached directional survey, and platt for details pertaining to this change.

q%‘i 55~
"o AT TS

e

O CrERAIGH

NAME(PLEASEPRlNT)ﬁenjamin Evans _ - rme Landman
Ty ._,v..{;:;:;._/ »

SIGNATURE lﬁ ’:Y C e oate  116/2007

b ——

(This space for State use only)

Lot "y rw' Y&wl‘: SrATE
s 3‘{3*\5 OF
5 MINING

/. #“,._,.._..._
~JSgelostoistions on Reverse Side)
7

(6/2000)

RECEIVED
JUL 1 3 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



« »Marion Encrgy Inc.

August 1, 2007

Diana Whitney

State of Utah

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Re: Directional Drilling R649-3-11

Alpine School District #3-17: 692.77°FNL, 2014.49° FEL NE/4 S17 13S-7E (Surface)
148t FSL, 14156t FWL / SW/4 S8 13S-7E (bottom hole)
Carbon County, UT.

Dear Ms. Whitney

Pursuant to the filing of Marion Energy Inc.’s Application for Permit to Drill the above referenced well on
January 5™ 2006, we are hereby submitting this letter in accordance with Oil and Gas Conservation Rule
R649-3-11 pertaining to the exception to location and Siting of wells.

. The Alpine School District #3-17 well is located within the Clear Creek Federal Unit Area.

. Marion Energy Inc. is permitting this well as a directional well in order to maximize drainage of
the reservoir in a topographically challenging area.

. The concept of drilling Multiple directional wells from a single pad site will allow Marion Energy
Inc. to minimize surface disturbance that would be otherwise cause by two or more separate pad
sites, as the plan is to drill two directional wells from this pad.

. Marion Energy Inc. hereby certifies that it is the sole owner within 460 feet of the entire
directional well bore.

Therefore, based upon the above information Marion Energy Inc. requests the permit be granted pursuant to
R649-3-11.

Sincerely,
Benjamin Evans

Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200 McKinney, Texas, 75069
Telephone: (972) 540-2967, Fax: (972) 547-0442



MARION ENERGY, INC.

Carbon County, Utah
Clear Creek Unit
ASD #3-17

Original Hole

Plan: Plan #2

Standard Planning Report

27 June, 2007



EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
MARION ENERGY, INC.
Carbon County, Utah

Nevis
Planning Report

o . Site Clear Creek Unit
“" WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Weli Elev)

WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)

Clear Creek Unit Grid
ASD #3-17 Minimum Curvature
Original Hole
Plan #2
Project Carbon County, Utah, Sec. 17, T135, R7E
Map System: Universal Transverse Mercator System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 - Alaska
Map Zone: Zone 12N (114 Wto 108 W)
Site Clear Creek Unit, Sec.17, T13, R7E
Site Position: Northing: 14,415,023.681t Latitude: 39°41'41.969 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 1,565,298.66 ft Longitude: 111° 9' 37.407 W
Position Uncertainty: 00ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: -0.10 °
Well ASD #3-17
Well Position +N/-§ 0.0 Northing: 14,415,023.68 ft Latitude: 39°41'41.969 N
+EI-W 0oft Easting: 1,505,298.66 ft Longitude: 111°9' 37.407 W
Position Uncertainty 0.0ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 7,918.0ft
Wellbiore Original Hole
Magnetics Model Name Sample Dute Dcelim'ﬂon Dip Angle Field Strength
¥ ©) (n1)
IGRF200510 6/27/2007 12.18 65.38 52,371
Design Plan #2
Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PROTOTYPE Tie On Depth: 0.0
Verticat Section: Depth From (TVD) *N/-8 +ElW Direction
") L] ) )
0.0 0.0 0.0 295.00
Plan Sections
L) ) ) ) L] mn Hool) (*1100m) (‘Hooly ) Target
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,650.0 0.00 0.00 1,650.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,068.6 42.56 285.00 2,041.7 212.6 -455.9 3.00 3.00 0.00 295.00
4,468.7 42.56 285.00 3,873.0 612.9 -1,314.1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,339.4 30.13 295.00 4,673.0 830.6 -1,780.8 1.43 -1.43 0.00 -179.99

6/27/2007 8:01:45PM

Page 2

COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77




Nevis
Planning Report

" Site Clear Creek Unit
 WELL @ 0.0t (Original Well Elev)
' WELL @ 0.0t (Original Well Elev)

EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
"MARION ENERGY, INC.
.. - Carbon County, Utah

.- Clear Creek Unit

ASD #3-17
Original Hole
Plan #2
tn m rHooR) (oo
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
100.0 0.00 0.00 100.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.0 0.00 0.00 200.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
300.0 0.00 0.00 300.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
400.0 0.00 0.00 400.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
500.0 0.00 0.00 500.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
600.0 0.00 0.00 600.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
700.0 0.00 0.00 700.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
800.0 0.00 0.00 800.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
900.0 0.00 0.00 900.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,000.0 0.00 0.00 1,000.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,100.0 0.00 0.00 1,100.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,200.0 0.00 0.00 1,200.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,300.0 0.00 0.00 1,300.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,400.0 0.00 0.00 1,400.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,500.0 0.00 0.00 1,500.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,600.0 0.00 0.00 1,600.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,650.0 0.00 0.00 1,650.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
KoP
1,700.0 1.50 295.00 1,700.0 03 -0.6 0.7 3.00 3.00 0.00
1,800.0 4.50 295.00 1,799.8 25 -5.3 59 3.00 3.00 0.00
1,800.0 7.50 295.00 1,800.3 6.9 -14.8 16.3 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,000.0 10.50 295.00 1,998.0 13.5 -28.0 32.0 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,100.0 13.50 295.00 2,095.8 22.3 -47.8 52.8 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,200.0 16.50 295.00 2,192.4 33.2 -71.3 78.6 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,300.0 19.50 295.00 2,287.5 46.3 -99.3 109.5 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,400.0 22.50 295.00 2,380.9 61.4 -131.8 1454 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,500.0 25.50 295.00 2472.2 78.6 -168.6 186.0 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,600.0 28.50 295.00 2,561.3 97.8 -209.8 231.4 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,700.0 31.50 295.00 2,647.9 118.0 -255.1 281.4 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,800.0 34,50 295,00 2,731.8 142.0 -304.4 335.9 3.00 3.00 0.00
2,900.0 37.50 285.00 2,812.6 166.8 -357.7 394.7 3.00 3.00 0.00
3,000.0 40.50 295.00 2,890.4 193.4 -414.7 457.6 3.00 3.00 0.00
3,068.6 42.56 295.00 2,941.7 212.6 -455.9 503.0 3.00 3.00 0.00
3,100.0 42.56 295.00 2,064.8 221.86 -475.2 524.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,200.0 42.56 295.00 3,038.5 250.2 -536.5 591.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,300.0 42.56 295.00 3,112.2 278.8 -597.8 659.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,400.0 42.56 295.00 3,185.8 307.4 -659.0 727.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,500.0 42.58 295.00 3,259.5 336.0 -720.3 794.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,600.0 42,56 295.00 3,333.1 364.5 -781.6 862.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,700.0 42,56 295.00 3,406.8 393.1 -842.9 930.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,800.0 42,56 295.00 3,480.5 4217 -004.2 997.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,800.0 42.56 295.00 3,554.1 450.3 -965.5 1,065.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,000.0 42.56 295.00 3,627.8 478.9 -1,026.8 1,133.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
- 4,100.0 42.56 295.00 3,701.4 507.5 -1,088.1 1,200.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,200.0 42.56 295.00 3,775.1 536.1 -1,149.4 1,268.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,300.0 42.56 295.00 3,848.8 564.7 -1,210.7 1,335.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,400.0 42.56 295.00 3,922.4 593.2 -1,272.0 1,403.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,468.7 42.56 205.00 3,873.0 612.8 -1,314.1 1,450.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
Ferron
4,500.0 42.11 295.00 3,996.2 621.8 -1,333.2 1,471.1 1.43 -1.43 0.00
4,600.0 40.68 295.00 4,071.2 640.7 -1,393.1 1,5637.2 1.43 -1.43 0.00
4,700.0 30.26 295.00 4,147.8 676.9 -1,451.3 1,601.4 1.43 -1.43 0.00

6/27/2007 8:01:45PM Page 3 COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77



Nevis
Planning Report

- Site Clear Creek Unit
- WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
“WELL @ 0.0R (Original Well Elev)

EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
MARION ENERGY, INC.
.. Carbon County, Utah

- Clear Creek Unit .- Grid
ASD #3-17 .+ Minimum Curvature
Original Hole :
Plan #2
incnation  Aximith o NS SEW  Seetion Rate Rite Rite
] v} ) ® " m (11000 (‘HooR) ("Moom)
4,800.0 37.83 295.00 4,226.0 703.2 -1,507.8 1,663.7 1.43 -1.43 0.00
4,900.0 36.40 295.00 4,305.8 728.7 -1,562.5 17241 1.43 -1.43 0.00
5,000.0 34.98 295.00 4,387.0 753.4 -1,615.4 1,782.4 1.43 -1.43 0.00
5,100.0 33.55 295.00 4,469.6 777.2 -1,666. 1,838.7 1.43 -1.43 0.00
5,200.0 3212 295.00 4,553.7 800.1 -1,715.5 1,892.9 1.43 -1.43 0.00
5,300.0 30.70 295.00 4,630.0 822.1 -1,762.8 1,845.0 1.43 -1.43 0.00
5,330.4 30.13 295.00 4,673.0 830.6 -1,780.8 1,965.0 1.43 -1.43 0.00
PBHL
Targets
Target Name _
= hithiiss target DipAngla DipDir.  TVD +N/-8 +ERW Northing Easting
- Shape ] ) " n " ) n Latitude Longitude
PBHL 0.00 360.00 4,673.0 830.6 -1,780.8 14,415,854.28 1,5983,517.86 39°41'50.149 N 111." 10'0.217 W
- plan hits target
- Circle (radius 100.0)
KOP 0.00 360.00 1,650.0 0.0 0.0 14,415,023.68 1,695,298.66 39°41'41.969 N 111° ' 37.407 W
- plan hits target
- Point
Ferron 0.00 360.00 3,873.0 612.9 -1,314.1 14,415,636.58 1,593,984.56 39°41'48.005 N 111° 9' 54.239 W
- plan hits target
- Circle (radius 100.0)

6/27/2007 8:01:45PM Page 4 COMPASS 2003. 14 Build 77



ASD #3-17
MARION ENERGY, INC. ciearCreek Unit
Plan #2 Carbon County, Utah

SECTION DETAILS

Sec MD Inc Azi TVD  +N/-S +E/W DLeg TFace VSec Target

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 00 000 0.00 0.0
1650.0 0.00 0.00 1650.0 0.0 00 0.00 0.00 0.0
4256 295.00 2941.7 2126 -4559 3.00 295.00 5030
4468.7 4256 29500 3973.0 6129 -13141 0.00 0.00 1450.0
53394 30.13 285.00 4673.0 830.6 -1780.8 1.43 -179.99 1965.0

6 I8 NE XY QN
w
o
»
oo
o

Ferron:

KoP

500
1000—]
1500—] » ]
_ o KOP . 1500
= i — ]
52000 40° 1
3 . d 1125 PBHL
o — 20 E : //
Ezsoc _ 2 1 ‘
3 - ® B 750 P
(1] - . ':« n : Q P
3. 1 S £ ]
B3000 N £ E
£ i E 315
> T Z A
[} T ,g = 4
: - . b( St —
= 3500 £ -
- o 0
i .VFerron @ 1
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WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS
Name TVD +N/-§ +EMW  Shape G
KOP 1865.7 0.0 0.0 Point
Ferron  3973.0 612.9 -1314.1 Circle (Radius: 100.0)
PBHL 4673.0 830.6 -1780.8 Circle (Radius: 100.0)

IIIIIIIIIIITli
1125 -750 -375

)/East(+) (750 ft/in)

SITE DETAILS: Clear Creek Unit

Sec.17, T13S, R7E
Site Centre Latitude: 39° 41' 41.968 N
Longitude: 111°9'37.407 W

T
Azimuths to Grid North

M True North: 0.10°
Magnetic North: 12.28°

Magnetic Field
Strength: 52370.9nT
Dip Angle: 65.38°
Date: 6/27/2007
Model: IGRF200510

Positional Uncertainity: 0.0
Convergence: -0.10
Local North: Grid
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OIL AND GAS LEASE Indexed .. Cordillera C
Abstracted A2 QOct 3] 1118 Rl
Roo, Feeo ._.._Q_-..QQ....

BOOK 173 O0F  Recm

THIS AGREEMENT, entered into as of the lst day of A[ffi'i%ﬁi?ﬁa%ﬁ_’
COUNTY RECORDER

between Jack Thomas hereinafter called

lessor and CORDILLERA CORPORATION hereinafﬁer called lessee,
does witness:

1. That lessor, for and in considerétion of the covenants and
agreements hereinafler contained to be performed by the lessee, has
this day_granted, leased, and let and by these pfesents does hexeby
grant, lease and let exclusively unto the lessee a 30.0000 % un-
divided interest in the hereinafter described land,'and with the
right to unitize this lease or any part thereof with other oil and
gas leases as to all or any part of the lands covered thereby as
hereinafter provided, for the purpose of carrying on geological,
geophysical and other e#ploratory work, including core dfilling,
and the drilling, mining, and operating for, producing, and saving
all of the oil, gas, casinghead gas, casinghead gasoline and all
other gases and their respective constituent vapors, and for con-
structing roads, laying pipe lines, building tanks, storing qil.
building power stations, telephone lines and other structures
thereon necessary or convenient for the economical operation of said
land alone or conjointly with neighboring lands, to produce, save,
take care of, and manufacture all of such substances, and for housing
and boarding employees, said tract of land with any reversionary
rights therein being situated in the County of Carbon, State of

Utah, and described as follows:

E/2SW/4 Sec. 8, Township 13 South,
Range 7 East, SLM

and containing 80 acres, more or less.
2. It is agreed that this lease shall remain in full force for
a term of 5 years from this date, and as long thereafter as oil or
gas, or either of them, is produced.from said land (or frgm lands

with which said land is unitized) or the premises are being

developed or operated. 445
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3. The lessee shall monthly pay lessor as royalty on gas
marketed from each well where gas only is found, one-eighth (1/8)
of the-proceeds if sold at the well, or if marketed by lessee
off the leased premlses, then one-eighth (1/8) of its market value
at the well. The lessee shall pay the lessor: (a) one-eighth
(1/8), of the proceeds received by the lessee from the sale of
casinghead gas, produced from any oil well; (b) one-eighth(1/8)
of the value, at the mouth of the well, computed at the prevailing
market price, of the casinghead gas, produced from any oil well
and used by lessee off the leased premises for any purpose or use
on the leased premises by the lessee for purposes other than the
development and operation thereof.

4. The lessee shall have the right to use, free of cost, gas,
oil and water found on said land for its operations thereon, except
water from the wells of the lessor. When required by lessor, the
lessee shall bury its‘pipelines below plow depth and shall pay
for dam&ée caused by its operations to growing crops on said land.
No well shall be drilled nearer than 200 feet to the house or barn
now on said premises without written consent of the lessor. Lessee
shall have the right at any time during, or after the expiration of,
this lease to remove all machinery, fixtures, houses, buildings,
amd other structures it places on said premises, including the
rightlto draw and remove all casing. Lessee agrees, upon the
completion of any test as a dry hole or upon the abandonment of
any producing well, to restore the premises to their original

contour as near as practicable and to remove all installations

within a reasonable time.

5. Notwithstanding anything in this lease to the contrary,
it 1is specifically agreed that lessors! only interest 1in said
pProperty is an undivided mineral interest, Lessors make no
warranty with respect to their title to said minerals. Any and
all arrangements for the right to the use of the surface of or
waters in or upon said lands are to be made with the owners
thereof. Without limiting the generality of the foregoing con-~
ditions, the provisions of paragraphs 1 and 4 of this lease
which fn any manner affect surface or water uses are specifically

subject to the provisions of paragraph 5.




6. Notwithstanding anything in this lease contained to the
contrary, it is expressly agreed that if lessee shall commence
operations for drilling at any timetwhile this lease is in force, this
lease shall remain in force and its terms shall continue so long as
such operations are prosecuted and, if production results there-
from, then as long_as pProduction continues.

If within the primary term of this lease, production on the
leased premises shall cease from any cause, this lease shall not
terminate. If, after the expiration of the priméry term of this
lease, production on the leased premises shall cease from'any cause,
this lease shall not terminate provided lessee resumes operations
for reworking or drilling a well within three-hundread sixty (360)
days fromAsuch cessation and this lease shall remain in force during
the prosecution of such operations and, if broduction results there-
from, then as long as production continues.

7. This lease and éll its terms, conditions and stipulations
shall extend to, and be binding on each of the parties who signs
this lease, regardless of whether it is signed by any of the other
parties herein names lessors. This lease may be signed in
counterparts, each to have the same effect as Lhe original.

8. This lease is subject to theiprovisions of the uUnit Agree-
ment for the Development and Operation of the Clear Creek Unit
Area Counties of Carbon and Emery, State of Utah, which was exe-
cuted as of January 1, 1957. Lessee hereby agrees to be substituted
for Lessor pursuant to said agreement and.to assume all of Lessor's
rights, duties and obligations thereunder.

9. This lease is subject to the provisions of the Unit Operating.
Agreement Clear Creek Unit Area Counties of Carbon and Emery, State
of Utah which was executed as of January 1, 1957. Lessee hereby
agrees to be substituted for Lessor pursuant to said Agreement and
to assumeball of Lessor's rights, duties and obligations thereunder.

10. This lease is subject to the provisions of the Gas Purchase

Agreement dated April 1, 1965 between Utah Natural Gas Company and

Tenneco 0il Company et al. Lessee hereby agrees to be substituted

1 ]
for lessor pursuant to said agreement and to assume all of lessor’'s

rights, duties and obligations thereunder. 447
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11. This lease applies only to zones and formations from the

surface down to the base of the Ferron sand.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this agreement

as Of the date first above written.

_DITEST:
& GOy,
el /,b :

AT

.
N

Lessor
~“m£:21645$§ZgZ;ZZ&ﬁ/
Jack/Thomas

CORDILLERA CORPORATION (Lessee)

nyj@,gv& A )\,R/VY‘\/*

nés N. Blue, Prebkident



STATE OF- / /j/

y ss
COUNTY OF g,ké—ﬂ/__)
On the _/_4_2_*__‘_‘ day of(/ Ll r 1977, b.efore me
2 .
personally appeared - Jack Thomas » Signor of the

above instrument, who duly acknow].cc"iged to me t:h.al: he/she

%4//
No ry Publlc

\ECMY( };omm15510n expires: -
~:,\.\. . 0 . . - L
; X D 0 l' " /7, 77 . Residing at@q{/_z /(/Zo/Z

e

\'-r""‘l- (a!U

executed the same.

i, \
. AW
B R -aP Y “ ! k
. . » . ‘“.\
F STATE OF COLORADO )

") ss
CITY AND COUNTY OF DENVER)

On the /5 """ day of __/_2_7&¢A ., 1977, before
‘me personal]..y appeared _QZQ,QJL@@“M/{%Q . Who, being
> . ’ * )
by me duly sworn did say that he is /ZK%CM

of CORDILLERA CORPORATION and that said instrument was signed

in behalf of said corporation by authority of its by--laws,

and said ;%:/h,, Lo ﬂm acknowledged to me that said

R corporation executed the same.
e G ’ '
\\'0 ‘
.- /

-.\

-

L
& AL
w s \OTA @
' \-o- ﬁ}'..q. %(QL_C%\S—\L(PFAJ
A G i Notary Public
-l VB ,
" commission expires:
“e ?I‘ co\—'y‘ P

,/))(g_ W2 A Q(S A8 Residing at!:B('/n (804 (26"‘—(0 7 100
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF QIL. GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

Ly KD EERLL NOWBER
State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
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T UNT o CA MIRECSENT HANE.
Clear Creek Uni

+ TYPEQF

§ VELL NAME snd HBER
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Marion Enetqy, inc 4300731182
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UTAH
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM S

3. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.
State ML-1257 :

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

mMmmmmemmwnwmmmmummmmm reentor plugged wells, or to
difll horizontal iaterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME.

(7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME.

Clear Creek Unit

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPEOFWELL
owwelr 1 caswew B omer Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR. 9. APT NUMBER:
Marion Energy, inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 0. FIELD AND POCL, OR WILDCAT:
119So. Tennessee #200 . McKinney srare TX 7 79069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL _
FooTAceEs AT surFace: 2014.49" FEL,692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QITRIATR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RaNGE, MERIDAN. NWNE 17 138 7E STATE: UTAH
" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION . TYPE OF ACTION
[J norceor NTent ] acioze [} oe=ren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
{Submit in Duphcate) ] AutEr casine [ rractuRE TREAT [J swerrack 1o REPARWELL
Approximats date work witt start [ casncrerar [[] wewconsTrRucTION [[] remporariLY ABANDON
[[] cHanceToPreEVious PLANS [] oreratoR cHANGE [} tueinG repar
. [ ownceTueme [ ruusanp asanpon [ venrorrare
SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ crancewer nans [[] rwesack [] water misposaL
(Submit Original Form Only}
et o ok ) D CHANGE WELL STATUS D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
[J commmcLe ProbuciNG FoRMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE omer: _Drilling Update
7113/2007 [ converrweL vvre [0 wecompLeTE - oFFERENT FORMATION 71312007

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR QOMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, ete.

As of report time this morning they were at 897",

NAME (LEASE PRINT-2 009 Endsley mme VP Operations
mmﬁ_%w pare _1113/2007
/
(Thie space for State use only) = }
RECE|vep
JU
€Sa000) (See (nstructions on Reverse Side) L ’ 72007

DIV oF OlL, GAS & MINING



Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORY
[LEASE NAME & WELL RO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 13, 2007
{riG namE AMD MumsR cousty lstare DAY Ko,
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 14
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hes  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE ORELED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
803’ 10 38 232 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb 14
[ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME . : [REPORTED BY
Drilling 12 1/4" hole @ 864 R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
R KB TO GL.
‘Mmempitmfmshwatarannularvdocityaﬂﬁﬁlmin.atdﬁﬂpipe. 15
i TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detatl .
6:00 10:00 | 4.00 |Rig up Reserve pit pumps and Tanks to circulate reserve pit / Test pumps shut in air package.
10:00 | 11:00 | 1.00 |Circulate hole clean wash to bottom / work tight hole.
11:00 | 19:30 | 8.50 |[Time Drilling From 571° to 761" At less than 40 ft/hr. / Directional Surveys every 90 ft.
19:30 20:30 | 1.00 [Pull out of hole to Shoe.
20:30 0:30 4.00 |Change out 5 1/2" Liners and Swabs to 6 1/4"/ per Co. Man request. ] Pressure test Pumps to 1800
0:30 1:30 1.00_|Trip in hole. / Stage pumps up to 120 and 120 spm.
1:30 3:00 1.50 _{Time Driling From 761" to 803" At less than 60 fthr.
3:00 3:30 0.50 |Rig Repair/Trip out to shoe to tighten conection between swivel & kelly spinners./leaking.
3:30 4:30 1.00 |Rig Repairs/Make up kelly remove furnbuckels from spinners retouque connection replace turnbuckels
4:30 6:00 1,50 |Rig Repairs / Set kelly back and trip back in hole.
Dally cost reflects rigmove cost: $36,412.00 and Return on rental pipe and hauling BOP in:$14940
24.00_[Circulating Reserve pit with DAPP water no air on hole / Reserve pitis full.
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 780 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
[TIME 3:00 Pac UL SIZE 121/4
WEIGHT 8.5 Pac-R {MFG STC
VIS 29 Fed Zan TYPE S619
WL Max Gel JET 3/136/18
PV/YP Fed Seal SERIAL NO. IX3406
MBY Duro Gel jpepTH OUT 803
ca PolyPlus  IDEPTHIN 530
GELS Super Sweep  {TOTAL FEET 273
ALK Cotion Seed Hulls {HRS 11
|oH Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE 'WT. ON BIT 2K
cL {DAILY COST $0.00 |ReM 50
Lom lerevious cosT $1925600  [ROP{fph) 24.8
%SOUDS CUMULATIVE COST $19,256.00 AN VEL 165.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
no. | DEScrirTION LENGTH - FT__|PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 12 1/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 653 .40 / 276.80
1 Mud Mtr 28.03 MODEL 8P80 | 8P80 746 .20 / 309.60
1 Shock Sub 10.39 |STROKE 850 | 8.50
1 Pony NMDC 9.90 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 |slick NMDC 2092  lsem 120 | 120 RBECEIvVEDND
1 |GapSub 4,17 GPM 406.00] 406.00 it
1 Islick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE | 1760.0| 1760.0 i v
6 |61/4"DCS 183.37  [ecp !
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 SLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56 nv Ar s
1 |6 3/4HM) jars 30.75 SLOWPUMP-PRES | 145 | 138 i GRS & MINING
6 4 1/2" HWDP 214.63 AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $98,585
|scrm 0 JpreEvIOUS cum cosT $525,929
U:\PROD\DORLG)AS BHA 788.99 JinaEcTION RATE 0 JeuMULATIVE WELL COST $624,513




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE WAME & WELL NO. FIELD {DaTe
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 12, 2007
{RIG KasE AND MUMBER couwTy {svare DAY NO.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 13
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. tes  foumn Rot. Hirs FOOTAGE DRILLED HLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Repart No.
571 1 28 41' 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb l 13
IACTIVITY AY REPORT TIME BY
Circulating Hole Clean C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
JREMARKS KB TO GL.
{Pumps Airing Up Do To Soap in System 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 {Test Choke Lines & Valves
7:00 12:00 | 5.00 {Tum How Line So Sensor Is On Top/Get Elevators Broke Off HWDP/LD 8" DC'S & Single HWDP
12:00 14:30 2.50 |[Pick Up Bit & Make Up To Mud Mir./Make Up Directional Tools & Scribe
14:30 22:00 7.50 |weld On Flow Line
22:00 1:00 3.00 {Drill Cmt & Aoat Equipment/ 440°-485'
1:00 2:30 1.50 |Drill Cmt 485'-530'
2:30 3:30 1.00 |Drill Actual/ 530'-571'/ Pumps Airing Up Do To Soap
3:30 5:00 1,50 {Hole Sluffing In/ 50% Returns/ Work Tight Hole Til Free
5:00 6:00 1.00 [Conditoion Hole & Circulated
24.00
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
TIME Pac UL SIZE 12 1/4
WEIGHT PacR IMFG STC
VIS Fed Zan TYPE S619
A, Max Gel ET 3/13 6/18
PV/YP Fed Seal SERIAL NO. IX3406
imBT Duro Gel DEPTH OUT 571
CA Poly Plus DEPTH IN 530
GELS Super Sweep _ [TOTAL FEET 41
ALK Cotton Seed Hulls  JHRS 1
lpH Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 8-10K
CL DAILY COST $0.00 |rReM 50
Lo |prEVIOUS COST $1925.00  |ROP(fph) 41.0
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $19,256.00 AN VEL Artiated
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  {PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 1214 1.50 Imaxe Nat Nat
1 Mud Mtr 28.03 MODEL 8P80 | 8P80
1 Shock Sub 10.39 {STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 {Pony NMDC 9,50 lunen s1ze 550 { 5.50 D&
1 |Slick NMDC 29.92  |spm 90.00 | 90 HECEVED
1 Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 224.00} 224.00 4 3
1 |Slick NMDC 30.13 |SURF PRESSURE 576.0 | 576.0 oL 72067
6 |61/4" DCS 183.37  |[ecp _
8  |41/2° HWDP 246.20  |stowPump-sPM | 58 56 UIV.OF 1Y, GAS & NINIVE
SLOW PUMP- PRES 95 85
AIR Driilling Operations data Y WELL COST $33,047
SCFM 250 Jerevious cum cosT $492,882
U\PRODADORLG.XLS BHA 543.61 |INJECTION RATE 0 JoumuLATIVE wELL COST $525,929




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORY
L EASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD {oare
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 11, 2007
{R1G NAME AMD mMBER ‘ county lsrare |oay wo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 12
{TOTAL DEPTH Rot. fies  foum Rot. K FOOTAGE ORILLED {LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Repart No.
530' 0 27 0 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb l 12
IACTIVITY &3 BEPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Testing BOPS C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
JREMARKS KB 7O GL.
Nipple Up & Test BOPS 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 14:30 8.50 |Nipple Up BOP'S/Rotating Head/Choke Line/Flare Line/Kill Line
14:30 | 18:00 | 3.50 [Test BOP'S/ Test Hoor Valves,Uppr & Lower Kelly Valves, Test Back To Pumps, Function Test BOP'S
18:00 20:30 2.50 |Test Choke Manifold & HCR Valves
20:30 | 22:00 | 1.50 |Leak Between Wellhead & Drilling Flange/ Pull Stack Off & Install Metal S-Seal Ring
22:00 | 0:00 | 2.00 |Set BOP Stack Back On Well Head & Nipple Up
0:00 2:00 2.00 |Testing Choke Line/ Annular Would Not Hold/ Tighen Annular
2:00 4:00 | 2.00 |Testing Pipe Rams & Blind Rams/ Tighten Hange
400 | 6:00 | 2.00 [Testing Casing/ Tighten Flanges On Back Side Of Wellhead
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
IpEPTH INo. oF sacks/ies | propucT NaME | BIT NO. 3
[TIME Pac UL SIZE 17 12
WEIGHT pPacR mre STC
VIS Fed Zan TYPE XRTVC
Wi Max Gej JET Open
ovyvp Fed Seal SERIAL NO. MR8869
ImeT Duro Gel DEPTH OUT 530
CA Poly Plus {DEPTH IN 266
GELS Super Sweep  {TOTAL FEET 264
ALK Cotton Seed Hulls {HRS 13
Jpnt Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE WT, ON BIT 8-10K
cL {pALLY COST 4$0.00 {rem 50
Juem {PREVIOUS COST $19256.00  |RoOP(fph) 20.3
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $19,256.00 AN VEL Arilated
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  {PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 17-1/2" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 3.32 MODEL | 8rP80 | 8P8O
2 8" 60.22 {STROKE 8.50 8.50 |l Y =l LT TN
1 }Cross over sub 2.28 | s128 550 | 5.50 =TV L
3 l61/4"DC 91.54  |spM
i Pony NMDC 9.75 GPM | L I ’ iﬁﬂi
3 {61/4"DC 91.83 SURF PRESSURE s OL
8 |41/ HWDP 24588  |kco UiV Ur UL, GAS & MINING
: |sLow pump- sPM
|sLow pump- PrES
AIR Drilling Operations data AILY WELL COST $25,602
[scem 0 JerEVIOUS CuM cosT $467,280
4:\PRODADDRLG.YAS BHA 506.32 JINIECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $492,882




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAMEQWELLNO, AED [osve
r;ﬁ;ine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 10, 2007
NANE AND NUMBER _ lcousty {svate Joar xo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 11
hmnnem Rot. s joum Rot. trs FOOTAGE DRILLED ILAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repart Na.
530' 0 27 0 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb 11
jACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
fl\g%mUp BOP'S C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
KB TO GL.
Resst Well Head/ Npple Up BOP'S v [ 15
TIME LOG
FROM 70 HOURS ~Activity Detail
6:00 16:00 | 10.00 {Waell Head Sitting To High Needed 3" Downward Adjustment/ Cut Clean & Reweld
16:00 | 18:00 | 2.00 |Move Catwalk/ Move D.C.'S/Move HWDP/Move Twin BOP'S/Move Hydrill/With Pole Truck
18:00 19:00 1.00 |Rig Service
19:00 23:00 4.00 |Set Twin BOP'S On Well Head/ Set Hydrill On Twin Stack
23:00 0:00 1.00 {Set In Catwalk/ Set V-Door/ Set WDP On Racks
0:00 3:00 3.00 |Nipple Up BOP'S/ HCR Valve & Kill Line
3:00 5:00 2.00 {Pull Rotary Table To Set Rotating Head On Hydril
5:00 6:00 1.00 {Nipple Up BOP'S & Rotating Head
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loerms INO. OF sacks/1LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 3
TIME Pac UL SIZE 17 1/2
WEIGHT Pac-R IMFG STC
VIS Fed Zan TYPE XRTVC
WL Max Gel JET Open
levrve Fed Seal |SERIAL NO. MRB869
Imer Duro Gel DEPTH OUT 530
ICA Poly Plus DEPTH IN 266
GELS Super Sweep  |TOTAL FEET 264
ALK Cotton Seed Hulls JHRS 13
pH Sawdust 1/8/G
l'cmz WT. ON BIT 8-10K
I DAILY COST $0.00 |rpm 50
fLem lerevious cost $19,256.00  |ROP(fph) 20.3
9%SOLIDS : CUMULATIVE COST $19,256.00 AN VEL Ariiated
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 |17-1/2" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat | Nat
1 Bit Sub 3.32 MODEL 8rP80 | 8PS0
2 8" 60.22 STROKE 8.50 8.50 DErsr-i i
1 |Cross over sub 2.28 LINER SIZE 550 { 5.50 TICLTVED
3 Je1s"oC 91.54 lspm
1 |Pony NMDC 9.75 GPM JP 7-2007
3 6 1/4" DC 91.83 |SURF PRESSURE "y om
8 l41/2" HWDP 24588  [Ecp BV OF DI, GAS 2 NG
SLOW PUMP- SPM
|sLow PUMP- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data IDAILY WELL COST $45,29%
|scrm 0 Jerevious cum cosT $421,981
U:\PRODADORLG.XLS BHA 506.32 JINJECTION RATE 0 JcumuLaTIVE wELL COST $467,280




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
IERSE NAME & WELL NO. FELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 9, 2007
WAME AND MUMBER ICOUNTY ]STATE DAY NO.
chnit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 10
Rmm.oerm fot. Hrs  joan Rat. Hrs FOOTAGE ORRLED ILAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.,
530° 0 27 0 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb I 10
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED 8Y
Welding On Well Head C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
KB TO GL.
mTMOf‘IZOOSKS 15.8ppg Class-G Cement 236bbls On Surface I 15
TIME LOG
FROM 1O HOURS ‘Activity Detail
6:00 10:00 4.00 |Wait On Cement
10:00 | 11:00 | 1.00 }Run 200' 1’ Pipe For Top Job
11:00 | 12:00 | 1.00 [Cement 290 sks 15.8 ppg Class-G Cement On Top Job/ No Cement To Surface Good Returns
12:00 16:30 4.50 |Wait On Cement/ Wait On Bulk Truck To Arrive With More Cement
16:30 | 17:00 | 0.50 [Run 75' 1’ Pipe Tagged Up At 75'
17:00 | 17:30 | 0.50 [Cement 300 Sks 15.8 ppg Class-G Cement 56 bbls/ Cement To Surface Good Returns
17:30 | 18:00 | 0.50 |Rig Down Cementers
18:00 | 23:00 | 5.00 [Wait On Cement/ Clean Location With Super Vac Truck
23:00 1:00 2.00 |Cut Casing To install Well Head
1:00 3:30 2.50 _|Nippie Up Flanges On Well Head And Set On Surface Casing
3:30 6:00 2.50 {Pre-Heat Wellhead To Install On Surface Casing
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loerm INO. OF sacks/LBs | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 3
b Pac UL SIZE 17 1/2
IweiGHT Pac-R MFG STC
jvis fed Zan TYPE XRTVC
MaxGel  |ET Open
v Fed Seal SERIAL NO. MR8869
[mer DuroGel _ |DEPTH OUT 530
fea Poly Plus DEPTH IN 266
faris Super Sweep  [TOTAL FEET 264
ALK Cotton Seed Hulls [HRS 13
Sawdust T/B/G
sz WT, ON BIT 8-10K
la |oany cost $0.00 RPM 50
jom JerEVIOUS COST $19.256.00  |ROP(fph) 20.3
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $19,256.00 AN VEL Ariiated
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NOo. | pEscripTION LENGTH - FT__ |PUMP NoO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmusth
1 17-1/2" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 3.32 MODEL 8P80 { 8P80O
2 |8 60.22  |stroxe 8.50 | 8.50 BECA EIVED
1 ]Cross over sub 2.28 LINER SIZE 550 | 5.50 )
3 Jle1/4"DC 91.54  |sem Ul 17 2607
1 |Pony NMDC 9.75 GPM i 7
3 J61/4"DC 91.83 {SURF PRESSURE T
8  |a1/2" HWDP 24588  {Ecp e VPIL, BAS & MINING
SLOW PUMP- SPM
SLOW PUMP- PRES |
AIR Drilling Operations data IDAILY WELL COST $78,809
{scrM 0 Jprevious cum cost $343,172
{U:\PRODNDDRL 6,305 BHA 506.32 JINJECTION RATE 0 JoumuLATIVE WELL COST $421, 581




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL NO. [FIELD DATE
Etﬂpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 8, 2007
NAME AND MUBER _ couwTy Jsvare Joar wo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 9
DEPTH Rot. Hrs Rot. trs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET© Nao.
530' | 45 | 27 72' 485", Surface Casing 55' Rkb Im 9
Jpomviry a7 REFORT TINE : REPORTED BY
Wait On Cement For 2 Hours Then Do A Top Job C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
JREMARKS KB TO GL.
TD Surface @530/Run Surface Csg/ Cmt 610 Sks Class G Cmt/ Lost Returns On Displacement l 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM 7O HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 10:30 4.50 |Drill ActuaV 458'-5307 Surface TD @ 530
10:30 | 11:30 | 1.00 ]Condition Hole & Circulate
11:30 15:00 3.50 |TOOH/ Lay Down 3-dts HWDP
15:00 | 15:30 | 0.50 |[Rig Service
15:30 | 16:30 | 1.00 |Rig Down Rotating Head/ Break Bit & Bit Sub & Lay Down Same
16:30 | 17:30 | 1.00 |Rig Up Casing Crew
17:30 | 18:00 | 0.50 |Safety Meeting With Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
18:00 0:30 6.50_|Run 11 Jts STC #46 K-55 Csg 4907 Washed Casing Down From 250'-485'
0:30 1:30 1.00 |Rig Down Casing Crew
1:30_| 2:30 | 1.00 [Rig Up Cementers
2:30 | 3:00 | 0.50 |Safety Meeting With Rig Personnel & Cementing Crew
3:00 4:30 1.50 |Rig Up Cementing Head
4:30 6:00 1.50 |Cmt 11 Jts STC #46 K-55 Csg 490' W/ 610sks 125bbis Class G-Cement/ Lost Retums
{Willl Cmt Top 200" @ 8 AM W/ 290Sks Class G Cmit}
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
joerTH 493 [NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 3
e 6:30 Pac UL SIZE 171/2
wecHT 10 Pac-R JurG STC
jvrs 59 50 Fed Zan TYPE XRTVC
jm 8 MaxGel _ DET Open
v 12/5 Fed Seal SERIAL NO. MRS869
et Duro Gel DEPTH OUT 530
ja Trace 2 Poly Plus  |DEPTHIN 266
leais 2/3 1 Super Sweep  [TOTAL FEET 264
jux 0.0/0.5 4 Cotton Seed Hubs |HRS 13
E‘[ 7 30 Sawdust 1/B/G
2 ' WT. ON BIT 8-10K
la 400 {pARY cosT $12644.00  [Rem 50
kom 0.100 IprEVIOUS COST $6,61200  |ROP(fph) 20.3
LSOLIDS 2 CUMULATIVE COST $19,256.00 AN VEL Ariiated
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH-FT _|pumMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION { Azmuth
1 17-1/2" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 3.32 MODEL 8P80 | 8P80
2 8" 60.22 |sTROKE 8.50 8.50 N e
1 |Cross over sub 2.28 {Lner s1zE 5.50 | 5.50 LoelVED
3 [61/4"DC 91.54 sPM 100.00 I it
1 |Pony NMDC 9.75 GPM 249.00 VL 1/ 2007
3  |61/4"DC 91.83  |SURFPRESSURE | 275.0 ~ )
8  |41/2" HWDP 245.88 ECD UiV OH QL CAC 9 vans
|sLow PumP- sPM TEOTERIRING
|sLow pump- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $53,542
- |scrm 500 JPreVIOUS CumM cosT $289,630
Ju-\PROD\DDRIG.XLS BHA 506.32 JinoEcTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $343,172




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tenn Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Fumuwmm FELD Jpare
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 7, 2007
WAME AND MUMBER [COUNTY ISTATE DAY NO.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 8
OEPTH Rot. trs  foum Rot. tss FOOTAGE DRILLED WQS!NGSZE,WEG’H’,GRADE SET @ Report No,
458 | 85 | 22.5 192 20", Conductor pipe. 55' Rkb 8
AT REFORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
KB TO GL.
m@_gl Wash & Ream 466'-266'/ Drill Actual 266'-458' [ 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS | Activity Detail
6:00 6:30 0.50 |Condition Mud & Circulate
6:30 | 21:30 | 15.00 |Reaming/ 166'-266'/ Hole Sluffing In On Top Of Bit/ Bring Mud Wt. Up TO 10ppg Vis 65-70/ 15% LCM
21:30 6:.00 8.50 |Drill Actual/ 266'-458'
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
joermi 280 Ino. oF sacks/ies | propucT NaMe | BIT No. 3
TIME 22:00 2 Pac UL SIZE 171/2
EIGHT 9.7 2 Pac-R MFG STC
jvs 58 11 Fed Zan TYPE XRTVC
s 8.4 50 MaxGel  |ET Open
pvre 12/6 15 Fed Seal SERIAL NO. MR8869
T 170 Duro Gel  |DEPTH OUT 458
o Trace lpePmi v 266
feas 23 TOTAL FEET 192
fax .0/.4 HRS 8.5
E‘E 7 1/8/G
2 'WT. ON BIT 8-10K
o 600 lpaRY cost $651200  IreM 50
kom 0.150 JprEvIOUS COST $6,61200  |ROP(fph) 22,5
SOLIDS 2 CUMULATIVE COST $6,612.00 AN VEL Ariiated
'‘DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 17-1/2" Bit 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 3.32 MODEL 8P80 | 8P80
2 8" 60,22 |STROKE 850 | 8.50 [Ty P
1 |Cross over sub 2.28 LINER SIZE 550 | 5.50 NMUUEIVED
3 |61/4"DC 91.54  |spM 100.00 I
1 [Pony NMDC 9.75 GPM 249.00 -""F 17 2007
3 614" DC 91.83 |SURF PRESSURE 248.0 "
5  |41/2" HWDP 153.56 _ |eco _ UV UFOL, cas g MINING
|sLow PUMP- SPM
|sLow pump- prES
AIR Drifling Operations data Y WELL COST $39,732
SCFM 500 Jprevious cum cosT $249,898
RRAPROD\DDRLG.MS BHA 414.00 INJECTION RATE 0 JcumuATIVE weLL CcoST $289,630




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
fuense namE & werL w0 FEWD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 6, 2007
NAME AND RUMBER ICOUNTY Ism's |pay xo.
lUmt Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 7
DEPTH Rot. s {cum Rot. trs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ JReport No.
272 14 14 217' 20", Conductor pipe. 55' Rkb , 7
AT REFORT TIME REPORTED BY
itioning Mud C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
KB TO GL.
Unstuck Drill Work Tight Hole/ TOOHY LD Hammer/ Condition Mud 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 |Work stuck pipe/ Pipe Free Work Tight Hole
7:00 8:00 1.00 |Pipe Free/ Mouse Hole Drill Collar
800 | 9:00 | 1.00 |Ream Tight Hole
9:00 11:00 | 2.00 [Work Tight Hole/ Lay Down 2-Drill Collars
11:00 13:00 2.00 |TOOH/ Break Hammer & Bit Sub/ Rig Down Rotating Head
13:00 13:30 | 0.50 |Rig Service
13:30 15:00 1.50 jWait On Bit
15:00 21:00 6.00 {Wait On Bit Sub
21:00 22:00 1.00 finstall 7/16 Ring in B- Section On ASD #7-16
22:00 23:00 1.00 |Make Up Bit & Bit Sub/ install Rotating Head
23:00 { 6:00 | 7.00 |Condition Mud/ Nefrulizing Scap In Mud System/ Centrifical & Mud Pumps Amng Up
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loermi INO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 2 3
i SIZE 171f2 17 1f2
e Imre IR STC
fors TYPE FB Hammer XRTVC
foa ET 5/16 Open
ovrve SERIAL NO. RR 1001 MR8869
o1 IpePTH OUT 266
fea joePT N 55 266'
leas [roTAL FEET 217
fux IHRs 14 0.00
B‘E 1/8/G
WT. ON BIT 6-8 K
ja |pany cost [rem 4
jone {PREVIOUS CoST |rop(iph) 15.5
4S0LIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL 445.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
No. | pEScripTION LENGTH - FT _ |[PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 |17-1/2" Bit 1.50 Imaxe Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 4.82 MODEL 8P80 { 8P80
2 8" 60.22 |STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 Cross over sub 2.28 LINER SIZE 5.50 5.50 ﬁ -
6 [61/4"DC 183.37  lsem N
GPM JOL 17 2007
|surr prESSURE i
|eco DV OFdN raca.
{sLow PuMP- sPM _ W G MINING
|sLow puMe- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $46,518
Iscrm JPREVIOUS CUM COST $203,380
APROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 252.19 {INJECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $245,858




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL BO. FIELD DATE
ine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 5, 2007
WAME AND MUMBER _ couwty Jsvare 1pay o,
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 6
DEPTH Rot. s fourn Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILED HAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET© Report No.
272 i4 14 217 20", Conductor pipe. 55' Rkb 6
AT REPORT THEE REPORTED BY
ming stuck pipe at 266' / waiting on surface jars, R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
 Pe— In ToeL
15
TIME LOG .
FROM 7O HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 18:00 { 12.00 |Driling Ahead 17 1/2" hole with Air hammer from 55' to 233' @ 14.8 fthr.
18:00 | 19:00 | 1.00 |Work through and ream tight hole. From 233" back to 209’
19:00 21:00 2.00 |Drilling Ahead 17 1/2" hole with Air hammer from 233’ to 272' @ 19.5 ft/hr.
21:00 | 2:00 | 5.00 |Work stuck pipe (packed off) at 240' Set kelly back / set ali string weight on stuck piont. _
2:00 3:30 1.50 |wiait on fishing tools (surface jars) pipe came free 50% started working pipe up and down 5 ft.
3:30 6:00 2.50 |Kelly up and circulate stuck pipe with 1400 cfm and 10 gpm foam. / wait on surface jars.
24.00
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
g l] NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO 2
T DAP SIZE 171/2
pvescHT Fed-Zan ImrG IR
s Poly-Plus TYPE FB Hammer
b Pac-UL. 3ET 5/16
e Super Sweep  |SERIAL NO RR 1001
pwr Myacde  |DEPTH OUT
fca MaxGel IpEPTH IN 55
jeas TOTAL FEET 217
ALK {HRS 14
T/B/G
E«E WT. ON BIT 68K
la DALLY COST Irem 41
jow JprevIous cosT [rortson) 15.5
FASOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL 445.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
no. | pescripTION LENGTH - FT  |[PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
i 12" Air hammer 7.00 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 2.95 MODEL 8P80 | 8P8O
2 |8 60.22 _ |sTROKE 850 | 8.50 [y .
1 [Cross over sub 2.28 JLineER S1ZE 550 | 5.50 TIROUEIZIVED
6 1[61/4"DC 183.37 SPM 11
pree .uw;ﬂ—rzm——l
|SURF PRESSURE .
|eco Ui Ur QL CAS § pomsnn
|sLow Pump- sPM S
|sLow pume- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $36,883
SCFM JprEVIOUS CUM CoST $166,497
A3 WPROD\DDRLG.XAS BHA 255.82 JInaECTION RATE 0 JcumuaTIive weLL cosT $203,300




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WAME & WELL B0, FIELD DATE
ine Schoot District 3-17 Clear Creak July 4, 2007
NAME AND NUWBER county Jsmate DAY KO,
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 5
o verry Rot. Hrs ot tes FOOTAGE DRILLED  JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
55 40 |NA. | 5
AT REPORY TIME REPORTED BY
Eng up tools to drill Surface. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
KB TO GL.
| 15
TIME LOG

FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail

6:00 11:30 | 5.50 jCenter conductor Pipe in hole and set up for cement, wait on cement crew.

11:30 held safety meeting with cement crew, cemented conductor pipe, started pumping 20 bbl. Water
Pressured up to 80 psi, hydroliced conductor up about 4 feet breaking chains, tied pipe down again and
pumped water 3 bpm then increased fate to 5 bpm, then pumped 200 sx type g with 2 cad2 and
1/4 Ib/sx flocele at 15.8 ppg. Displaced with 7.5 bbl fresh water kept returns throughout job and got 8

14:30 | 2.50 |bbiof cement back. Left approxamatly 15 feet of cement in pipe.
14:30 19:00 | 4.50 jwait on cement to cure.
19:00 Welding blewie line together and welding rotating deverter flange on conductor, Pick up and stab
4:00 9.50 |mouse hole and
4:00 6:00 2.00 [Pick up Tools and hammer./ install bearing assembly on rotating head.
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
Ino.oF sacxsiiss | propucTName | BT o, 2
[TIME DAP SIZE 17172
IWEIGHT Fed-Zan MFG IR
vis Poly-Plus TYPE FB Hammer
L Pac-UL JET 5/16
evive Super Sweep  |SERIAL NO. RR 1001
jpsr Myackde  |DEPTH OUT
fea MaxGel |pEPTH IV 55
leais TOTAL FEET
Jaix HRS
E‘E 1/B/G
WT. ON BIT
o |parLY cost [rem
joar {prEVIOUS COST {rRoP(fph)
9%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 |12" Air hammer 7.00 MAKE Nat Nat
1 Bit Sub 2.95 MODEL 8P80 | 8PS0
1 8" 4.00 STROKE 8.50 8.50
1 |Oross over sub 3.86 LINER SIZE 550 | 5.50 | =] :
<PM E‘C‘F‘!VE'B——..
GPM Jul 1
SURF PRESSURE 2007
ECD D.! "/‘ JatallaW -
SLOW PUMP- SPM VR CAS & MINING
|SLOW PUMP- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST 467,784
|scrm t Jprevious cum cost 498,713
J-APROD\DDRLGILS BHA 17.81 |INOECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $166,497




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL NO. FED Joare
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 3, 2007
MAME AND NUMBER county |stare DAY NO,
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 4
DEPTH Rot. trs Rob. ths FOOTAGE DRILLED JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repart No.
s ol 4
AT REFORT TIME REPORTED BY
Waiting on cement Trucks R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
KB TO GL.
Reamed out conductor hole to 26" using hole opener. Set 20" conductor @40' "GL" 15
TIME LOG
FROM O HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 11:00 | 5.00 {Pull conductor pipe and clean off cement / pull and laydown conductor
11:00 | 18:00 | 7.00 |Pick up kelly, swivel and pipe spinner, set rotary table back in and hook up chain and guards.
18:00 | 18:30 | 0.50 [Lubricate rig and put #1 mud pump back together and fill with oil.
18:30 21:00 | 2.50 }Pick up 16" bit, 26" hole opener, bit sub and crossover and make up under rig floor.
21:00 1:00 4.00 |Ream out conductor hole with 26" hole opener with 60 vis. Spud mud to 55' "RKB"
1:00 1:30 0.50 |Break tools off kelly,
1:30 | 2:00 | 0.50 |Puli Rotary Table.
2:00 4:00 2.00 |Run and set Conductor pipe at 40' GL (55' RKB)
4:00 6:00 2.00 |Weld plate across top of Conductor pipe and 2" collar for pressure cement job / WAIT ON BIG 4
24.00
MUD RECORD ] MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
1DEPTH [NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
e DAP SIZE 16-26
wescHT Fed-Zan MFG hyc/sec
jvrs Poly-Plus TYPE Mill
s Pac-U, hET Open
levree Super Sweep  |SERIAL NO. Retip
T Myacide DEPTH OUT 55 rkb
fea MaxGel joePm v 0
Jeuis TOTAL FEET 40
lux HRS ?
E‘E T/B/G
WT. ON BIT 2/4 k
e |pamY cosT |rem 42
jowe PREVIOUS COST [rop(fph) 9.0
LSOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 16" Bit 1.50 |maxe Nat | Nat
1 |26"Hole opener 4.50 {moDEL 8P80 | 8PS0
1 Bit Sub 4.00 STROKE 850 | 8.50 L
1 ICross over sub 3.86 |LInER sT2E 550 | 5.50 HidC =N/ A
l SPM bkl == & 4
= 17 2007
|SURF PRESSURE
|eco DIV Qs ¢
|sLow pump- spM SE - GAS S WIS
|sLow PUMP- PRES
AIR Driliing Operations data Y WELL COST $33,226
, |scem JereviOUS cum cosT $65,487
R-PROD\DDRLG. LS BHA 13.86 Jan3ECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $58,713




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME & WELL NO. IFIELD DATE
r;;ine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 2, 2007
NAME AKD WUMBER COUNTY IsrATE JoAY §O.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 3
II!MDEPTN Rot Hrs  foumn Rot. Hies FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Ilhpu'tlb. 3
rmmur REPORT TIHE REPORTED BY
Cleaning cement off conductor pipe. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
KB TO GL.
Pulled conductor pipe with 112,000. l 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 18:00 | 12.00 |Rig up floor and conduct prespud inspection, modify beaver slide for new catwalk placement (due to
6-17 well head)
18:00 1:00 7.00 |Clean out celiar, prepare o pull conductor pipe, Welder preparing conductor, waiting on 18 foot bails.
1:00 6:00 5.00 {Hook up 18' Elevator links, Welder preparing conductor pipe.
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
jpern [no. oF sacksiBs | probuct NaME | BIT NO.
TIME DAP SIZE
JwescHT Fed-Zan IMrG
s Poly-Plus TYPE
f Pac-i, JET
lovive Super Sweep  |SERIAL NO.
[mer Myacide loerTH oUT
fea MaxGel DEPTH IN
leats TOTAL FEET
ALK ltrs
T/B/G
EKE WT. ON BIT
ja DALY COST jrPm
PREVIOUS COST |roP(Eph)
MSOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
no. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
|maxe Nat Nat
|MopEL 8P80 | 8PS0
|sTrRoKE 8.50 | 8.50 - _
LINER SIZE 5.50 5.50 H'“"CE!VFF)
SPM - o
arm UL T 7205
|SURF PRESSURE
ECD DY OF QUL GAS &M
|sLow pumMP- SPM
|sLow pump- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $20,984
|scrm Jprevious cum cosT 44,502
APROD\DDRIG.NS  BHA 0.00 |INIECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST 5,487




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennes Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
[LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak ‘ July 1, 2007
[Rec waste ano muateer : loounty Jsvare Joar so.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah | 2
{TOTAL DEPFTH Rot. ths  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ !&:\No.
2
SACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Setting derrick on rig floor. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
JREMARKS KB TO GL.
15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 | 0:00 | 16.00 |Setderrick on fioor, change out tugger line and load test derrick, raise dertick, Rig up floor and sub
hook up mud and water lines, set in air pack and rig up front yard.
16.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
|oerTH Ino. oF sacks/es | propucT NAME | BIT NO.
TIME DAP SIZE
WEIGHT Fed-Zan MFG
VIS Poly-Plus TYPE
Wi, Pac-Uit, JET
pV/YP Super Sweep  [SERIAL NO.
|mBT Myacide DEPTH OUT
cA MaxGel DEPTH IN
GELS TOTAL FEET
ALK {HRS
= T
CAKE WT. ON BIT
L DALLY COST |reM
loap JPREVIOUS COST JROP(fph)
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH -FT__ |PUMP NO. 1 | 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
MAKE Nat Nat
MODEL 8P80 | 8P80
|STROKE 8.50 8.50
LINER SIZE 550 { 5.50 iV
|spm
GPM J djt 177007
|SURF PRESSURE
ECD _ DIV.OF Il GAS & M-
|sLow PuMP- sSPM
SLOW PUMP- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $22,251
{scrm Jerevious cum cosT $22, 251
jprcovorisxls  BHA 0.00 |InaECTION RATE 0 JoumuLATIvE weLL coST $44, 502




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

[LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak June 30, 2007
JrsG name AND NUMBER . county JsTare Joay xo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah | 1
TOTALDEPTH | Rottis jomfot ths | FOOTAGEORILED  JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE seTo la-,muu.

-1
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Ready to set derrick on floor and rig up. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
fremanss lm Toa

15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail

6:00 22:00 | 16.00 |Rig down dermick and sub struchure, set derrick off floor and move water tank and dog house, Move sub
back to 3-17 and set, level sub and center over hole. / Install B section on well head of 6-17

16.00
MUD RECORD ] MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loerm Ino. oF sacks/tes | probuct Name | BrT NoO.
TIME DAP SIZE
WEIGHT Fed-Zan MFG
VIS Poly-Plus TYPE
Ll Pac-UL JET
pvree Super Sweep  |SERIAL NO,
ImeT Myacide DEPTH OUT
cA MaxGel DEPTH IN
GELS TOTAL FEET
ALK |Hrs
FH . 1/8/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT
cL DAILY COST {RPM
[oar {prREVIOUS COST JRoP(fph)
9%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST AN VEL
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
|maxe Nat | Nat
|MopEL 8Pg0 | 8P80
|sTROKE 8.50 | 8.50 o)y
LINER SIZE 550 | 5.50 Vo i VIEED
— JUt—7-2007
|sURF PRESSURE
£CD DU FAS R Ne
|sLow pumP- sPM
SLOW PUMP- PRES
AIR Drilling Operations data IDAILY WELL COST $22,251
{sCFM Jerevious cum cosT
ju:wvRoD\DDRIGXLS  BHA 0.00 |rnsecTION RATE 0 JcumuLATIVE WELL COST $22,251




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do nat uee this form for proposals o drill new welis, significantly deepen existing wells below current botiom-hole depth, reemtar plugged walls, or to
difil horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposais.

6. I INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Clear Creek Unit

TYPE OF
* "L onwe [T caswew ] otmHeER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Alpine School District 3-17

——————————
2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. APl NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 70, FIELD AND POOCL, OR WILDCAT:
119 So. Tennessee #200 ., McKinney stare IRz 10069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:. 2014.49" FEL ,692.77' FNL county: Carbon
QTRIGTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MeriDiaN: NWINE 17 138 7E STATE: UTAR
" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION . TYPE OF ACTION
NOTICE OF INTENT ACIDIZE [} oeeren ] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Dupficate) ALTER CASING [0 eracrure TREAT [] sioerrackToREPAIRWELL
Approximate date work will start [] casncrerar ] wewconsTrRucTION ] TemPoRaRiLY ABANDON
7/43/2007 [] cranceTo PReEVIoUS PLANS [[] oreratoRr crance [[] o repar
[ cnanceTueme [ Prucanp asanoon ] ventorRARE
[ susseauenT RepoRT ] crancEweLL Name [J rwesack [ warer misposac
{Submit Original Form Only)
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
Dae of work corapletion:

[} commmciLe Propucing FormaTIoNs [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

O converrweLTvee [J wecompLeTe - DiFreReEnT FORMATION

D OTHER:

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show alf pertinent details including dates, depihs, volumes, efc.
Based on the latest directional plan provided by Nevis Energy we intend to deepen our intermediate string of casing from 2100

to approximately 2800". Cement volumes will be adjusted accordingly.

NAME (PLEASE PRI Doug Endsley .. VP Operations
SionATiRE . - pare  7113/2007
pa |
{Phis space for State use only) L_/ /o
APPROVED BY THE STATE |
OF UTAH DIVISIOM OF
GlL, GAS, ANDMINING RECEIVED
i 7]/ 0F Sy JUL 17 2007
o3y

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Well name:

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

string type:  Intermediate Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.

2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modill

by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 103 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 790 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,435 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,763 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 335 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J} Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 3447 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,391 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 2,413 ft Next setting BHP: 1,962 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 3,001 ft
Injection pressure: 3,001 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft°)

1 2800 9.625 36.00 J-565 ST&C 2732 2800 8.796 1215.4
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) {psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor i

1 1192 1948 1.634 / 1763 3520 200 - 98 394 4.01J —

Preparéd Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: July 23,2007

Salt Lake City, Utah

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2732 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modIl

Casing Schematic

Surface
| TOC @ TOC
0. e

10-3/4" Surface
MW 84 500. MD
Frac 19.3 500. TVD

TOC

790. @

9-5/8" Intermediate
MW 8.4 2800. MD
Frac 19.3 2732. TVD

I
I
|
|
l
|
|
|
|
|
|
I
|
|
|
1
|
|
I
|
|
|
|
|

7" Production Liner
MW 8.6 5304. MD
4391. TVD



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.

State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drilt new wells, significantly despen exieting wells below current botiom-hale depih, reemafpuggodwolb orto
driil horizontat faterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. -

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

jnne— gy
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPEOFWELL

3. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oL wew [] GASWELL B/l OTHER Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR. 9. AP1 NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
™3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 0. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 So. Tennessee #200 ... McKinney srare IR 7 19069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTaces AT surrace: 2014.49' FEL ,692.77' FNL county: Carbon

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOwNsHIP, RaNGE, MEriDun: NWNE 17 138 7E STATE: uT

‘AH

11, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
B/ [ acoee O oesre [[] RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit in Dupicate) 1 atercasine [[] Fracture wear [7] swerrackToREPARWELL

] wewconsTrucTiON
[[] oreraToR cHance

Approximate date work will start [[] casnererar
[ crancetoerevious puans
] canceTuBme

[ onance weL nane

[ rrucanp asanpon
[ ruesack
D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)

o susssquenT RePorT
(Submit Original Form Only)

Date of work compietion.

7/20/2007

[[] cHANGEWELL STATUS
[ commincLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ]  RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE
[} recOMPLETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION

[ comverrwewL Tvee

{71 TemPORARILY ABANDON
[[] rueine rerar

[ vewrorrare

[[] warer oisposat

[[] warer sHuT-oFF

A omer Run Intermediate
Casing

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, efc.

Marion Energy, Inc. intends to run intermediate pipe to 3150° +/-.

S— b
nane (PLEASE priTy_Charlotte Parker me Secretary
— m@ (\ﬁ-H@Qsdﬁoﬂ owre 712012007
{%s space for State uee oniy) €D BY THE STATE
A%DFRS}’AH DIVISION OF
OlL, GAS, A D_MINING RECE|vs -
= A Pﬂ U /0,3:» L 2 5 200
'\(-\/“f\!’“ Ao P[Wul g e DIV.OF oiL. aa -~ -



2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modil

Well name:

Operator: Marion Energy Inc

Stringtype:  Intermediate Project ID:
43-007-31182

Location: Carbon Co.

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 107 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 600 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 1,140 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 1,435 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psi/ft Tension: Directional well information:
Calculated BHP 1,795 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 500 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 559 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 3 °/100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 44,97 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,391 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 2,677 ft Next setting BHP: 1,962 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 3,001 ft
Injection pressure: 3,001 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) () (ft) (in) (ft)

1 3150 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 3001 3150 8.796 1367.3
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1309 1948 1.487 1795 3520 1.96 o 108 394 365J
Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Date: July 23,2007

by: Div of Qil,Gas & Minerals

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE

Salt Lake City, Utah

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 3001 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is {biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



2006-10 Marion Alpine School District 3-17modIIT

Casing Schematic

7" Production Liner
MW 8.6 5304. MD
4391. TVD

Surface
| TOC @ TOC @
| 0. 24.
|
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10-3/4" \ Surface
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Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
[LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 19, 2007
|iG Kame w0 mmaen COUNTY {sTATE Joa no.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 20
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot Hes  foum Rot. ts FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
2542 | 13.5 | 111.5 276 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb l 20
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED 8Y
Drilling 12 1/4" hole @ 2542' / Directional work. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
JREMARKS KB TO Gi.
Circulating 45 visc. Mud at 550 gpm hole is cleaning w.INomandemaid_@gonoonnecﬁons. 15
‘ TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:30 1.50 |Pull out of hole for Directonal tool failure.
7:30 10:00 2.50 |Directional tool repairs
10:00 11:30 1.50 {Trip in hole to 1229' bridge off.
11:30 13:00 1.50 {wash and ream 8 joints down / Test MWD tool.
13:00 16:00 | 3.00 |[Tripin hole 22007 picked up kefly to wash out bridges at 1450’
16:00 | 16:30 | 0.50 |Washed down from 2200' fo 2266
16:30 6:00 13.50 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 12 1/4" hole from 2266’ to 2542' Skiding 20’ then rotating 10’/ kelly
RE eE’ VED
s 23 2007
24.00 Wirie
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
|oePTH 2267 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
TIME 8:00 50 Dapp SIZE 121/4
WEIGHT 8.6 3 pac-UL MFG STC
VIS 54 4 Pac-R TYPE 5619
WL 16.8 0 Poly+ JET 3/18 6/22
fevrve 12/14 1 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. IX3406
ImeT 1 aluminum Sterate  [DEPTH OUT 2542.4
CA 0 Maxgel DEPTH IN 530
GELS 5/12 0 Durage TOTAL FEET 2012
ALK .0/.4 12 Asphasol HRS 83.5
fpH 7 0 Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE 2 1 €325 WT. ON BIT 2K
CL 300 |DALLY COST $5,561.00 |rem 115 /50
DAPP 8.000 IerEVIOUS COST $73671.00  |ROP(fph) 24.0
9%SOLIDS 5 CUMULATIVE COST $79,232.00 AN VEL 115.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPYION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 12 1/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 1707 2.0/299.9
1 Mud Mtr 28.03 MODEL. 8P80 | 8PS0 1801 3.8/296.5
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 8.50 8.50 1896 4.7/289.4
1 Pony NMDC 9.90 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 1990 7/291.10
1 Slick NMDC 29.92 SPM 170 2083 9.3/290.5
1 Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 550.00 2177 11.3/289.1
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE 1410.0 2270 14.4/290.7
6 16 1/4" DC'S 183.37 ECD 2364 15.6/293.6
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 |sLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56 2459 17.0/292.80
1 6 3/4 HMJ jars 30.75 SLOW PUMP-PRES | 145 138
20  141/2" HWDP 644.09 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $44,630
[scrm 0 JprEViOUS cumM cosT $873,889
U:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 1218.45 JIN3ECTION RATE 0 JoumuATIvE wELL COST $918,520




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
L EASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD [pare
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 18, 2007
NAME AMD WUMBER COUNTY Jsvare DAY KO,
Unit Drilling p. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 19
Trotacoepts | Mot fosmRot ths |  FOOTAGE DRIMED  JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE sETe Report Ho.
2266’ 20 98 366' 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb l 19
SACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drilling 12 1/4" hole @ 2266' / Directional work. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
KB TO GL.
Cw‘ ing 45 visc. Mud at 550 gpm hole is cleaning gﬂ_leotorgu_emdmmmalg@_gonoonnechons l 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 6:30 0.50 [Rig Repairs mud pumps
6:30 | 16:30 | 10.00 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 12 1/4" hole from 1900" to 2110’ Sliding 20" then rotating 10'/ kelly
16:30 17:00 0.50 [Lubricate rig.
17:00 | 18:30 | 1.50 {Repiace Payson Depth Cable and Sensor on crown.
18:30 430 10.00 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 12 1/4” hole from 2210 to 2266" Sliding 20’ then rotating 10 / kelly
4:30 6:00 1.50 |[Pull out of hole for Directonal tool failure.
RECEiver
DIV-OF o1t-aas % WINNG
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loePH 2154 INo. oF sacks/es | propucT NAME | BIT NO. 4
TIME 20:00 50 Dapp SIZE 121/4
IWEIGHT 8.4 6 pac-UL MFG STC
VIS 52 6 Pac-R TYPE 5619
m 12.5 0 Poly+ JEY 3/18 6/22
levive 8/12 Fed744 SERIAL NO. JX3406
ImeT 2 aluminum Sterate [DEPTH OUT 2266
ICA 35 Maxgel DEPTH IN 530
GELS 4/11 100 Durage) TOTAL FEET 1736
ALK .0/.6 24 Asphasol HRS 70
pH 7.5 0 Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE 2 0 C325 WT. ON BIT 2K
la 500 |pany cosT $5,10500  |RPM 115 /50
{parp 9,500 IprEVIOUS COST $64,566.00  |ROP(fph) 32.4
9%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $73,671.00 AN VEL 165.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  {PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 12 1/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 1519 .20 / 244.6
1 Mud Mir 28.03 MODEL 8P80 | 8P8D 1613 0.4/331.6
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 8.50 8.50 1707 2.0/299.9
i Pony NMDC 9.90 JLINER S1ZE 6.25 | 6.25 1801 3.8/296.5
1 |Slick NMDC 29.92 |spm 170 1896 4.7/289.4
1 (Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 550.00 1990 7/291.10
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE 1410.0 2083 9.3/290.5
6 6 1/4" DC'S 183.37 ECD 2177 11,3/289.1
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 |sLow puMp- SPM 58 56
1 |63/4HMIjars 30.75  |sLowpump-PREs | 145 | 138
20 4 1/2" HWDP 644.09 AIR Driling Operations data Y WELL COST $61,511
Iscem 0 ferEVIOUS CuM COST $812,379 ‘
JusproDioDRiS YIS BHA 1218.45 |Ii3ECTION RATE 0 JcumuLaTive wewt cost $873,889 ‘




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
[LEASE WASIE & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak l July 17, 2007
|rsc mame am0 mumeer county Isvate |oar wo.
Unit Drilling 0. Rig 132 Carbon Utah | 18
ITOTAL DEPTY Rot. s foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE ORILLED ILAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET© Report No.
1900 1 54 610’ 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb | 18
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drilling 12 1/4" hole @ 1900’ / Directional work. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
JREMARKS KB TO GL
C'%‘ 45 visc. Mud at 550 gpm hole is cleaning good./ No torque and minimal drag on connections. I 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 6:00 24.00 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 12 1/4" hale from 1235' o 1900
| ol Y ot TP
TECCIVED
Div-OF UIL, GAS & MiNing—
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
IDEPTH 1642' Ino. oF sacks/iBs | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
TIME 5:00 180 Dapp SIZE 121/4
WEIGHT 8.6 6 pac-UL MFG STC
VIS 65 6 PacR TYPE S619
WL 8 2 Poly+ JET 3/13 6/18
levrye 12/18 Fed744 SERIAL NO. IX3406
[mBT 1 aluminum Sterate |DEPTH OUT 1900
CA 60 Maxge! DEPTH IN 530
GELS 7/16 201 Duragel TOTAL FEET 1370
ALK .0/.5 4 Asphasol  JHRS
IpH 7 10 Sawdust 1/B/G
CAKE 1/8 2 C325 WT. ON BIT 2K
CcL 400 |DALLY COST $12,28000  |rPM 115 / 50
loape 9.500 lprEVIOUS COST $52277.00  |ROP(fph) 26.0
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $64,566.00 AN VEL 165.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
i 12 14" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 1236' 1.20 / 79.5
1 Mud Mtr 28.03 MODEL 8P80 | 8P8D 1330 .90 / 94.6
1 Shock Sub 10.39 |STROKE 8.50 8.50 1424 .5/113.20
1 lpony NMDC 9,90 |Lanen s1zE 6.25 | 6.25 1519 .20 / 244.6
1 {Slick NMDC 29.92 {spm 170 1613 0.4/331.6
1 |GapSub 4.17 GPM 550.00 1707 2.0/299.9
i Slick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE 1320.0 1801 3.8/296.5
6 161/4"DCS 183.37 ECD
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 SLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56
1 ]63/4 HM] jars 30.75 isLow rump-PRES | 145 138
15 14 1/2" HWDP 459.81 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $53,570
|scrm » 0 JprREVIOUS CUM COST $758,809
{U\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 1034.17 |INGECTION RATE 0 JcumuLATIVE wELL COST $812.379




Marion Energy inc.
119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE WAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 16, 2007
Jrsc mase am> mumper counry IsTare oAy No.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 17
{rotaL DEPTH Rot s foum Rot. Hes FOOTAGE DRILLED HAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ HNo.
1200 | 1 | 54 55  |13-3/8" 46# STCK-55 a5 Rk | 17
IACTIVITY AT REFORT TIME REPORTED 8Y
Drilling 12 1/4" hole @ 1290' R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
JREMARKS ) KB TO GL.
Circulating 40 visc. Mud at 640 gpm hole is cleaning good. 15
TIME LOG n
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 16:30 | 10.50 |Rig Repairs f Work on # 1 Mud Pump drive assembly.
16:30 | 18:00 | 1.50 |Pull out of hole to change batteries in MWD tool
18:00 19:30 | -1.50 |Change batteries and orient tools
19:30 20:30 1.00 {Trip in hole Bridged off at 660° Break drc.
20:30 | 21:30 | 1.00 |Rig Repairs, Work on fiuid end of #1 pump.
21:30 22:30 | 1.00 |Test Directional Tools, Circulate and condition mud
22:30 0:00 1.50 [Wash and Ream fron 660 to 700’
0:00 | 0:30 | 0.50 [Tripin hole to 1065
0:30 3:30 3.00 |[Pack off / Loose retumns / Circulate and condition mud, build volume.
3:30 5.00 1.50 [Wash and ream from 1065’ to 1235
5:00 | 6:00 | 1.00 |[Driling 12 1/4" hole from 1235 to 1270' RECCH -~
hillalaanh =4~ B\ 4 g W
UL 25 2067
' y NNz
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 1235 Ino. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 4
'TIME 12:00 Dapp SIZE 121/4
[WEIGHT 8.4 Fed-Zan MFG STC
VIS 36 Super Sweep  ITYPE S619
WL 24.8 Myacide IET 3/13 6/18
evrve 5/2 Fed744 SERTAL NO. IX3406
jmBT Baracat {perTH OUT 1235
CA 60 Maxge DEPTH IN 530
GELS 1/3 100 Duragel TOTAL FEET 695
ALK .0/.4 Asphasol {HRS 26
feH 7 Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE 2 WT. ON BIT 2K
CL 300 |DALLY COST $1,831.00 jroM 115 /50
|pase 2.000 IerEVIOUS COST $50,446.00  |ROP(fph) 26.0
[96SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $52,277 00 AN VEL 165.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT _ [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth’
i 121/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 653 .40 / 276.80
1 Mud Mir 28.03 {MODEL 8P80 | 8P8Q 746 .20 [ 309.60
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 850 | 850 839 0 /334.9
1 |Pony NMDC 9.90 |LINER S1ZE 6.25 | 6.25 959' .1/33.10
1 |Slick NMDC 29.92 |spm 170 1051 4/49.7
1 Gap Sub 4.17 IGPM 550.00 1143 .7 ] 65.10
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 |SURF PRESSURE 1320.0
6 lei/aDCS 183.37  jeco
9  l41/2" HWDP 246.20  |sLow pume-spM 58 56
1 6 3/4 HMJ jars 30.75 SLOW PUMP-PRES | 145 138
15  |41/2" HWDP 459.81 AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $68,325
jscem 0 JpreEvIOUS CuM COST $690,484
U:\PROD\DDRLS.XLS BHA 1034.17 JINJECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $758,809




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE WAME & WELL %0 rm.n DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 15, 2007
|R1c mame o mumBER boounTY JsTare DAY 4O,
Unit Drilling p. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 16
{TOTAL DEPTH Rot trs  fcum Rot. Hhs FOOTAGE DREULED JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
1235 2 53 34 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb l 16
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME ’ REPORTED BY
Rig Repairs /Working on Input shaft and bearing assembly for #1 pump  {R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
FREMARKS KB TO GL.
Dumped and cleaned mud tanks / Buiit 600 bbis Mud. 15
TIME LOG :
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 8:00 2.00 |Drilling 12 1/4" Hole from 1201 to 1235
8:00 11:00 | 3.00 |Pull out of hole to shoe. (Hole in good condition very little overpull on trip).
11:00 | 6:00 | 19.00 {Rig Repairs / Repiace pillar block bearings on #1 mud pump drive shaft
Dump and dean Mud tanks / Mix up 600 bbls of mud.
IS e
NLCVEIVED
W5 —|
DIVOF OLL, GAS & Minyve-
24.00 |Reserve pit full of solids / Maybe 1000 bbis of fluid in pit wit 1 ft of freeboard.
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
|DEPTH 1235 INO. OF sacks/1LBs | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
[TIME 10:00 50 Dapp SIZE 121/4
WEIGHT 8.5 80 Fed-Zan IMFG STC
VIS 42 0 Super Sweep  [TYPE 5619
jw 8.6 2 Myacide JET 3/136/18
levrve 14/12 0 Fed744 |seriAL NO. JX3406
ImsT 0 Baracat DEPTH OUT 1235
lea 220 Maxgel DEPTH IN 530
GELS 2/4 120 Duragel TOTAL FEET 695
ALK 0/.3 50 Asphasol HRS 26
jpH 7 45 Sawdust T/B/G
LCAXE 2 'WT. ON BIT 2K
cL 200 |pARLY COST $26,680.00  [reMm 115 / 50
DAPP 5.600 IPREVIOUS COST $23757.00  |ROP{fph) 26.0
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST $50,446.00 AN VEL 165.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT__{PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 12 1/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 653 .40 / 276.80
1 Mud Mtr 28.03 HMODEL 8P80 | 8P8O 746 .20 / 305.60
1 Shock Sub 10.39 {STROKE 8.50 8.50 839 0 /334.9
1 |pony NMDC 9,90 JLiner s126 6.25 | 6.25 959' .1/33.10
1 |Slick NMDC 29.92 |sem 120 | 120 1051 .4/49.7
1 Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 406.00| 406.00 1143 .7 / 65.10
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 |SURE PRESSURE 1760.0} 1760.0
6 [|61/4"DCS 183.37  |eco
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 SLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56
1 6 3/4 HMJ jars 30.75 {sLow puMp-PRES | 145 138
15 {4 1/2" HWDP 459.81 AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $22,289
|scrm 0 JPREVIOUS CuM COST $668, 195 ‘
JuAPRODADDRLG. S BHA 1034.17 |mecTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST 484




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE WAME & WELL NO. FIELD {oaTe
Alpine Schootl District 3-17 Clear Creak July 14, 2007
Jric name anp mmBER county JsTare foar no.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 15
ITOTAL DEPTY Rot. ths  fcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRELLED JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE No.
1200 | 13 | 51| 398  |13-3/8" 46# STCK-55 Tass R | 15
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drilling 12 1/4" hole @ 1201 R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
KB TO GL
lmudupmddeanﬂolewhila{)rillmm1109‘m1201' I 15
TIME LOG -
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail -
6:00 8:30 2.50 {Drilling 12 1/4" Hole from 803" to 926'
8:30 9:00 | 0.50 |Lubricate Rig
9:00 10:00 1.00 _|Drilling 12 1/4" Hole from 926" to 887
10:00 | 10:30 | 0.50 |Rig Repairs Fix #2 Mud pump — —
10:30 | 14:30 | 4.00 |Drilling 12 1/4" Hole from 987" to 1099’ RECEIVEr
14:30 | 16:00 | 1.50 |circulate and condition Hole, flow line Plugging off. T
16:00 17:00 1.00 1Drilling 12 1/4” Hole from 1099’ to 1109 JU‘ 2 5 299; ‘
17:00 19:00 § 2.00 |pull out of Hole to change Nozzles in Bit.
19:00 | 20:00 | 1.00 |change Jets in Bit to x22 and 3x18. DIV OF
20:00 | 22:00 | 2.00 [Trip in Hole, Lay Down 6 Joints ) AN
22:00 1:00 3.00 {wash Down 6. Joints
1:00 6:00 5.00 Drilﬁng121/4"Hoiefmm1109‘To1201,mudupahdoirou!at9HoledeanMﬁleDrﬂ!ing
24.00
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
JDEPTH 1100 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 4
s 10:00 52 Dapp SIZE 12 1/4
wesGHT 8.35 4 Fed-Zan IMFc STC
s 27 3 Super Sweep  |TYPE S619
j 2 Myackde JET 3/13 6/18
levre 1 Fed744 SERIAL NO. IX3406
{msT s Baracat |oepTH ouT 1201
Jca 30 Maxgel DEPTH IN 530
leais 70 Durage! TOTAL FEET 671
ALK .0/.3 Cotton Seed Hulls |HRS 24
Exg 7 Sawdust T/B/G
WY, ON BIT 2K
cL 200 |DALLY COST $4,501.00 |rPM 28
DAPP 9.500 [PREVIOUS COST $19.25600  |ROP(fph) 24.8
9%S0LIDS CUMULATIVE COST $23,757.00 AN VEL 165.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
No. | pESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT _ |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 j121/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat | Nat 653 .40 / 276.80
1 Mud Mtr 28.03 {MODEL 8P80 | 8P80 746 .20 / 309.60
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 8.50 8.50 839' 0 /334.9
i Pory NMDC 9.90 LIMER SIZE 6.25 6.25 959 .1/33.10
i Slick NMDC 29.92 ispM ] 120 120 1051 4/49.7
1 Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 406.00 | 406.00 1143 .7 ] 65.10
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 |SURF PRESSURE 1760.0] 1760.0
6 |61/4°DCS 183.37  |eco
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 |SLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56
1 |63/4HMjars 30.75 {sLowpump-pRes | 145 138
15 j41/2" HWDP 459.81 . AIR Driliing Operations data Y WELL COST $43,681
{scrm 0 JPREVIOUS CUM COST $624,513
JU\PROD\DDRLG. XS BHA 1034.17 |xnseCTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $668,195




Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

119 S Tennessee, Ste

McKinney, Texas 75069 AUG 07 2007
A7 - DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV. OF QL.
u':AssmuEOa(Eo 5\ L@g-' FIELD DATE GAS4 MiNING—
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 20, 2007
JRIG NAME AMD HUMBER _ county lsvare Joay xo.
Unit Drilling D. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 21
[TOTAL DEPTYH Rot #¥s  fcum Rot #rs FOOTAGE DRRLED [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report Mo,
2833 10 | 121.5 287 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb I 21
[ACTIVITY AY REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Washing & Reaming C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KB 7O GL.
Bit # 4/ 2-4-CT-S/ Washing & Reaming Bridges A 15
TIME LOG !
FROM 70 | HOURS Activity Detail . '
6:00 8:30 2.50 |{Drill Actual & Directional Drilling/ 2546'-261 1 -
8:30 9:00 | 0.50 |Rig Service
9:00 16:30 7.50 |Drill Actual & Directional Driling/ 2611'-2831"/ Minimal Build on Slides
16:30 | 17:30 | 1.00 |Condition Hole & Circulate/ Pump Back To Back Sweeps & Prepare To TOOH/ Slides Are Only Gaining
Minimal Build Rates/ TOOH To Inspect Directional Tools, Mud Mtr, & Bit
17:30 19:30 2.00 |Set Kelly Back & TOOH
19:30 23:30 4,00 |Lay Down 8" NMDC!/ Break Bit & Lay Down Mud Mtr/ Make Up Bit & Mud Mtr
23:30 0:00 0.50 {Scribe Directional Tools
0:00 2:00 2.00 |TiH Wi Bit #5
2:00 3:00 1.00 ({install Rotating Head Rubber/ Set Back One Stand DP/ P/U Kelly & Break Circulation
3:00 | 4:30 | 1.50 |Washing & Reaming/ 12011338
4:30 5:00 0.50 {Set Kelly Back & TiH W/ Bit #5
5:00 | 6:00 | 1.00 |Washing & Reaming/1914'-1955'
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 2833 INo. oF sacks/ies | ProDUCT NAME | BIT NO. 4 5
TIME 20:00 90 Dapp 1SIZE 121/4 121/4
WEIGHT 9.3 5 pac-UL MFG STC Security
VIS 45 6 PacR TYPE 5619 X5185
WL 13.6 0 Poly+ JET 3/18 6/22 Open
PV/YP 10/12 2 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. JIX3406 10845970
ImsT 1 atuminum Sterate |DEPTH OUT 2833
[CA 2 Myackie IDEPTH IN 530 2833
GEIS . 4/10 0 Duragel YOTAL FEET 2303
ALK 0.0/0.5 12 Asphasol jHRS 93.5 0.00
lpH 7 0 Sawdust T/8/G
CAKE 2 0 325 'WT. ON BIT 2K 5-8K
cL 400 |parLY cosT $6,484.00 {RPM 115 /50 - 115/50
DAPP 9,500 lprevious cost $79232.00  [ROP{fph) 24.0
9%SOLIDS 6 CUMULATIVE COST $85,716.00 AN VEL 115.0 115
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA ] DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 12 14" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 2553 19.5/293.4
1 Mud Mtr 28.17 MODEL 8P80 | 8P8O 2647 22,7291
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 8.50 8.50 2741 23.10/289.90
1 Pony NMDC ' 9.90 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Slick NMDC 29,92 |spM 1720
1 Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 550.00
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE 1410.0
6 |6 1/4° DCS 183.37 ECD
9 4 1/2" HNDP 246.20 |sLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56
1 |6 3/4 HM jars 30.75 |scowpump-pres | 145 | 138
20 [41/2" HNDP 644.09 AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $53,807
Iscrm 0 JPREVIOUS CUM COST $918,520
U\PRODADDRLG.XLS BHA 1218.59 |tIECTION RATE 0 JouMULATIVE WELL COST $972,327




Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 AUG 07 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING
LEASE MAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 21, 2007
G ANE AND MUMBER loouwty JsTate Joay xo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah | 22
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. s foum Rot Hs FOOTAGE DRILLED HAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
3105 | 20.5 | 142 272 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485 Rkb I 22
JACTIVIYY AT REFORT TIME . REPCRTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
{REMARKS. KB TO GL.
Drill Actual & Directional Drilli l 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 | 6:30 | 0.50 |Washing & Reaming 1955-1986'
6:30 7:00 0.50 |TIH/ 1986'-2600'
700 | 9:00 | 2.00 |Washing & Reaming/ 2600*-2833'
9:00 16:00 7.00 {Drill Actual & Directional Drilling/ Rot 2833‘-2838'/Sliding 2838"-2856'/Rot 2856'-2876'/Sliding 2876'-2882
Rot 2882'-2892'/Sliding 2802'-2912'Rot 2912'-2926'
16:00 | 16:30 | 0.50 |[Rig Service
16:30 6:00 13.50 |Drill Actual & Directional Drilliing/ Sliding 2926'-2941"/ Rot 2941'-2958'/Sliding 2958'-2975'1
Rot 2975"-2000' Slidinl2990‘-3005‘l Rot 3005'-3022/ Sliding 3022'-3037"/ Rot 3037'-3054'
Sliding 3054'-3072 Rot 3072' 30857 Shding 3085'-3105'
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 2851 INO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 5
[TIME 10:00 12 Dapp SIZE 121/4
WETGHT 9.1 4 pac-UL MFG Security
VIS 42 4 Pac-R TYPE X5185
Wi, 12.8 0 Poly+ JET Open
PV/YP 8/i2 2 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10845970
ImeT 1 aluminum Sterate |DEPTH OUT 3105
CA 10 2 Myacide {DEPTH IN 2833
GELS 4111 30 Duragel TOTAL FEET 272
ALK . 0.0/0.4 12 Asphasol [HRS 20.5
loH 7 0 Sawdust T/B/G
CAKE 2 0 325 WT. ON BIT 40-45K
CL 300 DAILY COST $5,182.00 |rPM: 115/50
DAPP 11.000 |pREVIOUS COST 48571600  |ROP(fph) 13.6
%SOLIDS 5 CUMULATIVE COST $90,898.00 AN VEL 120.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
i 12 1/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 2836 24.1/289.1
1 Mud Mor 28.17 MODEL 8PS0 | 8P80 2932 27.5/292.1
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 8.50 8.50 3027 28.8/294.31
1 jPony NMODC 9.90. LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Slick NMDC 29,92 SPM 170
1 |GapSub 4.17 GPM 550,00
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE 1410.0
6 |61/4"DCS 183.37 ECD
9 4 1/2" HWDP 246.20 SLOW PUMP- SPM 58 56
1 3/4 HM] jars 30.75 SLOW PUMP-PRES | 145 138
206 [41/2" HANDP 644.09 AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $43,369
SCFM 0 JprREVIOUS CuM COST $972,327
U:APROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 1218.59 |INIECTION RATE 0 JeumuLATIVE WELL COST $1,015,69




Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 AUG 07 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
LEASE NAME & WELL NO, FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 22, 2007
IrsG name a0 mumBER cousry Jstate Y ¥O.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 23
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. ths  foum Rot. Hrs | FOOTAGE DRILLED [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
3179 3 145 75 13-3/8" 46# STC K-55 485' Rkb I 23
[ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Running 9-5/8" Casing C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
[REMARS. KB TO GL
Hit Bri 659 Galided 2-Pins & 1 Box Running Casing 15
TIME LOG
moM | TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 9.00 3.00 {Drilt Actual & Directional Drilling/ Rot 31 05'-3117" Sliding 31 173147/ Rot 31473150
9:00 10:00 1.00 jCondition Mud & Circulate Well Bore Clean
10:00 10:30 0.50 |Rig Sevice
10:30 12:00 1.50 |TOOH For Wiper Trip/ Hole 30' Off Hole Depth Corrected To 3179
12:00 | 13:00 | 1.00 [TiH FOR Wiper Trip
13:00 13:30 | 0.50 [Wash & Ream 90" To Btm/ 3089-317¢'
13:30 14:30 1.00 |{Condition Hole & Circulate
14:30 18:00 3.50 {TOOH To Run Intenmediate Casing
18:00 19:30 { 1.50 [Lay Down 8" Directional Tools, Bit & Mud Mir
19:30 | 21:00 | 1.50 |Rig Up Casing Crew & Hole Safety Meeting With Rig Personnel & Casing Crew
21:00 22:00 1.00 |Run $-5/8" LTC 36# J-55 Casing
22:00 22:30 0.50 |Fill Casing
22:30 | 23:00 | 0.50 |Run 9-5/8" LTC 36# J-55 Casing/ Hit Bridge @ 659"
23:00 0:00 1.00 |Break Circulation/ Lay Down 1-t Casing/ Threads Gallded/ MU Another 3t Gallded Box & Pin
0:00 3:00 3.00 |Circulate Casing & Wait On Weider & Rig Up Welder
3:00 6:00 3.00 |weld Bad Connection On Casing/ TIH With 9-5/8" LTC 36# Casing _
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 3150 Ino. oF sacks/ies | PrODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 5
ITIME 16:00 26 ' Dapp |SIZE 121/4
WEIGHT 9.4 4 pac-UL MFG Security
VIS 42 4 Pac-R TYPE %5185
Wi 10.6 0 Poly+ JET Open
PV/YP 8/12 1 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10845970
MBT i aluminum Sterate |DEPTH OUT 3179
CA Trace i Myacide DEPTH IN 2833
GELS 412 9 Duragel TOTAL FEET 346
ALK 0.0/0.35 12 Asphasol {HRS 20.5
pH 7 3 Max Gel T/B/G
CAKE 2 0 C325 'WT. ON BIT 40-45K
CcL 400 DAILY COST $4,389.00 |rReM 115/50
DAPP 12.000 |prEVIOUS COST $00,298.00  |ROP(fph) 13.6
%SOLIDS 6 . CUMULATIVE COST $95,287.00 AN VEL 120.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH _ INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 12 14 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 3090 31.10/296.4
1 Mud Mtr 28.17 MODEL 8P80 8P80 Project Bit/3179 34.5/297
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 850 | 8.50
1 Pony NMDC 9.90 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25
1 Slick NMDC 29,92 SPM 170
1 Gap Sub - 417 GPM 550.00
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 |SURF PRESSURE 1410.0
6 6 1/4" DC'S 183.37 ECD
9 4 1/2° HWDP 246.20 |sLow pump- SPM 57 56
1 |6 3/4 HM] jars 30.75  |sLowPump-PRES | 260 | 255 ,
20 [41/2° HWDP 644.09 AIR Driiling Operations data Y WELL COST $42,171
SCFM 0 JPREVIOUS CUM COST $1,015,696
U:\PRODADDRLG.AS BHA 1218.59 jinaecTION RATE 0 JcumuLATIVE WELL coST $1,057,867




Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED
11'2 S Ten_?essee_; 5&‘8:3
McKinney, Texas 75069 AUG 07 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT NIV AE Al AAC o MNNG"
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD e D'AT‘E' ViE MR
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 23, 2007
|nsG nase amp Mumeer fcounTy lsrare Joay wo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 24
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. #rs  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Repart No.
3179 3 145 75' 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 485' Rkb 24
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
TIH W/ Singles To Tag Float Collar C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
{REMARRS KB TO GL.
Cmt 72 Jts LTC 36# 9-5/8" J-55 W/ 425sks 11ppg Lead & 270sks 15.8ppg Tail 1931.5 Cubic Ft Total I i5
TIME LOG N
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 6:30 0.50 |Rung-7/8"Casing
6:30 10:45 | 4.25 |Run Casing/Circulate Bims Up 2428 Weld Joints Of Casing @ 2428'&2514'
10:45 12:00 1.25 {Run Casing & Land Out Intermediate/ Ran 72 Jis LTC 36# 9-5/8" J-55 Casing/ Set @ 3142
12:00 13:00 1.00 |Establish Retums/ Rig Down Casing Crew/ Move Pipe Racks
13:00 15:30 2.50 |Rig Up Cementers & Water Trucks/ Held Safety With All Personnel Involved in Cementing Job
15:30 18:00 | 2.50 |lLead Slurry 425sks 3.82 yeild11ppg 28Sbbls/Tail Slurry 270sks 1.15yeild15.8ppgbSbbls/ Shoe @) 3142
18:00 6.50 |WOC/ Rig Down Cementers/ Run Pack Off Assembly On Well Head Test @ 2000psi/ TIH W/ 6° DC'S
0:30 Lay Down 6* DC'S/ Slip & Cut 110 Drilling Line/ Haul Pipe Tub Off Location & Haul Full Tub On Loc.
0:30 2:30 | 2.00 |PU Directional Tools/ Scribe Directional Tools
2:30 4:30 2.00 TIH/ Instali Rotating Head Rubber/ TIH
4:30 6:00 1.50 |PU/ 3- Singles/ Kelly Up @ 3072’
24.00
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 3150 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 6
[TIME 16:00 26 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 9.4 4 pac-Ut. MFG Security
VIS 42 4 Pac-R TYPE
Wi, 10.6 0 Poly+ JEY 7-16
PV/YP 8/12 1 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10964161
MBT 1 aluminum Sterate |DEPTH QUT
CA Trace 1 Myacide DEPTH IN 3179
GELS 4/12 9 Duragel TOTAL FEET 0
ALK 0.0/0.35 12 Asphasol HRS 0
lpH 7 3 Max Ge T/B/G
CAKE 2 0 C325 WT. ON BIT 0
= 400 {paRLY cost $0.00 Jrem ' 0
DAPP 12.000 |previous cosT $95287.00  |ROP(fph) 0.0
%SOLIDS 6 [CUMULATIVE COST $95,287.00 AN VEL 0.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 [121/4" 1.50 MAKE Nat Nat 3090 31.10/296.4
1 Mud Mtr 28.17 MODEL 8P80 | 8P8O Project Bit/3179 34.5/297
1 Shock Sub 10.39 STROKE 8.50 | 850
1 Pony NMDC 9.90 LINER S1ZE 6.25 6.25
i Slick NMDC 29.92 SPM 120
1 Gap Sub 4.17 GPM 400.00
1 Slick NMDC 30.13 SURF PRESSURE 1000.0
6 6 1/4" DC'S 183.37 ECD
9 4 1/2" HVDP 246.20 {SLOW PUMP- SPM 57 56
1 |63/4HMIjars 30.75 |sLowpump-prEs | 260 | 255
20 14 1/2" HWDP 644.09 AIR Drilling Operations data AILY WELL QOST $127,861
{scrm 0  Jprevious cum cosT $1,057,867
U:\PRODVDORLGXS  BHA 1218.59 [araEcTION RATE [ Josmuiarve weiL cost $1,185,728




Marion Energy inc.

RECEIVED

119 S Tennessee, Ste AUG 07 2007
McKinney, Texas 75069
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 24, 2007
{RIG KAME AND NUMBER county Jsvare Joar no.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah { 25
TOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs  foum Rot. Hss FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
3798 | 19.5 | 164.5 621’ 9-5/8" 36# LTC 3}-55 485' Rkb I 25
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED 8Y
Drill Actual & Directional Drilling C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
IREMARKS KB TO GL.
Drilled Float Equipment/ Drill Actual/ Dir Drifling 15
TIME LOG -
FROM 7O HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:30 1.50 |Drill Out Float Collar & Shoe
7:30 9:00 1.50 |Drit Cemet 3142 To 3229
9:00 10:30 1.50 |Drill Actual 3179 Sliding 3229 To3249 Rotating 3249 To 3260 Skding 3260703280
10:30 | 11:30 | 1.00 |Drili Actual3280 T03292 Sliding 3292 To3312 Rotaing 3312703323
11:30 12:30 1.00 |Drill Actual Sliding 3323To 3339 Rotaing 3339To3355 Sliding 3355T03370
12:30 14:00 1.50 |Drill Actual Rotaing 3370 To 3387 Sliding 3387 To 3405 Rotaing 3405T03418
14:00 15:30 | 1.50 {Drill Actual Sliding3418 To 3438 Rotaing 3438 T03450 Siiding T0o3470
15;30 17:00 | 1.50 |Drill Actual Rotaing3470 To 3481 Sliding 3481 To 3501 Rotaing 3501 To 3513
17:00 18:00 1.00 iDrill Actual Sliding 3513 To 3544
18:00 Drill Actual Sliding 3544 To 3565 Rotaing 3565 To3576 Sliding3576 To3596 Rotaing3596T03607
Sliding 3607 T03627 Rotaing 3627 TO3639 Slilding To 3665 Rotaing 3665 To 3670
Sliding 3670-3635 Rot. 3695-3702 S1..3702-3722 Rot,3722-3734
6:00 12.00 Sliding 3734-3754 Rot.3754-3766 Sliding 3766-3786 Rot.3786-3798
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
loerTH 3649 INo. OF sacks/LBs | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 6
[TIME 21:00 12/5XS. Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
[WEIGHT 9.3 6Gsks pac-UL MFG Security
VIS 3540 65xs. Pac-R TYPE
wL 11.8 0 Poly+ JET 7-16
{ev/yp 4/6 1 sxs. Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10964161
|meT 10% 15/gal. k-600 DEPTH OUT 3798
ICA Trace 1bkt. Myacide DEPTH IN 3179
GELS 2/5 15 sixs. Duragel TOTAL FEET 621
ALK .15/.4 8 sxs. Asphasol {HRS 19.5
JpH 8.5 11sxs. Max Gel T/B/G
CAKE 2/32 15/gal. €325 WT. ON BIT 4-8K
CL 300 DAILY COST $5,740.00 jrReM 50
{pare 8.5#/B8l |prEVIOUS COST $95287.00  |ROP(fph) 31.8
%SOLIDS TR. CUMULATIVE COST $101,027.00 AN VEL 230.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
»0. | DESCrRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 3184 32.8/298.4
1 Mud Mt 23.23 MODEL 8P80 8P80 3279 34.5/297
1 Pony NMDC 9.60 |STROKE 8.50 8.50 3469 39.8/296.9
i Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 3563 44.4/299.2
1 Gap Sub 5.24 SPM 120 3658 41.4/298.20
i Flex NMDC 28.10 GPM 406.00
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 SURF PRESSURE 1000.0
1 Jars 28.34 £CD
20 4 1/2" HWDP 644.09 SLOW PUMP- SPM 57 51
|SLOW PUMP-PRES | 340 290
AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $55,390
SCFM 0 |PrREVIOUS CUM COST $1,185,728
U:\PROD\DORLG.XLS BHA 1047.03 INJECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $1,241,118




Marion Energy inc.

RECEIVED

119 S Tennessee, Ste AUG 07 2007
McKinney, Texas 75069
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE MAME & WELL NO, FELD |pare
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 25, 2007
[Ric wase AnD NUMBER LCoUNTY {stare {oar xo.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 26
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. ts  foum Rot. Hrs FOCTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
4227 | 19.5 | 185.5 429 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 485' Rkb l 26
ACTIVETY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
TOOH For Bit #6 C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
REMARKS KB TO GL.
15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 Drill Actual & Directional Drilling/Sliding 3798'-381 8'/Rot 3818'-3830/Sliding 3830"-3835'/Rot 3835'-3838"
10:30 | 4.50 [Sliding 3838'-3858"
10:30 15:30 5.00 {Drill Actual/ 3856'-4016
15:30 16:00 | 0.50 {Rig Service
16:00 18:00 2.00 |Drill Actual/ 4016'-4060'
18:00 2:00 8.00 {Dnll Actual 4060 To 4174/ SL.4174' To 4178/ Rot. 4178 To 4226
2:00 3:00 1.00 {Pump Sweeps Circulate Hole Clean
3:00 6:00 3.00 {Trip Out Hole / Bit #6
24;00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 3830 INO. OF sacks/LBs | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 6
TIME 7:00 8 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 9.2 1 pac-UL IMFG Security
VIS 34 2 Pac-R TYPE
WL 12.6 8 Poly+ JET 7-16
PV/YP 4/5 5 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10964161
MBT 10 Saw Dust DEPTH OUT 4227
CA Trace 1 Myackle DEPTH IN 3179
GELS 2/3 6 Duragel TOTAL FEET 1058
ALK 0.0/0.6 9 Asphasol HRS 39.5
pH 7 3 Max Gel T/B/G
CAKE 2/32 1 C325 WT. ON BIT 4-8K
CcL 400 DAILY COST $5,159.00 |RPM 50
DAPP 6.0/1bs/bbl |PREVIOUS COST $101,027.00 ROP(fph) 26.8
%SOLIDS 5 CUMULATIVE COST $106,186.00 AN VEL 230.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 3754 46.5/299.3
1 Mud Mtr 23.23 MODEL 8PS0 8P80 3848 49.80/295.80
1 Pony NMDC 9.60 {STROKE 8.50 8.50 3942 50.10/299.80
1 Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4036 51.80/299
1 Gap Sub 5.24 SPM 120 4130 53.10/298.70
1 Flex NMDC 28.10 GPM 406.00
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 SURF PRESSURE 1000.0
i Jars 28.34 ECD
20  [41/2° HWDP 644.09 SLOW PUMP- SPM 56 51
SLOW PUMP- PRES 294 258
AIR Drilling Operations data DAILY WELL COST $51,375
SCFM 0 JprEVIOUS cuM cosT $1,241,118
U:\PRODADDRLG.XLS BHA 1047.03 INJECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $1,292 493




Marion Energy inc. RECEIVED

Mickinney, Texas 75060 AUG 07 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
NAME 3 WELL RO. FIELD DATE
rAﬂEine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 26, 2007
Jric name ano masser county Jsare DAY HO.,
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah | 27
{YOTAL DEPTH Rot Hrs  foum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRELLED HAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SETO© Report No.
4425’ 15 | 200.5 198 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 3142' Rkb l 27
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drill Actual C.E. Crow/ R.M. Crow
KB TO GL.
Fun. Test BOP'S/ inspect Well Head 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 7:00 1.00 {Trip Out W/ Bit #6
7,00 7:30 0.50 |[Func TestB.O.P,
7:30 8:00 0.50 {Make Bit Up To Mud Motor
8:00 8:30 0.50 }Insp. Well Head
8:30 8:30 0.50 iChange Out Dir. Tools
8:30_ | 9:30 | 0.50 |Rig Service
9:30 13:00 3.50 |[Trip In Hole W/ Bit #7
13:00 14:00 1.00 |Envromemtal/ Wait On Lighting Storm To Pass
14:00 14:30 0.50 |Trip In Hole
14:30 | 15:00 | 0.50 |Reaming 60 Feet To Bottom
15:00 18:00 3.00 |Drill Actual 4226 To 4269
18:00 12.00 |Drilt Actual SL. 4269 To 4286 Rot. 4286 -43;31 / SL.4331 To 4351 / Rot. 4351 To 4361
6:00 Drill Actual 4361 To 4393/ SL. 4393 To 4403/ Rot 4403 To 4424
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
|oer 4300 [No. oF sacksyss | propucT name | BT NO. 7
TIME 8,00 PM 24 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
waGHT 9.3 6 pac-UL MFG Security
VIS 40/41 6 Pac-R TYPE XS20S
L 8.6 2 Poly+ JET Open
levrve 9/11 2 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10714761
[meT 1 c-325 DEPTH OUT 4424
fea Trace 2 Myacide DEPTH IN 4226
laEs 2/3 24 Durage) TOTAL FEET 198
ALK 0.0/0.6 16 Asphasol HRS 15
7 8 Max Gel T/B/G
%{ 2/32 1 €325 WT. ON BIT 25/42 k
la 600 DAILY COST $7,059.00  |RPM 50/5
lpare 12,0/lbs/bbl PREVIOUS COST $101,027.00  |ROP(fph) 13.2
SOLIDS 5 CUMULATIVE COST $108,086.00  JAN VEL 230.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT _|PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
1 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 3754 46.5/299.3
1 Mud Mtr 23.23 MODEL 8P80 8P80 3848 49.80/299.80
1 Pony NMDC 9.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 3942 50.10/299.80
1 Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4036 51.80/299
1 Gap Sub 5.24 SPM 120 4130 53.10/298.70
1 Flex NMDC 29.95 GPM 406.00 4225 53.9/298.4
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 SURF PRESSURE 1000.0
1  Jars 28.34 ECD
20 141/2" HNDP 644.09 SLOW PUMP- SPM 57 51
|stow pusr-pRES | 329 258
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $64,008
|scrm 0 JerEVIOUS CUM COST $1,292,493
APRODDDRLS. LS BHA 1048.88 {1n3ECTION RATE 0 JOUMULATIVE WELL COST $1,356,501




Marion Energy inc.

119 S Tennessee, Ste

RECEIVED
AUG 07 2007

McKinney, Texas 75069
DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 27, 2007
{R1G WAE AND mUMBER oouNTY IsTare DAY NO.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 28
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  fcum Rot. Hes FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Reaport No.
4582' 14 | 2145 157 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 3142' Rkb l 28
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Trip in Hole @ 1895 R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
REMARKS KB TO GL.
Trip out for directional tool failure, change bit and mud motor l 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 | 16:00 | 10.00 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 4424’ to 4519'
16:00 | 16:30 | 0.50 |Lubricate Rig
16:30 20:30 4.00 |Dritling and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 4519 to 4582’
20:30 | 21:30 | 1.00 |[Circulate bottoms up Build pill / Pump pill
21:30 4:00 6.50 {Pull out of hole for Directional tool Failure / change out Bit, Motor and repair tools.
4:00 6:00 2.00 |Trip in hole.
24,00
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
{DEPTH 4460' NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 7 8
TIME 9:00 R Dapp SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 9.3 8 pac-UL MFG Security Security
VIS 41 8 Pac-R TYPE XS20S XS258
Wi 10 2 Poly-+ JET Open 3x22
pv/Yp 10/12 2 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10714761 10725340
imBT 12.50% 0 c-325 DEPTH OUT 4582
ICA Trace 1 Myacide DEPTH N 4226 4582
GELS 2/5 30 Durage) TOTAL FEET 356
ALK 0.0/0.6 12 Asphasol HRS 29
JoH 7 10 Max Gel T/B/G 48,bt,g.e. 2,10 if
CAKE 2/32 0 325 WT. ON BIT 42 To 50k
CcL 500 DALLY COST $6,087.00 jrPM 117/65
|parp 14.000 PREVIOUS COST $108,086.00  |ROP(fph) 12.3
%SOLIDS 5 CUMULATIVE COST $114,173.00 AN VEL 180.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT __{PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azxmuth
1 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 3754 46.5/299.3
i Mud Mtr 23.23 MODEL 8P80 | 8P80 3848 49,80/299.80
i Pony NMDC 9.60 |STROKE 8.50 8.50 3942 50.10/295.80
i Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4036 51.80/299
1 Gap Sub 5.24 SPM 129 4130 53.10/298.70
1 Flex NMDC 29.95 GPM 415.00 4225 53.9/298.4
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 SURF PRESSURE 1225.0 4317 52.80/297.8
1 Jars 28.34 ECD 9.5 4412 51.40/297
20 4 1/2° HWDP 644.09 SLOW PUMP- SPM 57 51 4506 49.90/296.5
SLOW PUMP- PRES 329 258
AIR Drilling Operations data AILY WELL COST $86,227
|scrm 0 JpreEvIOUs cum cosT $1,356,501
fu:\prODVDORIG S BHA 1048.88 |1noECTION RATE 0 JcumuLATIvE WELL COST $1,442,727




Marion Energy inc.

RECEIVED

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 AUG 07 2007
DIV oF o
DAILY DRILLING REPORT L GAS & Mining
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 28, 2007
|RIG NAME AND NUMBER ICOUNTY lSTATE DAY NO.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 29
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. s fcum Rot. ts FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
4848 15 | 229.5 266' 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 3142' Rkb l 29
ACTIVIYY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Pull out of hole for Mud motor failure. R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
REMARES KB TO GL.
Cg‘ delivered and cleaned and drifted. / 1042 units of gas out of drilling break @ 4785 15
! TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 8:30 2.50 {Trip in hole / Break circulation at shoe
8:30 11:00 2.50 [Wash and Ream 160"
14:00 11:30 0.50 {Lubricate rig .
11:30 1:30 14.00 Drilling and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 4582' To 4835
1:30 3:00 1.50 |Work Tight Hole ( Packing Off) Pump Sweep work through tight spot at 4785°
3:00 4:00 1.00 |Driting and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 4835' To 4848'
4:00 4:30 0.50 |Circulate and Condition mud for pull out of hole.
4:30 6:00 1.50 |Pull out of hole work through tight spot at 4608'
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4795' Ino. OF sacks/s | proDUCT NAME | BIT NO. 8
TIME 21:30 24 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 9.2 6 pac-Ui. MFG Security
VIS 38 6 Pac-R TYPE XS25S
Wi 8.6 0 Poly+ JET 3x22
levive 6/8 4 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. 10725340
ImsT 7.50 0 325 DEPTH OUT
CA Trace 3 Myackle DEPTH IN 4582
GELS 2/4 20 Duragel TOTAL FEET 266'
ALK .0/.3 12 Asphasol HRS 15.00
leH 7 10 max gel T/B/G
CAKE 2/32 5 saw dust WT. ON BIT 42/48
cL 400 DALY COST $8,212.00 {RPM 120/60
DAPP 10.000 |previous cost $114,17300  [ROP{fph) 17.8
9%6SOLIDS 4 CUMULATIVE COST $122,385.00 AN VEL 180.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmwth
1 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 4036 51.80/299
1 Mud Mtr 23.23 MODEL 8P80 8P80 4130 53.10/298.70
1 Pony NMDC 9.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 4225 53.9/298.4
1 Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4317 52.80/297.8
1 |GapSub 5.24 SPM 129 44912 51.40/297
i Flex NMDC 29.95 GPM 415.00 4506 49,90/296.5
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 SURF PRESSURE 1225.0 4599 48.9/296.1
1 Jars 28.34 ECD 9.5 4693 46.8/296.1
20 4 1/2" HWDP 644.09 SLLOW PUMP- SPM 57 51 47838 45/297.8
SLOW PUMP- PRES 329 258
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $75,851
{scrm 0 JPREVIOUS CUM COST $1,442,727
J:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 1048.88 linsecTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $1 518,579




Marion Energy inc.

RECEIVED
AUG 07 2097

Mckinney, Toxas 75069
n exas
ey DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MiNNG
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 29, 2007
{RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY [SI’ATE {DAY NO.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 30
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. s jcum Rot. His FOOTAGE DRELED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
4997 13 | 240.5 149 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 3142' Rkb 30
IACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Drilling @ 4997' R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
[REMARXS KB TO GL.
l 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 9:00 3.00 {Pull out of hole For Mud motor
9:00 10:00 | 1.00 |Change Mud motor and bit, Inspect Mwd Tool
10:00 13:30 | 3.50 |Lubricate rig
13:30 | 17:00 | 3.50 Wash and ream from 4463 fo 4848
17:00 6:00 13.00 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 4848' to 4997
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 4848 INO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 9 8
TIME 11:00 j 7 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4 8 3/4
WEIGHT 9.1 4 pac-UL MFG Reed Security
VIS 47 4 Pac-R TYPE HP53KPR XS525S
WL 8 2 Poly+ JET 3X22 3x22
PV/YP 8/12 10 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. ED1646 10725340
MBT 10.00 0 C-325 DEPTH OUT 4848
CA Trace 1 Myacide DEPTH IN 4848 4582
GELS 4/6 20 Duragel TOTAL FEET 149 266'
ALK .0/.4 11 Asphasol HRS 13 15.00
pH 7 10 max gel T/B/G 2,3 fcge 1Mt
CAKE 2/32 2 Safecarb WT. ON BIT 42-48 K 42/48
CL 200 joAlLY cosT $6,314.00 {rReM 120 /60 120/60
DAPP 8.500 {PREVIOUS COST $122,38500  [ROP(fph) 11.5 17.8
F%SOLIDS 3 CUMULATIVE COST $128,699.00 AN VEL 180.6 180.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
; | 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 MAKE Nat Nat 4412 51.40/297
1 Mud Mtr 23.23 MODEL 8P80 | 8P80 4506 49.90/296.5
1 Pony NMDC 9.60 STROKE 8.50 8.50 4599 48.9/296.1
1 Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4693 46.8/296.1
1 Gap Sub 5.24 sPM 129 4788 45/297.8
1 Flex NMDC 29.95 GPM 415.00 4884' 44,80 / 297
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 SURF PRESSURE 1225.0
1 Jars 28.34 ECD 9.5
20 |41/2" HWDP 644.09 SLOW PUMP- SPM 57 51
SLOW PUMP- PRES 329 258
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $57,949
SCFM 0 JerEVIOUS CUM CosT $1,518,579
U:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 1048.88 INJECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $1,576,528




|9

Marion Energy inc.
ST RECEIVED
nney, Texas 4
AUG g7 2007
DAILY DRILLING REPORT DVOEA ~..
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FELD pare 1 SAO & MINIM
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 30, 2007
RIG MAME AND NUMBER (COUNTY [STATE {DAY NO.
Unit Drilling Corp. Rig 132 Carbon Utah 31
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs  fcum Rot. Hrs FOOTAGE DRILLED [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET O Raport No.
4997 13 |1 2405 149’ 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 3142' Rkb I 31
IACTIVITY AT REPORY TIME REPORTED BY
Drilling @ 5245' / Drilled top of Tununk Shale @ 5233' MD R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
REMARES KB TO GL.
TOwillbe @ 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
6:00 13:30 7.50 |Drilling and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 4997" to 5086"
13:30 | 1400 | 0.50 [Lubricate rig
14:00 6:00 16.00 |Drilling and Shding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 5086’ to 5245’ / Drilled top of Tununk At 5233
24.00
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5126 Ino. oF sacks/ies | eropucT NaME | BIT NO. 9
TIME 17:00 52 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 9.2 4 pac-UL {MFG Reed
VIS 40 4 Pac-R TYPE HP53KPR
Wi 8.4 0 Poly+ JET 3X22
PV/YP 4/8 6 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. ED1646
MBT 7.50 0 C-325 {DEPTH oUT
cA Trace 2 Myadde  |DEPTHIN 4848
GELS 2/3 20 Durage) TOTAL FEET 397
ALK .0/.4 12 Asphasol HRS 36.5
pH 7 10 max gel 1/B/G
CAKE 2/32 0 Safecarb WT. ON BIT 42-48 K
CcL 300 DAILY COST $5,046.00 {RPM 120 / 60
DAPP 10.500 [prEVIOUS COST $122,38500  |ROP(fph) 10.8
%SOLIDS 3 ICUMULATIVE COST $127,431.00 AN VEL 180.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [Pump NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Axmuth
1 8-3/4 Bit 1.00 |maxE Nat Nat 4412 51.40/297
1 Mud Mtr 23.23 MODEL 8PS0 | 8PS0 4506 49,90/296.5
1 Pony NMDC 9.60 {STROKE 8.50 8.50 4599 48.9/296.1
1 Slick NMDC 30.50 LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4693 46.8/296.1
1 Gap Sub 5.24 |sPM 129 4788 45/297.8
1 Flex NMDC 29.95 GPM 415.00 4884 44.80 / 297
9 4-1/2" HWDP 276.93 |SURF PRESSURE 1295.0
1 Jars 28.34 ECD 9.2
20 |41/2" HWDP 644.09 |sLOW PUMP- SPM 57 52
IsLowpump-pres | 350 | 359
AIR Drilling Operations data IDAILY WELL COST $57,949
SCFM 0 ferEVIOUS cum cosT $1,518,579
U:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 1048.88 INJECTION RATE 0 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $1,576,528




Marion Energy inc.

RECEV'

119 S Tennessee, Ste
McKinney, Texas 75069 AUG 07 200
42-00\- D\ P) DAILY DRILLING REPORT DIV, OF OlL, G**
LEASE NAME & WELL NO, FIELD DATE
Alpine School District 3-17 Clear Creak July 31, 2007
|riG wame ano mumser (COUNTY Jsvare Ipay no.
Unit Drilfin . Rig 132 Carbon Utah | 32
TOTAL DEFTH Rot. ths  Joum Rot. Hes FOOTAGE DRILLED HAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
5320 6 270 75 9-5/8" 36# LTC J-55 3142' Rkb l 32
[ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
Pucking up and Running 7" Production casing R.L.Tatman / Shiloh Williams
REMARKS KB TC GL.
Shot Trip Wentg@lMHmaiirggpuﬁngomdholemeaydom ] 15
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detall
6:00 12:00 6.00 Drilling and Sliding Directional work 8 3/4" hole from 5245' to 5320
12:00 13:00 1.00 [Circulate Sweep around / Count strokes surface to surface to get idea of hole volume,
13:00 18:00 5.00 |Pump pill / puil out of hole SLM To top of BHA / Trip in hole to / Break circulation @ 4180' Trip to bottom
18:00 19:30 1.50 |Circulate Sweep Around / Rig up laydown truck / Pump Pill.
19:30 4:00 8.50 {Pull out of Hole Lay down drill string.
4:00 6:00 2.00 _|Rig up Casing Crew and rig Lay down truck for pick up Casing.
24.00 |{TD @ 5320 to fit the casing at 12:00 on 7/31/2007
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 5326 INo. OF sacks/iBs | propuCT NAME | BIT NO. 9
[TIME 14:00 68 Dapp SIZE 8 3/4
WEIGHT 8.9 13 pac-Ut. MFG Reed
VIS 52 6 PacR TYPE HP53KPR
WL 9.8 40 Safecarb DET 3x22
PV/YP 14/18 26 Fed-Zan SERIAL NO. ED1646
IMBT 10.00 40 kwik plug DEPTH OUT 5320
CA Trace 2 Myacide DEPTH IN 4848
GELS 6/15 143 Duragel TOTAL FEET 472
ALK .0/1.2 63 fedseal HRS 42.5
|pH 7 98 max gel T/B/G 8,4,bt,g,e3wt,0d
CAKE 3/32 3 Alurénum Sterate |WT. ON BIT 42-48 K
cL 500 DAILY COST $15,906.00  |reM 120 / 60
DAPP 8.000 IprEVIOUS COST $127,431.00  |ROP(fph) 11.1
9%SOLIDS 3 CUMULATIVE COST $143,337.00 AN VEL 180.6
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT  [PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION / Azmuth
MAKE Nat Nat 4412 51.40/297
MODEL 8P80 8P80 4506 49,90/296.5
STROKE 8.50 8.50 4599 48.9/296.1
LINER SIZE 6.25 6.25 4693 46.8/296.1
SPM 4788 45/297.8
GPM 4884’ 44.80 f 297
SURF PRESSURE 4980' 42.6/294.6
leco 5075 39.8/291.6
SLOW PUMP- SPM 57 52 5261 31.9/287.0
SLOW PUMP-PRES | 350 359 5282 31.8/287.10
AIR Drilling Operations data Y WELL COST $55,516
SCFM 0 [PREVIOUS CUM COST $1,576,528
U:\PRODNDDRLG.XLS BHA 1048.88 INJECTION RATE 0 JcuMULATIVE WELL COST $1,632,043




NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
« Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

A copy of drillstem test reports,

A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: _Marion Energy, INC Today’s Date: 09/18/2007
Well: APl Number: Drilling Commenced:
Cordingly Cyn 10-1 drlg/wcr 4300731173 05/19/2006
Ballpark Cyn 11-2 drig/wcr 4300731169 05/30/2006
Ballpark Cyn 16-2X drig/wer 4300731207 06/05/2006
Alpine School Dist 6-17 drig/wcr 4300731181 06/26/2006
Alpine School Dist 3-17 drig/wcr 4300731182 06/26/2006
Kenilworth Rail Road 154 drig/wcr 4300731170 07/05/2006
Kenilworth Rail Road 9-1 drig/wcer 4300731172 07/06/2006
Ridge Runner 2-18 drig/wcr 4301530683 08/12/2006

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM g

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
State ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION-FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

1. TYPE OF WELL
v - L
o weLL [] GAS WELL OTHER Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT-
119 So. Tennessee #200 ., McKinney state 1X 5 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FooTaGEes AT surFace: 2014.49' FEL,692.77' FNL county: -Carbon
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 17 13S  7E STATE:
UTAH
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] acoize [] oeeren [C] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[] nNoTice oF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [ Autercasin [[] rracTure TREAT [J* sietrack o REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casincrepar ] wewconsTRuCTION [] temporariLY ABANDON
[ cHance To PrEVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraTorcHANGE [J tusinG RerPair
] cnanGe TuBING [] Puc AND ABANDON [] venTor FLaRE
[V] sussequent RepoRT [0 crance wew name [] pesack [J water oisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only) .
[} cHance wew sTaTus [C] rropucTiON (START/RESUME) ] waTeR sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion: .
[] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE orxer: Casing Sundry
11/21/2007 [[] converr wew Tvee [[] REcOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Surface Casing: Ran 11 jts, 13 3/8", 46#, J-55, ST & C set @ 490'. Cemented w/ 610 sks Class "G". Lost returns during

displacement. Let set for 12 hrs and topped off w/290 sks class "G". circulated cement.

Intermediate: Ran 72 jts, 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, LT & C, set @ 3142' cemented w/ 425sx, 11 ppg, 3.82 yeild as lead followed by

270 sx, 15.8 ppg, 1.15 yeild as tail. Circulate 32 bbls to surface.

Production: Ran 139 jts, 7", 26 #, K-55, LT & C set @ 5311’ KB. Cemented w/ 400 sx, 12.4 ppg, 65/35 Poz as lead followed by
350 sx, 14.5 ppg, 50/50 Poz as tail. Bumped plug w/ 1950 psi. Circulated 29 bbls cement to surface.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) mnd‘?‘ley VP Operations

TITLE

11/21/2007

DATE

SIGNATURE

%M

&

{This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See [nstructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED

- Nov 30 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:

« Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log

+ A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run

+ A copy of drillstem test reports,

* A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations

* A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled

* A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: _Marion Energy, Inc Today’s Date: 02/14/2008

Well: APl Number: Drilling Commenced:

See Attachment

4% 07 3U3Z
INLPINE CHOOL TIST 21T
23S 78

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



Well:

Cordingly Cyn 10-1
Ballpark Cyn 17-2
Alpine School Dist 6-17
Alpine School Dist 3-17
Kenilworth RR 15-4
Kenilworth RR 9-1
Ridge Runner 2-19
Ridge Runner 2-18
Ridge Runner 8-19
Ridge Runner 1-30

drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
wer

drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer

API Number:

4300731173
4300731169
4300731181
4300731182
4300731170
4300731172
4301530684
4301530683
4301530682
4301530680

Commenced:
05/19/2006
05/30/2006
06/26/2006
06/26/2006
07/05/2006
07/06/2006
08/10/2006
08/12/2006
08/13/2007
09/11/2007



STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

AMENDED REPORT []

(highlight changes)

FORM 8

5.

LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

State ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR E
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG ' TREENAN
1a. TYPE OF WELL: \(I)VIIE_LL $VAE?_ L DRY D OTHER 7. UCNIITeOar :ng:;iME;lr:l;lAME
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
3 Rz D - BNrey [ RESR. OTHER Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND PQOL., OR WILDCAT
119 S. Tennessee #200 civ McKinney state TX zp 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES)

atsurrace: 2014.49 ft FEL, 692.77 ft FNL

11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:

NWNE 17 13S 7E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW:
12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEPTH: ‘L\ % -{6\ \(\ %6 -ﬁp\ o BKD reNiesss Carbon UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED:  [16. DATE COMPLETED: | - 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):
71312007 713112007 11/30/2007 aganponen [ ] Reapy To propuce W] 7921 GR
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 5‘340 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 5,300 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? *|21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUG SET:
™D 4\9";% w 4S5¥F : ™D
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23,
CBL WAS WELL CORED? NO E YES D (Submit analysis}
Dual Spaced Neutron WAS DST RUN? nof/]  ves[]  (submitrepory
DIRECTIONAL SURVEY? no[]  ves {Submit copy)
24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (i) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) | STAC TR | O e Vofbﬂ'é?;m CEMENT TOP ** | AMOUNT PULLED
17 112 13 3/ K-55 46# 0 485 ‘G" 900 Surface
12 1/4" 65/8 J-55 36# 0 3,142 50/50 695 Surface
8 3/4" 7 N-80 26# 0 5,311 50/50 750 Surface
\
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
2 3/8 4,700
26. PRODUCGING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (WD) | TOP (TVD) | BOTTOM (VD) | INTERVAL (Top/Bot-MD) | SIZE |NO.FOLES |  PERFORATION STATUS
® Bluegate 2,300 4207 3,800 3,906 43 | 172 |oven W] saueezea [ ]
® Ferron 4,207 5,223 4,300 4588| 43 | 224 [oren b7l saveezed []
) ‘ Open I:I Squeezed D
[(»)] Open D Squeezed D

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL

AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

3800-3906

1000 gals 7 1/2 % HCL, 50,000 Ibs 20/40 Brady sand, 38,000 gals 20# X-Link Gel

4300-4588

2500 aals 7 1/2 % HCL, 120,000 Ibs 20/40 Brady sand, 85,000 gals 20# X-Link Gel
]

29, ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS:

] etecrricAUMECHANICAL LOGS

D SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION

[] ceoLosic ReporT
[J core anaLysis

[} ostreport

] omer:

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY

30. WELL STATUS:

TsTG S\

(5/2000)

(CONTINUED ON BACK)

RECEIVED
 MAR 17 2008
DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION {OIL - BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
3/1/2008 24 RATES: — 0 16 300 Pumping
CHOKE SIZE: {TBG. PRESS. {CSG.PRESS. JAPIGRAVITY [BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER-BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: — TSTG
INTERVAL B {As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER-BBL:  |PROD. METHOD:
3/1/2008 24 RATES: = 0 150 250 Pumping
CHOKE SIZE:  |TBG. PRESS. JCSG. PRESS. |APIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL. RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER - BBL:  |[INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: — TSTG
INTERVAL C (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OiL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER-BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. |aPiGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER -~ BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —
INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TesT PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. {CSG.PRESS. |APIGRAVITY ]BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO {24 HR PRODUCTION |oOIL - BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
Vented
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval ’
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.
- Top Bottom s Top
Formation (MD) (MD) Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measured Depth)
Stan Point
Emery 1,500 | 2,300 |Sand, Coal, Water’ Emery 1,500
Ferron 4,207 5,223 }Sand, Coal, Gas, & Water Bluegate 2,300
Ferron 4,207
Tununck 5,223
35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS {Include plugging p )
We plan to squeeze perforations from 3800'-3906'
36. | hereby certify that the foregoing and attached infor is p and correct as determined from all avaitable records.
naME (PLEASE PRINTy ZDDOUg Endsley e VP Operations
SIGNATURE Xj—(m W oate _11/30/2007
This report must be submitted with‘lﬁ{() days of
o completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned welt
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore o significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation o drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**ITEM 24: Cement Top ~ Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)



MARION ENERGY, INC.

Carbon County, Utah
Clear Creek Unit
ASD #3-17

Original Hole

Survey: As Drilled

Standard Survey Report

01 August, 2007



Nevis

Survey Report
Company: MARION ENERGY, INC. Lbchl cc-ordinaté Refqrence: y Site Clear Creek Unit
Projoct: Carbon County, Utah TVD Reference: i WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Ciear Creek Unit MD Reference: ‘WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: . ASD #3-17 North Reference: : Grid
Woelibore: Original Hole Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Original Hole Database: . 0 EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
Project Cafboh County, Utah, Sec. 17, T13S, R7E ‘
Map System: Universal Transverse Mercator System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 - Alaska
Map Zone: Zone 12N (114 Wto 108 W)
Site Clear Creek Unit, Sec.17, T1 38, R7E
Site Position: Northing: 14,415,023.68+ Latitude: 39°41'41.969 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 1,595,298.66 ft Longitude: 111° 9' 37407 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: -0.10 °
Well ASD #3-17
Well Position +N/-S 0.0 ft Northing: 14,415,023.68 ft Latitude: 39°41'41.969 N
+EI-W 0.0 ft Easting: 1,595,298.66 ft Longitude: 111° 9' 37.407 W
Position Uncertainty 00ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 7,918.0ft
Welibore Original Hole
Magnetics Model Name Sample Date - Declination’ Dip Angle Field Strength
; ; €} . 1] nn
{GRF200510 6/27/2007 12.18 65.38 52,371
Design Original Hole
Audit Notes:
Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth:
‘Vertical Section: - Depth From (TVD) NS +EIW Direction
o L £ (] 6
0.0 0.0 0.0 295.00
Survey Program - , Date.  8/1/2007
From To S ~ v
m () - Survey (Wellbore) Tool Name Description
653.0 5,336.0 As Drilled (Original Hole) '
Survey
Measured - . Vertical _ Vertical Dogleg Bulld Tumn.
Depth Jnclination - Azimuth ~ Depth +NI-S +EI-W Section Rate: Rate Rate.
i) 0 €y ) (ft) w m 11008 - {1oofy (r100ft)
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
653.0 0.40 276.80 653.0 0.3 -2.3 22 0.06 0.06 0.00
746.0 0.20 309.60 746.0 0.4 ~2.7 26 0.28 -0.22 35.27
839.0 0.00 334.90 839.0 0.5 2.8 2.8 0.22 -0.22 0.00
959.0 0.10 33.10 959.0 0.6 28 28 0.08 0.08 0.00
1,051.0 0.40 49.70 1,051.0 0.9 -2.5 26 0.33 0.33 18.04
1,143.0 0.80 78.10 1,143.0 1.2 -1.6 2.0 0.53 0.43 30.87
1,236.0 1.20 79.50 1,236.0 1.5 0.0 0.7 0.43 0.43 1.51
1,330.0 0.90 94.60 1,330.0 1.6 1.7 -0.8 0.43 -0.32 16.06
1,424.0 0.50 113.20 1,424.0 1.4 28 -1.9 0.48 -0.43 19.79
1,519.0 0.20 24460 1,518.9 1.2 3.0 22 0.68 -0.32 138.32
1,613.0 0.40 331.60 1,612.9 1.4 27 -1.9 0.47 0.21 92.55

8/1/2007 9:20:56AM

COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77




Nevis
Survey Report

Company: o ' MARION ENERGY, INC. “Local Co-ordinate Reference:  Site Clear Creek Unit

Project: Carbon County, Utah TVD Reference: 5 WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: : Clear Creek Unit MD Reference: i ; WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: e ASD#RAT North Reference: , Grid
‘Wellbore: =+ Original Hole Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
“Design: Qriginal Hole Database: : : - EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
Survey
Measured ; Vertical v Vertical Dogley. Build Tumn
Depth . inclination ~* Azimuth Depth 4NIS +EIW Section ‘Rate - Rate " Rate -
) e © ) () I () 1Mooy - (ri00f) - (o0
1,650.1 1.00 307.20 1,650.0 1.7 24 -1.4 1.78 1.63 ‘ -65.86
KOP
1,707.0 2.00 299.90 1,706.9 25 1.1 0.0 1.78 1.75 -12.81
1,801.0 3.80 296.50 1,800.8 47 -3.1 4.8 1.92 1.91 -3.62
1,896.0 4.70 289.40 1,895.5 7.4 -9.6 11.8 1.10 0.95 -7.47
1,990.0 7.00 29110 1,989.0 10.8 -18.5 213 245 2.45 1.81
2,083.0 9.30 290.50 2,081.1 15.4 -30.9 345 247 2.47 -0.65
2,177.0 11.30 . 289.10 2,173.6 21.1 -46.7 51.2 2.14 2.13 -1.49
2,270.0 14.40 290.70 2,264.2 28.2 -66.1 71.8 3.35 3.33 172
2,364.0 15.60 293.50 2,355.0 374 -88.6 96.1 1.49 1.28 2.98
2,459.0 17.00 292.80 2,446.2 47.8 -113.2 122.8 1.49 1.47 -0.74
2,653.0 19.50 . 293.40 2,535.5 59.4 -140.2 1562.2 2.67 2.66 0.64
2,647.0 22.70 291.00 2,623.2 721 -171.6 186.0 3.53 3.40 -2.55
2,741.0 23.10 289.90 2,709.8 849 -205.8 222.4 0.62 0.43 -1.17
2,836.0 24.10 289.10 2,796.8 97.6 ~241.7 260.3 1.1 1.056 -0.84
2,932.0 27.50 292.10 2,883.2 1123 -280.8 301.9 3.79 3.54 3.12
3,027.0 28.80 294.31 2,967.0 130.0 -321.9 346.7 1.75 1.37 2.33
3,090.0 31.10 296.40 3,021.6 143.5 -350.3 378.2 4.01 3.65 3.32
3,184.0 32.80 298.40 3,101.3 166.4 -394.5 427.9 213 1.81 213
3,279.0 34.20 297.30 3,180.6 190.9 -440.9 480.2 1.61 1.47 -1.16
3,374.0 36.50 297.20 3,258.0 216.1 -489.7 535.1 242 2.42 -0.11
3,469.0 39.80 296.90 3,332.7 2427 -542.0 593.8 3.48 3.47 -0.32
3,663.0 41.40 298.20 3,404.1 271.0 -596.2 654.9 1.93 1.70 1.38
3,658.0 44 .40 299.20 3,473.7 302.1 -652.9 718.4 3.24 3.16 1.05
3,754.0 46.50 299.30 3,541.0 335.5 ~712.6 787.6 2.19 219 0.10
3,848.0 49.80 299.80 3,603.7 370.1 ~773.5 857.4 3.53 3.51 0.53
3,843.0 50.60 . 299.50 3,664.6 406.2 -836.9 9830.2 0.88 0.84 -0.32
4,036.0 51.80 299.00 3,722.8 4416 -900.2 1,002.4 1.36 1.29 -0.54
4,130.0 53.10 298.70 3,780.1 477.5 -965.4 1,076.8 1.41 1.38 -0.32
42250 53.90 298.40 3,836.6 514.0 -1,032.5 1,1563.0 0.88 0.84 -0.32
4,317.0 52.80 297.80 3,891.5 548.8 -1,097.6 1,226.7 1.31 -1.20 -0.65
4,412.0 51.40 297.00 3,949.9 583.3 -1,164.2 1,301.6 1.62 -1.47 -0.84
4,448.8 50.81 296.81 3,973.0 596.3 -1,189.7 1,330.2 1.65 -1.60 -0.52
Ferron :
4,470.0 50.47 296.69 3,986.4 603.6 -1,204.4 1,346.6 1.65 -1.60 -0.53
Ferron (as per geology)
4,506.0 49.90 296.50 4,009.5 616.0 -1,229.1 1,374.3 1.65 -1.60 -0.54
4,589.0 48,90 296.10 4,070.0 647.3 -1,292.4 1,444.9 1.12 -1.08 -0.43
4,693.0 46.80 296.10 41331 678.0 -1,355.0 1,514.5 2.23 -2.23 0.00
4,788.0 45.00 297.80 4,199.2 708.9 -1,415.8 1,682.7 2.29 -1.89 1.79
4,884.0 44.80 297.00 4,267.2 740.1 -1,475.9 1,650.4 0.62 -0.21 -0.83
4,980.0 . 42.60 294.60 4,336.6 768.9 -1,535.6 1,716.7 2.87 -2.29 -2.50
5,075.0 39.80 291.60 4,408.1 793.5 -1,593.1 1,779.2 3.61 -2.95 -3.16
5,168.0 34.70 289.10 4,482.1 813.2 -1,645.9 1,835.3 572 -5.48 ~2.69
5,261.0 31.90 287.00 4,559.8 829.0 -1,694.4 1,886.0 3.26 -3.01 -2.26
5,282.0 31.80 287.10 45777 8323 -1,705.0 1,897.0 0.54 -0.48 0.48
5,336.0 31.80 287.10 4,623.6 8406 -1,732.2 1,925.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
TD - Projection @ 5336"

8/1/2007 9:20:56AM Page 3 COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77



Nevis

Survey Report
Company: 'MARION ENERGY, INC. Local Co-ordinate Reference: Site Clear Creek Unit
Project: - Carbon County, Utah TVD Reference: - WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: 7712 Clear Creek Unit MD Reference: WELL @ 0.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: Lo ASD #3417 North Roference: =~ Grid
Wellbore: - Original Hole Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: - . Original Hole Database: EDM 2003.14 Single User Db
Targets
- -hit/miss target' " Dip:Angle - Dip Dir. TVD #N/-S - HEIW Northing Easting G
- Shape. : ) ) o) . m ) () Longitude

PBHL 0.00 360.00 4,673.0 830.6 -1,780.8 14,415,854.28 1,693,517.86 39° 41'50.149 N 111°10°0.217 W

- survey misses by 70.1ft at 5336.0ft MD (4623.6 TVD, 840.6 N, -1732.2 E)

- Circle (radius 0.1)
KOP 0.00 0.00 1,650.0 0.0 0.0 14,415,023.68 1,595,298.66 39°41'41.969 N 111°9'37.407 W

- survey misses by 3.0ft at 1650.1ft MD (1650.0 TVD, 1.7 N, 24 E)

- Point
Ferron 0.00 360.00 3,973.0 612.9 -1,314.1 14,415,636.58 1,593,984.56 39° 41' 48.005 N 111°9' 54.239 W

- survey misses by 86.3ft at 4539.1ft MD (4030.9 TVD, 627.3 N, -1251.7 E)

- Circle (radius 100.0)
-Survey Annotations

Measured . - Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth . .. - Depth . - +NI:S L aEW ,
e S " Comment
4,470.0 3,986.4 603.6 -1,204.4 Ferron (as per geology)

5,336.0 4,623.6 840.6 -1,732.2

TD - Projection @ 5336'

Checked By: Approved By:

8/1/2007 9:20:56AM Page 4

COMPASS 2003.14 Build 77




ASD #3-17

MARION ENERGY, INC.  Clear Creek Unit
Plan #2 Carbon County, Utah
SECTION DETAILS
Sec MD Inc Azi TVD  +N/-S +E/W DLeg TFace VSec Target
1 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0
2 1650.0 0.00 0.00 1650.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0
3 30686 4256 29500 2941.7 2126 -455.9 3.00 29500 503.0
4 4468.7 4256 29500 3973.0 612.9 -1314.1 0.00 0.00 1450.0
5 5339.4 30.13 295.00 4673.0 830.6 -1780.8 1.43 -179.99 1965.0
EEEEEEEENRRNRNEE As Drilled - Final
| | | 7/31/107 - Projection to TD
1000 f :
. : Jl } T
110 RN ! 1 (
1500 - KOP : 15001, i
] o » ; |
gzooc . LR 1125 PRAL
= ] o /i |
Z 8 : ks L : i
2500 ‘, . i PEiection @ 536" \
;ag) 3 \\a‘“ ' § . """"i'”\@e Ion?)\ i - |
S NG £ £ ] P o e ool | [ |
S3000 NN i £ 4 s S~ SEREERE
< . N b 4 L Ferron | {1 ‘\‘ ) |
% NN s TN
3 . \ W |- = N ‘
= 3500 \\ -1 s 4 [
E —r N \ Ferron (S B ! ,I
i : Q ARElIn ) 4 KoPL.
4000 A2 Kerron (as per geology 375
] TIN 1 1
\ [ B
i . PBHL al
4500 1 N 750
] | N. 7D - Projection @ 533 -
: ; | S T ;
5000—] —— i \I -1875 1500  -1125 -750 -375 0
-500 0 500 1000 1500 2000 2500 3000 West(-)/East(+) (750 ft/in)
Vertical Section at 295.00° (1000 ft/in)
WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS
Name TVD +N/-S +E/W Shape G
KOP 1650.0 0.0 0.0 Point A T
Ferron 3973.0 612.9 -1314.1 Circle (Radius: 100.0) . :
PBHL  4673.0 8306  -1780.8 Circle (Radius: 0.1) Azimuths to Grid North

SITE DETAILS: Clear Creek Unit

Sec.17, T13S, R7E
39°41' 41.969 N
111° 9' 37.407 W

Site Centre Latitude:
Longitude:

Positional Uncertainity:
Convergence:
Local North:

0.0
-0.10
Grid

True North: 0.10°
Magnetic North: 12.28°

Magnetic Field
Strength: 52370.9nT
Dip Angle: 65.38°
Date: 6/27/2007
Model: IGRF200510
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

AMENDED REPORT /]
{highlight changes)

FORM 8

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
State ML-1257
5. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
T Ta TYPE OF WELL, oL GAS DR OTER o 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
WELL - VEL L Clear Creek Unit -
“'b. TYPE OF WORK: |76, WELL NAME and NUMBER.
NErL -0 B 0O B RO OTHER Alpine School District 3-17
3. NAWIE OF OFERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc. 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND FOGL, OR WILDCAT
119 S. Tennessee #200 v McKinney stare TX  zie 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
3. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11 QURQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
arsurrace: 2014.49 ft FEL, 692.77 ft FNL ' '
NWNE 17 138 7E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REFORTED BELOW:
AT TOTAL DEPTH 12. COUNTY 13, STATE
i Carbon UTAH
14, DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: | 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, 6L}
71312007 7/31/2007 11/30/2007 seanoned [ ] reaovrorrooucs (7] | 7921 GR
16. TOTALDEPTH:  MD 5 340 19 PLUGBACKTD: MD 5§ 300 20. IF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * | 21. DEPTH BRIDGE  MD
’ PLUG SET:
™D ™D VD
22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN {Submil copy of each) 23,
CBL WAS WELL CORED? nolf]  ves[]  (submitanaysis)
Dual Spaced Neutron WAS DST RUN? NO Yes{ ] (submitegory
DIREGTIONAL SURVEY? No[T]  vesfZl  (submiteopy)”
24, CASING AND LINER REGORD {Repart all strings set in well)
HOLE SiZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#/ft) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (Mp) | STAGE CEMENTER o o e & vofﬁzié%au CEMENT TOP™* | AMOUNT PULLED
17 112 133 K-55 A6# 0 485 "G 900 Surface
12 114" 65/8 J-b5 36# 0 3,142 50/50 695 Surface
8 3/4" 7 N-80 26# 0 5,311 50/50¢ 750 Surface
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (WD) SizE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) | PACKER SET (MD)
23/8 4,700
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP(MD) | BOTTOM(MD) | TOP(TVD) ] BOTTOM (TVD} | INTERVAL (Topiaat- M0 | Si2E WO HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
@ Bluegate 2,300 4,207 3,800 3,906| .43 172 | open Squeezed [ |
® Ferron 4,207 5,223 4,300 4,588| 43 | 224 |oeen [/] saueezes [ ]
© Open D Squeszed D
(D) open [ ] squeezed ||
28, ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATERIAL

3800-3906
4300-4588

1000 gais 7 1/2 % HCL, 50,000 ibs 20/40 Brady sand, 38,000 gals 20# X-Link Gel
12500 gals 7 1/2 % HCL, 120,000 Ibs 20/40 Brady sand, 85,000 gals 20# X-Link Ge!

29, ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

7] sLeciricALMECHANICAL LOGS

[] seoroeic ReporT [T oiRecTionAL surRveY

] coreanaLYsis

] vsTRePoRT

[ otHer: Prod

D SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION

RECEIVED
MAY 2 0 2009
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)



#A. INITIAL PRODUCTION (NTERVAL A {As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL - BBL: GAS ~MCF: WATER - BBL:  jPROD. METHOD:
, /112008 8 RATES: = 0 75 80 Pumping
CHOKE SZE-  |7BG. PRESS.  |CSG. PRESS: - |APIGRAVITY - (BTU-GAS -~ |GASIOIL RATIO |24-HR PRODUCTION [OIL=BBL: .. GAS-MCF._ |WATER=-BBL: {INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: = 225 240 Producing
e - " INTERVAL B [As sHow i item #28) B T T
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OiL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER -BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
] . 3 S RATES: = IO SN D S -
CHOKE SIZE: {TBG. PRESS. |CSG.PRESS. |APIGRAVITY [BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION [OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —BBL: [INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —

INTERVAL C [As shown in item #26}

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL —BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —~ BBL: {PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. |CSG. PRESS. |APIGRAVITY |BTU ~GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION [OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —~ BBL:  [INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —

INTERVAL D {As shown in tem #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION {OIL - B8BL: GAS ~MCF: WATER — BBL: |PROD. METHOD:
RATES: =
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS, {CSG. PRESS. jAPIGRAVITY |BTU-GAS GAS/OIL RATIO [24 HR PRODUCTION [Oil.— BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
. RATES: —
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
Vented
. 33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers); 34, FORMATION [Log) MARKERS:
Show all imporiant zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and al drill-stem tests, inciuding depih interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.
. Top - Bottom . Top
Formation (MD) MD) Descriptions, Contents, etc. Namne (Measured Depth)
Stan Point
Emery 1,500 | 2,300 |Sand, Goal, Water Emery 1,500
Ferron 4,207 | 5,223 |Sand, Coal, Gas, & Water Biuegate 2,300
Ferron 4,207
Tununck 5,223
36, ADDITIONAL REMARKS { de plugging procadure)
We plan to squeeze perforations from 3800%-3906'
3¢. { hereby eertify that the going and di Hon is plete and tas ined from all avai d
NAME (PLEASE PRINT)_DRUg. Endsley wre VP Operations
SIGNATURE _L@ﬂ-’”‘\ &,w%;__ DATE 1(/ 4 Z Df
i § z _a—. L.
This report must be submitied within 30 days of
o completing or plugging a new well & reentering a previously piugged and abandened well
® drilling horizontal laterats fom an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore befow the previous bottom-hole depth
» recompleting to a different producing formation & drilling hydrocarbon explaratory heles, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top— Show how reported top(s) of cement were determ ined {circulated (CIR), calculated {CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-6340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(512000}



' STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Mulit-Locations

. TYPE OF WELL
! owLwelt [1  caswelt [1  OTHER

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Marion Energy, Inc. , Y2007 3] 82

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: R PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

119 S. Tennessee oiry McKinney srare VX | 7p 75069 (972) 540-2967 Clear Creek

4. LOCATION OF WELL ) )

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: county: Carbon
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERDIAN: S5~/ '7 / / 3S R o 7 E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [[] oeePen [T] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

b4 NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [] Autercasing [[] FrACTURE TREAT [ ] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION |:| TEMPORARILY ABANDON

[ cHanGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [T] orerator cHaNGE [] vusing Repair
] crance TuBING [C] Puucanp ABaNDON [} venTorFLARE

'] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ cHANGE WELL NAME [ Pesack [] warerDisPosAL

{Submit Original Form Oniy}
] cHANGE WELL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [T] waTER sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

|:| COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |Z| otrer: remedial flush jobs
] convert weLL TYPE [T} RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, vollimes, etc.

Recently Marion Energy conducted a series of short pump-in tests on the wells listed below to determine if the wells were in
need of remedial flushing of the Ferron formation. Those tests indicated that the wells were partially plugged with fines. It is
now our intention to start a larger series of remedial flush jobs in a cyclical manner consisting of periods of flushing followed by
a period of production. The length of each cycle will be determined by individual well response. Marion Energy will be utilizing
the necessary pumping equipment to achieve 3-5bbls/min and pressure up to 1800 psi. We anticipate starting these tests as
soon as we have removed snow from the access roads.

Ridge Runner 13-17 API # 4301530269, Ridge Runner 11-17 APl # 4301530685, Ridge Runner 2-19 API # 4301530684,
Ridge Runner 1-30 API # 4301530680, Ridge Runner 11-20 API # 43015302710, ASD 3-17 API # 4300731182, ASD 6-17 API
# 4300731181, Oman 2-20 API # 4300730289

NAME (PLEASE BRINT) g Endsley TITLE VP Operations
SIGNATURE Z‘j}]’\-" \ m oare  3/15/2010
(This space for State use only) REQUEST DEN'Eé/
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining RECEIVED
Dater@! 30/ (O o o
(6/2000) \) N (\/) /Lﬁ (See Instructions on Reverse Side) MAR 17 2010

pusdwmm ks bion & Fostdicate DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

XL St Pomp ia were not futhe “1231 P'e‘”& Prode detuilg
op%teg f-ﬁg{‘i)s(( e"t‘:j';' ct(_[c 4 ﬂv\t\bidqv\“‘t‘{\l et -CL, & aJtoted &*&SP&&»’M@& )a\,,fo-] et




Form 3160-5 U. IDSTATES FORM APPROVED '

(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR oo 313007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 TomeSgING UL TVE]]
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UAB P LD OFFIcE
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 2018 HAR 18 AH Q: L0
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. 1t Unit or CA/Agroement, Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well . UTU-301¥
Oil Well [/] Gas Well [ ] Other 8. Well Nomaand Now
Multi-Locations
2. Name of Operator Marion Energy, Inc. 9. API Well No.
% Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) Yz ool /8L
119 S. Tennessee Ste, 200 McKinney, TX 75069 972-540-2967 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M, or Survey Description) Clear Creek
o692, F’VL' 30/7 FEL 11, County or Parish, State
5—/9 TIZS ROIE Hwi'E Carbon
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
_ ] Acidize L Deepen I I production (StartResume) | Water Shut-Off
[ Norice of ntent [ Alter Casing ] Fracture Treat [_JReclamation Well Integrity
[ Subsequent Report ] Casing Repair [ New Construction 0] Recomplete [Zlother Remedial Fiush Jobs
(e ‘ [ Change Plans [ prugand Abandon ] Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection [:l Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Recently Marion Energy conducted a series of short pump-in tests on the wells listed below to determine if the wells were in need of remedial
flushing of the Ferron formation. Those tests indicated that the wells were partially plugged with fines. It is now our intention to start a larger
series of remedial flush jobs in a cyclical manner consisting of periods of flushing followed by a period of production. The length of each cycle
will be determined by individual well response. Marion Energy will be utilizing the necessary pumping equipment to achieve 3-5bbls/min and
pressure up to 1800 psi. We anticipate starting these tests as soon as we have removed snow from the access roads.

Ridge Runner 13-17 API # 4301530269, Ridge Runner,11-17 API # 4301530685, Ridge Runner 2-19 API # 4301530684, Ridge Runner 1-30 AP #
4301530680, Ridge Runner 11-20 API # 43015302710,%[) 3-17 API # 4300731182, ASD 6-17 API # 4300731181, Oman 2-20 API # 4300730289

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

DoyEgdsley Title VP Operations

Signature 9\529""’\ Z\,\,\Q\/@V)( Date 03/15/2010

(U THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thos E‘ ﬁ E

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. PR'CE F 'E LD OFF!CE

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or frandulent statements or representations as to anymatter within its jurisdiction.

e AUG 10201

(Instructions on page 2) . » R ‘531:

COPY AUG 16 2010
upoe om0 AMIENG




State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
MICHAEL R. STYLER

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR. Executive Director
Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director
December 9, 2010
Certified Mail No.: 7004 1160 0003 0190 4789
DIVISION ORDER

Marion Energy, Inc.
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200 4'3% w 7 g/ ) g Z
McKinney, Texas 75069 /4’/ e, Sehod] Didt 3-17
Attn: Mr. Keri Clark /134 1E 7

Subject: Bonding for Individual Wells

Dear Mr. Clark:

As of the date of this Order Marion Energy Inc. (Marion) has not satisfactorily
demonstrated Marion’s financial ability to meet Utah Code §40-6-5(f) and Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rule (R649-3-6) requirements for state-wide bonding as requested in the
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) certified letter dated October 25, 2010.

The Division is hereby ordering individual well bonds (R649-3-1.5) for all wells (see
Attachment A) currently covered under Marion’s $120,000 blanket bond. The total individual
well bond obligation will be $421,500.

Therefore, Marion has 30 days from the date of this Order to post the additional
bonding or enter into an agreement with the Division to satisfy this Order.

Marion has the right to appeal the Division Order by filing to the Board of Oil, Gas and
Mining a request for review, according to procedures set forth in Utah Administrative Code
R649-10-6. A request for review of a Division Order must be filed with the secretary to the
Board, Julie Ann Carter (801) 538-5277, within 30 days of issuance of the Order.

In the event Marion does not comply with this Division Order for Individual Well
Bonding the Division will file for a formal hearing before the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
pursuant to Utah §40-6-11(3) & (4).

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 841145801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING




Page 2
Subject: Division Order — Bonding for Individual Wells.
December 9, 2010

For bonding assistance please contact Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor at (801) 538-
5316. General questions regarding this Order may be directed to Clinton Dworshak, Compliance
Manager at (801) 538-5280, or John Rogers, Oil and Gas Associate Director at (801) 538-5349.

Sincerely,
Cliiion o ok
Clinton Dworshak
Compliance Manager
CLD/js
Exhibits

cc:  John Rogers, Associate Director
Steve Alder, Assistant Attorney General
Dustin Doucet, Petroleum Engineer
Randy Thackeray, Lead Auditor
Compliance File
Well Files

N:AO&G Reviewed Docs\ChronFile\Enforcement



Well Name

Cordingly Cyn 15-2
Cordingly Cyn 15-1
Cordingly Cyn 15-5

Alpine School District 6-17
Alpine School District 3-17
Oman 10-29

Utah Fuel 8

Kenilworth RR 1
Kenilworth RR 2

Ballpark Cyn 1

Cordingly Cyn 11-1
Ballpark Cyn 17-2
Cordingly Cyn 10-1
Ballpark Cyn 16-2X
Kennilworth RR 1-A

Attachment A

Well API

43-007-30102
43-007-31065
43-007-31167
43-007-31181
43-007-31182
43-007-31210
43-007-16015
43-007-31006
43-007-31007
43-007-31015
43-007-31070
43-007-31169
43-007-31173
43-007-31207
43-007-31229

Well Depth Bond
4890 $30,000
4735 $30,000
4500 $30,000
5825 $30,000
5300 $30,000
5500 $30,000
4390 $30,000
4445 $30,000
5007 $30,000
4468 $30,000
5520 $30,000
not reported $30,000
6435 $30,000
489 $1,500
8045 $30.000
TOTAL $421,500



U.S. Postal Service
- CERTIFIED MAIL.. RECEIPT

(Domestic Mail Only; No Insurance Coverage Provided)

Postage | $ ! z/ q / 2210

Certified Fes E E

Return Reciept Fee Here
(Endorsement Required)

Restricted Delivery Fee
(Endorsement Required)

Total Pos!
MR KERI CLARKE
__________ MARION ENERGY INC

| SFet %t 119 SOUTH TENNESSEE SUITE 200
""""""" MCKINNEY TX 75069

PS Form:3800. June 2002

ent To

7004 110 0003 0190 4789

See Reverse for Instructions

SENDER: COMPLETE THIS SECTION

® Complete items 1, 2, and 3. Also complete
item 4 if Restricted Delivery is desired.

® Print your name and address on the reverse
so that we can return the card to you.

W Attach this card to the back of the mailpiece,

or on the front if space permits.

COMPLETE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY

A. Sianature * /—\ 5 >
X%CBOA_) [ Addresses

A [T

1. Article Addressed to:

MR KERI CLARKE

MARION ENERGY INC

119 SOUTH TENNESSEE SUITE 200
MCKINNEY TX 75069

D. s delivery address different from ftem 17 L] Yos
‘If YES, enter delivery address below:  [1.No

3. I%y«ice Type
Certified Mail [ Express Mail
3 Registered [ Retum Receipt for Merchandise
Oinsured Mall O c.OD. ‘

; 4. Restricted Delivery? (Extra Foe) O Yes
2. Article Number A T e
(Transfer from service label) 2004 11L0 DOO3 0190 4789
PS Form 3811, February 2004 Domestic Return Receipt 102595-02-M-1540
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March 1, 2010

Mr. Brad Hill

State of Utah

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple
Suite 1210

Salt Lake City, UT 84114

Re: Application for Injection Well — Marion Energy’s Alpine School District 3-17.
654.99'fnl, 3189.35'fwl Section 17 Township 13 South Range 7 East, SLB&M

Dear Mr. Hill,

Marion Energy respectfully submits the enclosed original of the Application for
Injection Well (UIC Form 1) for the above referenced well.

Marion Energy desires to submit this application now to begin the noticing process
and comment period. Supplemental information will be submitted in the future by
Marion Energy as is required.

Thank you for your timely processing and review of this application. Please feel free
to contact myself or Mr. Keri Clarke at 972-540-2967 ext 3003 if you any questions
or need additional information.

Sincerely,

Scott Jacoby

Associate Landman

Marion Energy

Phone: 972-540-2967 ext 3008
Mobile: 817-937-6931

E-mail: sjacoby@marionenergy.com

Marion Energy Inc.
119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200
McKinney, Texas 75069

Tel (972) 540-2967
Fax (972) 547-0442



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESQURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

UIC FORM 1

APPLICATION FOR INJECTION WELL

Name of Operator Utah Account Number | Well Name and Number
Marion Energy N Alpine School District 3-17
Address of Operator Phone Number API Number
119 8. Tennessee  “™ McKinney STATE TX  Z*75070 (972) 540-2967 4300731182
Location of Well Field or Unit Name
. \ . Clear Creek Unit

Footage : 654.69' FNL 3189.35' FWIL. County : Carbon 5550 Dosignation and Namber

QQ, Section, Township, Range: NWNE 17 138 7E  state: UTAH FEE
Is this application for expansion of an existing project? Yes No [ J
Will the proposed well be used for: Enhanced Recovery? Yes [] No AIZI

Disposal? Yes Ne [
Storage? Yes [] No [/]

Is this application for a new well to be drilled? Yes [] No /] |
If this application is for an existing well, has a casing test been performed? Yes [] No []

Date of test:

Ay’
44
P Il
Ve / P
Proposed injection interval: from 4,268 to 5'1/13 ?ff”
T . . - ) ﬂ(é‘{}

Proposed maximum injection: rate 15,000 bpd pressure 400 psig

Proposed injection zone contains oil ] gas /], and / or fresh water [_] within % mile of the well.

List of attachments:

ATTACH ADDITIONAL INFORMATION AS REQUIRED BY CURRENT

UTAH OIL. AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

1 hereby certity that this report Is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.

Name (Please Print) 561077’ JAcoB Y

Title A5$OCI‘O~+€, LA/UDMA/U

(_S;# %M /VI ARcH

Signature Date

[/, 20/0

(5/2002)
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Chris Kierst - Affidavit Address List and Geological Pages ASD 3-17

From: "Scott Jacoby" <sjacoby@marionenergy.com>

To: "Chris Kierst" <chriskierst@utah.gov>

Date: 3/4/2010 6:31 AM

Subject: Affidavit Address List and Geological Pages ASD 3-17

CC: "Keri Clarke" <kclarke@marionenergy.com>, "Ben Evans" <bevans@marionener...

Attachments: Affidavit Geological Address ASD 3-17.pdf

Good Morning Chris,
Please find attached:

The affidavit of mailing
Address List and Maps of all operators, surface owners and Mineral owners
Geological Information.

Please do not hesitate to contact us if you have any questions. | will be out of the office today but | will be
responding to e-mail. Forimmediate attention please contact Ben Evans at bevans@marionenergy.com cell
phone 214-534-0358

Have a wonderful day!

Scott Jacoby

Scott Jacoby

Associate Landman

Marion Energy

119 S. Tennessee

McKinney, TX 75069

Phone: (972)540-2967 ext 3008
Mobile: (817)937-6931

Fax: (972)547-0442

E-mail: sjacoby@marionenergy.com

file://C:\Documents and Settings\DPRUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrowise\4B8F53AFN... 3/4/2010



AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING

I, Scott Jacoby, Associate Landman, Marion Energy, Inc. being first duly sworn, dispose and
state as follows:

On March 3, 2010, | caused to be mailed by certified, postage prepaid, retum receipt
requested, letters informing all operators, surface and mineral owners within a half mile radius
of our Alpine School District 3 -17 well of Marion Energy’s intent to convert the aforementioned
well into a produced water injection well. A map depicting the area in question was also
attached to each letter as required by the Department of Qil, Gas and Mining, as set forth in

rule R649-5 pertaining to the requirements for injecting fluids into reservoirs and the permitting
of Class Hl injection wells.

Dated the 3rd day of March, 2010

St s
&

Scott S. Jacoby /
Associate Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

The forgoing affidavit was subscribed and sworn to me by Scott S. Jacoby
This _3rd__ day of _March , 2010.

R
N7y THERESA GANN
‘ Notary Public, State of Texas
My Commission Expires

Octlober 10, 2010

'\

ke

%1

, Notary Public.

;.
3
A
T

My Commission expires: day of , 20

Marion Energy Inc.
119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200
McKinney, Texas 75069

Tel (972) 540-2967
Fax (972) 547-0442



Alpine School District 3 -17 (SWD)

Address of Operators within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

1. Northstargas, LC
C/O Steve Ault
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

2. Mobil Expl & Producing No America Inc
P.O. Box 5444
Denver, CO 80217

3. Marion Energy
119 S. Tennessee
McKinney, TX 75069
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Alpine School District 3 - 17 (SWD)

Address of Mineral Owners within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

. Merrion Oil and Gas Corporation
610Reilly Ave
Farmington, NM 87401

. Northstargas, LC
C/O Steve Ault
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

. Summit Energy Partners Clear Creek, LLC
1441 Ute Bivd

Suite 280

Park City, UT 84098

. Bureau of Land Management
Price Field Office

Attn: Don Stephens

125S. 600 W,

Price, UT 84501

. State of Utah

Trust Lands Administration
675 East 500 South

Suite 500

Salt Lake City, UT 84102



6. Reverse Exchange LLC
As title holder for
AOK Family Holding Trust,
Jana Gunderson, Trustee
341 North 1100 East
American Fork, UT 84003

7. Ms. Anastasia Daraban
1833 S. West Temple #1
Salt Lake City, UT 84115

8. Harvey Stone
155 Franklin Street
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

9. Mr. J Richard Bell
4632 Idlewild Road
Salt Lake City, UT 84124

10. Ms. Joni Buehner
350 Claude Drive
Santa Clara, CA 84765

11. Ms. Connie Condie
433 E. Vine Street
Murray UT, 84765

12. Ms. Connie Stauffer
8851 Edinburgh Circle
Highlands Ranch, CO 80129



13. Mr. John Nicolaides
5040 N. Second Street
Phoenix, AZ 85012

14. Mr. Paul Daraban
10104 Dunsinane
South Jordan, UT 84095

15. Mr. Michael Stathis
1579 S. East Canyon Drive
Cedar City, UT 84720

16. Mr. Tommy John Nicolaides
989 Military Drive
Salt Lake City, UT 84108

17. Mrs. Hilda Hammond
2912 Redwood
Costa Mesa, CA 92626

18. Mary Louise Seamons
1774 South 340 East
Orem, UT 84058

19. Evelyn Jacobsen
** No Address Available

20. Leoan Gunderson
3990 Raymond
Ogden, UT 84403



21. Anthon Madsen
1821 Howell
Richland, WA 99354

22. Annie Andersen
1646 Snow Rd
Fort Sill, OK 73503

23. Dix Jensen
525 Woodhill Dr.
Price, UT 84501

24. Alice Pannier
1138 Michigan Ave.
Salt Lake City, UT 84105

25. Carbon County
120 East Main Street
Price, UT 84501

26.James T. Jensen
2961 N. Caitland Ct.
Salt Lake City, UT 84121

27.Jerry L. Jesen
1155 N. Carbonville Rd.
Price, UT 84501

28. Bonnie Lynne Jensen Stradling
18316 Highway 56
Sherman, TX 75902



29. Louise M. Watts
**No Address Available

30. Johannah Hafen
**No Address Available

31. Louise F. Seeley
**No Address Available

32. Estate of Lee Thomas
**No Address Available

33. Jack Thomas
Route 2
Preston, ID 83263



MINERAL OWNERSHIP PLAT

Eaclyn Jaudhw

"?:!l blons Thaws
L F ZoicT Al Khattat
o Esaie of Loe 8 Thomas

Mary Lot Scanons
Juhaunal Halon

Alice Panwer

iy Jeneen

James fensen

Jeery hnwen

Fonnwe Lyt lepsca
Eaatawe of Loe Phamas
Juck Thaemwas

| Northstargas, L.C.
| Muerrion Oil and Gas
~ |C&B Energy '
| Sumumit Encrgy Pariners|

5 _

|
Northstargas, LiC.
Reverse Excharjge LLC |
Harvey A. Stong

State of Utah

16

i;ew ks

Federal |0

1 Zommy Jahn Nicolaides |

Anastasia Daraban |

re
N

Connic Condic l
Connic Stauiler
¢ Paul Daraban
Michael Stathis
Joanic Buchner

Alpine School
District #6-17-2] \

1. Richurd Bell
John Nicolades
Carbim County

TALON RESOURCES, INC.
615 N. 400 E., P.0). Bay 1230
Lluntugton, Utab 84528
Phonc (4355687-5310  Fux (435)687-5311

E-Mail talon ¢ ctr.nct

@Marion Energy Inc.

Alpine School District #3—17
Section 17, T13S, R7E, S.L.B.&M.
Carbon County, Utah

Irawn By Checked By
N. BUTKOVICH LW,
Drawing No, Datar
o 2/18/1
Exhibit A Laan
1" = 1000’
Jolo New
sheet 1 o ] 4462




=

Alpine School District 3 -17 (SWD)

Address of Surface Owners within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

Liodakis Ranch LLC
George E. Liodakis
2655 E. Chalet Circle
Sandy, UT 84093

Annie S. Kosec Trust
C/0 Richard Kosec
1776 Kenilworth Rd.
Helper, UT 84526

Blue Ridge Services LLC
Attn: Denise A Dragoo
Snell & Wilmer LLP
15 W. South Temple
Suite 1200
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

Church of Jesus Christ of LDS
LDS Church, Tax Division

50 E. North Temple

22" Floor, RE: 2A-0736

Salt Lake City, UT 84150

Alpine Board of Education
Alpine District

50 No. Center

American Fork, UT 84003

Alpine School District
Attn: Mr. Rob Smith

575 North 100 East
American Fork, UT 84003



7. Carbon County Recreation &
Transportation Special Service District
125 East Main
Price, UT 84501

8. Lutheran High School
2222 North Santiago Blvd
Orange, CA 92867
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DATE: 3/1/2010
WELL NAME: Alpine School District #6-17

FIELD: Clear Creek
DATA
Permanent Zero Point:..................... KB -7,934” GL-7919’
PBTD:...cuiiiiiiniinecnecienciecenecnnaannences 5,237 +/- MD
Casing Size, Weight, Depth:............... 5-1/2”, 17#, N-80 liner @ 2,009° — 5,825’
ID: 4.892” Drift: 4.653” Burst: 7,740 psi
7-5/8”,26.4#, J-55 @ 2,261°
ID: 6.969” Drift: 6.844” Burst: 4,140 psi
Tubing Size, Weight, Type: ............... 5,030° +/-x 2-7/8”, 6.5#, J-55, 8rd
ID: 2.441” Drift: 2.347” Burst: 7,260 psi
TOC: . uiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiieciiterestesreancennes 3,670’ +/- >90% bond (CBL dated 8/31/07)
| 1Y PSSP CBL dated 8/31/07, PND dated 8/31/07
| 5 o £ P PP Ferron: 5,080° — 5,260’ overall
SCOPE OF WORK

POH w/ existing equipment. Drill out 5-1/2” CIBP. RIH with 5-1/2” injection packer on
2-7/8” tbg. Convert well to SWD.

RECOMMENDED CONVERSION PROCEDURE

1. Notify proper agencies prior to commencing work to convert to SWD well.
2. MIRU well service company. NU well control equipment.
3. POH w/ existing production equipment.

4. RU pump, swivel, and tank. PU 4-3/4” bit and RIH on 2-7/8” tubing.
5. Drill out plug and wash down to 5,300 +/-. POH.

6. PU 5-1/2” x 2-7/8” tension set injection packer and RIH on 2-7/8”, 6.5#, J-55
8rd EUE tubing.

7. Load annulus with 165 bbls 2% KCI + 130 gals Champion Cortron 2383
inhibitor. Set Packer @ 5,030’.

8. Perform MIT on annulus. Pressure test to 400 psig for 30 minutes. Record
casing pressure on 0-1,000 psig chart with 1 hr clock. Record tubing pressure
manually every 5 minutes. Note ambient temperature at start of test. Have
proper agency witness test.

9. NU injection lines, meter. Install pressure gauge on annulus.



10. Secure well until final permit approval. Injection parameters are 15,000 bwpd
max rate, 400 psig max surface injection pressure.

11.  RDMO.



MARION
ENERGY

t

\0 AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING

I, Scott Jacoby, Associate Landman, Marion Energy, Inc. being first duly sworn, dispose and
state as follows:

On March 3, 2010, | caused to be mailed by certified, postage prepaid, return receipt
requested, letters informing all operators, surface and mineral owners within a half mile radius
of our Alpine School District 3 -17 well of Marion Energy’s intent to convert the aforementioned
well into a produced water injection well. A map depicting the area in question was also
attached to each letter as required by the Department of Oil, Gas and Mining, as set forth in
rule R649-5 pertaining to the requirements for injecting fluids into reservoirs and the permitting
of Class Il injection wells.

Dated the 3rd day of March, 2010

y 7
N/
Scott S. Jacoby
Associate Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

The forgoing affidavit was subscribed and sworn to me by Scott S. Jacoby
This _3rd__ day of _March , 2010.

%,

RO
w1 00e THERESA GANN
Notary Public, State of Texas

My Commission Expires

7
0,
%

.y

"0,

AW,
2

, Notary Public. LI October 10, 2010
My Commission expires:; day of , 20
RECEIVED
MAR 08 2010
Marion Energy Inc. DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200
McKinney, Texas 75069

Tel (972) 540-2967
Fax (972) 547-0442



Alpine School District 3 -17 (SWD)

Address of Operators within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

1. Northstargas, LC
C/O Steve Ault
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

2. Mobil Exp! & Producing No America Inc
P.O. Box 5444
Denver, CO 80217

3. Marion Energy
119 S. Tennessee
McKinney, TX 75069
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Alpine School District 3 - 17 (SWD)

Address of Mineral Owners within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

. Merrion Oil and Gas Corporation
610Reilly Ave
Farmington, NM 87401

. Northstargas, LC
C/O Steve Ault
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

. Summit Energy Partners Clear Creek,( LLC
1441 Ute Blvd

Suite 280

Park City, UT 84098

. Bureau of Land Management
Price Field Office

Attn: Don Stephens

125S. 600 W.

Price, UT 84501

. State of Utah

Trust Lands Administration
675 East 500 South

Suite 500

Salt Lake City, UT 84102



6. Reverse Exchange LLC
As title holder for
AOK Family Holding Trust,
Jana Gunderson, Trustee
341 North 1100 East
American Fork, UT 84003

7. Ms. Anastasia Daraban
1833 S. West Temple #1
Salt Lake City, UT 84115

8. Harvey Stone
155 Franklin Street
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

9. Mr. J Richard Bell
4632 Idlewild Road
Salt Lake City, UT 84124

10. Ms. Joni Buehner
350 Claude Drive
Santa Clara, CA 84765

11. Ms. Connie Condie
433 E. Vine Street
Murray UT, 84765

12. Ms. Connie Stauffer
8851 Edinburgh Circle
Highlands Ranch, CO 80129



13. Mr. John Nicolaides
5040 N. Second Street
Phoenix, AZ 85012

14. Mr. Paul Daraban
10104 Dunsinane
South Jordan, UT 84095

15. Mr. Michael Stathis
1579 S. East Canyon Drive
Cedar City, UT 84720

16. Mr. Tommy John Nicolaides
989 Military Drive
Salt Lake City, UT 84108

17. Mrs.' Hilda Hammond
2912 Redwood
Costa Mesa, CA 92626

18. Mary Louise Seamons
1774 South 340 East
Orem, UT 84058

19. Evelyn Jacobsen
** No Address Available

20. Leoan Gunderson
3990 Raymond
Ogden, UT 84403



21. Anthon Madsen
1821 Howell
Richland, WA 99354

22. Annie Andersen
1646 Snow Rd
Fort Sill, OK 73503

23. Dix Jensen
525 Woodhill Dr.
Price, UT 84501

24. Alice Pannier
1138 Michigan Ave.
Salt Lake City, UT 84105

25. Carbon County
120 East Main Street
Price, UT 84501

26.James T. Jensen
2961 N. Caitland Ct.
Salt Lake City, UT 84121

27.Jerry L. Jesen
1155 N. Carbonville Rd.
Price, UT 84501

28. Bonnie Lynne Jensen Stradling
18316 Highway 56
Sherman, TX 75902



29. Louise M. Watts
**No Address Available

30. Johannah Hafen
**No Address Available

31. Louise F. Seeley
**No Address Available

32. Estate of Lee Thomas
**No Address Available

33. Jack Thomas
Route 2
Preston, ID 83263



MINERAL OWNERSHIP PLAT

Asmic Ardersen
Louise Secley
Mary Louise Seamons
Julaninal Hafen
| Alice Fannicr

Dix Sensen
James lensen
Jerry Jensen
Bonnie Lynie lenscn
Hstate of Lo Thomas
Jack Thomuas

Northstargas, L.C.
Moerrion Qil and Gas
C&B Energy
Summit Energy Partners \

Northstargas, LiC.
Reverse Iixchange LLC

Harvey A. Stong

TALON RESOURCES., INC.
/ 615 V. 400 E., PA). Bax 1230
/ Huntugron, Utah 84528
1 Z . Phone (4356875310 Fua (4356875311
- #'Tommy John Nicolaides / E-Mail talony cts.net

Anastasia Daraban

Connic Condic
_ Connie Stauller

Michad S ; @ Marion Energy Inc.
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Alpine School District 3 -17 (SWD)

Address of Surface Owners within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

Liodakis Ranch LLC
George E. Liodakis
2655 E. Chalet Circle
Sandy, UT 84093

Annie S. Kosec Trust
C/0 Richard Kosec
1776 Kenilworth Rd.
Helper, UT 84526

Blue Ridge Services LLC
Attn: Denise A Dragoo
Snell & Wilmer LLP
15 W. South Temple
Suite 1200
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

Church of Jesus Christ of LDS
LDS Church, Tax Division

50 E. North Temple

22" Floor, RE: 2A-0736

Salt Lake City, UT 84150

Alpine Board of Education
Alpine District

50 No. Center

American Fork, UT 84003

Alpine School District
Attn: Mr. Rob Smith

575 North 100 East
American Fork, UT 84003



7. Carbon County Recreation &
Transportation Special Service District
125 East Main
Price, UT 84501

8. Lutheran High School
2222 North Santiago Blvd
Orange, CA 92867
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MARION
ENERGY

March 10, 2010

Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining
ATTN: Chris Kierst

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah

84116

RE: Additional Logs Pertaining to the Alipne School District 3-17
and the Alipne School District 6-17
Clear Creek Unit 13S-7E and 14S-7E, Carbon and Emery Counties, Utah

Dear Chris

Please find enclosed copies of additional logs that pertain to the Alpine School District
3-17 and the Alpine School District 6-17 wells. These logs had not been previously
uploaded to the DOGM website. Also included is a CD that contains the
aforementioned logs in digital format.

Additionally, the Cement Bond Log for the ASD #3-17 should be avallable on the
DOGM web site.

If you require any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at (972) 540-
2967 ext. 3004 or email bevans@marionenergy.com \

Sincerely,

R

Benjamin Evans
Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

DIV. OF OIL, gas & MINING

8290 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 186, Las Vegas, Nevada, 89117
Telephone: (702) 838-0716, Fax: (702) 838-5087



UIC INJECTION PERMIT ANALY SIS FORM
WELL NAME: Alpine School District 3-17 (4300731182)
R649-5-2. Requirements For Class II Injection Wells Including Completed Items, Needed Items, & Comments
Water Disposal, Storage And Enhanced Recovery Wells.

1. Injection wells shall be completed, equipped, operated, and 1. OK
maintained in a manner that will prevent pollution and damage to
any USDW, or other resources and will confine injected fluids to
the interval approved.

2. The application for an injection well shall include a properly 2. OK
completed UIC Form 1 and the following:

2.1. A plat showing the location of the injection well, all 2.1 OK(Rec'd on 3/8/10)
abandoned or active wells within a one-half mile radius of the
proposed well, and the surface owner and the operator of any
lands or producing leases, respectively, within a one-half mile
radius of the proposed injection well.

2.2. Copies of electrical or radioactive logs, including gamma ray 22 OK
logs, for the proposed well run prior to the installation of casing ’
and indicating resistivity, spontaneous potential, caliper, and

porosity.

2.3. A copy of a cement bond or comparable log run for the

proposed injection well after casing was set and cemented. 23 OK
2.4. Copies of logs already on file with the division should be 24 OK

referenced, but need not be refiled.

2.5. A description of the casing or proposed casing program of 25 Needed.
the injection well and of the proposed method for testing the
casing before use of the well.

2.6. A statement as to the type of fluid to be used for injection, its 2.6 Needed.
source and estimated amounts to be injected daily.

2.7. Standard laboratory analyses of (1) the fluid to be injected, 2.7 Needed.
(2) the fluid in the formation into which the fluid is being
injected, and (3) the compatibility of the fluids.

2.8. The proposed average and maximum injection pressures. 2.8 Otherwise OK, but an average injection pressure

t be ten .
2.9. Evidence and data to support a finding that the proposed 2.9 rlrl‘::ded. endered

injection well will not initiate fractures through the overlying
strata or a confining interval that could enable the injected fluid
or formation fluid to enter the fresh water strata.

2.10. Appropriate geological data on the injection interval and
confining beds, and nearby Underground Sources of Drinking
Water, including the geologic name, lithologic description,

2.10 The geologic submission needs to be augmented
with additional information to be detailed separately

thickness, depth, water quality, and lateral extent; also in an email.

information relative to geologic structure near the proposed well

which may effect the conveyance and/or storage of the injected

fluids.

2.11. A review of the mechanical condition of each well within a 2.11The §idetrack wellbore calfed the 6‘1?'_2 needg to be
one-half mile radius of the proposed injection well to assure that considered as a vector for escape of injectate in any
no conduit exists that could enable fluids to migrate up or down analysis of this sort as well as both of the proposed
the wellbore and enter improper intervals. SWD wellbores.

2.12. An affidavit certifying that a copy of the application has 2.12 OK

been provided to all operators, owners and surface owners within

a one-half mile radius of the proposed injection well.

2.13. Any other additional information that the board or division 213 OK

may determine is necessary to adequately review the application.

OTHER COMMENTS AND OBSERVATIONS: The items listed in red will need to be tendered and acceptable before a UIC Class I
Injection Permit can be issued. It is suggested that the geologist and engineer responsible for assembling the required submissions contact me
[(801)538-5337] if they have any doubt regarding the needed content.

Reviewed by: Christopher J. Kierst Date: _3/15/2010,




Page 1 of 1

Chris Kierst - ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Permit Analysis Documents and additional
def‘ mtlon of needed documentatlon
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From: Chris Kierst
To: kclarke@marionenergy.com
Subject: ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Permit AnaIyS|s Documents and addltlonal definition of needed documentation

The deficiencies cited in each of the Permit analysis docs are item #s 2.5 through 2.11, inclusive.

Taking them seriatim, Item # 2.5 specifies submission of what is essentially a standard annotated engineering
casing schematic. In addition, any well modifications toward conversion to a Salt Water Disposal well and
subsequent mechanical integrity testing should be elucidated in a proposed engineering procedure.

Item #2.6 is satisfied by a statement identifying that the well will be injecting Ferron Sandstone (Member of the
Mancos Shale) produced water from Clear Creek Field and the estimated normal daily injected volume.

Item #2.7 is satisfied by standard oilfield lab analyses (to include TDS) of the proposed injectate (a composite
Field water sample is acceptable in lieu of several individual well analyses), the connate water from the injection
zone in each of the respective proposed SWD wellbores and a scaling tendency (compatibility) analysis of the
respective connate/injectate mixtures.

Item #2.8 requires a statement estimating the normal daily operational injection pressure in addition to the
maximum injection pressure that you have already suggested on your UIC Form - 1. Incidentally, the max
injection pressure isn't necessarily exactly what you'll wind up with, but it's a good starting request.

Item #2.9 is generally satisfied by the results from a Step Rate Test. The test must be rigorously carried out.
Standards of acceptability exist (from USEPA) and I have a copy that I can send you if you wish,

The geologic documentation specific to Item 2.10 was already discussed today. To recapitulate, we want to
augment and extend the E-W cross section and N-S cross section, expand the area of the structure map on the
Ferron to include all cross section wells and post the lines of section on it. The cross sections will be modified
for better viewability. One thing I neglected to touch on during our conversation with John Pinkerton is the
need for higher resolution so I can blow the exhibits up by plotting them on our 42" width plotter, for wall
copies if need arises, without losing detail. On the 11 X 17 size emailed cross sections with multiple logs, some
of the logs have a pink or gray cast, probably an artifact of log reduction and reproduction. I would prefer that
the log traces be black on white for contrast with the influence of the log scaling grid (when reduced) minimized
for viewability. These things are hard on the eyes. I really don't need computer processed logs or color
banding over the log correlations. The correlations will suffice with simple annotated line depictions and the log
computer processing only clutters things up at this scale. Please be sure to include scale blocks on the logs that
I can read when I blow the cross sections up.

Item #2.11 requires a professional engineer's analysis of any wellbore within the half mile Area of Review as a
potential vector for the escape of injected produced water into suprajacent fresh water bearing aquifers. This
would include the sidetracked hole (junked?) designated as ASD 6-17-2 as well as the other candidate SWD
wellbores.

about:blank | 3/16/2010
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Present Completion

API: 43-007-31182
GL: 7,919
KB: 7,934’

Alpine School District #3-17

Casing Strings:

13-3/8", 46# , K-55 @ 490'
Cmtd w/ 1200 sx
TOC @ surface

9-5/8", 364, J-55 @ 3,142
Cmtd w/ 695 sx
TOC @ surface

7' Production, 26#, K-55 @ 5,311
Cmtd w/ 750 sx
TOC @ 2,500' +/- (>90% bond)

11/19/07: PBTD @ 5,270’

Spud Date: 7/3/07
TD Date: 7/30/07
Comp Date: 11/30/07

559 5563

TD = 5,340' MD, 4,628' TVD

Updated : 11/17/2009

LOCATION:
Clear Creek

SW SE SW Sec 8 (BHL)

SW NW NE (surface)
Sec. 17 T13S R7E
Carbon County, UT

Tubing String:

144jts. 2-7/8 j-55 =4586.54'
1 Sub Pump= 56.67"

K.B. =14'

E.O.T. @4657.21

Bluegate

3,800'-3,906' (4 spf)

11/07: 630g 7-1/2% HCl w/ balls
11/07: 840g 7-1/2% HCI and 83,220#
20/40 sand in x-link gel

Test: 16 mcfd, 300 bwpd

3/08: SQZ 3,800'-3,906', Drill out.

Ferron
4,300'-4,310",4,524'-4,540',4,550'-4,560",
4,578'-4,588",4,772'-4,782',4,786'-4,794'
10/07: 2,750g 7-1/2% HCL and 122,467 #'s
16/30 sand in x-link gel

Test: 150 mcfd, 250 bwpd




Saturation Index Calculations Marion Energy & Gordon Creek

%} Cha mplgn Champion Technologies, Inc. Compatibility Test
ﬁ Te C hnO |Og 1es (Based on the Tomson-Oddo Model)
Sample Date Comments
Zrine 1 - Gordon Creek / Thunderbird 19-14-8/18-14-8B 13-Jan-2009
Brine 2 : Marion / Alpine School District 03-17 12-Jan-2009
Brine 3 Marion / Alpine School District 08-17 12-Jan-2009
Brines I Mixing Ratio as %
Brine 1 10 20 70 70 40 30 30 50 25 25
Component 10 2 § 25 50
70 [ 70 10 20 30 30 40 | 25 25 50
Calcium, Ca*|mg/| 43 35 28 I 40 39 36 35 35] 37 35 34
Magnesium, Mqg*2img/I 11 1 2 3 4 8 8 5 4 4 6 4 4
Barium, Ba*?|mg/I 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Strontium, Sr*{mg/! 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Tron, Fe*?|mg/! 1 40 1 9 5 9 5 13 17 13 11 21 11
Carbonate, CO52|mg/I 0 132 264 211 198 53 66 119 132 145 99 132 165
Bicarbonate, HCO4™ |mg/I 4,050 2.440 2.928 2,943 3,104 3,616 3,665 3,230 3,069 3,118 3,367 2,965 3,087
Sulfate, SO42|mg/I 4 8 48 36 35 9 13 18 19 23 16 7 27
Chloride, Cly|mg/! 10.380 3.040 4,040 4,474 5,208 8,278 8,378 6,276 5,542 5,642 6,960 5125 5,375
CO, in Brine|mg/I 480 1 1 47 93 322 322 185 139 139 231 116 116
Ionic Strength 0.36 0.13 0.16 0.18 0.20 0.29 0.30 0.23 0.21 0.21 0.25 0.19 0.20
Temperature|°F 85 85 g5 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85
Pressure |psia 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100
Tomson-Oddo Saturation Index
Calcite; CaCO,f -0.48 2.16 2.13 0.45 0.16 -0.34 -0.35 -0.12 0.00 0.00 -0.21 0.09 0.08
Gypsum; CaS0,4-2H,0 N/A I/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Hemihydrate; CaS04-1/2H,0 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Anhydrite; CaSO, N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Barite; BaSO, N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Celestite; SrS0, N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
P(Pounds Per)T(Thousand)B(Barrels)
Calcite; CaCO, N/A 30.4 24.3 17.3 8.2 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 5.8 4.6
Gypsum; CaSO,4-2H,0 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Hemihydrate; CaSO4-1/2H,0f  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Anhydrite; CaSO,| N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A ~N/A NA | NA
Barite; BaSO, N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Celestite; SrSO, N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Compatibility.xls

Confidential
Champion Technologies, Inc.
Vernal District Technical Services

Three Brings (CO2 in Bring)
1/27/2009
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TABLE 2 - TRAVEL TIMES AND AMPLITUDES FOR FREE PIPE
(3 FT RECEIVER)

CASING | CASING TRAVEL TIME (ps) AMPLITUDE
SIZE WEIGHT {mV)
(in) (1b/ft) 1-11/16" TOOL 3-5/8" TOOL

9.5 252 233 81

-1/ 11.6 250 232 81
13.5 249 230 81

15.0 257 238 76

> 18.0 255 236 76
20.3 253 235 76

15.5 266 248 72

5-1/2 17.0 265 247 72
20.0 264 245 72

23.0 262 243 72

23.0 291 271 62

26.0 289 270 62

. 29.0 288 268 62
32.0 286 267 62

35.0 284 265 62

- 38.0 283 264 62
26.4 301 281 59

os/8 29.7 299 280 59
33.7 297 278 59

39.0 295 276 59

40.0 333 313 51

9-5/8 43.5 332 311 51
47.0 330 310 51

53.5 328 309 51

40.5 354 333 48

10-3/4 45.5 352 332 48
51.0 350 330 48

'51.5 349 328 48

FCD:March 31, 1994:RCT/RCT/k:\cbl.sop.

!
. Printed on Recycled Paper



Marion Energy Formation and Fault Picks for the ASD 3-17 and ASD 6-17

Formation picks for tops and faults (measured depth and subsea TVD)

Well APl KB (feet) lDepths Blackhawk [Star Point |Emery|Bluegate Shale |Ferron jTunuck Shale |Fault_1|Fault_2
iSro | “3o0v Feoy {222 B T

Alpine School District 3-17 43007311820000 7933{MD Eroded off |Surface 1210 2391 4372 5119] 1641 3110
SSTVD 6723 55531 4005 3488 6292| 4896

Alpine School District 6-17 43007311810000 7930|MD Eroded off |Surface 1209 2275] 4866 56011 1615 3080
SSTVD 6723 57801 4107 3614] 6333 5199




UIC INJECTION PERMIT ANALYSIS FORM
WELL NAME: Alpine School District 3-17 (4300731182)

R649-5-2. Requirements For Class II Injection Wells Including
Water Disposal, Storage And Enhanced Recovery Wells.

1. Injection wells shall be completed, equipped, operated, and
maintained in a manner that will prevent pollution and damage to
any USDW, or other resources and will confine injected fluids to
the interval approved.

2. The application for an injection well shall include a properly
completed UIC Form 1 and the following;:

2.1. A plat showing the location of the injection well, all
abandoned or active wells within a one-half mile radius of the
proposed well, and the surface owner and the operator of any
lands or producing leases, respectively, within a one-half mile
radius of the proposed injection well.

2.2. Copies of electrical or radioactive logs, including gamma ray
logs, for the proposed well run prior to the installation of casing
and indicating resistivity, spontaneous potential, caliper, and
porosity.

2.3. A copy of a cement bond or comparable log run for the
proposed injection well after casing was set and cemented.

2.4, Copies of logs already on file with the division should be
referenced, but need not be refiled.

2.5. A description of the casing or proposed casing program of
the injection well and of the proposed method for testing the
casing before use of the well.

2.6. A statement as to the type of fluid to be used for injection, its
source and estimated amounts to be injected daily.

2.7. Standard laboratory analyses of (1) the fluid to be injected,
(2) the fluid in the formation into which the fluid is being
injected, and (3) the compatibility of the fluids.

2.8. The proposed average and maximum injection pressures.

2.9. Evidence and data to support a finding that the proposed
injection well will not initiate fractures through the overlying
strata or a confining interval that could enable the injected fluid
or formation fluid to enter the fresh water strata.

2.10. Appropriate geological data on the injection interval and
confining beds, and nearby Underground Sources of Drinking
Water, including the geologic name, lithologic description,
thickness, depth, water quality, and lateral extent; also
information relative to geologic structure near the proposed well
which may effect the conveyance and/or storage of the injected
fluids.

2.11. A review of the mechanical condition of each well within a
one-half mile radius of the proposed injection well to assure that
no conduit exists that could enable fluids to migrate up or down
the wellbore and enter improper intervals.

2.12. An affidavit certifying that a copy of the application has
been provided to all operators, owners and surface owners within
a one-half mile radius of the proposed injection well.

2.13. Any other additional information that the board or division
may determine is necessary to adequately review the application.

Completed Items, Needed Items, & Comments

1. OK

2. OK

2.1 OK (Recd on 3/8/10)

22 OK

23 OK

24 OK

2.5 OK but we will likely require the MIT be run at 1000# .
rather than 400#.

26 OK

2.7 Needed and must be witnessed

2.8 OK

2.9 OK but you'll need to document the zero pressure
condition.

2.10 | will try to use the additional geologic materials you
sent. | suspect we had a minor misunderstanding
during the phone conversation and they aren’t quite
as long as | would have preferred, but if | need them
modified I'll let you know.

2.11 0K

2.12 OK

2.13 OK

OTHER COMMENTS AND OBSERVATIONS: The items listed in red will need to be tendered and acceptable before a UIC Class II

Injection Permit can be issued. It is suggested that the geologist and engineer responsible for assembling the required submissions contact me
[(801)538-5337] if they have any doubt regarding the needed content.

Reviewed by: Christopher J. Kierst Date: _4/12/2010
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Date:

Alpine School District 3-17 (4300731182)
Alpine School District 6-17 (4300731181)

UIC INJECTION PERMIT ANALYSIS FORM
FOLLOW-UP RESPONSE

3/24/10

Following are responses to comments regarding UIC Form 1 submitted by Marion
Energy, Inc. on 3/1/2010.

2.5

2.6:

2.7

2.8:

2.9:

2.10:

See attached wellbore schematic with present and proposed wellbore schematics.

The injected fluid shall be produced water from multiple wells within the Clear
Creek Federal Unit, all having a source of water from the Ferron Sandstone.
Estimated daily injection volume is 2,000 bwpd, increasing to 15,000 bwpd as
additional wells are brought online. Estimated daily average injection pressure is
0 (zero) psig, maximum surface injection pressure is 400 psig.

Produced and injected water samples are to be submitted separately. Mixing
ratios for produced water to injected water is proposed to be 25/75, 50/50, 75/25.
The analysis shall include TDS and scaling tendency.

Estimated daily average injection pressure is 0 (zero) psig, maximum surface
injection pressure is 400 psig.

Cross sections provided by Marion Energy, Inc. demonstrate confining shale
barriers above and below the Ferron member of the Mancos Formation. The
shales above the Ferron belong to the Bluegate Shale Member of the Mancos
Formation and those below belong to the Tunuck Shale Member of the Mancos
Formation. Both shales have considerable thickness and are known to be
regionally pervasive. These characteristics are considered in lieu of an initial
step rate test. The impermeable nature of the shales is suitable for the
confinement of the injectate within the Ferron Sandstone. It is also anticipated
the ASD 3-17 will have zero surface injection pressure during early period
injection. This will not allow delta P vs delta Q to be plotted accurately. Marion
proposes an initial Maximum Surface Injection pressure of 400 psig, and could
perform a step rate test if the well demonstrates stabilized positive pressure before
400 psig is achieved.

At the request of the DOGM the originally submitted geologic displays were
augmented to improve clarity for the viewer. Paper and digital (PDF) copies of
the displays are included and it should be noted the PDF files when zoomed in
show better clarity of the log curves then do the paper copies. The following
displays are being resubmitted for approval
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2.11:

1) Ferron structure map of the northern two-thirds of the Clear Creek Federal Unit
showing cross-section lines North-South and West-East.

2) Structural cross-sections North-South and West-East illustrating the structural
position of the Ferron Sandstone between the known confining shales of the
Bluegate and Tunuck and the structural position of the known fresh-water bearing
formations of the Star Point and Blackhawk.

3) Detailed stratigraphic correlations (A-A’ and B-B’) of the Ferron Formation
showing lateral continuity.

4) Single well log strips showing digital log curves for the ASD #6-17 and ASD
#3-17. Due to the deviated nature of both wells they were logged with cased-

hole tools only.

A review of wells within a ¥ mile radius of the prospective injection candidates
prosp j

yield the following:

Alpine School District 3-17:

No wellbore is within % mile radius of the Alpine School District 3-17, as
measured from the top of the Ferron, laterally to adjacent wellbores. The closest
well is the Alpine School District 6-17, which measures approximately 3,337
laterally between tops of the Ferron Sand.

Alpine School District 6-17:

The only wellbore within % mile radius of the Alpine School District 6-17 is the
sidetrack, 6-17-2. TD of the sidetrack is 5,164> MD. The sidetracked wellbore
was plugged back with cement and kicked off at 2,350 MD. The cement plug in
the side track wellbore provides a barrier to escaping injected fluids.
Approximately 695° of cemented 7-5/8” casing has greater than 90% bond, all
above the kick off point. Inside the 7-5/8” casing, a 5-1/2” liner has
approximately 1,320 feet of cement bond greater than 90% above the kick off
point. The potential vector for escaping injection fluids is therefore bound by a)
cement plug back of sidetracked wellbore, b) substantial cement of good bond
quality behind 7-5/8” casing, c) substantial cement of good bond quality behind 5-
1/2” casing, and d) geologic data presented (see 2.9 above), detailing permeability
barriers in the geologic column.




DATE: 3/1/2010
WELL NAME: Alpine School District #3-17

FIELD: Clear Creek
DATA
Permanent Zero Point:......covceveeeecnnns KB -7,934” GL-7.919°
PBTD:...ccciiiieiiiiiiiceienecnacrcanaans 5,270 MD (11-19-07)
Casing Size, Weight, Depth................ 77, 26#, K-55, 8rd @ 5,311°

ID: 6.366” Drift: 6.241” Burst: 4,360 psi
Tubing Size, Weight, Type: ............... 4,250’ x 2-7/8”, 6.5#, 8rd

ID: 2.441” Drift: 2.347” Burst: 7,260 psi
TOC: i iiiiiiiiiiiiiiieiceeteensccasannes 2,500’ +/- >90% bond CBL dated 8/30/07
| 117N CBL dated 8/30/07, PND dated 8/30/07
| i) o 1 OO Ferron: 4,300° — 4,794 overall
SCOPE OF WORK

POH w/ existing equipment. RIH with 7” injection packer on 2-7/8” tbg. Convert well
to SWD.

RECOMMENDED CONVERSION PROCEDURE

1. Notify proper agencies prior to commencing work to convert to SWD well.
2. MIRU well service company. NU well control equipment.
3. POH w/ existing production equipment.

4. PU 7” x 2-7/8” injection packer and RIH on 2-7/8”, 6.5#, J-55, *rd EUE
tubing. Hydrotest running in hole to 4,000 psig.

5. Land Packer @ 4,250° +/- . Load annulus w/ 128 bbls 2% KCl water + 100
gals Champion Chemical Cortron 2383 inhibitor.

6. Perform MIT on annulus. Pressure test to 400 psig for 30 minutes Record
casing pressure on 0-1,000 psig chart with 1 hr clock. Record tubing pressure
manually every 5 minutes. Note ambient temperature at start of test. Have
proper agency witness test.

7. NU injection lines, meter. Install pressure gauge on annulus.

8. Secure well until final permit approval. Injection parameters are 15,000 bwpd
max rate, 400 psig max surface injection pressure.

9. RDMO.



Proposed Completion

API: 43-007-31182
GL. 7919
KB: 7,934'

Casing Strings:

13-3/8", 46# , K-55 @ 490'
Cmtd w/ 1200 sx
TOC @ surface

9-5/8", 364, J-55 @ 3,142’
Cmtd w/ 695 sx
TOC @ surface

7" Production, 264, K-55 @ 5,311'
ID: 6.366", Drift: 6.421, Burst: 4,360 psi

Cmtd w/ 750 sx

TOC @ 2,500' +/- (>90% bond)

11/19/07: PBTD @ $,270'

Spud Date: 7/3/07
TD Date: 7/30/07
Comp Date: 11/30/07

|

Alpine School District #3-17
Proposed SWD

]

TD = §5,340' MD, 4,628' TVD

Updated : 2/25/2010

LOCATION:
Clear Creek
SW SE SW Sec 8 (BHL)
SW NW NE (surface)
Sec, 17 TI3S R7E
Carbon County, UT

Tubing String:

4.250' x 2-7/8", 6.5#, J-55, 8rd
Hydrotested to 4,000 psi

ID: 2.441" Drift: 2.347" Burst: 7,260 psi

Packer:

7" x 2-7/8" tension packer @ 4,250'
Annulus filled w/ 128 bbls 2% KCl and
100 gals Champion Cortron 2383 inhibitor

Capacity:

2-7/8" tbg: 00579 bbl/ft (24.6 bbls)

7" csg: 0382 bbl/ft (2013 bbls)

2-7/8" x 7" Annulus: 0302 bbl/ft (128.4 bbls)

PSI Test:

Pressure test tubing/casing annulus to

400 psig for 30 minutes using chart recorder
and witnessed.

Rate and Injection Pressure:
Max rate = 15,000 bwpd
Max surface injection pressure = 400 psig

Bluegate

3,800'-3,906' (4 spf)

11/07: 630g 7-1/2% HCl w/ balls
11/07: 840g 7-1/2% HC! and 83,220#
20/40 sand in x-link gel

Test: 16 mcfd, 300 bwpd

3/08: SQZ 3,800%-3,906', Drill out.

Ferron
4,300-4,310',4,524'-4,540',4,550'-4,560',
4,578'-4,588" 4,772'-4,782',4,786"-4,794'
10/07: 2,750g 7-1/2% HCL and 122,467 #'s
16/30 sand in x-link gel

Test: 150 mcfd, 250 bwpd

Fill

Cement

CIBP

Retainer

Packer

TAC

Perfs

On / Off Tool
F & Profile Nipple

Insert pump & SN

Mule shoe mud anchor

Profile Nipple w/ plug in place
Blanking plug
: I Profile Nipple

Orange peeled mud anchor

Sliding sleeve

Hydraulic
pump cavity

Elect. Submersible Pump
J Gas lift valve
Gravel

Pack
Screen

= X
L [



BEFORE THE BOARD OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
STATE OF UTAH

---00000---

IN THE MATTER OF THE REQUEST

FOR AGENCY ACTION OF MARION

ENERGY, INC. FOR AN ORDER :

GRANTING AN AQUIFER EXEMPTION NOTICE OF HEARING
AND APPROVING THE CONVERSION

OF THE ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT

#3-17 WELL LOCATED IN SECTION 17,  : Docket No. 2010-020
TOWNSHIP 13 SOUTH, RANGE 7 EAST, Cause No. UIC-362.2
CARBON COUNTY, UTAH, TO A CLASS
11 INJECTION WELL.

---00000---

THE STATE OF UTAH TO ALL PERSONS INTERESTED IN THE FOLLOWING
MATTER.

Notice is hereby given that the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (“Board”), State of Utah,
will conduct a hearing on WEDNESDAY, April 28, 2010, at 9:00 AM, or as soon thereafter as
possible, in the auditorium of the Department of Natural Resources, 1594 West North Temple,
Salt Lake City, Utah.

The hearing will be conducted as a formal administrative adjudication in accordance with
the rules of the Board as set forth in Utah Administrative Code R641 et seq. as provided for by
Utah Code Ann. § 40-6-1 et seq. and Utah Code Ann. § 63G-4-101 through 601.

The purpose of the hearing will be for the Board to receive testimony and evidence
regarding a Request for Agency Action that the Board enter an Order:

1. Granting an aquifer exemption for the selected zones in the Ferron Sandstone Member of
the Mancos Shale Formation and approving the Alpine School District #3-17 well as a Class II
injection well; and

2. Providing such other relief as may be just and equitable under the circumstances.

Objections to the Request for Agency Action must be filed with the Secretary of the
Board at the address listed below no later than the 10th day of the month, or two weeks before
the scheduled hearing, whichever is earlier. A party must file a timely written objection or other
response in order to participate as a party at the Board hearing,

Natural persons may appear and represent themselves before the Board. All other
representation by parties before the Board will be by attorneys licensed to practice law in the



State of Utah, or attorneys licensed to practice law in another jurisdiction which meet the rules
of the Utah State Bar for practicing law before the Utah Courts.

Persons interested in this matter may participate pursuant to the procedural rules of the
Board. The Request for Agency Action, and any subsequent pleadings, may be inspected at the
office of the undersigned.

Pursuant to the Americans with Disabilities Act, persons requiring auxiliary
communicative aids and services to enable them to participate in this hearing should call
Julie Ann Carter at (801) 538-5277, at least three working days prior to the hearing date.

DATED this 30th day of March, 2010.

STATE OF UTAH
BOARD OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
Douglas E. Johnson, Chairman

\ T

/sl Julie Carter

Secretary to the Board

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

(801) 538-5277



CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I caused a true and correct copy of the foregoing NOTICE OF
HEARING for Docket No. 2010-020, Cause No. UIC-362.2 to be mailed with postage prepaid,
this 31st day of March, 2010, to the following:

Matthew L. Crockett

Relma M. Miller

Beatty & Wozniak, P.C.

216 Sixteenth Street, Suite 1100
Denver, CO 80202

Michael S. Johnson

Megan DePaulis

Assistant Attorneys General

Utah Board of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 300
Salt Lake City, UT 84116

[Via Email]

Steven F. Alder

Fred Donaldson

Assistant Attorneys General

Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 300
Salt Lake City, UT 84116

[Via Email]

Marion Energy, Inc.

€/o Keri Clarke, Vice President
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, TX 75069

Bureau of Land Management
Price Field Office

Attn: Don Stephens

125 S. 600 W.

Price, UT 84501

Bureau of Land Management
Utah State Office

Attn: Becky J. Hammond

P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

Alpine Board of Education
Alpine District

50 No. Center

American Fork, UT 84003

State of Utah

LaVonne Garrison

Trust Lands Administration
675 East 500 South

Suite 500

Salt Lake City, UT 84102

Carbon County Recreation &
Transportation Special Service District
125 East Main

Price, UT 84501

Bruce Suchomel

UIC Program

USEPA Region 8 (P-W-GW)
1595 Wynkoop St.

Denver, CO 80202-1129

Church of Jesus Christ of LDS
LDS Church, Tax Division

50 E. North Temple

22nd Floor, RE: 2A-0736

Salt Lake City, UT 84150

Merrion Oil and Gas Corporation
610 Reilly Ave
Farmington, NM 87401

Liodakis Ranch LLC
George E. Liodakis
2655 E. Chalet Circle
Sandy, UT 84093



Annie S. Kosec Trust
C/0 Richard Kosec
1776 Kenilworth Rd.
Helper, UT 84526

Northstargas, LC
C/O Steve Ault
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

Blue Ridge Services LLC
Attn: Denise A Dragoo
Snell & Wilmer LLP

15 W. South Temple
Suite 1200

Salt Lake City, UT 84101

Summit Energy Partners Clear Creek, LLC
1441 Ute Blvd

Suite 280

Park City, UT 84098

Reverse Exchange LLC

As title holder for

AOK Family Holding Trust,
Jana Gunderson, Trustee
341 North 1100 East
American Fork, UT 84003

Lutheran High School
2222 North Santiago Blvd
Orange, CA 92867

Ms. Anastasia Daraban
1833 S. West Temple #1
Salt Lake City, UT 84115

Harvey Stone

155 Franklin Street
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

Mr. J Richard Bell
4632 Idlewild Road
Salt Lake City, UT 84124

Ms. Joni Buehner
350 Claude Drive
Santa Clara, CA 84765

Ms. Connie Condie
433 E. Vine Street
Murray UT, 84765

Ms. Connie Stauffer
8851 Edinburgh Circle
Highlands Ranch, CO 80129

MTr. John Nicolaides
5040 N. Second Street
Phoenix, AZ 85012

Mr. Paul Daraban
10104 Dunsinane
South Jordan, UT 84095

Mr. Michael Stathis
1579 S. East Canyon Drive
Cedar City, UT 84720

Mr. Tommy John Nicolaides
989 Military Drive
Salt Lake City, UT 84108

Mrs. Hilda Hammond
2912 Redwood
Costa Mesa, CA 92626

Mary Louise Seamons
1774 South 340 East
Orem, UT 84058

Leoan Gunderson
3990 Raymond
Ogden, UT 84403

Anthon Madsen
1821 Howell
Richland, WA 99354



Annie Andersen
1646 Snow Rd
Fort Sill, OK 73503

Dix Jensen
525 Woodhill Dr.
Price, UT 84501

Alice Pannier
1138 Michigan Ave.
Salt Lake City, UT 84105

Carbon County
120 East Main Street
Price, UT 84501

James T. Jensen
2961 N. Caitland Ct.
Salt Lake City, UT 84121

Jerry L. Jesen
1155 N. Carbonville Rd.
Price, UT 84501

Bonnie Lynne Jensen Stradling
18316 Highway 56
Sherman, TX 75902

Jack Thomas
Route 2
Preston, ID 83263

s A (T



CERTIFICATE OF PUBLISHED NOTICE

I hereby certify that I caused a true and correct copy of the foregoing NOTICE OF
HEARING for Docket No. 2010-020, Cause No. UIC-362.2 to be PUBLISHED in the following
newspapers on the following days:

April 4, 2010:
The Salt Lake Tribune and Deseret Morning News, newspapers of
general circulation in Salt Lake City and County.

April 1, 2010:
Sun Advocate, a newspaper of general circulation in Carbon County.
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Date:

Page 1

Alpine School District 3-17 (4300731182)
Alpine School District 6-17 (4300731181)

UIC INJECTION PERMIT ANALYSIS FORM
FOLLOW-UP RESPONSE

3/24/10

Following are responses to comments regarding UIC Form 1 submitted by Marion
Energy, Inc. on 3/1/2010.

2.5:

2.6:

2.7:

2.8:

2.9:

2.10:

See attached wellbore schematic with present and proposed wellbore schematics.

The injected fluid shall be produced water from multiple wells within the Clear
Creek Federal Unit, all having a source of water from the Ferron Sandstone.
Estimated daily injection volume is 2,000 bwpd, increasing to 15,000 bwpd as
additional wells are brought online. Estimated daily average injection pressure is
0 (zero) psig, maximum surface injection pressure is 400 psig.

Produced and injected water samples are to be submitted separately. Mixing
ratios for produced water to injected water is proposed to be 25/75, 50/50, 75/25.
The analysis shall include TDS and scaling tendency.

Estimated daily average injection pressure is 0 (zero) psig, maximum surface
injection pressure is 400 psig.

Cross sections provided by Marion Energy, Inc. demonstrate confining shale
barriers above and below the Ferron member of the Mancos Formation. The
shales above the Ferron belong to the Bluegate Shale Member of the Mancos
Formation and those below belong to the Tunuck Shale Member of the Mancos
Formation. Both shales have considerable thickness and are known to be
regionally pervasive. These characteristics are considered in lieu of an initial
step rate test. The impermeable nature of the shales is suitable for the
confinement of the injectate within the Ferron Sandstone. It is also anticipated
the ASD 3-17 will have zero surface injection pressure during early period
injection. This will not allow delta P vs delta Q to be plotted accurately. Marion
proposes an initial Maximum Surface Injection pressure of 400 psig, and could
perform a step rate test if the well demonstrates stabilized positive pressure before
400 psig is achieved.

At the request of the DOGM the originally submitted geologic displays were
augmented to improve clarity for the viewer. Paper and digital (PDF) copies of
the displays are included and it should be noted the PDF files when zoomed in
show better clarity of the log curves then do the paper copies. The following
displays are being resubmitted for approval
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1) Ferron structure map of the northern two-thirds of the Clear Creek Federal Unit
showing cross-section lines North-South and West-East.

2) Structural cross-sections North-South and West-East illustrating the structural
position of the Ferron Sandstone between the known confining shales of the
Bluegate and Tunuck and the structural position of the known fresh-water bearing
formations of the Star Point and Blackhawk.

3) Detailed stratigraphic correlations (A-A’ and B-B’) of the Ferron Formation
showing lateral continuity.

4) Single well log strips showing digital log curves for the ASD #6-17 and ASD
#3-17. Due to the deviated nature of both wells they were logged with cased-
hole tools only.

2.11: A review of wells within a % mile radius of the prospective injection candidates
yield the following:

Alpine School District 3-17:

| No wellbore is within %2 mile radius of the Alpine School District 3-17, as
measured from the top of the Ferron, laterally to adjacent wellbores. The closest
well is the Alpine School District 6-17, which measures approximately 3,337
laterally between tops of the Ferron Sand.

' Alpine School District 6-17:

The only wellbore within % mile radius of the Alpine School District 6-17 is the

sidetrack, 6-17-2. TD of the sidetrack is 5,164” MD. The sidetracked wellbore

' was plugged back with cement and kicked off at 2,350 MD. The cement plug in

‘ the side track wellbore provides a barrier to escaping injected fluids.
Approximately 695’ of cemented 7-5/8” casing has greater than 90% bond, all

| above the kick off point. Inside the 7-5/8” casing, a 5-1/2” liner has

approximately 1,320 feet of cement bond greater than 90% above the kick off

| point. The potential vector for escaping injection fluids is therefore bound by a)
cement plug back of sidetracked wellbore, b) substantial cement of good bond
quality behind 7-5/8” casing, c) substantial cement of good bond quality behind 5-
1/2” casing, and d) geologic data presented (see 2.9 above), detailing permeability
barriers in the geologic column.
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Chris Kierst - Correct Maps for the Wellbores 3-17 and 6-17

From: "Keri Clarke" <kclarke@marionenergy.com>

To: "Chris Kierst" <chriskierst@utah.gov>

Date: 4/14/2010 3:00 PM

Subject: = Correct Maps for the Wellbores 3-17 and 6-17

CC: "Crockett, Matthew" <mcrockett@bwenergylaw.com>, "Miller, Relma" <rmille...

Attachments: ASD Operators (4.14.10).jpg; Surface Owners 4.14.10.jpg; ASD Mineral Owenrs
(4.14.10).jpg

Chris

Here are the correct maps for the bottom hole locations and the surface locations for the wellsites 3-17 and 6-17.
We have looked at the circles and have decided that there are no new surface, mineral and operators from the
original letters we sent out for the applications. All three of the types have been covered with the original affidavit.
Let me know if these are ok as soon as you can. Cheers.

Keri Clarke

Vice President Land
Marion Energy Inc.
972-540 2967 (Off)
214-704 4377 (Cell)

file://C:\Documents and Settines\DPRUSER\I.ocal Settings\Temp\XPgrowise\dBC5D899... 4/14/2010
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AR ”\‘
Chris Kierst - Letter for Sampling ull }
From: "Keri Clarke" <kclarke@marionenergy.com>
To: "Chris Kierst" <chriskierst@utah.gov>
Date: 4/14/2010 2:24 PM
Subject: Letter for Sampling
CC: "Crockett, Matthew" <mcrockett@bwenergylaw.com>, "Miller, Relma" <rmille...

Attachments: 20100414104148867.pdf

Chris
Here is the letter about current sampling of water from the wells. Let me know if it is sufficient. Cheers.

Keri Clarke

Vice President Land
Marion Energy Inc.
972-540 2967 (Off)
214-704 4377 (Cell)

file://C:\Documents and Settings\DPRUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPerowise\4BC5D00F... 4/14/2010



Ei8 Environmental & Engineering Consuliing
3% North Main Street * Helper, Utah 84326
Office (439 472-3834 ° Toll free - (800 64 1-2927 * Fax - (435) 472-8780
gisechipreciscont. et

April 13,2010

Keri Clarke

Marion Energy, Inc.

119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, TX 75069

Dear Mr. Clarke,

This letter is in response to your request for a summary of the activities related to water sampling
in the Clear Creck area.

Eric Norton from Marion Energy contacted EIS on April 12 requesting water samples be taken
from four well locations in the Clear Creek area. I met with Mr. Greenan at the Oman 2-20 well
pad at 10:00 a.m. on the moming of the 12®, Mr. Greenan had the water sample jars he obtained
from SGS Laboratory the previous Friday. With Mr. Greenan controlling the water spoat at the
Oman 2-20 well head, I filled the sample jars with water directly from the well head. The
sample was taken at 10:15 a.m. We then traveled to the Alpine School District 3-17 and 6-17
well pad, Mark Jones from DOGM was on the access road to the well pad and followed us to the
location and observed as the samples were taken. Again Mr. Greenan conirolled the water spout
while I filled the jars at the Alpine School District 6-17 well head. The sample was taken at
10:25. The pressure coming from the Alpine School District 3-17 well was to high to collect
water samples by holding the jars under the spout. A bucket lined with a new, clean garbage bag
was used to collect water from the high-pressure spray. Samples were drawn from the filled
bucket at 10:30. Each sample from the three wells included a half gallon raw water sample in a
plastic jug, a quart of water with a HCI preservative in a glass bottle, and a pint of water with a
HNO; preservative in a plastic bottle.

We met Mr. Oveson at the Ridge Runner 13-17 access road turnoff. He had used a snow mobile
to access the well pad. He collected water samples from the frac tanks on the Ridge Runner 13-
17 pad at 10:48. Two half-gallon plastic jugs of raw water, two plastic pint bottles with a HNO3
preservative, and one quart glass bottle with a HCI preservative were filled from the frac tanks.
Mr. Greenan had returned to each of the well pads to collect run time and temperature data. 1
accepted the sample jars from Mr. Oveson and delivered the samples to SGS Laboratory. Chain-
of-Custody forms were filled out at the time of delivery, 1:05 p.m. Mr. Norton had discussed the
required test parameters with a SGS employee during a phone conversation while I was at the
laboratory delivering the samples. ’

If you have any questions, please let me know.

Sincerely,
Lot S S
Matthew Serfustini

Senior Project Lead, Biology Department
EIS :



Alpine School District 3-17 (4300731182)
Alpine School District 6-17 (4300731181)

UIC INJECTION PERMIT ANALYSIS FORM
FOLLOW-UP RESPONSE
Date: 4/15/10

Following are responses to comments regarding UIC Form 1 submitted by Marion
Energy, Inc. on 3/1/2010.

2.5:  See attached wellbore schematic with present and proposed wellbore schematics.

2.6:  The injected fluid shall be produced water from multiple wells within the Clear
Creek Federal Unit, all having a source of water from the Ferron Sandstone.
Estimated daily injection volume is 2,000 bwpd, increasing to 15,000 bwpd as
additional wells are brought online. Estimated daily average injection pressure is
0 (zero) psig, maximum surface injection pressure is 400 psig.

2.7:  Produced and injected water samples are to be submitted separately. Mixing
ratios for produced water to injected water is proposed to be 25/75, 50/50, 75/25.
The analysis shall include TDS and scaling tendency.

2.8:  Estimated daily average injection pressure is 0 (zero) psig, maximum surface
injection pressure is 400 psig.

2.9:  Cross sections provided by Marion Energy, Inc. demonstrate confining shale
barriers above and below the Ferron member of the Mancos Formation. The
shales above the Ferron belong to the Bluegate Shale Member of the Mancos
Formation and those below belong to the Tunuck Shale Member of the Mancos
Formation. Both shales have considerable thickness and are known to be
regionally pervasive. These characteristics are considered in lieu of an initial
step rate test. The impermeable nature of the shales is suitable for the
confinement of the injectate within the Ferron Sandstone. It is also anticipated the
ASD 3-17 will have zero surface injection pressure during early period injection.
This will not allow delta P vs delta Q to be plotted accurately. Marion proposes
an initial Maximum Surface Injection pressure of 400 psig, and could perform a
step rate test if the well demonstrates stabilized positive pressure before 400 psig
is achieved.

2.10: At the request of the DOGM the originally submitted geologic displays were
augmented to improve clarity for the viewer. Paper and digital (PDF) copies of
the displays are included and it should be noted the PDF files when zoomed in
show better clarity of the log curves then do the paper copies. The following
displays are being resubmitted for approval

SMéW/f/Z
EXHIBITE



2.11:

1) Ferron structure map of the northern two-thirds of the Clear Creek Federal Unit
showing cross-section lines North-South and West-East.

2) Structural cross-sections North-South and West-East illustrating the structural
position of the Ferron Sandstone between the known confining shales of the
Bluegate and Tunuck and the structural position of the known fresh-water bearing
formations of the Star Point and Blackhawk.

3) Detailed stratigraphic correlations (A-A’ and B-B’) of the Ferron Formation
showing lateral continuity.

4) Single well log strips showing digital log curves for the ASD #6-17 and ASD
#3-17. Due to the deviated nature of both wells they were logged with cased-
hole tools only.

A review of wells within a % mile radius of the prospective injection candidates
yield the following:

Alpine School District 3-17:
Two wellbores are within an % mile radius of the bottom hole location and/or the
surface location:

a) ASD 6-17 original hole

b) ASD 6-17 sidetrack hole

Alpine School District 6-17 sidetrack:
Three wellbores are within an ¥ mile radius of the bottom hole location and/or
the surface location:

a) ASD 6-17 original hole

b) ASD 3-17

c¢) Utah Fuel #7

The mechanical condition of each well within a % mile radius is sufficient to
prevent fluid migration up or down the wellbore into improper intervals. For all
the wells listed above, the Ferron Sand is bound from below by the Tunuck Shale
and above by the Bluegate Shale. There are no conduits created within these
wellbores to allow fluids to escape from the limits of these sealing shale members.
The Ferron Sand, and Tunuck and Bluegate Shales are members within the
regionally pervasive Mancos Formation.

The ASD 6-17 original hole was plugged back with 325 sacks cement in two
stages; top of plug tagged each time. The plug covers 1,242’ inside the Bluegate
Shale from kickoff point at 2,350’ to 3,565°. The TD of the original hole is in the
Ferron Sand and is filled with 11.6 #/g mud from 3,565 to 5,164’ (TD).




W

The ASD 6-17 sidetrack hole is completed with a 5-1/2” liner from 2,009’ —
5,825’ and cemented with 291 sacks cement. Cement bond quality of greater than
90% from 3,670° — 5,825, which includes the entire completed interval of the
Ferron Sand. Additionally, the top of the 5-1/2” liner overlaps 252 into the 7-
5/8” casing, which is cemented with 340 sacks cement and 695’ of bond quality
greater than 90%.

The ASD 3-17 is completed with 7” casing from surface to 5,311° and cemented
with 750 sacks cement. Cement bond quality is greater than 90% from 2,500° —
5,311°, which includes the entire completed interval of the Ferron Sand.
Additionally, a 9-5/8” casing string runs from surface to 3,142’ and is cemented
to surface with 695 sacks cement. The 9-5/8” casing penetrates the Bluegate
Shale by 840°.

The Utah Fuel #7 well was plugged and abandoned in July 1987. The wellbore
has two inside casing cement plugs above the Ferron Sand; bottom plug 3,132° —
3,790’ (658”) and top plug surface to 658” (658”). The Ferron Sand is further
isolated with two casing strings cemented in the hole; a) 4-1/2” liner from surface
to 4,063° and cemented with 200 sacks cement, and b) 7” casing string from
surface to 3,865 and cemented with 850 sacks cement.

Additional Considerations:

The proposed injection operations into the Ferron Sand of the ASD 3-17, ASD 6-
17, provide no EOR, pressure maintenance, or other secondary recovery benefit to
the gas hydrocarbon resource that may be present in the Ferron Sand. All natural
gas recovery from the Ferron Sand in the Clear Creek Unit to date (primarily in
the 1950°s and 60’s) has been a result of volumetric depletion. The location of
the ASD 3-17 and ASD 6-17 provide for disposal of water into existing wells
located in an isolated fault block. No deleterious effects are expected since water
production has been present whenever gas has been produced since inception
within the naturally fractured Ferron Sand. Ferron water being injected and
allowed to comingle with Ferron water already present in the natural fractured
sandstone will create no additional reservoir impacts than exist within the Ferron
in its current natural state.

It is expected that with improved economic conditions and positive production
response from the continuous dewatering of existing wells, a dedicated disposal
well option outside of the Ferron may be economic in the future. Opportunities to
expand dewatering to include all areas of the Ferron within Clear Creek would be
attractive at that time.



Saturation Index Calculations

Champion Technologies, Inc. i
(Based on the Tomson-Odde Model - CO2 in Brire) Ma rion Energy

Clear Creek
Sample Date Comments
Brine 1 ; Alpine School District: Well # 3-17 April 12, 2010
Brine 2 : Alpine School District: Well # 6-17 April 12, 2010 .
Brine 3 : Ridge Runner: Well # 13-17 April 12, 2010
Brine 3 : Olman: Well # 2-20 April 12, 2010
Brines to be mixed Mixing Ratio as %
: 25 10 40 20 30 30 30 35 25 10
25 20 30 10 | 30 35 20 25 30 20
Component 25 30 20 40 10 5 10 15 20 50
g ; 25 40 10 | 30 30 30 40 25 25 20
Calclum, Ca*2mg/l 5.82.30{<p 23 87 16 39 31 31 30 28 33 34 34 32 32 26
Magnesium, Mg*?|ma/l [18.94%12] 544 10 3 12 9 9 10 8 11 11 11 10 10 7
Barium, Ba™2lmg/l |5 2| 8| ¢.221 13 10 0 8 6| . 9 7 7 7 6 8 8 8
Strontium, Sr*2|mg/i 5 4 2 5 4 4 4 4 4 5 5 4 4 3
Carbonate, CO+2|mg/l 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 of] o
Bicarbonate, HCO. |mg/l 164 2,037} 70 1,898 2,037 2,006 1,995 1,897 1,992 2,014 1,986 1,879 1,997 1,995 1,988 2,003
Sulfate, so2mg/l} (v 28] £ 27 6 14 19 16 22 15 21 22 20 21 20 14
Chlorlde, Clyimg/l 2315 2,680] 76323,100 1,102 3,160 2,496 2,459] . 2,532 2,217 2,774 2,874 2,774 2,653 2,695 2,059
CO; in Brine|mg/I 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300 300
Ionic Strength 0.11 0.12] 0,07 0.12 0.10 0.10 0.11 0.10 0.1 0.12 0.11 0.11 0.11 0.09
Temperature|°F 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85 85
Pressu 100 100, 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100

" Caldte; Cac0,] -047 | 048 | 057 | -041 | -044 | 044 | -049 | 048 | -045 | -0.47 | 044 | 046 | -047 | -0.48

Gypsum; CaSO.2H,0] NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Hemihydrate; CaSO41/2H,0] N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Anhydrite; CaS04]  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NA | NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Barite; BaSO.F N/A N/A N/A NA | NA N/A N/A N/A N/A | NA N/A N/A N/A N/A

Gypsum; CaS0,2H,0]  N/A N/A NA | NA N/A N/A N/A NA | NA | NA | NA | NA N/A N/A

Hemihydrate; CaS0,-1/2H,0fF N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Anhydrite; CaS0,] NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA | NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA | NA - N/A

Barite; BaSOs] N/A N/A N/A N/A NA |1 NA N/A NA N/A NA N/A “N/A N/A N/A

Celestite; Sr504| N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NA |- NNA | NA | NA N/A NA | NA
Confidential 4 HOH Compatabllity.xis
Champlon Technologies, Inc. Four Brines (CO2 in Brine)
Vernal District Technical Services . 4/26/2010




Summary of Clear Creek Water Analysis Reports (updated 4/22/10)

TDS
: Sg Sodium | Chloride | Bicarbonate

Location Date Sampled Source grams/ml " ‘r)rl:;llL) mg/l mgil mgil
Alpine School District 6-17 1/12/2009 wellhead 1.005 11,0214 3,710 4,040 2,928
Alpine School District 6-17 2/24/2010 wellhead 1.007 % 1,781 1,544 2,184
Alpine School District 6-17 4/12/2010 wellhead N/A *5,9 N/A *2,538 *1,520
Alpine School District 3-17 17122009 wellhead 1.005 8,549 2,853 3,040 2,440
Alpine School District 3-17 4/12/2010 wellhead | N/A m N/A *2,315 *1,664
Ridge Runner 219 8/7/2008 wellhead | 1.010 9,791 3,480 4,320 1,908
Ridge Runner 1317 5/22/2007 wellhead N/A *3,848 N/A N/A 3,284
Ridge Runner 13-17 512412007 wellhead N/A *7.256 2,480 2,999 1,595
Ridge Runner 13-17 2/9/2010 wellhead N/A *3,735 N/A N/A 1,462
Ridge Runner 13-17 4/12/2010 frac tank N/A *3,618 N/A *1,059 *1,685

Utah Fuel 8 2/24/2009 wellhead 1.010 5,042 1,864 2,800 280

Utah Fuel 8 4/2/2009 wellhead 1.005 12,477 o 4,550 5,960 1,903

Oman 2-20 1/11/2002 wellhead N/A *5,321 2,075 2,000 2,342

. Oman 2-20 1/26/2010 wellhead N/A *6,243 N/A N/A N/A
Oman 2-20 {via ASD 3-17) 3/8/2010 wellhead 1.005 4,776 1,509 1,140 2,098
Walton 1X 4/29/1963 Sep. Dump| 1.002 3,780 1,263 1,220 1,287

previously submitted water analysis reports in yellow
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Chris Kierst - FW: Updated Clear Creek Water Analysis

From: "Keri Clarke" <kclarke@marionenergy.com>
To: "Chris Kierst" <chriskierst@utah.gov>

Date: 4/22/2010 3:26 PM

Subject: FW: Updated Clear Creek Water Analysis
CC: "Brad Hill" <bradhill@utah.gov>

Attachments: Clear Creek Water Analysis Summary (updated 4-22-10).xls; SGS Water Analysis Apr-
2010.pdf; ASD 3-17 & 6-17 Water Analysis Jan 2009.pdf

Chris

Some more information on water samples for you to review. We will send you the compatibility testing as soon as
we receive it from the sample people.

Keri Clarke

Vice President Land
Marion Energy Inc.
972-540 2967 (Off)
214-704 4377 (Cell)

From: Wayne McPherson

Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2010 1:59 PM

To: Keri Clarke; Jay Stratton; Doug Endsley
Cc: 'Miller, Relma'; 'Crockett, Matthew'
Subject: Updated Clear Creek Water Analysis

I have received more water analyses to include with the prior reports | submitted yesterday. The excel
spreadsheet reflects all analyses that | have compiled to date. The updates include water samples taken by third
party EIS on 4/12/10. Additionally, | have received the specific well analysis for the ASD 3-17 and ASD 6-17
waters used for the Thunderbird / Gordon Creek compatibility tests ran in January 2009.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Marion Energy, Inc.

Wayne McPherson I

800 W. Rock Creek Rd., Suite 121
Norman, OK 73069

(405) 366-7200 Office

(405) 640-5661 Cell

{(405) 321-6055 Fax

file://C:\Documents and Settings\DPRUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4BD06AB0... 4/22/2010
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‘ (4/22/2010) Chris Kierst - Clear Creek Water Analysis Summary (updated Page 1 1
Summary of Clear Creek Water Analysis Reports (updated 4/22/10)
TDS . . .
Location Date Sampled Source graﬁi - ppnTg,L) ¢ Sfl::i;llllm Cr:::gr;ltie Blcar;I:;7lnate

Alpine School District 6-17 1/12/2009 wellhead 1.005 11,021 3,710 4,040 2,928
Alpine School District 6-17 212412010 wellhead 1.007 5,562 1,781 1,544 2,184
Alpine School District 6-17 4/12/2010 wellhead N/A *5,984 N/A *2,538 *1,520
Alpine School District 3-17 1/12/2009 wellhead 1.005 8,549 2,853 3,040 2,440
Alpine School District 3-17 4/12/2010 wellhead N/A *5,741 N/A *2,315 *1,664
Ridge Runner 2-19 8/7/2008 wellhead 1.010 9,791 3,480 4,320 1,908
Ridge Runner 13-17 5/2212007 wellhead N/A *3,848 N/A N/A 3,284
Ridge Runner 13-17 512412007 wellhead N/A *7,256 2,460 2,999 1,595
Ridge Runner 13-17 2/9/2010 wellhead N/A *3,735 N/A N/A 1,462
Ridge Runner 13-17 4/12/2010 frac tank N/A *3.618 N/A *1,059 *1,665

Utah Fuel 8 2/24/2009 wellhead 1.010 5,042 1,864 2,800 280

Utah Fuel 8 4/2/2009 wellhead 1.005 12,477 4,550 5,960 1,903

Oman 2-20 1/11/2002 wellhead N/A *5,321 2,075 2,000 2,342

Oman 2-20 1/26/2010 wellhead N/A *6,243 N/A N/A N/A

Oman 2-20 (via ASD 3-17) 3/9/2010 wellhead 1.005 4,776 1,509 1,140 2,098
Walton 1X 4/29/1963 Sep. Dump 1.002 3.780 1.263 1,220 1,287

previously submitted water analysis reports in yellow
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Page 1]

Analysis Report

April 21, 2010
MARION ENERGY INC
2901 E. 20th street Page 1 of 1
SUITE 106
Farmington NM 87402
ATTN: Doug Endsley
Client Sample ID: Olman 2-20 Sample ID By: Marion Energy
Date Sampled: Apr 12, 2010 Sampler Company: EIS
Date Received: Apr 12, 2010 Sample Taken At Olman 2-20
Product Description: WATER Sample Taken By: M. Serfustinii

Time Received: 1305

Time Sampled: 1015

Field - Temperature: 86 Deg. C
Commenits: Dissolved Metals Filtered atl.ab

Well Head Run Time 24 Hrs
SGS Minerals Sample ID: 782-1002133-001

REPORTING ANALYZED
TESTS RESUT UNT NETHOD umT DATE TVE  ANALYST

Ol and Grease, (HEM) <5 nglL EPA 1664 5000 20100416 081500 M
Sulfate, SO4 <1 gl EPA300.0 1.000 20100414 190800 M
Conductivity 10110 pyhosiem SM2510 0.100 20100412 150000 M
H 758 s.u SVH500H 0010 20100412 145000 OM
pH Terrperature 2130 °C SVK500H 0.010 200412 145000 CM
Total Dissolved Salids 6180 mglL SMR540C 30.000 2100413 133000 M
Total Suspended Salids 23 mplL SMR540D 5,000 2100413 133000 CM
Chlaide, O 2500 nglL EPA300.0 1.000 20100414 190800 M
Alkalinity,mg Ca003L (pH 4.5) 1677 mglL Sve0B 5,000 2000414 120000 CM
Catborete Alkalinityas Ca003 <5 mglL S\V2s20B 5,000 2100414 120000 CM
Bicarbonate Alkalinityas CaC03 1677 mglL SV23208 5000 20100414 120000 M
METALS BY ICP

Barium Ba- Dissolved 4482 nglL EPA200.7 0.02 01004413 150000 M
Barium Ba- Total 4678 nglL EPA200.7 002 20100419 173300 M
Cacium Ca- Dissolved 47 moll EPA00.7 0030 20100413 150000 OM
Cacium Ca- Totd 47 mlL EPA200.7 0.030 20100419 173300 M
Iron, Fe- Dissolved <003 ngl EPA200.7 0030 20100413 150000 O™
Iron, Fe- Total 187 mglL EPA200.7 0.050 20100419 173300 M
Megnesium, Mg- Dissolved 1245 myL EPA200.7 0010 20100413 150000 M
Megnesium Mg - Toial 1278 molL EPA200.7 0010 20100419 173300 M

e gl

Allen Ludington
Water Lab Supervisor

N Minerals Senices Division
SGS North America Inc| 5035 North Airport Road Huntington  (435) 653.2311 £ (435)653-2436 www.sgs.comimin erals

l Member ofthe SGS Group (Société Générale de Surweifiance)

This document is isued by the Company under i Genseral Condlfons of Sers accessble at hip Awww.gscomt erms_and_condW onshim. Aenfon s drawn fo the Amimfon of Fabiky,
indemnifcaton  and jurisdicon issues defined thersin.

Any hoider of this doctment is advsed et informaton contined hereon refeds the Compsny's fndings at the fime of fs inwrventon only and wibin te lis of Clent's instuctons ¥ any. Ths
Company s sole responsbiMly is t Ks Chent and this documant does not exonerate parfes & @ ¥ansecion fFom exerdsng af ther rights and under he Any
unauthorized alieration, frgery or faislicaon ofthe content or appearance ofthis document isuniawiui andoflenders may beprossculed b the kilest extent ofthe law
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Page 2 |

AnalysisReport

April 21, 2010
MARION ENERGY INC
2901 E. 20th street Page 1 of 1
SUITE 106
Farmington NM 87402
ATTN: Doug Endsley
Client Sample ID: Alpine School District 6-17 Sample ID By: Marion Energy
Date Sampled: Apr 12, 2010 Sampler Company: EIS
Date Received: Apr 12, 2010 Sample Taken At Alpine School District 6-17
Product Description: WATER Sample Taken By: M. Serfustini

Time Received: 1305

Time Sampled: 1025

Field - Temperature: 57 Deg. C
Comments: Dissolved Metals Filtered atLab

Well Head Run Time 3 Hrs
SGS Minerals Sample ID:  782-1002133-002
REPORTING ANALYZED
JESTS BESUT UNT METHOD LMt DATE IME  ANALYST

Oiland Grease, HEM) 2 gl EPA 1664 5.000 20100416 081500 M
Sufde, S04 <1 gl EPA3000 1.000 20100414 190800 CM
Concuctivity 9880 phoslcm SM2510 0.100 20100412 150000 CM
pH 744 s.u SW500-H 0.010 20100412 145200 M
pH Terrperature 200 °C SVHS00H 0.010 20100412 145200 M
Totel DissolvedSolids 5084 mglL SM2540C 30,000 20100413 133000 M
Total Suspended Sdlids 1466 mglL SVR540D 5.000 20100413 133000 O™
Chiaide, O 2538 gl EPA 300.0 1.000 20100414 190800 M
Alkalinity,mg Ca003/L (pH 4.5) 1520 oL SVe208 5000 20100414 120000 CM
Cabonate Alkdinityas CaCO3 <5 molL Sves208 5.000 20100414 120000 OM
Bicabonate Alkalinityas CaC03 1520 gL SMZ3208 5000 20100414 120000 CM
NETALS BYICP
Barium Ba- Dissalved 3652 mglL EPA200.7 0.002 20100413 150000 OM
Baium Ba- Tota 5722 mglL EPA200.7 0.002 20100419 173300 M
Calcium Ca- Dissdved 29.50 mglL EPA200.7 0.030 20100413 150000 CM
Cacium Ca- Totd 5027 mglL EPA200.7 0.030 20100419 173300 M
Iron, Fe- Dissolved 1.99 mgl EPA200.7 0.0%0 20100413 150000 M
lron, Fe- Total 20078 gL EPA200.7 0.050 20100421 104900 M
Megnesium Mg- Dissolved 10.71 mglL EPA200.7 0010 20100413 150000 M
Megnesium Mg - Total 1384 nolL EPA 2007 0010 20100419  17:3300 M

M. yplir,

Allen Ludington
Water Lab Supervisor

. Minerals Senvices Division
SGS North America Inc| 5035 North Airport Road Huntington  t(435) 653-2311 f (435)653-2436 www.sgs.com/min erals

I Member ofthe SGS Group (Société Générale de Surweillance)

This doament s iswsd by the Company under #s General Condibons of Ssnks accessble @t hip Awww.sgsomt erms end_cond onshtn, Atlenfon Is drawn fo the Mmiafon of kabidly,
indemnifcaton  and jurisdiction issues defined therein,

Any holder of this document is advssd that infrmaton conbiined hereon refeds the Compeny's findings at the Sme of ks inlrvenfon only and within the limés of Chent's instucfons ¥ any. The
Company s sols responsbilty is to #s Chent and this document does not wnerate parfes b @ kansadon fom exerdsng al thek rights and i under the Any
unauthorized afieraton, brgery or falsficaton ofthe confent or appearance ofthis document isuniawisl andofenders may beprossculed b e fullest exint ofthe jaw
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Analysis Report

April 21, 2010
MARION ENERGY INC
2901 E. 20th street Page 1 of 1
SUITE 106
Farmington NM 87402
ATTN: Doug Endsley
Client Sample ID: Alpine School District 3-17 Sample ID By: Marion Energy
Date Sampled: Apr 12, 2010 Sampler Company: EIS
Date Received: Apr 12, 2010 Sample Taken At Alpine School District 3-17
Product Description: WATER Sample Taken By: M. Serfustini

Time Received: 1305

Time Sampled: 1030

Field - Temperature: 52 Deg. C
Comments: Dissolved Metals Filtered atLab

Well Head Runt Time 1 Hr
SGS Minerals Sample [D:  782-1002133-003

REPORTING ANALYZED
IESTS RESUT UNT METHOD LMt DATE TME ANALYST

Oil and Grease, (HEM) 9 nglL EPA 1664 5,000 20100416 081500 OM
Suifate, SO4 6 npl EPA300.0 1,000 20100414 190800 M
Conductivity 9300 prhosiem SMR510 0.100 20100412 150000 M
H 742 s.u SWVMS00H 0.010 20100412 145400 M
pH Tenperaure 1810 °C SWM500H 0010 2000412 145400 M
Total Dissolved Solids 5741 gl SVPS40C 30.000 20100413 133000 M
Total Suspended Solids 517 mglL S\VR540D 5.000 20100413 133000 M
Chioride, O 2315 mglL EPA300.0 1.000 20100414 190800 M
Alkalirity,rmg Ca0031L (pH 4.5) 1664 rglL SVR320B 5000 20100414 120000 CM
Catborate Alkalinityas CaC0O3 <5 gl SVR0B 5000 20100414 120000 CM
Bicabonate Alkdlinityas CaC03 1664 nglL SVR3208 5000 20100414 120000 CM
METALS BY ICP

Barium Ba- Dissaived 2502 gL EPA200.7 0.002 20100413 150000 CM
Barium Ba- Totdl 5210 nplL EPA200.7 0.002 20100419 173300 CM
Calcium Ca- Dissaved 2582 nplL EPA200.7 0.030 20100413 150000 M
Calcium Ca- Tatal 31.91 mgh EPA200.7 0.030 200419 173300 M
Iron, Fe- Dissolved 007 mglL EPA200.7 0.030 2MMO0413 150000 CM
lron, Fe- Total 4912 mglL EPA200.7 0.050 20100419 173300 M
Magnesium Mg - Dissolved 988 nylL EPA200.7 0010 2100413 150000 CM
Megnesium Mg - Total 11.99 molL EPA200.7 0010 20100419 173300 M

Allen Ludington
Water Lab Supervisor

X Minerals Senices Division
SGS North America Inc| 2035 North Airport Road Huntington  £(435) 6532311 f (435)653-2436 www.sgs.com/min erals

1 Member ofthe SGS Group (Socéts Générale de Surwiance)

This document is lsued by the Company under Ks General Condifons of Service accessble at hiip Awww.sgscomt erms_and_condl onshén. Alenfon Is drawn fo the Mmiaton of Habiity,
indemnifcation and jurisdicon issuies definad hersin.

Any holder of this document is advsed Mat informston confained hereon refeds the Company's findings at the Sme of s Intrvenfon only and within the [limis of Chant's instudons ¥ any The
Company' s sole responsbilty is to ks Chent and this document does not exonerate parfes b @ Fansaclon from ewordsng el ther rights and undar the Any
unauthorized alierafon, forgery or falsiicaton ofthe confent or appearance ofthis document isuniawisl and ofenders may beprosecuied b e Liflest sxent ofthe law
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AnalysisReport

April 21, 2010
MARION ENERGY INC
2001 E£.20th street Page1of 1
SUITE 106
Farmington NM 87402
ATTN: Doug Endsley
Client Sample |D: Ridge Runner 13-17 Frac Tank Sample ID By: Marion Energy
Date Sampled: Apr 12, 2010 Sampler Company: EIS
Date Received: Apr 12, 2010 Sample Taken At Ridge Runner 13-17 Frac Tank
Product Description: WATER Sample Taken By: M. Serfustini

Time Received: 1305

Time Sampled: 1048

Field - Temperature: 42Deg. C
Comments: Dissolved Metals Filtered at Lab

Frac Tank Sample

SGS Minerals Sample ID:  782-1002133-004

REPORITING ANALYZED
TESTS RESUT UNT METHOD uMT DATE TVE  ANALYST

Oil and Grease, (HEM) <5 nglL EPA 1664 5,000 20100416 081500 CM
Sulfate, SO4 <1 gl EPA300.0 1.000 20100414 190800 CM
Conductivity 5830 prhosicm SVR510 0.100 20100412 150000 OM
pH 70 s.u SIVM500H 0010 MDM00412 145600 M
pH Terrpersture 1540 °C SVM500-H 0.010 20100412 145600 M
Total DissolvedSolids 3618 molL SVR540-C 30,000 20100413 133000 M
Total Suspended Solids 43 nglL SVRS40D 5000 20100413 133000 OM
Chioide, 0 1059 mglL EPA300.0 1.000 20100414 190800 M
Alkalinity,mg Ca003/. (pH 4.5) 1665 gL SV2208 5000 20100414 120000 M
Cabonate Alkalinityas CaC03 <5 nglL SVe208 5,000 20100414 120000 OV
Bicaborete Alkalinityas Ca003 1685 ngl. SVe20B 5.000 20100414 120000 CM
METALS BY ICP

Barium Ba- Dissalved 39% myl. EPA200.7 o002 20100413 150000 CM
Barium Ba- Total 4,058 mglL EPA200.7 0.002 20100421 104900 M
Calcium Ca- Dissolved 11.34 mglL EPA200.7 0.020 2000413 150000 OM
CaciumCa- Total 11.34 mpl- EPA200.7 0.030 20100421 104900 OV
Iron, Fe- Dissolved 0.05 mgl. EPA200.7 0030 20100413 150000 CM
lron, Fe- Total 0.34 mglL EPA200.7 0.050 20100421 104900 CM
Megnesium Mg - Dissolved 440 mplL EPA200.7 0.010 20100413 150000 M
Megnesium Mg- Total 452 mgl EPA200.7 0010 20100421 104900 M

Wi Zudl g,

Allen Ludington
Water Lab Supervisor

. Minerals Senvices Division
SGS North America Inc| 5035 North Airport Road Huntington £ (435) 653-2311 f (435)-653-2436 www.sgs.com/min erals

1 Mermber ofthe SGS Group (Sadété Générale de Sunilance)

This document s isued by the Company under K General Condions of Servee accessible af hip Awww.gscomt erms_and_cond onshim. Aenfon s drawn to the mitafon of Nabily,
indermifcation  and jurisdicton isues defined herein.

Any holder of this doaiment is advised st information contsined hereon refeds the Company's findings at the Gme of s inlerventon only and within the limis of Chent's instucfons ¥ any The
Company's sole responsbilty is to ¥ Cient and this dowment does not exonerate parfes b @& Fansaclon fom exsrdsng alt thek rights and under the Any
unauthorized alteraton, frgery or falsfication ofthe conient or appearance ofthis document isunlawfl and ofenders may beprossculed b the et extient ofthe law
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,>§Cham Water Analysis Report

26-Jan-09
12-Jan-09
14-Jan-09
26-Jan-09

- Date Sampled :
TGCh les Date Received :
Date Reported :
Marion Energy Field : Clearwater
Lease : Clearwater
Location : Alpine School Disfrict 03-17
Attention : Sample Point : wellhead
oct - Salesman : Scott Harbison
cc2:
cc3 : Analyst : Karen Hawkins Allen

Comments : Metals analyzed by AA.

CATIONS ANIONS
Calcium : 35 mgl Chloride : 3,040 mgl
Magnesium : 1 mgll .
Barium mgh Carbonate : 132 mgh
Strontium : mgh Bicarbonate : 2440 mgl
Iron : 400 mgA .
Manganese : 00 mgl Suffate : 8 mof
Sodium : 2853 mgl
pH (field) : 7.00 Specific Gravity : 1.005 grams/imi
Temperature : 85 degrees F Total Dissolved Solids : 8,549 ppm
fonic Strength : 0.13 CO2 in Water : 1 mgl
Mole %CO2 inGas: mole %
Resistivity : ohm-meters H2S inWater : 0.5 mgf
Ammonia : ppm Dissolved Oxygen : ppm
SI calculations based on Tomson-Oddo parameters
Calcite (CaCO3) SI: 216 Calcite PTB : 304
GoeGeSeINT M ckermewr s
’ ’ Calcite PTB @120 F: 305
Caldite (CaCO3) SI@ 140F: 274 Calcite PTB @ 140 F: 305
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 160 F: 297 Calcite PTB @ 160 F: 306
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 180F: 3.20 Calcite PTB @180 F: 306
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 200F: 344 Calcite PTB @200 F: 306
Gypsum (CaS04) SI: -3.94 Gypsum PTB : N/A
Barite (BaSO4) St : N/A Barite PTB : N/A
Celestite (SrS0O4) Si: N/A Celestite PTB : N/A

Confidential
Champion Technologies, Inc.
Vernal District Technical Services

Page 1of 2
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H H 26-Jan-09
>>>‘ Champic Water Analysis Report bate Sampled : 1ok 00
Te C I na S Date Received : 14-Jan-09
Date Reported : 26-Jan-09
Marion Energy Field : Clearwater
Lease : Clearwater
Location : Alpine School District 06-17
Attention : Sample Point : wellhead
cel: Salesman : Scott Harbison
cc2:
cc3: Analyst : Karen Hawkins Allen

Comments : Metals analyzed by AA

CATIONS ANIONS
Calcium : 28 mgh Chioride : 4,040 mgA
Magnesium : 2 mgll 5
Barium mgh Carbonate : 264 mgl
Strontium : mg/l Bicarbonate : 2928 mgl
Iron : 10 mgl .
Manganese : 00 mgh Suffate : 48 mgl
Sodium : 3710 mgh
pH (field) : 6.00 Specific Gravity : 1.005 grams/mi
Temperature : 85 degrees F Total Dissoived Solids : 11,021 ppm
lonic Strength : 0.16 CO2 in Water : 1 mol
Mole %CO2 inGas: mole %
Resistivity : ohm-meters H2S inWater : 05 mgh
Ammonia : ppm Dissolved Oxygen : ppm
SI calculations based on Tomson-Oddo parameters
Calcite (CaCO3) SI: 213 Calcite PTB : 243
GoeGCDS@IT I cwrmamr
: ’ Calcite PTB @120 F: 244
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 140F: 2.71 Calcite PTB @ 140 F: 244
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 160 F: 293 Calcite PTB @ 160 F: 245
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 180F: 317 Calcite PTB @180 F: 245
Calcite (CaCO3) SI@ 200F: 341 Calcite PTB @200 F: 245
Gypsum (CaS04) SI: -3.29 Gypsum PTB : N/A
Barite (BaS04) Sl : N/A Barite PTB : N/A
Celestite (SrS04) SI: N/A Celestite PTB : N/A

Confidential
Champion Technologies, Inc.
Vernal DistrictTechnical Services

Page 2 of 2



BEFORE THE BOARD OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
STATE OF UTAH

IN THE MATTER OF THE REQUEST FOR AGENCY
ACTION OF MARION ENERGY, INC. FOR AN
ORDER GRANTING AN AQUIFER EXEMPTION
AND APPROVING THE CONVERSION OF THE
ALPINE SCHOOL DISTRICT #3-17 WELL LOCATED
IN SECTION 17, TOWNSHIP 13 SOUTH, RANGE 7
EAST, CARBON COUNTY, UTAH, TO A CLASS 1l
INJECTION WELL

MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE
SUPPLEMENTAL EXHIBITS

Docket No. 2010-020

Cause No. UIC-362.2

COMES NOW, Marion Energy, Inc. (“Marion”), by and through its attorneys,

Beatty & Wozniak, P.C., and pursuant to Utah Admin. Code Rule R641-105-300, and

hereby requests the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”) for leave to file the

following exhibits to supplement those already on file in this cause:

SUPPLEMENTAL EXHIBIT “H” -

SUPPLEMENTAL EXHIBIT “M?* —

Revised Wellbore Schematics for the
ASD 3-17 well depicting present and
proposed completions (2 pages).

Additional Water Analysis data (2
pages).

Supplemental Exhibits “H” and “M” were submitted in response to requests from

the staff of the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Division”).

Exhibits filed later than 30 days before the scheduled hearing date may be allowed

by the Board upon good cause shown (see Utah Admin. Code Rule R641-105-500). The

hearing on this matter is scheduled for April 28, 2010. These items do not materially

change the previously filed exhibits, but clarify and support the materials previously




submitted and respond to the Division’s requests. For these reasons, Marion respectfully

requests this Motion for Leave be granted.
Respectfully submitted this 26" day of April, 2010.

BEATTY & WOZNIAK, P.C.

.Re% ; Miller

6925 Union Park Center, Suite 525
Cottonwood Heights, UT 84047-6003
Telephone: (801) 566-8446

Facsimile: (801) 566-8447

E-mail: RMiller@bwenergylaw.com
Attorneys for Petitioner Marion Energy, Inc.




CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that, on this 26™ day of April, 2010, I caused a true and correct
copy of the foregoing Motion for Leave to File Supplemental Exhibits to be hand and
electronically deliveted to the following:

Michael S. Johnson, Esq.

Assistant Attorney General

Attorney for Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 300

Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
MikeJohnson@utah.gov

Steven F. Alder, Esq.

Assistant Attorney General

Attorney for Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 300

Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
SteveAlder@utah.gov

Gil Hunt

Associate Director, Oil & Gas

Utah Division of Qil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84116
GilHunt@utah.gov




Present Completion Updated : 11/17/2009
API: 43-007-31182 [ Alpine School District #3-17
GL: 7,919 LOCATION:
KB: 7,934' Clear Creek
SW SE SW Sec 8 (BHL)
SW NW NE (surface)
Casing Strings: Sec. 17 TI3S R7E
Carbon County, UT
13-3/8", 46# , K-55 @ 490’
Cmtd w/ 1200 sx [#8213 .
TOC @ surface B=: | Tubing String:
: { 144jts. 2-7/8 j-55 =4586.54'
9-5/8", 36#,1-55 @ 3,142’ | 1 Sub Pump= 56.67'
Cmtd w/ 695 sx 1 ; | K.B. =14
TOC @ surface ; ' E.O.T. @4657.21'
7" Production, 26#, K-55 @ 5,311' I
Cmtd w/ 750 sx
TOC @ 2,500 +/- (>90% bond) |
|
|
;.
|
{
f
|
[
I
|
!
I
|
!
Bluegate
LIl 3,800'-3,906' (4 spf)
~ 11/07: 630g 7-1/2% HCI w balls
11/07: 840g 7-1/2% HCI and 83,2204
20/40 sand in x-link gel
Test: 16 mcfd, 300 bwpd
3/08: SQZ 3,800'-3,906', Driil ont.
Ferron
4,300'-4,310',4,524'-4,540',4,550"-4,560',
4,578"-4,588",4,772'-4,782' 4,786"-4,794'
11/19/07: PBTD @ 5,270 10/07: 2,750g 7-1/2% HCL and 122,467 #'s

16/30 sand in x-link gel
Spud Date: 7/3/07 Test: 150 mefd, 250 bwpd
TD Date: 7/30/07 o :

Comp Date: 11/30/07 TD =5,340' MD, 4,628' TVD

EXHIBIT 1



Proposed Completion
API: 43-007-31182

Alpine School District #3-17
Proposed SWD

GL: 7,919 LOCATION:
KB: 7,934' — — Clear Creek
= SW SE SW Sec 8 (BHL)
:r < SW NW NE (surface)
Casing Strings: I Sec, 17 TI38 R7E
; Carbon County, UT

13-3/8", 46# , K-55 @ 490'
Cmtd w/ 1200 sx
TOC @ surface

9-5/8", 36#, 1-55 @ 3,142
Cmtd w/ 695 sx
TOC @ surface

7' Production, 264, K-55 @ 5,311
ID: 6.366", Drift: 6.421, Burst; 4,360 psi
Cmtd w/ 750 sx
TOC @ 2,500' +/- (>90% bond)

11/19/07: PBTD @ 5,270

Spud Date: 7/3/07
TD Date: 7/36/07
Comp Date: 11/30/07

TD =5,340' MD, 4,628' TVD

Updated : 2/25/2010

Tubing String:

4,250' x 2-7/8", 6.5%, J-35, 8rd
Hydrotested to 4,000 psi

ID: 2.441" Drift: 2.347" Burst: 7,260 psi

Packer:

7" x 2-7/8" tension packer @ 4,230
Annulus filled w/ 128 bbls 2% KCl and
100 gals Champion Cortron 2383 inhibitor

Capacity:

2-7/8" thg: .00579 bbi/ft (24.6 bbls)

7" csg: 0382 bbI/Rt (201.3 bbls)

2-7/8" x 7" Annulus: .0302 bbl/ft (128.4 bbis)

PSI Test:

Pressure test tubing/casing annulus to

400 psig for 30 minutes using chart recorder
and witnessed.

Rate and Injection Pressure:
Max rate = 15,000 bwpd
Max surface injection pressure = 400 psig

Bluegate

3,800'-3,906' (4 spf)

11/07: 630g 7-1/2% HCI w/ bails
11/07: 840g 7-1/2% HCl anid §3,220#
20/40 sand in x-link gel

Test: 16 mefd, 300 bwpd

3/08: SQZ 3,800'-3,906', Drill out.

Ferron
4,300'-4,310',4,524'-4,540',4,550'-4,560",
4,578'-4,588",4,772'-4,782',4,786'-4,794'
10/07: 2,750g 7-1/2% HCL and 122,467 #'s
16/30 sand in x-link gel

Test: 150 mefd, 250 bwpd

EXHIBIT tt -




Date Sampled :

% Champion Water Analysis Report . B0

= TeChnOIOQIGS Date Received : 14-Jan-09
Date Reported : 26-Jan-09
Marion Energy Field ; Clearwater

Lease : Clearwater

Location : Alpine School District 03-17

Attention : Sample Point : wellhead
ccl: .
cc2: Salesman : Scott Harbison
ccd: Analyst : Karen Hawkins Allen

Comments : Metals analyzed by AA.

CATIONS ANIONS

Calcium : 35 mg/l Chloride : 3,040 mgll

Magnes.ium : T mgl Carbonate : 132 mgll
Barium : mg/l

Strontium : mg/l Bicarbonate : 2,440 mgh

Manganese: 00 mon Sulfate : o mon
Sodium : 2853 mgl/l

pH (field) : 7.00 Specific Gravity : 1.005 grams/mi
Temperature : 85 degrees F Total Dissolved Solids : 8,549 ppm
lonic Strength : 0.13 CO2 in Water : 1 mgf
Mole % CO2 in Gas: mole %
Resistivity : ohm-meters H2S in Water : 0.5 mgf!
Ammonia : ppm Dissolved Oxygen : ppm

..........................................................................................................................................................................

SI calculations based on Tomson-Oddo parameters

Calcite (CaCO3) 8l : 2.16 Calcite PTB : 304

e CODIBIOT 2 caserrmomor o
’ ’ Calcite PTB @ 120 F : 305

Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 140 F : 2.74 Caicite PTB @ 140 F : 30.5
Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 160 F : 2.97 Calcite PTB @ 160 F : 306
Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 180 F : 3.20 Calcite PTB @ 180 F : 306
Calcite (CaCO3) SI @ 200 F : 3.44 Calcite PTB @ 200 F : 3086
Gypsum (CaS04) Sl : -3.94 Gypsumn PTB : N/A

Barite (BaS0O4) Sl : N/A Barite PTB : N/A

Celestite (SrS04) S| : N/A Celestite PTB : N/A

Confidential

EXHIBIT M -2
Champion Technologies, Inc.

Vernal District Technical Services Page 1 of 2




Analysis Report

April 21, 2010
MARION ENERGY INC
2901 E. 20th street Page 1 of 1
SUITE 106
Farmington NM 87402
ATTN: Doug Endsiey
Client Sample ID; Alpine School District 3-17 Sample D By: Marion Energy
Date Sampled: Apr 12, 2010 Sampler Company: EIS
Date Received: Apr 12, 2010 Sample Taken At: Alpine School District 3-17
Product Description: WATER Sample Taken By: M. Serfustini

Time Received: 1305

Time Sampled: 1030

Field - Temperature: 52 Deg. C
Comments: Dissolved Metals Filtered at Lab

Well Head Runt Time 1 Hr
S$GS Minerals Sample ID: 782-1002133-003
REPORTING ANALYZED
TESTS RESULT UNIT METHOD LIMIT DATE TIME ANALYST
Cil and Greass, (HEM) 9 mgll EPA 1664 5.000 2010-04-16  08:15:00  CM
Sulfate, S04 6 mgll EPA 300.0 1.000 2010-04-14  19:08:00 CM
Conductivity 9300 pmhosiom  SM2510 0.100 2010-04-12 150000 CM
pH 742 s.u. SM4500-H 0.010 20100412 145400 CM
pH Temperature 18.10 °C SM4500-H 0.010 20100412 145400 CM
Total Dissolved Sofids 5741 mgll. SM2540-C 30.000 20100413 13:30:00 CM
Total Suspended Solids 517 mgi. SM2540-D 5.000 201004413 13:30:00 CM
Chloride, C! 2315 mglL EPA 3000 1.000 2010-04-14  13:08:00 CM
Alkalinity, mg CaCOL (pH 4.5) 1684 molL 5M2320-8 5,000 2010-04-14  1200:00 CM
Carbonate Alkalinity as CaC03 <5 mgft 5M2320-B 5.000 20100414 1200:00 CM
Bicarbonate Atkalinity as CaCO3 1664 mgit 5M2320-B 5.000 201004-14  1200:00 CM
METALS BY iCP
Barium, Ba - Dissolved 2502 mglt EPA 200.7 0.002 2010-04-13  15:00:00 CM
Barium, Ba - Tolal 5.210 mglL EPA 200.7 0.002 20100419  17:33:00 CM
Calcium, Ca - Dissolved 25.82 mgil EPA 200.7 0.030 20100413 45:00:00 CM
Calcium, Ca - Total 31.91 mgiL EPA 200.7 0.030 2010-04-19  17:33:00 CM
lron, Fe - Dissolved 007 mgiL EPA 200.7 0.030 2010-04-13  15:00:00 CM
iron, Fe - Total 49.12 mglL EPA 200.7 0.050 2010-04-19  17:33:00 CM
Magnesium, Mg - Dissolved 9.88 mglL EPA 2007 0.010 20100413 15:00:00 CM
Magnesium, Mg - Total 11,99 mgiL EPA 200.7 0.0%0 20100419 17:33.00 CM
Y
Allen Ludmgton
Water Lab Supervisor
Minerals Services Division :
SGS North Amesica InC.| 5635 North Airport Road Huntington £ (435) 653-2314 £ (435)-653-2436 wvaw.sgs.com/minerals
] Member of lhe SGS Group (Société Générale de Stnveiance)

This document Js issued by the Company under #s General Coadidons of Service accessible al hifp/fvwiw.sgs. terms_and _conditonshim. Altention is drewn fo the lmitation ef fabiity,

indemnification end jurisdiction issves defined therein.

Any hoider of this document s advised that information confalned hereon refiects the Company’s findings at the bme of s intesvention omly and within the simits of Client's instulions, if any. The
Companys sole responsibily is to its Chent and this documen! does nof excrerats padies o a transaction fom exercising aR their rights and obfgations under the transaction documents. Any

forgery or #ication of the content or appearance of this document is urtawful sad offenders may be prosecuted (o the fulle st exlent of the law Ex H ' B IT m
/
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Chris Kierst - RE: April 12,2010 Sampling Event in the ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Sidetrack SWD
Candidate Wells

From: "Jay Stratton" <jstratton@marionenergy.com>

To: "Chris Kierst" <chriskierst@utah.gov>

Date: 4/29/2010 6:40 PM

Subject: RE: April 12, 2010 Sampling Event in the ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Sidetrack SWD
Candidate Wells

CC: "Miller, Relma" <rmiller@bwenergylaw.com>

Attachments: Fw: Water Analysis

Chris,

The water compatibility tests that were done by Champion Technologies on April 26 were from the same
sample that was collected on the ASD 3-17 and ASD 6-17 respectively on April 12. These were witnessed by
Mark Jones as attested by the EIS lab personnel collecting the samples. The samples were taken to SGS and
standard APl water analysis performed. When Marion requested the compatibility test be performed by SGS,
Doug Endsley was advised that they could not perform the testing in the format exhibited in the Champion
Analysis and that he had discussed with you over the phone.

There was enough water sample from both wells left over at SGS and this was delivered to Champion to use in
their compatibility tests that were reported on April 26. Consequently, the individual water analysis that were
first reported (and included as Exhibit M-3) were from SGS. The well analysis from Champion were completed
on April 23! (attached) but only the compatibility tests forwarded for the revised exhibits when it was
completed on April 26 (as attachment to Exhibit E).

Unnecessary confusion resulted from the SGS results being presented with the Champion compatibility

testing. The results were indeed from the same sample taken on April 12 for both the ASD 3-17 and ASD 6-17
but due to independent analysis they were not able to be reconciled with the Champion compatibility testing. |
should have caught this on the clarification request during testimony and we should have not mixed results
from separate labs for that component of the exhibits for the sake of clarity. | have attached the forwarded
email from Doug Endsley that contains the Champion Analysis. These should agree with the Brine 1, 2,3, &4
results presented by Champion. | will confirm that tomorrow when | can print them out and compare them
directly with the compatibility tests. However, | wanted you to get them as soon as possible.

| will also consult with our Attorney, Relma Miller on any testimony verification protocol to get the most
accurate information for the record.

Thanks for catching this oversight and | apologize for the confusion in the presentation of the sample analysis
and compatibility testing.

Best regards,

Jay

file://C:\Documents and Settings\DPRUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4BD9D288N... 5/3/2010
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From: Jay Stratton

Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2010 6:24 PM

To: 'Chris Kierst'

Subject: RE: April 12, 2010 Sampling Event in the ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Sidetrack SWD Candidate Wells

Thanks Chris. You must be working late tonight!

I'm away from the documents at the moment but will see if | can review them electronically this evening if
that will help you progress your review.

Regards,

Jay

From: Chris Kierst [mailto:chriskierst@utah.gov]

Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2010 6:16 PM

To: Jay Stratton

Subject: RE: April 12, 2010 Sampling Event in the ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Sidetrack SWD Candidate Wells

As you prefer, but please recalling that we are not working on Friday.

>>> "Jay Stratton" <jstratton@marionenergy.com> 4/29/2010 5:11 PM >>>
Chris,

We will review the documents you referenced below, and that were part of our testimony, with the technical
team and get back with you. | expect that you should hear from us tomorrow.

Thanks and regards,

Jay

From: Chris Kierst [mailto:chriskierst@utah.gov]

Sent: Thursday, April 29, 2010 5:43 PM

To: Jay Stratton

Subject: April 12, 2010 Sampling Event in the ASD 3-17 and 6-17 Sidetrack SWD Candidate Wells

Jay,
During the course of the hearing yesterday you delivered testimony to the effect that the SGS water analyses
for the subject wells (Exhibit M-3) were used as the basis for the Champion Technologies, Inc., Saturation Index

file://C:\Documents and Settings\DPRUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4BD9D288N... 5/3/2010



Page 3 of 3

Calculations (brines 1 and 2) report dated 4/26/2010, an attachment to Exhibit E, the Marion Energy Follow-up
Response document, dated 4/15/2010 (a response to my 3/1/2010 Permit Analysis Document emailed to Marion
Energy). Can you confirm this? We are unable to reconcile differences amongst several of the Component
concentrations listed that are common to the respective documents, specifically, the concentrations for Calcium,
Magnesium (6-17), Barium, Bicarbonates, Sulfates and Chlorides. Please inform our confusion.

file://C:\Documents and Settings\DPRUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4BD9D288N... 5/3/2010



State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

GARY R. HERBERT

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

May 13,2010

Ground Water Program Director

U. S. Environmental Protection Agency
1595 Wynkoop Street

Denver, CO 80202-1129

Subject: Aquifer Exemption Request for One-Half Mile radius around the Alpine School
District #3-17 and #6-17 Wells. located in Section 17, T13S, R7E. Carbon County.
Utah. Cause No. UIC-362.1&2

Dear Sir,

Marion Energy, Inc. petitioned the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (Board) for an
Underground Injection Control (UIC) permit to inject water into the subject wells located in
Section 17, T13S, R7E, Carbon County, and to exempt the Ferron Sandstone Member of the
Mancos Shale Formation within one-half mile radius of the bottom hole location of each well.
Proper public notice was given and a public hearing was held before the Board on April 28,
2010. One objection from Carbon County concerning a conditional use permit was received and
two comment letters were also received by mail. No public comments were given at the hearing
in response to this matter. The request was approved by the Board after the hearing.

In accordance with 40 CFR Part 144.7, the Division requests your approval of a UIC
program revision for this aquifer exemption.

Enclosed is a copy of the Board Order, exhibits, public notices, and certificate of
service submitted in support of this request. If you would like to discuss this requested
exemption or need more information, please call me at 801-538-5334 or Brad Hill at 801-538-
5315.

Sincerely,

; Director
JRB/GLH/js
Enclosures ~
cc: Brad Hill UTAH
N:\Board Staff Memos\Aquifer Exemption Injection Well DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 o facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 » www.ogm.utah.gov OiL, GAS & MINING



SNE S UNITED STATES ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY
REGION 8

(AN,

] a %ﬁ 1595 Wynkoop Street
@M; DENVER, CO 80202-1129
KT Phone 800-227-8917
hitp://www.epa.gov/region08
JUN 24 2010 ;_
|  RECEIVED
Ref: 8P-W-GW
JUN 2.8 2010
Mr.John R. Baza, Director
Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
Utah Department of Natural Resources
1594 West North Temple

Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
RE: Aquifer Exemption Concurrence
Clear Creek Formation
Marion Energy, Inc.
Wells: Alpine School District 3-17
SWSE Sec 8, T13S-R7E
| Alpine School District 6-17
NWNE Sec 17, TI3S-R7E
Carbon County, UT

API #43-007-31182 & 43-007-31181
Dear Mr. Baza:

The U.S. Environmental Protection Agency Region 8 (EPA) Underground Injection
Control (UIC) staff has reviewed your request on behalf of Marion Energy, Inc. (Marion)
regarding an aquifer exemption for the Clear Creek Field located in Carbon County, Utah, for the
Alpine School District #3-17 and #6-17 wells. Based on the review of the supporting
information provided by the Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining (UDOGM), and pursuant to
40 CFR § 144.7(a)(3) and EPA Ground Water Protection Branch (GWPB), Guidance #34, EPA
offers concurrence with the aquifer exemption. The aquifer exemption was requested in
conjunction with an UDOGM permit action.

The aquifer exemption is considered to be a non-substantial revision of the UDOGM
program for the regulation of Class II injection well under Section 1425 of the Safe Drinking
Water Act, as defined by UIC Program Guidance 34 and 40 CFR § 145.32.

BACKGROUND

Marion submitted applications for a UIC permit to the UDOGM for the Alpine School District
#3-17 and #6-17 wells and petitioned the Utah Board of Qil, Gas, and Mining for a UIC permit on April
28,2010, and a public hearing was held before the Board on April 28, 2010. Both wells are shut-in
producing wells. The permit request was to convert the wells to Salt Water Disposal (SWD) wells and
allow injection into the portion of the Ferron Sandstone Member of the Mancos Shale Formation at a
depth interval of 4,268 — 5,119 feet for the #3-17 well, and 4,866 — 5,601 feet for the #6-17 well. The
Area of Review (AOR) for the wells was proposed at one-half mile. On May 21, 2010, the UDOGM



submitted the request for an aquifer exemption to the EPA on behalf of Marion. The UDOGM approved
the Marion permit request after the public hearing. Additional information was provided by the
UDOGM and Marion to EPA via e-mail from June 7-9, 2010.

Four Ferron Sandstone Member water samples, taken from the 3-17, 6-17, Olman 2-20, and the
Ridge Runner 13-17 Frac Tank showed the Ferron Sandstone Member water to contain Total Dissolved
Solids (TDS) in the range of 3,618 — 6,180 mg/l. An aquifer exemption is necessary prior to injection
into the Ferron Sandstone Member because the formation has water containing less than 10,000 mg/I
TDS, meetmg the deﬁmtlon of an Underground Source of Drinking Water (USDW).

The injectate is proposed to be produced water from nearby production wells producing from the
Ferron Sandstone Member of the Mancos Shale Formation. The injectate will reportedly have a TDS
content in the general range of 3,618 — 6,180 mg/1 (based on the analytical data discussed above).

There are adequate confining layers immediately above and below the injection zone. The
injection zone is overlain by approximately 2,000 feet of shale layers in the Blue Gate Member which
would act as an upper confining zone. The upper confining layer includes shale in the depth interval of
2,391 — 4,372 feet for the 3-17 well, and 2,275 ~ 4,866 feet for the 6-17 well. There is approximately
500 feet of shale in the Tunuck Member which would act as lower confining layer.

Based on the information provided, EPA concurs with the aquifer exemption request for the
Ferron Sandstone Member of the Mancos Shale Formation citing the criteria listed below:

e [t does not currently serve as a source of drinking water. There is one water supply well
located within one-half mile of the well pad serving both the #3-17 and #6-17 wells, but it
draws water from the much shallower Star Point Aquifer, between the surface and 1,200 feet.

e It is mineral, hydrocarbon, or geothermal energy producing, or it can be demonstrated by a
permit applicant as part of a permit application for a Class II or Class III operation to contain
minerals or hydrocarbons that considering their quantity and location are expected to be
commercially producible. The Formation produces oil in commercial quantities.

DESCRIPTION OF THE EXEMPTED AQUIFER
The depth interval and extent of the exempted aquifer are as follows:

#3-17 well: The Ferron Sandstone Member of the Mancos Shale Formation between the approximate
depth of 4,268 ~ 5,119 feet, and horizontally within a one-half mile radius from the Alpine School
District #3-17 well with a down hole location of SW/SE Section 8 T13S, R7E, 160 feet from the south
line and 1,475 feet from the west line.

#6-17 well: The Ferron Sandstone Member of the Mancos Shale Formation between the approximate
depth of 4,866 — 5,601 feet, and horizontally within a one-half mile radius from the Alpine School
District #6-17 well with a down hole location of NW/NE Section 17 T13S, R7E, 2,410 feet from the
south line and 995 feet from the west line.



EPA concurs with the aquifer exemption requested by UDOGM. If you have questions or
concerns regarding the above action, please contact Bruce Suchomel of my staff by calling 303-
312-6001, or 1-800-227-8917, extension 312-6001.

Sincerely,

Stephen S. Tuber
Assistant Regional Administrator
Office of Partnerships and Regulatory Assistance

cc: Brad Hill, Environmental Manager
Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

Robert E. Smith, Geologist
USEPA, Office of Ground Water and Drinking Water
Drinking Water Prevention Branch (4606M)



State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

GARY R. HERBERT

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY 8. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director
June 29, 2010
Keri Clarke

Marion Energy, Inc.
119 South Tennessee, Suite 200
McKinney, TX 75069

Subject: Application for Class II Injection Permit. Alpine School District 3-17 Well. Section 17.
Township 13 South. Range 7 East, Carbon County. Utah API 43-007-31182

Dear Mr. Clarke:

Pursuant to Utah Admin. Code R649-5-3-3, the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Division") issues its administrative approval for conversion of the referenced well to a Class II
injection well. Accordingly, the following stipulations shall apply for full compliance with this
approval and a permit may be issued upon compliance with the stipulations.

1. Conformance with all conditions and requirements of the complete application
submitted by Marion Energy, Inc.

2. Compliance with all applicable requirements for the operation, maintenance and
reporting for Underground Injection Control (“UIC™) Class II injection wells
pursuant to Utah Admin. Code R649-1 et seq.

A casing/tubing pressure test shall be conducted prior to final approval.
Scheduling of this test shall be coordinated with Division personnel.

QI

Note that this letter does not constitute final approval to commence injection
operations. This approval is only temporary and allows Marion Energy, Inc. to perform activities
and gather information necessary for the Division to issue a Class II Underground Injection
Control permit.

If you have any questions regarding this approval or the necessary requirements, please
contact Christopher Kierst at (801) 538-5337.

.

Sincgel%,
3\ N
LR N
Brad Hill s
Acting Associate Director
BGH/CJK/js UTAH
cc: Bruce Suchomel, Environmental Protection Agency DNR
Carbon County Commission
N:AO&G Permits\Injection Permits\MarionEnergy\ASD 3-17 SWD S O

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 » www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-063018X

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals 1o dnll new walls, significantly daepen existing walls below cumrent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged waells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals,

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

|77 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

oo
1. TYPE OF WELL

—
5. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

owwelt [1  casweLL ) OTHER Alpine School District 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 3. AP NUMBER:
Marion Energy inc 4300731182
3, ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT-
119°S. Tennessoe #200  ;, McKinney state TX 25 75069 (972) 540-2967 Wildcat
4 LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT sURFACE: 692 FNL 2014 FEL county. Carbon
QTRQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDWN. NWNE 17 13S  7E STATE:
UTAH
" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[] NOTICE OF INTENT [ acioze [J oeepen [T] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit in Dupiicate) [ autercasing [] rracrure TrReat [7] sioerrack 10 REPARWELL
Approximate date work wih start: [ casinrRePair ] newconstrRucTION [[J TemporariLY ABANDON
[[] cHANGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [[J oreratoR cHanGe [ usinererar
[ crance TUBING [J #LuG AnD ABANDON [] venTorFLare
b4 susseauent RePORT [ cHance weLL Name [J ruseack [ wateroisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
Deteat " [[] crance weLL sTaTus [J PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [ warersHur-orF
te of work completion:
D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE m otrer: MIT
12113/2010 [J convert weLL TYpe [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumas, etc.

In advance of converting this well to salt water disposal, an MIT was conducted on 12/13/2010. Mark Jones of DOGM was in
attendance to witness and approve the test. Packer was set at 4247.03' KB with #14,000 compression. Loaded backside with
65 bbls. fresh water. Pressure up to #1000 and test for 30 minutes. Casing held #1000 for 30 minutes with no leak off. Mark
Jones signed off on the test as successful. Upon final approval for disposal, Marion will commence disposing water into this
well.

NAME (PLEASE PR} nTLE Vice President Operations

12/14/2010

SIGNATURE DATE

{This space for State use only)

{5/2000) (See \nstruchons on Reverse Side)






MARION
E N_\E RGY

(\’\W -7 AFFIDAVIT OF MAILING

|, Scott Jacoby, Associate Landman, Marion Energy, Inc. being first duly sworn, dispose and
state as follows:

On March 30, 2010, 1 caused to be mailed by certified, postage prepaid, return receipt
requested, letters informing all operators, surface and mineral owners within a half mile radius
of our Alpine School District 3 -17 well of Marion Energy’s intent to convert the aforementioned
well into a produced water injection well. A map depicting the area in question was also
attached to each letter as required by the Department of Oil, Gas and Mining, as set forth in
rule R649-5 pertaining to the requirements for injecting fluids into reservoirs and the permitting
of Class Il injection wells.

Dated the 30th day of March, 2010

%/M

Scott S. Jacoby /
Associate Landman
Marion Energy Inc.

The forgoing affidavit was subscribed and sworn to me by Scott S. Jacoby
This _30th__day of _March___, 2010.

THERESA GANN
e Notary Public, State of Texas
My Commission Expires

October 10, 2010

, Notary Public.

My Commission expires/atl)' day of [ )(, 7Lr.{/:>2f’ .20 4

Mearion Energy Inc.
119 S. Tennessee, Ste. 200
McKinney, Texas 75069

Tel (972) 540-2967
Fax (972) 547-0442
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Alpine School District 3 -17 (SWD)

Address of Surface Owners within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

Liodakis Ranch LLC
George E. Liodakis
2655 E. Chalet Circle
Sandy, UT 84093

Annie 5. Kosec Trust
C/0 Richard Kosec
1776 Kenilworth Rd.
Helper, UT 84526

Blue Ridge Services LLC
Attn: Denise A Dragoo
Snell & Wilmer LLP
15 W. South Temple
Suite 1200
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

Church of Jesus Christ of LDS
LDS Church, Tax Division

50 E. North Temple

22" Floor, RE: 2A-0736

Salt Lake City, UT 84150

Alpine Board of Education
Alpine District

50 No. Center

American Fork, UT 84003

Alpine School District
Attn: Mr. Rob Smith

575 North 100 East
American Fork, UT 84003



7. Carbon County Recreation &
Transportation Special Service District
125 East Main
Price, UT 84501

8. Lutheran High School
2222 North Santiago Blvd
Orange, CA 92867

9. Mary Louise Seamons
1774 South 340 East
Orem, UT 84058
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Alpine School District 3 - 17 (SWD)

Address of Mineral Owners within a 1/2 mile radius of the well site

. Merrion Oil and Gas Corporation
610Reilly Ave
Farmington, NM 87401

. Northstargas, LC
C/0 Steve Ault
P.O. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

. Summit Energy Partners Clear Creek, LLC
1441 Ute Bivd

Suite 280

Park City, UT 84098

. Bureau of Land Management
Price Field Office

Attn: Don Stephens

125 S. 600 W.

Price, UT 84501

. State of Utah

Trust Lands Administration
675 East 500 South

Suite 500

Salt Lake City, UT 84102



6. Reverse Exchange LLC
As title holder for
AOK Family Holding Trust,
Jana Gunderson, Trustee
341 North 1100 East
American Fork, UT 84003

7. Ms. Anastasia Daraban
1833 S. West Temple #1
Salt Lake City, UT 84115

8. Harvey Stone
155 Franklin Street
P.0. Box 536
Ferron, UT 84523

9. Mr. J Richard Bell
4632 Idlewild Road
Salt Lake City, UT 84124

10. Ms. Joni Buehner
350 Claude Drive
Santa Clara, CA 84765

11. Ms. Connie Condie
433 E. Vine Street
Murray UT, 84765

12. Ms. Connie Stauffer
8851 Edinburgh Circle
Highlands Ranch, CO 80129



13. Mr. John Nicolaides
5040 N. Second Street
Phoenix, AZ 85012

14. Mr. Paul Daraban
10104 Dunsinane
South Jordan, UT 84095

15. Mr. Michael Stathis
1579 S. East Canyon Drive
Cedar City, UT 84720

16. Mr. Tommy John Nicolaides
989 Military Drive
Salt Lake City, UT 84108

17. Mrs. Hilda Hammond
2912 Redwood
Costa Mesa, CA 92626

18. Mary Louise Seamons
1774 South 340 East
Orem, UT 84058

19. Evelyn Jacobsen
** No Address Available

20. Leoan Gunderson
** No Address Available



21. Anthon Madsen
1821 Howell
Richland, WA 99354

22. Annie Andersen
1646 Snow Rd
Fort Sill, OK 73503

23. Dix Jensen
525 Woodhill Dr.
Price, UT 84501

24. Alice Pannier
1138 Michigan Ave.
Salt Lake City, UT 84105

25. Carbon County
120 East Main Street
Price, UT 84501

26.James T. Jensen
2961 N. Caitland Ct.
Salt Lake City, UT 84121

27.Jerry L. Jesen
1155 N. Carbonville Rd.
Price, UT 84501

28. Bonnie Lynne Jensen Stradling
18316 Highway 56
Sherman, TX 75902



29. Louise M. Watts
**No Address Available

30. Johannah Hafen
**No Address Available

31. Louise F. Seeley
**No Address Available

32. Estate of Lee Thomas
**No Address Available

33. Jack Thomas
Route 2
Preston, ID 83263

34. Charlyn J. Dalebout
** No Address Available

35. Stephen C. Jacobsen
** No Address Available

36. Helen Louise and John Andrew Watts
** No Address Available
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GARY R. HERBERT
Governor

GREGORY S. BELL

Lieutenant Governor

Operator:
Wells:
Location:
County:
API No.:

Well Type:

State of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
MICHAEL R. STYLER ‘

Executive Director
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
JOHN R.BAZA

Division Director

UNDERGROUND INJECTION CONTROL PERMIT
Cause No. UIC-3454 = 362 .
Marion Energy, Incorporated
Alpine School District 3-17
Section 17, Township13 South, Range 7 East (SLBM)
Carbon
43-007-31182

Salt Water Disposal Well

Stipulations of Permit Approval

1. Approval for conversion to Injection Well issued on June 29, 2010.

2. Maximum Allowable Surface Injection Pressure: 400 psia

3. Corresponding Injection Rate: Limited by pressure.

4. Injection Interval: Perforations from 4,268’ to 5,119 in the Ferron Sandstone Member of
the Mancos Shale.

5. A Step Rate Test is required when the Maximum Aliowable Injection Interval Injection
Pressure is attained. The well is unlikely to reach this limit because the current reservoir
charging injection pressure is extremely low and insensitive to increases in injection rate.

Approved by: /Q’Q{—\IH\ 12//6) 2eic

Rogers Date

Assomate D1rector

JR/CKJjs

cc:  Bruce Suchomel, Environmental Protection Agency
Bureau of Land Management, Price
Carbon County Planning DNR

N:\O&G Permits\Injection Permits\MarionEnergy_Mid-Power Resources\ASD 3-17 SWD

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

UTAH

At

telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



RECEIVED STATE OF UTAH

UIC FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES S
APR 11 2011 DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
DIVOFOIL GAS&MNING \ONTHLY INJECTION REPORT
Operator: _Marion Energy, Inc. Report Period: Jan-2011
Address: 901 N. McDonald St., Suite 601
city McKinney Phone Number: _(972) 540-2967
state X zip 75069 Amended Report J (highlight changes)
Well Name and Number APl Number
Alpine School District 3-17 | /4- I 201 dgie. of 13t [4s0073iis2
Location of Well -7 ® : Field or Unit Name
. , 1V1$€L+10h Clear Creek Unit
Footage : 2014.49' FEL 692.77FWL County : Carbon - -
. Lease Designation and Number
QQ, Section, Township, Range; WNE 17 13S 7E State : UTAH Fee
Date Volume%ed Hours in Service Maximum Pressure Aver?:g:sgg ;ratmg Tubing /P(?:ssslragr;eAnnulus
0 0 0 0
0 0 0 0
0 0 0] 0
366 24 5 5 0
327 24 5 5 0
241 24 5 5 0
7 417 24 5 5 0
8 429 24 5 5 0
9 516 24 5 5 0
10 531 24 5 5 0
11 ~ 524 24 5 5 0
12 525 24 5 5 0
13 518 24 5 5 0
14 512 24 5 5 0
15 507 24 5 5 0
16 498 24 5 5 0
17 487 24 5 5 0
18 492 24 5 5 0
19 492 24 5 5 0
20 466 24 5 5 0
21 485 24 5 5 0
22 466 24 5 5 0
23 469 24 5 5 0
24 467 24 5 5 0
25 473 24 5 5 0
26 476 24 5 5 0
27 475 24 5 5 0
28 464 24 5 5 0
29 461 24 5 5 0
30 458 24 5 5 0
31 472 24 5 5 0
Total volume injected for month 13,014 All time cumulative volume injected 13,014

| hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.

Name (Please Print) _Iheresa Gann Title Sr. Division Order/Lease Analyst

Signature Date 4/8/2011

(5/2000)



Sundry Nunber: 63783 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acter casing [ casine repar
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
O CHANGE WELL STATUS O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS O CONVERT WELL TYPE
v SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT O PRODUCTION START OR RESUME O RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
[ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
O DRILLING REPORT 0 0 0
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: ISaIt Water Line Repair

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
We recently completed a repair on our Water Transfer Line by pulling a Accepted by the

6" liner through the existing 8" steel line. Attached is the report of that Utah Division of
work. 0il, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
June 08, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 6/5/2015

RECEI VED: Jun. 05, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 63783 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

Marion Energy
SWD Line Repair Report
6/2/2015

Permission was obtained from UPRR and UDOT to repair the salt water disposal line by feeding 6” SDR 7
HDPE pipe into the existing 8” steel line. Marion Energy Inc. repaired the water line in the approved
manner by running 7300’ of HDPE inside of the 8” steel line and reconnecting to the existing 8” HDPE
pipe that was part of the original system. Once the HDPE was run, Mark Jones with DOGM came out
and witnessed a pressure test of the line. On Friday May 29th, 2015 the line was filled with water from
the town of Scofield, Utah and pressured up to 350 psi to stretch the line. The pressure was then backed
off to 340 psi and held constant for 60 minutes. The test was deemed successful and the areas of

excavation were backfilled.

RECEI VED: Jun. 05, 2015



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 6/1/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Marion Energy, Inc Utah Gas Operating Solutsion, LLC

1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250 1415 N Loop West, Suite 1250

Houston, TX 77008 Houston, TX 77008

281-540-0028 281-540-0028

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Clear Creek

WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec |[TWN |RNG |API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attache Listq

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/24/20 15 :
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/24/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9345770-0161 ' ‘
REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: N/A

2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/25/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA weli(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/25/2015

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: 7/8/2015

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Clear Creek Tank Battery

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/25/2015
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SU46335

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SU46334 and SU46341

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 7/9/2015

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 7/9/2015

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 7/9/2015

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015

6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 7/9/2015

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 7/9/2015

COMMENTS:

7/9/2015



Marion Energy, Inc to

Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC

Effective 6/1/2015

Well Name Sec ;TWN |RNG|API 'Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status |Unit

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17 17 |130S |070E 4300731182 [2550 |State Fee wD A CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19 20 |140S |070E 4301530682 2550 |Federal |[Federal GW |OPS |CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18 17 |140S |070E 4301530683 |16130 Federal |[Federal . GW |OPS |CLEAR CREEK]
UTAH FUEL 10 5 |140S |070E 4300716016 |2550 [Fee Fee GW [P CLEAR CREEK|
RIDGE RUNNER 13-17 17 1140S |070E 4301530269 2550 |Federal Federal GW |P CLEAR CREEK]
UTAH FUEL 1 5 |140S |070E 4300716009 [2550 Fee Fee GW |PA  |CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 2 32 |130S [070E 4300716010 2550 Fee Fee GW_ |PA  |CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 3 32 |130S |070E 4300716011 2550 |Fee Fee GW PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 4 30 130S |070E 4300716012 2550 (Fee Fee GW 'PA  |CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 5 31 1308 |070E|4300716013 2550 [Fee Fee GW |PA CLEAR CREEK]
UTAH MINERAL STATE 29 (1308 |070E 4300730102 2550 |State Fee GW |PA CLEAR CREEK
BALLPARK CYN 17-2 16 |130S |100E 4300731169 15494 Fee Fee D |[PA

KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4 [16 |130S |100E 4300731170 |15495 Federal Fee D PA

BALLPARK CYN 16-2 16 |130S |100E 4300731171 15434 Fee Fee D PA

CORDINGLY CYN 10-1 15 |130S |100E 4300731173 |15435 Fee Fee D PA

BALLPARK CYN 16-2X 16 1130S |100E 4300731207 15496 |Fee Fee D PA

UTAH FUEL A-1 6 1140S |070E 4301516021 2550 |Fee Fee GW_ |PA CLEAR CREEK
UTAH FUEL 8 19 1130S |070E 4300716015 12550 |Fee Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK|
OMAN 2-20 20 |130S [070E 4300730289 2550 |State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK]
KENILWORTH RR #1 16 |130S |100E|4300731006 (14624 Fee Fee GW S

KENILWORTH RR #2 16 |130S |100E 4300731007 14625 Fee Fee GW IS

BALLPARK CANYON #1 16 (130S |100E 4300731015 15159 [Fee Fee GW S

CORDINGLY CYN 15-2 15 130S |100E 4300731064 15160 'State  |Fee GW IS

CORDINGLY CYN 15-1 15 [130S |100E 4300731065 15161 State | Fee GW |8

CORDINGLY CYN 11-1 11 |130S |100E 4300731070 15432 Fee Fee GW S

CORDINGLY CYN 15-5 15 |130S |100E 4300731167 15433 State  Fee GW IS

KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3 |16 |130S |100E 4300731168 |16041 Federal Fee GW S

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17 17 11308 |070E 4300731181 2550 State Fee GW S CLEAR CREEK
OMAN 10-29 29 |130S ;070E 4300731210 2550 State |Fee GW |S CLEAR CREEK|
KENILWORTH RR 1-A 16 |130S |100E 4300731229 16456 Fee Fee GW S

RIDGE RUNNER 11-20 20 |140S |070E 4301530271 2550 |Federal Federal GW |S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30 20 |140S |070E 4301530680 |2550 |Federal {Federal GW |S CLEAR CREEK]
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19 17 {1408 |070E 4301530684 (2550 |Federal Federal |GW 'S CLEAR CREEK
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17 17 1408 1070E 4301530685 2550 !Federal Federal !GW S CLEAR CREEK

6/25/2015



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drilt new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to C' ear C re ek
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

o weLL [] easweLL [ oTHER Compressor

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE _ .., Houston srace VX 5 77008 (281) 540-0028
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: county: Carbon
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 33 13S 7E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT O O 1
(Submit in Duplicate) ] autercasine [] eracTuRE TREAT [C] sioevrack To REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work wil start: [] casinerePaR [T] w~ew consTrRucTION [[] TeMPORARILY ABANDON
6/1/2015 [] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [/] operaToR cHanGE [] vusinG repar
[ cHance TuBING [[] PLuc anp asanpoN [T] ventoreare
[] suBsEQUENT REPORT [ cHance weLL NamE [] rruesack [[] wateroisposaL
{Submit Originat Form Only)
[C] cHANGE WELL STATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/IRESUME) [T] watersHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[J commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O orker:
] convertweLL Tvpe [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, eic.

Please accept this as notice that as of June 1st,2015, Marion Energy, Inc. is resigning as the operator of the "Clear Creek
Compressor Station” and assigning Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. as the successor of operator. This is in conjunction
with Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC bond number _J() 4@

"Clear Creek Compressor Station"

Sec 33 135S 7E NWNW

Marion Ener

Signatdre: , Date: (é" “l (\/
Name: ?Lu/\, Title: \j\P
9 l

Utah Gas (gerating Solutions, LLC.
Signature: Date: & ~15" 24+ ' g

Name: __EEUEK'- [ A Mk'h,hl Title: AT~ (¢ D A'“&NE\‘ ) Fact
NAME (PLEASE Emnjwo ’“k?-m TImLE &M_‘LMAMBMQF

DATE 6 - ls.— 204 r

SIGNATURE

{This space for State use only)

APPROVED
Lot ¢

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

liyz{\u. GAS & MINING
BY:_$=XaeWno O Madine




STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-1257

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Clear Creek Unit

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oL weLL [ GASWELL ]  OTHER
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Marion Energy, Inc
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 N Loop W, STE 1250 . Houston srare VX 5, 77008 (281) 540-0028 Helper Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:
STATE:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioize ] oeepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
/] noTicE oF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [ atercasie [0 rracTurEe TREAT [] siETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [J casing Repair ] wew consTRucTION [] vemporariLY ABANDON
6/1/2015 [C] cHaNGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [Z] oreraTOR cHANGE [ tusinG RePair
[J cwance TuBING [J PLuc aNp asanDON [J venTorFLaRe
[J susseQuenT REPORT [J cHance weLL NaME ] rucsack [] warter DisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[J cnance weL staTus [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] warter sHuT-oFF
Date of work completion:
[[] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O orwer:
[J convertwewL Type [ RrecOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As of June 1st, 2015, Marion Energy, Inc. resigns as Operator over its former Clear Creek Unit and Helper Field assets. In
conjunction with this resignation, Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. will be taking over as the Successor Operator upon your
approval. Please refer to all documents submitted by Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC. as successor unit operator and on

behalf of Marion Energy, Inc. regarding this change.

Please see the attached Appendix A below for a complete well and facility list that will be transferred upon governing approval.
As the Vice President of Marion Energy, Inc. | ask that you accept this letter as Marion Energy's official resignation and request
to transfer operating rights to Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC.

Signattire:

Date:él”l"(

Doug FlaAnery
Vice President

NAME (PLEASEFRINT) DA'W

. MachRIT

T Aﬁeﬁ"l—' CodRc T O?(—“A"OL

L.

SIGNATURE

oae _ @~ (Y- 201 ¢

{This space for State use only)

(5/2000)

APPROVED

{See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV. OIL GAS & MINING

BY:

JUL 09 2015

2



Well Name

ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 9-1
JACOB 5-5

JACOB 4-8

OMAN 2-31

OMAN 3-32

MADSEN 11-20

OMAN 7-19

WOOLSEY 3-31

OLD RAIL ROAD GRADE 17-1
KENILWORTH WASH 18-1
ALRAD CYN 13-1
CORDINGLY CYN 15-6
RIDGE RUNNER 7-20
RIDGE RUNNER 8-19
RIDGE RUNNER 2-18
UTAH FUEL 10

RIDGE RUNNER 13-17
UTAH FUEL 1

UTAH FUEL 2

UTAH FUEL 3

UTAH FUEL 4

UTAH FUEL 5

UTAH MINERAL STATE
BALLPARK CYN 17-2
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-4
BALLPARK CYN 16-2
CORDINGLY CYN 10-1
BALLPARK CYN 16-2X
UTAH FUEL A-1

OMAN 14-20

CORDINGLY CYN 2-1
SWD 1

SHIMMIN 33-1

SEAMONS 5-8
CRITCHLOW 29-1
RADAKOVICH 12-5-1
ALLRED 10-1

APPENDIX A

Well List

Sec TWN
17 130S
16 130S
5 140S
5 140S
30 130S
29 130S
19 130S
19 130S
31 130S
17 130S
18 130S
13  130S
15 130S
20 140S
20 140S
17  140S
5 140S
17 140S
5 140S
32 130S
32 130S
30 130S
31 130S
29 130S
16 130S
16 130S
16 130S
15 130S
16 130S
6 140S
29 130S
2 130S
28 130S
33 120S
8 130S
29 120S
5 1308
10 120S

RNG

070E
100E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
100E
100E
100E
100E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
070E
100E
100E
100E
100E
100E
070E
070E
100E
100E
110E
070E
110E
070E
110E

APl

4300731182
4300731172
4300731190
4300731191
4300731246
4300731247
4300731297
4300731298
4300731305
4300731354
4300731355
4300731357
4300731416
4301530681
4301530682
4301530683
4300716016
4301530269
4300716009
4300716010
4300716011
4300716012
4300716013
4300730102
4300731169
4300731170
4300731171
4300731173
4300731207
4301516021
4300731209
4300731236
4300731417
4300731431
4300731432
4300731433
4300731434
4300731435

Status
A
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
LA
OPS
OPS

PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
PA
RET
RET
RET
RET
RET
RET
RET
RET



RADAKOVICH 12-5
SEAMONS 5-8-2
WOOLSEY 3-31-1
ALLRED 13-1

JACOB 5-5

UTAH FUEL 8

OMAN 2-20
KENILWORTH RR #1
KENILWORTH RR #2
BALLPARK CANYON #1
CORDINGLY CYN 15-2
CORDINGLY CYN 15-1
CORDINGLY CYN 11-1
CORDINGLY CYN 15-5
KENILWORTH RAILROAD 15-3
ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 6-17
OMAN 10-29
KENILWORTH RR 1-A
RIDGE RUNNER 11-20
RIDGE RUNNER 1-30
RIDGE RUNNER 2-19
RIDGE RUNNER 11-17

Clear Creek Compressor Station

5 130S

8 130S
31 130S
13 120S
5 140S
19 130S
20 130S
16 130S
16 130S
16 130S
15 130S
15 130S
11  130S
15 130S
16 130S
17 130S
29 130S
16 130S
20 140S
20 140S
17 140S
17  140S
Facility List
33 13S

070E
070E
070E
110E
070E
070E
070E
100E
100E
100E
100E
100E
100E
100E
100E
070E
070E
100E
070E
070E
070E
070E

7E

4300731436
4300731437
4300731438
4300731439
4300731513
4300716015
4300730289
4300731006
4300731007
4300731015
4300731064
4300731065
4300731070
4300731167
4300731168
4300731181
4300731210
4300731229
4301530271
4301530680
4301530684
4301530685

RET
RET
RET
RET
RET

w
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STATE OF UTAH UIC FORM 5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT

Well Name and Number AP! Number
Alpine School District 3-17 4300731182
Location of Well Field or Unit Name
' ' Clear Creek
Footage : 2014.49' FEL, 692.77' FNL County : Carbon Toass Designation and Number
QQ, Section, Township, Range: NWNE 17 138 7E State : UTAH ML-1257

EFFECTIVE DATE OF TRANSFER: 6/1/2015

CURRENT OPERATOR
Company: Marion Energy, Inc Name: uj‘a @u)mu\_\
Address: 1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 Signature:
city Houston state TX _ zip 77008 Title:
~
Phone: (281) 540-0028 Date: Clulis
Comments:
NEW OPERATOR
Company: Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC Name: \(—L wl. M(z(ﬁ"
Address: 1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 Signature: : . :
city Houston state TX _ zjp 77008 Title: MQAJT’ L‘M (o 4] )‘(M&r
Phone:  (281) 540-0028 pate: o -(5-2en\
Comments:
(This space for State use only)
Transfer approved by: Approval Date:

Title:

Comments: A_{\ \V‘)\&Am ff/MI"]L /)MS /|4 44/ /Iof /}fo// 7;/
|

waf 7é y (s ANt

phis el <G5 o /s~
yic® ey




Sundry Nunber: 62786 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON |:| PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE |:| WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION v’ OTHER OTHER: IStep Rate Test

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Attached is our proposed procedure for a witnessed Step Approved by the
Rate Test. We would like to raise our permitted maximum Utah Division of
allowable injection pressure of 400psig. If you have questions Oil, Gas and Mining

about the procedure, or need more information, please
contact Patrick W. Merritt. Patrick W. Merritt
pmerritt@traton.org 281-540-0028 (O) 713-299-7558 (C) By:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 Houston, TX 77008

Date:

July 21, 2015

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/20/2015

RECEI VED: Apr. 20, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 62786 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

UTAH

DNR

.-A‘....('

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43007311820000

Notify Mark Jones, (435)820-8504, and or Dan Jarvis, (801)538-5338, at least 2 working days
prior to running the SRT to allow DOGM to witness the test.

RECEI VED: Jul . 21, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62786 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

Project: Step-Rate Test of ASD 3-17 SWD

Purpose: Determine formation parting pressure and establish max injection
pressure and rate allowed to prevent fracturing the disposal
formation.

Procedure:

1. Shut well in for minimum of 48 hrs. prior to testing to allow BHP to be at
or near shut-in formation pressure.

2. Move in and fill at least 3- 500 bbl frac tanks. Heat tanks if necessary.
Have water haulers standing by or be prepared to use produced water
from wells plumbed directly to frac tank in the event more water is
required

3. MIRU Halliburton pumping services. RU Halliburton SPIDR system for
pressure and rate monitoring and memory. Make sure system will be
able to calculate formation flow capacity and wellbore skin. If SPIDR is
not available contact slickline services for memory pressure gauges.

4. Pressure test Halliburton flow lines to 3000 psi. Fill casing and pressure
test to 500 psi. If casing will not hold pressure, discontinue testing.

5. Begin pre-test at 0.5 bbls/min for 1 displacement volume or 20 mins
whichever is longer. Ensure that all systems are reading and recording
properly.

6. Based upon pressure information obtained in step 5, begin test at
0.5bpm for 20 min of stabilized injection rate. Step up by 0.5 bpm at
each additional 20 minute intervals. Be especially careful to have each
step interval be identical in duration and that rate has stabilized. If at
any time during the test surface pressure reaches a pressure that would
exceed expected formation fracture pressure of 0.65 psi/ft, shut down
and back flow. Record all pressure information at regular time intervals.

7. If a backflow of the well is necessary shutdown until stabilized and
attempt to re-inject at the most recent stabilized injection prior to
pressuring up. If injection still can't be established record all
information and rig down test.

RECEI VED: Apr. 20, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 62786 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

8. If the test proceeds without having to backflow, perform as many steps
as necessary to achieve formation parting pressure (FPP). This will
generally be indicated by a constant pressure at constant rate over the
same time interval as other steps.

9. Once FPP is established, backflow well and record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 min
shut in pressures. Pump any additional water on location into disposal
and release frac tanks.

RECEI VED: Apr. 20, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 64967 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
v" NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE \/ WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Planned procedure is to attempt to clean out fill from the well from Approved by the
4,860'to 5,200'. If successful we would add perforations in the interval Whaly R8yi2dibof
5,000' - 5,100'. Permitted depth for disposal it 4,268' - 5,119". If the Oil, Gas and Mining
cleanout is not successful we would add perfs in the intervals 4,275' - Date:
4,282', 4,310' - 4,332', and 4,688' - 4.724'. After cleanout attempt and \b'
perforation additions, we would like to run a step rate test as attached By: 2

to better define the disposal limits of the formation. Currently the well
is only capable of approximately 4,000 to 4,500 BPD disposal capacity
under the 400 PSI pressure limit. The step rate test would be to
determine what pressure would be required to achieve the full 15,000
BWPD using a maximum pressure limit of 1,500 psi during the test.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE
Patrick Merritt 281 540-0028 President
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 7/127/2015

RECEI VED: Jul . 27, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 64967 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

Project: Step-Rate Test of ASD 3-17 SWD

Purpose: Determine formation parting pressure and establish max injection
pressure and rate allowed to prevent fracturing the disposal
formation.

Procedure:

1. Shut well in for minimum of 48 hrs. prior to testing to allow BHP to be at
or near shut-in formation pressure.

2. Move in and fill at least 3- 500 bbl frac tanks. Heat tanks if necessary.
Have water haulers standing by or be prepared to use produced water
from wells plumbed directly to frac tank in the event more water is
required

3. MIRU Halliburton pumping services. RU Halliburton SPIDR system for
pressure and rate monitoring and memory. Make sure system will be
able to calculate formation flow capacity and wellbore skin. If SPIDR is
not available contact slickline services for memory pressure gauges.

4. Pressure test Halliburton flow lines to 3000 psi. Fill casing and pressure
test to 500 psi. If casing will not hold pressure, discontinue testing.

5. Begin pre-test at 0.5 bbls/min for 1 displacement volume or 20 mins
whichever is longer. Ensure that all systems are reading and recording
properly.

6. Based upon pressure information obtained in step 5, begin test at
0.5bpm for 20 min of stabilized injection rate. Step up by 0.5 bpm at
each additional 20 minute intervals. Be especially careful to have each
step interval be identical in duration and that rate has stabilized. If at
any time during the test surface pressure reaches a pressure that would
exceed expected formation fracture pressure of 0.65 psi/ft, shut down
and back flow. Record all pressure information at regular time intervals.

7. If a backflow of the well is necessary shutdown until stabilized and
attempt to re-inject at the most recent stabilized injection prior to
pressuring up. If injection still can't be established record all
information and rig down test.

RECEI VED: Jul . 27, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 64967 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

8. If the test proceeds without having to backflow, perform as many steps
as necessary to achieve formation parting pressure (FPP). This will
generally be indicated by a constant pressure at constant rate over the
same time interval as other steps.

9. Once FPP is established, backflow well and record ISIP, 5, 10 and 15 min
shut in pressures. Pump any additional water on location into disposal
and release frac tanks.

RECEI VED: Jul . 27, 2015



STATE OF UTAH

omunded
Qpproved UIC FORM 5

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT

Well Name and Number AP! Number
Alpine School District 3-17 4300731182
Location of Wel! Field or Unit Name

Clear Creek

Footage : 2014.49' FEL, 692.77' FNL

County : Carbon

Lease Designation and Number

QQ, Section, Township, Range: NWNE 17 138 7E State : UTAH ML-1257
EFFECTIVE DATE OF TRANSFER: 6/1/2015
CURRENT OPERATOR
Company: Marion Energy, Inc Name:
Address: 1415 North Loop West, STE 1250 Signatdre:
city Houston state TX _ zjp 77008 Title: \). o ¢/
Phone: (281) 540-0028 Date: o
Comments:
NEW OPERATOR
Company: Utah Gas Operating Solutions, LLC Name: 2t Mkh—m!—t

Address: 1415 North Loop West, STE 1250

city Houston state TX _ zip 77008

Phone: (281 ) 540-0028

Comments:

Signature: y k) . (lil ™
Title: A{zgdf- Crangres A-m!; i FAcr
Date: @ -1S-nT

(This space for State use only)

Transfer approved by:

Title:

Comments:

(5/2000)

Approval Date:




INSTRUCTIONS

This report shall be filed to request a transfer of authority to inject for any injection well from one operator
to another. The request must be submitted prior to the date of the proposed transfer. The authority to inject
shall not be transferred from one operator to another without the approval of the division. If the transfer is
for an enhanced recovery project involving multipie wells, one form can be submitted with a list attached
describing the wells

The division shall, within 30 days after the receipt of a properly completed form, return a copy of the form
to each operator indicating approval or denial of the transfer of authority to inject. If approved, a copy of the
order authorizing injection shall be attached to the form which is returned to the new operator.

Send to:

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)



Sundry Nunber: 65717 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
1/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
1/ REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: IMIT TEST

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

See Attached Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
October 06, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 8/27/2015

RECEI VED: Aug. 27, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 65717 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

Reset Form STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML - 1257

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to Clear Creek
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Alpine School District 3-17

1. TYPE OF WELL .
oL WELL [] GASWELL []  oTtHEr Salt Water Disposal

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Utah Gas Operating Solutions LLC 4300731182
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1415 N Loop W, Ste 1250 . Houston srare TX . 77008 (281) 540-0028 Clear Creek
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTaGes AT surrace: 692 FNL and 2014 FEL county: Carbon
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 17 13S 7E S STATE:
UTAH
11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[] Acipize [] oeepen [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[] n~oTicE oF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALtercasing [] rracTure TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: |:| CASING REPAIR |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION |:| TEMPORARILY ABANDON

[[] CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS |:| OPERATOR CHANGE |:| TUBING REPAIR
[] cHanceTuBING [ ] PLUG AND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE

[0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHancE weLL NAME [] pueBack [] waTER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
|:| CHANGE WELL STATUS |:| PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) |:| WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:
[[] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS || RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O] otHer: MIT
8/26/2015

|:| CONVERT WELL TYPE |:| RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Cleaned out wellbore to 5,139

Added perforations at 4,910' - 4,920' and 5,020’ - 5,030
Ran packer for completion and discovered leak in annulus.
Squeezed with 150 sxs Class G +1% CacCl2.

Drill out and test squeeze to 1,000 psi.

Ran completion assy and set AS 1X packer at 4,245'

Test annulus to 500 psi.

Release rig

8-26-2015 Perform MIT test with Mark Jones witnessing. Tested annulus to 650 psi for 30 mins. Test held good. No pressure
recording of the test was made due to inoperable recorder onsite. Mr. Jones agreed the test was acceptable for submittal.

The step rate test approved in the previous sundry NOI has not yet been performed. UGOS will notice DOGM when that
activity is planned.

Agent - Lim Attny in Fact

NAME (PLEASE PRINF PatrICk W. Merritt TITLE

8/27/2015

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEI VED: Aug. 27, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 65717 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

INSTRUCTIONS

This form shall be submitted by the operator to show the intention and/or completion of the following:
e miscellaneous work projects and actions for which other specific report forms do not exist;
e all other work and events as identified in section 11, Type of Action, or as required by the Utah Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, including:
- minor deepening of an existing well bore,
- plugging back a well,
- recompleting to a different producing formation within an existing well bore (intent only),
- reperforating the current producing formation,
- drilling a sidetrack to repair a well,
- reporting monthly the status of each drilling well.

This form is not to be used for proposalsto

- drill new wells,

- reenter previously plugged and abandoned wells,

- significantly deepen existing wells below their current bottom-hole depth,

- drill horizontal laterals from an existing well bore,

- drill hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests.
Use Form 3, Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for such proposals.

NOTICE OF INTENT - A notice of intention to do work on a well or to change plans previously approved shall be
submitted in duplicate and must be received and approved by the division before the work is commenced. The operator
is responsible for receipt of the notice by the division in ample time for proper consideration and action. In cases of
emergency, the operator may obtain verbal approval to commence work. Within five days after receiving verbal approval,
the operator shall submit a Sundry Notice describing the work and acknowledging the verbal approval.

SUBSEQUENT REPORT - A subsequent report shall be submitted to the division within 30 days of the completion of
the outlined work. Specific details of the work performed should be provided, including dates, well depths, placement
of plugs, etc.

WELL ABANDONMENT - Proposals to abandon a well and subsequent reports of abandonment should include reasons
for the abandonment; data on any former or present productive zones, or other zones with present significant fluid
contents not sealed off by cement or otherwise; depths (top and bottom) and method of placement of cement plugs;
mud or other material placed below, between and above plugs; amount, size, and method of parting of any casing, liner,
or tubing pulled and the depth to top of any left in the hole; method of closing top of well; and date well site conditioned
for final inspection looking to approval of the abandonment.

In addition to any Sundry Notice forms submitted, Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log must
be submitted to the division to report the results of the following operations:
® completing or plugging a new well,

® reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well,

® significantly deepening an existing well bore below the current bottom-hole depth,

e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore,

e drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes such as core samples and stratigraphic tests,
e recompleting to a different producing formation.

Send to:

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)

RECEI VED: Aug. 27, 2015



Sundry Nunber: 63188 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
MARION ENERGY, INC. 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
v" NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION J OTHER OTHER: ILine Repair

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This Sundry Notice is not associated directly with the well above, the Accepted by the

Alpine School District 3-17. | chose this well to satisfy the systems Utah Division of
requirements for having an associated API. This is to notify DOGM that Qil, Gas and Mining
Marion is proceeding with a water transfer line repair that is not located FOR RECORD ONLY
on any well sites. The repair will be for approximately 7,300' of 8" steel November 02, 2015

line. We received approval from the UPRR and will be running a 6" poly
line through the steel line.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 5/7/2015

RECEI VED: May. 07, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 65814 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
v‘( SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION J OTHER OTHER: IWater Line Repair I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Permission was obtained from UPRR and UDOT to repair the salt water Accepted by the
disposal line by feeding 6” SDR 7 HDPE pipe into the existing 8” steel Utah Division of
line. Marion Energy Inc. repaired the water line in the approved manner Oil, Gas and Mining

by running 7300’ of HDPE inside of the 8” steel line and reconnecting to Date:
the existing 8" HDPE pipe that was part of the original system. Once ‘Ncﬁffﬁbf‘ﬁ\eé_z'g%‘
the HDPE was run, Mark Jones with DOGM came out and witnessed a By: L M AN
pressure test of the line. On Friday May 29th, 2015 the line was filled -

with water from the town of Scofield, Utah and pressured up to 350 psi
to stretch the line. The pressure was then backed off to 340 psi and

held constant for 60 minutes. The test was deemed successful and the
areas of excavation were backfilled.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 9/1/2015

RECEI VED: Sep. 01, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 67698 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
v’ ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Move Packer down to 4,850' Pump 2,000 gals 15% HCL with Ball Sealers Approved by the
Flush and over displace 50Bbls Move packer to 4,245' Pump 3,000 gals Debembielohi7e2015
acid with ball sealers Flush and over displace 50Bbls Perform packer Oil, Gas and Mining

integrity test Return well to active status Date:

~ I
By: “SiﬁbM%(¥g§ A

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Tyler Merritt 281 540-0028 Project Manager
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 11/12/2015

RECEI VED: Nov. 12, 2015




Sundry Nunber: 74509 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-1257 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CLEAR CREEK
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Water Disposal Well ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC 43007311820000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1415 North Loop West, STE 1250, Houston, TX, 77008 281 540-0028 Ext CLEAR CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: CARBON
0692 FNL 2014 FEL
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 17 Township: 13.0S Range: 07.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
] acioize L] acter casing [ casine repar
¥ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
L] chance weLL staTus L] comMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ] converTweLL Tvee
[] sussequent RerorT L] oeeren L] rracTure TREAT [J new consTrucTiON
Date of Work Completion:
[ operaTor chance ¥ PLUG AND ABANDON O rLuseack
[ rrobuCTION START OR RESUME [ RecLamaTion oF weLL siTE [ RecompLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
[ spuo report
Date of Spud: [ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION (] sipetRACK TO REPAIR WELL [J remporary AsaNDON
] +usine RepaR [ vent orFLare ] warer oisposaL
[ oriLLine reporT L] water srutorr [ si7a staTus ExTENSION [ Ao extension
Report Date:
] wiLocaT weLL DETERMINATION O orver OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached the procedure for plugging the well Approved by the
Utah Division of
0il, Gas and Mining

Date: October 06, 2016

By: (\;‘lﬁ'/\ (Lobu,gy?('

Please Review Attached Conditions of Approval

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE
Patrick Merritt 281 540-0028 President
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 9/19/2016

RECEI VED: Sep. 19, 2016




Sundry Nunber: 74509 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

UTAH

DNR

.-A*....f

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OIL, GAS & MINING

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43007311820000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338.

2. Amend Plug # 1: Set plug from 4240’ to 3740’ (x95 sx) across squeezed perf interval.

3. Note: Establish injection into perfs prior to setting CICR. If injection into perfs @ 490’ cannot
be established, then the plug inside the casing shall be set from 540’ (50’ below perfs) to surface
(£100 sx).

4. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure they are at the depths specified in the procedure.
5. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface.
6. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 — Well Site Restoration.
7. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply.

8. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure.

9. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
shall apply.

RECEI VED: Cct. 06, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 74509 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

222010 Wellbore Diagram 1263
API Well No: 43-007-31182-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: ALPINE SCHOOL DIST 3-17
Company Name: UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC
Location: Sec: 17 T: 13S R: 7E  Spot: NWNE String Information
Coordinates: X: 486186 Y: 4393907 . Bottom Diameter Weight Length Cqpqc. {‘ \f

. CLEARGREER String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/Tt) (f9 [ c(_)
Field Name: HOLLI 485 175
County Name: CARBON SURF 485 13375 a8 485
HOL2 3142 12.25
| HOL3 5311 8.75
o it 3142 §.625 36 3142
\ Cement from 485 ft. to surface PROD 5311 7 2% 5311 LL LSS
Surfgce: 13.375 in. @ 485 . T1 4700 2.375
< T S T @uss n « ‘
(4] i L In., (al . i
W'  x Ploy &3 77" 7_3 5 > S-us
(3] [§
) ofs prisr tosediny G OBR TR/ ——=  2.65¢
pehd\dn 14§ e 35 }
Febol 11 15}/ (LNUESDT 558
(!)-..v'l_ HQOI ({‘C':TXS-‘C‘{ 5:) = }{ j’(
yGo '/ CutS)(2-05%) ~ (COSK o
M@ H?sVC(-‘S)("“’s): %Qe.lgent Information
(Soo' — V! Neovel BOC  TOC
MR 7, "lg:'?" String (£t sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
i ' @\u =« 22— n 3142 0 HC 425
TN & ,——-—-—-U-'—"" il 3142 0 G 270
f PROD 5311 0 35 400
(ZO'N\\ (x5 ULsS)= bt PROD 5311 0 50 350
!
| T'OC @(?QO SURF 485 0 G 1100
23 -~ l{ a
3\.13'\'
Perforation Information
Cement from 3142 ft. to surf: Top Bottom
e r o ) o (It sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze
Intermediate: 8.625 in. @ 3142 ft. 3800 3906
Hole: 12.25 in. @ 3142 ft. 4268 5119
4300 5030
1‘? 3 4 ' N .
N (17 oo >sye d Formation Information
' < = 3% ' ' ™ ‘ Formation Depth
L420F A cBP (Q urdo *?\ Jq | EMRY 1500
# Ploy S, WO 3% FRSD 4207
Cement from 5311 ft. to strface
Tubing: 2.375 in. @ 4700 ft 700/("'5)( D o
uping: 2. n. 3
| g ‘iSs,(
Production: 7 in. @ 5311 ft.
Hole: 8.75 in. @ 5311 ft.
SoX!
Hole: Unknown
!
5223~
Tl TD: 5340 TVD: 4628 PBTD: 5300

Page |



Sundry Nunber: 74509 APl Well Nunber: 43007311820000

Alpine School District #3-17 Plugging Procedure

Well Name: Alpine School District #3-17

APl Number: 43-007-31182

Location: NWNE Sec.17-T13S-R7E Carbon County, Utah
Surface Csg: 13 3/8” K-55 46# set @ 490’
Intermediate Csg: 9 5/8” J-55 36# @3142’

Prod. Csg: 7” K-55 26# set @ 5311’

PBTD: 5270’

1. MIRU well service rig. NDWH and NUBOP.

2. Release the ASIX 10K Packer @4245’ and POH with 2 7/8” tubing and Packer

3. TIH w/ wireline set 7” CIBP. Set plug 60’ above top perf @ +/-4300". TIH w/ 2 7/8” tbg and tag plug

4. Pump cement through 2 7/8” tbg setting a 100’ plug from +/-4240 — 4140 (approx. 20sx)

5. TOH w/tbg and TIH w/7” CIBP set at +/- 1800’

6. Pump cement through 2 7/8” tbg setting a 100’ plug from +/-1800" — 1700’ (approx. 20sx)

7. RU perforators and perforate @ +/-490’. Set a wireline set CICR at +/-475'. Sting into retainer and
establish circulation down the 7” csg and back up into the 77 X 95/8” & 95/8” X 13 3/8” annuli. If
circulation cannot be established through perfs sting out of retainer and set a 475’ plug (approx.94sx)
to surface in the 7” csg. If circulation can be established, pump 75sx cement in the 7”X 95/8”

annulus to the surface and 164sx cement in the 9 5/8”X13 3/8” annulus, and sting out of retainer and
set a 475’ plug (approx.94 sx) to surface in the 7” csg on top of the retainer.

8. All cement should be Type Il or Class G or equivalent cement mixed at 5.2 to 5 gal/sk to make a slurry
weight of 15.8 ppg.

9. Erect dry hole marker on top of the plug extending 4 feet above the ground with following
description:

OPERATOR: UTAH GAS OPERATING SOLUTIONS,LLC

WELL NAME & NUMBER: Alpine School District #3-17

APl NUMBER: 43-007-31182

LOCATION: NWNE SEC.17-T13S-R7E CARBON COUNTY, UTAH

10. In case the area is agricultural or cultivated, there is no need for marker and only cut off the
casing 3’ below the ground level and cap it with above description welded on the cap.

RECEI VED: Sep. 19, 2016



Sundry Nunber: 74509 API

Vel | Nunber:

43007311820000

Proposed Completion

13-3/8", 46# , K-55 @ 490'
Cmtd w/ 1200 sx
TOC @ surface

9-5/8", 36#, J-55 @ 3,142’
Cmtd w/ 695 sx
TOC @ surface

7" Production, 26#, K-55 @ 5,311'
ID: 6.366", Drift: 6.421, Burst: 4,360 psi
Cmtd w/ 750 sx
TOC @ 2,500' +/- (>90% bond)

Permit Rate and Injection Press: I
Max rate = 15,000 bwpd

Max surface injection pressure = 400 psig
Permit Interval:

4,268' - 5,119'

KOP 1700
BUILD TO 54 DEG MAX AT 4,200
DROP TO 32 DEG AT 5261' MD

8-14-2015 Add perfs 4,910' - 4,920' and
5,020' - 5,030'

8-22-2015 CoBP -Tag 5,090’
8-13-3-2015 Tag Fill 5,139

11/19/07: PBTD @ 5,270'

Spud Date: 7/3/07

TD Date: 7/30/07

Comp Date: 11/30/07

API: 43-007-31182 [ Alpine School District #3-17 }
GL: 7,919 LOCATION:
KB: 7,934' Clear Creek
I SW SE SW Sec 8 (BHL)
SW NW NE (surface)
Casing Strings: Sec. 17 T13S R7E
Carbon County, UT

00

00

TD = 5,340' MD, 4,628' TVD

Tubing String:

4,250' x 2-7/8", 6.5#, J-55, 8rd
Hydrotested to 4,000 psi

ID: 2.441" Drift: 2.347" Burst: 7,260 psi

Packer:
7" x 2-7/8" ASIX 10K PKR @ 4,245'
Annulus filled FSW

Capacity:

2-7/8" tbg: .00579 bbl/ft (24.6 bbls)

7" csg: .0382 bbl/ft (201.3 bbls)

2-7/8" x 7" Annulus: .0302 bbl/ft (128.4 bbls)

MIT Test 8-26-2015 to 650 psi for 30 mins
Witness by DOGM Mark Jones

Feb 2015 Pump in test 3.9 BPM at 100 psi
3.5 BPM on Vaccuum

Approved Injection Interval:
4,268'-5,119'

Bluegate

3,800'-3,906' (4 spf)

11/07: 630g 7-1/2% HCI w/ balls
11/07: 840g 7-1/2% HCI and 83,220#
20/40 sand in x-link gel

Test: 16 mcfd, 300 bwpd

3/08: SQZ 3,800'-3,906', Drill out.

Ferron
4,300'-4,310',4,524'-4,540',4,550'-4,560',
4,578'-4,588",4,772'-4,782',4,786'-4,794'
10/07: 2,750g 7-1/2% HCL and 122,467 #'s
16/30 sand in x-link gel

Test: 150 mcfd, 250 bwpd

Updated : 9/16/2016

RECEI VED:  Sep.

19, 2016
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